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Moisture Boosts Area 9s Sagging Spirits
Farmers Rally:
Outlook Optimistic Residents Unite

Against MX Plan
Recent rains over the 

past two weeks in south 
Bailey County, where the 
largest part of the dryland 
farms are have been espe­
cially “ beneficial to the 
restoration of land blown 
out, back to a farming 
condition,” said Spencer 
Tanksley, Bailey County 
Extension Agent.

Lewis Dale, a farmer in 
the Needmore Community 
reported “l'A  to 2 total 
inches of rainfall directly 
south of Needmore, which 
is probably enough to plant 
on.” At second location, 
south of Monument Lake, 
Dale reported two inches 
on dryland. Still another 
location 2 miles west and a 
mile north of Muleshoe on 
the Friona highway, he has 
received from Vi to 1 inch 
during this rainfall period.

West from Needmore, 
Baileyboro area farmer, 
Frankie Fine reports a total 
rainfall since April 10 of 
approximately 3 inches. 
Fine said, “ Everything is 
really wet now and we can 
begin planting as soon as it 
warms up, but we’ll prob­
ably wait another 3 weeks. 
The weeds are beginning

Around

Muleshoe
There will be a senior 

high school mother's 
meeting April 27 at 3:30 
p.m. to plan the graduation 
reception. The meeting will 
be in Stephen Johnson’s 
room, 18, at the high 
school. For further infor­
mation or if you are unable 
to attend, contact Jeanetta 
Precure at 272-4795.

*••••
Remember to set your 

clocks April 26, when 2 
a.m. becomes 3 a.m., as 
daylight savings time be­
gins.

• • • • •

A reminder is issued 
that the annual Parent- 
Member Banquet of the 
Muleshoe FFA will be held 
Tuesday, April 28 at 7:30 
p.m. in the high school 
cafeteria.

• • • • •
Mrs. Bernice Carver of 

Huron, South Dakota visi­
ted over the Easter holi­
days in the home of her 
brother, Mr. and Mrs. E. 
W. Martinec of Muleshoe. 

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Billy Don 

Williams, Justin and Julie 
of Abilene spent the week­
end in Muleshoe visiting 
with family and friends. 

••*•*

Mr. and Mrs. Sherman 
Inman have just returned 
from a visit with their son, 
Jerry and Helen of El 
Paso. They attended 
church with them on Sun­
day, and heard Logan 
Cummings, a former 
Muleshoe man, who was 
preaching in revival there.

They visited friends in 
Los Cruces and attended 
church with them Sunday 
night. Then went on to 

esa, Arizona to visit their

to crop out and beds will 
probably have to be knifed 
before planting.”

On west toward Shafer 
Gin area, up to 2'/j -3 
inches of moisture has 
been reported.

Although Stegall rains 
were lighter, further west 
on the State line 1 to l'A  
inches has been received 
on dryland awaiting plant­
ings. One farmer in this 
area stated, “ This rain has 
been a life-saver. Under­
ground moisture has met 
the new moisture and the 
outlook now is favorable. 
We could possibly plant on 
this; however, another 2 
inches would put us in 
excellent shape.” He ad­
ded, “ Wheat was under 
stress before the rains, but 
has been helped with the 
rains; however, harvest of 
wheat could be difficult 
due to the shortness of the 
stalk.”

Pasture land in areas of 
rainfall is greening up; and 
pasture will be good if 
rains continue.

West of Muleshoe and 
south of FM 1760, alfalfa
farmers are reporting*

Cont. Page 6, Col. 2

Though stated ubruptly, 
solemnly, intellegently, or 
emotionally, the answer to 
having the MX Missile 
System located in Eastern 
New Mexico/Texas was 
“ not on our land.”

This response was given 
over and over at the two 
MX Hearings in Clovis 
Wednesday along with 
questioning why this area 
is even being considered in 
the DEIS. Approximately 
350 attended the first ses­
sion and about 600 atten­
ded the evening session.

A lack of patriotism was 
not evident but strong 
loyalty and ties to several 
generations of homestead­
ing was evident.

Although time was allot­
ted for questions about the 
system, the major question 
was why, this agricultural­
ly rich area is even being 
considered.

It was voiced that if as 
much indepth study had 
been done on this area as 
was done in Nevada/ Utah 
this area would not be an

alternative.
The DEIS is not in its 

final form and it is hoped 
reactions from the Clovis 
hearings will be included. 
The Reagan administration 
is expected to decide 
whether or not it wants a 
land-based missile system 
by July 1. The United 
States Congress will make 
the final decision on the

Cont. Page 6, Col. 1

Grand Jury 
Indicts 2

The Grand Jury handed 
down  ̂ two indictments 
Wednesday with Judge 
M.C. Ledbetter presiding.

Individuals include 
Esperamza Guillen who 
has been indicted for au­
thorization by another to 
participate in the food 
stamp program.

Another individual 
whose whereabouts are 
unknown, was indicted tor 
theft.

NUMBER ONE..... Eighth grade boys track team won District at Hereford on April 23. 
These boys broke some track records with this win. Total results will be published in next 
Thursday’s paper.

IRRIGATED WHEAT.....This photo was snapped on FM 1760 of circle sprinkler irrigated wheat, which looks good at this 
time. Irrigated wheat has not suffered the stress of the dryland wheat crop.

Holmes Formally Sentenced 
After One Year of Events
Janice Bates Holmes re­

ceived a formal sentencing 
of 60 years from Judge 
M.C. Ledbetter, Wednes­
day, almost one year after 
her involvement in the 

' ’fbwery of Lindsey Jewelry 
in Muleshoe.

Marcial Garcia who was 
convicted of burglary on 
March 12, 1979, also ap­
peared before the judge

Jr. Babe Ruth 
Parents Meeting

There will be an organi­
zational meeting for 
parents of Jr. Babe Ruth 
age players (13-15 year 
olds) and other interested 
persons on Thursday, April 
30 at 8 p.m. in the banquet 
room of the XIT Restau­
rant.

Attendance is critical for 
it may determine whether 
or not Muleshoe will have 
this league this summer. 
The league charter must be 
mailed by May 1.

For further information 
call Winston Allison at 
272-3267 or 272-3304 after 
5 p.m.

Wednesday and had his 
probation revoked. He was 
sentenced to a term of not 
less than two nor more 
than five years.

Ms. Holmes and her two 
companions were arrested

MHS One Act Play 
Wins Regional

Muleshoe High's UIL 
One Act Contest Play, 
Oedpipus the King, won 
the regional championship 
Thursday, April 23. The 
play advances to the state 
tournament in Austin and 
will be performed on 
Thursday, May 7.

Cast members receiving 
special honors and awards 
were Micharl Isaac, Carla 
Shafer, Julius Briscoe, Jeff 
Combs, Freddie Vela and 
Lori Butler.

Other cast and crew 
members are Marlin By­
num, Scott Ellard, David 
Pruitt, Danny Seales, San­
dra Graves, Dale Hughes, 
Dana Brewer, Sheri Ellard, 
Jimmy Lee, Lynnette Sha­
fer, Marvin Lewis, and 
Kevin Robinson.

for the alleged robbery of 
the jewelry store on April 
28, 1980. Jewelry valued at 
$50,000 was recovered 
from the car after a high 
speed chase.

The third to be tried, 
Ms. Holmes had not re­
ceived formal sentencing 
when she escaped from 
Bailey County jail late Au­
gust 31 or early September 
1.

According to a Septem­
ber 4 Journal article, the 
door to Ms. Holmes cell 
was not locked and she 
apparently picked the lock 
to the door leading into the 
‘run around’ section of the 
jail with a finger nail file. 
She is said to have had 
outside help in the excape 
as the small woman was 
reportedly too small to

have torn out the heavy 
mesh over the window.

Cont. Page 6, Col. 2

Organization
Meeting Set 

For Tennis Club
An organizational meet­

ing for a Muleshoe tennis 
organization has been set 
for Thursday, April 30 at 8 
p.m. in the high school 
cafeteria.

The purpose of the orga­
nization is to promote the 
game of tennis locally with 
future tournament and in­
structional plans.

For further information 
contact Jeff Smith at 
965-2886 or Harold Home 
at 272-5359.

Kindergarten - Grade
Spring Roundup May 1

Harold N. Home an­
nounces that Friday, May 
1, 1981 from 8:30 a.m. to 
3:30 p.m. is Spring Round- 
Up at Neal B. Dillman 
Elementary for kindergar­
ten and first grade children 
for the 1981-82 school year.

Children who will be six 
years old on or before 
September 1, 1981 are eli­
gible to register for first 
grade. Parents should 
bring the child's birth cer­
tificate and record of the 
child's immunizations 
(shots) if available.

Immunizations required 
by the new federal and 
state guidelines for a 4-8 
year old child's admission 
to school include the (1) 
DPT. three dose diph­
theria-pertussis (whooping 
cough)-tetanus series with 
at least one dose since the 
4th birthday and (3) im-

through seven years of age 
or enrolled in preschool, 
kindergarten, first grade, 
or second grade.

Required immunizations 
can be given at physician's 
offices or at the Texas 
Department of Public 
Health. 306 W. 2nd Street.

KINDERGARTEN
Also on May 1, all chil­

dren who will be five years 
old on of before September 
1, 1981, are eligible to 
register for kindergarten.

School officials strongly 
urge parents to register 
kindergarten children on 
this date because there will 
be no registration day at 
the beginning of school in 
the fall.

Children who are now 
enrolled in kindergarten at 
Neal B. Dillman Elemen-X * * '
tary are already enrolled 
in kindergarten at Neal B. 
Dillman Elementary are

LOCAL SHOWMAN RECEIVES AWARD ..... Shane
Gaunch of Muleshoe accepts the Texas Club Calf 
Association Brangus Championship belt buckle for 1980-81 
from TCCA representative Cherie M. Rash. He is a charter 
member of the TCCA.

Local 4-H Boys Win 
TCCA ’80-’81 Awards

Shane Gaunch, a Bailey 
County 4-H member, won 
the Texas Gub Calf As­
sociation Brangus Division 
Championship for 1980-81. 
The seventeen year old son 
of Jim Pat and Suzie 
Claunch of Muleshoe, 
Shane has been exhibiting 
steers for the past four 
years under the direction 
of Spencer Tanksley, his

exhibited the Rexerve 
Champion steer at the 
Bailey County Junior Show 
and the . Breed 
Champion in the Brangus 
division at the George 
Garretson Prospect Show.

The Texas Gub Calf 
Association is a non-profit 
organization designed to 
promote the exhibition of 
show steers throughout
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Mother's Day Cards 
Help Needy Overseas

Marjorie Pinschmidt, 
Director of the CARE office 
at 109 N. Akard Street, 
announced a special
Mother’s Day campaign 
during the 35th anniver-

Sewing Denim 

‘Popular’

Sports Fabrics
Denim, a "popular” in 

sports fabrics, has special 
characteristics and sewing 
requirements, advises
Nancy Brown, a clothing 
specialist.

Ms. Brown is on the 
home economics staff of 
the Texas Agricultural Ex­
tension Service, The Texas 
A&M University System.

"Denim has body, it is a 
firm twill weave, and it 
tailors beautifully. In se­
lecting a pattern for denim, 
choose one ihat-has few 
curves and no extreme 
bias," the specialist says.

In cutting denim, use the 
"with nap” layout to make 
sure all pattern pieces are 
going in the same direc­
tion. When pattern pieces 
are cut from a double 
thickness of fabric, always 
fold the fabric lengthwise, 
she advises.

When sewing denim, 
use cotton or cotton/poly­
ester thread of a size that 
is suitable for the fabric 
weight.

In finishing denim seams 
remember that it ravels 
more than any other sports 
fabrics, so it does require a 
seam finish. Which kind 
depends on a type of gar­
ment being constructed.

For a tailored look, use 
welt or Qat-felled scams. 
These will eliminate bulk, 
and they’lf-add an interes­
ting detail to the seams. 
Zigzag or edge stitch the 
seam edges.

Seams of an unlined jac­
ket may be bound by enca­
sing the edge of each seam 
allowance with doublefold 
bias tape and then edge 
stitching.

Top-stitching will add a 
finished touch to pockets 
and detail areas.

sary year of the interna­
tional aid and development 
organization. The gift card 
plan offers a way to honor 
mothers and other women 
in this country whild, at 
the same time, providing 
help for destitute mothers 
and their children over­
seas, Mrs. Pinschmidt 
said. Her office covers 
Texas, Oklahoma, and 
Louisiana.

Simultaneously, the 
campaign was launched 
nationally form CARE 
World Headquarters in 
New York by Dr. Philip 
Johnston, Executive Direc- 

• tor.

Hospitals To 

Participate In 
Disaster Drill

Like Boy or Girl Scouts, 
Lubbock hospitals must al­
so be prepared. Twice a 
year the Joint Commission 
of Accreditation of Hospi­
tals requires that a mock 
“ disaster” to be held to 
test staff responses and the 
hospitals’ disaster plans.

In compliance, a drill is 
planned for Tuesday, April 
28, at 1:00 p.m. Lubbock 
General, Methodist and 
West Texas Hospitals will 
be participating in the 
drill.

The setting for the 
planned disaster drill is an 
outdoor concert at Stumpy 
Hamilton Park, 22nd and 
Ave. X. During the concert 
a makeshift grandstand, 
full of people, collapses. 
Approximately 75 casuali- 
ties, equally divided be­
tween ambulatory and 
non-ambulatory, will be 
taken by LCHD EMS, Aide 
Ambulance and Rescue 
and Recovery to the three 
hospitals.

These drills give the 
hospital employees the op­
portunity to evaluate dis­
aster plans and identify 
problems which occur dur­
ing the drill. This also 
gives the participating 
hospitals a base to work 
from in evaluating and 
amending cooperative 
plans as needed.

MR.G0QDVDRENCH
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FOR MOST 

8-CYLINDERS 
PARTS & LABOR

O n n lt  w  QW*irt m a u l :
M m U I N  W t m l l

If your car needs a tune-up. come see Mr. 
Qoodwrench, because a tune-up can mean 
better gas mileage, according to the U S. 
Department of Energy

And a Mr Goodwrench tune-up means 
good service Because he has genuine GM 
parts available-parts right for your GM car. 
And all genuine GM parts and service are 
oovered by a eo-day/4,000-mile whichever 
comes first limited 
warranty.

So get a gas-saving tune-up now -stop by 
our dealership 
and m

wrench I <
A
4 <*>•

> nH |
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He explained, "By re­
membering your mother 
and other women you 
cherish with these attrac­
tive gift cards, you feed 
hungy families and help 
them work their way our of 
poverty. Mothers and their 
families receive nourishing 
food and medical aid as 
well as health and nutrition 
education. In keeping with 
DARE’s goal of helping 
poor people become self- 
supporting, they also re­
ceive the means and kno- 
how to grow more food, 
build schools, water sys­
tems and set up village 
industries to increase their 
meager incomes.” He ad­
ded that, “ CARE delivers 
aid to tens of millions of 
poor people in 35 develop­
ing countries.”

Emphasizing that, 
“ Your contribution will 
make a difference,” Dr. 
Johnston gave the follow­
ing examples: $5 provides 
600 nutritious biscuits in a 
feeding program; $15 buys 
a bowl of porridge for 300 
school children for a week; 
$50 provides access to ba­
sic health services for 400 
rural women and children 
through a training program 
by MEDICO, the medical 
arm of CARE; $75 brings 
fresh water to a rural 
villager through construc­
tion of a community water 
system.

The cards will be mailed 
to you or directly to the 
women you select. Please 
send contributions to 
Mother's Day Plan, CARE,

109 N. Akard Street, Suite 
917, Dallas, Tx. 75201. 
Give your name and ad­
dress, the name and ad­
dress of each woman 
honored (minimum $3 per 
card) and the instructions 
for card handling. If you 
wish cards mailed directly, 
state how each is to be 
signed. Make checks pay­
able to CARE and order 
early to assure delivery by 
Mother’s Day, Mrs. Pin­
schmidt urged.

o fin te re s tto
VETERANS

Unless Congress modifies 
the figures, the Reagan Ad­
ministration plans to reduce 
civilian non-postal federal jobs 
by 41,600 over the next year 
and a half. In some agencies, 
the cuts may be accomplished 
by not replacing people who 
retire or leave voluntarily, but 
in others a reduction in force 
(RIF) — the government 
equivalent of layoffs — may 
be necessary.

Under new RIF regulations 
published in the January 16 
Federal Register, veterans 
with a compensable service- 
connected disability of 30 
percent or more are placed 
at the top of their group for 
retention. Previously, veterans 
and disabled veterans had 
preference in federal hiring 
but none in RIF retention.

* * *
REMINDER: If you are a 

veteran of the Mexican border 
period or World War I, a 1979 
law provides that the Veterans 
Administration may issue cer­
tain medical services such as 
eyeglasses, a hearing aid, etc. 
Check the nearest VA Medical 
Center for details.

* * *
Vietnam-era veterans having 

trouble adjusting to civilian 
life — psychological, social, 
marital or other difficulties -  
can obtain counseling at over
90 community Vet Centers
across the country.

Federal A ll-R isk  
Crop Insurance.

Time is running out!
April 30
is the deadline for

Insuring 1981 Cotton
Act now to assure yourself 
complete crop protection.

Federal Crop Insurance
i» 5 Of n r o» aouktui rm»f

Joe Or Ricky Smallwood

MR. GOODWRENCH 
0 H  CHANGE, LOBE 
AND (HU QUALITYan. (Turin

1 3 95,
INCLUDES 
5QTS.OIL, 

FILTER & LABOR
Cbssk ysti avBsrl nunrnal or naiatauaot sokstfala 
ter rsociawadtd BuiatwutBco InUrrtl*.________
Mr Good wrench can make your GM car run 
cleaner, longer— and help save gas If your car 
is due. Mr Goodwrench will lubricate the 
chassis— change the oil— and install a new G M 
quality oil filter!

And remember, Mr Goodwrench will in­
spect your car— to make sure his work is done 
right

So stop in soon -for an oil and lube jo b - 
plus a new GM quality oil filter— all from 
Mr Good­
wrench'
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APRIL 26-29

IT COULD BE 
A BIG DEAL 

FOR YOU
Gom e Tickets and Collector Cards ava ilab le  at the 
checkout counter No purchase necessary

PLAY T O D A Y . W IN  T O D A Y

■ j -A • ■*
; * wr'fjjr; ■ i
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- •

M il  Htw M H e
f S « e w p * u % .

Each ot these advertised items is required to be readily available lor sale at or below the advertised price in each store, excep 
as specifically noted In this ad We reserve the right to limit quantities None sold to dealers

C H U C K  * 
S T E A K  "

Beef Boneless Center Cut l b .

$ A 7 9

SPARE RIBS
Country Style

$ 1 4 9
lb . ■

ARM R O A S T
Beef Boneless Waste Free

USDA 
Grade A

WHOLE
FRYERS

6 3 *

GROUND BEEF
* 1 8 9

Not Less 
than 80% 

lean
$1  79

I J

w
m Zm
Z m

v

P O R K  *  _  
C H O P S  ’ 8 4 9

Combination Pack lb . 
4 ends & 6 centers

3 l h e
_______ ______

O R A N G E S  R Q «
Del Monte

I^wato sa m

^  '  J9MATO SAUtf

1

TO M A TO
SAUCE

8 oz. can

Maryland Club

5/*1

a s
Regular,Electric Perk, Drip

M INUTE
M AID

Frozen Orange Juice

1 lb. 
can 1

12 oz. 
can 9 9

mOMflUtUlY Ea* That Groat (M M in< 
W tt Oomtne (Of tata.

ROBERT D. GREEN, INC.
2400 Wear American Blvd. 
MULESHOE, TEXAS 79347

] Shurfine

SUG AR  $ '
l 6,B'

I 7 9 !
■■■an inmiim—ill ivagrfM

WHITE
CLOUD

White, Yellow, 
Blue, Pink, Green

_ 4 roll
B a t h r o o m  T i s s u e  Pkg

H i-D ri 
1 roll

9 9



CAM PBELL ®  HAUSFELD

SOFT-WHITE

MT-MKI
UTEXfUT 
1AIL Ft&

SAT-N-HUE® 

W JEX 9 9 ?  « "
righten wall* and ceilings 

with a fresh coat of high 
hiding, non-drip latex. 
Dries in 30 minutes. P

r w u r m n ^
KITCHEN
FAUCET
One-lever control, high-rise 
spout, w^sherless. Chrome 
plated. 87501

SPRAY GUN 
AND REGULATOR
Spray gun and regulator with 
V4" fittings. Use with 1/3 to 1

LIGHT BULBS
00, 75 or 100 wott toft white 
tfufbs. 60/75/100/150AAV-48P

c o m p r e s s o r s

X-0 RUST® 
PAINT-ON or 
SPRAY-ON 
ENAMEL
Locks out moisture to protect 
indoor and outdoor m e­
ta ls from rust. Great for 
wood and concrete too. High 
gloas finish. Colors. XO 
10-Ft Ox. S pray ........... 2“

HARDWARE STORE

MECHANICSLAWN® 
CHIEF,COOLER

AND
JUG

FLAT-TOP a  i a  
TOOLBOX 7 . 4 7
Sturdy-steel w/baked-enam- 
el finish. Drawbolt wfpadlock 
eye; tote tray. MM429

The perfect combination for a great outing! Big 10 gallon 
cooler with molded recessed handles, high rise lid. 1 gal­
lon jug with Fast-Flo pushbutton faucet. 5283/813

SENSOR
LIGHT

21-INCH REAR-BAG MOWER
Powerful 3Vi-hp engine drives this big 21-Inch mower Lever- 
action height adjusters for precise cutting Big rear bag catches 
more than 2 bushels ol grass Roller-beanng wheels. 7-inch in 
front, 8-inch in back for smooth rolling' Grass catcher included 
Mower comes fully assembled 81

{ ' t o n  LUTRON 
ROTARY 

^  DIMMER
Continuous control; ro­
tary action Replaces stan­
dard switch DR-600RC

7-PIECE Q  Q Q  
DRILL SET 3 . 7 7
Professional quality tool 
steel drill bits from 1/16 to 1/4

Automatically senses 
darkness—turns on at 
dusk, off at dawn. Ideal 
for bathroom, hall. 48560

FLUORESCENT
UNDER-CABINET

LIGHT
With built-in switch and 
light diffuser. Durable 
therm oplastic housing 
18-in. 15W bulb, 6 ft 
cord. UL listed N1801-2

COMPRESSION
SPRAYER
With 1 Vi-gallon corrosion- 
resistan t tank, roto-valve 
spray, adjustable noale. 615

W EED-B- 
GON* Quart V P
Broadleaf weed killer rids 
lawn of w eeds w ithout 
harm to grasses 3987*

All-weather, nylon rein­
forced; flexible In cold 
weather 5*-in. I D T666-BG

Alpha Zeta Pi 
Meeting Held 
At Pizza Hut

April 21 Alpha Zeta Pi 
Chapter of Beta Sigma Phi 
met at 6:30 at the Pizza 
Hut for a make-up meet­
ing. Present for the meet­
ing were Cindy Purdy, 
Sherri Hawkins, Alice 
Liles, Peggy Pohlmeier, 
Terri Hahn, Betty Bush, 
Jean Treadwell and Pam 
Shipman. Everyone en­

joyed  a meal of pizza and 
’spaghetti.

Following the make-up

meeting, a regular meeting 
was held in the home of 
Pam Stockard. Marilyn 
Saylor served as co-hos­
tess. As the members ar­
rived they were served 
punch made from fresh 
strawberries.

Max King presented a 
program on the water con­
servation controversy 
Muleshoe is involved in 
with Lubbock. The pro­
gram was very informative 
and Mr. King sighted 
many ways individuals 
could conserve water daily.

Following the program, 
all members joined togeth-

Bailey County Journal, Muleshoe, Teias. Sunday, April 26, 1981, Pi

communications. A %
was received from

High Plains Commodities
Agents of

fitotfei and Company

Complete direct 
wire service in 

Muleshoe for trading 
in Commodities.

& /e u r H  C£ o m m o < 6 &

“Futures Trading and Hedging”

Herbert L. Griffiths
Afferu Owner

115E. Ave.D.

er in saying the opening. 
Roll was called with 21 
members being present. 
Joy Glover read the 
minutes of the previous 
meeting which were ap­
proved and signed by Cin­
dy Purdy. The treasurer’s 
report was given by Jean 
Treadwell.

Cindy Purdy read the 
local 
letter
Pam Shipman that she will 
be taking a one year leave 
of absense starting in June 
of this year.

Rickie Warren read the 
Golden Moment.

A City Council report 
was given by Janna 
Wartes. Janna reminded 
everyone of the Founder’s 
Day Celebration which is to 
be held on Tuesday, April 
28 at 7:00 at the Muleshoe 
Country Club. Also there is 
a City Council Meeting 
April 22.

All members voted on 
and approved a motion to 
send a donation to Girls- 
town.

All members also signed 
up for their choice of com­
mittees for 1981-82.

Pledge of the Year and 
Girl of the Year were voted 
on and will be announced 
on the 28 at the Founder’s 
Day Celebration.

Pat Black presented 
Cindy Purdy with a gift 
representing the chapter’s 
gratitude to Cindy for her 
service as President for 
1980-81. The meeting was 
closed.

Pam Stockard and Mari

lyn Saylor served cheese­
cake topped with fresh 
strawberries to everyone 
present.

Gifts were exchanged 
between the members to 
reveal who their Secret 
Sisters had been for the 
past year.

Present for the meeting 
were Renee Anderson, Pat 
Black, Linda Bullock, Betty 
Bush, Joy Glover, Terri 
Hahn, Sherri Hawkins, 
Debbie Hutto, Melissa 
Kelley, Joan Lewis, Alice 
Liles, Ruth Locker, Peggy 
Pohlmeier, Cindy Purdy, 
Marilyn Riley, Jana St. 
Clair, Marilyn Saylor, Pam 
Shipman, Pam Stockard, 
Jean Treadwell, Rickie 
Warren, and Janna 
Wartes.

Golden Gleams
The heart is the most 

noble of all the mem­
bers of our body.
-St. John Chrysostom.

He hath a heart as sound 
as a bell and his 
tongue is the clapper, 
for what his heart 
thinks his tongue 
speaks.

-Shakespeare.

Whatever comes from the 
heart carries the heat 
and color of its birth­
place.

-O.W. Holmes.

Look into the heart of any 
man. and you always 
find at least one black 
spot.

-Henrik Ibsen.

Leadership 
Conference 
Set For May

The Vocational Opportu­
nities Clubs of Texas 
(VOCT) Leadership Con­
ference will take place on 
May 1-2 at the Tarrant 
County Convention Center 
in Fort Worth. High school 
and junior high school stu­
dents will compete in a 
variety of leadership con­
tests and display exhibits 
to show their vocational 
skills in industrial occupa­
tions.

More than 2,200 
students and educators are 
expected to participate in 
the state meeting on May 
1-2. VOCT has 16,000 Tex­
as members.

Leadership contest will 
be held on such topics as 
extemporaneous speaking, 
job interview, prepared 
speech, club business pro­
cedures, and opening and

( closing ceremonies. An ex­
hibit hall will contain 
chapter and individual ex­
hibits displaying skills 
learned in the various pro­
grams. These will range 
from woodworking and 
small engine repair to fur­
niture upholstery displays. 
Tool identification contests 
will be held in construction 
trades, metal trades, and 
mechanical trades. The o- 
pening general session of 
the convention will get 
under way at 9 a.m. on 
May 2.

Texas students enrolled 
in vocational industrial ed­
ucation programs for the 
educationally disadvan­
taged and handicapped 
have an opportunity to de­
velop leadership abilities 
through participation in 
VOCT. Club activities in 
the state are coordinated 
by the Texas Education 
Agency’s Department of 
Occupational Education 
and Technology.

Senior Fun Carnival 
May 7 In Plainview

A Senior Fun Carnival, 
for all Senior Citizens 55 
years and older within the 
South Plains Association’s 
15 county region, will be 
held May 7 at Wayland 
Baptist College, Hutchin­
son Physical Education 
Center in Plainview.

Registration will begin at 
8:30 a.m. and all events 
will end bv 3:30 p.m.

1 * •
I so ¥
1 *

Inside seating is available 
'for all events. Box lunches 
may be purchased for two 
dollars, snacks and drinks 
are free.

The purpose of the car­
nival is to honor out­
standing Senior Citizens, 
conduct the senior Oly­
mpics and hold a mini 
health fair. The county 
with the most participants 
and or most points in the 
senior Olympics, wins a 
trophy.

Senior Fun Carnival is 
coordinated by Central 
Plains R.S.V.P. of Hale 
County, the Hale County 
Senior Citizen’s Associa­
tion, and Wayland Baptist 
College, and is sponsored 
by the SPAG aging pro­
gram.

For more information, 
call your local Senior Citi­
zen’j? Center or the South 
Plains Association of Gov­
ernments’ aging office at 
806-762-8721.

More Than Words
“I don’t like your dog. 

Every time I come he barks 
and 1 don’t trust him. I’d 
come oftener if it wasn’t for 
your dog.”

“ A dog.” said the host 
without blinking, “ is man’s 
best friend.”
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p re m ie r I f  Polyester 

steel W hitew all'
Constructed with 2 belts of ste 
cord and 2 tough body plies ol] 
Polyester Cord. Good traction ol 
both wei and d ry  pavement. H I 
traction tread compound rem ains\ 
flexible at tem peratures beiowf 
free ling  to m aintain good t r a d  
tion. In m any cases it elim inates j 
w inter tire changeover.

P16580R13
Whitewall

only 1*9 F£.T.
K r g u U r Sale P lat
P nee Price K . K  T

Number F i f h P a r k

P I 8 S / 7 5 R 13. W h i t e w a l l  . . . 4 0 . l t 2 .0 2

1*185/7 > K  i t  W h i t e w a l l  . . . ............ : . o . 4 i 4S.37 2 .1 9

P I 9 5 / 7 5 R I 4 .  W h i t e w a l l  . . . . . .  51.2 5 4 4.1 3 2 .3 3

P 2 6 5 / 7 S R 1 4. W  h i t e w a l l  . . . 49 ?0 2.4M

P 2 I 3 / 7 S R I 4 .  W h i t e w a l l  . . . 51.14 2 .5 X

P 2 2 5 / 7 5 R I 4 .  W h i t e w a l l  . . . . ............  59.34 S3 41 2.81

P 2 0 5 / 7 5 R I 5 .  W h i t e w a l l  . . . . . 5 6 .OX 50 47 2.57

P 2 I S / 7 5 R I 5 .  W h i t e w a l l  . . ............ 59.711- 51 73 2 .7 5

P 2 2 5 / 7 5 R I 5 .  W h i t e w a l l  . . . . 6 1  57 55.41 2 .9 3

P 2 3 S / 7 3 R 13. W h i t e w a l l . . . . 6 5 .X 9 S t .  30 3.11

JET S IM  

P o ly e s te r  t o r t

A S ” W hitew all

*he 4 ply polyester cord body 
csists im p a ct, blow outs, 

deterioration. Ypu  get a softer, 
quieter ride with no road whine or 
joint slap and no m orning thump.

178-13 *  1.50 F.E.T.
W hitew all Regular S>P Plus

Price Price mNumber Each Each

B 7 8 - I 3 .  W h i t e w a l l . . . 27.43 1.41
C 7 8 - I 3 .  W h i t e w a l l . . 21.60 1 . 7 t

C 7 8 -1 4 .  W h i t e w a l l . . . 2 l . t 4 1.44
1)7 8 -1 4, W h i t e w a l l .  . .  . ............................ 34.41 2 t . 2 t I . P t

E 7 8 - I 4 ,  W h i t e w a l l . . . . .........................  J 6 . t 4 31.17 7.64

F 7 8 - I 4 ,  W h i t e w a l l . . . . 32.77 2.14

(■ 78 -1 4 . W h i t e w a l l  . . 42.04 33.45 2.21

1178-14, W h i t e w a l l . . . . ............................45.33 34.24 2.S2

( . 7 8 - 1 5 ,  W h i t e w a l l .  . ............................4 3 .7 t 3S.63 2.14

H 7 H -1 S .  W h i t e w a l l 3 4 .t O 2.S7

J 7 8 - I 5 .  W h i t e w a l l ............................ 46 .40 36.70 2 . 7 t

L 7 8 - I S .  W h i t e w a l l .  . 39.6 0 7.14

A&M
FARM & RANCH SUPPLY

3 CONVENIENT LOCATIONS
1601 S. Ave. D Portales 
2600 E. M abry Drive Clovis 
Also Muleshoe, Texas

Spuing ^ e iw a d

First United Methodist Church
Invites You To Hear

Dr. Norman Hudson
Minister

May 3 -6 7:30 p.m

Muleshoe, Tx

Special Music Christian Fellowshi
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uUiss QAiest, QQideweM
flimted Mamge

Larisa Jean West and 
llory Gene Glidewell were ' 
ainited in marriage on Sat­
urday, April 18, at 7:30 in 
ttie evening in the home of 
Ihe bride's parents in Su­
dan. Rick Kaufhold of the 
Sudan Church of Christ 
officiated at the double 
ring ceremony.

The bride is the daugh­
ter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Audrey West of Sudan. 
The bridegroom is the son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Brownfield of Knott and 
Mr. and Mrs. Gene Glide- 
well of Santa Fe, New 
Mexico.

Presented in marriage 
by her father, the bride 
wore a formal length go* n 
of candle light organza, 
fashioned with a high Vic­
torian neck line. The em­
pire bodice had a deep 
sheer yoke edged in Chan­
tilly lace, and long, rlender 
lace sleeves with a ruffle at 
the hemline and extended 
up the back to form an 
apron effect that swept up 
into a chapel length train. 
The headpiece was a lace 
edged mantilla of imported 
illusion. Her bridal bou­
quet was of candle light

silk flowers and she carried 
a Bible covered in satin 
and lace. She wore a gold 
band ring which was given 
to her grandmother by her 
great grandfather, a neck­
lace belonging to her sister 
in law a>>d a garter of blue.

Mrs. Terry Gage of Lub­
bock was matron of honor. 
She wore a long gown with 
a Queen Anne neckline and 
long sleeves of coral color 
trimmed in coral ribbon 
inset in lace. Her head- 
piece was a wreath of coral 
flowers with streamers of 
coral satin ribbon, and she 
carried a long stem, candle 
light silk flower.

Dennis West of Sudan 
and brother of the bride, 
was the best man. Ushers 
were Brad West and Craig 
West, both brothers of the 
bride. The groom wore a 
candle light tuxedo and the 
best man, fathers, and 
ushers wore tuxedos of 
brown.

Mrs. Brad West, pianist, 
presented musicial se­
lections, “ The Wedding 
Song,” “ The Wedding 
March,”  and Mrs. Joe 
Kent, vocalist, accompa­
nied her on “ The Wedding 
Song” and “ Follow Me.”

The bride’s mother wore 
a formal length gown of 
coral crepe polyester. It 
featured a round neck line 
and bracelet length sleeves 
with a long capelet of coral 
chiffon.

The groom’s mother 
wore a formal length gown 
of soft beige with spaghetti 
straps and a lace jacket. 
They both wore corsages of 
candle light silk flowers.

The home was decorated 
with an archway covered in 
greenery and coral silk 
flowers with spiral candel- 
abras on each side with 
greenery and coral ribbons 
and flowers.

A reception followed in 
the home of the bride’s 
parents. The table was 
covered with a cloth of 
candle light polyester with 
insets of lace and edged in 
lace. It was centered by a 
candelabr with greenery 
and coral silk flowers en­
twined, and the bridal 
bouquet.

The three tiered wed­
ding cake, frosted in can­
dle light color, was touched 
with a stairway of coral 
roses and topped with 
wedding bells. Coral 
colored punch and mints 
were served from crystal 
and silver appointments. 
Mrs. Dennis West of 
Sudan and Miss Trina Wil­
liams of Dallas presided at 
the table.

Little Miss Suzanne Reid 
distributed rice bags of 
coral chiffon tied with pale 
beige satin ribbons.

The registry was cen­
tered with a soft beige 
doily and displayed a 
memory candle of candle 
light and pale beige.

The bride graduated 
from Sudan High School 
and attended Angelo State 
University. The groom 
graduated from Klondike 
High School and also at­
tended Angelo State Uni­
versity.

The couple will make 
their home in Lubbock.

Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Brownfield of Knott, hos­
ted a rehearsal supper 
April 17 at K-Bob’s in 
Littlefield.

■ ■ .w f l l  ~ ■ € )  f f l  I

P l a n t i n g
. We Have A Complete Line 

OfBulkGarden Seed,
Bermuda. Blue Grass & Perennial Rve

J

■f\ For Your Lawns

Asgrou\ Hr owning & (rrowers 
White (lorn Seed

Ray Griffiths & Sons
North End Of Main 272-4585

Progressive 
Home Club
The Progressive Home 

Club met in the home of 
Oma Stratton with six 
members and one visitor 
present. Norene Thomas, 
president, called the club 
to order and due to the 
absence of Roxie Hoover, 
Vera Engelking acted as 
secretary.

Roll call was answered 
by hints, tips and poems. 
No minutes were available 
to be read. Wenona Gibson 
drew the hostess gift.

Mozelle Reppie presen­
ted the program with a de­
monstration on how to 
make mystery pot holders.

After the meeting, the 
hostess served refresh­
ments to members Wenona 
Gibson, Norene Thomas, 
Noami Block, Mozelle 
Reppie, Vera Engelking, 
and the guest, Dorothy Rae 
Harlan.

The club adjourned to 
meet May 20 with Norene 
Thomas.

Life
Gather your kisses while 

you may.
For time brings only 

sorrow.
The girls who are so free 

today
Are chaperones to­

morrow.

r '

El P a so ’s N orm a Frye 
O LE R O C K IN ’ C H A IR S  
GOT M E--

A N D  I ’m G L A D !!!
You see, before my Pal Walker’s program my 

“ lumps” poked thru the spokes of my rocker. Now, 
after losing28'A pounds and 43 'A inches I can sit in 
my rocker, or an airplane seat, and feel slim and 
trim. There is space on each side!!

Before Pat Walker’s 1 wore only full skirts — to 
cover up. Now when I wear full skirts it is only 
because / want to.

Before Pat Walker’s I felt heavy, my choice 
of clothes was limited. Now my body feels 
strong, 1 feel healthy — and I shop in size 7, 
with nothing to hide.

The above testimony is important. But 
equally important — I’ve been able to main­
tain my present weight this past year even 
though I had surgery and 2 three week 
vacations. There was no problem, I fol­
lowed the Pat Walker’s method of eat­
ing. Sound good??? IT IS!!

Not only have I purchased a “ new 
body” , I now know the lovely ladies at 
the Pat Walker’s Figure Salon as my 
friends. THEY CARE! I’d love for 
you to meet them. Tell them I sent you.

Norma Frve

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Day 
celebrated their 60th wed­
ding anniversary on
Thursday, April 9.

• • • • *
Mr. and Mrs. R.B. Knox 

have vacationing at the 
lake.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Billy 

Wayne Gore, Stephanie 
and Dennis of Odessa visi­
ted during the weekend 
with their parents, and

grandparents, Mr. anti 
Mrs. Wayne Doty and Mr. 
and Mrs. Billy Gore and 
boys of Circleback. Joining 
the Doty’s on Sunday were 
their son, Mr. and Mrs. 
David Doty, Crystal and 
Daniel of Littlefield.

*****
Visiting in the home of 

Rev. and Mrs. Truman 
Johnson and family were 
his parents of Amarillo. 

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Claud 

Kropp were in the Lockney 
during the weekend to visit 
Mr. and Mrs. Tom Word.

APRIL BIRTHDAY.....Birdie Phelps, a resident of the 
Muleshoe Nursing Home, celebrated her 91st birthday 
with a party in the nursing home, hosted bTy the Needmore 
Community Club. Mrs. J.C. Shanks played the piano and 
Flowerland provided a corsage for Mrs. Phelps. She was 
bom April 6, 1890 in Tennessee and is a member of the 
Church of Christ. Her son, Bernard Phelps, resides in 
Muleshoe.

ONE MINUTE SPORTS QUIZ
1. Who won the Sea Pines 
Heritage Golf Gassic?
2. Name the winner of the 
NCAA basketball champion­
ship.
3. Who won the LPGA 
Kemper Open golf tourna­
ment?
4. Who was named As­
sociated Press’ college 
basketball of the player of 
the 1980-81 season?
5. Dave Kingman plays pro

baseball for what team?
/tow n  To Sport Quiz

1. Bill Rogers.
2. Indiana
3. Pat Bradley.
4. Ralph Sampson, Virginia.
5. New York Mets.

Getting Personal 
She-ls the congregation 

in the church a small one?
Old Maid-It’s so small 

that when the reverend says 
“Dearly beloved,” I always 
blush.

Brother Don Knight

Will Hold A Seminar 
on

■‘. J A a w i a g e ,  ’D t m c e  £  

Q m a m g e

Beginning Sun. April 26  
at 6 p.m.

and continuing for the 
next 7 weeks.

p i e A i j o n e  i s  E m i t t e d

rj/iinitlj ̂ Baptist C W i
300 Block East Ave. B

FREE FIGURE ANALYSIS
Make an appointment rto» lot .i free. m* 
obligation consultation at Pat Walker's 
We’ll explain hov» our program "orks, Iron 
the no-muss, no luss passive iscrcrse treat 
moots to mmi belief in yimt mb hi to nttvaev
Based on tour dollars per (hirlv 
minute treatment.

Entire Stock
2 0 %  o f f

2 Tables Misc. Items Vl Price 

Hanging Patio Chairs
By Papa San

<3[)allflouJer
iNtenc* Accr.soatts and  design

272-5377

Sj /̂tessions (D̂  SJiW,
Uke Clocks uA/tc

<x fo h  ^D oy

^ J ts o n a C ig e d  ^ y  Sm bity

(Tlendftitc 4dt)
Open 10-5:30 Mon-Sat

Expressions
" 272-5393

Figure Perfection Salons International

119E. Ave.C 272-4591

Now In Stock
Laundry Bags

For Trips, Camp, & Graduation

Caps & Cap Transfers
Little Girlg Shirtg Now Here!

(New Transfers Weekly)

The Tradewinds Plaza Merchants
Invite You To Come 
View The Paintings 
Of the Muleshoe Art 

Association’s Spring 
Exhibit April 25

Through May 2 .

800 W. Amer. Blvd.

Special Spring Sale
^  Off One Rack
(Sale Startg April 25)

Register For Gift Certificate

c,.
°<T £?ruym«/i, jfinc. 

272-5180

s
A *

Indian Earth Blush 
Re*. *14- ?105°

Aloe Body Lotion *495
Suntan Lotion Nowin Stock 

Sign Up For Free FacialfyPfm
272-5121

Come In & View
The Winners

Of The

Muleshoe Art Association 
Spring Exhibit

StaMy’s c_A/it Stack
272-4902

Come In During The 
Exhibit & Check Out 

Our Specials.
New Party Supplies Are 

Arriving Daily,



Muleshoe Twisters 
Attend Invitational

Twelve gymnasts from 
Hawkins and Purdy School 
of Dance and Gymnastics 
attended an invitational 
meet held in Garden City, 
Kansas over the Easter 
weekend.

Eight states were repre­
sented at this mid America 
Invitational. States repre­
sented were Georgia, 
Texas, Iowa, Kansas. 
Colorado, New Mexico, 
Oklahoma and Nebraska.

All gymnasts competed 
on six pieces of equipment, 
the still rings, floor ex­
ercise, vault, parallel bars, 
pommel horse, and the 
horizontal bar.

Three Muleshoe boys 
competed in the seven to 
nine year old group. They 
were A.J. Liles, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Liles; Cooper 
Black, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Clifford Black; and Kevin 
King, son of Mr. and Mrs, 
Max King.

Kevin placed fifth on the 
pommel horse. In the

Baptist To 
Hold 32 nd 
Annual Meeting

Rev. Brock Sanders, the 
pastor of Richland Hills 
Baptist Church in Mule­
shoe, announces that the 
Baptist Missionary Associ­
ation of America will hold 
its 32nd Annual Meeting 
on April 27-29, 1981 at the 
Mississippi Coast Coliseum 
and Convention Center in 
Biloxi, Mississippi.

The BMA of America is 
made up of 1,474 churches 
with 226,000 members in 
29 states with headquar­
ters in Little Rock, Arkan­
sas. The Association sup­
ports missionaries in 17 
countries.

Rev. James Schoenrock, 
Assistant Director of Mis­
sions for the BMA of 
America and former pastor 
of Central Baptist Church 
in Lubbock, will deliver the 
annual sermon on Monday 
evening at 7:00 p.m.

This annual meeting will 
be a time for business 
decisions to be made and 
missionaries to be elected. 
Various groups and com­
mittees will meet on Tues­
day, April 28, with most 
general business matters 
handled on Tuesday eve­
ning and during the gener­
al session on Wednesday.

Others chosen as mes­
sengers to represent Rich­
land Hills Baptist Church 
are Mrs. Peggy Sanders 
and Mr. and Mrs. J.T. 
Eubanks.

seven to nine year old age 
division the Muleshoe 
Twisters placed fourth a- 
mong the eight states rep­
resented. Eighteen teams 
competed in the meet.

Sic Muleshoe boys com­
peted in the 10-12 year old 
age group. They were 
Michael Angeley, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Ken Ange­
ley; Todd Bessire, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Travis Bes­
sire; Wes Hanks, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth 
Hanks; Lance King, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Max King; 
Winston Stice, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Kenneth Stice; 
and Greg Young, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Jim Young.

“ These boys were up

House-To-House 
Drive To Be 
Conducted In May

Mrs. Tom Jinks of 
Muleshoe will lead Bell­
ringer workers in a house- 
to-house drive during May, 
Mental Health Month.

Mrs. Jinks will be calling 
on others in the community 
to assist with the or­
ganization and working of 
the drive. All citizens are 
called upon to aid in this 
drive to benefit the fight 
against mental illness and 
the improved care for the 
mentally ill.

“ Proceeds will benefit 
the Mental Health asso­
ciation in Texas” said Al 
St.Peter, state President of 
the voluntary citizens' as­
sociation.

As a non-govemmental 
agency, the association can 
and does speak for the 
consumer-the person who 
needs professional help for 
an emotional disturbance.

The number one goal of 
the association for 1981 is. i n  5
to impfQve the care for 
discharged long term men­
tally disabled persons. The 
association is promoting 
self-help groups for 
families of patients and for 
former mental health cli­
ents.

“ The association is a 
moving force to get ser­
vices established where 
there are none. It also 
serves as a monitoring 
agency to see that 
treatment services are do­
ing what they were set up 
to do,” said President St. 
Peter.

No Hurry
Even those most eager 

to go to Heaven postpone 
the trip as long as pos­
sible.

-Republican. Emitsburg.

IkOPCOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOO&OOPCOOOPOOOCOCOOOO^i

Make It A 
Western 

Mother’s Day

ees WESTERN WEAR Inc.

against some stiff compe­
tition," Mrs. Hawkins 
said. “ They did very
well."

In the 13-15 year old 
division three Muleshoe 
boys competed. They were 
Brett King, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Max King; Van

Gregory, son of Dr. and 
Mrs. Jerry Gregory; and 
Jay Hawkins, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Richard 
Hawkins.

“ A trip to the Garden 
City Zoo was taken early 
one morning,” Mrs. Haw­
kins continued, “ one of the

zoo’s elk became attached 
to the Muleshoe gymnasts 
and made the visit quite an 
interesting one.”

Parents and coaches at­
tending the gymnasts were 
Phyllis Angeley, Richard 
and Sherri Hawkins and 
Coach Drew Oberbeck.
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321 MAIN MULESHOE OPEN 9 TO6
SALE PRICES GOOD MONDAY 7 

TO WEDNESDAY ONLY!

l o n i j L
c  r a n  t  h  o  n  v  c o

ATTEND KANSAS MEET.....Boys from Hawkins and Purdy’s School of Dance and 
Gymnastics attended an invitational meet recently in Garden City, Kansas. Pictured, Coach 
Dres Oberbeck in the back; back row from left, Brett King, Michael Angeley, Greg Young, 
Wes Hanks, Winston Stice, and Jay Hawkins; front row from left, A.J. Liles, Kevin King, 
Lance King, Todd Bessire, Cooper Black, and Van Gregory.

EN D -0F-TH E-M 0N TH  STOCK 
REDUCTION  SA V IN G S  N O W .....

WHO KNOWS!
1. Who is the U.S. 

Treasurer?
2. Where is the Welland 
Canal?
3. Where is the Gobi 
desert?
4. Name the highest city 
in the U.S.
5. For whom was Wash­
ington. District of Colum­
bia named?
6. Who was the 30th U.S. 
president?
7. What constitutes the 
American Bill of Rights?
8. What is an erg?
9. How many Fridays the
Answers To W ho  Knows
1. Azie Taylor Morton.
1. On the Niagara River.
3. Mongolia and China.
4. Leadville. Col.. 10,200 
ft.
5. George W ashington 
and Christopher Colum­
bus.
6. Calvin Coolidge.
7. The first ten amend­
ments to the Constitution.
8. A unit of electrical 
energy.
9. One. June._______ __

PROM 
TIM E IS
Time to celebrate the end of one 
era and the beginning of a new 
lifestyle.

Whatever the tempo, keep 
pace with an up-beat col­
lection of formal wear 
from Skeffington'a.

Classic and contemporary 
designs in a vast range of 
colorings to match or com­
pliment her gown.

You'll be both comfortable 
and carefree thanks to 
Skeffington’s tine tailoring 
and perfect fit.

. V . . . . .  .

Come in early and reserve 
the tua that’s just right 
for you.

Available for rental at

9

I
Tuxedo
Rental

228 Main

JWbe/tteon's Shop 
9fo/t j\im 272-8000

QJouft QUeddtng
QJou QVant $ t rjo Special

QAie <3oo.

Qjou/i u/ec(c(ing photog/tapta 
a/ic taugiabfe momentos ojj youft 
speciaf day. tfiml ttam 

to a tkm to us.

Q M e n  you b o o t  youA w edding with us 

tve*^ give you a  h/iidoA poAt/wit 

setting absodutedy j/tee.

C
oUp a eompCrtp (W 

wwtftinq ntatiounty.
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OFF REG ULAR  PRICE 

ON THE FOLLOW ING  ITEM S..... .

***  MENS WEAR ***
Entire stock M E N S  DRESS SH IRTS 
Entire stock M E N S  KN IT  SH IRTS 

i Mens Western STRAW  HATS

Elegant PU RR  SUEDE BLAZERS 
Mens H A G G A R  C O O R D IN ATE  SU ITS 

Entire Stock M EN S  H A G G A R  A N D  
LEVI DRESS SLACKS *

*** LADIES WEAR ***
Entire Stock Over 1,000 To Choose From 

LADIES & JUNIORS TOPS AND BLOUSES

Entire Stock LADIES & JR . SWIMWEAR 
LADIES PYKETTE FASHION COORDINATES

***  CHILDREN'S ***
Entire Stock Boys and Girl's

TOPS, SHIRTS, and BLOUSES

***  SHOES ***
EntireStock LAD IES DRESS SHOES 

Select Group LAD IES  S U M M E R  SA N D A LS  

G IRLS DRESS SHOES A N D  SA N D A LS  

M E N SH U SH P U P P IE S  A N D  G R IZZL IES

^ F A B R I C S  & ACCESSORIES***
EntireStock SIMPLICITY AND McCALLS 

EntireStock SEWING NOTIONS 
Entire Stock PLAYTEX BRAS & GIRDLES 

HANES HOSE AND UNDERALLS

f/n i/io n i/L
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Roundup...
Cont. From Page i

school May 1, so that 
kindergarten teachers will 
be available to enroll the 
new students and talk to 
parents.

All parents of children 
who will be five years old 
on or before September 1, 
1981, are encouraged and 
urged to enroll the children 
on May 1, so plans can be 
completed for the fall term 
1981-82.

If you have questions or 
know of an eligible child, 
please contact Milton Oyler 
principal at Neal B. Dill- 
man Elementary School, 
telephone 272-4313.

MX...
Cont. From Page 1

analysis and funding.
Several who want the 

MX to be located in this 
area were in attendance at 
the hearings but did not 
voice their opinion. The 
Govis City Commission 
and members of the Com­
mittee of 50 have publically 
expressed their approval.

Sabra Watson, wife of an 
area farmer, stated: “We 
have heard the Committe 
of 50 wants it here, but we 
have not heard from them 
at any of these hearings. 
They are eighter ashamed 
of their feelings or don’t 
have the guts to voice their 
opinions. All they have in 
their eyes are dollar 
signs.”

* * * *

Medicine has made 
progress in the past fifty 
years. People live longer
even if it does cost more.

* * * *

Muleshoe, Texas, Sunday, April 26, 1981

Police Report

A warrant was issued 
April 21 for criminal mis­
chief. A glass was broken 
in an automobile.

A charge of disorderly 
conduct was also made and 
a $50 bond was posted.

Holmes...
Cont. From Page 1

A teletype was received 
from Los Angeles County 
on November 14 stating 
Ms. Holmes had been ar­
rested on local charges. 
She was extradited to 
Muleshoe accompanied by 
Hal Bynum, deputy sheriff, 
on March 31.

Ms. Holmes co-horts in 
the robbery were sen­
tenced to 90 and 60 years.

Farmers...
Cont. From Page 1 
‘‘most hay looking excel­
lent and growing out 
well.” There is a problem 
with insects and some 
spraying for worms has 
begun.

In Maple area farmers 
have received 3 to 4 inches 
generally. Bill Hodnett, a 
farmer in this community 
said, “ The ground is very 
wet now, but enough rain 
has been received to prob­
ably begin planting.”

The Bula Community 
has received from 1 to l '/a 
inches of rain, comparitivly 
light for some other areas 
in the county. Bennie 
Claunch at Claunch Gin 
reported that “ moisture 
has been met but another 1 
to l'/j inches is needed to 
plant on.” He further sta­

ted, “ Farmers’ attitudes 
are much better and opti­
mistic since the rains."

Lazbuddie, Lariat and 
Pleasant Valley communi­
ties seem to have been 
shorted, so far. With total 
rains in these areas rang­
ing from 3/4 to 1 4/10 
inches of rain. In Pleasant 
Valley, irrigated areas, 
com is up and looks good. 
One farmer expressed the 
“ thankfulness of not hav­
ing to water up his com." 
Another added, "If 
another couple of inches 
would fall prior to June, 
the cotton land would be in
excellent shape for plant-
' _ *» mg.

Ronnie Holt, another 
farmer in the Pleasant Val­
ley Community reported 
“ corn is up and all we 
need is warm weather.”

Lazbuddie at this time 
remains relatively dry. 
Corn is planted, but not 
up. Wheat looks a little 
better now as well as 
pasture land. However, 
another 2-4 inches is badly 
needed.

Warren Givens, who 
farms east of Muleshoe on 
the Plainview Highway, 
reported approximately “ 1 
and 1/10 general rain, with 
wheat, hay and pasture 
coming back.” Givens also 
reported weavils and 
grasshoppers beginning to 
hatch out now.

All in all, it would stem 
that the outlook for Bailey 
County has greatly im­
proved, along with 
farmers’ spirits and the 
area will be a virtual bee­
hive of activity within the 
next week and increase 
along with additional rains 
hoped for.

Plainview 
Overhead Door 

Announces
Don Terrell

FREE
FREE
FREE

Mileage
Estimates
Installation
(on doors or openers of 

cetain am oun t)

★  Call (806)293-877 ★
Garage Door Parts & Repairs 

Garage Door Opener Installations 
Guaranteed Work 

Warranties 1 year labor & material
Commercial
Service

Residential
Sales

Night -  Day
Genie Garage Door Operators

Please Call Today
HAND DIPPED 

ICECREAM

$

C rUsh 

Coke

FOUNTAIN
DRINKS

Can....

i  Sprite

Dr. G s

Tab

Mello
Velio

^e sca

AM...
Cont. From Page 1

Easter weekend visitors 
in the home of the Charles 
Farmer’s were Mr. and 
Mrs. Gaude Collins and 
Justin Ray of North Platte, 
Nebraska. Mrs. Collins is 
the former Sharia Farmer. 

••••*

The Renewers Sunday 
School Gass of the First 
United Methodist Church 
will be sponsoring a bake 
sale for the Mitch Autrey 
love fund. It will be held 
Saturday, May 9 at Cash­
way, Pay N Save and Shop 
Rite grocery stores. All 
proceeds from the bake 
sale will be given to the 
Autrey family to help with 
expenses since Mitch’s ac­
cident.

The Three Way High 
School and Junior High 
Athletic Banquet has been 
set for May 5 in the 
cafeteria.

••* * *

The Art Association 
show exhibits at the 
Tradewinds Plaza may be 
viewed from April 27 to 
May 2. This show features 
oils, acrylics and water 
colors by local and area 
artists.

Local...
Cont. From Page 1 
TCCA shows based upon 
the number of steers in 
their class and how high 
they place in the class. At 
the end of the show year, 
following the Houston 
Livestock Show, the mem­
ber with the highest num­
ber of points in each breed 
division is awarded the 
Championship for the year. 
Each champion receives a 
gold and silver trophy belt 
buckle.

“ We are very proud of 
our TCCA Cahmpions," 
stated TCCA founder Billy 
W. Rash of Texas City. 
“ They worked bery hard to 
win their respective cham­
pionships and deserve a lot 
of credit.”

Another Bailey County 
4-H’er, Jerry L. Gleason 
from Muleshoe, son of Dr. 
and Mrs. Jerry Gleason, 
was the winner of the 
Polled Hereford Division in 
Texas Club Calf Associa­
tion competition for 
1980-81 according to TCCA 
founder Billy W. Rash.

Gleason accumulated 
more points in the Polled 
Hereford Division than any 
other TCCA member in the 
association’s eight sanc­
tioned shows.

In addition to coping the 
Polled Hereford title, Jerry 
also exhibited the Reserve 
Champion Simmental Steer 
at the San Antonio Live­
stock Show in 1981.

The Texas Club Calf 
Association awards points 
tom members who place 
their steers at sanctioned 
TCCA shows. At the end of 
the Association year, the 
member with the greatest 
number of points in each 
breed division is awarded 
the belt buckle for the 
year. Gleason is also a 
charter member of the 
TCCA.

1981 R ebate Checks D own  
For A pril - Up For Year
State Comptroller Bob 

Bullock Thursday said 
Houston was not among a 
list of nearly 1,000 Texas 
cities to receive April re­
bates of the one percent 
city sales tax.

Bullock said he is hold­
ing a $5.5 million city sales 
tax rebate for Houston un­
til the city clears up a 
$287,699 debt owed to the 
state as the result of an 
audit of interstate highway 
traffice fines collected in 
the city that were not 
turned over to the state.

Not counting the check 
due Houston, April rebates 
totaled $18.3 million, com­
pared to $24 million in 
rebates handed back to 
pities in April of 1980.

Total rebates this calen­
dar year to Texas cities 
reached $180.8 million, a- 
bout 14 percent more than 
cities took in during the 
first four months last year.

State law allows Bullock 
to withhold checks from 
the state to persons in­
debted to the state.

"The results of the audit 
-from June of 1975 
through March of 1980- 
are final and have been for 
the past nine months and 
the city’s lackadaisical at­
titude about this debt has 
been beyond belief,”  Bul­
lock said.

Bullock said he notified 
the city last month that he 
planned to withhold city 
payments if the debt was 
not cleared and that the 
city hasn’t even bothered 
to acknowledge the letter.

“ 1 don’t think this will 
bankrupt the city, but I 
think we’ll definitely get 
their attention about this 
liability,” Bullock said.

For 1981, Muleshoe has 
received $56,734.33 which 
shows a 14 percent in­
crease of $7,064.54 over

Dancin’ People 
Thrill Students

Over eight hundred 
Muleshoe K-5 graders ex­
claimed at the graceful 
movements, thrilled at the 
dancing animals and sachs, 
and joined in on simple 
dance movements as 
Dancin' People performed 
in Muleshoe Thursday.

Part of the Lone Ballet 
Company, the nine mem­
ber group captured the 
attention of the school 
children with samples of all 
kinds of dance; ballet, jazz, 
pantomine, gymnastics and 
others.

The Epsilon Delta Chap­

ter of Epsilon Sigma Alpha 
sponsored the group from 
Canyon which is under the 
direction of Alex Hess, 
instructor in dance at West 
Texas State University.

In a professional per­
formance the 15-19 year 
old dancers sought not only 
to show the different types 
of dancing but also teach 
timing, rhythm and emo­
tions through dance.

Sponsored by the Na­
tional Endowment of the 
Arts, the group will dedi­
cate the Amphitheatre on 
the shores of Lake Meri- 
dith in Fritch.

the $49,669.79 this time in 
1980. Rebates are down for 
the April period some 
$1,449 from 1980, with 
1981 total showing 
$4,799.64 this period as 
compared to April 1980 
total of $6,248.71.

Our neighboring town of 
Morton shows a 5 percent 
increase, with 1981 pay- 
men's in the amount of 
$14,520 as compared to 
$13,793 in 1980. Morton 
also shows a small monthly 
increase of this period of 
$186.00. Net payments for 
the 1981 period are $1393 
as compared to $1,207 in 
April of 1980.

A 7 percent increase in 
tax rebates is shown for 
Friona. They are, however, 
down in net payments for 
this period; showing 
$3,725.39 for 81 against 
$3,635.93 in 1980. Friona is 
up for the year’s period 
from $23,239.35 in March 
1980, increased to 
$24,944.59 in 1981.

Fort Worth’s rebates are 
up some 10 percent over­
all. However, the net pay­
ment for the 1981 period 
shows $818,163.85 as com­
pared to $853,624.76 for 
1980. 1981 payments to 
date are $6,854,165.00, up 
from last year’s total of 
$6,490,211.59 in this 
period.

★ ★
May Medicine
Show Scheduled 
By Chamber

For the third consecutive 
year, Tommy Scott’s Old 
Time Medicine Show is 
scheduled to appear at the 
Bailey County Civic Center 
at 7:30 p.m. on Friday, 
May 1. The Medicine Show 
billed as the last of it’s 
kind, has been featured on 
PBS and “ On The Road” 
with Charles Kuralt on 
CBS. The show is a variety 
of music and comedy in the 
style of vaudeville.

“ This show is one which 
has a little of everything, 
especially for the children 
in the audience,” accor­
ding to John Gulley, Man­
ager of the Muleshoe 
Chamber of Commerce and 
Agriculture. The Chamber 
is sponsoring the show.

Tickets for the Old Time 
Medicine Show are avail­
able at the Chamber office 
in City Hall at 215 South 
First for $3.00 each. Many 
civic-minded merchants in 
Muleshoe have purchased 
free coupons which may be 
redeemed at the door on 
the night of the perfor­
mance.

Time For Yard Work 
Don's Backhoe Service

DITCHES BASEMENTS FOOTINGS 
SEPTIC TANKS DUMP TRUCK 

GRADE TRACTOR

9 Don Copley lOp-***

Well go to bat for you 
anytime you have 

a financial problem.
Our business is finance and we know our business. 

We can give you sound advice and help you 

get your finances back on solid ground.

1st National Bank
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Approval Sought 
By Trans western 
To Expand

Texas Eastern an­
nounced that Transwestern 
Pipeline Company, a sub­
sidiary, has requested 
Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission approval to ‘ 
construct S16.3 million in 
gas compressor and related 
facilities along the Com­
pany’s 24 inch Panhandle 
Lateral. Capacity of the 
line would be increased by 
approximately 100 million 
cubic feet a day, allowing 
the Company to accommo­
date increasing supplies in 
the Panhandle producing 
areas of Texas and Okla­
homa.

Construction would add 
two new compressor sta­
tions in Roosevelt County,
New Mexico, and Deaf 
Smith County, Texas. A 
compressor unit would also 
be added at an existing 
station in Gray County, 
Texas.
Mt MIHUtE SMUTS QUIZ
1. What year did Bob Sea- 
gren win the Olympic Pole 
Vault?
2. Who won the Bing Crosby 
National Pro-Am Golf Tour­
nament?
3. Who won the NBA All- 
Star Game?
4. What is Roger Bannister 
best known for?

Arsvms To Sports Qiiz
1. 1968, 17 feet 8 '/i inches.
2. George Burns.
3. East 144, West 136.
4. He ran the first sub 4- 
minute mile.

West Plains 
Medical Center 

Report
i B i l H N SALEFARM AND RANCH SUPPLYADMITTED

April 20, Myrtle Wells, Jo 
Ann McDonald, Iva Jean 
Vinson, Inez Flores, Jen­
nifer Sebring, Christopher 
Stone, Stephanie Barrett, 
Floyd Ruthardt 
April 21, Darlene Caldwell, 
Betta Lancaster, Jo Donna 
Terry, Johnny Zapata 
April 22, Manuel Soto, 
Bobby Tucker, Cindy Per­
kins, Delter Wenner, Nor­
ma Bellar, Elena Garcia, 
Anna Gutierrez, Maria 
Carrion

Prices Good 
Thru M ay 9 th  81

SAVE UP 
TO 20%
OFF OUR

REG. LOW PRICES

STORE HOURS:
7:30  -  5:30

Monday - Saturday

Complete
Farm
Store

SO V ERE IG N  A RA M ID  
BELTED  RADIAL  

PO LYESTER/ARAM ID  
W HITEW ALL

DISMISSED
April 20, Liz Morris and 
baby boy, Haney Poynor, 
Alex Aguirre, Tina Collins, 
Linda Burton and baby 
boy, Hugh Gore, Gilbert 
Tuesada, Katie Roubinek, 
Cruz Rodriguez, Dana Ar­
nold, Michael Bomer, Elo- 
ise Gray, Jerry Mudgett, 
Henry Landers 
April 21, Lynn Thompson. 
Socorro Duardiola, Bonnie 
Harlin, Rita Pidilla, Bill 
Harmon, Iva Vinson, Floyd 
Ruthardt
April 22, Christopher 
Stone, Ophilia Billington, 
Jo Donna Terry, Golma 
Hubbell, Shawnda Phipps 
April 23, Bapata Johnny, 
Myrtle Lee, Elma Castillo, 
Stephanie Barrett

C o n s tru c te d  w ith 2 b e lts  of th e  am azinq  new  m iracle  fiber ARAMID ARAMID is 
s tro n g e r th a n  s teel, p o u n d  for p o u n d  T he body is built w ith p o ly e s te r  co rd  p lies tha t 
run  radially from  b ead  to  b ead  T h e se  p o ly es te r body  p lies a b so rb  b u m p s an d  road  
sh o ck  O rig inal eq u ip m en t sidew all.

9  { \ \ \ v /  r a d i a l  c r - io
9 ? ' J f  PO LYESTER/G LASS

O.E. WHITEWALL

'  STOCK NO
61C60 . .
61C66 . .
61C45 . .
61C49 . . ,
61C64 . .

P o ly es te r  a n d  g la ss  c o n s tru c tio n  w ith an  ag g re ss iv e  trea d  design  
p e r lo rm a n c e  an d  g o o d  looks O rig inal eq u ip m en t sidew all

STOCK NO. SIZE 
23C45 . . .  P2157SR15 
23C49 . . .  P22575R15 
23C64 . . . .  P2357R15

SPECIAL
43.70
45.84
45.15
46.40
49.50

G rea t radial tire

ALL SEASON STEEL BELTED RADIAL
SUE REG. SALE FET
P16580R13..............  41.17 33.89 1.89
P1857R13 ............... 44.65 36.75 2.02
P18575R14............... 50.41 41.50 2.19
P19575R14..............  51.25 41.75 2.33
P20575R14............  54.67 45.00 2.48
P21575R14..............  57.62 47.75 2.58
P22575R14..............  59.34 50.75 2.81
P20575R15..............  56.08 46.25 2.57
P21575R15...............  59.70 48.75 2.75
P22575R15...............  61.57 51.75 2.93
P23575R15...............  65 89 53.75 3.11

C o n s tru c te d  w ith 2 b e lts  oi s tee l c o rd  an d  2 to u g h  bo d y  p lies of F o ly es te r C o rd  G oo  
trac tio n  on  bo th  w et an d  dry  p av e m e n t In m any  c a s e s  it e lim in a te s  w inter tii 
ch a n g eo v e r.

PREM IER  IV 
PO LYESTER/STEEL  

W HITEW ALLNUMBER
A78 13. . 
B78 13. 
C78 13. 
C78-14. 
078 14. 
E78 14 
F78 14. 
G78 14 
H78 14. 
G78 15. 
H78 15. 
178 15 . 
178-15.

T he 4 ply p o ly e s te r  co rd  body  re s is ts  im 
softer, q u ie te r  rid e  with no  ro ad  w hine or

*  FREE MOUNTING *  FREE BALANCING
★ NO-TRADE REQUIRED
it FULL ROAD HAZARD GUARANTEE 
if OPTIONAL COMPUTER BALANCE ONLY $3.50 EA

JET STAR 120 
PO LYESTER  C O R D  

.85” W HITEW ALL

BATTERY SPECIAL
Cordovan G roup 24 

36 M on th  W a rra n ty W ide BedLOCAL ARTIST EXHIBITS WORK..... Velma Davis of
Muleshoe is shown with a water color portrait she has 
entered in the current art show. All exhibits may be 
viewed from April 27 to May 2. Winners will be announced 
in Thursday’s paper.

Special

Price Special Low Pirce

Start with 
more control

Finish with 
more cotton.
TEMIK" 15G

Party perfect
Gott’s 1-Gallon Cooler go 

anywhere.

3 Colors Available T 9 «  
REE. 9.75 SPECIAL #

•  Keeps beverages 
cool for hours

•  Fast flow faucet ^
for easy pouring v l V r > (  V

•  Integrally m olded handle
in lid for easy carrying L __ ;

•  Splash seal keeps beverages L _ j  

from spilling
•  Wide m outh opening for quick cleaning
•  3 year warranty

A LDICA RB PEST IC ID E

An insecticide, a mlticide, and ALKALINE
BATTERIESRAYOVACa nematicide

with just one application of granular

TEMIK(R) aldicarb pesticide at plant

Lng. Protects up to 10 weeks against

thrips and aphids, spider mites, flea

hoppers, plant bugs including lygus P re  p a c k a g e d  on  c a rd s .  S ixes A A  
C, D , *  V o lt.

Your p O (
Choice O T

and leafminers. Plus outstanding

control of root-knot and reniform

microscopic soil pestsnematodes
M u rra y  No. 1-21820 

Self P rope lled  

21 " Cut Rear Bag 

Lawn M ow er

that can seriously reduce yields

through root damage
M urray  Riding  
Lawn M ow er FA R M  & RANCH  SU PPLYRIVERSIDE CHEMICAL CO 

West Highway 84
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How To Get Credit - - And Keep It
Getting credit and keep­

ing it is challenging-and 
possible, one specialist in­
sists.

Building a credit record 
poses special problems for 
women and teens-but 
there are several ways to 
establish credit in your 
own name-and keep it, 
says Bonnie Piernot.

Mrs. Piernot is a family 
resource management spe­
cialist on the home econo­
mics staff of the Texas 
Agricultural Extension 
Service, The Texas A&M 
University System.

Credit is important in 
today’s credit-oriented 
economy-for acquiring 
"luxuries” in most cases 
and even for necessities in 
some cases, the speicalist 
says.
ESTABLISHING CREDIT

To establish credit in 
your own name, first open 
checking and savings ac­
counts at a local bank.

This will set up your 
financial identity. It also 
may provide you with ac­
cess to such sources of 
credit as bank credit cards, 
overdraft checking privi­
leges and personal loans.

Next, apply for a 
"small” personal loan-use 
your savings account as 
"security."

Cost of such a loan is 
usually low. And because 
this loan -- a personal loan 
-  may be fully secured by 
your savings account, it 
may be easier to obtain 
than other forms of credit.

After you pay off the 
loan, you can use this 
credit history to qualify for 
additional sources of 
credit.

Another way to establish 
credit is to apply at local 
retail stores for small a- 
mounts of installment
credit.

Once you’ve paid off the 
charge account, again, you 
can use that history to 
obtain additional credit.

KEEPING CREDIT
Remember two things in 

building a credit record.
First, be extra careful 

about making payments on 
time, since doing so will 
help you get credit and 
keep it.

Second, don’t abuse 
credit.

Credit improperly han­
dled can cause you more

problems than not having
it.
YOUR RIGHT TO KNOW

finally, you have the 
right to know what your 
credit record is.

That wasn’t always true.
Prior to the enactment of 

the federal Fair Credit Re­
porting Act in 1970, credit 
records were rather mys­
terious things, Mrs. Pier­
not says.

Credit reporting agen­
cies refused to reveal the 
contents of their records to 
consumers, and there was 
no requirement that er­
roneous reports be correc­
ted.

The Fair Credit Report­
ing Act represents an at­
tempt to solve these prob­
lems and others connected 
with the business of main­
taining credit records, she 
says.

*  • *  •

The reason many 
enterprises fail to go for­
ward is that it is much 
easier to plan to do than to
do.

•  * •  *

It could be said that 
politics is the art of being 
elected and statesm an­
ship is the art of govern­
ing a nation.

• *  • *

NOW WE’VE G O T  THE 
SAVINGS EDGE FOR 
YOU ON IH COM BINES
There's no question whether this is 
the year to trade combines. Because 
the Anniversary Savings deals 
we’re making will have you 
trading tomorrow.

Check out your savings options... 
Red Edge Rebates, Red Power Dollars 
or Waiver of Finance. Each choice 
gives you the option to get the equip­
ment you need today at great savings.

Get a check directly from IH with a 
Red Edge Rebate. Just buy any new. 
self-propelled Axial-Flow Combine we

VH
RED POWER DOLLARS

Model March April
1480, 1470, 
1460, 1440 
1420

$5,450
$3,240

$4,935
$2,725

Waiver of Finance is also available
instead of Red Edge Rebate or Red 
Power Dollars. To qualify, just finance 
through International Harvester Credit 
Corporation for a specified minimum 
number of months and you’ll pay no 
interest until product use season.
See us for complete details.

have in stock before April 30,1981 and 
a Red Edge Rebate check will be on its 
way to you. And the sooner you buy, 
the more you save.

RED EDGE REBATE

Model March April
1480,1470, 
1460, 1440 
1420

$4,200
$2,500

$3,800
$2,100

Or instead of a rebate, you can take 
advantage of Red Power Dollars, that 
are good toward the purchase of any 
new IH equipment or parts.

So if you need the 208 bushel 
capacity of the 1480, or if you've been 
waiting on the 125 bushel capacity 
1420, we're ready to put the Red 
Edge to work in your fields... and the 
IH Savings Edge to work on your 
bottom line

Stop by today for your best product 
selection and best savings selection.
We even have great Red Edge Rebates 
and Red Power Dollars on our new. 
in-stock IH Tractors and selected Hay 
and Forage Equipment.

Wooley International Inc.
INTERNATIONAL
AGRICULTURAL
EQUIPMENT

W.Hwy 84 
272-5514

Red Power Dollars must be used by December 31. 1981.
IH reserves fbe rlgh^to withdraw or modify this program at any «

Three Way 
News

By Mrs. H.W. Garvin

ART ASSOCIATION SHOW.. ...Mary Lee Garrett of Clovis 
is shown here at Tradewinds Plaza observing an oil and 
acrylic portrait done by Gennie Seifert of Clovis. The 
public may observe these paintings from April 27 to May
2 .

Mrs. Bill Dupler and
girls visited the Chuck Du- 
plers in Sundown Tuesday 
evening.

• • • • •

Janie Self and girls from 
Muleshoe spent the week­
end with her parents the 
H.C. Toombs.

Mr. and Mrs. George 
Tyson spent Thursday 
night in Lubbock with their 
daughter, the Tommy Dur- 
hams, and visited their 
son, the Troy Tysons, in 
Levelland Friday.

** * ••

Mr. and Mrs. S.G. Long

ICourthouse
News

MARRIAGE LICENSE 
James Timothy Chesnut of 
Mountain View, California 
and Linda Dianne Nowlen 
of Muleshoe

WARRANTY DEEDS 
Floyd E. Houston, Leo­

nard C. Houston and wife, 
Angie Lee Houston and 
Elbert L. Carly and wife, 
Litta Florene Carly to Ern­
est Ramm and wife, Mary 
Alice Ramm---A Lot, Tract, 
or Parcel of Land situated 
in Baily County, Texas.

Ruby Willman and 
Charlene Ann Hanks, ET, 
Vir, Kenneth Hanks of 
Bailey County, Texas and 
Karen Sue Bessire, ET Vir 
Travis Bessire and Rosa­
lind Kay Campbell, ET Vir 
William Campbell to K.H. 
Buhrman, Marshal Head 
and W.T. Millen as trus­
tees for the Y-L Methodist 
Church of Bailey County, 
Texas-Beginning at a 
point 98 Rods East of the 
(SW) corner of Survey 
Number (83) in Block Y, 
WD & FW Johnson Sub­
division of Bailey County, 
Texas and in and on the 
South boundary line of said 
survey for point beginning.

J.W. Maddox and wife, 
Gladys Maddox to John H. 
Puckett, Jr. and wife, Della 
Puckett-A tract of land out 
of Section (21), Block Y, 
WD & FW Johnson Sub­
division, Bailey County, 
Texas.

COUNTY COURT 
William Todd Allison, Al­
fred Anthony Espinosa, 
Henry Leon Barbour and 
Eddie Jim Overman, Order 
Granting Misdemeanor 
Probation
Mark A. Fried, Carrying a 
Handgun, $150 Fine

DISTRICT COURT 
Prentice Griffiths and 
Mary Coleen Griffiths - DV 
Patricia Morales and Do­
mingo Morales - DV 
Hope Gonzalez and Anto­
nio Gonzalez, Jr. - DV 
Sylvia Casanova and Jesse 
Casanova - DV 
James E. Storie VS Tom 
Clark ETAL - Judgement 
Barry and Young Equip­
ment Company, Inc. VS 
Pat White - Default Judge­
ment * * *

Theories are good 
things if they work.

If Not N.O.W. 
When?

If you haven’t yet combined your savings and checking 
accounts into a Muleshoe State Bank N.O.W. Account, 
you’re losing interest— fast!! The N.O.W. Account acts 
like a regular checking account— there when you need it. 
Open a N.O.W. Account— now and watch your interest 
grow!!

1 MULESHOE 1
1 C* jp 1 STATE BANK 1/1
■ A ,  Member FDIC 272-4561

Making Family Life More Fun
G IF T  G IV IN G IS A SNAP

spent the first part of the 
week in Amarillo and Can­
yon visiting their children. 

•**••
Mr. and Mrs. H.C. 

Toombs were in Lubbock
Saturday shopping.

* * * * *

The community received 
a good rain Saturday mor­
ning with amounts from
l'/i  to Vi inch.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Dupler 

and girls visited the Chuck 
Duplers in Sundown Satur­
day.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Carl Miller 

from Canyon spent the 
weekend with the S.G. 
Longs.

* * * * *

Mr. and Mrs. George 
Tyson entertained the se­
nior citizens in Amherst
Friday night.

*****
Guests in the Bobby 

Kindle home Sunday for 
dinner were Mr. and Mrs.

Robert Kindle, Mr. and 
Mrs. James Kindle and 
family, the Joey Kindle 
family, the Bob Foley fam­
ily, all from Maple and the 
Jerry Damron family from 
Needmore.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Jack 

Furgeson were dinner 
guests in the Jim Green
home Sunday evening.

* « * ••

The Joe Wheelers were 
in Clovis, N.M. Saturday 
shopping.

• • • * •
Abbreviation

S he-I want a shorter skirt 
than the one you showed me.

Clerk-H ave you tried the 
collar departm ent?

Home Definition
W illie (g lan c in g  over 

stock market p ag e)-P a , what 
is "short covering” ?

F a th e r -Y o u r  m o th e r 's  
latest party dress, my son.

Know Her?
Two th in g s  m ake a 

w om an happy--a husb an d  
and someone to compare him 
with.

Test results prove the 
complete performance
ofAsgrowcorn 
hybrids.

A picture like this is a snap if the camera has a built- 
in flash. No fumbling. Just shoot and the m otor­
ized, automatic film  advance lets you snap again 
and again, for the perfect expression you’ll treasure.

If gift-giving is in your 
future, zoom in on a present 
th a t ’s sure to  please: a 
camera will be snapped up 
by June grads, newlyweds, 
or Mom or Pop on their 
annual day.

Particularly a pocket 
camera. It won’t go out of 
vogue—or out of focus. It 
won’t sit idle in a dresser or 
gather dust on the shelf. It’s 
a snap to give, a pleasure to 
receive. Best of all: a pocket 
camera won’t stay long in 
the pocket. Each picture re­
minds the person who re­
ceives your gift of your

thoughtfulness.
You might want to con­

sider one of the small, easy- 
to-use pocket cameras. A 
variety of new models from 
Vivitar, for instance, range 
in price from about $35 to 
$85. Two models—the 830 
and 835—have built-in flash 
and motorized, automatic 
film advance.

You’ll make the memo­
ries of many families—on 
the go and on the grow— 
more memorable with a 
pocket camera for all 
occasions.

{juft
V*asgrow

eftcome grow with asgroWasgwv
RX 90 A Proven Winner
RX 962W White Hybrid With A Wide 
Range Of Adaptation
RX 125W& RX 153 W The Old Standard 
Whites For The High Plains

f o r  f u r t h e r  i n  f o r m a t i o n :  ttennie P irkrell 806-385-3763

Store Hours: 
Mon-Sot. W? 

Son. 1-6

DISCOUNT CENTERS

Q
Lotion

Vaseline Intensive 
Care 
10oz.

Silkience
Shampoo or

Conditioner^ 
7 oz.

PR ICES EFFEC TIVE 
A P R IL  2 6 -2 9

T oothpaste
Gleem 
7oz.

Wax
Johnson Wax 

Kit Paste 12 oz. 
orKit Liquid 16Fl.oz.

Turf 
Builder

Feeds 
4000 Ft.

Tuffies

Trash Bags 3/.2
Ch°*C6ct. -33 gal. 12ct.-11 gal.
8 c t .-30 gal. 20 ct.- 8 gal.

Work Gloves
Wells LaMont A
Brown Jersey M  X  V  
Style 501 & 501B

Rake
Lawn & Leaf 

Reg 2,#

Tennis Shoe
Childrens Oxford Style

Reg 9M $

> Garden Tools
'ĵ  Douglass

Long
Nose Spade - Reg 10” ♦Q88
Long . _ __

Handle Shovel-Reg. 6**

$399Hoe- Reg. 4M

Basket
Round Laundry
BUSize _Reg. 1*7

$119

L *

Tide
Detergent 
Gt. Size

ndry

$ 1 6 9

Dawn
^Dishwashing Liquid 

32 oz.

$148
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[Enochs News
By

Mrs J.D . Bayless

v  b

Brent George and two 
friends, Brian Bemdiman 
and Kelly Foster of Lub­
bock came by Friday after­
noon and stopped to visit 
Brent’s grandparents, the 
E.N. McCalls. They were 
on their way to the Capi- 
tain mountains to spend 
the weekend.

e a se s

Mrs. Joyce Crouch and 
her mother, Mrs. Mary 
Richardson of Levelland 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Jim­
my Richardson and Mrs. 
Dean McBee one day this 
past week. Mrs. Richard­
son remained for a longer 
visit.

ee ee e

Mrs. Edward Crume and 
mother, Mrs. Irene Parker 
and Mrs. J.W. Layton took 
a gift and refreshment and 
had a birthday party for 
their sister and Mrs. Par­
ker’s daughter, Mrs. H.H. 
Snow Wednesday.

eeeee

Dale Nichols was in 
Canyon one day the past 
week and visited his son, 
Mr. and Mrs. Donnie 
Nichols.

eeeee

The rain was great. 
Some received from Vi
inch to an inch.

eeeee

Mrs. Joyce Crouch of 
Levelland and Mrs. Dean 
McBee visited in the J.D. 
Bayless home one after- 
noon last week.

eeeee

Mr. and Mrs. Donnie 
Nichols were guests in the 
Baptist Church Sunday.

j Rev. and Mrs. Charlie 
Shaw of Seminole stopped 
in for a short visit with Mr. 
and Mrs. J.W. Layton Fri­
day afternoon. They were 
enroute to Tucumcari for a 
funeral. ...

eeeee

John Snitker spent 
Easter with his mother, 
Mrs. Carolyn Snitker at

Sunray.
••••a

Guests in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Brown 
last week were their 
daughters, Mr. and Mrs. 
Grady Youngblood and 
children Jona and Stacy 
also Patricia Brown of Ros­
well, N.M. The grand­
children and Patricia spent 
till Friday night with them.

eeeee

Mr. and Mrs. E.N. Mc­
Call were dinner guests in 
the home of their daughtei 
Mr. and Mrs. Robert 
George. They all went out 
to Buffalo Lake in the 
afternoon.

eeeee

Easter guests in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Goldman Stroud were their 
children and grandchildren 
Mr. and Mrs. Harold Pol­
lard and Steve of Enochs, 
Mr. and Mrs. Tommy 
Lewis and children of 
Earth, Mr. and Mrs. Joel 
Sinclair and children of 
Muleshoe, Mr. and Mrs. 
Craig Kirby and daughter 
of Three Way, Mrs. Jimmy 
Dickey and 3 children of 
Lubbock, Mrs. Phillip Bel- 
leavue and Reah of Lub­
bock, Mr. and Mrs. Glyn 
Stroud and children of 
Muleshoe, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Gene Stroud and
children of Dimmitt.

eeeee

Mr. and Mrs. Mike 
Heady and children were 
dinner guests Sunday in 
the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Sid Key.

eeeee

Mrs. Chester Petree, al­
so her sis»ers, Mrs. Gara 
Williamson and Mrs. Au- 
dra Hill of Lubbock visited 
another sister, Mr. and 
Mrs. Melvin Cowart of 
Fort Worth Saturday till 
Tuesday.

eeeee

Company in the home of 
Mrs. Winnie Byars Easter 
Sunday were her children 
and families, Mr. and Mrs. 
Jack .Parr, Dena Sue and 
Tracy of Lubbock Mr. and 
Mrs. Henry Hardaway, 
Tommie Joe and Robert 
and a friend Mike of

Brownfield, Mrs. Randy 
Robinson and Randy Ma- 
chclle of Whitharrel. Mr. 
and Mrs. Tom Byars, Scott 
and Alice of Seminole and 
friends Mr. and Mrs. John 
Gunter of Muleshoe 
stopped in to visit with 
them.

eeeee

Mr. and Mrs. Ray 
Spencer and daughter of 
Friona attended church at 
the Baptist Church and 
was dinner guests in the 
home of her grandparents 
Mr. and Mrs. Clifford 
Snitker, their son, Mr. and 
Mrs. J.C. Snitker and chil­
dren also had dinner with 
them Easter Sunday, 

eeeee

Mr. and Mrs. Gyde 
Price are at home after 
visiting their daughter, 
Mr. and Mrs. Dale 
Wheeler at Houston.

eeeee

Dr. and Mrs. Gerald 
Johnson of Odessa were 
Sunday dinner guests in 
the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
J.E. Layton, Mr. and Mrs. 
J.W. Layton were also 
guests.

eeeee

Mrs. H.H. Snow fell 
outside at the West Plains 
Medical Nursing Home in 
Muleshoe Friday afternoon 
and received bruises and 
cut her right hand bad and 
had to have about 15 stit­
ches took in it.

eeeee

Mr. and Mrs. Jr. Austin, 
Jeff and Stephanie Angel 
of Lubbock visited her 
mother, Mr. and Mrs. 
Johnny Cox Sunday they 
also visited his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Austin, 

eeeee

Rev. and Mrs. Gerald 
Moore of Las Vegas, N.M. 
and daughter, Marsha Ann 
Moore of Albuquerque, N. 
M. spent a night last week 
with her brother, Mr. and 
Mrs. Clifford Snitker. 

eeeee

Tested
No matter how busy a 

man is, he’s never too 
busy to stop and talk 
about how busy he is.

-News, Covington, La.

SAVE 3 WAYS!
•S a ra  up to 4 0 %  on your electric bill

•Improve* oir conditioning efficiency thri •Circulotei boot .te*f winter hr I
summer distribution

or hoot

EXCLUSIVE
PULL CHAIN REVERSE
SWITCH

* 3 YEAR GUARANTEE

Inflation Increasing Costs 
Of Agricultural Production

Bailey County Journal, Muleshoe. Texas, Sunday. April 26, 1981, Page 9

Population Growth Outpaces 
Milk Production in Texas

AUSTlN-"lnflation could 
devasta te  ag ricu ltu re , if 
changes don't come soon," 
Agriculture Commissioner 
R eagan V. Brown said 
recently, citing increases in 
fuel prices, interest rates and 
other production costs.

Brown recently testified 
before the House Committee 
on Agriculture in Washington 
and noted that the first and 
foremost need of agriculture 
at the present time is profit. 
He urged that commodity 
loan prices be set to cover the 
true cost of production on 
included crops plus a fair and 
equitable profit for the 
producer.

“Not only is inflation 
making it difficult for farmers 
to make a profit as costs rise 
faster than commodity prices; 
it is changing the ownership 
patterns of farm and ranch 
land,“ Brown continued.

“ Inflation, at least at 
current levels, is a relatively 
new phenomenon in this 
country and people have only 
recently begun to understand 
i t s  r a m i f i c a t i o n s  f o r  
agriculture," Brown said. "It 
really started to get serious in 
1978 and since then, has just 
tightened the noose."

Brown cited the latest 
f i g u r e s  f r o m  a U S .  
Department of Agriculture 
(USDA) annual report which 
indicated that although costs 
are going up in nearly every 
segment of the production 
cycle, the biggest increases 
stem from higher fuel prices, 
interest rates and fertilizer

prices.
The overall rise in per-acre 

production costs ranged from 
18 percent for cotton to 25.5 
for rice in 1980.

"Corn, sorghum, barley, 
oats, wheat, soybeans and 
p e a n u t s , . . . t h e y ’re  a l l  
increasing in production 
costs," Brown said. "But farm 
and ran c h  p rices have 
increased only marginally.

“According to the latest 
estimates, Americans spend 
the lowest percentage of their 
take-home pay on food than 
any other people in the 
world," Brown said. "We 
spend approximately 14 cents 
out of ever dollar we earn on 
food. But the farmer or 
rancher only sees about 5 
cent... the rest goes to the 
processors and retailers for 
p a c k a g i n g ,  p r o c e s s i n g ,  
shipping and other marketing 
costs."

Brown also stressed the 
importance of explaining to 
the 97 percent of our 
population, the importance of 
an abundant and healthy food 
supply. “It’s vitally important 
that we do everything possible 
to help keep the other 3 
pe r cen t  in a g r i c u l t u r a l  
production, to insure that we 
never have to depend on other 
countries fo r our basic 
foodstuffs," Brown said.

Merely A Suggestion 
Sign in a reducing 

salon’s window: "A word 
to the wide is sufficient.”

-Gtizen, Ashville, N.C.

AUSTIN—Texas dairymen 
have an excellent productivity 
record, reports Agriculture 
Commissioner Reagan V. 
Brown. However, the state's 
booming population has 
created a sharp gap between 
mi l k  p r o d u c t i o n  a n d  
consumption, with much of 
the milk being supplied from 
outside Texas.

"In Texas, milk ouput in 
relation to population has 
dropped sharply, due to the 
tremendous influx of people 
into the state," said Brown. 
"Texas now produces less 
milk per capita than any other 
southern state, and this means 
that there is a market for

much more production within 
the state."

Brown noted that within 
certain geographical areas of 
the state, there are wide 
d i s c r e p a n c i e s  b e t we e n  
production and consumption. 
In 1980, for instance, over 67 
percent of the state's total 
production of raw milk was 
centered in the northeastern 
portion of the state. However, 
only 33 percent of Texas' 
population lives within this 
area.

According to a paper 
presented at a recent meeting 
of the Texas Dairymen's 
Associations in Stephenville, 
a b o u t  o n e - h a l f  o f  the 
population of the southern

region of the U.S now resides 
in T ex as. (T h is  region 
includes Oklahoma, Kansas, 
New Mexico, Missouri and 
A rkansas) The percentage is 
expected to grow to at least S3 
percent over the next nine 
years. Accompanying this 
increase in population is a 
growing demand within the 
state for milk and dairy 
products, which is expected to 
be up by 20 percent over the 
next two decades.

"Due to  many economic 
pressures, the number of 
dairym en in Texas has 
declined steadily, and is now 
down to less than 2,600," said 
Brown. “ Dai rymen have 
improved their productivity 
greatly, but production has 
been outpaced by the state's 
huge population growth."

“IT’S A BIG  J O B ...

Methane Production: 
Is It Economical?

Slowing down the rising costs  of 
anything these days Even your e lec ­
tricity

You ve got som eone working on it lor 
you in the Southwest Southw estern 
Public Service is using Wyoming 
coal to  make electricity in its new 
power plants Because som e of the 
old plants run on fuel that just plain 
costs too much

Electricity could cost a lot more than 
it does But thank goodness it 
doesn 't — because of coal "

The Only Ceiling Fan 
You Reverse by a Pull!

To get air circulation without feeling a draft. 
Allows use in any location . . .  Summer and Winter.

A Brass Fan With Everything
★  POLISHED BRASS *  ANTIQUE BRASS + BRASS ft WHITE * BRONZE

SALE $ 2 7 9 9 5

MFG. SUGG. LIST $465.00

Rising energy costs 
affect poultry producers 
just like everyone else. 
They can, however, take 
advantage of the energy 
potential of thousands of 
chickens. Aided by techno­
logy, 200,000 laying hens 
can generage about 66,000 
cubic feet of methane gas 
every day.

But is the value of 
methane worth the cost to 
produce it?

That issue was ad­
dressed here recently by 
Dr. Edward L. Fulton dur- 
ing~the Texas Commercial 
Egg Clinic. Fulton is an 
associate professor at Tar- 
leton State University, Ste­
phenville, where an an­
aerobic digestion plant has 
been in operation since last 
June.

Anaerobic digestion is a 
process that converts ani­
mal wastes to methane or 
biogas and fertilizer. The 
process also practically 
eliminates odors and flies, 
Fulton explained.

“ The digester at Tar- 
leton was designed to be 
practical for farms and 
ranches in Texas,” Fulton 
said. According to his 
findings, an anaerobic di­
gester would be feasible 
for poultry operations with 

140,000 or more laying 
hens.

Fulton’s research shows 
that gas production for a 
poultry enterprise with
200.000 hens would total
66.000 cubic feet per day. 
Part of that could be used 
to heat the digester, which 
must be kept at 95 degrees 
F. During the winter, that 
would still leave at least 
49,500 cubic of gas or 
29,000,000 BTUs of energy 
per day.

The equivalent amount 
of energy in propane would 
cost $75,766 for a year. 
Natural gas would cost 
about $43,360. According 
to Fulton's figures, con­
struction of an appropriate 

| digester for the operation 
would cost approximately 
281,250.

It is important to 
intergrate the design of a 
digester with the individual 
farm or ranch. “ A 
standard plan or design 
cannot be used on-site in 
an energy-efficient way, 
the anaerobic digester on 
that farm is too large,” 
Fulton said.

Besides being a direct 
energy source for heating

things to consider. Fulton
said the feasibility of 
anaerobic digestion be­
comes more economical as 
the cost of energy goes up 
and other methods of 
waste disposal become 
more of a problem.

The Commercial Egg 
Clinic was sponsored by 
the Texas Agricultural Ex­
tension Service and the 
Texas Agricultural Ex­
periment Station in co­
operation with industry 
groups.

, DELUXE CAROUSEL 
I MICROWAVE OVEN

349”
It turns

CAROUSEL TURNTABLE 
Assures consistent, even cooking 
the food so you don’t have to 
SUPER LARGE 1.53 CU. FT OVEN CAVITY.
35 MINUTE TIMER
INFINITE COOKING CONTROLS - WITH _  _
5 PRE-SET POSITIONS. Presto* Control Master* heat control maintains uni-

' l,.“ blzc sl,4rP £»roi,,el Microwave w/Auto jorm ^eat from warm to 400®. Detaches for submer-
Cloctiao 5ible cleani"9 in 8ink or disbwasher
Stan. Temperature read-out shows internal temper- p™ pake, roast, stew or braise Cook a complete 
Aturc of ftxxls when probe u  used. Variable cooking Hm npr for uo  to  o io h t— A utom atically 
Control Sy stem 3 sequence programming. Defrosts P 'nner ,0 r up  10 a u ,o m a ,lc a "y
automatically w/touch-set of Defrost pad. Wood- 
grained Cabinet-Cavity Side; 1.21 cubic feet- 
G50 Watts, Outside: 24 5/8" x 15 3/4" x 17”. K T M l

Sunbeam

11525
FOOD
PROCESSOR
Powerful, direct-drive motor 
2V» qt. capacity Safety inter­
lock switch. Includes: cutting 
processing bled, shredding 
disc, sliqng  disc, mixing 
btede & spatula 14-11

SELECTED 
APPLIANCES 
-15%  OFF

Carouitl Alocard, th« Micron*** Oven »ith
Conputer Control - __

ilaply put pr* -pro»r.«*d card la 
touch "Start". th* Al»cor4 doe*

rotate* th* food »o r«* don't

CAROUSE!
MICROWAVE OVEN

Turntable assures consistent, even-cooking and 
programed card system adjusts cooking time for 
weight, quantity or proportions. Complete with 
temperature probe which automatically turns off at 
desired food temperature and variable cooking

•discard, 
the tlo t, 
the rest.

‘Carousel, 
hive ta.

•Auto-Touch. Sharp'* Micro-procaaaor offar* 
Touch Control of A ll Ftnctions.

•Frobo. Provide* Increased F lexib ility  I  
Accuracy aith Exact Readout of Teeperatur* 
a* Food Cooks *111 Turn Ovm Off or 
Maintain Specific Teapertture.

•Variable Cooking Control*, S^arat* Setting* 
for Detroit. Slam*. «o*»t, Full-Fouar S Hold.

•Auto-Start, Turn* the Oran on Autoeatically. 
•AudVMe Ton* Sound* each tie* Cooking 

in*truction 1* Entarad.
•Touch Senior* Control a ll Cooking Operation* 
Electronically.

•Electronic Digital kood-Out of Cooking Node, 
To^ierxtur*, Tien of Day, Eltpiad Cooking 
Tina, Frogran I  Mancry Finetion*.

•Super Urge I.S ) cu f t .  Oven Capacity.

1 3 8 9

G.E.
ELECTRIC
Razor sharp 9

KNIFE
inch stainless
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Our nation is witnessing a building boom, such as 
has never before been seen. Every d&y new fdunda- 
tions are being dug and laid. Any builder will tell 
you that it takes a firm foundation to support 
today’s skyscraper.

Our Lord, in His sermon on the mount, compared 
those that heed His word, to the wise man that built 
his house upon a rock, and those that did not heed 
His word to the foolish man that built his house 
upon sand and it was washed away.

Build your house upon a rock. . .  Attend church 
regularly.

Tltt (hutch n Ml oppotntfd OfMKr * Mm outM ter ipttodmf It* kr»wl«J,i of Nit Im 
lor inn ntf d Hit Nttnand lot mon t« rrtponl t« that Ion by lomf hit noi|hbor Without 
Mm iroundinf in tho Ion ol God. no (onimmnl or toooty or uoy ol lilt arill long 
porttntt ond Hit Irndorm whtth «t hold to door will tnirttobly ptmh Thtttlort, trm 
Irom ■ trifith poml ol rinr. on* thould wfport Ih# (hunh lot tht tohi ol rht wtlforr
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FESTIVITIES AT REESE AIR FORCE BASE.....Reese Air Force Base will sponsor its 
annual Open House on Sunday, May 10. The festivities will honor Reese’s thirty-second 
year of service as an active Air Force base. The event will offer a variety of activities that 
will be of interest to people of all ages. ------------

T k e .Sandhills
Philosopher

Editor’s note: The Sand­
hills Philosopher on his 
Johnson grass farm on 
Sandy Creek takes a look at 
car prices this week and 
shudders.

- 0 -

Dear editor:
I was listening to some 

farmers talking about the 
high price of pickups. They 
now cost around $8,000 to 
$10,000, maybe more if 
you insist on tires and air- 
conditioning.

“ Why, you used to could 
buy a small farm for that,’’ 
one pointed out.

It’s true, not only are 
pickups sky-high, but cars 
are too. This got me to 
thinking. The weak link in 
the car manufacturing 
business must be the peo­
ple they’ve hired to try to 
guess what the people 
want.

First they under-es­
timated the people’s desire 
for a small, fuel-efficient, 
car, and now they've * 
over-estimated the peo­
ple’s wealth.

If this keeps up, the 
two car family will 
gradually disappear and 
the one car family will walk 
or take the bus, as soon as 
the buses are put back in 
shape.

The only solution I can 
see for this is to bring cars 
into the economic pattern 
houses are in. 1 understand 
you can buy a $40,000 
house today and a year 
later sell it for $60,000. 
Nobody would object to 
paying $10,000 for a pickup 
if a few years later he 
could sell it for $15,000, 
provided pickups at that 
time didn’t cost $20,000.

However, there's a 
bright side. We may now

have the OPEC countries 
worried . If cars get too 
high to buy and gasoline 
too high to run the ones 
we’ve already got, OPEC’s 
oil market may shrink to 
almost nothing and the 
sheiks will have to go back 
to riding camels. If those 
guys are smart they’ll start 
offering a $2,000 bonus to 
anybody who’ll buy a car. 
They ought to learn from 
the safety-razo people. 
The money’s not in the 
razor, it’s in the blades.

Yours faithfully,
J.A.

Best Of Press
There Are Some 

An old-fashioned wife 
is one who tries to make 
one husband last a life­
time.

-The Grit.

(acts
%

Bill Wooley
Faced w ith  th e  possib ility  
of a doubling of w orld 
population before the mid- 
twenty first century, famed 
wheat breeder and 1970 Nobel 
Peace Prize winner Norman 
Borlaug challenged the  
nation’s wheat growers during 
a recent visit to a mid-western 
college. The challenge: An 
increase in wheat production 
over the next sixty years 
equaling the production of the 
past 12,000 years . . . that’s 
the kind of super production 
needed to feed the people of 
the world. Food, Borlaug said, 
is the number one priority of 
d e v e l o p i n g  n a t i o n s .  
"Developing superior plant 
strains isn't enough," Borlaug 
said, "unless you know 
enough about soil fertility to 
allow the plant to express itself 
to its full potential." Borlaug 
asserted his belief in food as a 
weapon for peace as ex­
pressed in the old proverb: 
"With a full stomach comes a 
happy heart."

Wooley
International, Inc. 

W. Hwy 84 
272-5514

F A R M
SERVICE YOU CAN TRUST

For
prompt
service,
Call:
272-3420

s© # WS4

301 N. First • 272-3420

Leave a record with your 
will -  of insurance policies, 
bank accounts and death 
benefits for which claims 
must be filed, reminds 
Nancy Granovsky, a family 
resource management 
specialist.

Mrs. Granovsky is on the 
home economics staff of 
the Texas Agricultural Ex­
tension Service. The Texas 
A&M University System.

N ursing Hom e 
News

< By Joy S ta n c e l l

Ruby McCamish went to 
her daughter Barbara’s 
and her family for Easter. 
Her sons visited her in the 
nursing home Sunday eve­
ning. Mrs. Kennedy also
visited her.

* * * * *

Effie Jennings was visi­
ted by Jim Don Jennings 
and family, Marie and 
Jessie.

*****
Bulah Connell was visi­

ted by Nellie and Ethel and 
her grandson visited on 
Monay.

* * * * *

Dottie Wilterding was 
visited by Elaine and her 
family from Hobbs, Lona 
Embry and Mr. and Mrs.
D.B. Head.

• • • • *

Some one said that the

Easter bunny that visited 
the nursing home Saturday 
was really Mary Jane San­
chez. Could that be true? 

*****
We would like to thank 

the Muleshoe Young 
Homemakers for dying Ea­
ster eggs for us.

*****
The Muleshoe Floral and 

Gift furnished us with 
fresh springtime flowers 
for each table in the dining 
room for our special din­
ner. We really appreciate 
this.

*****
Mildred Head made and 

served refreshments at the 
Easter egg hunt Friday 
afternoon. Several of the 
aides stayed after work 
Friday to hide eggs and to 
help the residents hunt 
them. They also helped 
with serving refreshments. 

••••*
Sunday morning E.B. 

Wilson came to have Bible 
study with Marie Engram, 
Dottie Wilterding, Marie

Patton, Russ Duncan, Al­
ma Henley, Vera Inman,
and Archie Scarlett.

*****
Tuesday the Hospital 

and Nursing Home Auxi­
liary came to shampoo and 
set the ladies hair and give 
manicures. They did about 
22 hair dos and twelve
ladies got their nails done. 

*****
Wednesday afternoon

Glenda Jennings, Bro. 
Louis Crenshaw and Ann 
Hall from the Lazbuddie 
Methodist Church came to 
have a sing a long with the 
residents. Glenda sang two 
songs that she had written. 

*****
Lona Embry brought the 

staff a cheese ball and 
different kinds of crackers
Tuesday. Thank you!

* * * * *

Mrs. Kenneth Precure 
made and brought the staff 
a large layer cake Friday.
We thank her for this. 

*****
The Lazbuddie Church of 

Christ ladies made home­
made pies for the residents 
supper Thursday.

Your time is of no 
value to anyone but your­
self; why not use it 
wisely?

Ellis Funeral Home
24 Hour Ambulunce Service 

Ph. 272-4574 Muleshoe

A TTEND THE CHURCH 
OF YOUR CHOICE

MULESHOE ASSEMBL Y OF GOD 
517 S. First

Rev. James Golaz
EMMANUEL BAPTIST CHURCH
Iglesia Bautista Emmanuel
107 E. Third
Isaias Cardenas, Pastor
RICHLAND HILLS BAPTIST CHURCH
17th and West Ave. D
Brock Sanders Pastor
SPANISH BAPTIST MISSION
East Third and Ave. E
Rev. Aradio Gonzalez

TRINITY BAPTIST CHURCH
314 Ave. B
Don Knight, Pastor
LONGVIEW BAPTIST CHURCH
Phone 946-3413
B.C. Stonecipher, Pastor

SIXTEENTH AND AVE. D 
CHURCH OF CHRIST

James Johnson, Pastor

Sunday - 10:30 a.m.
Evening - 6 p.m.
Wednesday - 8 p.m.
PROGRESS BAPTIST CHURCH 

Danny Jackson 
Progress, Texas
NORTHSIDE CHURCH OF CHRIST
117 E. Birch Street
SPANISH ASSEMBLY OF GOD
East 6th and Ave. F
Rev. Hipolito Pccina
UNITED PENTECOSTAL GOSPEL

LIGHTHOUSE CHURCH 
207 E. Ave. G 
George Green, Pastor 
MULESHOE BAPTIST CHURCH 
8th Street and Ave. G 
Bob Dodd, Pastor 
FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
220 West Ave. E 
Rev. J.E. Meeks

CHURCH OF THE NAZARENE 
Ninth and Ave. C 

David Gray . Pastor 
FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
130 W. Ave. G 
Rev. Walter Bartholf 
Sunday School 10:00 a.m.
Worship 11:00 a.m.
LATIN AMERICAN METHODIST MISSION
Ave. D and Fifth Street
R.Q- Chavez, Pastor
THE COMMUNITY CHURCH
Morton Highway
H.D. Hunter, Pastor
CALVARY BAPTIST CHURCH
James Williams, Pastor
1733 W. Ave. C
PROGRESS SECOND BAPTIST CHURCH 
Clifford Slay, Pastor 
1st and 3rd Sundays
FIRST UNITED METHODIST CHURCH
Rev. Bill Kent
507 West 2nd, Muleshoe
ST. JOHN LUTHERAN
Lariat, Texas
Herman J. Schelter, Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m.
Worship Service - 11 a.m.
PRIMITIVE BAPTIST CHURCH 
621 South First 
Elder Bernard Gowens 
MULESHOE CHURCH OF CHRIST 
David Cox, Minister 
Clovis Highway
JEHOVAH WITNESS 
Friona Highway
Boyd Lowery, Minister
IMMACULATE CONCEPTION CATHOLIC
CHURCH

Father Patrick Mahar 
Northeast of City in Morrison Edition 
ST. MATTHEW BAPTIST CHURCH 
Corner of West Boston and West Birch 
Rev. M.S. Brown, Pastor

Bratcher Motor 
Supply

107 E. Ave. B 272-4288

Muleshoe 
Publishing Co.

Muleshoe ’ 272-4536

White’s Cashway 
Grocery

Where Friends Meet & Prices Talk

Bailey County 
Memorial Park

“Every Service A Sacred Trust* 
272-4383

Margie Hawking, 
Manager

Good News 
Book Store

106 E. Ave. B. 
Bibles, Music, Books

Dent-Rempe 
Implement Co*

John Deere Dealer 272-4297

Attend the SeMces 

oJQJou/t Choice

Western Drug
114 Main 272-3106

James Roy Meat 
Market Co.

506 W. Amer. Blvd. 272-4361

Muleshoe Co-op 
Gins

First National 
Bank

“Home Owned*
202 S. 1st 272-4515

Baker Farm
_____g ------ 1 - 1 -  - Roy Whitt Western Snrinkers
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WHAT’S
happening
IN THE...

m

I F I E i ) scctioh

Deadline For Classified Ads Is 
Tuesdays Aid Fridays

11:00

CLASSIFIED RATES 
1st Insertion,

Per Word-S. 15 
Minimum Charge-  

$2.00
2nd Insertion,

Per Word-S. 13 
3rd Insertion,

Per W ords. 10 
Minimum Charge-- 

$1.80
Vi Cheaper to run 

Classifieds 3 times or more 
CARD OF THANKS 

25 Words-$3.00 
Over 25 Words 

Charged at regular 
Classified Rates 

Classified Display- 
Si. 55 per column inch 

Double Rate for 
Blind Ads 

DEADLINE FOR 
INSERTION 

11 a.m. Tues. for Thurs. 
11 a. m. Fri. for Sun.
WE RESERVE THE 

RIGHT TO CLASSIFY 
REVISE OR REJECT 

AN Y AD.
NOT RESPONSIBLE FOR 
ANY ERROR AFTER AD 

HAS RUN ONCE.

1. PERSONALS

WE BUY USED 
FURNITURE AND 

APPLIANCES 
CALL 272-3030 
HARVEY BASS 

APPLIANCE 
l-18s-tfc

Licensed Day Care for the 
Summer Only. Call now to 
reserve a spot for your 
child over 18 months of 
age. Diane Allison 
272-3304. 
l-16t-4tc

PHOTOGRAPHY BY 
OEC1A

For a lifetime of memories, 
let us put your wedding in 
beautiful pictures. Call 
Oecia for your date. 
385-5169. 512 Phelps. Lit­
tlefield. Tx. 79339. 
li&i-tfc

************************

2. LOST & FOUND

LOST: 2 yr. old male toy 
poodle. Light brown and 
very shaggy. Epletic and 
on medication. Answers to 
the name of Cocoa. Reward 
offered. Call 272-3222. 
2-15s-tfc
.................. .
LOST: Saturday morning, 
April 18, in the vicinity of 
the Ranch House Motel. 
Male Pit Bull puppy, 5 
months. Black with white 
mask, white throat and 4 
white socks. Has blue ny­
lon collar with name tag. 
Answers to the name of 
Diablo. Reward offered. 
Dianne Tanner 272-4261 
Ext. 42 or West Plains 
Medical Center 272-4524.
2- 17t-tfc

************************
3. HELP WANTED

HELP WANTED: Beauty 
operators in new facility 
with good working condi­
tions. Apply in person at 
1002 North Main, Friona, 
Texas 79035 or call 
247-2210from 9-6.
3- 7t-tfc

Need a supper cook at 
West Plains Medical Cen­
ter. Apply to Ruby Clark in 
hoiJ)ltal kitchen or call me 
at home at 272-3005 after 
five.
3-16s-3tc

HELP WANTED: Experi­
enced farm hand. House 
and utilities furnished. Call 
946-3471 after 7 p. m. 
3-16s-tfc

*****•**•**•*•••*•••****
8. REAL ESTATE 

FOR SALE
•***•*•***•***••••*••***

Receive free magazines. 
Details $2.00 and SASE to: 
Lenex, Rt. 3 Box 107, 
Muleshoe, Texas 79347. 
Nothing else to but. 
l-17s-3tc

NEED TO GIVE AWAY: 4 
puppies, 1 dog, good with 
children. 618 E. Austin 
272-4992. 
l-17s-3tp

$$$ MORE PEOPLE EARN 
MORE MONEY WITH 

AVON THAN ANY 
OTHER DIRECT-SELLING 

COMPANY!*!
Call now Nettie 272-3208 or 
Oneida 272-3346.

l-l7t-2tc

Lady Bee at Earth is now 
carrying Sculptress Bras. 
Call 252-3748.
15-26s-stfc

CARD OF THANKS 
************************

I wish to express my 
appreciation and thanks to 
friends, neighbors and rel­
atives for their prayers, 
food, flowers, cards and 
visits while I was in the 
hospital. A special thanks 
to Dr. Albertson and Dr. 
Sayago and the nurses of 
West Plains Medical Cen­
ter. May God Bless every­
one of you.

For all your real estate 
needs call:

GLAZE A GOFORTH

U2AVE. C 
272-4208

8-11-tfc

Krebbe Real Estate 
Sales and Appraisals 

201 W.Ave.C 
Muleshoe, Texas

FOR SALE: Exceptionally 
clean, 2 bedroom house. 
$22,500.00 Call 272-4846 
after 7 p. m.
8-16s-4tc

SALE OR RENT: One bed­
room house. Will sell for 
small down, balance like 
rent. Adults. Write 14352. 
Beach, SP 34, Westminis­
ter, Ca. 92683 or call 714- 
897-4391.
4-17s-5tp

FOR SALE: Dari Delite 
Drive Inn Muleshoe, Tex­
as. Building and fixtures 
on lease land. Location on 
Plainview Highway. Fiber­
glass paddle boat and 
trailer. Call C.J. Tiller 
946-3691 after 7 p.m.
8-17s-4tp

FOR SALE: 2 bedroom 
furnished trailer. 12 x 50 
with new carpet. Call 9-4, 
272-4383; after 4 p.m. 
272-4140.
8-17s-tfc

2 bedroom trailer house.

HOUSE FOR SALE: 2241 
sq. ft. of living area with 3 
bedrooms, 2 bathrooms, 
living room, den with fire­
place, game room, kitchen 
with all built-in appliances, 
storage house with 120 sq. 
ft., 2 car garage, central 
heat and refrigerated a/c. 
1903 W. Ave. G, across the 
street from the elementary 
school. Call 806/ 296-6595 
after 6 p.m. and on week­
ends.
8-16s-tfc

FOR SALE BY OWNER: 3 
bdr. 1 3/4 bath, brick, 704 
W. Ave. K. Call 272-5483 
or 272-4448. Owner is 
licensed real estate broker. 
8-16t-6tp

J.B. SUDDERTH 
REALTY1NC.

Box 627 
109 Fifth St. 

Farwell, Texas 79325 
Phone [806] 481-3288 

or 481-9149

60 Acres west of Mule­
shoe on highway. One 6 
inch well, side - roll 
sprinkler. Steel buil­
ding. 2 sets of nice 
improvements.

160 acres northwest of 
Muleshoe, 2 welts, lays 
good on FM highway.

8-49s-tfc

1.440 acres more or less. 
Southeast part of Parmer 
County on FM 214 on 
Running Water Draw. 7 
miles southeast of Bovina. 
$250/acre. Jones Appraisal 
Farm and Ranch. B.L. 
Jones. Jr.. Broker \806] 
799-5040 or 795-6359. 
8-l4s-6lc

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom 
brick. Has lots of extras. 
1907 W. Ave. G. 272-4701. 
8-12s-tfc

FOR SALE: Brick home in 
Richland Hills. 3 bedroom, 
2 baths, 1 car garage. 1817 
sq. ft. $45.000.00 Call 
272-3767.
8-16t-2tc

FOR SALE BY OWNER: 
Good 160 acre farm in 
Westcamp area. 1 - 6 ” 
well, 1 - 8 ” well, good 
water, underground tile. 
S1200 per acre. Call 
272-3767.
8-16t-2tc

FOR SALE BY OWNER: 3 
br., brick, fireplace 904 
West 7th. Call 272-5483 or 
272-4448.
8-16t-6tp

FOR SALE BY OWNER: 
160 acres irrigated. 1 new 
6” well, 1 10” well. Good 
water in alfalfa now. Wll 
sell on terms. Call 
272-3056.
8-16s-tfc

FOR SALE: 40 acres. 4'/« 
miles on 1760. Has new 
side roll, new electric mo­
tor and eight inch well. 
Call M. D. Gunstream, 
272-5035 or 272-4515. 
10-17t-9tc

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom, 2 
bath house, brick. 1850 
sq. ft. Very good location.

FOR SALE BY OWNER: 
Very nice 2 bedroom house 
all carpeted, panelled, 
drapes, stove, refrigerator 
and air conditioner. Large 
utility room, small storage 
building. Fenced in yard, 
car port. Seen by appoint­
ment after 4:00 week days 
and weekends. 272-4159.

8-17t-tfc_

HOUSE FOR SALE 
Just remodeled, 3 bedroom 
1 bath, garaged house. 
Call 272-3810 after 7 p.m. 
8-12s-tfc

SMALLWOOD 
REAL ESTATE 

232 Main 272-4838 
Joe and Ricky 

Smallwood

323 W. Ave. E. 3 bed­
room, 2 bath, living 
room. kitchen and 
dining area.

__^___________ 4.4 —
Large duplex, 913 and 
915 East Fir. Each unit 
has 2 bedrooms, 2 bath, 
living room and den. 
Small down payment

We need listings. 
See or call Joe or Ricky. 

8-4t-tfc

HOUSE FOR SALE: Rich­
land Hills Division. 3 br., 2 
bath, brick home. 2 car 
garage. Brick storage buil­
ding and fenced yard. 1828 
West Ave. E. Inquire next 
door or call 272-3644.
8-16t tfc

FOR SALE: 1480 sq. ft., 3 
bedroom, 1 bath, fully car­
peted home with 2 car 
garage on corner lot. Call 
272-4914 or 272-3908 or 
inquire next door.
8-16t-8tc

HOUSE FOR SALE: 3-2-2. 
Fireplace, Central Heat & 
Air & Storage Building. 
$59,000.00 506 W. 20th. 
Call 272-5527 ask for Bruce 
or Darrel. After 6 p.m. call 
915-367-7642.
8-16t-12tc

FOR SALE: Mobile home, 
bam and 1.997 acreage. 
2'/i miles north on 214. 
272-4141.
8-17t-tfc

N lO H t t , ,  914 weATN

TOWN and

COUNTRY
B E A L  E S T A T E

,.4M, RANCMM HWlI
JOHN W. SMITH. I  rotor 

806 272-4678 or 272-3725

Large brick home, 3 
bedrooms. 2 baths, 
central heat, kitchen & 
den. drapes go. Has it’s 
own water well and lots 
of concrete. S64,000.00.

Large home has 3 bed­
rooms, 2 baths, living- 
room, dinning room and 
den. Franklin fireplace, 
refrigerated air. Good 
buy $39,990.

Stucco house has 3 
bedrooms, 2 baths, new 
paint inside and out and 
new carpet. $27,500.

2 bedroom, all carpet, 
drapes, stove, refriger­
ator, and air condition­
er. Single garage. Real 
nice for !24,000. 216 
W. 12th.

16 X 20 fram commer­
cial building to be 
moved. See at Smith’s 
L.P. Gas.

8-15s-tfc

REID
REAL ESTATE 

We want your business 
‘ Remember"

Reid Real Estate 
Henry C. Reid. Kroner 
1614 W. American Rivd 

272-3142 or 272-5512
HIGH SCHOOL AREA- 
Nice 3-1 3/4-2 Brick 
home, approx. 1765 sq. 
ft., Cent. A & H, & 
fenced yard

Beautiful 2-1-1 Brick, 
Cent. A & H, built-ins, 
and many other extras, 
Buy Equity and assume 
loan.

Immaculate 3-2-1 Brick, 
Cent. A & H, many 
extras, & has its own 
well.

Richland Hills - 3 bdrm. 
2 bath home, approx. 
1500 sq. ft., Cent. A & 
H, priced to sell.
High School Area-2-1-1 
home. Lets take a look.

Country Living-2 bdrm. 
2 bath Mobile home 
plus a 3 Bdrm., w Bath 
Mobile home rental unit 
on approx. 1 acre on 
highway.

We have many other 
2, 3, & 4 Bdrm. listings 
so check with us before 
you buy.

FARMS
Bailey Co. - 395 ac. 
good, level farm, 4 
welB, 1 Valley Elect, 
Circle, approx ‘/i mile 
underground tile. 
Priced to sell.

Parmer Co. - 320 ac.,
1- 10” & 1-—” well. 2 
circles, 29 percent down 
and 8 percent owner 
financing.

Bailey Co. - 160 ac.,
2- 8” wells, 1 circle, lays 
perfect.

Commerical — 150”
Highway frontage with 
a 40’ x 92’ Bldg, with 4 
drive in garage doors. 
Owner financing.
8-17s-tfc

9. AUTOMOBILES 
FOR SALE

************************

FOR SALE: 1974 Chevy 
pickup and 1975 350 Ford 
Torino - fully loaded. Call 
272-5621.
9-16t-4tp

SURPLUS JEEPS, CARS, 
TRUCKS. Car invoice val­
ue $2,143.00. Sold for $100 
Similar vehicles available 
through government agen­
cies. Call 601-941-8014 Ex­
tension 511.
9-16s-4tc

7 1 Mercury stalionwagon - 
full power. 68 Oldsmobilc 2 
door hardlop. Phone 
272-4163 or 272-5148.
9-15i-6|p

10. FARM EQUIPMENT 
FOR SALE

•• • • • •* • • • • • • • • • • • •* • • • •

Custom farming, 8 row 
equipment. Classified rates 
call 272-5317 before 8 a m. 
or after 7 p. m. 
l-16s-tfc

* ••••*•**••••••••« -••••••
11. FOR SALE OR TRADE
•••••a******************

Giff Buckner has a motor­
cycle for sale. Contact a 
James Crane Tire Co. Call

FOR SALE: Stereo AM-Fm 
8 track with turn table. 
$100. Call 272-3172 after 5
p.m.
ll-17s-tfc

Temik 15G • $1.91 per 
pound. Other chemicals 
also. Save at Watson 
Chemical. 272-4737. 
ll-l&t-tfc

New 1981 18 ft. and 19 ft. 
Sea Arrows. See at Friona 
Boat Company at Reeves 
Chevrolet, Olds in Friona. 
806-247-2774. 
ll-3s-tfc

FOR SALE: Small part 
time business. Good op­
portunity for “ extra” cash. 
5 cents and 10 cents vend­
ing machines; 35 units. For 
more information call 
272-3993 or 272-3994. 
ll-12s-tfc

FOR SALE: Motorcycle - 
1977 Kawasaki KZ 1000, 
cruise, verier fairings, 
saddle bags and box, and 
custom seat. Call 385-4659 
after 6 p.m. Roland Bell, 
Littlefield.
11-1 Is-tfc

78-79 Yamaha GT 80. Ex­
cellent condition. Call after 
6 p.m. 925-6686. 
ll-17t-2tp

FOR SALE: 12’ x 54’ triple 
M trailer house, furnished, 
very clean at 14th and Ave. 
B, Muleshoe. 272-4053 af­
ter 6 or 298-2014.
11-17t-4tc
. . . . . . . . . . . . . .

ANTIQUES AND 
COLLECTABLES SHOW 

AND SALE 
DEPRESSION AND 
CARNIVAL GLASS 

May 2, 10 a.m.-9 p.m., 
May 3, 12 p.m.-5 p.m. 
$25.00 merchandise draw­
ing each day - 2 p.m. You 
must be present to win. 
Knights o f Columbus Hall 
East 21st Street - Clovis, 
New Mexico. Information 
contact Mavis Bricker [505] 
762-5320.

sponsored by 
SPONSORED BY  

HIGH PLAINS ANTIQUE 
DEALERS ASSOC.

11-16s-4tp

BURROWS 
UPHOLSTERY AND 

FURNITURE REPAIR 
118 W .A V E .C  

in the rear 
PHONE 272-4255 

12-30s-tfc

15. MISCELLANEOUS 
***•****•**•*•••••******

Gage Construction 
Bob Gage

Spcciali/.c in Custom 
Fireplaces 

Phone 272-5240 
Or

272-5105 
at Muleshoe 
Home Center

213 S. 1st 
Muleshoe, Texas 

!5-4s-tfc

FRANK’S 
REFRIGERATION 

APPLIANCE & SERVICE 
PARTS & REPAIR 

315 W 3rd Hi. 272-3822 
l5-7t-ifc

WILSON DRILLING 
Save Energy. Save Fuel 
Hill Geo-Thermal - Ground 
Water Healing, Cooling 
System.

Want a propane system? 
check with 

SMITH LP GAS 
MULESHOE

15-30s-tfc

WANT TO BUY: Authentic 
toy tractor including riding 
tractors of any age. F. 
Terrell, Rt. 2, Plainview, 
Tx. 79072, 806- 895-4683. 
15-17t-4tc

Public Notice
Sealed bids will be accep­
ted by the Three Way 
Baptist Church, Maple, Tx. 
for the complete removal 
and clean up of their old 
aucitorium until May 15, 
1981. Bids postmarked af­
ter this date will not be 
accepted. All bids will be 
final, and the Three Way 
Baptist Church reserves 
the right to refuse any and 
all bids. The bid accepted 
is to be paid before the 
removal begins. The buil­
ding is to be removed and 
clean-up completed no la­
ter than September 30, 
1981. The building is loca­
ted three (3) miles north 
and one-half (Vi) west of 
Maple, Texas. Bids are to 
made to: Three Way Bap­
tist Church, Box 88, 
Maple, Texas 79344. 
l-16s-7tc

Hopeful
Wife- We’ve got to fire 

that chauffeur. He’s nearly 
killed me four times.

Husband--He’s a good 
man. Let’s give him another 
chance.

*  *  *  •

There are a number of 
smart people in the world 
but very few students.

25-PACK

n o w
Supplies 

Last30-GAL.
TRASH BAGS
Heavy-duty 2-ply bags 
hold up to 60 Ibsl Each 
box includes 25 begs 
plus twist ties. TV325 

QUANTITES LIMITED

Fodaral All-Risk 
Crop Insurance.

■

T im e  is  r u n n in g  o u t!

April 30
is the deadline for

Cotton & Milo
Act now to assure yourself 
complete crop 
protection.

Mozelle Goble
806-746-5021

FOR INSURANCE CALL

F.L. NEWTON, Agent 
128 East 10th - Box 749 
Littlefield, Taxes 79339 
Phone: Bus. 806 385-3055

Like a good neighbor, 
State Farm is there.

a r c
Slate Farm Insurance Companies 

Home Offices Bloomington. Illinois

TOOL VALUE
OF THE MONTH

I W u iT iS p tk ,
n o w

LH. ROUND 
POINT SHOVEL
Features long wood han­
dle; hollowback, heat- 
treated , high-cerbon 
steel brisde w/rolled 
shoulders. C2LRCSX

^  OU/ytTITIES LIMITED J

Fry & Cox Inc.
401 S. I»t 272-4511

Rent-to-Own 
Color TV

Washers Dryers Refrigerator*

jVo Service Expense ISo Interest To Pay

IDUaion
Appliance

117 MAIN MULESHOE 272-6581

Oil & Filter Change 
with
Lubrication
*9.99

Msra's what w« 4k
•Drain old oil •Install up to 5 qts 
olWi.its *  10W40 oil •install


