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New officers were installed for the 
Chamber of Commerce in January of 
1976. The new officers were John 
Hutchison-President, J. L. Brock-lst 
Vice President, Frances Loftin-2nd Vice 
President, Jim Evans-Secretary-Trea- 
surer. Pat Sutterfield is the Women’s 
Division President.

In January of 1976, a "standing room 
only”  crowd was present in Spearman 
as the Spearhead Breakers organized 
their local CB club. The citizens band 
radio is one of the big stories of 1976. 
The radios are gaining even more in 
popularity with the new 40 band radios 
on the market the 1st of January, 1977.

A new program, K.I.D.S., began in 
Spearman in mid-January, 1976 and has 
developed into one of the finest local 
programs in the town’s history. 
President of the new program is Chuck 
Rigdon, Vice President is Earl Good- 
heart, and the program was one of the 
most successful of the year for Spear­
man.

The graduation class of 196S held 
their class reunion on Saturday, Decem­
ber 27, 1975. Johnnie Crawford was 
president of the class of 1965 and their 
reunion was held at Martin's Steak 
Garden in Spearman.

In the January 1st, 1976 paper, the 
headlines included a special city council 
meeting, where the budget was slashed 
near $60,000 for 1976. A law enforce­
ment merger was discussed and a 
January brucellosis quarantine of Texas 
cattle was announced. A new postal 
rate hike went into effect at 12:01, 
December 31, 1976!

On January 9th, Spearman grabbed a 
pair of basketball victories from visiting 
Alamo Catholic. The Spearman B team 
tournament was underway in Spearman 
and the first baby born in Hansford 
County was the son of Robert and 
Donna Goins of Gruver.

The Spearman golf coach was named 
"G olf Coach of the Year" as Coach 
Newton and his girls won the state 
championship for the Lynxettes and 
Spearman. Services were held in 
January for Dr. Hackley, prominent 
Hansford County physician.

February was a month of politics with 
commissioners Precincts 1 and 3 and 
the sheriff, tax assessor-collector and 
county attorney jobs up for grabs.

Filing for sheriff was incumbent R. L. 
McFarlin and Lee Phillips. Candidates 
for Commissioner Precinct 3 were B. J. 
Renner, Robert Ferguson, Dan Desi­
mone and L. M. Womble. Candidates 
for the Precinct 1 race were Garland 
Head. James Kenney, Roscoe Nelson 
and Ray Phelps.

J. L. Brock was named as citizen of 
the year at the annual Chamber of 
Commerce banquet. Brock received the 
award for his unselfish service to our 
community.

Construction was begun on the 
remodeling of the First State Bank 
which resulted in additional storage and 
office space and a second drive-up 
window. The bank also installed two 
new Burroughs 700 computers.

County Commissioners redistricting 
resulted in a law suit being filed in 
District Court by Ruth Gumfory of 
Gruver, against two candidates that 
filed for position of Commissioner Prec. 
3, L. M. Womble and Dan Desimone, 
claiming that they did not meet the 
requirements of residency for the post.

The Spearman Lynx, District 1-AA 
basketball champions met Childress in 
the bi-district game and lost a heart- 
breaker by a score of 66-64.

March was also a month of politics for 
Spearman residents with Ralph Blod­
gett filing for the job of mayor, and Hal 
Shufeldt, Tim York, James Brown, 
Verlin Behne, J. K. Hicks, Bill Pittman 
and Brad Beedy filing for councilmen. 
Those men filing for school board 
trustee were Kent Guthrie. Perry 
Dixon, Jimmy Greene, Jim Evans and 
Charles Eaton.

Plans were begun for Bicentennial 
activities for the County which were set 
to begin with the June 3, 4, and 5 
Hansford Roundup.

In the law suit against the two 
candidates, L. M. Womble and Dan 
Desimone, District Judge Richard 
Countiss ruled in a hearing that Mrs. 
Gumfory had the right to sue the above 
men and also ruled that the Commis­
sioners Court, the Democratic Execu­
tive Committee and the Democratic 
Chairman and the County Clerk were 
"necessary parties”  in the suit. In a 
subsequent hearing March 18, it was 
brought out that the legal description of 
the “ new”  precincts was not entered in 
the county record in 1974 and it was also 
not recorded whether the motion to 
redistrict had passed or failed.

The annual Hansford County Stock 
Show netted Gruver and Spearman FFA 
and 4-H members some $73,334.%. 
The show was held at the Gruver 
Agriculture Building.

A Review of 1976
The City of Spearman officials moved 

to accept the EDA grant for $322,200 to 
rework the gas system and drill addi­
tional water wells for the city.

Hansford County was listed as 2nd in 
wheat production in 1975 in the state of 
Texas.

In April Judge Countiss refused to 
grant a temporary injunction to keep the 
names of L. M. Womble and Dan 
Desimone off the May 1 primary ballot 
as was being asked by Plaintiff, Ruth 
Gumfory of Gruv^f.

The announcement was made that 
Miss America 1975, Shirley Cothran 
would be in Spearman June 5 to emcee 
the Miss Hansford County Beauty 
Contest.

A record number of voters turned out 
Saturday to cast their votes in the 
Spearman city and school board elec­
tions. In the city election 895 votes were 
cast with Ralph Blodgett being elected 
mayor, and Bill Pittman and Brad 
Beedy, councilmen. Winners for the 
school board elections were Kent Guth­
rie and Jim Evans.

The Lynx band was chosen to play for 
the Ronald Reagan Rally in Amarillo, 
Thursday, April 15. They were on hand 
but bad weather prevented Reagan 
from appearing.

The first tornado alert came on April 
15, with a tornado sighted 9 miles south 
and l'/i miles southeast of town. The 
storm resulted in .57 moisture.

Little League Baseball Season began 
on April 19.

Hail, high winds and tornado sight­
ings Monday, April 19, brought ap­
proximately 1 inch of moisture to the
county.

Registered voters were up in the 
county with a total of 3824. Voters 
registered in 1975 totaled 3255. 
Cancellations were 273 either by people 
moving or by death.

City officials along with representa­
tives of Canadian, Booker, Higgins and 
unincorporated communities being 
served by High Plains Gas Co. were 
present at a hearing before the Railroad 
Commission. High Plains was asking 
for a rate increase.

Honor students at Spearman High 
School were announced. Roger Jones 
was named Valdictorian. and Billy 
Jones. Salutatorian. Other honor 
students were Karl Johnson, Jimmy 
Jackson, Janyth Lackey, Suzy Gatlin, 
Mark Fox, Gary Burke and Rajan 
Martin. Commencement exercises 
were set for May 27 at 8 p.m. in the high 
school auditorium.

Sheriff R. L. McFarlin was returned 
to office in the May 1 primary, Helen 
Dry to the Tax Assessor-Collector spot, 
and County Attorney J. E. Blackburn 
was also re-elected B. J. Renner was 
elected Commissioner Precinct 3 and a 
run-off race was set for commissioner 
Precinct 1, with candidates Garland 
Head and Roscoe Nelson competing.

Roy Harbour was named FFA Star 
Chapter Farmer.

A new business, Brown L Supply, 
located at 102 Kenneth held its grand 
opening on May 14-15.

On May 17, city officials called for a 
bond election in the amount of $265,000 
to provide local matching funds for the 
EDA grant to rework the gas and water 
systems in the city.

Commissioners of Hansford County 
and city officials and local interested 
people met with representatives of the 
Army Corps of Engineers to discuss the 
Palo Duro River Dam project. A great 
deal of enthusiasm was generated at the 
meeting. The Corps of Engineers plan 
to make a study as to the feasibility of 
the construction of the dam.

A tragic fire early May 14 took the 
lives of two small boys in Morse and 
destroyed the home and all of the 
belongings of the Dale Packard family. 
Killed in the fire were Curtis Packard, 3 
years old and Christopher, 1 year old.

The first inkling of problems at 
Hansford Hospital came to light at their 
meeting May 19 with members of the 
board voting to keep S. M. Anderson on 
as administrator of the hospital. Issues 
there had come to the point that either 
Anderson left his post of Dr. Thomas 
would leave.

The city fathers called a bond election 
for June 15 in the amount of $275,000 
for matching funds for the EDA grant.

The Dr. D. E. Hackley Memorial Golf 
Tourney netted $3,800 for the Hackley 
Memorial Trust Fund which has been 
set up to promote the well being of 
handicapped children of Hansford 
County. This is a perpetual fund and 
will be governed by representatives of 
the Hansford Golf Club. Spearman and

Gruver Banks. Spearman and Gruver 
schools, medical staff and Ministerial 
Alliance members.

A petition was presented to Hansford 
County Commissioners asking that an 
election be called to determine whether 
or not Hansford County Board members 
should be elected or appointed. The 
positions have been appointed up to this 
time.

The resignation of S. M. Anderson as 
administrator of Hansford Hospital, and 
of Eloise Renner, as supervisor of 
nurses were accepted by the hospital 
board.

The highlight of the first part of June 
was the big Hansford Roundup held 
June 3, 4, and 5. Miss Tina Gawsor 
was named Miss Hansford County at 
the annual pageant which was graced 
with the performance of Shirley Coth­
ran, Miss America 1975 as emcee. U.S. 
Representative Jack Hightower of Ver­
non was guest speaker at the dedication 
of the Station Master’ s Museum 
Rodeos, a parade, a fiddlers contest, 
barbecue, etc.

The hospital board appointed Joan 
McClellan as Supervisor of Nurses and 
Loree Booth was apointed lab and x-ray 
technician.

Spearman voters set a new record 
June 15 when they voted overwhelming­
ly for the gas and water bond issue. The 
issue carried 3% wihch was a vote of 
confidence for Mayor Blodgett and the 
city council.

Speartex Grain completes a 500,000 
bushel capacity addition to their eleva­
tor on the Gruver Highway.

All-day Bicentennial festivities were 
planned for July 4 with a community 
worship service, community picnic, 
afternoon fun and games, a musical " I  
Love America”  presented by the com­
munity choir and a big display of 
fireworks at Lynx Stadium concluding 
the day.

Wheat harvest began to get under­
way June 21 with the yield better than 
had been anticipated.

A number of activities occurred July 
4, 1976 in Hansford County. Members 
of the First Baptist Church set a time 
capsule in cement, to be opened in 
2076, Sunday morning, followed by the 
big Bicentennial Birthday celebration 
during the day.

Dr. Thomas reapplied to the medical 
staff of Hansford Hospital on June 30 
and was now using the hospital for his 
patients.

In a public meeting on the Palo Duro 
Dam project, Col. Anthony Smith of the 
Army Corps of Engineers stated that it 
will take 3 years of planning and then 10 
years to build the dam if the study 
underway proves important to the flood 
control of the Canadian River Basin.

Gene Cudd, local John Deere dealer, 
was appointed as councilman to take 
James Jackson's place on the council. 
Jackson resigned the position as he was 
leaving Spearman. Joel Lee Lackey was 
appointed to the school board to replace 
Bill Partridge, who is moving to 
Canyon. Joel Lee was a former member 
of the board.

4-Tex Elevator was open for the 
wheat harvest with their new facility 
with a capacity of 284,000. The 
directors announced that they expect to 
have an additional 254,000 capacity by 
com harvest time.

Dr. R. L. Kleeberger of Spearman 
was honored at the Texas Division, 
American Cancer Society July 8-9 
meeting in Dallas. He was the recipient 
of a twenty-five year award for his 
service to the Society.

This community was saddened by the 
tragic death of two of its young men and 
the injury to a third in a two vehicle 
crash August 6. David Dear, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Ed Dear of Spearman, and 
Marcus Connelly, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Doug Connelly lost their lives in the 
wreck. Steve Thomas, brother-in-law of 
Connelly, was taken to an Amarillo 
hospital for treatment of his injuries.

TTie August 12 Red Cross Blood Drive 
netted 146 pints of blood, the goal was 
150 and authorities were very well 
pleased with this amount.

County schools were set to open 
August 23.

Tragedy occurred again August 21 
when Pamelita Jo Clawson, 12 years 
old, of Gruver was killed when the 
pickup truck she was driving rolled over 
twice on a county road 2.7 miles west of 
Gruver. She was the daughter of 
Rodney D. Clawson, who along with his 
10-year-old son, was also in the pickup 
suffering only minor injuries.

Football season began Sept. 3 with a 
scrimmage with the Dumas Demons.

Friends of Mrs. R. B. (Gertie) Archer 
attended an open house held for her by 
her children on the occasion of her 80th 
birthday.

Construction was begun on a 60’ x 
100' addition to the Union Church in 
early September.

Residents of Spearman and Hansford 
County opened their hearts and pocket- 
books and contributed $5,578.82 to the 
Muscular Dystrophy Drive held on 
Labor Day.

An announcement was made that Dr. 
Vong and Dr. Thu, doctors from 
Vietnam and residents of Gruver, would 
be opening the Gruver Clinic soon.

Spearman School Board approved a 
budget for fiscal year 1975-76 in the 
amount of $1,523,323 and $1,678,944 
for 1976-77 and set the tax rate of $1.39 
per $100 valuation.

Homecoming events were planned 
with the Spearman Lynx to meet the 
Shamrock team on October 1. The Lynx 
enjoyed Irish stew with a 36-0 win in the 
homecoming game. Pam Rylant was 
named homecoming queen.

Dr. Glenn Blodgett, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Ralph Blodgett of Spearman, 
joined Dr. Tom Latta in the practice of 
veterinary medicine at the Hansford 
County Veterinary Hospital.

The Spearman Volunteer Fire Depart­
ment held open house Sunday October 3 
which was well attended by Spearman 
residents.

A hail storm completely destructed 
some of the corn and maize crops in the 
northern portion of the county in late 
September.

A new chemical blood analyzer was 
installed at Hansford Hospital, as well 
as a new cardio machine.

The first frost of the season occurred 
on Thursday, October 7, when the 
temperature dropped to 28 degrees for 
an overnight low.

The Hansford Hospital Board was 
again looking for doctors as Dr. Jam<:s 
Thomas announced he would be leaving 
Spearman at the end of the year.

The annual Lions Gub broom sale 
brought in $2700.00.

The supply of gas to portions of the 
city was curtailed Monday, October 18, 
due to a gas shortage. The gas was shut 
off about four hours until High Plains 
Gas Company was able to get an 
emergency supply.

Hansford Implement Co. hosted a 
training session for John Deere Cpm- 
pany employees on combine operations 
October 19-21. Some 43 John Deere 
personnel from Texas, New Mexico, 
Arizona, California and Moline, 111. 
attended.

Attendance was good at the first 
swine flu clinic held Oct. 21 for the 
"over 65”  age group.

Grain harvest was almost completed 
at the end of October with yields 
reported slightly over average. The 
greatest disappointment to farmers was 
the drop of grain prices during the past 
two months.

The annual Halloween Carnival was

held October 30 at the County Barn with 
some fifteen booths rented for fun and 
frolic.

City officials were seeking an addi­
tional gas supply as another gas 
shortage was felt Monday, October 25, 
and also asked residents to conserve gas 
consumption in every way possible.

The election which had been called by 
county commissioners for Nov. 2 to 
decide whether or not hospital board 
members would be elected or appointed 
was unable to be held at that time as 
there is a ruling that no special elections 
can be held on the same day as the 
general elections.

Sheriff R. L. McFarlin warned Spear­
man and county merchants about hot 
check artists and urged them to get 
drivers license information on checks 
from people they were not familiar with. 
Seventy-five percent of the people 
giving bad checks here were from 
Perryton.

A total of 2500 Hansford County 
residents, which is 72 percent of the 
eligible voters, voted in the November 
2 general election. The tally was 983 
votes for Carter-Mondale and 1401 for 
Ford and Dole. Lloyd Bentsen received 
1255 votes and his opponent Alan 
Steelman 1119. In the other contested 
race for state representative Bob Gose 
received 1411 and Daisy Moore 963. In 
the district and county races, Richard 
Countiss, District Judge, received 1905 
votes, Steve Cross, district attorney, 
1783, J. E. Blackburn, county attorney, 
1823, R. L. McFarlin. Sheriff, 1843, 
Helen Dry, County Tax Assessor-Col­
lector. 1974, Garland Head, Com. 
Precinct 1, 445, and B. J. Renner, Com 
Precinct 3, 466.

Mrs. Hettie Davis celebrated her 
100th birthday at a reception held in the 
First Christian Church Fellowship Hall 
on Nov. 6.

The annual Arts, Crafts and Antique 
Show sponsored by the Dahlia Flower 
Gub was held Nov. 6 and 7 at Hansford 
Library. Mrs. Annie Allen was named 
"Woman of the Year” .

The annual 4-H Achievement Awards 
Banquet was held November 6 at the 
County Barn. Anita Walker of Gruver 
was named Gold Star Girl for 1976 and 
Todd Williams of Gruver was named 
Gold Star Boy for 1976.

Spearman residents observed Vet­
erans’ Day on November 11 at the 
Varsity Gym. The program was 
sponsored by the HD County Council 
with school bands, Boy Scouts, Music 
Gub members, men's quartet and 
others participating.

The Spearman Lynx won District 
1-AA championship with a win over 
Canadian Friday, Nov. 12. They met 
the Childress Bobcats at Pampa, Nov. 
19 and lost the bi-district game 16-14.

North Plains Truck & Implement Co. 
was purchased by Dick Elbert. The new 
business will be operated as North 
Plains International, Inc. Doug Connel­
ly, former owner, decided to retire from 
his farm equipment business due to

health and personal reasons.
A-l Automotive & Irrigation Service 

held their grand opening November 20. 
Jim McLain is the owner of the new
business.

The members of the First Christian 
Church observed the 50th anniversary 
of the church on Nov. 21 with an all-day 
celebration.

Spearman merchants planned a big 
Christmas promotion with prizes to be 
given away in two separate drawings.

Morse, Pringle school district resi­
dents will vote in January on a proposal 
to consolidate the two schools.

Christmas activities highlighted the 
last month of the year. The Chamber of 
Commerce sponsored a poster contest 
for kindergarten through 3rd and 4th 
grade. First place winners were 
kindergarten-Carly Shieldknight, 1st 
and 2nd graders-Anne Sheets and 
Ginton Tindell-3rd and 4th grade.

The First United Methodist Church of 
Spearman presented the cantata, 
"Night of Miracles" by John W. 
Peterson Sunday, Dec. 19.

The Girl Scout Christmas Banquet 
was held and the auction of arts, crafts, 
etc. made by the Scouts brought in $725 
for their use.

The city council was pleased when 
they let bids for the Gas and Water 
Improvement Project Dec. 14 to find 
that they were lower than they had 
anticipated. T.O.K. Company of Ama­
rillo was awarded the bid for Gas 
System Reconstruction and Improve­
ments with a figure of $282,079.50, H. 
W. Taylor Construction Co.'s bid of 
$71,583.60 for the Water Supply Line 
was let, and W. D. Jones Drilling of 
Dumas received received the bid for 
water wells 9 and 10 with a base bid of 
$79,500.00.

Hansford County Commissioners 
purchased three police cars at a cost of 
$4900 each from Hergert Pontiac.
Commissioners also called for an elec­
tion to be held on Jan. 15 to determine 
whether or not hospital board members 
are to be elected or appointed by the 
Commissioners, and also called an 
election for the Morse School District, to 
vote on consolidation with Pringle on 
the same date.

A Hot Check Seminar was held on 
December 14 with Deputy Jerry Ingram 
of Amarillo, Potter County Sheriff’ s 
Office presenting a film and slides on 
“ How to Protect Yourself From Worth­
less Checks.”

Baker & Taylor Women's Association 
opened their Fantasyland again for 
Christmas and many beautifully decor­
ated homes could be seen in the city 
during the holiday season.

Many families, clubs, and company 
parties, etc. occurred during the Christ­
mas season, ending the year on a happy 
note. Many county residents contribu­
ted to Operation Christmas Greeting 
sponsored by Hansford Hospital Auxil­
iary, donating money they would other­
wise have spent on Christmas cards to 
the auxiliary.

The staff of this newspaper wishes all 
of you a happy and prosperous 1977.

Services Held For Blanche Lamb
Funeral services were held 

at 11 a.m. Monday, January 
3, 1977 for Mrs. Blanche 
Lamb, a longtime resident of 
Spearman.

Mrs. Lamb. 85, died Fri­
day.

Rev. Don Wirsdorfer offi­
ciated at the service in the 
First Christian Church. Bur­
ial was in Holt Cemetery by 
Boxwell Brothers Funeral 
Directors of Spearman.

W E A T H E R
Hi Lo Prec. 

DECEMBER 28 61 27 
DECEMBER 29 57 16 
DECEMBER 30 51 16 
DECEMBER 31 36 4
JANUARY 1 31 11
JANUARY 2 35 8 .16
JANUARY 3 39 12

Total Prec. for Decembers
.02"

Total Prec. for 1976:
10.5 T _____________

Mr. and Mrs. R. E. Lee 
spent the Christmas holidays 
in Colorado Springs, Color­
ado visiting their children 
and friends.

A native of Gifton, Mrs. 
Lamb had been a resident of 
Spearman for 57 years. She 
was a member of the Metho­
dist Church.

Survivors include four 
daughters, Mrs. Fronye 
Close and Mrs. Juanita Jack- 
son, both of Spearman; Mrs. 
Helen Koleman of Wichita 
Falls; and Mrs. Ruby Col­
lingsworth of Perryton; two 
sons, Irvin of Ocate, N.M. 
and Bob of Stinnett; a sister, 
Mrs. Marjorie Sandage of 
Amarillo; 14 grandchildren, 
27 great grandchildren and 
10 great great grandchildren.

Wrestling Tourney 
Here Saturday

ment will be from the Maver­
ick Gub and River Road in 
Amarillo and a team from 
Pampa, as well as the local 
K.I.D.S. wrestlers.

Everyone is invited to 
attend.

"Corrie: Behind the Scenes with
THE HIDING PLACE", a new full- 
length color film from World Wide 
Pictures, will be shown at the First 
United Methodist Church, 407 South 
Haney, on Sunday, January 9. A single 
showing is scheduled to begin at 7:00 
p.m.

THE HIDING PLACE, a true story 
filmed in Holland and other European 
locations, is based on the experiences of 
Corrie ten Boom, who, with her father, 
sister and brother, provided refuge for 
countless Jewish families. A secret 
room was constructed in their home as a

The K.I.D.S. of Spearman 
will have a wrestling tourna­
ment on January 8 from 10 
a.m. until all matches are 
finished. The tournament 
will be held in the Communi­
ty Building.

Entrants in the tourna-

Hospital News
Patients in Hansford Hos­

pital are Ray Prachar, Tanya 
Bowling, Mae Floyd, Mary 
Howard and Mike Newsome.

Dismissed were Curtis 
McGill, Altha Overton, Ruth 
Garrard and Christy Garda.

The Hiding Place” To Be Shown
hiding place for use during Gestapo 
raids. The ten Booms’ activities were 
discovered, and they were sent to 
prisons and concentration camps.

CORRIE was produced to give people 
who have seen the "H iding Place" or 
who have read one of her books an 
opportunity to hear her share many o f 
her memories about her life. The film 
offers a great lesson in personal faith.

Everyone is invited to come. The 
showing is open to the public free o f 
charge. There will be a free-will 
offering. We encourage everyone to 
come for this special movie
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Spearman teams w in district opener
Spearman's two varisty 

teams and their B teams won 
4 games at Lynx Gym Tues­
day night to open the district 
1-AA games! The Spearman 
Lynx looked like a different 
ball team as they slashed the 
Wildcats for four quarters, 
winning the game with a big 
77-49 count! It could have 
been much worse, as Coach 
Moore could have beaten the 
Wildcats much worse.

Thirteen was the lucky 
number for the Lynx, as 
Friemel, Steele and Jones all 
tied for high point, followed 
by Martin with 6 points, 
Bodey with 6, Newton 10, 
Sherwood 2, Cunningham 
10, Porter 4, and the entire 
squad, including Randy 
Reid, Pete Garcia, Sam 
Boone all saw action Tuesday 
night.

One of the high points of 
the game, was a last second 
shot, just before the half by 
Zane Newton, which counted 
and Cunningham was in rare 
form hitting several beautiful 
bucket shots! Steele and
Friemel had exceptional 
good nights, as these two big 
men scored well for Moore's 
team! The biggest surprise 
of the night was the lack of 
fouling on the part of the 
Lynx! They were well poised 
and committed only 13 fouls. 
A new record was set for the 
Lynx as the game started on 
a technical foul. One of the 
Spearman players was called 
for "dunking or stuffing”  the 
ball in the pre-game warm­
ups. As a result of this. 
River Road was awarded a 
technical shot, and the ball at 
the start of the game!

The score by quarters was: 
21-14; 48-23; 62-37; 77-49.

The Homecoming game 
will be this Friday night, as 
the two Spearman teams play 
host to Channing.

The Lynxettes matched the 
high scoring Lynx Tuesday 
night, as they also scored 77 
points to defeat River Road 
girls in their opening district 
game, 77-29! The only 
senior on the Lynxette squad 
Carla Harper stuffed the 
baskets for 28 points, as

Carla had one of her typical 
great nights to open the 
basketball season. Equally 
impressive for the Lynxettes 
was the defensive play of the 
guards. Lori McAdams, 
JoNell Comegys and Cindy 
Gressett stopped the River 
Road girls in their tracks and 
made many outstanding de­
fensive plays. Carrie Clark 
scored 2 points, Christy Col­
lier 11, Carla Harper 28, 
Denise Ware made all of her 
free shots, 4 out of 4, Debbie 
Greene hit 16 points, and 
Tracie Keetch hit 15. Others 
who played in their opening 
district games were Beth 
Ann Flowers, Tammy Rob­
ertson and Connie Vernon. 
Score by quarters, 27-2; 
43-11; 66-18; 77-29! Coach 
Newton substituted freely, 
trying to let everyone get in 
plenty of playing time.

The band probably will be 
on hand Friday night for 
Homecoming so be sure and 
come out to see this ball 
game! Channing will have 
excellent teams and every­
one is invited!

As a footnote to last 
night's opening district 
games, fans are also remin­
ded that the highly improved 
Lynx and Lynxettes look like 
they will be able to handle 
the Dalhal Wolves in Spear­
man next week; they will 
play Dalhart here the night of 
January 14.

The Spearman B Girls 
team blasted River Road 
56-31 Tuesday night to open 
district play! Connie Vernon 
led the Lynxettes with 21 
points, followed by Connie 
Shields with 14 and Tammy 
Ford with 15, Val Hagger- 
man hit 2, and Kelly Shaver 
hit 4 points for the Lynxette 
scoring. Others who saw 
action in the opening game 
were Jan Umphress, Jan 
Oakes. Beth Sheppard. Beth 
Flores, Patti Short, Jane 
Flowers, Jan Rowers, Lisa 
Robertson, Diana Close and 
Jeanne McClellan.

Shields and Ortega led the 
Lynx B team in a romp over 
River Road, 71-39 at Lynx 
Gym Tuesday night. Both

Shields and Ortega hit 16 
points, followed by Whitaker 
with 10, Franklin 4, Garcia 8, 
Miesner 2, Connelly 2, True-

love 2, Snider 2, and Barber 
with 10; others who saw 
action were McColman. Har- 
» i* and Trevino.

The Lynx B team reminds 
everyone that Homecoming 
will be at Lynx Gym Friday 
night! Come out for an

evening of great entertain­
ment and watch the crowning 
of the Homecoming King and 
Queen!

D e a d l i n e -  ? 7  

January 15 -

Bo DnArmond, Spearm an s e n io r  t a c k l e ,  made th e  P a n h a n d le  S u p er tea m , 
named r e c e n ly  by th e  A m a r i l l o  D a i ly  News- Bo 1 s c o n s id e r e d  a s  one 
o f  th e  f i n e s t  f o o t b a l l  p la y e r s  in  th e  s t a t e .  We j o i n  In  c o n g r a t u la t in g  
t h i s  f i n e  s e n io r  f o r  b e in g  named t o  the Super te a m ! He 1 s N o 0 7 0 !

" " ■ ^ F d a y s  WED. -THUR-FRI. JAN 5 -G -7 "

What if it was your sister?
4 DATS

LkT -SUN-MON. -TUES.
jan 8-9-10-11 i  J

For the 
price o f  
a movie, /  
you’ll 
feel like 
a m illion

IK .M K IH M S  ....... . MM Ml I (H I iM K A K I \ , V .|'.1 ANNE ARCH! H IK IK Is IK A D A

C A r i lN II I  IKOM Vl IVNN Vi,.,.»|,U K  I'Al'l M1WAW1S M .» v M V A N  NAOV 

IS, ...t«IH Kl( HAKI) 1 HI.I IKON h o l M l k  HI KNAW) SOIWAKTZ

, i av -- United AMistsR
.Lvric Theatrp sp̂ rman

M e tro  G o ld w yn  M ayer presents 
starring a Ray Stark Production ol a Herbert Ross F ilm

W&lter Matthau & George Burns ,n Neil Simons 
"The Sunshine Boys" costarring Richard Benjamin
Panavison" Metrocolor • Screenplay by Neil Sim on • Produced by Ray Stark 

Inn] Directed by Herbert Ross A Rastar Feature r. i..,m ir>„
UnitBd Artists

Lyric Theatre S P E A R M A N

SAVE
UP TO

10%!

P-A-G IS THE ONE TO PLANT 
FOR THIS AREA

P-A-G 492
Hybrid Field Com

“ I cut 23 tons of silage per acre 
of P -A -G  492 off of 32 acres. I
w atered the 492 four tim es . I 
w ill plant P -A -G  492 again next
y e a r .”

STAN W ICK  
Stratford, Texas

FOR M ORE INFO RM ATIO N, 
CO NTACT YOUR 

LOCAL P-A-G DEALER.
P-A-0 SEED S. BOX 10303, LUBBOCK, TEX AS 7940B
Performance ot this seed may be adversely affected by 
environmental conditions, mutant strains of insects or 
diseases, or other factors beyond the control of P-A-G

Prices Good Thru Saturday, Jan. 8th

RUDY RED

GRAPEFRUIT

■ 2 5 '2 LB.

UTILITY

IA I0 E S I
H 6 1 8101b.

SHURFINE

Orange Juice

2-89*

•  •

FROM THE DELICATESSEN ^

I B -B -0
1

PINT,
I

*

BEEF $ l49i
ENGLISH PEA b in t  I
SALAD 79<

THURSDAY. JANUARY 6, 1977

Boxwell
Bros.

Funeral Home 
and

Flower Shop
Day-Night PIm m  659-2212

a, Texas

YOUR LOCAL USED 
COW DEALER: SPEAR­
MAN BI-PRODUCTS. 
Seven days a week dead 
Black removal. Pleaae call 
NB eoon as possible. 
659-3544.

8-rtn

fHansford  
Lodge

1040
a .f .&a .m .

W.M. George Young 
Sec. Cecil Biggers 

2nd & 4th Mondays

S E R V I C E S

PINT3 BEAN

SALAD 79'j
P R I N G L E S

SHURFINF 
CREAM STYLE OR 
WHOLE KERNEL

SHURFINE

BLEACH A O *
16AL m

CORN
4  FOR $ 1

ELERY
STALKS

^ P o t a t o  4 $  
\*\ Chips

-  89c
F R E S H  F R Y E R S  ^  ♦ ' * *

C U T  U P

W E  G I V E  B L U E  W E S T E R N  S T A M P S
F A M I L Y  S I Z E

N o . 1
202 N . B c rn ic c  S p e a r m a n ,  T e x a s

,  . . . .  .  S T O R E  H O U R S
6 5 9 * 3 2 3 0  8  a  . m . - 9  p . m

Fryers 59c
W H O L E

Fryers 53c

Hansford County 
Planned Parenthood 

26 S. Haney 
659-2483 
Spearman 
Mon.-Fri.

8 a.m. to 12 noon 
30S-rtn

Buy Shakiee Products 
wholesale.

See Dorothy or Leslie 
Groves 

14 S. Haney 
659-3027 

l-8tc

KIRBY SALES k  SERVICE
of Spearman, 912 S. Bernice. 
659-2797.

30-rtn

GRADER, Dozier, and Drag 
Line Work. Call Lee Roy 
Mitchell. Gruver, 733-2384. 

28-rtn

FOR SAND FREE DOMES­
TIC WELLS call W. V. Block, 
935-4088 at nights. Dumas.' 

24-rtn

NEED MARY KAY COS­
METICS. Call 2751 after 
5:00 p.m.

30S-rtn

Portable Disc Rolling.
Henry Ballard, phone 
935-5229. Dumas. Texas. 

lS-7tp

IS ALCOHOL A PROB­
LEM IN YOUR FAMILY? 

AL-ANON
FOB FAMILIES OF 
PROBLEM DRINKERS.

In this fellowship you
can:

..Meet others who 
share your problem.

..Learn about alcohol­
ism as an illness.

..Encourage the alco­
holic to seek help.

..Replace despair with 
hope.

..Improve the family 
atmosphere.

..Rebuild your self-con­
fidence.
For further information: 

CALL 659-2306 
44S-rtn

GENERAL PLUMBINfJ 
Phone 733-2912 

Gruver 
Call Collect 

Steve Phillips 
"Licensed"

10 Years Experience

BARGAIN RATES on RINSE
A VAC Shampooer. Dec. 18 • 
March 31, $11.00 per day 
rental. Call 2141 or 3437. 

5S-rtn
YOUR ANTIQUE TRUNKS
restored by the expert Dor- 
othymae Groves of Dorothy- 
mae's Trunks. Taking Janu­
ary and February orders 
now. 806-659-3027, Spear­
man.

8-4tc

M i s c e l l a n e o u s  
F O R  S A L E

1973 Ford Maverick, 2 dr., 
302 V-8, a/c and carpet. 
Ideal school car. 659-2309. 

2-6tp

1 Chevrolet El Camino Clas­
sic, 34.000 miles, call 659- 
2868.

7S-4tc
FOR SALE: ’71 Dodge
Demon, in good condition. 
Stick shift. 659-2077, 14 S. 
Brandt.

7S-rtn
FOR SALE: Kenmore Har­
vest Gold portable dish­
washer, used 2 months. 
659-3569.

7S-3tc

FOR SALE: Used Maytag
washer, Maytag dryer, Ken- 
more washer, Kenmore gas 
cooking stove. Call 659-2751 
after 5 p.m.

8-3tc

R e a l  E s t a t e  
F o r  S a l e

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom, 2 
bath, brick den fireplace, 
living room carpeted, electric 
range/oven, dishwasher, 
central air/hcat, storage 
shed. After 4:00. 659-3664.

3-rtn

FOR SALE: 100 ft. Crawford 
Addition lot on the Spcar- 
man-Gruver Highway, utili­
ties in, includes small office 
building, priced for quick 
sale. Emmett R. Sanders, 
Realtor, 659-2516, nights 
659-2601.

35S-rtn

FOR SALE: Very nice 3
bedroom, bath & half home 
near elementary and junior 
high schools. Attached gar­
age, utility room, central 
heat & air, carpets & drapes, 
humidifier, other extras. 
Appointment only. Emmett 
R. Sanders, Realtor. 659- 
2516, nights 659-2601.

5S-rtn

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom, l'/i 
bath, fully carpeted, central 
heat, brick home, attached 
garage, built-in kitchen. 
Also adjoining 55x153 lot 
plumbed for 2 house trailers. 
$27,000. This also includes 
furniture, 1967 Ford pickup 
and 1970 Dodge Comet car. 
Located at 213 N. Brandt. 
Phone 3667 days, 3633 after 
7 p.m.

7S-rtn

FOR SALE:
building, centi 
air, large lol 
parking, ideal 
clinic, located 
hospital at 7tl 
Emmett R. San 
659-2516. night 

29-i

FOR SALE: S
with 3 bedroo 
living room, 
kitchen with 
nets, den and c 
shop. Nice car] 
ling. For the fi 
lots of room at 
price. Emmet 
Realtor, 659-i 
659-2601.

38S-

FOR SALE: 5 a
435-5246.

5-ri

FOR RENT: VA approved
trailer space. 659-3000 after 
5:00.

39S-rtn

ooocxxxx

LBL Trailer Spaces: 540
monthly. 50' x 150' lots. 
Trailers also for rent. Call 
Manager. 659-3551, 206 S. 
Bernice.

40-rtn-T only
FOR RENT: Small 2-bed­
room trailer and nice 1-bed­
room apt. Call 3591 or 3017. 

7S-4tc

FOR RENT: Furnished
apartments. 659-2811.

6S-4tc

1659-2613 
1659-2951

FOR SALE: 7 good »««<i
gasoline golf carts. One
electric '76 model demon­
strator. like new. Bob Polk, 
(405) 338-6079, Guymon, 
Okla.

7-4 tc

FOR SALE: GZ 145 Wauka- 
sha Motor, used, about a 
year after being rebuilt.
659-3645.

2-rtn

oooooooc
-m viit«wrr,M  -urn

Dressed quail 1-75. 659-
2309.

2-6tp

' Medallion ho 
by owner. Be 
buiLtdJMck hoi 

MM( hopnr

outside
fenc‘d

^ t l  
8 $ ^ S. Town- 
659-2129 for a| 

6-4t

FOR SALE: 
house, plus larg 
has nice fruit tre 
lot, plenty of sp 
budget living. 
Sanders, Realtoi 
nights 659-2601.

36S-rt

' Busi  
O p p o r t

FOR SALE: Sf 
Wash for healt 
Call 733-2655.

42S-ri

TEXAS REFINE 
offers PLENTY < 
plus cash bonu 
benefits to matut 
in Spearman arc 
less of cxperienci 
P. Pate. Pres., 
ncry Corp., Bo> 
Worth. Texas 7( 

8-2tc

NOT 11
Anyone inter 

fascinating hoi 
pigeons call 435- 
4648.

7S-2t|

NOTICE TO I

The City of S| 
will accept sr 
January 11, 
P.M. in the O 
Manager, fo 
following pro]

1. Lot 7. Bl 
Town

2. Lot 9, B 
Town

The City resei 
accept or rej 
bids.

Posted this 
December, IS



trict opener
ing ot great entertain- 
t and watch the crowning 
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Deadline- 
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P-A-G IS THE ONE TO PLANT 
FOR THIS AREA

P-A-G 492
Hybrid Field Corn

“ I cut 23 tons of silage per acre 
of P -A -G  492 off of 32 acres. I 
w atered the 492 four tim es . I 
w ill p lant P -A -G  492 again next 
y e a r .”

STAN W ICK  
Stratford, Texas

FOR MORE IN FO RM ATIO N, 
CO NTACT YOUR 

LOCAL P-A-G DEALER.
P-A-G SEED S. BOX 10303, LUBBOCK. TEX AS 7940*
Performance ot this seed may be adversely affected by 
environmental conditions, mutant strains of insects or 
diseases, or other (actors beyond the control of P A G

i

FROM THE PIUCATESSEN |

B -B -Q  w ,  |

BEEF M 4’
>  I  ENGLISH PEA PIMT 1

0 I  SALAD 79*
4 8 o z . 3 BEAN PINT

179 1 SALAD 79«|
ETT P R I N G L E S

O t a t O

Chips ^

89cP A C K  w  M  V

F R E S H  F R Y E R S  *  *

THURSDAY. JANUARY 6, 1977

Boxwell
Bros.

Funeral Home 
and

Flower Shop
Day-Night Phone 659-2212 

Spearman, Terns

GENERAL PLUMBINf) 
Phone 733-2912 

Graver 
Call Collect 

Steve Phillips 
"Licensed"

10 Years Experience

YOUR LOCAL USED 
COW DEALER: SPEAR­
MAN BI-PRODUCTS. 
Seven days a week dead 
Block removal. Pleaae call 
a* soon as possible. 
659-3544.

8-rtn

fHansford  
Lodge

1040
a .f .&a .m .

W.M. George Young 
Sec. Cecil Biggers 

2nd Sc 4th Mondays

Hansford County 
Planned Parenthood 

26 S. Haney 
659-2483 
Spearman 
Mon.-Fri.

8 a.m. to 12 noon 
30S-rtn

Buy Shakiee Products 
wholesale.

See Dorothy or Leslie 
Groves 

14 S. Haney 
659-3027 

l-8tc

KIRBY SALES *  SERVICE 
o f Spearman, 912 S. Bernice. 
659-2797.

30-rtn

GRADER, Doxier, and Drag 
Line Work. Call Lee Roy 
Mitchell, Graver. 733-2384. 

28-rtn

FOR SAND FREE DOMES­
TIC WELLS call W. V. Block. 
935-4088 at nights, Dumas.' 

24-rtn

NEED MARY KAY COS­
METICS. Call 2751 after 
5:00 p.m.

30S-rtn

Dressed quail 1
2309.

2-6tp

•75. 659-

Portabie Dim Rolling.
Henry Ballard, phone 
935-5229. Dumas, Texas. 

lS-7tp

Easy Cleaning the 
ELECTROLUX 

Way 
ft

311 So. Dromon 
Spearman, Texas 
Phono 659-3630 

Donald W. Hanson
52S-rtn

IS ALCOHOL A  PROB­
LEM IN YOUR FAMILY? 

AL-ANON
FOR FAMILIES OF 
PROBLEM DRINKERS.

In this fellowship you
can:

..Meet others who 
share your problem.
■ ..Learn about alcohol- 

inn as an illness.
..Encourage the alco­

holic to seek help.
..Replace deapalr with 

hope.
..Improve the family 

atmosphere.
..Rebuild your self-con­

fidence.
For further information: 

CALL 659-2306 
44S-rtn

1 Chevrolet El Camino Clas­
sic, 34.000 miles, call 659- 
2868.

7S-4tc
FOR SALE: '71 Dodge
Demon, in good condition. 
Stick shift. 659-2077, 14 S. 
Brandt.

7S-rtn
FOR SALE: Kenmore Har­
vest Gold portable dish­
washer. used 2 months. 
659-3569.

7S-3tc

FOR SALE: Used Maytag
washer. Maytag dryer, Ken­
more washer. Kenmore gas 
cooking stove. Call 659-2751 
after 5 p.m.

8-3tc

R e a l  E s t a t e  
F o r  S a l e

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom, 2 
bath, brick den fireplace, 
living room carpeted, electric 
range/oven, dishwasher, 
central air/heat, storage 
shed. After 4:00. 659-3664.

3-rtn

FOR SALE: 100 ft. Crawford 
Addition lot on the Spear­
man-Graver Highway, utili­
ties in, includes small office 
building, priced for quick 
sale. Emmett R. Sanders, 
Realtor, 659-2516, nights 
659-2601.

35S-rtn

FOR SALE: Very nice 3
bedroom, bath Sc half home 
near elementary and junior 
high schools. Attached gar­
age, utility room, central 
heat Sc air, carpets Sc drapes, 
humidifier, other extras. 
Appointment only. Emmett 
R. Sanders, Realtor, 659- 
2516, nights 659-2601.

5S-rtn

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom. l*/i 
bath, fully carpeted, central 
heat, brick home, attached 
garage, built-in kitchen. 
Also adjoining 55x153 lot 
plumbed for 2 house trailers. 
$27,000. This also includes 
furniture, 1967 Ford pickup 
and 1970 Dodge Cornet car. 
Located at 213 N. Brandt. 
Phone 3667 days, 3633 after 
7 p.m.

7S-rtn

THE SPEARMAN REPORTER. SPEARMAN, TEXAS 79081 PAGES

BARGAIN RATES on RINSE
ft VAC Shampooer. Dec. 18 - 
March 31, 511.00 per day 
rental. Call 2141 or 3437. 

5S-rtn
YOUR ANTIQUE TRUNKS
restored by the expert Dor- 
othymae Groves of Dorothy- 
mae's Trunks. Taking Janu­
ary and February orders 
now. 806-659-3027, Spear 
man.

8-4tc

FOR RENT: VA approved
trailer space. 659-3000 after 
5:00.

39S-rtn

LBL Trailer Spaces: $40
monthly. 50' x 150’ lots. 
Trailers also for rent. Call 
Manager. 659-3551, 206 S. 
Bernice.

40-rtn-T only
FOR RENT: Small 2-bcd-
room trailer and nice 1-bed- 
room apt. Call 3591 or 3017. 

7S-4tc

FOR RENT: Furnished
apartments. 659-2811.

6S-4tc

FOR SALE: Brick office
building, central heat and 
air, large lot, plenty of 
parking, ideal for doctor’s 
clinic, located just west of 
hospital at 7th Sc Roland. 
Emmett R. Sanders, Realtor, 
659-2516. nights 659-2601.

29-rtn

FOR SALE: See this home 
with 3 bedrooms, 2 baths, 
living room, dining room, 
kitchen with built-in cabi­
nets. den and office or work­
shop. Nice carpet and panel­
ling. For the family needing 
lots of room at an affordable 
price. Emmett R. Sanders, 
Realtor, 659-2516, nights 
659-2601.

38S-rtn

FOR SALE: 5 acres in Waka.
435-5246.

5-rtn

oooooooooooooo

_  M  i s t c l l a n c o u s  
S E R V I C E S  I  F O R  S A L E

FOR SALE: 7 good » « « i l
gasoline golf carts. One
electric '76 model demon­
strator. like new. Bob Polk, 
(405) 338-6079, Guymon, 
Okla.

7-4 tc

1973 Ford Maverick, 2 dr., 
302 V-8, a/c and carpet. 
Ideal school car. 659-2309.

2-6tp

ED WHEELER 
REAL ESTATE 
Homes • Farms 

Commercial

659-2613
659-2951

Days
Nights

FOR SALE: GZ 145 Wauka- 
sha Motor, used, about a 
year after being rebuilt.
659-3645.

2-rtn

Beautiful 3 bedroom 
brick, 1 and 3/4 baths, 
den, fireplace, carpets, 
drapes, built-ins, etc. An 
exceptionally nice house 
Near High School.

•••••
Large lot with nice two 
bedroom home in front 
nice one bedroom house 

the back. Double 
arage with efficiency in 

the rear. One year rental 
on one bedroom house 
paid at time of sale.

bedroom, 1-3/4 bath, 
irner lot, nice yard, 2 

blocks froii) high school, a 
home one would be proud 
to own.

3 bedroom, single bath, 
carport, fenced yard, cor­
ner lot, 801 Dressen.

> 0 0 0

Medallion home for ' Me j 
; by owner. Beautifu* ^\ i- 
buiU'TnVk home „«S*per-

|v 7 L-t throughout.
S. Townsend. Call j  

659-2129 for appointment. 
6-4tc

FOR SALE; 3 bedroom 
house, plus large basement, 
has nice fruit trees on 100 ft. 
lot, plenty of space for. low- 
budget living. Emmett R. 
Sanders, Realtor, 659-2516, 
nights 659-2601.

36S-rtn

CITATION 
BY PUBLICATION

STATE OF TEXAS
TO: NELSON W WIL­

LARD. if living, and if dead.
the legal representatives of
said defendant, and un­
known heirs, and/or devi­
sees of said Defendant, and 
all unknown persons who 
may claim title in the herein 
described property under 
Deed dated November 1. 
1922, recorded at Vol. 25, 
Pages 377-379, Deed Re­
cords of Hansford County. 
Texas, Defendants, Greet­
ing:

YOU (AND EACH OF 
YOU) ARE HEREBY COM­
MANDED to appear before 
the District Court of Hans­
ford County at the Court­
house thereof, in Spearman, 
Texas, by filing a written 
answer at or before 10 
o ’clock A.M. of the first 
Monday next after the expi­
ration of forty-two days from 
the date of the issuance of 
this citation, same being the 
14th day of February A.D. 
1977, to Plaintiffs Petition 
filed in said court, on the 
10th day of December A.D. 
1976, in this cause, num­
bered 2368 on the docket of 
said court and styled DON­
ALD G. BELL, Plaintiff, vs. 
NELSON W. WILLARD. ET 
AL., Defendants.

A brief statement of the 
nature of this suit is as 
follows, to-wit: This suit is 
an action in Trespass To Try 
Title. The property involved 
in this suit is a Fee Simple 
interest in the following des­
cribed property, to-wit: ALL 
of Lots Numbered One (1) 
and Two (2), in Block Num­
ber Twenty-Five (25), First 
Addition to the Town of 
Spearman, Hansford County, 
Texas, as shown by the 
recorded plat thereof in Vol­
ume 25, Page 48, Deed 
Records of Hansford County, 
Texas.

If this citation is not served 
within ninety days after the 
date of its issuance, it shall 
be returned unserved.

The officer executing this 
writ shall promptly serve the 
same according to require­
ments of law, and the man­
dates hereof, and make due 
return as the law directs.

Witness, Marie H. Gould. 
Clerk of the District Court of 
Hansford County, Texas.

Issued and given under my 
hand and the seal of said 
court at Spearman, Hansford 
County, Texas, this the 28th 
day of December A.D. 1976.

Marie H. Gould. Clerk 
84th Judicial District Court
Hansford County, Texas
By Cathy Dart, Deputy

7-4tc-T only

In accordance with Art. 2544, 
Tex. Rev. Civ. Stat., the 
Commissioner's Court of 
Hansford County will select 
an official depository for 
county school funds for the 
biennium 1977-79 at their 
regular meeting on February 
14, 1977, 10:00 A.M., in the 
Deliberation Room in the 
Courthouse, Spearman, 
Texas.

8-3t-T only

FOR SALE: Spearman Car 
Wash for health reasons. 
Call 733-2655.

42S-rtn

TEXAS REFINERY CORP. 
offers PLENTY OF MONEY 
plus cash bonuses, fringe 
benefits to mature individual 
in Spearman area. Regard­
less of experience. airmail A. 
P. Pate, Pres.. Texas Refi­
nery Corp.. Box 711, Fort 
Worth. Texas 76101.

8-2tc

NOTICE
Anyone interested in a 

fascinating hobby racing 
pigeons call 435-4323 or 435- 
4648.

7S-2tp

L E G A L  N O T I C E

NOTICE TO BIDDERS

The City of Spearman. Texas 
will accept sealed bids until 
January 11, 1977 at 7:30 
P.M. in the Office of the City 
Manager, for sale of the 
following property:

1. Lot 7. Block 38. Original 
Town

2. Lot 9, Block 2, Original 
Town

The City reserves the right to 
accept or reject any or all 
bids.

Posted this the 17th day of 
December, 1976.

Amelia C. Johnson 
City Secretary

Thanks to my friends and 
neighbors for the cards and 
visits while I was in Hansford 
Hospital. A special thanks to 
Dr. Kleeberger and the hos­
pital staff for their wonderful 
care.

Mrs. E. C. Greene
We wish to thank each and 

everyone for the many, many 
acts of kindness and thought­
fulness extended to us at the 
loss of our loved one.

May God bless each of 
you.

WUma and Ann Lackey

The members of the family 
of Blanche Lamb wish to 
express their appreciation for 
all of the visits, food, cards, 
flowers, prayers and other 
expressions of sympathy and 
love which were extended to 
them.
The Family of Blanche Lamb

WANTED: Equipment
operator in oil field ser­
vice company.' Truck 
driving experience pre­
ferred but will train. Free 
hospitalization, time and 
half. $800 plus. Contact 
806-435-4311.

8-rtn

5 ? /

Majority Food Stamps 
Recipients Deserving ASSO CIATIO N
The vast majority of food 

stamp recipients in this coun­
try are deserving of program 
benefits, according to a U.S. 
Department of Agriculture 
study, and in Texas the 
figures are even better than 
most.

Nationally, according to 
statistics just released by 
USDA in its semi-annual 
quality control review, 92.4 
percent of the some 40,000 
households reviewed met all 
financial and basic program 
criteria.

During that same review 
period-January through 
June 1976-more than 1.200 
households currently partici­
pating in the program in 
Texas were reviewed and 
95.5 percent of these met the 
same requirements.

"We are encouraged by 
these statistics," says Nancy 
Snyder, national food stamp 
director for USDA's Food 
and Nutrition Service. "It 
means that the states are

$7.00 Off

Sears 48  
battery

was $39.99 
$32.99 

with trade-in

Sears has a credit plan 
to suit most every need

Satisfaction Guaranteed 
or Your Money Back

doing a better job of review­
ing their caseload, finding 
their difficulties and correct­
ing them.”

Texas State Department of 
Public Welfare which admin­
isters the food stamp pro­
gram in cooperation with 
FNS, has primary responsi­
bility for quality control re­
views.

Quality control reviews- 
conducted every six months-- 
are administrative tools for 
checking eligibility and cor­
rect issuance of stamps. This 
is done by reviewing a statis­
tically valid, random samp­
ling of a state’s caseload.

This past reporting period, 
the review was limited to just 
non-public assistance house­
holds. A non-public assis­
tance household is one in 
which at least one person is 
not receiving any other form 
of public assistance.

But other quality control 
reviews include negative

SPEARMAN, TEXAS 79081 
213 Main Box 458 659-3434

Published Weekly at 213 Main Street 
Spearman, Texas 79081

Owner-Publisher............William M. Miller
Second Gaaa Postage Paid at Spearman, 

Texas

ANY ERRONEOUS REFLECTION UPON 
THE CHARACTER OF ANY PERSON OR 
FIRM APPEARING ON THESE COLUMNS 
WILL BE GLADLY AND PROMPTLY COR­
RECTED UPON BEING BROUGHT TO THE 
ATTENTION OF THE MANAGEMENT. 
SUBSCRIPTION RATE-Hanafard, adjoining 
counties, com (nation with the Hansford 
Plainsman, S10.92 Tax ktdnded.
Other points $15.12 Tax kvduded.

In vert a coriander over a 
•killer when frying. It frill 
catch spatters but 1st best 
••capo.

action cases--those house­
holds that were either denied 
at time of application or later 
terminated-as well as public 
assistance households.

Copies of the report, "Pa r­
ticipation in the Food Stamp 
Program as Shown by Quali­
ty Control Reviews of Non- 
Assistance Households, Jan- 
uary-June 1976” , can be

obtained from the Food 
Stamp Division, Food and 
Nutrition Service, U.S. De­
partment of Agriculture, 
Washington, D.C. 20250.

MARKETS
WHEAT
CORN
MILO

S2.3S
$2.25
$3.40

Steel-belted
Silent-Guard

tires

N ow  on sale in sizes to 
f i t  m ost A m erican cars.

Sears has a credit plan 
to suit most every need

Satisfaction Guaranteed 
or Your Money Back

FOR THE ULTIMATE IN

STORM DOORS
CUSTOM B U IL T , DESIGNED, AND IN  COLORS
TO F IT  YOUR HOME...............

CONTACT

HOWARD MOYER a t  

ONLY ALUMINUM INDUSTRIES
4 0 5 -3 3 8 -6 9 6 6  o r  338 -6170  

P .  0 .  BOX 471 
GUYMON, OKLAHOMA 73942

Sears Sears
PLAINS SHOPPING 

C INTER
Spearman, Texas 
Pnone 659-2673

HEAR*. ROCaiK'K AND CO.

PLAINS SHOPPING 
CENTER

Spearman. Texas 
_  Phone 659-2578

Why N o t  D rop  In , And Give U « a T R Y , 
You’ll Get Yourself, One WHALE O f A  BUY.

EXCEL CNEV.4N.iS. CO.

w  #Join
our circle of 

friends.

W hy do we emphasize “circle of friends” while other 
banks emphasize their “full circle of service?” Because 
we’re the bank that pays special attention to customers: 
all of them, in a great big way, no matter what service 
or services they use. The bank that thinks of customers 
as a circle of friends. And the nicest thing about our 
circle is that it’s always open. There’s always room for 
one more. How abou4 you?

D F V
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You a r e  c o r d i a l l y  i n v i t e d

t o  a b r i d a l  sh ow er h o n o r in g

L u c l l e  E a r le s

b r i d e - e l e c t  o f  D a v id  M c C le l la n

T u e s d a y , J a n u a ry  1 1 , 1977

from  10 t o  11 a .

Home o f  B i1 1 S t rawn

1108 S . B e r n ic e

H o s t e s s e s : 
Tom E t t e r  
R ic h a rd  H o l t o n  
G e o rg e  C o l l a r d  
C a r l  A r c h e r  
Joh n n y L ee  
G a r la n d  Head

Mmes.
T .C ,  K it c h e n s  
P ,A ,  L y o n , J r .  
S lim  C a te s  
G len n  Day 
M a rv in  J o n e s  
B i l l  St rawn 

8 - 2 tp

in Perryton on Saturday, 
lanuary 8, at 10:00 a.m.

Pancake S u p p e r ^ ™
every Sunday at 9:45 a.m. at 

P l n n n o e l  the First Presbyterian
The Lions Club is planning church, 

a pancake supper for Feb. 4 ••Adjusting My Schedule" 
in the Junior High School js tj,e subject of Pastor Ed 
cafeteria from 5 til 7 p.m. Freeman’s children’ s sermon 

The supper will be before an(j “ John’s Expectation", 
the basketball games sche js t^e subject of his adult 
duled that night. Spearman sermon aI the service for the 
and Gruver girls will be pUhhc worsip of God on 
playing and Spearman and Sunday, January 9, at 11:00 
Bovs Ranch will also play. a m

Cost of the supper is S2.00 Mid-week Bible Study will 
for adults and $1.00 for be on Wednesday, January 
students. Tickets may be 12 a, 7:3o p.m. 
purchased from any Lions choir practice will be on

Club Thursday evening in 
her home. . . . .

Mrs W. L. Russell had 
high score and Mrs. Gwen- 
fred Lackey had second high.

Attending and enjoying a 
delicious dinner were a 
guest Mrs. Preston Scott, 
and members Mmes. Ger­
trude Archer, Leonard Jame­
son W. L. Russell, Gwen- 
fred Lackey, R E. Lee, Faye 
Lynch, and the hostess.

Xhe next meeting will be 
Thursday. January 13, in the 
home of Mrs. Leonard Jame-

Club member.

United
Presbyterian

Church N ew s

Wednesday. January 12, at
8:30 p.m.

If you do not have a church 
home, you are invited and 
encouraged to try the warm. 
Christian fellowship of the 
First Presbyterian Church.

Telephone Customers 

To Get Tax Break
Telephone customers 

across the nation will get 
another of continuing tax 
breaks this year as the excise 
tax on telephone bills will be 
reduced another 1 percent 
during 1977, from 6 percent 
to 5 as a result of the fifth 
step of a 10 year reduction.

The tax elimination was 
enacted as part of the Excise, 
Estate and Gift Tax Adjust­
ment Act of 1970 which 
called for successive one 
percent reductions in the 
excise tax on telephone bills 
on the first of each year until 
the tax expires on Dec. 31. 
1981.

General Telephone custo­
mers paid an estimated $2.5 
million less in Federal Excise 
Tax on telephone bills during 
1976 because of the I percent 
reduction in the tax begin­
ning Jail. I, 1976.

Based on the 1976 excise 
lax of 6 percent. General 
Telephone will have collected 
for the Federal government 
an estimated $15 million 
from customers by the end of 
1976.

Telephone customers
across the nation will save 
approximately $275 million 
at the lower 1977 rale, com­
pared to what they would 
have paid had the tax re­
mained at the 1976 level of 6 
percent, according to esti­
mates by the U.S. Indepen­
dent Telephone Association. 
Some $51 million of that 
amount will be saved by 
customers of the Indepen­
dent telephone companies.

Congress first imposed the 
tax on telephone bills during 
World War I as a "tempo­
rary" measure. Although 
repealed briefly after the

war. it was rcinstituted 
during the Depression and at 
one time rates were as high 
as 25 percent on long dis­
tance calls and 15 percent on 
local service.

The Independent Tele­
phone Association says the 
tax has cost consumers bil­
lions of dollars and estimates 
the U.S. Treasury will re­
ceive almost $2 billion from 
the levy in 1977;_ _ _ ^ ^ ^ —

January 6 is Epiphany, 
which commemorates the 
coming of the Wise Men 
from the East to see the child 
Jesus. With the warning 
from an angel, the Wise Men 
departed for home another 
route and Joseph, Mary and 
Jesus fled into Egypt.

The Lay Renewal Prayer 
Group will meet Thursday, 
January 6, at the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Larry Holt at 
7:30 p.m.

Friday. January 7, is a 
Fast Day to pray for people 
who w'ork in government at 
all levels.

There will be a joint plan­
ning session of representa­
tives from the Presbyterian 
churches in Spearman, Ca­
nadian, and Perryton at the 
Trinity Presbyterian Church

Bridge Club
The Blue Monday Bridge 

Club met Monday, January 
3, at Martin's Steak Garden 
with Mrs. F. J. Daily as 
hostess.

High score was won by 
Mrs. Vester Hill and second 
high was won by Mrs. Pres­
ton Scott.

Guests present were Mrs. 
Henry Cornelius and Mrs. 
Preston Scott.

Members present were 
Mmes. Bill Gandy, Vester 
Hill, Deta Blodgett. Gwen- 
fred Lackey, Willie Seitz and 
F. J. Daily.

Next meeting will be Jan. 
17 in the home of Mrs. Bill 
Gandy.

Mrs. John Berry was hos­
tess for the Bid-A-Bit Bridge

Union Church 
Plans Revival

Revival Service* have been act at the
Union Church here with the Rev. Dan 
Schiel of Conroe, Texas as the evange­
list. Dates for the revival are January 9 
through 23.

Rev. Schiel has a weekly TV program 
in Houston and is secretary-treasurer of
F.G.E.A.

Service time will be at 7 p.m. on 
Sunday night and 7:29 p.m. on week 
nights.

Everyone is invited to attend and a 
nursery will be provided.

New Plates
on Sale

License plates for 1977 will go on sale 
February 1, 1977 according to Helen 
Dry, Tax Assessor and Collector.

Instead of a sticker for cars and one 
For trucks, there will be one sticker for 
all classes of vehicles and there will be 
no change in the price of licenses.

For those persons from out o f state, 
licenses expire on December 31 and 
persons needing to renew these licenses 
should come in and purchase the final 
quarter 1976 licenses at this time. 
There is no grace period on this type of 
license, said Mrs. Dry.

PLAY
THE ALL NEW SERIES No. CK-35

CASH-IO
g a m e ! v

9 9 * 6 4 9 . 0 0

HAS BEEN GIVEN 

AWAY BY IDEAL IN 
CASH-KING PRIZES 
SERIES **CK1 &  *CK22

• • •

1976.
These *1,000 Winners Included.

LOLA ARMENTROUT - Ganka City. Kauai 
sots. TED GODFREY ■ Sprannaa. T ria l 
MARY MAE MrMILLAN ■ FMrvku. Oklahoma 
PAULA GARZA ■ Sataata. Kauai 
FORREST C MORRIS - Literal. Kaiiai 
LUELLA MONGOLD ■ Gaytnoa. Oklahoma 
JOSE S BARRERA ■ Hereford. T ria l 
BARBARA CAMPBELL - Hufotoa. Kaaiai 
LUCILLE AMOS - Ptalu. Kauai 
OPAL ANDREWS - Perry too. Tria l 
ANNABEL WILEY - Borjer Tria l 
CONNIE LOCKWOOD - Hay. Kauai 
MRS ROBERT R. ALLEN Gardea City,

DIANE MOUSER - Literal. Kauai 
KATHY SLATER - Speanaaa. Ten t 
LUCILLE R. LEWIS - UtyiiM. K u ia i

BARBARA H HEIU - Scan City. Kauai 
LETT IE V. SMITH - Pampa. Texai 
BOBBY ALLEN TEAGUE - Pampa. Tria l 
MAYDELL DAUGHERTY - Barger. Tria l 
SANDAUA GODINEZ Gardea City. K u ia i 
M. H. WESTON - Plalnvle*. Texai 
LAURA LEONARD - D u u .  Texai 
CORA M A EOT AS Hupalaa. Kauai 
MARY A MCCALLISTER Iliytoo.N.M  
LOUISE BERNING - Scott City. Kauai 
FRANCES PHILLIPS - Perrytaa. Texai 
KATHIE WAUGH ■ Laverae, Oklahoma 
MIKE SAXON - Barger, Texai 
J. H. DUNKERSON - Guvmoa, Oklahoma 
BONETTA HUNTER Woodward. Oklahoma 
MIKE ARCHEMBAULT • Uyuei, Kauai 
KIRK TORRES Spearman. Texu

Total Dollars Given in the !10O-MO-'5-'2 and ‘1 Games.

>ior
Winners
MO08
Winners
scoo
Winners

S T M

Winners
S IM

Winners

*26.100.00
s 4.680.00
* 6,150.00
*

7.990.00
* 22.729.00

Rotary Club 
News

Eastern Star 
Has Meeting

Spearman Chapter #721,
O. E.S. met for their regular 
meeting on Monday. January 
3. at the Hansford Lodge 
Hall with Judith Black. W. 
M. and Don Hendricks. W.
P. presiding.

The W. M., Judith Black 
recognized the Past Matrons 
and Past Patrons of Spear­
man Chapter, which included 
Don Hendricks. Nina Hen­
dricks. Virus Wilbanks, 
Mary Brock. Sandy Russell, 
Marjorie Collard, John R. 
Collard. Jr.. Deta Blodgett. 
Betty Uptergrove, Millie 
Craig and Lynanne Maize.

The W. M. Judith Black 
gave a very interesting re­
port on her trip to Fort Worth 
in October to attend Grand 
Chapter of Texas.

A Memorial Service was 
held for Mr. Frank Holt, a 
Past Worthy Grand Patron, 
who passed away during 
December.

Lovely refreshments were 
served by Mary Brock and 
Wilma Clark to 17 present.

The Spearman Rotary Club 
met Monday, January 3. at 
Martin's Steak Garden.

President, Junior Lusby 
presided over the meeting.

Mrs. Thu Lee, wife of 
Vietnamese Dr. Thu Lee, 
told of their experiences 
leaving Saigon and in various 
refugee camps and of her 
impression of the United 
States.

Guests present were Joe 
Supthen and M. E. Griffin, 
both of Borger. Mrs. Thu Lee 
of Gruver and Mrs. Mar­
guerite Nelson of Spearman.

Members present were 
Carrie Marie Berry, Roy 
Bulls, Junior Lusby, John R. 
Collard, Jr.. Ed Garner, Bob 
Pearson. Jack McWhirter, 
Don Hergert, Pete Fisher, 
John Hutchison, Kerry Hen- 
ton. J. L. Brock, E. J. 
Copeland, Mark Neff, Archie 
Burress, Larry Murphy, 
Mack McCormack, John 
Lynn, Jim McLain, Ed Free­
man, Bob Elliott, Gary Sims. 
Tim Woodington, Gene Cudd 
and P. A. Lyon.

Next meeting will be Janu­
ary JO at Martin's Steak 
Garden.

^Mx and SMxs Won . ‘Hendxicks 

xequest the honouX of youx pxesence 

at the maxxiage of theix daughtex 
JJe ^Veta Gaiihex

fRoy iDuval

on SMonday, the tenth day of /fanuaxy 

nineteen hundxed and seventy-seven 
SFiXtl iBaptist Chuxch 

Speaxnjan. 2~exas

Visitors over the New 
Year’s weekend in the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. Pope Gibner 
were their grandsons, Van 
Steed and Dan Steed, who 
are students at A&M.

Christmas holiday guests 
in the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Pope Gibner were their son, 
Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Gibner 
and family of Albuquerque, 
New Mexico.

ALL TYPES OF 
SAND BLASTING

Stock Trailers Cattle Trailers
HorseTrailers W aterTanks

Nitrogen Tanks

Jim Canada
GRUVER
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Mrs. Doris Colvin and Mrs. Jams* Cook 

request the honor of your presence 

Rt the marriage of their children,

Kay Rex 

to

Terry Cook

on Friday, the 7th day of January 

nineteen hundred and seventy-seven, 

at 8t00 P.M.

First Baptist Church 

Spearman, Texas 

Reception Following

Nationally | 
cision makers 
medicine, bu 
munications i 
are scheduled 
tions to Unit 
leaders from 
region meeting 
(Tex.), Jan. 7- 

Sponsored I
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Ground Beef
100% PURE BEEF

IN 3-LB. 
P A C K A G E  

OB MORE.

LB.

ony Electric 
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,  High Team Game
Co-op
Co-op
Martin's

High Ind. Series 
Millie Craig 
Beth Baker 
Patty Spoonemorc

High Ind. Game 
Millie Craig 
Beth Baker 
Mary Cornelius
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Friends of t 
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First Uni tec 
Church Gard 
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Stinnett, they 
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First Unitec 
Church of Be 
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184
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High Team Series

Boards To 
Celebrate

1947
1920
1822

Anniversary
The son of Mr. and Mrs. 

Lex L. Board of Borger will 
honor his parents with a 
golden wedding anniversary 
reception from 2 p.m. to 4

Nfr. and M 
per of Lubboc 
parents of a 
December 28 
Suzanne weig 
oz. and has t 
brother, Jay l 

Maternal gr 
Mr. and Mrs. 
of Memphis, ’ 

Paternal gri 
Mr. and Mrs. 
of Spearman.

NOLLY CREEK BRANN

W h o le !
FRESH
FROZEN

• I1H SIS! ATTACH1D
Hfw Brea$h..........
U.TOM't S.1AOSO, . . .  COOK ID

ish Slicks
FRESH EXTRA LEAN

o .  TON’S SRKADSO. A l l  COO AID

Ground 
Chuck...

IN 3-LB. 
PKGS OR 
MORE

Cotto Salami............Oil 99*
BAR s MEAT OR BEEP

Sliced Bologna..........,'i°i 89c

WILSONS CHUNK

Braunschweiger........ .....LI 89*
WINCHESTER, IMITATION

Bologna.................. is 69*

IO.TON’1 SHADED. H E  COOKED

89* Drumsticks.............

M "
WILSON'S RIOULAR OR POLISH
Smoked Sausage.........

*129 MIAOOWOALK HICKORY SMOKED
Sliced Bacon........... J

*1 *
MIAOOWOALK HICKORY SMOKRO
Sliced Bacon........... >,

<|)RING<H0ME THEVALUI§
HUNT'S

PRICES EFFECTIVE THRU 
SATURDAY. JANUARY I, 1177. 
NONE SOLD TO DEALERS 
LIMIT RIGHTS RESERVED.

MON.-SAT.
8:00 A .M .-9:00 P.M.

SUN.
10:00 A.M.-7:00 P.M.

Tomato Ketchup

663 2 -O Z .
BOTTLE

MRS. TVCKIR’S

Shorteningzz 94*
DEL MONTE COT

Green Beans

4 . 85

MEADOWDALE ENRICHED

! ‘flour” ,c S
BAB

UMIf-1 
WITH *5.D0 

MORE 
PVBCNASI.

DEL MONTE CREAM OR KERNEL

Coldon 
Corn.....
DEL MONTE

Swoot
__________ ___ ,_____Sim . POOS.....  “**
DEL MONTE HALVES OR SLICED ... DEL MONTE

CAMELOT

Tomato

RAFT SALAD DRESSING

Mlrads
DEL MONTE, LIGHT MEAT

AMELOT DINNER

J *

Cling
Ponchos a-oz.

..CANS

Julco......
CAMELOT

Snltino
Crackers

40OZ.
..CAN

Tbrif-T Ddry Foodi, J j  yourchoicê ^
T O N  CAMELOT COLBY OR MILD ^ ^ B ^ P  g

1 Longhorn C h e ese ...O O *
"  CAMELOT SLICED *

American Singles.____ js 84
MEL-O-CRUST SWEETMD.K OR BUTTERMILK M a n

Canned Biscuits.-----------
MEADOWDALE QUARTERED   A
m  m  0  LIMIT-4 WITH SI M ORMargarine r*.1.:.::*”..____ st 2cr

n-oz
. JAR Tuns...... 2

AMERICAN BEAUTY LONG OR

E M #  3  (

Spaghetti

SH-OZ.
CANS

ItOZ.
I...PKGS.

CHARM IN. ASSORTED COLORS

Bath
Tissue

■ A M B IT  PROZIN
MJZ. PACKAGE ... ALL VARIETIES

; SOZ. PACKAGE ... ALL FLAVORS FAIRMONT...DAIRY FAIR

i  fflpfit A m  f t y jm

Pot P ies I isW®
ALL FLAVORS FAIRMON

Pies lee Mitt
MEADOWDALE FROZEN FLOI

Orange,
HANDY PAR ... FRENCH FRn

Pota to
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Mr*. Doris Colvin and Mrs. Janies Cook 

request the honor of your presence 

at the marriage of their children,

Kay Rex 

to

Terry Cook

on Friday, the 7th day of January 

nineteen hundred and seventy-seven, 

at8i00 P.M.

First Baptist Church 

Spearman, Texas 

Reception Following
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Nationally Prominent 
Men To Speak At 
Eight State Meet
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High Team Series
I?
tin's
ty

Won Lost
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45 Vi I4 '/i 

32 28
31
31
27
43
44

1947
1920
1822

High Team Game
Co-op 692
Co-op 675
Martin's 672

High Ind. Series 
Millie Craig 529
Beth Baker 513
Patty Spoonemore 506

High Ind. Game 
Millie Craig 200
Beth Baker 184
Mary Cornelius 180

Boards To 
Celebrate

Anniversary
The son of Mr. and Mrs. 

Lex L. Board of Borger will 
honor his parents with a 
golden wedding anniversary 
reception from 2 p.m. to 4

Nationally prominent de­
cision makers in the field of 
medicine, business, com­
munications and education 
are scheduled for presenta­
tions to United Methodist 
leaders from an eight-state 
region meeting in Arlington, 
(Tex.), Jan. 7-9.

Sponsored by the South

p.m. Sunday, January 9.
Friends of the couple are 

invited to the reception in the 
First United Methodist 
Church Garden Room in 
Borger.
- Married January 9. 1927 in 
Stinnett, they have one son, 
Wayne L. Board of Amarillo. 
The couple moved to Borger 
from Morse in October, 1974.

They are members of the 
First United Methodist 
Church of Borger and the 
Order of the Eastern Star.

nI T  and Mrs. Lynn Kem­
per of Lubbock are the proud 
parents of a baby girl born 
December 28, 1976. Kayla 
Suzanne weighed 8 lbs. 13 
oz. and has a 2'/i year old 
brother, Jay Lynn at home.

Maternal grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Floy Anthony 
of Memphis, Texas.

Paternal grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Kemper 
of Spearman.

Central Jurisdiction of the 
United Methodist Church, 
the FUTURIST1CS CON­
FERENCE is to open at the 
Inn of Six Flags Friday 
evening (Jan. 7) at 7:00 
o ’clock with an address by 
Dean Roy Fisher, head of the 
School of Journalism at the 
University of Missouri in 
Columbia, Mo.

Dr. Michael DeBakey, 
heart surgeon at the Texas 
Medical Center in Houston, 
Millard Collins, executive for 
the International Businesa 
Machine Corporation in Dal­
las, and Dr. John Silber, 
president of the Boston Uni­
versity in Boston, Mass, will 
detail the decision made in 
medicine, business, and ed­
ucation respectively in sub­
sequent sessions of the three 
day conference.

"Shocking Decisions 
Made”  in the four areas 
under discussion is the sub­
ject of a series of media 
presentations produced by 
Travis E. Jordan, head of the 
instructional media services 
at Southern Methodist Uni­
versity in Dallas.

Laity and clergy from the 
denomination's seventeen 
annual conferences in the 
eight-state region have been 
invited to meet with the ten 
resident bishops for this 
Futuristics Conference.

“ We intend to create a 
public arena in which the

D r. Khun Young S on , h a s  now o p en ed  o t t l c e s  a t  th e  H a n s fo rd  C l i n i c .
P ic t u r e d  w ith  D r. S on , a r e  h i s  o f f i c e  g i r l s ,  C a r o ly n  C o lem an , r e c e p t i o n i s t ,  
and n u rse  D e lo r i s  G u t h r ie .  rhe new c l i n i c  h o u rs  a r e  9 -1 2 ,  and 1 -5 ,  w i t h  
th e  c l i n i c  c lo s e d  a l l  d a y  W edn esday . Th e  g i r l s  in  th e  o f f i c e  a r e  a s k in g  
anyon e  who m igh t h a v e  some p a in t in g s ,  o r  p i c t u r e s  t o  d i s p l a y  i n  th e  c l i n i c ,  
t o  b r in g  them dow n. Even  th o s e  a r t i s t s  who m igh t h a v e  p a in t in g s  f o r  s a l e ,  
can  d i s p la y  them a t  th e  c l i n i c .

church leaders will dialogue 
and exchange ideas with 
decision makers in those 
areas about the develop­
ments of the future,”  said 
the Rev. Dr. J. Woodrow 
Hearn. Baton Rouge, chair­
man of the planning commit­

tee.
“ The conference is expec­

ted to forecast the kinds of 
decisions the future will 
bring and we intend to 
explore the role of the 
Church in this future,”  said 
Dr. Hearn.

NOLLY CREEK BRAND BAR-S

Whole Fryers
FRESH
FROZEN

LB.
• I> H  a m  ATTACHED

ryer Breasts.......
©•TON'S IR IAO IO , FBI COOKED

ORTON'S 1 * 1 * 0 1 D, PRE COOKED

NORTON'S BREADED, PRE COOKED

8 9 e
FRESH FRYER THIOHS OR

Drumsticks. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . L.  79*
WILSON S REGULAR OR POLISH

Smoked Sausage. . . . . . . . . .
s p MEADOWDALE HICKORY SMOKED

Sliced Bacon. . . . . . . . . . . . . L L .  I f l *

* 1 "
MEADOWDALE HICKORY SMOKED

Sliced Bacon. . . . . . l-LS  J ? ”
1AK8 *

Pbrb Sausage

5 8

Slice#

THEVALÛ
Bacon

MRS. TUCKER'S

Shortening04.

PACK

LB. 7 9
SHOP MEAL FOR SUPERLATIVE 
SAYM0S, 7-DAYS A  WEEK ... WE 
WELCOME FOOD STAMP CUSTOMERS.

414Z.
CAR

' flour”

■AS

MEAMWRALI ENRKMED

F Iour

4 4 e
LIMIT-1 
WITH '5.09 
OR MORE 
PORCHASE.

RAFT SALAD DRESSING

Mirada
DEL MONTE, LIGHT MEAT

Chunk

AMERICAN BEAUTY LONG OR

Elko 3
t a i n i a l i  a H i  1<K,‘
9  g M a g i l M  EBB... p k g

CHARM IN. ASSORTED COLORS

Both

2 iw-oz ^  1  
CANS ■

89'

LADY CAMELOT 
SNEER-TO-TNE-WAKT

Parity Hose

4 7PAM *  “

M AI
RED. OR 0NSCERT8D 

'  ANTWERSPMANT

FAIRMONT...DAIRY FAIR

H-GAL.
• • • •• • •• •• • •• •• • •CTN

MEADOWDALE FROZEN FLORIDA UMIT-S WITH
H.M OR MORE

Pies lee M th
MEADOWDALE FROZEN FLORID

Orange Juice
HANDY PAK ... FRENCH FRIED

Potatoes 900090909990099^'

Tfio Ideal Plac 
lo /ore on 
Pielure-Perfoe 
Fre/fi Produce!

- j  /

WASNHMTOH FARCY RED

D eU dous  
Apples

Sit
CALEORNIA

Navel 
Oranges

COLORADO

1 0
•LB.

..• AO 5 8
Russet 
Potatoes.
RUBY RED m m  m

Grapefruit......................S  ■£ 0 *
CALIFORNIA. FRESH _

Carrots......... ...................... £» 25c
PURPLE TOP

Turnips  .. ..25*
Yams,................ 2*49*
f l o .1 0 *  t  A n a  s o a i t s d  .

( M R  Juice...............2 *  ’1" N a a k ......................... « * F
* I«o rr« . . , ,  evaar eoa ... y u l i o w  .  AA,

Apple Odor..................Popcorn...................................................4 W c

Moore Is Shotgun 
Winner

Pictured above is the proud owner, 
Don Moore of. Spearman, who was the 
winner of a Remington 7700 12-guage 
shotgun given away by the Signal Hill 
Repeater Association of Stinnett. The 
drawing was held December 22 at 
Curley’s Hardware in Stinnett. Shown 
with Moore is Kurt Shedeck, who is an 
active Ham operator in Spearman. 
Other membe s of the Association in 
Spearman are Jim Fowler, John Wilde, 
and Mike Holt.

The purpose of the raffle was to buy 
new equipment, a two meter repeater, 
static-free communication which can be 
heard up to 30 miles regardless of 
atmospheric conditions. The repeater 
may be used by all hams in the area 
regardless whether they are a member 
of the association or not.

The association is planning a new 
machine which will have an auto patch 
which is a phone-type system for mobile 
vehicles, a random code generator and a 
link at Bernstein, north of Graver. The 
association covers the south part of 
Hansford County and all of Hutchinson 
County. It is hoped that the association 
will be able to give Civil Defense funds 
for this equipment.

Anyone interested in becoming a 
member of the association may call any 
of the above men in Spearman. A 
novice code and theory course is now 
being taught in Borger. Requirements 
for becoming a member is a technician 
license or higher. ,

The association wishes to thank all of 
those people in the area who donated to 
their campaign for new equipment.

Thanks•• .
I would like to take this opportunity to 

thank the people of Precinct 1 and the 
county as a whole for their support, 
encouragement and confidence through 
the past 24 years that I have been a 
commissioner. Residents of Hansford 
County and of Precinct 1 are, in my 
opinion, the best in the world.

My retirement on January 1 marked 
26 years of service to citizens of 
Hansford County. I was a deputy 
sheriff for two years and served as 
Commissioner of Precinct 1 for 24 years.

I was one of the first backers for the 
establishment of Hansford Hospital and 
have backed the hospital all these years, 
during both good and bad times.

Some of the decisions that the 
commissioners court have made in the 
past did not please one and all, but the 
commisstOfien felt that they were the 
best solutions for the whole county.

Hansford County has been known for 
many years as having one of the best 
commissioners court in the state, and I 
feel sure that my successor. Garland 
Head, and B. J. Renner, newly sworn in 
commissioner of Precinct 3 will, along 
with the other commissioners, keep this 
tradition.

I also would like to thank the county 
employees for the beautiful engraved 
pocket watch given to me on my 
retirement.

JeeDay
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CLEARANCE

SALE
C L O S I N G  OUT AL L  

T A C K  l / 2 P r i C N

On e  g r o u p  m e n s  Cowboy  

boot s  -TonyLama, Sanders

^ o 8*_____________

30% off on a ll g o o s e  down 

W o m e n ' s ,  c h i l d r e n ' s ,  

m e n ' s  coats

3 0 %  off on r a ck  of s h i r t s  

3 0 %  off on al l  l a d l e s  wear

1976 M o is tu re  
W a s  S c a n t  10.52

The year 1976 ended cold and dry 
with only 10.52 inches of moisture in the 
record books.

The past year is not the driest on 
record for Hansford County, only the 
second driest. In the records here at the 
newspaper, the year 1930 recorded 
7.88. The next to the lowest record 
since 1880 was in 1910 when 11.15 was 
recorded. Two more record dry years 
were 1952 with 11.37 and 1953 with 
12.72.

The wettest year on record was 1884 
w ith  39.91. 1950 was the wettest in

5 5 T

recent years with 36.38 recorded.
In 1976 the driest months were  

January. February and December. 
January report was .06. February .05 
and December .02.

The month of September was the 
wettest of the year with 3.40 inches, and 
May and April followed April moisture 
was 2.16 and May 2.45. The only other 
month in which over *n inch was 
recorded was July with I '7*. June, 
which is normally the wettest month of 
the year recorded only .63.

Average Residential 
KWH Selling Price

J/cnestty.
FIND A BETTER BUY?

! • • •

30 %  off on al l  

B A I L E Y  H A T S

i -it*
J

P h o n e  6 5 9 - 2 4 7 6

BUNKHOUSE
- down t own  - 

S p e a r m a n

For a modern 18 cubic foot, frost free 

refrigerator/freezer, you will use 

approximately 188 Kilowatt-hours 

per month. For an entire month the 

electricity to operate this appliance 

should cost you less than 28c a day! 

Think of all the day-to-day comforts 

and conveniences you are afforded 

by electricity: lighting, entertain­

ment, heating and cooling, cooking, 

dishwashing, clothes washing and 

drying, water heating, refrigerators 

and freezers, and the many small 

appliances available to make chores 

easie r. . . and oftentimes fun! Add 

them all up and you'll quickly see 

that electricity is one of the best buys 

around.

COMMUNITY PUBLIC SERVICE
Your Electric Ugh! & ffaer Company

An Equal Opportunity Employer

LADIES
SHOES

IMPAIR 
REG. PRICE 
2nd PAIR 

FREE
2  1 M m  for  1

CHILDREN'S

SHOES ■/2  FKICS

MEN'S _

SHOES
i
' 2  ,R K I

MEN'S, WOMEN'S, CHILDREN'S

NOUSE SHOES !4
f  A  PRICE

Hand B ags 40 % TO
—  A  OFF
50%

ROSE MILK SKIN CARE 
CREAM
t2oi
Mfg List $2 29

*1 .1 9 4
SAVINGS

fr—  yw r  BO|MMrtwE ASttOATED 0BUGGBT8
JANUARY 1977

-ROSE MILK 
IS S S fc  MOISTURIZING 

'  VtFACE CREAM
t i f f . *  * |2 or Mfg list S? 98

TRIAMINICIN 
DECONGESTANT TABLETS

m m s m a

IKAZ VAPORIZER i
I  Warm Steam, Automatic Shut Oft
I I  2 gallon 

Mtg List $9 99

Ls4 .4 7
I KAZ HUMIDIFIERi
| Cool Moisture
I I gallon capacity 
Mtg List $16 50

‘8.47l
SUCRETS THROAT 

l LOZENGESl
] Regular or Menthol 
24s
Mtg List $1 37 each I

V

Reed's Family 
Shoes

209 Main Spaarman

OPEN 24

ALLSUPS
JANUARY SPECIALS!

ALLSUPS
CONVENIENCE STORES

OPEN 24 
HOURS

PIHCiS EFFECTIVE 
THURSDAY THRU SATURDAY 

JANUARY t-8 .1 S 7 7

BORDEN S HI PROTEIN

SttUiFRESN

CANNED
!r*8 "

7t UAL. 
CTH

BLISTEX LIP OINTMENT
.14 or
Mtg List 59-

Slnu tab

*1.00
SINUTAB SINUSl 
TABLETS 30s
Mtg List $2 86

• Che*

Cereal
Cara, Wheal ar Rica

49*

BORDEN'S

ICE CREAM

Vt UAL. 
RD. CTH.

F a m i ly  S lz a

U ta P k g .
Tide $ 4 4 9

*1 .4 4 TO P Q U A LITY BUY

]&

MAAL0X LIQUID
12 oz.
Mfg. List $2.14 *1.38

■CLEARASIL 
MEDICATED 
CLEANSER
4 02 Mtg List St I

*1.121

S r o n d m a 's

Asserted

Ceekles

GREAT WITH MII K!

HYDROX COOKIES
SHOP THE FRIENDLY. CONVENIENT 

ALLSUP S STONE NEANY0UI

1 IIZ - I
. r u .

1
MISS BRECK 
HAIR SPRAY .

I Regular or Super 11 02 
I L L *  Mtg List $1 64 each

m
THlDf AAC SMOOCSTID AO PMICF.S OPTIONAL WTTH PARTtCf̂ ATtNO STOWES

Sp e arm an  R exa ll D rug
#

659-2226 SPEARMAN 220 M AIN

HOT COOKED FOODS

• BBOCNICKEK *8808188
• HOT LINKS • MILD LINKS
• BUBBIT0S • COBB BOBS 

BEBIMB SAUSNBE *BULK BBQ BEEF
• b n  BEEF SANDWICHES 305 W. KENNETH
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You Nam e It I
We had a couple of inches 

of snow this past New Year's 
weekend and you might say 
that Jimmy Carter's New 
Year is starting off wet. 
Many changes in our country 
are taking place this year, 
and there are several big 
changes taking place, or 
getting ready to take place, 
in Spearman. New doctors 
have arrived and are practi­
cing. 1 never thought that I 
would live to see the day 
when we had to go to foreign 
countries to get our oil, 
gasoline, doctors, and 1 
guess in the near future cars! 
The little cars just aren’t 
going over too well in this 
country, however, 1 see 
where they have laid off all of 
the small car workers at GM 
because they can't sell the 
small cars in America! I 
doubt if Americans will buy 
small cars if gasoline goes to 
$1.00 per gallon, but we will 
wait and seel

•••
Everyone that I have 

talked with sure didn’t like 
the back-to-back holidays of 
Christinas and New Year's. 
We printed the papers early 
for two weeks, and we com­
pletely lost count of time! 
W e took off on Friday eve­
nings for two weeks and 
didn’t come back until Mon­
day, and the boob tube and 
the eating was Just too moch 
for moot of ns who are keyed 
to a 6-day week! I sure was 
proud of Mike Floyd catching 
that paas In the Sun Bowl, 
however, and I did watch 
some of the other football 
games, but football Isn’t 
football without the Dallas 
Cowboys! When they, or the 
Lynx, or the Greyhounds, or 
the Ranger* aren’t in the 
playoffs, I lose Interest!

•••
The big election to see 

whether the hospital officials 
will be elected or appointed 
will take place on January 15. 
Be sure and vote in this 
election. The future of your 
hospital still depends on 
people using the hospital, 
but exercise your right to 
vote in the January 15th 
election.

•••
The Christmas lights this 

year were great! Baker and 
Taylor’a Disneyland Christ­
mas scenes were “ something 
again”  to write homo about. 
In spite of the dry weather 
and extreme cold, this has 
been one great Christmas for 
most ail of ns.

**•
If there is any organization 

that I would like to brag 
about, it is the Post Office 
this Christmas! Ray Robert­
son and his crew kept the 
mail moving and it had to be 
the best service in the U.S. 
In fact, these men and wo­
men should be given special 
recognition by our commu­
nity for such fine Christmas 
service. Happy New Year to 
everyone at the Post Office, 
both in Spearman and the 
Gruver and Morse communi­
ties. You have all carried the 
mail this year and have done 
a tine job.

saw my last basketball

game of the yew at the 
Miami tourney when Spew- 
man boys boot Darronaett. I 
cwne down with the hundred 
yew flo and promised to slay 
away from the gym for three 
weeks. Bat, I am ready for 
action now and can hardly 
wait for the big game against 
the Dalhart Wolves In Spear 
man. Of course, we must 
win theee first two games to 
atay In the race, but I sure 
am anxious to see the Dal­
hart-Spearman games! By 
the way, we have our new 
1977 basketball programs 
printed and will deliver them 
to the schools this week!

I visited with the Rotary 
Club a minute Monday, and 
Mrs. Thu from Gruver was 
guest speaker. Head Rotar- 
ian, Junior Lusby and his 
Club had a full house to hear 
Mrs. Thu and it was very 
enjoyable to hear her speak. 
One of the things she said 
was that it cost $8.00 for a 
doctor’s office call in Viet­
nam and $8.00 for a haircut! 

•••
The Lions Club will have a 

pancake supper February 4, 
Friday night, at the Junior 
High School cafeteria! At 
the regulw meeting Tues­
day, Lion Jack Oakes won the 
big jackpot prize! A  plate la 
passed and Boss Uon Earl 
“ The Pearl”  Goodheart 
leaves the room. While he la 
gone, two plates are passed 
and everyone puts In at least 
a nickie. After a few minutes 
Eari comes back In the room 
and the Uon who pul In the 
last donation, wins the big 
Jackpot prize! Uon Oakes 
won the prize this week! The 
club raised enough money 
through this project ($10,001 
to supplement some of their 
programs!

Girl Scout 
.. News

Junior Troop #76 met 
Monday, January 3, in the 
Girl Scout House with leader, 
Mrs. Larry Evans.

The troop discussed their 
holiday vacation.

Those present were Lelia 
Goodman, Teri Thomas, 
Penny Cummings and Becky 
Evans.

Next meeting will be Jan­
uary 10 at the Scout House.

FRESH FROM NATURE

We have the gift 
you need to give:

• Food Supplements
* Beauty Aids 
•Cleaning Products 
THINK GOOD HEA LTH

see or call ^ 
Dorothymae Groves 

14 So. Haney 
Spearman, Texas 
806-659-3027

rrJtf’M ijn jf t r k

notes from Faith Lutheran Church

The Annual Congregational Meeting of Faith 
Lutheran Church will be held on January 13 at 
7:30 p.m. In our Lutheran heritage of faith, we 
have taken pride in combining two seemingly 
opposite things: congregational independence
and church-wide uniformity. The church-wide 
uniformity is accomplished through adherence to 
common confessions and administratively 
through our national and world offices. The 
viability and success of the congregational 
independence is based on the individual mem­
bers of each and every congregation. Every 
member of Faith is urged to attend this important 
meeting and take part in the responsibility of 
decision making.

The Luther League met Sunday, January 2 at 2 
p.m. and elected new officers for 1977. They are 
as follows: President-Tammy Bynum; Vice
President/Treasurer-Janet Oltman; Secre- 
tary/Reporter-Terry Bynum. The League also 
welcomed three new sponsors: Willie Reneau
and Ed and Coda Zschiesche. And a note of 
thanks from the Leaguers to Myrna and Cecil 
Bigger* for having been sponsors for the past two 
years. Thanks for all your helnl

A "Talent, Arts and Crafts Snow" plus a meal 
will be put on by the Luther League on January 
30. The exact starting time has not yet been set. 
The event will include a meal prepared by the 
Leaguers for those attending, talent preparations 
by the Leaguers and various members of the 
congregation, and arts and crafts on display by 
any and all who wish to do so. Everyone is being 
asked to participate in this “ show” , so plan on 
joining the fun and entertainment I

Congratulations to Evi and Robert Meyer on 
the birth of a baby girl! The new member of the 
family has been named Julie.

If you have no home church or would like to 
visit with us at Faith, we Invite you to join us in 
worship. The Sunday Morning Worship begins at 
9:30 a.m. and the Sunday School Hour begins at 
10:30 a.m.
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LADIES
SHOES

FOR

DRENS

2  P R IC E

1/2/  *  PRICE

OMEN'S, CHILDREN'S

SE SHOES V im *

Bags 40 % t o  5 0

oed's Family 
Shoes

OFF

209 Main Spaarman

OPEN 24 
HOURS

PRICES EFFECTIVE 
THURSDAY THRU SATURDAY 

JANUARY 0*0 ,11 77

IOOH SHUKFKSH

m t m a , . . . .
SHAMS !r:*3*®

BORDENS

ICE CREAM

Vt GAL. 
RD.CTN.

|0 9
F a m ily  S ix *

lid o $ 4 4 9

TO P Q U A LITY  BUY
8REAT WITH M ill

HYDROXCOOKIES... V , 69c
SHOP THE FRIENDLY. CONVENIENT 

ULSUP S STORE HEM YMII

305 W. KENNETH
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You Nam e It I
We had a couple of inches 

of snow this past New Year's 
weekend and you might say 
that Jimmy Carter's New 
Year is starting off wet. 
Many changes in our country 
are taking place this year, 
and there are several big 
changes taking place, or 
getting ready to take place, 
in Spearman. New doctors 
have arrived and are practi­
cing. 1 never thought that I 
would live to see the day 
when we had to go to foreign 
countries to get our oil, 
gasoline, doctors, and I 
guess in the near future cars! 
The little cars just aren't 
going over too well in this 
country, however, I see 
where they have laid off alt of 
the small car workers at GM 
because they can’ t sell the 
small cars in America! I 
doubt if Americans will buy 
small cars if gasoline goes to 
$1.00 per gallon, but we will 
wait and see!

•••
Everyone that I have 

talked with tore didn’t like 
the back-to-back holidayi of 
Chriatmaa and New Year's. 
We printed the paper* early 
for two week*, and we com­
pletely lost count of time! 
W e took off on Friday eve­
ning* for two week* and 
didn’t come back until Mon­
day, and the boob tube and 
the eating was just too much 
for moot of us who are keyed 
to a 6-day week! I sure was 
proud of Mike Floyd catching 
that pass In the Son Bowl, 
however, and I did watch 
some of the other football 
games, but football Isn’t 
football without the Dallas 
Cowboys! When they, or the 
Lynx, or the Greyhounds, or 
the Rangers aren’t In the 
playoffs, I lose Interest!

The big election to see 
whether the hospital officials 
will be elected or appointed 
will take place on January IS. 
Be sure and vote in this 
election. The future of your 
hospital still depends on 
people using the hospital, 
but exercise your right to 
vote in the January ISth 
election.

•••
The Chriatmaa lights this 

year were great! Baker and 
Taylor’ a Disneyland Christ­
mas scenes were “ something 
again’ ’ to write home about. 
In spite of the dry weather 
and extreme cold, this has 
been one great Christmas for 
moat all of na.

•**
If there is any organization 

that I would like to brag 
about, it is the Post Office 
this Christmas! Ray Robert­
son and his crew kept the 
mail moving and it had to be 
the best service in the U.S. 
In fact, these men and wo­
men should be given special 
recognition by our commu­
nity for such Tine Christmas 
service. Happy New Year to 
everyone at the Post Office, 
both in Spearman and the 
Graver and Morse communi­
ties. You have all carried the 
mail this year and have done 
a tine job.

•••
I saw my last basketball

game of the year at the 
Miami tourney when Spear­
man boys bent Danronxett. I 
came down with the hundred 
year flu and promised to stay 
away from the gym for three 
weeks. Bat, I am ready for 
action now and can hardly 
wait for the Mg game against 
the Dalhart Wolves in Spear­
man. Of course, we mast 
win these first two games to 
stay In the race, but I sure 
am anxious to see the Dal- 
hart-Speannan games! By 
the way, we have our new 
1977 basketball programs 
printed and will deliver them 
to the schools this week!

•**
I visited with the Rotary 

Club a minute Monday, and 
Mrs. Thu from Graver was 
guest speaker. Head Rotar- 
ian, Junior Lusby and his 
Club had a full house to hear 
Mrs. Thu and it was very 
enjoyable to hear her speak. 
One of the things she said 
was that it cost $8.00 for a 
doctor's office call in Viet­
nam and $8.00 for a haircut! 

sss
The Lions Gab will have a 

pancake sapper February 4, 
Friday night, at the Junior 
High School cafeteria! At 
the regular meeting Tues­
day, Lion Jack Oakes won the 
big jackpot prize! A  plate la 
passed and Boss Lion Earl 
“ The Pearl’ ’ Goodheart 
leaves the room. While he It 
gone, two plates are passed 
and everyone puts In at least 
a nlckle. After a few mlnntes 
Earl comes back In the room 
and the Lion who put In the 
last donation, wins the big 
Jackpot prize! Lion Oakes 
won the prize this week! The 
dob raised enough money 
through this project ($10.00) 
to supplement some of their 
programs!

Girl Scout 
, News

Junior Troop #76 met 
Monday, January 3, in the 
Girl Scout House with leader, 
Mrs. Larry Evans.

The troop discussed their 
holiday vacation.

Those present were Lelia 
Goodman, Teri Thomas, 
Penny Cummings and Becky 
Evans.

Next meeting will be Jan­
uary 10 at the Scout House.

FRESH FROM NATURE

We have the gift 
you need to give:

• Food Supplements
* Beauty Aids 
•Cleaning Products 
THINK GOOD HEALTH

see or call % 
Dorothymae Groves 

14 So, Haney 
Spearman, Texas 
806-659-3027

Our Heritage of
notes from Faith Lutheran Church

The Annual Congregational Meeting of Faith 
Lutheran Church will be held on January 13 at 
7:30 p.m. In our Lutheran heritage of faith, we 
have taken pride in combining two seemingly 
opposite things: congregational independence
and church-wide uniformity. The church-wide 
uniformity is accomplished through adherence to 
common confessions and administratively 
through our national and world offices. The 
viability and success of the congregational 
independence is based on the individual mem­
bers of each and every congregation. Every 
member of Faith is urged to attend this important 
meeting and take part in the responsibility of 
derision making.

The Luther League met Sunday, January 2 at 2 
p.m. and elected new officers for 1977, They are 
as follows: President-Tammy Bynum: Vice
President/Treasurer-Janet Oltman; Secre­
tary/Reporter-Terry Bynum. The League also 
welcomed three new sponsors: Willie Reneau
and Ed and Coda Zschiesche. And a note of 
thanks from the Leaguers to Myrna and Cecil 
Bigger* for having been sponsors for the past two 
yean. Thanks for all your help!

A “ Talent, Arts and Crafts Snow" plus a meal 
will be put on by the Luther League on January 
30. The exact starting time has not yet been set. 
The event will include a meal prepared by the 
Leaguen for those attending, talent preparations 
by the Leaguen and various memben of the 
congregation, and arts and crafts on display by 
any and all who wish to do so. Everyone is being 
asked to participate in this “ show", so plan on 
joining the fun and entertainment I

Congratulations to Evi and Robert Meyer on 
the birth of a baby girl! The new member of the 
family has been named Julie.

i f  you have no home church or would like to 
visit with us at Faith, we invite you to join us in 
worship. The Sunday Morning Worship begins at 
9:30 a.m. and the Sunday School Hour begins at 
10:30 a.m.
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^Basketball 1977 
Lynx & Lynxettes

n- 4....... * River Road................... H .............4:00
n. 6....... B-Team Tournament..... T .............Fritch
n. 7....... Gunning (Homecoming! H ...........6:30

20

I Jan 
Jan. 

I Jan.

•Canadian................... ... T.
..Jr. HI. Tournament....,.... H. ■ ■Spearman
. ’ Dalhart...................... ....H .............4t00
. *Boys Ranch.............. ....T..

...........5:00

. Tournament................ ...T..

. * Panhandle.................
Perryton. y,,. tug *  g *  T „

. Hoys Rancn ............ .

. 4River Road................
. B-Team Tournament...,....H.. .Spearman
..•Canadian................... ..........6:30
.•Dalhart......................im>£*

. .Graver.........................

S l nch7 tR .8 th *9 th L '

..•Panhandle..................

)

, \  Va .
I?

Homecominy this Friday nite__

W hite House 
Lu m b er Co.

306 Davis 
659-2818

Hansford 
Implement Co.
Hwy. 207 659 -2712  

Spearm an, Texas

Consum er Sales Co.
421 W. Kenneth Ava. 

Spearman, Texas 

659-2012

Jr. Lusby “Cats”
W. G ru ver Hwy.

* Spearm an , Texas

659 -3 7 6 6

/B A K ER  S T A Y L O R l
Equity Elevators

104 Collard 

Spearman, Texas 

659-2420
1 ■ i------------------------------------- -ftr

Speartex Grain Co.
Gruver State Bank L il’ L yn x Shoppe

514 C o lla rd
G R U V E R

312 Mala 689-2608

659 -3711
733-5061

Spearman, Texas
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G R O U N D  BEEF

KRAFT MAC. & CHEESE

KRAFT'S GRAPE

U N I T E D
SUPER MARKETS
WE G I V E  G R E E N  S T A M P S

DRESSING!
TYSON'S

s p * gm c ; ti

C E N T R A L  A M E R IC A N

C R IS P
P O D S



EXTRA LEAN " 
CURES OF BEEF

. .BONELESS SHOULDER

TUNA
MAD LAWN

BAGS

M E X IC A N
•QUESO
SALTILLO UNITED

SUPER MARKETS
WE GIVE h i GREE N STAMPS12 OZ.  

C A N S
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REEDY'S

JANUARY,
H

DINING ROOM REGULAR

5pc modern white formica top table with green vinyl
W  chairs on casters......... •••••:?•.......... • 'i'Jr19'
ww 7pc modern birch formica top table with orange printed

BS  vinyl chairs.... ..................... ;••••■......5pc modern white formica top round table with blue
vinyl chairs..........................   298.

5pc modern white formica top round table with yellow/
chrome swivel chairs.............................519«(j 7pc oak formica top oct table with caned back chairs..716.

h I 48" round drop leaf maple table with 4 leaves by
A  Tell City.................................... 379-
£  Glass doored maple china..................   769-
B  Glass doored maple buffet & hutch by Tell City........ 669.

Maple formica top dry sink........................... 269.Pine top gold hand painted server with louvered doors
by Christmas......................................325*

Pine dry sink on casters.............................. 279.
72" round pedestal table with 42" lazy susan by

8  Christmas........................................ 799.
A  Pie safe with tin doors ............................. 359-

BEDROOM
Mediterrean oak triple dresser, mirror, queen size

bed & 2 nite stands............................. 978.
Oak triple dresser, mirror, 5 drawer chest, queen

size bed & 1 nite stand.....  938.
Oak doored chest on chest, queen size bed & 2

nite stands.......................................788.
Country oak triple dresser, twin mirror, hutch queen

size bed, doored chest & 2 nite stands......... 1577.
Vintage oak triple dresser, mirror, 5 drawer chest

& queen size bed................................  988.
Queen size brass plate headboard with frame.........  159.
Several odd regular or queen size headboards........  149.
Vintage oak double dresser, hutch mirror, queen size

bookcase bed & 8 drawer chest................... 1137.
Pine dresser & twin mirrors, queen size pineapple

queen size bed & 2 nite stands.................. 10 9 7.
Pine triple dresser, hutch mirror, king size bed &

two nite stands................................. 1048.
Maple triple dresser, mirror, queen size bed & 2

nite stands.......................................928.
Maple lingerie chest...................................299.
Maple king size bed with frame........................ 239.

50set
50set

LIVING ROOM
Early american plaid wood arm sofa......................379/
Pine finish wood arm sofa............................... 629-.!
Pine finish wood arm loveseat(matches above sofa)...... ^ 9 /
Country style orange & brown plaid sofa and chair..... 1158. (
Rust & blue striped loose cushion sofa................. 659/
Blue print sofa.......................................... 649.,
Brown striped velvet sofa................................698.
Brown vinyl sofa.....................   ^98.
Aztec woven print sofa & matching chair............... 1299-
Orange & brown flame stitch sofa........................7^9-
Country style brown & black plaid sofa..................698.
Country style flame stitch chair & ottoman............. 519.
Orange tweed wood arm chair & ottoman............ ......398.
lpr dark brown velvet chairs............................ 298.
lpr blue velvet chairs...................................279.
lpr blue herculon chairs.................................219.
lpr orange & green striped velvet chairs............... 269.
lpr low back brown velvet chairs........................269.
Sculptured gold velvet swivel rocker.................... 229.
Hi-back orange striped velvet chair..................... 298.
Moss green velvet chair..................................239-
lpr early american plaid wood arm platform rockers..... 239;
Early american orange plaid swivel rocker................ 229.

SALE

4l9,50set
3 6 9 . 5 0 s e t

198.50set
398.5°set 
569.50set
2 9 8 .5 0
599.50
539.50
198.50
249.50
198.50
598.50 
279-50

698.50
698.50
598.50 

1198.50
798.50
119.50 

98.50ea
898.50
749.50
798.50
7 ^ 9 . 5 0
229.50
179.50

Regular Sale

298.50
498.50
359.50 
899.00
449.50
449.50
529.50
389.50 
975-00
598.50
559.50
398.50
339.50
19 8.5°ea198.50ea 
149* 5°ea 
179.5°ea 
179.5°ea
149.50
198.50
149.50 
179-5°ea
179.50

Hide-A-Beds
.......................5 ^ 9 . .

............................. 698 .,

............. 599.

............. 895..................... 698.
..................................... 5 ^ 9 .
............. 859.
............. 598.

429.50
529.50
449.50
698.50
5 4 9 .5 0
398.50
649.50
459.50

MANY MORE 

ITEMS ON

SALE ARE 

NOT LISTED

„ • * * * • .
*  A  STEAL

MAPLE OR DINE

OCCASIONAL UVIMC 
ROOM TABLES

VALVES TO *174.M

YOUR CHOKES A A O O

O N E G R O U P

S O F A
P IL L O W S

V A LU E S  
T O  8.95

I I I

A L L
TA B LE  FLOOR 

& S W A G
1 1

L A M P S

S ale
P riced

O N E  G R O U P

B ED S P R EA D S

V A L U E  T O  300° 
Y O U R  C H O IC E

2
P R IC E  I

Pictures,
M ir r o rs ,  

a n d  W a ll
Accessories

Sale
Priced

Blue & brown stripe......................
Beige velvet loose cushion..............
Woven orange/beige/green print..........
Orange print quilted loose cushion......
Green/gold herculon plaid...............
Light brown velvet.......................
Country style gold print wood arm.......
Brown & black plaid......................

La-Z-Boys
Black naugahyde & black nylon fabric....................219.50 169.50
Choice of brown or green naugahyde......................209.50ea l59-95ea
Choice of orange or green fabric combined with naugahyde209.50ea l59.95ea
Orange plaid wall recliner.............................. 309.50 198.50
Modern style green stripe herculon.....................259.50 198.50
Choice of green or gold velvet......................... 319.50ea 259-50ea
Choice of green, gold, orange, or brown velvet......... 291.00ea 239*50ea
lpr blue velvet......................................... 298.50ea I98.50ea
Early american plaid.................................... 279.50 198. 50
Orange plaid pine arm................................... 309.50 249*5°
Brown plaid pine arm.................................... 309.50 249-5°
Orange/beige/brown plaid wood arm......................298.50 239-5°
Choice of brown or beige stripe herculon.............. 309.50 249-5°
Brown & black naugahyde & fabric combination office ch..398.50 329*5°

REEDY FURNITURE CO

SIMMONS BEDDING
SIMMONS BEDDING

Odd full size mattress............ 99-95
Odd full size boxspring.......... IO9.50
Odd twin size mattress.............79*95ea
Queen size Beautyrest Backcare I Set 359.95set 
King size Beautyrest Backcare I Set. 499.95set
Deep Slumber queen size set........ 2S9.95set
Baby mattress....................... _ 32.50ea

69.95
79.95 _  
^ 9 . 9 5  

298.50.K 
399.50S 
1 9 8 . 5 0 . 5
19.95.gj

Full size Beautyrest 
Backcare I mattress or boxspring.149.95ea 119.5°

MISCELLANEOUS
REGULARPine curio cabinet............... 249.50

Antique white curio cabinet...... 259.50
Antique gold metal lighted etagerel69.50
Pine finished maple etagere...... 229»50ea
Fruitwood settle bench........... 219.50
Heavy oak floor pedestals........ 109.50ea
Pine entry piece with oval

framed mirror.............  329.50
Pine trestle desk..... ..........  284.50
Oak roll top desk................699.50
Pine gossip bench........ .......139.50
Large oak plant stand........... 17 9 .5 0
Decorated maple deacons bench.... 14 9 .50  
Butler tray coffee table........ 19 8.50
6 rack gun cabinet............... 249.50

Antique gold pedestal with
marble top............. 10 9 .50 -

SALE
179.50
159.50 
98.5°179- 50eaf

169.50 79.95et

219.50
179.50 
5 ^ 9 . 5 0

89.9598.50
10 9 .50
75.00

179.50

79.-95

Plains Chainlnn
• ■ w r r , n » Center

t


