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Royalty To Be Named 
At Sweetheart Festival

EARLY FRIDAY FIRE DAMAGES HOME-A s  thick, black smoke billowed throughout their home
early Friday morning, Mr. and Mrs. Jim Noble narrowly escaped without injury by knocking out a 

'bedroom window ana escaping from their burning home. An electrical short was blamed on the 4:45 
a.m. fire which left little fire damages, but did heavy smoke damage to the entire home. Two 
Muleshoe firemen are shown here adjusting a Scott Air Pack, preparing to enter the Noble home.

New Legislation Calls For 
New, Expanded Water Rules

New rules governing the 
permitting of water wells, waste 
of water, water well drilling, 
and the closing of abandoned or 
unused irrigation wells are to be 
considered by the Board of 
Directors of the High Plains 
Underground Water Conserva­
tion District No. 1. Considera­
tion of amending some of the 
District’s existing rules is re­
quired in order for the District 
to comply with new laws passed 
by the 69th Texas Legislature 
regarding underground water 
conservation districts.

Around

Muleshoe
***

During a meeting on Thurs­
day night, several representa­
tives of the classes of 1950-1959 
met to start preliminary plan­
ning for a gigantic reunion this 
year.

Gordon Wilson, a 1955 grad­
uate of Muleshoe High School, 
was elected president of the 
group. Several committees were 
formed to help get the “ Golden 
Fifties Reunion,’ ’ underway.

It was decided to hold the 
reunion on July 5 at the Bailey 
County Ciyic Center.

Next meeting of the Golden 
Fifties Group wul be February 6 
at 7 p.m. at K-Bob’ s and any 
member of the 1950’s classes of 
M uleshoe High School are 
urged to attend this meeting 
and help get the Golden Fifties
Reunion started.

**•
Muleshoe Singles Club will 

meet at 8 p.m. on Friday, 
January 31 at Sage’s Restaurant 
in Muleshoe.

All area singles are urged to 
attend this important meeting, 
says Jerry Hutton.

On Sunday, today, there will 
be a Praise Service at Circle 
Back Baptist Church, beginning 
at 6:30 p.m.

Available will be food and 
fellowship for all, according to 
the pastor, Ron Linebarger.

Circle Back Baptist Church is 
located four miles east of 
Needmore on FM298. For more 
information call Rev. Linebarger 
at 946-3676. ***

Five students from Muleshoe 
have been named to the 
President’s and Deans Honor 
Lists at South Plains College for 
the 1985 fall semester.

To qualify for placement on 
the President’s list, SPC stu­
dents must maintain a 4.0 or 
“ straight A”  grade point av­
erage for the semester. Stu­
dents on the Dean’s honor list 
must maintain a minimum

grade point average of 3.25. All 
onor students must enroll for a 

minimum of 12 semester hours.
Tamara Gover and Jimmy 

Watson have been named to the 
President’ s Honor List; and 
Alvin Langford, Charyl Shairrick 
and Vana Pruitt were named to 
the Dean’s Honor List.

The most notable change 
required in the District’ s rules, 
will require the permitting of 
wells designed to produce and 
which will produce more than
25.000 gallons of water per day. 
Previously, state laws and the 
District’s rules required permit­
ting only those wells which were 
designed to produce in excess of
100.000 gallons per day.

Several classifications of
wells will, however, be exempt­
ed from the permitting process. 
For instance, domestic wells 
which supply water for ten or 
fewer households, water wells 
for the drilling of oil and gas 
wells, and jet wells for domestic 
needs are exempted under the 
provisions of the new law. The 
District’s Board of Directors is 
given an option in the case of 
wells used to provide water for 
livestock and poultry connected

with farming, ranching or dairy 
operations. Under the law, 
individual boards may consider 
the applicability of exempting 
livestock wells within their 
jurisdiction.

Provisions for the automatic 
permitting of wells which pro­
duce from 25,000 (17.4 gallons 
per minute) to 100,000 gallons 
of water per day (69.5 gallons 
per minute) that existed at the 
time the law was passed are 
outlined in the legislation. The 
permitting of these wells is 
automatic upon application for 
and completion of a water well 
permit. This registration process 
is necessary so that the District 
may recognize all existing well 
sites and provide protection for 
these existing sites as new 
permits are requested.

Other changes in the Dis-
Cont. Page 6, Col. 3

15 Criminal Court 
Cases Beginning Here

A total of 100 prospective 
jurors have received notices to 
appear for possible service in 
287th District Court on Monday, 
February 3.

Fifteen criminal cases are on 
the docket to be heard during 
the week. At this time, cases on 
the docket include:

Roberta Lee Gutierrez, Sam 
Harris and Michael Lewis, 
burglary of a habitation; Chris 
Garza and Luis Daniel, burglary 
of a building; Manuel Daniel Jr. 
and Chris Garza, burglary of a 
vehicle; Clarence Edward 
Veazey, subsequent DWI; 
Danny Bara, burglary and 
Danny Bara, assault.

Also, Raymond Flores, burg­
lary of a habitation; Armando 
Toscano, subsequent DWI; 
Randy Mack Lackey, drug

Eossession; Randy Mack 
ackey, drug manufacture; Joe 

Carrion, sexual assault; Ramiro 
Martinez, Benny Martinez and 
Sylvia Estrada, theft; Randy 
Cantrell, burglary; Richard D. 
Feldhacker, burglary and 
Richard Franklin Puckett, DWI 
subsequent.

Names of the prospective 
jurors who are to report at 9:30 
a.m. on Monday, February 3, 
are:

Doyle Wayne King, Rachel B. 
Hodges, Randall Neal Stevens, 
William J. Duffy, Johnny W. 
Young. Raul S. Sanchez, Sam P. 
Barnes, Dolores Eva Bachicha, 
Lucille Carter Harp, Anselma 
Silvas Chavez, Shirley Wolfe 
Reynolds, Eddie Michael 
Castorena, Horace Leon 
Stratton, Joyce Castle Byrd and 
Steven Duane Cox.

Warren G. Givens, Lela 
Hughes Copley, Ladonna Faye 
Holmans, Larry Allen Free, 
Sondra Lanice Parker. Adela C. 
Garcia, Jasper.!. Clarence 
Woodson, Maria Gloria Torres, 
Carl Edward Hayes, Sheli 
Hawkins Carpenter, Hector 
Flores, Daniel Raul Sanchez, 
Bobby Randall Burris, Jodie 
Kay Marlow, and Janie G.

Terrazas.
Also, Carla Suzanne 

Williams, Danny Mac Seales, 
Nellie Marie Collum, Pamela 
Dee Atwood, Ralph Marines Jr., 
Shennee Cheree Hodnett, 
Christine Isaac, Wanda Louise 
Armstrong, Tracy Wayne
Tunnell, Chris Lane Johnson,
Vada Kirby Wilcox, Lucretia 
Denise Shannon, Alice Mae 
Kelton, Christie Ivy Whitt and 
William Orozco.

And, Mary Jane Madrid, 
Marilyn Kay Harris, William 
Bennett Harmon, Danny
Navejar Mendoza, Vince Lee 
Simnacher, John Edward 
Ziegenfuss, Colleen Royal 
Griffiths, Josephine Bustamante 
Naiera. Garv Steohen Smith, 
James C. Lewis, Vinson Lee 
Huggins, Olga Navejar 
Mendoza, Ronnie Brooks Miller, 
Ida P. Clark, James Chad 
Williams, Rosie Villanueva 
Hernandez, Ruth Massingale 
Hall and Fidel Chavez
DeLarosa. .

Also, Joe L. Langer, Toby 
Michael Tucker, Lela Crawford 
Smith, Michael Lewis 
Davenport, Cara Bass 
Davenport, Janie C. Mata, 
Charlott Shepard Welch, Mrs. 
Freda N. Long, Lynda Hughes 
Low, Fred Neil Lindt, Alfred 
Anthony Espinoza, A.R. 
McGuire Jr., Timmy L. Cannon 
and Maria Ellen Bynum.

Bettye Faye Pedroza. Julius 
Green Jr., Glenda Faye Powell, 
Maria Robles Gardea, Mary 
Florez Ramirez, Julio Garcia, 
Lon Dean Vansandt, Joe 
Anthony Castorena, Fausto- 
Davila, Felipe Miramontes, 
Rodney Lee Millsap and Linda 
Allen Rawlins.

And Charlotte Templar 
Harris, Estela Cantu Duarte, 
Horace G. Morgan, Helen 
Villalobos, Sheryl R. Dunham, 
Jessie Mae Sherwood, Curtis 
Jim Elder, Manuela Villarreal 
Serrano, Nina Lewis Landers, 
Betty Ziegenfuss Claybrook and 
Helen C. Lopez.

* * *

City Rebate Check 
Down Starting ’86

State Comptroller Bob Bullock 
recently sent checks totaling 
$53.2 million in local tax 
payments to the 1,017 cities that 
levy the one-percent local sales 
tax.

Muleshoe received a check in 
the amount of $12,594.43, down 
by 29.36 percent for the year 
from a payment a year ago in 
the amount of $17,828.49.

At Morton, the rebate check 
was very near their payment for 
the same time last year at 
$3,781.61, as compared to the 
$3,745.04 for the same period 
last year, an increase of 0.98 
percent.

From Littlefield, it was re­
ported that the city received a 
tax rebate check in the amount 
of $13,590.52, down by 6.61 per 
cent from the $14,552.06 re­
ceived for the same period last 
year.

Friona’ s check was in the 
amount of $5,726.89, reflecting 
an 11.72 percent decrease from 
the figure of $6,487.49 the 
previous year.

Houston’ s check for $8.4 
million was the largest, down 
three percent from last year’s 
payment of $8.6 million. Dallas 
received $6.4 million, down four 
percent from the $6.7 million 
sent last year.

San Antonio’s payment of 
$3.3 million was up eight 

gfpercent from 1985’s figure of 
$3.1 million. Austin received 
$2.6 million -  the same amount 
the city received in January 
•1985.

Fort Worth’ s check for $2.3 
million was a 28 percent 
increase over last year’s $1.8: 
million check. El Paso’s pay­
ment .was $1.3 million -- a seven 
percent increase over the $1.2 
million received last January.

“ Statewide payments are up 
three percent over last Jan­
uary’s checks. However, a short 
holiday shopping period since 
Thanksgiving and an early cut 
off in processing tax returns 
may account for some cities 
showing lower paym ents,”  
Bullock said. _
Cont. Page 6, Col. 6

“ A group of hard working, 
dedicated parents of area stu­
dents, combine their efforts to 
form the Muleshoe Fine Arts 
Boosters,”  said a spokesman for 
the organization. “ They work 
throughout the school year to 
raise funds to assist the band, 
speech and art departments.

“ Funds are earned from 
concession stand proceeds at 
football games, the annual 
dinner theater, bake sales, chili 
supper, and the harvest festival 
(now being called the Sweet­
heart Festival).”

Total funds to be paid out by 
the Fine Arts Boosters this 
year is in excess of $7,860. This 
does not include any ‘extra’ 
and /or unexpected payments 
which might be made other than 
the items listed below:

The boosters will be providing 
the following funds for the 
1985-86 school year, $500 to the 
art department to be used for 
replacement and repairs on 
equipment, art supplies and 
film for photography work; 
$2,000 to the speech department 
for lodging costs at invitational 
tournaments, costumes/props/ 
set for one act contest play; and 
$4,410 to the band for lodging/ 
fees/meals for all region band, 
meals at UIL contests and 
miscellaneous items.

Approximately $950 is paid 
yearly on a service and main­
tenance contract for the copy 
machine the boosters purchased 
in 1980 for use in the band 
department.

The spokesman added, “ Mak­
ing the public aware of the 
importance of the funds being 
raised, it is hoped that there 
will be a wide-spread partici­
pation in the forthcoming activ­
ity scheduled for Saturday, 
February 1, at the Civic Center.

“ The Sweetheart Festival will 
begin at 7 p.m. and conclude at 
11 p.m. with the coronation 
taking place at 10 p.m. Candi­
dates will be representing each 
fine arts department and the 
final winners will be determined 
by the amount of funds raised 
for their candidates.

Candidates include:
From Watson Junior High 

School: Amber Green, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Corky Green, 
and Abel Leal, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Jesse Leal, representing 
the band; Jaimee Kelton, 
daughter of D.J. Koenig and

Local Author Has 
Latest Book Ready

There’ s no such word as 
“ retired”  in Glen Williams’ 
vocabulary. Although he has 
been a farmer, a county judge, 
an insurance representative and 
currently is Community Service 
Advisor for the Aging Program, 
he also has a very prolific 
sideline — as an author.

Just released is Williams’ 
latest book, “ Baptism.”  This is 
by no means his first book 
published, and certainly will not 
be his last.

< West Plains Publishers, 
formerly Art Loft, owned and 
operated by Leon Watson, 
printed Williams’ latest publi­
cation. It is more than 170 
pages, bound in a hard cover, 
beige in color, with gold 
lettering.

Glen Williams probably has 
the most extensive private 
library on the South Plains, and 
spends much of his time, as he 
has for many years, in study 
and research prior to writing his 
books.

His latest book was termed by 
one reader, “ The most compre­
hensive book on Baptism 1 have 
ever read.”

When asked where he found 
the time to write, Williams said 
he writes while sitting down at 
night, between meals, and 
anytime he can find when he is 
not doing anything else. “ I am 
either reading or writing,”  he 
added. “ Sometimes I can find 
some time on Saturday, at least 
when I can be home, and 
sometimes can find time on. 
other days.”

At this time, he has another 
two books in the works -  and 
they will be in print in the near 
future. One is on the Book of

Revelations from the Bible and 
the second is “ Salvation,”  as 
taught in the Bible.

His first publication was 
“ Pre-Destination,”  printed in 
1965; followed by “ After the 
Diploma”  in 1979, a booklet 
printed on parchment.

He released “ At The Potter’s
Cont. Page 6, Col. 5,

Carroll Kelton and Chris Perez, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Mike 
Perez, representing junior high 
art; and Stephanie Cox, daugh­
ter of Mr. and Mrs. Reagan Cox 
and Andy Langfitt, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Herb Langfitt, repre-
Cont. Page 6. Col._4

Photography
Class Slated 
In Muleshoe

Muleshoe Chamber of Com­
merce and Agriculture is spon­
soring a Basic Photography 
Class. All interested individuals 
are encouraged to sign up by 
calling the CofC at 272-4248.

Lonnie Adrian will be in­
structing the class which will 
cover camera operations, types 
of film, uses, lens and appli­
cation; electronic flash and 
existing light, color harmony 
and composition.

Toni Eagle, manager of the 
CofC said cost of the class will 
be $65 and you will be required 
to furnish your own camera, 
along with operating instruc­
tions, and one roll of inexpens­
ive film.

She said the class is limited 
to 20 students, but a minimum 
of 15 will be required in order 
to conduct the class. The class 
will meet for three hours, from 
6-9 p.m. on February 4, 20, 18 
and 27 at Summit Savings.

DECA Plans 
Fund Raiser 
With Radio

Muleshoe High School DECA 
students are currently involved 
in planning a radio show to be 
aired Thursday, February 13, 
from 7:00 to 10:00 p.m. on 
KMUL. Students will begin 
selling 30-second radio spots to 
merchants and businesses on 
Monday January 27.

Students will learn salesman­
ship by selling the ads, gain 
skills in writing advertisements, 
and practice communications by 
conducting this radio show. 
Money earned through this 
project will be used for students 
to travel to the State Career 
Development Conference in 
Houston, March 14, 15, and 16. 
This will also be entered in the 
Pepsi Learn and Earn Chapter 
Event at state competition. 
Committee Chairpersons are 
Deborah Nieman and Beatriz 
Garcia.

“ Ads will be sold for $4 per 
30-second spot. Everyone is 
encouraged to participate in this 
worthwhile, learning event,”  
said Deborah and Beatriz.

DECA Developing Future 
Leaders for Marketing and 
Distribution.

NEW BOOK IN /WATT-Glen Williams, left, author; and Leon 
Watson^printer, are shown with Williams’ latest book, just off the 
press. The book is entitled “ Baptism-The Answer Of A Good 
Conscience.”  This is only one of several books written by Williams 
and published.
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Larrys Homemade

German
Sausage

2 Pound Package

Dry Cured Whole

Winkler Meat Co
401 Main Muleshoe 272-4703

Sudan Hornettes, Hornets 
Basketball News

Sudan News
by

Evelyn Ritchie

The Varsity Hornettes won 
over the Anton Bulldogs 42-28.

Krista Kirkland scored six 
points in the first quarter. Kim 
Crowson had two noints and 
JoAnn Wooley had two. After 
the first quarter was completed 
the Hornettes led 10-4.

In the second quarter Krista 
Kirkland hit two points and 
JoAnn Wooley hit four points. 
At halftime the score was 16-14 
with Sudan in the lead.

Krista Kirkland came out in 
the third quarter and hit 
another six points. Melissa Nix 
made four points. Kim Crowson 
and JoAnn Wooley scored two 
points each. Going into the final 
period the score was Sudan 30 
Anton 18.

Teena Newman hit two free 
throws and a goal for 4 points in 
the final quarter. Krista Kirk­
land hit three points. Melissa 
Nix and JoAnn Wooley made 
two each and Kim Kirkland 
sunk a free throw.

Krista Kirkland led the Hor­
nettes with seventeen points. 
She had two fouls. JoAnn 
Wooley had ten points and four 
fouls. Melissa Nix scored six 
points and had no fouls. Kim 
Crowson had five points and 
three fouls. Teena Newman 
ended the night with no fouls 
and four points.

The Varsity Hornets won over 
the Anton Bulldogs 60-40. David 
Wood scored six points in the 
first quarter. Brent Kirkland. 
Jeff Kinnie, Jeff Dodson, and 
Lee Bartley scored two points 
each. At the end of the first 
quarter the score was 14-7 with 
tne Hornets in the lead.

Brent Kirkland and John 
Taylor both hit four points in 
the second quarter. Jen Dodson 
and David Wood also hit four 
points each. Jeff Kinnie hit two 
points.

At halftime the Hornets lead 
32-19.

David Wood scored six more 
points in the third quarter. 
Brent Kirkland scored four 
points. Goinp into the final 
quarter the Hornets led 42-25.

Brent Kirkland hit six points 
in the final quarter. Lee Bartley 
made four points. Jeff Dodson 
also hit four points. Wade 
Donnell and Donald Williams 
hit two points each.

Brent Kirkland and David 
Wood led with sixteen points 
each. Brent had no fouls and 
David had one. Jeff Dodson was 
in double figures with ten 
points. He had two fouls. Lee 
Bartley had six points and four 
fouls. Jeff Kinnie and John 
Taylor had four points each. 
Jeff had five fouls and John had 
none. Donald Williams had two 
points and two fouls. Wade 
Donnell had two points and one 
foul.

The JV Hornettes barely won 
over the Anton Bulldogs 21-20. 
In the first quarter Star Tenny­
son and Stacie Williams scored 
two points each. Misty Bartley 
hit a free throw.
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See Me
James Lee 
272-4567 

Bailey County 
Farm Bureau 

1617 W. 
Amer. Blvd. 

Muleshoe

About IR A ’s
You Have 

Seen Your 
CPA or

A£&2UBlflIlL
Southern Farm Bureau's 

IRA’S
•Current interest rate 8.5% 
•Guarantee a monthly income 
at retirement

•Guaranteed for the lifetime 
of the individual 

•Will provide for contributions 
to continue in event of 
permanent and total disabil­
ity if waiver of premium is 
provided.

•No fee’ s or charges_______

Kim Brotherton had two fouls 
and scored four points. Misty 
Bartley had three points and 
five fouls. Machelle Burns 
scored two points and had two 
fouls. Tracie Williams hit one 
point and committed one foul.

Another close game was the 
JV Hornets. Sudan won 42-40.

In the first quarter Anthony 
Williams hit three points. Elliot 
King, Michael Bartley, and 
Eddie Salinas each scored two 
points.

Anthony again led the scoring 
in the second quarter with eight 
points. Elliot King hit three 
points. Michael Bartley scored a 
goal for two points.

Coming out on the quart in 
the third quarter the score was 
34-28 with the Hornets leading.
In the third quarter Anthony 
Williams made six points. Elliot 
King made two points and so 
did Eddie Salinas. Bill Gardner 
and Michael Bartley each hit a 
free throw.

In the final quarter Michael 
Bartley hit three points. Elliot 
King and Eddie Boyles hit two 
points each and Bill Gardner hit 
one.

Anthony Williams led the way 
with seventeen points. Anthony 
also had three fouls. Elliot King 
had nine points and three fouls. 
Michael Bartley fouled out with 
five fouls but scored six points. 
Eddy Boyles and Eddie Salinas 
each had one foul and four 
points. Bill Gardner had two 
points and five fouls.

A&M anthropologists study 
disappearing Indian society

COLLEGE STATION —  An an­
thropologist studying one of the last true 
Indian societies in northeastern Mexico 
says the group could disappear into the 
modern Hispanic melting pot of their 
country by the year 2000.

Many of the Pame Indians located in 
the state o f San Luis Potosi do not speak 
Spanish and live in dwellings still largely 
pre-Columbian in style, said ethnologist 
Dr. Norman Thomas of Texas A&M 
University. The Indians still depend 
heavily on gathering wild food to eat, he 
said.

The Fames had not been intensively 
studied by anthropologists until Thomas 
and Dr. David Carbon, a Texas A&M 
archaeologist, went rolheir virfaje and 
a rancheria last August.

Thomas, who plans to return next 
summer for more extensive work, said 
the heavy Indian content of the Pame 
culture is rapidly disappearing. Prob­
ably less than 1,000 true Pames are left, 
he said.

The two researchers are interested in 
studying the Pames because they pro­
vide one o f the few modern-day models 
of how Indians adapted to the arid lands 
of northern Mexico and Texas before the 
coming of European explorers.

Such analogies from present-day 
societies permit more accurate conclu­
sions to be made about the life of prehis­
toric hunter-gatherer societies, they 
said.

BAPTIST NEWS 
***

Among those who have beenjng 
ill <or are m or hospitalized include 

Bud Graves, Pearl Wingo, Hoyt 
Robertson and others that we 
may not know of at this time. 
Also Carol Tredman is a patient 
in the Brownwood Hospital.

#**
Sunday, Jan. 19 was Men’ s 

Day in the FBC. Men taught 
each class during Sunday School 
and Filled the choir during
worship services.

***
The men and women of the 

Llanos Altos Baptist Association 
will be making a mission trip to 
Ysleta, Texas on the Rio Grande 
River Feb. 2 thru the 8th. They 
will be doing work on a 
dormitory there that is used for 
Baptist work along the river. If 
interested, contact Buster 
Kitrell or Gaylon Burns.

***
There will be a seminar, Jan 

26-29 at the FBC on “ Control- 
ing Your Tounge” . Steve 
Branson, pastor of FBC Spring- 
lake will be leading this 
seminar.

«**
CHATTER

*#*
Debbie Hill of Lubbock visited 

during the weekend with her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Orville 
Hill and attended services 
Sunday morning at the FBC.

***
Sheila Summer was home 

during last weekend with her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Bob 
Summer.

***
Brad Byerley accompanied his 

dad, Elray Rasco to Ruidoso, 
N.M. this week to do some work 
on their cabin there.

***
Charlotte Brownd is presently 

a new employee at the Sudan
First National Bank.

***
RUTH S.S. CLASS MEETING 

***
Members of the Ruth Sunday 

School Class of the FBC met 
Monday evening in the fellow­
ship hall of the church for their 
January social. A salad supper 
was held.

Billye Doty gave the invoca­
tion and following the meal, 
Mrs. Esther Meeks assisted by* 
Libby Mudgett brought the 
devotional on “ Don’t Go 
Through Life Without Living 
It.”

A short business meeting was 
held and plans finalized for the 
Amherst Manor birthday party 
to be held on Thursday.

Attending were Rosemary 
Seymore, Billye Doty, Pill 
Bellar, Sara Woods, Frances 
Gardner, Mutt Hanna, Ann Hill, 
Evelyn Ritchie, Gwen West, 
Mary Harper, Libby Mudgett, 
Elsie Seymore and the guest 
Mrs. Meeks.

***
YOUNG HOMEMAKERS 

***
The January meeting of the

budan Young Homemakers was 
held Monday, Jan. 6. Larry 
Brotherton presented a program 
on furniture refmishing. Follow­
ing a short business meeting, 
refreshments were served to 
Julie Rigsby, Cindy Wiseman, 
Deanna Humphreys, Margaret 
Williams, Susan Donnell, Kathy 
Gatewood, Deneece McDonald, 
Lorna Brazil, and Shonda Hill. 

***
SHANDA BROADHURST 

NAMED TO
___ PRESIDENT’S LIST
Shanda Broadhurst, a junior 

•elementary education major at 
'Texas Tech, made the Presi­
dents Honor Roll at Tech for the 
ifall semester. To qualify for the 
iPresidents Honor Roll you must 
lhave a G.P.A. of 4.0. Shanda is 
a 1983 graduate of Sudan High 
and a 1985 graduate of South 
Plains College. She is the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Calvin Vernon of Sudan and the 
grandaughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Russell Ingle of Sudan.

She and her husband, Lance, 
reside in Littlefield.

Mr. and Mrs. Lewis Fields 
visited during the weekend in 
Stephenville with their son, 
Gary, who is a student at 
Tarleton State University there. 

**•
Bea Willingham has returned 

from Shreveport, La., where she 
spent the holiday with her 
sister, Mrs. Frances Gardner.

Hoyt Robertson remains a 
patient in the Methodist Hos­
pital where he recently under­
went surgery.

**•
Mr. and Mrs. Glen Cardwell 

flew to Greenville during Sun­
day afternoon to visit his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Hal 
Cardwell and other family 
members.

**•
It was reported that Carol 

Freeman, a former Sudan resi­
dent, wife of a former Sudan 
Baptist pastor, Eddie Freeman, 
is a patient in serious condition 
in the Brownwood Hospital.

Edith Humprheys was re­
leased Saturday from Methodist 
Hospital and it was reported 
that she is doing well.

***
Bud Graves was taken back to 

the Amherst Hospital recently.

Visiting with Mr. and Mrs. 
Joe Salem one day last week 
was their daughter, Mrs. Betty 
Korioth of Dallas. Also visiting 

► the same day was their son, Dr. 
Robert Salem of Lubbock.

*•*
Mr. and Mrs. Bernard Wilson 

were in San Antonio during the 
holidays to be with their

daughter, Mr. and Mrs. Kenny 
Wilson and family.

Visiting during the weekend 
with Mr. and Mrs. John 
Williams were their son, Ken 
and Marilyn of Breckenridge. 
They were moving to Hobbs and 
the Williams assisted them in 
their move.

**«
Visiting in the George Collins 

home this week were all their 
children who were here to 
attend funeral services Monday 
for their mother, Bessie. Among 
them were Tommy and Floyd

and families of Phoenix, Ariz., 
Louis and family of Portland, 1 
Oregon, Nadine Howard and 
family of Friona, Bessie Lamb 
and Pat Green and families of 
Levelland, Betty Johnson and 
family of Farwell and Rosalee 
Zeissel and family of Amarillo, 
and Mr. and Mrs. George 
Collins, Jr. and family of 
Lubbock.

Sudan 
Hornet Bzzz

BUZZZZ
Three Way played Jr. High 

here Monday, Jan. 13, at 5:00.
BUZZZZ

JV Basketball boys and vars­
ity boys and girls played Three 
Way Tuesday, Jan. 14, 5:00 
here.

BUZZZZ
Students finished out the 

semester on Thursday, Jan. 16.
BUZZZZ

A teacher’ s inservice day was 
Friday, Jan. 17, and all students 
were out.

BUZZZZ
The Sudan Stock Show was 

Friday and Saturday, Jan. 17 
and 18.

BUZZZZ
The Sudan eighth grade 

tournament was held Thursday, 
Jan. 16 through Saturday, Jan. 
18.

BUZZZZ
Eighth jjrade boys and girls 

will play at Amherst 5:00, 
Monday, Jan. 20.

BUZZZZ
Seventh grade boys and girls 

will be playing Farwell here on 
Monday, Jan. 20.

BUZZZZ
Seventh grade boys and girls 

will be playing Farwell here on 
Monday, Jan. 20.

BUZZZZ
JV boys and varsity boys and 

girls will be playing Spade here 
at 5:00 Tuesday, Jan. 21.

BUZZZZ
Littlefield Area Stock show 

will be held Wednesday, Jan. 
22 through Saturday, Jan. 25.

BUZZZZ
JV boys and varsity boys andl 

girls will be playing Anton herd 
at 5:00 Friday, Jan. 24.

BUZZZ
The Levelland eighth gradd 

tournament for boys and girld 
will be Thursday, Jan. 23| 
through Saturday, Jan. 25.

BUZZZZ

Journal 
Society Policy

A processing charge of 
$3 is made when a photo 
accompanies any wedding, 
engagement, or annivers­
ary with the exception of 
anniversary of 50 years or 
more.

Five dollars will be 
charged for any shower 
picture taken by the* 
Journal and $3 charged for 
any shower picture ac­
companying a story. 
Pictures may be picked up 
after the article appears in 
the paper.

Wedding, engagement, 
and anniversary stories 
must be in the Journal 
office by Monday noon for 
the Thursday paper, and , 
by Thursday noon for the 
Sunday paper.

After that time, stories 
will be run on a space 
available basis. Any wed­
ding more than two weeks 
old, when received, will be 
edited and only the basic 
information will be includ­
ed.

Shower pictures will not 
be taken without a 24 hour 
notice and copy must be in 
the office by 5 p.m. 
Monday for the Thursday 
paper and 5 p.m. Thurs­
day, for the Sunday paper.

Anthony's
Will Be

Closed Wed,
Jan. 29th 

For
Inventory.

Kim Brotherton scored four 
ints in the second period. At 

alftime the Hornettes were 
behind 11-9.

Stacie Williams hit one free 
throw for the only point in the 
third quarter.

Star Tennyson scored four 
points in the final quarter. 
Stacie Williams, Machelle 
Burns, and Misty Bartley each 
scored two points. Tracie 
Williams scored on a free 
throw.

Star Tennyson led the way 
with six points. She committed 
four fouls. Stacie Williams hit 
five points and had one foul.

O 1
\ J O H N  D t l R f  !

NO MORE

S lip  th ro u g h  14-toot g a te s  
w ith  th e  h o rizo n ta l-to ld  

1610 c h ise l p lo w
When you decide to buy a new chisel plow, 
there's good reason to rely on John Deere. 
The 1610 Chisel Plows oiler plenty o! muscle, 
clearance and choice ol working widths.

Transport the horizontal-fold John Deere 1610 
Chisel Plow with speed and ease. Ranging 
from 19 to 27 leet In working widths, this chisel 
folds from the tractor seat to clear 14-toot 
gates. ________
Adjust depth on the go lor uniform work, even 
when soil or terrain changes. Walk-Over™ 
wheels help keep the lrame level to minimize 
gouging by shanks.________________ _

Dent & Co.
W . Hwy 84 Muleshoe 

272-42%

+

>

»

• •



By
Deona Finck 

County 
Extension Agent

north of Brownwood. It will be 
March 14-16, 1986. Sessions will 
include developing leadership 
through recreation, how to lead 
games, songs, and party plan­
ning. In-depth sessions on quiet 
games, active games, cere­
monials, leading folk games, 
new gam es/initiatives, and 
marionettes and puppets, folk 
and round dancing, and more.

For further details contact the 
Extension office. The deadline 
is February ISth.

Teens And Stress
Teenagers may be especially 

vulnerable to stress related to 
school, family, and change. 
During the teenage years, 
youngsters experience dramatic 
physical, emotional and social 
changes. When too many 
changes pile up, the teen may 
feel a loss of independence and 
regress toward greater depend­
ence on parents and other 
adults for decision making.

Reactions to stress differ from 
one youngster to the next and 
from one time to another. The 
key to recognizing a teen under 
extreme stress is to observe any 
changes in his or her feelings 
.and behavior. An adolescent 
under stress may show one or 
more of the following 
symptoms:

* Disorganization - cannot 
follow instruction or has trouble 
completing assignments.

* Lack of interest in self and 
others - withdrawn, cannot find 
happiness.

* Preoccupied - stares into 
space, distracted.

* Emotional - cries easily, 
emotions out of his control.

* Behavior changes - acts 
differently than he or she used 
to.

* Violent outbursts - hostile, 
destructive, verbally dbusive.

* Regression - becomes 
“ babyish”  and has immature 
behavior.

* Weight change - sudden 
weight loss or gain.

* Fear - takes fewer risks, 
hesitant about trying new 
things.

* Fatigue - very tired, 
lethargic; may be due to loss of 
sleep or irregular sleep pat­
terns.

* Extreme obedience and 
compliance - doesn’t seem to 
really care or thinks that if he or 
she is good everything will be 
all right again.

* School absenteeism - due to- 
assuming more chores for de­
pressed parents, or because 
ne’ s unable to face'friends.

Caring teachers, parents, and 
group leaders who are alert to 
the symptoms of teenage stress 
may be able to prevent trag­
edies such as drug and alcohol 
abuse, or even teenage suicide.

LONGHORN 
RECREATION LAB

- WEEKEND WORKSHOP -
The Longhorn Recreation Lab 

Weekend Workshop is a train­
ing opportunity designed 
specifically for volunteers who 
are actively involved in planning 
and conducting programs for 
youth and adults. This infor­
mation and enjoyable workshop 
will bring together persons, 16 
and over, from a wide variety of 
recreation programs for a stim­
ulating exchange of ideas and 
techniques.

Those who are welcome are 
volunteers involved in recreation 
programming. This year the 
workshop focuses on a team 
approach. Groups are encour­
aged to send or come as a team 
of four people who will develop 
skills and ideas to start or 
improve the recreation pro-

frams in communities - Boy 
cout, Girl Scout, and Campfire 

leaders, 4-H and youth leaders, 
church youth and adult leaders, 
hospital volunteers, nursing 
home and senior citizen volun­
teers, Big Brothers and Big 
Sisters, recreation students, 
special population volunteers 
and extension homemakers. 
There will also be an option of 
archery learning about safety, 
position, form, releases, equip­
ment, etc.

The workshop will be held at 
the Texas 4-H Center, 12 miles

ANNA RAMOS
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Nursing Home R eceives 
Superior Rating

Anna Ramos 
Named To Sudan 
Senior Spotlight

Anna Dolores Ramos, 17 year 
old daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Jose Fernando Ramos of Sudan, 
is in this week’ s Sudan Senior 
Spotlight. She is a native of 
West Texas, born in Levelland 
on Aug. 25, 1968. Anna has 
dark brown eyes and hair, and 
is five feet seven and three 
fourths inches tall.

She has two sisters, Laura 
and Carmen. Anna attends the 
Immaculate Conception Catholic 
Church in Muleshoe.

“ My goal in life is to 
graduate from college and be a 
success”  said Anna. In high 
school, she has been FTA 
Chaplain and FTA vice presi­
dent. Anna stated that she 
wishes to spend her college 
days at West Texas State 
University.

Carmen Ramos, her sister, is 
her favorite person in life, Mrs. 
Lacewell and Mrs. Fisher are 
her favorite teachers along with 
computer as her favorite sub-, 
ject. Pink and pizza are here to 
stay according to Anna.

The summer month of June is 
at the top of the pick for 
favorite season and month and 
Richard Gere and the Cosby 
Show come in “ number one.”

When she is listening to 
music, Bruce Springstein and 
Klymax, with the song “ I Miss 
You” , come in first.

When asked for comments 
about S.H.S., she answered 
“ I’ve loved my years in S.H.S. 
The teachers are the best” .

Sudan Students 
Named To Dean’s- 
President’s List

Eight students from Sudan 
have been named to the 
President’s and Dean’ s Honor 
Lists at South Plains College for 
the 1985, fall semester.

To qualify for placement on 
the President’ s List, SPC stud­
ents must maintain a 4.0 or 
“ straight A”  grade point av­
erage for the semester. Stud­
ents on the Dean’ s Honor List 
must maintain a minimum of 12 
semester hours.

Donald Doty and Shawnd? 
Masten were named to the 
President’s Honor List; Kay 
Whitten, James Ingle, Keevan 
Masten, Kimberly Moss, Van 
Wallace and Sheryl Doty were 
named to the Dean’ s Honor 
List.

A total of 122 students were 
named to the President’s List 
for the fall, and 307 students 
were named to the Dean’ s 
Honor List.

SUPERIOR RATING AWARD—Jim Swanner, administrator of the 
Muleshoe Nursing Home proudly shows the Superior Rating 
Award that the nursing home received this week from the Texas 
Department of Health. In order to receive the superior rating a 
nursing home must have a total of 105 net bonus points and the 
Muleshoe Nursing Home had 130 bonus points. Swanner stated 
that he felt the staff is to be congratulated for this splendid 
achievement.

Dietary Questions 
About High Fiber Foods

Is it necessary to buy special 
high-fiber foods for health? Not 
if you’re eating a well-balanced 
diet that includes about 15 
grams of dietary fiber for every 
1000 calories, say nutrition 
experts.

Marketers have capitalized on 
medical scientists’ call for more 
dietary fiber as a possible 
cancer preventative, by intro­
ducing a number of high fiber 
products. For example, several 
cereals with 9-12 grams of fiber 
per one-ounce serving are now 
on the market shelves.

But according to Texas A&M 
University Agricultural Exten­
sion Service nutritionist Dr. 
Alice Hunt, more fiber isn’t 
always necessary.,

Shie -says nutrition research 
over the years has identified 
several useful properties of 
dietary fibers. Reduction of 
cholesterol absorbed by useful 
properties of dietary fibers. 
Reduction of cholesterol ab­
sorbed by the intestine, alter­
ation of the ratio of types of fats 
absorbed or changes in the 
transit time of digested food 
through the intestine have all 
been reported.

However, the researchers also 
point out that high bulk diets 
may cause a loss in the 
absorption of essential vitamins 
or minerals, says Hunt. Re­

duced absorption of proteins, 
fats, minerals and vitamins can 
result from 35 grams of dietary 
fiber per 1000 calories per day.

Research is continuing to 
determine both the best types 
and amounts of fiber for a 
helthful diet.

In the meantime, the person 
who eats a balanced diet 
containing the recommended 
four servings of vegetables and 
fruit each day, as well as four 
servings of whole grain breads 
and cereals, should be able to 
get enough fiber from regular 
foods, says the nutritionist.

Vegetables, fruits and whole 
grains are the most common 
food sources of fiber, she adds, 
Some of the foods highest in 
fiber include b ro cco li,. raw 
cabbage and carrots, dried 
beans and peas, wheat bran, 
oatmeal, dried prunes, unpeeled 
apples and other fruits with 
skins.

As a result of recent surveys 
by the Texas Department of 
Health. Muleshoe Nursing 
Home has been awarded a 
Superior Rating. Upon each 
inspection, bonus points are 
given for meeting or exceeding 
certain standards, likewise de­
merits are issued for deficiences 
or failure to meet standards. It 
requires a total of 105 net bonus 
points to receive the Superior 
Certificate, and the Muleshoe 
Nursing Home had a total of 
130 points.

The area in which grading is 
calculated are, Dietary Service, 
Nursing Service, Administrative 
Service, Activity and Volunteer 
Service, Physical Environment 
and Life Safety Code.

In a letter received along with 
the certificate Jerry T. Walker 
made the following statement: I 
express, for the Texas Depart­
ment of Health, our heartiest 
congratulations on this remark­
able achievement. We are 
certain that you will make every 
effort to maintain this superior

Justin Harrison 
Honored With 
Birthday Party

Justin Harrison, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Freddie Legg, was 
honored on his seventh birthday 
Saturday with a party held at 
McDonalds in Levelland.

A Ronald McDonald Cake, 
hamburgers, orange drinks and 
french fries were served. The 
group played games and the 
honoree opened gifts.

Attending were Alycia 
Seymore, Bo Baker, Aaron Nix, 
Kris Humphreys, Heath Harper, 
Kyla Morris, Courtney and 
Casie Legg, Breeanne Baker, 
Jamie Wiseman, Mindy 
Humphreys, Bradley Black,
Michael Don Richards, Doylene 
Seymore, Carroll and Cindy 
Legg, and Nancy Legg, mother 
of the honoree; and his sisters, 
Amber and Heather.

Do you try to get all 
the facts before 
criticizing someone or 
something? _____

level of care for your residents.
The Superior Certificate will 

remain valid until a re-determi­
nation is made pursuant to rules 
and procedures governing grad­
ing.

“ We are extremely pleased to 
receive this award and recog­
nition for the nursing home. We 
will continue to strive to provide 
the best care possible for our 
residents. I feel our staff is to 
be congratulated for this 
splended achievement’ ’ said 
Jim Swanner, nursing home 
administrator.

The nursing home also re­
ceived a Superior Certificate in 
1983.

TOPS
CLUB

Muleshoe TOPS Club chapter 
No. 34 met Thursday, Jan. 16 at 
6:30 p.m. in the meeting room 
of Bailey County Electric. Clara 
Lou Jones, leader called the 
meeting to order.

The TOPS pledge was recited 
and the fellowship song sung. 
Evelene Harris called the roll 
with 11 members present. 
Minutes of the previous meeting 
were read by Evelene Harris, 
and they were approved as 
read.

Best loser for the week was 
Inez McWilliams. Runners up 
were Mabel Wolfe, first, and 
Ernestine Steinbock and 
Laverne James tied for second 
runner up.

The meeting was closed with 
the singing of the goodnight 
song.

CLERK-TYPIST
WANTED IMMEDIATELY
Must Be Fast, Accurate.

Good Speller.
Apply In Person ONLY 

No Phone Calls. 
Muleshoe Journal 
304 West 2nd. St.
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Supervised By Texas Depart ment of Banking 
Price Frozen At l ime Of Purchase

White Sale
Wicker Bath 
Accessories

RECIPE
e  |

By Sarah Ann Sheridan

The colder the weather 
the more we seem to enjoy 
seafood in casseroles.

Sea Food Southern

y* c small scallops 
2 eggs
2 c cooked rice

V* c boiled shrimp 
2 T diced onion 
2 T fat

Vi c tomato catsup
Vi t celery salt 
1 t curry powder

Combine liquid from 
scallops with slightly beat­
en eggs. Add rice, scallops 
and shrimp. Brown onion 
slightly in fat and add cat­
sup, celery salt and curry 
powder. Stir into rice 
mixture. Place in buttered  ̂
shallow baking dish. Bake 
in oven 350 degrees for 30 
minutes.

There’ s some dif­
ference between the ap­
pearance of fairness and 
the intent to be fair.

50% off

Save Up To 5 0 %

Entire Stock 
I Winter Blankets

25%
Yelow Tog

Exclude Electric 
lets & Fur Throws

Signature 
Bed Pillows

AH Sizes

2**10
Reg. *5.99

BoSay County journal USPS 
040 200

Established March 31, 196,1. Published by Muleshoe 
Publishing Co., Inc. Every Sunday at 304 W Second. Box 
449. Muleshoe, Texas. 79347. Second Class Postage paid 
at Muleshoe Tcaas 79347.
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TEXAS PRESS ASSOCIATION

L B Hall President A Publisher 
Sammy? Hall-Vice President & 
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Octa Williams-News 

Evelene Harris-Soeicv
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T o ll *1999.............. ‘ 11.97
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Kh» *33.99..............*23.97
Save Up To 4 0 %

Entire Stock 
Bedspreads

20% off

Plaid
Table Clothes

50% O ff

Batting

2**5
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Sheet Sets
Rag. Sab
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“ D o n ’t settle fo r  
less than the 
biggest reb in d  you  
have  com in g .’ ’

— Henry Block

H&R BLOCK
At H&R Block, we guarantee 

you the biggest refund you have 
coming, or your return is FREE. _
Get back all vou’re entitled to t h e  in c o m e  t a x  p e o p l e  

-  come to H&R Block. 2 2 4  w . 2 n d  '2 7 2 -3 3 3 2  
w k  d a y s  9 -6  Sat. 9 -5

FREE WITH ANY $7.50 PURCHASE 
OF MERLE NORMAN COSMETICS.

Give this gift of luxuiy to your skin and 
see its grateful response to kind treatment.

“Luxiva Gift of Luxury’’—  a collection of 
four veiy special skin care products, tucked 
into a reusable/aua: pearl box with classic 
spring motif.

Such a luxurious offer comes along rarely, 
so snip out the coupon and hurry to Merle 
Norman today.

Bring in this coupon to get your FREE 
Luxiva Gift of Luxury (Luxiva Collagen 
Cleanser, Luxiva Collagen Clarifier, Luxiva 
Collagen Support, Luxiva Protein Creme) 
with a purchase of $7.50.

This offer is good through February 28, 
1986, while supples last. One to a customer.

m eR L E  n o R m f lr r
L

1519 W. Amer. Blvd. 
272-3459 Muleshoe

W hen you need some cash FAST —  sell it in the 
Classifieds. W hen you need to buy something at 
BARGAIN PRICES —  buy it through the Classifieds. 
You can’t top ’em anywhere!

Muleshoe & Bailey County
Journals

cD ouW6 Q ing Ce/iemony
Q in i f e g  Q A /it(iA o w  .( jU e ^ D a n ie #

(Jk̂ tmoon Ce/tewony Qluttes
J[k. oMcmn (-Poo& JMwscm

The First United Methodist 
Church was the setting of the 
Saturday afternoon, Jan. 18 
wedding of Nan Allison Pool 
and L.T. Johnson. The Rev. Bill 
Kent, minister, officiated.

Parents of the couple are 
Mrs. Sammy Allison of Mule­
shoe and Mrs. Addie Moyer of 
Friona. Mr. and Mrs. Bob 
Cumpsten of Muleshoe are 
grandparents of the bride.

Bobby Broughton, son in law 
of the bride, sang “ The Twelfth 
of Never” , and “ O Perfect 
Love” , accompanied by Elaine 
Damron.

Susan Black, sister of the 
bride, registered the guests.

Alison Broughton, daughter 
of the bride, and Dr. Homer 
Allgood served as honor attend­
ants. Mack Allison, Sam Allison 
and Winston Allison were ush­
ers.

A reception was held in the 
home of the bride’s mother 
immediately following the cere­
mony. Serving at the reception 
were Carolyn Allison, Joy 
Osborn, Becky Walker, Beth 
Askew, cousins of the bride, 
Kay Allison and Kathy Allison, 
sisters in law of the bride, and 
Loveta Wilson, niece of the 
bride.

Other members of the house- 
party were: Pat Angeley, 
Marjorie Precure and Dianne 
Allison,

Out of town guests were from 
Lubbock, Clovis, N.M., Brown­
field, Friona, Hereford, Ama­
rillo, Tahoka, Lovington, N.M., 
Enid, Okla.

A rehearsal dinner was host­

ed by the couple at K-Bob’ s on 
Jan 17. The parents of the 
couple and the bridal party were 
in attendance.

The bride attended West 
Texas State University and 
Texas Tech University and is a 
teacher at Watson Junior High 
School. The groom received his 
Associate of Applied Science at 
Amarillo College. He is Rad­
iology Department manager at 
West Plains Medical Center.

Following a wedding trip to 
Florida the couple will be at 
home at 914 Ivy, Muleshoe.

A personal shower was given 
the bride in the home of Mrs. 
J.E. McVicker on January 13. 
Co-hostesses were Mrs. Jack 
Rennels and Mrs. Kenneth 
Precure.

***
b e  w a r y  o f  w e i g h t

LOSS PLANS -  Some com­
mercial weight-loss businesses 
may help you shed more dollars 
than weight, cautions a family 
economics expert. “ Advertising 
that promises a specific weight 
loss for a set fee can be mis­
lead ing ,”  says Nancy L. 
Granovsky, “ because the diet
plan may also require the 
purchase of expensive dietary 
supplements, which raises the 
consumer’s cost.’ ’ These sup­
plements and special foods are 
often marked up by 300 percent 
or more and may be of 
questionable nutritive value, 
says the Texas A&M University 
Agricultural Extension Service 
specialist.

Karla Renee Withrow became 
the bride of Billy Frank 
McDaniel in the Crescent Park 
Church of Christ in Littlefield at 
7 p.m. Dec. 28, 1985. James 
Withrow of Sudan, uncle of the 
bride, read the double ring 
vows.

The bride is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. J.C. Withrow of 
Littlefield, former Sudan resi­
dents, and the groom is the son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Raymond 
McDaniel of Lubbock. Mrs. Lola 
Lentz is the grandmother of the 
bride.

Jerry Smith sang a solo “ Oh, 
Perfect Love” . Other musical 
selections were “ Winter Won­
derland” , “ Twelfth of Never” , 
“ Whither Thou Goest” , “ Wed­
ding March”  and “ Be With Us 
Lord” . These were sung by a 
choir directed by Alvis Jones of

Muleshoe Area 
Retired Teachers 
Meeting Held

The Muleshoe Area Retired 
Teachers met Friday January 17 
at the Muleshoe State Bank 
community room at 3:00 p.m. 
with 15 members present. The 
meeting was called to order by 
the president, Mrs. Maxine 
Ragsdale. The Pledge of Alleg­
iance to the flag was given.

Minutes of previous meeting 
was read by Mrs. Mary B.1 
Obenhaus. The treasurer report 
was given by Mrs. Lois 
Witherspoon. Mrs. Pauline 
Guinn, Community Participation 
Chairperson, requested that 
each member report the number 
of volunteer hours each has 
performed during the year. This 
report is due by February 15. 
Mrs. Jewel Pool was welcomed 
as a new member.

Sherry Nusser of Lubboc, and 
Deborah Lowe of Muleshoe, 
members of the Texas Depart­
ment of Health were introduced 
and presented a program on 
osteoporosis. “ Osteoporosis is a 
painful and crippling bone 
disease. To prevent this, re­
member if you support your 
bones by eating calcium-rich 
foods and follow other healthy 
habits, your bones will continue 
to support you. Pamplets were 
displayed and explained by 
Deborah Lowe of the local 
Health Unit. She extended a 
special invitation for everyone to 
take advantage of the services 
provided for by the Public 
Health Clinic of Muleshoe.”

Members present were: Lena 
Hawkins, Mary Louise Thaxton, 
Raneta Dawson, Margie Moore, 
Pauline Guinn, Dorothy 
B ed d in g f ie ld  , J o s e p h in e  
Mitchell, Aileen Siewert, Mary 
B. Obenhaus, Jean Moore, Lois 
Witherspoon, Jewel Pool, Robin 
Taylor, Carrie Lee Bishop, and 
Maxine Ragsdale.

The next meeting will be 
February 21, at the Muleshoe 
State Bank community room 
featuring the Sesquicentennial 
Program by Dorothy 
Beddingfield.

Littlefield.
Vows were exchanged before 

an alter decorated with a large 
basket of fresh gladiolas and 
carnations which stood behind 
the unity candle. Spiral can- 
delabras with white candles 
stood on either side.

Given in marriage by her 
father, the bride wore a floor 
length gown made by Molly 
Heard. It was white satin 
overlaid with white lace and 
featured a bound scooped neck­
line, gathered skirt and elbow 
length sleeves, seed pearls on 
the bodice and a detachable 
train. She carried a bouquet of 
white roses atop a white Bible.

Jackie Johnson, sister of the 
bride, served as matron of 
honor. Bridesmaids were 
Virginia Jones and Gail Hess, 
both of Lubbock.

Julie Johnson and Kendra 
Johnson of Muleshoe served as 
flower girls.

Barry McDaniel, brother of 
the groom, served as best man. 
Groomsmen were David Wynn 
of Garland, cousin of the groom, 
and David Hess of Lubbock.

Dora Black of Sudan regis­
tered the guests.

A reception was held in the 
fellowship hall of the church. 
Mrs. Joe Price of Plano and 
Mrs. Jerry Smith of Colorado 
Springs, Colo, served at the 
bride’s table. Mrs. Joyce Scott 
of Amarillo and Mrs. Johnnie 
Norell of Plainview served at 
the groom’s table.

Following a wedding trip to 
Acapulco, the couple will make 
their home in Lubbock where 
they are employed.

A rehearsal supper was held 
in the fellowship hall on Friday 
night hosted by the groom’s 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Raymond 
McDaniel.

oW /is Johnson 

xJJono.wl Q i/lih  

TZ/tidaQ Qhouien
Mrs. Dale Johnson, nee 

Sandra Hill, was honored with 
a bridal shower Saturday, Jan.
11 in the home of Quinelle 
Pickrell.

The serving table was covered 
with a white linen cloth and 
accented with a fresh floral 
arrangement of orchids, pink 
carnations and greenery. The 
honoree was presented an 
orchid corsage.

Breads, fruit plate, spiced tea 
and coffee were served from 
silver and crystal appointments.

Special guests included the 
mothers of the couple, Mrs. 
Wanda Hill and Mrs. Bertha 
Johnson, both of Sudan; the 
honoree’ s sister and niece, 
Donna Durham and Kayla of 
Lubbock; and aunts of the 
groom, Mrs. Elizabeth Jennings 
and cousins. Twila Hubbard and 
Nyki, all of Amarillo and 
Juanita Summers of Dimmitt.

W M U W eekly
Meeting

MR. AND MRS. BILLY FRANK MCDANIEL
(nee Karla Renee Withrow)

Muleshoe PTA Views Seat Belt Film

WMU of the Trinity Baptist 
Church met Tuesday, Jan. 21 at 
the church for Bible Study. The 
Bible reading for the day was 
Psalms 84:1-4. Eva Ashford 
gave the opening prayer.

Royal Service was “ D iff­
erence One Child Can Make . 
Dora Barber dismissed the 
group with a prayer.

Those present included: Ms. 
Barber, Ms. Ashford, Maxine 
Carter, Clara Coffman and 
Wenona Spears.

Muleshoe Elementary PTA 
met Monday, Jan. 20. Jim Ella 
Clemmons, president, called the 
meeting to order and Rose Mary 
DePaul led the invocation. 
Refreshments were provided by 
Glenda Copley.

A discussion was held to find 
nominations for incoming offi­
cers for the 1986-87 school year. 
A committee of three members, 
Rea Morris, Noe Deleon and 
Jim Ella Clemmons will contact 
prospective officers.

It was reported that the profit 
made from the Santa’s Work­
shop was $400.00 and everyone 
was thanked for their support of 
this project.

Teachers and members are 
asked to submit any ideas on 
purchases to be made for the 
elementary schools with the 
profits made from this years 
projects. There will be approx­
imately $1,300.00 per school.

A discussion was held on the 
date for the Halloween Carnival 
for 1986. John Fuller made a 
motion to have the carnival on 
Oct. 25, 1986, rather than the 
Nov. 1, 1986, alternate date. All 
members present agreed on this 
motion.

Kay Graves took the floor at 
this time and reminded mem­
bers of the March program 
on Child Abuse. The films have 
been previously viewed by Kay 
Graves, Jim Ella Clemmons and 
Mrs. Barbara Finney. The films 
for the children will be pre­
sented sometime in March 
during school hours.

Ms. Graves introduced Ruby 
Jackson with the Department of 
Highways at this time, and she 
presented the program on Seat 
Belt Safety. A film was viewed 
called “ For Jamie” . The film is 
a true story about a father 
taking his son for an ice cream 
cone, and didn’t see any need 
(to use seat belts since the store 
was only a mile from the house. 
As results the child is now

crippled and in a wheel chair. 
The film gave specific statistics 
on the advantages of seat belt 
useage. Vivid scenes of the 
effects of using and not using 
seat belts were viewed. After 
the film everyone was given 
pamplets, maps and coloring 
books for the children.

NOTES____
COMMENTS

Drive carefully and
enjoy 1986.

* • * •
Character is never 

established in a single 
year.
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W e’ve Moved
U-Curl-It Beauty Supply is in 

it’s new location at 2905 N. Prince

Come see our new store & sign 
up for a year's supply o f grooming 
needs. (valued at 9 100)

Drawing will be Feb. 28
(Don *t Have To Be Present To Win )

Serving the non-professional with name 
brands at the best prices '*

New Phone No. 
763-33322905 N. Prince Clovis

MRS. PRESTON SCOGGJN

Creative Living
with Sheryl Borden

Information relating to special 
occasion desserts and the role of 
physical therapy will be pre­
sented on “ Creative Living" on 
January 28 and February 1. 
Regardless of where you live, 
cooks use chocolate to make 
really special desserts. Jo Ann 
Cooper, a home economist at 
Hershey Foods Corp. from 
Hershey, PA will show off three 
desserts made with unsweet­
ened cocoa. She will prepare a 
chocolate cheesecake, a black 
forest cherry cake and a 
chocolate orange roll and ex- 
plaifi why cocoa is a good choice 
for making chocolate desserts -  
especially if you’re watching 
calories!

Steve Wilson is a licensed 
physical therapist at Roosevelt 
General Hospital in Portales and 
he will explain who can benefit 
most from physical therapy, 
what the patient’s responsibili­
ties are and show some pieces 
of equipment and explain their 
uses.

On January 30, the show 
will present information on 
using oven cooking bags, decor­
ating on a smaller scale and 
using customized patterns for 
better fit. Cathy McGreery is a 
home economist with Reynolds 
Metals Co. from Dallas, TX and 
she will show how to use 
Reynolds oven cooking bags, 
which are made of a heat 
resistant nylon and can be used 
in the microwave or convention­
al oven.

Recently American families 
aie finding their living space is 
smaller than it used to be. Ellen 
Cheever, a kitchen designer 
with the Maytag Co. of Sacra­
mento, CA has ideas for 
planning kitchens, baths and 
laundry spaces efficiently and 
attractively. She will show how 
to expand or contract areas as 
needed.

Another guest will be Laura 
Varney, founder of Clothing

OAk/ding Qkow&i (zUono/ts
i

cjW/ts Heston Scoggin

Pleas* call Energas Company 
41 hours bofoio you dig In 

streets, oltoyt or oaoomonts.

Energas Company will mark th# 
location of underground pipe­

line* with yellow-topped stakes, 
yellow flags or yellow spray paint.

There I* no charge 
tor thl* service.

ENERGB&,

inch ot edge, rrost sides; pipe 
top edge. Pat almonds into 
frosting, if desired. Chill. 10 to 
12 servings.

* To sour milk: Use 1 
tablespoon vinegar plus milk to 
equal 1 cup.

Viewers can request copies of 
printed materials offered on the 
show by calling on KENW-TV’s 
toll-free telephone lines. In New 
Mexico the number is 1-800- 
432-2361, out-of-state: 1-800- 
545-2359, and Portales and 
Roosevelt County: 562-2J12.

1 Bridal Selections
for

1 Richelle King
Bride Elect O f

Randy Watkins

1 Antiques & Junk
| l ( k >  S. 1st

Mrs. Preston Scoggin, nee 
Michelle Logsdon, was honored 
with a wedding shower Satur­
day, Jan. 18 from 2 until 3:30 
p.m. in the home of Theresa 
Jones.

Guests were greeted by the 
honoree, Mrs. Renda Logsdon, 
mother of the honoree; Ms. 
Doris Scoggin, mother-in-law of 
the honoree; and Theresa 
Jones.

Susan Lunsford and Laurie 
Grant served punch, coffee, 
blue and white thumbprint 
cookies, nuts, and mints from 
brass and crystal appointments.

The serving table was covered 
with a white lace over blue table 
cloth and accented with a blue 
and white flower basket ar­
rangement. The honoree’s cor­

sage was of blue and white silk 
flowers with a blue bow.

Special guests included: Mrs. 
Rine Dutton of Earth, grand­
mother of the honoree; Mrs. 
Elizabeth King and Mrs. Lewis 
Scoggin, grandmothers of the 
groom.

The hostesses gift was a 
vacuum cleaner. Hostesses for 
the occasion were: Dianne 
Nieman, Frankie Lunsford, La 
Jean Williams, Sandi Chitwood, 
Barbara Finney, Theresa Jones, 
Dianna Harrison, Lela Ann 
Smith, Betty Wuerflein, 
Jeannine Gunstream, Charlena 
Lindt, Sherri Shipman, Marcia 
Rasco, Adena Lindt, La Von 
Hunt, Deborah Nieman, Pat 
Gunter, Betty Carpenter, Sue 
Holt, Pam Miller and Pat King.

Design Concepts, Inc. of Man­
hattan, KS. This company drafts 
patterns by computer to each 
person’ s individual measure­
ments. Clothing Design Con­
cepts, Inc. offers basic patterns 
for pants, skirts and bodices 
and Laura will discuss the basic 
bodice pattern and show how to 
use it.

“ Creative Living’ ’ is pro­
duced and hosted by Sheryl 
Borden. The show airs at 12 
noon on Tuesday and Thursday 
and at 2:00 pm on Saturday. 
(All times are Mountain Stan­
dard).

BLACK FOREST
CHERRY CAKE

2 eggs, separated 
Vi cup sugar
1 Vi cups, unsifted flour 
1 cup sugar
Vi cup unsweetened cocoa 

' V* tsp. baking soda 
Vi tsp. salt 
Vi cup vegetable oil 
1 cup buttermilk or sour milk*
1 can (21 oz). cherry pie filling
3 cups sweetened whipped

cream
Sliced almonds (optional)

Beat egg whites in small 
mixer bowl until foamy; grad­
ually beat in Vi cup sugar until 
stiff peaks form. Set aside. 
Combine flour, 1 cup sugar, 
cocoa, baking soda and salt in 
large mixer bowl. Add oil, 
buttermilk or sour milk and egg 
yolks; beat until smooth. Gently 
fold egg whites into batter. Pour 
into two greased and floured 
9-inch layer pans. Bake at 350 
degrees for 25 to 30 minutes or 
until cake springs back when 
lightly touched in center. Cool 
10 minutes; invert onto wire 
rack. Cool completely. Place one 
layer on serving plate. Spoon 
one-half cherry filling in center 
to within one-half inch of edge, 
pipe edge with cream. Top with 
second layer. Spoon remaining 
cherry filling to within one-half

KARATE STUDENTS ATTEND ODESSA TOURNAMENT— 
Several karate students from Muleshoe recently attended a 
tournament at Odessa and brought home ribbons. Pictured front 
row (L-R) Evan Kelley, Colby Miller, Tracy Puckett, Michelle 
Winders; (back row) Ricky Wall, Danny May, Danny Kelley, 
instructor, Bruce Davis and Shawn Rejino.

Karate Students Attend Odessa Meet
Several students and their 

instructor, Dandy Kelley from 
West Texas Karate Academy 
attended the “ Odessa Super 
Fights and Triatholon”  Satur­
day, Jan. 18 af the Holiday Inn 
Convention Center in Odessa.

Those students competing 
were Michelle Winders, daugh­
ter of Mr. and Mrs. Mike 
Winders, entering yellow belt- 
free forms and point fighting. 
Colby Miller, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Mike Miller, competing in 
green belt point fighting di­
vision. Bruce Davis, competed 
in men’s yellow belt forms and 
point fighting division.

Competing in tournament 
competition for the first time 
was Shawn Rejino, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Lupe Rejino. Shawn 
competed in beginner yellow 
belt forms, 14-16 junior men 
division.

Also entered in tournament 
competition for the first time 
was Danny May, competing in 
men’ s beginner yellow belt 
forms division.

Tracy Puckett, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Dee Puckett, competed in 
yellow belt 10-13 year old 
division in forms and point 
fighting. Tracy placed third in 
point fighting.

Evan Kelley, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Danny Kelley, entered the 

reen belt 7-9 year old point 
ighting division and placed 
third.

Ricky Wall, entered men’ s 
advanced red belt division. He 
placed third in weapons forms, 
performing with knives. He also 
placed third in point fighting 
and fourth in hard style form

ENGAGEMENT ANNOUNCED—Mr. and Mrs. Berry Wood, Jr. 
announce the engagement and approaching marriage of their 
daughter, Donna Glea to Terry Alton Burton, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Alton Burton of Muleshoe. Miss Douglas graduated from 
Plainview High School and attended West Texas State University 
and is a graduate of Plainview Vocational School of Nursing. She is 
employed at Methodist Hospital in Lubbock. Burton graduated 
from Muleshoe High School and is employed at Alton Burton’ s 
Service Center. Vows will be exchanged on Mhrch 15th in the First 
Baptist Church Chapel in Plainview.

M issy Fisher Receives Honors At W BU

competition. Among 200 com­
petitors, Wall placed third over 
all in the Triatholon com ­
petition.

Danny Kelley, school in­
structor, placed third in Men’ s 
Black belt forms hard style 
division and first in Senior Black 
Belt point fighting division.

Competitors from Lubbock, 
Midland-Odessa, Amarillo, 
Dallas, El Paso, Hobbs, Snyder 
and Plainview entered this 
meet. West Texas Karate is 
associated with Muleshoe Fit­
ness Center,

Family and friends attending 
the tournament to support the 
local students were Mr. and 
Mrs. Dee Puckett, Mr. and 
Mrs. Mike Winders and Justin, 
Ricki and Erin Kelley, Maime 
Williams, Michael Nee, Lupe 
Rejino, Kris Fuller and Larry 
Parker.

W H O  K N O W S
1. In what way does a 
dolphin differ from a 
fish?
2. What famous writer 
of Western novels was 
born January 31, 1875?
3. Joe Yule Jr., is the 
name of a well-known 
movie star. Name him.
4. Where is Pike’ s Peak 
located?
Answer* to Who Knows
1. A dolphin must come 
up for air often-fish do 
not have to come to the 
surface to breathe.
2. Zane Grey.
3. Mickey Rooney.
4. r n ln m iln

A Sudan student has been 
named recipient of two honors 
for outstanding academic 
achievement at Wayland Baptist 
University.

Missy Fisher, a sophomore, 
was named to the Dean’s Honor 
Roll at Wayland for the fall 1985 
semester and is also included in 
the 1985-86 “ National Dean’ s 
List.’ ’

Miss Fisher, a 1984 graduate 
of Sudan High School, posted a 
3.78 grade point average for the 
recently completed term. She is 
a member of the Flying Queens 
basketball team, the No. 
1-ranked NAIA team in the 
nation, and the daughter of 
Mrs. Josephine Fisher of Su­

dan.
The Dean’s Honor Roll is 

announced at the end of each 
semester by Dr. Fred A. 
Teague, academic vice president 
and dean of the university, and 
lists the names of students who 
posted a 3.50 GPA or above on 
a 4.00 scale while carrying at 
least 12 semester hours.

A total of 122 students from 
nine states and two foreign 
countries were named to the 
Dean’ s Honor Roll at Wayland 
for the fall semester.
r n

* * * *
A newspaper, like a 

friend, is missed when 
not available.

We want to 
be sure your 

Social Security 
payments 

end up in the 
right hands... 
Your hands!

Come in to our office and sign up for direct 
deposit of your Social Security payments right 
into your checking or savings account instead 
of receiving them through the mail.

The direct deposit of your Social Security 
checks is a safer way of receiving your money. 
It eliminates the possibility of loss or theft. And, 
you can always be sure your deposits will be 
made on time, even if you’re away from home!

Retirement is a time to look forward to and, 
there’s plenty you can be doing if you don’t 
have to wait for your Social Security check — 
to receive it or deposit it. Let us help you en­
joy your retirement years — you’ve earned it 
— enjoy it to its fullest. Come in soon.

BROUGHT TO YOU AS A PUBLIC SERVICE BY:

M uleshoe State
272-4561101W. Bank

Amer. Blvd. Member F.D.I.C.
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Go Cart Races Pay
carl over.

ForVinson Cousins
Go cart racing is fun and 

entertaining, as well as time- 
consuming for the whole family 
as two Muleshoe families are 
well aware. They are the Bill 
Vinson and the Buria Vinson 
famililes.

Bill and Eva Lee Vinson have 
one s o n , _Jecd, w ] l o  .drives in 
three classes, three go carts 
each race night. Buria and 
Linda Vinson have two sons, 
Jeff and Allan. They each drive 
one cart, in one class, each 
night and at times, two carts. 
Buria and Linda Vinson’ s other 
son, Ray, raced until he 
graduated from high school in 
May, 1985.

Jerd was the First to start 
racing in July, 1983. He started 
with one nearly new cart and a 
stock Briggs and Stratton en-

S

gine.
About a month later, he and

his dad bought a second, nearly 
new cart and engine. That is the 
cart that Allan started racing in 
September, 1983, when a used 
cart was purchased for the 1984 
season, and Jeff started driving 
the extra cart.

Later, following the purchase 
of a third cart, Ray started 
racing. By July, 1984, Buria had 
purchased each of his three 
sons a cart. After trading, 
swapping and buying, Allan has 
one cart, Jeff has two carts and 
Jerd has five carts, with three 
of these being for sale at this 
time.

In the summer, Allan, Jeff 
and Ray worked for Buria at his 
business during the day, and 
were racing go carts at night. 
Last summer, Ray left for 
California to attend school.

Jerd does all the work on the 
family farm and works on his go 
carts. He says his day usually 
starts around 7:30 a.m. and 
ends about 10 or 11 at night.

The boys and their fathers do 
most of the work on their carts, 
with just major engine work 
being done by professionals.

The mothers sure don’ t get 
by without doing their share. 
They have the normal laundry 
and repair of racing suits and
equipment. Also, Eva Lee is one 
of the tvtwo scorers for the 
Amarillo club and Linda fills in 
when one of the scorers is 
absent.

The Vinsons have been racing 
every Friday night at Amarillo 
at the Modified Midget Track at 
Folson and Amarillo Blvd. from 
around the first of May until the 
last of September and every 
other Saturday night at the go 
cart track at the Lubbock 
Speedway on the Tahoka High­
way. That season usually runs 
from middle April to middle 
October.

During the part of the race 
season that coincides with 
school, usually the boys stay 
quite busy, according to Eva 
Lee Vinson. They work on carts 
at night and then on Thursday 
the carts have to be serviced 
and loaded so they can leave as 
soon as possible after school is 
out on Friday. Since Jerd has 
three and sometimes four carts 
to service and load, he usually 
does not get to bed until around 
10:30 p.m. Racing is over most 
of the time between 10:30 and 
11:30 p.m. So, most of the time 
it is quite late when the Vinsons 
return to Muleshoe from Lub­
bock or Amarillo.

Jerd and his parents made 
three trips to Topeka, KS so he 
could participate in the In­
ternational Karting Federations 
Grand National race. The parti­
cipants of this race come from 
Oregon, Louisiana, Kansas, Ne­
braska, and Missouri, as well as 
other states.

They said the first time they 
went to Kansas, it was just to 
find out what kind of racing 
facilities they had. At that time, 
Jerd won one first place, the. 
second trip in July was for the 
Trenationals and this was the 
"trst race for the participants to 

come from the entire Western 
United States, At this time, 
Jerd won a fourth place and the 
races were rained out after they 
had only raced two out of three 
heats.

When they went back in 
August for the Grand Nationals, 
troubles went with them. After 
a summer of preparing, every­
thing went wrong, and Jerd 
ended up running with a 
borrowed cart and engine, but 
he did come in eighteenth out of 
50 racers.

Jerd has approximately 170 
trophies, ribbons and medal­
lions. He has 117 first places, 
30 second places and 14 third 
places. Included in Jerd’ s troph­
ies are a first place win in 
September, 1983 for an IKF 
Region Four race held at 
Lubbock: High Point Champion 
for mid-season in 1984 in 
Modified IV Class, mid season 
Champion 1984.

Allan was mid season Cham­
pion in the Rookie II class. Also, 
Jerd was 1984 seasonal Cham­
pion in Junior 11, Rookie II and 
Modified IV, and Hi Points 
Champion in Rookie II, and 
Modified IV and second place in 
Junior II. These were won at 
Lubbock.

At Amarillo, they do not have 
mid season high points or mid 
season Championship, but at 
their season’s end, Jerd had
first in High Points Modified IV, 
Allan had first in Junior II and 
Jerd had second and third in 
Rookie II.

Jerd has first in Rookie II and 
Junior II and second in Mo­
dified IV in the Seasonal
Championship race. In 1985, at 
Lubbock, Jerd won first in High 
Points Mid Season in Rookie II, 
Junior II, and Box Stock and
Allan won second in Junior II.

Mid season Championship 
rst in Box Stock

Tired O f Paying Taxes On 
CD Interest?

A Single Premium Deferred Annuity 
With Southern Farm Bureau Life 
Insurance Company
Can help you accumulate more dollars for

retirement by tax/deffered accumulation of 
interest

[Current Rate: 8.5 |

Check on the requirements with 

Farm Bureau Insurance Companies Agent.

Rick Barrett Ricky Claybrook James Lee

This year, in August, Jerd 
will be traveling to the four 
cycle Grand Nationals in Alvin,
TX and all three racers will be 
going to the two cycle Grand
Nationals in California in July.

Jerd has two carts on display 
in the wheel division of the 
Amarillo Boat Show, being held

this weekend.
Another facet of the go cart 

racers are the benefits they 
perform, such as for Big 
Brothers and Big Sisters in 
Lubbock, as well as the Good- 
fellows in Lubbock.

Racing is big for the Mule­
shoe cousins — and they have 
the trophies and ribbons and 
medallions to prove it.

TwoFormer Residents
Charged In Murder

A former Muleshoe resident 
is among three men and a male 
juvenile charged in the shooting 
death of an Albuquerque college 
student.

According to reports, Linda 
Lee Daniels, 22, a student at 
the University of New Nexico, 
was abducted and later slain 
and her body hidden in moun­
tains northwest of Albuqueraue 

The following story is taken

JERD VINSON

Water.

saw Jerd with first 
and Rookie II and second in 
Junior II and Allan was first. At 
the Seasonal Championship, 
Jerd took first in Rookie II, 
Junior II and Box Stock and 
Allan took second in Junior D.

In High Points, Jerd was 
winner of a first in all three 
classes. At Amarillo, Jerd was 
High Pointer, first in Box Stock 
and Rookie II and second in 
Junior II, while Allan took first 
in Junior II. Jeff was first in the 
lOOcc senior class. Seasonal 
Champion went to Jerd in all 
classes.

Jeff has 43 trophies, ribbons 
and medallions, which include 
16 first, 14 second and 10 third 
places. Allan has 59 trophies, 
ribbons and medallions, which 
include 20 first, 26 second and 
16 third places.

Allan and Jeff also have a 
rollover trophy each. These are 
given when a driver rolls his

Cont From Page 1 
trict’ s rules and regulations are 
also required under the new 
law. For instance, the inculsion 
of “ negligence”  in the defini­
tion of what constitutes waste of 
water will be needed. Previously 
the District’s rules stated that 
persons who “ willfully”  caused 
the waste of water were in 
violation of the state law and 
the District’s rules. With this 
change, persons who “ willfully 
or negligently”  allow the waste 
of water will be in violation.

Additionally, provisions for 
the District to recover expenses 
incurred in covering open holes 
is modified. Prior to this 
legislation, the recovery of 
District expenses when the 
District is required to cover an 
open hole after failure of the 
landowner to do so, was limited 
to $100 in the form of a lien on 
the land. Now the recoverable 
fees for this action are a lien on 
the land for “ reasonable ex­
penses”  incurred by the Dist­
rict.

The Water District’s Board 
of Directors may also amend its 
rules to reference the Texas 
Water Well Driller’s Act regard­
ing the drilling and completion 
of water wells. The primary 
emphasis of this act requires a 
surface cement seal on all wells. 
This seal, according to the 
Water Well Driller's Board, 
requires that cement be placed 
in the annular space between

the borehole and the casing to a 
depth of ten feet below land 
surface, and requires that a 
concrete slab or block be placed 
around the well at land surface 
extending at least two feet in all 
directions with a minimum 
thickness of four inches slopped 
to drain away from the well. 
Basically these provisions serve 
to protect underground water 
from pollution by surface runoff, 
contamination from rodents bur­
rowing between the casing and 
bore hole, or intrusion of brine 
frpm other water-bearing strata.

from the Wednesday, January 
22, 1986 edition of The Clovis 
News-Journal:

“ Two men. one a baker’ s 
helper and self-professed un­
derworld figure and the other a 
construction worker, have been 
charged with murder in the 
abduction, rape and shooting of 
Miss Daniels.

“ A third man,a Sidney T. 
Sliger, 20, (formerly of Mule­
shoe), of Los Lunas, also has 
been charged in the case and a 
17-year-old also is in custody 
authorities said.

“ Johnny Zinn, 44, of Albu­
querque, described as the 
mastermind in the case, was 
charged with murder with 
firearm enhancement, kidnap­
ping and first degree sexual 
penetration.

“ Wallace R. Pierce, 24, also 
of Albuquerque (add as far as 
can be determined, with no 
Muleshoe relatives), was charg- 

* ed Tuesday with murder, con­
spiracy to commit murder, 
kidnapping, conspiracy to com­
mit kidnapping and two counts 
of fraudulent use of a credit 
card.

“ Zinn, Pierce and Siler were 
arraigned before Metropolitan 
Judge Charles Barnhart.

Preliminary hearings for all 
three are set for Jan. 31.

“ Albuqueraue Polict Lt. Bill 
Conley said Miss Daniel, whose

Author
Cont From Page 1

Royalty .ii
Cont From Page 1
senting junior high speech. 

‘  ....................eh "  • *
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Muleshoe High School candi­
dates are Todd Bessire, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Travis Bessire 
and Juanita Garcia, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Lino Garcia, 
representing MHS art; Brent 
Black, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Gaylon Black and Susan 
Lunsford, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Robert Lunsford, repre­
senting MHS speech; and 
Sergio Leal, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Jesse Leal and Leah Bell, 
daughter of Rosemary Bell, 
representing MHS band.

The Fine Arts Booster 
spokesman reminded, “ It is not 
too late for interested persons 
and groups to rent booth space 
and take part in this festival. 
Rental space is $25 and can be 
obtained by calling Sherry 
Barrett at 946-3647 or Carplyn

Conserve soil, 
moisture and time
with a Hesston
Cutter Chisel!

Hesston's Model 2540 Cutter Chisel is the minimum tillage tool 
designed for soil conservation and energy savings!

Cutter blades slice through heavy trash, allowing residue to clear the 
chisel shanks. The shanks then open moisture-absorbing grooves in the 
soil, while mixing mulch throughout the worked layer of ground. The big 
22-inch diameter cutter blades are spaced 7V»" for aggressive cutting and 
allow the chisel shanks to more effectively incorporate residue.

And th6 Cutter-Reel attachment (optional) is designed to slice through 
stubble, pulverize soil, level ridges and mix residue in the worked layer 
of ground.

Get multiple soil preparation benefits from one primary tillage tool! See 
it at your Hesston dealer!

Fry & Co.
401 S. 1st 272-4511

AjHESSTON T H E  P R I M E  L IN E

body was found in the Jemez 
Mountains, died from a gunshot 
wound in the head on Jan. 13. 
She was abducted the day 
before from in from of her 
fiance’s Albuquerque Northeast 
Heights Home when she re­
turned from a grocery store.

“ The Albuquerque Tribune, 
in a copyright story Tuesday, 
quoted sources close to the 
investigation as saying Pierce, 
Sliger and the juvenile, James 
S. Scartaccini of Los Lunas, 
abducted Mtss Daniels for Zinn, 
who said he wanted a woman 
for a pornographic film.

“ The Tribune reported Zinn 
ordered the woman killed be­
cause he was alarmed by news 
accounts of the investigation.

“ The Newspaper said author­
ities believe the pornographic 
movie story probably was a ruse 
so the others would go along.

“ Pierce, Sliger and Scartac­
cini were arrested last Friday. 
Zinn was arrested Monday after 
Miss Daniels’ body was found.”

(Note: The Journal learned 
that the juvenile suspect in the 
Daniels kidnapping and murder 
is a cousin of Sliger, and 
probably lived in Muleshoe for a 
short time in 1984 and possibly 
1985.

One source said the juvenile 
was married at the time he lived 
in this city.

Despite some reports that the- 
victim was a former resident of 
M uleshoe, such cannot be 
verified by The Journal, and it 
is doubtful that the victim even, 
lived in this city.)

Check a

House”  in 1980; and his 
experiences as a county judge 
was released in 1982, entitled, 
“ Here Comes The Judge.”

Williams also has a manu­
script ready for another 
phamplet-type publication, en­
titled “ When Wedding Bells 
Ring,”  written on marriage and 
home life.

He believes in studying as 
much as possible, and then 
putting his research to work to 
help other people, in readable 
publications and books.

A Primitive Baptist minister. 
Williams has a Muleshoe 
church, and travels extensively 
to other churches to conduct

Cont From Page 1
Bullock also sent checks +

totaling $24.3 million to the 
state’ s five Metropolitan Transit 
Authorities. Houston’ s MTA 
received $9.8 million, compared 
to last January’ s $9.9 million 
payment. Dallas’ DART check 
was for $9.6 million, up from 
last January’ s figure of $8.6. 
million. Austin’s fifth Capital 
Metro’s check was for $2.6 
million. San Antonio’ s VIA 9
received $1.7 million, up from 
last January’ s $1.6 million 
payment. The Fort Worth 
Trainsit Authority received 
$570,344 -- up from last
January’s payment of $439,200.

January checks represent tax­
es collected on sales made in 
November and reported to 
Bullock by December 20.

services.
“ Baptism-The Answer Of A 

Good Conscience,”  is available 
from West Plains Publishing or 
from Glen Williams at a cost of 
$ 10.

Tact
Tact is the quality which leads 

us to use keys rather than batter­
ing rams to open doors.

-Today’s Women.

Even At Home 
She Feels Close T o 

Her Medical Community!
Robbie Damron is shown with her new medical alert 

communication system. Hie AT&T system is now available 
from John Smith, a local distributor, and can be purchased 

outright nr rented on a monthly basis. Hie M edbl Alert 
will automatically call for emergency help in time of 
need. Call now for a free home demonstration. It's the next 
step toward better home health care.

Medical Alert O f 
West Texas

903 W . 7»h Muleshoe 272-4307
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West Plains 

Medical Center

Pat Dodson was encountered 
in the hall the other day looking 
frazzled. When asked what the 
problem was she replied hur­
riedly, “ My patient in 132 is 
needing help to go to the 
bathroom, the baby’ s temp in 
127 is sky high and needs a 
sponge bath, and my patient in 
110 is having a lot of emotional 
problems and needs to talk to 
me.”  With that she made her 
appointed rounds in classic 
methodical fashion using the 
techniques of priority setting 
she had learned in nursing 
school. It all sounds very logical 
and, almost, easy but it is far 
from easy. Pat is just one of 
those nurses who learned prior­
ity setting well.

Pat, a former computer oper­
ator, moved to Muleshoe in 
1982, with her husband VA. For

PAT DODSON, LVN

Local Woman’s 
Father Dies 
At Crosbyton

Funeral services for Vernie 
Melvin Head, 75, of Crosbyton 
were held at 4 p.m. Wednes­
day, Jan. 22 in the Crosbyton 
Church of Christ with Jim York 
officiating, assisted by the Rev. 
Roy Eason.

Interment was in the Crosby­
ton Cemetery under the di­
rection of Adams Funeral 
Home. He died at 3:15 a.m. 
Tuesday at Crosbyton Hospital 
following a lengthy illness.

He was born in Snyder and 
married Margaret Burrows in 
1974. in Lovington, N.M. He 
was a police officer for 29 years. 
He was a member of the Church 
of Christ. He moved to Crosby­
ton in 1960.

Survivors include his wife; a 
son, Joseph Lynn of San 
Angelo; two daughters, 
Geraldine Lingnau of Muleshoe 
and Anita Murray of Gillette, 
Wyo.; two brothers, K.S. of 
Lovington, N.M. and Audry of 
Snyder; two sisters, Leota Head 
of Snyder and Lois Avery of 
Bonham; 13 grandchildren; and 
19 great grandchildren.

West Plains 
Hospital Report

PATIENTS IN 
WEST PLAINS 

MEDICAL CENTER. INC. 
January 21-John Burch, Mae 

W ilterding, Inez Allgood, 
Enrique Toscano, Rebecca 
Villarreal, Rick Wilcox, Andrea 
DeLeon and Nicolasa Bara, all 
of' Muleshoe; Michael Harlin, 
Clovis; Georgia Thomas, Bo­
vina; Dora Actkinson, Farwell 

January 22-John Burch, Rick 
W ilcos, Andrea DeLeon, 
Nicolasa Bara, Jean Harlin and 
Thomas Garcia, all of Muleshoe; 
Georgia Thomas, Bovina; Nicole 
Ogas, Hereford 

January 23--John Burch, 
Andrea DeLeon, Nicolasa Bara, 
Jean Harlin, Thomas Garcia,. 
Elaine Burgess and George 
Mitchell, all of MuTesBoe; 
Georgia Thomas. Bovina; Nicole 
jOgas, Hereford

years Pat had been intent on 
raising her two boys Rod, now 
26 who graduated from college 
with a degree in Petroleum 
Engineering and Jeff, 23 who is 
currently a student at TTU 
majoring in Construction En­
gineering. She did not have 
time to pursue her dream of a 
career in nursing. But the idea 
of going back to school was 
never far from her mind. After 
25 years Pat finally was able to 
attend South Plains College 
School of Vocational Nursing. 
She went on to pass the state 
board exam with a perfect score 
of 800. Ironically, Pat says the 
hardest part of nursing school 
was the classroom! When asked 
if state board exam was what 
she expected, she replied, “ I 
thought it was going to be hard, 
and it was; terribly hard.”  Pat 
advises any and all young 
people to consider a career in 
health care because of the 
satisfaction you receive in re­
turn. A person in the health 
care field can really make a 
difference in the lives of others. 
The feeling of satisfaction is 
important, but, Pat says, it is 
also a good feeling to know you 
are going to be able to pay the 
bills with a paycheck after being 
broke for a whole year while 
going to school! Pat believes 
that nursing is a profession 
which, at times, can be very 
hard, dirty, demanding, and 
frustrating work but is also a 
profession that is extremely 
rewarding and satisfying. Pat 
Dodson is a Special Lady. She is 
an Angel of Mercy. T. Wilson 
RN DON WPMC

Dodie Actkinson 
Services Held 
At Farwell

Funeral services for Dora 
“ D odie”  Actkinson. 65, of 
Farwell were held at 11 a.m. 
Friday, Jan. 24 in Hamlin 
Memorial United Methodist 
Church in Farwell with the Rev. 
H.E. Stephens, Jr., pastor, 
officiating.

Interment was in Bailey 
County Memorial Park under 
the direction of Ellis Funeral 
Home of Muleshoe. Mrs. 
Actkinson died at 10 p.m. 
Tuesday in West Plains Medical 
Center.

Born in Alabama on April 14, 
1920, Mrs. Actkinson had been 
a resident of Farwell three years 
moving from Muleshoe. She 
was a homemaker, a member of 
the Farwell Methodist Church 
and Muleshoe Rebekah Lodge. 
She married John Theo 
Actkinson on Dec. 15, 1943, in 
Clovis, N.M. He died Feb. 7, 
'1983.

Survivors include two sons, 
Bobby Actkinson of Decatur and 
Johnny Actkinson of Farwell; 
three sisters, Miss Ceal 
Stanford and Mrs. Belle 
Williams, both of Muleshoe, 
and Mrs. Marie Carter of 
Clovis, N.M.; and six grand­
children.

Courthouse
News

MARRIAGE LICENSE 
James Christopher Werder- 

man, Jr. and Adele Marie 
Salas, Clovis, N.M.

Juan Guerra Nunez and Alicia 
Mora Sanchez, Muleshoe.

WARRANTY DEEDS 
Melvin L. Hale and wife, 

LaVerna Jo Hale to Frances 
Corbell Hyman—The (W /2) of 
Section 12 in Block C, Melvin, 
Blum and Blum Survey in 
Bailey County, Texas.

COUNTY COURT 
Waymon Charles Palmer DWI 

$250 Fine 2 Years Probation.
DISTRICT COURT 

Terry Winkler VS Texas 
Farm Bureau Mutual Insurance 
Company, a Corporation 
$7,473.24 Final Judgment.

NEW VEHICLES 
GMAC, 1986 Chev, PU, 

Robert D. Green, Inc., Larry A. 
Boom-Karen A., 1986 Chev
Sub., Robert D. Green, Inc., 
Harley D. Jones, 1986 Chev 
PU, Robert D. Green Inc., and 
Lucy N. Brock, 1985 Ford 4dr, 
Muleshoe Mtr. Co., Inc.

We Finance
Low Downpayment 

Pay-Day Payments
No Interest

Economy Motors
1400 W . Amer. Blvd. 272-3024
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Nursing Home

News
By: Joy Stancell

We would like to welcome our 
new resident. She is Inez 
Allgood. She was born in Ala. 
Feb. 11, 1896. She is a member 
of the Methodist Church. Wel­
come Mrs. Allgood to our 
nursing home family.

*•*
Claudia Cannon returned to 

the nursing home Monday after 
being hospitalized. Her recent 
visitors are her son Mr. and 
Mrs. Aubrey Cannon, her 
grandsons L. Roy Cannon and 
family, her great grandsons 
John and Matthew and newest 
addition Jason James, born 
Dec. 21, 1985, also her grand­
son Ronny G. Cannon.

Alfa Laney’s weekend visitors 
were sons Mr. and Mrs. Tommy 
Laney and grandson Mark of 
Dunkenville, Tex., Mr. and 
Mrs. James Laney of El Paso, 
also Lola Crim.

**«

Martha Harrison 
Services Held 
In California

Funeral services for Martha 
Royce Harrison, sister of Billy 
Hanna and Patsy Kent both of 
Sudan, were held Friday in Elk 
Creek, Calif.

Ms. Harrison died at 8 p.m. 
in the Enlowe Hospital in Chico, 
Calif.

She was born in Frederick, 
Okla. and had lived in Elk 
Creek for the past few years.

Survivors other than the two 
relatives mentioned include: her 
husband, Cecil of Elk Creek; 
five brothers, Eddie and Dickie 
Hanna, both of Warrenton, 
Oregon; Jerry Hanna of Elk 
Creek, Calif., Kenneth of Ama­
rillo and Clyde Hanna, Jr.; two 
sisters, Mary Beth of Orville, 
Calif, and Joy Garvin of Albany.

Lazbuddie 
School Lunch

BREAKFAST
MONDAY

Toast, Bacon, Jelly, Juice, Milk 
TUESDAY 

Cereal, Juice, Milk
WEDNESDAY

Cinnamon Rolls, Applesauce, 
Milk

THURSDAY
French Toast, Bacon, Juice, 
Milk

FRIDAY
Pancakes, Juice, Milk 

LUNCH 
MONDAY

Pizza, Green Salad, Corn, Pud­
ding, Milk

TUESDAY
Hamburger Casserole, Green 
Salad, Hot Rolls, Fruit, Milk 

WEDNESDAY
Beef Stew, Cheese Toast, 
Crackers, Peach Halves, Cook­
ies, Milk

THURSDAY
Chicken Nuggets/gravy, Green 
Beans, Hot Rolls, Fruit, Milk 

FRIDAY
Hamburgers, Tater Tots, Let­
tuce, Pickles, Fried cherry pies, 
Milk

SALADS
MONDAY

Chef Salad
TUESDAY 

Tuna Salad
WEDNESDAY 

Cottage Cheese Salad 
THURSDAY 

Chef Salad
FRIDAY

Cottage Cheese Salad

See Me
Rick Claybrook

272-4567y
Bailey County 
Farm Bureau 

1617 W. 
Amer. Blvd. 

Muleshoe

About IR A ’s
You Have 

n Your
or

■ Southern Farm Bureau's 
IRA’S

•Current interest rate 8.5%
•Guarantee a monthly income 
at retirement

•Guaranteed for the lifetime 
of the individual 

•Will provide for contributions 
to continue in event of 
permanent and total disabil­
ity if waiver of premium is 
provided.

•No fee's or charges
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Our thanks to Ernest Kerr’s 
brother-in-law Marion Mosley 
for the generous contribution to 
our activity fund. We really 
appreciate it.

**•
Claudia Camion was visited 

by Mr. McCormick and her 
sister and brother-in-law Wed. 
afternoon.

Ernest Kerr received a long 
awaited visit from his mother- 
in-law Goldie Baker Wednesday 
afternoon. Mrs. Baker has been 
recovering from a broken hip 
and arm. Also visiting him were 
his sister-in-law Ruth, his 
daughter Lindy Schuster,
Shane, Carolyn and Melinda.

* «*
Josephine Wenner has en­

joyed the visit of her son Ralph 
Wenner this week. Her other 
visitors were Lonnie and Nelda 
Merriott and Doris Ashford.

***
The Lazbuddie Young Home­

makers will host a Valentine 
party for us, Friday, Feb. 14th 
at 10:00. They will also decorate 
the nursing home for Valentines 
Day.

***
Beryl Hollis was visited by 

Jackie Johnson and daughter
Tuesday afternoon.

***
Mrs. M.E. Hickman was 

visited by her daughter from
Friona Wednesday afternoon.

***
Glenda Jennings came 

Wednesday afternoon to have a 
sing-a-long with the residents. 
Louise Legg came to have a 
ceramic class with the residents 
Tuesday morning. Residents 

articipating were Mrs. 
chuster, Lois Ethridge, Ernest 

Kerr, Edith Bruns, Edith 
Goucher, Josephine Wenner, 
Clara Weaver, Alfa Laney.

***
Josephine Wenner covered 

coat hangers for all the em­
ployees. They are so pretty and 
special to us. Thank you Mrs. 
Wenner.

***
Earl Peterson came Sunday 

morning for Bible study. The 
New Covenant Church came 
Sunday afternoon for Bible 
study.

***
Clara Jones and Josephine 

Mitchell came Thursday morn­
ing to have a devotional in 
music with the residents. Lois 
Ethridge read some verses from 
the Bible.

•**
Josie Flowers visited 

Margaret Beard Tuesday after­
noon.

***
Clara Weaver went out over 

the weekend to her home in 
Lazbuddie. Her grandson and 
daughter-in-law visited her this 
week, also Jerry Hutton and
Glenda Jennings.

***
The Needmore Community 

Club hosted a “ Non”  Birthday 
Party in the nursing home Day 
Room Thursday afternoon. We 
call it a “ Non”  Birthday Party 
because of not having any 
resident with a birthday in Jan. 

***
Thursday afternoon Retta 

Shipp, J.E. Embry, Laverne 
James and Lena Hawkins came 
to play 42 and Skip-Bo with the 
residents.

***
J.C. Shanks came Saturday to 

shave the men and give hair 
cuts. Clara Jones came Monday 
to Play the piano for the 
residents. Laverne James came 
Mon. afternoon to play Bingo
with the residents.

***

Mrs. Gregory.
*•*

Velma Gwyn played the piano 
for the residents Friday after­
noon. She played some gospel 
songs and some old “ oldies”  
that were favorites of the 
residents.

«* *
We enjoyed Mrs. Chaney 

singing alto at our sing-a-long 
Wednesday afternoon. We think 
she sings like an angel.

***
Thank you Xi Omicron Xi for 

the gift certificate at Wilson's 
•for video movies. We really will 
enjoy a lot of fun times.

***
BIBLE VERSE

Rebel not ye  against 
the Lord, neither fear ye  
the people o f  the 
land...The Lord is with 
us: Fear them not.

1. Who made this plea?
2. To whom were they 
speaking?
3. What was the oc­
casion?
Answer*
1. Joshua, the son of 
Nun, and Caleb, the son 
of Jephunneh.
2. The children of 
Israel.
3. When the ten spies 
made their report and 
frightened the childrenVelma Gwyn visited Grace 

Morris Friday afternoon, also

m B i n t$900
SO Lb . H o

of Israel with their tales.

HI PROTEIN

f A 26% c r S S S  taid .
* Fonnwl*(ed for hard working dogs 
•Forpeak conditioning and performance

High performance 
hybrids to make 

J r  the most of your
Irrigation program!

Water isn't cheap So naturally, you need corn hybrids 
':rJ  H r  with the genetic potential to come along with you and yield

the highest level your management can reach. That's why 3377 
* and 3186 make the perfect combination on the Plains. Plant full- 
season 3186 on your best land where It can express its full potential Then 

round out your irrigated corn program with earlier maturing 3377 
As companions, they give you a powerful combination of high yield and

performance characteristics you need

Superior yielder Outstanding heat and drouth tolerance 
Excellent for delayed plantings Tall wide-leafed hybrid with good ground

shading Large, girthy ears

3186 What a yielder! Excellent heat and drouth tolerance Tall,
semi-upright leafed hybrid Superior standability Excellent late season plant

health plus M DM V and heat smut resistance

See on* of thoso Pioneer dealers right away.

Jeri Wledsbush
272-4611

PIONEER
)  B R A N D  - S E E D S

'Registered trademark of Pioneer Hi-Bred international. Inc.
Pioneer* brand products are sold subject to the terms and conditions of sale which ere part of the labeling and 

sals documents Pioneer Is a brand name; numbers identify varieties

mm
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Social Security 
News & Views

A new Social Security con­
tinuing review process is begin­
ning, Laura Purcell Social Se­
curity manager in Lubbock said 
recently. The old process 
stopped in April 1984 while newt 
rules were developed.

“ The Social Security Disabil-' 
ity Benefits Reform Act of 1984 
and later regulations will make 
the process more effective, fair, 
and easily understood”  Mrs. 
Purcell said. “ Cases will be 
carefully and completely de­
veloped, and decisions to stop 
benefits will be well supported 
and uniform at all levels nation­
wide.”

Mrs. Purcell said that the 
'biggest change is the new 
medical improvement review 
standard. “ Benefits generally 
will continue unless there is 
substantial evidence of both 
medical improvement and abil­
ity to work. Before, only ability 
to work had to be shown.”

There are some limited ex­
ceptions where benefits may 
stop without medical improve­
ment, but they will apply in 
relatively few cases. For ex­
ample, entitlement can end if a 
person is gainfully employed or 
has clearly benefited from 
medical advances or vocational 
therapy related to ability to 
work.

“ Another important change 
provides revised rules for more 
realistically judging a mentally 
impaired person’ s ability to 
work,”  Mrs. Purcell said. 
“ They were developed in coop­
eration with public and private 
professional experts who work 
with mentally impaired people.

“ Also, a beneficiary who 
appeals a decision that he or 
sne is no longer disabled can 
have checks continue through a 
’decision by an administrative 
law judge. If the appeal is 
unsuccessful, though, benefits 
must be repaid unless a waiver 
is granted.”

he law requires everyone

who receives disability benefits 
to be reviewed regularly. How 
often a person’s case is re­
viewed will depend on the 
severity of the impairment, how 
likely it is to improve, and other 
factors.

A person getting Social Se­
curity or supplemental security 
income (SSI) disability checks 
can have his or her case 
reviewed from as soon as 6 
months to as long as 7 years 
after entitlement.

Among the first cases to be 
reviewed under the new process 
are those where medical im­
provement was considered likely 
when benefits were awarded. 
Many of these reviews were 

reviously scheduled but de- 
ayed while the new rules were 

being prepared.
Also scheduled for early 

review will be cases where a 
cessation decision was ap­
pealed. They include those 
returned by Federal courts 
which will be reevaluated under 
the new medical improvement 
review standard.

Mrs. Purcell encouraged any­
one in the Lubbock area who 
wants to know more about 
disability reviews to contact the 
Lubbock office. It is located at 
1611 10th St., Suite 100, and 
number is 743-7381.

C
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8. Real Estate 
For Sale

Rad Estate ft nnraNQ * |
201 Main - Pfi. 272-3611 •Commerdai

3-1 % -l Richland Hills dishwasher, range- 
oven, disposal, bar, new carpet, central 
heat, ref. central air. 50H-12 

***
2 houses on one lot would make good rent 
houses 2-1j/4-1 carport and one 2-1. both 
yards are fenced. H-23

***
2-2%-4-double carport-Brick-den or bed­
room, dining room, pantry, range-oven, 
dishwasher, fire place and storm cellar, 
very nice. 50H-10

••*
4-1-2 stucco-dining room, wall heater, tile 
and carpet floors. 25H-25 

•*•

"IF  You Wont It Sold • See U s"

H .C  Raid ■ralnr 
Roy Whitt 272-3058 
Ttwnla Raid 272-5311 
Joy Whitt 272-305*

J b
udderth Realty, Inc.

Drawer 887 
Farwell, Tx 79325 
Ph. 806-481-3288

181 acres, one 6 in. and one 8 in. well, 
valley sprinkler, west of Progress on
highway. Owner financing available.

•**
177 acres with zimmatic sprinkler near 
Lazbuddie. Good water area. Owner says 
sell.

***
EXCELLENT existing business opportun­
ity. Would make ideal family operation. 
Located in Farwell • Bovina - Oklahoma 
Lane area.

oo*
160 acres irrigated with circle sprinkler, 
excellent water area with nice 3 bedroom, 
2 bath home with 2 car garage, North East 
of Muleshoe.

320 A, 3-8 in. wells, circle sprinklu* 3 mi 
SE Clays Corner.

**•
A, 3 good wells, circle sprinkler,158

elevator and new office 
highway, Progress area.

sp
building on

•*•
639 ACRES irrigated; 5 wells; under­
ground pipe; with 800 head feed lot; scales 
and corrals; nice 4 bdrm, 2 bath, home; 
also will sell with or separately adjoining 
160 acre irrigated tract. All located NW 
Earth.. Owner says sell immediately to 
settle estate.

••*

A man of learning is never bored.
-Jean Paul Pichter.

Learning makes a good man 
better, and an ill man worse.

•Thomas Fuller.

Most men’ s learning is nothing 
but history dully taken up.

-John Seldon.

A handfull of good life is better 
than a bushel of learning.

-George Herbert.

A man learning has riches within 
him.

-Phaedrue.

8. Real Estate 
For Sale

Sudan Fire 
Department Netvs

The Sudan Fire Department 
has some big thank yous to 
hand out. One to the City of 
Sudan for the new Tire depart­
ment building. It certainly is 
nice to have all the equipment 
centrally located. Also, because 
this new building is heated, the 
fire department can keep the 
trucks filled with water, ready 
to go.

The deoartment is nlanning 
an Open House in the near
future and hope that all 
residents will attend.
, The second thank you goes to 
the Sudan Farmer’s Co-op for 
the $1,000.00 donation made in 
December toward the new fire 
truck. All the support from the 
community is certainly apprec­
iated. The donations are put to 
good use.

In December, a new portable 
water storage tank was purch­
ased. It will assist in any fire 
outside the city limits or where 
fire hydrants are not available. 
This tank can be set up easily 
and will hold 1500 gallons of 
water. This frees the water 
truck to return to the water 
supply for a refill. The pumper 
can pump from this portable 
tank and keep working on 
location .on the fire. The 
department feels this portable 
storage tank will be a real asset 
in this area with so many farm 
homes and barns.

In the month of December, 
the department made 12 runs in 
the ambulance and answered 
two fire calls.

Recently, the Fire Depart­
ment was privileged to nave 
Jody Phillips and Christine 
Wright, the Lions Club ex­
change students from Australia. 
They attended the weekly fire 
meeting and were very inform­
ative and entertaining. They 
were appreciated for taking time 
to speak to the group.

Haldon Messamore, Sudan 
Fire Department reporter, states 
“ we are always glad to help the 
citizens of Sudan and the 
surrounding communities in any 
way we can. We thank you 
again for all your support.

A wise man will hear, and will in­
crease in learning.

-Proverbs 1:5.

Sudan News
by

Evelyn Ritchie

•••

1
15. Misc. 15. Misc.

SHOP AROUND FOR THE BEST PRICE 
THEN SEE OUR PRICES 

60% OFF 14K GOLD & DIAMONDS 
EVERYDAY

Bi-Whe Health Mart
902 Main Friona, Texas

247-3010

18. Legals lS .L e g a ls

NOTICE TO CONTRACTORS
Sealed bids addressed to the City of 

Muleshoe, Texas will be received at the 
City Hall until 8:30 AM, February 18, 
1986, and then publicly opened and read 
for furnishing all plant, labor, material and 
equipment, and performing all work 
required for seal coating city streets.

Bids shall be submitted in sealed 
envelopes upon the blank form of the 
proposal attached hereto and marked in 
the upper left hand comer.

All proposals shall be accompanied by a 
cashier’s check or certified check upon a 
national or state bank in the amount of 
five (5%) percent of the total maximum 
bid price payable without recourse to the 
City or a bid bond in the same amount 
from a reliable surety company, as a 
guarantee that bidder will enter into a 
contract and execute performance bond 
within ten days after notice of award of 
contract to him. The bid security must be 
enclosed in the same envelope with the 
bid. Bids without check or bid bond will 
not be considered.

The successful bidder must furnish 
performance and payment bonds upon the 
forms which are attached hereto in the 
amount of 100% of the contract price from 
an approved surety company holding a 
permit from the State of Texas to act as 
surety or other sureties acceptable to the 
Owner.

The right is reserved to reject any and 
all bids and to waive any informality in 
bids received.

Plans, specifications and bidding docu­
ments may be secured from the office of 
Bill R. McMorries & Associates. Inc., 6300 
Canyon Dr., Amarillo, Texas 79109, on 
deposit of Fifty ($50.00) Dollars per set 
which sum so deposited will be refunded, 
provided: (1) All documents are returned 
in good condition to Bill R. McMorries & 
Associates, Inc. not later than 48 hours 
prior to the time for receiving bids; or (2) 
The Contractor submits a bid and all 
documents are returned in good condition 
to Bill R. McMorries & Associates, Inc. at 
the time that bids are opened.

CITY OF MULESHOE. TEXAS 
By: Darrell E. Turner, Mayor 

cl8-4s-2tc

Mrs. Edna Bellamy 
during the holidays in Muleshoe

Bellamy visited
in f  *

with her sister, Ida Ruth Holt

*•*
Verna Ingle has been a 

patient in the Lubbock General 
Hospital seveal days this week. 

**•
Edith Humpheys was released 

from the hospital and is 
recuperating at home.

••*
Visiting this week with Mr. 

and Mrs. Doyle Terrell has been 
their daughter, Mattie Pearl 
while Mrs. Terrell was hospital­
ized at the Amherst Hospital. It 
was reported that she may be 
released on Thursday.

***
Mrs. Vesta Hunt has been 

moved from CCU into a private 
room at the St. Mary’ s Hospital 
in Lubbock. It was reported that 
she is doing much better.

***
The Anchor Brothers will be 

in concert Jan. 25 at 8:00 p.m. 
at the Civic Center in Lubbock 
and will be singing in Midland 
and Kermit and that area 
during this upcoming weekend. 

***
Several college students have 

returned to classes this week 
including Kim Moss, Sherri 
Powell, Laima Powell, Shawnda 
and Kevan Masten, Jamie Ingle 
James Clay, Donald Doty.

***
Billy Hana and Patsy Kent 

left Wed. night to join their 
brother, Kenneth in Amarillo to 
go on to Sacramento, California 
to attend funeral services for 
their sister Martha Harrison 
who died late Tuesday night. 
Martha was here a couple 
weeks ago to attend funeral 
services for their brother, Mel­
ton.

***
Herman Welkner was taken 

by ambulance Tuesday night to 
the Littlefield Medical Center in 
Littlefield.

***
Doris Harper has returned 

home from spending the holi­
days in Reklaw with her 
daughter, Carole and family.

***
Pearl Wingo was released this 

week fro the St. Mary’ s 
Hosptial in Lubbock where she 
was taken . several days ago 
following an accident at ’her 
home when she broke a leg.

and members oT her family. Dr. 
Merlyn Bellamu of McAlister.
0 ^ .  v isited  here With h e r o n s  
uay Iasi weelc.

***
Debbie Hall was in Amarillo 

one day last week for a 
check-up and did not get a very 
good report. It was reported 
that she may have to undergo 
further surgery.

•*•
Cindy Nichols left Wednesday* 

for El Paso to attend graduation 
services for her husband, Jim­
my, who will be graduating with 
a class from the Air Force, her 
daughters, Brandi and Heather 
remained here with their grand­
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Dwayne 
Powell and family.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Warren Rudd 

of Houston visited during the 
holidays with his mother, Mrs. 
Nell Epps.

*****
Nancy Patterson of Dallas 

visited last week with Mr. and 
Mrs. John Kinnie and other 
members of the A.J. Roberts 
family and attended funeral 
services for A.J. last Tuesday.

*****
Among those who have been 

or are ill among the church 
family are Hoyt Robertson, Bud 
Graves, Roy Graves, Bessie 
Collins and Pearl Wingo. Rem­
ember these in prayer as well as 
those who have lost loved ones, 
The A.J. Roberts family and the 
Billy Hanna and Pat Kent 
families.

*****
If anyone is missing any 

dishes, please check in the 
kitchen at the FBC and if you 
find your missing dish, please 
pick it up between 8 & noon.

*****
Rev. and Pitts Davis and 

Sarah were in Austin during the 
holidays to visit her sister, Mr. 
and Mrs. Jeff White and their 
new infant daughter, Beth. The 
family members joined them 
there.

*****

Too Late
To Classify

FOR RENT: Nice 1-2 
bedroom apartments.
Some bills paid. Call 
272-4969 or 272-4754 
after 5 p.m.

"• s5-4s-tfc

17.Seed 
& Feed

HAY FOR SALE: Red 
Top can Round bales 
Will deliver locally call 
925-6732.
17-2t-6tp

h t VOTE 11 Vft!

Parmer County 

Political Calendar 

County
Commissioner 

Precinct 4 

Ray McGehee 

(incumbentj

Mr. and Mrs. Randal Gil- 
crease and Paula of Euless 
spent some of the holidays with 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. John 
(Bud) Graves and sister, Mr. 
and Mrs. Wayne Whiteaker. 
Others visiting with the Graves 
have been their son Mr. and 
Mrs Doc Graves of Brownwood 
and Donnie Graves and his 
daughter of Midland and Shell
Rodrigues of Greeley, Colo. 

*****

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Summer 
were in Albuquerque, N.M. 
during some of the holidays to 
visit his parents. Australian 
exchange student, Jodie
Phillips accompanied them on 
the trip. Jodie is among several 
exchange students here now in 
the United States with the Lions
Club sponsoring the group.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. W.C. Masten 

visited during the weekend in 
Canyon with their daughter, 
Mr. and Mrs. A1 Harrison and 
family.

* * * * *

Daryl Roberts has returned to 
his home in Stephenville and 
Monte to his in Burnet after 
having been here with the A.J. 
Roberts family and here to 
attend funeral services for their 
father, A.J. last week. Their 
families had to leave earlier in 
the week.

Sharon Roberts, Britton and 
Cindy have returned to their 
home after having been here to 
attend funeral services for their
grandad, A.J. Roberts.

*****

Hunting Season 
End For: 

Q u ail.....Feb.

Sandhill Crane 
Feb. 9

m
I BtU ey County
j  County Clerk
}  Barbara McCamish

J District Clerk 
}  Nelda Merriott

* 287th District Judge 
t  Jack Young

♦
*
*
*
♦
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
+
*
*
♦
*
t
*
i
t
*
*
♦
♦
i

Justice O f The 
Peace 

Precinct 1 
Jack Bates

County Treasurer 
Dorothy Turner

County
Commissioner 

Precinct 2
R oy Whitt

Precinct 4 
Rudolph Morato

(Incumbents)

4-

t

t

WHAT
IS YOUR HOUSE 
REALLY WORTH ?

M ost homes, are growir/iq in va lue every  day 
So 11 s importaHt tf) know  w hether your 

in su rance  cove rage  is su ff ic ien t
If your hom e is d e s t r o y e d  hy fire or 

storm, you m iqht not he ab le  to r e p la c e d  
with you r p resen t co ve rage

I Can show  yon a qu ic k  and  m;u< way to 
est im ate  the ap p ro x im u h  : oq

you r hom e  Ca l l  me 
today or d rop  hy and 
let s talk about y<>t - 
hom e It s pr<ybiabl • 

worth m ore  thar
you' think j

R oy Whitt
Insurance

272-3611 201 Main

o

i *
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Bailey County
Journal Classified Call 272 -4536

CLASSIFIED 
RATES 

First Insertion
Per Word.......... S.15

Minimum Charge 
$2.30

Consecutive
Insertions

Per Word..........$.13
Minimum Charge

$2.00

CLASSIFIED 
DISPLAY RATES 

$1.70
Per Column Inch

BLIND AD RATES
50% More

DEADLINES 
12 noon Tues. 

For Thursday Paper 
12 Noon Fri.

For Sunday Paper

We reserve the 
right to classify, re­
vise, or reject any 
ad. Not responsible 
for any error after 
ad has run once.

1. Personals

FURNITURE Upholst­
ering & repairs. 
Burrows Upholstery 
Shop 209 W. 2nd 
Phone 272-4255 Home 
Phone 272-5722. 
bl-41t-tfc
H O M E  R E PA IR S  
F.M. Saldana Con­
struction, licensed and 
b o n d e d  p l u m b e r .  
Specialized in cement, 
carpenter work, re­
modeling, painting, 
acoustical ceilings. 
272-4955. 
sl-16s-tfc

1, Personals 3. Help W  anted 5. Apts. 
For Rent

CORAL REEF #3 
All breed dog 
grooming. Special 
for month of Janu­
ary: all poodles (or 
same equal size) 
$10.00. Boarding at 
reasonable rates.

272-5709
Tradewinds Plaza

1. Personals

MARY K A Y  COS­
M E T I C S  J o s i e  
Flowers 272-3865 
l-40s-tfc
AVON REPRESEN­
TATIVES usually earn 
$6 to $10 per hour. 
For information call 
Nettie Long 272-3208 
of Tommie Graham 
505-762-4174. 
Ll-3t-10cc

CONCERNED 
i^bout Someone’s 

Drinking? 
HELP IS 

AVAILABLE 
through Al-Anon 

Call 227-2350 or 
965-2870 or call 227- 
2350 or come to visit 
Tuesday nights,  
8:00 p.m. or Satur­
day mornings at 
10:30 a.m. at 1116 
W. American Blvd., 
Muleshoe.

IN AMHERST Completely remodeled, loan 
appraised. 2 Bdrm, 1 Bath, large living 
rqom, fireplace, kitchen, built-ins, lots of 
cabinets, utility, fully carpdfed, central 
heat, ref. air call 246-3454.

O

JIMMIE CRAWFORD 
Real Estate & Ins.

1725 W. Ave. E 
Muleshoe, Texas 
Phone 272-3666

2- 1%-2 brick house Vi Mi. west of town on 
10 acres. Basement, green house & 3”  
well. Priced to sell.

***
3- 1 brick house with tile fence, garden, 
and good neighbors. Quite neighborhood.'

***
2-1 house with vinyl siding, new wiring & 
plumbing. Near downtown.

*•*
Commercial property - 3 lots on highway 
84 with 125 ft. frontage. Good location.

Have farm listings.
Call for information.

HENRY REALTY 
111 W. Ave. B 

Muleshoe, Texas 
272-4581 

•**
COUNTRY living, close to town. A 
3-Bedroom, 2-bath, large den with 
fireplace, central air/heat, located on 
one-acre tract. Carpet through-out, many 
built-in appliances in kitchen. TV-Cable. 
See to appreciate.

***
4 BR, 2 BATH, 2 car garage, central 
heat/air, large utility, carpet, "near down­
town. Excellent condition.

***
ISO ACRES with 6 inch well and 4 inch 
well. On highway close to Muleshoe.
Underground Tine connects both wells.

**•
ONE ACRE sites for home construction. 3 
miles East of Muleshoe on HWY. 3 lots 
remain.

JUST COMPLETED 3 bedroom, 2 bath, 
large living room, kitchen and dining. 
Excellent condition, near high school. 
Priced to sell.

•••
COMPLETELY remodeled 2 bedroom 
home. Ideal first home, must see to 
appreciate. Nice location with F.H.A. loan.

APARTMENT complex, mobile home park, 
vacant land for expansion. Terms avail­
able.

•••
2 BR on 2 acres near Lazbuddie. Large 
kitchen cabinets, carpet thru out, carport, 
fruit trees.

***
COMMERCIAL PROPERTY on Main 
Street, over 4,000 sq. ft., income 
, prod u ring jjroperty.

•**
COMMERCIAL PROPERTY - Excellent 
rental income from 4 separate offices. 
Lease agreements in force.

•••
3 BR, 2 BATH, spacious home outside city 
limits, near city on highway. 29’x40’ metal 
building. Lot (&’x602’

**•
3 BR, l BATH, completely remodeled, 
edge of city on highway.

FRANK’ S 
. REFRIGERATION 
AND APPLIANCE 

SERVICE 
Parts and Repair 

104 E. Ave. B 
Muleshoe, Texas 
Bus. Ph. 272-5090 

Home Ph. 272-3822

All natural, Good 
Basic Nutrition,
Weight Control,
Program. Safe.

Betty Steinbock
965-2866.

STORAGE 
Rooms Available 

For Storage 
$25.00 - $30.00 

per month 
Ted Barnhill 

272-4903 
bl-42s-stfc

Will Do
Custom Sowing 

or Planting 
with J.D. drill. 
Call 965-2417. 

,12-1 or after 8 p.m.

Being born poor need 
not be a permanent 
handicap but only hard 
work will erase it.

• • • •

EARN from $20,000 a 
year, Part time or 
up to $100,000 full 
time. Only a few 
franchises will be of­
fered for this area. 
Requires: 1. Male or 
female at least 18 
years of age. 2. A 
desire to work your 
own business. Now 
taking applications. 
Call for appointment 
272-3836. 
h3-4s-6tc
INDIVIDUAL needs 
reliable woman to 
spend nights with her 
mother. No work in­
volved - companion­
ship only. Please call 
272-3006 after 5:30 
p.m. if interested. 
g3-4s-tfc

4. Houses 
For Rent

RUIDOSO CHALET: 4 
bedroom for rent by 
day, weekend, or 
weekly. Call 505-257- 
2622 or 915-943-4261. 
Owner Dr. Albertson. 
a4-49t-tfc
FOR RENT: Small 
unfurnished house. 
Call 272-3107 
m4-ls-tfc

We’re long on ideas 
and plans and short on 
the energy required to 
carry them out.

JAMES F. HAYES & CO.
Vic Coker - Agent 

(806) 965-2468
•••

_Uf75 ACRES north of Lazbuddie on 
Running Water Draw. 370 acres central 
“blvot irrigated, 25CQ,cres row irrigated, 
balance is good fc fl/o f buffalo grass and 
gramma grass, v ell improved. 2 houses,

, barn, small feed lot, excellent fences and 
other improvements. $325 per acre.

160 ACRES 4 miles Northwest of Earth. 2 
wells, very good sprinkler, seller financed 
note may be assumed. Make offer.

320 ACRES Northwestern Lamb County. 
Very good water and soils, 3 irrigation 
wells, 1 domestic well, steel cattle pens, 
$600/acre.

1280 ACRES. Western Deaf Smith County* 
North of Friona. 960 acres of excellent 
grass. 2 windmills, 1 submersible pump. 
320 acres of cultivation. Very good fences. 
Other land available for lease to buyer of 
this property. $210/acre.

•••
162 ACRES North .of Pleasant Valley Gin. 
2 wells, excellent water, new sprinkler. 
Seller will finance. $900/acre.

*•*

160 ACRES West & South of Lazbuddie 
many improvements, Very Good water, 
ideal for combination of farming & cattle.

Contact Vic for information on other ranch, 
hunting and recreational properties.

Jto <_Ami Ofcesteit ^eafty
REAL ESTATE 

BROKER-APPRAISER

806-227-2368
FARMS FOR SALE
BAILEY COUNTY 

Dryland 
*•*

6 adjoining labors near Circleback with Vi 
of 100% minerals

LAMB COUNTY 
Dryland 

***177 ac. - 3 mi. N.W. of Sudan on 
pvmt. with 2 bdrm. home

179 ac - 1 mi. S.E. of Sudan on pvmt.
•*>*

80 ac. - 3 mi. S.W. of Sudan on pvmt.
*•*

177 ac. • S.E. of Lfd. near Bainer Switch 

Irrigated Land

240 ac. • 7 mi. N.W. of Sudan on Hwy. 84 
with 177 ac. alfalfa under sprklr. & 80. ac. 
grass & wheat

448 ac. - alfalfa with siderell sprklrs. 10 
mi. N. of Sudan

***
177 ac. - W. of Amherst with 2 wells

366 ac. W. of Sudan with 3 wells, Towable 
Bpl.

PARMER COUNTY
320 ac. - Near Lazbuddie with 3 - 8 ”  wells. 
Very Good.

2 FURNISHED APTS. 
for rent. Water paid. 
Call 272-3901 or come 
by 202 W. 8th after 5 
pm. Betty Jo 
Carpenter. 
c5-3s-tfc

8. Real Estate 
For Sale

FOR SALE by owner} 
3 bdrm, 1 bath, ga­
rage Country Club 
Addition $35,000.00 
272-5414. 
j8-3s-2tsc

FOR SALE: 1978
Windsor Mobile
Home. 14x70 2 bdrm,
1 bath, phone 272- 
4083.
w8-4s-2tsc
FOR SALE by owner 
3 bedroom on corner 
lot, clean, newly 
painted. 522 W. 8th 
965-2864 $29,500. 
h8-4s-tfc

FOR SALE: -1971 Mo­
bile Home, 3 Bed­
room, 1% Bath, 
$7,500. Call 272-5268 
after 5:00 p.m. 
g8-37s-tfc

8. Real Estate 
For Sale

OWNER SELLS: 3 
bdrm., 2 bath, brick, 
with fireplace, cent. 
A&H. Covered patio 
with nice yard. 1806 
W. Ave. E. 272-5663 
or 272-3230 
8-49t-tfc

FOR SALE: 2 bdrm., 
1 bath house to be 
moved. Price nego­
tiable. 925-6498. 
8-3s-6tp

LAMAR KELLY
REAL ESTATE 

BROKER

BRICK- 3 br., 2 
bath, 2 car ga­
rage, storage, 2.8 
acres, 1 Vi miles 
East of Amherst, 
TX, HWY 37.

3 BR. 1 BATH, 
all insulated. 500 

> Main, Amherst, 
TX *•*

Home Ph. 246-3357 
Office Ph. 246-3226 

Box 259
Amherst, TX 79312" 
k8-4s-8.tscts

8. Real Estate 
For Sale

To r  s a l e  b y  o w n ~
ER: 3 bdr. - 2 Bath, 
brick home in Country 
Club Addition. Fire­
place, sunken den, 
nice fenced yard, 
central A&H, 906 
Juniper. 272-5421. 
m8-2s-tfc

ATTENTION FIRST 
HOME BUYERS. 
1600 square feet max­
imized in 3 bedroom 2 
bath home. Nice stor­
age. Central heating 
& Air condition. Extra 
insulation. Total Elec­
tric. Country Club Ad­
dition. Call 272-3180. 
•s8-3t-tfc
HOUSE & SMALL 
ACREAGE on hwy. 
3 bedroom, 2 bath, 
cattle feed lot, 200 
head hog finish feed 
floor. 806-965-2754. 
g8-2s-lmc

9. Automobiles
For Sale

1979 CAPRICE Clas­
sic Coupe. Good con: 
dition. 272-4477 after 
6 p.m.
Vn9-ls-4tsc;

10. Farm 
Equip.

GOOD SELECTION of 
'used center pivot for 
sale or lease. Contact 
Irrigation Pumps & 
Power, Muleshoe, 
Earth or Dimmitt. 
I10-46s-tfc
TWO BOSS side roll 
sprinkler systems, 5 
inch line, 5 foot 
wheels self leveling 
heads. Good condi­
tion. 825-3822. 
bl0-4s-5tc

16. Livestock

CALL YOUR LOCAL 
Used Cow Dealer for 
7-day a week free 
dead stock removal. 
806-965-2903 collect 1- 
800-692-4435.

' hl6-33t-tfc

17. Seed 
& Feed

ALFALFA good small 
bales at Muleshoe $65 
Ton or best offer 
during January. 965- 
2984 Evenings. 
17-4t-3tp

BINGHAM & NIEMAN REALTY 
116 E. Ave. C 

272-5285-272-5286

PARKRIDGE

BEAUTIFUL 3-2-2 Brick Home, Energy 
Efficient, Cent. A&H, built-ins, sunken 
living area, nice office or study, large, 
finished basement. Ash woodwork, fire­
place with blower, aut. sprinkler sys. nice 
workshop, & much more!!!!

COUNTRY LIVING HOMES

3- 1-1 home on 1 acre, close to town, nice 
workshop-storage bldg. & attached shed.
$30’s....

#*<!
JUST LISTED-3-l-i home on pavement 
close to town on approx. 6/10 acre, 
storage bldg., workshop, unfinished base­
ment.

RICHLAND HILLS
JUST LISTED- 3-2-2 Brick, Cent. A&H, 
built-ins, fireplace, utility, fenced yard,
corner lot. $50’ s !!!! 1•**

JUST LISTED-Nice, large 3-2-2 Brick 
Home, Cent. A&H, built-ins, utility, 
approx. 2700 sq. ft. of Iv. area, nice 
covered patio, storage bldg., playhouse, 
fenced yard, & morel!!!!

***
4- 2%-2 Brick, Cent. A&H, built-ins, 
fireplace, study, basement, fenced yard & 
more. $60’s! 1!! ***
3-3-1 carport Brick, Cent. A&H, built-ins, 
fireplace, nice large den with built-in bar 
& gun cabinets, loads of storage, large 
utility, covered patio, gas grill, & storage 
bldgs.!!!

3-1 V*-2 Brick, Cent, heat, Euap. air, 
built-ins, nice earth tone carpets, new 
vinyl flooring, fenced yard & lots more! 11 
$60’ s

*•*
3-2-2 Brick, Cent. A^H, built-ins, earth- 
toned carpets, be^jpr.ully decorated & 
landscaped, fenc'eSPard, storage bldg. &
more!!!! V

•••
NICE 3-2-2 Brick, (energy Efficient-Total 
Electric), Cent. A&H, built-ins, fireplace, 
storm windows & doors, utility, nice patio 
&more!Jlll!

LENAU ADD.

3-1-1 home corner lot, Cent, heat, Evap.
air fenced yard. $30’s.....

***
NICE 2-1-1 home, wall furnace, evap. air 
storm windows & doors, utility, fenced 
yard & storage bldg. S30’sl 11

3-1 Vi-1 carport home, nice carpet, fenced
yard, neat. $30’s!!M!***
2-1-1 Home, Cent, heat, DW, utility, storm 
windows, well insulated, fenced yard. 
$20’ s !!!

2-1-1 Brick, Cent. A&H, built-ins, fire­
place, Comb, den-office, fenced yard with 
2 nice pecan trees, corner lot!!!! 1

HIGH SCHOOL AREA

JUST LISTEDSke  3-1 +  1 Carport Home 
on corner lot. Nice carpets, wall furnace 
heat, evap. air, fenced yard and storage 
bldg. $30’ s !!l!

3-1% Brick Home, with approx. 2750 sq. 
ft. of Iv. area. Cent. A&H, built-ins, 
beamed ceiling in living- room, nice den 
with ash paneling, large utility, fenced 
yard, storage bldg., & more!111!

PRICE REDUCED 3-1 U ^ m e  on corner 
lot, storage bu ild i^ ^ ^ - nice area for 
garden. $1

3-1-1 home, comer lot, Cent, heat, Evap.
air, fenced yard. $30’s !!!•••
3-1 % -l home, comer lot, Cent. A&H, 
1800+ sq. ft. of Iv. area, sprinkler sys., & 
also has a nice 2 room & bath rental unit. 
$40’s!l! 10% Owner financing.

2-1 home on 20 acres, 20 hp. sub. pump, 
domestic well, large bam & corrals, % 
mile sprinkler pipe, & more. $42,500...

•**
JUST LISTED-3-2-X detached garage home 
on corner lot, floor & wall furnace heat, 
evap. air, built-ins, ceiling fans, fenced 
yard, storage, approx. 2450 sq. ft. of Iv. 
area. $47,500!!!!!

***
JUST LISTED-3-l-l car detached garage 
home on comer lot, wall furnace, evap. 
air, utility, fenced yard, storage, cellar, & 
also has a nice one bedroom rental unit. 
$39,000!!!!!

GOOD RENTAL PROPERTY-2 houses (2 
bdrm., 1 bath, unfurnished & a 1 bdrm., 1 
bath furnished) all on one lot. $25,000 
Sales Price with a $400 per month
income!!!! *•*
IMMACULATE Brick, cent. A&H,
built-ins, earth ^w carpet. $40’ s 

*•* «
SMALL EQUITY 14’x80’ Mobile home- 3
bdrm., 2 bath, built-ins very nice...

•**
NICE Mobile Home lot, hookups, fenced 
yard & storage bldg.!!!!!

•**
BUILDING ON 2 LOTS, approx. 2350 sq. 
ft., paved parking...

NICE FASHION & FABRIC shop. Very 
good business, with good potential. Priced 
to Sell.

PRICE REDUCED-Uice brick office bldg. 
Approx. 4,000 sq. ft. Very nice offices and 
reception area, central A&H paved 
parking. •••
14 X 84, 3-2 SHULT Mobile Home, Cent. 
he4t, energy efficient, built-ins, pantry, * 
utility & more. Small Equity & Assume 
Loan to qualified buyer...

3-2 Mobile Hornty^Kfrlffi-uilt-ins. fenced 
yard, storag^C H r oc More. $13,00011!

YI-Approz. 400 acres, 4 wells, under-

found tile, 3-1 %-2 home, 2 large bams,
1 tenant house. $750.00 per acre.

#**
BAILEYBORO-2 Labors, 4 elect, wells, 3 
bdrm., 2 bath home, bams, corrals, 
approx. 55 acres of pasture land, on 
pavement..... •••
FAIR VIEW AREA -2 good dryland labors
on pavement. Priced to Sell! ! ! I!

***
NEEDMORE-Good Labor of land, 2 elec, 
wells with hi-pressure line for sprinkler
system, some minerals. Priced to Sell.....

•**

We have numerous farms, commercial 
property, & lots listed. Contact us for 
details on these and other listings.

” WE APPRECIATE YOUR BUSINESS”  
GEORGE NIEMAN, BROKER


