
POW release halted; U.S. nixes weekend withdrawal 
By GEORGE ESPER 

Associated Press Writer 
SAIGON ( AP) — The Communist 

declared on Thursday night they are 
suspending release of the last American 
prisoners in Vietnam because the United 
States went back on a deal for with-
drawal of all U.S. troops by the weekend. 

The North Vietnamese and Viet Cong 
called the altered U.S. position "illegal" 
and refused to hand over the remaining 
POWs in Vietnam pending "an ap-
propriate answer from the U.S. side." 

The 138 prisoners had been scheduled 
for release in two groups Saturday and 
Sunday in Hanoi in exchange for an 
accelerated U.S. troop pullout that would 
have put American forces out of Vietnam 
by Sunday, three days ahead of the 
deadline in the Paris cease-fire accord. 

The United States first agreed to the 
plan, proposed by North Vietnam and the 
Viet Cong. But later, on orders from 
Washington, the Americans reversed 
themselves. 

A U.S. spokesman said the United 
States "needed additional time to move 
U.S. troops out in an orderly fashion." 

In a letter to the U.S. delegation, Tra 
declared: 

"Now, by the U.S. violation, we 
suspended the handing over of the POW 
list and the release of POWs awaiting an 
appropriate answer from the U.S. side. 

"We demand the United States stop 
creating obstacles to the release of 
military and civilian POWs. We also 
demand the United States stop finding 
pretext to delay the U.S. and allied troop 
withdrawals. The U.S. side should bear 
full responsibility for the delay." 

A second letter was sent to the U.S. 
delegation from Maj. Gen. Le Quang 
Hoa, chief of the North Vietnamese 
delegation.; 

Hoa also strongly rejected the 

American demands and said they have 
no legal foundation. 

Hoa's spokesman, Bui Tin, said the 
next move is up to the Americans. 

The issue was certain to come up 
Friday .at a scheduled meeting of 
delegation chiefs of the United States, 
North Vietnam, South Vietnam and the 
Viet Cong, the four parties that make up 
the Joint Military Commission. 

The Paris peace agreement fixed 
Wednesday as the deadline for com-
pletion of American troop withdrawals 
and release of all U.S. prisoners captured 
in North and South Vietnam. 

North Vietnam and the Viet Cong so far 
have released 439 American prisoners 
and the United States has cut its troop 

strength from 23,500 iat the time of the 
cease-fire to 6,300. 

The 6,300 figure includes 825 members 
of the U.S. delegation to the Joint 
Military Commission and 50 military 
attaches and 159 U.S. Marines and Navy 
personnel attached to the U.S. embassy. 
The United states has said it will be a few 
days after the March 28 deadline before 
it can withdraw the 825 delegation 
members because the Joint Military 
Commission is not scheduled to expire 
until then, and it will take several days to 
complete the move. 

The U.S. side also says the 50 military 
attaches and 159 Marine and Navy 
personnel are authorized to stay as part 
of the U.S. Embassy staff. 

Tra's letter listed the military embassy 
staffers and the 825 delegation members, 
along with the new prisoner conditions as 
changes in the U.S. position that he said 
"testify that the U.S. side has violated 
the basic conditions of the peace 
agreement. 

In Paris, the Viet Cong and South 
Vietnamese met for the second time in 
their efforts to draw up a plan leading to 
elections in South Vietnam. But they 
failed to reach agreement on an agenda 
and decided to meet again next Monday. 
The speedup-pullout initially agreed to 
represented the opinion of the U.S. 
Command in Saigon that the troops could 
move out fast enough, he added, but word 
from Washington changed that 
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assessment. 
The U.S. representatives imposed new 

conditions for final U.S. troop with-
drawals, including demands for a list of 
nine Americans captured in Laos and the 
date and place they will be released. 

The U.S. delegation also proposed that 
the first group of remaining POWs be 
released Sunday instead of Saturday, and 
that the turnover be completed Wed-
nesday instead of Sunday. 

It said it would not begin the with-
drawal of the remaining American 
troops from Vietnam until the first group 
of POWs is transferred to U.S. custody. 

U.S. officials indicated that 
Washington changed signals at least 
partly because of second thoughts about 
the American prisoners captured in 
Laos. The U.S. Command lists seven 
American servicemen and two American 
civilians captured there. 

Lt. Gen. Tran Van Tra, chief of the Viet 
Cong delegation to the Joint Military 
Commission, said the concern was a 
"pretext" to slow down U.S. troop with-
drawals. 

Carr, Osorio innocent, 
to face more indictments 

Briscoe names 
new regents 

By GODFREY ANDERSON 
Associated Press Writer 

Gov. Dolph Briscoe named three new 
members to the Tech Board of Regents 
Thursday, subject to Senate con-
firmation. 

The three are J. Fred Bucy Jr. of 
Dallas, A. J. Kemp of Fort Worth and Dr. 
Judson F. Williams of El Paso, a current 
board member. 

Bucy is executive vice president of 
Texas Instruments Inc. He is a native of 
Tahoka. 

Kemp is executive vice president of the 
Texas Livestock Marketing Association 
and the National Finance Credit Corp. 

Williams is present of Uprends, an 
organization he formed which deals in 
oil, gas, farming and ranching in-
vestments. 

Bucy will replace Field Scovell of 

DALLAS, Tex. (AP) — A federal jury, 
which had heard 131/2  days of arguments 
and testimony in the case, Thursday 
found former Texas Atty. Gen. Waggoner 
Carr and former State Insurance 
Commissioner John Osorio innocent of 
all 12 counts of mail and wire fraud. 

The case grew out of the Sharpstown 
bank and stock scandals which erupted in 
1971. 

Immediately after the four-man, eight-
woman jury returned its verdict, Carr's 
wife embraced him and the three 
government lawyers arose as one man 
made a quick exit from the courtroom of 
U.S. District Court Judge William M. 
Taylor Jr. 

Osorio rushed to a telephone to call his 
daughter, Pat Nickles. 

There was general jubilation in the 
corridors with spectators rushing up to 
congratulate the defendants and the 
defense lawyers. They then crowded into 
elevators and met news and television 
camers in the lower lobby and corridors. 

Carr said he hoped that the people of 
Texas remembered that "I was not just 
innocent today, but have been innocent 
all the time." 

Waggoner Carr 

Greek survey released 

The dapper former attorney general 
paid his respects to what he called "a 
very fair federal judge and jury for a fair 
trial in which I was given every op-
portunity to present my defense." 

Reminded that he had once said "life 
has been hell' since the charges were 
filed, Carr admitted that some people 
might still see him under a cloud. 

Both Carr and Osorio still face nine 
indictments along with several other 
persons in cases growing out of the stock 
fraud scandals. They are in connection 
with alleged violations of the Securities 
and Exchange Commission's regulations 
and for allegedly making false 
statements or reports. 

No trial date has been set on the 
remaining indictments.  

Dallas. Kemp will replace Waggoner 
Carr of Austin. 

The three will serve six-year terms 
expiring Jan. 31, 1979. 

Both Kemp and Bucy are graduates of 
Tech. Kemp received his degree in 
journalism in 1942 while Bucy graduated 
in 1951 with a degree in physics. 

Bucy, 44, began working for Texas 
Instruments after receiving his master's 
degree in physics from the University of 
Texas in 1953. 

Kemp, 52, took his present job in Fort 
Worth in 1965. He farmed and ranched in 
Dimmitt from 1945 to 1965. 

He has served on the board of the Tech 
Ex-Students Association. 

Williams, 60, is being appointed to a 
second term as a Tech regent. 

He holds degrees in journalism from 
Hardin-Simmons University and the 
University of Missouri plus a doctorate in 
administration from the University of 
Texas. 

He was dean of the University of Texas 
at El Paso in 1956, when he became 
executive president of the White House 
Department Stores. 

He served as mayor of El Paso from 
1963 to 1969 during which time he was 
also president of the Texas Municipal 
League. 

Williams, Carr and Scovell were ap-
pointed to the board by former Gov. 
Preston Smith. 

Holdover regents are R. Trent Camp-
bell of Houston, Clint Formby of 
Hereford, Dr. John J. Hinchey of San 
Antonio, Frank Junell of San Angelo, 
Charles G. Scruggs of Dallas and 
Chairman Bill E. Collins of Lubbock. 

The new appointments will become 
effective upon confirmation by the 
Senate. 

Greer, expressed his attitude with "I 
have nothing against people who enjoy 
that type of thing." 

The poll seemed to indicate that more 
Greeks than non-Greeks seem to feel that 
the image of Greeks on campus has 
changed in recent years. "There has 
been a swing toward individuality. This 
is good, but Heel that it has gotten out of 
hand, and it hampers keeping the group 
together," was the opinion of Vicki 
Vannoy, a sorority member. 

Those feeling that the Greeks have 
changed thought generally that the 
changes have been for the best. "The 
fraternities have progressed. They now 
take in different types of people," said 
Jimmy Wright. One non-Greek com-
mented, "I'm less prone now to 
stereotype all fraternity people as frat 
rats," said Bob Anderson. 

Several times Carr told the jury: "I 
made a bad investment, but I'm not a 
criminal." 

Once he hinted there was some sinister 
circumstance in the fact that two lawyers 
from Washington had been brought to 
Texas to aid in his prosecution. 

"There's something behind this in-
dictment other than the words in it," he 
said without elaborating. 

Carr produced a brochure glorifying 
Frank Sharp and the Sharpstown State 
Bank, showed Sharp's picture to the jury 
and read them lengthy extracts. 

"If I was fooled, a lot of people were 
fooled with me," he said. 

Sighing deeply, Carr said: "My world 
has caved in, I wish I had never signed 
that agreement." 

Remarking that he faced a half million 
dollar lawsuit from NBL, he told the 
jury: "I plead with you to let me face 
Sharp on even terms in that other 
courtroom." 

U.S. Attorney Frank McCown rose to 
point out that it will be the trustee of 
NBI„ not Sharp, that Carr will have to 
face. 

"You today are the most important 
people in the world to me," Carr told the 
jury in conclusion. 

"You decide my life. My prayer is, I 
hope you'll have the wisdom to see the 
truth and the courage to speak it. My life 
will literally stand still from this moment 
until you come back and say, 'Not 
Guilty."' 

"Obviously Carr is a very ac-
complished public speaker," commented 
the prosecutor, who told the jury not to be 
influenced by the "emotional impact" of 
Carr's words. 

"A con man's biggest asset, besides his 
reputation if he is lucky enough to have 
one, is his ability to talk and his ability to 
sway people," McCown said. 

"This is exactly what you heard this 
morning, when you heard Waggoner 
Carr's very impassioned plea to you." 

McCown claimed it is "an old con 
game" to take a jury's mind away from 
the focal point of the evidence. 

Osorio said he was "very pleased" and 
profusely thanked "those friends who 
stayed by me." 

"We told it like it was," Osorio said. 
The case went to the jury halfway 

through the 14th day of the trial. 
Judge Taylor stressed that the jurors 

should not "speculate on the disposition 
of the case against Joe Novotny." 

Novotny, described as a brilliant young 
banker and the righthand man of 
Houston multi-millionaire financier 
Frank W. Sharp, was named alongside 
Carr and Osorio in the indictment. But he 
pleaded guilty to one count when the trial 
opened and will be dealt with separately. 

The jury heard an hour-long im-
passioned plea from Carr in his own 
defense. 

Carr accused the government lawyers 
of "Monday morning quarterbacking" in 
their investigation of the transactions of 
three years ago. 

He said they "glued together" totally 
legal acts done in good faith with their 
own statements which were unsupported 
by witnesses, and "a fantastic amount of 
imagination." 

"They made it all into a ball of wax to 
call me a criminal," said the man who 
was the state's top law officer from 1963 
to 1967. 

At one point, Carr stepped towards the 
jury and looked at them sharply. Then, 
his voice quavering slightly with 
emotion, he said: 

"I hope for your benefit that you never 
have a Joe Novotny walk into your life." 

Carr described Novotny as "the man 
who welched" on an agreement under 
which, he claimed, Sharpstown Realty 
Co. was to take over liability for the 
$550,000 loan which Carr and Osorio 
floated together and never paid. 

The government claimed they never 
intended to pay the loan which finally had 
to be settled by National Bankers Life 
Insurance Co. (NBL) under a com-
mitment letter it had given. Osorio was 
president of NBL when that letter was 
written 

Legal rights bill 
stalled by rules 

DRIVE FRIENDLY 

FBI Director Gray says 
aide lied about Watergate 

By TOM SEPPY 
Associated Press Writer 

I,ongley said Gammage has 19 of the 
necessary 21 votes to suspend the rules. 

She said the bill's supporters hope to 
suspend the rules on a day when two of 
the bill's opponents are off the Senate 
floor. 

Most senators believe a vote to suspend 
the rules for this measure would be 
considered a vote for it, Longley said. 
Therefore, the opposing senators will not 
vote for the suspension for fear of con-
stituent reaction, she said. 

Longley said she could not predict 
when Gammage's bill will be on the 
Senate floor. Hunt's office opened and the contents, 

including a gun and some electronic 
equipment, be placed in his custody. 

On June 27, Dean turned the contents of 
Hunt's safe over to the FBI. 

Hunt and six others face sentencing 
Friday for the bugging and burglary of 
Democratic national headquarters. 

Byrd told the newsmen that Gray's 
admission is "a starting one, especially 
in view of the fact that he continued to 
provide Dean with raw facts from the 
FBI's files." 

Byrd said it is "an amazing, incredible 
thing" that Gray would continue to 
provide FBI information to Dean, whom 
the West Virginia Democrat described as 
having an "element of ubiquity" in the 
Watergate investigation. 

She said the bill would be considered 
just as soon as the rules are suspended or 
Jones takes some action on his bill. 

"A notice of intent must be filed 24 
hours in advance of the day the bill is to 
be considered. We are filing this notice 
daily," Longley said. 

Gammage's bill would give all 18-year-
olds full legal rights. 

By LINDA GARRET 
Special Reporter 

The 18-year-old legal rights bill, 
sponsored by Sen. Bob Gammage of 
Houston, is stalled in the Texas Senate. 

Although the bill's sponsor has the 
necessary 16 votes to pass the measure, 
he does not have the necessary two thirds 
or 21 votes to suspend the rules to bring 
the bill out of calender order, said 
Gammage's aide Susan Longley. 

Longley said Gammage's bill is up for 
the third and final reading behind Sen. 
Grant Jones' bill concerning creation of 
junior college districts. 

Without suspension of the rules, the 
Senate cannot vote on the 18-year-old 
rights bill until action is taken on Jones' 
bill. 

Because Jones is not ready to vote yet, 
the 18-year-old rights bill is buried. 

Jones is opposed to Gammage's bill. 
Jones was unavailable for comment. 
Only suspension of the rules could 

bring it out of order. 

EDITOR'S NOTE: This is the last article of a three-
part series about the Tech Greek system. 

The changing image of Greeks at Tech 
was the subject of a random poll of 200 
Tech students by journalism lab 
students. Twenty-five per cent of those 
polled were Greek, a percentage slightly 
too high to fairly represent the number of 
Greeks on campus. 

Reasons for joining a sorority-
fraternity varied from "I wanted to 
broaden my awareness and form new 
friendships," said Paula Heflin, to "I got 
caught up in the band wagon, I guess," 
according to Claire Meyers. Many of the 
Greeks polled felt that joining a social 
club offered the benefits of friendships, 
social gatherings and a relief from 
lineliness. "I enjoy the friendship and the 
sisterhood. The status doesn't mean 
anything to me," as Diane Burton said, 
seemed to be a prevailing attitude. 

Most of the non-Greeks said that they 
"just weren't interested" in being in a 
sorority-fraternity, with the reasons 
ranging from "I don't have to bt_j my 
friends," said Danny Lyke, to "It gives 
you group identity rather than letting you 
be an individual," according to Doris 
Kuehler. Some gave monetary reasons, 
while others felt that the organizations 
promote "snobbishness." "I don't like to 
bake cookies, go to meetings or walk 
straight lines," said Debi Elkins. 

"Just like everything else, there are 
some good aspects, some bad," said 
Dennis Huff, as he summed up the varied 
images of the Greek organizations. 
"They are athletes, good-looking and 
philosophers," was Linda French's at-
titude toward fraternity men, while a 
non-fraternity man, Sammy Frits, 
commented that "They all look alike—
moustaches, windbreakers and two-tone 
shoes." 

Reactions to Greeks varied from 
"Greeks come to school to have fun, not 
to learn," said Roger Burman, to "They 
seem well organized and close to one 
another." One non-Greek, Richard 

WASHINGTON (AP) — Acting FBI 
Director L. Patrick Gray III conceded 
Thursday that White House counsel John 
W. Dean III probably lied to one of his 
agents during the Watergate in-
vestigation. 

The disclosure came when Sen. Robert 
Byrd, D-W.Va., asked Gray if Dean had 
lied to an FBI agent last June in saying 
he would have to check to see if 
Watergate defendant E. Howard Hunt 
had an office in the White House, when in 
fact, he knew he had one. 

"After looking back and making a 
minute examination of the record, I 
would have to conclude that that's 
probably correct," said Gray, who is 
seeking confirmation as permanent FBI 
director. 

Dean told the FBI agent during an 
interview with White House aide Charles 
W. Colson he would try to determine if 
Hunt had an office at the White House. 

That occurred only three days after he 
issued instructions to have a safe in 

Belles spell 
for House 

Regents hear circle report 

Gray has maintained that he supplied 
the FBI data to Dean in his role as 
counsel to the President while Dean was 
conducting a separate Watergate in-
vestigation to determine if any White 
House aides were involved. 

After questioning Gray for two hours, 
Byrd repeated earlier statements that he 

Bill Collins, chairman of the Tech 
Board of Regents, said he would per-
sonally ask for Tech Legal Counsel 
Carlton Dodson's report on Memorial 
Circle in today's regent meeting. 

The regents will meet in regular 
session at 3:30 p.m. in the Board Room of 
the Administration Building. Committee 
meetings begin at 8:30 a.m. 

AUSTIN (AP) — Six pretty Apache 
Belles from Tyler Junior College showed 
their backsides to the House Thursday, 
holding cards that spelled out R-E-F-0-
R-M across their posteriors. 

The stunt convulsed the represen-
tatives, who whooped and whistled and 
clapped their hands. 

Williamson has been a consistent 
opponent of Speaker Price Daniel Jr.'s 
"reform" program. 

In the middle of a ceremony honoring 
the Belles, Williamson directed the 
House's attention to the balcony, where 
six Belles rose from seats, did an about-
face and placed the cards across their 
derrieres. 

Tuesday, Dodson said, "I do not have a 
report today, but that ( the board 
meeting) is another day. It's not on the 

would not vote for him to be FBI director. 
"I think that the image of the FBI has 

suffered, in view of all the developments 
which occurred during his acting 
directorship, and I think that the 
professionalism, morale and efficiency 
of the FBI have likewise suffered, as has 
public confidence in the FBI," Byrd said. 

"There is too much evidence of 
political activity on the part of the acting 
director; there is too much evidence of 
subservience to the White House; there 
are too many unanswered questions with 
respect to the possible misuse of FBI files 
in connection with the Watergate in-
vestigation," he added. 

Byrd's statement came during Gray's 
ninth day as a witness before the Senate 
Judiciary Committee which began 
hearings on his confirmation Feb. 28. 

Byrd told Gray he found it "especially 
intriguing" that Gray would submit FBI 
files to Dean as late as Oct. 12 when 
President Nixon told a news conference 
Aug. 29 that he could say, on the basis of a 
complete investigation by Dean, that no 
one then on the White House staff was 
involved in the Watergate bugging. 

agenda rignt now. But I will report if they 
(regents) ask me." 

December 3, the board instructed 
Dodson to continue to "look for a way 
out" of the Memorial Circle controversy. 
At that meeting, the board upheld an 
administrative decision to ban all student 
activities from the circle. 

In other action, the board will consider 
student health and life insurance 
programs, schematics for the Home 
Economics Building addition and ar-
chitects for other campus construction. 



TECH SUNDAY NIGHT SPECIAL 
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Price includes Salad, Baked Potato, Red Beans, Texas 
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	Those who chose Canada and Sweden 	 
should not expect to be a part of America 

preserve, something that cannot be passed on to 
future generations if we are to blindly deny the 
Judas role those deserters and draft dodgers 
played. 

Do not ask us to forget. Ask us to remember. 
Ask the nation to remember this war. Ask the 
people to remember their part in the war and 
where they stood. 

bury the insidious causes and brutal effects of 
that war would be a more griefious error than 
the war itself. 

The consequences of our mistakes, whether 
they are the mistakes of the nation or its citizens, 
cannot be dissolved by the flowers on the graves 
or by an overly-sentimental and unreasoning 
amnesty. 

Cass Ray's plea for their amnesty is over-
shadowed by the bravery and loyalty of the men 
who chose to meet their responsibilities by 
fignting in the war or by going to prison for their 
refusal to fight. You seem to think that the 
deserters and draft dodgers took the only con-
ceivable alternative in the face of an "immoral 

By JEFF LUCKY 
Special Reporter 

Indeed, the Vietnam war has strained the 
moral fabric of America dangerously close to the 
point of an irrevocable tear. But to ,allow am-
nesty to the deserters and those who fled their 
responsibilities to the nation would be, un-
doubtedly, the final jerk in a protracted moral, 
intellectual and political tug of war that would 
finally rend that fabric into two irreconcilable 
fragments. 

Asking this nation to forget the tragic 
irresponsibility of those expatriates during one 
of America's most tragic times is tantamount to 
asking the country to forget the war itself. To 

war". That assumption is obviously a sen-
timental failing on the part of many in this 
nation. 

The ignoble expatriates, if they are or were 
more than peace and prosperity citizens, could 
have faced the consequences of their nation's 
error by remaining and dissenting in the manner 
of so many other conscientious individuals. 

If this nation were of the ilk that subjugates 
its own conscience by the ruthless political 
suppression of dissent, then amnesty would be no 
issue. There would be no moral fiber, no wor-
thwhile foundation to preserve and protect. 

But despite the turmoil and dissension, or 
perhaps because of it, there is something here to 

And above all, ask us to remember that we 
survived as a nation through the horrors of 
erroneous committment and tumultuous dissent 
and that those few in Canada and Sweden chose 
not to endure the struggle with us. Therefore, 
they chose not to be of us, or of our nation. 

Guest opinion 

Letter writer will quit if Tech 'comes out of coma' 
Lately, there have been three 

letters published in this paper 
concerning two letters of 
criticism that I wrote. In those 
three 	letters, 	personal 
criticisms and remarks con-
cerning my feminism were 
made. The latter is of particular 
interest to me since I am a 
male. The address given at the 
bottom of my letters is Sneed 
Hall; someone around here ( and 
it's not me) needs to get his head 
out. The suggestion has been 

A rumor has circulated these 
parts of the campus that 
Bledsoe Hall will become a coed 
dorm next year. Such an act by 
the administration as instituting 
a coed dorm in Lubbock would 
then be proof to me that this 
place is beginning to come out of 
the coma it's been in lately. 
Then, maybe I wouldn't feel the 
need to keep writing these 
damned letters to the UD. 

Pat Moran 
250 Sneed 

in those three letters were 
directed toward my person; it's 
not good debate technique. 

But, during all of this crap 
something interesting has 
emerged. The administration 
granted self-determined hours 
to freshman women; a great 
step forward, indeed! Maybe in 
the future; though, the ad-
ministration will make such 
liberal decisions without being 
prodded in the side by the threat 
of legal action. 

made that I try sugar instead of 
vinegar in my criticisms. I 
consider praising the city-
campus establishment in order 
to gain an open ear for my 
criticisms to be a very tactful 
endeavor; it's also hypocritical 
and deceitful. I wouldn't want to 
be labeled by either of those 
tags. The suggestion that 
blatant criticism closes the 
minds of the higher-ups was a 
totally wrong one; plans for a 
meeting between myself and 

Mr. Bailey of Residence Halls 
and Food Service are already in 
the making. 

It has even been inferred that 
my letters are the result of 
"malice, fear, or hate". How 
interesting this all is; I've now 
been psychologically analyzed 
through two letters in the UD. 
Amazing what they teach 
graduate students of speech 
communication to do these 
days, isn't it? I am at a loss to 
explain why all of the criticisms 

Independents gripe 
about intramurals 

We would like to express our 
complaints toward the in-
trapUral ,facilities at Tech. 
Fist 	of 'all:there simply aren't 
enough facilities for the large 
number of students. Secondly, 
the facilities that we do have are 
not used to benefit all of the 
students. 

The intramural facilities 
consist of one aging barn and 
two other indoor courts. The 
quality of Tech's facilities is of 
the same caliber as that of 
the First Baptist Church on 
Broadway. Other Southwest 
Conference schools have two to 
three times as many courts as 

Tech. 
The facilities at Tech are used 

primarily by fraternities and 
other clubs. Little or no time is 
set aside for the average 
student, yet the average student 
pays the same amount of money 
from tuition that the fraternities 
do. It is true that the average 
students do get to use the gym 
but this is usually after 10 p.m. 
when the fraternities and other 
clubs are done. Must the in-
dependents be secondary in a 
school this large? 

Mark Morlock, Steve Mod 
Bob Schmitz, Jay Clement 

Greg Napier, Mark Phillips 
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KTXT - FM 
TEXAS TECH VARSITY BASEBALL 

TEXAS TECH vs. SMU 
From the Tech Diamond 
Friday Afternoon 3 p.m. 

Saturday Afternoon 1 p.m. 
Live on THE BIG 92 

A Variety of Music for a Varied Student Body vet06 Paris . ,siziet3  *004 ece`N63%%  

'MICE!' 

1105 University 

U 
a 

GLOBAL TRAVEL 
HAS FOR YOU: 
1. The Spirit 
2. The Swinger 
3. The B&B 

4. The Look & See 
5. Pineapple Split 

'S Details on April 3. 

AirFrancett 
makes it easy to get there. 

Airalninat 



Parents or friends visiting for 
the weekend? Make reser-
vations with no cash in ad-
vance when you present your 
Tech I D (Except on football 
weekends * 
LUBBOCK INN 

3901 19TH STREET 	 AC 806 / 792.5181 WANT 
ADS 

742- 

4274 
MACKENZIE 

AMUSEMENT 
PARK 

"In The Heart of Prairie Dog 
Country" 

Open Pretty 
Week-Ends 
Sat. 2 p.m. 
Sun. 1 p.m. 

Opening Special 
This Ad Good for One Free 
Ride. 

All Rides 15 cents. 
Sat. 2-6 p.m. 

Private Picnic Area Available 

for reservations 
Special Group Rates 

763-2719 
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Psychologist's study shows 

Learning process lasts through middle age 
of the Santa Clara counseling 
center, said the mean in-
telligence quotient of 48 persons 
went up about 20 points between 
the first time they were tested, 
at preschool ages, and tests four 
years ago. 

"A lot of people feel as they 
grow older that they're going 

SANTA CLARA, Calif. ( AP) 
— A University of Santa Clara 
psychologist says a study 
started 42 years ago indicates 
that the learning process which 
contributes to a person's in-
telligence quotient continues at 
least through middle age. 

Dr. John Kangas, 29, director 

downhill. This study raises the 
hope that you can teach an old 
dog new tricks," Kangas said in 
an interview Wednesday. 

He said the 48 persons in the 
study were from a group of 212 
tested as preschoolers in the San 
Francisco Bay area in 1931. 
Given the Stanford-Binet IQ 

Travelers given road warnings 
STOPOVER at Washington, D.C. 
will be highlight of trip. Pictured 
with area Congressman George 
Mahon is last year's New York 
Spring Tour group. 

By JOANNA VERNETTI 
Staff Writer 

Spring tour open to Techsans 
The Tech-organized New 

York Spring Tour is a 14-day 
tour of the eastern United States 
available to any interested Tech 
student. 

Falls and planned excursions 
during a four-day stay in New 
York City, where members of 
the four will visit television 
game shows, China Town, Fifth 
Avenue, Greenwich Village, 
Radio City Music Hall and other 
landmarks. 

to discriminate against older 
people on the basis that they are 
not able to learn new things. 

"Maybe employers should 
take a second look and change 
their attitude toward hiring 
older people." 

Kangas said his testing in-
dicated that people in a 
stimulating environment are 
likely to increase their in-
telligence more rapidly than 
others. 

For example, women with a 
higher preadult IQ rating 
gained less in later years, he 
said. He attributed this to the 
possibility that these women 
found being a housewife less 
stimulating than women with 
lower preadult testing scores. 

Kangas said the opporite was 
observed among men. Those 
with higher preadult IQs gained 
more in later years, most likely 
because they entered more 
stimulating occupations than 
men with lower preadult scores, 
he said. 

test, the group had a mean IQ of 
110.7. 

Dr. Katherine Bradway, a San 
Francisco psychologist, looked 
up as many of the original group 
as possible and tested them in 
1941 and again in 1956. The 
scores were 113.3 and 124.1, 
respectively. 

Kangas said he located the 
group again and tested them in 
1968 and 1969. At the time of the 
latter test, the mean IQ had 
risen to 130.1, he said. 

Kangas, whose findings were 
published in the Journal of 
Developmental Psychology, 
said the researchers who 
developed the Stanford-Binet 
test believed IQ did not increase 
after a person turned 16 or 18. In 
the 1940s, he said, the Weschler 
Adult Intelligence scale 
assumed IQ rose until a person 
turned 25, leveled and then 
declined after the age of 35. 

-My study provides new hope 
for older people," Kangas said. 
"I think a lot of businesses tend 

loading of clothes and other 
items. Marshall said, "The 
driver's vision should not be 
obscured." No loose articles 
should be in the car which might 
cause an injury if a sudden stop 
were necessary. 

If one experiences car trouble 
during a trip, it is vital that he 
steer the car as far off the high-
way as possible. Lt. Pete 
Hubbard of the Lubbock police 
department said, "Get off the 
road safely." He added, "Be 
where you can be seen and not 
be hit by another car." 

To receive help, Marshall 

With most Tech students 
leaving for spring break today, 
local police officials are em-
phasizing the importance of car 
travel precautions. 

Tires, steering, brakes, and 
lighting systems should be 
checked before beginning the 
trip, according to Lt. Brent 
Marshall from the Safety 
Education Service of the Texas 
Department of Public Safety. 

Another special consideration 
for students is the proper 

The total fee of $197 ( including 
a $70 deposit) covers all ac-
commodation and travel needs. 

Tour plans include sight-
seeing with visits to art in-
stitutes in St. Louis and 
Chicago, a dinner trip into 
Canada after touring Niagra 

Applications available 
for UD , annual staffs 500 Bike Race, rodeo 

queen contests open 

The tour departs at 1 p.m. 
Tuesday, May 8 from the east 
parking lot of the Art Building 
and returns Monday, May 21 at 8 
a.m. to the Lubbock Bus Ter-
minal. The $70 deposit is due 
before April 15 and interested 
students should make reser-
vations as soon as possible by 
contacting Jerry Robinson, tour 
organizer. Meetings for the trip 
will be conducted in weeks to 
come, for which times and dates 
will appear in Raider Roundup. 

The trip will feature stops in 
Philadelphia, Washington, D.C., 
and Nashville, Tenn., where 
historical points of interest will 
be emphasized. Two beauty queen com-

petitions are on tap for April. 
Entries now are being accepted 
in the Queens Race, which is 
part of the Little 500 Bike Race 
festivities, and the NIRA rodeo 
queen competition. 

with their name, hometown, 
classification and major on the 
back. Raider Roundup 

Anyone sponsoring a team in 
the Little 500 is eligible to enter 
a student in the Queens Race. 
The winner will be selected by 
penny votes in the University 
Center April 3-6. 

editor. 
University Daily editor and 

La Ventana co-editors are 
selected by the Student 
Publications Committee. Once 
selected these editors will pick 
their own staffs. 

Applications may be picked 
up between 8 a.m. and noon and 
1 p.m. and 5 p.m. each day 
except Saturday and Sunday 
and are due to be returned no 
later than 5 p.m., Friday, March 
23. 

Any student interested in 
applying for a position on next 
year's University Daily or La 
Ventana should pick up ap-
plications in room 102 of the 
Journalism Building beginning 
Wednesday. 

Positions include University 
Daily editor, staff and 
photographer positions, 
University Daily advertising 
sales positions, La Ventana co-
editor, staff and photographer 
positions and La Ventana art 

said, "Tie a white handkerchief 
on the radio antenna or car door 
handle or raise the hood of the 
car." These are the two 
nationally recognized symbols 
of distress. University Police 
Chief Bill Daniels said, "These 
are signs to the passing motorist 
that you are in trouble." 

The police officials suggested 
that single travelers, especially 
women, lock all the doors and 
remain in the car after 
displaying the distress signals. 
Drivers were warned not to 
begin walking, but wait until a 
passing motorist stopped. 

When a motorist stops, the 
best procedure for the traveler 
to follow is to ask the stranger to 
go into the nearest town and 
have a wrecker sent out. Hit-
ching a ride with him was 
discouraged. Officials en-
couraged the driver to keep the 
doors locked and only crack a 
window while talking to the 
motorist. Daniels also warned, 
"Don't let a stranger have your 
keys or get into the car with 
you." 

Professional drivers often 
stop to help stranded motirists. 
Marshall said, "It is an un-
written law of courtesy that 
truck drivers stop." Some 
companies require their drivers 
to give assistance. 

Frequent rest breaks, 
moderate speed, and defensive 
driving are other precautions 
for holiday travelers. 

Sunday is the deadline for 
picking up entry blanks for the 
NIRA rodeo queen competition. 
Entry blanks may be obtained 
by contacting Carol Shugart at 
795-6257 or Buzz Cooper at 792-
0271. 

A question and answer session 
for contestants will be con-
ducted April 9. The winner will 
be announced April 11 and the 
rodeo will run April 19-21. 

April 2 is the deadline for 
entries. Contestants must be 
full-time students and should 
turn in to 129 Knapp Hall, a 
black and white wallet photo "BEST CATFISH YOU EVER EAT . 

TAHOKA HIWAY AT 82ND STREET" 
PAPPY'S CATFISH 

Orders To Go 11 a.m. - 9 p.m. 	744-9000 

TODAY 
A multi-disciplinary seminar 

on "Nutrition of the Older 
People" will be conducted at 
1:30 p.m. Friday in conference 
room 110 of the College of 
Engineering. Speakers will be 
Dr. Wilma D. Brewer, head of 
the department of foorl and 
nutrition at Iowa State 
University, and Dr. Walter J. 
Cartwright, chairman of the 
department of sociology at 
Tech. 

Applications for membership 
on the Free University Com-
mittee for '73-'74 may be picked 
up today through April 13, at the 
University Center program 
office. Interviews will be con-
ducted April 11-13. 

The Lubbock Theater Center 
will present Dracula at 8:15 
p.m. Friday in the Lubbock 
Theater Center Playhouse, 2508 
Ave. P. 

Sunday is the deadline for 
picking up entry blanks for the 
NIRA rodeo queen competition. 
Entry blanks may be obtained 
by contacting Carol Shugart at 
795-6257 or Buzz Cooper at 792-
0271. A question and answer 
session for contestants will be 
April 9. The contest is scheduled 
for April 11 and the rodeo will 
run April 19-21. 

THIS MONTH 
The Department of An-

thropology is offering courses in 
Patzcuro, Michoacan, Mexico, 
during the second summer 
term. Interested students 
should call Professor Richard 
Salzer at 742-2227 or the 
department of anthropology 
office at 742-6293. 

Any women's organization 
interested in coverage in Tech 
Tips should contact Jane Terry 
in room 233 of West Hall im-
mediately. 

The Missouri Club sponsors 
math labs to help freshman and 
sophomore math students 3:30 
p.m. to 5:30 p.m. Monday and 
Wednesday and 3 p.m. to 5 p.m. 
Tuesday and Thursday in room 
106 of the Foreign Language and 
Math Building. 

************************************ 

All 	home 	economics, 
sociology, and pre-nursing 
majors who are interested in 
working at Lubbock State 
School 	to 	fulfill 	class 
requirements or credit hours 
should contact Betsy Mason, 
742-5834 in room 312 Hulen. 

HEAR YE, HEAR YE; 
Hear ye the fine and funky 
sounds that have been captured 
and recorded on 

The Government Department 
is 	offering 	credit 	by 
examination in Government 231 
and 232. Students may register 
for the exams before April 2 in 
room 203 of the Social Science 
Building. The exam will be April 
7 in room 57 of the Science 
Building. 

RUIDOSO 
SKI SPECIAL 

February and March 
51000 per person per day includes 

Skis. Boots, Poles, Lodging.  
Reservations Required 
Skis by Tufly's Chalet 

Lodging By 
Idle Hour Lodge 

Story Book Cabins 
Fireplaces, Kitchens, Cable TV 

Groups from 4 to 100 
Mlnlmum.Two Days 

257-2711 
257-2115 

Those entering should turn in 
photos and entries to 129 Knapp 
Hall. 

TUESDAY April 3 
A faculty recital featuring 

Jane Ann Wilson, pianist, will be 
presented at 8:15 p.m. in room 1 
of the Music Building. 

There will be a quartet at 7 
p.m. Tuesday in Seaman Hall. 

Phi Upsilon Omicron will 
meet at 7 p.m. Tuesday in the 
Home Economics Building. 
Officers will be elected. 

WEDNESDAY, April 4 
The Music Department will 

present a student recital at 4:30 
p.m. in room 1 of the Music 
Building. 

Wayne Barlow will lecture on 
"Acoustics" at 7 p.m. Wed-
nesday in room 1 of the Music 
Building. 

THURSDAY, April 5 
A junior recital featuring 

Danny Barnett, baritone, will be 
presented at 8:15 p.m. Thursday 
in room 1 of the Music Building. 

High school seniors are in-
vited to attend a recruiting 
orientation session at 7 p.m. 
Thursday in the Mesa Room of 
the University Center. For 
information, call 742-5976. 

The Student Entertainment 
Committee will sponsor a 
Western Dance at 8 p.m. 
Thursday in the University 
Center ballroom. Wells Fargo 
will play and admission is free. 

SATURDAY, APRIL 7 
Cheerleaders tryouts are 

scheduled for 9:30 a.m. 
Saturday in the Men's In-
tramural Gym. Persons in-
terested in trying out for varsity 
cheerleader positions should 
apply in room 102 of the Jour-
nalism Building from 8 a.m. to 
noon and 1 to 5 p.m. any week-
day until April 6. 

Registration for the four-
teenth Premedical Day will 
begin at 9 a.m. Saturday in the 
lobby of the Chemistry Building. 
Discussions on topics of interest 
to premed students will be given 
by representatives from various 
medical schools. A special 
session for high school students 
interested in entering premed 
will be conducted in the af-
ternoon. Tours of the campus 
will be made. 

SUNDAY, APRIL 8 
The International Affairs 

Council will present a Pakistani 
Evening at 7:30 p.m. Sunday in 
the ballroom of the University 
Center. Pakistani folk dances, 
songs, exhibitions, snacks and a 
documentary movie will be 
featured. Admission is free. 

SATURDAY 
The University Chess Club 

will meet at 10 a.m. Saturday in 
the University Center. 

The Lubbock Theater Center 
will present Dracula at 8:15 
p.m. Saturday in the Lubbock 
Theater Center Playhouse, 2508 
Ave. P. 

SUNDAY, April 1 
The Lubbock Theater Center 

will present Dracula at 8:15 
p.m. Sunday in the Lubbock 
Theater Center Playhouse, 2508 
Ave. P. 

Members are invited to a 
Community Concert with 
Mildred Miller at 3 p.m. Sunday 
at Monterey Senior High School. 

MONDAY, April 2 
There will be an ,April Fool's 

recital at 4:30 p.m. Monday in 
room 1 of the Music Building. 

There will be a faculty quartet 
concert with John Gillas, tenor; 
Mary Gillas, soprano; and guest 
artists Thomas Carey, baritone; 
and Carol Brice Carey, alto. 

The Tech Outing Club will 
meet at 8 p.m. Monday in room 
209 of the University Center. 
Plans will be made for a trip to 
Truches Peak. Members will 
elect officers April 9. 

Women's 	Service 
Organization will meet at 7 p.m. 
Monday in room 357 of the 
Business Administration 
Building. 

Entries for girls interested in 
entering the Queens Race, 
which is part of the Little 500 
Bike Race festivities, will be 
extended until April 2. 

Anyone sponsoring a team in 
the Little 500 is eligible to enter 
a girl in the Queens Race. The 
winner will be selected by a 
penny vote conducted in the UC 
April 3-6. 

Entries must be full-time 
students, and each should turn 
in a black and white wallet 
photo with her name, 
hometown, classification and 
major on the back. 

25c Beer 
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.e.. 	 2 p.m.-8p.m. ...:. 
Charcoal Hamburgers & Bar-B-Que Sandwiches 

.i 	 FREEMAN'S CLUB 	 ,_•.,. 
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Everyday Price New $3.69 
******************************** 

ISLAND RECORDS 
This Week These Island Records 

$2.99 
Traffic 	"Shoot Out," "Low Spark" 
FREE "Heartbreaker" 
John Marlyn is "Solid Air" 
Mike Harrison 	"Smokestack Lightning" 

(Sale lasts from March 23 - March 29) 
BUDGET TAPES and RECORDS 

L2:115 A Main St. 	763-3139 

UNDERWOOD'S 

BAR•B•Q DINNER BAR•13•11 
AT ITS 

BEST! 
• BEEF • HAM • SAUSAGE 

• CHICKEN OR • RIBS 

Complete with choice 

of 7 Vegetables, 

Rolls, Relishes, 

Cherry Cobbler, 

Coffee, Tea or 

Soft Drink LET US CATER 
YOUR NEXT PARTY 

(NO CHARGE FOR SECONDS 
ON THE TRIMMINGS) 

TJnderwood's BAR-B-Q CAFETERIA / 711 34TH ST / 747-2775 

• 



The 
combination of 

suded 'n' cork make 
this shoe a must 
for your casual 

wardrobe. 

Black patent 
on black. 

We've illustrated only 
two of the 5 handsome 
styles available 
at this low price. 
Come see them all! 

MEN GET IN STYLE FOR LESS AT THE 

shoeRoorp 
4845 50th 	 792-4219 

9: 00-9:00 - Mon. Thru Sat. 

Columbia Records presents "The 
First Songs." Including "Wedding 
Bell Blues," "Stoney End," "He's 
a Runner," "And When I Die," 

"Flim Flam Man," "Buy and 
Sell," "l Never Meant to Hurt 
You," "Blowing Away," "Good 
by Joe," "Billy's Blues," "Lazy 
Susan," and "California Shoe-
shine Boys." 

"The First Songs." a re-issue 
of her first album. While other 
young girls poured their hearts 
into diaries, Laura Nyro 
changed the course of pop music. 

On Columbia Records gp, 

Also available on tape 
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Sink your teeth into LTC's campy 'Dracula' 
By CASS RAY 

Managing Editor 
Lubbock Theatre Centre's 

two-hour version of the classic 
"Dracula" is an entertaining bit 
of camp. 

Poorly acted, cheaply set and 
crudely directed. 

But entertaining. 
Although voice projection 

isn't always adequate, Karla 
Eoff's comfortable portrayal of 
the Count's bride is a reassuring 

white mice, bats, wolves, dogs, 
flies and spiders. 

one among the generally un-
perceptive performances of her 
fellow cast members. 

Marvin Platten's com-
mendable characterization of 
her father is more than equalled 
by overly affected portrayals by 
Donna Coomer and John Rogers 
and adequate performances by 
Tom Francis and Steve Wyatt. 

Buddy Lerch's portrayal of 
the bride's supposedly more 
human fiance is the worst of the 

And it's sometimes funny in 
places where it's not supposed 
to be funny. 

And it's a guaranteed 
nightmare for every youngster 
who screams at all the right 
times. 

It's a play the younger set can 
really sink its teeth into. 

Examination schedule Now you didn't REALLY 
think you were gonna get 
through this review without at 
least one intended pun, did you? 

TIME OF EXAMINATION 

Monday, April 30, 1973 

lighting, soap opera organ 
music, screams, drum rolls and 
wolf sounds were matched only 
by the players' frequent—and 
disarming—tugging at invisible 
lamp cords. 

The drama's opening night 
audience was young. And 
generally rapt—with the notable 
exception of a drowsy blue-
jeaned 11-year-old who perched 
on the edge of his seat during the 
scary scenes, after which he 
repeatedly settled back into his 
chair for a little shut-eye—and 
some innocently undisguised 
snoring. 

"Dracula" is a crash course 
in the often deplorable habits of 

lot—so stiff (no pun intended) 
that he appears OBLIGED to 
recite his lines, so amateur his 
erratic movements appear to be 
between "X"s tediously located 
across the stage floor. 

And Charles Hunter's un-
fortunately over-drawn 
caricature of the Count is an 
intriguing cross between the 
traditionally over-stuffed butler 
and Chilly Willy the penguin. 

The paper-like props of the 
patently uneffective and 
unimaginative set appear to 
have been dropped in-
discriminately onto the stage 
from an over-sized tumbler. 

And the appropriately eerie 

Low-income students tour Tech 
SINCE THE BEAUTY of the familiar is often not appreciated, a remarkable and 
mysterious Guru was imported for the third program in the EARTHKEEPING 
series for young people. "Us and Changes" will be seen Monday at 6 p.m. on 
Channel 5. 

1130 MWF 
1030 TT 
230 MWF 
430 MWF & ALL sections of Eng 131 
630-800 PM MW & Monday night classes only 

730-1000 
1030-100 
130-400 
430-700 PM 
730-1000 PM 

Tuesday, May I, 1973 

KTXT-TV Schedule 
730-1000 
1030-100 
130-400 
430-700 PM 

SUNDAY 
6 p.m. ZOOM 
6: 3 0 EARTHKEEPING- 
"Sodbusters" 
7 p.m. THE NATURALISTS- 
"Muir" 
7:30 THE FRENCH CHEF 
8 p.m. MASTERPIECE THEA: 
Premiere! "The Golden Bowl"-
Part I 
9 p.m. FIRING LINE 

MONDAY 
4 p.m. MR. ROGERS No. 416 
4:30 ELEC. CO. No. 241 
5 p.m. SESAME ST. No. 496 
6 p.m. EARTHKEEPING-"Us 
& Changes" 

900 TT 
1230 MWF 
830 MWF 
All sections of Acct 232, 234, & 235 
All sections of F&N 131 
630-800 PM 'TT & Tuesday night classes only 730-1000 PM 

NAL 
8 p.m. BEHIND THE LINES 
8:30 BLACK JOURNAL 
9 p.m. SOUTHERN PER- 
SPECTIVE 

WEDNESDAY 
4 p.m. MR. ROGERS 
4:30 ELEC. CO. 
5 p.m. SESAME ST. 
6 p.m. BETWEEN THE LINES 
6:30 LOCAL-TBA 
7 p.m. AMERICA '73 
8 p.m. FESTIVAL FILMS 
8:30 THE TURNING POINTS 
9 p.m. SOUL! 

Wednesday, May 2, 1973 

6: 30 INSIGHT-"Friends" 
7 p.m. SPECIAL OF WEEK- 
"Dance Theatre" 
8: 30 BOOK BEAT-"A Time For 
Loving" 
9 p.m. GARDEN SHOW 
9:30 WHO IS MAN? 

TUESDAY 
4 p.m. MR. ROGERS 
4:30 ELEC. CO. 
5 p.m. SESAME ST. 
6 p.m. FASHION FOCUS 
6:30 GREAT DECISIONS- 
7 p.m. BOOK BEAT 
7:30 BILL MOYERS' JOUR- 

730-1000 
1030-100 
130-400 
430-700 PM 
730-1000 PM 

930 MWF 
130 MWF 
1200 TT 
All sections of Biol 141 & 142 
800-930 PM MW & Wednesday night classes only 

Your first 
tampon 

should 
be a 

Kotex 
tampon. 

"In the past, students were 
advised by counselors to not 
even come to Tech," he said. 
"They would tell the students 
Tech was too big and too hard." 

Some of the students who 
attended the program said they 
were pleased with activities and 
information made available to 
them. 

One student said, "I have a 
better impression of what Tech 
is about now, and what it has to 
offer. I was always scared, but 
now I feel much better." 

Another student said she was 
planning to enroll at Tech 
because she was more secure 
about campus life. 

LEARN provided the event in 
coordination with the Upward 
Bound program and Don 
Boucher, coordinator for in-
ternal relations and special 
assistant to the office of the 
President. 

that enable them to attain post-
secondary education and 
vocational training." 

LEARN, which began in 1966, 
helps minority and low-income 
students with loans and 
scholarships. The program is 
funded by the Department of 
Health, Education and Welfare. 

"We're a recruiting element," 
said Garza. "We go to the area 
schools and provide students 
with as much information as 
they may need. We cover a 60 
mile radius." 

He said in the last six years 
LEARN has given students 
$26,000 in loans and scholar-
ships. 

"This is the first time this 
kind of program has been im-
plemented by LEARN," he said. 
"We brought these students to 
the campus so they will have 
some idea of what college life 
will involve. 

By ROBERT MONTEMAYOR 
Special Reporter 

A small group of Lubbock 
County high school students 
toured the Tech campus 
Wednesday, orienting them-
selves to the many facets of 
college life. 

A program sponsored by 
LEARN Educational Talent 
Search provided 40 students 
with information on academic 
curricula, financial aid, housing 
and other services available to 
them. 

David Garza, director of 
LEARN, said the program was 
created "to motivate and make 
students realize that post-
secondary education is possible 
—even if they come from low 
income families." 

Garza said all the students 
were from low income families. 
"We explain to them," he said, 
"that there ate ways and means 

Thursday, May 3, 1973 
730-1000 	 730 MWF 
1030-100 	 1030 MWF 
130-400 	 130 TT & Military Sciences 
430-700 PM 	300 TT & All sections of Fren 141 & 142; Ita1131; 

Lat 131 &132; Span 141 &142; Germ 141 & 142 
730-1000 PM 	800-930 TT & Thursday night classes only 

Clayton pushes review 
of water conservation 

730 TT 
330 MWF & Saturday only classes 
430 TT 
All sections of Chem 141 & 142 
530 MWF Eli's DISCOTHEQUE 

Saturday, May 5, 1973 
730-1000 
1030-100 
130-400 
430-700 PM 
730-1000 PM 

• 

WANT ADS 

742-4274 

OPEN Thursday thru Saturday 

Thursday Ladies Night 
OPEN 8:00 p.m. 

to 1 a.m. VOLKSWAGON 
OWNERS 

TUNE UPS 
ENGINES REBUILT 
PARTS& SERVICE 

LITTLE ENGINE REBUILOERS 

Texas Rep. Bill Clayton will 
present a review of needed 
water legislation at the state 
level at the luncheon of the 11th 
annual West Texas Water 
Conference at the KoKo Inn in 
Lubbock today. 

The West Texas Water 
Conference is sponsored by the 
West Texas Water Institute 
(WTWI), 	a 	regional 
organization of more than 30 
agencies emphasizing wise use 
of water resources, promoting 
research and encouraging 
better educational programs on 
the value and utilization of 
water. 7x7 8993 1923 A Ave 0 799.9830 

18 AND OVER 
4138 19th 	ID'S REQUIRED 1 BLOCK SOUTH OF 19th 

widow of Dr. William D. Miller. 
At the time of his death Miller 
was chairman of the WTWI and 
chairman of the Department of 
Geosciences at Texas Tech 
University. The presentation 
will be made by Dr. J. Rex 
Johnston of the Agricultural 
Research Service of the U. S. 
Department of Agriculture at 
Bushland. 

Morning activities include 
addresses by experts in water 
resources development, con-
servation, research and 
education. Sessions are open to 
the public. 

Topics covered during the 
meeting include "The Changing 
Water World," by Harry P. 
Burleigh, director of the Texas 
Water Development Board in 
Austin; "Four Viewpoints of 
Water Conservation," a panel 
discussion chaired by Dr. 
Harold Dregne, chairman of the 
Texas Tech Department of 
Agronomy; and "Water Quality 
and Feedlot Runoff," by Hugh 
Yantis, executive director of the 
Texas Water Quality Board in 
Austin. 

Re. Clayton, Spring Lake, is a 
water legislation leader in 
Texas, having either authored 
or co-authored every piece of 
water legislation during his ten-
year tenure in the Texas House 
of Representatives. 

Clayton will speak at the 
luncheon which closes the 
annual water conference. Also 
during the luncheon, the WTWI 
will present a plaque of ap-
preciation to Mrs. Ann Miller, 

TRINITY 
BONDING & SURETY CO. JC asp. Ann a 

913 ave. K • 747 3324 

Because only Kotex 
tampons have soft, 

rounded ends . gentle 
insertion guides 

instead of two bulky 
tubes. . and more 

protection than the 
leading brand. But 
the only way to be 

convinced is to let a 
Kotex tampon be 

your first one.  

Mil, BONDS ea 	_ 

AND TRAFFIC TICKETS 
ALL COURTS•ALL BONDS 

24 HOUR SERVICE 

Friday, May 4, 1973 
730-1000 
1030-100 
130-400 
430-700 PM 
730-1000 PM 

For requested examination of 
combined sections of a course 

FREE: all the dope wu'll 
need tr a Europe hip. 

If it 
wasn't, 
here's a 

second 
chance. 

Other services aysulable from SOFA nc lune 
• great Car Plan. the Student Rados's. i too-ace 
COLielef in Europe. and low coat eacem,r,c en, 
in hotels. nOliday Nilson. end hostels 

All the dope le In the FREE in Om:Jai 
Tre 	Student Travel Ovid. to Europe. 

SOFA — don't all on n— Send for it NOW 

0 SOFA please send tart the FREE dope 244 
Nee 

Address 	  

r e/f/S 41=1. 

For a trial size package of Kates' 
tampons (5 tampons), a pretty purse 
container, and a very explanatory 
book entitled "Tell 11 Like It Is", 
mall this order form with 250 in coin 
to cover mailing and handling to: 

Kotex tampons 
Box 551 CN1 
Neenah, Wisconsin 54956 

I 

I 

Page the word SOFA can get soy to Europe 
Africa, Israel. the Fat East or anywhere.  
AND, gel you bac ill 	

1 Al Inc wholly owned subsidiary of A •
aner, non-p,offiEufficean National 
Student Travel Bureau.. SOFA can 	If 
issue you the International student y 
Identny Care and book you on any of 
Our S. 000 student Charlie nights 
wimin Europe Alla. Inc Aides 
(Including Tel Avhr, Bombay Bangkok 
Nairob. islc.1 Up to ?04 taring, 
over normal tares. 

SOFA alp offers en extensive 
array of tours allowing Ma independent 
student 'ratifier to Lake odvaalege ol 
inetpensive group arrangernents and 
sightseeing We I *slur e culturei4 
rewarding Israel. kibbuU programs and 
educational tours witn.n Europe and 
the Sorer Union 

Clly 	 Slate ---/qt 
Send to SOFA/ 

European Student Trawl Center Ltd 
136 East 37th Street Suite 1205 
New 'fork N T 10322 

Tel (212) Pt )2000 

	4. 

L 

Name 

Addres _-

City_ 

Stale 

PROFESSIONAL MEN'S t's 0*. 
HAIRSTYLING 

	  ip 

Allow 4 weeks for delivery. 
Olfer expires December 31,197i 
Limit one per customer. 

•Butch Spears 
• Joe Hefley 	 w 
• Butch Moore 	 /1 
• Jerald Miller 

4812 50th — 792-4403 
dim 

OFemminity today 
from Kimberly-Clark 

If Your Hair Isn't Becoming 
To You — You Should Be Coming 
To Us!! 

*et 



TECH 
Student, Special 

10% Discount 
Parts & Labor 

This ad is your coupon 
Bring it with you! 

ifirri  10.0jFORDi  
I r Downtown Ford Dealer 

9th & Texas 765-8801 

flit  THE MATURE, 
4-SERIOUS SINGLE STUDENT 

Now Available For -4es 

TECH 

L76VILLAGE 
2-2233 

2902 3rd. Pl. 

(on a limited basis) 

1 BR., FURNISHED APARTMENTS, 
UTILITIES PAID 

UNIVERSITY 
VILLAGE 
763-8822 
3102 4th 

VARSITY 
VILLAGE 

762-1256 

3002 4th 

ALL YOU CAN 
EAT— 1" 

Specializing in CABRITO — Orders To Go 
125 N. UNIVERSITY — 	 — 712•16211 TAP BEER 

Air Force ROTC..The college 
scholarship program with 

fringe benefits. 

Some people might need to be coaxed with more than a full college schol-
arshipto join the Air Force ROTC. So, if free tuition, lab and incidental fees 
aren't enough . . . the Air Force offers a monthly allowance of $100.00, 
tax-free, in your junior and senior years. 
And free flying lessons to those qualified provide the most exciting fringe 
benefit of all. 
Interested? 

Contact  "The AFROTC Department about the two year program." 

at  "Room 27 Social Science Bldg. on campus, 742-2145 or 763-3383." 

Find Yourself A Scholarship In Air Force ROTC. 
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Sport Shorts Quarterbacks impressive 

Offense dominates workout 
yards. Jones gathered in seven 
passes for 84 yards and two TDs 
and Garner was the leading ball 
carrier with six carries for 36 
yards. 

WANT ADS 

742-4274 

Women's tennis 
Tech's women's varsity tennis team will be in Austin March 

23-24 to compete in the University of Texas Invitational Tennis 
Tournament. 

Representing Tech are Becky Roberts, a freshman from 
San Antonio; Sue Perry, a junior from Kermit; Judy Mar-
tindale, a junior from Amarillo; Sara Pfeiffer, a senior from 
Wichita Falls; Sharon Walker, a freshman from Lubbock; 
Karen Walker, a freshman from Lubbock; Gay Blocker, a 
freshman from Midland; and Sarah Holly. a freshman from 
Lubbock. 

Tech placed second in team matches at SMU held March 9 
and 10. The team's only loss was a 5-1 score with Odessa College. 

Tech will travel to a district tournament in Odessa on April 
13 and 14. 

IM wrestlmg tourney 
ATO edged Sigma Nu 43-42 to claim the All-University In-

tramural wrestling championship. 
Bruce McClendon was the clutch man for ATO, winning the 

177 lb. division for the deciding point. 
Other first place winners were Carl D'Costa, Phi Delis 134 

lb. division; Allen Atnip, Sneed, 122 lb. division; Tom Eckley, 
Sigma Nu 150 lb. division. 

Pike Mark Faris won the 158 lb. division; Armin Klusman of 
Sneed took the 167 lb. division; Tom Barker claimed the 190 lb. 
division and Dale Pierce of the Pikes took the unlimited title. 

Women's IM action 
Girls are now participating in basketball, tennis, and softball 

in the Women's Intramural Program. 
The winner of the All-University Basketball Championship 

will be determined Thursday, March 22 at 6:30 when the 
Roadrunners (open division) play against Alpha Chi Omega 
(Greek division). 

There were four divisions and the winner of the dorm division 
was Knapp Hall, while the BSU won the club division. The 
Roadrunners were the winner of the open division and in the 
playoffs defeated Knapp by a score of 42-24. Wednesday, the 
BSU was defeated by Alpha Chi Omega in the playoffs by 43-25. 

LOSE 20 POUNDS 
IN TWO WEEKS! 

Raider defensive tackle Ecomet 
Burley (74) puts the stop to Ronnie 
Samford during Tech's scrimmage 

session Thursday. It was the final 
spring practice before the spring 
break. See story at right. 

Competition was completed Tuesday in table tennis. Becky 
Roberts representing Horn Hall placed first while second place 
went to Erlinda Villalobos representing Los Tertulianos. 

In the tennis singles competition, Molly Grooters (Phi Mu), 
Patty McColl (Goose Club), and Leanne Mayerlee 
(A.F.R.O.T.C.), have advanced to the semifinals. The winner of 
a match between DeeDee Boyd (Goose Club) and Irma 
Guerrero (Los Tertulianos) will be the fourth player in the 
semifinals. 

The tennis mixed doubles tournament has been won by Jamie 
Wortham (Indepedent) and Phillip Boswell. Second place went 
to Stephanie Fellows ( Doak-Weeks) and Ricky Turner. Third 
place went to Ray Ann Shepher (Doak-Weeks) and Gene Davis. 
Luann Plunk ( Horn) and Jim Burleson placed fourth. 

In tennis doubles only two teams have already advanced to 
the semifinals. They are Jane Johnston and Debbie Jones 
representing Alpha Phi, and Ray Ann Shepherds and Patsy 
Troutman representing Doak-Weeks. Other teams are still 
playing in play-offs for the semifinals. 

Famous U.S. Women Ski Team Diet 

During the non-snow off season 
the U.S. Women's Alpine Ski Team 
members go on the "Ski Team" diet 
to lose 20 pounds in two weeks. 
That's right — 20 pounds in 14 days! 
The basis of the diet is chemical food 
action and was devised by a famous 
Colorado physician especially for the 
U.S. Ski Team. Normal energy is 
maintained (very important!) while 
reducing. You keep "full" — no 
starvation — because the diet is de-
signed that way! It's a diet that is 
easy to follow whether you work, 
travel or stay at home. 

This is. honestly, a fantastically 
successful diet. If it weren't, the U.S. 
Women's Ski Team wouldn't be per 

to use it! Right? So, give 
yourself the same break the U.S. Ski 
Team gets. Lose weight the scientific, 
proven way. Even if you've tried all 
the other diets, you owe it to your-
self to try the U.S. Women's Ski 
Team Diet. That is, if you really do 
want to lose 20 pounds in two weeks. 
Order today. Tear this out as a 
reminder. 

Send only $2.00 ($2.25 for Rush 
Service) — cash is O.K. — to Infor-
mation Sources Co., P.O. Box 231, 
Dept. ST, Carpinteria, Calif. 93013. 
Don't order unless you expect to lose 
20 pounds in two weeks! Because 
that's what the Ski Team Diet will do! 

The offense, behind Duniven, 
finally got cranked up on their 
third try, behind two Duniven to 
Pat Felix passes. But the drive 
stalled inside the 30-yard line. 

The first teams again did 
battle, and the defense made up 
for a little lost pride. On their 
first possession, the offense 
fumbled and Kenny, Wallace fell 
on the loose ball kfr the defense. 
The offense, led by Carmichael, 
stalled on their next possession 
despite a Carmichael run for 18 
yards. 

But three was a charm as the 
offense punched the ball in for a 
score. Carmichael hit Andre 
Tillman for 20 yards and John 
Garner for 17 on the first two 
plays. Following a run, Car-
michael found Ronnie Samford 
for 12 yards to the ten and then it 
was Jones again, this pass good 
for the final ten steps and the 
TD. 

Duniven then led the second 
offense for a score. A 12-yard 
run by Hoyt Glascock set the 
offense in motion and Duniven 
found Ricky Bates open for a 
couple of tosses. The capper 
came on a one-yard plunge by 
Mark Pace. The drive took 12 
plays. 

The first team scored once 
mote, led by Barnes. A 12-yard 
pass from Barnes to Lawrence 
Williams started the drive and 
Barnes ended it by circling left 
end and going in for the score 
from six yards out. 

Passing statistics were im-
pressive for the Raider quar-
terbacks. Barnes was eight of 
nine for 101 yards, Carmichael 
was six of seven for 64 yards and 
Duniven was six of nine for 50 

By BROOKS TINSLEY 
Sports Editor 

Red Raider throwers had a 
field day Thursday as Tech held 
its second spring scrimmage 
session. Quarterbacks Joe 
Barnes, Jimmy Carmichael and 
Tommy Duniven all completed 
more than half their passes as 
the offense again dominated the 
scrimmage. 

The first team offense, led by 
Barnes, scored on the first team 
defense on both of their first 
xissessions. Both were sixty-
ard drives as the offense was 
king the ball at their own 40-
Ard line each time. 
Calvin Jones got the first 

Raider TD on a nine-yard 
scoring toss from Barnes. 
Barnes completed three of three 
passes on the opening drive, 
including two to Jones. The 
drive took ten plays as the of-
fense picked up four first downs 
in the process. 

The offense scored again on 
their next possession. On first 
down, Barnes found Jones, this 
time for 23 yards, and the of-
fense was moving. Cliff Hoskins 
ran three straight times, 
picking up 27 yards, before 
Barnes and Jones hooked up for 
a nine-yard gain to the one. 
Terry Bridge went over from 
there for the score. 

The second team offense 
against the second team defense 
was a totally different story, 
though, as the defense held the 
offense to no first downs on two 
possessions, one of which ended 
in an interception by Selso 
Ramirez. For Ramirez, it was 
his second theft of the spring 
scrimmages. 

outstanding because of its 
strength in this area. 

In the junior college division, 
New Mexico should outshine the 
other junior college squads of 
Ranger, Cisco, Odessa, and 
South Plains. 

"We will be awarding ribbons 
to the first and second place 
finishers in each event," 
commented Tech track coach 
Vernon Hilliard. "There will be 
no team championship because 
relays stress individual ac-
complishment." 

Hilliard went on to say that 
whereas in the past the nine top 
qualifiers in each event from 

Tech hosts annual relays 
By TONY BATT 

Sports Writer 
Tomorrow at I,ubbock's 

Chapman Field, ten schools will 
be competing in the ninth an-
nual Tech Mini-Relays. This 
invitational meet serves as a 
warmup for the Texas Relays in 
Austin April 13-14. 

Besides Tech, the four other 
teams competing in the senior 
college division include UTA, 
West Texas State, LCC, and 
Wayland Baptist. No team 
points will be recorded during 
the meet but since relays consist 
mainly of field events, West 
Texas State is expected to be 

UT netters host Tech 

this region were invited to the 
Tech Mini-Relays, this year 
only the top six were invited. 

"This is because the Chapman 
track only has six lanes to run in 
whereas our track (where the 
meet has been held in the past, 
but is currently being refur-
bished with a Tartan track) has 
nine lanes," he explained. 

Coming off a fourth place 
finish in the Arlington relays a 
week ago, Tech should expect 
strong performances from Hugh 
Jones and Ken Ford. Jones 
finished third in the 880 last 
week while Ford took second in 
the long jump with a leap of 
23'101 :2". 

Tech's tennis players will not 
enjoy the luxuries of spring three. 
vacation as they travel to Austin 
to wrangle with the Texas 
Longhorns in dual-match play 
Mar. 27. 

Doubles pairings will be 
Hammerick and Bennett at 
number one, Chisholm and 
Moffett at number two and 

Morris and Smith at number Why Aren't 
You A 
Good Talker? 

Tech hitter leads SWC batting 

A noted publisher in Chicago 
reports a simple technique of 
everyday conversation which 
can pay you real dividends in 
social and business advancement 
and works like magic to give 
you poise, self-confidence and 
greater popularity. 

According to this publisher, 
many people do not realize how 
much they could influence others 
simply by what they say and 
how they say it. Whether in 
business, at social functions, or 
even in casual converations with 
new acquaintances there are 
ways to make a good impression 
every time you talk. 

To acquaint the readers of 
this paper with the easy-to-
follow rules for developing skill 
in everyday conversation, the 
publishers have printed full de• 
tails of their interesting self-
training method in a new book-
let, "Adventures in Conversa-
tion," which will be mailed free 
to anyone who requests it. No 
obligation. Send your name, ad-
dress, and zip code to: Conver-
sation, 555 E. Lange St., Dept. 
940-40, Mundelein, Ill. 60060. A 
postcard will do. 

The Raiders will be trying to 
continue the level of excellence 
they flashed last weekend when 
they skunked San Angelo State, 
9-0. The Techsans will carry a 3-
2 mark into the match with the 
Longhorns. 

Walter (Butch) Hammerick 
will be the number one seeded 
Techsan while Stan Morris will 
support him in the number two 
slot. Janies Chisholm will be 
number three, John Moffett will 
be number four, Terry Bennett, 
number five, and Jerry Smith, 
Number six. 

new for the Red Raiders. Doug 
Ault paced conference batsmen 
in 1972 with a .464 average and 
Jerry Haggard won the batting 
crown in 1969 at .400. 

Although the hitters got off to 
a fast start, a quartet of pitchers 
have yet to allow an earned run. 
Texas' Martin Flores, Houston's 
Steve Brewer, SMU's Art Widen 
and Tech's Randy Prince all 
won their conference openers, 

although Prince was relieved 
after five innings and Widen 
yielded an unearned run in the 
seventh inning of his victory 
over Baylor. 

SWC action continues this 
weekend with two games 
scheduled Friday and one 
Saturday in each of the 
following matchups: Texas at 
Baylor, Houston at TCU, A&M 
at Rice and SMU at Tech. 

DALLAS — Texas Tech's 
John Wilkes had a drab fresh-
man season as a catcher for 
Tech—a .000 batting average—
but the sophomore from Lub-
bock is making up for lost time 
in 1973. 

The Tech catcher is hitting 
.667 after the first round of 
Southwest Conference games to 
pace a crowd of sluggers who 
number four .600 hitters, seven 
over .500 and 16 over .400. 

He and SMU's Jim Moffett, 
another erstwhile light hitter, 
helped their teams to a pair of 
victories in three games over 
the weekend to stay in close 
pursuit of conference-leading 
Texas. Moffett batted in nine 
runs while hitting .600 against 
Baylor, leads the SWC with two 
homers and is tied for the lead in 
doubles with a pair. 

Seeking its ninth straight 
championship or share, Texas 
swept a three-game set from 
defending co-champion TCU 
last weekend and posted a 
conference-leading team bat-
ting average of .307. 

Bobby Clark ( .600), Charlie 
Crenshaw (.500) and Rick 
Burley 	(.455 I 	give 	the 
Longhorns three of the SWC's 
top ten hitters. 

SWC newcomer Houston split 
its opening series with Rice as 
catcher Mike Bollman joined 
the list of .600 hitters. 

Wilkes' batting lead is nothing 

with a heel that rises to any occasion on a kicky platform sole. 

The Personality slated to be the super star on campus to show 

off with color-coordinated separates. 

Personality. 

Office Supply 
1420 Texas 	762.5291 

Price Range $16 -$20 

Personality Shoes Are Available at: 
Jones-Roberts Shoe Store, 1205 Broadway—Town & Country—Caprock Ctr., Lubbock, Tex. 
Bob's Shoe Store, 820 Austin, Levelland, Tex. 
Ball's Department Store, Crosbyton, Tex. 
Brown's Department Store, Lockney, Tex. 
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Heidi stands tall 

• 



"An exquisite Swedish film! Max 
Von Sydow and Liv Ullmann 
are outstanding!" 

- Judith Crist, New York 

"A bursting, resonant film, 'The 
Emigrants' has reverberations." 

- The New Yorker 

"Stark Beauty!" 
- Playboy 

Max von Sydow 
Liv Ullmann 

The Emigrants 
v‘is 	 tr

4 
St ° 	 ea, S 

NO" 

CONTINENTAL 
CINEMA 763-2707 

By LES MOORHEAD 
Sports Writer 

The stage has been set, the 
curtain has been drawn, and the 
characters have been waiting in 
the home circles for Tech and 
SMU to get together again. 

Backyard conference action 
gets underway today with Tech 
hosting the Mustangs with the 
double bill starting at 1 p.m. The 
mini-shootout will pit two clubs 
with matching credentials ( 2-1) 
who, as usual since the first 
week of play, trail the 
Longhorns. 

It looks more like the pages 
from the past basketball season 
were turned back when Tech 
and SMU were battling for the 
top spot, and it seems when the 

two get together things tend to 
boil. No wonder, red, black and 
blue just don't clash. 

Coach Kal Segrist said 
righthander Randy Prince (1-1) 
will get the start on the mound 
in the first game which is 
scheduled for seven innings. 
Southpaw Monte Barnes (3-1) 
will likely go in the nightcap. 

Segrist said John Bickley (1-
1), who pitched strong his last 
time out against A&M, gets the 
nod in Saturday's single affair 
that also starts at 1 p.m. 

Segrist pointed out that Louis 
Avery (2-1) will probably see 
unlimited action in relief 
because he said, "Avery is the 
type who has the unique ability 
to come in and get people out 
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Special Owls Features Tonite & Sat. 

Family Entertainment 

Features at 2:15-4:30-7:00-9:15 
Making the Team for 
THE 3rd BIG WEEK 

COME AND HUDDLE WITH 
THE CHEERLEADERS 
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Irons inks 

with Tech.  

LUBBOCK MONTEREY'S ace tight 
end Dan Irons signs a letter-of-intent 
to attend Tech. Irons was one of the 
state's top prospects still unsigned. 
Looking on is his father, Ed Irons. 

Durocher faces league fine 

Draftsman - draw prints for 
mobile homes:  full time or part 
time. Mobile Home Mfg. Clovis 
Road - 2 miles west of Loop 289. 
763-6481. 

Models wanted for commercials 
photography. For information 
contact, Paper Arts - Suite 904, 
Lubbock National Bank 
Building. Phone 763-5071. 

Help needed - must be willing to 
work - male or female. Apply in 
person - Seven Knights Rest. 
4409 19th. 

MISCELLANEOUS 
FAILING COURSES? Reading 
speed, comprehension, and 
study skills inadequate? The 
successful program on our 
metropolitan campus is 
designed to correct not only 
minor but serious reading 
problem's. For your future 
academic success: Call Dr. 
Scott (214) 724-6541, Ext. 40, or 
write P.O. Box 418Q, Plano, 
Texas 75074. 

Key-punching - Programs and 
data cards. Quick Professional 
Service. DCP, 3521 34th, 792-
3844. 

PARTY PROOFS FOR: 

SAE 2-23-73 
ATO 3-3-73 
Phi Psi 3- 10 -73 

Ready at 2421 Broadway - Rear 
(Behind Custom Flowers). 
Dennis 	R. 	Carter 	- 
Photographer. 

COMPUTER CENTER 
PROBLEMS? for statistical, 
scientific 	and 	business 
programming or consultation 
call collect: (806) 894-3334. More 
than six years university-level 
experience. 

FUN IN EUROPE- June 7-28. 7 
countries. From Dallas $899.00. 
Mrs. Bert Dennis, Gail Texas, 
79738. ( 915) 856-4233. 

TO 
PLACE 
YOUR 
WANT 
ADS 

DIAL 
742-4274 

the title game by winning the 
open league and defeating the 
dorm champ, Knapp. The Alpha 
Chis won the Greek division and 
then defeated the Club winner, 
BSU. It is the third straight year 
for the Alpha Chis to finish 
second. 

Ors. CAULEY, CAULEY, and CAULEY 
OPTOMETRIST 

Vision Analysis and Contact Lenses 

4002-B 22nd Street 
(Corner of 22nd and 

	
By Appointment 

Nashville) 
	

Phone 792-4824 

The Roadrunners broke open 
a close game with a second half 
rally to defeat Alpha Chi Omega 
45-32 Thursday night and claim 
the Women's Intramural All-
University Basketball Cham-
pionship. 

Bobbie Winn led all scorers 
for the night as she scored 24 
points for the Roadrunners. 
Besides providing almost all the 
point production, Winn hauled 
down a number of rebounds. 

Joining Winn in the 
Roadrunner scoring column 

GOLDEN 
flORSITNOR 

TWIN 
Twin I - PG--

"The Legend of 
Nigger Charley" 

"The Possession of 
Joel Delaney" 

-X- 
"Rose Bud" & 

"Art of Marriage" 

Twin 2 
Walter Matthau & Carol 
Rurentt 	in 

"Pete & Tillie" 
-PG- 

-Red Sky at Morning" 

REP 
RAIDER 

TWIN 
Twin I 

Dianna Ross in 
"Lady Sings the Blues" 

"The Sterile Cuckoo" 
-R- 

Twin H 
"Super Fly" 

James Garner in 
"Skin Game" 

-R- 

ARCADIA 
-X-  "Is There Sex 

After Marriage" 

"Fuego" 

FINE ARTS 

NATIONAL. GENCRALM 

EXTRA EARLY SHOWING 
OPEN 4:30 P.M. 

FEATURES: 5:00-7:00-9:05 
NOMINATED FOR 4 ACADEMY AWARDS 

,altadnitz / MATTEL Productions 
Rent 

"SOUNDER" 
A Robert B. Reclaim/Martha Plitt Film 

pANsviSIONO COLOR BY DE LUXE. 

7 ACADEMY AWARD NOMINATIONS 

OPEN 6:30 
FEATURES 7:00 - 9:25 p.m. 
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Tech hosts SMU in crucial series 
when we need it. Otherwise, I 
would start him." 

Avery won the second game of 
the doubleheader with A&M 
Saturday and also helped out in 
the first win. 

Prince, who doubles up on the 
basketball court, has been 
throwing up to his potential, 
Segrist said. The tall, lanky 
fireballer stands 6'912". Who 
said baseball wasn't a game of 
inches? 

Barnes threw in Tech's only 
loss to A&M and Segrist said he 
pitched well. The big sophomore 
from I,azbuddie has filled the 
spot vacated by Ruben Garcia, 
who will possibly sit out the next 
two series' with SMU and Rice. 

The Mustangs defeated 

first, depending on the opposing 
pitcher, whether he throws right 
or left. 

Veteran Bobby Lewis is the 
second baseman, Bob Wiebe at 
third and Ronnie Mattson at 
shortstop. David Voegle and 
John Wilkes will catch. 

Baylor two of three in Dallas in 
last weekend's opener while 
Tech won two and lost one 
against the Aggies. 

Segrist admitted he was not 
sure what SMU had coming but 
said "We've just got to play our 
game, and if we do, we'll beat 
anybody. 

Segrist praised everybody up 
and down the lineup in the A&M 
series terming it "a real great 
team effort." Bunting was 
Tech's weakest part of their 
game, Segrist noted about the 
A&M series. "There were about 
six bunts we had that were not 
executed. 

Around the infield Tech will 
start either Robin Kilmer, 
I.arry Drown or Rick Weaver at 

In the outfield, Cecil Norris is 
in right, either John Reese or 
Gary Barrick in center, and 
Jimmy Horton, Eddie Cer-
vantes or Reese in left field. 

Elsewhere in the conference 
this weekend, Texas (3-0) is at 
Baylor (1-2), TCU (0-3) is 
hosting Houston, (1-1) who 
joined the SWC this year, and 
Rice (1-1) will entertain the 
Aggies (1-2) in Houston. 

WANT ADS 
1 DAY 
	

$1.65 
2 DAYS 
	

$2.20 	ALL CLASSIFIED ADVERTISING 
3 DAYS 	;2.75 
4 DAYS 	$3.30 

	
MUST BE PAID IN ADVANCE. 

5 DAYS 
	

$3.85 

DEADLINE IS NOON TWO DAYS 
(ABOVE RATES ARE BASED ON 
15 WORDS EACH ADDITIONAL 

	IN ADVANCE. 
WORD IS 10 CENTS PER DAY) 

FOR INFORMATION CALL 742.4274 

a meeting 
"Baseball had made an 

agreement that these meetings 
would be held and I feel if you 
make an agreement you have to 
live up to it," Feeney said. 

talking to him." 
Durocher broke up 

at Pompano Beach when Miller 
was explaining the agreement 
reached by management and 
player representatives for a 
three-year pact on the basic 
agreement that governs player 
contracts. 

Durocher has said he felt 
Feeney should have talked to 
him personally. 

HOUSTON ( AP) - National 
League president Charles S. 
Feeney said he anticipates no 
trouble collecting the $250 fine 
he assessed Houston Astros 
manager Leo Durocher March 
12. 

Durocher was assessed the 
fine for breaking up a meeting 
between Houston players and 
Marvin Miller, executive 
director of the Major League 
Baseball Players Association. 

When the fine was announced, 
Durocher declared he would 
resign before paying it and 
threatened to carry the case to 
court. 	• 

However, Feeney told the 
Houston Chronicle by telephone 
from St. Petersburg, Fla., 
Wednesday that it was specified 
the fine was to be paid by 
opening day and indicated he 
anticipates no trouble about it. 

"If I.eo wants a hearing, he 
can go through the proper 
procedure and ask for one," 
Feeney said. "I always enjoy 

Need a Home for good Cop-
pertone 30" Gas Stove. 795-2721, 

Drafting table $34.50. large 
draw, 31x42 vinyl work top. 
adjustable height, folds for 
carrying. 747-5679 after 5 p.m. 

FOR RENT 
Apts. for married couples, 1 
bdrm furnished, bills paid, 
laundry & pool. No pets. TECH 
VILLAGE, 2902 3rd Place, 792-
2233; UNIVERISTY VILLAGE, 
3102 4th, 763-8822; VARSITY 
VILLAGE, 3002 4th, 762-1256. 

Apts. for mature, serious, single 
students. 1 bedrm. furnished, 
bills paid, laundry & pool. No 
pets. TECH VILLAGE 2902 3rd 
Place, 762-2233; UNIVERSITY 
VILLAGE 3102 4th, 763-8822; 
VARSITY VILLAGE 3002 4th, 
762-1256. 

ELECTRONIC 
SURPLUS SALE 

Sat. March 24, 9 a.m. to 3 p.m 
5 new fl track auto stereos 523 50 ea. 
2 used Toshiba Cassette Recorders 
515.00 ea. 
1 21 Channel CB Radio 575.00 
2 6 to 12 volt Convertors $7.50 ea 
1 12 VDC to 110 VAC 1,000 watt $27.50 
Used Auto Stereos Good for parts 51.50 
Ca • 
New Transistors 15 cents each 
New Diodes 5 cents each 
New Radio 8, TV tubes 75 per cent off. 
Used radio 8. TV tubes 10-25 cents ea 
New stereo cartridges 75 per cent off.  
Large coke box S75 
Many other items. connectors, resistors. 
capacitors. relay, wire, cable etc.  
Building behind 202 N. University. 

DO YOU NEED: 1, 2 or 3 
bedroom furnished or un-
furnished houses, duplexes or • 
apts. RHD, 2318 Broadway, 763-
4621. TYPING Roadrunners win IM title game 

Anderson announces 
second annual tourney 

The initial announcement for Don Maynard, receiver for the 
the second annual Donny An-  New York Jets. 

	

derson Pro-Celebrity golf 
	

Newcomers to the tournament 
tournament revealed five will be Craig Morton of the 
members from the en-  Dallas Cowboys and Jim 
tertainment and sports worlds Grabowski of the Chicago 
will take part in the activities Bears. 
scheduled May 26-27. 

	

Willie Wood, former Green 
	

The tournament, sponsored 
Bay Packer and currently a by the Lubbock Jaycees, will 
coach for the San Diego provide funds for the Lubbock 
Chargers, will return along with Rehabilitation and Detention 
George "Goober" Lindsey and Center. 

FAST, GUARANTEED SER-
VICE, Graduate School Ap-
proved, IBM Selectric - 11 yrs. 
Experience. All kinds of typing 
accepted. Jo Ann Knight, 797-
2340. 

GRADUATE SCHOOL AP-
PROVED, Themes - Theses -
Dissertations. Professional 
typing on IBM Selectric. Work 
Guaranteed. Mrs. Davis. 2622 
33rd. 792-2229. 

THESES, DISSERTATIONS, 
Research papers, term papers. 
Typing done in my home. 799-
3294. 

Satisfaction Guaranteed. 
Themes, Term Papers, & 
Theses. McLarty. 792-9133. 

TYPING - Themes, Theses, 
Term papers. IBM Selectric. 
Work guaranteed. Mrs. Brenda 
Underwood. 744-2232. 

Eight years experience. Theses, 
Term papers, etc. Call Mrs. 
Arnold, 792-1641, 2810 53rd. Fast, 
guaranteed, spelling corrected. 

TYPING: Extra Large 
Selectric. Makes charts & 
graphs. Mrs. Morris Clinton, 
2703 38th, 799-0848. 

TYPING: IBM Selectric 
typewriter. Accurate, fast 
service. Guaranteed. Mrs. 0. P. 
Moyers, 4607 Canton, 799-8717. 

THEMES - THESES -
DISSERTATIONS. Professional 
typing on IBM Selectric. Ex-
perienced. Graduate School 
Approved. Mrs. James Ray. 
2208 37th. 744-1339. 

Fast, Accurate Typing. Ex-
perienced. Reasonable rates. 
Call day or night - 797-3172. 

Let me type your papers. Fast & 
accurate. 792-5446. 

HELP WANTED 
Need several dependable people 
for territory servicing. Hours 
arranged. $2 hourly. Call 762-
2412. FULLER BRUSH CO. 

McDonald's needs part time 
help for lunches. Apply 1910 50th 
or 2343 19th after 2 p.m. No 
phone Calls please. 

2 Bedroom Furnished or Un-
furnished Luxury Apt. Dish-
washer, disposal, shag carpet, 
self cleaning oven. Off Street 
parking. Close to Tech. 744-5954. 

CANTERBURY. Spacious three 
bedroom, two story 21 2 bath, 
two fireplaces, carpeted. bills 
paid. $283.50. 4401 20th. Century 
Enterprises 799-0417. 

A STONE'S THROW 

were Tommie Bohannon with 
nine, Beverly Robertson with 
seven and Judith Murrell with 
six. The Alpha Chis were led by 
Kathy Allen with 11, T. G. 
Richardson with nine and Lynda 
Bain with six. 

The first half was close 
throughout 	with 	the 
Roadrunners holding a slim six-
point lead at halftime. But Winn 
took charge the second half and 
the Alpha Chis could not catch 
up. 

The Roadrunners advanced to 
FROM downtown and Tech! New! 
General Electric built-ins, dishwash-
er, disposal. Completely paneled. 
Spacious 2 bedroom contemporary. 

AVAILABLE MARCH 15 $203.50. 
CENTURY ENTERPRNES 

2101 14th & Ave. U 
799-0417 

BEST 
Including 
Picture 
Actor 
Actress 
Screenplay "AT LAST, A 

COMPASSION-
ATE AND 
LOVING FILM 
ABOUT BEING 
BLACK IN 
AMERICA. . 

--JAY COCKS. 
Time Magazine 

One bedroom furnished Apt. 
Dishwasher & shag carpet 
Couples only - $145, Bills Paid. 
Maison Ville, 1901 9th. 744-2501, 
if no answer Call 795-5155. 

AUTOMOTIVE 
BARRETT'S AUTOMOTIVE -
208 N. University, 763-4436. 
Complete line auto parts & 
supplies. Student ID's honored 
for discount. 

1964 Ford Custom 4-Dr. Sudan. 
Good Condition. New Battery, 
New tires. Runs great. Steve - 
742-5676. 

Wife's 1965 T-Bird, Power & Air, 
clean, new inspection sticker, 
Office - 763-9241. 

'72 Mercury Monterey, 13,200 
mi. Call Cindy at 742-1121 before 
5 & 762-2683 after 5. 

1962 Thunderbird. See to ap-
preciate. Beautiful blue. Ready 
to go anywhere. $485.00, 765-
9749. 2216 30th. 

1972 Kawasaki F-9, 350cc, 1,000 
miles, extras, $800 or best offer, 
797-2293. 

FOR SALE 
Honda - Mini Trail 50, $100.00. 
8,000 BTU Deluxe Wards 
Refrigerated Air Conditioner -
used 3 months, $100.00. Lawnboy 
Lawn mower with catcher cost 
$120, sell $60. 797-1105, 795-2424. 

ELECTRONIC JUNK SALE. 
We buy, sell & trade. 9 a.m. to 3 
p.m. Sat. Only. Bldg. behind 
Hunter Drug, 202 N. University. 

ALL STAR CAST 
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