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BILL CLARK 

WINS $7 ON 

WHO'S WHO 

Pantherettes Win 
Fourth In Region 

The Gorman High School Pan-
therettes were defeated in the 
semi-finals of the Region II-B 
meet by Priddy by a score of 
39-32. Abbott won over the Gor-
man sextet for third place Sat-
urday night leaving the Pan-
therettes a fourth place finish in 
the Region. 

The "Speedy" Clark family 
was the hawk-eye for last week. 
They did not spot enough clues 
to claim the full jackpot of $12 
but Bill Clark's entry did identify 
Gus Frossard as the personality 
of the week to win $7. 

Jackpot really was in hiding 
and he will be doing his best to 
stay in seclusion as long as he 

Local Senior Wins 
can. So the only thing to do is 
to keep looking and one of these 
days he will slip up and become 
over confident and some 

"de-  Band Scholarship  
tective" will nab him. 

The jackpot for this week has 
grown to $17. To McMurry 

Fred Gray, high school senior 
and son of Mr. and Mrs. Harold 
Gray, has won a 4-year scholar-
ship to McMurry College in Abi-
lene. 

Fred recently attended an in-
strumental playing contest at the 
college for which he had prepar-
ed himself, with. his many other 
activities which include, beside 
his studies, clerking at Frossard's 
and heading the Methodist Youth 
Fellowship. He is also a member 
of the choir. 

`Portraits of Luke' 
Review Is Prelude 
To WSCS Study 

A similar meeting, co-sponsored by the Eastland County 
Farm Bureau, will be held at Nimrod Community Center 
Monday, March 14 at 7:30 p. m. Mr. Justice, President of 
ECFB, stated that their organization is extremely con-
cerned over the lack of planting allotted peanut acres in 
the county. 

The Pantherettes had defeated 
Paint Rock in their first game 
Friday night by a score of 39-32. 

The Gorman team finished the 
season with a record of 26 wins 
and 6 losses. 

Mary Robertson was selected 
on the All-Tournament team. 

Other seniors besides Mary 
playing their last game Saturday 
were Patsy Rawls, Karen Wright, 
and Emma Jane Skaggs. 

This year marked the fourth 
consecutive season the Panther-
ettes have been in the Regional 
Tourney. They have placed third, 
first, second, and four, respect-
ively the past four season in the 
Regional Tourney. 

Speaker For HNC 
Homecoming 
Is Announced 

Word has been received from 
W. D. Harper, President of the 
Hankins Normal College Ex-Stu-
dents Assn., that a definite corn-
mittment from the Rev. P. D. 
(Dick) O'Brien, Pastor of the 
First Baptist Church of Big 
Spring, has been secured that he 
will accept an invitation to bring 
the main address at the regular 
annual meeting of the Ex-Stu-
dent Assn. on June 5, 1960 at 
Gorman. 

The Rev. O'Brien was born 
near the Midway community of 
Gorman and has been with the 
First Church of Big Springs for 
approximately twenty years and 
is one of the most popular after 
dinner speakers in the State. 

Complete program for this oc-
casion will be announced at a 
later date as soon as the com-
plete program committee can 
meet and arrange same. 

Those asked to serve on this 
committee are as follows: 

Mr. E. E. Layton, Eastland; 
Robert Palmer, Stephenville; 
Mrs. Rosa Boucher, Mrs. Fannye 
Burkett, Roscoe Reeves and Mrs. 
Martha Sutton, all of Gorman. 

This and place of meeting will 
be announced at an early date 
for this committee according to 
the president. 

FATHER OF MRS. E. C. 
BRAMLETT BURIED 
IN STEPHENVILLE 

Jaycees Protest 
Sale of Part of 
Park Property 

At the regular meeting of the 
Gorman Junior Chamber of Com-
merce held on Thursday evening, 
March 3, 1960, the Jaycees dis-
cussed the recent action of the 
City Commission, regarding the 
transfer of a portion of the Frank 
A.. Gray Memorial Park and 
Swimming Pool located south-
west of Gorman. 

The property in question is 
part of the land formerly owned 
by the late Henry Capers and 
was deeded by him to the City 
of Gorman for the sole purpose 
of recreation facilities. 

It was _brought out at the meet-
ing that many thousand dollars 
and many man hours of labor 
was donated by the late Quarter-
back Club, the farmers, business-
men, women's clubs and the pres-
ent Jaycee organization to add 
beauty to this park. 

It was reported that the City 
Commission had begun the trans-
fer of sale of a portion of this 
park and the Gorman Jaycees 
unanimously made the following 
resolution: 

"The Gorman Jaycees go on 
record as opposing the action of 
the City of Gorman in selling or 
proposing to sell certain property 
that is under management of the 
Gorman Jaycees and further sug-
gest that the city cancel said 
deed or transfer." 

Funeral services for Mr. Lon 
Hook, father of Mrs. E. C. Bram-
lett, were held in Stephenville 
at the First Baptist Church on 
Monday at 2:00 o'clock. 

Friends attending the funeral 
from Gorman were Mr. and Mrs. 
0. R. Buchanan, Bro: A. D. Kyle, 
Jr., Mmes. Ray Rankin, Doyle 
Preston, Pete Mauney, Tom 
Thompson, M. E. Foster, Jesse 
Parker, Bob Browder, and Lizzie 
Jackson. 

Sixty women and high school 
girls heard Mrs. J. V. Edington 
of Abilene present a vivid por-
trait of Luke, as visioned by 
author Taylor Caldwell, Tuesday 
afternoon. The review of "Dear 
and Glorious Physicians" at the 
First Methodist Church preludes 
a Bible Study. 

The plot of the story with 
Holy Land background and sett-
ing. is two-fold; a biography of 
Luke and the Life of Christ. 

Mrs. Keith Whitt will present 
the first lesson of a WSCS three-
session study of Luke, the third 
gospel, Tuesday, March 15th, in 
Fellowship Hall at 9:30 a. m. 

Guests attending the tea were 
served on arrival at Fellowship 
Hall and later retired to the sanc-
tuary for hearing the review. 

Cherry-lime punch and dainty 
sweets with colorful tasty mints 
were served by high school girls: 
Tomasine Whitt, Edith Bolt, Jo 
Nell Turner, Judy Mehaffey, Car-
ol Ramsey, Carol Hatcher, Linda 
Shell, Janice Day, Linda Harri-
son, Gerry Haile and Kay Ann 
Craddock. 

OUT OF TOWN GUESTS 
Out of town guests included 

Mesdames M. R. Thomas of Abi-
lene, Archie Robinson, C. E. May 
and Beulah Harrison of Ranger, 
W. H. Davis, John Arnold, H. E. 
Parks and C. S. Eldridge of Des-
demona. 

Hostesses for the Woman's So-
ciety of Christian Service were 
Mesdames Barton Eppler, Wilbur 
Shell, Melvin Shell, and R. C. 
Mehaffey. 

NEW DAUGHTER FOR 
THE BOB LOVES 

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Love, 3126 
Mayhew St., Dallas, announce 
the birth of Paula Kathleen, born 
March 6, 1960 at Baylor Medical 
Center. 

Maternal grandmother is Mrs. 
Joy Miller, Modesto, Calif. Pater-
nal grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. Cody Love of Dallas. Great 
grandparents are Mr. W. G. Bak-
er of Gorman and Mrs. R. B. 
Love of Canton. Ohio. 

Little Kathy was born on her 
mother's birthday. She has a 
little brother, Kyle, who is two 
years old. 

LYNDALL MORROW 
ON HPC HONOR ROLL 

The Dean of Howard Payne 
College has announced that 
James Lyndall Morrow has a-
chieved the honor of being on 
the HPC Honor List for the en-
tire Fall Semester. 

James is a secondary education 
major. His minor is physical ed-
ucation. He is a graduate of Car-
bon High School and a sopho-
more at Howard Payne. 

LLBACK FOR TCU FROGS 
The Fort Worth sportswriter's 

wrote that the coaches knew all 
along that Max could run with 
Spikes and Priddy, in fact, he 
was even better, but their experi-
ence in defense kept him from 
playing more than he did the 
past two seasons. With Spikes 
and Priddy both graduated Pierce 
is expected to carry on the fine 
tradition of the Frogs having out-
standing fullbacks. 

Max was not only an outstand-
ing athlete for four years at Gor-
man High School but was well 
respected and admired by all the 
people of this community for his 
spirit of fair play and determi-
nation in his studies as well as 
sports. As Max has progressed in 
his college football he has con-
tinued to show the same spirit 
and determination and the peo-
ple who know him are justly 
proud of Max's accomplishments 
and wish him well in his next 
and final season with TCU. 

MAX PIERCE - NO. 1 FU 
Max Pierce, shown above tak-

ing a hand off from Quarterback 
Jackie Sledge, has had the best 
spring training season he has had 
since entering TCU. As a result 
of his fine showing in this year's 
/final spring drills Max is listed 
as the Number 1 Fullback for 
Abe Martins Horned Frogs. 

An ankle injury slowed Max 
down some when he was a Soph-
omore but even so he lettered the 
past tWo years as fullback and 
has participated in two post sea-
son Bowl games. Year before last 
he played in the Cotton Bowl 
game and last year in the Blue 
Bonnet Bowl in Houston. 

Every Town In County 
To Be Represented At 
County Stock Show 

Max has the distinction of hav-
ing never lost a yard in all his 
college career. He has made sonic 
yardage on every play. In the 
final scrimmage game Max made 
78 yards in 11 carries; scored one 
touchdown and was the outstand 
ing back in the spring drills. 

ITEMS OF 

INTEREST 
BUSINESSMEN'S CLUB TO 
MEET MONDAY NIGHT 

Members of the Businessmen's 
Club will hold their regular 
monthly meeting Monday night, 
March 14th. at the Fire Hall. 

DRIVERS LICENSE EXAMS 
THURSDAY, MARCH 17 

On Thursday, March 17, exam-
inations and tests for drivers 
licenses will be held at the Fire 
Hall in Gorman beginning at 
10:00 a. m. 

WSCS MEETING SET 
FOR TUESDAY, MARCH 15 

The WSCS will meet on Tues-
day, March 15th in the Fellow-
ship Hall of the First Methodist 
Church at 9:30 a. m. 

GAME PRESERVE TO MEET 
TUESDAY NIGHT, MARCH 15 

The Sabanna Valley Game Pre-
serve Association will hold its 
regular meeting Tuesday night, 
March 15 at the Center Point 
Community House, 5 miles south 
of Carbon. Members are urged 
to attend. Visitors will be wel-
come. 

Refreshments of coffee and 
cake will be served at the close 
of the business meeting. Tables 
will be available for those who 
may wish to play "42", dominoes 
or Canasta after the meeting. 

SINGINGS SCHEDULED FOR 
COMANCHE MARCH 11 - 13 

Singing will be held at the 
Liberty Free Will Baptist Church 
in Comanche beginning at 7:30 
p. m. Friday, March 11. 

There will also be singing at 
the Congregational Methodist 
Church of Comanche on Sunday 
afternoon, March 13. The church 
is located on Mercer Gap and 
Lake Eanes Road, 1 mile south 
of the square. 

NOTICE TO WOMEN 
A Crusade for freedom of Tex-

as women where their legal 
rights are concerned forms the 
core of activities for the Texas 
Federation of Business and Pro-
fessional Women's Clubs. 

Pamphlets on these legal prob-
lems can be obtained by writing 
Executive Secretary, Texas Fed-
eration of Business and Profess-
ional Women's Clubs, 501 Burk-
burnett Bldg., Fort Worth, Texas 

Excelsior Clubbers 
Toss Hats In Ring Approximately 225 F. F. A. 

and 4-H Club members, repre-
senting every community in the 
county, will compete for ribbons 
and $1,500 prize money at the 
Eastland County Livestock Show 
March 25 and 26. 

Exhibitors will show fat lambs, 
breeding sheep, goats, fat hogs, 
breeding hogs, fat steers, breed-
ing beef cattle, and dairy ani-
mals. Approximately one half of 

CARD OF THANKS 

We take this method to thank 
each and every one for every-
thing that you did during the ill-
ness and death of our husband 
and father.For the flowers, food, 
prayers and sympathy. 

Wife and Children of 
Charlie Denton 

lone." The famous Harvard as-
tronomer estimated that there 
might be a hundred million plan-
ets capable of supporting our 
kind of life." 

OMAR BURLESON 
VISITS GORMAN 

A group of businessmen hon-
ored Congressman Omar Burle-
son with an informal dinner at 
the Lone Cedar Country Club 
last Friday evening. The group 
expressed their appreciation to 
Mr. Burleson for the work he 
has done on behalf of the peanut 
farmer in the Southwest. 

the entriets for this year's sh5w 
will be in the fat lamb and fat 
hog divisions. 

Additional pens had to be a-2d-
ed to the facilities at the slt,w 
grounds to take care of the rec-
ord number of entries for this 
year's show. The additional pens 
were put on the northwest side 
of the Show barn. Members of 
the Livestock Raisers Association 
have worked nights getting the 
additional pens and facilities 
ready for this year's Show. 

The show, sponsored by the 
Eastland County Livestock Rais-
ers Association, is on the east 
side of Lake Eastland. George 
Steele, Rising Star rancher and 
businessman, is president. Wav-
erly Massengale, Eastland utility 
company employee and rancher, 
is General Superintendent. His 
assistants are Keith McDonald, 
Ranger, and Johnny Aaron, East-
land. 

Park Plambeck, Pleasant Hill, 
and Charles Veale, Ranger, are 
swine superintendents. 

Walter Kurklin and Bob Lev-
eridge, Cisco, are superintend-
ents of the sheep and goat divis-
ion. 

Brandy Humphrey and Jerry 
Chaney, Eastland, will have 
charge of the fat steers. 

George Rodgers, vice president 
of the sponsoring organization, 
and Ed Harrison, immediate past 
president, will supermind the 
beef cattle division. Both are 
from Gorman. 

This and many other books are 
available to you through the 
Progress Library without charge 
or obligation. 

• 
I appreciate the interest and 

publicity the Abilene Reporter 
has given our town, especially 
the Progress Library. Mr. Wright, 
their genial reporter, has been 
more than generous with the 
space allotted him. 

Someday I hope to have a buil-
ding large enough to have sep-
arate quarters for your library 
with chairs, tables, etc. Incident-
ally I have added another new 
book, ''Labor U. S. A." by Lester 
Velie. It is a candid look at 
American Labor today: its lead-
ers - good and bad - their drives, 
feuds, hopes and fears. 

Why this library? Every man 
should have a desire to do some-
thing for his 'town and the peo-
ple who have-  contributed to his 
success in business. 

Mr. Burleson, a former citizen 
of Gorman, always enjoys com-
ing to Gorman as he has many 
friends in this area. 

Tuesday night at Mrs. Martha 
Sutton's home the first action in 
the field of politics was noted. 

"Government's Greatest A-
chievements Have Been Attained 
Through Bipartisan Efforts." 

The members of the Excelsior 
Club had quite a bipartisan dis-
cussion on the candidates - pres-
ent and prospective. 

Mrs. J. W. Townsend took the 
announced Republican candidate, 
Vice-President Richard Nixon, 
and gave a complete run-down 
on his past, present and hopes 
for the future on him and his 
family. She also gave a short 
discussion on Gov. Nelson Rock-
erfellow. 

Mrs. Dahlia Steele was on the 
Democratic side and for her first 
subjects she had the only two 
Democrats that will admit they 
are candidates: Senators John F. 
Kennedy and Humphries. Sena-
tor Lyndon B. Johnson was the 
next under discussion; then came 
Symington, after that the "Two 
Time Loser" Adlai Stevenson. All 
very interesting, and food for a 
lot of thought. 

Some of the members were 
about ready to go to the polls 
but we stayed long enough to 
enjoy a most delightful refresh-
ment plate. 

Everyone was in a thoughtful 
and happy mood as we bade our 
hostess goodnight. 

See you at the polls! 

"Harlow Shapley, interviewed 
recently by the Associated Press, 
declared flatly, "We are not a- 

Honoring in the "Progress" this 
week is a young man who needs 
no introduction to us Gormanites. 

"Little" George Rodgers, af-
fectionately called, is pictured 
here with a new addition to his 
herd, Junior Husker Mischievous. 
The bull was purchased at the 

recent Fort Worth Livestock 
Show in Ft Worth. No newcomer 
to the ranching business in Gor-
man, George is aiming at perfec-
tion in his registered herd, as his 
Dad, Dr. D. V. Rodgers, is well-
known for. 

Continued on Page Four 

.011r 6tirmatt Progrr0s VISIT THE 
Progress Public Library 

No Obligations - No Charges 
No Signatures 

IMPORTANT PEANUT 

MEETING HERE MARCH 15 
D. B. Warren, Southwestern Peanut Growers' Associa-

tion Director, has announced that an important peanut 
growers meeting will be held at Gorman at 7:30 p..m., 
Tuesday, March 15. The meeting will be held in the high 
school auditorium. 

Several items of vital interest to peanut producers will 
be discussed. Plans for increasing planted peanut allotment 
in Eastland County will be one of the featured items. Mr. 
Emmett Powell, ASC office manager, will explain new 
peanut acreage allotment provisions. Eastland County has 
lost hundreds of thousands of dollars the past two years 
clue to the lack of planting alloted peanut acres. 

B. C. Langley, Supt. of the West Cross Timbers Experi-
ment Station, Stephenville, will explain to growers the 
latest practices relative to the prevention and control of 
Southern Blight and other plant diseases. 

Rcss Wilson, SWPGA manager, will answer grower 
quesions relating to 1960 peanut price support program. 

Refreshments will be served by the Gorman Business-
men's Club. All growers in the area are cordially invited 
to attend the meeting. 

Photo Courtesy Fort Werth Press 

HULLS 
by Kernel Gene, aPe 

• 
"of Stars and Men" by Harlow 

Shapley is the latest addition to 
the Prgress Library. Part of the 
book I have read and enjoyed -
a portion of it is too scientific 
for me to understand. G. F. Ben-
nett said he read it with a dic-
tionary in his other hand. Donald 
Bolt read it through almost with-
out stopping. 

The following is copied from 
the preface: "Suddenly as man 
begins to launch his own satel-
lites into outer space, there seems 
a remote chance of finding an 
answer to the age-old question, 
Are we the only human beings 
in this incredibly vast universe? 
Are there other people, more or 
less like us - perhaps even su-
perior to us - on other planets? 
If so, what does there existence 
mean to the master of Sun's third 
planet as he wonders about his 
own significance and ponders the 
will of God? 

\--ennesti»! 



KEEPING UP 
WITH FRIENDS 
Weekend guests in 'the home 

of Mr. and Mrs. J. W. Burns were 
Mr. and Mrs. Noel Burns from 
McGregor and Mrs. L. A. Shupp 
of Stephenville. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Rankin and 
daughter, Carole Rae, and Mr. 
Goodloe Baker went to Dallas 
last Friday night to visit relatives 
and friends and returned on Sun-
day afternoon. Ray attended a 
sales meeting on Saturday. 

Mr. and Mrs. M. H. Fairbetter 
and son left Wednesday for Ham-
lin to spend a few days with 
their son, W. M. Fairbetter, and 
family. 

Anna Bell Buske received 
word last Friday that her nep-
hew, Jake Duske of Sonora, pass-
ed away on March 3rd, 1960 from 
a heart attack. 

ness he was not able to have a 
party. 

Little Rickey is the victim of 
Leukemia. 

Cue.  • 	• 	• ONEI..!.5 otraAkarows.) 

	

Sovereigns crowned, married 	 
and buried here, 

Swayer 	  
uopuoi - kaqqy uolsieui4s-pm 

INSIDE 
DIFFERENCE IN A CHEVY WAGON! 

See Corvair for the wide, wide differ-
ence in compact cars! 
Every Corvair gives you a fold-down rear 
seat for extra storage space—at not a 
penny extra. And this is only one of 
-many advantages you'll find in no other 
compact car in the land! 

GRAPEFRUIT  

5c each 

PociiwAEErrir RtzENJ UICE 6ricc 
PATIO TAMALES 303  can 19c 

MELLORINE 1/2  GAL 39c 

STRAWBERRY PRESERVES"409zc 
FLAIR SHORTENING ""an  59c 
mrs GROCERY & MARKET 

We Deliver 	 Phone 40 

Live a, little ... and allow yourself the luxury of efficient, dependably 
Gas clothes drying! For all its advantages, economical Gas coddles yot 

clothes a whole year for no more than the price of a good clothes basket! L4ts 
you laugh at ever-mounting piles of laundry because whenever you do 

decide to get with it ... ZOOP! and you're through, faster than a 
West Texas jackrabbit. If you don't know the phone slumber 

of a Gas appliance dealer, call us. We know 'em all! 

a moats empbs Pioneer Natural Gas Company 
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KOKOMO NEWS 
By Mrs. Glenn Jordan 

Mr. Glenn Alexander of Lin-
coln, Nebraska was visiting with 
his sister and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Victor Pack and children, 

	..\41k  
Cburtb ttut  	

Name This Church' Can You 

Word has been received that 
Mr. and Mrs. Handley Kirk were 
involved in automobile accident 
in Waco at 12:45 P. M. Monday 
Mrs. Kirk was injured and is in 
th eHillcrest Hospital at Waco. 

Mrs. Luellen Holmes of Pueblo, 
Colo. is visiting with her sister, 
Mrs. Maud Smith. 

TAKE A rip 
riotti 	2.44; 

last Monday. Visiting with the 
Packs on Saturday night were 
her sister and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. W. M. James, Billy and Jo 
of Shamrock. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Eaves, 
Johnny and Bobby, Linda Eaves, 
Glenda Jordan, Larry Morrow, 
and Dwayne Snider attended the 
Youth Rally at the Baptist 
Church in Albany on Saturday 
night. 

Sylvia Hendricks was confined 
to her home several days with 
a throat virus. 

Mr. W. T. Henderson and sons 
of Rising Star visited with Mr. 
and Mrs. John W. Henderson on 
Friday night. 

• 	 - :I 
BIRTHDAY PARTY FOR 
LITTLE RICKEY MARBLE 

Last Sunday in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. J. H. Barbee, a 
birthday party was given in hon-
or of Little Rickey Marble who 
was four years old. He was hap-
pily surprised with a Jot of toys 
and had two birthday cakes, bak-
ed by Mrs. Gaylon Evans and 
Mrs. Buck Anderson. 

Those present to help enjoy the 
party were Mr. and Mrs. Delton 
Chambers and daughter, Mr. and 
Mrs. Woody Chambers and fam-
ily, and Mr. and Mrs. Dewey 
Chambers and family, all of Ris-
ing Star, Mrs. Cotton Shifflett 
and children of De Leon, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jimmie Nash and baby and 
Mr. Isra Anderson of Ft Worth, 
Mr. and Mrs. Gaylon Evans and 
Scott Marble of Stephenville, Mr. 
and Mrs. Clyde Barbee and Mrs. 
Etta Finley of Eastland, Mr. and 
Mrs. Buck Anderson and sons, 
and Miss Ozella Pulley of Gor-
man. 

Rickey came up from Houston 
with his mother and father, Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Marble, for the 
weekend. 

January 20th. was actually his 
birthdate but on account of ill- 

Mrs. Thomas Prague has been 
visiting in the home of her par-
ents, Mr. and Mrs. "Quail" 
Thompson. 

Mr. and Mrs. Check Smith 
were in Lubbock Wednesday on 
a business trip. 

Mr. and Mrs. B. W. Rankin 
have sold their farm and moved 
to Ft Worth on Thursday of this 
week. Their son, Robert, has 
been working there for several 
months. 

Mrs. Donna Day returned last 
weekend from Abilene where she 
has beer at the bedside of Mrs. 
Alma Elliott who has been seri-
ously ill in the Hendricks Me-
morial Hospital. Mrs. Eliott had 
major surgery but at last report 
she' was somewhat improved. 

Income Tax 
Service 

See ARLTON E. SMITH 
At SMITH DRUG 

' See The Dinah Shore Chevy Show in color Sundays, NBC-TV—the Pat Boone Chevy Showroom weekly ABC-TV Air Conditioning—temperatures made to orde —for all-weather comfort. 

•-• 

••=•••.. rfir 
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OPEN THE ONE-PIECE TAILGATE—SEE THE 

IED 
allows more room for bulky loads. • Widest 
choice of engines and transmissions-24 
combinations in all, to give you peak per-
formance with any kind of load. ■ Full Coil 
springs that ride right loaded or light- 
no other wagon near (levy's price and size 
gentles the bumps with coil s, rings at all four 
wheels. • More road and ramp clearance 
—you can take full loads over bumps and 
grades without scraping bumpers. is Truly 
practical 9-passenger model—with roomy 
rear-facing third scat 
and electric roll-down 
rear window. 

CIIEIROLET 

Chevy Wagons are widest where wagons 
should be—with the widest seating, the 
widest cargo space and the widest choice 
of power teams in the low-price field. 
Check any of the five handy, handsome 
new models at your dealer's. You won't 
find these versatile advantages in any 
other wagon near Chevy's size and price! 
■ Widest seating, front and rear—up to 
a full 3.1 inches wider in front, up to 4.2 
inches in the rear. al Widest cargo area—the 
load platform's a whopping 	feet wide, 
designed for a wider variety of cargo. 
II Widest area between wheel housings— 

See your local authorized Chevrolet dealer for fast delivery, favorable deals! 

SMITH BROS. CHEVROLET CO. 
Phone 26 Gorman, Texas 

J. T. Gregory 
Distributing Co. 

SERVE 	• 

411- 	GRADE A 

MILK 
AND OTHER FINE 
DAIRY PRODUCTS 

EASTLAND, TEXAS 

Jack Boyd, 
SALESMAN 

Mr. and Mrs. Glenn Jordan and 
Teddy visited with Mr. and Mrs. 
Claude Fuller on Saturday night. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Eaves and 
children were guests of the 
Claude Fullers on Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. George Eppler 
and children of San Angelo spent 
the weekend visiting with Mr. 
and Mrs. W. A. O'Neal and Mr. 
and Mrs. Albert Hendricks and 
Sylvia. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Eaves and 
children of Cisco were visiting 
with Mr. and Mrs. A. B. Eaves 
on Saturday night. On Sunday 
Mr. and Mrs. A. B. Eaves were 
visiting with his sister and fam-
ily, Mr. and Mrs. Jim Smith, at 
Rising Star. 

Mr. and Mrs. M. M. Logan and 
Joe Charles of Dublin visited 
with her brother, Mr. and Mrs. 
J. L. Morrow and Larry on..Sun-
day. 

\ Mr. and Mrs. Tidy Eaves were 
dinner guests of Mr. and Mrs. 0. 
N. Justice on Sunday. 

Rev. and Mrs. Jackie Heath 
and children were guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Calvin Brown on Sun-
day. 

SHEEP & GOAT MEN 
HEAD FOR WASHINGTON 

Two representatives of the 
Sheep and Goat Raisers .  Assn. 
are to go to Washington for the 
hearing on lamb and mutton im-
ports before the U. Si Tariff Com-
mission March 22. 

Imports of both frozen and 
live lamb from Australia have 
been on the increase and many.  
growers feel these imports are 
definitely affecting the price of 
the domestic supply. They be-
lieve the domestic market will 
improve if importh are halted, or 
put on a quota basis. 

TS&GRA directors have been 
urged through letters from the 
headquarters office, to write 
their U. S. Senators an'd Repre-
sentatives and explain the real 
situation and describe how these 
imports have affected the lamb 
and mutton trade in their par-
ticular areas. 

EIGHTH GRADE NEWS 

Track started Monday. They 
had to practice in the gym be-. 
cause of bad weather. 

We had visitation week last 
week and our day was on Wed-
nesday, the day we turned out 
school. 

There were eight pupils gone 
from our class Friday. 

Seven were absent Monday. 
Most of the illness was from flu. 

The thought that there are only 
ten more weeks of school brings 
joy to everyone's mind. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lonnie Rush of 
Lubbock spent the weekend with 
their cousin, Mr. and Mrs. John 
Lasater. 

Mrs. Mary Timmons and Mrs. 
J. A. McNeeely were able to be 
back in church on Sunday morn-
ing after lengthy illnesses. 

Mr. and Mr's. Delman Eaves 
and children were dinner guests, 
Sunday, of Mr. and Mrs. R. Q. 
Graham. 

Mr. John Scitern and niece, 
Maragaret Reeves, went to Hous-
ton on Sunday to visit with Mr. 
Henry Scitern. They report that 
he wasn't feeling as well Sunday 
as he had earlier in the week. 
However, he has been able to sit 
us some and is doing as well as 
could be expected. Mrs. John 
Scitern and children were unable 
to make the trip due to the chil-
dren being sick with a virus. 

Mrs. Nancy Hendricks and 
Sylvia visited with Mrs. W. F. 
Bryant on Sunday afternoon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Jordan, Mrs. 
Glenn Jordan and Glenda and 
Mrs. H. C. Wharton of Carbon 
attended the funeral of Mrs. H. 
J. Lane in Eastland n Sunday 
afternoon. 

Mr. and. Mrs. A. B. Eaves were 
visiting with Mrs. Carra Sessurn 
on Monday afternoon. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Donaldson 
visited in De Leon on Sunday 
with his sister and brother-in-
law, Mr. and Mrs. W. E. Filcher. 

Miss Carolyn Scitern and Mrs. 
Dave Callison of Duster went to 
Houston with their brothers, Al-
vis and John Scitern, last week 
to be with their Dad, Henry 
Scitern. Carolyn remained there 
for several days. 

HIGGINBOTHAM'S 
AMBULANCE SERVICE 

Night Phone 243 	Day 11 

Born Mter His Daddy Died - 
. . . . did little Tommy cloud the title to his mother's 
home? Or suppose little Tommy was born out of wedlock 
would this affect the titles to the properties owned, if any, 
by his father, or mother, or both? These and many other 
heirship problems may arise in any title which the lawyers 
or the courts must finally decide. The abstract, which pre-
sents the facts and conditioas surrounding such circum-
stances, is and always has been, the most important part 
of any real estate transaction. 

Earl Bender & Company 
EASTLAND (Abstracts Since 1923) 	TEXAS 

.1•••••••••( 

Clothes Drying lets you loaf through the laundering! 
5-01T-7§ 

432.,  _ P 	114410 
r rap 

WINDSHIELDS 

INSTALLED 

In All Makes 

of Automobiles 

All Work Guaranteed 
We Give Free Estimates 

BEGGS PAINT & BODY SHOP 
110 Gonzales St. 	DE LEON 

	
Phone 3851 

•:;•',•!?!•:.w.t ct,  • • "": 	• • 	• • • 	• 	-f -f•A liftfitsre. 	:,1r..t4axei,met triwitt luck. 
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THE TIME SHOP 
4 

ALFRED GRICE, USN.. 
ON DUTY IN WEST PACIFIC 

DESDEMONA 
NEWS 

Watch Repairing To A Science SAN FRANCISCO, Calif, (FH-
TNC.) - - Alfred L. Grice, air-
man apprentice, USN, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. A. L. Grice of Gorman, 
departed San Francisco, Calif., 
Feb. 6, aboard the attack aircraft 
carrier USS Ranger for a six-
month tour of duty with the U. 
S. Seventh Fleet in the Western 
Pacific. 

The largest 'flattop" in the 
Pacific, the Ranger was transfer-
red from the Atlantic Fleet in 
June, 1958, and is now on her 
second cruise to the Far East. 

196 
CENSUS is 

COMING 
C 

We carry a Complete Line of 
standard Jewelry Store Merchan-
dise. Watch Repair & Materials. 

No Long Waits. 

ETHEL KEITH, Reporter 

The Desdemona School closed 
on Friday and Monday, March 4 
and 7th due to illness. 

Mrs. Nora Lane has been in 
Eastland this past week at the 
bedside of her mother, 	Mrs. 
Amanda Rogers, who has been 
quite ill in the Eastland Hos-
pital. 

Little Sue Owens, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Owens, was a 
patient at the Gorman hospital 
a few days last week. 

The Stanley Clayton family arc 
all ill with the flu. 

The Rim Packs have been ill 
with colds and flu. 

Mr. Horace Lane and Mrs. 
Gracie Lewis have a sister, Mrs. 
Winnie Brown, in the Gorman 
hospital suffering from broken 
bones received from a fall on ice. 

Mr. and 'Mrs. Odis Wright of 
Andrews spent last week here 
with her sister, Mr. and Mrs. 
John Arnold. 

The Johnnie Dean Raglands 
were here last week visiting his 
parents, the Clarence Raglands. 

Aaron E. Henslee was home 
from College this week to visit 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. Aaron 
Henslee. 

Carson Loving has been dis-
charged from the service and has 
returned home. Mr. and Mrs. 
Loving, the former Sandra Hens-
lee, have moved to their new 
home near Lingleville. 

The Chubbie Foremans of Ft 
Worth spent the weekend here 
with her parents, the Roy Guth-
eys. 

Mr. and Mrs. E. E. Hunter of 
Ranger visited Sunday with his 
sister, Mrs. Dess Abernathy. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Barker 
have moved to Ft Worth. Wayne 
will work in the repair shop with 
his father. Lester Barker. 

Mrs. Maud Fuqua, who under-
went surgery at the Gorman hos-
pital several days ago, is now at 
home and well on her way to 
recovery. 

GORMAN, TEXAS 4 MR. & MRS. 0. N. JUSTICE 

tieteeteeteteettee<W,Pteee'M>eC,e.  BE SURE YOU'RE COUNTED 

WITH ALL AMERICANS 
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at 
auction market group in Febru-
ary, 1958 when the state organi-
zation had a membership of only 
16 markets. 

TLAA's roster of member mar-
kets now totals 92 located in 
every section of Texas, and the 
association, 19th. in national 
ranking in 1958, now ranks No. 1 
of the 37 state organizations in 
the nation. 

During Sunday's final business 
session, J. T. Wooten, Rocky 
Mount, N. C., president, National 
Assn. of Livestock Auction Mar-
kets, announced that the Texas 
Association, ranked No. 2 in 1959, 
had now passed the state of Iowa 
which had been rated No. 1 for 
five years. 

The directors voted Executive 
Director Lee a bonus and auth-
orized a substantial increase in 
all items of appropriations for 
promotional, publicity and legis-
lative services rendered from 
TLAA's state office at Strawn. 

GROVER C. LEE, JR. 
Re-Appointed as Executive 

Director, Nation's No. 1 
Markets Group 

IN THE 1906 Spiv FRANCISCO 
EARTIIQUAK: and FIRE, THE 

HARTFORD PAID CLAIMS OF MORE 
THAN // MILLION POLLARS— 

THE GREATEST LOSS EVER TO CON- 
FRONT AN AMERICAN INSURANCE 

COMPANY ur TO THAT TIME! 

ef! LEE RE-NAMED 
AS DIRECTOR 
STATE GROUP 

vif 
L. 
t t 

A Person Gets Curious And - Noses Around - In Our 
Store And The First Thing You Know Has Found 
Just What They Were Looking For — You Try It 

OUR NEW STOCK OF NOW 
IN ITS 150+1,  YEAR,  

THE HARTFORD FIRE: 
INSURMCE 

cLAims 
COMPANY 

ppqG  
AvEgAGING MORE 

THAN 

$56,000,000  

ANNUALLY! 

MILK COLOR GLASSWARE FAST, RELIABLE CLAIMS 
HANDLING IS ONE OF SEVERAL 
IMPORTANT BENEFITS WE OFFER  
OUR CLIENTS THROUGH COMPANIES 
SUCH As THE HARTFORD. 
WANT TO BE SURE OF THIS SEW.VICE 
WHEN YOU HAVE A LOSS ? 
CALL US TODAY. 

MAKES A VERY PRETTY TABLE SETTING 

ABILENE, Texas - - Grover C. 
Lee, Jr., of Strawn has been re-
appointed for a third successive 
years as executive director of 
Texas Livestock Auction Assn. 

The Strawn man's re-appoint-
ment to the post of executive of-
ficer of the 21-year-old state mar-
kets trade association was an- 
nounced late Sunday afternoon 
by Riley R. Kothmann, Uvalde, 
president-elect of the organiza-
tion, following the close of TL-
AA's 1960 convention held at the 
Windsor Hotel. 

The Strawn man first was nam 17th. District, Texas: 
ed as executive director of the ROY SKAGGS, Abilene 

SOMETHING ELSE PRETTY 
IS THE PRICE ON OUR 

Political 
Announcements 

S

e 

SLIPS & 
PETTICOATS Gorman Insurance Agency 

The Gorman Progress has been 
authorized to announce candi-
dates for public office in the 
Democratic primary election as 
follows: 

W. G. Kirk 	Berenice Jeffs 

Phone 134 Gorman, Texas OUR N E W 
FOR CONGRESSMAN: Artificial Flowers Iteitesentng #t HARTFORD FIRE INSuctaNCE COMPANY MOP 

HARTFORD i5, CONN. LOOK LIKE THE 
REAL THING 

WE HAVE PLENTY OF 

Easter Eggs 
WHO'S WHO 

R. M. (Bob) Vv-AGSTAFF 
of Abilene 

CONTEST RULES FOR SHERIFF: 
Lee Horn 
W. E. Reid 

	

1. This is a family fun contest. En- 	J. B. Williams (re-election) 
tries welcome from every member of the 

	

family old enough to fill out his or her 	0. M. (Hop) WHITE  
own. You MAY submit me entry per 
person at any or all rf the Sponsoring FOR TAX ASSESSOR- 
Merchants whose ads are In the row COLLECTOR: 
that is heavily bordered this week — 

	

hut only one entry per person at any 	J. C. Allison (re-election) 
one store (more than one will disqualify 
all entries of that person for that week.) 
Anyone may enter unless a member of 
your family is employed by the Gorman 
Progress. Sponsoring merchants and 
their families (and their employees and 
families) are most welcome to enter 
EXCEPT during weeks that entries are 
brought into that Sponsor's place of 
business. 

TODD'S VARIETY STORE 

CARD OF THANKS 

I wish to express my appreci-
ation for the cards, letters, and 
flowers, and the prayers offered 
in my behalf, while I was in the 
hospital. 

May God's richest blessings be 
yours. 

Who's Who 
in Gorman Mrs. John Wheeler 

Authorized Dealer For PHILCO TV &  IRadio 

"AUTHORIZED FACTORY SERVICE MAN" 
We Give S & H Green Stamps 

Gorman, Texas Phone 4 
FOR STATE REP. 
76TH. DISTRICT: 

Paul Brashear (re-election) 
Don Kincaid 
Scott Bailey 

WHERE TO LOOK FOR CLUES 
H1UGINBOTHAM'S 

AMBULANCE SERVICE 
Night Phone 243 	Day 1' 

Clues may be hidden in ANY ad in this group ad. When a 
Star appears in any of these ads, it means that additional 
advertising of that merchant appears elsewhere in this issue 
of the paper, and additional clues may be hidden in any of 
those ads, also! 

Clues will be scattered .. . there may be from one to five 
clues in any ad - or none. This is a contest of skill - and we 
intend to do our best to outwit you. We invite you to do 
your best to outwit us! 

Copyright 1959 by B. Reinhardt. All rights reserved. 

FOR STATE SENATOR 
22ND. DISTRICT: 

Torn Creighton 

2. Nothing to buy. Use any slip of 
paper for entry blank. DO NOT put 
your entry in an envelope; Not neces-
sary to be present at the drawing to 
win. Not necessary to be a subscriber 
to the PROGRESS to participate. FOR CONSTABLE, Precinct Five 

E. L. (Jug) DENNIS. re-election 
BILL PARTEN D g Good 

At Home 

3. WHO'S WHO may he anyone in 
the GORMAN territory. Clues to his 
ior her identity will be hidden ONLY 
In ads of Sponsoring Merchants A this 
means any ad in this section or any ad 
of the same merchants elsewhere in 
the paper.) When a star • or stars •• 
appear in any ad in this section, It is 
your warning that other ad (s) of the 
same merchant (in which there may he 
clues) while others may have as many 
as five. Beware of false clues; there 
may be some! This is a contest of skill. 
and we intend to do our best to outwit 
you. We'll be delighted if you succeed 
in outguessing us, in spite of our best 
efforts! 

SMITH BROS. 
CHEVROLET CO. 

*Sales -CHEVROLET- Service 

Phone 26 	I 	Gorman 
Hardware - Lumber 

Furniture 
EASTLAN D 

CHIROPRACTIC 
OFFICE 

Office hours 9 to 5 p.m. 
Closed Thurs. - Sat. at noon 

DR. R. G. VERHETSEL, D.C. 

101 S. Hillcrest - Eastland 
Phone 536 

• 

4. If. by coincidence, the name of 
the WHO'S WHO or other facts about 
him) happen to appear in news items. 
editorial matter or other places in this 
newspaper, these will not count as 
clues. JAY'S 

GROCERY & MARKET 

Friendly Service 
Throughout The Years 

Gorman Tuns 

Dry Goods - Shoes 

5. To enter, write down the nam' 
you think the WHO'S WHO is. List all 
the clues you can find in all the ads of 
the SpOnsoring Merchants in this Issue. 
Don't forget your own name and ad-
dress! Then, drop your entry at any 
Sponsoring Merchant whose ad is be-
tween the heavy borders in this issue.  

You may enter at all four if you wish! 
There are no other places where entries 
will be acceptell—and mail entries will 
not be accepted. Any member of the 
family may bring in all entries for that 
family. Children under 12 must be ac-
companied by an adult. 

Phone 40 	We Deliver Ready-to-Wear 
a 

Crx0•-9-..enCrK.6ex0)e-Ge•-44 

Dr. Fehrmon H. Lund 
Optometrist 

Eye Examinations — 
Prescribing of Lenses 

— Visual Rehabilitation 

TODD'S VARIETY 
Authorized Philco Dealer 

S & H Green Stamps 

ORMSBY'S GROCERY 

A Dependable Source of 
High Quality Products 

Tops To Small Fry 
Joe Ormsby 	Phone 22 Mr. & Mrs. E. E. Todd Ph. 4 6. This week's contest starts when 

you receive this issue, and closes at 4 
P. m. of the following week. At that 
time (4 p. in. next Monday) a drawing 
will he held. The first entry drawn that 
correctly identifies the WHO'S WHO 
will win $7.00. If THAT entry also 
lists every correct clue (and NO false 
clues) hidden in all ads of sponsoring 
_merchants, a BONUS of $5 will be add-

d. Whenever this BONUS is not won. it 
will be added to next week's BONUS—
which will continue to grow until it is 
son! Winning BONUS requires a PER-
FECT list of correct clues—the exact 
htmther and all copied correctly. 

MAin 9-1177 405-6 Exchange Bg 
EASTLAND, TEXAS 

MR. AND MRS. GENE BARNETT 
ROBERTSON 

GULF STATION THE TIME SHOP We are proud of the young people entering business in 
WIT 

Gas - Oil - Greasing 
S & H Green Stamps PEST CONTROL German and compliment the Barnetts on their grocery and 

station. 
Watch Repairing & Jewelry 

Mr. & Mrs. 0. N. Justice 
93 Phone 

We fight disease through Inse( 
Ind Rodent Control. 

Write for information 
BRUCE CLEVELAND 

MIRACLE LABORATORIES 

Phone 2-9575 	Borns 
Brownwood, Texas 

Home Office, Abilene. Too,  

Hwy. 6 

J. W. MIEARS, Consignee 
THOMPSON'S HARDWARE 

Quality - Not Price 

Home Owned 	Phone 157 
Phone 42-R2 

Mobil 

Products 

Gorman 

GORITIAll 

TEXAS 

Ev• ry possible precaution' will be 
u to prevent typographical errors 

that might be mistaken for clues, but 
errorless typography CANNOT BE GUA-
RANTEED thy anyone). The-publisher 
of The Gorman Progress will be the 
Judge in all questions, and his decision 
in ill MODERN MEMORIALS 

(nationally advertised) 
We Specialize In 

COROFLEK PAINTING 
WELDING - Arc & Acetylene 

Shop Located At 
301 North Kent Street 
LONNIE E. CAPERS 

HENDERSON'S VARIETY WRIGHT BROS. 
IMPLEMENT CO. `Oldest Bank In Eastland County: Family participation gives you a 

better chance to win the Jack-pot. Your 
%vire, husband, or some bright-eyed 
youngster MAY spot a clue that you 
miss! 

Contributes Generously 
Headquarters For Gifts 

Toys & School Supplies 
Massey-Ferguson Dealer 

Gabe Wright 	Phone 139 Got any Perry Mason in you? Think 
YOU can outwit the contest? Remem-
ber you can't win if you don't enter! 



OLIVER SPRINGS 
NEWS 

George Rodgers 
WANT ADS 

MARKETPLACE 

' 
OF !MILLIONS.. 

6. - 	41.ket.SlakitadaliSiteCiaTI 

EARLY BIRD GETS THE WORM 

NSW SPRING=   MIXTEiric 
Continued from Page One 

George is active as the Vice-
President of the Texas Livestock 
Raisers Assn. in Eastland, and is 
also a new member of the Farm 
Bureau. He is scheduled to over-
see the Beef Cattle Division in 
Eastland County Livestock Show 
on March 25-26, to which all are 
cordially invited. 

Married August 1 to a New 
Mexico girl. Pat, they are very 
torten seen on his 640 acres, keep-
ing a good watch on their small 
:but well-bred herd. 

By Florence Richardson 
Our Thought for the week: 
"It isn't necessary to blow out 

the other person's light in order 
to let your own shine." YOU SHOULD 

SEE THEM! I 
NOTICE - We do first class renovat-
ing on mattresses. Wo make new cot-
ton and Innerspring mattresses. PrIt• 
chard Mattress Factory. Phone 6941. 
De Leon. Free Pick-up & Delivery. 	fn 

The All Time Favorites 

CHECKS & POLKADOTS 

Are Better Than Ever For 

Easter This Year. 
We are proud to have George 

-and his wife in our community 
to carry on the tradition begun 
many years ago by his beloved 
grandfather, Dr. George Black-
well, and Dad, Dr. Rodgers. We 
tan also speculate that we'll be 
.hearing more good things of this 
young rancher in years to come. 

M ATTRESSES REBUILT — Have your 
old 	mattress made like a new ben tt- 
t (Cul innerspring mattress. Prices are 
reasonable, work guaranteed. Eppler's 
Furniture Store of Gorman represent-
ing Summers & Son Mattress Co. of 
Stephenville. Texas 

LADIES ARE 

ALWAYS WAITING FOR 

Solid L!nens - Beautiful 

Embroidorod Linens - Pure 

Silk Prints - Wash Silks 

Embroidered Polished 

Cottons - Stripes - Solids 

and Floral Prints in All 

Your Favorite Colors -

In Cottons and 

Combinations 

Hospital Report 
The following were reported as 

:patients at the Blackwell Hos-
pital in Gorman on Wednesday 
-morning: 

201 - Mrs. Robert Price, Dublin 
202 - W. R. Ware, De Leon 
:203 - Willie Layman, Comanche 
204 - Mrs. Burnet Eison, Gorman 
'205 - Mrs. Howard Gilbert, 

Carbon 
206 -  - Juanava Collins, Gorman 

- Mrs. Martin Warren, Hurst 
:209 - G. W. Dingus, Comanche 
:210 - Mrs. Harvey Johnsoon 

De Leon 	(No Visitors) 
!214a - Thomas B. Hawk, De Leon 

301 - Clyde Pulley, Gorman 
302 - W. L. Wolfenbarger, G'man 
303 - Mary Ann Echols, Gorman 
:304 - David Revels, Gorman 

(No Visitors) 
305 - W. S. Nichols, Caddo 
306 - Larry Kirk, Gorman 
307 - Linda Jarrett, Gorman 
308 - Johnny Eaves, Gorman 
310 - Mrs. 0. V. Lqudermilk, 

Comanche 
.311 - Dena Campbell, Gorman 

491 - Wesley Eads, De Leon 
(No Visitors) 

402 - Billy Gray, Gorman 
403 - Jim Rodgers, Gorman 
304 - J. R. Todd, Gorman 
495 - Sanford Lemley, Gorman 
-406 - Tommy Broom, Gorman 
407 - Marvin Nix, Gorman 
408 --Mrs. Cannie Pittman, G'man 
409 
410 
411 
412 
414 
415 
418 
419 

r3+ Who's To Pay 
The 

The following are reported 
residents of the Kirk's Nursing 
Home in in Gorman: 

Fiddler? 
41 

41/4U Mrs. Alice Whitley, Texico, .M 

What's That +fl 
r3+ 

You Say c (:1 /2  TIN Onrinait progrEss 
Entered as Second Class Moil at the Pos• 
Office in Gorman, Texas under 'he A- 
of March 3, 1878. Published on Thursdaytch 

?cc If you want to make your car glide along to a happy 40 at Gorman. Eostland County. Texas. ) 

KERNEL EOCENE BARER. (F.,,nr I' if liti Th r 	 EY.0iat 
JOE 13ENNETE. ftcgs/ant Pubb—.7.r 	 tune, fiddling around won't do it - - but our contin- ,41 

MRS. CARROLL MCKIE, Editor-Of fir' .” 
Herman Bennett. Apprentice 

tal 	

416.1 

WANTED — Carpenter Work. 
Venetian Blinds Repaired. Char- 
lie Goodwin. 	 4-7p 

B. E. SIMPSON service, plus the best motor oils and Texaco +0 

Mrs. J. J. Brown, Gorman 
J. C. LaGrone, Comanche 

- Fred Gray, Gorman 
- Glenda Rodgers, Gorman 
Mrs. J. W. Shook, De Leon 
- Mrs. Mattie Barker, DeLeon: 
- A. M. Thurman, Gorman 
- Loyd Chambers, Gorman , 

SEE ME OP. CONTACT L. F. KELLOGG at 123J 
PHONE 64 	 ' GORMAN 

SUBSCRIPTION RATES: 
Eastland, Comarche Counties 

$2.00 per year 

FOR SALE — To settle estate 
H. R. Mason's 6-room house and 
5 acres of land. See Dave Harper, 
Gorman. 	 3-31c 

ucus 

gasoline will. 

JOHNSON TEXACO 

SERVICE STATION 

11 lllllll 1111111111111111111111 llllllllllll 1 lllllll 1 lllllll 11 lllll 111111111111111111 lllllllllllll 1 lllll 11111 

All other subscriptions, $3.00 per year 
Service Men, Complimentary 484  

Enjoy modern AUTOMATIC yard lighting with the 
TEXAS L

rJ 
c)i, e PRESSE 

ti-'54 	
Gorman 4,461  

WESLEY SPIVEY, Operator 
We Give B & B Stamps 

Phone 225 	 Hwy. 6 

4g1 
- 41 

*017 
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FOR SALE — 6-room house, 
modern conveniences, re-model-
ed, glassed-in sleeping porch. —
4-room house, bath and wash 
porch, remodeled inside. — One 
lot 90x180, south front, one block 
east of school. Other lots avail-
able. Lots and houses priced to 
sell. Will move houses to town. 
J. C. Seaton, 12 miles north on 
Desdemona Hwy. cr see W. G. 
Baker Feed Store and he will 
give directions. 	2-25fnc 

	' 7,1F-i 	ntl 
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MRS. RANDALL KEY ROPER 

Marriage vows were solemnized Saturday, February 20, 
1960 in the chapel of the First Baptist Church of Plainview 
for Miss Linda Lee Self, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Tilman 
Self, and Randall Key Roper of Olson. 

Following the chapel ceremony guests were received in the 
church parlor. Laura Jeanene Smith, cousin of the bride, 
secured names at the register. 

Relatives attending from Gorman were the bride's uncle, 
George L. Smtih, and daughter and her aunts, Misses Linnie 
and Lellar Smith. 

The bride's mother, Mrs. Tilman Self, writes that her fam-
ily still consider Gorman as home. 

HAVE DIRT — WILL HAUL — FILL-IN 
AND LEVEL YOUR YARD 

BUILD DRIVEWAYS TO YOUR SPECIFICATIONS 

WORK DONE BY CONTRACT OR BY THE HOUR 

— LIVESTOCK & GRAIN HAULING — 

IS YOUR YARD LEVEL? 

We stock Sylvania Silver Screen 
85 TV Picture Tubes; Philco TV 
and Radios. Authorized factory 
service man for Philco. Phone 4 
for service. Todd's Variety Store, 
Gorman. 	 6-122nc 

DEAD ANIMAL SERVICE o 
— Hamilton Rendering Co. —
Free and Sure — Call Collect 

Phone 303, Hamilton, Texas. fn 

GUARANTEED TV SERVICE - 
Any make or model. No matter 
where you bought it. Kay Radio 
& TV, Dial 4905 	'De Leon, 
Texas. 	 11-13fnc 

NOTICE — Beginning Monday, 
December 7. until further notice, 
we will slwighter at the Locker 
Plant every day except Saturday. 
Chamber's Fi nzen Food Lockers. 
Phone 125, Gorman. 	12-l0fnc 

We have a complete line of 
Nursery Stock. Drive to our Nur-
sery for your Pecan Trees, Fruit 
Trees, Shrubs and Evergreens. 
We do landscaping. Womack's 
Nursery, (on Hwy. 6 near Rucker) 
De Leon, Texas. 	12-31fnc 

For the newer varieties of Peach 
and Pecan Trees come to our 
place. Open on Sundays after one 
p. m. Womanck's Nursery, (on 
Hwy. 6 near Rucker) De Leon, 
Texas. 	 12-31fnc 

MATTRESSES RENOVATED —
Save up to 50c1r. Guaranteed. 
Choice size, firmness. Matching 
box springs made by Western 
Mattress Company. Write Box 
5288, San Angelo, or phone Del-
ma's Beauty Shop, 229W2, Gor- 
man. 	 1-14fnc 

• FOR SALE — House, modern 
conveniences, 	100 ft. front lot. 
1/2 block in rear. E F. McCor- 
mack, Phone 72-W, 	1-14fnc 

MONUMENTS FOR SALE 
Guaranteed Monument Co. 
ARNOLD BUTLER, Rep. 

Well I can speak for the peo-
ple here in these parts - - we 
have really had some real winter 
weather. I think some sunshine 
would be welcomed by everyone.  
for a change. 

The Willie Hendersons have 
been in Galveston visiting rela-
tives. 

The Travis Wallis family of 
Borger were visiting the A. D. 
Bryans this past week. 

The R. H. and Kenneth Wat-
son families spent last weekend 
in West Texas visiting the Jim-
mie Bryans, Elmer Watson fam-
ily and Lula Brandon. 

Mr. an:i Mrs. Jessie Atchison 
were in Goldsmith Thursday 
visiting Mrs. Bob Atchison and 
Mrs. Irby Mauney. 

Word was received here' last 
week of the ddath of Mrs. Ida 
Hirst in Beeville. She lived here 
years ago and still owns proper-
ty in this community. 

The Rex Kinsers visited the 
Loyd Glassons Tuesday night. 

The Buel Bryans spent Wed-
nesday night with the A. D. Bry-
ans. They were leaving for their 
new destination at Swenson on 
Thursday. 

The Homer Richardsons and R. 
H. Watsons were dinner guests 
Sunday in the B. A. Hirst home. 

The Edward Johnsons were in 
Eastland Sunday afternoon. 
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Home Notes 

ADVERTISING RATES 
Display, per Column inch - 45. 
Naticnal, less agency disc. - 56c 
Classified Adverrsing 	3c per word 

Minimum charge 59. 

Mrs. Ella Counts, Gorman 	! 
Mr. J. E. Ryan, Glen Rose 
Mrs. Flavie Bunch, Ranger 

Mrs. Nora Bible, Gorman 

W. H. Trice, Gorman 
Mrs. W F. Wolfer-barge:. 
T: L. Johnson, De Leon 
George McCulloch, Cisco 	.  
Mrs. Dan Kinser, Gorman 

PHOTOS AND FILM 
Roll Film Developed - Jumbo 
Enlargements. 

8 exposure roil - 50c 
12 exposure roll - 65c 

24 Hour Service. Please enclose 
check or money order. 
SCOTTY'S STUDIO, 104A Texas 
St., De Leon. 	 2-25fnc This ELECTRIC EYE turns 

the light ON at dusk ... 

OFF at dawn ...automatically 
FOR RENT — 5 room house, 
chicken house, garden, storm cel-
lar. On Gorman-De Leon Hwy., 
near Rucker. Homer E. Stephens, 
Rt. 1, Gorman. 	 3-lip 

READY-LITE makes yard lighting completely 
automatic . . . gives you light for nighttime 
beauty and convebience with no waste from 
needless daytime operation. 

• READY-LITE IS CONVENIENT. A photo-
?electric cell, the Electric Eye, turns the light on 
at dusk, off at dawn. And there is an electric 
convenience outlet in the base for your electric 
yard tools and for other uses. 

• READY-LITE IS ECONOMICAL ... because it's 
never on when it isn't needed, it saves you 
money. 

STRAYED — 1 Black Berkshire 
Gilt. Approximately 180 lbs. Call 
Doyle Preston at No. 20 or write 
Gorman, Texas. 	 ltc 

FOR SALE — 20x40, 4 room 
house to be moved. Ideal for lake 
cabin. See Rob or James Kinser ' 
or write Box 5, Gorman. 	ltp 

WANTED — Gardens to 
Will use a small tractor. 
or see Vernon Warren, 
Gorman. 

ONE COMBINATION 
COFFEE TABLE - 

MAGAZINE RACK 
2 LAMPS - 2 STEP TABLES 

1 CHAIR - 
1 LARGE SOFA PILLOW 

1 SOFA BED 
with wooden arms, walnut 
finish - Lasting Qualities 

Plow. 
Write 
Rt. 2, 
3-24p 

FOR SALE — 2 New Rear Trac-
tor Tires. 12.4x36 with rims if 
you need them. A bargain for 
quick sale. Ranger Farm Store, 
Ranger, Texas. 	 3-25c 

Cr • READY-LITE IS CLEAN ... it's electric and 
maintains its brilliance. Anyone can clean an 
electric yard light. 

READY-LITE IS ATTRACTIVE. There are many 
beautiful styles from which to choose; a style 
to harmonize with any type of home. 

c.L.....1/40k...-.1tra.74s. • 

FOR SALES — Floor sample GE 
Home Freezer - Up Right 18 cu. 
ft. Reg. price $399.95. To close 
out, $299.95. No down payment, 
24 months to pay. Ranger Farm 
Store, Ranger, Texas. 	3-25c 

(and your old suite 
regardless of condition) 

ELECTRIC 
• OUTIET 

for added 
convenience 

JUST PUT YOUR READY-LITE 
ON YOUR ELECTRIC SERVICE BILL 

Your authorized Ready-Lite dealer can 
arrange it. Up to 24 months to pay. 

i 	
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HIGGINBOTHAM'S 
AMBULANCE SERVICE 

Night Phone 24J 	Day Ph. 11 

it 
tl  

h 

FOR SALE — Sheet Iron build. 
ing, 24x36, in good 	condition. 
Also small sheet iron building 
Also would consider selling somt 
lots on Hwy. 6. See Joe Bennett 

. TEXA 	 IC 'SERVICE COMPANY :A 
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