
Olp (carman Promos 
OUR 72ND TEAR OF SERVICE DECEMBER 21, 1972 	 NUMBER FORTY-FOUR THE GORMAN PROGRESS; &Aland Co.. TEXAS 78454 10c Pc Copy 

APPROVE BO 
HOSPITAL DIS 

Lighting Contest 
Winners Named 

D ISSUE 
TRICT VOTERS 

Gorman area residents ap-
proved the authorization of 
the South Eastland 	County 
Hospital District to issue the 
$312,000 in bends in the elec-
tion held Saturday with 216 
taxpaying owners voting for 
the bond sale issue and 78 
against. 19 non-property own-
ers cast votes for the issue 
and 2 against. A total of 315 
votes were cast. 

HULLS 
By _Kernel Gene Baker, aPe 

Passage of the bond issue 
now enables the district to 
complete the acquisition of 
the Blackwell Hospital from 
the estate of the late D. V. 
Rodgers, who put up the col-
lateral to build the facility. 

Sale of the bonds will be 
secured in the very near fu-
ure and according to E. G. 
Henderson, vice-president of 
the Board of Directors, there 
is no way of knowing how 
much of the 75 cents tax the 
district would have to assess. 
He also stated that the hos-
pital has operated at a profit 
for the past three months and 
if this continues taxation may 
not be necessary. In the event 
taxation is necessary no taxes 
will be involved until at least 
October, 1973. • When the bonds are sold 
the funds will be used to pay 
off the amount the hospital 
owes Stephenville Savings and 
Loan Assn., the firm which 
financed its construction. In-
terest on the loan from the 
Stephenville firm is nine per-
cent and with the passage of 
the bond issue Saturday will 
make it possible for the dis-
trict to borrow funds to pay 
off the loan at about six per-
cent. 

flint-Fs to Mr and Mrs. Al-
vin Lasater for bringing the 
!Kernel a sample of their pro- 

_ 

g_.aducts, 
• 

100 PROOF STILL 
OPERATING IN KOKOMO 

As a rule ::.e Kern^1 does 
not publicize things of this 
nature, and I try not to men-
tion names, but times being 
as they are it should be 
brought to the public's atten-
tion. As most everyone knows 
Kokomo is noted for its•doing 
things in a big way, and the 
Kernel has enjoyed many 
happy hours in their commun-
ity and partaken of much 
fine food but my ethic, as a 
publisher rerptires me to 
make the following statement 
Early in the week, I entered 
my office and war told there 
was a fifth of 100 proof i 
my ice box. 
Somewhat surprised I rushed 
hack aliel opener' U'? 	• .- u  
Sure enough there was 
brown paper sack with a be! 
tle inside. I immediately op 
ened the sack, uncorked the 
bottle, tasted the contents and 
it was 100 percent pure cow's 
cream. Being an addict to 
liquid of this type I drank a 
third of tl:e fifth. Do you know 
there are people in big cities 
that do not know what real 
cream is. 

411 

Area voters had approved 
creation of the hospital dis-
trict and granted it taxing 
authority in 1959 to assess a 
tax of no more than 75 cents 
per $100 valuation. The issu-
ance of bonds was the only 
issue in the election held on 
Saturday. 

—GP— 

Christmas Party 
For Lawndale 
Residents Held 

12-7-72 

Residents of Lawndale 
Home for Senior Citizens en-
joyed their Christmas Party 
Sunday night, December 17. 

All gathered around, the 
lovedy tree and decorated 
lobby of the home for the ex-
changing of gifts with each 
receiving three or more gifts. 

Ladies of the Kokomo De-
monstration Club presented 
the program which in-
cluded singing of carols and 
as they were singing Jingle 
Bells Santa Claus appeared 
to the delight of everyone, 
to pass out gifts. 

Many of the families of the 
residents of the home were 
present for the party. 

Out of town judges, new 
even to the county, but with 
some experience in balance, 
colors, lighting, etc., judged 
the entries in Gorman on Mon 
day- night. They were especial-
ly pleased to find the copeti-
tion was so great. Although 
they gave more points to the 
ones they thought deserved it, 
they commented on the great 
amount of work and cooper-
ation shown by all entries. 

First place was Johnnie 
Baze who will receive a 
Ready-Lite compliments of 
Texas Electric Service Co. 

Second place, with just one 
door or window, was Dorenda 
Underwood, who will receive 
an electric heater compli-
ments of Texas Electric Ser-
vice Co., 

Third place went to Sue 
Spivey who received $15 in 
cash. Fourth place Sue Sim- 
mons who received $10.00 in 
cash compliments of Gorman 
Chamber' of Commerce. 

The winner in the Commer-
cial division was Ray's Elec-
tric who will receive a pla-
que with his name and the 
year engraved on it and the 
privilege of displaying it un-
til the judging takes place 
next year. 

Gene Foster, president of 
the Chamber of Commerce 
stated: "I want to thank the 
people that entered. Everyone 
was worthy of consideration. 
The winning entry did not re-
ceive the highets number of 
points in all four categories, 
but placed very high in all 
categories, which was origin-
ality (maximum of 30 points) 
Ingenuity (maximum 30 p'tsi 
artistic (max. 20 pts.) and 
lighting techniques (max. 20). 
Drive by and see all of the 
pretty homes , some of which 
were entered, but all are 
beautiful to see. 

Those entered were: Dorthy 
Hatcher, Donna Jay, Dale 
Brightwell, Don Spraberry, W. 
R. Jarrett, Ellen Gressett, Sue 
Simmons, Johnnie Baze, Bill 
Simmons, Sue Spivey, Bonnie 
Zink, Troy Scitern, Beth An-
derson, Vicki Redman, Sunny 
Kellog, James Swanner. Gene 
Simmons, and Dorenda Un-
derwood. 

Thank you for your part in 
making Gorman more beau-
tiful during this Christmas 
season. 

—GP— 
CARD OF THANKS 

My wife joins me in thank-
ing Dr. Pino and Dr. Canut 
and the hospital staff for the 
fine treatment I received dur-
ing my stay ip Blackwell Hos-
pital. Also to the friends who 
visited us and those who car-
ried us to and from the hos-
pital and for the cards and 
many other kindnesses. we 
thank you. 

A. V. Littlefield 
—GP- 

3 PANTHERS 
ON ALL-AREA 
HM 6-B TEAM 

Let us share with friends and 
with family the traditional cus- 
toms, the decorations, the giving 
of gifts. Let us take the spirit of 
Christmas into our heart, with 
all the joy and the happiness 
that comes with the Greatest 
Gift of All. 

Merry Christmas. Peace on 
earth. Good will to all. This is 
the season of seasons. The holi- 
day of holidays. Unto the world 
a Saviour is born and the hope 
that came into the heart of man- 
kind on that night long ago in 
Bethlehem is strengthened anew. 

BENEFIT MEXICAN 
DINNER SET FOR 
THURSDAY - 6 TO 8 P. M. 

Questionnaire 
On Peanut 
Diseases Mailed 

0. A. Kinney 
Laid To Rest 
December 14th 

Three Panther Squad men 
were named this week as re-
ceiving honorable mention on 
the Class B All Area Team, 
They were David Shipman, of-
fensive guard and defensive 
linebackers, ends, Kelly Hen-
derson and Ricky Fuller. 

Honorable mention on the 
6-B All District Football Team 
were Bimbo Roberts, David 
Porter and Bill Baze, offense. 
Steven Stinnett and James 
Webb de ensive. 

--GP— 

EASTLAND COUNTY 
CENTENNIAL NEWS 

The Mexican Dinner, spon-
sored by the Gorman Com-
munity Christian Catholic Or-
ganization, will be held from 
6 to 8 p. in. Thursday, De-
cember 22nd in the Gorman 
School Cafeteria. 

RECEIVES DEGREES 
FROM TARLETON 

David Oliver of Plainview, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Bob Eth-
eridge of Gorman received the 
Bachelor of Science Degree in 
General Agriculture from Tar-
leton State College in com-
mencement exercises held on 
Sunday, Dec. 17 in Wisdom 
Qymrrasium. 

—GP-- 

Christian College where he 
was a member of the Ex-Let-
termen's Association. 

He married Flora Clark 
Sept. 8, 1929 at Comanche and 
went to Stamford in 1932. He 
was past director of the Retail 
Furniture Association, a mem 
bet-  of the Stamford Rotary 
Club of which he was past 
president, a Mason and Shri-
ner and had served as a mem-
ber of the city council. 

He was co-owner with his 
son in the Kinney Furniture 
Company. He was a member 
of St. John's United Methodist 
Church. 

Tickets are $1.75 for adults 
and 51,25 for children. All pro-
ceeds from the dinner will be 
used toward the building of 
a church in Gorman. 

LAWNDALE NOTE 
OF APPRECIATION 

Thanks to th ladies of the 
Kokomo Home Demonstration 
Club for their time and devo-
tion in helping each month 
with the birthday parties and 
the help they have given to 
the residents of the home on 
other occasions. 

AUSTIN — Agriculture 
Commissioner John C. White 
has announced that a quies-
tionnaire on peanut disease'; 
is being sent to about 5 per-
cent of the peanut farmer:, 
in the Central Texas peanut 
producing area. 

The questionnaire asks far-
mers to give their oninion on 
the amount of acreage intact-
ed with underground plant 
diseases. 

If you have not been con-
tacted by a representative of 
the organization for a ticket, 
you may purchase them at 
the Progress office. 

—GP— 

Mr. Kinney was reared in 
Gorman and was a member 
of Gorman's first football 
team. He graduated in 1921. 
His wife was a former teach-
er in the Gorman Schools. Elvy Clark and Mrs. Jose-

phene Hatchett of Corpus 
Christi will arrive Thursday 
for a four day visit with his 
brothers and sisters, Mr. and 
Mrs. George Hollifield, Mr. 
and Mrs. Speedy Clark, D. R. 
Clark, Lorena Clark and Es-
telle Craddock. 

Commissioner White stated, 
"I hope the farmers will take 
an interest in returning the 
questionnaire to the Texas De-
partment of Agriculture, 301 
West Navarro, De Leon, Tex-
as 76444. The information 
from the questionnaire will 
be used to guide the Depart-
ment in developing peanut re-
search projects for the 1973 
and 1974 crop years." 

We also appreciate the 
members of the Church of 
Christ. First Baptist Chur-
ch and the First United Meth-
odist Church for presenting 
Sunday services and helping 
in other work with our resi-
dents. 

Thank you and God bless 
you. 

Survivors include his wife, 
Flora, of Stamford; one son, 
Ray Kinney of Stamofrd; two 
grandchildren; a sister, Mrs. 
Bertie White of Miami, Fla.: 
two brothers, Henry of Stam-
ford and Frank of Fort Worth. 

0. A. Kinney, 69, long time 
Stamford merchant, died at 
8:45 p. m. Tuesday at Stam-
ford Memorial Hospital De-
cember 12, 1972, where he 
was taken following an appar-
ent heart attack at his home 
at 6:30 p. m. 

Funeral services were held 
at 4:30 p. m. Thursday at 
St. John's United Methodist 
Church in Stamford with Rev. 
Jarrell Sharp, pastor, and 
Rev. Thurman Morgan of 
Texas Christian University in 
Fort Worth, a retired minis-
ter, officiating. 

Burial was in Highland 
Memorial Cemetery in Stam-
ford under direction of Kin-
ney Funeral Home. 

Mr. Kinney was born July 
9, 1903 in Docket. He was a 
1923 graduate of Abilene 

Dear Mr. Baker: 
Mrs. Mary May Mehaffey 

Harrell died the other day in 
a Lubbock nursing home, and 
I read her obituary in the 
paper I used to work for in 
Brownwood. And I'm sure you 
wrote a story ahout her in the 
Progress. 

She was my teacher in first 
grade in Gorman when I start 
ed to school in 1935. And I 
did not see her again after 
first grade that I recall. So 
my memories are not clouded 
by anything that happened in 
her life before or after the 
1935-36 school year. 

In other words, for me Mrs. 
Harrell is, was. will always be 
"my first grade teacher." I 
am able to put her off in a si 
little corner room of my mind 
reserved for "my first grade 
teacher" — a little room from 
a schoolhouse long since torn 
down in Gorman (theSr built 
the new school while I was in 
Dorothy Dean's second grade 
class). 

What do I see when I visit 
that little first grade class 
room in my mind's eye? I see 
a widow of seven years rais-
ing a son, Charles Edwin Har-
rell. Jr., on a teacher's sal- 
ary during the 	depression. 
and I recall that as a first 
grader I knew she had to 
supplement that salary by 
selling insurance in the even-
ing. That was one of her 
tough years. I'm sure. 

In the classroom she was a 
strict disciplinarian. Even her 
nephew, Jimmy Mehaffey, 
who called her "Aunt Mary" 
in class and got away with it, 
didn't get any other special 
favors. There was no kinder-
garten in Gorman Schools. 
Maybe there isn't even to-
day. So the first grade teach-
er got a bunch of rowdy kids 
who had never been in a class 
room before. During that first 
year she was supposed to 
teach us to read. I recall a 

little contest she pushed in 
the spring of 1936, a kind of 
personal challenge to the pup-
ils to see how many books 
they could read before school 
ended. I read 16 books! I 
don't know how many books 
other kids read, but I do know 
that today many first graders 
cannot read even one book 
through during first grade 
We all learned to read, I 
think. And that is just about 
the best tribute a teacher can 
have. There must be hundreds 
of others who appreciate her 
for getting them off on the 
right foot in first grade. 

I nate that Mrs. Harrell 
left three grandchildren. I 
hope they were fortunate e-
nough to have a first grade 
teacher as special as mine.  
If they didn't learn to read 
in school. I'll bet grandmoth-
er held a book reading con-
test at home! 

Sincerely yours, 
Joe B. Swan 

Professor, Journalism 
Calif. State University 
San Jose, Calif. 

• 
Thanks, Joe. Last time I 

saw Jimmy Mehaffey he was 
operating a TV cable comp-
any near Tyler, and is doing 
real well. The obituary on 
Mrs. Harrell was not sent to 
us and R. C. Mehaffey didn't 
tell us. 

Gorman is fortunate in con-
tinuing to have dedicated 
teachers. Incidentally, we 
have a new high school build-
ing, new hospital, fine nursing 
home and many other im-
provements in our fair, city. 

Monroe Rollins has announ- 
ced these additions to 	the 
Executive Committee of the 
Eastland County Centennial 
organization: Bill Auvenshine 
of Ranger and Ranger Junior 
College, Chairman of Spec-
tacle Ticket Sales; Carl Gar-
rett of Eastland, Chairman 
of Publicity; and George 
Brazell of Desdemona and 
Cisco Junior College, Chair-
man of Specitl Events. 

This completes the filling 
of all spots on the Executive 
Committee. 
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• 1  SOht 
and all is calm with 

prayers for a peaceful 

earth and love be-

tween fellowmen. Our 

prayers are with you 

for a wonderful 

Christmas season. 

• 
• 
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Oldest Bang In Eastland Counhi: 
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BLACKWELL CLINIC 
A. E. PING, M.D. — J. R. CANUT, M.D. 

Peace 
on earth and 

good will 
to men of 
all faiths. 

.,-0 	ct 
Dear Santa Claus 
I would like a bike and a race 
car set. I would like a walkie 
talki. 
Love 	JAMIE 

Dear Santa Claus — I would 
like a pair of house shoes and 
a coat and a record player 
and a packages of cake mix 
and a piano and a pool table 
and a bottle of glue. 

and a Merry Christmas 
Love, SHAY 

Dear Santy: — I Want a 
pivot pool. I want a guns box 
too. 

Love, EDDIE 

Dear Santa Claus: - I want a 
bike and sume glus and a 
doll and a ball. 

Love - Rosemary 
Merry Christmas 

Dear Santa - I would like a 
typewriter and I would like a 
basketball and I would like 
a pair of . go go boots and I 
would like a piano and 	I 
would like another purse and 
I would like some kind of 
game and I would like a pair 
of pans and I would like 5 
swedrs. 

Love - SUSAN 

Dear Santa Claus 
Baby ternler Love 
Baby Carriage 
I want a now pair of shoes 
I want a now snowmaker 
I want a piano 
Love 	BRENDA 

Merry Christmas Santa 
Dear Santa Claus 
I want a bb gun and sum 
b. b. s to. I want a greenhor-
net badge and gobs of candy 
canes. and a battle ship game 
and a walkie talkie and a 
pivot pool. 

Love 	 DANE 

Dear Santa Claus 
I want a how and arrow set. 
a new football. and a pool 
table. and a rock'em socleetn 
robot and boots. 
[Ave 	 RANDY 

Dear Santa Claus 
I want a Babby Dear one and 
a hair Styling head. Love 

KATHY ANN SNIDER 

AUL humps- 15% OFF 

Style 839 	Height 41" — Width 33' 
BIG MAN Chair 

Dr. W. H. 
Stephen 

Optometrist 
Thursdays in De Leon 

Phone 893-6799 
(45-3444 	Dublin, Teams 

FOY TRUE 
Appliance Service 

For Writhing Machine 
Repair and Plumbing 

FOR BETTER SERVICE 
CALL 

Phone 734-5384 German 

Dr. Fehrman H. 
Lund 

Optometrist 
405-6 Exchange Bldg. 

629-1177 — EASTLAND 
313 Main St. — RANGE! 

Ranger - 1 tt 5:30 Theodor 
8:30 to 12:00 Fridays 
Closed Thursday tz 
Saturday Afternoms• 

Chiropractic 
1. Rollins Pain Without 

Drugs. 
2. Restores Health 

Without Surgery 
3. Prolongs Life 

naturally & Economical/ 
OFFICE HOURS 

7:00 - 12:00 — 1:30 - 6:00 
Mon., Tues., Wed., Fri. 

7:00 - 12:00 on Thursdays 
Closed all day on Saturdays 

and Thursday afternoon 

Dr. Clay Salyer 
171 1. Blackjack St. 

445-3317 	DUBLIN 

Dear Santa Claus 
GORMAN PROGRESS, Eastland Co., Texas, DEC. 21, 1972 

ttifitelq4 
Dear Santa Claus: 
I want a house 
Love 	 VIRGINIA 

Dear Santa Claus 
A plow 

Love 	JOHNNY 

Dear Santa Claus 
I want aSSP toy and I hope 
you have a good Christmas 
Love 	TIMMY 

Best wishes to you at 

this special holiday 

time. Peace, good 

will to you and yours. 

Love 	 RAY 
a gun sit 	a car sit a cat 

Dear Santa Claus 
I would like a typewriter and 
go go boots. and a basket ball 
and a piano and a purse and I 
want a baton. 
Love 	STACY 

Merry Christmas 

MARY MEHAFFEY 

• • 	• 	• 	• .• 	• 	• 	•.$ 
• • 	• 	• 	• 	• 

•f. 

Let us rejoice 
and give praise for all 
the wonders of this day. 

May the joy of this holy 
season warm every heart; 
May the days ahead reflect 
the peace of this greatest 
of all holidays. 

THE GORMAN PROGRESS 

MARVIN NIX UNDERGOES 
SURGERY IN LONGVIEW 

Marvin Nix, former resi-
dent of Gorman and employee 
of Mobil Oil Company in Des-
demona, underwent surgery 
Tuesday in Good Shepherd 
Hospital in Longview. His con- 
dition is considered 	quite 
serious. 

Those who may wish to 
send get well cards may ad-
dress them to Good Shepherd 
Hospital, Room A-406, Long-
view, Texas 75601. 

—GP-- 

KEEPING UP 
WITH FRIENDS 

Mary Mehaffey left Sunday 
for an extended visit wtih her 
sons, Mr. and Mrs. Gene Me-
haffey in Old Ocean and Lt. 
Col. and Mrs. W. L. Mehaf-
fey at Laughlin AFB at Del 
Rio. 

Mr. and Mrs. L. F. Miears, 
Jr. of Austin and Mrs. E. C. 
Watson and Carl of Midland 
spent the weekend with their 
mother, Mrs. L. F. Miears. 
and Mr. and Mrs. James 
Miears. 

Doyle Shipman and his 
roommate, Mike .Crow, spent 
the weekend with Mr. and 
Mrs. Lindon Shipman and at-
tended the graduation exercis-
es of Burl Harper at Tarleton 
State College Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Ste-
phens of Odessa and Tracy 
Harwell of Eastland visited 
Sunday with Speck and Terry 
Clarice 

Mr. and Mrs. Mark Hulse. 
Leah and Amy of Denver 
City spena the weekend with 
Mr. and Mrs. Huppy Morris. 
Their son, Mr. and Mrs. 
James G. Morris of Brown-
field, will arrive Thursday 
for a weekend visit. 

Entered as Second Class Mail at th. 
Post Office in Gorman, Texas under thl 
Act of March 3, 1878. Published or 
Thursday ,at Gorman, Eastland County 
Texas 76454. 

KENEL GENE BAKER, Publisher 
JOE BENNETT, Assistant Publisher 
MRS. ESTELLE CRADDOCK, Editor 

GORMAN TELEVISION 
CABLE SERVICE. INC. 
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GORMAN PEANUTS 
A Division of American Cold Storage Corporatten 
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S 0 EIFIE 
The Reclining Sofa 

by LA-Z-BOY 
The La-Z-Boy Reclina-Rocker Sofette is the 
perfect way to share your every relaxing 
mood! Side by side, independently of each 
other, you may lounge, watch TV. catnap, 
read, and recline to full bed. Individual leg-
rests operate independently, too. World-
famous La-Z-Boy craftsmanship is built into 
each Reclina-Rocker Sofette. A variety of 
styles allow a choice that will blend beauti-
fully and artistically with any surrounding. 
Here is gracious living at its very best. 

Ar a Hefty Or/6*w all Arottfh & 'ear CHRISTMAS 
JOY 

And may the 

true spirit of 

the season 

be yours this 

Yule ... 

ARVIN CASSETTE TAPE RECORDER ONLY  $24.88 
(Requires No Transformer) 

ARVIN TRANSISTOR RADIO ("ZNAL PRICE $14•88  

From All of Us at Higginbotham's 

HIGGINBOTH AM'S 
QUALITY & SERVICE 

GORMAN. TEXAS 

Was $699.95 - NOW 
MUNT7 MULTIPLEX (Stereo & 25 In. Color TV) 	$525.00 
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Sincere wishes for a happy 

heart-warming Christmas. 

And Merry Christmas To 

Our Good Friends, 

One and All. 

• -.. • 	b  • b  

Stra'as 
Aracc  

May you and 

yours give and 

receive generously 

of meaningful 

Christmas Joys. 

GORMAN PROGRESS, Eastland Co., Texas, DEC. 21, 1972 School Menu Wednesday — Pressed ham 
sandwiches, vegetable soup, 
potato chips, milk and fruit 
and cookies. 

Peanut-ty Good Filing Deadline 
Past Medicare 
Expenses Noted 

MilarTaffrki?..tiresisAraillatit.'‘ 
Thursday — Turkey and 

dressing with giblet gravy, 
green beans, candied yams, 
cranberry sauce, milk, bread 
and Christmas ice cream. 

Following is the menu list 
for the Gorman School Lunch 
room for the week of Dec. 
18-21: 

Monday - Boiled wieners, 
blackeyed peas, tossed salad, 
milk, bread and chocolate 
pudding. 

Tuesday — Fried chicken, 
new potatoesi English peas, 
hot rolls and prune bars. 

Merry Christmas and a 

Happy New Year! 

If you are a Medicare bene-
ficiary, December 31, 1972 
may be a very important date 
to you. Medicare can pay 
medicare insurance benefit 
claims only if the claim is 
filed within certain limits, and 
December 31, 1972 is the dead 

IF MO 
MERE IS 57/1t1MPE 70 SHOP' 
FOR LAST MINUTE GIFTS 

OzirS 

line date for claiming bene-
fits for services which were 
received during •the period 
beginning October 1, 1970 
through September 30, 1971, 
advises Bob Tuley, Abilene 
district manager. 

If you need assistance in 
completing your application 
for these services, or if you 
have a question, you should 
see Don Austin when he is 
in Gorman on Dec. 21, at 
10 a. m. at the City Office. 

If a representative of the 
Social Security 	Administra- 
tion will not be in your town 
before December 31, you 
should come to the Abilene 
office located at Room 2321 
Federal Building. That office 
is open 9 a. m. to 5 p. m., 
Monday through Friday, with 
the exception of Christmas 
Day. The telephone number 
for Me Abilene office is (915) 
677-5262. 

Stephenville.. 
Mrs. Fran Eaton, Mineral 

Wells, Mr. and Mrs. Ray Dan-
iels and April of Rising Star, 
Mr. and Mrs. George Morgan, 
Charles Morgan, Mr. and Mrs 
Joe Morgan, and Mr. and Mrs 
Otto Morgan, all of De Leon. 

Sixteen of their twenty 
grandchildren and sixteen of 
their 19 great-grandchildren 
were present. 

WE HAVE A 
LARGE SELECTION 

O F 

GIFTS 

FOR ALL 

THE FAMILY 

The Progress is always haps 
py to publicize Gorman indus-
try, especially our new peanut 
business. Talking with Mrs. 
Jordan Monday and she said, 
"Tell all cooks there are mak-
ings for good holiday eating 
at the Nutri-rich Nut House. 
Besides being very good, pea-
nuts are very nutritious. They 
are rich in protein, calcium, 
phosphorous. iron and niacin. 

You do not see many skin-
ny peanut farmers, do you? 

A new item added recently 
to their sock of peanut goodies 
is the one pound packages of 
granulated peanuts for baking 
and candy making. They are 
are roasted salt-free with the 
husks removed before being 
chopped. They are yummy 
good in candy, cookies, pies, 
sauces and on ice cream. 

A recipe book jut out by the 
Texas Peanut Producers 
Board, is yours for the ask-
ing, and has many tried and 
tested recipes using peanuts 
in main dishes, soups, salads, 
sandwiches, breads, cakes, 
cookies and candies. 

Kernel Gene is still trying 
to round up pictures and a 
detailed story of our new in-
dustry. 

Maybe after the holidays. 
— GP -- 

All Top Quality Merchandise 

Becki White 
Honored With 
Lingerie Shower HAPPINESS IS... SERVING YOU... 

THE VERY BEST! 

The J. K Daniels 
Honored Sunday 

Mr. and Mrs. J. E. Daniels 
were honored by their child-
ren with open house Sunday, 
December 17. 1972, at the Fire 
Hall in observance of their 
Sixtieth Wedding Anniversary. 

Children hosting the event 
were: Mr. and Mrs. B. E. 
Daniels. Deer Park, Mr. and 
Mrs. A. B. Daniels and Mr. 
and Mrs. Melvin Daniels of 
De Leon, Mr. and Mrs. Gil- 
bert Daniels, Brownwood, M.r 
and Mrs. Alvin Scitern and 
Mrs. Wanda Kimmell, Gor-
man, Mrs. Lee Skaggs of Big 
Sandy. 

A daughter, Mrs. A. 3. 
Goates of Hobbs, N. M. was 
unable to attend. 

Fall theme was used in de-
corations for the center pieces 
for serving and decoration ta-
bles of bronze, gold and 
orange mums. The tables were 
covered with white lace table 
cloths, the handy work of Mo-
ther Daniels, and each had 
an underlay of gold. The 
three tiered white and gold 
cake was baked and deco-
rated by Mrs. Tommy Cam 

Mrs. Joe Pittman of Fort 
Worth, the oldest daughter„ 
registered guests. grand dau-
ghters-in-law, Mrs. Gerald Sci 
tern and Mrs. Kathy Scitern, 
ladeled punch and served 
cake. 

Out of town relatives and 
friends attending were: Max-
ine Skaggs, Big Sandy. Ann-
ette Kimmell, Mrs. Dorothy 
Egglton, bothof Mineral Wells 
Alma McConnel and Michael 
of Big Sandy, Travis Skaggs, 
Corrigan, Sharon Holmes of 
Angora, Minn., Lois Melton, 
Mr. and Mrs. Walter Daniels 
of Ranger, Mr. and Mrs. Ira 
Wilson, Boyd, Mr. and Mrs. 
Dale Wilson, Decatur. 

Joe Pittman, Connie and 
James, Mildred Selby, Lois 
Goodwin, Bettye Gammon, 
and Vera Wedekind, Joyce 
Erhardt, all of Fort Worth. 

Mr. and Mrs. Odis Jordan. 
Tommy, Zandra and Michael 
of Eastland; Lonnie Gains of 
Brownwood, Mr. and Mrs. 
and Mrs. James R. Daniels, 
Wendy, Donna, Alvie and Mr. 
and Mrs. Alvin Daniels all of 

We Will Be Closed 
December 24th and 25th 

Miss Becki White was hon-
oree at a lingerie shower in 
the home of Miss Jeanette 
Jackson Wednesday, Decem-
ber13 from 4:30 to 6:30 p. m. 

Co-hosesses were Christi 
Duran, Bernadean Reeves, 
Karen Moore and Patty Hirst. 

The refreshment table was 
covered with a white cloth 
and centered with a red can-
dle arrangement. Punch and 
cookies were served. Appoints 
were crystal. 

Following the opening of 
gifts rice bags were made for 
the December 22 wedding of 
Miss White and Mr. Quintin 
Wright. The bags were made 
from red net and tied with 
white ribbons, the bride elects 
chosen colors. 

GLASSON CAFE 
LOYD & BOBBIE GLASSON 

(DOWNTOWN) 

PHONE 734-5716 	 GORMAN 

FLCiflirarrivai-tcrar._,I whAarSitatigirmarte 
THE DICK FOSTERS 
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From our "house" 
to yours- 

Merry Christmas. 

FOY TRUE.  
APPLIANCE SERVICE 

I

ii 	BLACKWELL HOSPITAL INC. 

Laks.

i  limcatirstvii;:gorawagrzt 
GORMAN MILLING COMPANY. INC 

ietkaat.nsiaiG44 
Mr. and Mrs. Foy True 
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LEWIS FINA STATION 

A blessed Christmas 

filled with peace 

and great happiness. 

TODD'S VARIETY STORE 

ii~91101.004010.0040VONOW010014 

All the happiness 

of Christmas he 

yours this year. 

,furter Xhuttl 
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it's Christmas 
and a joyful time. Let's 
celebrate and give thanks 
for our abundent blessings. 

LO'S BEAUTY SHOP 
LORENA CLARK - OWNER - OPERATO R 

hViiMe.4"13~44/A4)%104314W0W40,414114 
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We wish our friends and patrons 
the blessings of a warm and 

happy holiday. 

RON'S AUTOMOTIVE 
RON HUDSON, Owner 

PHONE 734-5613 Cor. Kent & Hwy. 6 GORMAN 

Norii4Pit~iiktritoftelSieftrainft0P.iii 

We 
sing his 
praise and 
glory for 
this day. 

GORMAN PROGRESS, Eastland Co., Texas, DEC. 21, 1972 Christmas Day ... .1i4. 0.41201,W1,11;01WilaWa 

11,11. eril lioWW70911WrWillig 

This Christmas Season, 1972 
the mystery and magic of 
Christmas night are very real 
as hundreds of millions of 
people in smal countries and 
great nations across the 
breadth of the world join 
hands in the eternal wish of 
peace on earth and goodwill 
toward men. 

In this day of instant com-
munications, flashing in words 
and pictures the sometimes 
confusing kaleidoscope of the 
world events, it seems ap-
propriate to give thanks for 
one gift that has preserved 
the humanity and the hard,  
won, accumulated knowledge 
of man through thousands of 
years — the gift of the written 
word. In countless languages, 
the written word has spanned 
the whole surface of the Earth 
making knowledge of 9od and 
the teachings of Christ life-
long, everyday companions of 
men and women everywhere. 
Through the written word all 
men know the story of Christ-
mas. These words endure ot 
be read and reread again and 

imai noosoNninievans • • 
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Texas Poll-Ettes 
To Award Two 
Ag Scholarships dV(ERY 

WRIST-A/1AS ',2 vik, 

Property Protection Plan off-
ered by Texas Farm Bureau. 

Effective November 1, 1972 
all members who have the 
official "N o Trespassing" 
signs posted on their property 
will .be protected again tres-
pass and other offences. This 
reward program is provided 
by the Texas Farm Bureau 
and affiliated insurance com-
panies. 

Action was taken by the 
County Board of Directors' 
monthly meeting to adopt the 
program. 

The new service - to mem-
ber program - provides for the 
posting of property according 
to the new anti-trespass law 
passed during the last session 
of the Legislature. 

A reward of $200 is offered 
by the Texas Farm Bureau 
and insurance companies lead. 
ing to the arrest and final con-
viction of persons committing 
trespass, felony theft. arson, 
or melicious mischief as dc- 

GREENS 

'County Farm 
Bureau Adopt 
Protection Plan 

Eastland County Farm Bu-
reau has adopted the new 

again. How else could the 
story of Tiny Tim and the 
name of Charles Dickens have 
become synonymous with the 
Spirit of Christmas? 

Countless millions of chil-
dren have listened in breath-
less wonder as their parents 
read the fantasy-conjuring 
words of "The Night Before 
Christmas" — the reindeer, 
the fur-trimmed red suit and 
the jolly cry of, "Merry Christ 
mas to all and to all a good 
night!" These words, written 
in 1823 by an American min-
ister and poet, Clement C. 
Moore, are here today as part 
of the living legend of Christ-
mas. So, let's give thanks for 
the written word. Its power 
has preserved the Spirit of 
Christmas. and its wisdom 
may yet save mankind from 
his own folly. 

40!itteNtzPstPti4 

Two scholarships will be a 
warded by the Texas Poll-
Ettes, ladies auxiliary of the 

iTexas Polled Hereford Asso-
ciation, this Spring. 

The Texas Poll-Ettes, who 
are deeply interested in young 
people, offer these scholars-
hips as a means to assist 
young people in furthering 
their education in the various 
fields of agriculture. 

All applicants should be 
High School graduates and 
residents of Texas. Each ap-
plicant must have three rec• 
ommendations; one of which 
must be from the County A-
gent, Club Advisor, FFA Ad-
visor, or High School princi-
pal. 

Scholarships may be used at 
any Junior College, College 
or University in the state of 
Texas. Applications must be 
in no later than March 1, 1973. 
For further information, con-
tact Mrs. M. D. Arrington, Rt. 
1, Jacksonville, Texas 75765. 

fined by Article Aso, on prop-
erty of a current Farm Bu-
reau member. 

Each member will automat-
ically have protection on- the 
effective dates provided he 
has properly posted his prop-
erty. Signs will be available 
from the county at a cost of 
$1.00 each. 

In addition to the sign. the 
member may elect to pur-
chase a name plate that may 
be attached to the sign. These 
cost an additional $1.00 each. 
Decals for automobiles, trucks 
and other vehicles will be pro-
vided at no cost to the mem-
ber. 

The County Farm Bureau 
will be responsible for com-
pleting a form forunished 
them for the purpose of re-
porting information leading to 
the arrest and final convic-
tions under the program. 

The Farm Bureau insurance 
adjustor will investigate and 
send the report with further 
information to the state office. 
The $200 check will be sent 
from Texas Farm Bureau to 
the County Farm Bureau pres. 
ident, who will deliver it to 
the reward recipient. 

There is no cost to the in-
dividual member for the pro-
tection except for the signs 
and optional name plates to 
be attached to the signs. The 
County Farm Bureau assumes 
the cost of the program which 

oftiatAlsNesNIctNflkoPf.tioN0ftistikolti 
is 20 cents for each current 
member of the organization 
not having a fire or casualty 
policy with the Texas Farm 
Bureau insurance companies 

sitaktitei*WSI*~i~.~:t404! 

May the spirit 

of Christmas 

reach into every 

heart. 

dro ig  

lot AUL 
frtanitinb Joyous holiday greetings 

to friends and customers 
of our community. Mr, and Mrs. Carl Deon 

Stacy and Julia 

• • 	• • 
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Merry Christmas... In this merry 

season, we are pleased to greet 

and thank all our loyal customers. 

CARBON 
FARM SUPPLY 

CARBON, TEXAS 

10004"0%0%0NC%ONiaN0144:0*01§4 
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We join our heartfelt 

prayers with yours for 

peace and good will. 

MUSIC 
DISTRIBUTORS GORMAN EXXON STATION MUNN 

CLEANERS 

Rankin 
Army & Navy 

Surplus 

May this Yule bring you 
fulfillment of great joy. 

THE G. T. LEONARDS — THE NEIL JANES — CRAIG WALLER — 

HWY. 6 	PHONE 893-6631 	DE LEON 
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NOTICE TO ALL SUBSCRIBERS 

IN GORMAN EXCHANGE 

Your DDD equipment will be cut into service on Thursday, December Slat. MI 
1 and 2 Party Phones may dial direct without operator assistance. Party Nue sub-
scribers may dial direct but will be intercepted by the operator and IdeaMeatball of 
the calling number will be requested. 

DIRECT DISTANCE DIALING 
With Direct Distance Dialing (DDD), you can dial your own station-to-station long 
distance calls. To make Direct Distance Dialing possible, the nation has been divided 
into more than 120 geographic areas. Each area has its own three-figure "Area Code," 
(see map on Inside Front Cover). 

You probably can obtain the area code of the place you are calling by checking the 
map. If the map does not clearly show the area code you want, and it is not listed in 
the introductory pages of your directory, call the operator and she will give you the 
area code. 

You can dial direct to almost any telephone with a seven-figure or a two-letter, five-
figure number. 

HOW TO DIAL 

First get the correct local number and the area code of the city you wish to call. 
Then dial the DDD Code that is shown below. Follow the example as shown below. 

EXAMPLE FOR CALLS WITHIN THE 817 AREA 

DDD Code Telephone Number 

1 257-2241 

EXAMPLES FOR CALLS OUTSIDE THE 817 AREA 

DDD Code 
	

Area Code 
	

Telephone Number 

1 
	

312 
	

258-2241 

HOW TO GET OUT OF TOWN NUMBERS 

If you do not have the number in the city you are calling, dial "Operator" and ask 
her to connect you with "Directory Assistance" in the distant city; or dial 1 plus the 
Area Code of the town you wish to call, then dial 555-1212. If the town you wish to call 
is within the 817 Area you need not dial the Area Code. There is no charge for these 
calls. 

IF YOU REACH A WRONG NUMBER 

Ask the person who answers what city you have reached. Then dial "Operator" im-
mediately and report it to tier. She will cancel the charge. There is no charge for 
these calls if immediately reported to the Operator. 

"BUSY" SIGNALS AND "NO ANSWERS" 

If you get a "busy" signal or if no one answers the telephone you are calling hang up 
and try the call a little later. No charge is made on uncompleted calls. 

IF YOU NEED HELP 

If you are cut off, encounter difficulty in hearing or experience any other trouble, just 
dial "Operator" and report it to her. She will be glad to help you. 

REMEMBER — DDD Calls are Cheaper. You are cordially invited to try the 
new equipment. 

Courtesy of 

COMANCHE COUNTY 
TELEPHONE COMPANY, INC. 

GORMAN, TEXAS 

dry 
May the true spirit of the First Christmas shine 

brightly in your heart today and every day. 

COMANCHE COUNTY TELEPHONE 
COMPANY, INC. 
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ADAPTED FROM A CHRISTMAS CAROL 

IN PROSE 

BY CHARLES DICKENS 
C5\ 

ittesSetur4 ofOlb 'Scrooge 
ft 

the door with a bang, and the 
sound echoed like thunder 
throughout the house. 

was taken back in spirit, many 
weary years, to his boyhood 
home. The Christmases of his 
youth paraded before him. Some 
of them were sad, for he was a 
lonely boy, but others were jolly. 
Scrooge was amazed as events of 
the past flew before his eyes. 
Times and people that he had 
known and many of them long 
ago forgotten. The best of these 
he had not forgotten and he felt 
pleasure when the spirit took him 
to a warehouse where he had 
served as an apprentice. 

With a wife and three children 
to support, Bob Crachit hardly 
made enough money as a clerk 
in the firm of Scrooge and Mar-
ley. When Marley died, Scrooge, 
his sole administrator, retained 
the firm's name and continued 
the business. Scrooge was tight-
fisted and grasping. He was also 
untrusting. One particular Christ-
mas Eve, as Crachit sat busily 
copying letters in his cold, drab 
little corner, he was mindful of 
the fact ,that Scrooge, in his 
counting room nearby, had left 
open the door in order to keep a 
cautious eye on his employe. 

Suddenly, the two of them 
stood in the city streets on 
Christmas morning. All the sights 
and sounds that Scrooge had re-
fused to recognize were there—
people in the streets, greeting 
one another, the smell of good 
food and fruits, the church bells 
calling good people to church and 
chapel. Scrooge and the jolly 
giant went on, invisible, through 
the streets, to the very door of 
Bob Crachit's house. Scrooge 
stood in awe as the Spirit blessed 
the small dwelling. Inside, Mrs. 
Crachit, her daughter Belinda 
and Martha, and son Peter, await-
ed the return of their father. In 
he came, carrying Tiny Tim upon 
his shoulder. Tiny Tim, bearing a 
crutch, and his limbs supported 
by an iron frame. 

When the hour for closing ar-
rived at the counting-house, 
Scrooge grumpily stopped his 
money-counting, dismounted from 
his stool and told his clerk, Bob 
Crachit, that work was ended for 
the day. 

Scrooge didn't approve of the 
holiday, but he had to recognize 
that it existed. "You'll want all 
day tomorrow, I suppose?" 

"If quite convenient, sir." 
Look all the more unpleasant, 

Scrooge said: "It's not convenient, 
and it's not fair. If I was to stop 
half-a-crown for it, you'd think 
yourself ill-used, I'll be bound? 
And yet, you don't think me ill-
used, when I pay a day's wages 
for no work." 

When the third Spirit had 
gone, Scrooge kept the memory 
of the sight of his own name 
upon a tombstone, and no mourn-
ers in sight. When he awakened, 
he renewed his promise, "I will 
live in the past, the present and 
the future." 

Scrooge dressed in his very 
best and went into the streets. 
People were everywhere. Many of 
them he had seen during the time 
of his visit with the Ghost of 
Christmas Present. Scrooge 
looked so pleasant that people 
spoke to him and, afterwards, he 
confessed, their voices were mu-
sic to his ears. One gentleman, 
only days before rudely refused 
when he asked Scrooge for a do-
nation to a fund for the poor, was 
surprised when Scrooge present-
ed to him a healthy sum of 
money. 

Satisfied with his search, 
Scrooge locked himself in —
double-locked himself in, which 
was not his custom. • Strange 
sounds were in the air, and 
strange things happened. A dis-
used bell hung near his bed. It 
began to swing slowly, then rang 
loudly, as did every other bell in 
the house. Scrooge listened in-
tently. Another sound began 
when the bells ended. It seemed 
someone was dragging heavy 
chains over the wine merchant's 
casks in the cellar below. 

The sound grew nearer and 
nearer. And then, within the 
room, he stood. Marley, with his 
pigtails, his waist-coat, tights and 
boots. The chain he drew was 
wrapped around his middle. It 
was made in steel, but resembled 
familiar-things--cash boxes, keys;  
padlocks, ledgers, deeds and 
heavy purses. 

When they peered into the win-
dow, Scrooge saw an old gentle-
man in a Welsh wig, sitting at a 
high desk and he exclaimed, 
"Why, it's old Fezziwig! Bless his 
heart, it's Fezziwig alive again." 

As they looked, Old Fezziwig 
laid down his pen. He looked at 
the clock. "Yo, ho, there! Ebene-
zer! (that's me, thought Scrooge), 
Dick! (Ah, Dick, Wilkins, to be 
sure), no more work tonight. 
Christmas Eve, Dick. Christmas, 
Ebenezer. Let's have the shutters 
up." 

Scrooge continued to watch as 
the Crachits busily prepared their 
small Christmas feast. Everyone 
joined in preparation of the meaL 
Excitement mounted as they 
gathered about the table and Mrs. 
Crachit approached the roast 
goose with a carving knife. A 
murmur of delight arose and even 
Tiny Tim shouted Mirrah! A pud-
ding, much to small for so large 
a family, was a wonderful treat. 
Dinner over, the family gathered 
round the hearth. Bob Crachit 
raised a toast: "Merry Christmas 
to us all, my dears, God bless us." 
The family re-echoed the senti-
ment and Tiny Tim, the last of 
all, said "God bless us every one!" 

1v?":' is 
God save you!" 

"Bah," said Scrooge. "Humbug!" 
So much as the nephew tried, 

so hard did Scrooge resist the 
idea of Christmas. He denounced 
it and wouldn't say a good word 
about it or about anybody or any-
thing 

Scrooge, ill-tempered as usual, 
seemed annoyed when his neph-
ew entered with a cheery greet-
ing. "A Merry Christmas uncle! 

Tactfully as he could:era-6r 
reminded his employer that 
Christmas came but once a year. 

"A poor excuse- foil /picking Et 
man's pocket every twenty-fifth of 
December!" said Scrooge. "But I 
suppose you must have the whole 
day. Be here all 'the earlier next 
morning." 

Buttoning his greatcoat to the 
chin, Scrooge growled to himself 
as he walked out the door. He 
was hardly out of sight before 
the clerk had closed tie, o,s 
and headed home*a!rd'ib 
Town. Because it was Christmas 
Eve, he paused long enough to go 
down a slide on Cornhill, twenty 
times, behind a lane of boys. 

Scrooge journeyed on, to his 
nephew's house. He passed the 
door a dozen times before he had 
the courage to knock. Then he 
made a dash to the door, and did 
it. 

"Fred," he said when his neph-
ew appeared. 

"Why, bless my soul!" cried 
Fred. 

"It's I. Your Uncle Scrooge. 
I've come to dinner. Will you let 
me in, Fred?" 

He was made so heartily wel-
come. He thought his nephew 
would shake his arm off. He was 
perfectly at home within minutes. 

In came a fiddler, who sat on a 
lofty desk and began to play. In 
came Mrs. Fizziwig and the three 
Miss Fizziwigs and six young fol-
lowers. In came all the young 
meniandiwomen employed in the 
business, the housemaid, with her 
cousin, the baker. 

The party began. Scrooge re-
lived every moment of it. Yet, 
ever-conscious that the Ghost of 
Christmas Past still had eyes 
upon him. Other scenes of his 
past life were re-lived, until at 
last he felt he could bear no 
more. 

Scrooge cried out, "Leave me! 
Take me back. Haunt me no long-
er!" Again, he was in his own 
bedroom, exhausted, drowsy, and 
eventually to sleep. 

It was a ghost, no doubt, for 
Scrooge could see .right through 
the waistcoat, the two buttons on 
the back clearly visible. A ghost 
that talked. The ghost told 
Scrooge that the chain represent-
ed all the misdeeds and unkind 
acts 	, a lifetitne and that he, 
Scrooge, vas kaShioning his own 
chain, a heavy weight that would 
bear upon him when he was dead. 

But, all was not hopeless, the 
ghost reminded. He told Scrooge 
that other visitors would follow 
throughout the night. Three spir-
its in all would come, each with 
a message of importance. If 
Scrooge were wise, the ghost cau-
tioned, he would listen carefully 
and see clearly all the visitors 
would show him. "Christmas a humbug, uncle? 

You don't mean that, I'm sure." 
"I do," said Scrooge. "Merry 

Christmas! What reason have you 
to be merry? You're poor enough." 

What Scrooge failed to under-
stand is that being rich or poor 
isn't the most important thing in 
the world. 

The friendly nephew said, 
"Don't be cross, uncle." 

But Scrooge continued: "What 
else can I be when I live in such 
a world of fools as this? Merry 
Christmas! Out upon Merry 
Christmas! What's Christmas time 
to you but a time for paying bills 
without money; a time for finding 
yourself a year older, but not an 
hour richer? Bah! Keep Christ-
mas in your own way and let me 
keep it in mine." 

Scrooge felt an interest he had 
never known before. He asked of 
the Spirit if Tiny Tim would live. 
The Spirit replied, "I see a vacant 
seat and a crutch without an own-
er, carefully preserved." Scrooge 
hung his head. He felt worse 
when he heard Bob Crachit pro-
pose another toast and Mrs. Cra-
chit respond that she did not 
wish to drink a toast to Mr. 
Scrooge, "such an odious, stingy, 
hard, unfeeling man." But, she 
did, and the children drank after 
her, while the Ghost of Christ-
mas Present took Scrooge to visit 
here and there about the town, 
showing him both misery and 
happiness along the way. 

And soon thereafter, Scrooge 
was face to face with another 
visitor. 

"I am in the presence of Christ-
mas Yet to Come?" said Scrooge. 

Scrooge took his usual lonely 
dinner in a melancholy tavern, 
read all the newspapers in the 
place, then turned homeward to 
bed. He lived in chambers that 
once had belonged to his de-
ceased partner. It was a dreary 
place. No one else lived there, al-
though some rooms were let out 
as offices. 

The fog lay heavy and the yard 
was dark, but Scrooge knew every 
stone and soon was putting his 
key into the door lock. 

There was, upon the door, a 
huge knocker. There was nothing 
unusual about it except, at this 
very moment, it appeared not as . 
a knocker but to the startled 
Scrooge as the face of his late 
partner. Marley's face, plain as 
could be. 

Next morning, Scrooge hurried 
to the office, much earlier than 
usual. . . he wanted to be there 
before Bob Crachit, to catch 
Crachit coming late to work. He 
did. Bob was nearly twenty min-
utes late. He had his hat in his 
hand, awaiting the wrath of 
Scrooge. It never came. 

Instead, Scrooge greeted him 
cheerfully—and told him that he 
was to receive a raise in pay. 
Crachit was amazed. But he knew, 
finally, that Scrooge was sincere. 
The old man patted him on the 
back. "A Merry Christmas, Bob! 
A Merry Christmas—a merrier 
Christmas, Bob than I've given 
you in many a year." 

When the ghost vanished, 
Scrooge checked his door. It was 
still double-locked. Wearily he 
put himself to bed and eventu-
ally fell asleep. He awoke, not 
knowing the time, to find it was 
still dark. The curtains beside 
his bed were drawn back by a 
hand and the first vision appear-
ed. It was a strange figure, like a 
child, and yet again like an old 
man. It's hair was white, yet the 
face was smooth as that of a 
child. It held a branch of fresh 
green holly in its Jiand and, in 
contradiction, its dress was trim-
med with summer flowers. Strang-
est of all, however, was a bright, 
clear crown of light that sur-
rounded the head. 

The friendly nephew left and 
went out into the fog and dark-
ness. It was very cold. Workmen 
repairing gas-pipes had built a 
fire and stood around it to warm 
their hands. 

The shops were still bright and 
holly sprigs and berries were in 
the windows. Merchants were 
busy as everyone prepared for 
Christmas. 

The Lord Mayor in his Mighty 
Mansion gave orders to his fifty 
cooks and butlers to keep Christ-
mas in a proper way. 

The little tailor busied himself 
stirring tomorrow's pudding 
while his wife and baby went to 
the market to buy the beef. 

Again, in the dark, Scrooge 
found himself awake. No vision 
appeared within the room. He 
waited. When he could restrain 
himself no longer, he reached 
for his slippers, put them on, and 
walked cautiously to the door. As 
he reached for the lock, a voice 
on the other side called his name 
and bade him enter. He complied. 

It was his own room, no doubt, 
but it was changed. It was gaily 
decorated, with holly, mistletoe, 
and ivy. In the center of the 
room, heaped together to form a 
throne, were turkeys, geese, game, 
sausages, mince pies and much 
more. In the center of the room, 
too, a jolly giant. "I am the ghost 
of Christmas Present. Look upon 
me!" 

Scrooge felt a terrible sensa-
tion within himself. He had never 
had such a feeling before. He 
stared until the sight before his 
eyes became only a door knocker 
again, turned the key and let 
himself into the room. Once .in-
side, he paused, looking behind 
the door as if he expected to see 
Marley standing there. He closed 

The visitor told Scrooge that he 
was the Ghost of Christmas Past 
and, before Scrooge knew it, he 

The robed spirit seemed to in-
cline its head. It quickly showed 
Scrooge how his own death might 
be, with on one to mourn his loss; 
in fact, some seemed happy at 
his passing. It also showed him 
how Tiny Tim might die and 
leave countless friends to mourn 
and sorrow for him. 

Scrooge assured the Spirit that 
he was a changed man, and that 
the shadows that had passed be-
fore him had altered his life: He 
said: "I will honor Christmas in 
my heart, and try to keep it all 
the year. I will live in the past, 
the present, and the future . . . . 
Oh. tell me I may sponge away 
the writing on this stone!" 

In the years that followed, 
Scrooge kept his word and his 
promises. Tiny Tim did not die 
and to the gentle lad Scrooge be-
came a second father. He also be-
came as good a friend, a master 
and a man as the city ever knew. 
A few people laughed to see the 
change in him, but Scrooge let 
them laugh and paid little heed. 
His own heart was laughing, with 
joy and happiness, and he gave 
joy to all who knew him. 

Scrooge never encountered an-
other Spirit. And, long years 
after, it was often said of him 
that he truly knew how to keep 
the Christmas. May that be true 
of each of us and, always, as Tiny 
Tim observed, "God bless us 
every one!" 
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Tool sharpening of all kinds. 
Mail or bring your saws lawn-
Lawn Mower repair service -
mowers, etc. to Capers Service 
Repair on N. Kent St. - Desde-
mona Hwy. Box 42, Gorman, 
Texas, 76454 	 fnc. 

FOR SALE - 1962 Chevrolet 
4 door Station Wagon. Reason-
ably priced for cash sale. 
Herman Bennett, Phone 734- 
5868. 	 2-12-21c 

MON MX MAU 
&WAS 

PRECISION SAW FILLNG 
Saws re-toothed, hand, circle 
and saws and power blades, 
Every tooth made uniform, 
accurate and needle sharp on 
our Falty Automatic saw Filer. 

Lots of Goodies 
At Bake Show 

"Tis the season for baked 
goods" and many were on dis-
play at the 20th annual East-
land County Pecan Bake Show 
held December 1 and 2 in the 
Eastland Courthouse 	lobby. 
The Adult and Youth Bake 
Show featured over 70 entries 

'73 Crop Peanut 
Quotas and 
Allotments 

Washington - The U. S. 
Department of Agriculture 
announced a national peanut 
marketing quota of 1,771,000 
tons and a national allotment 
of 1,610,000 acres for the 1973 
crop. Growers who comply 
with their allotments will be 
eligible for loan and purchase 
support at a rate to be an-
nounced later. Noncompliance 
farmers will receive no loan 
and purchase support and 
marketing penalties will ap-
ply to any excess peanuts pro- 

duced. 
Legislation provides that 

the Secretary of Agriculture 
proclaims a national market-
ing quota and a national acre-
age allotment each year. The 
legislation further provides 
that the marketing quota be 
established at the higher of 
either (1) the average quan-
tity of peanuts harvested for 
nuts during the 5 years im-
mediately preceeding the year 
in which the quota is pro-
claimed, adjusted for current 
trends and prospective de-
mand conditions, or (2) that 
quantity sufficient to provide 
a national acreage allotment 
of 1,610,000 acres. 

On the basis of the pros-
pective need for peanuts for 
food uses (peanut butter, salt-
ing, candy manufacturing and 
related uses) the national 
marketing quota would be 
934,000 tons, which would re-
sult in a national acreage al-
lotment of 1,004,546 for 1973. 
The Agricultural Act of 1938, 
as amended, however, provid-
es for a minimum national 
allotment of 1,610,000 acres. 

In determining the market-
ing quota for the 1973 crop 
of peanuts, a "normal" yield 
of 2,200 pounds per acre was 
used. This yield, multiplied 
by the minimum national 
acreage allotment of 1,610,000 
acres, results in the 1973 na-
tional peanut marketing quota 
of 1,771,000 tons. 

The national peanut acre-
age allotment is apportioned 
to states, and the state al-
lotments are apportioned a-
mong individual peanut-pro-
ducing farms within each 
state, according to provisions 
of governing legislation. 

Dation 

1/2  PRICE 

SEATON'S VARIETY STORE FOR SALE - Rubber Bands 
Typewriter and Adding Ma-
chine Ribbons. Gorman Pro 
gress, 734-5410. 

this year which was the big-
gest show held in recent years. 
The Bake Show divisions were 
sponsored by the Eastland 
County HD Council. Entries 
consisted of pies, cakes, can-
dy, cookies, and nut bread. 
Winning top honors were the 
following: 

ADULT DIVISION 
Candy: 1. Mrs. Lon Horn, 

Eastland; 2. Mrs. Marion 
Thomas, Sr., Ranger; 3. Mrs. 
Glenn Jordan, Kokomo, 

Cookies: 1. Mrs.' Cullen 
Rodgers, Kokomo; 2. Mrs. Al-
bert Hendricks, Kokomo; 3. 
Mrs. Ray Judia, Cisco. 

Cakes: 1. Mrs. Lon Morn; 
2. Mrs. Zelma Lusk, Eastland 
3. Mrs. Edward Stacy, Car-
bon. 

Pies: 1. Mrs. J. L. Morrow, 
Kokomo; 2. Mrs. Johnson 
Smith, Eastland; 3. Mrs. Her-
man Cchaefer, Cisco. 

Nut Bread: 1. Mrs. Ruby 
Cavanaugh, Eastland; 2. Mrs. 
Odis Rodgers, Kokomo; 	3. 
Mrs. Ray Judia, Cisco. 

Grand Champion of the 
Adult Division was Mrs. J. L. 
Morrow of Kokomo. Reserve 
Grand Champion was Mrs. 
Ruby Cavanaugh of Eastland. 

YOUTH DIVISION 
Nut Bread: 1. Theresa Scott 

Rising Star 4-H; 	2. Ronnie 
Harris, Rising Star; 3. Sherry 
Smallwood, Cisco 4-H. 

Cookies: 1. Terri Wood of 
Carbon; 2. Theresa Scott, Ris-
ing Star; 3. Ronnie Harris, 
Rising Star. 

Cakes: 1. Kim Rodgers, 
Carbon; 2. Karen Plowman, 
Eastland; and 3. Patty Wea-
thers, Cisco. 

Candy: 1. Konnie Harris, 
Rising Star; 2. and 3. Theresa 
Scott, Rising Star. 

Pies: 	1. Leshia Claborn, 
Cisco 4-H. 

Grand Champion of the 
Youth Division was Terri 
Wood of Carbon 4-H and Re-
serve Grand Champion was 
Konnie Harris of Rising Star. 
CENTERPIECE DIVISION 
Pecan centerpiences and ar-

rangements were highlighted 
at the 20th annual Eastland 
County Pecan Show on De-
cember 1 and 2. All the center-
pieces featured pecans or 
some part of the pecan plant 
such as leaves. A record total 
of thirteen entries were on 
display this year. 

Winners in this division 
were: 1. Mrs. Marie Owens 
of Cisco; 2. Mrs. Lon Horn, 
Eastland; and 3. Mrs. Dale 
Carlile of Cisco. 

Other individual entries 
were Mrs. Odis Rodgers, Ko-
komo; Mrs. D. D. Sandlin, 
Carbon; Mrs. Zelma Lusk, 
Eastland; Mrs. Dick Yield-
ing, Eastland; Mrs. Herman 
Schaefer, Cisco; Her m a n 
Schaefer, Mrs. Ray Judia, 
Mrs. Wayne Carlile, all of 
Cisco; Mrs. Edward Stacy, 
Carbon; and Mrs. Don Haley 
of Clyde. 

Cash awards and ribbons 
were presented to the top 
three places by the Eastland 
County Pecan Growers Asso-
ciation. Awards consisted of 
first place $10, second $5 and 
third place $3. 

RENT _FOR : 	Semi-f urnished_ 
recently re-deco-
Pittman. 734-5380 

12-21fne, 

apartment, 
rated. A. D. 

DEAD ANIMAL SERVICE 
As near as your Telephone 
$3.00 service charge under 50 
miles from Hamilton - Over 
50 miles - 15c per mile. Phone 
DU 6-3303, Hamilton, Texas 

MATTRESSES - 
BOX SPRINGS 

New renovated, feted cotton, 
innrspring, choice of firmness, 
size and color. Satisfactiena 
guaranteed. Made in San An-
gelo by Western Mattress Co. 
Free pick-up and delivery -
Ph. 7345611, Gorman 3-16fac 

BIG CLOTFING SALE - 25 to 
50% off on all clothing. I have 
in stock 40 pair men's trousers 
60 suits, 94 dress coats, thou-
sands of ladies dresses, blouses 
skirts, & pants. Also children's 
clothing. Girls' dresses 25c. 
Don Rodgers Real Estat office 
Gorman. 	 12-17fnc 

FOR SALE - Paint $2 gallon 
and up. W. T. Barnes Lumber 
Co., 305 W. Labadie, De Leon, 
Phone 893-6611. 	1-6fne 

NEED 
An extra key - made while you 
wait. Rankin Army-Navy Sur-
plus. 

FOR SALE - Tropical Fish 
aquariums, pumps, plants and 
accessories. May be seen at 
Nathan's Barber Shop. 9-7fnc 

SEWING MACHINES FOR 
SALE - Used Singer Sewing 
Machine $24.75. We also clean. 
oil and adjust all makes and 
models. For further informa- 
tion call Estelle 	Craddock, 
734-5410. 	 1-12-7p 

PIANO Tuning and Repairing. 
Felton Carr, Box 82, Rising 
Star. 643-6401. 	6-1-11p 

FOR SALE - Rubber Bands 
Typewriter and Adding Ma-
chine Ribbons. Gorman Pro-
gress, 734-5410. 

FOR SALE - 1969 SS Che-
velle, clean and in good con-
dition. Ray Mathis. 893-6378, 
De Leon. 	 2-12-21c 

NOTICE - Will pay $100 re-
ward for information leading 
to the arrest and conviction 
of any person, or persons, 
guity of breaking and enter-
ing the farm house of I. P. 
Anglin. 	Contact the Sheriff 
of Comanche County. T. F. 
Anglin. 

FOR SALE - 4 room house 
with bath, carport, nice storm 
cellar with four 50x120 ft lots. 
Several fruit and pecan trees. 
Don Rodgers Real Estate, 734- 
5807, Res. 734-5563. 	12-7fnc 

FOR SALE - New Electric 
Victor adding machine, one 
manual Victor adding ma-
chine. One used Underwood 
typewriter $30. One used Roy-
al typewriter $40. One used 
Royal typewriter $60, Also 
new and used electric type-
writers and calculators. Es-
telle Craddock, Progress of- 
fice. 734-5410. 	 fnc 

	 also, 

PIANOS 
We have a nice selection of 
Mirrow Spinettes in most all 
styles and finishes. Also nice 
selection of practice pianos. 
We do custom re-finishing and 
styling and tuning. Terms if 
desired. 

WANTED: Baby sitter for 4f 
mouth old baby. Call Dorenda 
Underwood, 734-5501 	2-1228c 

FOR SALE: 60 A., 55 cult. 18 
peanuts. irrig. well and equip. 
goes. - Pavement, $400 A. 
terms - - 120 A. 80 peanuts, 
2 wheel moves, 5 wells & 
pumps, 3 br. home, $600 A. 
- - - 300 A., 78 peanuts, love & 
coastal grass, wheel move ir-
rigation system, good wells, 
home, $410 A. good 6% loan 
- - 2 - - 3 BR homes, corner 
lots, $4.500 & $4,000. We need 
your listings. Cogburn Realty. 
893-6666 De Leon. 	12-21fne 

DOUGLAS PIANO SALES 
613 E. Washington 

Phone 965-4221 
Stephenville, Texas 

MATTRESSES 
Save 30-50% 
New or Renovated 
Baby or King Size 

GOODSON 
MATTRESS FACTORY 

& TRADING POST 
Phone 356-2136 

Comanche, Texas 

10-Clearance 
All TOYS 

a5%OFF 
Our Shelf Price 

ALL 
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CELERY 	stalk 	.19 
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CANNED 

Armour's 

Can 

Star 

HAM $3A9  No. 300 
CRANBERRY 

Ocean 

Can 

Spray 

SAUCE 
29c 

5 Lb. 
GLADIOLA 

Bag 
FLOUR 

49e 3 HUNTS 
No. 300 Cans 

PEARS 
$1 

Skinless 
89c 
HAMS 

Hormel 
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oz 
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bag 
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MRS. 

Can 
SHORTENING 

TUCKER'S 

69c 

COUNTRY 

8c 
BISCUITS 

Can 

GIRL 

1 Lb. 
ZESTA 

Box 

Keebler's 
SALTINES 

39c 

14 Oz 
HUNTS 

Bottle 
CATSUP 

4 for $1 48 oz. 
WESSON 

bottle 
OIL 

99c 

4 
Griffin 
oz. can 

Black Pepper 

39c Foremost 
EGG NOG 

qt. 
MIX 

59c 

with 
LONGHORN 

beans 300 can 
CHILI 

29e 303 can 
BRUCE"S YAMS 

29c 

For 

22 oz. 
Dish 

HOUID 
bottle 

Washing  Hands 

57C 

JOY
GILBERT 

TURKEYS 	Smoked Turkeys 

GRAPEFRUIT 	CANDIES 
CHRISTMAS GOODIES 

TREES & CANDY X.MAS Bacon  
ARMOUR'S 
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STAR 

■ 

89  
- 
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May you and 
yours give and 

receive generously 
Ntiza..., 	of meaningful 

Christmas Joys. 
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GIFT & SCHOOL SUPPLY HEADQUARTERS 
Phone 734-5518 	 Got-man, Texas 

Np.011  at  

€4400  

Choose From Our 
FULL LINE OF 

COTY - LENEL 

& FABERGE 

GORMAN PHARMACY 
PHONE 734-5859 

George Simmons. R. Ph - Richard Watson. R. Ph. 
Night Phone 734-5530 or 734-5307 

Jerry Mehaf fey 

WANTED 
Several Openings for Sewing  Machine 

Operators. Position Offers Many Fringe 
Benefits: Hospitalization and Life Insur-
ance, Paid Vacation, etc. 

J. M. WOOD MFG. CO. 
Subsidiary of 

GEN ESCO, INC. 
AN EQUAL OPPORTUNITY EMPLOYER 

403 E. Blackjack Street 	 DUBLIN, TEXAS 
4-12-21 

BOOKKEEPING 
A N D 

TAX SERVICE 
JAMES JAY 

PHONE 734-5316 	 GORMAN, TEXAS 

MONUMENTS 
RILEY-GARDNER MEMORIAL - HAMILTON 

Era Maupin, Agent 
SEE DISPLAY AT MAUPIN SERVICE STA. 

R 0. Box 484 	 Gorman, Texas 76454 

N 



Our spirits soar and seek 

to wish you all that will 

bring happiness and joy. • 

GORMAN PROGRESS, Eastland Co.. Texas, DEC. 28, 1972  Mrs. Baker Host 
Friendly Ladies 
Christmas Party 

LAWNDALE 
VISITORS 

Crop Rotation 
Is Important 
To Producers Doris Clark of De Leon 

visited Mrs. Edward Macan. 
Mrs. R. M. Curb visited Mr. 

Claude Curb. 
Mrs. Alton Watson and Mr. 

and Mrs. Clea Echols visited 

est Wishes 
stI\ 

hOtioy greetings 
AUSTIN — Texas Aoricill-

ture Commissioner John C. 
White noted the increased in-
terest in crop rotations in the 
peanut producing area of Cen-
tral Texas and pointed out 
that crop rotations are of 
special importance where 
fields have been continuously 
planted in peanuts. 

"Crop rotations help to re-
duce crop damage from dis-
eases, insects, and nematod-
es," he said. owever, Com-
missioner White warned that 
it is possible new land being 
put in peanuts may be in-
fested with crop-damaging 
nematodes. Research workers 
have proven that some kinds 
of lesion nematodes can live 
in land where sorghums, corn 
and Common and Coastal Ber-
muda grass have been grown. 

Commissioner White urged 

Mary Ann Echols. 
Thomas and Elizabeth Lee 

of Cisco visited Ed Meglas-son. 
Mrs. Dorthy Henson and 

Mrs. Ricky Henson and baby 
of Ranger visited Sadie Burns. 

Ruthie and Sherry Porter 
visited George Porter. 

Dorenda Harper, Gorman 
and Lavona Sharp, Desdemo-
na visited William Shipman. 

Jeff Watson visited Lela 
Knox. 

Mr. and Mrs. Homer Mc-
Learen of Cisco visited Mrs. 
Eilza Maxey. 

Minnie Sparks, So. Hous-
ton and Charlie Steddum, So. 
Houston visited Floyd McCor-
mack. 

Mrs. Bill Wood of Waco vis-
ited Hiram Clay. 

Minnie Watson of Brown-
wood visited Hattie Uwe. 

Mrs. Bill Skiles of Big 
Springs visited Grace Skiles. 

Mrs. Elma Brown, Gorman 
Mrs. Jack Newland, Waco, 
Mr. and Mrs. Hadley Ander-
son of Houston and Mrs. L. 
D. Holliday visited the home. 

Mrs. Ray Rankin 
Host Hom'akers 
Christmas Party 

all farmers who are putting 
in new land to have soil sam-
ples analyzed for nematodes 
before peanut crops are plant-
ed in 1973. He said that root-
knot nematode may live in 
other crops besides peanuts. 
When peanuts are planted in 
land infested with 	certain 
kinds of root-knot nematodes, 
then damage to the peanut 
crop usually fo!lows. On reg-
ularly cropped land it is to 
the farmer's best interest to 
have his fields analyzed for 
nematodes at least each two 
years. 

For some unknown reason, 
nematode populations c a n 
practically disappear from a 
field that has a history of high 
nematode damage to crops. 
Conversely, fields with low 
populations of nematodes may 
suddenly have damaging num 
bers of nematodes. 

Nematode samples can be 
sent to the Texas Department 
of Agriculture, De Leon Re-
search Lab, 301 West Navarro 
De Leon, Texas 76444, for 

analysis. The samples should 
be received at least two 
months in advance of plant-
ing time. The samples must 
be moist, in plastic bags, and 
properly identified, 

Merry Christmas, good night. 
Those attending were Mmes. 

A. E. Pino, Charlie Torrez, 
Jim Turner, W. 0. Parr, H. 
M. Gilbert, C. R. Day, Charlie 
Garrett, M. H. Fairbetter, Bill 
Chandler, J. W. Hodges, F. R. 
Haile, Dorthy Hatcher, Vel-
ma Bennett, Mary Mehaffey, 
Charles Duran, G. C. Acrea, 
Othell Clark, Estelle Crad-
dock, Ralph Dunn, Edgar 
Higginbottom, 	W. T. Shell, 
Joe Collins, and Miss Don 
Moorman, and the host, Mrs. 
Baker. 
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Welcome the warmth of 
Christmas in your 
heart and indeed your 
holiday will be 
greatly blessed. 

y 

Many _44 
0 • AL • , • • )1` 	' 

lAWNDALE HOME 
FOR SENIOR CITIZENS 

From Mini to Maxi, that's 
where the skirts have gone, 
not forgetting the detour via 
pants suits. 

Colorful Maxies, long sleev-
e,- blouses, complimetary 
wide belts, knee slits, gold 
braids, ruffles with lace were 
on parade when Mrs. Gene 
Baker was host for the Fri-
endly Ladies Christmas Party 
in her home Wednesday. De-
cember 13th. 

All twenty-four being pres-
ent and accounted for, presi-
dent, Msr. Charlie Garrett. 
put on the soft petal and it 
was time for the devotional. 

The devotional, given by 
Mrs. Milton Fairbetter, was 
titled, "The Story of the An-
gel." Gabriel, the angel of 
the Lord, had in times long 
twist come to the aid of the 
prophet Dani°l. but the story 
has to do with later times 
when Gabriel was sent to 
Zacharia to tell him that a 
son, John, the forerunner of 
Christ, would be born to him 
and Elizabeth, his wife. And 
then of his visits to Mary, 
the virgin, and Joseph, to 
whom she was engaged. 

Was Gabriel with the Heav-
enly host as shepherds heard 
them sing? Did he guide the 
wise men? Both the shepherds 
and the wise men were among 
those who have sought and 
found Him. "If with all your 
hearts you truly seek Him, 
ye shall surely find Him." 
Deut. 4:24. 

The devotional was conud-
ed with the reading of "The 
Day Christmas Broke Into 
Prison," by Sgt. E. L. Allen. 

Time for the social hour 
had arrived with Christmas 
giving and getting and buffet 
dinner. 

Weight watching and waist-
lines were forgotten when 
lovely plates filled with chic-
ken salad, cranberry salad, 
cheese bits, chips and dips, 
hot rolls, and pound 	cake 
were served with hot punch. 

• HI FASHION 
BEAUTY SALON 

Mrs. Ray Rankin was host 
for the annual Christmas Par-
ty for the Homemakers Class 
of First Baptist Church with 
Mrs. Doyle Preston co-hostess 
on Thursday, December 15. 

Candles, holly and Christ-
mas theme was used in deco-
rations through the house, 

Gifts for exchanging were 
placed under the beautifully 
decorated Christmas free. 

The evening program was 
under direction of the Class 
president, Mrs. M. E. Foster. 
Mrs. Lindon Shipman gave 
the Christmas Story. using the 
the second chapter of Luke,‘ 
verses 1-14. 
Invocation was given by 

Mrs. 0. R. Buchanan. 
The Hostess served a deli-

cidus sandwich plate, spiced 
tea with fruit and cake. 

Attending were: Mesdames 
Lindon Shipman, Stanley Por-
ter, John West, Huron Polnac, 
M. E. Foster, J. E. Lawrence, 
0. R. Buchanan, R. M. Curb 
and L. D. Holliday. 	 a-Q4st 	 candlelight and time to say 

All of this by Christmas 

444eilieSL 4C114/(a 

<9, 2008 NOV'69 
M.P. 59 

As the season's glow 

spreads its magic, we 

wish for you and your 

family all the best the 

season has to offer. 

Happy holidays! skiinitAaWiakaiialiA10401148AiatinNEOWS"Wokas 

DAVIS COIN LAUNDRY 

Mrs. V. L. Davis 

Sincere wishes for 
a Christmas filled 
with joy and love. 
Peace on earth to 
all good men. 

Tie iulethied 
Ovatma The everlasting beauty of Christmas 

sparks the spirit of mankind- it is 

with thanks that we wish you a 

beautiful season 
May the happiness of the season 

be yours in great abundance. 

SHEEL 7 TILL 11 
SOUTHWESTERN 

PEANUT GROWERS' ASSOCIATION GORMAN 
INSURANCE AGENCY ROSS WILSON, Manager 

GORMAN, TEXAS 

aqtflaitflt,  04410,404-0410**WaiiiiWitAOWSWISAniinkialail 



MISSION PROGRAM 

KOKOMO 
NEWS 

By MRS. GLENN JORDAN 

CHRISTMAS PROGRAM 

Mrs. J. S. Clearman, Chair- 
man, of Missions, 	was in 
charge of the Lottie Moon 
Mission Christmas Program 
at the Kokomo Baptists Chur-
ch on Sunday morning, Dec. 
17. Mrs. Woodrow Browning 
and Mary Jo Clearman, with 
Mrs. Claude Fuller at the 
piano, rendered the special 
music. Others on the program 
were Woodrow Browning, Mrs 
Qdis Rodgers, Mrs. Glenn Jor-
dan, Mrs. J. 0. 4ackson, Jr., 
Teresa Fields, Mrs. Lee Bish-
op and Christi Fuller and Jim-
my Little. 

Mr. and Mrs. Woodrow 
Browning, Albert Hendricks, 
Jimmy Little, and Mrs. Claud 
Fuller rendered the special 

There will be a Christmas 
Program( tree and gift ex-
change at the Kokomo Baptist 
Church on Wednesday, Dec. 
20 at 7 P. M. Visitors are in-
vited by the Pastor, Bro. Joe 
O'Neal, and members of the 
church. 

The Young People's and In-
mediate Sunday School class-
es will have a party in the 
fellowship hall following the 
Program and tree. 

Foster, Bradley Carr, Noble 
Laminack, Glen and Angela 
Burgess, Jimmy, Kathy and 
Gloria Turner, Becca, Allen 
and Stephen Scitern, Alphie 
Pino, Clifton Pittman, Eddie 
Pettie, James Wooten, Aline 

GORMAN PROGRESS, Eastland Co., Texas, DEC. 28, 1972 rANITA SCITERN HONORED 
ON 7TH BIRTHDAY DEC. 14 

Cates, Kristi Odell and Nita's 
sisters, Brenda and Amy. Also 
her grandmothers, Mrs. Alvis 
Scitern and Mrs. Alvin Lasa-
ter, and an aunt, Mrs. Glenn 
Scitern, and Mrs. Jimmy Tur-
ner. 

THE GORDON 
SPOT 

By DeMarquis Gordon 
County Agricultural Agent 

Several have called my at-
tention to a mistake made in 
the news article which gavo 
the results of the pecan show. 
I made the mistake. We had 
217 instead of 117 entries in 
our county show. This was 
one of our largest pecan 
shows, but not quite as large 
as the 1970 show. That year 
we had 219 entries. Last year 
there were 200 entries. 

We had pecans of all sizes 
and shapes The largest pecans 

a Choctaw entry, weighed 
31 1-2 nuts per pound. They 
were owned by Mrs. C. E. 
Smith of Rising Star. In con-
trast the smallest pecans were 
so small that it took 907 to 
weigh a pound. They were en-
tered by Mrs. Clyde Garrett 
of Eastland. 

Thanks to the Eastland C. 
of C. and all the people who 
helped shell pecans and pro-
cess each entry. Our volun-
teers shelled 2140 pecans or 
aporoximately 40 pounds. 
PECAN BAKE SHOW 

Mrs. J. L. Morrow of Ko-
komo, was overall Grand 
Grand Champion of the Adult 
Bake Show Division. Mrs. Mor 
row took top honors on her 
pecan pie. 

GRAND CHAMPION 
1 c. white corn syrup 
3 •tssp. butter 
1 cup sugar 
3 eggs 
1 teaspoon vanilla 

Anita Scitern was honored 
on her 7th birthday by her 
mother, Mrs. Gerald Scitern, 
with a party at the Fire Hall 
on Thursday, December 14. 

Her birthday cake was bak-
ed in the shape of a Christ-
mas tree and decorated with 
red Christmas balls. Red 
punch was served with the 
cake to her guests, all stu-
dents in the first grade. 

Party favors were popcorn 
balls, candy canes and ba-
loons. 

Those attending were Lisa 

1 cup pecans (chopped) 
114 teaspoon salt 

Heat syrup and butter un-
til butter melts. Beat eggs 
lightly and add sugar and 
then eggs to syrup and but-
ter. Beat well( and then add 
salt, vanilla and pecans. Bake 
in 350 d. F. oven until done. 
Do not over bake. 
PIE CRUST (single crust for 

9 inch pie) 
1 113 cups sifted reg. flour 
112 teaspoon salt 
112 cup shortening 
3 tablespoons water 

Preheat oven to 425. Sift 
flour before measuring; spoon 
lightly into measuring cup and 
level without shaking or pack 
ing down. Combine flour and 
salt in a mixing bowl. With a 
pastry blender or two knives, 
cut in shortening until uni-
form; mixture should be fair-
ly coarse. Sprinkle with wa-
ter a tablespoonful at a time: 
toss with a fork. Work dou:h 

Mr. Lrs. itobbins 
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Our sincere thanks- we appreciate 
the opportunity the season brings 

to say "Thank You" and to wish 
you a Merry Christmas. 

music at the evening services. 
Mrs. J. L. Morrow remains 

in Mineral Wells at the bed-
side of her sister, Mrs. L. R. 
Higginbottom, who is in a 
hospital there. Mr. Morrow 
visited with them on Sunday. 

Kevin Rodgers of Brown-
wood spent Sunday night with 
his grandparents , Mr. and 
Mrs. Odis Rodgers and was a 
visitor at the Kokomo Bap-
tist Church on Sunday night. 

Mary Jo Clearman of Ho-
ward Payne has arrived home 
to spend the holidays with her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. J. C. 
Clearman. 

Mr. and Mrs. Dwayne Sni-
der of Texas Tech arrived on 
Saturday to spend the holi-
days with their parents, -Mrs. 
Hazel Snider and Mrs. Nor-
man Park. 

Christi Fuller, Teresa Fields 
and Teddy Jordan will finish 
semester finals at Tarleton 
on Tuesday and spend the 
holidays with their parents, 
the Claude Fullers, Vernon 
Fields and Glenn Jordans. 

Sorry that the news is short 
this week, but time is very 
limited during this time of 
preparations for Christmas. 

Merry Christmas to all! 

LAWNDALE HAS OWN 
DECORATING CONTEST 

Something new was added 
at Lawndale Home this Chrizt-
mas, "A Resident Door De-
ration Contest." Employees 
assigned certain doors and if 
you visited the home, you 
knuw all of them are beauti-
ful. 

Gene Foster, judge of the 
contest, said it was a very 
difficult project to judge as 
all were so good! He did 
choose five. First place was 
won by employee Dewey Lo-
gan; second place Mrs. Roy 
Kinser; third place Mrs. Vada 
Fields; fourth place Jo Ann 
White and fifth place Inez In-
gram. 

Christmas Party for the em-
ployees of Lawndale was 
held Tuesday Dec. 19th. 

into a firm, ball with your 
hands. Press dough into a 
flat circle with smooth edges. 
On a lightly floured surface, 
roll dough into a circle about 
1-112 inches larger than invert-
ed pie plate. 

Gently press dough into plate. 
Be careful not to stretch the 
dough. Trim 11 2 inch beyond 
the edge of plate; fold under 
to make a double thickness of 
dough around rim and flute 
with fingers or fork. 

Mrs. Jeff Cavanaugh East-
land, won Reserve Champion 
this year at the Pecan Bake 
Show. Pumpkin Bread was 
the winning reserve champion 
Mrs. Cavanaugh stated that 
one year she baked 39 loaves 
of pumpkin bread. 

PUMPKIN BREAD 
2 tsp. soda 
1-112 tsp. salt 
1 tsp. cinnamon 
1 tsp nutmeg 
4 eggs 
1 can pumpkin 
3 12 cups of flour 
3 cups sugar 
2 3 cup water 
2 cup chopped pecans 
1 cup oil 
1 tsp vanilla 

Mix well together and pour 
into 3 greased loaf pans. Bake 
at 350 oven-for 1 112 hours or 
until it passes toothpick test. 

Terri Woods of Carbon 4-H 
Club, top overall Grand Cham 
pion honors at the recently 
held Eastland County Pecan 
Show. Terri( 13 years old, won 
top prizes on her Hello Dolly 
Bars. 

JOBE EQUIPMENT CO. 
A. E. SMITH PEANUT DRYER & 

WAREHOUSE 

734-5790 	Gorman Taxas 

HELLO DOLLY! BAR 
1 stick oleo melted 
I c. graham cracker crumbs 
1 cup coconut 
1 cup chocolate chips 
1 cup chopped pecans 
1 can Eagle Brand Milk , 

Do not mix; Spread in pan 
in the above order as listed 
in a 9 inch square pan. Bake 
in 350 oven for 35 minutes. 
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CITATION BY PUBLICATION 
THE STATE OF TEXAS 

TO: Aaron Stewart, Jr., De-
fendant, Greeting: 

YOU (AND EACH OF YOU) 
ARE HEREBY COMMAND-
ED to appear before the 91st 
District Court, Eastland, Tex-
as of Eastland County at the 
Courthouse thereof, in East-
land, Texas, by filing a writ-
ten answer at or before 10 
o'clock A.. M. of the first Mon-
day next after the expiration 
of forty-two days from the 
date of the issuance pf this 
citation, same being the 1st 
day of January A. D. 1972, to 
Plaintiff's Petition filed in 
said court, on the 12th day of 
October A. D. 1972, in this 
cause, numbered 25,957 on the 
docket of said court and styled 
Eddie Mae Stewart, Plaintiff, 
vs. Aaron Stewart, Jr., De-
fendant. 

can be cooked with little or no water. 
Once water starts to boil, use the lowest 
heat setting that will keep it boiling. 

aS 

Use flat-bottomed 
pans 
The flatter the pan 
the better the con-
tact with the elec-
tric unit. Also. be 
sure the pans have 

ight•fitting lids to reduce cooking time 
and moisture loss. And match pan size to 
unit size to avoid heat loss. 

Cook and freeze 

Bake two cakes or 
pies, or make dou• 
ble recipes of such 
foods as stews and 
spaghetti sauce. 
Then freeze one 
for future use. Also. when you're baking. 
prepare an oven meal at the same time 
so no surface cooking is necessary—simply 
choose foods that will cook at about the 
same temperature. 

A brief statement of the 
nature of this suit is as fol-
lows, to-wit: 

Divorce and Child Custody 
If this citation is not served 

within ninety days after the 
date of its issuance, it shall 
be returned tmserved. 

The officer executing this 
writ shall promptly serve the 
same according to require-
ments of law, and the man-
dates hereof, and make due 
return as the law directs. 

Witness Joe T. Gray, Clerk 
of the 91st District Court of 
Eastland County, Texas. 

Issued and given under my 
hand and the seal of said court 
at Eastland, Texas, this the 
17th day of November, A. D. 
1972. 

Thaw before 
cooking 

Thawing meats be-
fore cooking re-
duces cooking 
time. Also, when 
recipes call for a 
turn it on too far in 

Use minimum 
amount of water 

The more water 

you use. the longer 
it takes to get it 
hot. Many foods advance—usually 10 to 15 minutes will do. 

TEXAS 	  
ELECTRIC SERVICE  

COMPANY 
Pe pre pone( at your Sc,vIce 

R ARMSTRONG. Manager 

NABORS FUNERAL HOME 
Joe T. Gray, Clerk, 

91st District Court 
Eastland County, Texas 

By Mary Jane Rouch, 
Deputy 
4-12-21e 
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G E Ern nOS 

This little wish is our 

way to bid you good tid- 

ings on Christmas Day. 

vininia • • • • IS • • • • 	 • • 

• • 	• 	 • 	• 	• 	 • 	 • 

801 IDA y  

CHEF 

:4-4. • • a ---winimangin SWARM MAPP•11.1111MOISIMIWIliaa 

<•• 	 „7:1R!/4 	 -."4,11111 

tziltik. 

tai r a --- 

May the joy and 

peace of Christmas 

be with you. 

4 

May the spirit of Christmas 
surround us all and let the deep 
meaning of this great holiday 
remain within our hearts. 

SMITH DRUG & SALES 

S 
CHRI ST MAS 

We wish all our friends 

a very joyous and cheerful 

Christmas season. 

efloiktag 
redittom 

W. H. SMITH 
DEPARTMENT STORE 

Tips to help 
you use electricity 
more efficiently 

for cooking. 

You can get the most value from 
your electric range by following these tips. 

•••••• don' 

Don't open the 
oven door 
unnecessarily 

Opening the oven 
door when the oven 
is hot can cause 
heat loss and ex-
tended cooking time 
undercooking. 

It also can result in To all of our friends the 

peace and joy of this 

beautiful season. 
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