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Pfc. Freddie Lee Bennett  

you meet good guys and bad. I 
don't guess all people can be good 
though. 

How is the office running a-
long? You know I am kinda dissa-
pointed. I didn't think the paper 
could be put out without me being 
there, but I see Joe has done a 
good job of taking up where I left 
off. I sure hope Joe never has to 
come to the Army because there 
wouldn't be one of the Bennett fa-
mily to help put out the paper. 
That would break a record of 
about 2 years. Is that right or is 
the record longer? Say Gene, 
I will be home Christmas and there 
is one thing I would like to know. 
Is there any chance of your need-
ing and old printer about the 20th 
of Dec. through about the 30th? 
You see I am going to need a lit-
tle spare cash and I really need to 
practice up on what I know, for I 
will be back in a few years to help 
out again. Sure will be glad to get 
back into the swing of the office 
again. Well Gene, it is about time 
for lights out. 'Tell everybody I 
said hello and take care of them-
selves and don't you work too hard. 
See you Christmas. As you would 
say "Happy Easter Egg." 

As ever, your 
printer's devil, 

Fred 

Funeral For John T. Foley 
At Carbon Meth. Monday 

.  - 
Funeral services for John T. Fo-

ley of Carbon were held in the Car 
bon Methodist Church Monday af-
ternoon at three p. m. Rev. Davis 
of Baird„assisted by Rev. B. B. 
Edmiaston, pastor of the Carbon 
Church, conducted the services. 

Mr. Foley was born in Comanche 
County, Texas on November 17, 
1883. ° He died four days before 
his 65th birthday, on Nov. 13th. 

In 1904, Mr. Foley married Miss 
Laura Butler of Comanche County. 
They came to Eastland County a-
bout forty years ago. He was a 
member of the Methodist Church. 
Farming was his occupation. 

He is survived by his wife, two 
sons. Tryo of Midland and Fred of 
Carbon; four daughters,  Mrs. 
Gormley of Rising Star, Mrs. Odis 
Mitchell of Carbon, Mrs. Cecil Til-
ley of Lovington, New Mexico and 
Mrs. John C. Williams of Dumas, 
Texas; and eleven grandchildren. 

Four sisters also survive him. 
They are Mesdames Mary E. Pell 
of De Leon, Joe Davis of Abilene, 
Kate Sims of Dublin and Mrs. Ali-
ce Shaffer of Dublin. 

Interment was in the new Car-
bon Cemetery. 

Cole - Lasater Vows 
Solemnized Nov. 12th In 
John Henderson Home 

Miss Verna Cole became the 
bride of John Lasater of Kokomo 
at 7:30 p. m. Friday November 12, 
in the home of Rev. and Mrs. John 
Henderson. 

In a single, ring ceremony the 
couple exchanged the vows read by 
Rev. Henderson. The couple stood 
in a seasonal setting, made of ou-
tumn leaves. Attendants were Mr. 
and Mrs. Jimmy Lasater as the 
best man and the matron of honor. 

The bride was attired in a navy 
blue creation. 	Her accessories 
were black. She wore a corsage 
of white mums, tied with pink. 

Following the wedding, refresh-
ments were served to the wedding 
party and to the guests, Mrs. W. 
N. Stephen's, the groom's mother 
and to his sister, Mrs. L. D. Hol-
liday and Mr. Holliday. 
• The couple plan to make a short 
trip visiting relatives in Kermit. 
They will be at home at the Cole 
place north of the city. 

Travis L. Wallis of Borger was 
a recent visitor in the Progress of-
fice. He is visiting relatives here. 
He stated the crops in,  the vicinity 
of Borger were very good this year 

Bill David, S. M. U. student was 
home over the week end with his 
parents Mr. and Mrs. E. D. David. 

Mrs. Mary Shelton Kimble 

Mary Shelton Kimble, who will 
reach her 83rd birthday Nov. 20th 
and William Virginia McNeely 
Bennett, who is 81 years old, saw 
Gorman in its infancy. Mrs. Kim-
ble came to Gorman in 1894. But 
Mrs. Bennett •was living here and 
saw the town laid off in 1890. 

Mrs. Virginia McNeely Bennett 

Mrs. Bennett remembers that this 
same community was known as the 
Shin Oak when the McNeely fa-
mily came to this county in 1884. 
The springs above the former Bass 
Lake and now Frank Gray Park 
were called Shin Oak Springs. 
They furnished water for people 
for miles around. Most folks haul-
led water. The draw above the 
springs extended to the Shin Oak 
Post Office on the old Carbon 
road. The P. 0, was about a mile 
from the present city limits of 
Gorman. People thought nothing of 
walking a couple of miles for the 
mail. All the land of this townsite 
was covered with shinnery. Gor-
man people, who have no shade 
trees, might have had one of the 
original oaks were it not that the 
axe was used all too well. 

The McNeelys, with their chil-
dren, seven girls and two boys, 
lived in a house located near the 
site of the present Gorman School. 
Two of McNeely family, sisters of 
Mrs. Bennett are Mrs. L. L. Dukes 
and Miss Mollie McNeely of the 
Duster Community. 

Mrs. Bennett had the thrill of 
seeing her brother, Buck McNeely, 
and her husband, Leander Bennett 
(now deceased), move the first 
business house into Gorman. The 
building was a Dr. Adcock's Drug 
Store. They moved it in from Shin 
Oak Springs (Bass Lake). They 
set it about where Cook's filling 
station is located. 

Gorman was named for a rail-
road man, who is thought to have 
been at least partially responsibble 
for the advent of the Katy. 

Portions of some of the houses 
first built in Gorman still remains 
intact but all have been remodeled. 
Mrs. Bennett mentioned the Scales, 
Geo. Smith, the Cain and her own 
home as being among the first. 
All original buildings were made 
of lumber. 

In the new town the H. T. Ham-
ricks opened a general store. The 
present Baptist Church had its be-
ginning in Shin Oak near the P. 0. 
but it was moved to Gorman soon 
where the members alternated 
with the Methodist in having 
preaching twice a month in the 
.school house. The school was the 
lower floor of the Masonic Hall. 

I

It was located near where T. W. 
Beard lives now. 

Mary Shelton had by this time  

finished public schbol, attended 
Sam Houston Normal, and had 
taught school in Gorman and East-
land. In 1890 she had married 
young Dr. Edwin Kimble (now de-
ceased) .The young couple had li-
ved at Jewett for four years while 
the doctor practiced up and down 
the county. 

When in 1894 they came to Gor-
man they rented a house. But they 
soon built the Kimble residence, 
the last addition of which was corn 
pleted in 1910. Dr. Kimble had his 
first office in the Stephenson 
Drug Store. Mrs. Kimble said, "At 
that time there were three saloons 
and no church building. However, 
the present location of the Metho-
dist Church had been bought for 
the amount of $35. When the 
church was finished, for the lack 
of pews, planks were placed on 
nail kegs. 

In 1906 several brick structures 
had replaced wooden buildings. 
And the Kimbles were among the 
leaders who built the present Met-
hodist Church. 

Both Mrs. Kimble and Mrs. Ben-
nett have been faithful members of 
their respective churches. Mrs. 
Bennett is a member of the hoc 
department of the First Baptist 
Church. Mrs. Kimble seldom mis-
ses a service in the Methodist 
Church. 

It was in 1924 that Mrs. Kimble 
had the honor of being the only 
elected delegate, west of the Mis-
sissippi to attend the General Met-
hodist Conference in Memphis, 
Tennessee. 

Mrs. Kimble supports a mission-
ary in China. When she was asked 
how she happened to be doing this 
she explained, "Oh, I had a little 
oil well to come in during the first 
boom and I'd been reading a great 
deal about China, so I decided I 
wanted to support a missionary in 
that Country. I had heard Sid An-
derson of Rising Star talk. I knew 
then that he was the one I wanted 
to support." 

Mrs. Kimble retains some busi-
ness interest with her son, John 
Kimble. Both of her children were 
reared in Gorman. Mrs. Bert Mc 
Glarery (Linnie) makes her home 
in Austin.  

In spite of her failing eyesight 
Mrs. Kimble keeps up a good 'cor-
respondence and does a lot of cro-
chet. 

Mrs. Bennett has good eyesight. 
She says she has never been fool-
ish enough to wear bi-focal lenses. 
She not only crochets but does lo-
vely needle work. She attributes 
her good health to the fact that 
she keeps busy. 

In the evening of life these two 
women walk more slowly but they 
watch the progress of Gorman 
with no less interest. The sum of 
their years in Gorman is 112. 

MERCHANTS IN GORMAN 
TO OBSERVE HOLIDAY 
THURSDAY, NOVEMBER 25 

The merchants of Gorman will 
bserve Thanksgiving Day, Novem 

ber 25th as a holiday. 
The First National Bank re-

quests that you handle all neces-
sary bank business on Wednesday. 

To The State Press: 
I have been requested to state 

my views on the following matters, 
which will probably come before 
the next session of the legislature. 

New and Additional Taxes: 
It is my considered opinion that 

no new or additional taxes should 
be levied. With the prospect of a 
surplus of $100,000,000.00 in the 
general fund, I can see no neces-
sity of any more revenue. I am in 
thorough accord with the proposi-
tion of "freezing" at least $50,000' 
000.00 of this surplus for future 
use. If this country should have 
another depression or recession, 
this fund would materially assist 
in relieving the situation. 

Recommendations of the Gilmer-
Aikin Committte: 

I have just received a copy of 
the report of this committee, and 
have not had an opportunity of 
studying it. I would prefer to 
make no comment until I have 
thoroughly considered it. 

Satate Prison Reform: 
I am committed to the proposi-

tion that we should spend what-
ever sum is necessary, out of the 
general fimd, to remedy the situa-
tion in our penal institutions. I 
favor the recommendations of the 
General Manager of the Prison 
System, Mr. 0. B. Ellis, who seems 
to be an able administrator and 
doing an excellent job. 

Revision of State Election Laws: 
I have not given this matter tho-

rough consideration, but it occurs 
to me that we should have a morel 
secret ballot, and .it should be 
made a felony to tamper with elec 
Lion returns, with particular refer-
ence to attempt to change the re-
sults in any voting precinct. 

Farm to Market Roads: 
I am in accord with the view 

that farm to market roads should 
be built as rapidly as possible. I 
do not look with favor on levying 
an additional gasoline tax for this 
purpose, however. It is reported 
that there has been or will be 
spent this year something over 
$100,000,000.00 on our road sys-
tem. It occurs to me that out of 
this vast sum of money, more of 
it could be used for lateral road 
purposes. 

There will doubtless- be many 
more important matters to be con-
sidered, but the above will proba-1 
bly require and receive the most 
attention. 

T. M. COLLIE 
Representative, 106 District 

PARKING LOTS SHAPING UP 

The city has graded the lot next 
to the Locker Plant and has had 
lights installed. This lot with the 
lot back of Ormsby's Grocery will 
help relief the parking problem in 
Gorman if car owners will conti-
nue to show their fine spirit of 
cooperation by using these lots 
when they plan on staying in town 
for several hours. 

Number Forty 

Commercial No. 4 J. A. Hirst is 
having a mud acid treatment to 
eat out some excess mud, which 
seems to have accumulated. 

Commercial Production No. 4 J. 
C. Burns drilling at 2357. 

Commercial No. 5, J. C. Burns 
drilling at 882 feet. 

Commercial Production'No. 1 E. 
L. Park swabbing after treatment 
Tuesday afternoon with 1000 gal-
lons. The response seems good. 

Man Drilling Co. No. 1 Sandy 
Roberts drilling at 2740 feet. 

Luling Oil and Gas No. 1 Rumph 
drilling at 1446 feet. 

Kadane and Sons No. 1 White-
sides rigging up. 

Coast Oil No. 2 George Bell are 
setting pipe at 2812 feet. 

D. D. Feldman No. 1 Cooper Oro 
eery drilling at 2760 feet. 

National Cooperative Refinery 
Assn. No. 1 Krell are attempting 
to correct a water break-through. 
They did a squeeze-job and are 
now waiting for the cemented area 
to hardeh so completion can be con 
tinued. 

Scott Drilling Co. No. 1 B. F. 
Porter have set pipe after almost 
2 months of gruelling trouble. Fish 
Mg- jobs, twisted tubing, just any-
thing that a jinx could cook up to 
retard the progress of completion, 
has happened to the Porter. Now, 
however, they think they will be 
able to perforate tomorrow. 

Edwards No. 1 J. David Smith 
rigged up and set surface pipe. 
Then they moved the rotary off to 
get a spudder, to finish the job. 
The spudder it still wandering a-
round somewhere, apparently for 
it had not arrived at this writing. 

Kirk and Mellard are reopening 
the Pete Mauney. They will make 
tests all the way from the Caddo 
to the Ellenberger, it is reported, 
or until they determine just what 
they do have in the hole, 	- 

Kirk and Mellard have installed 
high pressure Separator and are 
building tanks to take care of pro-
duction of whatever does come 
from tthe Moseley well. South-
western have laid 3 inch line to 
the well for the  gas,  but there 
seems to be a quantity of oil show 
ing recently. 

Joe Josephson was in Gorman 
Tuesday, talking seriously of plug 
ging his well on the Baskin, even 
though there is sufficient  gas in 
the hole, that when the hole is 
opened the escaping gas can be 
heard for 3 or 4 miles in the neigh-
borhood, and the oil is heard gur-
gling and bubbling in the hole. It 
is not a gusher to be sure, but 
there is something in that hole 

besides water. 

KING THEATRE 
Thursday - Friday 

Dana Andrews Jean Peters 
In 

Deep  Waters 
Also 

Two Color Cartoons 

Saturday 
Allan "Rocky" Lane 

In 
Bandits of Dark Canyon 

And 
Frank Buck's 

In 
Bring 'Em Back Alive 

Also 
Jeses James Rides Again No. 6 

Sunday and Monday 
Betty Grable - Doug Fairbanks, Jr. 

In 
That Lady in Ermine 

Also 
Billy Burke Comedy 

Tuesday and Wednesday 
Dana Andrews - Gene Tierney 

in 
The Iron Curtain 

Also 
Cartoon - Snapshoots 

Thursday and Friday 

Jane Wyman - Lew Ayres 
In 

Johnny Belinda 
Also 

Color Cartoon - Novelty 

Dear Gene, 
How does this find you and all 

the rest of the Progress family? 
Fine I hope. As for me I guess 
you could say I was doing fine. 
Having to study a lot though. Go 
to school six hours a day_ and the 
rest of the time 'I either study or 

Ore letters. Sure was proud of 
today. I received a Fort Worth 

Star Telegram or Dallas Morning 
dews clipping, I don't know which. 
One of my friends sent it to me. 
lit was about your library. You 
know I can remember when I used 
to go out and carry books that peo 
pie had brought in. They brought 
in new and old but I think they 
were all read by someone. It does 
people good to read once in a while 
it rather takes a man off his trou-
bles. About all the reading mate-
rial I have to read is radio books, 
letters and the Progress. I learn 
all about radio reading books but 
I think I had rather read the Pro-
gress and find out all' the news of 
home. As for enjoying the paper I 
don't think anyone enjoys it as 
much as Mauney and I do. Some-
times we have to flip to see who 

?gets it first but, anyway, we both 
get to read it and that is the im-
portant thing. 

4  You know Gene I really believe 
what you said about people in big 
cities now. It seems they are all in 
a hurry going someplace and don't 
know where they are going. I am 
glad-my home is in a small town 
because you know everyone and all 
the folks you see, you say hello 
and they all speak back. In a big 
town a guy never knows who his 
neighbor is. As the Army would 
say, "I can't see it." Since I have 
been in the service I have met 

ys from all over the states and 

QUOTES 
Took time out Monday to re-read 

some of the nice renewal letters I FALLS FROM SPEEDING CAR 
have received the past month 	WORRIES ABOUT BEING LEFT 
Mrs. H. M. McDaniel of Frisco  i  
writes, "I certainly enjoy my home Freddie Ray Levens, 3 years old 
town paper although I have been fell out of his dad's car while it 
away for eight years." 	 i was traveling about 50 miles per 

W. L. Gann of Eastland writes, hour. When his father stopped 
‘'.e hear from our old home town the car and rushed back to pick up 
reading the Progress and al- the boy, he and Mr. Watson, grand-

_ .vs look forward to it each week. father said they met the boy run-
"Lf you had stopped my Prog-j ning toward them saying, "I was 

ress I would have lost an old' afraid you were going to run off 
friend and would have been lost and leave me." 
without it, as I have been taking' After being examined by a doc-
the Progress for years. Thanks a- 1  tor, Freddie Ray showed no ill af-
gain for sending me the paper and I fects from his experience except 
keep up the good work of the past!) a few bruises. 
Miss Ora Wright, Amarillo, Tex.' Mr. and Mrs. J. N. Watson and 

rs. Ethel Sutton, forrnely Et- Mr. and Mrs. Ray Levens and Fred 
Capers, who now resides with die were on their way to visit Ray' 

er husband, John, in sunny calif-• father at Roby 
fornia states they can't tell Thurs.-) 
day from any other day in the• CAKE SHOW SLATED FOR 
week since they have not been get- NOV. 23 IN EASTLAND 
ting the paper. She says, "No kid- 
ding we forget to appreciate a On November 23rd the public is 
thing until it is denied Us. I still invited to attend the Home Demon-
have one mother brought when titration Club's Cake Show to be 
she was out here and its worn slick held,  in connection with Bewley 
so please send us one every week. Mills Better Baking Contest. The 
We are fine and enjoying sunny show will open at 10 A. M. and the 
Calif. Saw the Los Angles Rams cakes will be judged during the 
vs the Washington Red Skins and forenoon. Each club will come 
Sammy Baugh is really a game early and set up am exhibit of their 
within himself. There were 80,000 accomplishments. 
people there and they cut the Auction of the winning cakes and 
lights and evryone struck a match, sales of all cakes will be held in 
and you can't imagine how beauti- the afternoon. From 2 P. M. til 
Sul it was. 	 4 P. M. refreshments will be ser-
, Two letters received on the elec- ved at open house. 
tion were too late for publication 
but I did apprciate getting them 
and hope you will write again on 
other subjects which I will be glad 
to publish at any time. 	Traffic Highway Patrol 

* Reports On Accident 
Former Assistant Editor and Chief 

Misses The Old Home Town 
The report of the Highway pa- 

trol officer regarding the traffic 
accident some eight-tenths of a 
mile north of Carbon Saturday 
evening, according to city officer, 
Tom Greer, stated that John T. 
Foley, aged 65, who met his death 
as a result of the accident, had, 
immediately preceding the colli-

sion for reasons unknown, pulled 
his car to the left side of the road 
as he drove south, into the path 
of a northbound- car driven by Eu-
less Westmoreland. 

Mr. Westmoreland, who reported 
the accident to authorities in East-
land at once, was absolved of any 
question of negligible responsibil-
ity for the collision, the traffic pa-
trolman having come to, the scene 
of the accident. 

Mrs. Westmoreland, who accom-
panied her husband at the time of 
the accident, received a cut on her 
forehead. She was returned to 
Gorman in a car where the wound 
was dressed at the Blackwell, Sani-
tarium. 

Ambulance service from a near-
by town was delayed. The call 
was then given to Higginbotham's 
Funeral Home of Gorman, who 
brought the body of Mr. Foley  A 

the Blackwell Sanitarium, where 
efforts to restore him were futile. 

The ladies expect to have their 
program broadcast over KWBC. 

UBLISHER-EDITOR 	Panthers Win Final Game 60 QUOTES FROM AN AMATEUR 

' The Gorman Panthers defeated 
the De Leon Bearcats 6-0 in a dis-
trict tussle here Armistice Day to 
give the Bearcats undisputed pos-
session of the cellar position in the 
district placing. 

Both teams entered the game un 
victorius thus far in district play, 
and both were out for, what seem, 
ed, their only chance to change 
their record. The Panthers scored 
one time in the second quarter and 
that was enough. 

For the larger part of the first 
two periods the ball moved back 
and forth between the two teams, 
with neither ever seriously threat- I 
ening to score. But in the wain-
ing minutes of the second period, 
with Gorman on De Leon's 38 yard 
like, a pass from Stacy to Rails; 
went all the way for the tally that 
won the game. The pass was com-
pleted to Rolls on the 25 yard line 

and he ran it over from there. 
Pnly one tackler made .a bid to 
stop Rails, and his fingertips only 
glazed his' heels. 

Stacy proved to be quite a head 
ache for the De Leon boys on of-
fense, as he broke through the line 
or around end time and time again 
for long runs and precious yard-
age. Harris, Brown and Pittman 
also proved to be hard to stop 

when the ball was in their posses-
sion. 

Enloe,. Moore, Mehaffey and 
Hallmark distinguished themselves 
on defensive playing. Every man 
on the squad played heads up ball 
and,were at their best. The line 
opened gaping holes and the backs' 
slammed their way through them 
for large gains. 

IIMMI=1••=10.1.., 
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At a recent guest social of the Woman's study Club, Mrs. W. E. 
Cantrell,6th District Presidentsneaker oLth evening, following eraIess,discoverd 

 she had been 
ieardyeepresidents 

of local study clubs... She saw at  once  the cooperative spirit  of the 
women and by way of acknowledgement,  asked that they join her 
when the Progress requested her picture. 

Above reading from left to right are: Mrs. Walter Davis, president 
of the Excelsior Club; Mrs. Cody Love, president of the Progressive 
Study Club; Mrs. Cantrell and Mrs. Berenice Jeffs, president of the 
Woman's Stud: Club. 

States District President 
Spirit Of Cooperation Outstanding 
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A HANDSOME ROBE 

For His Leisure Hours 

Every man likes to come home on a 

cold wintry hignt and relax gracious-

ly in his good - looking, war'mrobe. 

It's the nerfect gift for you to give 

him this Christmas—something he 

wants very much.. See our large and 

unusual selection of silk, rayon and 

wool robes . . . our smart smoking 

jackets. Plus our other choice gift 

items for men. Make our store your 

headquarters for Dad, brother, son, 

husband, favorite uncle or special 

boy friend. You'll always find what 

THEY want here at what YOU 

want to spend. 

Shop early for Christmas — here! 

$5.95 and $10.95 

BIBBY'S 

DEPARTMENT STORE 
Gorman. Texas 

04.44.004**0••••••••••••••• 

4 
	 Your Prescrip- 

pion filled as 

III:ordered by the 

Doctor. 

Ph. 55 	 Night Ph. 109 
Es WALKER, Druggist.  

Mehaffey Drug 
✓s+t44.64.44e•-••••••••••• 

2 	COMPLETE 
MAGNETO SERVICE 

We Rebuild All Types of - - - 
MAGNETOS 

Farm - Oil Field - Industrial 
OIL FIELD ENGINES —

AUTOMOBILES —
TRUCKS 0 TRACTORS 

I 	SMITH BROS. 
e. CHEVROLET CO. 
;Phone 26 	 Gorman 

CALL COLLECT 

Gorman 300 or 
Brownwood 9494 

BROWNWOOD 

RENDERING 

COMPANY 

Go To Hail 
FOR NEW 

SMITH - CARONA 
TYPEWRITERS AND 
ADDING MACHINES 

421 West Commerce Street 

Tel. 48 Eastland 

Quarter-mile beam. Fingeriiiip 
direction. Chromium plated. Roof 
mounting model.  J iSCO ovaimaie, 

lirivisemi.aces•rissu.misisr-imaristswirmaier=i 

Why  TERNATIONAL Trudi Service 

IlLeans TON-MILE ECONOMY 
.  Contact us if you're interested in truck service 
that keeps trucks operating economically. Here's 
why: 

We plan your work efficiently. Our shopnaen are 
competent craftsmen. They find and fix little 
troubles before they become big ones. They have 
the skill and will to do thorough jobs. 

We are pact of the International Truck service 
organization. We have factory-standard Interna-
tional parts. We have special International equip-
ment for testing, servicing and repairs. 

So contact us for service that pays off in the 
language the truck operator understands best 
ton-mile economy. This service available for other 
makes as well as International. 

Heat may be di. 
rected f rom the 
front of the heater 
toward driver's 
feet; or may be 

,diffused through-
( out cab.Defrosiing 
is by a 25-blade 
blower wheel. 

DifififfEMEONEMMeli` 

STEERING 
CONTROL et 	1  

KNOB 

Promotes truck safe-
ty and driver effi-
ciency. Makes steer-
ing easier. Precision- 

HIGGINBOTHAM MOTOR CO. 
Gorman, Texas 

EdWar'd is really hot in history. 
He and Joe together nearly take 
over the entire dismission. Say you, 
guys give someone else a change. 

pi 

Here is your ramolin' reporter 
to give you all the lowdown on 

• these night owls. 

JUNIOR JOTS 
Peggy Bell, Reporter 

FOR 	rj, 

PRESTON FLORIST 

"The Paper Home Folks Prefer" The Gorman Progress, Thursday, Novembe 18, 1948 Gorman, Texas. 
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Fish Bait 
M. A. L. 

By Visiting Reporters 

As you all know by now, we won 
over -De Leon in the gome Thurs-
day. We sure are proud of our 
boys. 

To start off this week's news; 
Dessie Mae, what time did you and 
Patsy get home Saturday night? 
Huh! Some of the Freshman say 
it's too bad we can't have a house 
of horrors more often. Hey Au-
drey who has your eye now? (A 
sophomore maybe, or maybe not?) 
J. F. where were you seen last? 
Jack, how are things going around 
your part of Gorman? 

Well, as the washwoman brings 
her clothes to the line, this line 
must be brought to a close. 

P. S. - Shirley Simon, how was 
the show Monday night ? 

Soph Suds 
Joy Hampton, Reporter 

From the results of Thursday 
rite we now have these startling 
facts. James Brown was doing 
very well for himself because of 
his dancing. Everyone agreed he 
was really in the jive of things. 
We must say the dance was pepped 
up a bit when the boys won their 
annual game with De Leon. We 
were sure proud of them. 

Betty Ann 'Brightwell was con-
fronted with a very serious prob-
lem trying to decide which she 
would give the honor of taking her 
home, Gerald Richberg or Marvin 
Bailey. Well, first come, first ser-
ved, so after some thinking Ger-
ald won out. She even surprised 
everyone by being with her old 

heart throb Gerald Hale over the  

if you get caught is it Jerry? 
Jeanette can't make up her mind 

whether it's going to be Freddie 
or Gerald. 

We hope B. S. and B. E. had a 
good time Saturday night. We did 
our best. 

Adele has been seen lately with 
that handsome boy from the Ko-
komo community. Who could it 
be but Glenn Donaldson. 0. T. try 
again sometime. She might go the 
next time. 

If you see everyone in town 
start climbing the buildings. you 
know La Velle is driving through. 

Billy Check, Roy, and Jack still 
prefer Seniors. They have been 
seen lately with Mackie, Freda 
and Betty Sue. 

Louise, are you and Desdemona 
still o. k. 

J. F., Jo Olive said you had bet-
ter think twice before you started 
to tell anything. By the way Jo 
why were your slacks so dirty? 

Six weeks is next week so every 
one is having to study real hard. 

JERRY CLARK ON HONOR 
LIST AT NTSC 

Jerry Clark of Gorman is among 
524 junior and senior students who 
have been named for the dean's 
honor list at. North Texas State 
College for the fall semester. 

The list which also includes the 
names of 298 graduate students 
who are automatically on the ros-
ter, is the largest in the history of 
NTSC. To be included students 
must maintain at least a B ave-
rage for 12 hours' work the pre-
vious semester, with no grade be-
low C. 

Inclusion on the list exempts 
students from the usual penalties 
for class absence and gives them 
special library privileges. 

er+ 

week end. 
Joy Hampton has been wearing 

a sad look all week after being dis 
I appointed over the week end. After 
'Baylor didn't make it home after 
all. 

Everyone must agree that we 
like that idea of the gum sale now 
we have it at our fingertips. 

Seems as if J. F. Lily finally 
won out. Betty Beard has to ad-  HAMILTON RENDERING CO' 
mit she is still carrying the torch 	Hamilton, Texas 
for him and J. F. only gives an ap- 

FREE AND SURE REMOVAL OF 
DEAD OR CRIPPLED STOCK 

Phone Collect 303 

1111110-0111•10•0111111100011111111•04101110.0-010111•040-001111110-00010041111110.0-01111100031111100411611110.1 

proving grin to this. Well you 
can't blame him. 

i$1110.00011119.0.11101110-0400139.0111300,041111000•008700•00111100.0. 

One of  the  most  important thing's  .o.amst-o•twascsoolcom•o-oiess000.seisoocoionswo.assoi 
.., 	, 	, 	,, 

AFTER your Borne burns, you that will happen our Junior Year 
happened last week. We got our 

may find the contents are seri "Atomic Bomb" pins. 

: onsly damaged by fire and wa-.  From all occasions it looks as 
4. ter. 	 s 	 0 if Lucille had her hands full Thur- 

Von may have tto stand a six-i sday night. j,, 	Some people decided it would be 
+ able portion of the loss unlessi cheaper not to eat breakfast at 

I  * you have sufficient irisrance toe  home, but to wait and eat pecans 
i pay for the damage. 	: in study hall. It's not very funny 

Ask this agency to check your 
!insurance NOW! 	 Gorman Prooress 

i Published on Thursday at Gormat 
Eastland County, Texas 

	

Gorman 	EUGENE (Gene) BAKER 
I 	Owner - Publisher 

LUCRETIA FAIRBETTER Insurance 	Associate Editor 

i Entered as Second Class Mail at 

	

Agency 	he Post Office in Gorman, Texas 
under the Act of March 3, 1879. 

GLYNN K1RK, 	• 
• SUBSCRIPTIONS 

	

BERENICE JEFFS 
	

T Local, per year 	  $1.50 
Phone 134 	 Gorman, Local, 6 mos. 	  $1.00 

Out of Trade Territory 	 $200 
Sixe Months 	  $1.25 

Dtn.  Edw. Adelston 
OPTOMETRIST 

Eyes Carefully 
Examined 

Glasses Guaranteed 
To Fit 

406 Exchange Bldg. 
Eastland, Texas 

Fanny O'Neal and Joy are hav-
ing an awful time staying in class 
better calm down girls. 

Gergie doesn't have much to say 
or do this must mean her heart be 
longs to someone away. Say now 
how about a hint old girl. 

Nick Baker was only to glad to, 
move during fifth period beCause 
now he is by 'his favorite sweet-1, 
hearts; Helen Bennett, Ruthie War I 
ren, Wanda Daniels, and Mae Belle 

77—a 
 

Kae. 

IV A N TED 1,000 TONS 
DRY Farmers' Stock Peanuts for Seed purposes 

In- order that we shelters may supply your desirable seed 
peanuts next spring, we must have peanuts that are thorough-
ly cured before placing in storage, as green peanuts will heat 
when bulked. 

Yo farmers arc not gaining anything when you sell your 
peanuts green. to some shelter, and permit him to dock you 
tor excess moi: tare. There would be no dock if your peanuts 
were dry. This is your opportunity to provide desirable seed, 
next spring, to plant. 

PLEASE CONTACT US BEFORE SELLING 

KING PEANUT COMPANY__ 
Abilene, Texas 



C444.44',444.4.4.444.44.44;144 

Geared To Better Driving 

hen your car's transmission is 	
O 

in need of repair, let us do the 
job. We'll do it  quickly, effi-

ciently and expertly. 
When in need of repairs — 

O 
	 CALL.-- 

O 	
U. S. ROYAL TIRES and BATTERIES 

FIRST NATIONAL BANK 

"Oldest Bank In Eastland County" 
GORMAN, TEXAS 

The 

Live Up To Your Faith 
Faith in God and the Spiritual values of life 
are essential to these times. Faith can con-
quer fear and guide us to personal and world 
peace. In faith, we can find strength and 
courage for these days. 

Live up to your faith! Attend 

your Church and Support 

your Church. 

The Paper Home oiks Prefer" 
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One Sure Way - 

. . . and about the only way, to find out about a land title 
is to get an abstract. The logical time to get an abstract is be-
fore the property is purchases. Most any land owner will glad-
ly furnish an absirait before the sale if he knows his title to 
be good, but few will bother about it after the transaction is 
closed. If you have bought prpoperty without an abstract and 
still own it, better see us soon. 

Earl Bender & Company 
Eastland 
	

Abstracting Since 1923 	 Texas 

4> 
• 

4> 
	

NOTICE 
4> LOCKER BOXES ARE RENTED BY THE 0 

4> VEGETABLES, YOU MAY RENT AN EX-  3 
I> YEAR. IF YOU HAVE EXCESS MEAT OR 4  
• 4 

t 
TRA BOX BY THE MONTH. 	

3 
4> 

t 	FROZEN FOOD LOCKERS 3 
4 

C 	 .1. P. LEE, -Manager 	
4 t 

45 
:44•4>G0.: 4;4;:,.44?:?6,4-44><G4.4 

ft,ce.Otste9tssInisee•s.settauev..(resw,s 

FOSTER'S GARAGE 
t  Phone 154 	 Gorman, Texas 

• • 
O 

MOSLAH SHRINE CIRCUS, BIGGER AND BETTER THAN EVER, 
TO OPEN IN FORT WORTH NOVEMBER 19 FOR 10-DAY RUN 

For the sixth season, Moslah Temple's Shrine 
Indoor Circus will open its doors November 19 at 
8 p. m. in Will Rogers Memorial Coliseum in Fort 
Worth, and shown above are cenes from the all. 
professional show. Upper left is Aida, "the girl 
in the moon," whose spectacular aerial act brings 
the Circus to a thrilling climax. E. Morgan Town-
sen, Chief Rabban of Moslah Shrine and Circus 
General Chairman, is shown upper right arranging 
final details for the show. Lower left is Poodles 
Hanneford and his trained horses and lower right 
an  acrobatic chimpanzee is going into his act. 

Performances will be given every evening at S 
p. m. and-special matinees will be held at 2 p. m. 
November 20-21  and 25-20. Tickets may be ordered 
from Moslah Shrine Cirrus, P. 0. Box 1220, Fort 
Worth .1, Texas, and will go on sale November 10 in 
the Texas Hotel Lobby in Fort Worth. Members of 
Moslah Shrine in many Texas towns now have gen-
eral admission tickets for sale which may be ex-
changed for reserved, box or ring-side seat tickets. 
General admission tickets are $1.20, reserved seats 
11.80, and box and ring-side seats $2.40. All per-
formances will be held in the fireproof coliseum. 

IN GOOD TASTE 

FOR ALL TASTES! 

Athletes Know 
the Benefits of Heat Lamps 

IWO'  taiardielzail 	 -el 4  lYiTivrtia  a-  iriillziarrallifitaiiltrigtiii6RWSIZViriagilnsltrittlizailiri`ti 

Whatever your taste in food, whether it be for the elaborate 
dish or the simpler fare, you'll find it here,  whop  you savor 

',the flavor of our dinners, you'll say as we: Delicious! 
Kokomo News Mr. and' Mrs. Floyd Wood and 

family, Mr. and Mrs. Albert Hen-
dricks, Fanny Bell O'Neal shopped 
in Ranger Saturday. 

Aunt Mug Mel is very ill in the 
!Gorman Hospital. Mrs. Ellen Clear 
Iman, Mr. and Mrs. Pete Neil and 
daughters, Otis all of Lamesa 
have been at her bedside. Others 
to visit are Mrs. Grace McDonald 

Mr. Gage Wright, who recently 
received severe burns on his hands 
and face when a piece of 'oil equip-
ment exploded, is on the job and 
his burns are healing rapidly. 

Mr. Frank Dean is reported to 
be feeling much improved as of 

of Ft. Worth, Mr. and Mrs. Fer_  Tuesday.  
rell Creager of Ranger, Mrs. Neil Mr. Marcy Allen, who suffered; 
Eaves and children of New Mexico a heart attack Saturday afternoon 
and Mr. and Mrs. Paul Norris and has been confined to the hospital: 

but he is, at this writing, doing 

4 
K) 

 

K) 

4 
0 
0 
0 

Ann of Ft. Worth. 
Mr. and Mrs. Lucius Johnson 

were shoppers in Ranger last Sat-
urday. 

Mrs. Carra Sessum and Mrs. J. family accompanied by Mr. and 
M. Hendricks spent Saturday  with Mrs. Arthur Wood of Eastland vin i 
Mrs. John Riker. We are sorry to ited Mr. and Mrs. Reed Wood and 
report little Sharron Kiker on the family of Vernon Sunday 
sick list. 

Mr. and Mrs. Leo Cleg of Roby, 
Texas, Mr. and Mrs. Tolar of Sweet 
water were guests in the W. A. 0' 
Neal home Sunday. 

Those visiting Mr. and Mrs. 
4 John Timmons Sunday were Mr. 
0  and Mrs. Dub Brown, Gorman,.  .4> 
4  Mr. and Mrs. Bruce Laminack andl  4> 
0  children of Grandview, Mr. and,  4> 

Mrs. Cullen Rodgers and family, fl> 
4  Mr. and Mrs. Otis Rodgers, Verna 4> 
CP,_ Leo Garrett and Jolene Treadway. 4> 
\r, 	Mr. and Mrs. Lucius Johnson St> 

4 

4 

4 
4 
4 

4 
4 
4  who is very ill. 
) 	Mr. arqi Mrs. Lewis Treadway 
4  visited Mr. and Mrs. Oscar Tread-
4 way Friday. 

4 4 	Mrs. J. M. Hendricks is visitting 
4 her daughter  Mrs. Floyd  Wood 
4  and family. 

NOV. 30 DEADLINE FOR EN-
LISTMENT TO EUROPEAN 

4 COMMAND OF US ARMY 

All  men, with or without prior 4 
military service,  who desire to en- /1 

4  list in the U. S. Army for duty in  4 
0  the European Command must do  4 
4  so prior to November 30 deadline, 4 
4  it was annonuced by S-Sgt. James  4 

Hendrick of the Eastland Recruit-  4 
4  ing Station. 
4 	Openings exist in the colorful  4 
4, US Constabulary Forces, the com- 
CP, bat famed 1st Infantry Division 
\Ir and the US Army Unassigned. 	:(1.  

For full irformation on appli- 
cation and en' 	nt policy, inter- \,/, 
ested indivich.- ,  are  urged  to go \Y.  

W. Main St., Eastland. 
Force Recruiting Station at 311 
at once tto the Army and Air 

•srrie.dee•Ons.C.ue, 
S.4 
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12,71mc 

TOP-NOTCH CAFE 
BOB SCOTT, Manager 

There will be a community sing-
at the Kokomo School house Sun-

,day, November 21, 6:30 P. M. 
Everyone is invited. 

A large crowd attended church 
'and Sunday School last Sunday. 

'ILLNESS IN COMMUNITY 

aler/VZ 
HEAT LAMPS 
/RI KEYED 7V 
BETTER 
LIVINO 

Take.a tip born athletes and their coaches 
and trainers—ihey 	-know that one of the 
best ways to get quick relief from muscular 
aches and pains is by applying the relaxing, 
soothing heat of amelectric heat lamp. Sore 

• and still muscles, strained ligaments or more 
severe sprains all react to the penetrating 
heat of heat Imnps. 

Electric heat lamps have many other uses 
around the home, too. For example, they dry 
fingernail polish, paints and lacquers rapidly. 

) And best at all, they (It any standard lamp 
sxket. No special stands or holders are need-
ed, unless you prefer them. 

UMWMOMMWMIXWMAMMNRIMANIOWON41.00MMON.MOMMWP.tIMANONWNMVIAWWNWMAtql* 

nicely. 

Mt. and Mrs. Floyd Wood and 

visited Mr. and Mrs. Orval John-
son of Eastland Monday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Glenn Jordan and 
Joyce, Mr. and Mrs. Clifford Nel-
son shopped in Ranger Saturday. 

Mrs. Joe McNeely is reported to 
he better. She is still in the Ran- 
ger General Hospital. Mrs. Tom 
Etheredge and Jana of Amarillo 
are here. 

Mr. and Mrs. Oscar Treadway 
spent Thursday night with his 
Mother Mrs. Boatwright of Carbon 

4 

0 
4 

t> 
4> 

4> 

Appliance stores, department stores and furniture stores  have 
elearir  heat lamps ovolioble  now. 

SAVE MONEY! 

And Tear On Your Equipment 

TEXAS ELECTRIC SERVICE  COMPANY 

	

1 	I..  D. STENN 	Manager 

	

mem= 	  

SAVE TIME! 

Save Rear 

Buy your 0-20-0 and other grades of fertilizer delivered 
and spread on your fields and pastures 

This new method of applying 0-20-0 to cover crops will save you 
time when you are the busiest - during th peanut harvest. There is 
no need to stop your harvegting to fertilize your cover crops. This 
big 6-wheel, all-wheel drive truck will bring the fertilizer right to 
your field and accurately distribute it for you. The cost is very rea-
sonable -- come by and let us xplain this new plan to you — works 
eqqually in pastures and with al grades fertilizer. 

• Plenty of 20% Super-phosphate Now Available • 
Shellers 	• 	Seed Peanuts 	• Pabak Fertilizer 

GORMAN PEANUT CO. 
SHELLERS 	SEED PEANUTS PABAK FERTILIZER 

Gorman, Texas 
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HAT SALE 
Beautiful Fur-felt, feather 

and ribbon trimmed hats 

Were $12.95 — 

NOW $3.95 

GOOD FELT SPORTS 

and BEANIES 

Were $2.95 — 

NO W$I.00 

LADIES SHOPPE 
Mrs. Elsie Gates 	Phone 88 	Gorman Hotel Lobby 

4.4 

•••••••••••••••4 a••••••••••••••••••••••••4 

MAY YOUR HOPES BE 

FULFILLED AS WAS THE 

PROMISE OF THAT-SIN-

GLE BRIGHT STAR WHICH 

HERALDED THE FIRST 

CHRISTMAS. 
NOEL 

Mr. and Mrs. (your name) and children 
you may include the names of the children 

or 

Flace Your 

Order 

Early 

For 

Thanksgiving 

Turkeys 
We offer you foods for one of the most delicious, ,J7,--, 
most festive Thanksgiving dinners you've ever < 
had and all at surprisingly low cost. Heap your  	-  '''':'--.--;;';'.. 
table high with finest quality Clover Farm foods. 	-- ----111111111  .....I.C.1,424-1 4  aat- ,,,ase 

—'41111r 	V"'" 

Clover Farm — Rich Flavor 

PUMPKIN 2Vz 
Can 15c 

"'The Paper Home Folks Prefer" 
	

The Gorman Progress, Thursday, November  18, 1948 	 Gorman, Texas 

SOLVOX DEDICATION 

SUNDAY NOV. 14th 
SACRED RENIDITIONS 

Our Library 
LUCRETIA FAIRBE1 i 

ARIZONA STAR 

WANT ADS 
DEAD ANIMAL SERVICE—Free 
and Sure - Call collect Phone 303 
Hamilton, Texas. 	 2-5FN 

PERSONALIZED Christmas and 
Greeting Cards 50 for $1.00 up to 
$2.60 for 25 with name. Year 
round Gift Wrappings. Mrs. J. W. 
Richardson, Phone 33-J 	12-2p 

FFOR SALE-,-Good Seed Oats. D. 

In the Progress Library this 

week there are numerous books by 

the best authors or should if be 
said, authors who write the best 
sellers. Among them are Lloyd 
Douglas, Upton Sinclair, Sinclair 

I

Lewis, Robert Wilder and others. 
Arizona Star is a book written 

by Faith Baldwin. The story is a 
western but not in the sense of a 

Rev. W. F. Smith, the pastor ad- 
shootum-up. The title is the name dressed the audience with a few ap FOR SALE—Bargains in used Ser-

. 'of a square dance, a favorite step plicable and explanatory remarks, ,vel refrigerators - Servel Kerosene 

	

in Arizona. The scene is in and regarding the gift and the preset- 	gerators and Electrical Ref ri- 

round about a lodge. The story is 
tation. 

 He 
 spoke of the honored gerators. Willy-Willys Furniture 

one's commendable relation to the Mart, Eastland, Ph. 585 10-21fn 
church in days past. 	 , See the new Ferguson tractor at 

Other renditions with variations the Comanche County Tractor Co., 
given by Mrs. David were: 

	

Leadth Me," Beautiful Garden"Hoef 	
11-25c 

see only as managed by her. 

 
Prayer," "Sweet 

Smith spoke 

oHkeouirn  ohfisPsrearmyery,",WLeeonh,a1v,ee.naesw dempster grain drills 

De Leon, Texas  

1 

	(Comanche County Tractor Co., De 

New tandem disc Ferguson system 

i De Leon, Texas 
at Comanche County Tractor Co., 

New Krause one-way Ferguson 

11-2ge 

and "Whispering Hope." 

	

This novel of the years of the 	

11-25c 

	

on the theme "Christian Responsi-' 	  
bility in Prayer and Activity." 

"Take Time to be Holy" was the 

Two disc breaking plows at the 
Comanche County Tractor Co., Be 

LetUs Mail Your Christmas Greeting 
	  o 1500 M  

closing number on the solovox. 
in her utmost desire to make their 	  
futures secure. Security she can makes no effort at transition. She 

fiction completely but the charac-
ters and the scenes are composite 
and true to life in Arizona. 

The first pages of the story pla-
ces the reader in the land of desert 
and blue sky. 

The power of the matriarch, Old 
Ern Grafin, is so great that many 
lives are controlled or burned by 
her tangent. She makes herself 
blind to the pleasures of her  (ova 

tor Co., De Leon, Texas 	11-25e 
of the characters from a distance simple begins another chapter. 	'system at Comanche County Trac- T  

Because the writer brings some 

At the Nov. 141st Sunday mor-
ning 

 
service in the Methodist 

Church, a solovox, a gift from 0. 
T. Shell and the Melvin Shell, Wil-
bur Shell and W. G. Kirk families, 
was dedicated to the memory of ' 
the late Mrs. 0. T. Shell. 

Following the order of worship 
Mrs. Donna David at the solovox 
gave the prelude, "Above the Hills 
of Time." 

on to the scene in Arizona, she est you. 

 
war will enlighten you and inter- 

J Jobe and Son 

Mesdames Elsie Gates, Don Moor 
L. A. Shugart is reported to be man and Donna Moorman were 

doing nicely after suffering a heart Sunday guests in Brownwood. 
attackseveraldays ago. daughterntaGmau-Muaa 

Mr. and Mrs. J. L. Glasson had Mr. and Mrs. B. E. Wilson went 
to Hot Springs, Ark. Saturday in their children from Lamesa visitt- 

ing them this week. 	 response to a message that his 
brother had suffered a stroke. Miss Brona Lou Holden of Abi- 

Mrs. Otis Neill and daughter Su- 

son
lene was guest of Arvilla Simp- '  

last week end. 	 sanne of Slaton spent the week end 
Mrs. W.  R.  Eppler was  in  Abi-  in the home of Mr. and Mrs. Z. 0. 

lene last week visiting in the Mehaffey while visiting Mr. Neill' 
mother who is ill in the Blackwell homes of her daughter, Mrs. Phil 

Gates and her son, Bill Eppler. 	Sanitarium. 

	

 	Mr. and Mrs. Duane Hite of Aus- 
HOLIDAY SPECIAL 	tin spent the week end in the home 

8.  exposed films developed and of her parents Mr. and Mrs. J. N. 
printed - 25c. Enlargements 5x7 Ellison. 
otwnioyrfso5re  35c. Enlargements 8x10 Guests in the home of the Gene 

•Baker's Sunday were Mr. and Mrs. 
M. H. FAIRBETTEK 	IR. .. Taylor of Ranger. 

e.t,eaeeeeat-t-ts...eae.t.eaeeeeee 
SEASON GREETINGS 

FAMILIES and INDIVIDUALS 

embers of the Progress. 

0 n 1 y Two Dollars 

FOR 

31c 	Fruit CocktaiIi.lo.v.efr,:r Fruit Can 

 21/2  41 c 

Clover Farm in Nectar Syrup 

PEACHES 
SHliaczlesor No.C2=1/2 290 

Clover Farm—Tiny Tots 

SHUR FINE PEAS 

83c Pie Cherries hrt72  29c 
Niblets Corn 	Fresh Corn 

Off-the-Cob ‘2ancP..1 9c 

Niblets Mexicorn ca. 1 	23c 2 Oz. 

Clover Farm 

PANCAKE FLOUR 206 130. No. 2 
Can 29° Clover Farm Florado 

Clover Farm 
Red—Sour Pitted 

How many times have you haid, "Oh my, I forgot to send the a Cord." 
A number of your friends who have moved away front Gorman and 
subscribe to the Progress will enjoy reading your Greeting. . . If 
you live out of town, Just think of all your friends here that would 
like to hear from you. 

We have a limited number of plates similar to the one above. Come 
in and choose yours early. If you live out of town mail us $2.00 and 
we will choose a  greeting  for you. If you would like to write your 
own greeting (not over 32 words) we will select a picture to go with 
your personal greeting -- no extra charge. 

These Greetings will be published in our Special Christmas Edition. 
If you would like for this Special Christmas Edition to be mailed to 
someone whose name is not on our mailing list include 10 cents extra 
with their name and address and we will be glad to mail tthem one. 

FOR SALE—Corner lot next to 
Dick Grey. Mrs. Lee Stanfield. 

FOR- SALE—Four room house. 	 Gornian, Texas 
John Little, Rt. One, Eastland 25p 

C.•::',4><>4:.<4.4.64,44;:>4.44:44444444.44,444i>4 

LOST—Red fabric dress gloves. 
Party, who found or picked up in 
error, please return to Mrs. M. H. 
Fairbetter at the Progress Office. 

The Gorman Progress 

Leon, Texas 	 11-25c 

Ferguson moldboard breaking 
plows at Comanche County Trac- 
tor Co., De Leon, Texas 	11-25c 

FOR SALE-1946 Dodge, Fordor 
sedan $1,650. Mrs. W. D. Sessum 
Kokomo Schoolhouse 	11-18p 

NOTICE — To Hog Owners. If 
you keep hogs, keep them on your 
own place. "Nuf Said". N.  F. Ben-
nett, Route Two. 

For Sale—'41 Chevrolet Special De 
Luxe  and '40 Ford DeLuxe, both 
good tires. Priced right. Junior 
cars have radios and heaters, Clean 
Stacy, Gorman. 

WANTED to buy— standard size 
baby bed. Call 45-W. 

LOST—Large bunch of keys be-
tween Gorman and Eastland. $5 
reward. Return to Gorman Hotel. Mince Meat 

Shortening 

Clover Farm 2  9 Oz. 
Old-Time 	Pkgs. 

Mrs. Tucker .3  
For All Your 	Lb. 
Baking Needs 

Clover
F
- 

OLIVES 
Clover Farm—All Green Tips 	 Clover Farm Fancy 

ASPARAGUS 	P ais  37,  WHOLE BEETS 

_Tt: 29° JELL POWDER 3 pkg.. 23° ORANGE JUICE 
Clover Farm-6 Delicious Flavors 

Clover Farm 

EVAP. MILK____or41.7.f. 29° 21° 

46 Or. 27,. 

White Swan Quality Mustard & Turnip 

GREENS 	 2 21° 
Clover Farm 

CilAPE JELLY "Fruit- d7fraz;  21,  

White Swan Crushed 

PINEAPPLE 	No.
Can  

3
33°  

Durkee 

COCONUT 	Plug.  17° 

49c Sifted Peas Clover Farm No. 2  23c  
Quality 	Can Coy ee Clover Farm Vacuum— Reg. or 

Money Back Guarantee Drip _ Lb. 

0. B. Cut or Long 

MAC.,-SPAG. 
Old Dutch 

i CLEANSER 

Clover Farm—Complexion 

7 Pkg (7'  9° SOAP Free ____ Wash 	4 Rag   

	Call 12° 

 
Clover  Far

m JUICE 

Panel Bodies suitable  for  mounting on 
the Forward-Control Chassis are sup-
plied by many reputable manufacturers. 

Wash Day Wonder 

HILEX Qt. 14° 

ORANGES or 	8 .lb 
GRAPEFRUIT Bag 

SPUDS 
Ten Pounds 

FISH - OYSERS 
Dressed Fryers 

Honor Brand 

Strawberries 

Sunshine 

320 CHOCOLATE DROPS:: 39 

SLICED 
BACON 

Seven 
ROAST 

PORK 
SAUSAGE 

Loin and T-Bone 
STEAK 

See Our Large Assortment 
ofCHEESE.' 

ki tie /gw aeovkt 
01/1/-b'tai 6=r) Ciesshs 

/ CHEVROLET/ 
I 

	 Take a good look at this latest addition to the Chev- 

rolet truck line. It's worth it. Because here is something 

altogether new, something that will put your door-to-door delivery 

business on a new high level of efficiency—a forward-control chassis 

permitting double the ordinary load space! And that isn't all! In addi-

tion, there's Chevrolet's new foot-operated parking brake, steering 

column gearshift and solenoid starter plus full standing room comfort 

and convenience. Just wait till you see them! You'll want this Chevrolet 

Dubl-Duti chassis. It's a double value! 

• Model 3742-1251/4°  wheelbase. For nine- and ten-
TWO foot body installations. 
MODELS! • Model 3942-137°  wheelbase. For ten- and eleven-

foot body installations. 

wdevdece-De,, 
CHEVROLET TRUCKS 

F 
Pound 
	 63c 

Pound 
	 55c 

Pound 
	 55c 

Ponud 
	 73c 

DOUBLE CUBIC CAPACITY! 
packages per trip 

.. less cost per package. 
Chassis are designed for 
bigger bodies with no 
extra wheelbase added. 

SHORTER TURNING RADIUS! 
Wide front tread enables 
driver to turn within a 
small circle! 

GREATER CONVENIENCE! 
Chevrolet's new solenoid 
starter—operated by in-
strument panel button—
assures positive starting. 

NEW EFFICIENCY! 
Chevrolet's foot-operated 
parking brake assures 
positive, safe braking in 
an emergency or for 
parking! 

NEW OPERATING EASE! 
Advance-Design gearshift 
(on  125,/,' wheelbase 
with 3-speed transmission) 
is mounted on the steering 
column. 

Admiration 

27' OLEOMARGERINE Lb. 

Sunshine 

isZr 39' HI-HO CRACKERS 1:01'; 29° 
Sunshine 

Bot. 23° CHOCOLATE VJFE Z: 25° 

Smith Bros. Chevrolet Co. 
	4 



Department 
and represent a step recommended 
by the Governor's Safety Confer-
ence. 

Motorists who utilize the speed 
advised on these signs will find 
that there is no side-throw in their 
cars at this speed. 

The speed indicatted on the sign 
was determined by a scientific 
study of each individual curve and 
turn, and will vary because of the 
different elements such as degree 
of turn and the amount of bank on 

l each separate curve. 

Texas Highwiay by the 
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NE W HIGHWAY SIGNS TO HELP MOTORISTS ON CURVES eirmamommoomommimmi 

ATTENTION R. E. A. CUSTOMERS 
If it's a new Electric Refrigerator you need con-

tact ALTON LOMAX your R. E. A. Frigidaire 
Dealer, Cisco, Texas - For Immediate delivery. 
One Model D-J-7,  7  cu. ft. Frigidaire -- $309.75 
or a 9 cu. ft. size for immediate delivery. 

DESDEMONA 4-H CLUB MEETS 

The 4-H Club of Desdemona I Saturday, November 13, Betty 

Grade School was called to order 
Jane Foster celebrated her thir-

Nov. 8 by presdient, Bettye For- 
teenth birthday with a group of 

rest. We discussed what we would 
with a Buffet luncheon consisting 

do for the next meeting. We had 
to elect a new Parlimentarian be-
cause our other one (Lavada 
Swaim) is going to move to Breck-

would have to do extra to get a 
gold star pin. The meeting was mg°. Volunteer numbers were given by 

adjourned. the boys and girls. Neal Gilbert 

	o 	and Bob Love entertained the 
group by singing a comic and a po- 

DUBLIN, HAMILTON IN 	pular song, "A Tree in the Mea- 

CHAMPIONSHIP GAME FRI. dow." 
In the afternoon the party was 

With the champsionship of Dis- continued at the King Theatre. 
trict 8 A at stake, the Dublin Lions 	Those enjoying the party were: 
and Hamilton Bulldogs tangle at Lillian Pearl Beard, Floyedene 
Dublin Friday night at 7:30. The 

friends from 11:00 to 4:00 o'clock 
of turkey with all the trimmings. 

After luncheon, games were play 
ed. Jeania Faye Westmoreland and 
Ray Bennett winning prizes for 

enridge. We discussed what we  B. 

BIRTHDAY PARTY 

e 
a 

s' '3 	orb BEGINNING OF 
nURVE 

d̀en 	— 

450 FT. 
APPROXIMATELY 

Gilbert, Partricia Morrison, Bar-
game will bring to a climax one of ] bara Bennett Erma Lilly, Melba 
the most thrilling district seasons Ruth Brown, Ernestine Todd, Susan 
in years. The Lions and the Bull- St. John, Neal Gilbert, Bob Love, 
dogs have each lost only one con- Ray Bennett, James Bulter, Deal 

Herring and Ernest Hanson. 

Other guests were: Mrs Carle 

Hamilton lost to the Ranger .ng  
Lacey, Mrs. Ada Kinney, Mrs. Her- 

Bulldogs while Dublin dropped a ri 
	Mrs. St. John, Mrs. J. E. 

thriller to Eastland to bring about 
 Foster. 

I this title deciding game. 	Hostesses were Mrs. Ina Hanson 

The Ranger Bulldogs will share  land Betty Jane Foster. 

the title but are ineligible to re- 'Week and Dublin school officials 
present the district. 	 laze expecting the largest crowd 

Tickets have been on sale all of the year. 

ference game during the season 
and appear to be about evenly 
matched. 

AUSTIN, Nov. 22—A view like 
the one pictured will soon confront 
Texas motorists. The new type of 
highway sign will serve to warn 
of the maximum safe and comfort-
able speed for curves and turns. 

These signs are part of a new 
program of advisory speed zoning 

-'4m  OUSE 
Inc 

LOMAX ELECTRIC 
Telephone 622 
	

Cisco, Texas 

DESTINED TO BE THE BRIGHT SPOT OF 

YOUR BLOUSE COLLECTION! FLATTER- 

ING, GOLD RIC-RAC AND LACE... 

CLEVER NOVELTY BUTTONS FOR A 

DAZZLING EFFECT AND 

A GRAND VALUE AT 

THIS THRIFTY LITTLE 

PRICE. SMOOTH WHITE, 

FRENCH RAYON CREPE: 

SIZES 32 TO 38. 

JUST ONE FROM A 

SENSATIONAL BLOUSE 

COLLECTION...FOR YOURSELF 

...OR FOR GIFTS. 

.9 
Get MORE  for what you 

pay,  SA Vrat  Mode O'Day! 

MODE O'DAY 
• Dresses Lingerie Hosiery • 

Mrs. J. W. Johnson, Owner 

East Side Square 	 Eastland, Texas 

inniiigEBEIMERNEMENEMENSMOMPIN 

ittle  =  ofniue 
Would blow his horn, 

'G.o weaving through traffic too fast, 
'Twas a great mistake 

To blow and not brake, 
And Fate upset him at last ! 

The air turns blue, too, when a reckless Boy Blue turns up in crowded traffic! Other 
motorists curse him—pedestrians fear him—and no wonder! 

Speeding is the prime cause of accidents—it kills 10,000 persons a year. And remem- 
ber-50 miles an hour may be safe on good roads, on open highways—while 20 can 
be dangerous in bad weather or heavy traffic. Speeding is driving too fast for conditions. 

Drive as though your life depended upon it—it does! 

SPEND 	\SECONDS 

6SAVE\g 	LIVES 

Kennon's Humble Service Station 

EXTRA SPECIAL 

for 

CHRISTMAS GIFTS 

ODDS and ENDS 
HIGH GRADE DECORATED DISHES 

(Slightly Imperfect) 

10C to 69c Per Piece 
Cups and Saucers 
Sugar and Cream 
Soup Bowls 
Salad Bowls 

Covered Bowls 

PLATTERS 
Small and Large 
PLATES 
Three Sizes 

Thanksgiving Means Extra 

Company - Now is the time 

to REPLACE broken and 

chipped dinner ware at rea-

Sonable prices. 

Shelley's Variety Store 
"The Friendly Store" 

Gorman, Texas 

0444444.44.4444444444 



Complete 

Re-Boring Work 
On All Makes Of Cars 

We Give Expert Repair Service 

Come In and See Us Today 

Desdemona -News 
BABY BOY 

MY.  and Mrs. Sherwood Voor-
hies are the proud parents of a 
baby boy born recently in the 
Blackwell Sanitatrium. 

BAPTIST CHURCH TO HAVE 
THANKSGIVING SERVICES 

Thanksgiving  Services will be 
held at the Baptist Church Thurs-
day, November 25th, Rev. H. D. 

Martin, pastor has announced. 
• There will be a program, Thanks 
giving  Prayers and Song Service. 

Also some good speaking, come 
and bring your lunch. 

P. T. A. TO HAVE 
THANKSGIVING SUPPER ____ 

Monday night November 22, the 
Parent-Teachers Association will 
sponsor a Thanksgiving Supper at 
the Desdemona High School Build-
ing.  

A live turkey will be given away 
to the one holding the lucky num-
ber. 

rds 
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WRIGHT 	S. 

V: 0 Vvr E. 

ei 

91.70-a, 

For, over sixty-two years it 

has been our privilege 15 

render a service to this com-

munity. 

Texas 

* 
4> 

4> ,4> 
4> 
4> 
4). 
4> 
4> 4> 

6' ,'Ie."'"0"It"',',..4t,1," 5tt"e>...('.',bY  
go : Mr. and Mrs. Billie Joe Clark 

4> 	and grandson of Mr. and Mrs. Ho- 

4> 	 0 mer Abernathy of Desdemona is 

4I> 	 4 still critically ill in a hospital at 

mates hope for speedy recovery. 

4, Mr. and Mrs. Russ Burleson over 
4> 

x 

BUY NOW and SAVE 

41> 	
4 of Gorman visited this week end 

1> 	 0 with his mother Mrs. Eula Clark. 

0 	 0 
	Leon "Rusty" Alread, son of Mr. 

4> 	
and Mrs. Leon Aired of Ft Worth 

.4> 	 I Ft. Worth. His friends and school 

4> 	 • 	

A, 

,., — r. an 	is. IVIelvin AbernathyAbernathy

'C' 	 \Z.  and two children of Freer visited 

1> 	 \r  ,  the past week end with his parents 
4). 	 3  .Mr.  and Mrs. Homer Abernathy. 
4.> 	. Mr. and Mrs. Harold Burleson of 

.4). 	 4  Ft. Worth visited their parents 
Al> 	 1,  Mr. and Mrs. Dave Griffith end 

SON'S BARGAINS 
ON 

TREE LITES 
BUBBLE LITES 

Only $2.49.  

Gorman, Texas 

The above prices are less 
than half of last year's pri-
ces. — The rest of our 
Christmas Lites are list pri-
ce less ten percent. 

Fluorescent Liles - - I: —Carle... Rogers, „sm_ of.35..L. , and ix  

4 	rs. Ciscra Roxers is visiting her 
4 sister Mr. and Mrs. W. L. Craddock 

of Grand Prairie. 
Mr. and Mrs. Charlie Warden an 

4 daughter, Gwendolyn of Ranger 

4 

4 

0 

Lunch 'tickets are now fifty cents 
and twenty-five cents. 	See the 	  
committee and buy yours now. , LOOKING AT RELIGION 

There will be plenty of enter-
tainment - make your plans to 
come. 

THE CLIMATE) testes SUNRISE.  
SEVICES IN CALIFORNIA TAKE RACE 
ON MT. ROUBIDOUX 1400 FEET ABOVE 
The SEA AT RIVERSIDE BENEATH 	, 
MI6 HUGE CROSS. THE CKOSS 
WAS ERECTED i5 ARP . 

WAS
0,1gagral,4PB.0  

fl 

paNZDAI OK Sr 	(Karr 7h,r,  _a  

90w/carte ORME' ANP IL00 
 Trof._ 

PeoPr: PowevrFe.  nr  IS NO a25._ie,ee 
PUVLIC ASO iY9 PHOTO&O.‘045 Arr, AVAIL/101:F 

THE METHODIST CHORCIA IN  lzPZ15, ILL., 
CELEBRATED ITS 10011. BIRTHDAY IN A 'MAI 
LONGDIRIVE TO GET 100 NEW MEMDERS., 
-THE GOAL WAS PASSED 55 SIX MONTHS] 

O * 
. * 	All Prices On Gas Heaters 

4  

4 4) 

	

4 4> 	Marked Down 
4  
4 4> 

4> 
4) 

O 4> 	BENNETT APPLIANCE 
4; 3  • EVERYTHING ELECTRICAL • 

O 4> 
4 4> 
4 * 

C44>446>4.4..44=4G';46.44.4<>404'46444444  

4 

0 

.1415e. - "'PAW, ..4%M.1%P.WAVAMANC- 

4)  Phone  526 
41>  

Horn much more enjoyable is the Thanksgiving 
Feast after you and your family have attended 
church services . . . to thank God for the plenty 
which is yours .. . to express your faith in the 
attend services regularly and support your church 
Almighty. Go to church this Thanksgiving .... 
attend services regularly and support your church 

Golder. Oak Feed 
P-duce 

L
110V1) FULLEY, Manager 

§ 

spent the week end with her mo-
ther Mrs. Nina Lohman and grand 
mother Mrs. Sally Eaton. 

Mr. and Mrs. Buster Owens of 
Cisco is visiting their ,parents Mr. 
and Mrs. W. A. Saint and Mr. and 
Mrs. Dick Owens 

Mr. and Mrs. Charlie: Warden 
land daughter accompanied by her 

4 mother and grandmother Mrs. Nina 
.  Lohman .end Aunt Sally Eaton 
4. ,  made a business trip to Clyde 
4 Saturday. 
4 I  Saturday. 
4 	Harold Martin of Denton, son of 
4  Rev. and Mrs. H. D. Martin came 

jthrough. Desdemona with a black 
tail deer that he and his compan-
ion killed in Mexico. 

Rev. and Mrs. Green of Emerlee 
visited their old friends Rev. and 

1 
 Mrs. H. D. Martin recently 

0  j  Basketball Teams visit Lingleville 
4 
41 Desdemona visited Lingleville 
<I) i Tuesday night. 	The Desdemona 
0  I girls lost a hard fought game 29-19 
4 1The boys were defeated 22 - 7. 
4 	Desdemona girls and boys will 

enter Huckaby's Tournament this 
Week end. The girls play Alexan-
der Girls Friday morning Novem-
ber 19 at 10 o'clock. The boys 

play Santo Friday night at 7 P. M. 
o 	 

VETERANS ADMINISTRATION 
HOSPITALIZATION 

The Veterans Administration op 

	

crates a network of 126 hospitals 		 
for the treatment of ill and dis-
abled veterans. An additional 12,-
500 beds -- in civil, state, and oth-
er federal hospitals -- are being 
used by this agency on a contract 1 
or agreement basis. Clinics also 
are maintained in the 70 VA Reg-
ional Offices, and in other  VA 
field offices, for pre-admission ex-
aminations and treatments. 

Any veteran, who has had war 
time service or a peacetime vet- 
eran who is in receipt of a compen 
Sable disability, if discharged or 

§ separated under condition's other 
& than dishonorable, are entitled to 
k  VA hospital treatment, under the 
Y following priority system: 

Y 
FIRST—Emergency cases. 
SECOND—Those suffering from 

§ injuries or diseased incurred or ag-
§ gravated in line of duty during 
§ wartime service. 
& 	THIRD—Those who state under 

oath that they are unable to pay 
hospital charges for treatment of 
non-service connected disabilities 

§ or illness. These veterans if not 
in the emergency category, must 
wait until a bed becomes available. 

Emergency patients may be ta-
ken directly to the nearest VA hos 
pital. If possible, the veteran, or 
someone acting for him or her, 
should communicate with VA by' 

1 telephone or telegraph. 
In all other cases, the veteran, 

his
, 
 nearest relative, guardian, or 

representative, should fill in the 
proper form for hospital care, VA 
Form 10-P-10. These forms are 
available at any VA office, County 

§ Service Officer, Veterans Organi- 
§ zations Service Officers of the A- 

merican Red Cross. 	 i 

t cident thereto have prior VA ap- I 
If the admission and travel in-I 

proval, transportation may be pro-1 
vided at government expense for 
any case. 

BENNETT APPLIANCE 
• EVERYTHING  ELECTRICAL 

Phone  160 
	

GORMAN 
	

P. 0. Box 298 

SUPERHUMAN RULERS 
of THIS WORLD 
NEAR THEIR END! 

Publii address by 

F. AI ELOFSKY 
Representative of  Watchtower Society 

. .  Sunday ....  November 21 .. ..2 P. M. .. 
Home of Z. Parrack, 209 Neblett St., Eastland 

ALL KINGDOM SEEKERS WELCOME 

FREE 
	

No Collection. Taken 	 Free 

The perfect government is a kingdom! That kingdom is 
now at hand! But, you say, have not kingdoms, outmoded and 
swallowed up by the various representative forms of govern-
ment, disappeared from the moderriscene? Are not the mod-
ern forms of man rule making progress where past kingdoms 
failed? True, past kingdoms of men failed, as will all forms 
of human governments, including the latest system of world 
rule, the United Nations. But the perfect government is a 
kingdom, not of man, but ofo God. It is God's Word that pro-
phesies concerning it, saying, "In the days of these kings 
shall the God of Heaven set up a kingdom .. . (it) shall not 
be left to other people ... it shall stand for ever." 

It is that now established kingdom of God which the book 
"The Kingdom is at Hand" high-lights in its coverage of the 
Bible's main theme. Showing all scriptures relating to the 
Kingdom, the book takes you, by narration, from the first 
Kingdom promise given in Eden down through the typical 
kingdom, the covenant for the Kingdom, the King's  first ap-
pearance, and into the present, proving the Kingdom now at 
hand. When nearly all persons have turned toward man rule, 
this 384-page book fearlessly holds forth the kingdom of God 
as the only hope for man. You may obtbain it on a 35c con-
tribution at the meeting advertised or by sending in the cou-
pon below. 

Watchtower 	117  Adams St. 	Brooklyn, 1, N. 11". 
Please send me the book "The Kingdom Is at Hand". I-M-
elt:se " 75c contribution. 

Name 	  

Street 	  

City     Zone - 	State 	  

Alex Rawlins & Sons 
MONUMENT BUILDERS 

Weatherford 	 Phone 24 
Mrs. Dave Ramsey  Gorman Representative 

PRICES GOOD ONLY UNTIL 
PRESENT STOCK EXHAUSTED 

$L98 

Xmas Wreaths 
49c 

Mr. and Mrs. Jr. Branham. were 
week end guests with her parents 
Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Moore. 

Autrey Key of Odessa is visit-
ing with his mother, Mrs. Ethel 
Key. 

Mr. and Mrs. Scottie Lemaster 
visited this week with his parents 
Mr. and Mrs. Lemaster and her 
parents Mr. and Mrs. CharlieMalt- 
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Automatic Sleeping Comfort for Two! 

NEW G-E "TWO-CONTROL" 
AUTOMATIC BLANKET 	$52.95 

  

  

For couples who like separate 
degrees of sleep-wooing warmth! 
G-E Automatic Blanket with 
new, exclusive "Two-Control" 
feature. Husband sets  his control 
for warmth be likes. Wife sets 
hers for warmth she desires. 
Each control adjusts  automatic. 
ally  to weather change% within 
the bedroom. 

72586 inches. Blue, rose, green, 
cedar. 0.,?erating cost, only a few 
pennies a night. 
Easy to wash. Launders beauti-
fully. Carefully made to rigid 
General Electric safety standards, 
and approved by Underwriters' 
Laboratories, Inc. 	— 

  

  

Only General Electric Offers You the 
Two-control Automatic Blanket 

  

Ey DON MOORE 

e.u.,.""eedledlerevelere.."-"AANnevAdvsrav,......remere-P6PANNArweee 

GENE and GABE Phone 139 Gorman 

4> 

4). 
4> 
4> 

VICTOR ADDING MACHINES 
t> 
4> 	 Hand or Electric 
4> 

t> 
4> 

Peeler Printing Co. 

ROYAL TYPEWRITERS 
The World's No. 1 Typewriter • 

COMPLETE OFFICE OUTFITTERS 

Authorized District Representatives 

Breckenridge, Texas 

4 

4 



Bob and Luzelle Blackwell near 
Staff visited Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Poteet Thursday. net results - 
winter's supply of pecans. 

This writer talked with a form-
er Alameda school principal, J. W. 
Turner in Eastland, Wednesday.,  
He states, he keeps posted on our 
doings by reading our column, 
even tho' he is on the faculty of 
Carbon. 

And if Robert still wants to 
know - that diamond ring, certain-
ly, looks nice on the hand of a cer-
tain lady, and she promised us all 
'the information for the Cheaney 
news at a later date. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ira Wilson and 
children went to Breckenridge, 
Sunday to visit his sister, Mrs.( 
Henry Proctor and family. 

Mrs. Myrtle Wilson of Leon, and.  
Mrs. Onie Shook of Ranger visited 
in the community Sunday. 

E/M1111111111h1111111031linthlifil(d11111114(0111111TIIIIMIIIVIIIVINIZIIIIIPINIIBINIIIIIPUldROZ1111011111111(rdmovettlig 

THE NM "1Z" I WORK CONDITIONED 
Power styling the new Minneapolis-Moline "Z" for more 
work made a complete "face lifting'.  necessary to show 
an all new model. This new look outside symbolizes a 
new look inside. A larger engine of improved design—
"Revacycle" transmission gears and  a  higher speed 
range. A more efficient cooling system and improved 
steering have revitalized and work conditioned the "Z" 
for high performance. General design features include: 

31 h.p. on drawbar and 36 h.p. on belt at 1500 R.P.M. 
Balanced crankshaft with 3 main bearings. 
"Tri-metal" connecting rod bearings. 
New pressure oiling system. 
Increased cooling fan size and tapered roller bearing 

mounting. 
Dust sealed distributor, voltage regulator and combina-

lion ignition switch. 
Wobble stick gear shift lever. 
5  speed transmission-2.4, 3.6, 4.6, 6.3, 13.1 and reverse 

2.2 M.P.H. 
"Revacycle" differential gear. 
MM hardened sector type steering. 

Front tire size 5.50x16, rear tire 
size 11-38. 

We invite you to see us for com-
plete facts on all 4 "Z" models and 
MM Uni-matic tool control. 

Bring in your Grain Drill and let us equip it with 

an MM FERTILIZER DISTRIBUTOR 

D. J. Jobe & Son 
Farm Machinery and Supplies 

Phone X-2 	 Gorman 

The Gorman Progress, Thursday, November 18, 1,94.8 	 Gorman, Texas 
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FOR.  A DELICIOUS 

4 	Make Thanksgiving Day Din- 
§ 

ner this year a good Old Fash- 

5 	jotted Family Treat. Certainly 

Dad has earned it, and the young-

§ stets will be thrilled by it. Plan 

§ your Thanksgiving dinner shop- 

§§ ping here and we 	assure you 

§ that your budget will benefit from 

4 	§ our holiday specials. 

1  § 

$ 

§ 

4 , § , , 
, Grocerg market & , 
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JAY'S 

Steph-
enville spent the week end with 

Miss Roberta Gilbert of 

Iher parents Mr. and Mrs. H. M. 
Gilbert. 

Mr. and Mrs. Buck Whittenburg 
of Ballinger visited her cousin Mrs. 
Bill EdrmIndson and husband Sat-
urday night. 

ily of Taylor Arkansas visited 

Mr. and Mrs. E. T. Hagman of 
Cisco are the proud parents of a 
baby girl born November 14 at the 
Blackwell Sanitarium. The young 

lady was named Alice Fay. She 
weighed 7 pounds, 13 ounces. The 
paternal grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. Charley Harlow of Carbon. 

Miss Doris Neal Stokes enter-
tained a group of young people in 
her boom Friday night. The cou-
ples were Doris Stokes, Willard 
Burns, Joyce, Cornwell, Billy Hirst 
Guindal and Ethel Hogan, Dalton 
Reynolds. Flossie Shugart, Lonny 
Frazer, Bearl Arnold, Joan Bryant 
Junior Kennedy, and Mildred. Mur-
ray. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Everett and 
children visited her parents Mr. 
and Mrs. Wade White Wednesday. 

Miss Leta Garret moved to De 
Leon last Tuesday. 

Mr. and Mrs. D. C. Culland and 
daughter Grady Culland and fam- 

Tonn's brother and mother of Col-
orado City met them at Merkel 
for the ball game. 

Mr. and Mrs. J. D. Jordan of 
Monohans visited Mr. and Mrs. E. 
R Yarbroguh and other relatives 
here last week. 

week. 

Mrs. T. E. Robertson visited in 	• 

Ted's jaw set. "All my cards are 
Another lesson in the "Church on the table, honey . . . might as 

Dallas last weekend. 	
iWorsMp" series, conducted by lo- well let him know where I stand 

right from the beginning," 
cal minister, Harry Payne, Sunday 

6, 	Mrs. M. A. Rose of Eastland is 
making a visit this week with her 

Y daughter, Mr. and Mrs. Jno. Love. 

Mrs. Pat Kilborn of Eastland at-
Ltended church Sunday at Church 
of Christ at Carbon. 

Church Services 

Dave Love of Odessa spent the 
week end with his Mother, Mrs. 
Ann Love and family - with him 
were his daughter, Mrs. Nove D. 
Cresswell and three children from 
Hermleigh, Texas who, by the way, 
are granddaughter, great-grand-
daughter and two great gandsons. 

Mrs. Eula Hart has her father, 
Mr. Carter from Eastland, visiting 
her for an indefinite stay. 

Dee Rodgers family Sunday. 

Minister Harry Payne was the 
dinner guest of Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Grice Sunday. 

15 chapters o Genesis. 	mg 
singers from other congregations 

Mr. and. Mrs. Melva Love and 

eaney ews 

* 	do and all I ask is a chance to prove it. 

'THE newspaper advertisement; 
I-  read: "WANTED: Sober, relb; 

able man to take complete chargei 
of advertising department of large 
firm. Must be able to assume full' 
responsibility. College-trained men' 
only need apply." 

Ted Clifton read it over toast and 
eggs. "Mona!" he eisclaimed, "Lis-
ten .. . this is what I've been look-
ing for...." 

"Yes, it does sound good," ag, eed; 
;Mona, over his shoulder. 

Ted reflected. "It isn't that old, 
Todd is a bad sort . . . it's just; 

that he doesn't 
seem to want tel 
give me full rein; 
and you know I 
work better with-; 

out so much supervision." 
Mona raised her hand in a dra 

matte sweep "Onward and upward,; 
my lad . 	. Let's enter greener 
fields via this ad . 	let Todd feed 
his business to the birds!" 

He ushered a dazed but happy 
Ted to the door. 

you handle the new plastic deal,  
with the Denver people?" 

Ted outlined in enthusiastic detail 
the plans he had been longing to 
put into action. 

WHEN he had finished, the boss 
looked at him in astonish-

ment. "My boy," he instructed, 
"Go right ahead. Call see in for a 
conference only if you feel you need 
moral support." He shifted his• 
weight and smiled. "Come back to-
morrow. We will draw up a new ar-
rangement as well as full authority 
in your department."  

After he had ushered a dazed but 
happy 'red to the door, the head of 
Todd and Todd drew a letter from 
his desk. He 'ebortled. "This is 
really good!" Adjusting his glasses 
he read: 

"My present emPloyer is afraid to 
trust me to stand  on my own feet, in 
fact I do not believe he fully trusts his 
own feet. 

Putting the letter back, he smiled 
again. "I guess young Shane will 
always wonder why he never re-
ceived an answer to that letter. It 
was a good thing I made that ad-
vertisement a blind one, otherwise 
I might have never discovered 
what a tip-top advertising fireball 
I had right here all along!" 

Released by WRis Feature'. 

Kissing Mona goodby, Ted whis- 

9-Minute 
II Fiction 

oadd have it understood from the 

Blind 
Advertisement 

By 
EMM1E BELL PORTER 

1 
Thirty minutes later Ted leaned their daughter and sister Mrs. Har Preaching Services next Lord's back. "Read it to me, honey . . 	.1 

mon Ables and family over the Day at the Cheaney Church of let's hear hOW it sounds." 	1 week end. 	 Christ will be conducted by Bro. 
Mr. and Mrs. J. R. Tonn visited Morris Womack of Abilene Chris- '  "Dear Sir: If you are looking fora  i 

man with initiative, willingness to 
tian College. 'Bible Study at ten their daughter, Mr. and Mrs. Bus- 	 work and a capacity to handle your 
o'clock and preaching at 11 o'clock. advertising, look no further. However, ter McDaniel of Abilene Thursday. / w 

They attended the Colorado City Bible Study and Singing are an- beginning !hall ant to have full charge 
and Merkel Football game Thurs- nounced for the Saturday,  night  and not be hindered, swayed  or I 

meda Church Of Christ. Minister unfortunately my present employer is 
Harry Payne will conduct the Bi- afraid to trust see to stand on my own 

feet, in fact I do not believe he fully ble Study which will cover the first trustsl 	'  awn  feet. I know what I can I 

Respectfully, Theodore Shane.' 
are invited to attend and it is hoped 	Mona's eyes glowed. "Oh, Ted, .1 
the whole community will come that is a good letter, but is that 

Mrs. J. W. Brown of Sweetwater and take part. Services will be- part bad about your boss not trust- 
viisited Mrs. Gladys Brown last gin at 7 o'clock. 	 Mg you?" 

at Alameda was on "Singing" 	pered,"Keep your fingers crossed 
Subject Sunday night was "Open for luck, sweet." 

ing Today, the Doors of Tommor- 
A  T FOUR O'CLOCK that after- 

row" and was well attended by 	noon the buzzer on Ted's desk 
members from Grandview, Chean- impatiently summoned him into the 
ey and Salem Communities. 	inner sanctum of the Big Boss— 	I 

J. Anthony Todd. himself. That i1- 
Mrs. Jessie Lemley was ill and lustrious individual sat stiffly erect,' 

his halo of steel gray hair bristling Mr. and Mrs. B. W. Lasater of I unable to attend church Sunday. 
excitingly. 

••••••••••••••••••••••st-ooe 

NOTICE 
We wish to announce to the insuring public that 

Neal H. Rose is associated with us in the insur-

ance business and we respectfully solicit a part 

of your business. 

We have some of the best companies and promise 

you honest and courteons treatment. 

Homer R. Mason 

CHOICE 
PEANUT BAGS 

Hay Ties 

HEATERS 
GAS and BUTANE 

AUTOMATC 
Wash Machines 

SUBSCRIBE TO 

The Abilene Reporter-News 

FALL BARGAIN OFFER 

YEAR 
ONE 	 .95 	By 

Mail 

Daily and Sunday--7 Days a Week! 

More Exclusive West Texas News 

Sports • Comics 	World News 

You Save Over $5.00---- 
(Regular Rate $15.00) 

See Your Local Agent 
Today--and Subscribe 

(THIS OFFER EXPIRES DECEMBER 31, 19413) 

:Mlle Paper home Folks Prefer" 

Carbon News 	
sie Anderson of Stamford. 

J. G. Nowlin is visiting his dau- 
ghter, Mr. and Mrs. Dick Murray 

BABY GIRL 	 of Lamesa this week. 

Mr. and Mrs. 0. C. Payne and 
children attended the Eddie Arnold 
show in Brownwood last Friday. 

Mr. and Mrs. W. W. Martin vis-
ited her brother F. Wood in Cisco 
Saturday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd Goswick and 
children of Big Spring spent the 
week end with her mother Mrs. L. 
L. Murray. 

Mrs. W. S. Maxwell visited rel-
atives in Lampasas last week. 

Miss Joyce Cornwell entertained 
a group of young people with a 
wienie roast in her home last week 

clay night. Charlene and Mrs. meeting November 20th at the Ala- 
crippled iby any supervisor, h 

 am at 4resent 	
elper bor 

Eastland visited her parents Mr. "Sit down, Shane!" he thundered. Mr. Ben Freeman was reported 
and Mrs. J. L. Black, Sunday. 	 "Sit down. I want to talk with you i on the sick list this past week. 

Dinner guest of Mr. and Mrs. J. 	 about that Finkle advertising deal. 'I  
L. Black Sunday were Floy May- Ronnie Love visited with the Just how would you handle it?" 

Ted blinked in surprise. "Why, 
sir, I would channel it through the, 1 
mediums of the small retailer for,   
there's not enough volume to in-
terest  the large concerns." 

The owner of Todd and Todd nod-,  
a in agreement "Right! That's  44-4'40.44'.<>44.444><>44.4.444444><ii4.4.6044Q 

Joy visited Sunday in the parental nerj  should be doe! Go 

dud 
what I've been tellingrign-htiyareratd- 

Dave Weekes home. 	 with it!" 
"Thanks!" agreed Ted. "That 

§ 	A birthday celebration was held should be quite a deal if handled' 
§ Sunday in the Ben Freeman horn properly." 

honoring Uncle Cicero Weekes . on ' "By the way," inquired Mr. Todd, 
his 87th birthday. Also the occa- I his eyes twinkling, "just how would 

A  sion honored the birthday of Mrs.  1  ,  
,Z'' Batley Dean, but minute details 	— 
N were lacking. 

FEEDS 
SEES 

FERTILIZER 

W. G. BAKER 
Gorman, Texas 
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• • MRS. B B BRUMMETT AND 

Spirit of Gorman MISS VIRGIE SHAW 
	  CARBON STUDY CLUB 

SPEAKERS FOR EXCELSIOR 
SPONSORS TOURNAMENT 

__The '38 Study Club of Carbon is 
sponsoring a game tournament to 
be held at the High School Cafe-
teria building on _Friday _night, 
Nov. 19th at 7:30. 
__Admission will be fifty cents per 
couple and all proceeds will go for 
charitable purposes and toward up-
keep of _Carbon's _Library. _Our 
friends at Gorman are invited to 
attend. - 

0 	 

HOWARD HOME 
DEMONSTRATION CLUB 
MEETS 

WITH A MODERN 
LIVING ROOM SUITE 

"IN THE EVENING OF LIFE" 

"Pure Religion and undefiled be-
fore God, the Father is this- To 
visit the fatherless and the widows 
in their affliction and to keep him-
self unspotted from the world." 

James 1:27 
This Indian Summer, late one 

day I came within an humble cot- 
tage. My host, a genial man, I 
did not know. Not oft in recent 
years had he in the church pew 
sat, else I had known him before., 
At once I sensed his brilliant mind 
but that was not the "why" of my 
visit. Word to me had come that-- " 

He hqd sat beside the elderly I 
gentlemen, their illness through. 
When they had gone, their widows 
he had remembered. 

Of mornings he stops in passing. 
Then each of the aging women by 
her own window sits, awaiting his 
return with her spool of thread or 
perhaps a loaf of bread but most 
of all the mail or bits of news from 
about town. 

Surely he has "Pure Religion." 

Higginbotham Bros. & Co. 
Gorman, Texas 

Howard Community Home De-
monstration Club met Thursday 
evening Nov. 9th in the home of 
Mrs. R. G. Lewis. 

Miss McCoy, County Mune De-
monstration Agent, gave an inte-
resting demonstration on Home De 
coration and showed types of pa-
per to be, or not to be used in 
various rooms. 

The club had one new member, 
Mrs. Rex Bailey. 

Lovely "Secret Pal" gifts were 
exchanged to keep the club gues-
sing as to who it is. 

Tinty cheese-it sandwiches, cof-
fee doughnuts, and hot chocolate 
were served to the following: 

Mesdames Foote, Heeter, Tid-
well, Sparks, Bailey, Koonce, Ro-
berts, Keith, McCoy, one visitor, 
Mrs. Lonnie Williamson and the 
hostess, Mrs. Lewis. 

On Tuesday evening Nov 9th 
Mrs M F Allen was hostess in the 
Homemakers cottage, to the Excel-
sior ChM for their regular meet-
ing. 

During the roll call, Something 
out of nothing," many interesting 
ideas for salvaging damaged ar-
ticles were given. 

Miss Virgie Shaw; the school 
Home Economics teacher appeared 
on the program as a guest speaker 
Her subject was, "Meeting Interior 
Decoration Problems of Today." 
She enlarged upon the theme, 
"Beauty of style, and harmony 
and grace depend on simplicity." 
She explained the proper use of 
a  color scheme, the importance of 
a center of interest, the placing of 
furniture and the choice and loca-
tion of pictures or wall decora-
tions. 

A second speaker on the prog-
ram was Mrs. B. B. Brummett who 
chose for her subject, "The Selec-
tion and Use of Silver. China and 
Crystal." Mrs. Brummett accentu-

I ate& the talk with a display of a 
table with complete settings. She 

I spoke of the appropiate choice for 
formal and informal occasions. 

Following the study hour the 
hostess served coffee and cake to 
the members and guests. 

!..6•90!>1,e-e.t-tt.dte-tt.1!>03.t-e-e,C1>A•et.•••1,46ACt-t1,4-1C 
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CORTIRUED 

We proudly announce the addition of another 

famous brand name-MAYFAIR SLACKS -

at our Men's Furnishing Department - another 

brand you know in fashionable men's wear! 

The Fun Jamboree, a variety 
show at the school building Mon-
day evening, sponsored by the Wo-
man's Study Club, amounted to a 
splendid success in entertainment 
and profit. 

"Couch" Deavenport, gowned in 
strutter's cloth and wearing a cute 
little doll hat and "Soft" Beard 
arrayed in a charming ensemble 
put the audience in an uproar. The 
applause of the children was itself 
an added attraction'. 

Sylvia 'Brummett's Ensembel 
showed appreciable Junior talent. 
Members of the group; Deanna 
Rose, Janie Thompson, Annye Kate 
Blair and Joe Wilkins, were accom 
paned by a young pianist, Juani- 
ta Hoskins of Desdemona. 	the order. 

Dr. Francis Barker and Bill At' a social hour following the 
Parr must have robbed several iniation pie and coffee were ser-
markets. All the Frankfurters ta- ved. 
ken from their patient, R. B. Lane' ) 	 
abdomen could not have been pur-'meat shortage over. 
chased at one market - or is theI The end of the program left the 

audience clamouring for encores. '9 

MEN - - BOYS 

PRECISION TAILORING 

for our worsted wool covert 
suit with cutaway jacket. Its 
classic lines provide a back-
ground for accessory accent. 

COOL WEATHER IS HERE - COLD WEATHER IS ON 

ITS WAY AND WE'RE READY TO KEEP YOU WARM 

IN GOOD LOOKING 

SWEATERS-styled by BRENTWOD, MacGREGOR, and 

MANHATTAN, short and long sleeves, newest styles, sea- 

son's best colors 	  from $3.95 

DRESSES 
Reg. Price 	Sale Price 
3.95 	 .  2.77 
5.95 	 3.77 
7.95 • 5.77 
9.95 . 	6.77 

14.95 . 	9.77 
17.95 . 12.77 
79.95 . 14.77 

SUITS 
Reg. Price 	Sale Price 
19.95 	 14.77 
22.95 	 16.77 
24.95 	 18.77 
32.50 	 22.77 
39.95 	 24.77 
44.95 	 29.77 
47.50 	 32.77 
49.95 	 34.77 

WOOL SHIRTS - by MANHATTAN and MacGREGOR, all 
the popular colors, loud and conservative ____ $7.95 & 8.95 

MACKINAWS 	those ever popular all wool mackinaws, 

striking in bold plaids, and others 	  $7.50 up 
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HOT WATER FOR HEALTH 

 

§ 

  

SWEAT SHIRTS - men's and boy's, in whites, 'grays, red, 

orange, green, maroon 	  98c up 

POPLIN JACKETS - good looking, light weight poplin 

jackets, brown and gray, MANHATTANS and 

MacGREGORS 	  $7.95 up 

GABARDINE SHIRTS - styled by MANHATTAN, MAN- 

CHESTER and MacGREGOR 	 -$5.95 

LEATHER JACKETS and COATS - a nice selection of 

styles to choose from 	  $12.95 up 

SPORT COATS - for leisure, work, or play, a nice assort- 

ment to choose from 	  $15,.95 up 

To keep healthy, your family 
needs plenty of hot water. And• 
when illness strikes, you need 
even more hot water on a mo-
ment's notice. 

Assure yourself of a constant 
supply of hot water for all needs 
by installing an automatic gas 
water heater. We have informa-
tion that will help you choose 
the proper sized heater to fit 

your family's needs. 

N;%, 

FOR HOT WATER MAGIC-% 
("NSA cgroa 

FOR YOUR SUIT, YOUR SKIRT 

YOUR SLACKS 
Have Plenty of costume changes with a variety of fine 
BLOUSES, and frilly SHIRTWAISTS. 

At our Ready-To-Wear Department, you'll find crepes, cottons, 
and others-frilly and tailored.  

Reg. Price 	Sale Price 
3.95 . . . . 2.77 
5.95 . . . . 3.77 Immediate hostallation- Pick the automatic 

gas water heater you need from our wide 
selection. We'll install it at once. 

MEN'S FURNISHING 

Higginbotham Bros., & Co. 

GOrman, Texas 

a 
EM PIjrZi5 (5D, SOUTHERN 

J. L. Deavenport, District Manager 

Gorman, Texas 
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Rebekahs Entertain 
Ranger Lodge 

The Gorman Rebekahs had com-
pany from Ranger. Tuesday night, 
November 9, and a school .of in 
struction in which we all displayed 
our ignorance. Since none of us 
knew all the answers, the session 
proved quite enlightening. 

It is time to elect new officers, 
so those of you who haven't been 
coming to Ledge get a move on 
and let's do this thing right. We 
'can make it more instruction as 
well as entertaining for all con-
cerned. Come out next,  Tuesday 
and every Tuesday night at 7 P M. 

Lou Rankin, Reporter 

Fun Jamboree Furnishes 
Hilarity For All 

9.95 

Mayfair Slacks 
One thing that grads and undergrads have in common - an 

affection fro the perfection of MAYFAIR slacks. In our se-

lection of genuine MAYFAIR slacks, you'll see a wide array 

of fabrics and shades-but whichever you choose, you'll find 

one high standard of excellence - in style, tailoring and 

craftsmanship. Ask for MAYFAIR - for the last word in 

slacks! 

MOM 
SCEAXIL RY 

    

WHY, BE  PROUD 
7D HAVE YOU CARRY 

MY BOOKS HOME 
FOR  ME,  HARRY 
JUST LEAVE THEM 
ON THE FRONT PORCH/ 

INITIATION SERVICE HELD 
BY 0. E. S. MONDAY NIGHT 

On Monday evening at a call 
meeting of the Eastern Star, Mrs. 
A. N. Turner and her daughter, 
Juanita Turner were initiated into 

FAILLE TWO - PIECER 

that's erady to go from mat-
inee to cafe at the drop of an 
invitation._ Tunic jacket has 
jutting pockets. Lustre black 
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