
EXCELLENT SCRAMBLING - Jimmy Johnson is shown 

scampering away from one of the Bearcat defensive lineman 

in the game played Friday night. the other Panthers in the 

picture are No. 20 Jacky Johnson and No. 63 Philip Osborne. 

STRONG OPEN FIELD TACKLING - Show above is No. 32 

Rodney Reeves and No. 40 Ray Bond making a fine tackle of 

one of the running back of the Bearcat team in game action 

held Friday. 

GOOD DEFENSIVE WORK - Shown above are some of the 

mighty Panthers stopping one of the Bearcat runner in game 

action Friday night. The Panthers are: No. 22 Mark Swanner, 

No. 37 Russ Gressett, No. 60 Andy Kinser, No. 51 Curtis 

Warren, and No. 11 Jimmy Johnson. 
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SENATE PASSES 
AMENDED PEANUT BILL 

The Mattingly Bill as 
modified was passed by the 
Senate on September 16 by a 
vote of 51 For and 47 
Against. 

The Grouwer Group Sec-
retary said the basic dif-
ference in the Lugar and 
Mattingly proposals is that 
Lugar would have abolished 
both allotments and quotas 
while the Mattingly Bill a-
bolishes allotments, but re-
tains quotas in place for the 
next four years. He said a 
prolonged effort by growers 
over the past 16 months had 
emphasized the retention of 
both allotments and quotas 
and that the same objective 
will be vigorously pursued in 
the House of Representatives 
where Farm Bill debate is 
expected to begin within a 
few days. It is still possible. 
he said, to put the present 
program back together in a 
Senate-House Conference 
Committee provided acreage 
allotments survive the House 
debate. 

Grower representatives in 
Washington from the South-
west were: Bill Boswell, De 

Leon, Texas; Steve Ridgway, 
Pleasanton, Texas; Terrell 
Coffey, Hinton, Oklahoma; 
LaVerne Johnson, Fort 

Cobb, Oklahoma; 	Stanley 
Harrison. Pot-tales. New 
Mexico and Ross Wilson. 

It 

tabling the Lugar Amend-
ment. Georgia Republican 
Senator Mack Mattingly had 
offered a substitute to the 
Lugar Amendment that 

growers considered much 
superior to the Lugar Bill, 
but which was inadequate as 
written. Wilson said. Al• 
though the Mattingly Bill 
calls for abolishment of acre- 
age allotments, it 	would 
maintain poundage quotas at 
a minimum national level of 
1.24 million tons. 

Following negotiations be-
tween growers and Senator 
Mattingly a number of 
changes were made in the 
Mattingly Bill to insure that 
production of additional pea-
nuts in excess of the farm 
base production or from non 
quota farms does not enter 
the domestic edible market 
until the supply of peanuts 
from quota farms within the 
farm base production is ex-
hausted. Another change in 
the Mattingly Bill secured by 
growers is to call for a 
minimum support rate of 
$596 per ton on quota pea-
nuts to be adjusted annually 
based on increased produc-
tion costs. Growers were un-
able to block a provision 
authored by Mattingly to 
transfer poundage quota 
across county lines within a 
state. 

The Senate passed on 
September 16 a peanut bill 
for the years 1982-85 after 
amending the proposal pass-
ed on April 30 by the Senate 
Agriculture 	Committee. 
Adoption of the measure fol-
lowed one and one-half days 
of debate on the Senate floor 
and lengthy deliberation and 
negotiations between grow-
ers and Senate farm leaders, 
according to Ross Wilson, 
National Peanuts Growers 
Secretary. Senate action on 
the Bill is only the first step. 
Consideration by the House 
of Representatives will be 
the next phase of the legis-
lative process. 

A Senate vote occurring 
early on September 16 on 
whether to table an amend-
ment offered by Republican 
Senator Richard Lugar of 
Indiana that would have a-
bolished acreage allotments 
and poundage quotas in 1982 
served as an early warning of 
further difficulty, 	Wilson 
said. The Senate voted by a 
majority of 56 to 43 not to 

table 	Senator 	Lugar's 
amendment. That vote pro-
vided a strong implication 
that the Senate would vote 
for Senator Lugar's proposal 
to completely dismantle the 
peanut program if given an 
opportunity to do so. How-
ever. prior to the vote on 

C OF C TO 	W ilson Infant 
HOST PICNIC 	Laid To Rest 

W ednesday 

ger Hospital. Graveside ser-
vices were at 10:00 a.m. 
Wednesday at Evergreen 
Cemtery, directed by Ed-
wards Funeral Home, 

Jim Hall, minister of Mes-
quite and Rusk street Church 
of Christ, officiated. 

Survivors include his 
parents; paternal grand-
mother, Virgie Faye Wilson 
of Breckenridge; maternal 
grandmother, Mrs. Jean 
Reid of Ranger; maternal 
great-grandmother. 	Mrs. 
Ona Deramus of Brecken-
ridge; a brother, Keith of the 
home; and two sister, Rene 
and Heather, both of the 
home. 

PTO MEETS FOR 

FIRST MEETING 

RANGER — The infant 
son of Robert L. and Janie 
Wilson of Gorman died at 
birth at 12:50 p.m. Tuesday 
September 22. 1981 at Ran- 

The Gorman Chamber of 

Commerce will host a picnic 

supper September 29 at 8:00 

p.m. at rPttnis A. Gray Me-

morial Park. 

All members and their 

families are invited to attend. 

- Anyone wishing to join the 

Chamber are invited, and 

bring a friend. 

Bring a covered dish, the 

Chamber will furnish hot 

dogs. drinks, plates, napkins 

and silverware. 

Come on out for a good 
time! 

4 	jr 

FIREMEN RECEIVING A CHECK - Above are Gene Foster. 
Fireman. Jim Burleson, Birdsong Representative. Jack 

Harrison. Cheif, and Doug Rainey Fireman receiving a 
donation given to the Gorman Volunteer Fire Department 

from Birdsong Peanuts. 

Gorman PTO held its first 
meeting of the year Wed-
nesday, September 16 at 3:00 
p.m. in the High School 
Library. Plans for the Hal-
loween Carnival along with 
other business items were 
discussed. More information 
will be forthcoming in the 
paper in the future on these 
activities. 

New members of PTO this 
year are: 
Keith and Mildred Witt 
Buryl Rodgers 
Lynn and Pat Silva 
Connie Bryant 
Shilia Perez 
Donna Fraley 
Lola Grham 
Gena Rone 

Returning Members are: 
Mary and Mike McCormick 
George and Francis Warren 
Tommy and Michaelyn Clark 
Brenda and Daryl Hirst 
Linda and Rodney Stephens 
Marilyn and Glenn Warren 
Charles and Carlyn Little 
Bill Sandlin 
R. C. and Martha Harrington 
Ellen Gressett 
Barbara Morrison 
Jackie and Dennis Frasier 
Terry and Wendell Treadway 
Woodrow and Helen 

Browning 
Allen and Linda Gibbs 
Janda Taylor 
Milton Jenson 
Ted and Rita Higginbottom 
Karen Burleson 
Jean and Brent Lasater 
Judd and Ann Maxfield 
Nedra Green 
Debra Clark 

—GP— 

CARD OF THANKS 

I would like to say thanks 
for all the kindness shown 
me during my stay in Black-
well Hospital. And the good 
care I received from Dr. L. 
and Dr. J.. the nurses and 
the girls who work at Doctors 
Clinic. 

Thank You 
Jimmy Hallmark 

M. Lewis's 
Married 
Sixty Years 

Marvin and Ida Lewis are 
celebrating their 	Sixtieth 
Wedding Anniversary at 
their home on Cresent 
Street on Thursday. Septem-
ber 24th. 

Marvin is native of San 
Saba and Ida Hobbs was 
born in Gonzales. They at-
tended school at Waldrop in 
McCollough County. That is 
when the crops were laid by. 

But their school days were. 
over when the autumn leaves 
of 1921 began to fall. There 

was a double wedding with 
Rev. Wright, a retired Bap-
tist minister, officiating in 
his home. The second couple 
was Marvin's cousin, Homer 

Chamberlain and Miss Marie 
Stewart. 

After their children Ora 
Lee and James were born the 
Lewises came to Eastland 
County where they acquired 

ranch land. 
Mr. Lewis was associated 

with the late Hugh Baskin in 
the cattle business for a 
number of years. He ran the 
local gin for ten years and 
was bookkeeper for Smith 

Brothers. 
Mrs. Lewis was a seam-

stress and after moving into 

town was employed at the 

Kirk Nursing Home for two 

years. 

Members of the Baptist 
Church, they enjoyed many 
happy years at Midway. 
Marvin has kept pounds of 
church records made while 
he served as treasurer and 
also a builder when he and 
Rob Kinser lowered the roof 
of a 12 foot church ceiling. 

Midway was for the 
Lewises and others the best, 
with its class meetings. soc-
ial gatherings, preaching and 

singings. 
Tall can call 2646. HAPPY 

ANNIVERSARY. 
—GP- 

Patients listed in Blackwell 
Hospital as of Wednesday 
September 23 were: 
Bill Barrett 	Gorman 
J. D. Rogers 	Gorman 
Melrose Jobe 
Patsy Ingram 
Claude Curb 
William Isbell 
Reuben Watts 
Robert Adams 
Minnie Allen 

Gorman 
Gorman 
Gorman 
German 
Gorman 
Gorman 
Gorman 

Quintin Wright 	Gorman 
Enoch Cook 	Carbon 
Wanda Ward Stephenville 
Gladys Dempsey Gorman 
Nancy Haile 	Gorman 

Julia Carter 	Eastland 
David Willett 	Rising Star 
_ Patients dismissed 	on 
September 16: 
Carrie Cook 
E. H. Cook 
Fred Coker 

Dismissed September 17: 
Sarah Mize 
Ora Lee Mize 
Roy Parker 

Dismissed September 18: 
Patsy Ingram 
Homer Underwood 
George Hallmark 

Dismissed September 19: 
Jimmy Hallmark 
Roy Watson 
Ana Mae Tarrance 
Lorena Clark 
Dane Gressett 

Dismissed September 20: 
Roy Buntin 

Dismissed September 21: 
Bernice Haynes 
Jessie Tunnell 
Alton Perrin 
Melton Willard 

—GP— 

LOOK WHO'S NEW 
IT'S A BOY 

Jim and Teresa Lindaman 
of Lewisville. Texas 	are 
proud to announce the arrival 
of their son. Jacob Lloyd 
Lindaman, Jacob was born at 
the Lewisville Memorial 
Hospital on August 26, 1981 
at 2:31 p.m. He weighed 
seven pounds and one ounce 
and was twenty inches long. 

Maternal grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Ted Under- 

Press 
Points 

Joe Bennett, Publisher 

—J— 
Well it seems that the 

peanut farmers received ir, 
other slap in the face from 
the Senate with the vote on 
the peanut bill. The Senate 
passed the amended Mat-
tingly Bill by a vote of 51 to 
47. However, the peanut 
Iarmers can be thankful in 

ne sense of the word, 
because if the Senate had 
passed the Lugar Bill it 
would have abolished the 
allotments and quotas, while 
the Mattingly bill abolishes 
allotments, but retains gout-
as in place for the next four 
years. A big effort On the 
part of the growers will be 
vigorously pursued in the 
House of Representatives for 
the retention of both allot-
ments and qoutas. The de-
bate in the House is expected 
in a few days. 

It seems the government is 
always trying to tear down 
the things that have operated 
successfully for many years 
and replace it with some-
thing that could ruin the 
peanut industry. If too many 
Farmers plant peanuts. the 
supply will be so great that 
the surplus will be over-
whelming and the price will 
fall to the bottom and then it 
will not be profitable to raise 
peanuts. Its just like any 
other industry, when every-
one gets into the act to make 
money. there is an overload 
and all those involved lose 
their shirts. 

Maybe some day the citi-
zens of this world will tell the 
government officials to let 
things alone that arc working 
and jump on the many many 
things that need correcting. 
If this is not done, then the 
United States will be in the 
same shape as a lot of other 
countries who arc starving 
due to the lack of food. Think 
about it and let your govern-
ment officials know what you 
think. It could help and it 
darn sure won't hurt any. 

—J— 
The Panthers did a good 

job on Friday night but came 
out on the short end of a 20 to 
12 score. They did have one 
touchdown called back on a 
penalty. but the game was 
really a good one. The Pan-
thers were playing with a few 
members nursing nagging 
injuries and Jeff Seaton did a 
fine job of taking over at 
quarterback after Dane Gres- 

• ettg 	*Vas injured on the first 
_ offensive play for the Pan-

thers. He hit on 3 of 7 passes. 
one of which was a beautiful 
30 yarder to Mark Swanner 
on the drive for the tying 
touchdown which was nulli-
fied by the penalty. We 
congratulate the Big Red on 
their play against a very 
heavy front line for Dc Leon. 
Also De Leon had all their 
players healthy for this game 
and were ready to play. 

The Panthers go to Glen 
Rose to take on the Tigers 
this Friday and we look for 
them to have a good night 
and come home with a vic-
tory. Lets all go to Glen Rose 
and back the Panthers to 
victory. 

-J-- 
Quite a few peanuts are 

coming in but it is expected 
that it will be a couple of 
more weeks before the har-
vesting really gets underway 
in full swing. The recent rain 
we received sure helped to 
complete the growing season 
for the peanuts. 

It looks as though pro-
spects are good for an above 
average peanut harvest this 
year. We hope this is the 
case as the farmers are due a 
good crop. 

—J— 
And remember to smile - -

because God Loves You! 
—GP— 

BAKE AND WHITE 
ELEPHANT SALE SET FOR 
TODAY 

A Bake and White Ele-
phant Sale sponsored by the 
Eastern Star will be held 
Thurdsay September 24 at 
the Nut House beginning at 
8:00 a.m. 

Jim Burleson, 
Birdsong Representative is shown givening Terry Clark a 
donation from Birdsong Peanuts to the Baseball Association. 

PTO RECEIVES CHECK - Brenda Hirst, 	 and 
Mary McCormick, PTO members are shown receiving a check 
from Jim Burleson, representative of Birdsong 'Peanuts. 

Gorman Chapter 443 
.E.S. meets the 1st 

Monday each month 
at 7:30 P.M. 

Gorman Ledge 716 
AF&AM stated meet-

ing5.2nd Tuesday of 
every month at 8:00 

p.m. Members urged to at-
tend. Visitors welcome. 

Panthers Defeated By Bearcats 

Travel To  Glen Rose Friday  
GAME AT A GLANCE 

16 	First Downs 	10 

19 	Yards Rushing 	330 

37 	Yards Passing 	13 
3of7 Passes Comp. lof5 
0 	Interceptions 	1 

	

Fumbles Lost 	1 
3 for 36 Punts. Avg. 4 for 30 
7 for 35 Penalties 8 for 100 

The Gorman Panthers let 
Bearcat running back Roman 
Saldivar get loose on the first 
play from scrimmage for an 
80 yard touchdown and that 
one run turned out to be the 
difference in the game as the 
Bearcats won the battle 20 to 
12. The Panthers had one 
touchdown called back on a 

penalty late in the game and 
came up short on the score-
board. 

After Saldivar had scored 
on the 80 yard scamper to 
gave the Bearcats the lead. 
with 11:43 left in the first 
quarter, the Panthers came 
back with a touchdown with 
2:27 left in the quarter with 
Jeff Seaton going the final 
yard on a keeper play. The 
Panthers went 82 yards in 10 
plays. A pass try for two 
points fell short and the 
Panthers trailed 7-6. 
This was the score at the 
halftime intermission. 

Following the break at 
half-time, the Bearcats got 
the ball on the 50 after an 
interception and moved the 
distance in 5 plays with 
Saldivar rambling for the 
final 38 on a fine run with 
2:51 left in the third period. 
Edwin Hale kicked his sec-
ond point after and the 
Bearcats led 14 to 6. 

The Panthers took the 
ensuing kickoff and went 77 
yards in 15 plays with Jimmy 
Johnson going the final 18 
yards on a beautifully execut-
ed play with 6:13 left in the 
final period. Again the try for 
two points fell short and De 
Leon led 14-12. 

The Bearcats then took the 
kickoff and moved 75 yards 
in 12 plays with Edwin Hale 
scoring on a fourth down and 
two play, going 24 yards with 
2:26 left in the game. Hale's 
kick for the extra point went 
wide and De Leon extended 
its lead to 20-12. 

But the Panthers were still 
not finished as they took the 
kickoff on their own 48 and 
moved to the 6 yard line 
before time ran out. The 
Panthers had scored their 
apparent 18th point, but a 
penalty flag for motion nulli-
fied a fine run by Jimmy 
Johnson. Following the pen-
alty time ran out on the 
Panthers and their opportun-
ity to tye the game. 

This was a typical Panther-
Bearcat battle of the past few 
seasons as both teams put 
forth fine efforts. The Big 

quarterback and did a very 
good job. completing 3 of 7 
passes and didn't make a 
bobble on his handoffs. 

A few of the Panthers were 
bothered with nagging injur-
ies but did a very good job 
despite not being at full 
strength. 

The Panthers are now k 
and 2 arid the Bearcats are 
and 1. 

Red defense just couldn't 
stop the Bearcats running 
game and let them loose on a 
few occasions for the win. 

We feel the Panthers did a 
fine job since they were 
facing a very heavy team and 
this can be very tiring for an 
entire ball game. One of De 
Leon's linemen overloaded 
the scales at 280 and he was 
surprisingly fast for his size. 

Jimmy Johnson led the 
Panthers on the ground with 
159 yards on 27 carries. 
Scotty Mauney had 33 on 12 
tries. Toofer Bond got 6 on 1 
tote. Jacky Johnson had 2 on 
1 and Jeff Seaton had a -5 on 
3 keeps. Dane Gressett had a 
-5 on the first snap as the ball 
was fumbled for a loss. He 
went out of the game with an 
ankle injury and Jeff Seaton 
played the entire game at 

The Panthers will travel to

Glen Rose this Friday Met  
for an 8 p. m. game with the  
Tigers. The Tigers  hay' a ' 

good team and the Panth env, 

will need an all-out effort 
win this one. However, IY` 
feel that the Big Red will I* 
ready for this game and Ai 
get the victory Friday night. 
Right Panthers? 

Get 'Em Big Red. 

Hupp Mortises Mark 
Go/den Anniversary 

Mr. and Mrs. Hupp Morris. Route One, Gorman, will 

celebrate their Golden Anniversary Sunday October 4th from 

2 to 4 P.M. at the First Baptist Church Fellowship Hall in 
Gorman. 

Hosts will be their children, James Morris of Brownfield 

and Pam Hulse of Hobbs, New Mexico. 

They were married on Otober 7, 1931 in Kilgore, Texas. 

She is the former Lottie Browning. Both are natives of 
Gorman. 

Mr. Morris retired from Loffland Bros. Drilling Co. in 
March 1971. They returned to Gorman to make their home 

after living in Brownfield for 24 years. They are avid sports 

fans. Mr. Morris is a member of the Methodist Church and a 

Mason. Mrs. Morris is a Baptist and a member of Eastern 
Star. 

They have five grandchildren: Mark Morris, Mitzi Morris 
of Lubbock; Leha, Amy and Susan Hulse of Hobbs, New 
Mexico. 

No invitations will be sent locally. All friends and relatives 
are invited to attend. 

SCHOOL 
Menu 

Week of Sept. 28 - Oct. 2 
BREAKFAST 

MONDAY - Pineapple 
juice. dry cereal, and milk. 
TUESDAY — Orange juice, 
toast, jelly and milk. 

WEDNESDAY — Apple 
juice, rice, toast and milk. 

THURSDAY — Pineapple 
juice, sweetrolls, and milk. 
FRIDAY — Orange juice. 
hotcakes, bacon, syrup and 
milk. 

LUNCH 
MONDAY - Creamed ham- 
burger, new potatoes, Eng- 
lish peas, peanut butter bars 

TUESDAY — Roast beef and 
gravy, creamed potates, 
green beans, hot rolls and 
cake squares. 
WEDNESDAY — Bologna 
sandwiches, salad, soup and 
fruit and crackers. 
THURSDAY — Meatloaf, 
blackeyed peas, corn and 
pudding. 
FRIDAY — Sloppy Joe's, 
french fries, salad, and ice 

Pickup's are $7.50. We pick-
up and deliver. 

JUNIOR CLASS TO HOLD 
CAR WASH 

The Junior Class will have 
a Car Wash Saturday Sep-
tember 26 in Front of the 
School. Washing will start at 
8 a.m. and end at 4 p.m. 
Price for Cars is 56.00 and 

Mrs. R, C. Dennis had the 
following visitors over the 
weekend, Rev. and Mrs. J. 
B. Hamilton from Garland, 
Texas and Mrs. Alvin Frasier 
from Loop, Texas. 

RUMEN= a  

cream. 	  1 Items of Interest  
rr 

wood of Gorman, Texas. 
Maternal great-grandmoth-
ers are Mrs. Thelma Ras-
berry of Carbon and Mrs. 
Evelyn Underwood of East-
land, Texas. 

Paternal grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Don Lindaman 
of Cedar Falls, Iowa. Pater-
nal great-grandmother is 
Mrs. Cornelia Lindaman of 
Wellsburg, Iowa. 

Gorman School Homecoming 
will be Saturday October 24. 

THANK YOU 
Dear Mr. Birdsong: 
We the Gorman Volunteer 

Fire Department do ap-
preciate the generous do-

nation. It will go a long way 
on our new building. 

Yours truly. 
Chief Jack Harrison 
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HELP WANTED: 3 to 11 

shift full and part time 
L.V.N.'s. Apply in person to 
W. C. Swanner at Gorman 
Care Center. 	9-10-fnc. 

Try Alo-very Liquid, and Alo-
Vera with VITAMIN E pro-
ducts for skin care. Call 
Marcia at 817-445-2343. 

4.10-1 C. 

JOB INFORMATION 
ALASKAN AND OVERSEAS 
Employment. Great income 
potential. Call 602-941-8014. 
Dept. 219. Phone Call Re- 
fundable. 	4-10.1 C. 

FOR SALE: WATER COLOR 
MARKETS* It) BRIGHT 
COLORS, FINE. LINE. Pro-
gress Office. 

FOR SALE: Eldon HOT FILE 
starter set 2511 % OFF. Pro-
gress Office. 

FOR SALE: Child gentle 

horse, saddle and accessor-
ies included, George Rod- 
gers. 734-2364. 	2-9-24 C. 

BULLDOZER WORK 
Specializing in irrigation 
ponds, and brush work. Also 
elevated scraping. Gary Wil-
son Construction, Dc )eon, 
893-6558. 	4-10-6 C. 

FOR SALE: Nice 12 by 55 
foot, 2 bedroom, bath, mo-
bile home in Gorman. Fully 
carpeted with stove. re-
frigator, dining table and 
chairs. Randy Seaton. call 
after 5:00 p.m.. 734-2979 or 
2147. 	 8-6-FNC. 

R&R CARPET CLEANING 
S19.95- First • Normal Room 

$15.00 - each additional room 
$5.0() cach Bath and Hall 
$5.00 for each 	Anti-Soil 

Randall Rogers 
Office 	 Home 
029-1121 	647-1211 

7-2-FNC. 

HELP WANTED: Dietary, 
full or part time. Apply with 
Jessie Lee Eison or W. M. 
Hiscy at Blackwell Hospital 
in Gorman. 	7.30 FNC. 

FOR SALE: Nice three bed-
room house. nice location. 
completely 	remodeled. 
Shown by appointment only, 
734-2417. 	9-17 FNC. 

KIDS IN SCHOOL? Work 
part time, short time, show-
ing House of Lord's toys. 
gills. decoration. Fun Job, 
no investments. no exper-

ience necessary. Call collect. 
817-842-5436. 	2-9-25 C. 

FOR SALE: Home on  297 

Winkler in Gorman. Extra 
large living room, dining 
room, china caginets. car-
peted. draped. two bed- 
rooms, modern 	kitchen. 
Good location, acre lot with 
pecan. fruit trees and utility 
house. Call 817-776-1817. 

4-10-1 C. 
FOR SALE: Nice building lot 
in newi sub-division. 71 by 
212 feet, water well and fruit 
trees. Tommy Clark. 734- 
2107. 	 8-6 FNC. 

WILL DO POTTING 
PLANTS. Re-pot and etc. 
Terri Holland, 734-2017. 

4-10-1 C. 

NEED EXTRA 
STORAGE SPACE? 	• 

Storage building available 
tor rent. Inquire at Gorman 
Pharmacy • 734-2859. Gor- 
man. Texas. 	7.3 FNC. 

WANTED 
R.N. and L.V.N. Nurses 

for 11:00 p.m. to 7:00 a.m. 
shift. 
Gorman Blackwell Hospital 

Gorman. Texas 
"34.2294 

3.12 FNC. 

VIE GORMAN PROGRESS 
Entered as 2nd Class Mail at 

the Post Office in Gorman. 
Texas 76454. Under the Act 
of March 3. 1878. Published 
on Thursday at Gorman. 
Eastland County, Texas 
76454. 

Publication No. 222780 
Second Class Postage Paid at 
Gorman, Texas 76454. 

Joe Bennett, Publisher 
Estelle Craddock, Editor 

Lonnie Bennett, Asst. Editor 
and Photographer 

SUBCRIPTION RATES 
Eastland and Comanche Co. 

$6.00 Per Year 
All other subscriptions 

S8.00 Per Year 
Display Rate 

S1.10 Per Col. bleb 
Classified Advertisements 

7 Cents o'er Word 
MInhoom Charge - S1.40 
Car'' 	-- $1.50 

..,..„.„.m.,..„.„.„..,..„.,_,,...,...,,,..,..„..„.„..„..„...„,„  ,,,,,, 
.4., 	• FIRST UNITED 
il METHODIST CHURCH 
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44g  
‘a• 
ii. 	REV, SAM PARTEE, PASTOR 
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t GORMAN 	 DESDEMONA t4s u, 	School 9:45 a.m. %. 	 Worship 9:00 a.m. 
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%., 	 Every Other Sunday 
1/4. 	Worship 	7:00 	p.m. %. 
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Custom 
Hay Baling 
ROUND AND SQUARE BALES 

STAN CLARK 
734-2598 

ODELL CARTER, Minister 
SCHEDULE OF SERVICES 

BIBLE CLASS 	  10:00 A.M. 
MORNING WORSHIP 	  19:45 A.M. 
EVENING WORSHIP 	  6:00 P.M. 
THURSDAY LADIES CLASS 	 10:00 A.M.• 
WEDNESDAY EVENING 	7:00 PM; 

01.111111111111.111.11111111.111 	1.1MIS 

FOR SALE: Large group of pictures 

made by Progress Photographer are 

available at the Progress Office 

for 501 Each. 

• INVITATIONS 

• ANNOUNCEMENTS 

• NAPKINS 

• BRIDAL BOOK 

• ACCESSORIES 

The Gorman Progress 

WIDCING 
STA/13412Y 

Ape PI 

Westward, Hoo! 
Wrangle up a whole 
range of new fashion 
partners here . . . from 
belts to buckskin! 

LADIES LARRY MA HAN 

CORDUROY JEANS 
$28.95 
MEN'S 

DENIM SHIRTS 

1  01.0::IgC
o tton 

$17.95 EACH 

JUSTIN EEL BOOTS 
RUST & CAMEL $179.95 

+0 PYTHON a $199- $249  
1,11,:',1  EEL BOOTS-$209.00  
CAPE LEATHER BOOTS 

44° 

LADIES & MEN'S RUSSETT COLOR $139.00 
OPEN 9:00 A. M. TO 5:00 P. M. 

CLOSED ON MONDAYS 

BIG J
r
s BOOTS 

(DOWNTOWN) GORMAN, TEXAS 

Jolene Gilliland, Owner 	Phone T34-2IW 

• 

A 

DR. 
CLAY 

SALYER 
Chiropractor 
445-2205 

200 E. Blackjack 
Dublin, Texas 

• 
■ 
1 
■  • 

MATTRESSES 
New and Renovate 
Choice of ticking 
Choice of firmness 
New innerspring unit 
New mattress guarantee 

Western Mattress Co. 
1507 Austin Ave. 

BROWNWOOD, TEXAS 
in Gorman Call Coiled 

915-646-8944 
7-23-fnc, 

Racquetball! 

Ifs a sport you're sure 
to enjoy! 

4.  

• 

‘RACCLQUUBET  

"looks like you're starting to see double and feel single '' 

EASTL ANO 

PHONE ) sl?) 

629 $2114 

you 

You won't be seeing doUble when you re-
ceive your bill for insurance from us. 
Our rates are low and we never sell 
insurance you don't need. 

GORMAN 
'INSURANCE 

AGENCY 
MARY JEFFS 	734-2312 

DUBLIN ZERO LOCKER 
Dublin, Texus 7640 

Phone 117-44S-2424 

Custom Slaughter And 
Processing 

CHOICE FED BEEF 
FOR SALE 

WHOLE • HALVES - QUARTERS 

Jerry Westoortind, Alemeger 

See Display of Monuments 

across from Football Stadium 

MONUM ENTS 
Riley-Gardner Memorial-Hamilton 

Era Maupin, Agent 
P.O. Box 848 	Gorman 

0 

Happy Day. 
We still have three of our 

residents in the hospital -
Hattie Watts, Claude Curb 
are in Blackwell Hospital. 
Mrs. Allie Hammond is in 
the De Leon Hosptal. Every 
one wishes them a Speedy 

Recovery. 

GORMAN PROGRESS, SEPTEMBER 24 , 1981 Bingo winners last week 
were: Game No. 1 and 2, 
Oscar Can; No, 3 Dan Boat-
wright, No. 4 Vera Goodwin. 
Blackout Winner was Mary 
Harrell. 

Thank you, Kent Bridges 
and Velma Can for helping 
with Bingo. 

d‘  

FOR SALE: GREAT DANE 
OPEN TOP - 45 feet by 13.6 
feet. Excellent condition call 
817-731-0866. 	1-9-24 C. 

GARAGE SALE: 	Haile 
home, Duster Road, twin 
mattresses, dressing table 
and stool, clothes, mirrors, 
gadgets, and miscellaneous 
items. - 	 1.9-24 C. 

WANTED: One Shorthorn 
"Roan" Durham Bull - 2 to 3 
years old. Commercial. 

2-10-1 P Fill Up Befor Winter 
SALE - TWO CENTS OFF 

Regular price Propane • 
FROM SEPTEMBER 22 

TO OCTOBER 10 
MLEARS BUTANE CO. 
734-2517 GORMAN 

2-10-1 C. 

FOR LEASE: Bertie's Diner, 
on Hwy. 6 East, in Gorman. 
Call 734-2922 or 734-2761. 
Carl Dean Stacy. 	2-10-1 P 

GARAGE SALE: One block 
behind the Gulf station. Fri-
day and Saturday from 9 
a.m. Vickie Hallmark. 

1-9-24 C. 
Cen-Tex Real Estate 

PHONE 134 -2777 	GORMAN, TEXAS 

Nice two bedroom Mobile Home. Size 14 foot by 56 

foot. Three years old. Refrigerator and stove I 

furnished. Carpet and paneled. Central heating. 

• 58.500 	
IA f 

GARAGE SALE: Saturday 
September 26 at Bea O'Neal 
home by R. H. Watson. Time 
8 to 5. Barrells, wire, lawn 
mower, junk iron, clothes, 
heaters, tables, and all kinds 
of goodies. 	1-9.24 P 

Commerical Lot - Size 115 foot by 115 foot. Located 

corner of Hwy. 6 and Hwy. 8. Owner financed at 

12% interest. 

FOR SALE: 1980 Model 
Lilliston 1580 Peanut com-
bine. Contact Guy Clifton at 
First National Bank, Hico, 
Texas. Phone 817-796-4221. 

9-24 FNC. 

NINE TO FIVE SALE-
Friday September 25. East 
side of nursing home. Good 
childrens clothers, toys and 
games, Ladies clothes, sizes 
12-14-16, Men's Clothers, 
sizes medium and large, Size 
12D boots - soles never 
touched ground. 	Louise 
Clark - Carolyn George. 

1-9-24 C. 

1.494 Acres next to Primitive Baptist Church in 
Gorman City limits. Lot is "1" shaped with frontage ' 

Dn Ector St. and Hall St. $5,500 

HELP WANTED: Full time 
personal interested in work-
ing in respiratory theraphy 
department. Apply in per-
son. Blackwell Hospital, Gor-
man, Texas 76454, Phone 
734-2294. 	1-9-24 C. 

Two Lots located South of Football Stadium with two 

buildings suitable for barns. $3,300. 

Kay Watson Eula M fears 
Jerry Mehaffey, Broker 
%-- A 

JIM FRANKS 
SUPPLY SERVICE 

Washer, dryers. refrigera-
tors and stoves, 15 years 

experience. Prompt service. 

893-6778. 	3-10-1 P. 

SURPLUS, JEEPS, TRUCKS 
AND CARS-inv. Value $2143 
sold for $100. For informa-
tion on purchasing similar 
bargains, Call 602-941-8014, 
Extension 219. Phone call 
refundable. 	4.10-1 C. 

FOR SALE: 12 young gui-
neas. Call 734-2044. 2-9-24c 

MOTHERS 41 HOMEMAK-
ERS Work part time from 
now to December. Showing 

House of Lord's Toys and 

Gifts. Fun Job, Party plan. 
Kit on loan. Call Collect 

817-842-5436. 	2-9-22 C. 

GARAGE SALE: Saturday 
September 26th from 8:00 
o'clock. Headache Rack, 
small propane tank, 	two 

bumpers for pickup, two 
good saddles, ping-pong 
table, T.V.. good clothes, 
dishes and many other items. 
Call 734-2241 dyas or 734-
2712 after 5 p.m. First street 
east of hospital. 	Velda 

Foster. 	 1-9.24 P 

FOR SALE: Sears Kenmore 
Gas Ranger, 1976 model -
White. General Electric Re-
frigerator, frostless - white. 
Call Tuesday, Wednesday or 
Thursday. 758-2238. 1.9-24c 

GORMAN CARE 
TIMER NEWS 

By Jettle Daniels 
Everyone had a very nice 

week last week, thanks to our 
visitors and to the good 
people who sent peas and all 
the good things to eat. 

Thanks to Vardie Huff for 
the peas 1st week, and to 
Velma Bennett for picking 
the peas and thanks to the 
Laides of the Home for 
shelling them. 

Also, Thanks again to Mr. 
and Mrs. Clifford Moore for 
the melons, they were enjoy-
ed very much. While enjoy-
ing them, several were talk-
ing about days gone by and 
when they'd swipe a melon 
now and then and how good 
they were, Weren't they? 

Everyone had a very nice 
afternoon. 

Bro. Partee, brought our 
Bible Study last week, every-
one enjoyed his message 
very much. 

Thanks to those who came 
to the singing, we had a good 
time, thakns to Joyce Dennis 
for playing for us. 
"The Needs of the Older 
Adult." 

"The Needs of the 
Older Adult." 

A. Need to render some 
socially useful service; B. 
need to be considered a part 
of the community; C. Need to 
enjoy normal companion-
ships; D. Need for recog-
nition as an individual; E. 
Need for health protection 
and care; F. Need for spirit-
ual satisfaction. 

These are just a very few 
of their needs. 

Think real seriously about 
numbers, I3* D* and F. 

This Thursday is Birthday 
time again. Those having 
birthday's are: Lucy Lasater, 
Judy Phillips, Stella 
Swanner, 011ie Nelson. Ava 
Mason, Eulon Perry, Buddy 
McClearon and Oscar Tread-
way. 

We wish them a very 

HELP WANTED: Peanut 
pickers. See Peanut Cor-
poration of America. Apply 
in person, phone 734-2757. 

1-9-24 C. 

MONTGOMERY WARDS 
893-2016 

De Leon, Texas 
TRUCK LOAD SALE 
SEPTEMBER 25 thur 

October 31 
Every Appliance in store on 
sale now. Free merchandise 
certificates (S5 to $40.00) 
given with select appliances 
thru October 3rd. Enter our 
Truck Load Sweepstakes. 
Come Shop and Save Money. 

1-9-24 C. 

FOR SALE: 2 motorcycles. 
Honda 740 - $1,600.00 and 
Honda 400 for $1,000.00. 
Also a small 2 bedroom 
house to be moved, best 
offer. Vernon Ables. 734- 
2506. 	9-10-fnc. 

ODDS AND ENDS PIC-
TURES STILL AVAILABLE 
AT PROGRESS OFFICE 
FOR FIFTY GENTS EACH 
WHILE THEY LAST. 

FOR SALE: Three bedroom 
house. Shown by appoint-
ment only. 

FOR SALE: Home on 207 
Winkler in Gorman. Extra 
large living room, dining 
room, china cabinets, car-
peted. draped, two bed-
rooms, modern kitchen. 
Good location, Acre lot, with 
pecan, fruit trees and utility 
house. Call 817-776-4817. 

4-10-1 C. 

DR. JIM GRAY 
Family Dentist 

Office 

WELCO 
TO SERVICES-  

of the 
GORMAN 

CHURCH OF 

CHRIST 

OPEN 9 TO 5 

MONDAY, THURSDAY 

and FRIDAY 

734-2113 
Gorman 

dragfran•••••••••••••••••••••1  
• Need a New Roof? 	• 
• • 
0 	 All Types 	 is 

a
le 	 • 

We Specialize in Hot Topping 	• • • 
a 	compositions shingles 	0 
0 	 0 
II 
0 	 II ALL Work Guaranteed 	• 
0 	 0 • Paul Williams Roofing Co. 	. 

__. 	. 	. 	__„.,_ 

. 

COGBURN. REALTY' .  ___ 	_ 
893-6666 	 De Leon, Texas 76444 

194A. - 50 A. peanut allotment. Some coastal. Spring, 
small creek, real good lakesite. $550 A. 

In Desdemona, real neat 	three bedroom, carpeted, 
nice birch cabinets, fire place. Big corner lot. Huge 
Oak Trees. 9 pecan trees, Concrete patio. Garage, 
Stately older home. $19,000.00 

Farms- Farms- Farms 
We Need Your Listings On All Sizes. 	- 

Approximately 2 acres good loamy soil, two bedroom 
home, shade trees, pavement, 515,000. Cash or term's. 

• (817) 639-2330 	r7e • 
inommossonn tononinounialin non go 

IKE'S PAINT & BODY 1 
1 11/2  Miles North of Carbon 
1 on. Hwy. 6 
I Phone 639-2426 

Free Estimates 

Rawlins -Monuments I 
- SINCE 1 88 4 - 

A Shrine of Memory 
Our Reputation Has Been Built 

On Customer Satisfaction - 
If we may assist you 

Please Call. Collect - - 
Estelle Craddock 

7342410 - GORMAN, TEXAS 

1.  AUTO GLASS INSTALLED AND 

INSURANCE CLAIMS PROMPTLY HANDLED, 

	

1 	WE WORK ON AMERICAN AND IMPORTED 

	

.1 	 CARS AND TRUCKS 
nossans am ism im mina mia 

danamana.  
Rosa's Yardage Shop 

OPEN 6 DAYS A WEEK - 10-6 p.m. 

4 mi. N. of Carbon Hwy. 6 
3/4 mi. W. on Mangum Rd. 

FABRICS-THREADS-ZIPPERS-TAPES-TRIMS 
and NOTIONS- WE NOW STOCK RED HEART 
YARN. 	COME BROWSE AROUND! ! ! ! 

629-8202  

Stephen's 
Studio 
DIRECT COLOR 

PORTRAITS 
PHOTOGRAPHY WORK 

Open Tuesday through 
Saturday 

105 S. Patrick 	445-3765 

S 



KOKOMO NEWS 
By Zelda Jordan 

i>r tl 

9 0  

CApRolotOryloN 
. tabor ••••• •%1. 	0411.1 CIMIMIPM•11.• 

9852 %sit 
29.00 

9850 
26.00 
Matches Easy Travelers Sleepwear 
Group. 

This special grouping of robes in our new lighter 
weight polyester fleece has the warm looks a 
woman wants at a popular price. The classic 
styling permits endless co-ordinating capabilities_ 

Matches Easy Travelers Sleepwear 
Group.  

Fleece Robes  Polyester 

BUY NOW FOR YOURSELF AND FOR CHRISTMAS GIFTS - 

USE OUR LAY-AWAY PLAN 

SEE OUR LARGE SELECTION OF 

TEXSHEEN PAJAMAS, LONG AND SHORT GOWNS, ROMPERS 

MINI GOWNS, WALTZ GOWNS AND SLEEP SHIRTS AND 

TEXSHEEN FULL AND HALP SLIPS AND PANTIES AND 

CHILDRENS' LINGERIE, 

.7 

DEPARTMENT STORE 
GORMAN, TEXA? 76434 

9853 
29.00 

4774 
13.00 

4779 
15.00 

CALL R&R FUEL COMPANY 
HIGHWAYS 68,8 -- GORMAN, TEXAS 

For All Your DIESEL FUEL NEEDS 

Also GASOLINE and OILS 
Delivered to Your Tanks in Gorman, 

Carbon, Kokomo and Desdemona 

Call 134-2515 - 134-2396 

OLNEY SAVINGS INTRODUCES 

S 
THE  OLNEY 

SAVINGS INVESTMENT 
PLAN 

HIGH YIELD. 
FLEXIBILITY. 
FLOATING RATE. 

Olney Savings now offers a new way to invest your money. 
The Olney Savings/Investment Plan. It's designed to give you 
a high yield. And because you can withdraw amounts of $500 
or more at any time without penalty, it gives you the flexibility 
you need in these changing times. 

The interest rate is determined daily by Olney Savings and 
may change from day to day. A minimum of $2,000 is required 
to open your account. This plan is a repurchase agreement 
and you may renew by a simple phone call. by mail, or in 
person. 

The Olney Savings/Investment Plan is backed by guaran-
teed U.S. Government securities. protected by the strength 
and resources of Olney Savings and is not insured by the 
F.S.L.I.C. 

For the investor looking for short term. high yield and flexi-
bility. the Olney Savings/Investment Plan is ideal. 

Talk to one of our savings counselors. They're prepared to 
answer any questions you have. We want to help. 

Come see us soon. Or call and we'll come see you. 

OLNEY 
SAVINGS 

EDE 
Olney, Seymour, hxksboro, Bridgeport, Macon*, 
Weatherford, Azle, Graham, Archer City, Brownwood, 
Bow* and Wichita Foils. Also Electra Swings in Electra, 
Ranger Savings .n Ranger, Eastland Sowings in Eastland. 
All Divisions of Olney Savings. 

GORMAN PROGRESS, SEPTEMBER 24, 1981 HOMEMAKERS CLASS 
NEWS 
HOLDS FIRST MEETING 

The Homemakers Class of 
First Baptist Church met on 
Tuesday September 8, 1981 
in the home of Mrs. Anna 

Faye Foster for their first 
meeting. The co-hostess was 
her daughter Mrs. 	Pam 
Childers. 

the specialists on the tour. 

Gen: 2-7; Story of Hope by 
Helen Chandler. a 12 year 
old boy given by Theresa 
Parker. Accordian solo given 
by Milton Fairbetter. Jr. 
Meeting closed with prayer 
led by Rubs.  Acrea. 

Delicious refreshments of 
coconut cake, dip. crachers 
and fruit punch were served 
by Lucretia to Helen Chand-
ler. Ruby Vandergriff, Ruby 
Area. Mozelle Rhymes. 
Hazel Elliott, Theresa Parker 
and Tommye Haile. Velma 
Bennett and Mildred Whitt. 

Growers will discuss fu-
ture plans following the tour. 

Everyone interested in pe-
cans are invited regardless of 
age, socio-economic level, 
race, color, sex, religion or 
national origin. 

—GP— 

ANNUAL EASTLAND 
COUNTY FALL PECAN 
TOUR FRIDAY 

The annual Eastland 
County Fall Pecan Tour will 
be Friday September 25 an-
nounces De Gordon. East- 
land Count) 	Extension 
Agent. The tour will begin at 
9:30 a.m. at the L.R. Bock 
orchard. The Boch orchard 
was formerly owned by Ben 
Freeman and is located 10 
miles south of Ranger just off 
Highway 571. 

The tour will include only 
this orchard. Visitors will see 
several different varieties, 
herbicide experiments, and 
results of close planted trees. 
Two Extension Specialists 
will be on the tour to discuss 
pecan problems with grow-
ers. Dr. Sammy Helmers, 
Horticulturist and Dr. Jesse 
Cocke. Entomologist, will be 

q'HE FRS? ARMY uNirogm 
\NA- -.TANI'ARril-gr By ORDER 
OF ---1-4E CONINgtrfAL ARAN IN 
1779! THE UNIFORM t'lkS FtLUE. 
REP. riPliTE FRFF AND fve_ARLET 

iNrICATEr UNIT AMP ROO. 
DE. 16 N ION ./ 

La Von Snider of Brown-
wood. Mr. and Mrs. Dwayne 
Snider, Sheri and Lisa of 
Stephenville, Mr. and Mrs. 
Ted Snider, Susan and Toby, 
Mr. and Mrs. Jamie Snider. 
Mr. and Mrs. Gene Snider. 
Kathy and Mike. Mr. and 
Mrs. Danny Snider, Justin 
and Belinda and Mr. and 
Mrs. T. W. Jumper of Car-
bon were Sunday dinner 
guests of Mrs. C. L. Snider. 

Mr. and Mrs. M. R. Henry 
of Post visited with her 
parents. Mr. and Mrs. Lon 
Snider during the weekend. 

Ben Rollins and his sister 
and brother-in-lay... Mr. and 
Mrs. Oral Joy of Cross Plains 
have returned from a va-
cation trip to visit with Mr. 
Joy's sister. Mrs. 	Sybil 

the County Council. There 
will be a booth at the County 
Fair on October 1-3 where 
these vials of life can be 
purchased. Members of the 
Kokomo E. H. Club also have 
vials for sale. 

Mrs. Rodgers served re-
freshments of vegetables and 
dip. crackers and cheetoes, 
angel food cake and ice 
cream and cold drinks. 

444E MOST FAMOUS 
Move RN ARMY uNIFORO 
PESIL;MATIC4 15 71-le GREEN BERET- 7HE 1-1EADGEA 

OF 7HE ARM'S 5I'ECIAL FoRa5 
•30i..PtER I 

Shobe in Augusta. Kansas. 
WORKDAY AT 

SIMPSON CEMETERY 
A workday has been set for 

Saturday. September 26 at 
the Simpson Cemetery be-
ginning around 9:00 a.m. 
Water erosion has caused 
some ditches and these need 
to be filled in. Bring wheel-
barrows, shovels, hoes and 
rakes. 

Mr. Willard Carroll of 
Abilene and the Gideon Or-
ganization, was the guest 
speaker at the Sunday morn-
ing service at Kokomo Bap-
tist Church. Mrs. Carroll ac-
companied her husband to 
Kokomo. Other visitors were 
Dwayne Snider and 	his 
daughter, Sheri of Stephen-
ville. 

Mr. and Mrs. Carroll, Mr. 
and Mrs. J. C. Clearman and 
Bro. and Mrs. Jim Andrews 
were among those attending 
the Gideon Banquet at East-
land on Saturday night. 

Miss Anne Shelburne of 
Ft. Hancock, Texas recently 
visited with a neice, Mrs. E. 
L. Foster and family at Lake 
ixon and attended church elt.ervices at the Kokomo 
Baptist Church with Mrs. 
Foster. 

Mr. and Mrs. Milton A. 
Burns of Abilene were recent 
visitors with her sister, Mrs. 
Bessie Everton. Mrs. Bill 
Bingham of Midland was 
also visiting recently with 
Mrs Everton. 

Mr. and Mrs. Cullen Rod-
gers spent the weekend in 
Midlothian visiting with the 
Gene Rodgers and Jimmy 
Rodgers families. 

Mrs. Lavelle Rodgers was 
a weekend visitor with her 
daughter. Glinda Steele in 
Everman and with a son Mr. 
and Mrs. Harold Rodgers 
and family in Grand Prairie. 

Suzanne Schofield of Gran-
bury was a weekend visitor 
with Wanda Rainey at Car-
bon. 

The evening began with 
the electing of officers for the 
new year: 
President - Mavis Lasater 
V-President - Euna Porter 
Secretary: Barbara Tucker 
Treasurer: Allene Reeves 
Out-Reach: June Dossey 
Recording Secretary: 

Lois Buchanan 
Reporter: Opal Holiday 
Flower Committee: 

Iris Preston 
Hazel Smith 

Nominating Committee: 
Blanche Browning 

Georgia Faye Skaggs 
Thanksgiving Committee: 

Geraldine Wright 
Gladys Chambless 

Group Captains: 

Arlene Pittman 
Ruby Overstreet 

Jo Ann Butler 

After the officers were 
elected Mrs. Elaine Skinner 
gave a very inspiring de- 
votion on patience. 	The 
guests were served refresh-
ments of salads, sandwiches. 
and a very pretty vegetable 
plate, cake, coffee and tea. 

Those attending 	were: 
Lavoyce Hirst. Bea O'Neal, 
Ruby Overstreet, Luzelle 
Been, Doris Bryan. Winell 
Bryant. Gladys Chambless, 
Euna Porter, Luise Brown, 
Blanche Browning. Thelma 

The United Methodist Wo-
men met in the home of Don 
Moorman for the second 
lesson of the Mission Study. 
The Cry of My People! led by 
Mozelle Rhymes study lead-
er. Prayer and mediation 
period led by Ruby Acrca. 
Helen Chandler read Scrip-
tures from Acts 17: 24.25.26 
and Gen. 2: 7. 

The story by a little boy 
and girl from Beunas Aires 
given by Theresa Parker and 
Tommy Haile. Economic 
growth and development and 
the underdevelopment 	of 
those countries with per cap-
ita income in 1975 being 
$105.00 to 1301.00 per per-
son and expression of the 
people and hard work ex-
pressed through songs and 
poems and repression of the 
people given by Mozelle 
Rhymes the leader. 

The meeting closed by 
repeating in unison the 
prayer of St. Francis Assissi! 

Next meeting will be Sep-
tember 28th in the home of 
Velma Bennett. Everyone in-
vited to attend. 

Delicous refreshments of 
Pimiento cheese, cookies and 
pink lemonade and coffee 
was served by Hostess Don 

UMW MET AT HOME OF 
LUCRETIA FA1RBETTER 

The United Methodist Wo-
men met in the home of 
Lucretia Fairberter for the 
Mission Study September 14, 
1981 at 2:30 p.m. Mozelle 
Rhymes is the Study Leaaer. 

"The Cry of My People" 
by Esther and Mortiner Arias 
of Bolivia out of captivity in 
Latin America. We learn to 
see Latin America through 
Latin American eyes. Areas 
of politics. enconomics, re-
ligion and human rights. 
christianity is a devine fac-
tor in their life. The dis-
covery of poor and the redis-
covery of the gospel - a 
theology of oppressed! 

Scripture, Gen: 4 • 27; 

Mrs. Berniece Rodgers 
and Mrs. John Rodgers and 
Jonna of Carbon attended 
the West Texas Fair at 
Abilene on Friday. Jonna 
brought home three ribbons 
from the Junior Food Show. 
She received First Place with 
her candy. Second Place with 
her nut bread, and Third 
Place with her drop cookies. 
Congratulations to Jonna. 
John Rodgers was at the Fair 
several days with his FFA 
students from Carbon who 
had livestock at the Fair. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Rod-
gers and Jonna and Mr. and 
Mrs. Jeff White of Graham 
was visiting with Mrs. Ber-
niece Rodgers on Sunday 
afternoon. Bob Rodgers of 
Brownwood visited with his 
mother on Monday. 

Mrs. C. L. Snider and her 
brother and 	sister-in-law, 
Mr. and Mrs. T. W. Jumper 
of Carbon were 	supper 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
Dwayne Snider and family in 
Stephenville on 	Tuesday 
night. 

Mr. and Mrs. Orville Fair 
of Dublin and Mr. and Mrs. 
Cell Bays of Highland were 
visiting with Mr. and Mrs. J. 
L. Morrow on 	Saturday 
night. 

Mr. and Mrs. J. L. Morrow 
visited with Mr. and Mrs. M. 
M. Logan at Dublin on Mon-
day. 

edia==mor...011^. 	 

Moorman to Ruby Lee Van-
dergriff, Ruby Acrea, Mo-
zelle Rhymes, Lucritia Fair-
better Theresa Parker, Helen 
Chandler, Tommye Haile, 
Rose Partee, Mildred Whitt 
and Velma Bennett. 

TUCKER AUCTION BARN 
Monthly Consignment Sales 

Beginning OCTOBER 3 at 1:00 P.M. 
CONSIGNMENTS NEEDED 

Contact FRED T TUCKER 
(TXS081-1152) 

817-629-1956 after 5 p. m . 

Approx. 1/2  M i. off FM 2563 
in Flatwoods Community 

FAMILY BUDGETS — 
SPENDING YARDSTICKS IS 
PROGRAM FOR KOKOMO 
EH CLUB 

County Extension Agent. 
Mrs. Janet Thomas gave a 
very timely and informative 
program "Family Budgets -
Spending Yardsticks" to the 
Kokomo Extension Home-
makers Club on Monday. 
Inflation seems to be the 
number one domestic pro-
blem these days as it gets 
harder and harder to meet 
expenses and save toward 
retirement. 

Some of the guidelines 
given were to have goals. 

learn to set debt limit, be 
careful with credit and high 
interest rates, pay cash if 
possible to avoid the high 
interest, and plan how the 
family income can best be 
spent now and for saving for 
a comfortable retirement. 

The meeting was held in 
the home of Mrs. J. C. 
Rodgers with Mrs. Albert 
Hendricks presiding. Mrs. 
Rodgers gave the devotion 
"The Righteous Bear Fruit" 
from Prov. 11:25-31. Mrs. 
Berniece Rodgers led the 

prayer. 
Seven members and two 

visitors. Mrs. Janet Thomas 
and Mrs. Lyle Green ans-
wered the roll call with "My 
Favorite Teacher". 	Mrs. 
Greene was enrolled as a 
new member of the club. 

The minutes were read 
and the treasurer's report 
given. 

Mrs. Thomas gave a report 
on the State T.E.H.A. meet 
in Austin last week. She also 
explained the "Vial of Life" 
project that is sponsored by 

Hampton, Jo Ann Butler, 
Hazel Smith, Elaine Skinner, 
Iris Preston, Juanita Fuller, 
Frankie Jo Shipman. Pam 
Childers, and Anna Faye 
Foster. Frankie Jo Shipman 
closed the meeting with 
prayer. 



HEARING TESTS 
will be conducted on 

TUESDAY, 
SEPTEMBER 29 

at Gorman City Hall 
from 11-12 and 1-2 

'There will be no charge for this service 
Brownwood 

* * * * * * * * * ** * * * * ** 

KING SIZE 
WALLET 

CREATIVE 

COLOR 
PORTRAITS 
FOR ONLY 
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MU MO II SUM Sal LOW WES,  

* * * * * * * ** 

$1,000 minimum 
21/2  year C.D. 
Effective September 22-28 16.55 

1739 YIELD 

14.37 
Substantial penalty for early withdrawal. 

$10,000 minimum 
6-month C.D. 
Effective September 22-28 

Substantial penalty for early withdrawal. 

This is an annual yield. The rate is subject to change at 
maturity. Federal regulations prohibit the compounding 
of interest during the term of the account. 

Come see us soon, or call and we'll come see you. 
'Cause it's the Olney way to save. And check out the 
Olney Savings Checking Account ... it pays 51/4% plus a 
whole lot more. 

Olney, Seymour, Jacksboro, Bridgeport, Nocona, 
Weatherford, Azle, Graham, Archer City, Brown-
wood, Bowie and Wichita Falls. Also Electra Savings 
in Electra, Ranger Savings in Ranger, Eastland Sav-
ings in Eastland. All Divisions of Olney Savings. 

To us, people are worth 
a whole lot more than money. 

0 OLNEY 
SAVINGS FsTx 

1881-1981 

HIGGINBOTHAM'S 
Celebrating 100 years of quality and service 

TAX FREE. BEGINS 
OCTOBER 1. 
SIGN UP NOW! 

CONVERT YOUR 
6- MONTH MONEY 
MARKET C.D. TO 
THE ALL-SAVERS 
C.D. NO PENALTY! Olney, Seymour, Jacksboro, Bridgeport, Nocono, 

Weatherford, Azle, Graham, Archer City, Brownwood, 
Bowie and Wichita Falls. Also Electra Savings in Elec-
tra, Ranger Savings in Ranger, Eastland Savings in 
Eastland. All Divisions of Olney Savings. 

T"ALL-SAVERS C.D. 
Beginning October 1, 1981, Olney Savings will offer a 

1-year certificate which pays tax-free interest - up to 
$2,000 for married couples filing jointly, $1,000 for an indi-
vidual. $500 minimum required. 

This tax-free feature is not the only attraction of the 
All-Savers C.D. It will also return a high yield. For many sav-
ers, the All-Savers C.D.'s tax free yield will be higher than 
the after-tax yield available in other types of accounts. And 
the Olney Savings All-Savers C.D. is insured by the 
F.S.L.I.C., up to $100,000. 

Come in and talk with us about the All-Savers C.D. We're 
prepared to answer any questions you have and we can 
begin now to set up your All-Savers C.D. We're ready to 
help. 

Come see us soon. Or call and we'll come see you. 

1 4  your family 
income is 

Yovr To* Bracket 
probably is 

Interest rate needed 
to 
federal income tax is 

520,000 or less 25% 16.81% 

$25,000 30% 18.01% 

$35,000 40% 21.02% 

$50,000 or 
more 

50% 25.25% 

The above ngures ore approximate and ore based on 1981 tax tables The 12.61% 
interest rote is equal to 70% of overage investment yield on one year U.S. Treasury 

as of more recent auction dote 

OLNEY 
SAVINGS 

entered. Entries will be sold 
at 4:00 p.m. Friday, October 
2 after judging. 
7. All, entries must be on 
disposable containers and 
wrapped securely, (plastic 
bags). 

Classes 
1. Cookies - twelve (12) 
2. Candies - twelve (12) 
3. Breads - A. Yeast B. Quick 
4. Cakes 
5. Pies 
6 Peanut Creations - any-
thing with peanuts or peanut 
butter as one of the main 
ingredients. 
7. Decorative Cakes. 

PRESERVED FOODS 
1. Participant must abide by 
general rules. 
2. Any entry not in standard 
jars will be judged in a 
separate category. 
3. All entries must be labeled 
on the jar as to content. 
4. Pickles. jellies and relishes 
will be opened and flavor 
tasted when judged. 
5. All entries must be sealed. 
6. Participant may not enter 
identical entries or more than 
three items in each class. 
7. When necessary entries 
will be combined for judging. 

Classes 
1. FRUITS: apples, black-
berries, peaches, pears. 
other fruit. 
2. VEGETABLES: 	Grean 
beans, beets, tomatoes, 
blackeyed peas, okra, squash 
and mixed vegetables, i.e., 
soup mix, etc. 
3. JELLY: grape, plum, 
berry, jellies not listed. Spec-
iality items will be judged on 
appearance. quality of pro-
duct and flavor. 
4. BUTTERS: Peach, plum, 
apple. etc. 
5. JAMS: Grape. plum, berry 
and etc. 
6. PRESERVES: Strawberry, 
peach, arpicot, pear mar-
malade, other fruits not list-
ed. A. Fruit. B. Sweet. C. 
Dill Cucumber, D. Other ve-
getables, i.e., okra, squash, 
etc. 
7. RELISH: Fruit - pear, etc. 

Vegetable, 	pickles, 
fruits, jelly, etc. 

HANDCRAFTS DIVISION 
1. All general rules of the 
Fair will apply to this di-
vision. 

Classes 
KNITTING: A. Sweater, B. - 
Afghan. C. Poncho, Shawl, 
Stole, D. Anything of merit 
not mentioned. 
CROCHET: A. Sweater, B. 
Afghan. C. Tablecloth, Bed-
spread, D. Any items of 
merit not mentioned. 
NEEDLEPOINT: A. Any cen-
ter filled item - exhibitor 
completed background, B. 
Originial canvas designed 
and executed by exhibitor, 
C. Picture, D. Pillow, E. 

$3.00 per event with $2.00 
going to the jackpot and 
$1.00 to the club. There will a 
concession stand open for 
your convience. 

damage, loss, or injury to 
any person or article while 
participating in the Eastland 
County Fair. There will be a 
watchman on duty at night. 
14. No name tags shall be on 
articles to be judged. Num-
bers will be assigned upon 
registration. 
15. Names of winners will be 
rosted in each division after 
judging is completed. 

BAKED GOODS 
Notice: Baked entries be-

come the property of the 
County Fair and will not be 
re turned. 
I. Participant must abide by 
the general rules. 
2. No commercial mixes may 
be used. 
3. Each participant shall 
hake his own entry. No entry 
group will be accepted. 
4. A receipe must accompany 
each entry. 
5. Entries requiring refriger-
ation will not be accpeted, 
i.e.. gelatin. whipped cream, 
ice cream. (All entries not 
keeping six (6) hours will be 
sent to be sold. 
6. Bake goods will be sold at 
the booth where they were 
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Eastland County 
Fair Is Coming 

Points will be carried over 
from each playday. There 
will be 4 classes: Pee Wee, 
Junior, Intermediate, and 
Senior. Entry Fee will be 

JACKPOT PLAYDAY 
SUNDAY SEPTEMBER 
27 

The Grant Town Riding 
Club will be having a Jackpot 
Playday, Sunday, September 
27, 1981, at 1:30 P.M. in 
Mingus, Texas. The rain 
date will be the following 
Sunay. A gift certificate will 
be presented to the High 
Point Contestants at the end 
of  the September Playday. 

Any items of merit not 
mentioned. 
EMBROIDERY: A. Liquid 
embroidery. B. Crewel, C. 
Other embroidery items, D. 
Machine. 
CERAMICS: A. Glazed. 1. 
under glazes. 2. over glazes; 
B. Stains. 
QUILTS: A. Applique guilts. 
B. Quilt tops. C. Pieced 
quilt, D. Quilted pillows. 
WOODCRAFT: A. Wood-
buring, B. Wood carving. C. 
Handmade wooden items. 
Others: Pottery, Tatting, 
Metal Art, 	Bedspreads 
(other than knitted or cro-
chet], Jewelry, Decorations -
Christmas, etc., Decoupage, 
Seed Art, China Painting, 
Macrame, String Art, Dolls 
and Toys, Art Plaster, Mis-
cellaneous - candles, lye 
soap, beadwork, foil art, wall 
plaques, Tole Painting, 
Leather, Crafts From Junk. 
FURNITURE: A. Refinished 
Furniture. B. Upholstered 
Furniture. C. Handmade 
Furniture. 

CLOTHING DIVISION 
1. Participants must abide by 
the general rules of the Fair. 
2. Garment will be judged on 
construction and overall ap-
pearance. 
3. Garments should be on a 
hanger. 

BE CHECKED OUT BY DI-
VISION WORKERS BE-
FORE BEING RELEASED 
TO OWNER. 
6. Each division will have the 
following classes: Adult - 18 
years and over; Youth -
Kindergarten to 3rd grade; 
Youth - 4th to 7th grades; 
Youth - 8th to 12th grades. 
7. Ribbons will be awarded to 
1st, 2nd and 3rd places. 
8. Best of show awards will 
be given to each division. 
Winners to be chosen from 
the 1st place winners in each 
class. 
9. Regardless of number of 
entries, article must be 
worthy of rating before it is 
given a ribbon. 
10. Decision of the judge will 
be FINAL. 
11. All entries (exclueding 
handcrafts) must have been 
prepared during the previous 
12 months. Entries in the 
Handcrafts division must not 
have been placed in any 
previous County Fair. 
12. Entries need not be new 
but must be clean. 
13. The Fair Association will 
not be responsible for any 

The annual Eastland 
County Fair will be held Oc-
tober 1, 2, and 3rd at the 
Posse Barn and Fair 
Grounds on the Eastland 
Lake road. A complete list of 
rules for entering various 
catagories will be puslished 
September 27th. 

Free entertainment will be 
furnished each night of the 
Eastland County Fair. 

Thursday night, October 1, 
Dale Brooks and the Texas 
Rangers of Eastland, will 
entertain. Judy Smalley will 
be featured. 

The Country Ramblers of 
Strawn will "pick and sing" 
Friday night. 

Lyndell Cockburn, who is 
in charge of the entertain-
ment this year will be 
featured Saturday night. She 
will be with the Eastland 
County Combinations' of 

Ranger. 
HOME CRAFT DIVISION 

1. There will be no entry fee. 
2. All entries (except baked 
goods) will be accepted from 
12 noon to 6 p.m. Thursday, 
October 2, with judging to be 
Friday morning. Baked 
goods entries will be accept-
ed from 9:00 to 1:00 p.m. on 
Friday morning, 	with 
judging at 1:30 p.m. Friday, 
October 2nd. 
3. No entries will be accepted 
after 6 p.m. excluding baked 
goods. 
4. Only one entry per class 
per contestant. Due to limit-
ed space, only one item will 
be accepted, i.e., one pillow-
case, one book and. etc. 
5. NO HOME CRAFT EN-
TRIES WILL BE PICKED UP 
BEFORE 6 P.M. SATUR-
DAY IN ORDER THAT THE 
PUBLIC MAY VIEW ALL 
ENTRIES. ENTRIES MUST 

Classes 
1. Women's Clothing 
2. Men's Clothing 
3. Girl's Clothing 
4. Boy's Clothing 
5. Western Clothing 
LIVING PLANTS DIVISION 
Directors: Mrs. Lois Raley 
and Ranger Garden Club 

Members 
1. Participants should abide 
by the general rules of the 
Fair. 
2. All plants should have 
been in the grower's pos-
session for 3 months prior to 
the Fair. 
3. flowering plants must be 
in bloom. 
4. Plant entries will be re-
leased between 6 - 8 p.m on 
Saturday, October 3. 

Classes 
1. Foliage Plants 
2. African Violets 
3. Flowering Plants 
4. Cactus 
5. Succulents 
6. Ferns 

Olney Savings Introduces 

IMLUESaii  

Area  heating 
• saves 

energy 
And helps reduce your monthly 
heating costs. 
Your heating requirements will be reduced by 
heating only those rooms that are used 
regularly...even if you already have central 
heating. Dearborn 
heaters are safe. They 
provide warm, even 
temperatures. And 
using them is less 
expensive than 
heating an entire 
home. 
The energy shortage 
is today. Buy your 
Dearborn area heater 
while all sizes are still 
available. 

Ceiling Fans for Winter? 
169.95 Limited Supplies 

Only if you want to continue saving on your 
energy bills. Heritage fans with reversible 
motors reduce your heating costs by redistribu-
ting the heated air from the ceiling down to 
where you live. Light kits available. 

BUY NOW! 
WINTER IS JUST 
AROUND THE 

CORNER 

140.00 
184.00 
199.95 
239.95 

DWC 10, 10,000 BTU 
DRC 20, 20,000 BTU 
DRC 30, 30,000 BTU 
DRC 40, 40,000 BTU 

Available in LP or Natural Gas 

Dearborn®  
STOVE COMPANY - DALLAS. TEXAS 
A Division of Addison Products Company 

734-2227 - GORMAN 
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FOOTBALL SCHEDULE 

SEPT. 25 - Glen Rose 

OCT. 1 - Loraine 

OCT. 9 - Evant* 

OCT. 16 - lometa* 
OCT. 13 - Rising Star* 

(HOMECOMING) 

OCT. 30 - Goldthwaite* 

NOV. 6 - Blanker 

SEPT. 4 - Gorman 28-Hico 0 

SEPT. 11 - Dublin 25 - Gorman 0 

SEPT. 18 - De Leon 20 - Gorman 12 

*Denotes District Games 

T - 8:00 

T - 8:00 

H -7:30 

T - 7:30 

H - 7:30 

H - 7:30 

T - 7:30 

4.

4.  4. Dudley McCarty 	4. 	 Caye Little 4,  

4. 4. 	

4. COACHES: Head - Alan Gibbs 	4. 
4. 	 4. 
4. 4. 	 Dail Ables 	4. PANTHER MASCOT: 

4. 

::. 
:4. 
.. 
.474 

44 

44. 4. 

4: 

NO. 

10 
11 
12 
20 
22 
23 
24 
33 
37 
40 

50 
51 
55 
60 
61 
62 
63 
66 
70 
74 

77 
78 

80 
81 
84 
88 

76Juan 

NAME 

Scotty Mauney 
Jimmy Johnson 
Dane Gressett 
Jacky Johnson 
Mark Swanner 
Eddie Pettit 
John Woodall 
Rodney Reeves 
Russ Gressett 
Ray Bond 

Jeff Ripley 
Curtis Warren 
Mike Jones 
Andy Kinser 
Harvey Bryan 
Olin Harrington 
Phillip Osborne 
Darrell Savage 
Joe Underwood 
Joey Casey 

Pacheco 
Matt Ables  
Royce Ridens 

Jeff Seaton 
John Silva 
Darren Clark 
Mark Watson 

WT. 

150 
180 
155 
160 
160 
125 
110 
190 
150 
145 

130 
210 
155 
220 
180 
120 
170 
155 
205 
150 
150 
220 
160 

140 
145 
130 
120 

444 
 4. 

POS. 

B 
B 
B 
B 
E 
B 
B 
B 
B 
B 

C 
C 
G 
T 
G 
G 
G 
G 
T 
T 
G 
T 
T 

B 
E 
E 
E 

CLASS 

SR. 
SR. 
JR. 

SOPH, 
SOPH. 
SOPH. 
JR. 
JR. 
FR. 
SR. 

FR. 
SR. 
SOPH. 
SR. 
SR. 
FR. 
JR. 
SR. 
FR. 
JR. 
SOPH. 
SR. 
SOPH. 

SOPH. 
JR. 
JR. 
SR. 

PANTHERS ROSTER 

4. 4.. 
44. 4. 
44 44. 
4. 

44. 
44 4. 
44. 
4... 4. 

It' 
44. 
44. 41 
44. 4. 
44. 
4. 4. 
4. 4. 
4.. 
;t4  
:44  
It 4. 4. 
44. 
4. 4. 
44. 
44. 
44 4. 
‘.4 4. 
44 
44. 4. 
44. 

444 4. 
4. 
4. 4. 

4. 
4. 
44. 

4. 4. 
4. 4. 4. 
44. 
4. 44. 
4. 4. 4. 44. 
4. 4. 
;'. 
4:: 4. 4. 

4. 

4. 4. 

4.7. 

TWIRLERS: 

Shelene Young 
Kristi Odell 
Nita Scitern 

MANAGER: 

Jimmy Woodall 

CHEERLEADERS.: 
Tracey Dossey 

Terri Keith 
Angela Burgess 

Mary Gray 
Lisa Foster 

BAND DIRECTOR: 

Jim Andrews 

DRUM MAJOR:.  
Alfie Pino 

SUPERINTENDENT: 
G. W. Maxfield 

PRINCIPAL: 

Bill Sandlin 

COLORS: 

Red and Blue 

MASCOT: 
Panthers 

SUPPORTING THE PANTHERS ALL THE WAY IN '81 
W estside Mobil - Garage 

Brown's Feed Store 

Birdsong Peanuts 

K&W Garage and Tire Store 

Gorman Insurance Agency 

Higginbotham's 

Lasater Dept. Store 

Todd's Variety 

Foster Floral 

Gilmore's Auto Center 

Gorman Pharmacy 

Comanche County Telephone Co. 

a. 

Smith Bros. Chevrolet Co. 

Artistic Beauty Salon 

Southwestern Peanut Growers Assn. 

Ables Garage & Blacksmith 

Gorman Exxon Station 

Jay's Grocery and Market 

Doctors Clinic 

First National Bank 

Mauney Farm Supply 

Gorman Milling Company 

Family Medical Clinic 

Clark Construction Co. 

Mason Auto Parts 

Sunbelt Savings 

Texas Electric Service Co. 

Granny's Kitchen 

Gorman TV Cable Service 

Henderson's Quick Way 
Grocery and Deli 

Munn Cleaners 

Bob's Grocery and Station 

Jay's Insurance Agency 

Smith Peanut Dryers 

& W arehousee 

A.O. Easley Trucks, Inc. 

Blackwell Memorial Hospital 

Big J's Boots 
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NIOR 
IZENS 

NEWS 
We had a nice welcome 

shower the past week. It was 
sure appreciated though we 
could use a lot more just 
now. 

What a shame and a dis-
grace to our nation that so 
many in our armed forces are 
drinking alcoholic drinks and 
using drugs. Tho they get 
those drinks and tobacco at a 
Discount. That stuff is sold at 
all PX Stores. Then when 
they get to drinking they 
want something stronger. 

While at the same time 
they try to cure the alcoholics 
etc. 

If Congress would put a 
10% increase on all alcoholic 
beverages and all tobacco 
products. with no discounts 
to anyone. that would raise 
many billions of dollars. 

The Post Office wants to 
raise letter postage to 20 
cents. Just cut mail delivery 
to five days per week. If that 
will not balance the budget 
then, roll back that salary 
increase. They were not en-
titled to in the first place. 

Labor and colored are in 
Washington protesting Rea-
gan policy. I say do not let 
those air Controllers that 
went on strike never be 
allowed to work a day on any 
U.S. or State job. 

THose that are able to 
work and on the Food Stamps 
programs let them work at 
least one day on some kind of 
job for each $25 in Stamps. 

What a shame, the State 
Legislature could not agree 
in 6 months Session on the 
U.S. House of Representa-
tives District and had to get 
Bullock out of a place being 
treated for a drinking pro-
blem. 

Well, Cardinal Cody did it. 
His step cousin lived in his 
home and drew $8,000.00 per 
year as secretary. Tho she 
says she did no work for it. 

The investigators siad he 
gave her a million dollars. 
Tho Mrs. Wilson said it was 
just a mere pittance of 
$373,000.00. That was salary 
gifts, etc. 

All the other Cardinals, 
priests. etc. came to Cody's 
aid. "Birds of a Feather 
Flock Together". Remember 
he is just a man and no man 
is perfect. Enough said? 

I received a letter from 
Elbert and Cora Lee from 
Colorado. They said that they 
stayed at same Motel we 
stayed with them in 1961. 
The only change was the 
price was twice as high now. 
Tho that year in August. We 
saw it sleet on the 23rd of 
October and 10 inches of 
snow fell. The sleet was a 
Fraser. Called the "Ice Box" 
of the Nation. 

Elbert was Trout fishing. 
So he decided to go a little 
ways down stream to a small 
fall. In about ten minutes he 
came running back and said 
he saw a large one, about 
seven feet tall walking up 
that trail on its hind feet and 
eating as it went along. I 
asked him why he didn't cast 
that thing in the tongue. He 
said, "it could not stand still 
long enough". He said no his 
shoes were shaking too much 
for him to stand still long 
enough to cast. 

People protect the Nuclear 
Power Plant. We have to 
have them. 

People protest the Neutron 
bomb. That is some thing we 
have to have to stand against 
Russia. Our Armed Forces 
are so inadequate. They went 
down for the last ten years. 

I .,oticed in the paper 
where the report said so 
many farmers in Small Busi-
ness are failing. Why is it 
they did not tell of many, 
many millions of dollars lost 
by lending to Small Business 
Administration to the Blacks. 
They just wasted it. 

Iran is blaming the U.S. 
for all those bombings. They 
are sure killing each other 
off. 

Well, our first frost is one 
month away. On October 
21st, we will see Frost here. 
It may not be a killing one 
tho. 

Look up and smile as the 
AFLCIO are not in power yet. 

TH3 RAMBLER 
REPORTER 

-GP- 
Fish have been seen at ocean 
depths of almost 7 miles. 



Miracle 
Whip 

Kroft: 

Miracle Whip 
LIMIT I 

qt $1.39 

POTATOES  RUS1S0ETLTB. BA1:69 

CABBAGECOLORADO 
POUND1 0 

TEXAS SUPER SELECT 

CUCUMBERS 2-290 

EAST TEXAS 	 POUND 

YAMS 390 

TOTINO'S 

PIZZA 
ASSRT. FLAVORS 
	$ 

i *I 9  
EACH 	I 

SQUASH TEXAS 
YELLOW  POUND 290 

JELLO 
ASSORTED FLAVORS 

3 OZ. 

290 

5 
POUND 

BAG 
8 9 c 

VANILLA WAFERS MKG.890 

,„cio something „, 
about inflation! 

fi,-„„,„,„„... THESE FOOD SPECIALS! 
j,, 	

GOOCH'S FRESH 	
LB. 

STEAK     giogi POUND 98 
R 	POU D1• OAST GAOROMC H 

R 0 AST CHUCK POM.49 

STEAK 
CHOPS 

GOPOCdRCKENTER CUIT)1111 • 79  
PORK 	POUND 1 .49 
GOOCH 

C
MARYLANDFCLUB OFEE  

Limit 1 $ 2.0'1 
TISSUE"' 4 ROLL PKG. 890 
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CARBON NEWS 
By Mrs. Bob Hasting 

639-2511 

School Supplies 
SHOP ONE STOP 

Grocery & Market 

44;25 
There may be as many as 40,000 asteroids, large chunks of rock, orbiting the sun between 
Mars and Jupiter. 

Sisimma  734-2241 unibel 
Gorman 

J & J AIR CONDITIONING 
& REFRIGERATION 	 
Full Line GE Dealer 

Free Estimates 
on Installation 

629-2251 
Service on All Makes r  

Owner, James Schuman 	 

SHUGART COUPON 
WEDNESDAY, SEPT. 30 

HIGGINBOTHAM'S 
199  
WALLET SIZE 

COLOR PORTRAITS 

994 • 
TffiNS 1 Extra charge 

;8 x10; 	for 
orrra 	GROUPS 

Even if you're 
unhandy, you can 
do something to 
help hold down 
electric bills. 

Save energy and money at 
home by learning how to insulate, 
caulk and weatherstrip —it's easy 
when you know how. Just call us, 
or ask for our "Unhandy Person's 
Guides" on the comments portion 
of your bill. 

It's important to learn ways to conserve energy, especially 
since the cost of electricity must continue to increase, partly 
because all fuel used to make electricity continues to 
cost more. 

For example, a contract for low-cost natural gas expires at 
the end of this year, and we'll have to use more high- 
priced gas next year. 

You can conserve and help 
hold down your bill by using the 
"Unhandy Person's Guides" from 
Texas Electric. 

D R ARMSTRONG. Manager. Phone 8932266 

Texas 
Electric 

Service 
company 

COCA-COLA 
MR. PIBB 

12 OZ. 6-$1.79 

Mr. and Mrs. Collin 
Campbell were honored by 
their children and grand-
children with a reception on 
their Golden Anniversary at 
the Carbon School Cafeteria 
Sunday September 20. Hosts 
were Kenneth and Von Cieia 
Snider. Linda and Julie of  

Rosebud. Arkansas; Roy and 
Reba Reeves and Pollyanna 
of Fort Worth; Weldon and 
Colleen Lamb of Nimrod; Bill 
and Addie Lou Walker, 
Philip, Sallie, Loren and 
Collin of Burket; Chris and 
Audrey Humphry of Huron, 
Michigan; James Snider of  

Hollonian Air Base, New 

Mexico; Perry Reeves of 
Denton. 

Around 140 friends and 
relatives from all over regis-
tered during the afternoon. It 
was a very enjoyable after-
noon for all. Our congratula-
tions and Best Wishes to the 

Campbells. 

Mr. and Mrs. Charles 
Driver of Bossier, Louisana 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Buck 
Weston on Saturday. 

Mrs. Clifford Gilbert and 
Mrs. Calvin Gilbert of Den-
ton visited Mrs. Vadis Phelps 
and Mr. and Mrs. Roy Skin-

ner on Saturday. 

Mr. and Mrs. T. W. Jum-
per of Houston have been 
visiting at their home here 
this summer. 

--- 
Mrs. Muriel Thurman of 

Colorado City spent Sunday 
with her aunt Mrs. Ruth 

Craighead. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bud Robert-
son of Goldthwaite were 
Sunday guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Buck Weston. 

--- 
Odis Skinner of Midland is 

at the bedside of his father. 

5500.00 
MINIMUM 

INVESTMENT 

Roy Skinner, who will under-
go surgery in the Graham 
Memorial Hospital in Cisco 

on Tuesday. 

Carbon Kids are Winners 
at the West Texas Fair in 
Abilene last week. Three 
members showed animals in 
the Saturday Scramble Show 
at the fair and came away 
winners. Carlton Cozart won 
First Reserve Champion and 
Showmanship with his Suf-
folk Ewe. Bill Stephens 
showed his Charolais Heifer 
to win First Place; Third 
overall and Showmanship. 
Jerry Carlton won Third with 

his Charolais Heifer; Shan- 

non Spruill and Frank Boykin 
scrambled for heifers last 
Saturday at the Rodeo and 
will be in next year's show. 
Jonna Rodgers, Carbon 4-H 
Secretary took honors in the 
Baked Goods Show also held 
on Saturday. She won First in 
Candy; Second in Bread; and 
Third in Cookies. 

The Carbon 4-H Club held 
their first meeting Thursday, 
September 17. We elected 
officers. They are Ronnie 
Cagle, President; Darla 
Cagle, Vice President; Jonna 
Rodgers, Secretary; Sylvia 
Hamilton, Treasurer; Wayne 
Sevell, Reporter; Shannon  

Bond, Assistant Reporter. 
Brian Bond, Council Dele-
gate; Darla Cagle. Photo-
grapher. Other members are 
Laura Wood. Cody Wells, 
Shane Burgess, Shana 
McDaniel. Michael Norris, 
Jenny Norris, Ricky Cagle, 
Earl Hamilton, Craig Gryder, 
Mike Gryder, Jackie Pickens, 
Leslie Wood, Jancey Hamil-
ton. 

Wayne Sewell, 
Club Reporter 

NOW EARN 

25% 
LATER - OCT. 1 
EARN 12.61% 

ON 
TAX-FREE, FULLY INSURED 

ALL-SAVERS 
1 YEAR CERTIFICATES 
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