
Gorman Lodge 716 
AF&AM stated meet-

ings 2nd Tuesday of 
every month at 8:00 

p.m. Membeys urged to at-
tend. Visitors welcome. 
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Go 
Pittman -- lemons Tornado Warning 
Exchange Vows 	Signal Test Set 

Press 
Points 

Joe Bennett, Publisher 

After surveying the cur-

rent export market outlook 
for U. S. produced peanuts 

the National Peanut Growers 
Group Steering Committee 

has advised growers to make 
decisions on the planting of 

additional peanuts in a cau-
tious and deliberate manner. 

Ross Wilson, Texas repre-
sentative on the national or-
ganization. said that a dele-
gation of U. S. peanut pro-
ducers recently visiting 
European users of U. S. 
peanut found marketing op-
portunities to be in a de-
pressed state. Factors con-
tributing to the poor market 
outlook include inflation, lack 
of strength in the dollar and a 
surplus of peanuts world 
wide. 

Wilson said that prices for 
shelled goods presently be-
ing quoted by foreign users 
of U. S. peanuts convert to 
prices on farmers stock sub-
stantially below the cost of 
production. He said there- 

nuts going into Association 
loan pools will have even 
poorer potential of returning 
to growers anything over the 

loan rate for additional pea-

nuts." 
The grower spokesman 

said that in spite of the 
present dim market outlook 
for the short range in 1982, 
the grower team studying the 

export situation believes 
there remains a bright future 
for American peanuts in the 
European market. He cited 
as partial reason for his long 
range optimism the 13 per-
cent increase in peanut but-
ter sales in Europe last year, 
but the broad development of 
that market is in its infancy, 
he said. 

For now, Wilson 	said 
European buyers are enjoy-
ing the prospect of acquiring 
cheap peanuts, a condition 
that is being nurtured by the 
current oversupplied world 

market. 

fore, the National Peanut 
Growers Group has recom-
mended that growers not 
plant additional peanuts in 

1982 unless a contract has 
been secured that will assure 
a satisfactory net return to 

the producer. Wilson stated 

that growers should remem-
ber that additional peanuts 
not contracted must be plac-
ed in the area association 
pool and that pool dividends 
depend on both domestic and 
export edible demand. He 
said that there currently 
exists a considerable inven-
tory of 1981 crop segregation 
1 peanuts held by handlers 
and by the three area grower 
associations under the loan 
program. "We can only con• 

elude at this point. Wilson 
said. that any production of 
1982 crop additional peanuts 
without contracts will only 
add to the oversupply sit-
uation and further deterior-
ate markets. Also, such pea- 

Referendum and Election 
of T.P.P.B. Approaching 

Arlton Smith, Civil De-
fense Director for Gorman, 
has scheduled a test of the 
tornado warning signal at 
1:00 P.M. on Saturday. 
March 13. 1982. The purpose 
of this test is to familiarize 
the citizens of the community 
with the signal that will 
indicate the approach of a 
tornado or other disaster. 

The warning will be sound-
ed on the siren that is 
mounted on the water tower. 
and the signal will consist of 
one long blast lasting one 

minute. followed by numer-
ous short blasts. This test 
will be conducted only if the 
weather is fair on the sche-

duled date. 
With the approach of the 

tornado season. it is impor-
tant that all our citizens know 
the meaning of the signal so 
that lives may be saved if and 
when disaster strikes. If you 
hear this signal during incle- 

ment weather, take cover 
immediately near the center 
of your house or building. 
covering yourself with blan-
kets or pillows to protect your 
from flying glass. If you are 
caught outside .during a tor-
nado, lay in a ditch or other 
depression in the ground and 
cover you head with your 
arms. Do not, under any 
circumstances, get into your 
car and try to outrun a 
tornado. Countless lives 
were lost in Wichita Falls 
because people were unpre-
pared and did not know what 
to do. Take just a few 
moments to instruct your 
children and loved ones. Plan 
ahead---for an event that we 
hope never happens. 

In case of an actual tor-
nado the television cable 
system will be interrupted 
for an announcement. 
insert siren warning signals 
cut. 

fornia. 

CARD OF THANKS 
We would like to take this 

opportunity to thank every-
one for the nice gifts, flowers 
and cards, and visits that 
have been made in regards to 
the birth of our son, William 

Nolan. We also express a 
special thanks to Dr. L. and 
N.Agulia, Becki Wright and 
the hospital staff for the good 
care and kindness during our 
stay in the hospital. 

—GP— 

All producers of peanuts 
within the area defined, in-
cluding owners of farms on 
which peanuts are produced, 
are eligible to vote in the 
election if such producer 
would be required under 
H.B. 525 to pay the assess-

ment. 

Delta. Hunt. Collie, Dallas, 
Tarrant. Hood, Erath. Bos-
que. McLennan, Bell, Mi-
lam. Lee, Bastrop, Fayette, 
Colorado. Wharton and 
Matagorda. Producers east 
of this line are in District No. 

Joe Boswell 
Executive Director 

Texas Peanut 
Producers Board 

The Texas Peanut Produc-
ers Board is required by law 
to hold biennial elections for 
the purpose of electing board 
members. In the 1976 bienn-
ial election, three board 
members were elected for 
six-year terms. Those whose 
terms expire April 30, 1982 

are: J. 0. Jackson. Jr. -
District No. 2; Bill Huff -
District No. 3; and Billie 
Wayne Heiser • District No. 4 
(B. W. Heiser resigend July, 
1980 and J. M. Lindsey, III, 
was appointed to fill the en-
expired term). 

DISTRICT NO. 2 - Includes 
the northwestern counties of 
the State. The southermost 
boundary of this district in-
cludes the following coun-
ties: Loving, Wheeler, Ector, 
Midland. Glasscock. Sterl-
ing. Coke. Nolan, Taylor. 
Callahan, Eastland, Palo 
Pinto. Parker. Wise. Denton, 
Grayson. Fannin and Lamar. 
All peanut producers north of 
this line are in Di',trict No. 2. 

DISTRICT Nr 	3 - tie 
westermost b wkeiarx this 
district incli `des t_` follow- 

ing co- 	ed River, 

3. 

DISTRICT NO. 4 - The 
northermost counties of this 
district includes the follow-
ing counties: Maverick. Za-
valla, Medina, Bexar, Guad-
alupe, Gonzales, Lavaca, and 
Jackson. Producers south of 
this line are in District No. 4. 

REFERENDUM STATE 
AT LARGE - The Texas 
Peanut Producers Board pro-
poses to increase the current 
assessment rate from $1.00 
to $2.00 per ton to be 
collected at the point of first 
sale to finance programs of 
advertising, promotion. mar-
ket and product develop-
ment. education and re-
search designed to increase 
the profitability of peanut 
production. All peanut pro-
ducers within the State are 
included in the referendum. 

The referendum and elec-

tion of board members must 
be completed and tabulated 
by May 6. 1982. 

Any producer of peanuts 
who is qualified to vote in the 
election and desires to be a 
candidate for membership on 
the Texas Peanut Producers 
Board shall file with the 
principal office. P. 0. Box 

398, Gorman, Texas 76454, 
an applicaiton to have his 
name placed on the ballot. 
The application must be 
signed by the candidate and 
by at least ten producers who 
are qualified to vote in the 
election and must be filed at 
thirty (30) days prior to the 
election (April 6). 

No candidate, unless so 
nominated, shall have his 
name placed on the official 
ballot. However, this does 
not prevent the writing of the 
name of any candidate on the 
ballot by any qualified voter 
at the election. Spaces shall 
be provided on the ballot for 
such write-in candidates. 

	O 

rep. Hanna 
at Farmer's 

Speaker 
Banquet 

PATSY J. INGRAM 
MAKES STATEMENT 

Re-elect Patys J. Ingram. 
Justice of the Peace to the 
citizens of precinct Five, 
Eastland County, Texas as 
you know it is almost election 
time '82, and time for the 
office of Justice of the Peace 
to be filled for four more 
years. At this time I would 
like to ask for your vote and 
influence. As the incumbent 
I feel that I have the know-
ledge of the law and what the 
people of Precinct Five want. 

I feel that I have the ability 
and dedication to perform 
the duties that are required 
of the office of Justice of the 
Peace. I also have the respect 
for law and order that is 
required to be Justice of the 
Peat e. 

I have attended numerous 
siliogils sponsored by the 
Justice of Peace Training 
Center at Southwest Texas 
State University in San Mar-
cus. These schools are re-
quired by law to be Justice of 
the Peace. 

During my present term of 
office I feel that I have been 
fair.• honest and impartial. 

When Re-Elected I will 
continue to do so. 

When you go to the polls to 
vote in the May Democratic 
Priniary remember a vote for 
Patsy J. Ingram is a vote for 
Experience. Honesty and 
Ability. 

Pd. Pol. Adv. by Patsy J. 
Ingram and Friends. 

—GP— 

THANK YOU 
The family of Arabellah 

White Wolfe wishes to ex- 

received his education at 
John Tarlton State University 
and the University of Texas 

at Austin and he is married 
to the former Betty Elliott. 
They have three children, 
Judith, Stephen and Mark. 
In addition to his legislative 
responsibilities, Mr. Hanna 
maintains an office in Breck• 

enridge where he is a busi-
ness man with interests in oil 

and ranching. 
Representative Hanna is 

past Chairman of the South-
west Regional Energy Coun-
cil. He is on the Southern 
Interstate Regional Energy 
Council. He is on the South-
ern Interstate Nuclear Board, 
the Interstate Oil Compact 
Commission, the Texas 
Energy and Natural Re-
sources Advisory Council, 
the National Conference of 
State Legislators, Southern 
Conference of State Legisla-
tures, in Addition to his 
duties as Chairman of the 
Commitee on Energy Reso-
urces of the House of Repre-
sentatives, in which capacity 
he served for 8 years. 

—GP— 
CARD OF THANKS 

My sincere thanks to Dr.L. 
and N. Agulia and the staff of 
capable nurses and staff for 
the excellent care and atten-
tion during my stay in Black-
well Hospital. My thanks 
also to Friends for the flow-
ers, gifts, phone calls, cards 

and visits. May God bless 
each of you. 

Mary Turner 

mmm m 
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Gorman Fire Department 
will meet Monday March 15. 

Viviane Mae "June" Pitt-
man and Perry Lee Lemons 
were united in marriage at 
Chapel Two inside Elmen-
dorf Air Force Base in An-
chorage, Alaska. The double 
ring ceremony was officiated 
by Methodist Chaplain, Rev. 
Richard Johnson on October 
25, 1981 at 7:00 P.M. 

The bride is the daughter 

of Lilia E. Pittman. Gorman. 
Texas and Samuel Forrest of 
Philadelphia, Pennsylvania. 
The groom is the son of 
Gloria Lunsford and Michael 
Lemons of Peoria. Illinois. 

The altar was decorated 
with two lovely floral ar-

rangement of daisies and 
gardenias. Seven branch 
candelabras were placed on 
each side of the altar accen-
tuating the unity candles. 

As mothers were ushered 
in, organist Maribeth Steele 
played the traditional wedd-
ing and other love songs all 
through the ceremony. The 
bride's mother wore a floor 
length white gown embroid-
ered in blue satin flowers and 
jewelry of rubies. 	The 

groom's mother chose a floor 
length pale blue gown with 
smocked bodice and pleated 
skirt. Both mothers wore 
gardenia and rosebud cor-
sages. 

Neil Cline escorted the 
bride to the altar in lieu of 
her stepfather Murl Edward 
Pittman who was unable to 
attend and was given in 
marriage by her mother. 

The bride wore a long 
cathedral train of soft white 
bridal gown designed by her 
mother. The full. puff up 
skirt was overlayed with 
sheer and appliqued with 
Venise lace embedded in 
seed pearls. The bottom of 
the skirt was edged with 
pleated ruffles. The fitted 
bodice was also appliqued 
with Venise lace along with 
the full bishop sleeves. The 
high neckline dropped into a 
heart shape and edged with 
pleated ruffles. To complete 
her bridal attire, the cathed-
ral length veil of bridal 
illusion was sparsely covered 
with single Venise lace flow-
er and seed pearls. It was 
handmade by her mother 
with the help of her brother 
Joel Paul Pittman. She 
carried a bouquet of cas-
cading blue silk roses and 
gardenia accented with ivy 
and ribbons. made by the 
groom's aunt Mrs. William 
Clarke. Something new was 
her wedding gown and some-
thing old was an oriental 
pearl nicklace belonging to 
grandmother Adelina Espin-
osa of San Francisco. Cali- 

Linda Plante served as the 
maid of honor and the brides-
maid was Michelle Torre. 
Both wore identical bluish 
purple knee length dresses 

with corsages. They carried a 
small bouquet of silk blue 
roses with tiny flowers and 
ribbons. The groom wore a 
pale blue tuxedo with light 
blue ruffled shirt. 	David 
Garinger served as best man 
and Ray Graves A the 
groomsman. Both wore 
tuxedos identical to the 
groom's with white rose bou-
tonniere. The flower girl. 

Becky Danks, wore a full 
light blue dress layered in 
lace, puffup sleeves and 
electric blue sash. She wore a 
crown of white flowers on her 
hair and carried a basket of 
gardenia. blue rose and 
white dainty flowers. The 
ring bearer Jeff Oakes, wore 
a blue dress suit and carried 
a white satin heart shaped 
laced pillow and nosegay 
attached. Clarence Durst was 
fhe usher assisted by the 
bestman and groomsman. 
The groom's mother hosted 
the rehearsal dinner at La 
Mex in downtown Andchor-
age. 

A reception followed the 
wedding at Mac Chalet in-
side the base. It was de-
corated in white and blue 
colors by friend of the bride 

and groom. Wedding bells 
hanged from the ceiling. The 
decorations of the newlywed' 
tables followed the white and 
blue color scheme. Two bou-
quets of mixed flowers were 
placed on the bride's table 
beside the crystal punch 

bowl. The three tiered wedd-
ing cake was made by Linda 
Plante and Michelle Torre. It 
was decorated with blue 
roses and miniature white 
flowers. An array of assorted 
dishes were served from the 
groom's table. The wedding 
party was assisted by Sherrie 
Oakes. Sherry Danks. Jeff 
Clark and Rick 	Fisher. 
Amidst a burning fireplace 
and lively dancing music, the 
guest from different branch 
of the U. S. Armed Forces 
were entertained until mid-
night. 

The bride graduated high 
school from Saint Joseph 
School, attended The Philip-
pine•Chinese School of 
Nursing in Manila. Philip-
pines and The Texas Wo-
man's University in Denton, 
Texas. The groom graduated 
at Woodruff High School in 
Peoria. Illinois. Both will be 
attending Alaska University 
in Anchorage where they 
presently reside. 

Gorman Premedve Baptist 
Church will meet Saturday 
March 13 at 7:30 p.m. and 
Sunday March 14 at 10:30 
a.m. 

Lions Club will meet Tuesday 
noon March 23 at the Band 

Hall. 

— J— 
The Outstanding Farmer 

will be named at the Cham-
ber of Commerce Banquet *ere tonight at 7:30 in the 
school gym. The Community 
Service Award will also be 
presented to an honoree at 
the event. This banquet is 
always a highlight of the year 
in this community as all the 
folks in the area get together 
for fellowship and good food. 
Every citizens of this com- 

munity should be present for 
this occasion. And folks are 
always anxious to find out 
who the honorees are. So be 
sure and attend the banquet 
tonight at 7:30. 

—J— 
The Lions Club Light Bulb 

Sale continued on Monday' 
afternoon but they could not 
cover the anticipated amount 
of houses they planned to. 
So. be on the lookout for the 
Lions for they will surely be 
coming your way to sell you 
some light bulbs. If all goes 
well the Lions will be selling 
again this Monday after-
noon. If you haven't been 
contacted please check at 
Lasater's Disc. Store, Gor-
man Pharmacy or East End 
Co-Op. for your bulbs which 
arc on sale in these places. 
The Lions will appreciate it 

very much. 
—J— 

Most folks around here are 
concerned about the agricul-

ture situation and what the 
outcome will be. We have an 
article elsewhere on this 
page concerning the price of 
additional peanuts. Sources 
quote the market as being 
depressed and urges farmers 
to look close at the prospects 
before planting additional 
peanuts: 

Be sure and read the 
complete story elsewhere in 
this issue. 

—J— 
The Texas Peanut Produc-

ers Board will hold a referen-
dum and election of directors 
with complete tabulations to 
he completed by May 6. See 
the story on this elsewhere 
in this issue and the require-
ments to file for a place on 
the ballot. 

—J— 

•
Noticed where Mr. Temple 

was in Abilene this week and 
understand that the farmers 
of this area showed interest 
in his idea of helping the 
farmers who needed assist-
ance with a new slant on the 
loan situation. He stated that 
the state should pass legisla-
tion making loans available 
for farmers who are caught in 
the squeeze of high interest 
loans and rising costs due to 
inflation. 

I am sure we will hear a lot 
of campaign speeches before 
the voting time in May and in 
the General Election. 

—J— 
We have gotten a picture 

of the Weehunt home for this 
week. but construction was 
not far enough along on the 
Tommy Clark home to take a 
picture. 

Also I understand that 
Johnny Watson is in the 
process of building Kay a 
new home out on the Duster 
road. That is he hopes to get 
it built if he can get the road 
finished to the building site. 1 
think Kay is getting anxious 
Johnny, so you had better 
get on the ball or else you 
will come out like Tommy did 
with all those knots on the 
head. 

City Commission will meet 
Thurdsay March 18 at 8:00 
a.m. at City Hall. 

Gorman Schools will dismiss 
classes Friday at 2:30 p.m. 
for Spring Holidays. Classes 
will resume on March 22. 

LOOK WHO'S NEW 
IT'S A BOY 

Jerry and Cindy Yates 
wish to announced the arrival 
of their new son Jarrod Lynn, 
horn March 7, 1982 at 10:55 

in Blackwell Hospital. 
He weighed 6 pound and was 

inches long. 
He is joined by a brother 

Brandon age 81/2 . and a 

sister. Whitney age 5. 
— GP— 

SENIOR CLASS PLAYS 
SET FOR FRIDAY MARCH 
12 AT 7:00 P.M. 

Gorman High School Sen-
ior Class will present two 
Plays entitled. "Hillbilly 
High Jinks" and "Four Little 
Words" in the Gorman High 
School Auditorium on Fri-
day. March 12 at 7:00 P.M. 

1dmission will be $1.00 
per person. kindergarten 
through adult. Everyone is 
invited to attend. 

— GP— 

THREE CANDIDATES 
WITHDRAW FROM CITY 
RACE 

Filing late Wednesday 
night as candidates for the 
City Commission were W. C. 
"Check" Smith for the po-
sition of Mayor, Jack Harri-
son for Place Four on the 
Commission and Ben 	R. 
Townley for Place Two on the 
Commission. 

All three men have with• 
drawn their names from the 
ballot in the April 3 election. 

The men gave personal 
reasons for with drawing as 
candidates. 

Unopposed in the election 
will be Mayor, Charlie Gar-

rett; A. E. (Arlton) Smith, 
Place Two and Jimmy Mor-
ris, Place Four on the City 
Commission. 

—GP— 
LOOK WHO'S NEW 

IT'S A BOY 
Mr. and Mrs. Don Curb 

happily announce the arrival 
of their son. William Nolan, 
born at 8:00 p.m. February 
24. 1982 in Blackwell Hospi-
tal. He weighed 8 pounds 
and 5 ounces. He was wel-
comed by his sister. Brenda 
Kay Morris and maternal 
grandparents. Mr. and Mrs. 
Ed Burton of Whiteface and 
paternal grandmother, Mrs. 
Annie Curb of Comanche and 
paternal great-grandfather. 
M. H. Curb of Comanche. 

—GP— 
Mr. and Mrs. James 

Miears spent the weekend in 
Conroe with Mr. and Mrs. 
Ray Williams. 

RECIPES NEEDED 
Remember to turn In your 

recelpes to Frances Warren 
or to the Progress Office by 
April 6 for the PTO Cook-
book. 

Gorman Chapter 443 
O. E.S. meets the 1st 
Monday each month 

at 7:30 P.M. 

—J— 
The oil activity continues 

in the surrounding area but 
is not as active now as it was 
prior to the first of the year. 

—J— 
And remember to smile - -

because God Loves You! 
— GP— 

Gorman Students and 
Teachers will have a holliday 
from school and classes from 
March 15 through March 19. 
This is the annual Spring 
Break. 

Honorable Joe C. Hanna, 
State Representative will be 
guest speaker at the Cham-
ber of Commerce Banquet on 
Thursday March 17. 

Mr. Hanna has been a 
frequent guest at the ban-
quets for many years, and it 
is an honor to have him as 
speaker for the 17th annual 
banquet to be held Thursday 
March 11, in the High School 
Gym at 7:30 p.m. Tickets are 
$3.50 per person. 

THE Outstanding farmer 
for 1981 and the Commuity 
Service Award will be pre- 
sented. 

Entertainment were be the 
Sandy Land Band with Rolad 
Smith. The public is invited. 

State Representative Joe 
C. Hanna was born in 
Lawton, Oklahoma but has 
lived all of this life in Texas. 
Mr. Hanna lives in Brecken-
ridge in Stephens County, 
which is one of the five 
counties reprsented in the 
area which make up the 54th 
District. Other counties re-
presented by Mr. Hanna are 
Eastland, Palo Pinto, Jack 
and Montague. Mr. Hanna is 
serving his sixth term as a 
State Representative. 

NEW HOME — Shown above is the new home of the Ronnie 
Weehunts in the Leon-Oliver Springs area. It is located on the 
Miears estate and is the completion stage. 

Woman's Auxiliary of Black-
well Hospital meets first 
Tuesday of each month at the 
Senior Citizens Center at 
3:00 P.M. 

He is presently 
employed by the City 
of 	Rising 	Star. 

The couple plan to be 
wed at tile FirFit Bap-
tist Church on April 
17th in Rising Star. 

press our appreciation to our 
friends for all the acts of 
kindness and concern shown 
us in out time of sorrow. To 
the City and Eastland Co. 
Law Enforcement personal 
who took time to assist with 
the service and give encour-
agement to a fellow officer 
we. are eternally grateful. 
The food, flowers, visits, and 
words of comfort will never 
be forgotten. May God bless 
each of you. as he has us with 
friends who are priceless. 

Mr. and Mrs. Albert White 
and the family of 

Mrs. Arabellah White Wolfe. 
—GP— 

Ray Darnell 
?can Gray 

Announces 
Ligugernent 
Dr. and Mrs. Jim 

Gray, of the Okra Com-
munity announce the 
engagement of their 
daughter, Elizabeth 
Jean, to Mr. Ray 
Darnell, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Raleigh Darnell, 
of Rising Star, Texas. 

Miss Gray is a 1980 
graduate of Hardin-
Simmons University 
with a B.B.A. degree in 
Accounting. She is 
presenti employed as 
City Accountant for 
Cisco. 

Mr. Darnell is a 1981 
graduate of San Angelo 
State University with a 
B.A. degree in History. Representative Hanna 
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BOOTS 
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NEW SHIPMENT M EN'S SH 0 RT SLEEVE 

WESTERN SHIRTS 
BY RUDDOCK 
P A STELS & WHITE 

closed each Monday 

BIG J's BOOTS 
(DOWNTOWN1 GORMAN, TEXAS 

OPEN 9:00 A. M. TO 5:00 P., 

Phone 134-2840 	Jolene Gilliland, Owner 

MATTRESSES 
• New and Renovate 
• Clwice of ticking 
• Choice of firmness 
111 New innerspring unit 
■ New mattress guarantee 

Western Mattress Co. 
1507 Austin Ave. 

BROWN WOOD. TEXAS 
Gorman Call Collect 

915-646-8944 
7-23-fnc. 

$5.00 for each 	Anti•Soil 
Randall Rogers 

Office 	 Home 
h29-1121 	647-121' 
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lorl1WpAnHo -Wami. 

Gorman Blackwell Hospital 
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DUBLIN ZERO LOCKER 
Dublin, Tens 16444 

Phone 811-4454424 

Custom Slaughter And 
Processing 

CHOICE FED BEEF 
FOR SALE 

WHOLE - HALM - QUARTERS 

Jury Westasondand, Masepr 

Stephen's 
Studio 
DIRECT COLOR 

PORTRAITS 
PHOTOGRAPHY WORK 

Open Tuesday through 
Sarurday 

105 S. Patrick 	445-3765 

DR. 
CLAY 

SALYER 
Chi ropChiropractor 
445-2205 

200 E. Blackjack 
Dublin, Texas 
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REYNOLDS MANUFACTURING CO 
Customer Service Division 

• Siding 
• Storm Windows 
• Replacement 

Windows 
• Patio Storm Doors 

THE ENERGY SAVING 
GLASS FOR YOUR HOME FREE ESTIMATES 

105 E 8th - Cisco 

442-1380 
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SUNGLAS .  • • • 

RABIES VACCINATIONS 
TO BE GIVEN MARCH 13 

Larry Damron, D.V.M. 
from Stephenville will be at 
Gorman Milling Company, 
Saturday March 13 from 1:00 
to 3:00 p.m. Rabies vac-
cinations for small animals 
(dogs and cats) will be avail-
able for $5.00 per animal. 
Distemper shots will 	be 
available. 

Dogs are the principal 
spreaders of rabies, or by-
dropholia. Outbreaks occure 
among skunks, coyotes, 
foxes and other animals that 
attack livestock and fouls. All 
warm blooded animals are 
suscetible. 

The infection is cause by a 
filtrable virus that attacks the 
nervous system. It is trans-
mitted in the saliva of a 
diseased animal that bites its 
victims. Upon entering the 
blood stream, the virus in-
fects the nerves, follows their 

finally involves the brain. 
course to the spinal cord, an 

From 15 to 45 percent of the 
bites of rabid animals result 
in death to the victim. 

Please have your dogs and 
cats vaccinated and help 
prevent this disease in our 
community. 

GORMAN PROGRESS, MARCH 11, 1982 FFA ATTENDS! 
SWEETWATER 
HAMPSHIRE TYPE 
CONFERENCE 

On Wednesday February 
24. Bo Caraway, Bill Gres-
sette Dane Gressett, Scotty 
Mauney and Phil Osborne 
went to the 	Sweetwater 
Hampshire Type Confer-
ence. 

The Chapter purchased a 
good young boar. Dane Gres-
sett, Scotty Mauney and Phil 
Osborne also participated in 
the judging Contest 	and 
placed 5th out of 60 partici-
pating teams. Dane Gressett 
was 7th highest individual 
out of some 300 participants. 

Nancy. 
Bobbie Brown, 	Anna 

Laura Clearman, Zelda Jor-
dan and Berneice Rodgers 
will serve as the Program 
and History Committee. 

Others present for the 
meeting were J. C. Clear-
man, D. F. Eaves, Glenn 
Jordan, Jerry Gibbs, Lyndon 
Lasater and Ava Rodgers. 

So. Mark Your Calendars 
for May 8, then bring a 
basket lunch and enjoy the 
day visitng with friends. 
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IC On WOO NEWS 
By Zelda Jordan 

BULLDOZER WORK 
Specializing in irrigation 

ponds, and brush work. Also 
elevated scraping. Gary Wil-
son Construction, De Leon. 
893-6558. 	11-12-FNC. 

FOR SALE: Square bales 
Costal Hay in barn, $2.00 
bale. Stan Clark, 734-2598. 

4-5-1 C. 

FOR SALE: 10 acres, all 
costal, excellent well, city 
water, extra nice 16 foot wide 
energy efficient mobile hone, 
A/H, 2 full baths, nice 2 car 
garage, electronic opener, 
lots pecans and fruit trees. 
An extra clean cetup. Cob-
burn Realty, 893-6666, De 
Leon. 	 fnc. 

ab. minwomm_ 

WANTED: Would like to 
keep children in my home, 
Monday thru Friday. Shirley 
Casey, 734-2843. 	2.4-18 C. 

FOR SALE: 1972 Nova, 4 
door, clean, power and air. 
Call 734-2517. 	1-4-11 P. 

FOR SALE: Four year old 
AQHA registered quarter 
horse mare $1,000 or best 
offer. Contact Jess Hallmark, 
734-2751. 	2-18-FNC. 

FOR SALE BY OWNER: 2 
story, 3 bedroom, 11/2  bath, 
approximately 1780 Sq. Ft. 
garage, on six lots, pecan 
trees, excellent location, 
close to school and hospital. 
Weekdays call 734-2241 or 
nights and weekends call 
734-2997. Joe Baze, shown 
by appointment only. 2-3-18p 

FOR SALE: Frigidair micro-
wave like new, $200.00, 
Call Kenneth Good at 734- 
2620. 	 1.4-11 C. 

A little sleet fell here on 
Friday. but it was not as 
heavy as it was down toward 
Gorman. It is back to spring-
time weahter now - cool in 
the mornings, warming up in 
the afternoons. 

!ma Boles of Clyde, Mrs. 
Jimmy Nelson, Tena. Travis 
and Teresa of Lewisville, 
Kelly and Yancy Buchanan of 
Clyde, Mr. and Mrs. H. L. 
Smith of Eastland and Don 
Smith of De Soto, Sammy 
Bell and June and Matt 
Hawkins were visitors at the 

FOR SALE: Costal Sprigs. 
Willie Cantwell, 817-647-
1962 or Marvin Jones 817- 
445-3501. 	8.5-29 P. 

Kokomo Baptist Church on 
Sunday morning. 

There will be a revival at 
the Kokomo Baptist Church 
March 21-28. Bro. Charles 
Davenport of Tulia will be 
the evangelist. 

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Hen-
dricks visited in Clyde on 
Friday evening with Mr. and 
Mrs. Roy Buchanan, Kelly 
and Yancy and the boys came 
home with them for a visit 
until Monday night. The 
Hendrick's met the Buch-
anans in Cisco on Monday 
night for Kelly and Yancy to 
return home. 

Deliah Eaves returned to 
Midland on Sunday after a 
weeks visit with her parents. 

The fig tree belongs to 
a family that produces la-
tex and yields rubber. Break 
a twig off a fig tree and 
a white liquid will ap-
pear - rubber in the raw. 

Mr. and Mrs. D. F. Eaves. 
Mr. and Mrs. Mark Eaves of 
Midland were also recent 
visitors with Mr. and Mrs. D. 
F. Eaves, and her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. James Ruther-
ford in Rising Star. 

Mrs. Dora Garrett spent 
last week in San Angelo with 
Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Hallmark 
and family. Mrs. Hallmark, 
Amy, Becky, Wayne and 
LeeVi brought her home on 
Sunday and also visited with 
Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Little 
and the Frank Hallmarks in 
Eastland. 

Bro. and Mrs. Jimmy Nel-
son and family of Lewisville 
visited during the weekend 
with Mr. and Mrs. Clifford 
Nelson. Jimmy preached in 
Coleman on Sunday morn-
ing. They also visited with 
Mrs. 011ie Nelson and Mr. 
Jim Jordan at the Gorman 
Care Center. 

Mrs. D. F. Eaves, Mrs. 
Glenn Jordan, Mrs. June 
Hawkins and Matt were in 
Abilene on Monday. Glenda 
Miles met them for lunch. 

Bobbie Brown, 	Anna 
Laura Clearman, Bernice 
Rodgers, Corby Rodgers, 
Zelda Jordan, Letha Rogers 
and D. B. Crawley were 
visiting with Lum and Sarah 
Tuggle on Tuesday after-
noon. 

FOR SALE: Railroad cross 
ties, ideal for landscaping, 
57.00 each. Contact Tommie 
Guthery at Texas Central 
Railroad Company at 734- 
2278. 	 4-4-1 C. 

FOR SALE: Wife's car -
1977 Cadillac ElDorado Biar-
ritz. One owner, 35,000 miles 
- all Cadiallac extras. Real 
leather interior, new Miche-
lin Radial tires. Fire Mist 
Oranger. $7,000 - firm. Dr. 
Clay Salyer, Dublin, Texas, 
445-3317 or 445-3792. fnc. 

FOR SALE: Nice 3 bedroom 
brick home, 11/2  baths, 
carpeted, dishwasher, 
covered patio, 1 car garage 8 
years old. On nice lot with 
fruit trees. Close to school. 
Shown by appointment only. 
Call 734-2117. 2-4-FNr 

FOR SALE: 1977 Chevrolet 
Luv pickup. Good condition, 
good tires, air conditioner, 
Call 893-5831, De Leon. lip. 

FOR SALE: To be moved 15 
x 40 ft. wood frame building, 
fully insulated and sheet 
rocked. Plummed for bath, 
wired for electricty, ceiling 
fan. $10,000.00 Call John 
Miears. 893-2385 or 893- 
2907. 	 3-11 FNC. 

FLOWER BULBS - Fancy 
leaf Caladium, large Cannas, 
Elephant Ears, Gladiolus and 
Dinner Pate Dahlias. Avail- 
able at Ronald's 	Variety 
Store, De Leon. 5-3-11 C. 

FOR SALE: Blue Healer and 
Black Healer pups, and 
started pups. Wormed and 
shots. W. F. Duske, 734-2111 
in Gorman. 	52-2-12-83 P 

FOR SALE: 1979 - 245 Mas-
sey Furgeson Tractor with 
hydraulics. 500 hours of use. 
Also used 336 John Deere 
baler. Call 445-3955. 2-25fnc 

25% OFF 
ALL FABRIC & NOTIONS 

House of Joy Sewing Center 
Gorman. Texas 

734-2121 
2-25 FNC. 

WANTED: Experienced bur-
lap bagger, sewer, and fork 
lift operator. Inquire bet-
ween 7:00 a.m. and 3:30 
p.m. at 817-893-2034. Equal 
opportunity Employer. 

2-3-11 C. 

GARDEN CENTER 
OPENING SOON AT 

Ronald's Variety Store 
Shrubs, Rose bushes, Pott-
ing Soil, Planters, Plant 
Food, Trees, Green Plants, 
Hanging Baskets, Bedding 
Plants, Garden Seed, and 
Concrete Statuarys 	(Bird 
Baths, Donkey wlcart, Chic-
kens, Rabbits, Skunks, Patio 
Table w/ benches, and many 
other concrete items for your 
yard)... Many of these items 
are now on Sale at Ronald's 
Variety Store, De Leon. 

5-3-11 C. 

FOR SALE: Nice three bed• 
room house, nice location, 
fully carpeted. completely 
remodeled. Shown by ap-
pointment only, 734-2417. 

4-1-14 FNC. 

NBC 

FM 97 
NEVIS/MUSIC 

RADIO*24 HOURS 

Bob Rodgers and Corby of 
Brownwood spent Sunday 
night with Mrs. Berneice 
Rodgers. Corby remained for 
a visit this week with his 
grandmother. Mrs. Bob Rod-
gers, Kevin and Jason are 
with a church group on a 
skiing trip to New Mexico 
this week. 

FIRST IN TEXAS!! 
GENERIC All-in-The-Ear Hearing Aid. 

Brand Name Equivalent 

FOR SALE: Four piece anti-
que white bedroom suite, 
matress and springs, Mobile 
home steps and other odds 
and ends. Bertha Gregory, 
734-2352. 	1.2-15 C. 

SELECT ART ITEMS -
Featuring Popular Contem-
porary Artists. Choose from 
Western, Country, and Wild-
life Scenes. 

House of Joy 
Downtown Gorman 

734-2121 
2-25 FNC. 

• 

$395.00* 
1 Year Factory Warranty 

Custom Fit and Custom 
Built to your loss! 

COASTAL SPRIGGING 
817.647-1002 

4-5-1 P. 

JOB OPPORTUNITY 
WANTED: A person with 
banking experience (prefer-
ably several years) for ful 
time position. Contact Frit 
Riggs at First National Bank. 
Gorman, Texas, 817-734-
2255 or 734-2254. 2-3-11 C. 

FOR BUILDING AND RE-
MODELING, CONTACT 
SENTRY SERVICE, CALL 
734-2934 or 734-2863 	or 
Ricky Park at 734-2818, 3-4 
FNC. 

PERSONAL- Do you need 
family, sex or love advice? 
Please call FREE 
1-84)0-223-4141. Every week 
day night from 11 p.m. til 2 
a.m.-Sally Jessey Raphael 
or listen on FM 97. T-tnf 

r'n 

FOR SALE: Two bedroom, 
one bath on 3'/2 lots, fenced 
fruit and pecan trees. Alton 
Watson. 734-2630. 4-4-1P. 

APRONS FOR SALE 
"Our Style or Yours" 

House of Joy 
Sewing Center 
Gorman, Texas 

734-2121 
2-25 FNC. 

Poll= in mis 

FREE Nearby Test 
! IKE'S PAINT & 

BODY  I 

Carbon 
I 

I 

TUCKER AUCTION CO. 
Monthly Consignment Sales 

ilR5T SAT. OF EACH MONTH 7:00 P. M. 

MERCHANDISE CONSIGNMENTS ACCEPTtD 
Estate, Farm, and 

Liquidation Sales Also Conducted 
FRED TUCKER VIrTIONttR (IX.11113Z-1152) 

PHONE 817-629-1956 
Approximately 1 2 Mile Oft FM1563 

in Flatwoods Community 

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Bennett 
returned home Monday from 
Big Spring where Jim had 
undergone hip surgery in the 
Malone Hogan Hospital. He 
reports he is doing fine and is 
glad to be home. 

DEAN COLLINS 
HONORED ON BIRTHDAY 

Mrs. Dean Collins honored 
Dean with a family birthday 
dinner at their home on 
Sunday, February 28 in cele-
bration of his 74th birthday. 
Those present to enjoy the 
day and wish Dean "Happy 
Birthday" were Charles, 
Caryolyn, Caye, Charla and 
Alan Little, Linda, Larry and 
Sheryl Sandlin of Carbon and 
Darlene Gonce of Eastland, 
Jim, Judy, Jerry and Jenni-
fer West of McGregor. 

172 ivliles Nor h of 

on Hwy. 6 

Phone 639-2426 
Free Estimates 
JUT° GLASS INSTALLED AND 

INSURANCE CLAIMS PROMPTLY HANDLED. 

WEDNESDAY, MARCH 17 
9:30 a. m to 1:30 p. m. 

Gorman City H an 
TEXAS STATE HEARING AID CENTER 

The All-In-The Ear Specialists 
4201 A N. 1st. Abilene, Tx. 79603 

915/ 673-4989 
Small extra charge for needed options. 
Standard Hearing Aids Also Available 

The Largest Staff of Licensed 
Consultants in The Big Country 

"Nerve Deafness" CAN be Helped! CD) VISA ammass 

TO SERV/CI 
of the 

GORMAN CHURCH 
OF CHRIST 

ODELL CARTER, Minister 

SCHEDULE OF SERVICES 
BIBLE CLASS     10:00 a.m 
MORNING WORSHIP 	  10:45 a.m 
EVENING WORSHIP 	 6.00 p.m 
THURSDAY LADIES CLASS 	 10:00 a.rr 
WEDNESDAY EVENING 	  7:00 P.N,  

WE WORK ON AMERICAM AND IMPORTED WELCOME 
I 
I a: 

CARS AND TRUCKS 
▪ SO NM S 	NM INN NM NMI MN JI 

FOR SALE: Nice building lot 
in new' sub-division. 71 by 
212 feet, water well and fruit 

= trees. Tommy Clark, 734- 
: 2107. 	 8-b FNC. 

The Kokomo-Simpson 
Cemeteyr Association met at 
the Kokomo Community 
Center on March 2 to make 
plans for the annual Home-
coming and Cemetery work-
ing. Bro. Joe O'Neal pre-
sided. The 100th Anniver-
sary of the Simpson Ceme-
tery will be observed this 
year with a special program. 
The Homecoming will be 
held on Saturday, May 8 at 
the Kokomo Community 
Center. Norma Webb and 
Nancy Hendricks will be 
responsible for getting out 
the letters to those, that are 
interested, who live away. If 
anyone knows of someone 
whose name and address 
should be added to the list, 
please contact Norma or 

R&R CARPET CLEANING 
SI9.95 - First Normal Room 

$15.00 - each adtlitional room 
$5.00 each Bath and Hall 
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Can You Afford 
The Damage? 

       

             

No one is ever prepared 
for a tragic fire, but 
you can be financially 
safeguarded. Talk to us! 

           

            

GORMAN INSURANCE 
734 _2312 AGENCY GORMAN 
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J EWELRY 
REPAIR 

STONE SETTING 
ENGRAVING 
PROMPT SERVICE 
We Buy or Take 

In Trade 
Your Old Stones 

CRAIG 
JEWEL RY 

893-2522 De Leon 

I 7.1.W.A.P.A.W.M.W.S.P.1.7.41.9.A.M.M.M.49-4.?"..1.44M, 11 /4  
‘a. 
48 
lb 14. 

14. ‘,. ,.. 
‘4, 

:444: 
‘4. 
14 ‘1/4 
it 
I., 
,4. %Ai 

FIRST UNITED 
METHODIST CHURCH 

Reaching Out,  To You!  
REV. SAM PARTEE, PASTOR 

GORMAN 	 DESDEMONA 
School 9:45 a.m. 

Worship 9:00 a.m. Worship 	10:50 a.m. 
Worship 	5:00 p.m. 	

Every Other Sunday 

.R.1-#.1.1.P.M.P.M.O.P.W.M.M.P.M.W.P.P.P.M.W.MMIP 

NBC 
NEWS/MUSIC 

FM97 
RADIO * 24 HOURS 

4 

WitTirflARIVINDIVO A 

FOR SALE: Large group of pictures 

made by Progress Photographer are 

available at the Progress Office 

for 50t Each. 
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Eastland County art exhibit 
to be held March 18-20 

Everyone is invited to 
show and participate in the 
Eastland County ninth an-
nual Art Association exhibit. 
The exhibit and show will be 

March 18, 19, and 20. 
Mrs. Laverne Allgood will 

be chairman of the show. She 
is a member of the Eastland 
Chamber of Commerce. 

Reagan Brown guest speaker 
for conservation meeting 

Reagan V Brown, Texas 
Commissioner 	of 
Agriculture, will speak at 
the annual meeting of the 
Leon-Bosque Resource Con-
servation and Development 
Area at Lake Proctor on 

March 17, 1982. The public is 
invited to attend. Tickets can 
be purchased at the Soil Con-
servation Service offices in 
Comanche, 	Dublin, 
Eastland, Glen Rose, Meri-
dian, and Stephenville. 

Introducing. . . . . 
RED CHAIN 

SWEET FEED 
9% Crude Protein 

50 LB. BAG $2.65 
GORMAN MILLING CO 

G orman, Texas 

POTATOES 
IDAHO 

RUSSETT 

lbs. $ 1 

SHURFINE 

SUGAR 
Limit 1 W ith $10 Purchase 

5 LB. BAG 1.09 

• # 

PEI 	'RE 
OPEN MONDAY- SATURDAY 	OF DE LEON, TEXAS 
8 AM -IPM SUNDAY 9AM-6PM 	PRICES GOOD WED. thru TUka.. 

BISCUITS 
S SHURFRESH 5 

8 OUNCE CANS 

ROUND 
STEAK 

FULL CUT LB.$1 • 78 
BACON 

SLICED 
SLAB 

POUND $ 1 .29 
ECKRICH 	SMOKED 

SAUSAGE 

GOLD MEDAL 

FLOUR 
5 POUND BAG99` 

ZEE SPILLMATE 

PAPER 
TOWELS 
JUMBO ROLLS 

69` roll 

REG. 0NLYc is fin  
POUND 4r  1.77 

VALUABLE COUPON 

DR. PEPPER 
LITER BOTTLE 99C 

LIMIT 1 WITH THIS COUPON 

DE LEON FOOD FARE ONLY 
EXPIRES M ARCH 16TH 

WavilINST. FAir./7'alit0/9Y. A45, 00 tze 
Awe 	 /-rcaP/4&C,647, 

If you've been sitting on the fence about 
what to do with your money, it may be time 
for some Olney Savings accountabilit 

At Olney Savings, accountability means 

we take care of you and your money. We 
do a good job for you. And we always treat 
you right. 

It's our business to stay on top of all that's 
new and we'll always offer you the best and 
the most of all that's available. 

All we want is the opportunity to serve 
you. And to be held accountable. 

That's our challenge 	and our pleasure. 
Come see us soon. Or call and we'll come 

see you. 'Cause it's still the Olney way to save. 

OLNEY 
SAVINGS 

Olney, Seymour, Jada.boro, Bridgeport, NOCOMI, Weatherfued, Azle, 
Graixen, Archer City, Brownwood, Bowie, Wichita Falls and Vernon. 
Also Electra Savings in Electra, Ranger Savings in Ranger, Eastland 
Savings in Eastland. All Divisions of Olney Savings. 

Paintings will be accepted 
for registration at the First 
United Methodist Church at 
the corner of Mulberry and 
Olive Street, Thursday, 
March 18, at 8;00 a.m. - 4:00 
p.m. A $1.00 registration fee 
will be required for each en-
try. There will be a limit of 
five entries unless otherwise 
approved by show chairman. 

You must check out your 
painting with the committee 
between 4:00 and 5:-00 p.m. 
on Saturday, March 20. Ear-
ly check outs will not be per-
mitted. 

Professional painters or 
any individual who teaches, 
holds 	workshops, 
demonstrates or earns a 
reasonable income from 
sales of paintings. 

An advanced painter is 
any individual who has been 
painting more than 5 years. 

An intermediate painter is 
any individual who has been 
painting for 5 years or less. 

A novice painter is any in-
dividual who has been pain-
ting,2 years. 

All paintings must be dry 
and framed and equipped to 
hang by wire only. No saw-
tooth hangers. 

A qualified judge has beer 
obtained for this Art Show. 

All classifications of pain-
tings should be oil or acrylics 
used as oil, or watercolors, 
or acrylics used as water-
colors, and pastels, 
graphics, painting or glass. 

Awards for the show are 
donated by the Eastland 
Chamber of Commerce. 

There will be eight awards 
given. A $50.00 award will be 
given for the best painting of 
the show. This is given by the 
Eastland National Bank. 

The Texas Electric Ser-
vice Company donated $50.00 
for the First Place. 

Second place award is 
520.00 donated by H&R 
._,umber Company. 
Morren's Gift Shop 

lonated $15.00 which will be 
riven to the third place win-
ier. 

Moylan Construction Com-
pany donated 3 awards. Five 
dollars will be given to the 
first place Elementary win-
ner. Junior High first place 
winner will receive $7.50. 
The High School first place 
winner will receive $12.50. 

Every reasonable care 

School Hill 
News 

By Oma Lee Riddell 

I would like to use the 
space this time to thank each 
peison who helped in any 
way to make easier the 
sickness and death of my 
mother, Ruby Stokes. A 
special thank you to the ones 
who brought food, flowers. 
prayers, kind words and any 
other thing that I may have 
forgotten. God Bless you all. 

will be taken to protect the 
entries; however, no respon-
sibility is assumed by the 
Eastland County Art 
Association, Chamber of 
Commerce, or owners of the 
building for loss or damage 
from any cause. All entrants 
will automatically agree to 
this clause with entry. 

There will be no charge for 
any sales. Percentage gifts 
will be accepted. Artist may 
receive payment for sold 
paintings by presenting 
display card to show chair-
man. 

Money prize awards will 
be presented at 10:00 a.m. on 
Friday, March 19. Winners 
will be contacted to be pre-
sent. 

The .  show will be open to 
the public from 9:00 a.m. to 
5:00 p.m. Friday, March 19. 
On Saturday, March 20, 9:00 
a.m. to 4:00 p.m. 

For further information 
contact: Chamber of Com-
merce 629-2332; Mrs 
Laverne Allgood 629-2551; 
Mrs. Jan Novak 629-1997 
(after 5 p.m.) 

NBC 
NEW_SitAUSIC 

FM 97 
RAM* 24 HOURS 

POLITICAL 
COLUMN 

District offices $50.00 
County offices $50.00 
State offices $50.00 
Justice Precinct $25.00. 
All political adver-

tisements paid for by friends 
of candidates or candidates 
must bear at least one 
signature and address. 

Political advertising 
reflecting adversely upon 
the character of a person 
will be refused. 

Political advertising 
charged for at a rate of $1.20 
per column inch. 

The Progress is authorized 
to make the following 
political announcements, 
subject to action of the 
Democratic Primaries on 
May 1 and June 5, 1982. 

U.S. House of 
Representatives 

17th District 
Charles Stenholm 

91st District Clerk 
Mary Jane Rowch 

Incumbent 
Marciel Greer Justice 

Justice of Precinct 5 
Patsy J. Ingram - Incumbent 
V. 0. (Vardie) Huff 

Comanche County Commis- 
sioner Precinct 4 
David Ethredge 
'Paid Political adv. by can- 
didates listed above) 

BOYD CARPETS 
All Carpet - 10% OFF 

Roll or Cut in Our Roll Ends and Reminants 
25 to 50% OFF 

WE HAVE ANSO II CARP ET 
SALE DAYS MARCH 10-11-11-13 

• 

OPEN ALL DAY SATURDAY 

ONE ROLL OF 

Designer Salarian-S12.95 SO.YD.  
THREE ROLLS Linoleum a20% OFF 

FREE ESTIMATES 

1100 W.Cenfral - 915-356-3813 — Comanche Texas 

Come get some 
Olney Savings Accountability. 



••••••••••-•"•:•••••••••••Wir4r••••••;•••• 	 •-•;•‘•-•.e.•.••••••••••••• 

• 

J&J AIR COND & REF. 

GORMAN PROGRESS, MARCH 1 1 , 1982 "Pacer" 
Bennett Rites 
Held Wed 

Services For 
Arabellah 
Wolfe Held 

EASTLAND COUNTY! 
LIVESTOCK SHOW SET 
FOR MARCH 18.20 

On March 18 thru 20th, the 
annual Eastland County 
Livestock Show will be held. 
There will be about 50 stu-
dents from Gorman showing 
90 hea of sheep. 85 head of 
hogs, 2 beef cattle, 1 dairy 
cattle, 8 pens of broilers, and 
3 rabbits. 

The business firms of Gor-
man have supported the 
youth of our area every year 
which is greatly appreciated. 
Again this year we need the 

Aubrey "Pacer" Bennett, 
68, died at 6:39 a.m. Tuesday 
March, 1982 in HEB Hospital 
in Bedford from a long 
illness. 

Graveside rites were held 
at 3:00 p.m. Wednesday in 
Oaklawn Cemetery. The 
Rev. Darrell Dossey, pastor 
of First Baptist Church offic-
iated. 

"Pacer" was born Decem-
ber 3. 1913 in Gorman and 

prophets message from God 
to the exiles. Don Moorman 
gave lessons from second 
lasia. The closing benedic-
tion was led by Ruby Acrea. 

Refreshments of dessert , 
coffee and tea were served to 
Rose Partee, Helen Chandler 
Theresa Parker, Ruby Vang-
ergriff, June Vermillion, Don 
Moorman, Mozell Rhymes, 
Velma Bennett, Pauline Den-
nis, Lucretia Fairbetter and 
Ruby Acrea. 

The next lesson "A study 
of Isaiah" will be Monday 
March 15 at 2:30 p.m. in the 
home of Mozell Rhymes. 

—GP— 

NEWS 

Arabellah White Wolfe, 79_. 
of Ft. Worth died Sunday in 
the A.M. on February 28th in 
a rest home in Ft. Worth. 

Services were at 10 a.m. 
Tuesday March 2, 1982 at 
Ware, Owens, Brumley Fu- 
neral Chapel with 	Rev. 
Moore officiating. Graveside 
services were at Oaklawn 
Cemetery here with Rev. 
Richard Watson of New 
Hope Baptist Church offic-
iating. Pallbearers were Lane 
Campbell, Larry Campbell, 
Brad Campbell, 	Quintin 
Wright and Charles White all 
of Gorman. 

HOMESTEAD BENEFITS 
AVAILABLE TO THOSE 
OVER 65 

Homeowners who are air 

65 or older and failed to 
recieve their School District 
Homestead Exemption in 
1979 have until April 1, 1982 
to still sign up. In this way, 
Over-65 homeowners will be 
able to take advantage of the 
tax freeze associated with the 
$10,000 Homestead exemp-
tion given by the School 
District of the State. 

According to House Bill 
885 which was passed by the 
Special Session of the 67th 
Legislature, Over-65 home-
owners who Qualified For the 
school homestead "Tax 
Freeze" in 1979, but did not 
apply for the limitation, my 
file an application with the 
Chief Appraiser of the 
County Appraisal District in 
which the home is located. 

This application must be 
made with the Chief Ap- 
praiser of the 	Eastland 
County Appraisal District be-
fore April 1, 1982. 

To qualify for the tax 
limitation, on January 1, 
1979 a homeowner must have 
satisfied these requirements: 

—Be 65 years of age or 
older. 

UMW MEET IN HOME OF 
TOMMYE HAILE 

United Methodist Women 
met in the home of Mrs. 
Tommye Haile Monday Mar. 
8. 

Mrs. Lucretia Fairbetter, 
Bible Study leader gave a 
review of the lesson of First 
Isaiah. She stated "We 
praise God in our hymns 
and to be a servant is to be 
christian." 

Mozell Rhymes gave the 
support of our community to 
help support the youth in the 
show and sale. We would like 
to invite you to attend the 
sale of Champions to be held 
Saturday night at 7:00 P.M. 
This year the sale will be 
held in the new livestock 
Barn recently built at the 
Stock Show grounds. If you 
would like to purchase an 
animal in the sale we invite 
you to attend and do your 
own bidding, if you can not 
attend and would lick to 
purchase an animal, Contact 
Bo Caraway at 734-2505 be-
fore the sale. 

We certainly would ap-
preciate your interest in our 
local youth activities. 

Thank You, 
Bo Caraway 

Mr. and Mrs. L. A. Ben-
nett of Eastland visited Sun-
day with his mother, Mrs. 
Ruby Bennett. Also visiting 
on Monday was another Son, 
•Mr. and Mrs. Bill Bennett of 
Weatherford. 

Jolene Gilliland returned ak 
home Monday from a Ten IW 
Day visit in Springfield, Mis-
souri with her grandson, 
Ronnie Eison, who has ac-
cepted a position as Sales-
man with Larry Mahan Boot 
Company. 

Born January 9, 1903 near 
Meridian, she married 
Thomas Albert White of 
Gorman in 1923, who pre-
ceded her in death on Jan-
uary 29. 1941. Both were 
members of New Hope Bap-
tist Church. 

Survivors Include two sis-
ters. Freda Reede of Buncan, 
Okla. and Martha Wright of 
Ft.Worth. one brother Henry 
Campbell of Ft.Worth. Seven 
children. Albert White of 
Gorman, Jack and Ralph 
White of Ft. Worth, Charles 
White of Quinlin. Louise 
Husketh of Garland, Ann 
Stephens of Ft.Worth, Dor-
othy Smith of Hurst. Six step 
children, 37 grand children, 
44 great grand children, and 
7 great-great grand children. 
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—Own his or her home. 
—Use that home as his or 

her Principle Residence. 
The Chief Appraiser will 

consider all applications and 
notify each applicant before 
April 15, 1982. If the ap-
plication is approved, the 
Chief Appraiser will make an 
entry on the appropriate 
school district's 1982 apprai-
sal records. 

This entry will indicate the 
amount of tax the Over-65 
taxpayer should have paid in 
1979. had he been granted 
the $5,000 general home-
stead exemption and the 
510,000 for 1979, 1980, or 
1981. 

For 1982, the taxpayer's 
amount of homestead taxes 
paid may not exceed the 
amount of taxes the school 
district would have imposed 
on the homestead for 1979, 
had the taxpayer been grant-
ed his homestead exemp-
tions. This frozen tax amount 
will remain in effect as long 
as the homestead remains 
the same. 

For information and appli-
cation forms, you may con-
tact the Eastland County Ap-
praisal District office located 
on the second floor of the 
Eastland County 	Court- 
house. The mailing address 
is P. O. Box 914, Eastland. 
Texas 76448 and the tele-
phone number to call is 
629-8597. 

U.I.L. PRACTICE 
MEET RESULTS 

The Members of the 
Gorman Literary Club and 
their coaches, Mrs. Linda 
Glover, Mrs. Rowena Wilson 
and Mr. Charles Jordan atte-
nded U.I.L. practice meets: 
Febuary 21 at Early, Febuary 
27 at Glen Rose, and March 2 
at Comanche. These are the 
practice competition before 
the District. Regional, and 
State competitions. 

UIL Literary event are 
open to all students in high 
school. Students begin pre-
paring for these contests 
early in the school year and 
are coached in the art of 
delivery in speaking events, 
style in writing events, and 
fluency, speed. and correct-
ness in business skills. These 
academic skills are required 
daily. These young men and 
women are to be commended 
for their effort and recog-
nized for their achievements 
in representing their school 
and community through fair 
academic competition. 
EARLY 
Typing: 

Toby Cordell, 1st. 
Feature Writing: 
Tracy Dossey, 1st. 

Headline Writing: 
Tracy Dossey, 3rd. 
Toby Cordell 6th 

Newswriting: 
Toby Cordell, 6th. 

Shorthand: 
Kayla Odell. 1st. 

GLEN ROSE 
Editorial Writing: 
John Brinegar 3rd. 

had lived here all his life with 
the exception of the time he 
served in the Raiders Sth 
Division of the Marines dur-
ing World War II. He was a 
retired farmer. 

Suriviors are his wife, Opal 
of Gorman; two step sons, 
Phillip Eugene Golob of Gor-
man; and Frank Robert 
Golob of British Columbia; 
His mother, Mrs. Mennieola 
Bennett of Gorman; a sister 
Vern Elliff of Waco; 9 step-
grand children; 7 step great 
grandchildren. 

Pallbearers were: Jackie 
Don Simpson, Dean Bennett, 
Gene Ellison, Jerry Mehaf-
fey. Bud Short and Lowell 
Rawls. 

Toby Cordell 4th. 
Headlene Writing: 
Tracy Dossev, 3rd. 
Toby Cordell, 6th. 

Informative Speaking: 
John Brinegar, 3rd. 

Persuasive Speaking: 
Alfie Pino, 2nd. 

COMANCHE 
Informative speaking: 
John Brinegar, 3rd. 

Persuasive Speaking: 
Alfie Pino, 3rd. 

Feature Writing: 
Tracy Dossey, 6th. 

Headline Writing: 
Toby Cordell. 3rd. 
Tracy Dossey, Sth. 

Editorial Writing: 
Toby Cordell, 6th. 

Shorthand: 
Kayla Odell, 1st 
Bill Townley 5th 

Typing: 
Toby Cordell, 2nd. 
Veronica Kight, 6th. 
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FARM EQUIPMENT 

AUCTIO N 
SAT., MARCH 13 1;.°:. 
4 MILES EAST OF MORGAN MILL, TEXAS 
ON FM1188. 

Selling 
TRACTORS: J. D. 3010, 3020, 4010, 
4020, 4430; Ford 3000, 5000, 8700, 
9700; M. F. 35, 85, 1085, 1100, 1150; 
I.H. M, 460, TD9 Dozer and others. 

EQUIPMENT: 

Planters, Cultivators, Grain Drills, 
Moldboards, Tandem Disc, Offsets, 
Chisels, Ox Plows, Peanut Trailers, 
Irrigation Pipe, Wheel Moves, Peanut 
Combines, Balers, Cutters, Cattle 
Trailers, Pickups, Welders and Much, 
Much More. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CALL 

JAKIE LAUGHLIN 
817-968-4982 or 4963 
LICENSE It TXS102-1265 

FHA & Bank Selling Their Repossessed 
Equipment in this Sale. 

—GP — 
Cut flowers last longer 
if the leaves below 
water level are removed. 

• Vie‘•••••••••••••.•••••!•.........tet.0.1/46„•All•••.•41:•••%.•:•:•.*44•444•MINI.•••,•.•.•.•.• 

GIGANTIC 

ASSORTED PKG. 
5 for 

'3.00 

IrSummer's coming 
So's WIT weather! 

Cool the 
energy crunch 

with 

The General Electric Executive 
central air conditioner costs less to 
use than older and less efficient air 
conditioners. 

The secrets in the extra-large coil: it makes the high 
efficiency GE compressor even more efficient. And. 
lets face it, energy savings can mean big money 
savings these days. You can keep your cool and 
save on energy. 

Start your energy savings program now. 

The time to start is now, before summer's heat gets to you .. 
and to your budget. Then you can enjoy energy-saving 
efficiency for years to come. 

SEE A MEMBER OF THE 
LIONS CLUB 

OR 
SEE AN ASSORTMENT AT 

East End Co-Op 
Gorman Pharmacy 

Lasater's Disc. Store 
We bring good things to life. 

GENERAL Jr4 ELECTRIC 

• eii••••••••••-•Y 	 -c.- -- 	eve:: 	• Q.." • 

Gorman 
••••••••••••••••••••••••••••!* • • .•••••••••••••••••„4.,e.te. dmo. mfr. ••44,4,4••••••••• 

J&J AIR CONDITIONING 
HEATING & 

REFRIGERATION 
629-2251 	 EASTLAND id 

• Aire • .1••••• 111 	  
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TOUCH 
THE TEXTURE 

FEEL 
THE FASHION 

SAMPLE 
THE SELECTION 

LASATER'S 

lovingly detailed detailed 

NATURAL LEATHER 

$41.95 

D 

DEPARTMENT STORE 
GORMAN, TEXAS 

inaMIS  

HOT KNOTTING 
BLACK AND WHITE 

$32.95 

BERIBBONED BEAUTY 
KAHKI AND PLUM 

$3 4.9 5 

4 

 SITE SUE 
WALLET 

CREATIVE 
COLOR 

PORTRAITS 
FOR ONLY 

G 

• 

GI I Pt Nil% KAN N WAWA. 

MENA DAD WE SD Ili NI 

'Intl cols Al IgtI Lill 101 MIL. 
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13MST! 
All Ceiling Fans 
10% Off 
Be ready for the hot days of summer with this 
great reduction on all fans in stock. 

• 

BEDDING REDUCED 
Save $50 to $100 

ON MATTRESS & 
BOX SPRING SETS. 

A LL SIZES 

Get Ready for Spring 
It's fix-up, clean-up time and what better time to buy 
a ne‘‘ ladder. Choose from wood or aluminum 
styles. 

New from Homelite 

14 XL CHOWIELITE 
XL Chain Saw with 14" bar and chain 

115.95 

$10.00 Off One Week Only 
Save $10 on any push mower now in stock andbe 
ready for spring. 

H IG,104ars or !?!!!Am.' 
134-2221 - 	GORMAN 
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SENIOR CITIZENS NEWS 
"Memories" 

Hi! On this cool Saturday 
morning. My what a variety 
of weather we had yesterday 
evening. Thunder, lightning, 
wind, hail, sleet, snow and 
rain. Tho we did not need 
this 25 degree weather as it 
put a lot of fruit in deep 
freeze. We could use a lot of 
wet moisture. 

When we lived on place 
near Staff, the farm I bought 

HOSPITAL 
REPORT 

walking from Eastland and 
just north of Flatwood, Dr. 
Johnson stopped and carried 
me on home about 10 miles 
out of his way. He told me he 
admired me serving our 
country. He said I knew and 

December 1918. I was com-
ing hcme to Grandmother 
Scott's funeral. I told them if 
I could come I would be there 
at 11 a.m. on day of funeral. 
Tho heavy snow delayed me 
12 hours or more. I was 

from Scott heirs in 1921 two 
of Dads cousins that worked 
in steel mills at Burmingham 
visited us. They wanted to 
take dog and go hunting. The 
dog jumped a jack rabbit. 
One said it was a deer. Dad 
told him it was a mule eared 
jack rabbit. They had ears 
like a mule. They treed a 
squirrel and one wanted to 
catch it bare handed. 
Could not talk him out of it. It 
was a draw. The thing chew- 

Gorman 
Gorman 
Gorman 
Gorman 
De Leon Patients fisted in Blackwell 

Hospital on Wednesday 
March 10 were: 
Estella Baker 	Gorman 
J. D. Rodgers 	Gorman 
Willie Barrett 	Gorman 
Faye Marshall 	Gorman 
E. H. Cook 	Got-man 
Elizabeth Williams Gorman 
Gladys Cooper Westworth 
Gladys Lucke 	Gorman 
Ellen Mayes 	Rising Star 
Daniel Boatwright Gorman 
Barbara Ballew 	Eastland 
Wanda Ward Stephenville 
Charley Ward Stephenville 
Cindy Yates 
boy Yates 
Leona Flippin 
Kay Watson 
Prudie Britain 
U. Z. Aaron 
David Larkin 
Landon Lee 

Emmett Lasater 	Gorman 
Jennifer Rice 	Rising Star 

Dismissed on March 5: 
Ozella Pulley 
Bert Whitt 
Debbie Hogan 
Mary Turner 
Billie Jean Dendy 

Dismissed on March 6: 
Santos Hernandez Gorman 
Margaret Frankin 

Rising Star 
Earlene Smith 	Eastland 
Louise Merrill Desdemona 
Georgia Miller Rising Star 
Vernon Snodgrass 

Rising Star 
Dismissed on March 7: 

Annie Haile 	Gorman 
Veno Haile 	Gorman 
Deliah Wright 	Gorman 
Donnie Frasier 	Gorman 
Mary Sutton 	Gorman 

Dismissed on March 8: 
Alma Davis 	Rising Star 
Sarah Mize 	De Leon 
Eula Robbins 	Gorman 

and baby 
Gorman 

Rising Star 
Gorman 
Eastland 

Rsing Star 
Cross Plains 

Dublin 

Dsimissed on March 9: 
James Lofflin 	Rising Star 
T. E. Vermillion 	Gorman 
Melba Roberts 	Gorman 

Patients dismissed 	on 
March 3: 
Joey McKinzey 	Gorman 
W. F. Duske 	Gorman 

Dismissed March 4: 
Cathy Pippin 	Rising Star 
Katherine Robinson 

Rising Star 

east side. 
Onc time Ben Layton. wife 

and son Marcus visited us 
there. They were from Cal. 
He worked fro Oil Co. lived 
in City. Marcus was dressed 
in fine clothes at all times 
and one day Gail bet Arthur 
that he could hide an egg on 
Mack and it could not be 
found. Arthur felt in pants. 
shirt. etc. shook his head and 
said they were fooling him. 
Mack was all smiles. He said 
"Oh yes there is." So Arthur 
walked up and hit his cap and 
said "There is that egg". 
Marcus yelled -Uncle Loss" 
Dad got the razor strap. They 
waltzed. I was an innocent by 
stander. 

I will say this. Dad never 
whipped me in my life. I 
knew he went meant what he 
said. I never whipped any of 
my children except Elbert, 
one time at school. A boy was 
sore at me and took it out on 
Elbert. He fought back. I was 
out jogging, the other day 
and Dr. Lonnie Lou and his 
boss was jogging. Dr. said 
Bookie went to De Leon to let 
Windy give him the works, a 
Hair Cut, Shampoo and all 
that good smell um on his 
head. Then Bookie began to 
complain as the women 
would come up to him smile 
and almost swoon over him. 
They would run their hands 
over is invisible hair and run 
their hands their perma-
nents. He has about decided 
he is getting too old for such 
foolishment. 

Our deepest 	sympathy 
goes out to the Joe Barron 
family. I played with Joe as a 
child. He lived where Pinky 
Jobe lives. Grandad Scott 
lived where Dallas lives. 

Also I notice where Mrs. 
Stokes died. The mother of 
Mrs. Reddell of School Hill. 
This is something all must 
do. May you look to the 
Keeperof the Books in your 
time of mourning. 

We moved from Flatwoods 
in December 1915 to place 
where Bo Caraway lives. Dad 
lived there while I was in 
Army. In 21 months I came 
home twice. The last time 
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STATEMENT OF 
MONDISCRLMINATION 
Comanche County Tele-

phone Co., Inc. has filed with 
the Federal Government a 
Compliance Assurance in 
which it assures the Rural 
Electrification Administra-
tion that it will comply fully 
with all requirements of Title 
VI of the Civil Rights Ad of 
1964 and the Rules and 
Regulations of the Depart-
ment of Agriculture issued 
thereunder, to the end that 
no person in the United 
States shall, on the ground of 
race, color, or national ori-
gin. be excluded from par-
ticipation in, be denied the 
benefits of, or be otherwise 
subjected to discrimination 
in the conduct of its program 
and the operation of its 
facilities. Under this Assur-
ance, this organization is 
committed not to discrimi-
nate against any person on 
the ground of race, color or 
national origin in its policies 
and practices relating to 
applications for service or 
any other policies and prac-
tices relating to treatment of 
beneficiaries and partici-
pants including rates, con-
ditions and extension of ser-
vice, use of any of its 
facilities, atiendance

ef 	
at and 

„fir 
paccmipatntrt: any meetings 
of AmineficarieS and parti-
cipants or the exercise of any 
rights of such beneficiaries 
and participants in the con-
duct of the operations of this 
organization. 

Any person who believes 
himself, or any specific class 
of individuals, to be sub-
jected by this organization to 
discrimination prohibited by 
Title VI of the Act and the 
Rules and Regulations issued 
thereunder may, by himself 
or a representative, file with 
the Secretary of Agriculture, 
Washington, D.C. 20250, or 
the Rural Electrification Ad-
ministration, Washington, 
D. C. 20250, or this or-
ganization, or all, a written 
complaint. Such complaints 
must be filed not later than 
180 days after the alleged 
discrimination, or by such 
later date to which the Sec-
retary of Agriculture of the 
Rural Electrification Admin-
istration, extends the time 
for filing. Identity of com-
plainants will be kept con-
fidential except to the extent 
necessary to carry out the 
purposes of the Rules and 
Regulations. 

HEARING TESTS 
ARE IMPORTANT 

If you are have a hearing 
problem of any kind you owe 
it to yourself to have an Elec-
tronic Hearing test made to 
find why and what can be 
done to help you before it is 
too late. The tests are free 
and will only take about 20 
minutes of your time. 

We explain in plain En-
glish what can be done to 
help you, then you make your 
decision. We never try to 
high pressure you into buy-
ing anything. There are thou-
sands of people today suffer-
ing from hard of hearing-
ness, (even ,some that wear 
Hearing Aids), just because 
they waite too late to do 
something about it...don't let 
this happen to you. 

Mrs. Joe Treadway will 
hold a regular Hearing Aid 
Workshop at the City Hall in 
Gorman on Monday March 
20 from 1:30 to 3:30 p.m. 
We invite you to come in for 
your free test. We do repair 
service on most makes of 
Aids, and have a full service 
on cleaning, tubes, batteries 
for your Aid, and can always 

$13m you money. We are 
4Licehsed by the State of 

to fit and Dispensing 
Hearing Aids. We are 

ajw,0* close by when you 
need us. We are in the 
Ramilton office every Friday 
torn special tests and assist 
ycit in every way. 

TREADWAY HEARING 
AID SERVICE 
108 South Bell 

HAMILTON, TEXAS 
817-386-5918 
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you know you would not have 
to serve after your operation. 
I told him I got a part that I 
could stand. As there were 
places I could not take. 

THE RAMBLER 
REPORTER 

ed and bit his hand. Tho he 
took other hand and choked it 
Went on and dog treed 
cotton tail. Dad told him it 
would not hurt him. He 
shook his head and said that 
it was too large. so I pulled it 
out. We had a weed dinner-
When the man put iodine on 
his hand he really waltzed. 
They said they could tell 
folks in Alabama about hunt-
ing in wild West Texas. 

In Spring of 1913, I was 
plowing with those 2 and 3 
year old mules with a ham-
mock seat cultivator and a 
neighbor came there and we 
were talking. A whirl wind 
blew his straw hat off and it 
went sailing by. So did the 
mules. I stood up in stirrups 
and the seat came off. I did 
not yell "Elvira, nor get 
up", but saved lines and 
stopped them.Got off and 
drove them back to seat, puit 
it on and was ready to go. 

In those short days in June 
I was laying by Cotton. 
Worked all week until Sat-
urday noon. I felt sorry for 
the mules. I stopped at well 
and put lines down to get a 
drink. They were gone to 
back side of field 1/4  mile and 
back to exact spot I had 
stopped them. A 11/2  mile 
run, on place where Abie 
Duncan lives. I had two more 
runs with them. Tho I came 
out ok. 

Dalton Sellars was about 6 
or 7 he saw the boys tail 
cows. So one day he slipped 
up behind the big mule and 
tailed her. Dad saw it just as 
it happened. Too late. The 
mules feet went on each side 
of his head. What a lucky boy 
that day. 

When we lived at Flat-
woods in 1912-15, we did not 
have any pasture. We would 
cut corn tops and cane for 
stock. We had two jersey 
steer yearlings. So Dad made 
some yokes for them and we 
broke them to work and pull 
a cart. We would haul feed 
and melons with them- They 
made a good team. 

In the Fall of 1913, we 
were picking cotton on west 
side of place and a shower 
came over dumping about 1/2  
inch rain. The Sun did not 
even stop shining. We went 
to the house. Dad wanted to 
know why we quit. So I went 
back and brought the sacks 
back and started picking on 

JOHNNY C. SMITH 
D .D 

GENERAL DENISTRY 
OPEN MONDAY THRU FRIDAY 9 to 5 

FOR APPOINTMENT CALL 893-6032 
706 FANNIN 	 DE LEON, TEXAS . 

PAT MAYNARD 
REAL ESTATE 

1-20 - EASTIA110 - 811-629-8568 

150 Acres, South of Carbon. Good hunting and 
fishing. Older house. $500.00 Per Acre. 

17'/2 Acres near Gorman. Water well, natural gas 
available. 1/4  Minerals. $25,000.00 

10 Acres West of Gorman, Stock Tank plus Co-op 
water. 510,000.00 

147 Acres near Carbon. Approximately 80 acres 
cleared. $500.00 per acre with Terms. 

* 

Russell Cordell 	Pat Maynard 
Associate 	 Broker 

811-134-2690 	 817-619-5u63 
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VALUES 
POTATOES 

1USETT$ 

10 LB. BAG P* 

tY Sn  
OR 

• 

I 	Jo-. • '-' •roi 
AS' 

PORK  & VAN CAMP 1601. CAN 

BEANS 2 FOR 89c ROAST GOOCH 
ARM 

ROAST GOOCH 
CHUCK 

GOOCH'S FRESH 

GROUND BEEF $1.29 
STEAK 22  POU! 119 98 
GOOCH'S 	 12 OZ. PKG. 

FRANKS 99' 
BACON'C' Ropii NiRBSIASTApoRuND 89, 

POL1.55 
P011.45 

POUND 

MARGARINE BLUE BONNET 	
69

c 
QUARTERS 	1 LB. 

DORITO 'S FR ITO LAY
POUND PK6.$ 1.59 

School Supplies 

SHOP ONE STOP 

Grocery & Market 
PHONE 734-2316 —4— GORMAN 

If you use 
Kilowatt Hours 

Per Month) 

Then your 
bill will 

increase about 
500 KWH $ 5.00 
750 KWH S 7.50 

1000 KWH $10.00 
1250 KWH $12.50 

Texas 
Electric 

Service 
Company 

Sizzling 
chicken-tried 
meat strips, 
golden tries, 

Texas toast and 
creamy country 

get 
  g rl ta a"st  aaCl esopprner 

specs
price_ 

WH. KRL. 
or CREAM 

TEXAS RUBY RED 

GRAPEFRUIT EACH  19` 
SOUP CAMPBELL 

CHICKEN NOODLE 	2 mi 69
c 

CALIFORNIA 

STRAWBERRIES 
79` CARTON 

ASSORTED FLAVORS 

JELLO 
3 01. PKG. 

3 FOR 8 9 

2-89' GREEN DEL MONTE 17 OZ. CANS 

IDAHO  YELLOW BEANS  
, ONIONS TOMATOES 4PRic 
Lb. 29' MAYONNAISE 

KRAFT'S 	 limit 1 

2 FOR 89 

320UNCE 

$1 59 • 

C 

GORMAN PEE WEE 
BASKETBALL TEAMS 
WIN CARBON TOURNEY 

Gorman Pee Wee Girls 
and Boys won the Carbon 
Tournament Championship 
Game held Saturday night. 

In the first game on Friday 
Gorman 6th grade girls play-
ed Albany 5th grade girls 
and won 23 to 6. Molly 
Vaughn scored 5 points, 
Cuca Landa scored 10 points. 
Cathy Dixon scored 4 points, 
Kristi Cordell scored 2 points 
and Becky Cordell scored 1 
point. 

In the second game played 
Saturday the Gorman girls, 
6th grade beat the Albany 
6th grade girls 22 to S. Molly 
Vaughn scored 14 points. 
Kristi Cordell 4. Cuca Landa 
2. and Becky Cordell 2. 

CHAMPIONSHIP GAME 
Gorman won the champ-

ionship game with Ranger 22 
to 6. Cuca Landa scored 13 
points. Molly Vaughn scored 
4 points. Cathy Dixon 2, 
Becky Cordell 2, and Kim I. 

PEE WEE BOYS 
WIN CHAMPIONSHIP 
GAME 

Gorman Pee Wee boys 

111.NBC 
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won all three games in the 
Carbon Tournament. 

In games played Friday 
night Gorman 6th graders 
outscored Albany 5th grader 
38 to 0. 

Miguel Pacheco scored 4 
points, Don Rodgers scored 4 
points. Michael Ables 4 point 
Scott Gressett scored 6 point 
Scott Cambell scored 16 po-
ints. Trent Harrison 4 points 
and Jerry Simmons scored " 
points. 

ALBANY GIRLS WINS 
FIRST GAME 

In the Carbon tournament 
Albany 6th grade girls out-
scored Gorman Sth grade 
girls 21 to 8 in the first game. 

Joni Williams scored 4 
points and Amy Scitern scor-
ed 4 points. 

GORMAN GIRLS LOSE 
TO ALBANY 

In the second game of the 
tournament Gorman 5th gra-
ders lost to Albany 5th 
graders 12 to 2. Kim Sharp 
scored 2 points. 

ALBANY BOYS WIN 
SECOND GAME 
Gorman 5th grade boys lost 

to Albany 6th grade boys 26 
to 13. 

Michael Warren scored 5 
points. Keith Wilson. Ron-
son Childers and Manuel 
Rameriz. Troy Timms. Ran-
dy Burns scored 2 points 
each. 

In the second game Gor-
man 6th grade boys out 
scored Albany 6th graders 
23 to 21 Miguel Pacheco 
scored 1 point, Michael Ab-
les 12, Scott Gressett 3 and 
Scott Cambell 8. 

CHAMPIONSHIP GAME 
Gorman 6th graders won 

the Championship game by 
defeating Ranger boys 33 to 
7. 

Miguel Pacheco scored 6 
points, Michael Ables scored 
2 points, Scott Campbell 
scored 2 points. Scott Gres-
sett scored 4 points. Don 
Rodgers scored 6 points, 
Randall Gibbs scored 6 
points. Trent Harrison had 6 
points, Jerry Simmons had 1 
point and Eddie Wood had 2 
points. 

FIFTH GRADE BOYS 
WIN CONSOLATION 

In the Carbon Tournament 
the Gorman 5th grade boys 
won the consolation game 
with Sidney. Gorman scored 
27 points Sidney 18. 

Ronson Childers scored 10 
points. Johnny Osborne 4. 
Michael Warren and Man-
guel Rameriz socred 2 points 
each. 

In the second game the 
Gorman 5th grade boys out-
scored Albany Sth grade 
boys 21 to 18. 

Ronson Childers scored 11 
points. Manuel Rameriz 2, 
Keith Wilson 4, Johnny Os-
borne 1 and Michael Warren 
2 points. 

GORMAN CARE 
CENTER NEWS 

By Jettie Daniels 
We had several at Bingo 

last week and every one 
enjoyed the game very much, 
especially 011ie Nelson as she 
won three games. 

Stella Swanner won Game 
I and Bessie Rhodes No. 2 
011ie Nelson won games 3 
and 4. 

Thanks very much to Vel-
ma Carr and Shelia Perez for 
helping. 

Thanks very much to Rev. 
Marion Dennis for doing our 
Bible Study for us last Wed.  

His message was from the 
14th Chapter of St. John. 
"The Lord Talks To Us." 

Bro. Richard Watson has 
the Bible Study on March 
10th. Every one is welcome 
to attend these services. 

I still have the 24th and 
31st. open for any one who 
wishes to Volunteer, Be glad 
to hear from you. 

This week's schedule is as 
follows- 
MONDAY 8TH 
Exercise-10:a.m. 
Dominoes-3:p.m. 
TUESDAY 9TH 
Bingo-2:p.m. 
Dominoes-3:p.m. 
Musical-7:p.m. to 9:30 p.m. 

WEDNESDAY 10TH 
Exercise-10 a.m. 
Bible Study-2:p.m. 
Dominoes-3:p.m. 

THURSDAY 11TH 
Bible Quiz-10:a.m. 
Dominoes-3:p.m. 
Singing-7:p.m. 

FRIDAY 12TH 
Exercise-10:a.m. 
Checkers-3:p.m. 
Dominoes-3:p.m. 
SATURDAY 13TH 
Checkers-3:p.m. 
SUNDAY 14TH 
Kokomo Baptist — 2:30 p.m. 
Church of Christ-5:p.m. 

Had a nice group at Sing-
ing Thursday and results  

were: We had a good Sing-
ing. Thanks to those who 
came, hope you'll bring some 
one with you. 

Our residents enjoyed visi-
ting with each of you. 

Thanks to the visitors that 
came our way over the week 
end, you made our residents 
week end a much brighter 
one by your visits. Come 
back soon. 
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Basketball News 

TOP QUALITY 
STORM WINDOWS 

60 Cents a Combined Inch 
(Width plus Height) 

Example 2 Feeti by 3 Feet Window 
24 inch by 36 inch equals 60 inches times 60 cents 

Total of 536.00 
(Slide Windows and Color extra 

Installation Available 

JIM W INFREY 	 134-2638 - - GORMAN 

Your electricity 
is costing more in 1982 

mainly because 
the fuel to make it 

is costing more. 
This year, we're paying 

more for fuels we use to make 
your electricity. This is partly 
because another low-cost nat-
ural gas contract has expired. 
But mainly it's because the 
price of all fuels keeps rising. 

We don't make a profit on 
fuel; we charge our customers 
exactly what we have to pay 
for fuel. And we show the 
amount for "fuel" on your bill 
each month. The chart below 
shows an approximate 
increase in your bill this year 
compared to last year as a 
result of increasing fuel costs. 

At Texas Electric, we're 
trying to hold down fuel costs 
by using lignite coal— a 
cheaper fuel. And we're build-
ing a plant to use uranium, 
the lowest priced fuel avail-
able to us. 

You can help hold down 
your bill by conserving at 
home. To learn how, please 
call us. 

D R. ARMSTRONG, Manager, Phone 893.2266 
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