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Farwell High students and 
alumni will celebrate home- 
coming 1980 on September 18 
and 19, with the theme "The 
Old and The New." 

Festivities kickoff with the 
traditional parade beginning at 
7 p.m. Thursday. The parade 
will form at the First Baptist 
Church. The procession will 
travel up Fifth street to 
Avenue C, turning left down 
Third Street with a final left on 
Avenue G, ending at the 
customary bonfire, according 
to Clay Williams, Student 
Council president. Williams 
stated that those participating 
in the parade should meet at 
the church at 6:30 p.m. "Three 
prizes will be awarded to the 
top floats entered," he said. 

Graduates will be welcomed 
to an open house Friday from 
9-11:30 a.m. at the school. "Old 
yearbooks and refreshments 
will be in the library for those 
visiting," Williams said. 

In preparation for the home- 

Second Year In Row - - 

football half-time festivities, 
along with past homecoming 
royalty. 

Before heading to the foot-
ball game, the senior class 
invites everyone to a chili 
supper at the school from 
5-7:30 p.m. Tickets are $3 for 
adults and $2 for ages 12 and 
under. 

A victory dance will top off 
the two-day event in the old 
gym after the football game. 
Sponsored by the senior class, 
the dance is set to begin at 
10:30 p.m. ending at 1 a.m. 

The cheerleaders will sell 
mums throughout the week 
according to Tania Adrian, 
sponsor. Mrs. Adrian also said 
that during this year's home-
coming "All the 'ones' will be 
honored...classes of '41, '51, 
'61, '71, etc." 

All alumni and other inter-
ested persons are urged to 
attend all the homecoming 
festivities. 

coming game against the 
Morton Indians, a pep rally is 
slated for Friday at 2:30 p.m. 
in the gym. Highlighting the 
event will be the crowning of 
the Homecoming King and 
Queen. 

This year's royalty candi-
dates are freshmen, Shelley 
Ford, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Jerry Ford, and Alan 
Eubank, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
J.W. Eubank; Sophomores 
Tammy Obenshain, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Harlin 
Obenshain, and Steve Schilling, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
Schilling; juniors Ginger Elli-
son, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Jerry Ellison, and Waverly 
Coates, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Floyd Coates; seniors Cydney 
Ford, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Doyle Ford, and Chris 
Bristow, son of Rev. and Mrs. 
Dudley Bristow. 

The King and Queen will 
again be honored during the 

Farwell Young Homemakers 

Named Outstanding Chapter 
Ryburn, Coffman Tops - - 

served as voting delegates. 
Two local members were 

also elected as Area I officers 
at the conference. Sharon Tiebreaker Decides 

Contest's First Winner 

Eubanks will serve as Area I 
vice-president in charge of 
programs and Tina Sides as 
Area I secretary/treasurer. 

When Lazbuddie tied Sudan in 
one of the season's first football 
games, a moan could be heard 
throughout the Twin Cities. It 
was then that 180 football 
contest entrants realized they 
had blown their chance for a 
perfect guessing score. 

However, with 10 correct 
choices, Patti Ryburn of Farwell 
is the first weekly winner in the 
22nd annual Tribune sponsored 
Merchant's Football Contest. 

Mrs. Ryburn was one of 12 
entrants choosing 10 correct 
teams. Her tiebreaking tally 
was off by only one point, 
sending her to the weekly top 
spot making her $7.50 richer. 

Second place winner was 
Hobby Coffman of Amarillo. 
Also choosing ten right Coff-
man's tiebreaker differed by 
only 11 points, winning him a 
check for $5. 

The judges narrowed down the 

for the funds to redecorate the 
School's Home Ec Cottage, and 
a Door-to-door American Heart 
Association Campaign. 

This, combined with several 
community projects, such as a 
needy family basket, a foster 
children's party, sending can-
ned goods to the Portales 
Christian Children's Home and 
a donation to Girls Town 
captured the Area I top award 
for the group. 

In addition, out-going presi-
dent Tina Sides was named as 
Area I Young Homemaker of 
the Year. Mrs. Sides was 
selected by the Farwell club as 
their candidate for the title, 
competing with six other Area 
I women. She was chosen on 
her past year's club activities. 

Two other awards were 
nabbed by the local women. 
First place was awarded to 
them for their program exhibit 
on Food Dehydration, compet-
ing with ten other groups. For 
their programs on energy the 
club placed fourth. 

Those attending the annual 
convention were Tina Sides, 
Beverly Foster, Sheree Mont-
gomery, Barbara Knowlton 
and Sharon Eubanks. Mrs. 
Foster and Mrs. Montgomery 

For the second year in a 
row, Farwell's Young Home-
makers came home from the 
Area I Young Homemakers 
convention with top awards. 

the local group was judged 
on their ability to help 
individuals develop personal 
abilities; develop a better 
understanding of the home and 
family members and strength-
ening of bonds between the 
home and the community. 
They returned from the Ama-
rillo meet with the title of Area 
I Outstanding Chapter of the 
Year. Last year the local 
women's group was named 
Outstanding New Chapter. So 
in its two years of existence 
the club has certainly done its 
part to put Farwell on the 
map. 

A synopsis of the year's 
programs, projects and com-
munity services was presented 
to the Area I judges for the 
Oustanding Chapter competi-
tion. The Farwell club had a 
busy past year with programs 
in wheat weaving, family life, 
natural foods and auto repair. 
The many money-making proj-
ects included T-shirt sales 
with profits going to Muscular 
Dystrophy, an FHA Taffy Pull 

possible winners to 12, each of 
whom had 10 correct guesses. So 
in the contest's first week, it 
was the tiebreaker that decided 
the winner. 

Besides Ryburn and Coffman, 
others choosing ten correct 
teams were Mrs. E.A. Key, 
Clovis; Sammy Gonzalez, Jr., 
Muleshoe; Wanda Walker, Rid 
ley Lonsdale, Kevin Owen, 
Harold Carpenter, Bill Craft, 
Janene Berry, Doyle Green and 
Brian Langdon, all of Farwell. 

With 11 weeks left in the 
annual contest, it is still a good 
time to enter and have a chance 
at the big prize of two tickets to 
the Cotton Bowl in Dallas on 
New Year's Day, plus $75 
expense money. The contest's. 
second place winner will enjoy 
two tickets for El Paso's Sun 
Bowl, plus $37.50 in cash. 

To enter, simply circle a 
favorite team on the entry blank 

and then tally a tiebreaking 
score in the indicated box. The 
closest score entered determines 
the winner in the event of a tie, 
but this will not affect the 
weekly win-loss total. 

Contestants must be 12 years 
of age or older and only one 
entry per person will be 
accepted. 

Entry blanks are available at 
the Tribune office, in each issue 
of the Tribune and must be 
returned no later than Friday at 
5 p.m. to the Tribune office. Any 
entries mailed must bear a 
postmark no later than Friday. 

Tabulation of all entries and 
weekly winners are kept an file 
at the Tribune office a— are 
always available for inspection. 

It is most important to get in 
on the contest in the very 
beginning for a chance at the 
top bowl game prizes. 

Open House Set 

By Texico Schools out-going president and was 
chosen for her past year's club 
activities. She is the mother of 
Jim Bob, left, and Jacquelyn, 
and the wife of James Sides. 

Tina Sides was named Area I 
Outstanding Young Homemak-
er of the year at the recent 
Area I Young Homemaker 
convention in Amarillo. Mrs. 
Sides is the Farwell club's 

year's total enrollment. 
James Harding, high school 

principal, was voted as the 
New Mexico Activities Asso-
ciation voting delegate from 
Texico schools. Kenneth Shaw, 
junior high principal, will also 
serve as a Texico voting 
delegate. 

Those attending the board 
meeting were members Ronnie 
Curry, Herman Genies, Greg 
Martin, Mike Spearman, and 
president Arlye Crooks. Also 
present were Jim Pierce, 
Marcia Leaven, James Hard-
ing, Paula Leighton and Ron-
nie Warmuth. 

Couple United By Telephone 

We admit that our columns 
have been politically orientat-
ed lately. So we were not 
entirely surprised at receiving 
a letter the other day that took 
us to task for our animosity to 
Jimmy Carter. The letter 
declared him to be an honest, 
hard working, Christian gentle-
man. 

We agree: Carter, we think 

'

honest, hard working and a 
Christian." We bear no 

animosity to James Earl 
Carter as an individual or as a 
person. However, as a Presi-
dent of the United States 
Jimmy Carter is the political 
pinnacle of the political philos-
ophy that we believe to be 
degrading and stultifying to 
the individual person. It is this, 
the representative of this 

likolitical philosophy that we 
take to task, not the person. 

Our disagreement with the 
philosophy currently entrench-
ed in Washington. D.C., is so 
deep and wide ranging that it 
iS almost impossible to tell of it 
in the limited space of our 
weekly column. Let us give 
you an odious example of the 
strangling tentacles of Big 
Brother in action as he chokes 

tf reedom from the individual. 
Recently the federal govern-

ment set some goals in the 
educational processes of handi-
capped children. One of the 
goals is the toilet training of 
the children. Here is a federal 
mandated goal--"Student will 
stay on pottychair and perform 
needed function at least once 
each day." 

Now try as we might we 
',cannot find a clause in the 

Constitution of the United 
States that says that the 
Federal government shall 
mandate the defecational rou-
tines of the citizenry. 

This, we admit, is a far out 
example, but it brings the 
impact of the government to a 
very personal level. It is this 
desire on the part of those of 
the very "liberal" philosophy 

• with which we take such strong 
exception. 

This year's election will be 
an irretrievable branching of 
the road in our method of 
government. The decision that 
the electorate of this country 
makes this fall will affect not 
only those of us today but it 
will determine under what type 
of political philosophy our 

*children and their children's 
children will live. 

This is not a light decision. It 
is a decision that every 
American should ponder deep-
ly, with soul searching and 
prayer. The question that 
will be answered at the ballot 
box on November 4th will not 
be who is President, Jimmy 
Carter or Ronald Reagan, but 
will be, rather, do we turn 
toward a more self-reliant 

W.form of government or do we 
- continue our drift to a 

state-controlled form of social- 
: ism in which even the bowel 

habits of the people are subject 
to regulation. 

Pondey not the party plat-
forms as such, they are 
window dressing. Think well on 
the philosophy of government 
that has produced these docu- 

• ments. This is what you as a 
citizen -will be voting on in 
November. 

WeJI, the Oilers didn't knock 
the Steelers' door down as 
Bum Phillips prophesied last 
season. At the conclusion of 
last Sunday's mauling of the 
Oilers by the Steelers, Bum 
was asked to comment on the 
game. Replied Bum, "No 

di comment, I don't have my 
losing speech ready." 

(Continued on Page 2) 

and the airman couldn't leave 
school for a wedding, 

Justice Smith saw that as no 
problem and married the two 
by telephone with the bride's 
parents present. This was 
Smith's first proxy marriage 
since taking office in April of 
1979. 

"Texas is one of 14 states 
that recognizes proxy mar-
riages and makes them legal," 
Smith said. 

Justice Smith and Miss 
Pigott used two phones in 
County Judge Porter Roberts' 
office, while the bridegroom 
repeated his vows to Smith 
from Mississippi. 

The couple still plans on a 
church wedding as soon as 
they are reunited, but in the 
meantime, the Air Force will 
acknowledge Miss Pigott as 
the new Mrs. Schaffer and she 
can now join her husband at 
his new duty assignment, 
which is expected to be 
overseas. 

by Mary Sobin 

In this age of "dial-a-every-
thing" from dial-a-prayer, to 
dial-a-hotline and even dial-a-
joke...it should come as no 
surprise that Parmer County 
Justice of the Peace Albert 
Smith recently held a "dial-a-
wedding." 

Well, sort of. Actually the 
legal term is Marriage by 
Proxy, and Justice Smith 
joined two people in marriag" 
simply by dialing direct. 

Joseph M. Schaffer is cur-
rently serving temporary duty 
with the Air Force while 
attending professional school 
in Biloxi, Miss. His now new 
bride, Annette Pigott, lives 
with her Air Force parents at 
Cannon AFB. 

The couple needed to be 
married before Schaffer grad-
uated from Air Force schooling 
so her name could be placed on 
his official orders for his 
permanent duty assignment, 

Band Boosters 

Elect Treasurer 
Farwell Band Boosters held 

their first meeting of the school 
year Wednesday, Sept. 3, and 
elected Tommie Fulcher as the 
new treasurer. 

Martha Curtis, club president, 
said that other items discussed 
at the meeting included the 
annual band birthday calendar 
project as well as a possible trip 
to Mexico for band members. 

Mrs. Curtis also stressed that 
booster members should pay 
their dues as soon as possible. 
Dues are $5 per year. 

Wins 

Contest 

Patti Ryburn of Farwell accepts 
this week's top prize of $7.50 
from Johnnie Rundell of Farwell 
Insurance Agency, a contest 
sponsor. Not only did Patti beat 
out ISO other entries with her 10 
exact guesses and one point 
difference tiebreaker, she also 

out-guessed her husband Mark, 
who only guessed nine teams 
correctly. Coming in second was 
Hobby Coffman of Amarillo. 
nabbing the $5 prize with 10 
correct predictions, and only an 
II-point difference in his tie-
breaker. 

An open house has been 
scheduled by the Texico School 
Board, according to Jim 
Pierce, superintendent. 

Set for Tuesday, at 7 p.m. 
MDT, Pierce advises that the 
entire school facility will be 
open and all teachers will be 
present. 

"All parents, students and 
interested visitors are invited 
to attend," Pierce urged. 
"Those coming will be able to 
learn about all the upcoming 
school programs and have any 
questions concerning student's 
work answered by the teach-
ers," Pierce said. 

In their Tuesday night 
meeting, the board voted to 
buy a Chevrolet pickup and 
automobile for the Vo Ag and 
Driver's Ed departments. 

Mrs. Mary Peyton, business 
teacher, will travel to Santa Fe 
to check into the possiblities 
and advantages of becoming a 
State Vocational Business De-
partment. "This is something 
we would like to consider, 
providing the standards will 
serve as an advantage to our 
students," Pierce stated. 

Board members learned that 
actual enrollment for the 
school system, including kin-
dergarten, is 375. which is up a 
bit from their projected fig-
ures, yet still down from last 
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(Continued from Page 1) 
The Cowboys may not even 

get out of their division this 
year. We were impressed with 
the Philadelphia Eagles as 
they pounced on a supposedly 
good Denver Bronco team. In 
our opinion, at this juncture, 
Danny White is nowhere near 
the QB that the Cowboys need 
to win against a team like 
Philadelphia and Ron Jawor-
ski. 

We still think it's possible for 
Coach Landry to trade Tony 
Dorsett for a good experienced 
quarterback. We think this 
could be a winning stroke for 
Dallas this year. 

Last Rites Thursday 
For Albert Anderson 

600 MAIN, CLOVIS 
Ph. 763-4411 

dirt 	For Service and Repair Call 769-2134 
Willa 	Weekends and Nights 163-4413 

Total Loss 
After being occupied only two 
weeks, the Texico mobile home 
of Ira Selman went up in flames, 
which firefighters say were 
caused by an electrical short. 

In the good of days local 
government used to ask "Do 
we need it? Can we get along 
without it?" but nowadays it's 
"Will the government pay for 
it?" 

The Sunday night blaze left an 
estimated $4,000 damage to the 
trailer as well as $4,000 damage 
to its contents. No one was 
inside at the time the fire broke 

It  RED  SEZ . . . out, and there were no injuries. 
Members of both the Texico and 
the Farwell fire departments 
answered the call and fought the 
blaze. 

It's almost closing time. 

We're getting ready to print your new 
telephone directory. So if you need to 
make any changes in the White or Yellow 
Pages listings, call our business office. 
Well be happy to help and to provide 
information about any charges which 
may be involved. 

But don't wait. Because before you 
knowit, the new directory will be on the 
press. 

And then it will be too late. 

0 
Mountain Bell 

Lazbuddie Home - - 

the U.S. Navy, Mr. Anderson 
had been a ranch hand in the 
Ft. Sumner area after being 
reared there. 

Survivors are his wife, 
Irene; step-son Leo DeAguiar, 
Sonoria, Calif.; step-daughter 
Barbara Jean Pearl, Mt. View, 
Calif.; and three sisters, Eva 
Neuzum, Alma Gingrich, and 
Bonnie Jones, all of Clovis. 

Honorary pallbearers were 
Monte Hamilton, Bob Clark, 
Jack Wilmoth, Jack Turner, 
Walter Julian and Chino Silva. 

Law Officers Arrest Laborer 

Funeral services for Albert 
E. "Humpty" Anderson, 68, 
were conducted at Steed-Todd 
Funeral Home, Thursday, 
Sept. 11, at 2 p.m. MDT, with 
final services at the Ft. 
Sumner Cemetery, in Ft. 
Sumner. 

Mr. Anderson died Monday, 
Sept. 8, in Clovis High Plains 
Hospital. 

Born November 12, 1911 at 
Paducah, Tex., Mr. Anderson 
had lived in Texico ten years 
and was a Baptist. 

A veteran of World War II in 

Texico City Council 
Sets Legal Action 

In their Tuesday night 
meeting, the Texico City 
Council authorized city attor-
ney Harry Patton to begin 
legal procedings agianst form-
er city clerk Clara Wiehl 
Harvey, according to Marie 
Christian, city clerk. Proceed-
ings will take place for the 
balance of missing funds above 
the surety bond, she said: 

In other action the council 
passed a resolution for a 
budget increase to be tal:en 
from unbudgeted funds. 

A resolution of Curry County 
Revenue Bonds was also 
approved by the council. 

Don't worry about avoiding 
temptation. As you grow old-
er, it starts avoiding you, 

Northern New Mex. 

APPLES 
Golden Delicious 

Jonathans 

stolen. 
Bennie Shelby, Bovina, re-

ported that his CB antenna was 
stolen from his pickup. 

Lovelace said Sherley-Ander-
son-Pitman grain elevator in 
-Farwell had been entered, but 
nothing was reported missing. 

The sheriff also said that 
Tony Marroquim, age 21, had 
been arrested in Ft. Worth on 
a Parmer County Warrant. 
Marroquim was serving a 
four-year probation for bur-
glary and was arrested for. 
non-compliance of that pro-
bation. Parmer County depu-
ties will travel to Ft. Worth to 
bring Marroquim back to 
Farwell to face charges of , 
breaking probation, Lovelace ' 
slated. 

PLAVORAMA 
FRUIT 

MARKET 
482-9243 

Tout° 

Niles Fellars, representing 
the Environmental Improve-
ment Division, of the Clovis 
District, expressed apprecia-
tion on behalf of his office for 
the city's removal of old cars. 

It was also reported that the 
Texico-Farwell Lions club will 
donate funds for the purchase 
of trees for KKR Park. 

Those attending the Tuesday 
night meeting were Mayor 
John R. Hadley, trustees Vane 
Dosher, Truman Kittrell, and 
Lewis Cooper. Also present 
were city employees Billy 
Hammit, Marie Christian, and 
Harry Patton. 

Parmer County Sheriff 
Charles Lovelace reports that 
Jose Ruelas, 28, is in county 
custody after being caught in 
the Lazbuddie home of Myrtle 
Steinbock. Ruelas was arrested 
for breaking and entering and 
is being bound over for grand 
jury action. Bond has been set 
at $500. Ruelas was reported to 
have broken the back door 
latch to gain entry to the 
Steinbock residence. "He was 
an alien doing labor work in 
the Lazbuddie area," Lovelace 
stated. 	• 

The sheriff's department is 
investigating several other 
breaking and entering reports 
and several stolen items. 

The Lazbuddie home of Jim 
Everett was forcibly entered 
and he reported a Zenith T.V., 
stereo, speakers and one 
sho,tgun as missing. Everett 
had been away from home two 

days when he returned to find 
the items missing. 

Linda Stanton, Bovina, an e, 
employee at Federal Aviation 
Administration, located nine 
miles S.E. of Bovina, reported 
that an aluminum ladder 
locked to the south side of the 
FAA building had been stolen. 
Thieves cut the chain attaching 
the ladder to the building, to 
remove it. 

Bill Harper of Amarillo 
reported that a submergible 
pump had been stolen from his 
farm, located east of Friona. 

The sheriff's department is 
looking for the thieves of an,, 
evaporative window air condi-
tioner, a shotgun and a set of • 
living room drapes from the :1  
home of Lucas Silva, Bovina. 
Silva was in the process of 
moving from the J.J. Rushing ' 
farm, returning for the final 
load, only to find everything 

PUBLIC NOTICE 
BRIEF EXPLANATORY STATEMENTS 

OF PROPOSED 

CONSTITUTIONAL AMENDMENTS 
GENERAL ELECTION 
NOVEMBER 4, 1980 

AVISO PUBLIC() 
Breves DecIaraciones Explicativas 

De Las 

ENMIENDAS CONATUCIONALES 
PROPUESTAS 

ELECCION GENERAL 
4 DE NOVIE/v1BRE DE 1980 

proval of a budget execu-
tion committee that would 
be composed of the Gov-
ernor, Lieutenant Gover-
nor, Speaker of the House 
of Representatives, Chair-
man and Vice-chairman of 
the Senate Finance Com-
mittee, and Chairman and 
Vice-chairman of the Com-
mittee on Appropriations 
of the House of Repre-
sentatives. 

The proposed amend-
ment will appear on the 
ballot as follows: 
"The 	constitutional 
amendment to grant the 
governor power to exer-
cise fiscal control over 
the expenditure of ap-
propriated funds as pro-
vided by law." 

• 

rensar  ant hems dentro de 
coda ranting& H requisito 
constitutional de cafe la 
torte de comisionados del 
towing° sea la junta tie 
avalifos semi eliminado, y 
a 	los of iciales eleetos del 
condado o de In comision 
directira de la unidad fis-
cal se les probibird  genic 
roma mit Mbras de la junta 
de revision de °miring. 

PROPOSITION NO. 1 
ON THE BALLOT 

Senate Joint Resolution 
35 proposes a constitution-
al amendment that would 
authorize the Legislature 
to permit banks to estab-
lish and operate un-
manned teller machines 
within the county or city 
where the banks are lo-
cated and to share the use 
of teller machines on a 
basis consistent with anti-
trust laws, if it finds such 
operation will serve the 
convenience of the public. 
The Legislature has al-
ready passed enabling leg-
islation ( H.B. 1510) for 
this proposed amendment. 

The proposed amend- 
ment will appear on the 
ballot as follows: 
"The 	constitutional 
amendment permitting 
the legislature to au-
thorize banks to use un-
manned teller machines 
within the county or the 
city of their domicile on 
a shared basis to serve 
the public convenience." 

La enmienda propitesta 
aparecerd en hr boleta 
coma gigue: "La en-
tnienda constitutional 
regalere solamente una 
evaluariOn y ?Ina junta 
pain rerisiOn de availing 
en eada condado para 
detertninar Ins impues-
tns de ad valorem." 

al amendment that would 
change the jurisdiction 
and authority of the 
State's appellate courts. 
The amendment would 
change the name of the 
Courts of Civil Appeals to 
Courts of Appeal and pro-
vide that these courts 
have intermediate appel-
late jurisdiction over both 
criminal and civil cases. 
The amendment would 
change titles for the As-
sociate Justices of the Su-
preme Court to Justices 
and would require mem-
bers of the Supreme 
Court to be attorneys li-
censed in this state while 
holding office. 

The proposed amend-
ment will appear on the 
ballot as follows: 
"The 	constitutional 
amendment to change 
the name of the Courts 
of Civil Appeals and the 
names and qualifica-
tions of the justices of 
the Supreme Court and 
to prescribe the juris-
diction and authority of 
the appellate courts." 

stitutional 	requirement 
that the county commis-
sioners court sit as a 
board of equalization 
would be eliminated, and 
elected officials of the 
county or governing body 
of the taxing unit would 
be prohibited from serv-
ing as members of the 
board of equalization. 

The proposed amend-
ment will appear on the 
ballot as follows: 
"The 	constitutional 
amendment requiring a 
single appraisal and a 
single board of equal-
ization within each 
county for ad valorem 
tax purposes." 

PROPOSITION NO. 6 
ON THE BALLOT 
Senate Joint Resolution 

8 proposes a constitution-
al amendment that would 
allow the Governor who 
appointed a previously 
confirmed official to re-
move that official from 
office subject to the ad-
vice and consent of the 
Senate; and if the Legis-
lature is not in session, to 
call a special session of 
the Senate which may last 
no longer than 2 days for 
consideration of the re-
moval. 

The proposed amend-
ment will appear on the 
ballot as follows: 
"The 	constitutional 
amendment to authorize 
the governor to remove 
appointed officers with 
the advice and consent 
of the senate." 

• 

limitaciones prove] as por 
la ley y sujeto a la apro-
bacion de tan comite dent-
tiro del: presupuesto que 
constard del Gobernador, 
Gober nador 	Teniente, 
Presidente de la Cchnara 
(le Representantes, Presi-
dente y Vice-presidente 
del Cn»rite de Finanzas del 
Senado. y Presidente 
Vice-presidente del Comite 
de Asignaciones Fiscales 
de la Cdmara de Repre-
sentanteR. 

La enmienda propuesta 
aparcerrd rn In boleta 
roma signe: "La en-
mienda constitutional 
concede al Gobernador 
el leader pare eierrer 
control fiscal de las pas-
tas de Ins fondos asig-
»arias scarier la ley." 

PROPOSICION NO. 6 
EN IA BOLETA 

Resolutbrin Conjunta #8 
del Senado propane rum 
enmienda constitutional 
gem permita al Gobernador 
remover n un of ;tint de Ret 
cargo auippre este ham! 
Rhin previnaunte nambra-
do par el Cohn-nadar it 
ennfirmada por rl Senado. 
El remover al of irial serif 
unicaniente halo cl con-
gentinrieato del Srnadn, y 
si In I,egislatura nn esta 
en sesiOn, se eannerard 
Inllr sesiOn extraordinaria 
del Senado, In coal no du-
raid mds de tins dins, ;earn 
consider-0r la elimination 
del 0.6(40 en caRo. 

La enmienda propuesta 
aparererd en In bnIrta 
roma gigue: "La en-
mienda ronstifurional 
natori:a que el Gober-
nador remurra a los oil-
dates nambrados bajo 
conseio 1/ consentimien-
to del Smith)." 

• 

PROPOSICION NO. 1 
EN LA BOLETA 

Resolution Conjunta ±35 
del Senado propane una 

	

enmienda 	constituf'ionrtl 
que autorire a la Legila-
tura perm ifir a los 
establecer y opt rar me-
quinas registration's auto-
?milieus (teller machines.).  
dentro del condado o 
dad en donde estate log.  
bancos compartiendo el us6 
de las mdquinas registra-
doras de aciterdo con las 
leyes antimonapolistas, si 
acaso esta operaciOn re-
suite conreniente para el 
priblico. La Legistaf urn ye) 
aproho In autori:arion de 
esta legislation (H.R. 
1510) para In proposition 
de esta enmienda. 

La enmienda propuesta 
aparecerd en la boleta 
comb sigue: "La en- 

	

Mienda 	constitutional 
permite a la Legislatura 
autothar.que los haneos 
risen nidquinas registra-
darns autonuiticas (tell-
er machines) dente.° del 
condado o ciudad de sit 
domicilio en Ina plan de 
cooperation pare con-
reniencia pfiblica." 

PROPOSICION NO. 2 
EN LA BOLETA 

Resolution Conjunta ;L.:97 
de In Ctimara propane una 
enmienda constitutional 
que conrcda al Estado y al 
acusado el drrecho de min 
apelation interlocatoria en 
los siguientes Milos de in 
torte en causas crimi-
vales: los folios antes del 
juicio sobre la constitu-
cionalidad de una ley: 
sabre la petition pan: anu-
lar, destifuir, o desechar 
mut acusacion; y sabre 
urea petition para suprimir 
la evidencia. 

La enmienda ;manliest(' 
aparecerd en la boleti,' 
conro sigue: "La en-
mienda constitutional 
autoriza la apelarion dr 
ciertos folios antes del 
juicio de ruin cone en 
una cause( criminal por 
el Estado o par el acusa-
do." 

PROPOSITION NO. 4 
ON THE BALLOT 

Senate Joint Resolution 
18 proposes a constitution-
al amendment that would 
allow the Legislature to 
authorize the conduct of 
bingo games by certain 
specified groups for chari-
table purposes, subject to 
the limitations that opera-
tion of the games must be 
approved in local option 
elections and that all pro-
ceeds must be spent in 
Texas. 

The proposed amend-
ment will appear on the 
ballot as follows: 
"The 	constitutional 
amendment to authorize 
bingo games on a local 
option election basis if 
the games are conduct-
ed by a church, syna-
gogue, religious society, 
volunteer fire depart-
ment, nonprofit veterans 
organization, fraternal 
organization, or non-
profit organization sup-
porting medical research 
or treatment programs 
and if the proceeds are 
to be spent in Texas for 
charitable purposes of 
the organizations." 

PROPOSITION NO. 2 
ON THE BALLOT 

House Joint Resolution 
97 proposes a constitution-
al amendment that would 
grant the State and the 
accused the right to an in-
terlocutory appeal from 
the following trial court 
rulings in criminal cases: 
pretrial rulings on the 
constitutionality of a stat-
ute; on a motion to quash, 
dismiss, or set aside an 
indictment; and on a mo-
tion to suppress evidence. 

The proposed amend- 
ment will appear on the 
ballot as follows: 
"The 	constitutional 
amendment authorizing 
appeal of certain pre-
trial rulings of a trial 
court in a criminal case 
by either the state or 
the accused." 

PROPOSITION NO. 3 
ON THE BALLOT 

House Joint Resolution 
98 proposes a constitution-
al amendment that would 
require a 'single appraisal 
of all property subject to 
ad valorem taxation and 
would provide for a single 
board of equalization with-
in each county. The con- 

PROPOSICION NO. 7 
EN LA BOLETA 

Resolution 	Con junta 
=121 de In Carrara pro-
pane una enmienda conga-
turional que autorire a los 
condadas ran una pobla-
don de 5000 o means, que 
constraint?' y mantengan 
raminos imirados cobra,-  
do ra:nnablemente par el 
trabajo. Par ley, la Legis-
Wilma puede limiter ester 
autoridad. Los ingresos 
rcribidnA par Imhof° rn 
et:winos priradas se pew-
den usar Ralamente pan! 
raustrurriOn, para adqui-
siriOn de derecho de paste, 
o para el manterliMiento 
de canines 

La enmienda Imanifesta 
aparecerd en In haleta 
roma sigue: "La en- 
?Hitachi 	constitutional 
aatori:a gut los cumin-
dos eon iota pohlacion 
de 5000 o winos traba-
jen en canines priva-
dos." 

PROPOSITION NO. 7 
ON THE BALLOT 
House Joint Resolution 

121 proposes a constitu-
tional amendment that 
would authorize counties 
with a population of 5000 
or less to construct and 
maintain private roads if 
they impose a reasonable 
charge for the work. The 
Legislature by general 
law may limit this au-
thority. Revenue received 
front private road work 
may be used only for the 
construction, 	including 
right-of-way acquisition, 
or maintenance of public 
roads. 

The proposed amend-
ment will appear on the 
ballot as follows: 
"The 	constitutional 
amendment authorizing 
counties with a popula-
tion of 5000 or less to 
perform private road 
work," 

PROPOSITION NO. 5 
ON THE BALLOT 

House Joint Resolution 
86 proposes a constitution-
al amendment that would 
allow the Legislature to 
authorize the Governor to 
exercise fiscal control over 
the expenditure of certain 
appropriated funds, sub-
ject to any conditions and 
limitations provided by 
law and subject to the ap- 

PROPOSITION NO. 8 
ON THE BALLOT 
Senate Joint Resolution 

36 proposes a constitution- 

del Sena so propene aura 
enmienda constitutional 
que amble la jurisdiction 
y autoridad de las.,cortes 
de apelacion del Estado. 
La enmienda cambiard el 
nombre.de Cortes-de: Apt:-
lac/ones Chilies a, Cortes 
de Apelacion, dared° n es-
las rortrs jurisdirrion de 
apelatien sobre casos cri-
minales y chiles. La en-
mienda carnhiard el titido 
de los .lurres .4soriados (le 
la Corte Suprema a, Jete-
rnrj;ni riliror:gduere; al nicagretfee silo: 

pream sea)? abogailos con 
licencia del estado de Te-
xas mientras permanezcan 
en el plies:to. 

enmienda propuesta 
rtparererd en la boleta 
roma slime: "La en- 
Mireida 	constitutional 
que rambler cl eionibre de 
Cortes de Apelaciones 
Ciriles y el mender-es y 
requisito de log „nieces 
de la Corte Suprema !t 
dicta in jurisdiction y 
notoridad de ins tortes 
de apelarion." 

PROPOSICION NO, 9 
EN LA 130LET.4 

ResoluciOn Coniunta = 51 
de In (Amara pinyon 4' lout 
en in irnda 	(-west iturinnal 

g : r e cirasefirie e  clunalgcrine Pra 	e inirtil  gun  
rampages ronlo separa-

frilan...zesi_d0r1:11171:1,01r;q 17a.asiredq o s 

Ins hirnes innettebles—las 
tales fueron prapjedad de 
algann de los rrinpuges 
antes drl matrimonio 
fueron adquiridos despuis 
roma tat regale), pa sea MI 
legado de Nene.: raker, a 
dr ,iesrendencia, Las pore-
;as rpm (shin por rasarRe 
a los rpm )le) estrior rastu10.R, 
y sin la intention (le dr-
Pravdar a saes acreedores 
preexistenfes, )neuter re-
nadirs(' de me: rn raanda, 
entre si y par esrrito, foda 
a parte de set prapieflarl. 
Pucilen trembirin intercom-
!liar un interes romein en 
Metres post-if-los o que ran 
a poseer por rot intents  • 
eimohr en la roa?anida,1 (11-
lrieneg. La enmienda per-
mitird n los cone/ages eon-
vrnir par rseritn que  Los 

ifllnigs121 nrsifrealqrhe  ilf rrnel davpeireliavi- d 
partirillum Regifird siendn 
prop:whirl particular en 
/agar de ser rominfidad flf 
bit ries coma stria si no 
oxistiera este caner- alio par 
rseritn.1.0 err aienda pro-
pane que el rrala de ton 
crinange n ogre se sapone 
.eptit inclifye Milos Ins in-
"mesas y !deems derivados 
de tal regain, 

La enmienda prnnursta 
apareterti en In bnleta 
coma Rigor: "La en-
mimic( -constitutional 
permite a ins tonyuges 
el reinsenbir rpm los in-
gresos o los birne.s 
Re deriven de los Merles 

	

nin coma blares particu. 	
• part iridarrs permanece- 

lures." 

PROPOSITION NO. 9 
ON THE BALLOT 
House Joint Resolution 

54 proposes a constitution-
al amendment which de-
fines separate property 
owned by either spouse as 
all property, both real and 
personal, of a spouse 
owned or claimed before 
marriage, and that ac-
quired afterward by gift, 
devise or descent. Persons 
about to marry and 
spouses, without the in-
tent to defraud pre-exist-
ing creditors, may by 
written instrument from 
time to time partition be-
tween themselves all or 
part of their property. 
Spouses may exchange a 
community interest in 
property owned or to be 
acquired for a community 
interest in other commu-
nity property. The amend-
ment would allow spouses 
to agree in writing that 
income or property aris-
ing front any separate 
property is to be separate 
property rather than as 
community property as it 
would be in the absence 
of an agreement. The 
amendment proposes that 
a gift from one spouse to 
another is presumed to in-
clude all income or prop-
erty deriving from such 
gift. 

The proposed amend-
ment will appear on the 
ballot as follows:. 
"The 	constitutional 
amendment 	allowing 
spouses to agree that 
income or property aris-
ing from separate prop-
erty is to be separate 
Toperty." 

PROPOSICION NO. 8 
EN L.4 BOLETA 

Resolution Conjunta #36 

PROPOSICION NO. 3 
EN LA BOLETA 

Resolution Conjunta =98 
de la Crimara imopone una 
enmienda ronstitucional 
que requiem una evalua-
tion de todos los bienes 
sujetos a los imporstos  de 
ad valorem y proveerd uni-
camente una junta porn 

PROPOSIC1ON NO. 4 
EN LA BOtET A 

Resolution Con junta =18 
del Senado ;annum' una 
eninienda 	ronstitucianal 
permitienda a In Legisla-
tarn el autorizar juegos de 
bingo por grupos con 
propOsitos caritatirns SO-
lamente sujetos a las li-
mitaciones de que la opera-
tion de los juegas tient 
que ser aprobada en elec.-
clones de option local, y 
que todas las ganancias 
tengan que ser usadas en 
Texas. 

La enmienda propuesta 
aparererd en In Goleta 
coma signe: "La en- 
mienda 	cons( if acional 
autoriza los jurgos de 
bingo bajo eiercioneR de 
option local si in.s juegos 
son &rigida,: par, ya 
sea. 000 igiesia, anti 
sinagoga, una aRneia- 
(-len religiose, 	ser- 
Hein rolantaria de bon,-
beras, una soriedad no 
lueratira de veteranns, 
una organharion frater-
nal, a una soeirdad no 
lurrativa gar apnpa la 
investigation medica a 
programas de tra In-
nriento medico y si ins 
gananrius son usadas en 
Texas para los prop& 
sitns caritatirns h' las 
organi:ationes." 

PROPOSICION NO. 5 
EN L.4 BOLETA 

Resolution Con junta =S6 
de la Carrara propone una 
enmienda constiturional 
epic permite a la Legisla-
ture autnrizar rd Gaberna-
dor pant gat cier:a con-
trol fiscal de las pastas de 
riertns rondos financieros 
preriamente 	aNignados, 
sujeto alas condiciones y 
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Farwell 4-H'ers Win 
In Curry Co. Fair 

Top Showman 
Receiving a trophy naming 
him winner of the Showman-
ship Award in the Swine Show 
at last week's Curry County 
Fair is James Barfield, Texico 
FFA member. Presenting the 

trophy is an unidentified Fair 
Princess. Barfield was among 
many Texico FFA and 4-11 
('lub members to enter ani-
mals in the swine show. 

We Do Commerical 

Carpet Cleaning 
Free Estimates 

CITY CLEANERS 
Ph. 481-3384 Farwell, Tex. 

ALLS UP S 
CONVENIENCE STORES 

INFLATION FIGHTING 
SPECIALS! 

WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT 
PRICES EFFECTIVE SEPTEMBER 11-13,1980 

SPECIALS GOOD WHILE SUPPLY LASTS - LIMITED SUPPLY 

BORDEN'S ICE CREAM SANDWICHES OR NUM 	C 9  
6 CT. 
PKG. BUDDIES 

• 

SHURFRESH 

BISCUITS 10/1.00 

gOarkie 
GROW

N 
FOLGER S ALL GRINDS 	I el

COFFEE 
$299 

1 LB 
CAN 

ALLSUP'S Ffell COOKED 
PARKAY 1 LB. QUARTERS 	 / at  

MARGERINE 	OT  
PRESWNE  ANTI FREEZE $399  

6 

 PN. CANS 

UP 	$189 

BURRITO'S 

11111 FOR 

KRAFT AMERICAN 12 OZ. 

$159 SINGLES 

BORDEN'S HI PROTEIN 

MILK 	 V2 GAL. N.  

BORDER'S 

YOGURT 

AIISUP 

MILK 

Si " GAL  
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Budget Amended - - 

'79 Spending Shrinks 

For Farwell Schools 

Area Welcomes Gentle Rain 
It was raining and it was 

pouring, but no one in this area 
was snoring! In fact, Prentice 
Mills, executive director of the 
Parmer County ASCS office 
exclaimed "There sure ain't 
nothing wrong with this rain!" 
' Mills said that "it may slow 
up both the corn and cotton 
harvests, but it will be worth 
thousands of dollars to the 
dryland wheat farmers!" 

At press time, half an inch 
was reported at the Leon 
Langford farm, six and one 
half miles north of Farwell. 
"And it's still raining," Lang-
ford said. 

Lonnie McFarland, manager 
Ducking The Drops 

of Sherley-Anderson elevator 
in Lariat also reported half an 
inch and added that it was 
raining "all the way from 
Lubbock." 

Walter Curd of Texico re-
ported six tenths of an inch in 
his area, and according to 
Mills, Clay's Corner had less 
than half an inch. 

Before the mid-week rain, 
Farwell had only received 
about 4.2 inches of the precious 
liquid, as compared to 9.1 
inches for the same time 
frame last year. 

As Mills said "We sure 
needed this rain...it will be 
worth a lot to us." 

The Farwell schools reduced 
their spending by more than 
nine thousand dollars last year, 
according to W.M. Roberts, 
superintendent. 

In a meeting last Monday 
night, the school board amended 
their 1979-80 budget to show 
actual expenditures of $1,064,859 
as compared to the budgeted 
amount of $1,073,963. 

In a previous meeting the 
members voted a tax rate of 
$1.06 per hundred dollar valua-
tion. The board voted in their 
Monday night gathering to place 
$0.15 of this amount in an 
Interest and Sinking Fund and 
$0.91 in the local Maintenance 
Fund. 

The 1980-81 tax roll was 
approved and the board also 
voted to turn over to attorneys 
property on the delinquent tax 
roll for collection. 

An Amarillo Certified Public 
Accounting firm, Cornell and 
Company, has been selected by 
the board to do an independent 
audit of the 1979-80 fiscal year. 

In other action, the school 

but did their best to walk 
between the drops on their way 
home from school. 

-Students Paul Meeks, David 
:31oseley, Steve Geries and 
:Ralph Galvan were caught in 
:the Wednesday showers too, 

board swore in Richard Haseloff 
as a new board member. 

Also, permission was granted 
to the senior class, represented 
by Doris Ford and Annette 
Black, for the use of the old 
gym. It will be' used for the 
upcoming homecoming dance. 

Teachers will no longer be 
required to have a yearly 
physical examination as tbe 
board voted to delete this 
practice. However, the board 
did reserve the right to demand 
a physical if opinion considered 
one necessary. 

Those attending last Monday 
night's meeting were members 
Bill Martin, Richard Haseloff, 
Joe Hughes, Wilbert Kalbas, 
Doyle Ford, and Caroline Ander-
son. Member Billy Mayfield was 
absent. 

Principals Don Malone, Jerry 
Owen and David Gobble were 
also present and reported on 
their school's activities. 

Also present at the meeting 
were Superintendent W.M. Rob-
erts, James Craig, Dorothy 
Eason, and Pat Graham. 

Reserve Champion 
Kent Harding, Texico FFA 
member, shows his medium 
weight cross which won Re-
serve Grand Champion honors 
atlhe Swine Show at the Curry 
County Fair last week. The 

Texico FFA-4-11 Club group 
won the Herdsmanship Trophy 
at the Swine Show and many of 
the exhibitors had their hogs 
qualify for the sale at the Fair. 

Ai Texico 

Local Exhibitors 
Curry Fair Winners 

Although a complete list of the Texico 4-H Club and FFA 
local exhibitors winning a-  Chapter won the Herdsman-
wards at the recent Curry ship Trophy in the Swine 
County Fair will not be Show. 
available until next week, it is 

	
James Barfield, Texico FFA 

reported that area entrants did member was named the top 
well in the Clovis event. 	showman in the Swine Show, 

Some 25 members of Texico, and Kent Harding, also a 
Pleasant Hill and Farwell 4-H member of the Texico FFA, 
Clubs and FFA chapters showed his medium weight 
qualified their animals for the 	cross hog to Reserve Champ- 
livestock sale at the fair. 	ionship honors in the show. 

The Pleasant Hill 4-H Club 
	

A complete list of local 
received the Herdsmanship winners at the fair will be 
Trophy in the Sheep Show and published next week. 

Roberts Hears Cases MONDAY - Pizza, let-
tuce and tomato salad, 
buttered peas, fruit gelatin 
and milk. 

TUESDAY - Hot dogs 
with chili, pickles, onions, 
french fries, cookie, fruit 
and milk. 

WEDNESDAY - Ham-
burger and potato casse-
role, lettuce and tomato 
salad, hot rolls, half an 
orange, and chocolate 
milk. 

THURSDAY - Chicken 
pot pie, celery stick, hot 
biscuits, peaches and milk. 

FRIDAY - Burritos with 
chili, shredded cheese, 
lettuce and tomato salad, 
cobbler and milk. 

DWI, fined $200 plus court costs 
and sentenced three days. 

Francisco Delarosa, 49, Bo-
vina, DWI, fined $150 plus court 
costs, sentenced three days, 
probated for six months. 

William D. Cole, 52, Bovina, 
DWI.fined $200 plus court costs, 
sentenced three days. 

Joe Chavez, 22, Clovis, DWI, 
fined $200 plus court costs and 
sentenced three days. 

SCHOOL LUNCH MENU 
At Farwell 

MONDAY - Open face 
sandwich, lettuce, tomato, 
pickle slice, au gratin 
potatoes, peach cobbler, 
bread and milk. 

TUESDAY - Tamales, 
seasoned pinto beans, but-
tered spinach, corn bread 
and butter, peanut butter 
candy, milk. 

WEDNESDAY - Fish 
Krispies, tartar sauce, 
macaroni and cheese, 
blackeyed peas, carrot 
sticks, hot rolls and milk. 

THURSDAY - Sloppy 
joes, mixed vegetables, 
carrots, corn chips, apple 
sauce, raisin cake and 
milk. 

FRIDAY - Spaghetti and 
meat sauce, tossed salad, 
buttered corn, garlic 
bread, pear gelatin and 
milk. 

Parmer County Judge Porter 
Roberts heard the following 
cases in county court recently: 

Jerry Roberts, 26, Friona, 
theft WC, fined $1 in court costs, 
made restitution. 

Velma Freeman, 25, Friona, 
theft WC, fined $1 in court costs, 
made restitution. 

Rufus Martin, 50, Friona, 
DWI, plead not guilty, made 
S500 bond. 

Harvey Schott. 38, Black, 

STEED—TODD 
FUNERAL HOME 

"When Understanding Is sN'eeded Most" 

1 rine(' & Manana-Clovis-Ph. 763-5541 CAPITOL FOODS 
ir• 

Two Farwell 4-H Club mem-
bers walked away from the 
Curry County Fair Open Show 
with some top awards last 
week. 

4111 Danna Ralston's exhibits 
won seven awards, and Teresa 
Rose's entries grabbed six. 

Danna had four Champions, 
with a Chester White Gilt, 
Hampshire Gilt, and a Hamp-
shire Market hog. The young 
exhibitor also placed two times 
with a Reserve Champion 
Chester Market hog, and a 

Crossbred Barrow, and also 
had a Reserve Grand Champ-
ion Open Barrow, 

Teresa exhibited four 
Champions, including a Spot 
Barrow, a Spot Gilt, a Buck 
Boar and a Junior and Senior 
Birkshire Boar. She also 
showed two Reserve Champ-
ions: a Spot Barrow and a Spot 
Gilt. 

Farmer County 4-H'ers will 
show livestock at Dumas and 
at the South Plains Fair later 
this month. 

 

COMA 5in 
DAILY SPECIALS 

MERCHANT STEAK. . . .9.95 

FRIED CHICKEN LIVERS. . . .9.10 

CHICKEN FRIED STEAK . . . )2.95 

SAL AD BAR, BAKED POTATO & CORN 

CHICKEN CHOW MEIN. . . .12.95 

CHINESE, AMERICAN, MEXICAN FOOD 

PHONE 763-4823 	 CLOVIS 

• 

 

WC AVIATION 

MULTIVISCOSITY OIL 

Application and Description 

• First multiviscosity SAE 20W-50 grade ashless dispersant aviation oil. 

• For use in aircraft piston engines in both summer and winter 
seasons. 

• Meets the requirements of: 
Avco Lycoming Material Specification No. 30W 
Teledyne Continental Motors Material Specification MHS-24B. 
Revised 1-1-77. 
Additive treatment meets MIL-L-28851 B. Amendment 1. 

• Has successsfully passed major aircraft engine manufacturer's 150 
hour model tests. 

• One SAE 20W-50 grade oil replaces two viscosity grades. 80 and 100. 
with no sacrifice in performance. 

• Easy starting and quick lubrication under cold conditions. yet full oil 
film strength under high temperature — high load conditions such as 
take-off. 

• Ashless dispersant to keep engine clean. 

X/C Aviation Multiviscosity Oil, SAE 20W-50 
vs Type A Aviation Motor Oil. Grade 100 

X/C Multiviscosity has the low temperature 
performance of an SAE 20W grade oil. 

X/C Multiviscosity has the high temperature 
performance of an SAE 50 grade oil. 

X/C Multiviscosity has the same engine cleanliness 
performance. 

Available From 

HELTON OIL Co. 
Serving The Texico-Farwell Area 
• 

Ph. 481E3222 

• 



MR. AND MRS. EDWARD ENGRAM 
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11°P SHOPPING 
Infants and 
Maternity 

1312 Main
Wear 

763-7145 DIRECTORY 
Just Arrived 

Preppy 
Look 

Shirts 

ALLs
0  
uPS 

CONVENIENCE STORES 

INTRODUCING 
Our New Expanded Deli 

Always Fresh Food 

Quick Service 

Available 24 Hours Per Day 
365 Days a Year 

MENU 
.69 

.69 

.79 

.79 
3.49 
1.49 
3.99 
1.25 
.39 

.35 

.99 

.39 
1.49 
1.19 
1.19 
1.25 

.59 

.69 

.49 

1.25 
1.25 

Burritos...Bean and Beef 
New Cheese and Bean 

New Beef Taco Roll 
Gooch Old Style German Sausage 
Allsup's Hot and Mild Links 
Whole BBQ Chicken 
BBQ Beef Brisket Sandwich 
Mouth Watering BBQ Spare Ribs. Per Lb. 
Allsup's BBQ Beef Sandwich 
Hot Southern Fried Pies 
Apple 
Cherry 
Peach 
New Mexican Style Taquitas 
New Chile Rellenos 
New Hot Tamales 
New '. 4 lb. Ham Sandwich 
Oscar Mayer ' 4 lb. Big One Hot Dogs 
Southern Fried Chicken Quarters 
Beer Batter Cod Fish Sandwich 
Crispy Golden Corn Dogs 
New Allsup's Pochitos (Mexican Hot Dog) 
Good 01' American Hot Dogs 

Introducing 

Chicken Fried Steak Sandwich 
New Steakfinger Sandwich 

FRIED 
PIES 
Buy One 
Get One 

FREE 

• 
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Engrams Honored With 

Anniversary Reception 

• Mr. and Mrs. Edward Engram 
of Farwell were honored with a 
reception in observance of their 
50th Wedding Anniversary Sun-
day afternoon in the Fellowship 
Hall of Hamlin Memorial United 
Methodist Church. 

Hosting the reception were the 
Engrams' children, Mr. and 
Mrs. Donald Engram of Detroit; 
Beth Williams of Las Cruces; 
Patsy White of Lubbock; and a 
granddaughter, Cindy Williams 
of Las Cruces. 

Miss Williams registered the 
more than 100 guests who came 
to the reception. 

Guests were served from a 
table covered with an ivory 
cloth caught in drapes at the 
center and corners of the table. 
Gold bows centered with a small 
gold disk bearing the number 50 
held the draped effect. To Wed October 

Texas W.I.F.E. - - 

Women's Farm Group 

To Convene In Amarillo 

Mr. and Mrs. Fred R. Gaddis 
of Texico announce the engage-
ment and forthcoming marrige 
of their daughter, Traci Ray, 
to Steve Powell. He is the son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Neil Hendrick-
son of Farwell. The birde-elect 
is a 1979 graduate of Texico 

-High School and is currently 
employed at El Paso Products 
in Odessa. The prospective 
bridegroom is a 1980 graduate 

4 
of Farwell High School and is 
currently employed at B.D.W. 
Machine Shop in Odessa. The 
wedding will be Saturday, Oct. 
4, at 3:00 p.m. MDT in the 
Pleasant Hill Baptist Church, 
Pleasant Hill, New Mex. All 
friends and relatives of the 
couple are cordially invited to 
attend. No local invitations will 
be sent. 

inequities in the cost of produc-
tion of agriculture commodities. 
In addition, they develop united 
efforts with the general public, 
together with Congressional 
Legislative and Executive bod-
ies in the promotion of economic 
prosperity of the field of 
agriculture. It is also their 
desire to develop understanding 
of the economic conditions of 
agriculture and its importance 
to the nation. 

A silk floral arrangement in a 
gold epergne featured various 
shades of gold and was flanked 
on either side by votive candles 
in amber and gold holders. The 
three-tiered cake of ivory was 
decorated with gold rosebuds 

and the top tier held two gold 
wedding bands. Decorated col-
umns separated the top tier 
from the other tiers. Punch, nuts 
and gold and ivory colored 
mints were also served. White 
napkins embossed in gold bore 
two doves and wedding rings 
and the names "Edward and 
Lennie, 1930 - September 16 -
1980." 

Favors were small white 
cards bearing the couples' 
names and their wedding date 
and held by a small white dove 
holding a gold wedding band. 

A gold coffee service was 
featured on another table which 
was covered with ivory and held 
a large arrangement of gold 
chrysanthemums. 

The honorees, their children 
and their granddaughter wore 
corsages and boutonnieres of 
silk flowers in shades of gold.' 

The couple reports that they 
really enjoyed the visits and 
wishes from friends who attend-
ed the reception along with all 
the cards and telephone calls 
they received in honor of the 
occasion. 

Farwell were their daughter 
and son-in-law, Mr. and Mrs. 
Kevin Penner of Lubbock. The 
Penners recently moved to 
Lubbock from Beaumont and 
Mrs. Penner iDeborah has 
just begun her first year at 
Texas Tech Law School. 

Staying in the Martin Kube 
home in Farwell and visiting 
with them and other relatives 
and friends in the area 
recently were Mrs. Emily 
Stovall and Raymond Evans of 
Cedar Hill, Tex., and Mrs. 
Esther Kelm of Malone, Tex. 

Also visiting briefly with the 
local family was Alvin Graf of 
San Antonio. 

Texas WIFE. (Women In-
volved in Farm Economics) will 
host their fourth annual conven-
tion Saturday and Sunday, Sept. 
13 and 14, at the Quality Inn, 
Amarillo. This year's theme is 
"Revival for Survival." 

W.I.F.E., a politically, non-
partisan, non-sectarian and non-
commercial organization, be-
lieves that if agriculture is to 
survive the 80's, there must be a 
revival of grass roots involve-
ment in agriculture legislation. 
Two area members are state 
officers, Naomi Austin of Far-
well serves as state recording 
secretary and June Saylor of 
Muleshoe is state president. 

Saturday's convention agenda 
will feature speakers on various 
commodities beginning at 10:45 
a.m. CDT with Dr. James 
Supak. Supak is Area Agrono- 

Marie Christian 

Gets Scholarship 
Texico City Clerk Marie 

Christian has received a full 
scholarship to attend a three-
day training school in Albu-
querque. Sponsored by the 
New Mexico Municipal League, 
the municipal training session 
is set for September 22 - 24. 

The scholarship will allow 
the city clerk to attend the 
seminar with all expenses 
paid. Mrs. Christian said she 
applied for the scholarship and 
feels receiving it "is quite an 
honor." 

For further information on the 
W.I.F.E. convention slated for 
this weekend, contact one of the 
following: Inette Johnson, Box 
704, 'Culla, phone 995-3139; Kay 
Reese, Rt. 1, Box 52, Meadow, 
Tex., phone 585-6485; or Susan 
Hughes, Rt. 1, Ropesville, Tex., 
866-9667. Any one of the local 
members may be contacted 
also. S 

mist on cotton with the Texas 
Agriculture Extension Service. 

Bill Nelson from Texas Wheat 
Growers will speak at 11:30 a.m. 
and Elbert Harp will speak at 
1:45 p.m. on Grain Sorghum. 
Beef Commodity will be the 
topic of the 2:30 p.m. speaker, 
and at 3:30 p.m. Carl King, 
president of the Corn Growers 
Association, will speak. There is 
no charge for attending these 
meetings. 

Congressman Charles Sten-
hom, 17th District, will be the 
keynote speaker at Saturday 
evening's banquet. Those wish-
ing to attend will pay an 
admission of $7. 

"W.I.F.E. is recognized in 
Washington, D.C., as a farm 
lobbying group," Mrs. Austin 
told the Tribune. Their purpose 
is to promote economic prosper-
ity in agriculture and adjust 

Mr. and Mrs. Weldon Dane 
of Texico were visited by his 
sister and her husband, Mr. 
and Mrs. Henry Hoursover of 
Lubbock, on Sunday, Aug. 24. Visit With 

Mrs. Benderman Visiting Friday night and 
Saturday in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Hurshel Harding in 

Mrs. Joe Magness returned 
to her home in Farwell last 
Friday afternoon from a trip to 
Ventura, Calif., where she had 
visited for two weeks with a 
son and grandson, Fred Mag-
ness and Brandon. En route 
home she visited in Amarillo at 
the home of her daughter and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. C.H. 
Lackey and sons. 

LIKE NEW!! 
METAL WARDROBE - LARGE SIZE 

TRUNDLE BEDS - COMPLETE 

SWIVEL ROCKER - BEIGE VELVET 

CONSOLE STEREO - RADIO, PLAYER AND 8 TRACK 

DINING ROOM SUITE - CHINA, TABLE, 4 CHAIRS 

Outstanding Chapter 

Mrs. J.B. Benderman of 
Texico had as guests over the 
weekend her granddaughter 
and her husband, Mr. and Mrs. 
Corliss Nelson of Albuquerque. 

The visi1t was in honor of 
Mrs. Benderman's 81st birth-
day which was Wednesday, 
Sept. 10 The Nelsons arrived 
Saturday and brought a lovely 
decorated birthday cake for 
the honoree, and on Saturday 
evening took the local lady out 
for dinner in honor of the 
occasion. 

On Sunday the guests at-
tended morning worship serv-
ices with Mrs. Benderman at 
Hamlin Memorial United 
Methodist Church before re-
turning to their home later that 
day. top prize. Officers for the local 

club are, L to R Beverly 
Foster, vice-president; Sheree 
Montgomery, in-coming presi-
dent; Brenda Gulley, parlia- 

601 Main 
Clovis 

763-7111 

mentarian; Bobbie Pierson, 
historian/recorder; and Tina 
Sides, out-going president. Sec-
retary/treasurer is Patsy 
Camp, not pictured. 

Farwell Young Homemakers 
were chosen as the Area I Out-
standing Chapter during their 
annual convention in Amarillo, 
this being the second year in a 
row the Farwell club won the 

I 

Around The Twin Cities 

Watt fled glues via a geed out 

in a imil_441 tem 

Marriage 1 
Licenses I 

Farwell City Council meets 
Monday at city hall, beginning 
at 5:15 p.m. CDT. 

•.• 

Texico Woman's Club will 
meet at the Community Build- 
ing Monday at 7 p.m. MDT. 

•4.4, 

Farwell Study Club meets in 
the Club Room Monday at 6:30 

Parmer County Courthouse 
issued only one marriage 
license since the last report. It 
was issued to Santos Lopez and 
Mickael Garcia. 

Texico-Farwell Lions Club 
Broom sale will begin Friday, 
Sept. 19 at 4 p.m. CDT and run 
through Saturday, Sept. 20, 
(starting at 9 a.m. CDT) at the 
parking lot of Hughes Auto, 
Farwell. 

p.m. CDT. 
• 0 

Farwell Hospital District 
Board to meet at the Convales-
cent Center, 8. p.m. CDT, 
Tuesday. 

Farwell 9-H to meet at the 
Courthouse Tuesday at 8 p.m. 
CDT. 

ROTHWELL BODY SHOP 
1814 West 7th (Behind Delmer's Automotive) Clovis, N.M. 

CALL 163-3530 For Free Estimate On 
ALL AUTO BODY REPAIR & REPAINTING 

ALSO GLASS WORK By Lucky Girl - Long Sleeve 

In Asst. Colors 

FREE 2 LETTER 
MONOGRAM 

With The Purchase Of 

A Shirt (One Per Customer) 

Good Thru Sat., Sept. 13 

PROMPT DEVELOPING 
SERVICE -I-- 

ALL. SIZES FILM -- 

LARGE SELECTION 
PHOTO ACCESSORIES 

O.L. ANDERSON, 
PROPRIETOR 

617 Main 

HUDSON UPHOLSTERY 
Custom Upholstery. Slip Covers, Bedspreads 

And Decorator Specialty Items. 

516 Norris Ph. 505/763-1142 
Clovis, New Mexico 

Now's the time to apply your 

\ fall fertilizer on wheat 

\ ground. / 

Come by to see us for your 

fertilizer needs: 

K-MAG Phosphate 

Custom Blends - Application 

Dry Nitrogen 

Interstate \ 
Fertilizer, Inc. 

Office Ph. 481-3838 	500 N. 9th 
Whse. 481-9093 	Farwell, Texas • 

Kids D•1+ 

faiOSE 
611 Main-In The Village-Clovis 

acemsegginalustimaismar 	 IP -MP — 



RINSEMAC 
$4.00' 
MAIL-IN 

COUPON 
OFFER 

Rent RINSENVAC Today...And 
get a coupon worth S4.00 off 
on your next rental! 

Look for the special mail-in 
certificate on our 
RINSENVAC display je, 
Offer expires 
October 31.1980 	 . 

FARWELL HARDWARE 
Ph. 481-3186 

r' 

RIWSIlIVAC 

MR. AND MRS. MIKE GOETTSCH 

Men's Shirt Sale 
Buy 2 

) 	At Regular Price 

/7(i 	Get One FREE  
try  

k 	 Layaways Welcome 

ee's •WESTERN WEAR 

1910 W. Amer. Blvd. 	 Muleshoe 

CELEBRATING OUR 

3rd AM/YERSARY 
SALE 

OPEN SUNDAY 12-5 
Starts Sunday, Sept. 14th 

Continues Thai Sept. 

Furniture 
Waterbeds • • Accessories 

1511 N. Prince Street Clovis 	762.0892 
• 

All Dinettes In Stock 40% off 

Waterbeds & Accessories 

10% off 

master charge 

Woodward 

Bedroom Suite 
5 Piece Reg. $999 

Special $699 

Twin Oaks N 

Bedroom Suite 
5 Piece, Dark Oak Color 

Reg. $2400 
Special $ 1200 

cLouts ilAs A PLAtir 
714a -r Cad fir EM ALL! 

N ritn-rs, rbiA LEG'S "DiNta 
TON/eal  L/1 EW 1,  TEENsi ht 

IDRANA PA At! 

etill-MEN /5 	rr • 
45% OFF 

SEPC. r crieriorN ; 
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Beta Sigma Phi 

Plans New Year 
Double-Ring Ceremony Unites 

Peggy White, Mike Goettsch 
Alpha Rho Lambda chapter 

of Beta Sigma Phi met at the 
home of Linda Foster Septem-
ber 9 and made plans for the 
new year. 

A family skating party is set 
for Monday at the Farwell 
Skate-a-Rama from 6-8 p.m. 
CDT. Admission is $2. 

Linda Foster was chosen by 
members to represent them in 
the national Valentine Sweet-
heart competition. 

Nationally, the sorority is 
celebrating 50 years of exist- 

Marriage 

Announced 

ence and at their Monday night 
meeting, members heard a 
short reading of the sorority's 
history. 

The program was presented 
by Sheree Montgomery. Mem-
bers were surprised with 
memories from their past in 
the program "Share Golden 
Treasurers." Mrs. Montgom-
ery had gathered past informa-
tion from the families of 
sorority members. 

Those attending were Nedda 
Travis, Laura Jacobs, Pam 
Smith, Linda Foster, Kendale 
Burch, Gay Goettsch, Anita 
Ralston, Cynthia Thigpen, 
Pauletta Curtis, Sharlotte Don-
aldson, Robyn Palady, Gloria 
Hutchins, Mary Ann Lingnau, 
Terri Baker, and Sheree 
Montgomery. Transferee Sand-
ra Joiner was welcomed from 
McLean Texas. 

the unity candle. 
The bride, given in marriage 

by her father, wore a formal 
white gown of organza featur-
ing a modified batteau neck-
line, and Empire waist a-line 
skirt, and leg-of-mutton sleeves. 
The bodice of the gown was 

designed with a yoke outlined 
in Venice lace with lace also 
accenting the round neck. 
Venice lace also accented the 
sleeves and the skirt and 
fan-shaped train which fell 
from the waistline. 

She wore a derby styled hat 
trimmed with Rose of Venice 
lace. One side of the hat was 
turned up and accented with a 
silk rose and the entire hat was 
draped in veiling with stream-
ers of veiling in back and 
blusher in front. She carried a 
bouquet of yellow silk tiger 
lilies with eucalyptus leaves of 
green and burgundy tied with 
burgundy streamers. 

Her wedding dress was worn 
by her sisters, Mrs. Robin 
(Lynne) Mahaney and Mrs. 
Ricky (Joyce) Ketcherside in 
their weddings. 

In carrying out bridal tradi- 

1520 MITCHELL 
For Longer Lasting Flowers 

PMADCRWS 
flowerland, inc. 

1520 MITCHELL - 763-3465 

Mr. and Mrs. Buttons Howard 
of Farwell announce the mar-
riage of their daughter, Becky,' 
to Kie Watkins, son of Mr. and' 
Mrs. Sy Watkins of Lubbock, 
formerly of Farwell. 

The couple exchanged wed-
ding vows Monday, Aug. 25, in 
Santa Fe, N.M. 

Becky and Kie are both 
graduates of Farwell High 
School. They are making their 
home in Lubbock where Kie is 
attending Texas Tech graduate 
school and Becky is employed at 
Tech. 

Theta Rho ESA Meets 

tion, something old was a hat 
pin belonging to her paternal 
grandmother, Mrs. A. D. White 
of Amarillo. Something new 
and blue was her garter and 
something borrowed was her 
bridal hat which belonged to 
her matron of honor, Mrs. 
Rhonda Taylor of Oklahoma 
City. 

Other bridal attendants were 
Kristi Magness Spearman of 
Farwell, cousin of the bride; 
and D'Lynn Eubank, also of 
Farwell. The three bridal 
attendants wore full length 
dresses of gold silk knit 
featuring blouson bodices, fit-
ted sleeves and straight skirts. 
The dresses were accented at 
the waist with burgundy belts. 
Each attendant carried a 
long-stemmed burgundy silk 
poppy and eucalyptus leaves 
with gold ribbon streamers. 

Attending the bridegroom as 
best man was Greg Geuther of 
Lubbock. Groomsmen were 
Travis Bibbs and Terri Mc-
Cully, both of Lubbock, and 
ushers were Boyd White of 
Farwell, brother of the bride, 
and Chip Craft of Lubbock. 
The bridegroom wore a white 
tuxedo with satin trim and his 
attendants wore tuxedos of 
burgundy with matching satin 
trim. 

In a candlelight ceremony at 
4•Wijamlin Memorial United 

Methodist Church on Saturday, 
Aug. 16, Peggy Lee White 
became the bride of Michael 
1. Goettsch. 

Parents of the couple are 
kr. and Mrs. Joel P. White 
and Mr. and Mrs. Carl 
Goettsch, all of Farwell. 

Officiating at the double-ring 
a  'Service was Rev. W. T. Perry, 

Pastor of the Crane United 
Methodist Church and former 
Pastor of the Farwell Metho-
dist Church. 

Forming the wedding setting 
at the chancel of the sanctuary 
:were seven-tier candelabra 
flanking the altar with ferns 
accented with gold and bur-
gundy ribbons. Family pews 
were also marked with gold 
'and burgundy bows. 

Providing traditional wed-
Aing selections at the organ 
was Mrs. Donald Christian. 
She accompanied Mrs. Troy 
Christian as she sang, "The 
Wedding Prayer," and after 

. the couple repeated their vows, 
she sang, "May The Grace of 

:Christ Our Savior," as they lit 

Week Of Prayer Set 

For Farwell Baptists For Business Session 
"Yesterday, Today, Forever 

God at Work" is the theme for 
: the Missions Week of Prayer, 

sponsored by the First Baptist 
Church of Farwell. 

Set for September 14-21, the 
week-long event will feature 

• programs put on by the men and 
women of the congregation. 

Sunday night will kickoff the 
activities with a special pro-

I gram offered by the Baptist 
• men. It will be held at the 

church beginning at 7 p.m. CDT. 

Farwell Women Host 

Mrs. Carrie Christian of 
Farwell underwent foot sur-
gery at an Amarillo hospital 
last week and is recuperating 
at the home of her daughter 
and family, the Benny Darnells 
in Amarillo. She hopes to he 
able to return to her home 
sometime next week. 

Delta Kappa Gamma 
Mrs. Nina Glasscock of 

Farwell remains hospitalized 
at Highland Hospital in Lub-
bock for medical treatment. 
Her condition was reported 
slightly improved early this 
week. Her brother, James 
Bruce of Colorado, has been 
here visiting with Nina during 
the past week or two.- 

to Gwen Corn, corresponding 
secretary. 

New president Robin Gregory 
and members made plans for a 
fall rummage sale as well as 
proposals for their annual 
Walk-a-Thon. Definite plans for 
the philanthropic project are to 
be set at the organization's next 
meeting, September 22. 

Reports were heard on the 
club's Border Town Days 
booths, which were a tatoo 
parlor and a lemonade and tea 
stand. 

The gathering was held at the 
home of Maxine Williams, and 
Deb Williams served as co-host-
ess. Attending the event were 
Leslie Lunsford, Nell Walling, 
Dardanella Helton, LaMoin Wil-
liams, Diane Actkinson, Marga-
ret Aycock, Lillie Christian, 
Gwen Corn, Altha Herington, 
Judy Jones, Jeannie Norris, 
Becky Norton, Tommie Snod-
grass, Caren Spearman, and 
-Joyce Williams. 

Delta Kappa Gamma mem-
bers had their initial meeting 
of the new school term 
Saturday night, Sept. 6, in the 
home economics building at 

'Fzirwell Schools. 

• Penny Hughes of College 
Station and Sherri McCully of 

	

Odessa were candlelighters. 	Theta Rho Chapter of Epsiloti 

The Baptist Women will hold They wore matching dresses of Sigma Alpha (ESA) sorority 
the "week of prayer" program printed burgundy and gold held its first business meeting of 
and supper in the fellowship with gold flowers. 	 the year September 8, according 

hall, to begin at 7 p.m. CDT. All 	For her daughter's wedding 	  
women are invited to attend. 	Mrs. White wore a full length 

	

Rev. Dudley Bristow, church gown of forest green knit 	Hospital Notes 
pastor, will have a special accented at the waist with a 	 • 
message and filmstrip at week's gold belt. Her corsage was of 
end, September 21. "God at gold iris. 
Work," a film about Baptist 	The bridegroom's mother 
missions, will begin at 7 p.m. at wore a long gown of blue knit 
the church. Fellowship and featuring long sleeves, belted 
singing will follow. Ladies are waist and stand-up collar. Her 
requested to bring cookies. 	corsage was of white iris. 

A reception in the church 
parlor honored the couple after 
the wedding ceremony. Mem-
bers of the houseparty were 
Lynne Mahaney, Joyce Ketch-
erside, Colleen Stover,, Barba-
ra Marion and Gay Goettsch. 

The bridal table held six 
eight-inch circular cakes sur-
rounding a fountain. Ivy 
entwined around the cakes 
which were decorated with 
gold tiger lilies and burguildy.  
forget-me-nots. Crystal and 
silver appointments were used 
to serve cake, punch, nuts and 
mints. Completing the table 
decor were gold napkins 
printed with "Mike and Peg- 

Mrs. G.D. Anderson of Far-
well, who has been receiving 
medical treatment at a Lub-
bock hospital, hoped to be dis-
missed to return home later 
this week. 

Hosting the kick-off meeting 
were Frances Boling, Pat 
Owen, Elizabeth Phillips, 
Edith Martin, Billie Carlyle 
and Hattie Coffer. Others from 
Farwell attending were Lynn 
Roberts, Judy Howard and 

Faith SS Class 
Meets Tuesday 

Karolene Inman. 
Mrs. Phillips, new president 

of the organization, conducted 
a business session after the 
evening's activities had begun 
with a Mexican dinner. Those 
present met in groups to 
discuss the programs and 
assignments planned for the 
coming year. Yearbooks of the 
coming activities will be 
distributed later. 

In addition to the Farwell 
teachers and former teachers 
attending, seven women from 
Friona were also present. 

Faith Sunday School class of 
First Baptist Church, Farwell, 
met Tuesday night of this week 
in the home of Loyce McCles-
key. 

After a short business ses-
sion, Estellene Billington gave 
a devotional entitled, "Dedi-
cated Hands." 

The hostess served refresh-
ments to Naomi Austin, Estel-
lene Billington, Mary Jean 
Patrick, Nan Preston, Eliza-
beth Range, Carol Dean Hug-
gins, and Lovelle Childs. 

Mrs. Virgie Harding of 
Texico is hospitalized at St. 
Mary's Hospital in Lubbock for 
medical treatment this week. 
Her condition was reported as 
improved at mid-week; how-
ever, she was expected to 
remain hospitalized at least 
several more days. 

***** 

Junior Foreman of Texico 
received medical treatment at 
the hospital in Muleshoe for 
two days last week. 

gy. ' 

For traveling the bride wore 
a terry suit of burgundy, 
accented with beige belt, After 
a wedding trip to Ruidoso the 
couple is at home in Farwell. 

The bride is a 1978 graduate 
of Farwell High School, attend-
ed San Angelo University for 
one year and is employed at 
the Parmer County Adult 
Probation office. 

Goettsch is a 1977 graduate 
of Farwell High and is 
employed by MBPLX at 
Friona. 

of Style 
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*Skirts 

Food habits 
may be changed 
by high fuel costs 

COLLEGE STATION —
The fuel crunch may change as 
many eating habits as driving 
habits, says Texas .k6cM Uni-
versity's dean of geosciences. 

As fuel goes up, so will food 
prices and Americans will sub-
stitute for meat at the market 
and grow their own vegetables, 
explained Dr. Earl Cook. He 
predicts more cereal-based 
foods and less junk food in the 
future. 
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Wolverines In Action 
CAMPERS 

JIMMY LOVE 

Defensive linebacker Jimmy 
Love was named by the Texico 
coaching staff as Wolverine 
player of the week. 'Love had 
18 tackles during last week's 
contest with Carrizozo. Ile also 
had a big play in a crucial 
situation stopping a Carrizozo 
score in the third quarter," 
said head coach David Lynn. 

H 

• 
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WATCH FOR OUR BIG 

FALL SALE 
Wolverine Of 

At Texico - 

The Week 	Carrizozo Grizzlies Edge 
Advertised In Next Weeks Paper 

Wolverines 8-0 In Opener Heated Campers For Rent! 

1200 E. 1st - Clovis - 762.9506 

an 8-0 count after scoring the 
game's only TD in the final 
minute of play. Fumbles and 
first-game jitters contributed 
to Texico's failure to score. 
Texico hosts Lubbock Christian 
tonight at 7:30 MDT. (Texico 
School Photo] 

'4.97 & Up 

'3.84 
'4.10 
'4.75 
128.00 

I 	 FIRE CALLS 

Prefinished Paneling 

4x8 112 Sheetrock 

Masonry Cement 
Portland Cement 

Storm Windows 

Texico's Kent Harding and 
Willie Bibbs f in white I appear 
to be heading in opposite 
directions awaiting the play to 
develop in Friday night's 
battle between Texico and 
Carrizozo. The Carrizozo Griz-
zlies took the season opener by 

this year," Coach Lynn de-
clared. "I hope we gained some 
experience the other night." 

Lynn said first time quarter-
back Gary Mitchell "did good 
for first time out." 

Other players Lynn recognized 
were Lynn Tubbs, Willie Bibbs 
and Todd Genies. "Todd played 
real well even though he was 
injured." 

The coach also expressed 
gratitude for the fan support at 
the season's first home game. 
"We had a nice crowd, I 
appreciated that." 

The Wolverines will host 
Lubbock Christian on the Texico 
turf tonight at 7 p.m. MDT. 

Head coach Lynn finds the 
Lubbock team to be "Well 
coached and quick," but feels 
that "we have a good chance of 
winning if we can eliminate 
some of last week's mistakes." 

***** 

responded to the 200 block on 
Anderson in Texico where a 
mobile home was engulfed in 
flames, September 7. The fire 
was reported at 8:23 p.m. 
MDT. 

The Farwell fire fighters had 
no other calls this week. 

FREE DELIVERY TO 
TEXICO & FARWELL 

HOME LUMBER 
& SUPPLY CO. 

Texico Boosters 
Meet Thursday 

1201 E. First 	Clovis 	763-4437 

To Subscribe Just 

Phone 481-3681 

Texico 
9 

124 
47 

6-12-2 
4.50 
2-48 

Statistics 
Carrizozo 

First downs: 	10 
Rushing: 	100 
Passing: 	77 

Passing Att: 	4-9-1 
Penalties: 	5-60 
Punts: 	3-30.5 

Texico Volunteer Fire De-
partment reported two ambu-
lance calls and one fire call 
this week. 

A woman was transported to 
Clovis High Plains Hospital 
from 419 Griffin St., Texico, at 
4:27 p.m. MDT, September 3. 
Their second call was six miles 
south on State Line Road 
September 6, transporting a 
Texico woman to the Muleshoe 
hospital. 

Both the Texico and Farwell 
Volunteer Fire Departments 

yards before relinquishing on a 
punt in the first quarter. Three 
plays later the Wolverines 
fumbled the ball over for Grizzly 
possession on the Texico 25-yard 
line. 

The ball was later recovered 
by Texico on the Wolverine 
15-yard line after Carrizozo 
running-back Beltran fumbled in 
a first down attempt. 

A holding penalty stopped a 
steady pace made by the 
Wolverines which saw them at 
the Grizzly 17. The pigskin was 
put back on the 32. The penalty, 
coupled with an incomplete pass 
gave the ball back to Carrizozo. 
After changing hands several 
times, the ball finally ended up 
in Wolverine possession again 
after Herbert Bibbs intercepted 
a Carrizozo pass. However, with 
the two minute warning given, 
Texico lost the ball on downs to 
their opponent. 

Fans were more than sur-
prised when Carrizozo crossed 
the goal line in the last minute 
of the game. 

"We're short on experience 

With 58 seconds on the clock 
Carrizozo scored the game's 
only touchdown to beat Texico in 
the Wolverine's season opener 
8-0. 

Wolverine quarterback Gary 
Mitchell had a pass intercepted 
on the Carrizozo 20 to set up the 
deciding touchdown in an other-
wise scoreless game. 

"They beat us on one pass 
play," said Wolverine head 
coach David Lynn. "Otherwise 
we outplayed them. We beat 
them both offensively and 
defensively," he stated flatly. 

When asked for the cause of 
Texico's scoreless effort, Lynn 
responded "we just fumbled the 
ball every time." 

"We were on the four-yard 
line twice in the first half," the 
coach recalled. "We had 11 
fumbles and lost five of those." 

In. a game filtered with 
mistakes and penalties it seem- 
ed as though neither team could 
keep the ball long enough to 
score. 

The Carrizozo Grizzlies were 
able to move the ball only 15 

Texico Athletic Booster Club 
was to meet Thursday night, 

'.,Sept. 11. at 7 p.m. MDT in the 
:;high school library. 

Regular business items were 
to be attended to, and all booster 

:;'..club members and persons 
'interested in the athletic pro-
- 

 
gram were urged to be on hand 

;. for this meeting. 
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Texico Jr. High 

To Meet Muleshoe 
Texico Junior High football 

learn will travel to Muleshoe VE 
YOUR 

PROFIT 
 CURE P 

-.•• September 18 for their second • 

season game. 
Wolverine head coach Dave 

Lynn said. "I think the Jr. High 
will have a good team this 
year." 

Offenses Stymied 
Neither Texico nor Carrizozo 
had much luck moving the ball 
against their opponents in 
Friday night's game played at 
Texico. Here Texico's offense 
is stymied. as. the red-suited 
Grizzlies close in. Carrizozo 

scored a TD in the final minute 
of the game to win the match 
8-0. Texico will host Lubbock 
Christian High tonight [Fri-
day] with the game to begin at 
7:39 MDT.. ! Texico School 
Photo) 

I , 

• 

• 

Texico C of C 
Seeks Members 

A membership drive is now 
underway for the Texico 
Chamber of Commerce, ac-
cording to Louise Engram, 
Chamber president. 

The drive is under the 
direction of John Hadley and 
Rev. Buford Swan. For fur-
ther information phone Hadley 
at 482-9426. 

Six people attended the 
Chamber's monthly meeting 
last Monday discussing the MX 
Missile site proposal and 
Texico's park. 

The Chamber meets the 
second Monday of each month 
at 6:30 p.m. MDT at the 
Citizen's Bank. 
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For All Your 

New & Used 

Car, Truck & 

Pickup Needs. 

Oldest Man 
Albert Osborne was presented 
a purple ribbon at the Curry 
County Fair honoring him as 
the oldest man attending. 
Osborne is 98 years old and 
was raised in Ft. Sumner. He 
currently resides at the Far-
well Convalescent Center and 
has family in Albuquerque. 
I Photo courtesy of Farwell 
Convalescent ('enter]. 

Classified Ms 

Get Results 

Sale On Storm Doors & Windows 

Nil 
,I121 WORLEY 

Installation 
sl Per Window 

• 
FARWELL 

WINTER IS JUST 
AROUND THE CORNER 
PREPARE NOW! 
COMPARE OUR PRICES. 

PLEASANT HILL . 

The Price 

Is Right 

At Don Price's 

MILLS INC. 
Mott's Venetian Blinds 

& Clovis Tent And Awning 

FREE ESTIMATES 

DON PRICE — OWNER 

763-7416 	 2108 PRINCE 

FREE 90 DAY FINANCING 

s 
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WE WILL BUY 
YOUR 

HIGH MOISTURE 

CORN 
UP TO 30% MOISTURE 

WE SHRINK 1.75% 

CALL 
JOHNNY HOPKINS 

EX FEEDERS INC 

CUSTOM CATTLE FEEDING 

P.O. Box 215 	Phone (806) 481-3324 
FARWELL, TEXAS 79325 

• 

REAL ESTATE AND FIXTURES 
10 A.M., Wednesday, Sept. 17, 1980 

1nd and Ave. A 
CEINIVING1144M GROCERY -- FARWELL TEXAS 

BUILDING 
100 x 80 Ft. Block and Brick Building 
with Glass Front, Compressor Shed, 
Flat Roof, Concrete Floor In Good 
Condition. Heating and Refrigerated 
Air Conditioning. 

Sold Bulk and 

Piecemeal 

LEGAL DESCRIPTION 

All of Lot 27 end the East 114 feel 
of Lots 28, 29, 30, 31 and 32, Block 2. 
of the Original Town of Farwell, 
Parmer County, Texas. 

STORE FIXTURES & EQUIPMENT 

1—Toledo Speed—Pak Scale Model 
No. 1010, Serial No. 4218 

1—Toledo Guardian "70' Duplex 
No Springs, Honest Weight Scale, 
Weighs up to 18 Lbs. 

1—J B. Dove & Sons Plaster iron 
Sealer, 3 Rolls Plastic, Serial No. 
61111, Model M.W. 4 

1—National Register (Ounces & Price-
ing Machine) Serial No. 6201774, 
Model No. 191344.5) 

2—Meat Blocks 
1—Meat Cleaver 
1—Toledo HI Speed Meat Saw, Model 

No. 5300, Serial No. 8838, 3 
Phase Motor, 220 Volts. 

1—Hobos Meat Slicer, Serial No. 
1834724, Phase I, Model No. 
1612, 1 4 H.P., 1725 R.P.M. 

1-2-Well Kitchen Sink 
1—Globe Stlmpson Meat Grinder, 

Phase 1, 1 H.P. 

2—Two-All Metal Grocery Carry-Out 
Carts 

1 —Metal Walk-In Cooler 
2—Wooden Walk-In Coolers 
1—Wooden Desk 
1—Desk Chair 
1—VIctor Adding Machine 
7—Green Stamps Dispencers 
12—Shop Lilting Mirrors 
1-30-Cup Collee Pot 
2—National Cash Register Check- 

Out (Old Models) 
21—Grocery Carts 
1—Wooden Shelving (Aprrox. 300' 

with Shelving on Both Sides) 
1—Sale 
3—Carry-Out Carts 
1—Lot Miscellaneous Shelving 
2—Check-Out Counters 

1—Hobart Steakmaster, Serial No. 
135284, Phase 1, 1/4  H.P., 1725 
R.P.M. 

1—Barba-Matte Roaster, Serial No. 
526, 115 Volts 

1 —Barbe-MatIc Warmer, Serial No. 
1684. Model 16 

1-50' Open Top Ref rig. Meat Case 
(Storage Space In Bottom with 
Shutting Doors) 

1-50' Open Top Frozen Food Case 
1—SO' Open Top Fresh Vegetable 

Case (Hooked Up With Water 
Sprayer) 

1—Ice Maker 
1—Ice Freezer 
1—Coke Machine 
1—We ter Fountain 
1—Two-Wheel Dolly (New) 
1—Set Meat Hanging Scales 
2—Four-Wheel Stocking Carts (Like 

New) 

TERMS: Real Estate - 15% at time of sale. 
Monthly payments at 10% interest. 

S.E.A. Reserves Right to 

Reject Any in All Bids. 

Balance 15 years. 

FOR MORE INFORMATION CONTACT 

Jack hulks Auctioneers 
TEE• 011.0053 	thessed aid loaded 

(806) 763-4919 	
Lubbock, Texas 79417 
	P.O. Box 5101 

CHANNEL 9 
ON YOUR CABLE 

-SUPERSTATION- 
WTBS 

A FULL HOUR OF 

WORLD NEWS 
EACH NIGHT 

State Line Tribune, Friday, September 12, 1980-Page 7 
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Cowboys Lasso Steers 

In Fumbling First Game 

Steers Of The Week 

EMILIO PAEZ 

The season's first was a game 
where Farwell fumbled eight 
times, which was almost as 
many points as Plains scored, 
and consequently Farwell lost, 
13-0. "It was a case of 
first-game jitters," said Steer 
head coach Randy Adrian. 

The victorious Cowboys grab-
bed their only two TD's in the 
first nine minutes of the game, 
leaving the rest of the contest 
pretty evenly matched, except 
for those ever-present fumbles. 
"We just couldn't hang on to the 
ball," Adrian stated. 

The Plains opening kickoff 
was received by Emilio Paez 
and Farwell started play on 
their own 25-yard line. But the 
Steers couldn't seem to go much 
further after being hampered by 
a five-yard penalty for illegal 
motion and the beginning of 
their "fumble streak" in the 
backfield. The fumbled ball was 
recovered and moved eight 
yards by Ralph Paez, but the 
fumble was to be the first of 
many setbacks for the Steer 
scoring effort. 

With a fourth down and five 
yards to go, the Steers relin-
quished the ball with a punt. 
Plains gained control of the ball 
and the game and scored their 
first touchdown with 7:26 left in 
the first quarter. Tailback Mike 
Cheatham went over from six 
yards out, and Martin Huerta 
kicked the extra point, and 
Plains led 7-0. 

A kick out of the end zone by 
Plains put Farwell at their 
20-yard line, with Emilio Paez 
pushing the team forward in a 
25-yard run for a first down, 
followed by a 17-yard run for 
another first down. The offens-
ive strategy looked promising 
until the ball was fumbled on a 

Fancy 

Footwork 

RICKY ARMSTRONG 

Ricky Armstrong, junior, 
earned Defensive Steer of the 
Week honors after Friday 
night's game against Plains. 
Armstrong, 177 pound guard, 
recovered a fumble and made 
eight tackles in the Steers' 
opening effort. 

pitch-out to Jack Deaton, again 
giving Plains command. 

A 55-yard pass to Cowboy 
Martin Heurta, waiting patiently 
behind the entire Steer defense 
put the ball on Farwell's 15-yard 
line. The Cowboys then scooted 
the ball forward in three plays 
bringing the second and last TD 
of the night by Steve Crump, 
putting the Steers behind, 13-0. 
The PAT attempt failed as the 
snap was fumbled. 

Again Farwell seized the ball 
in an effort to score, and once 
again lost the ball to Plains on a 
fumble. 

But Plains couldn't move the 
ball enough for a score, and a 
15-yard penalty for an ineligible 
receiver didn't help. A Plains 
fourth down punt game Farwell 
a scoring chance once more. 

But this time, not only were 
they hurt by a fumble causing 
an eight-yard loss, they began 
their short-lived control with an 
incomplete pass. Again they 
surrendered the ball with a punt 
to Plains. 

The two teams continued to 
push each other back and fourth 
on the turf, a series of penalties 
and fumbles for both teams 
keeping the pigskin from cross-
Nig the goal line. Additionally 
Farwell was hindered by two 
pass interceptions during the 
game, restricting their scoring 
efforts. 

Just before the second half, 
Farwell had their fans on the 
edge of their seats. The Steer 
goal venture looked as though a 
TD was in sight, but with 51 
seconds left, the Steers had 
three incomplete passes before 
the buzzer sounded. 

"Fumble-itis" dominated the 
second half, in addition to 
penalties assessed to both sides. 

downs and held onto that lead to 
win the game 13-0 in the season 
opener for both teams. The 
Steers play their first home 
game of the season this Friday 
night when they host Amherst 
beginning at 8 o'clock CDT. 

Steer back Ralph Paez tears 
around right end turning a first 
quarter fumble into an eight-
yard gain in action at Friday 
night's game against the Cow-
boys at Plains. The hosts 
managed two first period touch- 

Emilio Pan, I46-pound back, 
was named Offensive Steer of 
the Week for his performance 
in the Plains-Farwell game 
played Friday night at Plains. 
The junior half back carried 
the pigskin 18 times for 106 
yards for the Blue and White in 
the season opener. 

However, the two teams proved 
to be almost equal in strategy as 
neither team let the other cross 
the goal line. 

The third quarter began with 
a Farwell kickoff to Plains, but 
outstanding defensive plays by 
Steers Byron Mayfield, Emilio 
Paez and Boyd White forced the 
Cowboys into a punting situa-
tion. 

Farwell kept control and once 
more had the fans expecting the 
long awaited TD, but the 
ever-present fumble caused 
them to yield one more time to 
Plains. 

It was a see-saw ball game for 
the duration. "We were inside 
the 25-yard-line four times and 
fumbled," Adrian said. "Once 
we were on the two-yard line 
and fumbled." 

"We could play any team in 
the league if we could just hang 
on to the ball," he said. 

Statistically Farwell stayed 
neck-and-neck with Plains. 
"Fumbles set us back, we need 
to hang on to the ball," the 
coach repeated. 

Coach Adrian was pleased 
with the Farwell fan support. "I 
was really impressed with the 
amount of people that came 
down for the game," he said. 

In closing comments, the 
football coach expressed that he 
"was very proud of the offensive 
line, they looked real good." 

Farwell coaching staff named 
Emilio Paez and Ricky Arm-
strong as Steers of the Week 
following their performancs in 
the Plains game. 

Paez carried the ball 18 times 
for 106 yards and Armstrong 
made eight tackles and recover-
ed a fumble to earn the week's 
honors. 

Coach Adrian also had high 
praise for Alex Paez, defensive 
end; Richard Carpenter, tight 
end; Chris Bristow, left guard; 
and Ralph Paez, corner back. 

Tonight is the first home game 
of the season for Farwell as they 
take on the Amherst Bulldogs at 
3 p.m. 

Coach Adrian is looking 
forward to some tough competi-
tion, and comments that the 
Bulldogs "have a big team 
physically...their defensive line-
backers weigh 202 and 221 
pounds." 

The Bulldogs, however, are 
beginning their season with a 
loss of 14 of their starters to 
graduation and are under the 
leadership of a new coaching 
staff. Adrian noted that Amherst 
lost to Springlake last week, 
33-7. 

Statistics 
Farwell 
	

Plains 

	

14 
	

1st downs 	6 

	

193 
	

Yds. Rushing 	160 

	

30 
	

Yds. Passing 	117 

	

3-8 
	

Passes Att. 	6-8 

	

5 45 
	

Penalties 	10-90 

	

223 
	

Total Yards 	277 

Over ICC - - 

JV's Win Big In Season's First Clash 
played real well, I'm extreme-
ly pleased." 

The JV team was to have 
played Amherst Thursday. 
They will travel to Morton 
September 18 along with the 
7th and 8th grade teams when 
gridiron action begins at 5 p.m. 

MULESHOEs.....„0.freptiA 

• I 

I 

first season victory was a 
serious injury to one of the 
players. 

Slot back and defensive back 
Manuel Cantu suffered a 
broken thigh bone after being 
knocked down while complet-
ing a pass interception. Cantu 
underwent surgery the follow-
ing morning at Lubbock Meth-
odist hospital and will be out of 
action for the rest of the 
season. 

Coach Bill Phillips said he 
though offensively "we did 
super for the first game" and 
observed that defensively "we 

Motor Rewinding & Rebuilding 
• 

Electric Motors 
• 

Air Compressors 
• 

Belts & Pulleys 
• 

Starters & Generators 
• 

679 	 Electrical Supplies 
• 

Berkeley Pumps 
L °oat a IS saes<to  

.... 
210 East Third P.O. Box 

I
Phone 18061 272-4571 
Muleshoe, Texas 79347 

The JV Steers galloped over 
Lubbock Christian JV's with a 
sound score of 20-6 in the 
season opener last Thursday 
night. 

Spectators saw Alan Eubank 
throw a 45-yard pass to Claude 
Gobble for the team's first 
score. 

Eubank then ran the ball a 
good 25 yards for the second 
TD, and a four yard scoot by 
Paul Fulcher completed the 
team's scoring efforts, with the 
extra point made by Ricky 
Sierra. 

A dampener (o the team's 

Farwell Volleyball Team falls To Dora 
Lovett obtained three out 01 
the four Farwell points in the 
match. 

The volleyballers will travel 
to Elida September 16 for their 
next competition. _"I heard 
Elida has a good team," 
Phillips commented, "They 
beat Dora.- 

The Farwell Steerette Vol-
leyball team traveled to Dora 
last week for the season's first 
match. 

Farwell lost 15-2, 15-2 in a 
best out of three game 
situation. Steerette coach Ted 
Phillips acknowledged player 
Kim Lovett as top scorer. 

COURTHOUSE 

NOTES 

Instrument report ending 
September 3, 1980 in county 
clerk office, Bonnie Warren, 
County Clerk. 

WD - Charles H. Caudill - 
Ranza B. Boggess - lot 8, Blk.2, 
Staley Add.Friona. 

a 

	

	WD - Linnie Mae Crook - 
Darrell Crook - lots 13, 14, 15 & 
16, Blk.18. Farwell. 

WD - Leonard Dobbs - James 
E. Colepan - lots 29, 30, 31, 
Blk.7 Farwell. 

WD - Harry G. Hutcheson -
Malcolm Cantle] - lot 12, 
Blk.2,Welch Ac Add. Unit .1, 
Friona. 

WD - Dudley R. Hughes - 
Jane Elizabeth - 1.06 ac. of 
NE/cor SEt4 Sec.4, Blk.E, 

• Synd. 
WD - Oscar G. Guerra - Alan 

D. Clark - lots 4 & 5, Blk.44, 
Friona. 

WD - Donald F. Christian -
Prod. Cr. Asso. - SE' 4 

Sec.16,T1OS;R2E. 
OGL - H.H. Coffield, Est. 

Tricentral US Inc. - NE Li Sec. 
20, Blk. B, Synd. 

All Wrapped Up .  

attack in check after the 
first-quarter scoring spree by 
the host team and the remainder 
of the game was played up and 
down the field with neither team 
managing to cross the double 
stripes. 

Byron Mayfield, the Steers' #70, 
appears all wrapped up in his 
work as he helps down Plains 
quarterback James McElroy 
who had just gained five yards 
on a keeper. The determined 
Steer defense kept the Plains 

"He who knows when to stop runs into no danger." 
Lao-Tse 

rePublic AuctioL 
FOR THE SMALL SUSINESS ADMINISTRATION 2000 Out You Go 

Farwell's Boyd White closes in 
for the kill as Cowboy James 
McElroy returns a punt front 
Steer Brian Langdon. This was 
all part of second quarter action 

in the Farwell-Plains season 
opener played Friday night at 
Plains. White managed to chase 
the Cowboy ball handler out of 
bounds on the Cowboy 42. 

SEED DRILLS 
The Complete Transportable 

Seeding System 

* INCREASED WEIGHT 

* INCREASED CLEARANCE 

* SUPERIOR STRENGTH 

* INCREASED SEED BOX 

CAPACITY 
See Them At 

PLAINS 
EQUIPMENT CO. 

5400 MABRY DRIVE - CLOVIS 



CARD OF THANKS 
I would like to say thank you 

to everyone who has been so 
kind to me since my accident. 
The calls, prayers, cards, 
flowers and visits have been 
deeply appreciated. Special 
thanks go to the Farwell 
Fireboys who were so punctual 
and who, in their knowledge 
and ability, handled the situa-
tion so beautifully. The com-
munity should be especially 
proud of this group and to 
them I am especially grateful. 
Dorothy Quickel and family 

1-1tp 

PIANO IN STORAGE — Beau-
tiful spinet-console stored lo-
cally. Reported like new. 
Responsible party can take a 
big saving on low payment 
balance. Write Joplin Piano, 
Inc., Joplin, Missouri 64801. 

1-1tp 

Phone 

481-3681 

To Place Your 

Want Ad 

-Th.-7C,  • 

Commercial Property 

For Sale 
PRICE REDUCED 

On 2800 square foot com-
mercial building on high-
way in Farwell. Contact 
Rufus Freeman at First 
Federal Savings and Loan 
Association, 801 Pile, 
Clovis. 762-4417. 	38-tinc 

FOR SALE — 25 inch Zenith 
console color TV, good 
shape, beautiful cabinet. 
Priced to sell. 481-3685 after 5 
p. In , 	 47-tfnc 

BUSINESS CARDS? 
Choice of Styles 

and Inks 
at 1.(m. Low Prices 

STATE LINE TRIBUNE 

TWO MINUTES"'  
11/1131 WE BIBLE 

BY CORNELIUS R. SIAM PRES. 
BEREAN BIBLE SOCIETY 

CHICAGO. ILLINOIS 60635 

lb  
Sudderth Realty, Inc. 

& Auction Service 
Box 627 - 109 5th St. - Farwell, Tx. 79325 

Phone [806] 481-3288 or [806] 481-3388 

"Sales And Loans Are Our Service" 

Licensed In Texas & Oklahoma 

OFFICE HOURS 
Monday - Friday, 9 a.m. to 5 p.m. 

Saturday, Call Any Time 

IL 
kE AllOr 

LICENSED AND BONDED TO HANDLE REAL 

ESTATE, EQUIPMENT AND LAND AUCTIONS..  

IF YOU OWN"IT, WE CAN SELL IT. 

WE NEED YOUR 
FARM LISTINGS NOW! 

SPECIALS 
Nice large 3-bedroom, 2-bath house. Utility room. 
Kitchen/dining/den combination. Garage, fenced 
backyard. Priced to sell. 

152 acres dryland, 4 miles northwest of Bovina. Lays 
nearl.. perfect. 

Very nice 1978 Art Craft mobile home. 72x14 feet, 2 
bedrooms, 2 baths. On four lots. 

e ell, lays real good. 160 acres 
••irs. 

Two good 160 acre irrigated farms south of Farwell on 
highway. 

320 acres, irrigated, with circles. Lays nearly perfect. 
Near West Camp. 

160 acres, irrigated, with circle. Excellent water area. 
Three miles east of Lariat. 

80 A. with large two story home, 5 bedrooms, 3 baths, 
2-car garage. Side-row sprinklers and one 8-inch well 
with 125 h.p. motor. Lays on highway, east of Farwell. 
Need immediate sale. 

Super nicr-be*orq, 11/4  bath brick home, 
with garage)n greAt AleighboThood. 

..... 

Commercial property — 840 square foot block 
building on completely paved 100x150 corner lot. 
Some covered parking. 

Quiet country living — nice 3-bedroom, 1 3, 4 bath 
home with fireplace. Small storage building. All 
on five acres, one mile off highway. Need 
immediate sale. 

Ranch-style country home, on 10 acres. 
4-bedrooms, 2 baths, fireplace, carport, large 
kitchen, roping arena, boxcar corrals, completely 
fenced, even has city water. 

Attractive brick home in super neighborhood. 3 
bedrooms, 2 baths, built-in kitchen, home office, 
large double garage, spacious yard. 

Spanish style 2-bedroom, 1-bath house. Garage, 
nice yard. See to appreciate. 

3-bedroom, 2-bath house on 41/2  acres. Fireplace, built-in 
kitchen, double garage. Five miles out, near highway. 

640 A. irrigated. Six 8-inch wells. Two tailwater systems, 
all tiled together. With one four-bedroom house and one 
two-bedroom house. Good Quonset steel barn. 600 A. 
lays nearly perfect. Six miles southwest of Bovina, 
Oklahoma Lane area. 

1285 A. Seven circle sprinklers. Seven 8-inch wells. 
Corrals and feedpens. Trailer house. Priced to sell. 
Owner will finance. 29% down or will take cash. 

640 acres dryland, 34 farm land, 14 grass land. Lays 
perfect. Northwest of Broadview, N.M. 

Two bedroom. 1 bath stucco house, cozy atmosphere 
with Franklin stove. Priced to sell. 

Nice 3-bedraow, 11/2  bathhorce with small 
basement. GoocillocAtion, item- ea‘k/and church. 

320 acres, irrigated, with two electric wells and circles. 
All wheat. Fenced, excellent water area. Near Bovina 
Feeders. 

160 acres, irrigated, circle sprinkler, 2 wells, excellent 
water, insulated steel barn, :1-bedroom house. On 
highway. N.W. of Muleshoe. 

10 acres with nice three-bedroom, two-bath brick 
house. Barns, cattle pens, pasture. West of Bovina. 

234 acres, lays perfect, with very nice 3-bedroom, 2-bath 
brick house. One small stucco house. Metal storage 
building. On pavement north of Bovina. Priced to sell. 

SAVING IS GREAT 
INVEST IN REAL ESTATE 

"Sales and I,o.ths Are Our Service" 

Page 8-State Line Tribune, Friday, September 12, 1980 

Legal Notice 
CITATION BY PUBLICATION GREETING: 

You are hereby commanded 
to appear by filing a written 
answer to the Plaintiff's Peti-
tion at or before ten o'clock 
A.M. of the first Monday after 
the expiration of forty-two 
days from the date of the 
issuance of this citation, same 
being Monday the 20th day of 
October, 1980, at or before ten 
o'clock A.M. before the Honor-
able District Court of Parmer 
County, Texas, at the Court 
house of said County in 
Farwell, Texas. 

Said Plaintiff's Petition was 
filed in said court on the 5th 
day of September, 1980, in this 
cause, number 4770 on the 

FOR RENT — business build-
ing, 703 Avenue A, Farwell. 

60x30 feet. Call Dickie 
Clayton at Horn-Clayton In- 
surance, 481-9246. 	41-tfnc 

THE STATE OF TEXAS 

TO: LOIS ETHEL HARD-
GRAVE, LELA BURTON and 
J. S. BUTCHER, and their 
unknown husband or husbands, 
or wife or wives, each of whose 
present whereabouts and place 
of residence are unknown, and 
if deceased, then their un-
known heirs, assigns, devisees 
and legal representatives, all 
of whom are unknown, and 
whose place of residence are 
unknown, and all unknown 
claimants whose place of 
residence and whereabouts are 
unknown, Defendants, 

FOR SALE — Farwell Farm 
Supply building and two lots. 
Call Floyd Coates, Oklahoma 
Lane Farm Supply, 825-2345. 

52-tfnc 

FOR SALE — Red Delicious 
apples, already picked. Call 
481-9361 or come by 108 Avenue 
I, Farwell. 	 1-ltp 

within ninety days after the 
date of issuance, it shall be 
returned unserved. 

The officer executing this 
process shall promptly execute 
the same according to law, and 
make due return as the law 
directs. 

Issued and given under my 
hand and the seal of said 
Court, at office in Farwell, 
Texas, this the 5th day of 
September, 1980. 

(SEAL) 

docket of said court, and 
styled: 

EUGENE LONSDALE, 
Plaintiff 

vs. 
LOIS ETHEL HARDGRAVE, 
ET AL, 	Defendants 

The names of the parties to 
the cause are as follows: 

LOIS ETHEL HARD-
GRAVE, LELA BURTON and 
J. S. BUTCHER, and their 
unknown husband or husbands, 
or wife or wives, each of whose 
present whereabouts and place 
of residence are unknown, and 
if deceased, then their un-
known heirs, assigns, devisees 
and legal representatives, all 
of whom are unknown, and 
whose place of residence are 
unknown, and all unknown 
claimants, are Defendants. 

A brief statement of the 
nature of this suit is as follows, 
to-wit: 

Plaintiff is suing in trespass 
to try title to recover title to 
and possession of: 

A tract of land (193' x 227.2') 
of Garden Lot 11, Section 31, 
Township 9 South, Range 1 
East, of a Capitol Syndicate 
Subdivision of Parmer Coun-
ty, Texas, described by 
metes and bounds as follows: 
BEGINNING 192.2 feet west 
of an iron stake number 10 
and 11; THENCE West 193 
feet to a point; THENCE 
South 227.2 feet to a point; 
THENCE East 193 feet to a 
point; THENCE North 227.2 
feet to the place of begin-
ning. 
In the alternative Plaintiff 

pleads and invokes the 5, 10 
and 25-year Statute of Limita-
tions as same apply to land 
titles in the State of Texas, as 
is more fully shown by 
Plaintiff's Petition on file in 
this suit. 

If this citation is not served 
within ninety days after the 
date of issuance, it shall be 
returned unserved. 

The officer executing this 
process shall promptly execute 
the same according to law, and 
make due return as the law 
directs. 

Issued and given under my 
hand and the seal of said 
Court, at office in Farwell, 
Texas, this the 5 day of 
September, 1980. 

CAR WASH 

A self-service car wash has 
proven to be a high return 
business. Site Analysis, con-
struction, equipment, parts 
and service. CAR WASH 
EQUIPMENT CO. Call collect 
(214)243-3521. 	 52-3tp 

ATTEST: 
Dorothy Quickel Clerk 
District Court, Parmer 
County, Texas 
By Dorothy Lovelace Deputy 

Published in State Line Tri-
bune Sept. 12, 19, 26 and Oct. 3, 
1980. 

LOSE WEIGHT safely & 
effectively. Face it, you want 
Dex-A-Diet II once a day 
capsules. Rose Drug & Gift. 

52-2tp 

LOST -- Small brown with 
black Chihuahua dog. Reward. 
Call Suzahn Inman, 825-3211. 

52-2tp 

*****************% 

Classified 

Ads 

Get Results 
***************** 

Fatale Mack 06 Cloud 
Leonard Harper-Minister 
Sunday School-10 a.m. 
Morning Worship-10:50 a.m. 
Evening Worship-6 p.m. 

GRAVE, and her unknown 
husband or husbands, each of• 
whose present whereabouts 
and place of residence are 
unknown, and if deceased, then 
their unknown heirs, assigns, 
devisees and legal representa-
tives, all of whom are 
unknown, and whose places of 
residence are unknown, and all 
unknown claimants whose 
place of residence and where-
abouts are unknown, Defen-
dants, 
GREETING: 

You are hereby commanded 
to appear by filing a written 
answer to the Plaintiff's Peti-
tion at or before ten o'clock 
A.M. of the first Monday after 
the expiration of forty-two 
days from the date of the 
issuance of this citation, same 
being Monday the 20th day of 
October, 1980, at or before ten 
o'clock A.M. before the Honor-
able District Court of Parmer 
County, Texas, at the Court 
house of said County in 
Farwell, Texas. 

Said Plaintiff's Petition was 
filed in said court on the 5th 
day of September, 1980, in this 
cause, numbered 4769 on the 
docket of said court, and 
styled: 

REBA MAE JOHNSON, 
Plaintiff 

VS. 
LOIS ETHEL HARDGRAVE, 
ET AL, 	Defendants 
The names of the parties to 

the cause are as follows: 
REBA MAE JOHNSON is 

Plaintiff, and LOIS ETHEL 
HARDGRAVE, and her un-
known husband or husbands, 
each of whose present where-
abouts and place of residence 
are unknown, and if deceased, 
then their unknown heirs, 
assigns, devisees and legal 
representatives, all of whom 
are unknown, and whose 
places of residence are un-
known, and all unknown claim-
ants, are Defendants. 

A brief statement of the 
nature of this suit is as follows, 

Plaintiff is suing in trespass 
to try title to recover title to 
and possession of: 

A tract of land (92.2' X 
227.2') out of Lot 11, Section 
31. Township 9 South, Range 
1 East, Capitol Syndicate 
Subdivision of Parmer Coun-
ty, Texas, described by 
metes and bounds as follows: 
BEGINNING 100 feet west of 
an iron stake numbered 10 
and 11; THENCE West 92.2 
feet to a point; THENCE 
South 227.2 feet to a point; 
THENCE East 92.2 feet to a 
point; THENCE North 227.2 
feet to the place of BEGIN-
NING. 
In the alternative Plaintiff 

pleads and invokes the 5, 10 
and 25-year statutes of limita-
tions as same apply to land 
titles in the State of Texas, as 
is more fully shown by 
Plaintiff's Petition on file in 
this suit. 

If this citation is not served 

Texia 
Fiut Baptist Chock 

Joel Horne-Pastor 
Sunday School-9:30 a.m. 

Morning Worship-10:45 a.m. 
Evening Worship-6:30 p.m. INEXCUSABLE 

Faunii 
Fag Baptist Cklack 
Dudley Bristow-Pastor 
Sunday School-10 a.m. 
Morning Worship-11 a.m. 
Evening Worship-7 p.m. 

while preaching virtue, these 
moralizers practiced vice, and 
God said: "Therefore thou art 
inexcusable, 0 man, whosoever 
thou art that judgest: for where-
in thou judgest another, thou 
condemnest thyself; for thou that 
judgest doest the same things" 
(Rom. 2:11. 

It is the same today. Multi-
tudes of self-righteous people are 
outwardly cultured and moral, 
but they forget that God looks 
upon the heart and sees hate as 
murder, jealousy as theft and 
lustful looks as adultery. He con-
siders, not what we do, outward-
ly, but what we desire to do or 
wish we dared to do. He sees the 
desires and motives of the heart. 

But thank God, "Christ died 
for sinners" — guilty sinners, and 
all who come to God by faith in 
Christ are "justified freely by His 
grace, through the redemption 
that is in Christ Jesus" (Rom. 
3:24). 

Aeoesitifq 06 Gut 
Rev. A.W. Harris 
Sunday School-9:15 a.m. 
Morning Worship-10:30 a.m. 
Evening Worship-6:30 p.m. 

The second chapter of Paul's 
Epistle to the Romans is a dark, 
sad passage, but it opens the door 
to the richest blessing the human 
heart can contain: salvation by 
grace! 

The openingi  words: "Thi ere-
fOre thou art inexcusable.' are 
blunt indeed, but God exposes 
our sinful condition only so as to 
save us from it. 

This is where most philoso-
phies and the Bible clash head-
on. Most philosophies close their 
eyes to the sinful nature of man. 
They argue by and large, that man 
is inherently good, while over-
whelming evidence bears witness 
that he is bad. Therefore human 
philosophy offers no salvation 
from sin and its just penalty. 
Only the Bible does this by '71w 
gospel (good news) of the grace 
of God." 

In Paul's day the Greek phi-
losophers condemned the uncivi-
lized pagans for their open im-
morality and wickedness. But 

Sag 9ou 
CaikaPic Ckunck 

Fr. Juan Jose Montoya, OFM 
Sunday Mass-9 a.m. [MST] 
Confessions 
Sunday-8:30 a.m. {MST) 

Phone 15051763-6468 

(SEAL) 

ATTEST: 
Dorothy Quickel Clerk 
District Court, Parmer 
County, Texas 
By: Dorothy Lovelace De-
puty Itteut .Cigki Baptist Mack 

Thomas J. Spikes-Patstor 
Sunday School-9:4S a.m. 
Morning Worship-11:00 a.m. 
Evening Services-6:30 p.m. 

• 
Published in the State Line 
Tribune Sept. 12, 19, 26 and 
Oct. 3. 1980. 

Citation by Publication 

THE STATE OF TEXAS 

TO: LOIS ETHEL HARD- 

CAPITOL FOODS 
Catuvui 13aptiet Ckwiek 
Carrell Watkins-Pastor 
Sunday School-10 a.m. 
Morning Worship-11 a.m. 
Evening Worship-7 p.m. 

FARWELL 
INSURANCE 

AGENCY, INC. 
Xt. TO-FIRE-U %St. 11 "I 
509 1% e 	- Ph. 181- tii7 I 

FIYou Will Save 
Money 

When You 
Insulate 

LEE'S ELECTRIC 

Wad PexecuW Cluatk 
B. Schwarz-Pastor 
Sunday School-10 a.m. 
Morning Worship-11 a.m. 
Evening Worship-7:30 p.m. SHERLEY-ANDERSON-PITMAN, 

INC. Ohlakasta fan 
Wtetkadiet Mack 

Allen C. Forbis-Pastor 
Sunday School-10 a.m. 
Morning Worship-11 a.m. 
Evening Worship-6 p.m. Ar P. O. BOX 426 

FARPELL. TEXAS 79325 

Farwell Ph. 481.3380 

ROSE DRUG 

& GIFT SHOP 
Prescriptions a Specialty 

481-3281 

The 
CITIZENS BANK 

Texico Branch 
Complete Bank Service 

Member FDIC 

Lu 
WORLEY MILLS INC. 

a4M- 

Ottawa Ian 
&Sig Cktack 

Howard Rhodes-Pastor 
Sunday School-10 a.m. 
Morning Worship-11 a.m. 
Evening Worship-6 p.m. 

CECIL'S LOVELACE 
OIL CO. 

Woodrow Lovelace Ph. 481-9937 

West Camp 
Baptist Clutitck 

Don Kimbrough - Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 6 p.m. 

• 
St. Delue5 

latkenau Ckultk 
Herman J. Schelter-Pastor 
Surtidav School-9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship-10:30 a.m. 

Is ..... ow--sr ===== 

 

Iterit-to-()In 
Color TV 

Washers 	Dryers 	Refrigerators 
No Service Expense 	 No Interest To Pay 

Mon 
Appliance 

117 MAIN 
	

MULESHOE 
	

272-5531 

tt. Ntitiln ED & LEGAL It.1TES: 
First insertion. per %tont - lilt 
Second and additional insertions - Sc 
Minimum charge - 52.00 on cash order 
Card of Thanks - Same as classified %%on! rate 

Double rale for blind ads 
Classified Display - S1.73 per col. inch 

MINIMUM BILLING CHARGE $3.00 

Classified Insertion Deadline For 
Friday's State Line Tribune - 10 a.m. Wednesday 

Lariat Ckundt 06 Ckniet 

L.L. Ginning-Minister 

Sunday School-10 a.m. 
Morning Worship-11 a.m. 
Evening Worship-6 p.m. 

%mutt Riff 
Saptibt Mack 

Bob Reid-Pastor 
Sunday School-9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship-10:30 a.m. 
Evening Worship-7 p.m. 

Test& Baptist Cktack 

FUNDAMENTAL 
INDEPENDENT 
For Information 

Call 481-9208 

flasaim Westalid 

WeLka4liet Dula 
Duane Knowlton-Pastor 
Church School-10 a.m. 
Morning Worship-11.a.m. 

p. Evening Worship-7 m. 



1 e/Avanee..ega 
One Rack Summer Coordinates 

15% off 
One Group Odds & Ends 

S10 each 
One Group Disco Tops & Bottoms 

8 5 each 
"SAVE ON HANES HOSERY" 

New Store Hours: Mon., Tues., Wed., Fri., Sat. 

9 to 5 Texas Time 	Thursday 11 to 8 

(Margie Crooks, Owner) 
812 Ave. A - Farwell 

Hormel 12 Oz. Can 

SPAM 4.19 
BIG BLUE 
BONUS 

SPECIALS 
WITH FILLED BIG BLUE 

BONUS BOOKLETS 

State Line Tribune, Friday, September 12, 1980-Page 9 

0 Berkshire 

Rep Visits 

Farwell 

To Subscribe 
Just Phone 
481-3681 

MOBILE HOMES 
3101 W. 7th STREET 

CLOVIS, NM 
• V. A. LOANS 

• 1.00% DOWN PAYMENT 
• IS YEAR FINANCING 

-WE SERVICE 
WHAT WE SELL" 
NEW HOMES 

1900 2 bedroom $151 month 
19X0:1 bedroom $900 down 
laao 2 bedroom VA $500 initial 
1900 3 bedroom FHA $2111 month 

CAll. 
505-763-3870 

• 

Merrill Smith, right, executive 
secretary of the American 
Berkshire Association, was in 
Farwell Thursday visiting with 
local Berkshire breeders and 
attending the Curry County 
Fair. lie is shown here with 
Claude Rose Jr., left, and Seth 
Ralston as the threesome looks 
at Rose's fair entry "Diabold." 
Merrill, who is traveling 
throughout the United States  

promoting the Berkshire hogs, 
spent some time visiting the 
Roses at their home in Farwell 
and at the Berkshire hog farm 
operated by the local family. 
Located in Springfield, Mass., 
the ABA keeps pedigree re-
cords on purebred Berkshires 
around the nation and offers 
suggestions to hog raisers on 
breeding. 

Nabisco 13 Oz. Chips-Ahoy 

COOKIES 
	

99$ 

• 

APAYWAVVVI.W.W.M.Vev%Vie"......Wv%%%% .̂VVYVV.W.M.Yel.W....WAYWAPIevf 

Schilling 121/2  Oz. Box Enchilada Or Taco 

CASSEROLE 	Box 89' 
Stokely 32 Oz. 

GATORADE 
	

49$ 
Pillsbury 1 lb. Box 

INST. POTATOES 	eel $90  

Ragu 14 Oz. 

SPAGHETTI SAUCE 
	

69' 
Barra 16 Oz. Strawberry 

PRESERVES 
	

79$ 

Kleenex 125 burn 
Boutique 

TISSUE 

5$ 
MTN bkoi Fium BIG BLUE 

an SCOUT 

24 Oz. Crisco 

OIL 

69' 
rm MOI RUM BIG BLUE 

voaur 

Shurfine 
5 lb. Bag 

SUGAR 
4.49 

.Imuoitm 816 BLUE 
101610:ILIT 

Star Kist 61/4  Oz. 

TUNA 99$ 
Casserole 2 lb. Bag 

PINTO BEANS Bag 89' 
Russell's 

Insulation Service 
" 	Travis Russell 

With the cost of heating fuel going up. and the need to cut down on the use of electrical 
energy. it makes good sense to save heat in the winter and conserve air conditioning costs in 
the summer. How can you accomplish both of these objectives at the least cost? Insulate! 

RUSSELLS INSULATION SERVICE located at West of Portales in New Mexico. phone 
478.2488. can completely insulate YOUR home or business so that your fuel consumption will 
be greatly reduced. as will your use of electricity for air conditioning! You might call them 
-the energy saversr.  Specializing in residential and commercial insulating with free 
estimates available 

This reliable f ram features a wide variety of insulating ideas for the conservation-con. 
scious homeowner or businessman. Featuring attic insulation, cellulose insulation. storm 
windows. metal building spray. sound control and existing walls. 

So doyour part to conserve our valuable energy resources. Call RUSSELL'S INSULATION 
SERVICE and arrange for a consultant to assess your insulation needs. The writers of this 
1980 United Merchants Edition suggest that it will be the smartest move you'll make! 
RUSSELLS INSULATION SERVICE would like to take this opportunity and thank all their 
many friends and customers for their continued patronage.  

F-100 PICKUP 

No. 5243 

ONLY 

15 Oz. Pine Sol 

UQUID CLEANER 	Bottle 89' 
Bake-Rite 3 lb. Can 

SHORTENING 

Minute Maid 12 Oz. Can 

OINIGE JUICE 

$1.39 

79$ 

Calif. Sunkist 

ORANGES 

Tex. Firm Head 

CABBAGE 

W. 29' 

Lb. 9' 
Stillwell Big 2 lb. Box 

FRUIT COBBLERS Each $1.49 
VAlson Smoked Picnic 

HAMS 
	

Lb. 98' 
Morton 9 Oz. 

HONEY BUNS 
	

Pkg• 49$ 
Shurfresh 10 Oz. Pkg. 

COLBY CHEESE 
	

Lb  4.29 
Morton 11 Oz. 

T.V. DINNERS 
	

Each 69' 
Shurfresh 12 Oz. Pkg. 

BOLOGNA 
	

Pkg 98' 
Wash. New Crop Red Del 

APPLES 
	

lb. 59$ 
U.S.DA Choice Boneless 

BEEF BRISKET 
	

Lb $1.69 

• 

• 

• 

• 

23 
Per Month 

Tex. New Crop 
YAMS 

• 

Based on a selling price of '5995.00, '600 down, upon approved credit, 

your monthly payment will be '156.23 for 48 months. APR 17.20,6. 

Total amount of payments: 11499.04. 

Hagelgantz 
Big Country Ford and Subaru 

The 
Performers 

2400 E. 
Mabry 

We Redeem U.S.D.A. Food Stamp 

Open Til 9 o'clock Every Night 

Double Stamps On Wednesday 

900 Ave. A Farwell 

Ph. 481.3432 
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Area 

Merchants thall Vontes 22nd 

Annual 

Cal 
Implements 

Jordan 

Serving You With 

EASTERN 
RURAL 

The 

COOPERATIVE 
Finest In 

NEW 
TELEPHONE 

Communications 

MEXICO 

Systems. 

, _ 

-•010.17"---  
ill 
,i+0 

A 
11  

;;:- II  
lit 

Best 

114 
1, 
1.1011 

Bank 

, or? 

Around 

ti 
East of Clovis 

Ph. 

On 

763-5517 

U.S. 60-70-84 joii,  

JOIIN DEERE  TEXICO BRANCH 

481.3109 

LOVELACE 

Woodrow Lovelace 

OIL 

Farwell, 

CO. 

Tex. 

MONSANTO 

RETAIL CENTER 

4131-3366 	 Farwell, Tex. 

SALES 

HiWay 18 N. 

MASSEYEFERGUSON 
& 
762.3726 

SERVICE 

Clovis, N.M. 

Ed & Gene 

Ammo-Pbos 
Anhydrous 

FARWELL FERTILIZER 

Dry Fertilizers 
Animals 

CHEMICALS 
Olin 

DIVISION 

Ph. 481-3844 

- 	 GRAND PRIZE 

2  Tickets To The 	 0 0 

Cotton Bowl Plus $7 5 Cash 

SECOND PRIZE 
2  Tickets To The 	$ 375 PITMAN, 0 

Sun un Bowl Plus 	I 	Cash 

WEEKLY PRIZES 

$1.50 - 1st Place 

$5.00 - 1nd Place 
1. There are 12 football games listed. 
2. Pick the team you think will win in each 	game 

and circle the WINNER'S NAME. 
3. PICK THE SCORE of the GAME OF THE WEEK and 

place your guess in the appropriate blank on the 
entry. Bring or mail the entry blank to The Tribune 

4. Tabulations of individual entrants will be kept all 
season and at the end of the season Grand and 
Second Prize winners will be named. 

5. Only one entry blank may be submitted 	per in- 
dividual. 

6. Tabulations 	be 	for 	inspection.  will 	available 	public  
7. Contestants must be 12 years old or over. 
8. Game of the Week used as the tiebreaker only. 

Luce's 

Friday 	Night 	Buffateria 

Saturday Night 

Spur 
Buffateria 	- 	Daily - 	11 

All You Can 

- 5 p.m.-9 	p.m. 

- 5 p.m.-9 	p.m. 

Banquet 	Facilities - 

a.m.-3 	p.m. 

Eat 

- fish & Baked 

- 	Mexican 	Food 

Homemade Pies 

Restaurant 

Chicken • 	Salad 	Bar 

- 	Salad 	Bar 

In 	Farwell 

SHERLEY-ANDERSON- 

John Williams, 
"SERVING 

INC. 
Mgr. 

PARMER COUNTY FARMERS THE YEAR 

SHERLEY-ANDERSON 
GRAIN 

Lonnie McFarland, 

In 	Lariat 

Mgr. 
'ROUND" 

111) SECURITY STA_TE BANIi 

-, ,- • 

0,-74, Euzv."Kf.f.,TENAs 

_x.,4allik 	rip 	a i i 	1 

In . _ 
____ 

' • 	MB lb ... 

FARWELL 

YDUR AGENT I.,,..../ 	''' 

Ph. 481-9372 

AGENCY 

509 Ave 

or 

INSURANCE 

INC. 

A 

481-3671 

CAVAACK & SONS, INC t 

	

314 MAIN 	CLOVIS, N.M. 
:..1/, 	mcn, 	Wu 	riAtf 	ftamen 	life 

Ournets: ToOpll crioqor9 g jimmy ealmaci2  

iJ 	1 Arp' 

office by 5 p.m. Friday of this issue. 
 

Sardis Shredders 

Semis Blades 

Phone 272-5514 

WOOLEY—HURST 
Your Favorite 

"Sales And 

Hamby 
Miller 

Muleshoe 

Service" 

Dealer 
Kory 

Phares-Wilkens 

INC • 

Wagons 

Grain Carts 

W. Hi Way 70-84 

Ph. 481-3838 

481-9093 

Custom 

- 

INTERSTATE 

Seeds - 

- 	Off. 

Whse. 

Application 
Anhydrous Ammonia 

- 

FERTILIZER, 
Custom 

- Chemicals 

Blends 

INC. 

500 N. 9th 

Farwell, 	Tex. 

. 

,. 

WORLEY 

LIM. 

( 	' 

Wi 

f ir 

MILLS INC. 

Air wig 1_,....11 
', 

''1' 

ENTRY BLANK 
NAME 

701 Ave A 

Insurance 

Horn-Clayton 

"To Be Sure 
Farwell 

Agency 
-Insure" 

481-9246 

ADDRESS 
PICK SCORE FOR THIS GAME 

1171A\ FARWELL, 
P. 0. BOX 426 

TEXAS 79325 Amherst 	 at Farwell 

* 
FAR-, 	FEEDERSINC. 

OKLAHOMA 
"'"Agr iculture 

LANE FARM 
Is Our 

Every Need For The 

Caldwell Shredders - Hamby 

Ph. 825-2345 

225-2146 

SUPPLY 
Business" 
Farmer 

Tools 

CIRCLE YOUR CHOICE 

1. Lubb. Christian at Texico 

2. Kress at Crosbyton 

3. Hart at Shallowater 

4. Nazareth at Sp'Lake-Earth 

5. Sudan at Bovina 

6. Boys Ranch at Friona 

7. Sunray at Vega 

8. Abernathy at Olton 

9. Kentucky at Oklahoma , 
10. Texas A&M at Georgia 

11. West Texas at Okla. State 

12. N. Carolina at Texas Tech 
• Texico, 

481-3471 --" 

CUSTOM CATTLE FEEDING 

P.O. Box 215 	Phone(806)481-3524 
FARWELL, TEXAS 79325 

JOHNNY HOPKINS, MGR. 	RES. (505) 389-5302 

300 

TWIN 

Ave A 

CITIES MACHINE WORKS 

Farwell, Tex. 

Pt 
•--......  ,... 
...1 

,„4.....e.  

JJ' s MOBILE 	, 
HOMES, INC. 

P.O. Box 412 	801 Wheeler Ave. 

New Mexico 88135 	• 
Phone 505-482-3341 

. 	- _ 

• 

4 

G 
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