
Double Barreled Thanks 

First Place Winner 

New Postmaster 
Weldon Smith, left, was sworn 
in as the postmaster of Texico 
Post Office on Wednesday, 
Sept. 18, replacing Mrs. Louise 

Engram who retired from that 
position in April of this year 
after serving as postmaster 
since 1965. Officiating at the 

swearing-in ceremony was 
K.P. Primrose of Roswell, 
right, manager of the sectional 
center of this postal district. 
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Coronation Today At 3 - - 

Bennie Raney, center, of 
Capitol Foods received plaques 
of appreciation from both the 
Texico and the Farwell cham-
bers of commerce. John Had-
ley of Texico, left, and Don 

Steer Spirit Soars 

For '82 Homecoming 
bration. For his initial effort in 
organizing this event, Haney 
got 32 area merchants to 
participate, and he commented 
that the promotion would be 
"bigger and better" next year. 

Williams of Farwell, right, 
made the awards to Haney in 
appreciation for his efforts in 
promoting the merchants 
drawing program as part of 
the Border Town Days cele- 

Chrysler Corporation and the 
United Auto Workers renewed 
their work contract last week. 
Exact terms were not made 

S public, but a good guess is that 
wages went up, or if wages 
didn't, then other work benefits 
did. 

About the only thing we 
know for sure is that there was 
not any member of the taxpay-
ing public taking part in the 
negotiations. We are also 
positive that Chrysler is still 
working on capital guaranteed 
by the U.S. Treasury. 

If such be the case, it would 
appear that the public had a 
stake in the labor settlement 
contract and deserved some 
consideration by both labor 
and management. 

It does seem odd to us that 
both the UAW and Chrysler 
could think that the Company 
can sell more cars by raising 
the price. Of course Tip O'Neill 
thinks we can buy prosperity 

• by going deeper in debt. 
The new morality, the news-

peak, and the new economics 
leaves us older folks bumfuz-
zled. 

Chacho Arce Is First - - 

Tiebreaker Game Scores 
Determine Two Winners 

As proof that we more 
seniors are out of communica-
tion, here is a bit of verse from 
one Viola Brooks who is a 
resident of the Golden Age 

10 Rest Home in Clovis. We hope 
you will enjoy her verse. 

COMMUNICATION GAP 

Student Council skit, and the 
singing of the school's alma 
mater by the senior class. 

All area fans, parents, and 
friends are urged to attend the 
pep rally, the enchilada sup-
per, and the big game to cheer 
the Steers on to victory. 

Following the game the 
Booster Club is sponsoring a 
reception for all Steer boosters 
and ex-students. The reception 
will be at the home economics 
building immediately following 
the game. 

At 10:30 p.m. the homecom-
ing dance will get underway in 
the old gym. KSEL from 
Lubbock will provide the disco 
for the dance which is 
sponsored by the Senior Class 
Parents. Admission is $3 per 
person or $5 per couple. Light 
refreshments will be served, 
and the dance will end at 1:30 
a.m. 

So, all you fans, put on your 
blue and white duds and attend 
all the homecoming festivities. 

large;Jay Anderson and Tam-
by Obenshain, senior candi-
dates; Raymond Sierra and 
Shelley Ford, junior candi-
dates; Roger Robertson and 
Denise Ford, sophomore can-
didates; and Tyson Carpenter 
and Kristen Davis, freshman 
candidates. 

Today's pep rally culminates 
a week of Crazy Days that 
have helped get the spirit train 
in motion. 

Monday was crazy hair day 
(forgive us Vidal Sassoon and 
Mr. Kenneth, or yawn); Tues-
day was 50's day; Wednesday 
was plaid day; Thursday was 
inside-out day; and today 
(Friday) is dress up day when 
everyone dons his best to show 
his pride in being a part of 
Farwell High Homecoming 
1982. 

In addition to the coronation 
of the Homecoming Royalty, 
the pep rally will feature a 
special dance by the varsity 
and junior high cheerleaders, a 

class member or may be 
bought at the door. 

At halftime of the big game, 
a tradition started several 
years ago by the Booster Club 
will again be highlighted when 
the Coming Home Queens 
(Homecoming Queens of 10, 20 
and 30 years ago, 1952-53, 
1962-63, 1972-73) will be intro-
duced. This will be in addition 
to the introduction and recog-
nition of this year's queen and 
the homecoming court. 

Coming Home Queens to be 
honored are Rose Atchley 
Cassady of Gruver, queen in 
1952; Bonnie Cochran Clayton 
of Bovina, queen in 1962; and 
Caroline Anderson Lewis of 
Lubbock, queen in 1972. Mrs. 
Lewis will be unable to attend 
the game; however Mrs. 
Cassady and Mrs. Clayton plan 
to be here for the festivities. 

Candidates for this year's 
king and queen honors are 
Gary Haseloff and Kelly Davis, 
seniors and candidates-at- 

A rip-roaring pep rally this 
afternoon (Friday) at 3 p.m. in 
the gym will take up where the 
spirit-rousing bonfire left off 
Thursday night to get the 
Steers and Steer fans psyched 
up for the Farwell home-
coming game with the Sea-
graves Eagles tonight at 8 p.m. 
CDT. 

The pep rally, which is to be 
dedicated to the seniors, will 
be highlighted by the corona-
tion of the Homecoming Queen 
and King. All football fans and 
school supporters, and espec-
ially the parents of the seniors, 
are encouraged to attend 
today's pep rally. 

Activity won't let up until 
1:30 a.m. Saturday when the 
homecoming dance winds down 
and Homecoming '82 will be 
officially over. 

Starting at 5 p.m. the junior 
class will be serving an enchil-
ada supper at the school 
cafeteria. Tickets may be 
purchased from any junior 

Many Thefts Reported Across County 

• 

REMEMBER when "Hippie" 
meant big in the hips, 

And a "Trip" involved travel 
in cars, planes or ships. 

When "Pot" was a vessel to 
cook things in, 

And "Hooked" was what 
Grandmother's rug might 
have been. 

When "Fix" was a verb that 
meant mend or repair. 

And "Be-In" meant simply 
existing somewhere. 

When "Neat" meant well or-
ganized, tidy and clean, 

And "Grass" was a ground 
cover, normally green. 

Nazareth over Hart, Peters-
burg over Kress, Springlake-
Earth over Anton, Sundown 
over Lazbuddie, Southwestern 
Louisiana over West Texas, 
Texas Tech over Air Force, 
Texas over Utah, Oklahoma 
over Kentucky, and Notre 
Dame over Michigan. 

Everyone has a chance to 
win one of the weekly contest 
checks, so get your guessing 
game in gear and try your 
hand and get your entry in 
each week. 

Contestants must be 12 years 
of age or older, and only one 
entry per person will be 
accepted. Entries must be 
returned by 5 p.m. CDT Friday 
to the Tribune office, of if 
mailed, must have a Friday 
postmark. 

Tabulation of all entries are 
kept on record at the Tribune, 
and are always available for 
inspection. 

Dannheim, 62 points off. 
Leader in the overall contest 

after three weeks is Charles 
Dannheim with a total of 28 
points. In second place with 27 
points total are Chacho Arce, 
Dianne Dannheim, Linda Fipps, 
James Harding, Jane Kent, 
Teresa King, and Emilia Mar-
tinez. (See contest standings 
for the first five places else-
where in paper.) 

The Texico High School 
computer still leads the Texico 
Math Class by a good margin, 
but its programmer Ronnie 
Warmuth is leading the com-
puter, and one of his students, 
Emilia Martinez, is leading the 
group. 

For all of the out-of-area 
readers who play the contest 
among family members and 
are unable to get the local 
scores, winners of last week's 
contest games were Texico 
over Eunice, Bovina over 
Morton, Lockney over Olton, 

Due to the Farwell Steers 
swatting the Sudan Hornets 
last week by the lopsided score 
of 62-0, the point spreads of the 
tiebreaker game scores were 
extremely high in the Mer-
chants Football Contest, result-
ing in much figuring to deter-
mine the top two winners. 

Chacho Arce of Farwell was 
one of four contestants to pick 
11 games correctly, but he won 
the first place weekly prize of 
$7.50 by being (only) 42 points 
off on the tiebreaker game 
score. Arce picked Farwell 
over Sudan by the score of 
26-6. 

Charles Dannheim of Ama-
rillo was the second place 
winner, and he received a $5.00 
check for his efforts. He also 
picked 11 of the 12 games 
correctly but he was 55 points 
off on the tiebreaker. 

Also picking 11 correct 
games were Lonnie McFar-
land, 59 points off, and Eileen 

•
When "Lights" and not people 
were switched on and off, 

And a "Pill" might have been 
what you took for a cough, 

When "Groovy" meant fur-
rowed with channels and 
hollows, 
And "Birds" were winged 
creatures like robins and 
swallows. 

Sharon Ford of San Angelo 
reported $700 worth of items 
taken from her car on the 
night of September 19. In her 
report to Sheriff Morgan on 
September 20, she listed cloth-
ing, a television, and records 
among the items taken from 
her car when she left it sitting 
on the side of the highway. 

On September 20, Thomas 
Gonzales of Farwell reported a 
three- or four-month-old black 
and white face calf stolen or 
strayed from his property 
behind the Sherley-Anderson-
Pitman elevator. 

irrigation well about Septem-
ber 15. It was valued at $53. 

Lawrence Widner of Bovina 
reported that a 150-pound hog 
was stolen about September 17. 
The hog is valued at $300. 

On September 19, John 
Carlson of Farwell reported 
some truck motor parts stolen 
on the night of the 18. 

Johnny Stewart reported on 
September 20 that a plate glass 
window was shot out of a 
building at Second Street and 
Avenue A in Farwell. The 
window is thought to have been 
shot out about September 17. 

To Distribute Surplus Cheese 

When "Fuzz" was a substance, 
fluffy like lint, 

• 
And "Bread" came from ba-
kers, not from mints. 

When "Roll" was a bun, and 
"Rock" was a stone, 

And "a Hang-up" was some-
thing you did with a phone. 

The Department of Human 
Resources will be distributing 
surplus cheese at the Parmer 
County Courthouse in Farwell 
on Friday, Oct. 1, reports 
Pearl Cervantez of the Bovina 

was fined $300 plus court costs 
and sentenced to 30 days in 
jail. 

On September 17, Vichit 
Moungkhounpradith, 22 of Clo-
vis was arrested by county 
sheriff's officers on a New 
Mexico warrant for aggravat-
ed battery and false imprison-
ment. 

Joe Mendoza, 22, of Friona 
was arrested by the THP 
officers on September 19, for 
DWI and was fined $300 plus 
court costs and was given 30 
days in jail. 

On September 15, Ronald 
Byrd of Farwell reported the 
theft of a chrome grill from the 
right front of a 1980 Chevrolet 
pickup. The grill, valued at 
$55, was reportedly taken 
sometime within the last three 
weeks. 

On September 17, Don Mc-
Donald of Lazbuddie reported 
a battery stolen from an 

Neighborhood Center. 
Distribution will begin about 

8:30 a.m. and applications for 
qualification for the cheese will 
be available at the courthouse 
that day. 

Parmer County Sheriff Bill 
Morgan reports that his de-
partment has been busy the 
past week investigating num-
erous thefts and burglaries in 
various parts of the county. 
Several arrests were also 
reported by the sheriff's 
department. 

Sheriff Morgan said that on 
September 20, Richard Dimas, 
17, Jessie Nava, 18, Luis Ruiz, 
17, and Valentine Castillo, 17, 
all of Friona, were arrested by 
the Friona police department 
on a charge of burglary. 
Dimas was released on $2,000 
bond and his case is pending 
grand jury investigation. The 
other three are being held 
pending grand jury investiga-
tion. 

Sheriff Morgan also reported 
that on September 14, Fred 
Carrell, 47, of Stinnett was 
arrested by the Texas Highway 
Patrol Officers for DWI. He 

Weldon Smith New Texico Postmaster 

When "Chicken" meant poul-
try, and "Bag" was a paper 
sack, 

When "junk" was trashy cast 
• offs and old bric-a-brac, 

And "Cat" was a feline, a kit-
ten grown up, 

And "Tea" was a liquid you 
drank from a cup. 

having been there for some 
time. Included in the group are 
Mrs. Rada Winkles, Mrs. 
Thelma Venable, Paul Skaggs, 
and Orville Scott, with John 
Hadley and Mrs. Sue Harris as 
substitute mail route carriers. 

The Smiths have two child-
ren, Lisa, 17, who is a senior in 
Tucumcari and will graduate 
there; and Lonnie, 15, who will 
be starting as a sophomore at 
Texico this week. Smith says 
they are looking forward to 

getting settled in Texico, "But 
we just couldn't talk Lisa into 
the move until after gradua-
tion." 

Smith is joining a well 
seasoned crew at the post 
office with all other employees 

Chacho Arce of Farwell, left, 
was first place winner in last 
week's Merchants Football 
Contest. He accepts a check 
for $7.50 from Johnnie Rundell 

of Farwell Insurance Agency, 
one of the contest sponsors. 
Arce correctly picked 11 of the 
12 games listed and missed the 
tiebreaker game score by 42 

points. The other three contest-
ants who picked 11 right were 
further from the tiebreaker 
score due to the Steers' 
lopsided win last Friday night. 

When "Swinger" was someone 
who swings in a swing, 

And a "Pad" was a sort of 
a cushiony thing, 

When "Way-out" meant dis-
tance, and far, far away, 

And a man couldn't sue you for 
111) 	calling him "Gay." Texas - - 

Voter Registration Deadline Is Oct. 3 
county or political subdivision 
conducting the election, and 
registered to vote. 

tion card, contact your county 
Voter Registrar, or call the 
Secretary of State's Office toll-
free at 1-800-252-9602. • Parmer County potential 
voters may obtain a voter reg-
istration card from Hugh 
Moseley, county tax assessor, 
at the courthouse. 

All Texans not currently 
registered to vote must do so 
by October 3, 1982, in order to 
vote in the November 2 general 
election. 

To be eligible to vote, poten-
tial voters must be a citizen of 
the United States, at least 18 
years of age on the day of the 
election, a resident of the 

Words once so sensible, sober 
and serious, 

Are making these freak-sence 
like psyche-delirious, 

It's "Groovy" man, groovy; 
English it's not, 

Me thinks that the language 
has gone straight to POT. 

The reason some people get 
lost in thought is because they 
are in unfamiliar territory 

In the good old days the 
government lived within its 
income and without most of 
ours. 

Young Texans may register 
to vote if they are at least 17 
years and 10 months of age, 
but may not vote until they 
reach 18 years of age. 

To obtain a voter registra- 

Hollene Cem. Association To Meet Sat. 
*** garden tools deemed necessary 

for the clean-up work. 
Lunch will be served at 12 

o'clock. 

Interested persons are asked 
to meet at the cemetery at that 
time and are reminded to 
bring lawn mowers and other 

Hollene Cemetery Associa-
tion will have its fall meeting 
and clean-up day on Saturday, 
Sept. 25, starting at 9 a.m. 

Weldon Smith, formerly of 
Tucumcari, officially assumed 
duties as postmaster at the 
Texico Post Office on Septem-
ber 18, replacing Mrs. Louise 
Engram who retired from that 
position in April of this year. 
Mrs. Engram had served as 
Texico postmaster since 1965. 

Smith was born and reared 
in Melrose and lived there until 
he joined the Navy in 1956. He 
served as a radio operator on a 
ship in the Pacific for four 
years, and also received his 
high school equivalency certifi-
cate while serving in the Navy. 

Following his discharge from 
the service, Smith moved to 
Tucumeari where he operated 
a gas station for about four 
years. It was during this time 
that he met and later married 
his wife, Bertha. 

He joined the postal service 
18 years ago in Tucumcari 
where he worked as a 
distribution clerk. Smith says 
he received most of his postal 
education as "on the job" 
training, once replacing the 
postal service supervisor of 
operations for five months last 
year until a new postmaster 
could be appointed. 

The position of postmaster is 
a permanent position, and, 
says Smith, "If I like it, I'll 
stay." He also says, "I am 
looking forward to serving the 
community and maintaining 
good mail service." • 

The Bible says that the meek 
will inherit the earth, but I'm 
not so sure they want it. 
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Splashy Intersection 

Calculations Used To Determine 
Effective Tax Rate 

1. ASSUMPTIONS 

2. IA1 1981 Total Tax Levy from the 1981 Tax Roll (Assumption No. 1) 	  
(El) Subtract 1981 Taxes Levied for Maintenance and Operation (MR0) on 

Property in Territory that Has Ceased to he a Part of the Unit in 
1982 (Assumption No. 5) 	S 

(C) Subtract 1981 Debt Service (I&S) Levy (Assumption No. 3)  	- S 
(D) Subtract 1981 Taxes Levied for Maintenance and Operation (M&O) on Taxable 

Value of Property Becoming Exempt in 1982 (Assumption Nn. 6) 	 
Subtract .  1981 Taxes Levied for Maintenance and Operation (M&O) on Taxable 
Value of Property Lost Because Property is Required to be Appraised in 1982 at Less 
chatXMarket Value (Assumption No. 71 	  

(F) Subtract Frozen Maintenance and Operation (M1540) Tax Levy of Over-65 
Homesteads with Frozen Taxes (Assumption No. 13) 	- $ 

(C) Adjusted 1981 Tax Levy for Calculation 

706,188 

-o- 
86,274 

.21,925 

- s 	  

9,707  
s. 	 586,282 

3. IA) Adjusted 1981 Tax Levy for Calculation (2C above) 	  
(B) Divided by Adjusted 1982 Taxable Value for Calculation DE above) 	 

Multiplied by 5100 valuation 	  
IC) Calculated Maintenance and Operation (NI&O) Rate for 1982 	  

S 	586,282 
$ 61.343.903 
S 	95 	X 	0( 955 	:1100 1 s 	588 

INTEREST AND SINKING RATE FOR 1982 

4 (A) 1982 Tax Levy Needed to Satisfy Bonded Indebtedness or Debt Service (ISIS) 
(Assumption No. 11) 	  

(II) Subtract Frozen Interest and Sinking (l&S) Tax Levy of Over-65 Homesteads with 
Frozen Taxes (Assumption Nn. 14)  	- S 	1,664  

IC) Adjusted 1982 Tax Levy for Debt Service (15S) 	  S 	68,548  
(D) 1982 Total Taxable Value of All Property !Assumption No. 8) 	  5 62.694.033 

90, 213 

(El Subtract 1982 Taxable Value of Over-65 Homesteads with Frozen Taxes 	1,267,110 
(Assumption No. 121  	

s 
 

(F) Adjusted 1982 Taxable Value for IhS 	  $ 61,426,323  

(C) Divide the Adjusted 1982 Tax Levy (or Debt Service ithS1 (4C above) by the 
Adjusted 1982 Taxable Value for IhS (4F above) 	  

$ 	 5. 001442  

Multiplied by $100 Valuation 
(H) Calculated Interest and Sinking OS) Rate for 1982  	5  .1442 )4:is

Si10000 

5. IA) Calculated Maintenance and Operation (1.1&01 Rate for 1982 I3C above] 
1442 $100 

(C) Calculated 1982 Effective Tax Rate 	  
(B) Add Calculated Interest and Sinking Rate 1I&S) for 1982 1411 above)  	$  

	 $  .9558 S100 

$  1.10  

1982 Ef ethyl! Tax fluter is the tax rote pubhshed by the tax nese.!“nr. ns required hs. Sec 2t: 04 of the 

Property Tax Code. See sample form ou puge 18 

MAXIMUM TAX RATE 

1. IA) Calculated 	1982  Effective Tax Rate (5C above) 	  
(13) Multiplied by Three Percent (3%) 	  
(C) Equals Amount of Increase Allowed by Code 	  
(DI 1982 Maximum Tax Rate 11A • IC. above) 	

 

1. 1981 Total Tax Levy from the 1981 Tax Roll 	  

2. 1981 Tax Rate (S LOS  M50 and S 0 .15  IhS) 	  

1 	10 • 7Sino 

s  

s 

s  

S 

$ 

s 

.03 
X 03 

1.13 SI00 

7061:21088 

3. 1981 Debt Service (1.58) Levy 	  

4. 1981 Maintenance and Operation (M&O) Levy 	  SIM  8187,927 144 617,914  

5. 1981 Taxes Levied for Maintenance and Operation (M&OI on Property in Territory 	
- 0- That Has Ceased to be a Part of the Unit in 1982 	  

0. 1981 Taxes Levied for Maintenance and Operation (M&O) on Properly Becoming 
Exempt in 1982 21,925 

7. 1981 Taxes Levied for Maintenance and Operation (M&01 on Taxable Value of 
Property Lost Because Property is Required to be Appraised in 1982 at Less than Markel 
Value 	  -0- 

$ 	  

s  62,694,033 

s  82,420  

8. 1982 Total Taxable Value of All Property 	  

9. 1982 Taxable Value of New Improvements Added Since January I. 1981 	 

10. 1982 Taxable Value of Property Added Since January I. 1981, by Annexation of 
Territory 	  $ 	-0-- 

90,213 

.„1,267,710 

11 1982 Tax Levy Needed to Satisfy Bonded Indebtedness or Debt Service 116161 	 

12. 1982 Taxable Value of Over-65 Homesteads with Frozen 'Fasts 	  

13 Frozen Maintenance and Operation (11 /41510) Tax Levy of Over-05 Homesteads with 
Frozen Taxes 	  9.107 

14. Frozen Interest and Sinking (I&S) Tax Levy of Over-65 Homesteads with Frozen 
Taxes 	  1,664 

II. CALCULATION 

MAINTENANCE AND OPERATION (M&O) TAX RATE FOR 1981 

(A) 1982 Total Taxable Value of All Property (Assumption No 8) 	 562,694,033  

(B) Subtract 1982 Taxable Value of New Improvements Added (Assumption No.9) 	s 	82,420  
ICI Subtract 1982 Taxable Value of Property Added by Annexation (Assumption 

No. 10) 	  
(DI Subtract 1982 Taxable Value of Over-65 Homesteads with Frozen Taxes 

(Assumption No. 12) 	  
(E) Adjusted 1982 Taxable Value for Calculation 	  

- s 	  

$l, 267  , 710  

S 61,343,503  
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Fire Safety Tips 
By David Kube 

Cool weather is here once 
again and many people are 
beginning to light their fur-
naces and burn their fire-
places. Before you heat your 
home with either of these 
methods, make sure your flue 
and chimney are clean of soot 
and debris. Filters of furnaces 
should also be checked and 
replaced, if necessary. Soot, 
dust and debris can be very 
dangerous, but with the proper 
precautions you can LEARN 
NOT TO BURN. 

The Farwell Independent School 

District Board will meet Monday, 

September 27 at 8 p.m. in the 

Superintendents Office for the 

purpose of setting a new tax rate 

for the District. 

Farwell Independent School District 

Farwell, Texas 

Welcome Rain Falls 
On Twin Cities Area 

Notice Of Calculation Of Effective Tax Rate 

And Publication Of Estimated Unencumbered Fund Balances • 
The Twin Cities were treated 
to a hard afternoon rain late 
Tuesday afternoon that 
brought from .3 inch to 
one-half inch of moisture. 

intersection in Farwell. The 
Trib photog got water in the 
window twice before getting 
this "wet" shot. 

Local drivers not being used to 
water in the gutters made a 
big splash as they crossed the 
Third Street and Avenue C 

I, Ron Proctor, Chief Appraiser, Tax Assessor, and Tax Collector for the Farwell 
Independent School District, in accordance with the provisions of Sec. 26.04 of the Property 
Tax Code, have calculated the tax rate which may not be exceeded by more than three 
percent by the governing body of the Farwell Independent School District without holding a 
public hearing as required by the code. That rate is as follows: $1.10 per $100 of value. 

The estimated unencumbered balances for Maintenance & Operation Fund: $48,540.85. 
The estimated unencumbered balances for Interest & Sinking Fund: $28,570.74. 

Ron Proctor 

Chief Appraiser, Tax Assessor, and Tax Collector 

At Curry County Fair - - 

FFA, 4-H Livestock Sale 

Nets '11,268 For Members 
September 20, 1982 

• 

• 

shire; Dena McDaniel - 3rd 
Light Spot; Penny Pierce - 2nd 
Light Spot, 2nd Medium Cross, 
5th Light Duroc, 7th Heavy 
Hampshire; Robin Pierce - 6th 
Light Cross, 4th Medium 
Duroc; Danny Powell - 7th 
Light Hampshire, 3rd Medium 
Cross; Larry Powell - 1st Light 
Hampshire; 

Also, Danny Reid - 11th Light 
Hampshire, 15th Medium Dur-
oc; Martin Singleterry - 11th 
Heavy Duroc; Melissa Single-
terry - 17th Light Cross; Sheila 
Smith - 10th Heavy Spot; Steve 
Smith - 5th Light Cross, 5th 
Heavy Cross; Michelle Smith -
15th Light Cross; 

And, Tyler Smith - 16th & 
19th Light Cross; Joe Steward -
7th Light Spot, 9th Light 
Hampshire; Kevin West - 2nd 
Chester, 5th Medium Cross, 9th 
Heavy Duroc, 10th Heavy 
Hampshire; Terry Whitener -
9th Heavy Hampshire, 12th 
Light Duroc, 7th, 15th, and 16th 
Heavy Duroc, 12th Light Cross, 
11th Medium Cross. 

Lamb Exhibitors and their 
placings included: Chad 
Barnes - 2nd Light White-face 
Medium Wool lamb; Justin 
Barnes 8th; Marcus Schaaf -
3rd Class I fine wool lamb, 4th 
Heavy Blackface Cross; Caro-
lyn Smith - 12th Suffolk lamb; 
Brette Southard - 13th Suffolk. 

Jubal Pierce placed 8th with 
his medium light cross steer. 

• 

Pierce, $744, hog; Justin 
Barnes, $385, lamb; Jubal 
Pierce, $1,183.60, steer; and 
Brette Southard, $420.75, hog. 

Those who exhibited hogs 
and their placings included: 

Christi Barfield - 13th Heavy 
Hampshire, 10th Medium Cross; 
Codie Burch - 1st Light Cross, 
14th Medium Duroc; Stanley 
Cross - 15th Medium Cross; 
Michael Day - 6th Chester; 
Tonya Dunsworth - 11th Medi-
um Duroc; 17th Medium 
Cross; Eric Harding - 6th 
Medium Cross; 

Also, Jeff Holland - 3rd 
Chester; 2nd Light Hampshire, 
8th Light Duroc;Wayne Hol-
land - 5th Light Hampshire, 
2nd Medium Duroc, 10th Light 
Cross; Kathy Lingnau - 7th 
Chester, 12th Heavy CroSs; 
Elias Orozco - 6th Light Duroc, 
4th Medium Cross; Urbano 
Orozco • 5th Medium Duroc, 
11th Heavy Hampshire; Benjy 
McDaniel - 2nd Light Cross; 

And, Cory McDaniel - 1st 
Light Duroc, 8th Heavy Hamp- 

Nineteen members of Texico 
FFA, Texico 4-H, and Pleasant 
Hill 4-H clubs came away from 
the Curry County Junior Live-
stock Sale with $11,268.05 The 
sale on Saturday morning, 
Sept. 11, completed a week-
long series of competition in 
livestock events at the Curry 
County Fair. 

Those who sold animals and 
the prices received include: 

Texico FFA - Kevin West, 
$544.50, hog; Jeff Holland, $549, 
hog; Danny Powell, $684.75, 
hog; Elias Orozco, $679.25, 
hog; and Eric Harding, $632.50, 
hog; 

Texico 4-H - Cory McDan-
iel, $592.50, hog; Marcus 
Schauf, $412, lamb; Larry 
Powell, $508.50, hog; Codie 
Burch, $517.50, hog; Benjy Mc-
Daniel, $522.70, hog; Wayne 
Holland, $484, hog; Dena Mc-
Daniel, $627, hog; and Steven 
Smith, $464, hog; 

Pleasant Hill 4-H - Chad 
Barnes, $517. lamb; Penny 
Pierce, $799.50, hog; Robin 

at the Archie Tarter home on 
First Street measured .55. 

Only .1 of an inch was 
reported at the Lariat elevator 
while it was reported that the 
Clarence Meeks farm at 
Pleasant Hill received 11/2  
inches. Also reportedly re-
ceiving 1 inch and one-half 
inch on two places were the 
Ralph Franse farms south of 
town, while only .1 of an inch 
was called in from Oklahoma 
Lane. One-hall inch fell at the 
Ted Magness farm southeast of 
Farwell. 

Golden West Seed in Texico 
had 1/2  inch in their gauge, and 
it was reported that Arthur 
Mitzelfelt reported 1.30 inches 
at his home on 21st Street in 
Clovis. 

Farwell streets and dips 
looked like they received more 
moisture than was measured 
as cars plowed through the 
puddles and rivers left by the 
fall rainstorm. 

Rain fell in varied amounts 
across sections of Curry and 
Parmer Counties Monday 
night, bringing mixed emotions 
from area farmers, although 
benefits from the moisture 
probably out-weighed any det-
riment. 

The moisture did slow the 
corn harvest for those who had 
early corgi; however, some 
corn in the area was still being 
irrigated at mid-veek, 

Area cotton fields and some 
grain sorghum patches had 
used up their moisture supplies 
and were also needing a drink, 
and early wheat especially 
welcomed the gentle rain. 
Some farmers were awaiting 
rainfall prior to planting their 
wheat; so the moisture was 
also particularly fine on the 
listed wheat ground. 

Fred Chandler reported that 
the rain gauge at Sherley-An-
derson-Pitman in Farwell 
showed .3 inch while the gauge 

To State Convention 
Five area residents traveled 

to Austin recently to represent 
Parmer County as delegates 
and alternates to the 1982 
Republican State Convention. 
Among those serving as dele-
gates were Martin Kube, 
Frank Hinkson, Mrs. Frank 
Hinkson, Garvin Thorn, and 
Mrs. Garvin Thorn. 

More than 6500 delegates and 
alternates from throughout the 
state attended the 1982 Con-
vention on September 10 and 
11. The event featured address-
es by Secretary of Commerce 
Malcolm Baldrige, Governor 
William P. Clements, Jr., 
Senator John Tower, and all 
statewide Republican candi-
dates. 

Delegates elected a Republi-
can State Chairman and Vice- 
Chairman, as well as 62 
members of the State Republi- 

Auction Nets *3600 
For Texico Schools 

can Executive Committee. 
They also adopted a Republi-
can State Platform, attended 
workshops and conferences, 
and approved changes in the 
Party Rules. 

Republican County Chair-
man Martin Kube stated that: 
"We were excited about at-
tending this 1982 convention 
and representing the growing 
number of Republican voters 
in our county. This event was 
the kickoff for one of the most 
critical election campaigns in 
our state's history. I am 
convinced that we came away 
with a unified conservative 
slate of candidates solidly 
behind a firmly conservative 
state platform." 

The 1982 Republican State 
Convention was held Sept.10-11 
at the Special Events Center in 
Austin. sale, ending the event with a 

total of approximately $3600 
which will be put back into the 
school funds. • Texico School Changes 

Credit Requirements 
The Texico School Board has 

voted to change the required 
credits needed for high school 
students to graduate. Before 
the vote was passed, the 
students needed 20 credits, now 
the requirement will be 22. 

AIN changed by the vote will 
be the number of credits given 
for athletics and physical 
education classes. Prior to the 

change, these classes were 
each worth 1/2  credit, now they 
will be worth one full credit. 

"We took something away 
from the students with the 22 
credits, but we gave them 
something with the full credit 
for physical education and 
athletics," said James Pierce, 
Texico school superintendent. 

411 

Contest Standings 
1st Place - 28 Points 

Charles Dannheim 
2nd Place - 27 Points 

Chacho Arce 
Diane Dannheim 
Linda Fipps 
James Harding 
Jane Kent 
Teresa King 
Emilia Martinez 

Saturday's Texico school 
auction ended on a profitable 
note as the items auctioned 
brought a total of $3600. Put up 
for auction by the school were 
such items as typewriters, 
adding machines, chairs, desks, 
video recorders, two sheds, 
and a house. 

The house was sold to H.B. 
McIntire of Portales, who 
started the bidding and then 
raised his own bid "just to help 
the school." His final bid was 
$1,000 and, as stipulated in the 
sale, he will remove the house 
from the lots before October 
30. 

The two sheds that were 
beside the house went to Frank 
Dalton. They, too, have to be 
moved or torn down by 
October 30. 

The school sold almost 
everything intended for the 

C.L. Mahaney 
Loyce McCleskey 
Mark Meeks 
Mike Norris 
Diane Parker 
Dorothy Quickel 
Dale Sikes 
Albert H. Smith 
Carroll Smith 
Loyd E. Smith 
Texico H.S. Computer 3rd Place - 26 Points 

Scott Brown 
Billy Roberts 
Ronnie Warmuth 

4th Place - 25 Points 
Fern Christian 
Lorine Dannheim 
Kerry Ford 
Kent Harding 
Roy King 
T.J. Kittrell 
Ysleta Kittrell 
Mrs. W.M. Roberts 
Ruth Scott 
Johnny Torres 
Mike Woods 

5th Place - 24 Points 
Jim Berry 
Weldon Dane 
Sam Drager 
Richard Engelking 
Jeanette Ford 
Don Gartin 
David George 
Steve Geries 
Duane Hamar 
Lee Ann Holladay 
Myrna Lingnau 
Mike Littlejohn 
David Lynn 



JOIN THE ALLSUP'S MARATHON 
OCTOBER 9,1982 - 7:00 A.M. - M.D.T. 

CLOVIS, NEW MEXICO 
THERE WILL BE MANY WELL KNOWN RUNNERS THROUGHOUT MANY STATES. 
FOR MORE INFORMATION CONTACT ROYCE JONES, 3532 BRYNHURST CT., 
CLOVIS, NEW MEXICO 88101 OR PHONE 505/762-5010. 
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Local Exhibitors Win 
Ribbons At Curry Fair 

Nominations Open 
For WTCC Cultural 
Achievement Awards The Curry County Fair in 

Clovis has closed its gates for 
another year after a successful 
six-day run. 

On exhibit at the recent Fair 
were all different kinds of 
livestock, as well as produce 
and flowers, and almost any 
type art and craft that can be 
imagined. 

Many persons from the 
Texico and Farwell area 
exhibited items in the Fair and 
participated in many of the 
events during the annual fall 
festivity. 

Below is a partial list of local 
area persons who won ribbons 
for their displays or projects at 
the Fair: 

slides, records, tapes, or 
anything that requires me-
chanical assistance. 

Nominees must reside in the 
132-county area served by the 
West Texas Chamber of Com-
merce and be able to attend 
the presentation. The presenta-
tion honoring 1982 recipients 
will be held in conjunction with 
the WTCC's annual convention 
in Kerrville, April 17-19, 1983. 
Supportive materials should be 
as complete as possible and 
well organized. Final selection 
can be based only on materials 
provided. 

Studying Rocks 
Farwell Elementary students 
in grades 3.5 are undertaking 
an explorer class study pro-
gram this year, with rock 
collecting being one of the 
topics currently being studied. 
Clarence Kube of Farwell, 

second from right, an avid 
rock hound, met with the class 
last week to discuss differ-
ences in rocks, identification of 
various rocks, and to show 
some samples from his vast 
collection. Shown with some of 

the rocks the class has 
collected as well as some of 
Kube's own rocks, are, from 
left, Brian Johnson, third 
grade, Doug Davis, fourth 
grade, and Chasity Autrey, 
fifth grade. 

r rat 
Phone 

481-3681 

To Place Your 

Want Ad 

Students Share In Explorer Program.  

Nominations are now open 
for the coveted West Texas 
Chamber of Commerce Cultur-
al Achievement Awards for 
1982, according to WTCC 
Cultural Affairs Chairman, 
Juanita Bryant, Lubbock. 

Each year the WTCC honors 
individuals and organizations 
for outstanding contributions to 
West Texas culture. Past re-
cipients of the award have 
included artists, musicians, 
authors, craftsmen, cartoon-
ists, corporations, organiza-
tions, and others who have 
made outstanding contribu-
tions to the culture of West 
Texas. 

Nominations and materials 
supporting the nominations, 
such as news clips, brochures, 
letters of recommendation, 
programs, and other written 
information should be sent to 
Cultural Affairs staff repre-
sentative, Larry Fitzgerald, 
West Texas Chamber of Com-
merce, P.O. Box 1561, Abilene, 
Texas 79604, no later than De-
cember 15, 1982. Materials 
may not include video tapes, 

second, okra; and first, peppers, sweet 
bell. 

Wilma Whitener won ribbons in several 
divisions, including second, comforters; 
first. sheaf, wheat winter, any other; 
first. sunflower, three heads; second, 
cucumbers, slicing; third, cucumbers, 
pickling; first, peppers under three 
inches; and first, squash, any other; 
second, Ja'open° green peppers. 

Pam Monk won several ribbons in the 
home economics division beginning with 
first, Ball Special Award, pickles and 
relishes; first, pickles and relishes, 
cinnamon; third, red hot sauce; first. 
clothing, girls, any other; first, clothing, 
mens boys, any other; third, corn 
muffins; first. sweet rolls; second, quick 
bread; third. chocolate chip cookies; and 
third, rock painting. 

Jubal Pierce came home with four 
ribbons for leathercraft work, Including 
second, advanced leathercraft, original 
design; second, advanced leathercraft, 
article of choice; first, advanced 
leathercraft, home furnishings and 
accessories; first, open leathercran, any 
other; and first, fifth year record book. 

Melissa Singleterry won second In fifth 
year record book, seventh in the High 
Plains junior carcass show; third, two 
piece coordinated outfit, casual. ages 
14-19. 

Mark Myers won third for his young 
pen rabbits. 

Louise Fenn won third for a ceramic 
nativity scene in crafts, any other. 

Cheryle Whitener won third for sheaf 
wheat, winter, any other; and first for a 
Christmas tree made from glass baby 
food jars In the category of craft, any 
other. 

Leah Kelley won second place for oat-
meal cookies and second for her pecan 
cookies. 

Penny Pierce won first in the Junior 
division, first year record book. 

Martin Singleterry won third for his 
long chile peppers. 

The watermelon contest saw five 
winners from the Twin Cities with Paul 
Skaggs winning second In the senior 
division for a 35-pound watermelon. 
Delbert Lingnau won first In the 20-year 
and up division for his 55 pound water-
melon. 

Todd Lingnau won first, ages 9-19, for a 
561/2 pound watermelon, while Wayne 

• 

Holland won second with a 50-pounder. 
Kirk Lingnau won first In the age 2-8 
bracket for a SO-pounder, 

Wayne Holland also won second for an 
uncut Jack-o-lantern pumpkin. 

Kelley Cooper won fifth in the age four 
and five stick horse race. 

?alai Fenn took sixth place In six and 
nine water bucket race; third In the eight 
to ten egg and spoon race; and second in 
the seven to 12 musical chairs. 

Andi Kirkland brought home sixth 
place in the age four and five goat ribbon 
race. 

Justin Mahaney won third place in the 
water bucket race, ages four and five, 
and first place in the egg and spoon race, 
ages five to seven. 

Jody Mahaney took fourth place in the 
goat ribbon race, ages 6-9; fifth place in 
the stick horse race. ages 6-7; and sixth 
place in the egg and spoon race, ages 5-7. 

The Pleasant Hill community won first 
place for their carrots and second place 
for their sweet bell peppers. 

Paul Meeks took first, second and third 
place for his male bantles. 

Paula Novslainen of Texico brought 
home ribbons from the paint horse show 
including third place for brood mares; 
sixth place for youth mares; third place 
for youth showmanship, 14-18; fifth place 
for youth western pleasure, 14-18; and 
fourth place for ladies wool lead class 
senior. 

She also won three ribbons In the Curry 
County Youth Horse show, including 
ninth place for halter mares, senior; fifth 
place for western pleasure, senior; and 
fourth place, western horsemanship. In 
the rabbit show, she won fourth place for 
a French Lopp and fourth place for a 
California. Her Amherst pheasant won 
first place In its category. 

Jackie Morris also entered the paint 
horse show bringing home first place for 
1981 fillies; fourth place for youth mares; 
third place for youth showmanship. 13 
and under; and fourth place for youth 
western pleasure, 13 and under. 

She also brought home several ribbons 
in the Curry County Youth Horse Show, 
including fourth place for showmanship, 
13 and under; fifth, western pleasure. 13 
and under; second, AQUA reigning pat-
tern I. 13 and under; second, western 
horsemanship, 13 and under; fifth, pole 
bending; and sixth, barrel racing. 

SCHOOL LUNCH 
MENUS 

TEXICO 	FARWELL 

Around The Twin Cities 
Monday morning, Sept. 27. 
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and talked about mineral 
collecting in other parts of the 
United States. His lecture 
included a demonstration of 
how to identify a rock by its 
hardness as well as the 
hardness of several rocks in 
the collection. 

Kube answered questions 
asked by the students and went 
over some of their rock 
collections with them. Before 
class ended, the students asked 
Kube to return next week with 
more of his rock collection to 
tell them more about this 
shared special interest. 

Farwell Chamber of Com-
merce will meet for its 
monthly session Tuesday, Sept. 
28, at Luce's restaurant at 
noon. 

Farwell Booster Club will 
sponsor a reception for ex-
students and fans tonight 
(Friday) in the Farwell home 
ec cottage following the Home-
coming game between Farwell 
and Seagraves. 

t • Fire Calls 

MONDAY - Salisbury 
steak, mashed potatoes, 
green beans, hot rolls, 
peanut butter and syrup, 
and milk. 

TUESDAY - Barbecue 
beef on bun, cowboy 
beans, stuffed celery, fruit-
ed gelatin, milk. 

WEDNESDAY - Enchil-
adas, shredded lettuce, 
Spanish rice, fruit cocktail 
cake, tostados, milk. 

THURSDAY - Fish with 
tartar sauce, macaroni 
and cheese, hot rolls with 
butter, peach, milk. 

FRIDAY - Tamales, 
beans, coleslaw, corn-
bread, oatmeal cookie, 
milk. 

MONDAY - Spaghetti 
with meat sauce, salad, 
hot rolls, peanut butter 
and Karo, milk. 

TUESDAY - Cheesebur-
gers, onions and pickles, 
lettuce, French fries, fruit, 
milk. 

WEDNESDAY - Tacos, 
pinto beans, lettuce and 
tomato salad, cornbread, 
milk. 

THURSDAY - Fried 
chicken, creamed pota-
toes, green beans, hot 
rolls, peaches, milk. 

FRIDAY - Enchiladas, 
lettuce salad, buttered 
corn, mixed fruit, milk. 

*** 

Texico City Council will have 
its bi-monthly meeting Sep-
tember 28 at 6:15 p.m. MDT in 
the city hall. 

Brette Southard earned several ribbons, 
Including second In Unit II and advanced 
dog care; second In Junior rabbits, old 
pen; second, junior rabbits, young pen; 
second, turkeys; first, junior garden; 
first, Unit iv record book and poster; 
first and champion, Columbia ram two 
years and older reg.; first and champion, 
Columbia rams yearling reg.; first and 
champion. Columbia ewes two years and 
older reg.; first. Columbia ewes yearling 
reg.; first and reserve champion, 
Columbia ewes under one year reg.; 
second. Columbia ewes under one year; 
first, Columbia flock; second, fourth year 
record book; and first, rocketry, one 
model rocket. 

Brett Taylor earned several ribbons In 
the agricultural division beginning with 
first in grain sorghum. milo; first. 
shelled popcorn, white; first, wheat, hard 

lip 	red winter and any other variety; second. 
wheat, winter, any varioty; first, fruits, 
vegetables, apples, red; first, beans, lima 
shelled; first, beans, pinto shelled; 
second, beans, any other shelled; first. 
peas, blackeyed, pOd; first pumpkin. 
stock; first, squash, cashew; first water-
melon, icebox; first, most unusual, any 
vine product; and first most unusual 
fruit. 

Justin Barnes entered the 4-11 welding 
events winning three ribbons, first, 
electric welding skillplate; first, oxya-
cetylene skiliplate; and first. footscraper. 

Chad Barnes won three ribbons in 
woodcraft ages 9-13: second, horseshoe 
tie rack; first, letter holder; and first. . 	nail point design. 

Robin Pierce won In the 4-H home 
economics division and 4-H leathercraft 
division: first, leathercraft II; second, 
leathercraft II, checkbook cover; first, 
leathercraft II, other article; first, fourth 
year record book; second loaf plain white 
yeast bread; third, cinnamon raisin 
buns; first coffee cake, any type; and 
first, junior clothing, T-shirt. 

Terry Whitener won first, Junior 
leathercraft, one comb case; first, Junior 
leathercraft, knife sheath; second. junior 
leathercraft. bookmark; Junior leather-
craft, coaster; second, open leathercraft, 
bookmark; second, open leathercraft, 
any other article; and first second year 
record book. 

Joyce Williams won Best of Show 
awards for clothing in the home 
economics division as well as first in 
clothing, wool suit; first, clothing, cotton 
skirt; and first, clothing, cotton blouse. 

Jackie Morris came away with first 
and reserve champion in show rabbits; 
first, game birds; second, game birds; 
and third, lambs, sub deb. 

Gary Singleterry won second in sheaf, 
wheat, hard red winter; third, carrots; 

I 	CAPITOL FOODS 
tl~ Ate Btu 

Texico Volunteer Fire De-
partment reported only one 
call this week. The fire truck 
was called to Rose Street in 
Texico to extinguish an air 
conditioner fire. 

Farwell Volunteer Fire De-
partment reported no fire or 
ambulance calls this week. 

Clarence Kube, local farmer, 
who is an avid and well known 
area rock collector, who spoke 
to the group about rocks, their 
origins, and types. Kube began 
his lecture by talking about the 
difference between igneous, 
sedimentary, and metamor-
phic rocks, showing each type 
as he spoke. 

He then explained how 
crystals "grew" inside the air 
pockets of other rocks. The 
rocks he displayed from his 
collection contained several 
samples of crystals which he 
identified by shape and color 
explaining what each was. 

Also in this collection were 
samples of petrified wood. He 
explained how wood became 
petrified also identifying the 
types of wood. Of special 
interest to the class was a 
piece of petrified ivood inside a 
larger rock. This specimen 
brought several questions from 
the students. 

During his lecture, Kube also 
showed samples of minerals 
such as gold, lead, and copper, 

Students in grades 3-5 at 
Farwell Elementary School 
have gotten an explorer pro-
gram underway this year. In 
this program, students listed 
their top ten interests in the 
order in which they would like 
to study such topics. Classes 
were then formed from these 
lists, including those in geneal-
ogy, metric cooking, bicycling, 
and rock hounding. 

The special groups change 
every three weeks so that the 
students may explore and 
learn about as many new 
subjects as possible. "These 
are things they wouldn't 
normally get in school," says 
Mrs. Billie Carlyle, fourth 
grade teacher. 

Mrs. Carlyle is supervising a 
group of students who wished 
to learn about rocks. The 
group made a small collection 
of rocks, identifying and 
labeling them during the class. 
They also have a rock tumbler 
in the room to tumble the 
stones they find and wish to 
add either to the group 
collection or to a collection of 
their own. 

Last Friday the class hosted 

*5* 

Parmer County Commission-
ers Court will convene Monday 
morning, Sept. 27, in the 
county courtroom. 

sit* 

Parmer County Commission-
ers Court will conduct a public 
meeting on the county budget 
at 5 p.m. on Monday, Sept. 27, 
in the county courtroom. 

Farwell and Texico school 
bands will march in the South 
Plains Fair parade in Lubbock 

Farwell Booster Club will 
meet September 28 at 8 p.m. at 
Luce's restaurant. 

*.• 

Texico Athletic Booster Club 
will meet Thursday, Sept. 30, 
at 7:30 p.m. MDT in the high 
school library. 

• 
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PRICES EFFECTIVE SEPT. 23-25,1982 
WHILE SUPPLIES LAST 

ALL GRINDS 

1 LB. 
CAN " • 

FOLGER'S 
COFFEE 

ALLSUP'S CHOPPED 

BBQ SANDWICH 
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EACH le le 

If you like LP-gas for 
heating and cooking, 
why stop there? 0011E FOR  THEJIOLID-IY$ 	 
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 	BORDEN'S 	a 

CHOCOLATE MILK 41 

QUART 

• N 
SPILL MATE 	r 	c 

PAPER TOWELS )Y 

• 

PALMOLIVE 32 02 

1 DISHWASHING LIQUID $159 

If you alreadycook or heatwith 
Philgas, you know howwell it 
doesthe job. 

So why not put its dependa- 
bil itytoworkforyou in air con- 
ditioning, clothesdrying, water 
heating, enginefuel oralmostany 
other job around the home and 
farm? 

You get efficiency, economy 
and convenience. 

Come byand let usshowyou all 
thewaystheclean, blue Philgas 
flame may help you save money. 
Because if it heats and cooks 
that well , why stopwhileyou're 
ahead? 

ATKINS DILL 16 OZ. 	at 	FAMILY SIZE FRESH START 

)1.2 PICKLE SLICES 	 LAUNDRY DETERGENT $43 
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ASSORTED FLAVORS 

BORDEN'S DIPS 

ALLSUP'S PREMIUM 

ICE CREAM cm, 
'/: 011.. 	
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RD. CTN. 
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AILSUPS 
CONVENIENCE STORES 

HELTON OIL ,INC. 
Ph. 4814222 

Serving The Texico-Farwell Area 
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Jerry Mueller Pastor 
Of San Jose Church 

Fifth Graders Enjoy 

Study Of Watermelons 
Father Jerry Mueller has 

taken over the pastoral duties 
at San Jose Catholic Church in 
Texico. He arrived here a-
round the first of August to 
make preparations to replace 
Father Juan Montoya who had 
been at San Jose since 1980. 

"Father Jerry" is originally 
from Cincinnati, Ohio, but re-
ceived his bachelor's degree in 
philosophy from Duns Scotus 
College in Detroit, Mich. He 
then attended the University of 
Dayton, in Dayton, 'Ohio, 
where he received his master's 
degree in theology, at the same 
time attending Saint Leonard's 
in Dayton and earning his 
master of divinity degree. 

After being ordained in 1973, 
he spent nine years teaching 
religion, and three years 
teaching freshman Spanish at 
Bishop Luers Catholic High 
School in Fort Wayne, Ind. 
During the summer breaks 

• Walter Kaltwasser signed a 
proclamation declaring the 
Friday preceding Labor Day 
as the official "Watermelon 
Day" in Farwell. 

While in the mayor's office, 
the students asked questions 
about city goverrunent and the 
mayor's job. 

Special thanks were ex-
pressed to Delbert Lingnau 
and the parents of fifth graders 
for providing the watermelons. 

Billie Worley and Karolene 
Inman are the fifth grade 
teachers. 

• 

One fun activity was drawing 
a watermelon picture, with 
each person only drawing for 
one minute, then passing the 
picture on to someone else to 
add their minute's worth of 
artistic ability. 

On Friday, Sept. 3, several 
students brought watermelons 
to school, and both classes 
enjoyed a watermelon feast. 

On Tuesday, Sept. 7, the 
group visited the Farwell 
mayor's office at the city hall, 
riding a bus driven by 
principal James Craig. Mayor 

there, he studied Spanish in 
Guadalajara and Satillo, Mex-
ico. 

When asked about his trans-
fer to New Mexico, Father 
Mueller explains that this is 
the providence of Saint John 
The Baptist, with missions in 
Santa Fe, Albuquerque, and 
surrounding areas, as well as 
missions working with the 
Pueblo and Navajo Indians. 

Father Mueller is head 
pastor of the San Jose Church 
which is a mission church out 
of Our Lady of Guadalupe 
Church in Clovis where he is 
an assistant pastor. 

The services in the Texico 
church are given bilingually, 
blending  with the Spanish 
background of the church. 
Father'Mueller says, "I'm not 
fluent in Spanish, but I get 
by," when asked about the 
bilingual services. 

Mueller says he's really 
proud of the church and its 
members, "I really like the 
way the church looks," he 
said. The church has been 
newly remodeled in the Span-
ish style with wrought iron and 
stained glass doors, and sev-
eral archways both inside and 
outside the church. Father 

Ready For The Feast 

Mueller especially praises the 
statue of Saint Joseph and the 
Christ child which has been 
redone to show a hispanic.  
heritage. When showing the 
statue, he explains how Father 
Montoya painted and shaped 
the statue to reflect the 
Mexican heritage of most of 
the church's membership. 

The Texico church claims 
about 150 members now, but 
there is a local census to be 
held soon to determine the 
current figure. The congrega-
tion is also making plans to 
attend the Saint Francis 
Eighth Centenary in Roswell 
on October 3. The celebration' 
is to commemorate the 800 
years since the birth of Saint 
Francis with mass, parade, 
and other festivities, The 
church members, along with 
Father Mueller, will be pre-
paring floats and banners for 
the celebration in conjunction 
with Our Lady of Guadalupe 
Church in Clovis. 

Father Mueller also has 
plans on how to pay for the 
remodeling already done to the 
church and to finish the 
remodeling of the inside of the 
building. 

weighed and measured the 
melons in math class before 
the feast. From left are Venus 
Samaniego, Lance Castleberry, 
Lupe Arce, Blanca Burciago, 
and Eloy Anaya. (Karolene 
Inman Photo] 

These fifth graders at Farwell 
Elementary School were a-
mong those who brought 
watermelons for the two 
classes to enjoy following their 
recent classroom study of the 
watermelon during a science 
unit on plants. The students 

Students in the two fifth 
grade classes at Farwell Ele-
mentary School are presently 
studying a science unit about 
plants. They have performed 
several investigations, includ-
ing planting seeds in plastic 
bags and watching them sprout 
and grow on the bulletin 
boards. 

They are also watching plant 
cuttings root in water and have 
seen a new African Violet plant 
start from a leaf. 

One of the most interesting 
,2 bits of information was that a 

fruit is a ripe ovary. The study 
focused especially on the 
watermelon, and the students 
engaged in several activities 
using watermelons. 

A "word search" puzzle was 
done; they made smaller 
words from the word water-
melon, and they did research 
to learn facts about the 
melons. One interesting fact 
was that watermelons were 
originally grown in Africa. 

In math class they weighed 
the watermelons in both 
pounds and kilograms and 
measured the circumference in 
inches and centimeters. They 
averaged weights and circum-
ferences of their melons to see 
if they fell within the national 
averages according to an 
encyclopedia. 

For Senior Citizens 

The Older The Better, Says Sports Historian 
A Growing 

Bulletin Board 

Watching plants grow from 
cuttings place in water has 
been part of a science study on 
plants for Farwell fifth graders 
during the past few weeks. 
Shown with their carefully 

tended plants are, from left, 
Lupe Arce, Lonnie Wilhite, 
Irene Jones, Stephen Ketcher-
side, and Julian Garcia. They 
are students of Billie Worley. 
[Karolene Inman Photo] 

• 
Completes Unit Training 

A eading sports historian 
's looking for authentic 
Olympic Games memorabil-
ia circa 1896 through 1980. 

San Jose Pastor 
Father Jerry Mueller has as-
sumed pastoral duties at San 
Jose Catholic Church in Tex-
ico. Mueller takes great pride 
in the newly-remodeled church 
building and its members, and 
has made plans to continue the 
remodeling project of the 
church. Father Juan Montoya 
was the former pastor. 

• 

The training included wea-
pons qualifications, squad tac-
tics, patrolling, landmine war-
fare, field communications and 
combat operations. Comple-
tion of this course qualifies the 
soldier as a light-weapons 
infantryman and as an indir-
ect-fire crewman. 

Pvt. Alan C. Stanberry, son 
of Ronnie D. and Connie E. 
Stone of Bovina, has completed 
one station unit training 
(OSUT) at the U.S. Army 
Infantry School, Fort Benning, 
Ga. Stanberry is a 1981 
graduate of Bovina High 
School. 

OSUT is a 12-week period 
which combines basic combat 
training and advanced individ-
ual training. 

This bulletin board in the fifth 
grade room of Karolene Inman 
at Farwell Elementary seems 
to be alive, but it is only 
holding plants which are 
growing in plastic bags. Plant-
ing the seeds in the plastic 
bags was just one of the many 
activities the fifth graders 
participated in while studying 
a science unit on plants. Shown 
with their plant project are, 
from left, back, Eloy Anaya. 
Ruben Galvan, Sammy Her-
rera and Frank Gump; and in 
front, Blanca Burciago and 
Edith Ausburn. [Karolene In-

' man Photo] 

of this nature gathering dust 
in the basement or attic? If 
so, you can get in touch 
with Jim Jacobs at Nine 
East 40th Street, New York, 
NY 10016, or call (212) 
532-1717. 

How many of the Olym-
pic Games can you remem-
ber? If you've saved some of 
the mementoes of those 
Games as the years went by 
—old posters, books, plaques 
or programs —you may find 
that your memories are 
worth money. 

Jim Jacobs, one of Ameri-
ca's leading sports historians, 
collects and preserves Olym-
pic artifacts. He's eager to 
buy or trade old Olympic 
programs and books, med-
als, personal films, cups, 
plaques, banners or posters 
from any of the Olympic 
Games, 1896-1980. 

Do you have any material 
Soldiers were taught to 

perform any of the duties in a 
rifle or mortar squad. 
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Jr. High Student Council 

JESSICA HADLEY 

EASTERN NEW MEXICO UNIVERSITY 

College 01 Fine Arts 

presents 

UP\INEINlY 1H691RE 
NADSC 1F1611RE 
DICE 

2 6  

Order Your Season Tickets Today! 

NAME 

STREET ADDRESS 

CITY 	  

PHONE 	 

STATE 	SIP 

NUMBER OF SEASON TICKETS ORDERED 

TOTAL AMOUNT ENCLOSED 	  

Detach and mail to 	University Theatre 
ENMU Station 037 
Porlales. NM 88130 

Make checks payable to University Theatre 

SEASON TICKP.ab $16.00 
General Admission VICO 
Senior Citizens 63.00 
Pre-college Students $2.00 
ENMU Students with ID $1.00 

	SIIMMM111011111111111•11, 

Just Received: 
New Shipment Of 

Unfinished Furniture. 

Sewing Center Et 
Matching Storage Bench 

Childs Wardrobe 

Baby Dressing Table 

Roll-Top Et Knee-Hole Desk 

Chests-All Sizes 

Gun Cabinet 

[L, 
. re. 	 ca:1:1 	art:  

Cl.:77 	 "34* 	f elts1 t 	PI- 
3d 	t va a qt. 

163-7121 
ern main 

	a 

Kick up your heels in style 
with Hush Puppies 

Lana a dressy heel 
in a variety of 
metallic colors 

$30 

Anything goes with 

Hush PuppieS 
520 main . Clovis 

turnercharge, 

VISO frIntetClrd. 
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Lazbuddie Homemakers 
Win First At Amarillo 

Lazbuddie Young Homemak-
er Chapter won first place for 
its display booth at the Area 
Convention in Amarillo on 
August 28. A first place ribbon 
and a check for $20 were 
received at the banquet Satur-
day night. 

Two members and one 
advisor represented the Laz-
buddie Chapter at the Area I 
Young Homemakers of Texas 
Annual Convention. Debbie 
Weir, president; Janice Brad-
shaw, historian; and Cassan-
dra Cargile, advisor; "enjoyed 
a full day of meetings and pro-
grams, and a delicious meal at 

the banquet that night," they 
report. 

Each chapter was allowed to 
display a major project or pro-
gram which had been accom-
plished during the year. The 
Lazbuddie chapter's yearbook 
and scrapbook were displayed, 
along with the Lazbuddie 
Community Cookbook. 

Also displayed were a poster 
describing the senior citizens' 
projects and a poster describ-
ing the chapter programs for 
the year, along with the 
chapter's outstanding member 
plaque. 

Music Group To Appear 

At Methodist Church 

• First Place Booth 
Representing the Lazbuddie 
Young Homemakers at the 
Area I Young Homemakers of 
Texas Annual Convention in 
Amarillo on August 28 were, 

Kendra Stephens, Janel Lov-
vorn, members; back row, 
Steve Geries and Joanna 
Castner, members. 

receiving a blue ribbon and a 
check for $20. The members 
are pictured beside their 
winning display. 

from left, Janice Bradshaw, 
historian; Cassandra Cargile, 
advisor; and Debbie Weir, 
president. The chapter won 
first place for its display booth, 

bers are, from left, front row, 
Dee Anne Ray, secretary; 
Suzanne Hardage, president; 
Dana White, vice-president; 
Camille Buchenau, member; 
second row, Jimmy Lovato, 

Farwell Junior High Student 
Council members wasted no 
time in getting down to 
business in their first meeting 
last Friday when they elected 
council officers. Council mem- 

will present contemporary and 
traditional music at the pro-
gram in the church sanctuary 
beginning at 7:30 p.m. CDT. 

Following their program, 
refreshments will be served in 
the church fellowship hall. 

Everyone in the area is 
cordially invited to hear this 
musical aggregation. 

Appearing at Hamlin Me-
morial United Methodist 
Church in Farwell for a special 
program on Saturday evening, 
Oct. 2, will be the musical 
group, "Nightwind," of Mc-
Murry College in Abilene. The 
group is directed by Betty 
Carol Wilson, choral teacher at 
McMurry. 

The entertainment troupe Jr. Student Council Elects New Officers 
• Kubes Visit In Austin Hospital Notes R.D. Williams, Daughter 

Reunited After 60 Years Martin and Frances Kube of 
Farwell recently spent part of 
their vacation in Austin, where 
Martin attended the Texas 
Republican State Convention. 

Farwell Junior High Student 
Council met in its first session 
Friday to elect officers and 
discuss goals and immediate 
plans. 

Officers for the council are 
Suzanne Hardage, president, 
eighth grade; Dana White, 
vice-president, eighth grade; 

grade; and Janet Lovvorn, 
sixth grade. Elizabeth Phillips 
is the council sponsor. 

Among items on the agenda 
was the "name the computer 
contest" to be sponsored by the 
council with results of the 
contest being given around 
Oct. 1. 

and Dee Anne Ray, secretary, 
seventh grade. 

Other members of the Stu-
dent Council are Camille 
Buchenau, eighth grade; Jim-
my Lovato, eighth grade; 
Joanna Castner, seventh 
grade; Steve Geries, seventh 
grade; Kendra Stephens, sixth 

• Texico Women's Club Hosts Salad Supper 

While Martin was at the 
convention, Frances spent the 
two days in the State Library 
doing family research. The 
rest of the week, they visited 
with their son, Wayne and 
family of Bryan, Tex., and 
with Frances' parents and two 

Williams Jr. and son Mark of 
Earth; Mr. and Mrs. Jim Wil-
liams, Cherly, Jordan and 
Charlie of Muleshoe; Mrs. 
Peggy Clayton of Rapid City, 
South Dakota; Mr. and Mrs. 
Terry Swartz of Hobbs; Mrs. 
Sue Callahan of Farwell; Dean 
McMillan and Cory of Dallas; 
and Mrs. Grady Box of 
Portales. 

Senior Citizens 

brothers and families near 
Lampasas. 

A highlight of the trip was 
when the couple, along with 
Wayne and family, attended 
Sunday church services at St. 
Paul's Lutheran Church, an 
historic 111-year-old church at 
Serbin, Tex. Martin's two 
great-great-grandfathers help-
ed found and build the church, 
so Martin's grandchildren 
made the seventh generation to 
worship there. 

Lynn Kittrells Parents Of Son 

Texico Women's Club held 
its membership meeting and 
had a salad supper at their 
initial fall get-together Monday 
night. Officers of the club were 
hostesses. 

The serving table was laid 
with a lace cloth and centered 

with a silk floral arrangement. 
Aileen Teel, club president, 

conducted a business session at 
which it was announced that 
the District Convention will be 
October 1 and 2 in Roswell. 
Delegates from the local club 
planning to attend are Janice 

• Texico Baptist Women 

Have Royal Service 

Meet Set Thurs. 
Texico-Farwell Senior Citi-

zens were to meet Thursday, 
Sept. 23, at 6 p.m. MDT at the 
Center in Texico for their 
bi-monthly potluck supper and 
games night. 

Board members were to 
conduct a meeting at 5 p.m. 
before their regular session. 

Mrs. Cora McGuire of Far-
well was admitted to Lubbock 
Methodist Hospital Saturday 
night where she is currently 
confined to intensive care. 

••• 

Mrs. Nadine Langston of 
Farwell was released from 
Clovis High Plains Hospital 
Wednesday after being treated 
for a broken leg. "She is 
recuperating at home and is 
just taking it easy," reports 
her daughter Linda. 

••• 

Joe Caywood of Texico is in 
room 410 in Lubbock Methodist 
Hospital undergoing treatment. 

••• 

Silas Jones of Texico was 
taken to the hospital in Mule-
shoe Friday night where he is 
currently in room 122, and is 
reported to be doing well. 

R.D. (Bob) Williams of 
Farwell was recently reunited 
with his daughter, Marianne 
Wendt of Chicago, Ill., after a 
60-year separation. 

The events leading up to the 
reunion started this summer 
when Mrs. Wendt vacationed 
in Albuquerque. While there, 
she went to Santa Fe to get a 
birth certificate, and thought 
she would see if there was a 
death certificate for her father. 

Much to her surprise, there 
was no such certificate, and 
she also learned that her 
father had lived at Glorieta, 
N.M. So she went there and 
looked up a cousin who 
directed her back to Santa Fe 
to a David Williams who is a 
brother to the local man. A 
phone call was made to 
Williams here at Farwell and 
things began to unfold when a 
date was set for a reunion of 
the pair. • 

On September 11, Mrs. 
Wendt and her son Randy flew 
to Lubbock where they were 
met by members of the family. 
They returned to Farwell for a 
reunion with Williams and 
other family members and 
time of getting acquainted. 

Nineteen persons were on 
hand for the occasion, includ-
ing Mrs. Wendt and her son of 
Chicago, Mr. and Mrs. R.D. 

Turner and Mary Powell. 
In other business the club 

decided to host a meeting of 
political candidates at their 
October 18 meeting to which 
the public will be invited. More 
information about this pro-
gram will be announced later. 

Two new members, Deborah 
Autrey and Mellie Moore, were 
welcomed to the club. 

Attending the meeting were 
Marcia Leavell, Audrey Kit-
trell, Aileen Teel, Diane Par-
ker, Maxine Shaw, Mary 
Powell, and the two new 
members. 

Mr. and Mrs. T.J. Kittrell of 
Farwell; and maternal grand-
parents are Sarah Reid of 
Levelland and Glenn Marsh of 
Albuquerque. 

Great-grandparents include 
Thelma Kittrell of Farwell, 
Marie Guenther of Weslaco, 
Tex., and Marian Marsh of 
Nebraska. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lynn Kittrell 
of Texico announce the birth of 
their third child, a son, born 
Thursday, Sept. 17, at Clovis 
High Plains Hospital. 

Named Jered Trevor, the 
new arrival weighed nine 
pounds, six ounces. He has two 
sisters, Lindsay and Kara. 

Paternal grandparents are 

Marriage 
Licenses Kerry Fords Have Daughter Completes Course. 

Pvt. Thelma Hernandez, 
daughter of Celestino and 
Jovita P. Hernandez of Far-
well, has completed a wheeled-
vehicle mechanic course at the 
U.S. Army Training Center, 
Fort Jackson, S.C. 

During the course, students 
were trained to perform main-
tenance and assist in the 
repair of automotive vehicles 
and associated equipment. 

The Baptist Women of the 
FirsrBaptisiChurch bf Texico 
met at the church on Wednes-
day afternoon, Sept. 1, for their 
regular Royal Service program 
with chairman Mora Schlueter 
presiding. 

The meeting opened with the 
mission support chairman Lois 
Hudnall reading the names of 
the missionaries having birth- 

Two marriage licenses were 
issued this week by the 
Parmer County Clerk's office. 

Receiving the licenses were 
Bryan D. Ray and Brenda 
Jones; and Joseph Roberto 
Aragon and Sylvia Ann Garza. 

Mr. and Mrs. Kerry Ford of 
Farwell are parents of their 
first child, a daughter, born 
Friday, Sept. 17, in the hospital 
at Muleshoe. 

The new arrival, who has 
been named Kristin Rana', 
weighed seven pounds, 10 

Jessica Hadley Has 4th Birthday 

Hereford Church Plans 
Arts & Crafts Festival 

Health 
Complaints 

, Even though health problems 
tend to increase with age, 
studies show that physical 
complaints don't -- in spite of 
the stereotype of older adults 
as hypochondriacs. 

The Baltimore Longitudinal 
Study of Aging found no differ-
ence in physical complaints 
between youth, middle-aged 
and elderly persons, says Jud-
ith Warren, family life educa-
tion specialist-aging with the 
Texas Agricultural Extension 
Service. 

days on that day, then leading 
in prayer. 

The title of the program was 
"Taiwan: Strong House For 
Missions," with sub-topics be-
ing "A Significant Past-The 
Laying of a Good Foundation," 
"An Exciting Present-The 
Building of a Strong House," 
and "A Challenging Future-
And the House Shall Stand," 
with Velma Kelley, Lois Hud-
nall, and Gracie Dane reading 
the sub-topics. Mrs. Schlueter 
then gave the closing remarks 
and dismissed the group in 
prayer. 

Present at the meeting were 
Lois Hudnall, Velma Kelley, 
Mora Schlueter, and Gracie 
Dane. 

ounces, and was 20 inches in 
length. 

Maternal grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Rick Parker of 
Odessa, and the paternal 
grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Barthell Ford of Farwell. 

Great-grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. Top Lindop and Mr. 
and Mrs. Uvon Ford, all of 
Farwell, Mr. and Mrs. Spur-
geon McNutt of Shawnee, 
Okla., and Mr. and Mrs. 
Archie Parker of Tecumseh, 
Okla. 

kitten in.the center, with table-
cloth and napkins to match the 
general motif. 

After having cake and 
punch, Jessica opened her 
presents and the young group 
played games. 

Leftover egg yolks can keep 
for two to three days, cov-
ered with water in a tight-
lidded jar and refrigerated. 

Wesley United Methodist 
Church of Hereford has sched-
uled its second annual "Wes-
ley's Fall Festival of Arts and 
Crafts" on Saturday, Nov. 13, 
from 9 a.m. to 6 p.m. in the 
Hereford Community Center. 

Only a limited number of 
booths are available with 

applications being screened. 

All area artists are invited to 
apply, and church members 
urge artists to get their items 
ready now. 

For more information, write 
Mrs. Gail Blain, Box 164, 
Hereford, Tex. 79045. • 

Ask Health Questions Toll Free 

Arts And Crafts 
Show Scheduled 

The Moonlight Extension 
Club is sponsoring its 4th 
annual Arts and Crafts Bazaar, 
December 3-4, at the Bailey 
County Civic Center in Mule-
shoe. Booth sizes are 10x10 and 
are $25.00 for the two days. 

Anyone wishing to reserve a 
space should contact Betty 
Campbell at 806-272-4583 from 
8-5. If you have a health ques-

tion, the National Health Infor-
mation Clearinghouse (NHIC) 
can answer it. 

The service is free, says Dr. 
Mary Ann Shirer, health edu- 

ths.drive  

Jessica Hadley of Texico had 
her fourth birthday last Sun-
day, September 19, and was 
treated to a party in her home 
by her parents and friends. 

Present at the party were 
her grandmothers, Mrs. Eve-
lyn Hadley of Texico and Mrs. 
Edith St. Clair of Muleshoe. 
Her aunt, Mrs. Jean Smith of 
Farwell, brought along her 
daughter Sheila as well as the 
birthday cake Mrs. Smith had 
baked especially for Jessica. 

Mrs. Kay Singleterry and 
Mrs. Vicky Lynn also attended 
the festivities, and rounding 
out the guest list were Sammy 
Singleterry, Andrea Carter, 
and Natasha Shaw, and, of 
course, Jessica's mom, Mrs. 
Raymond Hadley. 

The party room was decorat-
ed with little animals and 
balloons with a table decora-
tion of pink, including puppies, 
kittens, and koala bears. The 
birthday cake featured a pink 

To Subscribe 

Just Phone 

481-3681 

Texas Off tce of Traffic Safety 

cation specialist for the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Ser-
vice, Texas A&M University 
System. 

Dr. Shirer says NHIC refers 
health questions to the group 
or organization which can best 
provide an answer. An NHIC 
staff member contacts the 
organization and requests a 
response be sent directly to 
each person making an in-
quiry. 

NHIC is a service of the 
Office of Health Information, 
Health Promotion and Physical 
Fitness and Sports Medicine, 
U.S. Department of Health and 
Human Services. 

To obtain health information 
from NHIC, call 800/336-4797 
(toll-free), or write P.O. Box 
1133, Washington, D.C. 20013. 

• Ruth Hofland 
To Receive Cap 
Ruth Hofland, a junior 

nursing major from Farwell at 
West Texas State University, is 
one of 70 nursing students 
receiving caps during the 
annual convocation on Friday, 
Sept. 24. She is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Whitesides of 
Farwell. 

Convocation begins at 7 p.m. 
in the Mary Moody Northen 
Recital Hall on the WTSU 
campus. 

The capping of nursing 
students symbolizes comple-
tion of basic course require-
ments for nursing majors, said 
Anita Carroll, nursing instruc-
tor. Male nursing students 

• receive bars in place of caps, 
she said. 

Featured speaker during the 
ceremony is Dorothea L. Fee, 
a registered nurse and assist-
ant administrator, Nursing 
Division at High Plains Baptist 
Hospital in Amarillo. 
ems•wow,wm"..~....." 
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Season's First Win - - 

Steers Of The Week 
Junior High Teams 

Split Sudan Games Steers Take Sting From 

Hornets For 62-0 Romp 
I 

by Mark Cole the Farwell backfield, in-
cluding a 55-yard run by Paul 
Fulcher which took the ball to 
the 5-yard line. Lucio took the 
ball in for the touchdown to 
give the Steers a 13-0 lead. 

After trading possessions of 
the ball, the Steers took it once 
again on the 32-yard line, 
where Eubank ran 62 yards on 
second down and five, for the 
touchdown putting Farwell 
ahead 19-0. 

After the kickoff, Farwell 
recovered a Sudan fumble on 
the 21 which set up a 33-yard 
field goal by Sierra to make 
the score 22-0. 

Sudan received the ball, and 
the Hornets were again stop- 
ped by tackles from the Steer 
defense, including a stop by 
Robby Armstrong for a 4-yard 
loss to force another punt. 

With time running out in the 
first half quarterback Eubank 
led the Steers downfield with a 
20-yard completion to Frank 
Cantu and a 10-yard com-
pletion to Jimmy Bernal for 
the TD which closed the first 
half Farwell 28 - Sudan 0. 

The second half began with 
Farwell receiving the kickoff 
to open the third quarter. Each 
team had possession of the ball 
several times, then with Su-
dan's ball 'on the 45, the Steer 
defense recovered a fumble to 
open up a drive that included 
an 18-yard run by Armstrong 
and an 11-yard run for the TD 
by Lucio. Sierra kicked the 
extra point to make the score 
35-0. 

After each team had pos-
session once more, Sudan went 
to the passing game. On first 
and 10 Sudan threw an 
incomplete pass, and on second 
and 15, Sudan took to the air 
again only to find Farwell 
defensive back Todd Christian 

I 

was 32-0 with Sudan in the 
lead. 

"They started to play ball in 
the second half," said Coach 
Valderez. The young Steers 
held Sudan during the entire 
half with the exception of an 
interception which cost Far-
well another touchdown, bring-
ing the score to 40-0 after 
Sudan made their PAT. 

With about two minutes left 
in the game, Joe Jaime ran 
two yards for a Steer touch-
down, and after Jason Schilling 
ran three yards for the PAT, 
the final score was 40-8. 

After the game Coach Val-
derez named the following out-
standing offensive players in 
the game: Steve Lara, for 
catching two passes, and for 
making runs of 80 and 40 
yards; Joe Jaime, who made 
the touchdown; and Steve 
Schilling, for his run for the 
PAT. 

Devensive players named 
were Homer Anzaldua, David 
Woods, Jerry Cole, and Jason 
Schilling for their defensive 
play during the game. 

Next game for the junior 
high Steers will be September 
30, when they meet Friona at 
Steer Stadium with the first 
game beginning at 5 p.m. 

Farwell 7th and 8th grade 
football teams played Sudan at 
Sudan last Thursday, splitting 
games with the young Hornets. 

The 7th grade played a good 
defensive game, winning by a 
final score of 12-0. Coach Lupe 
Valderez said the game "was 
actually a controlled scrim-
mage, with neither offense 
making any headway during 
the game." 

Joe Jaime ran an intercep-
tion 40 yards for a Steer touch-
down, and later in the game, 
Damon George intercepted 
another Sudan pass, taking it 
35 yards to the goal line for the 
only scoring of the night. 

Following the game. Coach 
Valderez named Damon George 
and Joe Jaime as outstanding 
offensive players. David Mose-
ley, Damon George, Joe Jaime, 
and Scott Bailey were named 
as outstanding defensive play-
ers by Coach Valderez. 

The 8th grade fell to Sudan 
by a lopsided 40-8 score. 

Coach Valderez said, "The 
boys were really intimidated 
by the size of the Sudan team." 
He also said he had to play 
some of the 7th graders on the 
8th grade team, but they still 
gained no yardage during the 
first half. The score at the half 

At Steer Stadium Friday 
night the Farwell Steers took 
the sting out of the Sudan 
Hornets with a 62-0 win, the 
first of the season for the Blue 
and White. 

To open the game:-  the 
Hornets won the coin toss and 
chose to receive. After taking 
the ball on the 33, the Steer 
defense took its toll. Tackles 
by Gary Haseloff and a stop 
four yards behind the line of 
scrimmage on third down by 
Raymond Sierra, forced a 
Sudan punt on 4th and 14. 

After a 50-yard Sudan punt 
and no Farwell return, the 
Steer offense showed its skill, 
beginning its first scoring 
drive on the 15-yard line. With 
shorts runs from Raymond 
Sierra, Alan Eubank, and Paul 
Fulcher, the Steers faced a 3rd 
down and five, when a 65-yard 
sprint from Santiago Lucio 
brought the ball to the 9-yard 
line. Eubank, on first down, 
ran the ball to the two, from 
where he also took the ball 
across the goal line for six 
points. Sierra kicked the extra 
point to give Farwell a 7-0 
lead. 

Later in the first quarter, 
Sudan took over the ball on the 
22, and again were held to 
minus yardage by the tackles 
made behind the line by Steve 
Schilling, Sierra, Johnny Dan- 
iel, Eubank, and Lucio. On 4th 
and 18 the Hornets punted and 
Lucio took the return 47 yards 
for a touchdown which was 
brought back because of a 
penalty, ending the first quar-
ter of play. 

The Steers began the second 
quarter on the 37-yard line and 
went 63 yards behind the 
running of several members of 

MANUEL CANTU RAYMOND SIERRA 

Defensive Steer of the Week 
honor goes to Raymond 
Sierra, junior middle lineback-
er, for his performance in the 
Farwell-Sudan game. He was 
named by the Farwell coach-
ing staff for making eight 
tackles last Friday night. "He 
seemed to be in on every 
tackle," said Coach Bruce 
Dollar. 

JIMMY BERNAL 

Offensive Steers of the Week honors are shared by Jimmy 
Bernal, junior, and Manuel Cantu, junior. They were named 
by the Farwell coaches for their "great" offensive blocking 
enabling the backs to break through for long runs and victory 
in the Farwell-Sudan game last Friday night at Steer 
Stadium. Bernal also scored one touchdown and caught one 
pass for 12 yards; and Cantu caught one pass for 25 yards 
during the game. 

[Photos by Steve Holcomb of Clovis and Bill Kent of Farwell] 

Farwell High School 

Elects Class Officers 

4 

4 

nia Bland, Shirley East, and 
Edward Wees. Class parents 
are Mr. and Mrs. Delbert 
Lingnau and Mr. and Mrs. 
Eddie Smith. 

Freshman class officers are 
Eric Williams, president; Bob-
by Ford, vice-president; Kevin 
Owen, secretary; and Sherilyn 
Thigpen, treasurer. Class spon-
sors are Randy Long, Richard 
Montgomery, and Mrs. Martha 
Wheeler. Class parents are Mr. 
and Mrs. Jerry Ford, Mr. and 
Mrs. Vernon Thigpen, and Mr. 
and Mrs. Joe Hughes. 

Farwell Steer Paul Fulcher 
[#22] pulls away from the pack 
of Sudan Hornets en route to a 
55-yard pick up which ended at 
the 5-yard-line where he was 

Students at Farwell High 
School met last week and 
elected class officers for the 
coming year. 

Senior class officers are 
Kelly Davis, president; Steve 
Schilling, vice-president; and 
Jennifer Stancell, secretary-
treasurer. Class sponsors are 
Mrs. Lucille Franse, Mrs. Pat 
Graham, and Mrs. Dorris 
White. Class parents are Mr. 
and Mrs. Jerry Davis and Mr. 
and Mrs. Harlin Obenshain. 

Junior class officers are 
Suzahn Inman, president; Lez-
lie Castleberry, vice-president; 
Sheran Smallwood, secretary; 
and Norine Jones, treasurer. 
Sponsors are Coach Vester 
Joiner, Coach Mike Martin, 
Mrs. Kay Stanton, and Coach 
Lupe Valdarez. Class parents 
are Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy 
Castleberry, Mr. and Mrs. 
Troy Christian, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe Smallwood. 

Sophomore class officers are 
Roger Robertson, president; 
Mark Cole, vice-president; 
Kim Routon, secretary; and 
Sammy Sanchez, treasurer. 
Class sponsors are Mrs. Daph- 

The Blue and White charges of 
Coach Bruce Dollar picked up 
their first win of the season, 
drubbing the Hornets 62-0. 

Ivins Photo] 

finally hauled down by the 
defenders. The action came in 
the second quarter of the 
Farwell-Sudan encounter Fri-
day night at Steer Stadium. 

waiting to make the inter-
ception and take the ball all 
the way for the touchdown 
making the score 41-0. 

After the Farwell kickoff, 
Sudan took the ball on the 20. 
With tackles by Tim Hughes 
and Jesse Anzaldua, Sudan 
was forced to punt once again. 
On the punt, there was another 
fumble which was recovered 
by Frank Cantu on the 3-yard 
line to set up a Eubank 3-yard 
run for the touchdown. Sierra 
again kicked the extra point to 
make the score 48-0. 

Sudan received the ball on 
the 20 where they were held 
motionless by the Steer de-
fense. On 3rd and 12, Johnny 
Daniel recovered a fumble in 
the air and ran it all the way 
for an apparent touchdown; 
however, the ball was brought 
back to the point at which it 
was caught. The Steer offense 
took over and Lucio ran 25 
yards for the touchdown. 
Sierra kicked the extra point to 
make the score 55-0. 

Later in the fourth quarter 
with Sudan's ball on the 30, 
Sierra picked off a Hornet pass 
and returned it 24 yards to the 
6-yard line where Armstrong 
carried the ball six yards for 
the touchdown. Sierra kicked 
the extra point for the last 
Farwell score. 

Sudan made a final effort to 
score but the Hornets were 
stopped by the Steer defense 
including several tackles by 
Steve Schilling. 

The Steers' first home game 
of the season thus end-
ed: Steers 62 - Hornets 0. 

•.. 

Coach Bruce Dollar said, 
"The boys played real well 
against Sudan, executing the 
defensive plays well and doing 
a great job on the offensive 
blocking. We just couldn't have 
made those long runs without 
the blockers doing their jobs so 
well." 

When asked about tonight's 
game against the Seagraves 
Eagles, Coach Dollar said, 
"Seagraves is one of the best 
teams on the South Plains. 
They have won 100 games and 
lost only 16 in the past 10 
years, and haven't been scored 
on this year. They have won 
with scores of 35, 34, and 35-0 
in the last three games, but we 
hope to change that." 

U. 

STATISTICS 

a The Black Mountain Gulf Club 
in North Carolina has the 
longest 17th hole in the world: 
745 yards with a par of six. 4'1  

Farwell Sudan 
24 First Downs 3 
453 Yards Rushing 41 
72 Yards Passing 10 
525 Total Yards 51 
4 Passes Att. 7 
3 Passes Comp. 1 
3 Passes Int. By 0 
0 Punts 
0 Punt Avg. 29 
3 Opp. Fum. Rec. 6 
11/100 Penalties/yards 6/60 

Three For Fat-well 
Purchase, or lease from Deere, any 
tractor model listed here and quality for 
a John Deere money bonus 

and White who held the visitors 
to three first downs white 
racking up an awesome 62-0 
score. Tonight [Friday] the 
Steers host the Seagraves 
Eagles in the Homecoming tilt 
starting at 8 p.m. [J.R. Ivins 
Photo] 

Raymond Sierra boots the ball 
through the uprights from 33 
yards out to put three more 
points on the board for the 
Steers in Friday night's thrash-
ing of the Sudan Hornets. The 
game, played at Steer Sta-
dium, was a rout for the Blue 

110-hp 4240: $2,300 
90-hp 4040: $2,200 
80-hp 2940: $1,800* 
80-hp 2940: $1.400' 
70-hp 2640: $1,300 

180-hp 4840: $3,600 	60-hp 2440: $1,200 
155-hp 4640: $3,400 	50-hp 2240: $1,100 
130-hp 4440: $2,800 	40-hp 2040: $ 900 
*without Sound-Gard' body 
• 

 
with Sound-Gard body 

300-hp 8850: $8,200 
235-hp 8650: $6,400 
185-hp 8450: $5,700 
228-hp 8640: $4,500 
179-hp 8440: $4,000 

SUPER 
TRACTOR 
SAVINGS 

Farwell 50's Day 
"is this how our parents 
looked?" ask, from left, Kelly 
Davis, senior, James Gump, 
freshman, and Geretta Hutch-
ins, junior. These students 
were participating in part of 
the Farwell Homecoming 
week which featured 50's day, 

crazy hair day, inside-out day, 
plaid day, and dress up day to 
celebrate the homecoming 
event. Homecoming Royalty 
will be crowned at a pep rally 
at 3 p.m. today, and the Steers 
host Seagraves in the game 
beginning at 8 p.m. 

THP Sergeant Reports 

Area Accident Results 
Sergeant Billy Don Scott, 

area supervisor of Parmer 
County, reports that the month 
of July, the Texas Highway 
Patrol Troopers investigated a 
total of seven accidents in this 
county. There were three 
injury accidents with a total of 
six persons injured, and four 
property damage accidents. 

In District 5B, which in-
cludes the top 31 counties of 

the Texas Panhandle, there 
were 269 accidents investigated 
by the Texas Highway Patrol. 

Highway Patrol Captain Bob 
Russell reports that the THP 
Troopers investigated nine 
fatal accidents with a total of 
11 persons killed, 103 injury 
accidents with a total of 193 
persons injured, and 157 prop-
erty damage accidents. 

Oriental 

Masonry 

Portland 
Storm 

Insulation-Fiberglass 

& 
1201 E. First 

HOME 

Stucco 

Cement 

Cement 
Windows 

FREE 
TEXICO 

SUPPLY 

& 

Clovis 

DELIVERY 

LUMBER 

9.95 

4.25 

4.95 

c .18 

FARWELL 

taw & Up 

Per Sq. Ft. 

TO 

CO. 
763-4437 

1MAR:83 
WAIVER 
OFFER 

This Monday,Sept. 20 thru 
Sunday, Sept. 26 only. 

Only at participating stores. 

Finance your new tractor with Deere and 
get a second bonus: finance charge can 
be waived to March 1, 1983. This waiver 
plus the money bonus is yours, from 
John Deere, over and above our new 
tractor discount. And we're making 
specially good trades on your older 
models-3020's, 4020's and other 
tractors of that age. 
(Financing and leasing subject to 
approved credit.) 

Get our best deal...get a John Deere 
money bonus...get a waiver of finance 
charge from Deere. Get moving...the 
whole deal can be withdrawn on short 
notice from Deere. 

Every Hungr-buster is made to your order 
with a quarter-pound' of 100% pure lean beef. 
•Pre-wokeic *Nr • 

CAL JORDAN 
IMPLEMENTS 

763-5517 

EAST MABRY MINE We treat you like a Texan. 
Cowin •342 712 0 000 Carol sa my., Nntya S to irgonarits 0 Ella 0 0 00 Carol grievant! 11101"r. AR 0 0 Coy 

I 



RONNIE GALVAN TERRY TUBBS 

CALL ON US 
During Harvest Time 

FOR PARTS AND 
SERVICE 

OUR SERVICE CREW 
IS RADIO DISPATCHED! 

Wooley 
International Inc. 

West Hi-Way 70-84 	Muleshoe 
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Sundown Roughs 'Horns For Homecoming Victory Remain Undefeated - 

Green Machine Rolls On, 
Wolverines Big Lick Awards 

• 
Defeats Cardinals 14-2 

they travel to Valley to take on 
a strong bunch of Patriots who 
have a 2-1 record on the 
season. 

Coach Campbell says of the 
Patriots, "They are a real 
good ball team." 

Although losing three of his 
all-staters to graduation, Coach 
Ted Giddens says he's had to 
replace that many almost each 
of the five years he has been 

coach at Valley, but he 
believes that his program is so 
strong from freshman through 
seniors that he has capable 
persons to fill those shoes. 

Lazbuddie will find out if the 
spots have been adequately 
filled in the opening district 
game tonight at 8 o'clock. 

Texico Juniors 

Selling Mums 

Offensive and defensive Wolverines for the Big Lick Award 
have been named by the Texico coaching staff for their 
performance at Eunice last Friday night. Terry Tubbs won 
the defensive honor for making nine tackles and his kickoff 
return. Ronnie Galvan won the offensive honor for his punting 
ability, and he also made three tackles during the game. 

[Photos by Ronnie Warmuth] 

played a good physical game. 
We still made some mental 
mistakes, but that happens 
sometimes with high school 
kids." 

According to Coach Lynn, 
the Eunice coach said his team 
played the best game all year 
against Texico. Coach Lynn 
also said that Eunice fumbled 
the ball near the Texico pal 
line and should have scored. 

When asked about tonight's 
game at Mountainair, Coach 
Lynn said, "Mountainair is in-
consistent in their plays which 
makes things real confusing, 
but we'll be prepared for 
them." He says his main 
concern is going on the road 
again. "We don't have any 
short trips, they're all long, 
hard trips." 

Texico junior class this week 
is beginning the sale of mums 
for the Homecoming game 
against Melrose on October 15. 
The mums range in price from 
$6 to $9, with a child-size 
carnation corsage available for 
$5. 

The mums or corsages can 
be ordered by contacting any 
member of the junior class, or 
by calling the high school 
office. All orders must be in by 
October 7, stress class mem-
bers. 

Texico Group Hosts Ice Cream Social 

second half when Billy Bibbs 
hauled in a Steward aerial for 
59 yards and six points. Billy, 
behind a fierce block from 
brother Earl, slipped by a 
would-be Cardinal tackler and 
raced to paydirt. Lloyd Wil-
liams kicked the PAT to put 
the Wolverines in front 14-0. 

The remainder of the second 
half was dominated by the 
defensive play of both clubs. 

Boarman hopped on a Cardi-
nal fumble late in the third 
period at the Eunice 29-yard 
line, but the Eunice defense 
stiffened and kept the Wolver-
ines from capitalizing on the 
break. 

After a good Eunice punt 
early in the fourth period, 
Texico was backed up deep in 
its own territory when the 
Cardinal defense trapped Wol-
verine quarterback Steward in 
his own end zone, putting the 
Cardinals on the scoreboard 
for the first time this season. 

The Wolverines hit the road 
again tonight (Friday) when 
they go to Mountainair looking 
for their fourth win to keep 
their undefeated streak alive. 

N. 

Coach David Lynn said, "I 
was real concerned about 
Eunice, but the Wolverines 

special guest State Representa-
tive Hoyt Pattison of Clovis. 

The Association had extend-
ed a special invitation to 
Pattison and thanked him for 
all the help he has given 
Texico school in the past and 
especially for his support in 
getting the funds for the 
proposed new building. 

The Texico Education Asso-
ciation sponsored an ice cream 
feast last Saturday in the 
school cafeteria. All Texico 
school employees and their 
families were invited. 

The event attracted about 30 
persons who were treated to 
homemade ice cream, cookies, 
and a cake baked by Mrs. Ima 
Gene Swinney. 

Included in the visiting was 

STATISTICS 
Texico 	 Eunice 
9 	First Downs 	9 
158 	Yards Rushing 	49 
109 	Yards Passing 	76 
10 	Passes Att. 	18 
4 	Passes Comp. 	7 
0 	Passes Int. By 	0 
4 	No. Punts 	6 
34.3 	Punt Avg. 	29.8 
1 	Opp. Fum. Rec. 	2 
10/90 Penalties/Yards 8/60 

Although the team has now 
been scored on, Texico's No 
Nonsense Defense still has not 
allowed a point this season as 
the Wolverines downed the 

igunice Cardinals 14-2 Friday 
wnight at Eunice to bring their 

season win streak to three. The 
home team scored the safety 
when Wolverine quarterback 
Brad Steward was trapped in 
the end zone. 

Texico received the kickoff 
to open the District 2-A en-
counter with Kevin West 
returning the kick to the 
27-yard line. The Wolverines 
were unable to generate any offense and were forced to 
punt. 

Steward got off a 35-yard 
boot and the Green Machine 
got a chance to prove its 
defensive power. They quickly 
forced a Cardinal punt and the 
offense had its second oppor-
tunity of the evening. 

Texico moved quickly down 
the field with Earl Bibbs 

dibreaking left around blocks by 
"Pr ommy Boarman and Jeff 

Holland to go 48 yards for an 
apparent TD; however, the 
play was nullified on a clipping 
penalty. Then the Wolverine 
offense sputtered and died at 
the Eunice 22. 

The teams exchanged punts 
on the next two possessions, 
but early in the second period 
Texico's defense was again put 
to the test as the Wolverines 

"lost a fumble on its own 
29-yard line. Shutting down the 
Cardinal offense very effect-
ively were linemen Jeff Hol-
land, Tommy Boarman, and 
Ronnie Galvan, with able 
assistance from linebackers 
Lynn Tubbs and Billy Bibbs. 

Eunice attempted a field 
goal on fourth down, but the 
kick went awry and the 

AikWolverines set up offensive 
Wshop once again, this time 

beginning what turned out to 
be the first scoring drive of the 
night. 

Five short plays moved the 
Wolverines downfield 80 yards 
with Earl Bibbs going over 
from the three to cap the drive 
and put six points on the 
board. Steward's kick was 
good and the Wolverines led 
the match 7-0. 

• The main play of the drive 
was a 42-yard pass from Stew-
ard to tight end Bob Johnson 
which took the ball deep into 
Eunice territory. From there 
the line play of Lloyd Williams, 
Boarman, Holland, Jesse Oroz-
co and Ronnie Dunsworth led 
Bibbs into the end zone. 

The remainder of the first 
half was a defensive struggle 

diand the teams went to the 
wlocker rooms with Texico 

leading 7-0. 
The Wolverines scored on 

their second possession of the 

Upcoming 

Sport Events 

The Sundown Roughnecks 
scored in the second and fourth 
quarters Friday night while 
holding the Lazbuddie Long-
horns scoreless to take a 14-0 
win and make their homecom-
ing a happy event. 

The two teams played fairly 
evenly during the first period 
with neither able to get the 
offensive gears in motion, but 
in the second quarter the hosts 
scored on a 25-yard drive that 
ended with a 10-yard run for 
the TD by the tailback, and a 
kick for the PAT. The drive 
started when an alert Rough-
neck pounced on a Longhorn 
fumble to give Sundown pos-
session. 

Lazbuddie managed one sus-
tained drive during the second 
period, but stalled at the 
15-yard line, leaving the hosts 
with a 7-0 advantage going into 
the locker rooms at halftime. 

The third quarter proved to 
be much like the first with 
neither team managing a' 
scoring drive. Lazbuddie's at-
tempt at a field goal went wide 
and the count remained 7-0. 

With about five minutes left 
in the contest a 9-yard pass to 
the split end resulted in six 
more points for Sundown. The 
kick for the PAT was true and 
that iced the game at 14-0 for 
the Roughnecks. 

Lazbuddie was held to 87 
yards while the host team 
racked up 253. 

The defeat leaves the Long-
horns of District 2-lA South 
Zone with a 1-2 record while 
putting the Roughnecks of 
District 2-lA North Zone with a 
1-1-1 tally. 

Coach Terry Campbell of the 
Longhorns said after the game, 
"We played good defense, but 
we just couldn't seem to 
generate any offense." 

Defensive player of the week 
named by Campbell was Bart 
Elliott, with Noe Gonzales given 
the Hit of the Week Award. 
Campbell did not name an 
outstanding player on offense. 

The Longhorns begin district 
action tonight (Friday) when 

Texico Pep Group Sells Spirit Shirts 

Farwell Steers will host the 
Seagraves Eagles at Steer 
Stadium tonight (Friday) in 
their Homecoming game at 8 
p.m. 

returned to the school by Sep-
tember 27, with shirts arriving 
around October 8. 

For further information, con-
tact Patty Wilson, Jackie 
Burk, Kay Warmuth, or Dixie 
Jesko. 

The Texico pep club known 
as the Bleacher Bums will be 
selling Wolverine spirit shirts 
starting this week. The shirts 
are green and white baseball 
jerseys with a scene of a 
Wolverine jumping over the 
words TEXICO printed on the 
front. Also available will be the 
person's name or initials at the 
cost of 25 cents per letter. 

The shirts are priced at $10 
for adult sizes and $9 for 
children's sizes. Order blanks 
will be given to the Texico 
students, and are available at 
the high school and elementary 
offices. Orders are to be 

National 

Farm 
Safety 
Week 

Sept. 19 - 26 
This past year, agriculture surpassed mining and 

construction as the vocation which accounted for the most 
accidents. In 1981, 1,900 deaths and 190,000 disabeling 
injuries occu red on the farm. 

More than half of the accidents involving farm 

machinery occur during harvest season. 

This year's campaign theme is, 

"Make It A Safe Harvest" 

 

Sonny & Tommy Invite Their Customers To Come By 

For Coffee Or A Soda Pop And Discuss Their Storage 

And Marketing Problems. 
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FARWELL - PLEASANT HILL 

     

Texico Wolverines will travel 
to Mountainair to meet the 
Mustangs tonight, with game 
time at 7:30 p.m. MDT. 

••• 

Lazbuddie Longhorns will 
play the Valley Patriots at 
Valley at 8 p.m. 

Texico volleyball A girls will 
compete in the Roswell Invita- 
tional September 24 and 25. 

••• 

Texico A, B, and junior high 
volleyball beams will travel to 
Dora September 28, with 
games beginning at 4 p.m. 
MDT. 

••• 

On September 30, Elida will 
come to Texico to play the A 
and junior high volleyball 
teams; games to start at 4 
p.m. MDT. 

11$11 

Farwell 7th, 8th, and fresh-
man football teams will host 
Friona at Steer Stadium on 
Thursday, Sept. 30, with games 
to begin at 5 p.m. 

I Home of The 
Green Machine 

The 1983 Cars 
and Pick-ups 
are now here. 

Still a fine selection 
of '82 Olds, Pontiac, 

Buick and GMC's 
in stock. 

GMC P.U. Discounted 
as high as '238300  

GMC Custom Vans 
Discounted up to $31000° 

Cutlass Ciera's Discounted 
as high as '2429" 

Buick Park Ave (Demo) 
Discounted s1400°° 

Large savings 
on all '82's 

ROBERT GREEN, INC. 
Muleshoe, Texas 

Parts & Service 7:30 - 5:30 

Salesmen 
Ken James - Terry Yell 

    

STEED-TODD 
FUNERAL FUNERAL HOME 

"When Understanding Is Needed Most" 

Prince & Manana-Clovis-Ph. 763-5541 

 

          

      

FREE 
ESTIMATES 

  

          

    

LET US GIVE YOU A FREE ESTIMATE ON YOUR 

NEXT BODY WORK NEEDS. WE WORK ON CARS, 

TRUCKS, FARM EQUIPMENT AND STOCK TRAILERS. 

 

     

     

    

AUTO - PICKUP - TRUCK 
GLASS 

 

     

      

EXPERT INSTALLATION 

   

    

The Body Shop 
104 Sixth Street, Farwell 

(Former Skating Rink) 

 

     



Texico Schools 

Teachers Of The Month 

/IN 
PREVENT BLINDNESS. 

JESSE OROZCO AUDREY MCCAULEY 

Helpful hints for budget 
blues will be the main topic on 
"The Creative Woman" show 
on September 28 and October 
2. Guest Connie Moyers, 
consumer service representa-
tive for Southwestern Public 
Service Company in Clovis, 
will explain how to make every 
penny count when it comes to 
cooking, grocery shopping, and 
menu planning. 

Viewers will learn to make 
homemade sweetened conden-
sed milk, pan coat, and learn 
to make several basic mixes 
ahead of time for use in other 
dishes. 

On September 30 "The 
Creative Woman" will feature 
topics on decorating with 
brass, a discussion with coun-
selors concerning women and 
alcohol, and a demonstration 
using the Jenn-air grill car-
tridge. 

Kaye Willmon, owner of The 
Final Touch in Clovis, will 
discuss decorating ideas fea-
turing brass items. She will 
demonstrate several different 
decorating concepts using the 
brass, baskets, silk flowers and 
butterflies, and talk about dif-
ferent levels in arrangements. 

Recently a Psychology of 
Women class at ENMU was 
asked to write the types of 
questions they were most con- 
cerned with in relation to 
women and alcohol and drug 
abuse. Some of these questions 
and many others will be 

r 	. . 1 
1 To Subscribe 1 
I 	Phone 	I 1 	 i 
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L 	 J 

George W. Strake, Jr. 

PROMPT DEVELOPING 
SERVICE — 

ALL SIZES FILM — - 

LARGE SELECTION 
PHOTO ACCESSORIES 

O.L. ANDERSON, 
PROPRIETOR 

617 Main 

HUDSON UPHOLSTERY 
Custom Upholstery. Slip Covers, Bedspreads 

And Decorator Specialty Items 

Cantonese Cuisine 

American Foods 

Banquet facilkits 

Catering 

For All Occasions 

Mabry Drive, Clouis - Ph. 763-4823 

We're matching innovative design with innovative 
financing—cutting already low rates on new equip-
ment down to the bone. Choose from four rock-
bottom annual percentage rate financing plans': 

4.9% A.P.R. financing for 15 months 
6.9% A.P.R. financing for 27 months 
8.9% A.R.R. financing for 39 months 

10.9% A.P.R. financing for 51 months 

Whichever plan you choose, the first payment 
is not due for 15 months. Rates apply on all new 
Allis-Chalmers tractors over 40 hp, including the 
exciting new 8000 Series models, and on all new 
rotary and conventional Gleaner combines and new 
Allis-Chalmers implements. Come in for full details 
on these limited time offers. Besides offering lower 
rates on new equipment, we're also offering special 
terms on good field-ready used equipment. 

'When financed through Mrs-Chalmers Credrt Corporabon 

Mrs-Chalmers resents the nght to alter or withdraw programs at its option. 

Gleaner  is an Allis-Chalmers trademark 

bYtir A ALLIS:CHALMERS 

PLAINS EQUIPMENT COMPANY,' INC. 

P. O. DRAWER A 

CLOVIS. NEW MEXICO 1141101 

O 
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McDonald's - - 

Two Texico Band Members Are 
All-American Band Nominees 

Home Eye Test Can Uncover 

Vision Problems In Children 
copies to employees, these 
booklets are available igb 
quantities free of charge.'  
TSPB is an affiliate of the 
National Society to Prevent 
Blindness, the nation's oldest 
voluntary health organization 
dedicated to sight conserva-
tion. 

sional eye examination, but to 
parents and teachers it's often 
the first indication of a vision 
problem and a sign that the 
child should have an eye exam. 

Almost a million copies of 
the kit are distributed each 
year, dramatically increasing 
the number of children whose 
eyes are being checked in the 
crucial early years. With some 
three million more children 
reaching their third birthday 
each year, the need to find 
those with vision problems 
continues. 

The Home Eye Test for Pre-
schoolers is available in Eng-
lish or Spanish. For a free 
copy of the test or other 
information about children's 
eye care, write to the Texas 
Society to Prevent Blindness, 
P.O. Box 7602, Amarillo, 
Texas, 79109. 

If your company, agency or 
institution wants to offer free 

ANNA SOUTHARD 

Two Texico High band 
students, Jesse Orozco and 
Audrey Autrey McCauley, are 
among the seven high school 
musicians from the Texas 
Panhandle and Eastern New 
Mexico who have been nomin-
ated to the 1982 McDonald's All 
American Band, it was an-
nounced last week. Jesse plays 
cornet and Audrey plays alto 
clarinet. Jesse also played in 
the New Mexico Lions Band at 
International Convention this 
year. 

The seven band students 
were nominated by their band 
directors in spring of this year 
and are now being considered 
along with other Texas and 
New Mexico students for 
positions on the All-American 
Band. Other area nominations 

EDDIE WEST 

include Canyon High School 
students Scott Sauer and Janie 
Baird; Booker High School 
student John Reimund; and 
Clovis High School students 
Roy McClintock, and Cathy 
Wood. 

"Once again, a very select 
and talented group of boys and 
girls have been nominated 
from our area to the All-Amer-
ican Band," said Ronald C. 
McVean, owner/operator of 
McDonald's Restaurants in the 
Texas Panhandle and Eastern 
New Mexico, "We are proud of 
their accomplishment. This 
honor is given only to the very 
best musicians in the country." 

The seven nominees are in 
competition with other Texas 
and New Mexico high school 
students who are vying for four 

An estimated half a million 
children aged three through 
five in the United States have 
eye disorders. Many of these 
defects can be most effectively 
treated in the early years. One 
of the eye problems of greatest 
concern, amblyopia ("lazy 
eye"), may lead to permanent 
vision loss if not discovered 
and treated before age six. 

To help identify children 
with eye probeims, the Texas 
Society to Prevent Blindness 
(TSPB) offers the Home Eye. 
Test for Preschoolers. Beamed 
at the parents of children in 
the preschool age range, the 
"test" is a simple do-it-your-
self way to check a child's 
sight at home. It can be pre-
sented as a game to play. The 
kit is self-contained, with an 
eye chart and directions for 
giving the test and interpreting 
the results. 

Children usually don't com-
plain about vision problems 
since they have no way of 
knowing how well they should 
see, and lazy eye frequently 
gives no signals through am 
pearance or obvious symp-
toms. The Home Eye Test does 
not substitute for a profes- 

positions on the All-American 
Band. Nominees are judged on 
the basis of their musical 
abilities, achievements and ex-
perience as well as good 
citizenship. Two musicians are 
selected from each state and 
the District of Columbia, plus 
one member each from the 
Virgin Islands and Puerto 
Rico. Those who are selected 
for the All-American slots will 
be announced in late Septem-
ber. 

The 104-member All-Ameri-
can Band will perform in this 
year's nationally-televised Ma-
cy's Thanksgiving Day Parade 
iin New York City and in the 
famed Tournament of Roses 
Parade on New Year's Day in 
Pasadena, Calif. 

All band members will be 
eligible for music scholarships 
to be awarded by the New 
England Conservatory of Mu-
sic in Boston, and the National 
Music Camp at Interlochen, 
Mich. 

Yamaha International Cor-
poration will award a new, 
professional-model instrument 
to an outstanding player in the 
All-American Band. All bari-
tones, sousaphones, percussion 
instruments, electric key-
boards and other electric 
combo products used by the 
McDonalds All-American High 
School Band are provided 
through the courtesy of Yama-
ha. 

Anna Southard and Eddie West were the first honorees 
selected as Teachers of the Month by Texico Schools Student 
Council. Mrs. Southard and West received framed certificates 
of appreciation last week at a surprise teacher breakfast for 
junior high and senior high instructors, hosted by Student 
Council members. 

Mrs. Southard teaches junior high language arts and one 
junior high science class. She has been teaching for 20 years, 
and this is her 12th year with Texico Schools. A graduate of 
ENMU, Mrs. Southard serves as the Rifle and Flag team 
sponsor for the band. 

West is in his 20th year of teaching vocational agriculture at 
Texico High. A graduate of New Mexico State University, 
West taught five years at Grady before moving to Texico. He 
also serves as the FFA Advisor. 

We Geative Woinari 
BY SHERYL BORDEN 

lip Dill=== 

I
^ Parmer County

Weather 
Elkins, Jenn-Air demonstrator 
for Fields and Company, 
Lubbock, will demonstrate the 
use of the grill cartridge made 
for the Jenn-Air surface units. 
She will discuss venting, 
cleaning, and the flexibility of 
the cartridges. 

"The Creative Woman" is 
produced and hosted by Sheryl 
Borden for KENW-TV, and the 
show is seen on Tuesday and 
Thursdays at 12:30 p.m. MDT 
and 2 p.m. on Saturdays. 

4 Advisory 

answered by a group of coun-
selors who work in the field of 
alcohol and drug treatment. 

Guests on this segment are 
Ed Duda, prevention and ed-
ucation specialist-counselor, 
Alcoholism Treatment Unit for 
Mental Health Resources, Inc., 
Clovis; Lt. Ed Boyle, CAFB 
drug and alcohol abuse control 
officer, Clovis; and Kennie 
Hardee, counselor for MHR, 
Inc., Clovis and Portales. 

To conclude the show, Sandy 

Warm temperatures and 
scattered rainfall again char-
acterized the weather in 
Parmer County for the past 
week. At Friona, 0.66 inch fell 
on 11 September. Maximum 
temperatures were 4.4-4.7° 
above normal while minimum 
temperatures were 0.2-0.6° 
above normal. Radiation val-
ues for the week were quite 
high and this in conjunction 
with the warm temperatures 
continued to result in high 
evaporative demands. 

Dryland sorghum and irri-
gated corn crops in the county 
are at or past physiological 
maturity and the dry condi-
tions will be beneficial for 
drying grain. Dryland cotton 
crops are depleted in terms of 
soil water reserves and con-
sumptive use for the period 
has been quite low. 

At Friona, the heat unit 
accumulation to date is 1990, 
while normal for this date is 
1738. 

Precipitation data at Friona 
for the next 3 weeks show the 
probabilities of getting 3, 1, 
and 0.4 inches or more of pre-
cipitation are 9, 47, and 72%, 
respectively. There is a 10% 
chance of getting no rainfall in 
the next 3 weeks and the mean 
value is 1.22. The maximum 
amount ever occurring is 5.61. 

William A. Dugas, Jr. 
Assistant Professor/ 
Agricultural Meteorology 
Specialist 

At Amarillo Parade 

Crazy Hats And Socks 
and junior high out of town 
bands. Attendants report that 
the parade route was about a 
mile long with spectators lined 
up to "eight people deep," with 
some overflowing into the 
street. Farwell junior high 
band also participated in the 
parade. 

Texico High School Band par-
ticipated in the competition at 
the Amarillo Tri-State Fair 
parade Monday morning. The 
competition included bands 
from all over the area with 
trophies going to the outstand-
ing 5A band, 4A and below 
bands, junior high city band, 

Last Friday at Farwell Schools 
was Crazy Hat and Sock Day 
which really kicked off this 
week's Homecoming festivi-
ties. Depicting the day with 
their "crazy" attire are Jen- • I 

Texico Varisly Volleyball 
Roswell Invitational Tournament 

Stplaba 21 25 

AOSatiti.. 

5:00 

YSTEI: 

saving tips and recipes on the 
"Creative Woman show Sep-
tember 28 and October 2. 

Guest On Show 
Connie Moyers, consumer ser-
vice representative for South-
western Public Service Co. in 
Clovis, will discuss budget 

SATURDAY 
11t00 

SATURDAY 
9:00 

ARTESIA 

6:00 Friday 

TEXICO 

Strake 
be Talk 

SATURDAY 
1 .00 

RIVERSIDE 

T 00 Friday 

PmS JV 

SATuRom 
12:00 

1..11URDAT 
10:00 

GODDARD 

1:00 ?Hay 

CAPROCK 

'11UPTAT SATURDAY 
5'00 fork CLOVIS 

SHOPPING 
DIRECTORY 

CRIME: IT'S THE 
VICTIMS WHO ARE 

LOCKED UP 
I want to talk to you this • 

week about an issue that trou-
bles me greatly and which I 
know is of great concern to 
Texans. It seems that when-
ever I have spoken about 
crime in the past 12 months I 
have gotten a strong and trou-
bled response. No matter 
where I am—Jewett, Roma or 
Dalhart—people tell me they 
are angry and afraid about 
crime in our state. 

This anger and fear con-
cerns me for two reasons. 
First, because this kind of an-
ger and fear serves as a sort of 
"jail" for innocent people. 
They are the ones locked in 
their homes at night while 
criminals go free. The second 
reason I am concerned is be-
cause unless something is done 
to stop the crime epidemic, 
people will be ripe for the kind 
of politician who will play on 
citizens' fears. The result 
could be that Texans lose their 
liberty in return for their 
"safety". In that sense. the 
crime problem is like a cancer 
gnawing at democracy. 

The incumbent Lt. Gover-
nor's response to the crime is-
sue has been shameful. While 

Infants and 
Maternity 

Wear 
1312 Main 763.7145 

he has been in Once the crime 
rate has risen 131'4. He has 
done nothing to attack crime in 
a substantial way. In fact, he 
has fought stronger anti-crime 
measures. He openly opposed 
the new wiretapping law de-
signed to catch drug dealers. 
He openly opposed the Gover-
nor's anti-crime package by 
putting it in a legislative com-
mittee run by a hostile Senator, 
who promptly bottled it up. 
Much of the package passed 
anyway and now Mr. Hubby 
has the gall to go around the 
state taking credit for it! 

His sympathies in the tight 
against crime are evident. Not 
long ago he allowed the Amer-
ican Civil Liberties Union 
(ACLU) to hold a fundraiser in 
his Houston mansion and he 
proudly defends it. The ACLU 
has consistently opposed laws 
that would make it easier to 
deal with the crime problem. 

I think such two-faced ma-
neuvering is disgraceful. It is 
obvious that if we are going to 
attack the crime problem. if 
we arc ever going to give law 
officers, judges and prison 
guards the tools they need to 
make us safer, Bill Hobby will 
have to go. 

If you have thoughts about 
this. I'd like to hear from you. 
Please write me at 1213 W. 
34th, Austin. 78705. 

nifer Williams. left, drum 
major, and Tammy Obenshain, 
twirler. Each day this week. 
students dressed for the "spe-
cial" days. [Delores Williams 
photo) 

ROTHWELL BODY SHOP 
1814 West 7th (Behind Delmer's Automotive] Clovis, N.M. 

CALL 763-3530 for free Estimate On 
All AUTO BODY REPAIR & REPAINTING 

ALSO GLASS WORK 

.1 

	A 

Paid Political Advertisement_ Texans for Strake 1213 W 34th 
Street. Austin. Texas 78705. Bayard Friedman Treasurer. 

Ph. 5051763-4142 1325 S. Prince St. 
Clovis, New Mexico 
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INTEREST 
RATES 

BROKEN! 
12.5°0 
ON ALL NEW 

VEHICLES 
IN STOCK! 
(With Approved Credit) 

4 
DAYS 
ONLY! 

(OPEN UNTIL 8 PM MIMS. & FBI) 

THE CLOVIS NEW CAR DEALERS WORKING WITH THE 

=ESTER N 	• inletrfirst Now 
BANK 	National Bank 	CLOVIS NATIONAL BANK 

ARE MAKING THIS SPECIAL LOW INTEREST RATE 
AVAILABLE NOW THROUGH SUNDAY-SEPT. 26-5 PM 

COME SEE THE 1983's WITH CLEARANCE PRICES 
AVAILABLE ON ALL REMAINING 1982's . . . 

NEVER HAS THERE BEEN A BETTER TIME TO BUYIM 
This Special Low Interest Financing Is Brought To You By The Western Bank, First National Bank, & Clovis National Bank And The Clovis New Car Dealers . . . 

• BENDER OLDS-CADILLAC-DATSUN • DOC STEWART CHEVROLET & BUICK 

• CLOVIS HONDA • CROW PONTIAC • RIERSON MOTORS 

• WATSON LINCOLN-MERCURY-TOYOTA 

• HAGELGANTZ BIG COUNTRY FORD AND SUBARU 



Legal 
Notice 

PAINTING 
PLUMBING 

Reasonable 
481.3667 

WANTED — receptionist and 
office clerk. Typing and 10-key 
proficiency. Apply in person, 
Parmer County Cattle Co., four 
miles west on Highway 60 from 
Bovina. Contact Jeanette Wal- 
ling, 806/225-4400. 	3-tfnc 

ji  

Sudderth Realty, Inc. 

Drawer 887 - 109 5th St., Farwell, Tx. 79325 
Phone 806/481-3288 or 806/481-3388 

Licensed in Texas, New Mexico and Oklahoma 

•••••••Ww%A.W.WaiftrnefteememossoftWamle 

lb pm An 41 tool nisi* and? 
1st the profusion's kelp po 	bryiag, 

soling or Iradlsg. We spooklin In mins. 
Olev as o all or Como by today. 

WE NEED YOUR WRNS TODAill 
alloWern~k•Nogirsia•WisellerWW•e•Set•So"..S•i% 

RESIDENTIAL AND COMMERCIAL 

Nice two-story 3-bedroom, 2-bath stucco house with fire-
place and garage. Priced for immediate sale. See to ap-
preciate. Possible owner financing. 

*it 

Need commercial property? Brick tri-plex with car-
ports. A good buy. 

Spacious 3-2-2 brick home with fenced yard. Makes this 
ideal home for the young family. 

••• 

In Texico, cozy 2-bedroom, 1-bath house with backyard 
storage. 

••111 

Quality plus• in this 2-2-2 with cozy den, storm windows, 
storage building and beautiful; completely fenced yard. 

••• 

Unique design and luxury master suite are only part of 
the special appeal of this 4-2-2 brick custom home. 2 
fireplaces, prestige neighborhood. 

*0* 

Plenty of closet space in this comfortable 3-bedroom, 11'2 
bath home, with fenced backyard, single garage and 
hobby/utility room, 

s  

Nice 2-bedroom, 1 	

iii  
5, c 	:Paced backyard. 

•• 

FARM AND RANCH 

160 acres, irrigated, with sprinkler. Extra good water 
area near Oklahoma Lane. 

••• 
230 acres Pleasant Hill area, priced to sell. 29% down. 
Owner will finance balance at 8%. $400 per acre. 

••• 

160 acres irrigated with nice small house. Lays nearly 
perfect. 

••• 

441 acres, four wells, nice brick home, steel barn, 
corrals, corn dryer and elevator. 

••• 

460 acres, three wells. Priced to sell. Good terms. 

160 acres irrigated 4 miles southwest of Bovina. 
••• 

160 acres Pleasant Hill area. One 8-inch well, one 
tailwater pit with pump. Lays nearly perfect. Priced to 
sell. 

••• 

••• 

162 acres irrigated joining Texico city limits on south. 
••• 

SAVING IS GREAT 

INVEST IN REAL ESTATE 

"Sales and Loans Are Our Service" 

••••• 

Get the family out of town and into this 3 bedroom, 1 1/2  
bath stucco house in Lariat. Has domestic well, central 
heat and air cond., insulated, garage, incinerator, 
corrals, and small feed shed. All on approximately 7/10 
acres. Just $20,000. 

••• 

If you're looking for a house in the country to rent, tall 
J.B. about this one. Located 4 miles northeast of Lariat. 

160 acres irrigated, southwest of Farwell, 
••• 

320 acres, 2 8-inch irrigation wells with motors and one 
large tailwater pit with pump. Lays nearly perfect. 
Priced to sell. Terms. Pleasant 11111 area. Will split into 
two separate 160-acre tracts. 

••• 

140 acres irrigated with circle sprinkler southwest of 
Muleshoe. 

••• 

320 acres irrigated, well improved, good water, .good 
house, large insulated shop, east of Farwell. 

••• 

466 acres, irrigated, 4 miles east of Bovina on highway. 

Lays nearly perfect. 
••• 

Ideal family farm. 240 acres, irrigated, SW of Bovina, 
good water area. Two 8-inch wells, 4-bedroom home 
with basement. Large garage. Owner financing avail- 
able. 

••• 

148 acres irrigated, w/extra nice large home. Bovina 

area. 

"ALWAYS ABOUNDING" 
"Therefore, my beloved breth-

ren, be ye stedfast, unmoveable, 
always abounding in the work of 
the Lord, forasmuch as ye know 
that your labor is not in vain in 
the Lord" (I Cor. 15:58). 

We should note carefully that 
the Apostle Paul here addresses 
only his brethren in Christ, 
those who have truly been born 
again—born into the family of 

hardest. Sometimes our bodies 
suffer for it, but we do not 
immediately giVe up. 

And how much more urgent 
is the work of the Lord! Souls 
for whom Christ died are perish-
ing all about us. It is our 
plain duty to pray for them and 
tell them of His love. It is our 
responsibility to toil and sacri-
fice that they may hear and 
believe the good news. What 
shall we say when some day we 
stand before our Savior if we 
have been satisfied merely to 
know Him ourselves? And 
what will He say? 

Let us then be up and going, 
"always abounding in the work 
of the Lord." Life is too short to 
fritter away the precious mo-
ments God has given us to pro-
claim His saving grace. Let us 
tell them, then, by lip and by 
life, by our testimony and by our 
behavior, that "Christ Jesus 
came into the world to save 
sinners" (I Tim. 1:15) and that 
"we have redemption through 
His blood, the forgiveness of sins 
according to the riches of His 
grace" (Eph. 1:7). 

Furthermore, he sent this 
appeal to Christians every-
where: To "all that • in every 
place call upon the name of 
Jesus Christ our Lord" (I Cor. 
1:2). He knew that there is a 
tendency among all believers to 
be tempted to abandon the work 
of the Lord through discour-
agement or carelessness, so he 
pleads with us to be "stedfast" 
and "unmoveable," reminding 
us that our labor is "not in vain 
in the Lord." 

How we need this exhorta-
tion! We do not soon abandon 
our businesses or homes. We 
toil on in spite of difficulties and 
obstacles, and when the outlook 
is darkest we often work the 

TWO MINUTES 
hero/ ME BIBLE 
BY CORNELIUS R. SIAM PRES. 

BEREAN BIBLE SOCIETY 
CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 40635 

FARWELL 
SURANCE 

AG
IN

ENCY, INC. 
AUTO-FIRE-CASUALTY 
509 Ave. A - Ph. 481-3671 

SHERLEY-ANDERSON- 

PITMAN, INC. 

Gregory Medical Services 

Dr. Jerry Don Gregory 
General Practice of 

Medicine and Surgery 

Announces 

New Office Hours 
Monday-Thursday 

8 a.m.-12 p.m., 1p.m.-5p.m. 

Friday & Saturday 
8 a.m. - 12 p.m. 

Appointments Accepted & Encouraged 
(Patients Register In Dr. Gregory's Office.) 

108 S. 1st 	Office Phone 272-5139 	Muleshoe, Texas 

ATTOMONFARMS 
Triple S Machine & Pump u 

	

11 	
has moved to Clovis 

U
We now offer the following: 

I. Irrigation Well Service 

2. Complete Machine Shop Service 

	

II 	
3. Welding Service 

4. Steel & Pipe Sales 

	

fi 	 1111 

	

on 	
5. Utility Trailers 

6. Livestock Feeders 	
IP 

7. Hay Racks 

	

in 	8. Goose Neck Plates 	
g 

	

1 	

Our irrigation service personnel have years of experience 
— We do the job right. 

Larry Stamps 	1115 W. 7th 	Bud Gibson 
Gerry Stamps 	Clovis, N.M. 

TRIPLE S 	. 

Well Service 
505-769-0775 

========== 

4 P.O. Box 426 
Farw ell, Tx. 79325 

WORLEY MILLS INC. 

infiirkT‘ 

ROSE DRUG 
& GIFT SHOP 

Prescriptions a Specialty 
481-3281 

CITIZENS BAH 
Texico Branch 

Complete Bank Service 
Member FDIC 

Pleasing flit! 
Baptist Chia& 

Bob Reid - Pastor 
Sunday School - 9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 10:30 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 6 p.m. 

Lyda Clunk 06 Clutiet 

L.L. Ginning - Minister 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 6 p.m. 

• 

• 

• 
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Research indicates nitrogen 

efficient in oil & gas recovery 
State Line Tribune 
Farwell, Texas S 

COLLEGE STATION —
Laboratory studies indicate ni-
trogen could be used to recov-
er more than 90 percent of the 
oil and natural gas left in res-
ervoirs, says a Texas A&M 
University researcher. 

Encouraging test results 
show that using nitrogen as a 
replacement for natural gas in-
jection increases recovery of 
oil, condensate and gas reser-
voirs, said Dr. Paul Crawford, 
professor of petroleum engi-
neering and assistant director 
of the Texas Petroleum Re- 

wnn pocket 
To bring out a coin or key 
The cross is there to remind me 
Of the price He paid for me. 

It reminds me, too, lo be 
thankful 

For my blessings day by day 
And to strive to serve Him 

better 
In all that I do and say. 

It's also a daily reminder 
Of the peace and comfort I 

share 
With all who know my Master 
And give themselves to His 

care. 

search Committee headquar-
tered at Texas A&M Universi- 
ty. 

Nitrogen has been tested in 
the laboratory to displace 
volatile oils. The oil recovery 
was about 97 percent with ni-
trogen injection compared 
with 99 percent recovery for 
natural gas and 98 percent 
with condensate. 

Nitrogen will both stretch 
our limited carbon dioxide 
supplies and reduce costs, 
Crawford said. 

WILL BUY GOOD used furni-
ture and appliances. Haney's 
Swap Shop, Farwell, Tex. 
481-9511. 

48-tInc 

APPLICATIONS are now being 
received for the position of 
part-time custodian for the 
Farwell Clinic. Please call 
481-3336 or come by 301 Third 
Street before October 8. 3.3tc 

Classified Ads 

Get Results 

So, I carry a cross in my pocket 
Reminding no one but me 
That Jesus Christ is Lord of 

my life 
If only I'll let Him be. 

OWN YOUR OWN Jean-Sports-
wear, Infant-Preteen or Ladies 
Apparel Store. Offering all na-
tionally known brands such as 
Jordache, Chic, Lee, Levi, 
Vanderbilt, Calvin Klein, 
Wrangler over 200 other 
brands. $7,900 to $16,500 in-
cludes beginning inventory, 
airfare for one to Fashion Cen-
ter, training, fixtures, grand 
opening promotions. Call Mr. 
Loughlin (612) 635-1304. 

3-ltp 

HOUSE FOR RENT - Call 
806/647-2245. 	52-tfnc RUMMAGE SALE — Oct. 1 & 

2, rear of Farwell City Hall. 
Farwell Study Club. Will dk 
accept donations of rummage, '1' 
contact 481-3441 for pick up. 

3-1tc 

COURTHOUSE 
NOTES 

CLASSIFIED & LEGAL RATES: 
First insertion, per word - 10c 
Second and additional insertions - 8c 
Minimum charge - $2.00 on cash order 
Card of Thanks - Same as classified word rate 

FOR RENT — Furnished 
apartment, utilities paid. In-
quire at 221 Anderson St., 
Texico. 	 3-Itc 

FOR SALE - Spacious 3 bed-
room home. Living and dining 
room, large kitchen, basement, 
garage, and apartment, stor-
age building. Call 481-9574. 

51-tf nc 

Double rate for blind ads 
Classified Display - $1.75 per col. inch 

Instrument report ending 
September 15, 1982 in the 
county clerk office, Bonnie 
Warren, county clerk. 

WD - Ernest Howard-Pedro 
Arguelles - Pt. lots 14 & 15, 
Sec. 33 T9S; R1E 

WD - Virginia Winegeart-
Pete B. Fulcher — NW1/4  & 
N1/2SW1  Sec. 4, T15S; R2E 

WD - Dora Dean Nunley-Vir-
ginia Winegeart — lot 7, Bik. 4, 
Mimo, Farwell 

WD - Veterans Land Bank-
Nellrita Beene — part of Sec. 
25, TIN; R3E 

Unusual plants 
will supply food, 
experts predict 

MINIMUM BILLING CHARGE $3.00 • 

• 

el 

• 

Classified Insertion Deadline For 
Friday's State Line Tribune - 10 a.m. Wednesday 

PUBLIC NOTICE 
A budget hearing will be 

held on September 27, 1982 at 
5:00 P.M. for all interested 
citizens of Parmer County. The 
following budget is proposed 
for the fiscal year of 1983: 

The total budgeted expendi-
tures are expected to be 
$1,540,002.00 of which Revenue 
Sharing monies of $94,349.00 or 
6.13% of the budget, is 
estimated to be received 
during E.P. 14 • 

The meeting will be held at 
Farwell, Texas in the County 
Courtroom for the purpose of 
discussion of the proposed 
budget. The proposed budget 
may be examined on weekdays 
in the County Judge:s office 
during regular business hours. 
All interested citizens will have 
the opportunity to give written 
and oral comment. Senior 
Citizens are encouraged to 
attend and comment. Handi-
capped persons needing assist-
ance or aids should contact the 
County Judge's office before 
the meeting. 
BY ORDER OF THE COM-
MISSIONERS COURT 
Porter Roberts, County Judge 

Published in the State Line 
Tribune September 17 and 24, 
1982. 

"A bore is a person who talks 
when you wish him to listen." 

Ambrose Bierce 

Dear Editor and Chief, 
I know your first name, 

everyone does. Being a Yankee 
by birth, however, perhaps I 
am pompous, or maybe the 
girl's school I attended dwelled 
too long on the social graces. 

Whatever, your time being 
valuable, I won't bend your 
ear, but get on with it. 

My beloved Bill will have 
died two years ago, Sept. 16. 
As his folks were in business 
for 30 years in that area and 
my husband grew up there, I'd 
like to remind my many 
friends of his passing. 

He was an air force pilot in 
WWII, shot down over Ger-
many, reported missing, then 
reported killed in action, and 
finally found by the Red Cross 
in a German prison camp, 
disabled, bad legs. but he sur-
vived. 

I like to think his great love 
for me sustained him. I have 
every letter he ever wrote me, 
My treasured possessions, 
priceless, but only to me. My 
love and thanks to Rosa for 
giving me Bill, her only child. 

The enclosed means much to 
me too. Expect you have read 
it before, but it never fails to 
strengthen me so perhaps it 
might help someone else. 

Hope to meet you and your 
lovely wife sometime. I was 
assistant foreign news editor 
for the Chicago Herald Exam-
iner and reporter during 
WWII, 

Most sincerely, 
Joyce L. Roberts 

Emelt Ckiaek 06 Mist 
Ralph Gates - Minister 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 10:50 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 6 p.m. 

The Cross In My Pocket 

I carry a cross in my pocket 
A simple reminder to me 
Of the fact that I am a Christian 
No matter where I may be. 

COLLEGE STATION —
Consumers all over the world 
can expect to see more food 
products and food ingredients 
from cottonseed, soybeans and 
sunflowers, say industry ex-
perts at a recent conference at 
Texas A&M University, 

Non-conventional plants also 
will provide more fuel, rubber, 
plastics, lubricants and animal 
feed, the experts predict, as 
researchers find replacements 
for products now imported into 
the United States such as castor 
oil and tung oil. 

This little cross is not magic 
Nor is it a good luck charm 
It isn't meant to protect me 
From every physical harm. 

Texica 
Ent Baptist CkM 

Joel Horne - Pastor 
Sunday School - 9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship • 10:45 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 6:30 p.m. 

It's not for identification 
For all the world to see 
It's simply an understanding 
Between my Savior and me. 

Emu& 
Tint Baptist' Chink 

Dudley Bristow - Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - II a.m. 
Evening Worship - 7 p.m. 

When I put my hand in my 

Atioexhig 06 Gait 
Rev. A.W. Harris 
Sunday School - 9:15 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 10:30 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 6:30 p.m. 

Sax Sete Collidit Cku'tek 

Father Jerry Mueller 
Sunday Mass - 9 a.m. [MST] 
Confessions 
Sunday - 8:30 a.m. [MST) 

Phone 1505]763-6468 

Ultttfd Pectinatai Clunk 
Rev. L.L. Harris - Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship - 7:30 p.m. 
Thursday Worship - 7:30 p.m 

Caboui Baptist Ckwiek 
Orbin Snodgrass - Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m 
Evening Worship - 7 p.m. 

Kew Light Baptist Clunk 
Thomas J. Spikes - Pastor 
Sunday School - 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship - I I a.m. 
Evening Services - 6:30 p.m. 

°Wham Lou 
Weilliv[int  Chi & 

Joel Ware - Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Worship - 11 a.m. & 6 p.m. 
Bible Study - Wed. 6 p.m. 

kir.] 5 p.m. 

Okialtasta Lou 
13aptiet Cktatit 

Howard Fthodes - Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - II a.m. 
Evenin: Worshi • - 6 1.m. LOVELACE 

OIL CO. Tempte Scotia Chad( 

Woodrow Lovelace FUNDAMENTAL 
INDEPENDENT 
For Information 

Call 481-9208 th Your Payroll 
U.S. Sen. Lloyd Bentsen, Room 240, Senate Office Building, 
Washington, D.C. 20510 Pho. 202-224-3121. St. Sialuee 

Luthetax ekttittit 

Herman J. Schelter - Pastor 
Sunday School - 9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 10:30 a.m. 

U.S. Sen. John Tower, Room 142, Old Senate Office 
Building, Washington, D.C. 20510 Pho. 202-224-3121. 

U.S. Rep. Kent Hance, U.S. House of Representatives, 1610 
Longworth Building, Washington, D.C. 20515. Pho. 
202-225-4005. itastfix Weatatitit 

iffetketliti Cluadt 
Donald Holladay.  - Pastor 
Church School - 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 11 a.m. 
Evening. Worship - 7 p.m. 

State Sen. Bill Sarpalius, Texas Senate, P.O. Box 12068. 
Capitol Station, Austin, Tx. 78711. 

Gosdwiff  Spaxish 
Baptist iftiaisx 

Sunday School - 9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship - 10:45 a.m. 
Church Training - 5:30 p.m. 
Evening Worship - 6:30 p.m. 

Wednesday Evenings - 7:00 

House Speaker Bill Clayton, Texas House of Represent-
atives, P.O. Box 2910, Austin, Tx. 78769, Pho. 512-475-3400. 



Rtetud he Name with Laura 'atolls 

Parmer County Extension Agent 
for Home Economics 

The 1992-83 Border Town Days 
Queen Jennifer Williams of 
Farwell rode in the Bull Town 
Days parade at Bovine, in the 
back of Steve Jones' 1924 

Dodge pickup. Jones' pickup 
won first place in the old car 
entries at the local Border 
Town Days parade. [Delores 
Williams photo) 

NOTICE 
Board of Review of Parmer County 

Appraisal District Meeting has been 

changed from September 25 

to October 16, 1982. 

Keebler 18 Oz. Vanilla Creme or Chocolate Fudge 

COOKIES 
WESTERN or 
PORK-BEANS 

99' 
Mill or Match 

151/2  Van Camps 2090 
Upton 3.6 Oz. hut 

TEA 
Shurfresh Big 24 Oz. Cni. 

COTTAGE CHEESE 
Campbell's No. 1 Can 

TOMATO SOUP 
Franco American 14'/4 Oz. Can 

SPAGHETTI 
Sunshine 12 Oz. Box HI-Ho 

CRACKERS  
&sic 32 Oz. Jug Kosher 

DILL PICKLES 
Wolf Brand IS Oz. (No Beans) 

CHID 
Chicken-Of-Sea 61/2  Oz. 

TUNA 
32 Oz. 6 Pk. 

PEPSI 
Shurfine 6 Oz. Pkg. White or Yellow 

CORNBREAD MIX 
Minute Maid 12 Os. 

LEMONADE 

99'  

99'  

890  

4.79 

514.00 

79' 

4.99 

4.29 
414.00 

314.00 

79' 

BIG BLUE 
BONUS 

SPECIALS 
WITH FILLED BIG BLUE 

BONUS BOOKLETS 

Pops-Rite 2 lb. Bag . 

POP CORN 
250  

With each filled BIG BLUE 
BONUS BOOKLET 

Shurfine 1 lb. 

COFFEE 
4.39 

With each filled BIG BLUE' 
BONUS BOOKLET 

With each filled BIG BLUE 
BONUS BOOKLET 

Nestles 1 lb. Ban 

°COMTE 
QUIK • 

With each fitted 	BLUE 
BONUS BOOKLET 

Shurfresh 

EGGS 
Elfti large 

29' 
'With each filled BIG BLUE  
BONUS BOOKLET 

Kraft W. 

MIRACLE 
WHIP 
69° 

ith each filled BIG BLU 
BONUS BOOKLET 

3 lb. 

CRISCO 
4.79 

Hormel Semi-Boneless 

PORK ROAST 
U.S.DA Choice Boneless 

ROUND STEAK 
Wilson's Dry 

SALT PORK 
U.S.DA Choice Boneless 

SIRLOIN TIP ROAST 
Hormel Super Select 

PORK STEAK 
Alpo 141/4  Oz. Beef Chunk 

DOG FOOD 
Alpo 25 lb. Bag 

DOG FOOD 

lb, 4.49 

Lb. $1.79 

Lb. $1.19 

lb.  4.79 

Lb. $1.59 

2169' 

$6.29 

WIMP 

We Redeem U.S.D.A. Food Stamp 

Open Til 9 o'clock Every Night 

Double Stamps On Wednesday 

900 Ave. A Farwell 

Ph. 481.3432 

000 

gib 0 
0000 
0000 
0000 
0000 

ai ;reel  

ml 

  

• 

• 

• 

Nutrient density is an im-
portant consideration when 
choosing foods and planning 
meals. 

Nutrient density is a food's 
nutrient content — how much 
nutrition it provides — as 
compared to the number of 
calories it contains. 

To determine nutrient den-
sity of a food, compare its 
number of calories for one 
serving with the amount of 
nutrients, such as vitamins and 
minerals. 

Foods with low nutrient 
density have many calories 

ft  and few nutrients. To get 
✓ enough nutrients from these 

foods requires large quantities 
of them — at a high-calorie 
cost. 

On the other hand, foods with 
high nutrient densities supply 
significant amounts of several 
nutrients — and relatively few 
calories. 

Low nutrient-density items 
.n  include high-sugar and high 
▪ fat foods, such as soft drinks 

and chips. 
High nutrient-density items 

are watery, fibrous foods such 
as vegetables, which are low in 
sugar and fat. 

To get the most nutrition at 
the lowest calorie cost, re-
member these food facts: 
Instant meals made in a cup or 

• 

• 
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dG 
Ore Ida 2 lb. 

TATER TOTS 
	

99'  
Gary's im" 
BARBECUE BRISKET 
	

$2.99 
Borden's (Half Gallon) 

ICE CREAM 
	

4.59 
cast 1 lb. Bag 

CARROTS 
	

19 
Calif. Firm Pink 

TOMATOES 
	

3 ut1$1.00 
Colo. U.S. No. 110 lb. Bag Russet 

POTATOES 
	

99' 
card. Thompson Seedless 

GRAPES 
	 lb. 59' 

bowl may not contribute much 
protein or vitamins A and C 
because they contain only 
small amounts of meat and 
vegetables. 

Usually, plain foods are less 
expensive, have fewer calories 
and contain more nutrients  

than those with rich sauces. 
Foods with the highest per-

centages of U.S. RDA are not 
always the best selection, 
because a food with a high 
percentage of a certain nutri-
ent improves a diet only if the 
diet is short in that nutrient. 

In Bovina Parade 

AUTUMN 
IS A TIME 

TO BUCKLE-UP 
FOR SAFETY 

0 National Safety Council 
444Nwhrou, an Avenue 

I lhron 

Notice Of Board Of Review Meeting 

Notice is hereby given that the Board 

of Review of the Parmer County Appraisal 
District will meet on Saturday, October 16, 

1982, at the Parmer County Appraisal 

District office whose address is 305 3rd St., 

Bovina, Texas, from 9:00 a.m. - 12:00 noon 
and from 1:00 p.m. - 4:00 p.m. (or until all 

appointments have been met). 

Board will be meeting to determine, fix, 
and equalize the value of all taxable property 

for Parmer County cities and school districts. 

Protest letters must be filed by 4:00 p.m. 
Wednesday, October 13, 1982 to meet with 

the Review Board. 

Parmer County Appraisal District 

Box 56 	Bovina, Texas 79009 
Phone 806/238-1405 

Or Toll Free, Operator Enterprise 8-3371 

Ron Proctor, Chief Appraiser 
Parmer County Appraisal District 

• 
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Area 
Merchants FOOTBALL CONTEST al Ann ual 

Risen Campers 
1200 E. First - CI,* - Ph. 762-9606 

Siarstafi Camping Trailers 

Shasta Trailers £ Fifth Wheels 

GENE'S C.B. 
AND AUTO SOUND 

is Now At 

2201B Mabry Dr. 
Behind Dora Built Bldg. 

9 	"Best Bank Around" — . 

— 

TEXICO 

1111 
liff 

- 
ill 
-- 

BRANCH 

IH 
40 

1 	li  
ri 
--1 - 

1 
IT 1 	1  
- 	• 

. ‘,nr 
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LOVELACE OIL CO. 
Woodrow Lovelace 

Farwell, Tex. 

Rose Drug 
Prescriptions Our Specialty 

Ph. 481-3281 	Farwell 

C & T Fertilizer and 

Equipment, Inc. 

Farwell - Clovis 
481-3366 	 Farwell, Tex. 

FARWELL FERTILIZER 

Custom Combining 

The Hardages 	 Ph. 481-3844 HiWay 

-.r. 44 Nesir 

MASSEY-FERGUSON 
SALES & SERVICE 

18 N. 	 Clovis 

GRAND PRIZE 
Two tickets to the 

Dallas Cowboys 
vs 

New Orleans Saints 
In Texas Stadium 

Sunday, December 19 
Plus one nights lodging at the 

Regent Hotel with transportation 
to and from Cowboy Stadium with 

$5000 

expense money. 

,.. 	SECURITY STATE BANK 

__AAIIM 	'-'11 

( .1 
WlY 

WORLEY 
LIM 

Al7t--  

—if  

MILLS INC. 
—111, Vie IR 	_ i_ ....,  

P. O. BOX 426 
FARWELL, TEXAS 79325 

Sillr—` ITIr --- — A --7---  '• 	di 	t' 	so 	 ism 	— 

FARWELL INSURANCE 

A 
In 	Farwell 

SHERLEY-ANDERSON- 
PITMAN, INC. 

John Williams, Mgr. 
"SERVING PARMER COUNTY 

In 	Lariat 

SHERLEY-ANDERSON 
GRAIN 

Lonnie McFarland, Mgr. 
FARMERS THE YEAR 'ROUND" 

7'. 	
AGENCY INC. 

YOUR/
AGENT
dependent 	 509 Ave A insurance 	'  

5..=-.- 	Ph. 481-9372 or 481-3671 
WEEKLY PRIZES 

$7.50 - 1st Place 
$5.00 - 1nd Place 

1. There are 12 football games listed. 
2. Pick the team you think will win in each game and circle 

the WINNER'S NAME. 
3. PICK THE SCORE of the GAME OF THE WEEK and place 

your guess in the appropriate blank on the entry. Bring or 
mail the entry blank to The Tribune office by 5 p.m. Friday 
of this issue. 

4. Tabulations of individual entrants will be kept all season 
and at the end of the season Grand and Second Prize 
winners will be named. 

5. Only one entry blank may be submitted per individual. 
6. Tabulations will be available for public inspection. 
7. Contestants must be 12 years old or over. 
8. Game of the Week used as the tiebreaker only. 

INTERSTATE FERTILIZER,INC. 
Custom Application - Custom Blends 

Seeds - Anhydrous Ammonia - Chemicals 

Ph. 481-3838 - Off. 	 500 N. 9th 
4814093 - Whse. 	 Farwell, Tex. 

We Support The 

Texico 	 Farwell 
Wolverines 	And 	Steers 

C A RMAC K & SONS, INC, 

	

314 MAIN 	CLOVIS, N. M 
' 38. 	mr, 	>icre 	ride, 	,oPorn 	like N ikel 

Your Favorite 
Sends Shredders & Blades 
Bushhog Module Builders 

"Sales And 
Phone 272-5514 	Muleshoe 

WOOLEY INTERNATIONAL 
■ 

HI. 
Miller 

Noble 

Service' 

Dealer 

, 

Hamby 
Crustbuster Drills 

W. Hi Way 70-84 

• 

Farmers Cooperative Elevator 
Serving you from three convenient locations 

Clays Corner - Muleshoe - Enoch 
ENTRY BLANK 

NAME 
Bull Dog Welding 

88 Blacksmith 
Bob Vinton, Owner 

901 Wheeler - Texico - Ph. 482-9113 

ADDRESS OKLAHOMA LANE FARM SUPPLY 
"Agriculture Is Our Business" 

Every Need For The Farmer 

Caldwell Shredders - Hamby Tools 
Ph. 825-2345 	 225-2146 

PICK SCORE FOR THIS GAME 

Texico 	 at Mountainaire 

CIRCLE YOUR CHOICE 

1. Seagraves at Farwell 

2. Shallowater at Sp'Lake-Earth 

3. Hart at Lubb. Christian 

4. Dexter, N.M. at Bovina 

5. Memphis at Kress 

6. Dimmitt at Olton 

7. McNeeee St. at West Texas 

8. Baylor at Texas Tech 

9. Mississippi at Arkansas 

io. Missouri at Tex. 

11. Nebraska at Penn St. 

12. So. Cal. at Oklahoma 

ZUKE 4 ,  OF CLOVIS. INC. 
F 	' 	 520 MAIN 

CLOVIS 	NEW MEXICO 88101 

TWIN CITY MACHINE WORKS 
481.3471 

300 Ave A 	Farwell, Tex. 

JJ's MOBILE 
HOMES, INC. 

P.O. Box 412 	801 Wheeler 	Ave. 
1. 	

Texico, New Mexico 88135 

Phone 505-482-3341 	,, 
6 

EASTERN NEW MEXICO 
RURAL TELEPHONE 

COOPERATIVE 
Serving You With The Finest In Communications Systems. 
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