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The weather this week is 
quite a contrast from the cold 
we were endliring last week. 
Wednesday of last week was 
quite a contrast w :t blizzard 
conditions about noon and 
almost a clear blue .13.y in the 
evening. 0.ir stit• 	lid not 
goduce a measure amount 
tn. moisture, hut a 	cau- 
sed a n:eas able amotin • of 
dr: . ing problems.," high for 
Tuesday, January 3rd, reach-
ed 61 with the same or higher 
predicted for Wednesday. 

I am happy to report how-
ever. There were no snow 
and/or ice related accidents 
Qiich required the local amb-
ulance service. We made a few 
runs during the severe cold 
but our transfers to Amarillo 
came at a time when the 
highway crews had had an 
opportunity to have the roads 
cleared. 

-ewe- 
In making out the Ambu- 

',.„,mce report for the year, Mary 
K. Christner reported a record 
year in the number of ambu-
lance runs for 1983. I am 
reminded of our predicted 
number of runs at the time the 
service was started in 1976; 
local service at that time 
(Wright Funeral Home) av-
eraged about 70 runs per year. 
The oil field caused a number 
cit runs at that time, but the 
number continues to increase 
with very few rig-related ac-
cidents in 1983. 

-ewe- 
Last week, just as I was 

completing my column, the old 
typewriter played out. I made 
comment of the age being at 
least 25 and had that verified 
ahen the repairman could not 
find a serial number. At the 
present time, I have an electric 
machine borrowed from the 
Wheeler Abstract. I will cer-
tainly be glad to get the old 
reliable back in service. 

-cwe- 
I was called to the Wheeler 

Care Center about noon Tues-
day morning to take pictures. I 

not know what the residents 
were having for dinner, but 
the aroma certainly made me 
hungry as I walked up to the 
front door. 

Mr. Hyatt and his staff are 
to be commended for the way 
in which they operate the 
facility. The home is always 
clean and smells clean, the 
t'jsidents are clean, and there 
is normally some activity in 
progress for the residents. 

I urge everyone to take time 
from their busy schedules and 
vist the home. Most of the 
residents are local and would 
enjoy a visit from old friends. 

Crop Irrigation 
Meeting Topic 

JOE DON KING 
research scientists, Exten-

sion specialists and agents, 
and area farmers will get 
together in 	Amarillo 	in 
January to share the latest 
information on new equipment 
as) techniques to improve 
__up irrigation. 

This will be the annual High 
Plains Irrigation Conference, 
on January 12 at the Texas 
A&M University Agricultural 
Research and Extension Cen- 

• ter in Amarillo, said Don King, 
county Extension agent. The 
center is at 6500 Amarillo 
Blvd. West. 
4'The emphasis this year 
will be upon surge flow irri-
gation, use of low energy 
precision application (LEPA) 
systems, use of soil sensors to 
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MONA JENNINGS 

JamesConwell 
Buried Wed. *** HIM 

BOYS 
• James Oscar Conwell, 81. a 

former Wheeler resident, died 
Sunday morning in Las Vegas, 
N.M. 

Services were held at 2:30 
p.m. Wednesday at First Bap-
tist Church, the Rev. Jerry 
Parker, pastor, officiated. Bur-
ial was in Wheeler Cemetery 
by Wright Funeral Home. 

Mr. Conwell was born at 
Gainesville. He was married to 
Edna Jeneva Davis in 1925 at 
Wheeler. They moved to Albu-
querque, N.M.. in 1939. 

Mr. Conwell was an elect-
rical contractor and a Baptist. 

Survivors include his wife; 
two sons, James 0. Conwell, 
Jr. and Kenneth Conwell, both 
of Albuquerque; a brother 
Buford Conwell of Fort Worth; 
a sister, Mrs. H. 0. Miller of 
Borger; four grandchildren; 
and four great-grandchildren. 

Pallbearers were: Earl Bar-
nes. James Conwell, Jr., Ken-
neth Conwell, Henry Davis, 
Ray Davis, and S. D. Miller. 

FIRST 

SAT. 1,10 p.n. 

Perry Elliott 
Rites Read 

FIRST 
Sat. 7:00 p.m.  

rise  : GIRLS 
••••••••••• 

THIRD 
Sat. 500 p.m. 

SHAMROCK 
(Session 2) 

Thurs. 5:30 p.m. 
MeLEAN (Session 3) 

Fri. 1:30 p.m 

(Session 4) 

Fri. 8:30 p.m. 

(Session 1) 
Thurs. 9:00 s.m. 

WELLINGTON  (Session 3) (Session 4) 

Fri. 4:00 p.m. Fri. 9:00 a.m. 

BOOKER 

(Session 1) 
	 Thurs. 12:00 

MIAMI  

THIRD 
Sat. 4:00 p.m. 

SHAMROCK 
(Session 2) 

Thurs. 4:00 p.m. 
Mel CAN (Session 3) 

Fri. 12:00 
(Session 4) 
Fri. 7:00 p.m 

hours in advanced Criminal 
Justice course work at 
W.T. S. U. 

Mr. Adams has 3 years of 
military experience serving in 
the Military Police of the U.S. 
Army as a Sentry Dog Handler 
for the Canine Corps and 
attained the rank of Sergeant. 
Mr. Adams has nine years 

(Session 2) 
Tht...-s. 7.00 p.m. S Sessions 

Thurs. 11 6 2 
Fri. 	384) 
Sat. 	5) 

WHEELER 

CO-HOSTS: The Wheeler 
High School Girls Basketball 
Team will be the co-hosts for 
the annual Wheeler Invita-
tional Tournament. The tourn-
ament is scheduled for Thurs-
day, Friday and Saturday of 

Front Row: Becky Crockett, 
Dana Haws, Kristi Pierce, and 
Shawna Hampton. 
Not pictured is Coach Jan 
Newland. 

this week. These young ladies 
will be doing their best to keep 
their share of the trophies. 
They are (back row, I. to r.) 
Nise Gilbert, Renee Hogue, 
Mario Hartman, Melanie Wil-
liams, and Michelle Bentley. ••••V 

art 

•i 

Vera Mae Trimble Services Today ei 
Services for Vera Mae Trimble, 53. of Briscoe, 

will be held Thursday, January Sth at 3:00 p.m. 
Mrs. Trimble passed away January 3rd. 

The funeral will be in The First Baptist Church, 
Wheeler. Burial will be in Wheeler Cemetery. 
Wright Funeral Home is handling the arrange-
ments. 
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• Jennings Inducted Into Hall of Fame Panhandle 
WHEELER INVITATIONAL TOURNAMENT 
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CHAT WITH EDITOR 

ti. Huh. C 

AWE 
the way to the top by putting 
together rounds of 78 and 85 to 
win the 1983 Class A State 
Medalist crown. Mona now 
competes for Texas Tech Uni-
versity in Lubbock. 

The Panhandle Sports Hall 
of Fame will recognize the 
outstanding area athletes and 
coaches January 15, with cer-
emonies scheduled to begin at 
2 p.m. in Ordway Auditorium 
on the Amarillo College camp-
us. The public is invited. 
Further details may be obtain-
ed by calling the sports de-
partment of the Amarillo 
Globe News. 

MEMPHLS 

Top Ten Wear Light 
Dressing Roos C 

Bottom Team Wear Dark 
Dressing Room D (Session 1) 

Thurs. 10:30 a • 

WELLINGTON 
(Session 4) (Session 3) 

Fri. 10:30 e.m. 	 Fri. 5:30 p.s. 

BOOKER 

The Panhandle Sports 
Hall of Fame will honor its 
1983 honorees January 15. 
Among those selected to be so 
honored will be Wheeler's 
Mona Jennings, the 1983 
Class A State Medalist in girls' 
golf. 

Jennings was a regional 
contender her freshman and 
sophomore years and placed 
third in the Class 2A state 
medalist race as a junior. 
Jennings climaxed an out-
standing high school career 
her senior year by being 
undefeated starting with 8 
invitational tournaments all 

(Session 1) 
Thurs. 1:30 p.m. 

MIAMI 

CONSOLATICV 
Sat. 2:30 p.s. 

110.spauf glutei JIMMY ADAMS IS 
SHERIFF CANDIDATE LEFORS 

5 Sessions 
Thurs. 11 6 
Fri. 	3 A 4 
Sat. 	5) 

(Session 2) 
Thurs. 0:30 p.m. 

%HEELER 

Old Admissions 
5-15 O.W. Pendleton 
12-11 Clifford Weatherly 
12-25 Owen Jones 
New Admissions 
12-27 Amy Watts 
12-28 Lola Lantz 
12-29 Maggie Myers 

Norma Sumrall 
12-30 

MEMPHIS 

Jimmy Adams has authoriz-
ed the Wheeler Times to 
announce his candidacy for the 
office of Sheriff of Wheeler 
County. This candidacy will be 
subject to the Republican Pri-
mary in May of 1984. 

Mr. Adams, a 37 year old 
native of Wheeler County. is 
married to the former Marie 
Holloway of McLean, Texas, 
and has three children who are 
enrolled in the Wheeler Public 
School system. Mr. Adams is 
involved in many civic organ-
izations which include Cub 
Scouts Master, President of 
Wheeler High School Band 
Boosters, Lions Club, and is a 
member of the First United 
Methodist Church of Wheeler. 
Mr. Adams is the sone of Mr. 
and Mrs. Carroll Adams, and 
the grandson of the late Mr. 
and Mrs. W. W. Adams who 
came to Wheeler County in 
1909. 

Mr. Adams graduated from 
Wheeler High School and 
West Texas State University 
with a Bachelor of Science 
Degree in Criminal Justice 
Administration and has 18 

CONSOLATION 
Sat. 1:00 p.m. 

LEFORS 

Lucille Tipps 
Leon Moore 

12-31 Cathrine Dick 
Sandra Randolph 

1-1-84 Lance Reames 
Acie Kennedy 
Darville Atherton 
Glynnis Wiebe 
M.A. Rothenbarger 
Ron Powell 
Cindy Crutchfield 

1-2 	Frank Hyatt 
Richard Piercy 
Albeit Gunter 
Reba Hoffman 

1-3 	Myrtle Dorman 
Dismissals 

12-28 Leon Green 
12-29 Curtis Kidwell 

Gwen McClaren 
Susie Ivey 

12-30 Amy Watts 
Edwin Watts 
Norma Sumrall 

1-1-84 Leon Moore 
1-2 	Lucille Tipps 

Perry Lynn Elliott, 52, died 
Thursday. 

Services were held at 2:30 
p.m. Saturday, December 31 
in First Baptist Church, Rev. 
Jerry Parker, pastor. officiat-
ed. Burial was by Wright 
Funeral Home of Wheeler. 

Mr. Elliott was born in 
Wheeler County. He married 
Evelyn George in 1957 at York, 
S.C. He served in the U.S. 
Army for 20 years, until he 
retired and returned to 
Wheeler in 1973. He was 
employed by Taylor Petro-
leum. 

Survivors include his wife; 
four sons, Kenneth stationed 
in Okinawa; Tim, George and 
Daniel, all of Wheeler; a 
daughter. Darla Burch 	of 
Wheeler; his father and step-
mother, Mr. and Mrs. David 
Elliott of Sulphur Springs; 
seven brothers, Charles of 
Pampa, Robert of Spearman, 
Jessie of Sulphur Springs, 
Kenneth of Abilene. Billy of 
Arlington, and Tommy and 
William, both of Plano; and 
four sisters, Dorothy Cope of 
Kernville, Calif., 	Maxine 
Price of Sunnymeade, Calif.: 
and Sharon Guiterrez and Jane 
Elliott, both of Plano. 

Pallbearers were Charles 
Elliott, Dennis Elliott, George 
Elliott. Robert Elliott, Wayne 
Wheeler, Don Whiteley. 

Honorary Pallbearers were 
Normal Dyer, Billy Elliott, 
Kenneth Elliott, Leon Elliott, 
Rodney George, Leon Lane, 
A.E. Miller, Jr. 

Burial was on the Elliot 
Farm. Southeast of Wheeler. 

Lonnie Miller Enters 
County Sheriff's Race 

children are all very special to 
us. I have raised 4 chidren of 
my own and am aware and 
concerned with the problems 
our childern face today. As 
Sheriff, I could implement 
programs to help the children 
of Wheeler County cope with 
the pressures of drug and 

FREE 
CLINIC 

LONNIE MILLER 
alcohol abuse. that I am un-
able to implement as a deputy. 

The crime rate in the State 
of Texas is on the rise. As the 
Sheriff of Wheeler County, I 
will do my upmost to insure all 
the people of Wheeler County 
will be able to depend on the 
Sheriff's Department. No per-
son in Wheeler County should 
feel afraid in their own home. 

I would like to take this 
opportunity to personally 
thank the members of the 
Wheeler, Shamrock. Briscoe. 
Allison, Kelton and Mobeetie 
Volunteer Fire Departments. 
the Ambulance Crew, and the 
citizens that have assisted in 
manhunts, storm watches and 
searches for lost children in 
the past. They are a great 
asset to Wheeler County. As 
your next Sheriff. 1 feel that I 
will have people I can depend 
on for any emergency. 

Continued Page 7 

A free Immunization Clinic 
will be held Wednesday, Jan-
uary 11, 1984, at 9 a.m. to 12 
noon in the Wheeler High 
School Auditorium. All pre-
school children are eligible. 
This clinic is being sponsored 
by the Texas Department of 
Health. 

JIMMY ADAMS 
experience as a police officer 
in the City of Amarillo, the last 
two years spent as a training 
officer/investigator. He as-
sisted in the establishment of 
the school liason program 
instituted in 1979 with the 
public schools of Amarillo, 
Texas. He was also involved 
with the new officer training 
program instituted in 1978 to 
enhance the training of new 
police recruits. Mr. Adams 
received thirteen departmen-
tal citations including one form 
Clarence M. Kelly, Director of 
the F.B.I. for the apprehen-
sion of a bank robbery suspect 
in 1976. For the same incident 
Mr. Adams was named officer 
of the month for December of 
1976. 

Mr. Adams has taught 
classes in Criminal Investiga-
tion, Laws of Arrest, Laws of 
Search & Seizure, Introduction 
to Corrections, and Police —
Community Relations at the 
Amarillo Police Department 
Academy. Amarillo College 
and W.T.S.U., and an entire 
basic course for the Reserve 
Deputy Division in Potter 
County. He holds all law 
enforcement certifications is-
sued to Texas Peace Officers 
by the State of Texas. These 
certifications. 

Mr. Adams served a one 
year internship with the Potter 
County Adult Probation De-
partment and worked one year 
in the Potter County Adult 
Probation pre-trial release pro-
gram. He received advance 
certification in Adult Probation 
from the Texas Department of 
Corrections. 

Before moving to Wheeler 
in 1982, Mr. Adams was 
employed by Sears, Roebuck 
& Co. as the Security manager 
in Oklahoma City, OK. He has 
training in inventory control, 
employee defalcation, store 
security, and product liability 
investigations. 

"I am seeking the office of 
Sheriff of Wheeler County 
because the many supporters 
that have encouraged me to 
run and I feel that I can add a 
new dimension to law enforcc• 
ment in Wheeler Count\ . 

Continued Page 7 

Briscoe Fire Dept. 

Lonnie Miller has authoriz-
ied The Wheeler Times to 
announce his candidacy for 
election to the office of Sheriff 
of Wheeler County subject to 
the action of the voters in the 
Democratic Primary. Satur-
day, May 5, 1984. 

Lonnie was born in Wheeler 
County on January 10, 1933. 
He resides with his wife Avis 
and son Charlie at 400 W. 
Oklahoma St. in Wheeler. He 
is member of the First Baptist 
Church of Wheeler and is a 
member of the Masonic 
Lodge. He has over 19 years 
experience working in law 
enforcement with the past 41/2  
years here with the Wheeler 
County Sheriff Department. 
Lonnie is a Certified Police 
Officer and graduated with a 
96.2 grade average. He has 13 
different diplomas including 
Criminal Investigation. Homi-
cide Investigation, Bookkeep-
ing and Records and is also a 
licensed Hypnotist in Criminal 
Investigation. 

I am asking for your vote 
and support in this election. I 
will guarantee to continue to 
respond to and serve the 
people of Wheeler County the 
way I always have. In the past, 
I have been stationed in 
Wheeler and worked primarily 
in the Wheeler area. As your 
next Sheriff. I will serve the 
people of the Shamrock area 
with the same concern and 
respect as I have shown the 
people in the Wheeler area for 
the past 41/2  years. Shamrock 
has a very capable Police 
Department and constable. As 
your next Sheriff, I will work 
closely with and assist them in 
every way possible. 

I have worked hard to make 
Wheeler County a safe place to 
live and raise children. Our 

Volleyball 
Tournament 
The Briscoe Fire Depart-

ment will have a volley mall 

tournament March 1-2-3. Any- 
,ne 	interested in enter tag. 
contact: Kay Gatlin 323.8426, 
Brenda Hefley 375-2281; Bob-
bye Horn 826-5676. 

Lean and Lefors will be com-
peting with the Wheeler team 
for the trophies. Team mem-
bers pictured here are: (back 
row, I. to r.) Mark Moore. 
Robert Andis, Jimmy Braun- 

stein. Paul Hartman, Ronny 
Jones, Manson Porter, Coach 
Warren Besly. Front Row: 
Dale Hazel, Larry Trevino. 
Justin Miley. Roger Brown 
and Steven Snapp. 

CO-HOSTS: The Wheeler 
Mustangs will serve as Co-
hosts for the Wheeler Invita-
tional Tournament this week-
end. Memphis, Wellington, 
Booker, Miami. Shamrock.Mc- 



Mobeetie 
editations Goldie Gordon 

Jupiter's Great Red Spot is 25,000 miles wide. 

Our Young People 

I 
. 	• S.:ate .A11 

BRIDGETT MICHELLE 
CHANDLER: 2 year old 
daughter of Brad and Sue 
Chandler of Wheeler. 

RONAL WAYNE STAsS, Jr.: 
one year old son of Ronal 
Wayne and Juanita Stas of 
Sherman, Texas. Grand-
parents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Louis Stas of Wheeler. 

• For all your prescription 
and cosmetic needs! 

• Gift Selections for all 
Occasions 

Alligt  YOUll M1(11111011 (HIM 

HYLAND'S 
PHARMACY 

BUTCHERING & PROCESSING PRICES 

Beef processed, double wrapped 220 Per Pound 
$7.50 for Butchering 

Pork Processing including curing 

Double wrapped 280 per pound 

$8.50 a head for butchering 
We  butcher Mon., Tues., Thurs & Fri. until 11:30 A.M. 

CALL FOR QUARTER-HALF-WHOLE 
BEEF PROCESSED 

WE NOW HAVE CUTS OF PORK & BEEF ON SALE 

SHAMROCK SLAUGHTER PLANT 
North of City 	 Phone: 256-3241 

Closing at Noon on Saturday 

	

--M!P 	 

Flexible Maturity 
Certificates from 
Security Federal. 
Pick your maturity rate to the 

-exact day! 
TERM 

COMPOUNDED DAILY 
RATE 	 ANNUAL YIELD 

91 days - 182 days 

182 days - 1 year 

1 year - 18 months 

18 months - 3 years 

3 years - 4 years 

4 years thru 5 years 

8.23% 8.70% 
8.73% 9.25% 
8.95% 9.50% 
9.72% 10.35% 

10.29% 11.00% 
10.52% 11.25% 

reSeeurityEbderal de SAVINGS AND LOAN ASSOC IAT IQ4fr  

We can take care of you. 
(Rates Subject to Change.) 

Cy. ni • 'Qs( 	•••I1L I • Member FSLIC 

M I L. -III A R T Highways 83 & 152 

FOR PEOPLE ON THE G 0 	Wheeler, Texas 

OPEN SEVEN DAYS A PRICES EFFECTIVE INRU- 
WEEK 6:00 A.M. 	 JAN 7,1984 

,mss  $159 
(

kal 6 PACK 

1 PEPSI 

OMEGA GRAIN SUPPLY, INC. 
P.O. Box 157 - (806) 826-5953 

Wheeler, Texas 79096 

iWrif It  6  
WI* °Ali 

C*4 

Pacific Molasses Company 
stntnj  the feed industry since 1919 

DIET 
CENTER. 

THE 
NATURAL 

WAY 
TO LOSE 
WEIGHT 
CALL TODAY 

1,11N AT THE LOS/ 

DIET 
CENTER. 

• 

669-2351 

Page 2-THE WHEELER TIMES-Thursday, January 5, 1 984 

Court Records 
visiting with Ariza and Anna 
Belle Corcoran. 

Christmas Eve Aaron, Clau-
detta and Caaron Laverty had 
Christmas with Aaron's moth-
er, Mrs. Laverty. Mary Ruth 
Derby from Haber Springs, 
Arkansas, attended also. 
Christmas Day was spent with 
an old-fashioned family time 
with Richard, Russell, Claude, 
Caaron, Gordon. Barby and 
Cheyenne from Pampa at 
home. 

Margaret Trout's family met 

Closed for Christmas 
DECEMBER 27, 1983 
Release Federal Tax Lien-
United States of America to 
Terry L Vick, etux, 12-15-83 

LIST OF INSTRUMENTS FIL-
ED IN WHEELER COUNTY 
CLERKS OFFICE FOR THE 
WEEK OF DECEMBER 26, 
TRIM DECEMBER 30, 1983 
DECEMBER 26, 1983 

Scribner, Mr. and Mrs. Bobbie 
Moyer and Family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Lonnie Powell and dau-
ghter from Skelleytown, and 
Mr. and Mrs. T. C. Tosh and 
daughters. 

Mr. and Mrs. Leon Jenkins 
from Austin and Bill Scribner 
and son Chuck from Torney, 
Texas, spent Friday night 

Now Allstate can save 
you 35%* off Texas 

state rates for 
homeowners insurance. • 

ro...are 

- 	--.1.••4•••••-•1 

410111igt:.".7.?. 

Come in and compare. 
Your Allstate agent will show you just how much 
you may save on 
homeowners dwelling 
insurance with Allstate's 
new low rates. 

We're helping you 
keep your insurance 
costs down-as we 
protect your home 
against loss from 
fire and many other 
hazards. Come in 
soon and find out 
how much you might 
save. Or just phone us. 

Goldie Gordon 
My news this week will have 

part of my Christmas news in 
it because of a telephone 
failure. 

Eunice and Ransom Carter 
played dominoes with Tince 
and Leona Williams. They saw 
the old year out and the new 
year in. Visiting Tince and 
Leona Sunday were Ronnie, 
Tanya Stewart and children 
from Sayre, Leola Stewart and 
Gene Coward from Canadian. 

Leola and Calvin Stuart 
spent New Years in Erick with 
Jim and Patsy Richardson and 
Dean and Iva Richardson. On 
the way home, they visited 
with Mr. and Mrs. T. A. 
Richardson and Ronnie, Tanya 
Chad and Jerod Stuart at 
Sayre. 

Visitors in the home of 
Curtis and Nettie Lancaster 
were Mrs. Sidney Lynch from 
Pampa and Beverly's sons 
Jason and Preston, and Doyce 
Watson from Odessa. 

Eating New Year's Dinner 
with Ruth and Lester Hath-
away was Orville Greenhouse, 
Gayla and Wade Hathaway. 
Paul and Clarice Hathaway, 
and Larry, Kimberley, Krista 
and Shelley Johnston. 

John and Mary Chesser and 
children from Pampa visited 
last week with Mary's parents 
Lucy and Henry Johnston. 

Ernest and I had some 
friends we hadn't seen for 
many years drop in for a 
Christmas visit. Mr. and Mrs. 
Marvin Long from Amarillo 
ate supper on Sunday evening. 

Jewel and Lester Leonard 
spent Christmas in Pampa 
with Mr. and Mrs. Lawrence 

1625 "good hands"people in 
Texas invite you to come in and compare. 

Allstate' 
You're in good hands. 

RIVES 	115 West Texas St. 

Phone: 826-3573 

;:.°F,:taX,::."1,721.1:2MTS•etn=f*r 

D-Kim Janes, etux to Donald 
E Rives, etux, 12-19-83, S35' 
Lot 21 & N65' Lot 20 BIk 8, 
Shamrock, Montlew 
D-Donald E Rives, etux to 
Kim Janes, etux, 12.19-83, 
N25' Lot 21, all 22 Blk 8, 
Shamrock, Montlew 
D-Paul M Price, etux to 
Donald E Rives, etux, 12-19-83 
N 40' Lots 21, 22, Blk 8, 
Shamrock, Montlew 
D-Paul M Price, etux to 
Donald E Rives, etux, 12-19.83 
N 40' Lots 21, 22 Blk 8, 
Shamrock, Montlew 
D-Donald E Rives, etux, to 
Carl R Baker, etux, 12-19-83, 
S35' Lot 21 & N60' Lot 20 Blk 8 
Shamrock, Montlew 
RDT-First Bank and Trust 
Shamrock to William E M 
Rives, etux, 12-21-83, E1/2  Sec 
15 A-8 
RDT-First Bank and Trust, 
Shamrock, to E M Rives, etux, 
12-21-83, E'/ Sec 15 A-8 
MD-Joe W Hayes Inc, etal to 
Wheeler Oil Company, 12-20-
83, 1/12 Int in Secs 57,58,74 
and SE% Sec 73 Bk 23 
RDT-Red River Savings and 
Loan Assn to Donald E Rives, 
etux, 12-19-83, N65' Lot 16 all 
17-19 and 510' Lot 20 BIk 8 
Shamrock, Montlew 
DT-Donald E Rives, etux to 
Red River Savings and Loan 
Assn, 12-19-83, same as above 
MML-Billy J James, etux to 
K Designers, 11-3-83, Lots 5, 6 
BIk 1, Morris, ??? 
C.0 AGREED JUDGMENT-
American National Bank in 
McLean to James Throckmor-
ton, 9-26-83 
D & AOL-Petroleum Corpor-
ation of Texas to PC Ltd, 
7-5-83 
DT-O I L Energy Inc to Kidde 
Inc, etal, 12-19-83, Secs 18-20 
0S2 and Sec 39, 43 BIk A-7 
DT-Adams Exploration 
Company to Continental Illi-
nois National Bank in Chicago, 
12-1-83, See Instrument 
ROL-Phillips Petroleum 
Company to Jim T Miller, etal, 
10-28-83, Lots in Stanley Addn 

r‘,14go' 24-HOUR 41% Gfr DROP SERVICE 

Vogue Drive-In 

Cleaners 

1542 N. Hobart, 

Pampa, Texas 

669-7500 

G'''We ate r44N0t Cs AOGat GO4Pet CS4ENOPZ G..10.9"D 6-44P4Z GWZ 

Ceiling Fans 
WINTER SALE 

FASCO with Light 

LITCO 
Old Jacksonville 

X159 
$149 
$1390 

INSTALLATION AVAILABLE 
Call: Mrs. Betty Rives 

or Wheeler, (806) 826-3224 
E.M. Rives 
Shamrock, (806) 256-5250 

eiNtAL., 	 es#4009 e-04104...9 Ci 4049 e.-0411100.9 0044' 

ProMolas 16% 

in Pampa on Dec. 24th. for 
their Christmas. They all ate at 
Dyers and then had their 
Christmas tree. Those attend-
ing in the home of Lynn. 
Glenda Mixon and children 
were: Helen and Charles Mix-
on from Amhurst; Mr. and 
Mrs. Kenny Fisher and child-
ren from Sudan; Don, Mary 
Margaret and Kelley Quarles, 
Shonda and Cassie Hamilton, 
and Mr. and Mrs. Kevin 
Crawford of Pampa, and Mar-
garet Trout. Margaret spent a 
week with the Mixon's and the 
Kenny Fisher's. 

Word has been received that 
Arletta Witt is a little better 
and her family spent Christ-
mas Day with her in the 
hospital. 

Lynn Sims' Mom, Wilma 
Wyatt from Lubbock and Mrs. 
Edgar Lester from Borger 
visited over the weekend in his 
home. 

Byno Atkins and children 
from San Angelo and Herbert 
Atkins from Amarillo were 
visiting Sunday in the home of 
Herk and Elnita Atkins. They 
came home to help thaw the 
waterpipes. 

Visiting last week in the 
home of Marie and Gene 
Gudgel and Novelene and 
Byron Simpson was Mr. and 
Mrs. R. C. Parker from Mc 
Lean. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bill McKib-
ben from Lovington, New 
Mexico, visited Wednesday in 
the home of Laverne Scribner. 

Albert Scribner from Cass-
ville, Missouri, and Bud. 
Charlsie, and Carol Ann 
Scribner from Olton spent 
part of last week with Laverne 
Scribner. 

Elaine Wynn from Amarillo 
and Eva Webb visited Sunday 
in the home of Bill and Leatha 
corcoran. 

Sympathy to the Cotton 
Ridgeway family on the death 
last week of Cotton's cousin, 
Bill Ridgeway of Pampa. 

Bill and Chuck Scribner 
from Forney and Mary Ellen 
and Leon Jenkins from Austin 
visited with Laverne Scribner 
and family last weekend. 

Virginia and Bill Ridgeway 
visited in Pampa last week 
with Virginia's mom, Mrs. 
Lonzo Shaw, Ray, Darlene, 
Heather and Jennifer Asencia 
and Mary Louise, Donna and 
Darla Denham. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clifford Hef-
ley from Wheeler visited in the 
home of Marie and Gene 
Gudgel. 

I found this in "Hidetown" 
the other day and it gave me 
a good laugh so I thought I'd 
share it with you. With this 
water frozen, cars not starting, 
I think everyone is having a 
case of cabin fever. 

"Mobeetie Bachelor's Club 
in need of Wives", Mobeetie 
News, Christmas Edition, 1911 
Published by Mr. and Mrs. D. 
Belmont Johnson. 

Because of the large number 
of men at this time, this article 
came out in the paper. The 
Bachelor's Club has a fine 
membership being fairly good 
looking and industrious. To 
any young women looking for 
someone to cuddle against, we 
would suggest you send for the 
list of marriageable young 
men. This prospect No. 44 
was an example given: 

I am a hard working bach-
elor and want a wife. I believe 
in Women's suffrage. Women 
ought to have a voice in 
politics. My income is $500 a 
year, a large elegant ranch 
home, 3 automobiles, loving 
disposition, only objectionable 
feature would be height and 
weight which are 4 ft. 2 in., 
and 225 pounds. 

Would like to have a woman 
who could cook for 18 cowboys 
milk 14 cows before breakfast, 
and if necessary, help in the 
round up roping the steers. 
This is an elegant home for a 
handsome hard working wo-
man. Can have Sunday off. 

There are several good pro-
spects engaged in business in 
Mobeetie. Their only draw-
back is they are all very timid 
and blush when they pass by a 
pile of undressed lumber. 

Wheeler 
OL-State of Texas to 0 I LI 
Energy Inc, 4-5-83, Sec 21031k 
0S2 
OL-State of Texas to OIL 
Energy Inc, 4-5-83, Sec 19 Blk 
052 
D-Vaughn Dee McDowell, 
etal to Veterans Land Board, 
12-12-83, 71.62 ac Sec 64 Blk 
17 ExcMins 
CONTRACT-Veterans Land 
Board to Timothy D Ray. no 
date, 71.62 ac Sec 64 BI.17 
ExcMins 
D-Vaughn Dee McDowell, 
etal to Timothy Ray, etux, 
12-12-83, 5 ac Sec 64 Blk 17 
ExcMins 
P OF ATTY-Mary Elizabeth 
Bledsoe to Paula I Britt, 
12-2-83 
ASSIGN OVERRID ROYALTY 
-Maguire Oil Compan to 
Robert E Glaze, 12-21-83, ee 
Instrument 
EXT DT-Joe Dukes, etux to 
Canadian Production Credit 
Association, 12-27-83 See hist-
DECEMBER 28, 1983 
Closed due to Weather-related, 
conditions 
DECEMBER 29, 1983 
C/C PROBATE PROCEED-
Lula Rice, dec, 12-20-83 4 
ROW-Clyde Whittle to Gulf 
Oil Corporation, 2-1-83, NW'/. 
& W1/2 NE1/4  Sec 78 Blk 17 
ROW-John D McDowell Sr to 
Gulf Oil Corporation, 2-2-83, 
NE% Sec 55 BIk 23 
ROW-Enserch Exploration 
Inc to Gulf Oil Corporation, 
3-14-83, N1/2SE1/4 NE% Sec 78 
Blk 17 	 • 
ROW-Audrie M Howard, et-
al to Gulf Oil Corporation, 
3-28-83, W1/2 W1/2  Sec 69 BIk i 
23 
MD-Robert S Davis to Robert 
S Davis Inc, 12-22-83, All my 
Int E1/2 SE1/4  Sec 54 & N%SW 
%&S1/2 NE1/4  Sec 55 13 
CD-L V Dunn to Stella M 
Wood, 12-20-83, E1/2  Lot 21 
Blk C, Shamrock Cem tia  
MD-Leon D Moore, etux to A 
W Burrell, 12-21-83, lac Int 
51/2  and W 220 ac N1/2  Sec 19 
A-4 
MD-Leon D Moore, etux to A 
W Burrell, 12-21-83, 6 aclnt W 
1/2 &NE1/4 , Sec 21 Blk A-4 
MD-A W Burrell to R A 
Noret, Trustee, 12-27-83, 2 ac 
IntW1/2 &NE% Sec 21 Blk41-4 
MD-A W Burrell to R A 
Noret. Trustee, 12-27-83, 2 Ac 
IntW1/2 &NE1/4  Sec 21 A-4 
MD-A W Burrell to R A 
Noret, Trustee, 12-27-83, 2 
aclnt S1/2  &W220 ac N1/2  Sec 
19 A-4 
MD-A W Burrell to R A 
Noret, Trustee. 12-27-83, 2 ac 
IntS1/2  &W 220 ac N1/2  Sec 19 
A-4 
MD-A W Burrell to R A 
Noret, Trustee, 12-27-83, 2ac 
Int 51/2&W 200ac WA. Sec 19, 
A-4 
RMML-First Bank and Trust, 
Shamrock to Tamara L Tucker, 
etal 12-28-83, Lots 4, 5 Blk 7, 
Shamrock 
EXT DT-Pete Kirkland to 
First Bank and Trust, Shzlitn-
rock. 12-22-83, 150' x 200' 
S1/2 SW% Sec 43 Blk 17, Ex 

AMOills  L-R C Callan to Tom F 
Marsh, Inc, 12-2-83, Sec 96 
Blk A-5 
A OF JUDG-Paramount 
Supply Company to Terry's 
Portable Welding, 12.21-83 
RDT-Travelers Insurance 
Company to Wayne B St, 
etal, 8-3-83, See Instrument 
D-Robert E Gragg, eta] to 
Ray Cogburn. etux. 3-10-83, 
Lots 1-4 Blk 8, Allison, Exc 
Mins 
D-Pearl R Means to Floyd 
Poer. etux, 12-20-83. Lots 
210-24 Blk 6. Shamrock 
COR RDT-First Bank & Trust 
Shamrock to Gene Seymdlitr, 
etux. 12-29-83, 5 ac SE'/. Sec 
51 Blk 17, Excmins 
DECEMBER 30, 1983 
New Year's Holiday 
DISTRICT CLERKS FILINGS 
# 8360 David Bradstreet VS 
Doug Benefield-Damages 
#8361 J R Black, etux VS 
Allied Chemical Corp & Baker 
and Taylor Drilling-Daman* 

*A unique liquid pasture 
supplement containing 

No Urea 
Fat Fortified 

• An economical, labor-saving alternative to 
offset today's high production costs. 

• A scientific balance of liquid ingredients 
fortified with essential vitamins, phosphorus 
and other minerals. 

another quality product available only at 

Nels CRISPY 

pc: CORN  DOGS Fo 79° 
MI-MART 	 MI- ART 

Sandwich ref  [ow-fat $4199 
Mad tar ler Milk env 

AU VARIETIES FRff0 

PIPS CZ 99,  

Guest speaker in the Mo-
beetie Methodist Church was 
Mark Wilson from Canadian. 
Everyone enjoys hearing him 
preach and he has preached 
for the church several times. 
His wife and children attended 
also. 

Pinky and Randy Hamilton 
and sons spent Christmas 
weekend in St. Jo visiting Mr. 
and Mrs. R. D. Reeves ant 
Mr. and Mrs. W. L. Hamilton.  

Rev. Ralph Hovey and Mar) 
Cindy and Charles Jones and 
children spent Christmas it 
Clovis with Ralph's son Mr. 
and Mrs. David Hovey and 
children. 

Continued Page 3 
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THE 

SHIRT SHACK 

WVOLISALIRS 

we work like I 
BEAVER to save 
/,,r uott.. 

SAVE! SAVES SAVE! 
Free Delivery 

All Types Cedar Roofing and Composition 
Shingles.Cedar Fencing All Types 

Beam & Redwood 
Heavy Shakes our Specialty 

Heavy Shake Roof for price of #1 Cedar 
WE DO TURN KEY ROOFING & FENCING 
Don't miss our Cedar Fence Prices 

Free Estimates Call 806/857-2411 
Drawer L 
Fritch, Texas 79036 
Office (806) 857-2411 Garry Boyer 

Saving Vegetable Seeds 
For Another Year 

Though seeds are a 
bargain when you consider 
how many dollars' worth of 
vegetables you get from 
them, their cost can still add 
up if you have to buy sev-
eral varieties of vegetables 
every year. 

You may find that the 
seed packets of some vege-
tables contain many more 
seeds than you can possibly 
use in one year's garden, 
and you may wonder if 
these seeds can be saved and 
planted the following year. 
In most cases, the answer is 
yes, if the seeds have been 
stored in a cool (40 to 45 
degrees), dry place. 

Under such conditions, 
some seeds, like beets, 
eggplant, cantaloupe, and 
tomatoes, can be expected 
to last more than 5 years. 

The cole crops, lettuce, and 
peppers can be expected to 
last 3 to 5 years, while some 
seeds only last a year or 
two, like onions, parsley 
and corn. 

1. 3. 

C. • 
. 0. • 
o • a 

or stand the tube on its end 
in a glass containing about 
1 inch of water. 

Keep the paper-towel 
tube moist and unroll it in 7 
to 10 days to see how many 
seeds have sprouted. Deter-
mine the percentage of via-
ble or "good" seed by 
dividing the number of seed 
germinated by the total 
number of seed tested. 

Discard the seed it' the 
percentage of good seed is 
less than 70 percent. If the 
percentage is better than 70 
percent, plant the seed with 
the knowledge that you are 
doubly saL ing I110110 this 
year. 

To check whether last 
year's seeds are still 
"good," follow this simple 
procedure. Place a known 
number of seeds on a dou-
ble layer of paper towels. 
Roll the toweling up over 
the seeds and secure it with 
a rubber band or string. 

Place the rolled-up 
tube in an oblong cake pan 
and moisten it with eater, 

4  

P O. Box 9005 Dept BR 
Waco. TX 76710 

TExAs 

NIPS  

AN ECONOMICAL CHOICE 
Center Plains offers a 32% protein product 

designed to be fed to mother cows, stockers, 
9 N. 	and yearlings grazing dormant forages or grain crop 

residues. A 15% protein product is 
designed to be fed to the same classes 

of livestock grazing forages of higher quality 
during late Spring, Summer and early Fall. Both 
products are high in available phosphorus, 
have high net energy for maintenance and gain, 
and have high digestibility of nutrients; 
they are highly efficient supplements that 
maximize use of available roughage for 
maximum profit and return to the stockman. 

, • • T 

tat 
fi 

•.. 
r 	. ' • • 
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CENTER PLAINS 
WORKS HARD 
TO DESERVE 

#5-YOUR BUSINESS. 
Center Plains Liquid Supplement, a product 
of Center Plains Feed, available throughout 
the Southwest. 

Manufactured for 
and Guaranteed by 

ENTER 
7  PLAINS 

FEED 
A DIVISION OF CENTER PLAINS INDUSTRIES. INC 

(806) 622-2000 P.O. Box 7970 Amarillo, Texas 79109-7970 

J.E.M. FEEDS 
James Masters 

West of Wheeler on Hwy 151 
826-3265 

I. 	; 
- • • • 
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co 9- enwi TiOon, nwo 
Wanda Walker 

by the community at the 
Baptist fellowship hall for the 
Nettie Walsh family. The fam-
ily appreciated it very much, 
and said it was so nice of 
everyone. 

Willis, Mary, Monte, Ward 
and Julie Harrison (and her 
fiance Bart) visited Ed and 
Donna Nall on Christmas. 

The Christmas program at 
the schoolhouse on Dec. 19th 
was very lovely and the sing-
ing was beautiful. I believe it 
gets better every year. Santa 
Claus made his appearance 
after the program and the 
children loved it. P.S. The 
adults too, I think. 

and children, Ernie and Sue 
Martin and children from Elk 
City, Bennie and Debbie 
Boydston, Cheryl Badillo, 
Vance, Caroline, Kevin and 
Kyle Boydston, Forrest, Jan-
ice. Neal and SaRita Boydston. 
Terry and Juanita Ockerman. 

Out of town family and 
friends attending Nettie Wal-
sh's funeral on Monday, Dec. 
26th, were: Jim and Lois 
Johnson of Borger, Rev. and 
Mrs. David Carrington and 
family of Dumas, Rev. and 
Mres. John Nichols and family 
of Dumas, Linda Hendrick and 
boys, and Sybil Fish of Dumas. 
From Amarillo. Grace Henson 
and Edell Tedford, and Darrel 

Mobeetie From Page 2 

Lee Brown family; Juanita 
Fillingim, Bonnie Maddox, 
Roberta Maddox Eudey, Joe 
and Sherry Wagoner and 
Shawna, Paula Reed and Ron-
nie from Amarillo; David and 
Rita Pearson and Dallas and 
Lindsey. 

Charles Crownover family 
visited in Claude with the 
Frank Crownovers Christmas. 

E. G. and Willa were having 
their family together Monday. 

Roberta Eudey from Pales-
tine and Cynthia Lowe, Jimmy 
and Tammy Maddox and Jen-
nifer, Mike Maddox family 
from Shamrock, and Bobby 
and Bonnie Maddox and girls 
from Hobart, Okla., visited 
Bob and Alma Maddox. 

Saundra Meek spent a few 

and Johnnie Harrison. Willis 
and Mary Harrison of Canyon, 
Donald and Patsy Stinnett of 
Buena Vista, Colorado, and 
Rev, and Mrs. Oscar Welch of 
Wheeler. 

Also, Mildred and Rusty 
Johnson of Houston; Warren 
and Charlene Brown, Larry 
and Sandy McCuan and boys 
Ronnie and Debbie Brown of 
Amarillo. Len and Betty 
Brown of Dumas, Dale Brown 
and Peggy Brown of Dumas. 
From Ponca City, Oklahoma, 
Vickie and Christi McCuan; 
from Hutchinson, Kansas, 
Wendall and Gayle Stinnett 
and Clay, and from Dumas, 
Jerry and Sharon Horton and 
girls, Virgil and Jean Stinnett, 
Judy and Sean Velo, Jimmy 
and Linda Henry, Danny and 
DeAnn Stinnett. 

A lovely meal was prepared 

days with Evelyn. Evelyn had 
a party for the young folks 
Friday night. Spine them wit- 
Keith Meek, Darren and Krbtl 
Hefley, Jennifer Brown, Tina 
Watson, Carol Watson, Rod-
ney Hudson, Leslie Meadows, 
Tonya and Julie Gilmer, Kevin 
Ratliff, Mark Meadows, Rus-
sell Laverty and Chris. They 
had refreshments and played 
games. Was too cold to go 
carolling. 

The Courthouse Singers 
presented some great singing 
at Gageby Church Sunday 
night. Those singing were Bus 
Dorman, Ernest Henderson, 
Clois Hanner and grandson, 
Brandon Adams. Cassandra 
Morgan played the piano very 
well and also sang with them 
some. Mrs. Harmer and Wen-
dell Morgan were also pres-
ent. 

Lois Meadows and Martha 
Meek visited Evelyn Meek 

Our... 
WINTER WHITE 

and 

JANUARY CLEARANCE 

Sales Continue! 

1 

Sunday. 
Den 	Mayne McElroy 

end Iracy. 	Kulani 
laid Joshua came Monday to 
stay till Thursday with us. 
Others visiting were Sharron 
Mitchell, Bob Ratliff family. 
Bea Ogle and girls; Greg and 
Mona Worley from Paducah; 
Tina, Rheann and Leesa Wat-
son; Cuyler, Christian, and 
Cassidy Stinnett, William and 
Vickey Cornell and children 
from Clinton, Okla., and Shar-
on Kulman from Hinton, Ok., 
Aaron Laverty family, Gaye 
Hale and children; Jannet 
Carter, and Birdella Roberts. 

Rick Bruntmeyer from Mis-
souri came by and visited the 
Charles Crownover, Willis Fil-
lingims and E. G. Fillingim. 
He was on his way to a job 
near Lubbock. Hope it works 
out o.k. 

Girls from the Assembly of 
God Church and friends en-
joyed a slumber party at the 
E.O. Kelley home Friday night 
hosted by Linda. Some there 
were Esther Brown and Jenni-
fer and Jill, Tina and Leesa 
Watson, Mandy Ferguson, 
Melody Ratliff, Leslie Mead-
ows, and Tina Lehman. 

.....)+4.4.4.4.4.4.4.w..4.4„4.4.4.4.4. 
CarriesA  Sewing  Box 
: 	 : 

	

it, 	505 S. Canadian in Wheeler 

•• • • Clearance Sale ...,.. , ... • , 
• ..:. • • : y  20% Off Notions y  
A 

.e, 

	

y 	 on 	 v 

20-30-40% Off :„ --.,6 
v  

y fr/ e : 

	

y 	All Fabrics / •• • 

	

i•• 	 as • 

	

y 	 v 

.. Yarn 	894 

	

, 	 4. •t••1•  
*eta Sere 

4.01 
Dale Stinnett had surgery at 

Shattuck Wednesday to re-
move metal plates and screws 
from his arm from an accident 
and surgery many years ago. 
They were giving lots of 
trouble. Got to come home 
Thursday and is doing pretty 
well. 

The Crownover kids spent 
Friday night and Saturday 
with E. G. and Willa Fillingim. 

Joe Woodward spent a few 
days Christmas with his 
grandparents and then had a 
nice vacation visiting relatives 
and friends in Waco, Brown-
field and other towns. 

Charles and La Jo Crown-
over and children visited the 
Gayle Singletons at Kelton 
Sunday afternoon. 

New Year's 
Eve Lock-in 

Exterior - Interior Painting 
Qualified with references 

Reasonable Rates 
Hourly or by the Job 

Call 256-3944 

Kenneth Ladd 
•••—r- 

114 East Texas Street 
Wheeler, Texas 

ALL OCCASION GIFT 
WRAPPING DONE—S1.00 Up 

JENNINGS PLUMBING 
& ELECTRIC SERVICE 
"A flush is better than a full house!” 

Owner: Larry Jennings 
Phone: 806-826-3153 	 Box 423 
1110 S. Math 	 Wheeler, Tx. 19096 

Roto-Rooter Service--Repairs—ReefrodeUng 
9 years Experience 
Reasonable Rates 

COME SEE OUR: 
Tee Shirts, Jerseys, Caps, 
Baseball Shirts, 	Designer 
Sweatshirts, Socks, Etc. 

Phone: 826-5719 

Jeff Reid 
845-2104 

I was sorry to hear Betty 
Howard had lost her brother. 

Doyle Grimes was sure glad 
to see his son Gary, Maryln 
and children from Amarillo. 
They spent several days last 
week helping Doyle fix the 
water pipes. 

Free Blood Pressure Clinic 
There will be a free blood 

pressure clinic for everyone in 
Mobeetie regardless of your 
age. It will be in the Fellow-
ship Hall of the First Baptist 
Church from 2:00 P.M. until 
6:00 P.M. on Jan. 6th, 1984. 

The clinic is sponsored by 
the First Baptist Church and 
conducted by Louise Hogan 
and Gazelle Patterson. 
"Remember the Life you Save 

May be Your Own" 
Are you lonely and need a 

friend to brighten up your life? 
The X.Y.Z. club could be your 
answer. All the Mobeetie Sen-
ior Citizens are invited to the 
X.Y.Z. covered dish supper on 
Jan. 6th at 6:00 P.M.' in the 
Fellowship Hall of the Baptist 
Church. 

The Mobeetie Baptist Chur-
ch had a lovely candlelight 
service Jan. 1st ushering 1984 
in with the Lord's Supper. 

Laverne Scribner's Birthday 
Saturday was Laverne 

Scribner day in Mobeetie with 
her family and many friends 
coming to the City Hall to wish 
her a "Happy Birthday". They 
shared a beautiful white cake 
with pink roses saying, "Hap-
py Birthday Laverne" with 
her. Those who attended were: 

Bill and Chuck Scribner 
from Forney; Mary Ellen and 
Leon Jenkins from Austin; 
Albert Scribner from Cassville 
Mo.; Bud, Charlsie and Carol 
Ann Scribner from Olton; 
James H. Gunter from Claude; 
Irvine Kantz from La Cres-
cento, Cal.; Buck Scribner 
from Plainview; Susie, Vern 
and Suzanne Lohberger from 
Allison; Ruth Beck, and Betty 
and Doug Beck from Dumas. 

Jack and Larue Sims from 
Amarillo; Juhrie Sims, Can-
yon; Juanita and Fred Sims, 
Herferd; Bonnie and Lawrence 
Scribner from Pampa; Dutch 
Elliot from Pampa. Blanche 
and Paul Powers of White 
Deer; Marie and George Kil-
crease from Pampa; Anna Lee 
Sims of Mobeetie, Mary K. 
Sims of Amarillo, Lynn Sims 
from Mobeetie and his mother 
Wilma Sims Wyatt from Lub-
bock. Bill and Blenton Martin 
from Hart Camp, Mrs. Edgar 
Lester from Borger and a large 
number of Mobeetie friends. 

Sweetwater Creek 
Builders 

• Custom Homes 	• Remodels 
• Additions 	 • Roofing 

• Concrete Work 
Box 55 

Mobeetie, TX1 

Jeremy, Timothy, and Kristi 
Montgomery spent several 
days in Allison recently visit-
ing relatives. Their mother, 
Sue Montgomery, was married 
in Cheyenne, Oklahoma, Dec. 
12 to Ernie Martin and lives in 
Elk City, Oklahoma. The chil-
dry thoroughly enjoyed all 
the Christmas festivities. 

Steve O'Donnell and Tina 
(Lynette) daughter of Jim and 
Vivian Wallace, their young 
daughters Monica and Kim-
berly, arrived recently from 
Oxford, England, where they 
were stationed for two years. 
S4eve is a government em-
pl9Aee working in Communi-
caMons. He is in the process of 
being transferred to Hong 
Kong, China. They will be 
stationed there for two years. 
Lynette and the girls plan to 
stay with the Wallaces for a 
few months. Monica is in the 
first grade in Allison. 

Christmas night at the 
school, the Gilmer family had 
a 4union. It was attended by 
several families. Genie Corn-
ell, Bob and Mary, Anthony 
and Judi, Janice and Harmon 
Parker and boys, David Leon 
and Winnie Gilmer and their 
three children from Briscoe; 
Becky Cornell, Jennie Walker, 
Eddy, Wanda and family; Pete 
Gilmer, Margaret, Becky. 
Jegnie and Linda Kay, Keith, 
Ann and Natalie Boydston. 
Kenneth and Peggy Chandler, c 
Brad, Sue and girls, David 
Gilmer, Jr.; Linda and family, 
Jim and Vickie and Casey of 
Wheeler, Bob and Mary Nell 
Finsterwald of Mobeetie and 
their two children. 

Breakfast Christmas Eve 
guests of Clifton and Louis 
Bittston were: Eddy Walker 
and family, Gary, Julie and 
Arnie Boydston, Ernie and Sue 
Martin and family, Bennie and 
Debbie Boydston, Cheryl Ba-
dillo, and Kim Boydston. 

Virgil, Jean, Danny and 
DeAnn Stinnett were over-
night guests on Sunday night, 
Dec. 25, of Clifton and Louise 

dston. 
Judy and Sean Velo were 

guests of the Eddy and Wanda 
Walker family on Christmas 
night. 

Willis, Mary, Darrel and 
Johnnie Harrison visited their 
grandmother Maudie Harrison 
on Monday at the Cheyenne 
Convalescent Home. 

Vivian Wallace entered the 
Cotmunity Hospital at Elk 
City, Okla., on Tuesday for 
tests and observation. 

Mr. Ed Nall was out deliv-
ering bags of delicious pop-
corn to several homes in 
Allison on Christmas Eve. 

Christmas dinner guests at 
Bruce and Pearl Harrison's 
were: Darrel and Johnnie 
H4rison of Amarillo; Dr. Greg 
Harrison of Canyon; Dr. and 
Mrs. Willis Harrison, Canyon; 
Monte and Ward Harrison of 
Canyon. Also, Julie Harrison 
and friend from San Marcos, 
Texas; Louise and Kim Boyd-
ston, Juan and Cheryl Badillo, 
Bennie and Debbie Boydston, 
Jimmy and Vivian Wallace, 
St e, Tina. Monica, Kimberly 
nonnell of Oxford, England. 

Christmas Eve guests of W. 
H. and Opal Boydston were: 
Clifton, Louise and Kim Boyd-
ston, Eddy and Wanda Walker 

MOBai it, SCHOOL 

MENU 

The Baptist Church spon-
sored a New Year's Eve lock-in 
Dec. 30, 1983. The excitement 
started at 7:00 p.m., and the 
doors weren't unlocked until 
2:30 A.M. the next morning. 
Some of the activities included 
a ping-pong tournament, atari 
tournaments, some very wild 
games of spoons and many 
other games too numerous to 
mention. A movie entitled 
"Super Christian" was shown 
and enjoyed by everyone. A 
meal of sloppy Joes was 
served, and lots and lots of 
"Munchies" were enjoyed all 
evening. The evening was 
closed with a devotional and 
several tired faces. 	The 
activity was a great success. 
Those people attending and 
helping to make the night so 
enjoyable were: Russell La-
verty, Chris Rowley, Terri 
Seitz, Sheila Moffett, Greg 
Langley, Karla Hall, Todd 
Bacon, Claude Laverty, Ronny 
Vandever, James Morris, Deb-
bie Darnell, Betsie Stepps, 
Julie Stepps, Wayne Hall, 
Wenona Anderson, Gary Hall, 
Kichi Hamilton, Tammy Har-
well, Gary Thomas, Kent Mc-
Laughlin, John Thomas, Scott 
Corcoran, Eddie Anderson, 
Amy Morris, John Moffett, 
Jimmy McDaniel, Brandon 
Hamilton, Jamie Arganbright, 
Travis May and sponsors: 
Gary and Carolyn May, Paul 
and Clarise Hathaway, Kim-
berly and Larry Johnston, 
James and Alesha Moffett and 
Coach Larry Bacon. 

Haydon Chiropractic Clinic 
PHONE: 665-7261 

103 East 28th St. 	 Pampa, Texas 

WHEELER PLUMBING CO. 
204 S. Main St. 

New Construction — Remodel 
Repair — Sewer Service 

Phone: 826-5907 
Free Estimates 

MAX McQUEEN 
P.O. BOX 754 — WHEELER, TEXAS 

This had been a wonder-
ful Christmas season. We've 
really enjoyed being with old 
friends and new friends and 
hearing from friends in several 
states. But most important is 
the wonderful gift God sent 
many years ago when he sent 
his son to earth to be our 
Savior and to love and care for 
us. 

Gene and Roberta Signs 
spent a few days with Tarita 
and Billy Waters and John 
Paul near Sallisaw, Oklahoma. 
John Paul was to come back to 
stay until there is a new baby 
at their house. 

Ronnie and Sue Watson and 
girls spent Christmas Day with 
L. D. and Shirley Stewart and 
girls near Dodson. 

J.P. and Martha Meek and 
Shawn and Cindy and Suzann 
Everett and Shane 	were 
Christmas Day guests at Mack 
Sides home at Twitty. 

Bea Ogle's mother, Norma, 
West from Atlanta, Georgia 
came in Thursday after some 
delay at Dallas, airport to stay 
nearly a week. Bea and girls 
met her at Amarillo. Nice to 
have her out to church and the 
Christmas program. 

Keri Crites of Dallas is 
visiting her aunt, Karen Hef-
ley and Alicia. 

Ruth Irvine and Stephanie, 
Sharron and Becky Tipps left 
Wednesday for a family get 
together at Greenville at the 
home of Glenn and Mozelle 
Thomas and children. Ran into 
lots of slippery roads but made 
it back o.k. 

Larry and Vickey Nelson and 
children were spending Satur-
day with Vickey's parents, 
Earl and Shirley Jolly in 
Wheeler. Christmas Day they 
planned to be with Larry's 
mother, Sybil Nelson. Susan 
and James Hall and girls from 
Clarendon were also to be 
there. 

The Bob Ratliff family spent 
Christmas Eve with Bob's 
sister, Paula and Dan Wilson 
and Brenda and Karen at 
McLean. Visiting at Bob's 
Christmas Day were his moth-
er, Vera Ratliff and Sue 
Reames and Gerald Reames. 

Lee and Esther Brown and 
children visited relatives near 
Booker Christmas Day. 

Chuck and Phoebe Hartline 
and Aaron visited Chuck's 
family at Chickasha, Oklaho-
ma over the holidays. 

Nice to have Rick and Lucy 
Lucas and Charisa and Russell 
from Westport, Kentucky at 
church Sunday. They 	are 
spending a few days with Roy 
and Lois and will visit other 
relatives and friends. Rick is to 
preach Wednesday night at 
Gageby. 

Dale and Debbie Stinnett 
and children ate dinner with 
Debbie's mother in Pampa 
Sunday. They were celebra-
ting Debbie's birthday as well 
as Christmas. 

Darrell Rodenberg and boys 
were spending Christmas with 
relatives in Kansas. The boys 
were to stay for a longer visit. 
Shannon came back with Dar-
rell for a few days visit. They 
ate supper Thursday night 
with the Willis Fillingims. 

We enjoyed having Mary 
and H. G.Newman and Clint 
for a few days. Some other 
visitors were Dan and Chris 
Fillingim and Andy; Marlin 
and Theresa Burns and Jessica 
Leon and Vea Fillingim; Chuck 
and Ann Jones and Children 
from Loop, Tx.; Charlie and 
Mike Phillis; the Ronnie Wat-
son family; Bob Ratliff family; 

Monday: Breakfast: Hot bis-
cuit, sausage and gravy, jelly, 
butter, milk. 
Lunch: Steak, ranch beans, 
fried okra, pears, hot rolls with 
butter, milk, tea. 
Tuesday: Breakfast: Buttered 
toast, malt-o-meal, jelly, but-
ter, juice, milk. 
Lunch: Batter fried fish, mac. 
and cheese, green beans, 
peach cobbler, hot rolls with 
butter, milk, tea. 
Wednesday: Breakfast: Hot 
biscuits, scrambled eggs, ho-
ney. butter, juice, milk. 
Lunch: Submarine sandwich, 
tomato soup, lettuce, tomatoes 
pickles, onion, choc. cake, 
milk, tea. 
Thursday: Breakfast: Cheese 
toast, individual cereal, juice, 
milk. 
Lunch: Fried chicken, mashed 
potatoes, black-eye peas, jello 
with topping, hot rolls with 
butter, milk, tea. 
Friday: Breakfast: Hot biscuits 
bacon gravy, juice. 
Lunch: Pizza burgers, French 
fries, tossed salad, cookies, 
milk, tea. 
A salad bLr is available daily. 

Mobeetie 
Mr. and Mrs. Delphne Larry 

Ware from Quincy, Washing-
ton, ate supper and visited 
with Arch and Annabel Ware 
and Patsy Hooper Friday 
Delphne is their nephew. It is 
nice to see the sun shining 
Annabel said. 



RESIDENTIAL . . . 
✓ 1 Br stucco home close to town - in great 
shape 

V 3 Br, 3 bath, mobile home on the edge of 

town  V House to complete remodeling. Pay $800 
and assume loan 

✓ 2 Br stucco home close to town - owner 
wants to move. 

kow  3 Homes in Shamrock - all price ranges 

ioeCozy3 maintenance
Br,2bath,brck home. Designed for 

minimum  
V 2 Br home by school - large garage for 

amateur or professional mechanic - fenced 
yard 

3 Br - stucco home with outstanding 
fireplace and a kitchen designed for the cook. 
Lots of living space in this home. 

ome in a quiet Br

lac 	compare this neighbor 
b b , 	ri  

3 Br., 2 bath, almost new, fireplace, fenced 
yard 

3 Br stucco home by school. 
✓ 3 Br, 2 bath, almost new, fireplace, fenced 
yard 

V 4 rent houses priced 10% below market 
value. Will sell as a group or separately 

vo Large home with possibility of at least 2 
apartments. Price reduced. 

1./ 3 Br mobile home with addition, cellar, 
fireplace-Owner will finance 

May be moved: 
2 bedroom, one bath. 

2 Bedroom, 1 Bath: This home is 
completely remodeled. New roof, new carpet, 
new vinyl floor in kitchen and bathroom, new 
storm windows and doors, new double wall 
heater, new stainless steel double kitchen 
sink. Fresh paint inside and out, new acoustic 
ceilings throughout. 

Num er One Energy Saver 

STORM WINDOWS AND DOORS 
PLAINS ALUMINUM 

BOX 38 - PANHANDLE, TEXAS 79068 

- FOR "FREE" ESTIMATES - 
Call Collect : 806/537-3382 

or 537-3400 
FOR SALE: Set of 15" Ford 
production aluminum mag 
wheels, Phone: 826-5518. 

CARPENTRY WORK 

& GENERAL REPAIRS 

*Reasonable Rates 

Buck Hill 

826-5827 

Satalllte T.V. Systems starting 
at $1350.00 options available 
on receivers, LNA and satal-
lite finders. Remote or man-
ual. 

L. & F. REPAIR 

WILLEM 
TREE LIMBS 

FURNITURE 

JUNK 
You Call-Will Haul 

Weekdays Phone: 
The Wheeler Times 

826-3123 
After 5:00 & Saturdays 

Phone: 826-3221 

L.V.'s BOOKKEEPING 

and Tax Service 

General Bookkeeping 
Business Letters 

Income Tax 
Billings 
Payrolls 

Financial Statements 
Profit & Loss 

Statements of Condition 
806/826-3395 

FOR SALE: Grinder mixer, 
357-New Holland. excellent 
condition. Phone 826-3395. rtn 

FOR SALE: Love grass hay, 
big bales. 826-5776. 	ltp 

Wanted To Buy: Oil Field Drill 
Bits. 1-405/243-0293 in Elk 
City, Oklahoma. 

FOR SALE: 1981 Chevrolet 
Impala, excellent condition, 
call 826-3153 after 5:00 p.m. 

FOR SALE: 1976 Ford Elite, 
power steering, tilt wheel with 
cruise control, AM-FM radio 
and eight-tract. 	Great gas 
mileage, excellent condition. 
Call 826-3474. 	 ltp 

Entered as second-class matter December 18, 1933, at the Post 
Office at Wheeler, Texas 79096, under the act March 3, 1879. 

Louis C. Stas, Owner and Publisher 

SUBSCRIPTION RATES: 
Wheeler County. . . $7.75 	Outside County. . . .$8.75 

Box 1080 
?-1-7-1;..1" Phone: 826-3123 

BURRELL OIL & GAS PROPERTIES 

P.O. Box 23 
Wheeler, Texas 79096 
Ph. 806/826-3519 
(if busy) 826-3529 

Leases, Mln. & Roy. Bought 
Ask for Mark or A. W. 

FOR RENT: Trailer space in 
Moore's Trailer Park, 826- 
5634. 	 rtn 

FOR RENT: 4-2 bedroom hou-
ses. 2-mobile homes at $100. a 
month. Phone Carroll Adams. 
826-3184. 

FOR RENT: 2 bedroom, furn-
ished house, $145.00 a month. 
Carpeted throughout and 
clean. 826-5692 after 6:00. rtn 

FOR RENT: 3 bedroom furn- 
ished trailer house, $150.00 a 
month. 826-5531 or 826-5634. 

House For Rent: 	Clean, 
furnished or unfurnished. Call 
after 5:00, 826-3019 

FOR RENT: 2 bedroom• furn-
ished trailer with washer and 
dryer. 6-3315. 

FOR RENT: 2 bedroom house. 
808 Main. Contact Ramona 
Burress 323-6245. 

FOR RENT: One or 2 bedroom 
house in Wheeler. 323-69362tc 

APARTMENT FOR RENT 
2 bedroom, appliances includ-
ing washer and dryer. Call 
256-3792 evenings, or 826-
3364 days. 

FOR RENT: Two bedroom 
furnished trailer. Nice and 
clean, available 1-2-84. Call 
826-5531 or 826-5634. 	rtn 

NOTICE 
It has come to my atten-

tion that some nasty rumors 
are going around in Wheeler 
County. I would like to publicly 
deny these rumors. My broth-
er-in-law and executor have 
not only been completely fair 
in settlement of our estate, but 
also, the easiest get along with 
that a person could ask for. 

RON STUART 

GEO. RICHARDSON 

All Types Of 
INSURANCE 

BABY BED AND MATTRESS 
FOR SALE: Dark pine finish; 
phone: 826-3252 	ltp 

Vote in May Primary 

Poe 4-THE WHEELER TIMES-Thursday, January 5, 1984 1.. . ..... 

We Sell the Wheeler Area 
FARM & RANCH 

Vic  House and 6 acres southeast 
of Wheeler-great country at- 'V 
mosphere I 

v 2 acres with hog & chicken 
pens and barn; 8 miles east of 
Wheeler-Home has 2 Br 

V 475 acres E of Briscoe-330 
ac. in wheat. Love grass, 50 
acres. Good fences and electric 
watering system for cattle 

80 Acres by Briscoe with 
new mobile home. Owner fin-
ancing. 

t" 1280 ac. SE of Briscoe; 440 
ac. wheat, improved pasture, 5 
lakes, stocked deer, turkey, 
quail, and prairie chicken 

vo 640 ac. SW of Wheeler on 
river. 190 ac. wheat sub-irri-
gated pasture. 800 gal/min. 
irrigation well, deer, turkey, 
quail 

195 ac. 4 miles West of 
town. Irrigation systems 

frof Vs section, 2 miles south of 
town-large home, barns & 
great fences 

vo 640 acres with 6 bedroom 
home and barns 

COMMERCIAL 
Office Space for rent in a prestigious 

location. 
Vs Office Building, trailer spaces and Old 

Gin Buildings for storage. 
V Why work for someone else wnen 
you can own your business? Check the 
income potential in the Wheeler Game 
Room 

Office space or rent property across 
from hospital-2 Br home next door. 

V Three rent houses, 2 trailer spaces at 
the edge of town. 

LOTS 
V One-maybe two-lots in a secluded 
area of town-has trees and all city 
utilities 
V 3 Lots to build on-$12,000.00 

Commercial-Highway 83-will co-
consider trade for ANYTHING 
V Large lot priced below what other 
lots sell for-on paving 
✓ Large lot across from hospital. Good 
neighbors 

e smith agency 
RUTH SMITH, Broker 

Phone:  806/826-5541 or 826-3238 1 JOE LEE, Salesman 

Want  At 
TGIVE 	 New Testa- 
ments. In honor of the "Year 
of the Bible" we have a New 
Testament for anyone who 
doesn't have one or who needs 
a new one. Call 826-5985. rtn 

Letters From. The Panhandle 
Judy Wolcott 

Dear Folks: 
Have you dug your way out 

of that 28 inches of snow yet? 
What a time to have such a 
storm, with everyone on the 
road for the holidays! It must 
have seemed strange Christ-
mas Eve to have only one of us 
there to celebrate, after years 
of big, noisy Christmases. 

Our Christmas was beauti-
ful. The "Birthday Party for 
Jesus" was a big success. It 
was lots of fun, with clowns, a 
rainbow of helium-filled bal-
loons bobbing here and there, 
and even a birthday cake. Yet, 
coupled with a reenactment of 
the Christmas story by junior 
high students, it really 
brought home the true mean-
ing of the day. 

As we sat around the tree 
Christmas afternoon, it was 
easy to see that there was 
something different this year 
just by looking at the presents. 
It was a Western Christmas! 
There were jeans, of course, 
and an assortment of clothing 
in Mobeetie maroon, but there 
was also a cowboy hat, a 
miniature ranch set, Dallas 
Cowboy items, and a set of 
mounted longhorns! 

The trip to Houston for a 
check-up for Jon was some-
what harried. The roads were 
fairly clear until we reached 
the other side of Dallas. Then 
it began to get very icy, and 
our accelerator began to stick. 
The disc jockey we were 
listening to on the radio was 
warning people to be careful 
for she had slid into a ditch 
twice on her way to work that 
evening. Cars and trucks spun 
around on that glaze and flew 
in every direction. We all 
travelled at 10-15 miles per 
hour, inching our way along. A 
couple of times when we 
neared a bigger town, we 
stopped to check into a motel, 
but there weren't any vacan-
cies. We all had the same 
idea-to get off those roads! 
We did spend the night in 
Huntsville though, and the 
roads were all right the next 
morning as we made our way 
to Houston and the Medical 
Center. 

I was flooded with a comb-
ination of awe, nostalgia, and 
apprehension at the familiar 
sight of the Center. On a 
return visit, it's almost as 
though you try to slip a 
protective covering over your 
emotions. But it doesn't work. 
Once inside. you feel the same 
gratitude that there is such a 
place with countless dedicated 
skilled, caring workers-and 
the same horror at realizing 
that these thousands of people 
around you have all had their 
lives and hopes turned upside 
down by one word-cancer. 

The main suite at M. D. 
Anderson where new patients 
register and are admitted, had 
been redecorated. Instead of 
rows of black vinyl chairs and a 
nondescript color of carpeting. 
the room now has soft apricot 
carpet and lovely soft. uphol- 

FOR SALE: 8x32 Logging 
Trailer for Mobil office or 
Lakeside Cottage. Phone 806/ 
826-3123. 

FOR SALE: full blooded 
Dachshund puppies, 1 male, 2 
females. 6 weeks old. $40. 
826-3070 during noon hour and 
after 5:00. 	 ltc 

Cakes FOR ALL 
OCCASIONS 

call Avis Miller 826-5904 

stered chairs in peach, ivory or 
willow green. 

Of course, that dreaded 
disease touches all ages. This 
trip's "heart-tugger" was a 
little boy of around three years 
of age. He was thin and bald 
from his chemotherapy, but he 
rode in a Little Tykes stake 
wagon holding a tape recorder 
playing children's stories. His 
young mother pulled hit{/ 
along cheerfully. Bless her 
heart! She'd found a way to 
make the ordeal easier on both 
of them. 

We also continued to be 
fascinated by the foreign lang-
uages we heard (although 
"Texan" is sometimes still 
foreign-sounding(. In 	one 
large waiting area, two women 
talking discovered that th%r 
were from the same little area 
of Saudi Arabia! 

At our last appointment of 
the trip, we waited to be called 
in to see the doctor for his 
examination and the results of 
the tests. The anticipation was 
building as we sat there paired 
into couples, offering our 
support by our presence. Soiale 
people read, some watched 
television, some stared off, 
lost in thought. I worked on my 
counted cross-stitch because it 
relaxed me. Yet, from time to 
time, I'd see others watching 
me, and that rhythmic in-and-
out of the needle seemed to 
soothe them too. 

Our social worker rec - 
nizing us. rushed up. flung h r 
arms around us and said, 
"Where's Mobettie?". Can 
you imagine. they'd spelled it 
wrong! And then it was time to 
see the doctor (Good old Dr. 
McBride. just friendly enough, 
just gruff enough). And we 
passed! Thank you, Lord! 

We had a quick lunch in the 
hospital cafeteria. Here Ai 
there we would see someone 
sitting alone, 	their faces 
marked in red or blue, like war 
paint. And they were going to 
battle-off to radiation to fight 
the enemy. In fact, many of 
the technicians wear T-shirts 
that proclaim in bold letters. 
"Fighting Cancer-Now that's 
a job!". 

Before we left we stopped at 
the hospital chapel where I 
had spent so many hours last 
year on my "prayer-bones". 
We thanked God for M. D. 
Anderson, and prayed for the 
day when there would no 
longer be a need for such a 
place. 

After this, we were ready 
have some fun. We weTt 
downtown to the Galleria, a 
huge shopping mall with very 
exclusive stores. The tiny 
white Christmas lights were 
still twinkling in boughs of 
evergreen around the center of 
the mall and there was beauti-
ful classical music playing. As 
we looked down from the levs! 
we were on. we saw bright' 
dressed skaters ice-skating on 
the bottom level. The decora-
tions. the music. the skaters. 

SEWING MACHINE 
REPAIRING 

30 years experience 
Inquire at 

Carde's Sewing Box 
Phone:826-3352 

FOR SALE: Country house, 
out-buildings and 10 acres, 
fenced with new fencing. Call 
826-5904. 	 rtn 

FIREWOOD FOR SALE: Oak 
Jimmy Adams, General Con- and hickory, delivered and 
tracting, Free Estimates, 826- stacked. Phone 826-5692 after 
3019 after 5:00. 	rtn 6:00. 	 rtn 

Complete 

Mobil Home Service 
MOVING - LEVELING 

ANCHORING - SKIRTING 

Call 826-5692 
George Harris 
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THE 

BUSINESS DIRECTORY 
Cakes 

CATERING SERVICE FOR 
Wedding & Anniversaries 

Cathy Hunt-375-2391 
Kay Luttrell-375-2421 DEALER REPOT 

3 bedrooms, 2 baths. 14 x 80 
mobile home with siding, 
storm windows, garden tub 
etc. Assume payments $272.70 
a month with approved credit. 

We take trades-anything of 
value. 

QUALITY AFFORDABLE 
HOMES 

Hwy 60 West, Pampa 
665-0715 

	

Mim•as, 	 

HOUSE FOR SALE: In the 
country 31/2 	miles: from; 
Wheeler, 4 bedrooms, large 
living area with fireplace. 11/2  
baths, formal dining room,' 
large kitchen with bar, 1,1rge 
utility, basement, good storm 
celler, storage shed, chiclen 
house, 2 car carport, fenced 
yard, trees on 3 acres. Call 
826-3166 or after five, 826-
5685. I will pay cash for mortgage 

notes secured by Real Estate. 
Call Don at 826-3573. PAMPA 

POOL & SPA 
"We sell Hot Tubs, Spas, 
Swimming Pools, Saunas, 
and Metal Storm Cellars" 

"We Service" 
1312 N. Hobart 
Phone 6654218 

FOR SALE OR TRADE: Two 
bedroom, large living area. 
806 Canadian St. Will consider 
trade for a large trailer. Call 
669-7822, Pampa. 	4tp 

Wheeler Lodge No. 1,099 
A. F. & A.M. 

LIGHTS AND SIGHTS 
CasaBlanca Ceiling fans, 
Lamps, Lampshades, Lighting 
Fixtures, Gift Items, Lamp 
Parts & Bulbs, Curio and Gun 
Cabinets. 
Unique Items for your Home! 

665.8341 
107 N. Cuyler 

Downtown Pamps 

SEWING 

ALTERATIONS 
For Public 

Phone: 826-5863 
Sue Chandler 

FOR SALE: 41/2 ' x 9' Snooker 
table, solid oak. Also a green, 
red headed Amazon Parrott 
and cage. Phone 6-3059. 	rtn 

MONDAY 

7:30 P.M. 

Robert Lane, Sec'y. 

Members Urged To Attend. 

Visitors Welcome. 
GUARANTEED 
AUTO GLASS 

INSTALLATION 
& Body Repair 

CROSS 
CAR CENTER. 
Phone: 826-5515 
Wheeler, Texas 

• • %%• •4,•;  

WHEELER 
REDI-MIX 

REDI-MIX CONCRETE 
SAND 

Washed Gravel-All Sizes 

Office Hours: 7:30 to 5:00 

P hone 806-826-3223 

POLITICAL 
CALENDAR 

•••-•.1061-?... 

CLASSIFIED 
RATES: 

PAUL'S REAL ESTATE 
Houses or Land 

Paul Topper 
200 S. Canadian St. 

806/826-5237 
Wheeler, Ti. 

All classified ads must be 
paid in advance, except for 
open ledger account custo-
mers. 

DEMOCRATIC PARTY 
For County Sheriff 

John H. Rushing 
Doyle Ramsey 
Lonnie Miller 

REPUBLICAN PARTY 
For County Sheriff 

Jimmy Adams 

NOTICE 
The City Council of the 

City of Wheeler, Texas will 
meet in a special session, 
Monday. January 9, 1984 at 
7:30 P.M. 

Purpose of meeting: to ap-
prove contract for purchasing 
water wells from Kenady and 
Masters. 

Charges are 15c per word 
Minimum charge is $1.50. 

Card of Thanks charges 
will be $3.75. 

Aluminum 
Self-Storing 

STORM-SCREEN 
WINDOWS 

Permanent year-round protection. 
Chargeable from inside. Easy to 
clean..prowler-proof. Eliminates 
drafts...Cuts fuel bills.... 

WHEELER LUMBER CO. 
Phone 826-5543 Wheeler, Tex. 

Fine Service for Fine People 

CITY DUMP 
GROUND HOURS 
Monday, Tuesday, Thurs-

day. Friday and Saturday 
8:30 A.M. til 5:30 P.M. 

Closed on Wednesday 

ADVERTISING 
DEADLINES 

Classifieds: 5:00 p.m. Mon. 
Display: 	5:00 p.m. Mon. 

- ••••••• • 



Leonard Bryan, Kent and Tim. 
Mr. and Mrs. Dale Bryan and 
Dallas. 

The Jack McArthurs had 
Laquense and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Odell Perry of Wheeler. 
Yolanda went to California to 
be with her sister and Dwight 
visited an aunt in Lubbock. 

Guests in the H. E. Smith 
home were Mr. and Mrs. 
Darell Greene and girls, Pat 
and Debbie and girls, 011ie 
Anderson, Norma Zellmar, 
Mr. and Mrs. Denny Smith 
and family of Erick. 

Visiting with Ray and Doris 
Smith were Mr. and Mrs. 
Arnold Waggoner, Jonathon 
and Martha of Helena, Martha 
Kockanower, Mr. and Mrs. 
Chris Kockenower, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jim Waggoner and Jason 
of Woodward. 

Our ABC station was off two 
days. He may never know 
what happened to Dorian. If 
that wasn't bad enough, CBS 
pre-empted Dallas to show a 
silly movie. Beyond my com-
prehension why they should so 
misread our desires. 

Jenny on "One Life" con-
fided she learned to cook at 
Elk City, Oklahoma. Our own 
Roger Miller headlined the 
Austin City Limits New Years 
weekend. 

Locked 
Out... 

of your 

Home, Office, 

or Business 

call me.. . 

Wheeler 
Lock & Key 

Phone: 826-3123 

Between 8 & 5 

Rick Hefner 

LEWALLEN 
INSURANCE AGENCY 

• 
• 

ALL-LINES 

845-2951 
1ST STATE By Elln. 

MOMETILTEx. 

Watt  
YOU ItePertt  inprny 

••••-... 

826-5719 
114 TE US ST 

WHEELER. Tx. 

hOrtRYINT All Sales Final 
No Exchanges 
No Alterations 

VISA/MASTERCARD 
Welcome 

gib - — - — .11b 

snacks from the Milk group. 
Muffins, crackers, breads 

and popcorn are from the 
Bread and Cereal group. 

Fruit juice. fresh fruit, raw 
vegetables and raisins and 
other dried fruit are part of the 
fruit and vegetable group. 

Cold meats, nuts and seeds 
are part of the meat, fish, 
poultry and beans group. 

Also remember that several 
small meals a day often pro-
vide for top efficiency and per-
formance rather than 1 or 2 
large meals. 

You can plan ahead when 
you're away from home too. 
Take nutritious, carry-along 
snacks such as fruits, nuts and 
canned vegetables or fruit 
juices. 

* * * * * * * 
Cholesterol and Children 
According to a recent issue 

of Family Practice News, one 
in three children today has at 
least one risk factor for coro-
nary artery disease by age 14 
because average serum cho-
lesterol levels are higher than 
the optimum. 

• * *** it* 

Breads and Cereals Lower 
Calorie Than We Think 

Bread and starchy foods 
have been unfairly treated. 
They have been billed as 
fattening and high in calories. 
Many "starchy" foods are 
actually lower in calories than 
most people think. According 
to a nationwide survey con-
ducted this year by the Wheat 
Industry Council most people 
overestimate the numer of 
calories in common foods. 
Here are some of their results: 

Correct 	Preceived 

	

Calorie Count 	Calorie Level 

	

163 	 394 

	

269 	 350 

	

61 	 117 

	

76 	 136 

	

12 	 74 

	

88 	 160 

	

160 	 419 
Breads and cereal products 

are important sources of B 
vitamins, iron and protein. 
Whole-grain products contri-
bute magnesium. folacin, and 
fiber. 

Fiber or "roughage" from 
breads and cereals is also 
important for food regularity 
and relief of constipation. 

These fibrous foods are 
bulky and crowd out other 
calorie sources. More chewing 
is required, so added ettort 
slows you down and gives your 
stomach that "full feeling". 

* ***** * 

Calcium and Kids' Fractures 
Nearly one in four children 

who were fracture patients in a 
study done by the University 
of Utah consumed less than 60 
percent of RDAs for calcium 
and phosphate. As reported in 
Pediatric News in June, a 
control group who ate more 
than 60 percent of RDAs had 
higher bone mineral content. 

Educational programs con-
ducted by the Texas Agricul-
tural Extension Service serve 
people of all ages regardless of 
socio-economic level, 	race, 
color, sex, religion, or national 
origin. 

WHEELER SCHOOL 

MENU 
Week of Jan. 9-13 

Monday; Breakfast: Juice. 
Cinnamon Rolls. Milk. 
Lunch: Fish Sticks, Macaroni 
& Cheese, Peas, Bread, Milk, 
Fruit. 

Tuesday; Breakfast: Juice, 
Biscuits, Sausage, Milk. 
Lunch: Spaghetti & Meat 
Sauce, Salad, Corn, Texas 
Toast, Milk, Brownies. 

Wednesday; Breakfast; Juice, 
Cereal. Toast, Milk. 
Lunch: Steakfingers, Potatoes, 
Green Beans, Bread, Milk, 
Cake. 

Thursday; Breakfast: Juice, 
Cereal, Toast, Milk. 
Lunch: Turkey & Dressing, 
Mixed Vegestables, 	Milk. 
Fruit. 

Friday; Breakfast: Juice, Pan-
cake pups, Milk. 
Lunch: Subs, Pinto Beans, 
French Fries, Milk. Pudding. 
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and Mrs. Tim Wells of Pampa; 
Mr. and Mrs. Leon Smulcer. 
Jeffrey, Elaine and Dennis; 
Kevin Hill, Mr. and Mrs. 

a herd of lively kids. 
I remember once when the 

sleet lasted six weeks with no 
school. The roof would literally 
bounce up and down. It was so 
cold the boys couldn't stay out 
over ten minutes at a time. 
One of my happiest days was 
when that old yellow bus 
finally came over the hill. 

Iva Thompson went to Sayre 
to spend the week with Leroy, 
Peggy and boys. Came home 
to no water. 

With Mr. and Mrs. Albert 
Bryans were Mr. and Mrs. 
Arnel Lee Bryan and Pam; Mr. 
and Mrs. Tony Sargent; Mr. 
r-- 

Grandparents are Truman and 
Maxine, J. D. and Norma. 
Great grandmother is Elsie 
Alexander of Amarillo. She 
and Nelda were to come 
Saturday to admire the baby. 

I'm about ready to stop 
these Monday holidays and 
settle down to normal, the rest 
has been nice. The TV, video 
game, scanner, and fiddle 
have been going all together 
most of the time. I don't know 
how people survived who had 

WELCOME TO 

FIRST UNITED METHODIST CHURCH 

Church 

8TH AT MAIN P. 0. BOX 89 

WHEELER, TEXAS 79096 

18061 8263114 Parsonage 1806) 826-3079 

9:45 a.m. 
11:00a.m. 
6:00 p.m. 

Ernie 
McGaughey, 

Pas tor or in ei r o °mein cl a 
Linda Doughtry, CEA (Home Economics) 

Sunday School 
Morning Worship 
Evening Worship 

Mr. and Mrs. A. J. Reed, Mr. 
and Mrs. Earl Stewart and the 
Willard Stallings plus other 
relatives. 

Friday, Irene, Marie, Wil-
ma, Doris, and children visited 
Birdie Whipkey. 

Mr. and Mrs. Rhome Nix, 
Olen and Opal Nabors had a 
dinner with the Bill Davis 
family at Hobart. They plus 
the Wilbur Nabors had a Xmas 
Eve dinner with Coy and 
Geraldine Bruner at Erick. 
Then they went on to Sayre to 
the Howell Christmas tree in 
the home of Shorty and Doris 
Howeli. 

Rollie Howell is now home 
from Amarillo. Howard Fuchs 
is in the hospital. 

Read a neat trick. Take your 
checkbook and put 1984 on all 

WHEELER 

ROOFING CO. 

• • • • • • • 
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Residential 

the checks. Time you get thru 
it you will be used to the new 
year and won't date them 
wrong. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Thomp-
son and kids had Christmas at 
Skellytown with Lori's folks 
Mr. and Mrs. Dan Holloway. 

Been feeling so good be-
cause the cold might kill the 
grasshoppers. Then the Gov. 
report came out. Said the 
severe weather would get the 
greenbugs and weevils. But 
the grasshoppers were all 
ready snuggled up under-
ground. It wouldn't even faze 
them. 

With the Truman Alexand-
ers were their children, Mr. 
and Mrs. Jerry Alexander and 
kids. Mr. and Mrs. Harvey 
Banks, Mr. and Mrs. Gene 
Keathley and children, J. D. 
and Norma Banks, and Sam 
Alexander. 

Mr. and Mrs. Harvey Banks 
have a little girl, Marjorie 
Deene born at Cheyenne. 

Mrs. Joe Flowers 
Have you got your shirt yet 

that says, "I made it thru the 
winter of '83"? I will be so 
glad when 24 degrees is the 
low instead of a heat wave. It 
was wonderful at long last 
Thursday to see the sun still 
hanging in the sky. 
4 We have a jillion birds at the 
feeder. Guess the native food 
is short on account of the 
drought. This is the first time 
we have ever had meadow 
larks come to the house. 
Found a big beautiful owl dead 
in the yard. 

Several of our neighbors say 
• they lost livestock that fell on 
ahe ice and froze before they 
'Todd get up. 

We were invited to have 
Christmas dinner with the 
Johnnie Reeds but didn't think 

• this was the time to go to 
Texas. Zero is too cold to stir. 

Visiting Bess. Imo, Iris, and 
Sam LeGrand for a Merry 
Christmas were Mr. and Mrs. 
Robert Hammons, and Chera, 

*vir. and Mrs. Bill Hammons 
and Darla, all of Amarillo, 
Frank, James, Ricky and Mark 
of Erick, Mane LeGrand from 
Stillwater, and Amy Loyd of 
Albuquerque. 

Carl Haag and Steve from 
Borger, and Johnny Haag of 
Midwest City were out over 
the weekend to see Aunt Alta. 

sjler pipes are still frozen solid. 
A lot of folks are singing 

that tune. Ours froze one 
morning but Joe reversed the 
old vacuum and pumped warm 
air under the house. Soon had 
it going. 

Jimmy and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Leonard Ely and Bryan 
from Burns Flat had Christmas 
with Ike and Jane Schmidt on 

taturday. Sunday they went 
up to see the H. C. Elys at 
Rose Hill. 

Mr. and Mrs. Hansford 
Jenkins of Yukon and Audie, 
Chris, and Brandon Jenkins of 
Elk are visiting Stella Jenkins 
this week. 

Jan and Jeff Franks of 
Watonga, Jerry and Lisa Al- 

-11mander and children had 
Christmas with the Gerald 
Tiptons and Tammy. 

Mr. and Mrs. James Mc-
Mullen visited his mother for 
two days at Henrietta, Ok. 

Funeral services were Fri-
day at Martin's Chapel for 
Virgil Reed. Burial was at the 
Buffalo Cemetery. He was the 
uncle of L. G. Reed. Guess he 

tvas a distant cousin of mine. 
His grandmother and my 
grandfather were brother and 
sister. 

With the Otto Atkinsons 
were Joyce Napier, Maryland; 
James and Barbara Magness 
of Alpine, Ruby Hudson also 
of Alpine; Mr. and Mrs. Willie 
Atkinson of Plainview. They 

Bill ate turkey with Eb, Eva, 
and the boys. 

Memorial services were the 
17th for Frank Dyer who died 
at the Veterans Hospital in 
Amarillo. Funeral was at 
Shamrock and burial at Whe-
eler. He was the brother of 
Brenda Smulcer. 

Frank's mother Elizabeth 

eters of Alma, Ark., and Mr. 
and Mrs. Benny Dyer and 
family of Mountainberg, Ark., 
were here for the services and 
visited Leon and Brenda. 

Birdie Whipkey entertained 
with a Xmas Eve dinner, 
followed by the tree. Guests 
were Mr. and Mrs. Oscar B. 
Luman of Shamrock, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jimmy Holmes and Der- 

'Ilk from Panhandle, Mr. and 
Mrs. Harold Dean Whipkey 
and boys, Cleo Springs; Mr. 
and Mrs. Ray Dean Sites and 
family of Mountain View, 
Weltha & Wynona Heflin of 
Erick, Mr. and Mrs. Troy 
Sites, and Katie Whipkey. 

Talked to Willie Johnston 
14 of her loved ones turned up 
it celebrate with her. 

With the Haskell Reeds 
were Mr. and Mrs. Wayne 
Fox, Garland and children, 
Alvin and Sheri who are in 
school at Abilene; Roy and 
Doris Ray. Stacey and Sarah of 
Midwest City, Mr. and Mrs. 
Paul Reed and children of 
Erick, Orville and Marie Stew-

art of Colorado. 
T The Stewarts also visited 

COMPOSITION — SHINGLES — SHAKES 

All Types of Repair Work 
All Work Guaranteed 

FREE ROOF INSPECTION AND ESTIMATES 
PHONE (806) 826-3306 

J.C. Erb, P.O. Box 1211, Wheeler, Texas 

WE ALSO DO CONCRETE WORK AND REMODELING 

Good Nutrition Helps Make 
You Feel Better 

Good nutrition plays an im-
portant part in feeling good. 

Nutrition is the food you eat 
and the way your body uses 
this food. Nutrition affects 
your physical and mental per-
formance as well as how you 
look and feel. 

Good nutrition means eating 
the proper amounts of foods. 
This depends on your age. sex, 
amount of physical activity and 
;our state of health. 

The Daily Food Guide gives 
a plan for sound eating habits 
and includes the following 
groups: 

*Milk Group — 2 or more 
servings a day for adults, 3 
servings for children and 4 
servings for adolescents and 
pregnant women. 

* Breads & Cereals — 4 or 
more servings a day. 

* Vegetables-Fruit Group —
4 or more servings each day. 

* Meat, Fish, Poultry and 
Beans Group — 2 or more 
servings a day. 

* Fats, Sweets and Alcohol 
Group — Use with caution. 
May be used to provide ad-
ditional calories as needed. 

It is not necessary to have 3 
square meals per day to be 
well nourished. Americans are 
snacking more and feeling 
guilty about it. According to a 
national survey conducted this 
year by the Wheat Industry 
Council, two-thirds regularly 
snack between meals. Snacks 
can be nutritious and fit into 
the daily food guide. 

For example, yogurt, ice 
cream and cheeses can be 

Realty the Southwest 
Try our Special 

Thursday, January 5 thru Wed., Jan. 11 

Ham & Cheese Sandwich 
Reg. Order Fries 
Medium Drink 

* MOBILE HOME FOR RENT 
* NEW HOME FOR SALE: Nice 3 bedroom, 

2 bath, fireplace, double car garage. 

* HOME FOR SALE: 4 Bedroom home. 
Excellent location, close to School, 
close to town. Financing Available. 

* FOR SALE: Large 2 bedroom home with 
beautiful fenced yard and nice storm cellar. 

* MOTEL FOR SALE: Excellent business 
opportunity. 

* Mobile Home For Rent 

10.75% Interest 
Is Still Available 

Harvey's 
Family 

Restaurant 
Phone 826-3333 

GATELEY ELECTRIC 
Wheeler, Taxas 

"No Job Too Small" 

• New Construction 
• Remodeling Service 

• Residential 

• Lighting Fixtures 

• Small Appliance 
Repair 

WE NEED YOUR LISTINGS! 

806/826-3573—Office 
826-3283—Home 
826-3341—Home 

John Norman, Broker 
Don Rives, Salesman 
Lona Williams, Saleslady Chris Gateley 

(806) 826-3352 Ir 826-3123 

The Country Clipper 
announces the association of 

BOB WELLS, Cosmotologist. 

Country Clipper now offers complete 

hair care for the entire family. 
(Walk-iris Welcome) 

Get acquainted offer: 

$25® - $30® - $35® Perma 
Phone: 826-3358 	 for the month of January 
For Appointments After 6:00 

Phone:826-5251 	 1101/2  W. Texas (Next Door to Hyland's) 

Product 
5 oz. spaghetti 
with tomato sauce 
S oz. macaroni and cheese 
One slice wheat bread 
One slice white bread 
Saltine cracker 
Medium-size potato 
Cream-filled snack cake 

ANNOUNCING 
the sale event 

of the season 
U BAR U 

OILFIELD TROUBLE SHOOTING 

IPS —ROSS HILL CERTIFIED 

NOTED FOR 24HR. SERVICE!! 

The Peppermint Tree's 

JANUARY 
CLEARANCE 
Starts Friday, 
January 6, 10 a.m. 
We will be closed 
Thursday in preparation. INDUSTRIAL 

COMMERCIAL 
OILFIELD 

INSTRUMENTATION 
ELECTRONICS 

NO JOB TOO BIG 204 S. THIRD 
CANADIAN/323-5591 

FULLY INSURED 
WILL SUPPLY COPY OF INSURANCE IF NECESSARY 

GEre‘leil ARN, MUTUAL BOB UNDERWOOD 
BOX 269 WHEELER, TX 79096 

806-826-3150 	24 HRS. 

U BAR U 

••• 

• 

S 

S 

S 

S 
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RADIO & T.V. 
SERVICE 4 

COMMERCIAL RADIO& TV 

808-826-366e 
We will try to repair any make and/or model 

Radio and T.V. 
700 E. Oklahoma St. 	Phone: 826-3568 Rt 1, Canadian, Texas 

REASONABLE, SOUND PROTECTION 
for your home and other property, 

If you want to save, contact RITA PEARSON 
Phone: 375-2379 
If no answer call 375-2528 



- 40 E. Hwy. 83 
Mon. - Fri. 8 - 7 	Sat. 8 - 8 	Sun. 9 - 6 

RANCH STYLE 

BEANS 
3 16FOORZ. .84 

KRAFT MARSHMALLOW 

CREME 
13 OZ. 884  

$148 
MEADS 
SPLIT TOP WHEAT 

BREAD 
11/4  LB. 684 

CUCUMBERS 
4 FOR 88 

RUB
GRAPEFRUIT 

FOR .84 
AVOCADOS 
6 FOR .84 

PEARS 
3 984 

`TOMATOES 
LB. 5 

CARROTS 
3LB.884 

HONEY BOY CHUM 

SALMON 
15.5 OZ. S 148 

DAWN LIQUID DISH 

DETERGENT 
$148 

NESTLE 

CHOCOLATE MIX 
32 OZ. $ 228 

CAMPBELLS CHICKEN NOODLE 
Chi 	OR CREAM OF MUSHROOM 
Nc 

OTI72.1 	FOR 
Mushroom 3 10.5 OZ. 9  SOUP 

8' 

ATKINS HAMBURGER 

DILL 
SLICES 

1wRz 98
c 

WISE 
TACO OR BEAN 

DIP 
2 luz.911  4 

AMERICAN 10 OZ. 

ELBO — 
RONI 

3 FoR 98' 

TEXSUN 
PINK GRAPEFRUIT 

JUICE 
46 OZ.68 C  

NEW TRAIL 	 KEEBLER CLUB 

GRANOLA CRACKERS 
BARS 

ALL 	s dug 
FLAVORS 

16 OZ. 084  

SCHRIEBERS 

CHEESE 
SLICES 12 OZ. PKG. 

HORMEL'S LITTLE 

SIZZLERS12 OZ. PKG. 97 
TYSON'S 
BREAST PATTIES. CHICK'N STICKS OR 
CHICK'N CHUNKS 

CHICK 'N 12 OZ. $ 1.7 
QUICK PKG. 

77' 
C 

GROUND BEEF 
ROUND STEAK 
SIRLOIN STEAK 
CUBE STEAK 
BLADE CUT 
CHUCK ROAST 
BONELESS 

CHUCK ROAST 

LB • 
$1137 

LB $247  

LB. $247  

LB. $297  

LB. $137  

LB 961  

LOW 
EVERYDAY DISCOUNT PRICES 

SUPER TRIMMED, FRESH DATED, 
USDA CHOICE BEEF 

LEAN 
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lower prices better quality 
FOLGERS 

OFFEE 
1 LB. 	ALL GRINDS 

$198 

:BEAMS 
3  16 OZ.e84 

FOR 2w 

BRACH CHOCOLATE BAGGED 

CANDY 
ALL FLAVORS 12 OZ. 

GLADIOLA 

CORNBREAD 
MIX 

WHITE OR YELLOW 

56 OZ. 91E1 

RANCH STYLE 

CHILI 
19 OZ. PLAIN 

984  

POPSRITE 

POPCORN 
3 1 LBFO. RBAG 98 

VAN DE KAMPS FISH 27 OZ. 

ORE IDA COB 	alga 
1!E  TOP APPLE 
@RBI EAR  %dr 

JUICE 12  048 

FILLET $288 
STILWELL BREADED 

OKRA oz24. 98' 

()UALI I Y 

8  m.eats 
BAKERS ANGEL FLAKE 	EFFECTIVE DATE JAN. 4 - 10 
COCONUT 
7 01.5 
BAG 

7 - UP 
REG. OR DIET CANS 

12 OZ.-6 PAK 

BAKERITE 42 OZ. 

-SHORT ENING 
98' 
RALSTON 

WHEAT, RICE OR CORN 

CHEX 
$128 

GOLDEN GRIDDLE 

SYRUP 
$148 

TV BATH 

4 Olin; 4  

rel TV PAPER 

---:-- TOWELTowels S  
rill°41 

98 
' 2--- 	

ROLL  

TV SLICED 

BEETS 3 
 16

FOR 
oz. 984 

ha  

PET RITZ 

PIE 	5 Cr. 

SHELLS$148  
STILWELL 
ALL FLAVORS 32 OZ. der 	J. 8  
BBLERS '1.11  

784  
TV CINNAMON 9.5 OZ. 68  
ROLLS 

BUTTERMILK 
BORDEN 1/2  GAL. 	 $10 

BORDEN 24 OZ.  

COTTAGE $11 8  CHEESE 
RGPA(Aiiiiii2FOR98 

CEN, 	TV TEXAS STYLE 12 OZ. 	.8  
ISCUITS 3FORa 

FAB LAUNDRY 

DETERGENT 

CITRUS HILL ORANGE 

'JUICE 32 OZ. 

TV CUT 
OR FRENCH SLICED 

GREEN 

WELCHS STRAWBERRY 

PRESERVES 
$148 

BUTTERCRUST 
ANGEL FOOD 

CAKE 
$118 

HUNTS 

SNACK 
PACKS 

ALL .8FLAVORS 

LONE STAR 

DOG 
FOOD 

10 
BAG LB.$ 228 

PURINA 100 

FOOD 

4 61/z OZ.91114  
FOR 



Care Center Comments  

Shop 	 Home 
826-3636 HESS 	8263240 

TRUCK 8i TRACTOR 
All Types Truck & Tractor Repair 

407 East Oklahoma St. 

Wheeler, Texas 

fr  

Co NI 	t 

56E.' e.IATO7 
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Letters 	From Page 4 dent, who personally attended 
to it! 

That's all for now. Next 
week, I'll tell you about our 
stop at Gilley•s in Pasadena! 

LOVE,J. 

and family. She was delayed at 
take-off time because of snow 
and cold. She will be back as 
soon as it is convenient to 
make another trip. 

Mrs. Harvey Hudgins and 
Vivian Mitchell, of Shamrock, 
visited at the Center on Mon-
day. Vivian visited with her 
sister-in-law, Icyl Luttrell and 
Mrs. Hudgins brought honey 
jelly for the residents to enjoy. 
Cora Brown and Janie Bliss, 
also from Shamrock, came 
Sunday for a visit. They 
brought homemade candy and 
party mix for every one. 

Mrs. C. F. Hefley has made 
a donation to the Activity 
Fund. It is very much appreci-
ated and will be put to good 
use. 

A few Care Center resi-
dents came to their first anni-
versary at the Center today. 
One year ago, Lola Shire, 
Hattie Lee, and Jake Allen 
entered Home. These resi-
dents seem to have no com-
plaints. They, like the others 

gelere, are proud to have had 
this facility where they have 
been loved and cared for. They 
have made this their home 
away from home. Today an 
Anniversary Banner was hung 
—fluttering away with stre-
amers and balloons. Pictures 
were taken of everybody, also 
group pictures of then and 

Sow. 
Everything was a bit quiet 

Meeting From Page 1 

Several of the women, and 
one young girl, were working 
with flowers today. They were 
creating wall hangings with 
arrangements of flowers on a 
wooden plaque. 

Pat McWhorter visited on 
Anniversary Day. Of course, 
she was here at the beginning. 

BRISCOE LUNCH 

MENU 
Week of Jan. 9-13 

Monday:  Beef tips on nood-
les, green beans, cabbage 
slaw, pears. cornbread, 
choice of milk. 
Tuesday: Sloppy joes, But-
tered corn, French Fries, 
Fiamb. buns, choice of milk, 
ice cream bars. 
Wednesday:  Spaghetti w/ 
meat sauce, tossed salad, 
fried okra, fruit 	salad, 
French bread, choice of 
milk. 
Thursday:  Roast, Baked po-
tatoes, cauliflower salad. 
apple sticks, biscuits, choice 
of milk. 
Friday:  Oven baked chicken 
macaroni and cheese, veg-
etable sticks, jello w/ fruit, 
rolls, choice of milk, 

FIRST ANNIVERSARY 
Wheeler Care Center ob-

served its first anniversary 
Tuesday. January 3rd. The 
facility opened its doors in 
1983 and admitted 4 individ- 

The average car uses 1.6 
ounces of gas idling for one 
minute. 

The residents marking their 
first anniversary at the home 
are Hattie Lee (left), Lola Shira 
and Jake Allen. The late Bob 
Taylor was the second resident 
to enter the home. 

uals; three of the original 
residents remain at the home. 
Pictured above are the admin-
istrator and his wife, Mr. and 
Mrs. A. B. Hyatt, and director 
of nurses, Gary McWhorter. 

today. There has been so much 
celebrating, we all needed a 
little quiet and rest. 

I visited Mrs. Bledsoe to-
day. She has been here for 
only a few weeks. But she says 
nobody could have been more 
kind and attentive than the 
staff at the Center. She is 
grateful for such a nice place 
to live, when it wasn't possible 
for her to live alone. Mrs. 
Bledsoe is the mother of Paula 
Britt. She feels fortuante to be 
close by to part of her family. 

I also visited with Ethel 
Herd. She is a new resident. I 
asked her if she were com-
fortable there. (She has been 
in the hospital for quite some 
time). She said "part of the 
time". Ethel wasn't making 
any complaint about the place 
or care. Under the circum-
stances, there just isn't any 
place she could be entirely 
comfortable. 

Mrs. Mcllhany is still on 
holiday at her son's home. She 
plans to return to the Center 
this week. 

Ida Farmer also is still away. 
She is at Midland with her son 

BUSTER D. CONLEY 
Buster D. Conley, grandson 

of Mr. and Mrs. Bill Rains, 
Mobeetie, will return to Kem- 
per Military School 	and 
College. Boonville, Mo., Tues-
day. Jan. 3. following a Christ-
mas furlough which began on 
Dec. 17. 

Conley, an eighth grade 
student, is attending Kemper 
for his first year. 

were a treat to our senses. 
It was amusing to see this 

side of life so different from 
our own. I picked up a sweater 
casually thrown in one corner 
of a clearance table, and 
noticed it had been marked 
down to only S73! A veritable 
bargain! Most of the people in 
the mall were dressed very 
elegantly, even the teenagers. 
But you know, those teenage 
girls especially. looked so old 
and troubled. We couldn't 
help but compare them with 
our fresh sweet-faced Mobee-
tie girls like Betsy and Debbie. 

Some of the other unusual 
sights in Houston were a 
Poinsettia tree (it had 1500 live 
blooms and its own watering 
system); lunch in a nice rest-
aurant, and hearing the men at 
the next table talking about 
flying to Louisiana to duck 
hunt after lunch; and because 
of the cold weather, homes in 
the more elite areas of the city 
had their shrubs and trees 
covered in special blankets, 
color-coordinated to the 
homes' exteriors! 

Well, as they say, "It takes 
all kinds to make this old world 
go around"— and we've got 
'em! 

You'll be happy to know that 
we now have water again! 
Eureka! After 10 days of the 
bucket brigade, and using 
Carter's Bathhouse, we're 
back in business, thanks to 
Mr. Mickey, our Superinten- 

Miller 	From Page 1 

monitor moisture needs, and 
pending water legislation 
which will affect West Texas," 
King said. 

On the program will be: 
Olan Moore, agricultural con- 

Rant from Dimmitt; Jerry 
-Walker, Soil Conservation 
Service agricultural engineer 
who has been testing surge 
irrigation on the Hgh Plains; 
State Senator Bill Sarpalius of 
Canyon; Dr. Bill Lyle, research 
agricultural engineer with the 
Texas Agricultural Experi-
ment Station at Lubbock, who 

4e

veloped the LEPA system, 
d a panel of producers. 
The growers are Phil John-

son of Friona, Willie Wieck of 
Etter, Q.D. Bevil of Gruver 
and Norman Hinchliffe of 
Earth. 

The program will begin with 
registration, coffee and ex-
hibits of equipment at 8:45 
a.m., the county agent said. It 

%All conclude at 3:00 p.m. It is 
sponsored by the Texas Agri-
cultural Extension Service and 
the Panhandle Economic Pro-
gram. 

Educational programs con-
ducted by the Texas Agricul-
tural Extension Service serve 
people of all ages regardless of 
socio-economic level, race, 
iplor, sex, religion, or national 
origin. 

I handed in my resignation 
as Wheeler County Deputy 
Sheriff on January 2, (effective 
February 1) prior to announc- 
ing my candidacy for County 
Sheriff. 

I will greatly appreciate your 
vote and support in the up- 
coming election. 
(Political announcement paid 
for by Lonnie Miller. P.O. Box 
778. Wheeler, Texas 79096.) 

snow 
Water Well 

Service 
Windmill and submersible 
pump sales and service. 

Call anytime: Jerry Koelzer 

806/826-5906 
Wheeler, Texas 

Adams 	From Page 1 

1/4  

SAVE  up to 50% 
on 

Fall and Winter 
Shoes and Boots 
During our 53rd 

Semi Annual 
SHOE SALE 
Hub's Booterie 

Pampa, Texas 
	

119 W. Kingsmill St. 

ONE YEAR LATER: After one 
year of operation, the Wheeler 
Care Center has 50 residents 
and offers employment for 40 
individuals. The ninety bed 
facility was opened on January 
3, 1983. This picture was taken 
just before noon Tuesday with 
a number of the residents 
gathered in the dining area 
for recreation. The home of-
fers a well-rounded set of 
activities to keep the residents 
happy and entertained. 

JUNIOR VARSITY: These 
young ladies are members of 
the Wheeler Junior Varsity 
basketball team. Pictured are 
(back row, I. to r.). Coach Mike 
Newland, Tammy Baker. 
Bridgett Wallace. Angie Bail-
ey, Melanie Dutson, Angela 
Presley, Lori Lee. Front row, 
Cary Hatcher, Tina Alvey, 
Tami Jo Childress, Cristen 
Cornett. 
JUNIOR VARSITY: Pictured 
below are the members of 
Wheeler's Junior Varsity Bas-
ketball team. They are (back 
row, 1. to r.) Coach Mike 
Newland, Scott Barnes, Roger 
Cross, Lyndol Loyd, Robert 
Andis, Darren Grimes, Joel 
Dodd, Todd Alvey, Coach 
Warren Besly. Front Row: 
Draton Childress. Toby Collins 
Bobby Sword. Drew Thomas, 
Charlie Miller, Bill Wiggins. 
Cody Wiggins. 

 

First Baptist Church 
of Wheeler 

Invites you to join with us in 

our choir program 

 

  

Graded Choirs 

  

 

"TINEY TUNES"--4 yrs thru 1st grade 
meets at 6_00 	on Sunday in the 
Preschool Department. 
Leaders: 	 Debbie Morgan 

Joetta Sword, Tammy Jolly 

"MUSIC MAKERS"--2nd thru 4th grades 
meets at 6:00 P.M. on Sunday in the 
1st and 2nd grade room. 
Leaders: 	Karen Parker 

Suzanne Hampton 

"YOUNG MUSICIANS"--5th thru 6th grades 
meets at 6: P.M. on Sunday in the 
3rd and 4th grade room. 
Leader 	 Sylvia Lee 

"YOUTH CHOIR"--7th thru 12th grades 
meets at 5:00 P.M. on Sundays in the 
Youth Department. 
Leader 	 Robert Morgan 

"SANCTUARY CHOIR"--16 yrs. and up 
meets at 8:00 P.M. Wednesdays 
in the auditorium. 
Director 	Robert Morgan 

 

Music-- 

a Family Affair 

 

Jerry Parker 
Pastor 826-5523 

Robert Morgan 
Minister of Music 

Emergency 
Care Class 

People oriented law enforce-
ment is my goal. It is my 
desire to serve each and every 
citizen of Wheeler County 
equally and without prejudice. 
I will endeavor to work with 
• e youth of the County, to 
improve the image of law 
enforcement within the com-
munity, and to gain the 
respect of all citizens of 
Wheeler County. I would like 
to establish a well trained 
Volunteer Reserve Deputy 
Division, to assist in natural 
disasters and manpower emer- 

Lncies without involving out-
e agencies. Involving the 

men and women of Wheeler 
County with the law enforce-
ment of their community will 
establish an open door to 
better communications bet-
ween the citizens and the 
Sheriff's Department. 

It is my belief that my 
experience in administration, 
*minal justice investigation, 
police/community relations, 
and criminal justice education, 
qualifies me to serve as the 
Sheriff of Wheeler County. If 
you feel that my qualifications 
and my goals are what you 
want in law enforcement in 
Wheeler County, I would ap-
preciate your vote and support 

rthe upcoming elections." 
Political announcement paid 

for by Jimmy Adams, Box 374, 
Wheeler, Texas 79096) 

Planting Potatoes— 
On Top of the Ground NIPS  

Sorority Meet 
one eye 'n each piece. Dust 
the seed pieces with a fungi-
cide like Captan and cure 
the pieces in a warm, humid 
place until planting. 

Stop adding the 
organic material when the 
seed pieces are covered to a 
depth of 6 to 8 inches—this 
is the optimum depth for 
potato production. The 
potatoes will develop right 
in this layer of organic mat-
ter, which means there will 
be less chance of soilborne 
disease and cracks in the 
potatoes. 

Within 90 days, you 
will be able to reach down 
into the compost around 
your plants and pull out 
your first above-ground-
grown potatoes—smooth, 
clean, and trouble-free. 

MESTER," 

The Wheeler Ambulance 
Service will sponsor an Emer-
gency Care Attendant Class 
beginning Monday, January 
16. The instructor for the class 
will be Dwight Tipps of Bris-
coe. The classes are open to 
anyone interested in learning 
how to care for a victim of 
heart attack, choking. or ac-
cident; a total of 44 hours of 
instruction will be offered at 
the Wheeler Ambulance barn, 
located just north of the Whe-
eler County Jail. 

The classes will be  taught on 
Monday and Wednesday 
nights from 7 to 10:30 p.m.,At 
the completion of the instruc-
tion, students will be given a 
written test and will also be 
tested on their skills of band-
aging, splinting and Cardio-
Pulmonary Recussitation. 

Successfully completing the 
course and passing the tests 
will qualify you to work on the 
Wheeler Volunteer Ambu-
lance Service. Those express-
ing an interest in serving on 
the Ambulance service will be 
considered. 

Books may be purchased at 
the first meeting. 

Prepare the soil by till-
ing it as deeply as possible, 
working in a complete ferti-
lizer and liberal amounts of 
organic matter. At planting 
time, set the seed pieces 
firmly into the top of the 

Oil Painting, Pastel, Watercolor, 

Tole Painting 

Join Us 
WHEELER—VISE ENERGY 

Tuesday 9 a.m.-11 
1 p.m.-3 p.m. 

All Day 9 a.m.-3 p.m. 
Tuesday night 7:00 p.m.-10:00 n.m. 

Mobeetie City Hall 
Thursday night 7 p.m.-10 p.m. 
Saturday morning 9:30 a.m.-12:30 

Instructor Lynda Williams 
Interested? Call 

Wheeler Classes Phone 826-5576 
Mobeetie Classes Phone 845-3581 P.O Box 9005 Dept.  BR 

Waco, TX. 76710 

soil, about to 8 to 10 inches 
apart. Rows should be at 
least 3 feet apart. 

Now comes the part 
that explains how you can 
grow potatoes "above 
ground." Cover the seed 
pieces with 3 to 4 inches of 
compost, well-rotted hay, 
grass clippings, or some 
other organic matter. 

Within 3 to 4 weeks, 
the potato plants will 
emerge through the cover-
ing of organic material. 
When the plants are 3 to 4 
inches tall, apply another 2 
inches of organic matter 
around them. This is the 
equivalent of "dirting" 
traditionally grown pota-
toes. You may need to add 
:another layer in a week or 
two as the organic matter 
settles. WlflvacCailt.E.401WW.A.7 ..,  

Potatoes are a favorite 
eating crop, but they are 
not widely grown in Texas 
gardens. Why? Perhaps 
because gardeners think 
they are too hard to grow. 

If this notion has kept 
you from planting potatoes, 
you may be interested in 
this alternative approach. 
Though it sounds unusual, 
this technique involves 
planting your potatoes on 
top of the soil, and it is 
really quite simple. 

Plan on planting your 
potatoes about 3 to 4 weeks 
prior to the last anticipated 
freeze in your area. About 3 
to 4 days before this date, 
cut your whole, certified 
seed potatoes (do not use 
table-stock potatoes) into 
pieces weighing 1-1/2 to 2 
ounces each, with at  least 

The Alpha Mu Alpha 
chapter of Beta Sigma Phi met 
December 12 in the home of 
hostess. Teresa Rose. Melonia 
Simmons served as co-hostess. 
Belinda Masters gave the pro-
gram and Kim Goad showed 
movies of the area convention 
held at Vernon and of past 
Easter egg hunts and past 
chapter meetings. 

The major topic of discuss-
ion was the  collecting of food 
items for Christmas baskets 
and organizing the sorority 
family Christmas party. 

Members present 	were 
Margaret Dorman. Sheryl Ri-
ves, Donna Velasquez, Vicki 
Kenney. Marlene Miller. Di-
ana Johnson. Kim Goad. Kay 
Luttrell. Teresa Rose. Melonia All Classes Paid 4 Weeks in Ad%  amp 

Simmons. Carletta Burton. 
Stacey McQueen. Deedy Zy-
bach, Carol Porton and Belin-
da Masters. One member was 
absent.  



Illearter 

!DEL MONTE whole 

GREEN BEANS 
16 oz. 
Cans 30c 1#1gottfaiel 

r HUNT'S 	7 
TOMATO SAUCE 

8 oz. 
Cans 5/ 1° 

9 

Ad 

THRIFTY 
McSAVER 

• ' 

31A oz. 
Can 894  

Cinnamon Sticks 
$159  

1 oz. 
Pkg. 

10 oz. 
Box 

SUNBEAM 

VANILLA WAFERS 
3/1' 

20 Off Label 
WESSON 

OIL 

39 

Dr. Pepper 
L 	Six Pack t  6 12 oz. 	.49 

Cans 

SHURFINE SMOOTH OR CRUNCHY 

PEANUT BUTTER 
1802. 

00c 
JAR AV AI 

FULL OF JUICE 

ORANGES 

119 
WASHINGTON D'ANJOU 

PEARS 	 LB. 49c 
Aft 35c BANANAS 

GREEN ONIONS L BUNCH 
CALIFORNIA LARGE TIE 	

47c 	s 
CALIFORNIA PURPLE TOP 

TURNIPS 	 L. 35c 	w BL S 

CAMPBELL'S 

Cream of Chicken 

3/894  

(allifrAtk CAMPBELL'S CREAM OF 

c3 TOMATO 
SOUP 

YOUR CHOICE 
TIDE OR CHEER-S1.00 OFF LABEL 

LAUNDRY 
DETERGENT 

SEVEN-UP 
Diet Dr. Pepper 

Sugar Free Dr. Pepper 

Caffene Free 

5 LB. 
BAG 

GOLDEN RIPE 
CRISP GOLDEN 

CARROTS 	 

SUNSHINE KRISPY 

CRACKERS 

id  69c 

Kleenex Huggies 

$299 

HEALTH & BEAUTY AID SAVINGS 

i BUY ONE GET ONE FREE $ 1 89  
EDGE 
GEL 	2 CAN 

PACK 

SHURFINE 

Cinnamon 

SHILLINGS Whole 

GOOD NEWS 

Disposable Razors 
$119  

DISHWASHER DETERGENT 

CASCADE 
35 OZ.$ 1 39  

BOX  

ZEE 

TOWELS 
'Ruomi_Bi° 	694  
TOTAL GROCERY SAVERS 

FRESH DAIRY SPECIALS 

BABY FOOD 	 JAR 

GERBER STRAINED FRUITS & VEG. 4/$1 CORN CHEX 
3/$1  RICE CHEX 
' 	WHEAT CHEX 

4/$1 

ROUND STEAK 

WRIGHT'S HICKORY SMOKED SLICED SLAB 

LB. 

HEAVY GRAIN FED BEEF 

BACON 
29 

$ 

HEAVY GRAIN FED BEEF 

THRIFTY 
McSAVER 

BOX 

29 

LB SIRLOIN STEAK LB.  

GERBER FRUITS A VEGETABLES 

JUNIOR FOODS .. JAR 

GERBER ASSORTEDFRUIT 

BTL. 

Overnight 
Newborn 
Toddlers 

14 Ct. 
24 Ct. 
12 Ct. 

eilliPAFFILIATED 
FOODS INC. 

MEMBER STORE 	% 

We're proud to give von more! 

F T 
limifty 

H T w L 

PRICES EFFECTIVE JAN. 5-7, 1984 

WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT QUANTITIES 
WE ACCEPT RAO STAMPS 

A 

HILISHIRE FARM REG OR POLISH SMOKED 

SAUSAGE 
RUDY'S FARM WHOLE HOG PORK 

SAUSAGE 	 
RUDY'S FARM WHOLE HOG PORK 

SAUSAGE 

$199 

969 

$337 

ROUND STEAK cir 
HEW GRAIN FED BEEF 

T-BONE STEAK LB.  

EXTRA LEAN-CHUCK QUALITY El % LEAN 

GROUND BEEF 

HEAVY GRAIN FED BEEF BONELESS CENTER 

$209 
$299 

MINUTE MAID FROZEN 	$ 

ORANGE eA 
JUICE 	16 OZ. 

29 

BIRDSEYE 

COOL WHIP 
PET-RITZ 

PIE SHELLS 

LB. 

1 LB. 
ROLL 

2 LB. 
ROLL 

VELVEETA CHEESE 

$299  

• .1 
11111P • 

FROZEN FOOD SPECIALS 8 oz. 
Ctn. 

Reg. 

Deep 

79c 	KRAFT  Colby and 
594 	 Cheddar Cheese 

Pkg 	$1 49  994 	iooz 

2 lb. 
Box 

L 

3 
102 OZ. 

CANS 
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