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*WANDA JACKSON WILL 
APPEAR IN CRUSADE 

Wheeler I.S.D. 
Trustee Election Co. Jr. Livestock Show, Barbe 

Scheduled For February 19-21 
cattle superintendent and 
Steve Zybach is his assistant. 

As in the past, the market 
hog division is the largest part 
of the show with 120 entries. 
David Zybach will be swine 
superintendent and Phillip 
Gaines and Gary Hall will be 

need for the youth of the 
County." 

Short Course On 
Beef Production 

assistants. Keith Robertson 
will serve as judge. 

General 	superintendent 
Champ Davis said, "On behalf 
of the Wheeler County Live-
stock Show, I want to invite 
everyone to come to the show 
and give us the support we 

she was voted "The Favorite Female Performance twice. 
Female Country Music Sing- 	In real life, Wanda is a 
er" of the Scandinavian coun- devoted Christian and lives 
tries — Norway, Sweden, happily with her husband and 
Denmark, etc., and just a few manager Wendell Goodman 
years before had received a and their children in Oklahoma 
tremendous reception from City. Although her preference 
country music fans in Japan, is performing for the public 
Philipines, Korea and the Far and her religious work, she 
East. In 1972 Wanda was still finds the natural mother's 
chosen as one of the country instinct best of being with and 
music stars to make the first caring for her family. A talent-
U.N./CMA sponsored tour of ed and versatile star of tele-
Australia, New Zealand and vision, moving pictures and 
Japan, where a triumphant stage, that's the best descript-
reception was received. Wan- ion of Wanda Jackson. 
da has been nominated for the 	Wanda will be singing Feb. 
Grammy Award for Best 17 in the Larry Jones Crusade. 

Allison-Briscoe 
Community Show Feb. 19 

The Board of Trustees of the 
Wheeler Independent School 
District has set Saturday, April 
4, as the date for the 1981 
Trustee election. Three posit-
ions on the Board will be voted 
on. They are Position 1, cur-
rently held by Don Whiteley, 
Position II, currently held by 
Mrs. Betty Hennard, and 
Position III, currently held by 
Dr. Mike Smith. All requests 
by candidates to have their 
names placed on the ballot for 
this election shall be in writing 
and filed with Mrs. Vida 
Brown, Secretary of the Board, 
not later than 12 P.M. on 
March 4, 1981. 

Each applicant shall state 
the number of the position for 
which he is filing as a candid-
ate. 

Currently, Don Whiteley, 
Mrs. Betty Hennard and Dr. 
Mike Smith have all filed for 
the above positions. 

All support would be ap-
preciated. 

The Allison-Briscoe Com-
munity would like to say Thank 
you to the following donators 
of trophies and plaques for 
their show. 

Election To Fill 
3 City Positions 

The Allison-Briscoe Com-
munity Show will be held 
Thursday February 19, 1981 at 
1:00 P.M. Mr. J. C. Saunders 
from Follett will be judging the 
students animals. The stu-
dents from Allison who will be 
exhibiting animals are: 
Swine: Chris, Carol and Jim 
Bob Hall, Charles Nelson, 
Leon and Tenna Lane, Tam-
my, Randy and Ronnie Hall, 
and Kevin Boydston. 

Lambs: Angela, Mark and 
Melissa Elmore, and Michelle 
Coulter. 

Steers: Destry Coulter, Bret 
Begert, Kim and Richie Kiker. 

These students will also 
have animals on exhibit at the 
Wheeler County Stock Show 
on February 20th with the sale 
being held February 21st. at 
6:00 P.M. 

G.C. Lamb — Rex Miller; 
R.G.C. Lamb — Briscoe 4-H; 
G.C. Steer — James McCar-
ley; R.G.C. Steer — Allison 
Booster; G.C. Swine — David 
Zybach; R.G.C. Swine — Duzy 
Farms; Showmanship Lambs 
— Allison Farm & Ranch; 
Showmanship Swine — Bris-
coe Booster; Showmanship 
Steers — Steve Zybach. 

The Allison students will be 
attend the Houston Stock 
Show March 1st-6th and 
Pampa Stock Show March 15th 
through 18th. 

Vivacious and versatile —
talented and terrific — are the 
adjectives to describe 	the 
artistry of pretty Wanda Jack- 

:1? son. Wanda, a veteran star of 
Country Music in a relatively 
short time, has been singing 
and entertaining fans of 
Country Music throughout the 
United States, Canada — even 
around the world—since her 
early teens. 

A native of Oklahoma, 
Wanda's talents were dis- 

fr covered by another great en-
tertainer from the Southwest, 
Hank Thompson. Wanda con-
fesses that much of the state 
presence and technique that 
she prossesses was learned 
from Thompson when she 
appeared on many shows with 
him after first entering her 
career. Wanda has consistent-
ly been a best seller for Capitol 
Records and has thrilled mill-
ions of fans throughout the 
world in her personal appear-
ances. 

Aside from being a great 
favorite of country 	music 
shows, fairs, rodeos, and all 
types of presentations 	all 
across the United States and 
Canada, Wanda is one of the 
few country music artists who 
has been so talented as to 
record her songs in native 
languages in both Germany 
and Japan. In 1971 and 1972 

Beef Production Course Tax Statements 

Wheeler County 4-H and 
FFA members will exhibit 
their livestock projects in the 
Wheeler County Junior Live-
stock Show February 19-21. 
The show, sponsored by the 
Wheeler County 	Livestock 
Show Association, will be held 
in the Wheeler County Agri-
cultural Center in Wheeler. 

The show will begin Thurs-
day evening, February 19, 
with the weigh-in of animals at 
6:00 P.M. 

The show will get underway 
Friday morning at 9:00 A.M. 
with the lamb show. The lamb 
show will be followed by the 
beef cattle show. The market 
hog show will begin at 6:30 
p.m. on Friday. 

On Saturday, the barbeque 
will begin at 5:30 p.m. and the 
highlight of the show, the 
auction sale, will begin at 7:00 
p.m. 

Champ Davis, President of 
the Livestock Show Asociation, 
will serve as general superint-
endent of the show. 

Charlie Puryear, superint-
endent of the sheep show, and 
Gordon Estes, assistant re-
ported that the sheep numbers 
have increased from 45 last 
year to a record 88 lambs this 
year. The lambs will be judged 
by Buddy Logston, County 
Extension Agent for Hall Co-
unty. 

There are 28 steers and 
eight heifers entered in the 
beef cattle show. They will be 
placed by Don Reeves, Coll-
ingsworth County Estension 
Agent. Paul Macina is the beef 

There will be a beef cattle 
production meeting Tuesday, 
February 23rd in the District 
Courtroom in Wheeler. 

Dr. John McNeil, Area Beef 
Cattle Specialist for the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Ser-
vice, will discuss cow herd 
nutrition and supplementation 
of cows during the winter. 

Dr. McNeill will also give a 
presentation on the brucellosis 
program that went into effect 
in 1980. There are several 
aspects of the program that 
Affect every cattleman involv-
ed in selling heifers, cows or 
bulls. 

In addition, Dr. Carl Patrick, 
Area Extension Entomologist, 
will talk about internal and 
external parasite control in 
cows and calves. 

Dr. Patrick will also discuss 
the outlook for the grasshop-
per situation during the com-
ing summer. He will also have 
information on the grasshop-
per control program of the 
Animal and Plant Health In-
spection Service of the USDA 
and the Texas Department of 
Agriculture. 

Educational programs of the 
Texas Agricultural Extension 
Service serve all people re-
gardless of socio-economic 
level, sex, race, religion or 
national origin. 

BASKETBALL NEWS JJoopitaL noted Anne Mcllhany 
On U.T. Council Old Admissions 

12-29 Claude Cox 

Time has arrived again to 
elect City officials. Are you 
satisfied with the way the City 
business is carried out? Are 
you satisfied with the way your 
tax money is spent? If not, 
apply for a place on the City 
Election ballot. Filing deadline 
is March 4, 1981. 

Three places on the council 
are to be filled in the April 4 
election. Places 1, 3 and 5 are 
presently held by Kirvin 
Roper, Berniece Hall an& 
Jimmy Hill respectively. Rop-
er and Hall are each compet-
ing a two year term on the 
council and Hill is filling the 
unexpired term of Bob Roark. 

Kervin Roper has filed for 
re-election to his place on the 
council. He is completing his 
first term on the council as 
head of the transportation. 

Mrs. Hall will be completing 
her third year on the council; 
she was elected in 1978 to fill 
the unexpired term of Jimmy 
Helton and re-elected in 1979. 
She has been working with the 
park and swimming pool. 

Jimmy Hill was appointed to 
the council in September, 
1980, to fill the seat vacated by 
Bob Roark; he has been over-
seeing the maintainence of the 
streets. 

If you feel these people have 
been doing a good job repre-
senting your interests in the 
city government, tell them 
"thank you" and encourge 
them to file for re-election. 

WHEELER LOSES 
SQUEAKER TO SHAMROCK 

The Wheeler Mustangs lost 
a squeaker to Shamrock 62-63 
Tuesday, February 3. The 
Mustangs trailed by as many 
as 14 during the first half. 
However, they fought back in 
the second half to tie the game 
with less than 4 minutes to go. 
The Mustangs missed several 
opportunities to take the lead. 
Shamrock took a 3 point lead 
on free throws with 8 seconds 
left on the clock. Benny Baker 
hit a short jump shot under the 
basket to pull the Mustangs 
within 1 point, as the buzzer 
went off. Boyd Waldo led all 
scores with 24. Benny Baker 
and Mike Gallagher had 10 
each. 

Miss Anne Mcllhany, 
daughter of Judge and Mrs, 
Grainger McDhany of Whee-
ler, has recently been chosen 
for membership in the 
Education Council of the Uni-
versity of Texas at Austin. 
This select group of students 
who are majoring in Education 
provides liason between 
faculty and students, and is 
headed by Dr. Lorrin Kenna-
mer, Dean of the College of 
Education at the University of 
Texas. 

Miss Mcllhany is also a 
member of Pi Beta Phi Sorority 
where she serves as Pianist; 
Angel Flight Honorary Service 
Organization; and is on the 
Dean's Honor Roll Cum 
Laude. She plans to complete 
her studies at the University of 
Texas in 'December of this 
year. Mike and LaQuinta Hulse of 

Allison are proud to announce 
the arrival of a daughter, 
Angela Michelle. She was 
born January 25th at Sham-
rock General Hospital and 
weighed in at 6 lbs and 4 ozs. 
Grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. Clifton Boydston of Alli-
son and Mrs. Rose Burch of 
Amarillo. Great grandparents 
are Mr. and Mrs. Bruce Harri-
son and Mr. and Mrs. W. H. 
Boydston , both of Allison. 

new Arrival 

TP 
0 
8 
6 
10 
24 
10 
4 

TP 
17 
10 
9 
13 
12 
2 

Wheeler 12 30 46 62 
Shamrock 26 43 52 63 

Wheeler 	FG FT F 
Ty Henderson 0 0 4 
John Harris 	4 0 5  
Joey Waldo 	2 2 2 
Benny Baker 5 0 2 
Boyd Waldo it 2 2 
Mike Gallagher 5 1 4 
Russell Gaines 2 0 2 

FG FT F 
6 5 2 
4 2 3 
2 5 3 
6 1 4 
3 6 2 
1 0 2 

Shamrock 
Clerkley 
Taylor 
Bennet 
Salinas 
Darrow 
Doss 

Dr. Krehbiel states that the 
field of beef cattle production 
must take a close look at 
efficiency of production in the 
future. With land prices, feed, 
and taxes rising, the producer 
is meeting more and more 
competition for the consum-
er's dollar at the meat counter. 
From the economic view of the 
beef cattle business, there is 
every indication that in com-
paring the producer of yester-
year and the producer of 
tomorrow, beef must be pro-
duced more efficiently in order 
to be a profit-making business. 
Dr. Krehbiel indicated that the 
beef production short course 
will deal will methods of 
producing beef at a lower cost 
and the ways of producing the 
kind of beef that the home-
maker wants to buy. The 
course will include such im-
portant topics as nutritional 
requirements, winter feeding, 
minerals, vitamins, feed ad-
ditives, implants, facilities, 
equipment, selection of bulls 
and cows, animal identificat-
ion including freeze branding, 
crossbreeding, feeder cattle 
grades, diseases, parasites, 
reproduction, market trends 
and management for efficient 
production. The course can be 
altered to meet the wishes and 
interests of the farmers and 
ranchers attending. 

"Short courses it )eef pro-
duction, as well as in other 
areas, are available to farmers 
throughout the state under the 
cooperative program between 
Texas Education Agency and 
Texas A&M 	University," 
states Bob Jaska, associate 
professor, Department of 

Continued Page 2 

By Charles Buzzard 
The four stages in the 

property tax process are 
Development of Tax Values; 
Meeting of the Board of Equa-
lization; Adopting a Tax 'Rate; 
and Tax Collecting. 

The first stage begins on 
January 1 of each year. The 
development of tax values by 
the tax Assessor usually will 
continue through July. The 
rendition period is when the 

a 

	

	taxpayers are responsible for 
asserting their rights. 

The rendition period is the 
time during which taxpayers 
must assert their claims for tax 
relief. To be entitled to tax 
relief, the taxpayer must file 
an application each year. 

Your applications have to be 
filed with each appropriate tax 
office for 1981, during the 
rendition period. The rendition 
period is between January 1 
and April 1 or April 30 of each 
year. Trie last date varies with 
each jurisdiction. Check with 
your local assessor to insure 
that your applications will be 
timely. The assessor has the 
authority to grant a 60-day 
extension, but only for good 
cause. The determination of 
what is good cause lies with 
each local assessor only. The 
best idea is to apply before the 
deadline. If you miss these 
deadlines, you miss your op-
portunity for tax relief. 

Several forms of tax relief 
are available to Taxes taxpay-
ers. Among these are Home-
stead Exemptions, 65 and 
Over, Disability, Disabled 
Veterans or Survivors, Pro-
ductivity Values. These tax 
relief measures will be de-
scribed in detail in the coining 
weeks. 

Michael and Roxann Ather-
ton of Watford City, N.D. 
announce the arrival of a baby 
girl. Niki Marie Atherton was 
born Monday, February 9, 
1981 at 8:10 A.M. in McKen-
sie County Hospital in Wat-
ford City, N.D. She weighed 8 
lbs. 9% ozs. and is 23% inches 
tall. 

Maternal gfandparent if B. 
Modena Hutton of Dallas, 
Texas. Paternal grandparents 
are Darville and Sammie 
Atherton of Wheeler, Texas. 
Maternal great-grandparents 
are Lester and Olive Bowling 
of El Reno, Oklahoma. Pater-
nal great-grandparents are 
Mattie Atherton and Sam 
Dougherty both of Pampa, 
Texas. 

flew -Arrival 

new Arrival'  

WHEELER MOISTURE 
Wheeler received some 

moisture Monday and a lot of 
cold Tuesday. Very light 
showers Monday resulted in a 
total of 0.14 	inches 	of 
moisture. The cold front Tues-
day produced temperatures of 
8 degrees during the day and 3 
degrees for Wednesday morn-
ing's reading. 

Wheeler received 0.06 
inches of moisture in the 
month of Jnauary for a total of 
0.2 for the year. 

NOTICE 

new Arrival 
[Fifth Generation] 

Mr. and Mrs. Dwain Rat-
cliff of Wheeler announce the 
arrival of their daughter, Stacy 
Diane Ratcliff. Stacy was born 
Jan. 26, 1981 at Elk City 
Community Hospital. 	She 
weighed 6 lbs. 5 ounces and 
was 19% inches long. 

Grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. Evert Ratcliff of Wheeler 
and Mr. and Mrs. Jack Ward 
of Denison. 
Great grandparents are Mrs. 
Nora Babb of Wheeler, Mrs. 
Goldie Ward of Denison, Mrs. 
Georgia Ratcliff, and Mr. and 
Mrs. John Morris of Howe, 
Texas. 

Great-great grandparents 
are Mrs. Mary Willeford of 
Hurst, Texas. 

Mobeetie Calls 
City Election 

Andy Wayne Gearhart 
was born January 31, 1981 at 
6:44 p.m. at Shamrock General 
Hospital. He weighed 8 lbs. 
and 2 ounces, measured 21 
inches long. Andy was wel-
comed by his brother Rusty 
Dewayne, and the proud 
parents are Jim and Dada 
Gearhart. Grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Don Blakley of 
Clinton, Oklahoma, Mr. and 
Mrs. F. L. Gearhart of Wheel-
er. Great grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Herman Goett-
zen of Weatherford, Okla., 
Mr. and Mrs. Jim Jacquinto of 
Wheeler, John Gearhart of 
Erie, Kansas; Lewis 011en-
burger of Oklahoma City. 

Mobeetie City Election, will 
be held Saturday, April 4, 
1981. February 3 is the first 
day to apply for forms placing 
your name on the ballot in the 
1981 election. 

A beef production short 
course for adult farmers will 
be held March 9-12 under the 
sponsorship of the Allison 
High School Vocational Agri-
culture Department according 
to Mr. John Sollis, Superin- 
tendent, and Mr. 	Ricky 
Smetana, Teacher of Voca-
tional Agriculture. 

Dr. Elmer V. Krehbiel, Beef 
Production Specialist with the 
Vocational Agriculture Divis-
ion of the Texas Education 
Agency and the Department of 
Animal Science at Texas A&M 
University,

for rthis Corse. 
will cboethee . H  instruc-

tor
e is  

headquartered at Texas A&M 
University. 

Dr. Krehbiel has a strong 
background in animal produc-
tion and genetics. He received 
a B.S. degree from Oklahoma 
State University in 1950, and 
M.S. degree from the Univer-
sity of Arkansas in 1959, and a 
Ph. D. degree from Virginia 
Polytechnic Institute in 1966. 
His graduate studies were 
based on selection for type and 
reproduction performance of 
cow herds. 

Between periods of formal 
training, Dr. Krehbiel worked 
with the beef cattle industry as 
artificial insemination techni-
cian, beef cattle herdsman and 
ranch manager in Oklahoma. 
He also served as beef cattle 
research assistant in Ark-
ansas, and animal geneticist 
for the USDA at Miles City, 
Montana. For two years prior 
to joining the Agricultural 
Education Specialist Program, 
he served as Area Livestock 
Extension Agent in Ohio. 

The short course at Allison 
High School is scheduled to 
begin March 9 at 6:30 p.m. in 
the Vocational Agriculture 
building. During the dates the 
short course is in progress, Dr. 
Krehbiel will be available to 
assist cattlemen with indivi-
dual problems and to provide 
on-the-farm instruction, ac-
cording to Ricky Smetana. 

Cattlemen interested in at-
tending the short course 
should write or call the super-
intendent of schools, Mr. Sol-
lis, or the teacher of vocational 
agriculture, Mr. Ricky Sme- 
tana, at 806/375-2444, 	or 
806/375-2433. An entry fee of 
$5.00 will be charged. 

Beef Production Short 
Course certificates will be 
presented to each cattlemen 
who attends all the training 
sessions. 

1-20 Frank Madden 
1-25 Coy Revious 
1-28 Mary Lea Cole 

Mable Williams 
Ruth Douglas 

1-31 	Alvin Sellers 
2-2 	Billie Holmes 

Ruby l Free 
2-3 	Martha Williams 
New Admissions 
2-3 	Lisa Thompson 

Baby Boy Aytes 
Caryn Risner 
Cora Teakell 

2-4 	Cabrielo Jimenez 
Baby Boy Jimenez 
Gail Snapp 

2-5 	James Thompson, Jr. 
Sabrina Thompson 
Jeremy Seay 
Deborah Markham 

2-6 	Baby Girl Markham 
Michael Hibler 
Joe Peterson 
Jake Holcomb 
Shekteas Page 

2-7 	Doretta Moore 
Rose Davis 
Donna Ries 

2-8 	Vicki Goldsmith 
Geraldine Broadbent 
Margaret Hoelewyn 
Gerald Childress 

2-9 	Michael Skelton 
Glen Tedder 
Don Williams 
Eddie J. Pannell 
Shirley Ivey 

2-10 Mary Lee Markham 
Leon Dockins 
Theodora Oliphant 

Dismissals 
2-3 	Gladys Pannell 
2-4 	Deborah Markham 
2-5 	Rita Aytes 

Baby Boy Aytes 
2-6 	Michael Hibler 

Caryn Risner 
Robert Douglas 
Wilber Beck 

2-7 	Allene Holt 
Baby Boy Jimenez 
Gabrielo Jimenez 
Willodene Burke 
Norene Pavlosky 

2-8 	Joe Peterson 
Lisa Thompson 
Jeremy Seay 
Sabrina Thompson 
James Thompson, Jr. 

2-9 	Debbie Markham 
Baby Giri Markham 
Billie Wheeler. 
Rose Davis 

2-10 Bessie Laycock 

MUSTANGS HAND 
MEMPHIS DEFEAT 

The Wheeler Mustangs de-
feated Memrnis, 53-42, Friday 
night. The Mustangs tough 
defense and well executed fast 
break allowed them to come 
back from a slow start and 
steadily increase their lead in 
the second half. The Mustangs 
were led by Benny Baker with 
20 points and 20 rebounds. 
John Han-is and Russell 
Gaines had 10 points each. Ty 
Henderson and Boyd Waldo 
led the team in assists with 5 
each. 

Wheeler 12 24 32 53 
Memphis 14 20 24 42 

Wheeler 	FG FT F TP 
Ty Henderson 2 0 1 4 
John Harris 	4 2 2 10 
Ronny Alls 	0 1 0 1 
Benny Baker 	8 4 4 20 
Boyd Waldo 	2 0 3 4 
Mike Gallagher 2 0 1 4 
Russell Gaines 5 0 3 10 
Memphis 	FG FT F TP 
Monzingo 	4 6 0 14 
Wood 	4 2 3 10 
Richardson 	3 4 0 10 
Floyd 	1 0 1 2 
Montgomery 	0 0 1 0 
Foster 	0 0 1 0 
McGlathery 	1 0 0 2 
Mackey 	1 0 2 2 
Hernandez 	1 0 0 2 

MUSTANGE 	1 I LS 2-0 
After Friday nights win over 

Memphis, the Mustangettes 
are 2-0 for district play. Missy 
Wiggins was outstanding with 
30 points which she put on the 
board, shouting 60% on field 
goals and 100% from the Free 
Throw line. 
Ballgame Statistics w M 
Field Goals Att. 	54 56 
Field Goals made 	27 19 
Field Goal % 	50 30 
Free Throws Att. 	19 15 
Free Throws Made 12 6 
Free Throw % 	63 40 
Fails 	 16 19 
Final Score 	66 44 

MUSTANGM 	ES DOWN 
THE IRISH 

Last Tuesday night the 
Mustangettes traveled 	to 
Shamrock and opened the 
second half of district play 
with a won over the Irish by 57 
to 36. 

Randy and Carla Richerson 
are the proud parents of a 
daughter, Casey Patrice, born 
Sunday, January 18, 1981, 
weighing 6 lbs. 6% ozs. at 
High Plains Baptist Hospital in 
Amarillo. Grandparents are 
Mrs. Jyeton Lowery of Ama-
rillo, Mrs. Ron Richardson of 
Pampa and Mr. and Mrs. J. R. 
McCann of Skellytown. Great 
grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. R. M. Beauchamp, Mr. 
and Mrs. Cecil Richerson, Mr. 
and Mrs. H. W. Reynolds of 
Nocona, and Mr. and Mrs. C. 
W. Cade of Skellytown. 

W S 
32 59 
14 15 
43 25 
39 17 
29 6 
74 35 
17 24 
57 36 

Ballgame Statistics 
Field Goals Att. 
Field Goals Made 
Field Goal % 
Free Throws Att. 
Free Throws Made 
Free Throw % 
Fails 
Final Score 
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2IASONA3LE, SOUND PROTECTION 
for your home and other property. 

If you want to save, contact RITA FILLINGIP.1 
Rt. 1, Canadian, Texas 	 375-2379 

WELCOME TO 

FIRST UNITED METHODIST CHURCH 

8TH AT MAIN • P. 0. BOX 89 

WHEELER, TEXAS 79096 

Church (806) 826-3114 - Parsonage (B061 826.3079 

Sunday School 
	

9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 
	11:00 a.m. 

Evening Worship 
	6:00 p.m. Ernie 

McGaughey 
Pastor 

JOE GARRETT 
Concrete Construction 

SPECIALIZING IN STORM SHELTERS, 
DRIVEWAYS, BARN FLOORS, 

SIDEWALKS AND PATIOS 

— OIL FIELD WORK — 

PHONE: 826-3389 

AFTER 3:00 P.M. 

Box 351 	Wheeler, Texas 79096 

. t 

Donlyn's Restaurant 
Highway 152 West — Wheeler 

OPEN: 5:30 A.M. - 9:00 P.M. 
(MONDAY thru SATURDAY) 

8:00 A.M. - 2:00 P.M. 
(SUNDAY) 

BUFFET & SALAD BAR 
11:30 A.M. — 2:00 P.M. 

(DAILY, EXCEPT SATURDAY) 

RESERVE OUR DINING ROOM FOR YOUR 
PARTIES OR BANQUETS 

Phone: 826-9914 

FREE • FREE BREAKFAST EACH MORNING FOR ONE OF 
• FIRST 20 CUSTOMERS 

BEGINNING MARCH 1 WE WILL FEATURE 

MEXICAN FOOD 

HOMEMADE PIES 

Plenty of Elbow Room! 
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Walter and Charlotte Co-
ward visited Sunday in Cana-
dian with Gene, Judy Coward 
and the girls. Sandra Ran-
dolph and Deno from Sham-
rock visited Sunday with the 
Walter Coward's. 

and Shonda from Amarillo, 
Don's parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Schoon from South Dakota, 
Jeff Kelley and Mr. and Mrs. 
Ernest Gordon were dinner 
guests Sunday in the home of 
Mrs Flora May Kelley, Joe 
and Shara. 

Mrs. Martha Sides from 
Borger and his nephew from 
Lubbock. 

We are very proud to report 
Kay Hamilton came home 
from the hospital on Thursday. 
Her family and friends are 
proud she is home again. 

Mobeetie seems to be full of 

for the Mobeetie ballgame. 
Visitors in the home of 

Brooks and Edith McLaughlin 
on Sunday were his sister, 

Candlelight Valentine Banquet 
Ivan Dockins and John Ax 
decorated the church with 
lovely red and white Valentine 
decorations. 

The program of puppets was 
presented by "The First Bap-
tist Church" of Pampa. the 38 
young people were served a 
menu of fried chicken, mashed 
potatoes, green beans, frozen 
red fruit salad and cherry 
creme pie by Faye Anderson, 
Katy Hansard, Peggy Hogan, 
Betty Howard, Louise Hogan, 
and Anna Belle Corcoran. 

Wheeler Home 
Extension Club 

The Wheeler Home Exten-
sion Club met Jan. 27 at 2:00 

p.m. at the home of Laura 
Underwood, 	vice-president 
who called the meeting to 
order in the absence of Judy 
Wollard, President. Evelyn 
Meek presented a program on 
physical fitness entitled "How 
to Cut Risk of Heart Attack 
and Strokes." Her program 
also included a demonstration 
of exercises that will lead to 
better physical fitness. Mem- 
bers present were: 	Laura 
Underwood, Valetta Franken-
bery, Sandi Quaid, Donna 
Moore, Darla Brooks, Mary 
Sue Williams, Debra Hilt-
brunner, and Betty Rives. Our 
next meeting will be ajoint 
meeting with the Briscoe Club 
at the Copper Coin Room. Feb. 
24, at the bank on home 
decorating. 

Wheeler Extension Club is 
open to people of all ages 
regardless of socio-economic 
level, color, race, sex, religion 
or naitonal origin. If you are 
interested in joining, contact 
Betty Rives, 826-3224. 

GoIdle Gordon 
Those attending the Panfork 

monthly association meeting 
at the First Baptist church in 
Samnorwood were Rev. and 
Mrs. John Hansard, Jesse 
Stepp. and Mr. and Mrs. 
Doyle Grimes. 

Lorena Rector, Eula John- 
son, Letha Corcoran, 	and 
Bulah Grimes visited Wed-
nesday in Pampa with Mrs. 
Bonnie Hogan. Later they 
went to White Deer where 
Letha Corcoran visited with 
her cousins, Mr. and Mrs. 
Lillie Safford and husband. 
Lorena, Eula and Bulah had a 
very enjoyable afternoon visit-
ing with Bulah's mother Mrs. 
Mary Brewer and Mrs. Audrey 
Alexander. All will be glad to 
hear Mary Brewer is well. 

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Shelton 
visited last week in Lefors with 
an old school buddy, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jay Wallis and family. 

Mrs. Gazelle Patterson took 
LaVerne Scribner to Pampa 
last week to see her doctor. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Scha-
hen and Rusty from Harmon, 
Oklahoma spent Sunday visit-
ing with Win and Claudia 
Quarles 

Mable Wilson from Stinnett 
visited last week with her 
sisters, Mrs. Maggie Myers. 

Jana Corse took her 2 4-H 
show calves from the Mobeetie 
club to the show at Ft. Worth 
last week. Zana Corse came 
home form college at Texas 
Tech and went down to be with 
her family. Pierce and Nettie 
Walker are holding down the 
place while they are gone. 

Dinner guests last Sunday in 
the home of Pierce and Nettie 
Walker were Jimmy and 
Dorothy Walker from White 
Deer. Afternoon guests were 
Carl and Opal Henderson from 
Pampa and Alene Corse and 
Jana. 

Leon and Ada Anglin were 
dinner guests 	and spent 
Saturday night in the home of 
Ada's son Coon Lawrence at 
Pampa. 

Visiting with Tince and 
Leona Williams last week was-
Tince's sister Sue Cristene 
Meek from Amarillo. 

Sue Harrison went to Ama-
rillo on Friday to see the Dr. 
and returned back by McLean 

Estelle Hodges 
Joins Quilters 

The Quilting Club met with 
Edith Corcoran as hostess who 
put in a lovely stamp quilt for 
the ladies to work on. A new 
member was added, Estelle 
Hodges, and they had one 
visitor Pet Sims. Members 
presetn were Mada Allen, 
Fannie Whitten, Jane Seitz, 
Edith Corcoran and Bulah 
Grimes. 

Refreshments of spiced tea. 
hot chocolate, cookies and 
cake was enjoyed by all. 

115 W. Texas 

826-5224 or 826-5202 L 

• 

Nombre de Nit-ice/Nina 	 Edad 	 

Nombre de Padres; Guardian 

Domicilio 

Cuidad 	 Zip 	Teldfonoi 

Nombre de la Persona que hizo la recomendacion 	  

Numero del telefono de la Persona que hizo 
la recomendacion (Par ley, toda la informaciOn que usted nos de 
sera guardada como informaciOn confidencial.I  
Envie esta forma a: 

Region XVI Education Service Center 
Attn: Special Education Director 

P. 0. Box 30600 - Amarillo, Texas 79120 
Title VI B Education of the Handicapped Act 

ST WITIONILL 
IEA..1\T I-4E 

in Wheeler 

MOBEETIE BLOOD 
PRESSURE CLINIC 

The Mobeetie Blood Pres-
sure Clinic met on February 
6th in the Baptist cottage with 
Louise Hogan, Jane Seitz and 
Gazelle Patterson attending. 
This is a free service for all, 
the first Friday of each month. 
There were 37 attending this 
rnnnth pays as much for 

MONEY MARKET CERTIFICATES 
of $10,000 or more 

as any Bank or Savings and Loan. 
(There is a substantial interest penalty for early withdrawal.) 

Federal regulations law prohibits compounding interest 
during the term of the deposit. 

• •. • • • 
• tf 

0 	• • 

o• 4. 

••• • • 
• •  If you have not opened your 

N.O.W. Account, you may 
want to visit with our friendly 

personnel to see if this 
Interest Bearing Checking Account 

will fit your needs. 

Each depositor insured to 3100.000 

FINIAL 0110511 INSIAANCI COIPOIATLON 
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the flu now with many of our 
school kids also home with It 
besides the grown-ups. 

James Moore and Bobbie 
Hamilton had an accident last 
week. We are glad it wasn't a 
serious one. James broke a 
bone in his ankle and Bobbie 
has a broken hand. 

All are out of the hospital 
now except Margaret Trout 
and she is still very ill. 

Novelene Simpson 	and 
Claudia Quarles went 	to 
Pampa on Wednesday to see 
the Doctor and shopping. 
Ray and Velma Farbes were 
dinner guests in Pampa Friday 
with their son, Mr. and Mrs. 
Tommy Farbes and John. 

Dinner guests in the home 
of Bill and Virginia Ridgway 
on Sunday were Virginia's 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Lonzo 
Shaw and niece from Pampa. 

Visiting Sunday in the home 
of Ellen and Charles Haning 
were Mr. and Mrs. Peeler 
Haning from Fritch, Mr. and 
Mrs. Cotton Ridgway, Virginia 
Ridgway and Mr. and Mrs. 
Ariza Corcoran. 

Mr. and Mrs. Don Schoon 

"REMEMBERED EVERY-
THING BUT INSURANCE!" 

A free survey of your risks 
and insurance policies is 
offered by the Rives In-
surance Agency to uncover 
any gaps in yur insurance 
protection. Have peace of 
mind with proper insurance. 

RIVES 

Rogue Theatre 
Wheeler, Tx. 826-3078 

Showtime! 7:30 PM 

2 Week Run! 

Feb.13-26 

170 *401; 

EACH TUESDAY IS BARGAIN 
NIGHT...ALL SEATS SI. 

A candlelight Valentine Day 
Bouquet was given the even-
ing of February 7th in the 
basement of the First Baptist 
Church. Winona Anderson, 

Ft. Elliott Study 
Club Meeting 

The club met on February 
3 in the home of Mrs. Gazelle 
Patterson. Due to the illness of 
President, Margaret Trout, 
Gazelle Patterson as Vice-Pre-
sident opened the meeting. 
Bessie Galmor gave the club 
collect. The minutes were then 
read and approved. 

Miscellanous roll call was 

led by the vice president. 
Edith Sims presented an in-
spiring devotional. The pro-
gram "A Night in the Emer-
gency Room of an area Hos-
pital" was presented by Eula 
Johnson. 

Refreshments were served 
to Eula Johnson, Edith Sims, 
Bessis Galmor, Laverne Scrib-
ner, by hostess Gazelle Patter- 
son, 

Mrs. Brown Is 
Club Hostess 

The Wednesday Study Club 
met January 22, 1981 in the 
home of Mrs. R. Wm. Brown. 
In absence of the president, 
Mrs. David Britt, the vice-
president, Mrs. W. D. Mit-
chell presided. Mrs. Mitchell 
also directed the program on 
Home Life and Health. 

Mr. Charles Hix, Adminis-
trator of Parkview Hospital 
discussed: "Medicare — A 
Bane or a Blessing". A quest-
ion and answer period follow-
ed. Mrs. Grainger Mcllhany 
brought Life Styles for Living. 

Those present were: Mes-
dames F. H. Davidson, Shelby 
Pettit, Harold Nash, Nelson 
Porter, Lewis Wright, George 
Weems. Grainger Mcllhany, 
Golda Mcllhany, W.D. Mit-
chell, Harry Wofford, W.A. 
Finsterwald and R. Wm. 
Brown. 

Visitors were Mrs. Delmer 
Wood and Miss Reba Wofford. 

Club Meets With 
Mildred Porter 

The Progessive Study Club 
met in the home of Mildred 
Porter on Jan. 22,1981. for our 
for our program on Free 
Enterprise. 

The Importance of Home & 
Family Living was brought by 
Novella Vanpool. 

Free Report on infation and 
how it affect Free Enterprise 
was given by Rubye Sanidfer. 

The program He Made It 
Work was presented by Irma 
Kirk. 

Lovely refreshments were 
served to the following:Zinnie 
Bailey, Ila Byers, Ida Farmer, 
Leola Farris, Pauline Hefley, 
Irma Kirk, Jewel Moore, Ruby 
Lee Sandifer, Novella Van-
pool, Opal Daughtry, Inez 
Lancaster, and the hostess 
Mildred Porter. 

BEEF 	From Page 1 
Agricultural Education at 
Texas A&M University, who 
coordinates the program for 
Texas A&M. 

"This Cooperative pro-
gram," states Jaska, "is de-
signed to make the services of 
specialists available to conduct 
short courses under the super-
vision of public schools. 

All 
Fruit Trees, 
Shade Trees, 

& Shrubs 
IN STOCK & READY 

TO GROW! 

Lakeside 
Greenhouse 

15 Mi. E., 4 N. & 
14 E. of Wheeler 

OPEN 
6 DAYS A WEEK 
until 6:30 P.M. 

CLOSED SUNDAY 

NOTICE 
Farmers, Ranchers, 

Business People 
are you a small 2-way radio user? 

The Reliable, Affordable 2-Way Is For YOU 

Pace 2-Way 
Low Band, VHF, UHF, Pagers, Walkie Talkies 

Mobile Phones 

WE SERVICE WHAT WE SELL 

Dub's Radio Communications 
629 South 7th 

806-323-5538 
Canadian, Texas 

iCONOCE USTED A 
ALGUN NINO/NINA 

CON INCAPACIDADES? 
En tin minuto usted puede 

cambiar toda una vida 
Todos los nirlosiniFias incapacitados de 3 hasta 21 aros de edad 
tienen derecho de recibir educac iOn dentro del ststema de educaciOn 
• Esta es una ley estate!, pero much gente no se dan cuenta 
de este hecho. 

Si usted sabe de algun 	 incapacitado que no este reci- 
biendo los servicios educacionales apropiados. 

Hable El Telefono 

806-376-5521 
o Ilene esta forma abajo y regrthsela. 
El Region XVI Education Service Center (El Centro de Servicios Edu-
cacionales de la Region XVII puede asistirle para que usted pueda 
recibir los servicios apropiados para el nirlo/nina incapacitado. 
Recomendaciones y recursos pueden ser recibidos poi medio de 
Direction Service Component. Ciertos servicios appollados en co-
operaciOn con el distrito local de educacien pueden ser mantenidos 
cor el Direct Service Component. 
Pot favor tome un minuto de su tiempo para Ilenar esta aplicaciOn o 
Dame al telefono 806-376-5521 o si prefiere. comuniquese con el 

- director de Special Education de su escuela ptiblica local 
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1-806-352-8961 
28-B Medical Drive 

Amarillo, Texas 79106 

HEARING TESTS • HEARING AIDS 
SERVICE ON ALL MAKES 

In-the-Ear Aids • Eye-glass models 
Behind-the-Ear Aids • Body Aids 

Ask about the exclusive Blitone Certified Hearing 
Service Plan that helps keep your aid working. 

FREE ELECTRONIC HEARING TEST 
IN YOUR HOME OR OUR OFFICE 

ffeeme• HEARING AID SERVICE•••"" 
Senior Citizens Center 

306 S. Canadian 

BELTONE 
SERVICE 
CENTER 

Every Second 
Thursday of 
the month. 

2.5 p.m. 

ASK TO SHE 
A. W. McGinnas 
tortiflinl 14,4e 	4i4  

Specialist 

Perfect storage for farms, ranches 
Store feed, tools, supplies & eqpt. 

Or for home—store everything! 
(Moving services available) 

Storage Vans 

contribute to improving nut-
rition and health. 

The 4-H food-nutrition pro-
gram also helps young people 
develop skills in planning, 
purchasing, preparing and 
serving tasty, attractive and 
nutritious meals and snacks. 
The program urges boys and 
girls to learn by doing and to 
become familiar with the prin-
ciples of nutrition as they 
relate to good health, physical 
fitness and an attractive ap-
pearance. 

Sewing can be educational 
and fun for young people in 
the 4-H clothing program. 
These 4-H members plan and 
create attractive garments that 
express their individual life-
styles. 

4-H clothing projects and 
activities are geared to dif-
ferent age and skill levels. 
They emphasize basic fabric 
selection and clothing con-
struction that ensure wearable 
finished garments. 

4-H members also develop 
consumer skills in purchasing 
ready-to-wear clothing, 	ac- 
cessories, and sewing equip-
ment and supplies. They learn 
how to evaluate and care for 
their wardrobes. They also try 
practical needlecraft arts like 
crocheting and knitting. 

Information on any of these 
4-H home economics projects 
is available at the county 
Extension office. 

Educational programs con-
ducted by the Texas Extension 
Service serve people of all 
ages regardless of socio-eco-
nomic level, race, color, sex, 
religion or national origin. 

Mobeetie Basketball Activities 

is said to 
marks off 
vinyl tile. 

the girls out of eight games. 
McLean and Mobeetie now 
tied with 7-1 records await the 
outcome of the next two games 
to a possible re-match in a 
playoff contest. Shannon Bat-
ton paced the girls with 13 pts 
and hitting 7-10 free throws. 
Shonda Quarles had 11 pts., 
Kim Hamilton and Gayla Dar-
nell both had four points. The 
Mobeetie girls missed six one 
and one opportunities in the 
fourth quarter. This gave the 
tigerettes a chance to pull 
within two and take the fianl 
two shots that fell short at the 
buzzer. 

In Tuesdays contest Mobee-
tie beat Allison 38-30. Mobee-
tie has depended on eight girls 
throughout district. Shannon 
Batton has a 11.2 average 
followed by Kim Hamilton 7.6, 
Shonda Quarles 7.1, Gayla 
Darnell 6.5, Linda White 4.8, 
Donna Quarles 4.0, Jamee 
Batton 2.2, and Cindy Harri-
son 1.8. The Hornettes have 
averaged 45 pts during district 
and allowed their opponents to 
score 37.8 pts. per contest. 

The Hornettes play Lefors 
Tuesday and travel to Sam-
norwood Friday for their final 
contest in regular district 
action. 

HORNETS PREPARE FOR 
SHOWDOWN 

Mobeetie increased their 
district record to 7-1 with a 
87-64 defeat over the McLean 
tigers at McLean. McLean led 
the Hornets the first half 
40-36. The second half turned 
out in Mobeeties favor with a 
28-11 3rd quarter and a 23-13 
fourth quarter performance. 
Making the final score 87-64, 
Danny Hilburn had 32 pts 
while Dale Hathaway had 20 
pts and Dennis Hilburn had 15 
pts. Mike Lane had 18 pts for 
the McLean Tigers. In last 
Tuesdays game February 3, 
1981, Mobeetie beat Allison 
91-61. Danny Hilburn had 29 
pts., Dale Hathaway 18 pts, 
Dennis Hilburn 10 pts. and 
Donald Farrow had 12 pts. 
Charles Nelson had 25 pts. for 
the losers. 

The Hornets will have faced 
Lefors Tuesday night before 
the rematch against Samnor-
wood tommorrow night at the 
Samnorwood gym. Samnor-
wood took a 67-65 decision 
over the Hornets earlier. Sam- 
norwood, posts an undefeated 
district mark of 8-0, aloss 
would force a district playoff 
game provided no loss Tues-
day by Mobeetie. 

The Hornets are led in 
District with a 25.7 average by 
Danny Hilburn a 12.6 average 
by Dennis Hilburn, a 10.7 pts 
average by Dale Hathaway 
and a 9.7 average by Carol 
White. Bobby Hamilton had a 
car accident and out with a 
broken hand. Donald Farrar, 
Mike Kelsey, Ray Estes, and 
Wade Hathaway will have to 
fill the missing position and be 
the backbone of the bench for 
the Mobeetie Hornets. 

The Hornets with a 7-1 
district record have a 76.1 
scoring average allowing their 
opponents to score 53.3 in 
District. Next contst is at 
Samnorwood tomorrow night 
where the Hornets will finish 
their district play. 

Silver polish 
take crayon 
linoleum or 

Name of Child 	 _Age 

Name of Parent/Guardian 

Mailing Address 

	Phone ( 	) City_ _ 	 Zip 

Name of Person Making Referral 

Telephone of Person Making Referral ( 
(By law, all information is held in strict confidence) 

Mail Referral Form to: 
Region XVI Education Service Center 

Attn: Special Education Director 
P. 0. Box 30600 - Amarillo, TX 79120 

Dr. M. V. Cobb 
CHIROPRACTOR 
Specializing in The 

Examination And 
Treatment of Spinal 

4nd Nervous Disorders 

256-2133 

310 SouthMain 
SHAMROCK, TEXAS 

Today's 
Security Rates. 

14.680% 
6-Month Money Market C.D. 

$10,000 minimum deposit required. 

Rate effective through Feb. 18, 1981 

12.00% 
12.93 % YIELDL  

30-Month Treasury Rate C.D. 
Only $100 minimum deposit required! 

Rate effective Trough 	Feb. lfl, 1981 

Substantial interest penalty required for 
early withdrawal from certificates of deposit. 

SECURITY FEDERAL SAVINGS ,-.FOR SECURITY! 

Security federal Savings 
and Loan Association 

PAMPA: West Francis at Gray HEREFORD: 101 7 W. Park Avenue 

AMARILLO: 15th and Polk. 45th and Teckla. 3105 S. Georgia 

MEMBER FSLIC 

CARD OF THANKS 
We would like to express 

our appreciation to the people 
of Wheeler and Wheeler com-
munity for your contribution to 
the success of our golden 
wedding anniversary. We are 
deeply greatful for the cards, 
the gifts and the donations to 
the United Methodist Church 
Building Fund in our honor. 
We certainly appreciate the 
fact that you found time in 
your busy life to come and 
share some time with us. 

Cecil and Lottie Eva Denson 

MOBEETIE GIRLS TAKE 
REVENGE ON McLEAN 

38-36 
Mobeetie Varsity Girls tied 

for the district title with a 
38-36 victory over McLean last 
Friday night at McLean. It was 
the seventh win in District for 

DO YOU KNOW A CHILD 
WITH A HANDICAP? 

In One Minute You May 
Change a Lifetime 

Every handicapped child, from ages 3 through 21, has the right to a 
free public education. It's a state law, but many people are un-
aware of this fact. 

If you know a handicapped child who is NOT receiving appropriate 
educational services, 

Call Collect 

806-376-5521 
or complete Er return the Referral Form below. 
Region XVI Education Service Center can assist in obtaining the 
appropriate services for a handicapped child. Referral & Resources 
can be provided through the Direction Service Component. Certain 
Supportive Services in cooperation with your local school district 
can be provided by the Direct Service Component. 

Please take one minute of your time to either fill out the attached 
form, call the above phone number, or contact the Special Educa-
tion Director of your local school. 

REFERRAL FORM 

It. VI B Ethical 	if the Fiandn: Bipei A. 

North Plainsly-Pro u cts d 
Division of Tri-State Industries 

Prompt removal of dead 
livestock. 

Chrimi yllAS919LEFamily Portrait 
Reg. $44.95 
Value $ 95 

Saturday, February 21 
WHEELER CHRISTIAN ACADEMY 

Save Waiting 

In Line, 

Call For Ad 

Appointment 

826-3056 

After 4:00 P.M.: 

826-3358 

APPOINTMENT 

NOT 

MANDATORY 

One Special 

Offer Per 
Family 909.3 

ENERGY SQUEEZER 
The Electric Heat Pump 
The heat pump. . .all heating and cooling 
to keep you comfortable year 'round 
from one system. And, it's energy 
efficient. Because even on cold days, the 
heat pump delivers more heat than energy 
used to produce it 
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f-H Home Economics Projects Offer Information cisions on household 	pur- 
chases. 

Spending their dollars wise-
ly is the goal of boys and girls 
enrolled in the 4-H consumer 
education program. 4-H mem-
bers learn to distinguish wants 
from basic needs, prepare 
budgets and set short and 
long-range pending goals. 

Practical consumer educat-
ion activities help 4-H'ers shop 
discriminantly. They begin to 
look critically at 	advertise- 
ments and commercials, exa-
mine hangtags and care leaf-
lets, study warranties and 
time-payment contracts, and 
compare features and prices of 
products. 

As they become aware of 
consumer rights, young people 
find they are entitled to truth-
fully advertised products that 
meet certain health and safety 
standards. 

As informed consumers, 
4-H'ers realize their responsi-
bilities of following instruct-
ions on products and using, 
not abusing, credit. They learn 
about exchange and refund 
preivileges, too. 

The 4-H food-nutrition pro-
gram teaches that an adequate 
diet should contain a variety of 
foods daily. The greater the 
variety of foods, the less likely 
a person is to develop a 
nutrient deficiency. Food a-
lone does not assure good 
health, but good eating habits 
of moderation and food variety 

learn practical information and 
develop useful skills in a 

variety of projects, including 
home environment, consumer 
education, child care, home 
management, clothing, and 
food and nutrition. 

These project activities help 
members learn more about 
their roles as members of 
families, points out Linda 
Daughtry, County Extension 
Agent with the Texas Agri-
cultural Extension Service, 
Texas A&M University Sys-
tem. They develop a better 
understanding of parenthood, 
too. 

Those in the home environ-
ment project learn to make 
their homes attractive, com-
fortable and convenient places 
to live. This has become a real 
challenge for many 4-H'ers 
with limited family resources. 
Members also become more 
aware of the values of old 
furniture as they learn to 
refinish and reupholster pieces 
for their homes. 

Participating in the 4-H 
home management project 
teaches members to set realis-
tic goals based on family 
values and needs. They also 
learn to take advantage of 
available resources to help 
them reach the goals. 

Young people make con-
sumer decisions every day. 
They select items for personal 
use and influence family de- 

Youngsters enrolled in the 
4-H home economics projects 

WHEELER PLUMBING CO. 
204 S. Main St. 

New Construction — Remodel 
Repair — Sewer Service 

Phone 826-59W 
Free Estimates 

et in ea rom crincia, 
Linda Daughtry, CEA (Home Economics) 

FLU DANGERS 
QUESTION: Can in-

fluenza be dangerous for cer-
tain individuals? 

ANSWER: The risk of com- 
plications and death 	from 
influenza is high for those over 
age 65 and for children and 
adults with chronic health 
problems. 

These problems can include 
diabetes, severe anemia and 
disease of the heart, lungs, or 
kidneys. 

In addition, patients who are 
on medications that lower the 
body's resistance to infection, 
are considered to be in the 
high-risk group. 

Pneumonia is another factor 
that makes the flu dangerous. 
either "primary" pneumonia 

due to the influenza virus itself 
or "secondary" pneumonia 
caused by bacteria invading 
the diseased respiratory tree, 
is a complication that prolongs 
the flu beyond its usual one-
week course. 

FLU VACCINE 
QUESTION: What type of 

influenza vaccine is being 
offered this year? 

ANSWER: According to the 
Texas Department of Health 
the vaccine recommeded for 
the 1980-81 winter is a triva-
lent preparation offering pro-
tection against B/Singapore 
79 and two other strains, 
A/Braizil/78 	and A/Bang- 
kok/79. Persons 28 years of 
age and older will require only 
one dose of the new vaccine. 

The Texas Department of 
Health is making flu vaccine 
available for high-risk groups 
through the department's re-
gional public health clinics, 
local health departments, pri-
vate physicians, and nursing 
anc convalescent centers. 

About 80,000 doses will be 
available free to high-risk in-
dividuals. 

Because of the lack of 
exposure to previous strains, 
people under 28 who did• not 
receive at least one dose of the 
1978-79 or 1979-80 trivalent 
vaccine will require two doses 
of the new vaccine. 

FLU TYPES 
QUESTION: What are the 

different types of influenza? 
ANSWER: Three types of 

influenza virus that have been 
indentified are called types A. 
B and C. Research has shown 
that influenza A and B virures 
change their genetic make-up 
slightly each year. The annual 
changes are known as 
"drifts." 

As a virus 	changes 
or"drifts," immunity created 
by previous infection or vac-
cines becomes less effective. 

In the past, influenza-A 
viruses have caused a major 
outbreak about every 10 years. 

On the other hand, influenza 
caused by type B viruses have 
had widespread occurrences, 
but the disease is generally 
milder. 

Type C viruses never have 
bben associated with a large 
epidemic. 

Educational programs con-
ducted by the Texas Extension 
Service serve people of all 
ages regardless of socio-eco-
nomic level, race, color, sex, 
religion or national origin. 

Owens Salvage Co.,Inc. 
447-2581 Hwy. 83 South Wellington, Texas 79095 

THE FLU — 1981 
Influenza, or "the flu." can 

mean more than a bad case of 
the sniffles for the aged and 
chronically ill. Here are an-
swers to some frequently ask-
ed questions about flu. 

WHAT FLU IS 
QUESTION: Just what is 

influenza, or the flu? 
ANSWER: Influenza is an 

acute respiratory illness. 
Symptoms include fever, 
coughing, sore throat, a runny 
nose, and general aches. 

Most patients recover com-
pletely within a week, al-
though many continue to feel 
unusually tired for some time. 

Pampa, Texas 	 Wheeler, Texas 
	 Follett, Texas 

665-7802 	 826-5821 
	

653-5171 

"SERVING NORTH PLAINS WITH FAST, EFFICIENT SERVICE." 

a 



ALL TYPES OF 	 • OIL 8. GAS LEASES 	I 

Cr FRIT API( 
• ROYALTIES 	• MINERALS 

PETROLEUM LAND MANAGEMENT 
SERVICES 

LIST OF INSTRUMENTS FIL-
ED IN THE OFFICE OF THE 
COUNTY CLERK AND DIS-
TRICT CLERK OF WHEELER 
COUNTY, TEXAS FROM FEB 
2 THRU FEBRUARY 6, 1981 
FEBRUARY 2, 1981 
MD--Lowery Walker et ux to 
Carolyn Walker McNeil 5---
1980 1/4 of 1/6 int 72 A-5 
AOL--Apache Corox to Oil & 
Gas Incentive Ptnarship 
1-14-81 Secs 3, 4, 5, 16 to 
18.23. 24 Blk A-3; 1 AB&M 
Sur; 68 & Pt 67 BIk A-7 
P OF A1TY—John T Pickens to 
W Ralph Holloway 1-17-78 & 
Vera Davis to Dorothy Lee 
Gillis 5-21-75 
ROL--HNG Oil Co to Texas 
Osage Roy Pool, Inc 1-15-81 
Sec 4 Blk RE 
2 ROW--Jack Sims & Johnnie 
Lee Young to Perry Gas Trans 
Inc 1-21-80 18 A-5; 32 A-3 
PARTIAL RDT--United States 
of Amer to Charles T Master-
son et ux 1-19-81 Sec 12 052 
AOL--Burwell M Bates et al to 
Lon B Turk et al 1-2-81 Secs 1, 
2 Blk A-9 
2 OL & RDO--S Gene Hall et 
ux to Magic City South 9-9-80 
Secs 1, 2 Blk A-9 
3 AFF--H H Hall & Ruth 
Rogers to John H Hill 1-21-81 
ROL--John H Hill to Virgil 
Caperton et al 1-26-81 Secs 1, 
2 Blk A-9 
C/C NAME CHG APPL--Miles 
Kimball Co to A-K Corp 
10-10-80 
3 MD--Kimball Ventures Inc et 
al to Alberta S Kimball et al 
1-13-81 Mesne Ints N120 ac 
NW% 100 A-5; SW% SW% & 
SE% SW'% 63 M-1 
2 MD--Clint G Frye to R C 
Callan 1-22-81 15 ac int 47 A-3 
exc 25.8 ac; 2 B 5 B&B Sur 
D--David L Gossett et ux to 
Keith R Stewart 1-2081 W1/2  
Lot 4 Blk 67 Shamrock, WSSA 
AFF--David Leon Gossett et al 
to Monite Gossett et ux 
1-20-81 W1/2  Lot 4 Blk 67 
Shamrock, WSSA 
D--Allen B Hale et ux to City of 
Mobeetie 1-20-81 Lot 20 81k 
117 New Mobeetie 
DT--City of Mobeetie to First 
St Bk Mobeetie 1-15-81 Lot 20 
Blk 117 New Mobeetie 
DT--Billy Buckingham et ux to 
Roy Reeves et ux 1-29-81 
SW'/. Sec 29 A-8 
DT--Rasco Inc to Fort Worth 
Natl Bk 1-14-81 Wheeler Co 
Land not set out 
CERTIF--State to Merle 
Holmes Hatcher 9-11-80 & 
AFF--Louis E Griffin to Merle 
Holmes Hatcher et vir 7-3-80 
RATIF OL-1-11-80 N1/2  Sec 27 
A-5 from Virginia Robey to 
Minco Oil and Gas Co 
2 AFF--Loyd T Lee Ex Parte; E 
D Baker Sr to E D Baker 
Sr10-13-80 NE% 7 A-S (Part) 
RATIF OL--M E Kriegel Trust 
et al to Minco Oil and Gas Co 
12-4-80 NE% 49 A-7 
RENTAL DIV ORDER--Johnie 
Burrell et al 1-9-81 NE% 49 
A-7 
D--Bobby L Maddox et ux to 
Horace A Fillingim et ux 
2-2-80 L 4 Blk 107 New Mob 
Exc Min 
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AOL--Pioneer Production Corp 
to Hunt Energy Corp 5-5-80 
SE'/4 Sec 61 A-7 
2 MD--O B Burton et ux to 
Gary D Burton et al 1-30-81 40 

• ac int NE% 10 A-4 
COR D--Jerry Dan Hefley et 
ux to Edward Joe Ellison et ux 
1-22-81 5.82 ac NE% 59 A-8 
COR DT--Edward Joe Ellison 
et ux to Texoma Fed Cre UniS 
1-22-81 5.82 ac NE1/4  59 A-8 
Exc Mins 
COR DT--Bobby Joe Dukes et 
ux to First St Bk Mobeetie 
1-7-81 Pt Sec 6 Blk RE 
D--Warren Thompson et ux to 
Bob Richardson 12-28-73 W1/2  
55 A-5 exc mins 
FEBRUARY 3, 1981 
3 MD--L J Powell et al to 
James Vise et al 1-27-81 3 ac
int SE'/4 81 A-S exc 10.09 ac 
2 FIELD NOTES--H C Wea-
therby to Glenn Scott 8-24-79 
566 ac 5 Blk E; 405.14 a 40 A-8 
OL--Hyland C Weaver et ux to 
Amarex Inc 8-13-80 Sec 48 Blk 
A-8 
OL--Daisy C Mizar to HNG Oil 
Co 10-23-80 NW'/. SW% Sec 
29 A-7 	 0 
OL--Thurman Calcote et al to 
Exxon Corp 1-27-81 W220 ac 
N1/2  & S1/2  19 A-4 
DT--Melvin Simpson to Amer-
ican Natl Bk McLean 2-2-81 
N1/2  Sec 60 Blk 23 
3 ROY D--Cleo C Gaines et ux 
to fames A Gaines et al 2-3-81 
45 ac int N100ac W1/2  3 BIk A-4 
FEBRUARY 4, 1981 
ROYALTY AGREE--Geraldine? 
Bagley et al to Leede explor et 
al 10-19-79 NE1/4  14 A-8 
ASSIGN--Geraldine Bagley to 
Ronald D Nickum 10-19-79 
NE'/. Sec 14 A-8 
D--Robert Carroll Powell to 
James Vise et al 1-27-81 SE% 
81 A-5 exc 10.09 ac & Exc 
Mins 
RVL--Naomi C Beard et al to  L. 
C Powell 12---1980 SE'/. Sec 
81 A-5 exc 10.9 ac 
MD--Robert Carroll Powell to 
James Vise et al 1-27-81 1 ac 
int SE% 81 A-5 exc 10Ac 
D--Mrs. S W Roark to Roy Don 
Chick et ux 1-26-81 Lots 8, 9, 
S10. 7 N15' 10 Blk F Wheeler, 
Park Addn 
FEBRUARY 5, 1981 
D--W E Mason to R D Mason• 
et al 2-5-81 NW% SE% & 11 
1/7 ac NE'/. 4 T&NO Ry Co 
Sur 
APPT TRUSTEE--United St of 
America to Teddy E Nelson et 
ux 1-15-81 No Land set out 
3 AOL--Tom F Marsh to Dyco 
Pet Corp 2-1.80 Sec 47, 48 A-3; 
2 Blk 5 B&B Sur 
2 AOL--Tom F Marsh to Jame 
B Franklin & to W P Bucktha 
2-17-79 3 pages of land Dec 
2 OL--State of Texas to Tom F 
Marsh, Inc 1-23-81 7.407 ac 26 
A-4; 11-768 ac 50 M-1 
OL--Zane Gray Francis et ux to 
Phillips Pet Co 1-5-81 Lots 7, 8 
Blk 3 Wheeler Stanley 2nd Ad 
RENTAL DIV ORDER--Ora 
Wilson et al to Irene Trout et al 
1-14-81 32, 32A, 0s2 
2 ROL--Harold Rose to Alan W 
Noyes et al 1.27-81 NE% Sec 
SO A-5 
TMMI-TDT--Melvin W May to 
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Phone: 826-3123 

Entered as second-class matter December 18, 1933, at the Post 
Office at Wheeler, Texas 79096, under the act March 3, 1879. 

Louis C. Stas, Owner and Publisher 

SUBSCRIPTION RATES: 

Wheeler County. . .$7.75 Outside County. .. .$8.7 

T MEMBER 1981 

TEXAS PRESS ASSOCIATION 

PAUL'S REAL ESTATE 
Houses or Land 

Paul Topper 
200 S. Canadian St. 

806/826-5237 
Wheeler, Tx. 

GUARANTEED 
AUTO GLASS 

INSTALLATION 
& Body Repair 

CROSS  
CAR CENTER Gal-a f  
Phone: 826-5515  ,1m,s,  
Wheeler. Texas 	''''="" 

Dr. Marion Roberts 

J M 

insii 	OPTOMETRIST 
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FOR SALE: 40 acres, 2/8 
miles N. city on hwy. 83, 4 
bedroom house, 36'72' 
steel garage & shop. Steel 
pens and barns. 30 acres 
can be divided spearate. 
806/826-5650 	rtn 

--- — 
FOR SALE: '78 Chevy Van, 
customized, and '72 Chevy flat 
bed pickup. 826-3053. 	rtn 

HOUSE FOR SALE 
By Owner 

3 bedroom, large living 
room, kitchen with built-in 
appliances, bathroom, cen-
tral heating, large two story 
work shop and garage. On a 
90 by 150' lot, good location 
call 6-3102 after 4:00 p.m. 

rtn 

approximate area 502.62 
acres. 
PROPOSAL NO. 3 (1 Year): 
Donley and Hall Counties, 
U.S. Highway 287, from Fled-
ley to Estelline, length 26.25 
miles, approximate area 
339.04 acres. 
PROPOSAL NO. 4 (1 Year): 
Donley County, U.S. Highway 
287, from Armstrong County 
line to Hedley, length 27.35 
miles, approximate area 
355.04 acres. 
PROPOSAL NO. 5 (2 Year): 
Knox County, U.S. Highway 

-82, from King County line to 
Baylor County line, length 
30.75 miles, approximate area 
195.00 acres. 
PROPOSAL NO. 6 (2 Year): 
Knox County, U.S. Highway 
277, from Haskell County line 
to Baylor County line to in-
clude F.M. 266 from U.S. 82 to 
Goree, length 26.15 miles, ap-
proximate area 209.58 acres. 
PROPOSAL NO. 7 (2 Year): 
Wheeler County, U.S. High-
way 83, from Hemphill County 
line to Collingsworth County 
line, length 31.95 miles, ap-
proximate area 323.36 acres. 
PROPOSAL NO. 8 (2 Year): 
Wheeler County, Interstate 
Highway 40, from Gay County 
line to North Fork of Long Dry 
Creek, length 11.10 miles, ap-
proximate area 306.54 acres. 
PROPOSAL NO. 9 (2 Yeaar): 
Wheeler County, Interstate 
Highway 40, from North Fork 

. 	r. 

OIL & GAS PROPERTIES 

LEGAL NOTICE 
Local Invitation to bid on 

Highway mowing 
Sealed proposals for ten 

separate mowing contracts in 
Hardeman, Childress, Hall, 
Donley, Know, and Wheeler 
Counties will be received at 
the State Department of 
Highways and Public Trans-
portation District Office at 
1700 Avenue F, N.W., P.O. 
Box 900, 79201, until 2:00 
P.M., February 20, 1981. 

Proposals will not be con- 
solidated for bidding 	pur- 
poses. Bidders must submit 
individual bids for any of the 
following separate highway 
illowing proposals: 
PROPOSAL NO. 1 (1 Year): 
Hardeman County, U.S. High-
way 287, from F.M. 268 to 
Wilbarger County line to in-
clude all of F.M. 925, length 
30.56 miles, approximate area 
540.12 acres. 
PROPOSAL NO. 2 (1 Year): 
Hall Childress, and Hardeman 
Counties, U.S. Highway 287, 
from Estelline to F.M. 268, to 
include all of Loop 328 and 
F.M. 2466, length 34.88 miles, 

WILL DO BABY SITTING in 
my home. 54.00 per day — 4 
miles NW of Wheeler, Phone: 
826-5200. 	 Itp 

FOR SALE. Tappan double 
over & range and broiler. 

A. W. BURRELL 
Route 1 

Twitty, Texas 70090 
806/256-2069 

LADY VENUS: Aloe Vera 
Cosmetics now available at the 
City Cleaners & Fabrics. Call 
for free facial and skin treat- 
ment. 826-3268. 	rtn 

SPANISH TAPES & RE-
CORDS. L. & F. Repair. 
826-3241. 

MARK BURRELL 
Box 23 
Wheeler, Texas 79006 
806/826-3208 

Wheeler County, Interstate 
Highway 40, from Station 1151 
+ 00 to Oklahoma State line 
to include all of F. M. 1802 and 
Spur 30, length 9.92 miles, 
approximate area 314.29 
acres. 

Proposals, 	plans, and 
specifications may be obtained 
at the Department Office of 
the following 	Maintenance 
Construcion 	Supervisors: 
John W. Rothwell, Jr., Child-
ress; Albert B. Johnson, Jr., 
Clarendon; Gene R. Crabtree, 
Quahah; Terry L. Keener, 
Munday; Joe B. Hall, Sham-
rock; or District Office, Child-
ress. 

A pre-bid conference will be 
held with Mrs. Lewis H. White 

District Engineer at the 
District Office in Childress{  
Texas at 10:00A.M. February 
20, 1981. Persons interested in 
bidding on any of the above 
proposals should attend this 
pre-bid conference. Following 
the pre-bid conference bids 
will be opened at 2:00 P.M., 
February 20, 1981. 

The State Department of 
Highways and Public Trans-
portation, in accordance with 
the provisions of Title VI of the 
Civil Rights Act of 1964 (78 
Stat. 252) and the Regulations 
of the U.S. Department of 
Transportation (15 C.F.R., 
Part 8), issued pursuant to 
such act, hereby notifies all 
bidders that it will affirma-
tively insure that the contract 
entered into pursuant to this 
advertisement wil be awarded 
to the lowest responsible bid-
der without discrimination on 
the ground of race, color, or 
national origin. 

TREE LIMBS 

FURNITURE 

JUNK 

Will haul after school or 
Saturdays. 

Day Phone: 826-3123 MARY KAY 
COSMETICS 

New Consulant 

BARBARA DYER 

FOR SALE 
By Owner 

CAKES Evenings & Saturdays 

CATERING SERVICE FOR 	? Phone 826-3221 	 • • 
Wedding & Anniversaries 

Cathy Hunt-375-2391 
FOR SALE: Portable 2 station Kay Luttrell-375-2421 
Beauty Shop, 12'x24', cedar 
siding. completely carpeted, 

WAITRESS WANTED: Apply new equipment, frig. air, built 
at Sparlin's Restaurant. 	rtn in bathroom, fully supplied. 

nnnnintment nnlv Phnna• 

Phone: 826-3091 
Free Facials — Supplies — 

Deliveries 

3 Br—large master Br, liv-
ing room, den, utility room, 
11/2  bath, new carpet, new 
appliances; central H/A. 
Good location for appoint-
ment call 826-3065. 

FOR: Seed Potatoes, Onion 
bulbs, bulk garden seed, peat 
pots. Robinson Feed & Seed, 
Shamrock. 

....... 

826-5750. 	 rtn 

FOR SALE: 681/2  acres land, 
near Wheeler. Phone: 
1/714/885-7442, 	Ken 
Crowder. 	 rtn 

55 COWS FOR SALE: George 
B. Dunn, Phone: 845-2561 or 
665-4534. 	 4tp 

I MINERAL & ROYALTY 

I am interested in purchas-
ing your minerals or royalty 
acres. 

BW Spillman 
Wheeler Oil Co. 

Box 832 
Wellington, Texas 

Phone: 806/447-2525 

HOUSE FOR SALE. 2 bed- FOR SALE: 3 bedrooms, 21/2  
room, 2 baths, den, dinning bath, living room, den large 
room, living room & kitchen. utility room, basement, all 
Phone: 826-5259. 	rtn carptedted on 5 acres. 1601 W. 

12th st. Good out buildings 
CARPENTRY WORK: Finish and fence. Phone: 826-5810 rtn 
work and general repairs. Buck 	in 
Hill, 826-5750. 	 rtn 	

Mark Woods 
I Oil & Gas Properties 

FIRE CHIEF HONORED 
Wednesday, February 4th 

In appreciation the Bris-
coe Fire Department pre-
sented their Chief, Thur-
man Horn with a concrete 
sculpture, shaped like con-
crete dumped out of a wheel 
barrow. Those members re-
sponsible wish to remain 
anonymous. 

Reducesafe &fast with GoBese 
Tablets &E-Vap "water pills" 
Hyland'S Pharmacy. 	2tp 

FOR SALE: 55' 3 leg TV 
Tower, Zenith Chroma color 
antenna & booster. 826-5648. 

Nam II& ‘ 	WV V 111. % 

Roofing of all types — Residential Additions 

i 	P.O. Box 542 	Wheeler, Tx 79096 

i
Of lice: (806) 826-5268 

	

Home: 	(806) 826-5865 

PROMT 	DEAD 	STOCK 	Phone: 826-5992. 
REMOVAL Seven days a week 

of Long Dry Creek to St 
1150 + 00. To include all of 
F.M.3075 F.M.1547 (Wheelr 
  '   _ _ _ 	_ .__ _ _ _ 	_ _ __ service. Call your local used 	FOR SALE: 1979 Ford Lariat. 

Co.) C 	F.M. 2474 and F.M. 2168, cow dealer at 669-7016, or toll new Refrigerator, twin bed, 
LOST: Six black & black & Free 1-800/692-4043. 	and living room furniture. length 19.20 miles, approxi- 

white face cows. Missing from 	 rtn Phone: 826-3124. 	2tp mate area 340.94 acres. 
PROPOSAL NO. 10 (2 Year): 

HOLCOMB 

Trailer Park 
West 12th Street 

Phone 806/826-5810 
or 827-5942 

o nay 	am ens 	p 
miles northeast of Wheeler. 	FOR SALE: Good used carpet, 	BABYSITTING done 	in 	my 
Phone 	826-5609. 	Reward 	14'x15' 	reasonable, 	Phone: 	home. Reasonable prices. Call 
offered. 	 2tp 	826-5519. 	 ltc 	826-3124. 	 2tp 

BEST BUILDERS 
FOR SALE: 1978 Ford Lariat, 
power & air, automatic, ex- 
cellent condition. Phone: 
826-5882. 	 2tc 

_ 

Backhoe & Dirt Moving 

Metal Building Erection 

PETTY & ASSOCIATES 
General Contractors 

807 N.Wall 	 Shamrock, Texas 

Phone 256-2759  
WANTED: Female Concession 
Help. Must be willing to work 
Friday and Saturday nights. 
Apply in person. 	Rogue 
Theatre. Phone: 826-3078. rtn 

PIANO FOR SALE or trade. 
600 Kiowa, 826-3104 	2tp 

THE 

BUSINESS DIRECTORY NOTICE 
Notice is hereby given by 

the Parks and Wildlife De-
partment that a public hearing 
will be held at 2:00 P.M. on 
March 17, 1981 at the County 
Courthouse at Wheeler for the 
purpose of gathering infor-
mation concerning proposed 
hunting, fishing and trapping 
regulations for Wheeler 
County. 

As the result of action by the 
Texas Legislature, the Texas 
Parks and Wildlife Commiss-
ion is responsible for the 
setting of seasons, bag limits, 
and means and methods of 
taking the wildlife resources in 
Wheeler County. All interest-
ed persons are urged to attend 
and comment upon the pro-
posed regulations. 

NOTICE OF HEARING ON 
APPLICATION TO LEASE 

STATE OF TEXAS 
COUNTY OF WHEELER 
TO ALL PERSONS INTER-
ESTED IN THE ESTATE OF 
GENE B. CAPERTON. DE-
CEASED. 

I. David M. Britt, the per-
soanl representative, as Ad-
ministrator, C.T.A. of the 
Estate of Gene B. Caperton, 
hereby give notice of hearing 
on application to lease oil and 
gas mineral interests, said 
application being filed on the 
26th day of January, 1981, 
covering the interests of the 
Estate as contained in the 
lease attached thereto, said 
hearing to be held on the 9th 
day of March, 1981 at the 
Wheeler County Courthouse, 
Wheeler, Texas. 

Signed the 6th day of Feb-
ruary. 1981. 
David M. Britt, Administrator 

C.T.A. of the Estate of Gene 
B. Caperton, Deceased 

NOTICE TO ALL PERSONS 
HAVING CLAIMS AGAINST 
THE ESTATE OF SILAS N. 
CHILDRESS, DECEASED 
Notice is hereby given that 

original Letters Testamentary 
for the Estate of Silas N. 
Childress were issued on Jan-
uary 26, 1981, in Cause No. 
2172 pending in the County 
Court of Wheeler County, 
Texas. to: Leona Glenn 

The residence of such Exe-
cutor of Deaf Smith County, 
Texas. The post office address 
is: c/o Lowell Lasley, P.C., 
P.O. Box 445. Wheeler, Texas 
79096. 

All persons having claims 
against this Estate which is 
currently being administered 
are required to present them 
within the time and in the 
manner prescribed by law. 

Dated the 26th day of 
January, 1981. 

ouse Movin 

U-U Electrical Service 
"We handle all your electrical needs'' 

RESIDENTIAL, COMMERCIAL and CUSTOM 

Robert and Laura Underwood, Owners 

Box 269 	Wheeler, Texas 79096 

Call Day or Night: 826-3150 

If no answer — 845-2442 

lflaikaa 

CARPENTER SERVICE 
No job too large or too small 
For the best job — Call the 
best people 
George Harris — 826-5692 

ARLIN'S-326-5898 
Wheeler, Texas 

FOR SALE. Full size bed and 
frame. Bobby Jennings, Call 
after 5:00, 826-3153. 	rtn THE 

SHIRT SHACK 
114 East Texas Street 

	

Letters 
	

Transfers 

	

Jersy 
	

T-Shirts 

Sherri Lewallen 
Phone: 826-571^ 

FOR SALE: Hay grazer in 
large round bales. 826-5843. 

FOR SALE. Large home and 5 
acres at west edge of Wheeler 
city limits. James Verden, 
Phone: 826-5965 after 5 p.m. 

rtn 

ASSISTANT MANAGER 
TRAINEE WANTED. Exper-
ience preferred. Good benefits 
with fast moving company. 
Apply in person. No phone 
calls please. C.R. Anthony, 
314 N. Main Shamrock, Texas. 

4tc BUTCHERING & PROCESSING PRICES 

Beef processed, double wrapped 19,* per pound 

lc A Pound for Butchering 

Pork Processing including. curing 

Double wrapped 22e per pound 

$8.50 a head for butchering 

W e  butcher Mon., Tues., Thurs., & Fri. until 11:30 A.M. 

CALL FOR QUARTER —HALF —WHOLE 
BEEF PROCESSED 

WE NOW HAVE CUTS OF PORK AND BEEF FOR SALE 

SHAMROCK SLAUGHTER PLANT 
North of City Phone: 256.3241 

Closirg at Noon on Saturday 

 

OIL & GAS LEASES 
I am interest in leasing your 
Oil & Gas Leases, purchas- 
ing your Minerals 	and 
Royalties. 

R.C. Callan 
204 E. Texas St. 
(806) 826-5522 

Wheeler. Texas 79096 
or 

Amarillo Office 
Box 7473 

(806) 352-7891 
Amarillo, Texas 79109 

LOT ONLY FOR SALE: at 1120 
S. Main. Call 825-5609. 	2tp 

DRILLING 
Commerci al 	Resi den ti al 

WELLS 
COMMERCIAL PUMP 

SAL ES & SERVICE 

CEPTIC TANK 
SOLD, SET & CLEANED 

BACKHOE WORK 
Banks Water Well Service 

& Drilling 
Mobeetie, Texas 
Phone: 845-3431  

TRAILER SPACE AVAIL-
ABLE: Extra large lots. 
826-5634 or 826-3215. 	rtn 

RATES 
CLASSIFIED RATES 

All classified ads must be 
paid in advance, except for 
open ledger account cus-
tomers. 

Charges are 13 cents per 
word. Minimum charge is 
51.30. 

Card of Thanks charges 
will be $2.75. 

ADVERTISING 
DEADLINES 

Classifieds: 5:00 p.m. Mon. 
Display: 	5:00 p.m. Mon. 

Phone: 669-3333 
STORM-SCREEN 

WINDOWS 
Permanent year-round protection 
Changeable from inside. Easy tc 
c lean..prowler•proof. Eliminates 
drafts...Cuts fuel bills..,.  

WHEELER LUMBER CO. 
Phone 826-5543 Wheeler, Tex. 

t=ine Service for Fine People 

112 W. Kingsmill 

Pampa, Texas 

Let Me Write It . . . 	rc  CUSTOM DRAPERIES 
Swags, Cornices, Shutters 

GEO. RICHARDSON 	—WE INSTALL FREE — 

All
Telephon•.: 256-3652 

Types Of 
INSURANCE 	Brannons Decorators 

Shamrock, Texas 79079 
Leona Glen 

By Lowell Insley 
Attorney for the Estate 



Residence Phone 
806-826-3210 

Monitoring Channel 21 
"Bear Balt" 

JOHNSON 
Tire Service 

24 hr. call Jack Johnson 
806 Alan Bean 

Wheeler, Texas 79096 

CEILING FANS 
WINTER & Energy Savers 
SUMMER 

THE PARLOR FAN by FASCO 
Reversable Air 
Variable Speed 

Large Selection of Colors 
5 Year Warranty 
ENCON FANS 

42", 48" & 56" Blades 
Choice of 3 Colors 
5 Year Warranty 

Light Fixtures for Both 
FASCO & ENCON FANS 
1980 Prices Good as Long 

As Supply Last 
CONTACT 

E.M. Rives 
806/256-5250 

Twitty, Tex. 79090 

Betty Rives 
OT 	 806/826-3224 

Wheeler, Texas 79096 

NUMB ARMS, LEGS 
Danger Signals 

There may be misalignment of vertebras in 
the spine causing pressure on nerves, yet the 
patient experiences no pain in the back. 
Instead, a variety of sensations may be felt 
in other parts of the body. These include 
tingling, tightness, hot spots, cold spots, 
crawling sensations, electric shock sensa-
tions. stinging, burning, and others. 

Here are nine critical symptoms involving 
back pain or strange sensations which are 
usually the forerunners of more serious con-
ditions. Any one of these usually spells back 
trouble. 

(1) Paresthesias (see above) (2) Headaches 
(3) Painful joints 14) Numbness in the arms 
or hands (5) Loss of sleep (6) Stiffness in the 
neck (7) Pain between the shoulders (8) Stiff-
ness or pain in lower back (9) Numbness or 
pain in the legs. 

These signals indicate that your body is being robbed of 
normal nerve function. Until this function is restored, 
you will, in some degree, be incapacitated. The longer 
you wait to seek help, the worse the condition will be-
come. Don't wait! Should you experience any of these 
dahger signals ... call for in depth consultation in Lay-
man's terms. 

itaydon aitoptactic Clinic 
103 East 28th Street & Perryton Pky. 

PAMPA, TEXAS 79065 

TELEPHONE 806-665.7261 

Don't 
miss 
your 
calling. 

ALLLINES 

LEWALLEN 
INSURANCE AGENCY 

845-2951 
lit STATE Br. Bum. 

GMT I E.Trx. 

11111',;  

YOUR  
ilSalne AOC NT 

•47:2 • 7. mit 

826f5719 
114 TE SS ST.  

WHEELER , Tx 

110 W. Oklahoma 
Phone: 82(-3241 

L and F 
REPAIR 
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doing pretty good. 
Saturday Alice Bell was 

going to her grand-daughter's 
wedding shower, Karen Hel- 

and Hoyle Helton and Kathy. 
News From Last Week 

Sue Ratcliff and Mandy 
went to Pampa Thursday to 
doctor, ate lunch with Mrs. 
Robert Ratcliff and took her 
shopping. 

J. P. and Martha Meek, Jay 
Phil and Shawn ate supper 
with Lyn and Suzanne Sims 
and Shane in Mobeetie. 

There was a party for the 
Gageby church young folks at 

Continued Cal-mr 

Realtythe of Southwest 
• Two Storage 

on Hwy. 152. 
'HOUSE W/1 Acre of land 
city utilities & city water.  

Along with nice orchard. 
Priced to sell. 

NEWLY LISTED 
Superior condition — 3 
Bedrooms, 1 1/2  baths, large 
family room w/built-in book 
cases. Lot 300 ft. deep, 
landscaped, with work shop 
in back — Good Value. 
County Living on Five acres 
W/2600 sq. ft. House. 2 
Water Wells and Commer-
cial Barn. Priced to sell. 

Barns located  

Easy to Love 
This cozy two bedroom 

house on Commanche is 
too-oo Easy To Love. It has 
a lovely price also. Come in 
and see us about it. 
investment Property - Still 
remaining 2 - 100' x 150' 
lots. 

THE SECRET 
Owner's moving & must sell 
their 2 bedroom, 1 bath, 
large utility, centeral heat, 
two car garage. An Afford-
able Home. 

WE NEED YOUR LISTINGS! 

806'`826-5202-Office 
826-3283-Home 

John Norman, Broker 
Don Rives, Salesman ENGAGEMENT 

ANNOUNCEMENT 

Special Purchase 	Just Arrived! 
Ladies Spring Shoes 

Armes  

Famous Name Brands at reasonable prices 

Mr. and Mrs. V. C. Webb of 
Mobeetie wish to announce 
the engagement and ap-
ptoaching marriage of their 
daughter, Lallie Elaine Webb 
of Amarillo to Eddie Keith 
Wynn, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Eddie W. Wynn of Amarillo. 

Miss Webb is a 1976 grad-
uate of Lefors High School. 
Attended West Texas State 
University and was an active 
member of Alpha Kappa Psi, a 
professional business frater-
nity at WT. She graduated 
December 1979 with a Bache-
lor of Business of Administra-
tion Degree. Since that time 
she has been employed with 
Daimond Shamrock Corporat-
ion in Amarillo, Tekas. 

Mr. Wynn is a 1977 
graduate of Amarillo High 
School, Amarillo, Texas, since 
then he has been a sales 
represenative for Allied Tires. 

The couple plan a March 21 
wedding to be held at the 
Central Church of Christ in 
Amarillo. 

Examples: 
Connie 
Easy Street 
Naturalizer 
Joyce 
Johansen 
Amano 

Vetolii Parker 
We welcome Lou Dean 

Douthit back to her old stomp- 
ing ground. Hope she and 
Kenneth are happy here now 
as we will be having them 
around again. 

Thursday 5 our daughter 
Zetha Dougherty came this 
afternoon visited us. 

Friday afternoon, Marylu 
Markham just called me, told 
me about her new grand-
daughter. George and Debbie 
Markham has a new baby girl 
born last night little after 12 
midnight, they named her 

• Haley Lyn, she weighed 8 lbs. 
and I forgot the ounces. She 
was welcomed by 2 brothers, 
Brian and Monty. Bob and 
Marylu Markham and Lewis 
and Reta Grayson are the 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Lawrence Aderholt are great 
grandparents. Mother and 
baby were doing ok in Wheeler 
hospital. 

Nelson and Gaye Parker and 
Christine came by Saturday 

• afternoon picked Colie up they 
went to Perryton to visit the 
Weldon Parkers and helped 
Weldon Saturday. 

Bill and Mattie Jackson 
shopped in Wheeler Thursday. 

Mattie said her neighbor, 
Mrs. Jack Brooster went to 

IP Lawton, Oklahoma to have 
surgery, Jack is a teacher at 
Briscoe. 

Gena Zybach attended Jess 
Bessire funeral Friday after-
noon in Canadian. He passed 
away Tuesday. 

Steve Zybach's full blood 
limousin bull won 1st in his 
class in World Futurity in Sue 

• Fall, South Dakato last Tues-
day. 

He is gone now to take a bull 
to North Platt, Nebraska. 

Evelyn Meek went to Sayre, 
Oklahoma Friday to dentist, 
she went by Wheeler, Fannie 
Mae Bradstreet and Jewell 
Holloman went with her. 

Last Tuesday Mark and 
Annette Meek and Kaleb 

• visited Helen Helton. 
Friday night Cloid and 

Teresa Helton and Amber ate 
supper with her. 

Saturday morning, February 
7th it don't seem so cold but 
sure looks like we could get 
some snow today. 

Tom and Alice Bell Helton, 
went to Borger visited Jim an 
Lois Johnson ate dinner with 

• • them. 
They visited Mrs. Lawrence 

Aderholt in rest home there, 
Duane Hayes was also there 
visiting, Mrs. Aderholt was 

Our Low Price 
$16.95 

19.95 
25.95 
14.95 
29.95 
29.95 

Regular Price 
$31.98 

35.95 
39.99 
25.99 
62.00 
72.00 

Plus many, many more! ! ! 

Also many of our new Spring Fashion Dresses, Blouses, 
Skirts. Childrens clothes, etc. are here. 

FINAL CLOSEOUT on all WINTER STOCK! 
3 for 1 SHOE SALE. FASHIONS reduced 75% 

From 
Court 	Page 4 COUNTRY 

BRISCOE 
Chuck and Phoebe Heartline, 
Thursday nite. Some there 
were Darren and Christy Hef-
ley, Kevin Ratcliff, Keith 
Meek, Sharon and Dennis 
Sumpter, Jay Phil and Shawn 
Meek, Mona and Shirley 
Sumpter. 

More on the Shela and 
Doyles baby boy, he was 
named James Carroll, and he 
weighed 8 pounds and 7 
ounces, born January 27. 

Roberta Signs folks from 
Tyron, Oklahoma spent the 
week with them. 

Steve Collins spent the 
weekend with Kevin Ratcliff, 
Tina Lehman spent weekend 
with Melody Ratcliff, 
Rick Brentmeyer family were 

supper guest in the Chrles 
Crownover home Thursday. 

Wellington 
East Side Square 

Childress 
212 Commerce Visa and Mastercard Accepted Mobeetie Jr. Hi. 

Take Victories 

HEAR 
Evangelist in R R 

Preaching 
the Word ivi  

Mobeetie Junior High girls 
beat Briscoe 36-30 for their 
fourth district win to remain 
tied with Kelton for first place. 
Final district game was Mon-
day against Allison. Debbie 
Darnell led the girls with 12 
pts. and Tins Densberger had 
10 pts. Tammy Gilmer had 15 
pts for the losers. 

Mobeetie boys took Briscoe 
55-32. This was the second 
win in District for the boys and 
left them in third place in 
district. Their final district 
game was played at Allison 
Monday night. 

The district tournament for 
Mobeetie, Kelton, Briscoe and 
Allison begins tonight in Bris-.  
coe. The tornament will con-
tinue through Saturday. If the 
winner is different than the 
round robin winner there will 
be a playoff Monday, February 
16. 

When the phone rings, answer it. No matter where 
you are. In the bath, back yard, even next door. 

The totally portable Freedom Phone" from Electra 
goes where you go. There's no cord to tie you down. 
So you can take-or place- calls anywhere around 
the home or office. 

In addition, the Freedom Phone" has features you 
won't get from an ordinary telephone. 

Our Freedom Phone it 3000 model gives you an 
up-front volume control, and automatic re-dial. A 
one-way paging system from the base station to 
the receiver location. And a "secure-  feature that 
prevents outside access to your telephone line. 

Come in today. And test-dial the Freedom Phone h 
3000 from Electra. 

First St Bk Mobeetie 11-28-80 
2.496 ac 7 Blk RE 
2D--Vera Tepe & Velma Tepe 
Carver to Opal Tepe Wright & 
Walter L Worley Jr, 10-1-80 
Lots 3 to 6 Blk 11 Shamrock 
RELEASE FED TAX LIEN--
United States of Amer to Dana 
R Keesee 12-12-80 
D--C D Rochell et ux to 
Columbus Bryant, Jr 1-29-81 
NSOft El0Oft Lot 3 Blk 11 
Shamrock, Bowers Addn 

• D--Yvonne Sivage to Bonnie 
Sivage et al 11-28-80 SE% & 
W1/2  NE% 56 A-8 
D--Garth Wrinkle et al to 
James Vise et al 1-27-81 SE% 
81 A-S exc 10109 ac & Exc 
Mins 
MD--Garth Wrinkle et al to 
James Vise et al 1-27-81 1 ac 
int SE'/, 81 A-5 exc 1010 ac 

ea- 	FEBRUARY 6, 1981 
DT--James Vise et al to Cana-
dian Prod Cre Assn 1-27-81 
SE% 81 A-5 exc 10.09 ac 
D--Tony Garcia et ux to Will-
iam H Terry et ux 2-5-81 
140'x150' 37 Blk 17 
2 OL--Steve Huff et al to 
Colorado Interstate GAs Co 
11-10-80 Sec 33 A-3 
ROW--Edith Sims to Perry Gas 

% 	Transmission, Inc 1-22-81 Sec 
17 A-5 
2 AOL--Natural Gas Anadarko, 
Inc to Joseph S Gruss et al 
6-2-80 Sec 77 A-5 
ROL--Arkla Exploration Co to 
Dudley R Stanley et ux 1-19-81 
NEVI 50 Blk A-3 
RDT--Golden Light Eq Co to 
Odessa Mooney undated and 

(11 	no land set out 
D--Ben T Griffin to Wheeler 
Co-Op 2-5-81 330'x1320' Sec 5 
A-4 exc Mins 
DT--Wheeler Co-Op to First 
Nati Bk in Wheeler 2-6-81 
330'x1320' Sec 5 A-4 exc Mins 
DED D--William Grant Cope-
land et ux to The Public 2-6-81 
E40' SW'A 90 Blk 13 
DISTRICT CLERK'S OFFICE 
#7873 Jack Winter Apparel Inc 
vs Barbara Yarborough et al 
2-2-81 Suit on Debt 
#7879 Cora Beth Smith vs 
Richard Wayne Smith Jr, 
2-5-81 Suit on Support 

MENU 
February 16-20, 1981 

MONDAY: Breakfast; Oat-
meal, Toast, Juice, Milk. 
Lunch; Hamburger Steak, 
Macaroni & Tomatoes, Feench 
Fries, Roll, Milk. 
TUESDAY: Breakfast; Cin-
namon Roll, Juice, Milk. 
Lunch; Vegetable Soup, Grill-
ed Cheese Sandwich, Pickles, 
Milk. 
WEDNESDAY: Breakfast; 
Sausage, Biscuit, Honey, 
Juice, Milk. 
Lunch; Shrimp, Onion Rings, 
Macaroni & Cheese, Texas 
Toast, Milk. 
THURSDAY: Breakfast; Blue-
berry muffins, Juice, Milk. 
Lunch; Becf & Macaroni Cas-
serole, Fried Okra, Tossed 
Salad, Roll, Milk. 
FRIDAY: Breakfast; Rolled 
Wheat Cereal, Toast, Juice, 
Milk. 
Lunch; Ham & Beans, Cole-
slaw, Hush Puppies, Milk. 

Christ is the Answer 
CRUSADE 

COMING TO WHEELER 
FEB. 17-22 	Nightly at 7:30 

Also Ministering in Music 
Wanda Jackson 	Royalheirs 

ton and Randy Cromer in 
Wheeler. 

Thursday 5th was Irene 
Zybach's birthday. So Happy 
belated Birthday to Irene. 

Thursday morning, Rozena 
Zybach, Melody Goad, Gaye 
Purcell, Johua and April visit-
ed Clarence and Irene. 

Friday night Clarence and 
Irene went to Sayre, Thurman 
and Bettie and Stephany Zy-
bach took them out to eat at 
the Stables ;n Sayre, to cele-
brate Irene's birthday, they 
went back to Truman and 
Betties, ate ice cream and 
cake. 

Jane Kiker and Gladys Kik-
er also visited Clarence and 
Irene. Jane and Gladys went 
by Clarendon and spent the 
nite with Bill Wise and family 
on way home. 

Ruby Zubach and Essie 
Finsterwald attended a Valen-
tine luncheon Saturday, the 
theme was love, there was a 
wonderful meal, singing, it 
was at the church of Christ in 
Shamrock. Several towns were 
represented, 115 	women 
there. 

Saturday night Elbert and 
Ruby Zybach, David and 
Becky and children, Curtis and 
Jane Ann Hall and Kent 
visited R. L. and Rozena 
Zybach and saw their new 
house. 

Sunday afternoon guest at 
Elbert and Rubys were Vern 
and Susie Lohberger. 

Weekend visitors at the 
Colie Parkers were Ted and 
Scotty Parker, Garry Parker, 
Randy and Sheridon, Leroy 
and Janice Parker, Angie, Lee, 
Susie, Katie from Dumas, 
Nelson and Gaye Parker and 
Christine, Lee's friend Teddy. 

Sunday night Weldon and 
Diana Parker and Marianda 
and Michelle to spend the 
night with us. 

Happy Birthday to Mattie 
Jackson, February 16 and 
Tommy Clark. 

Tolmage and Shirley Fillin-
gim from Providence, Utah 
came Thursday visiting Willis 
and Verna Fillingim and other 
relatives, stayed till Sunday. 
Others at Willis and Verna 
Saturday wer E. G. and Willa 
Fillingim, Boyce Crownover, 
Gayle, Andy, and Randy Sin-
gleton, J. P. and Martha 
Meek, Jai,  Phil and Shawn, 
Horace and Juanita Fillingim, 
Bonnie Maddox and girls, 
Lawrence Fillingim, Dick and 
Ruth Irvine, Sharron, and 
Stephany and Rick, Dan and 
Rita Fillingim and children, 
Evelyn Meek, Mrs. Velma 
Boren, Macky and Linda Sides 
and children. 

Evelyn Meek and Frances 
Hefley attended a concert in 
Shamrock Sunday and visited 
Mrs. Elmer Simpson and 
others at the rest home. 

Briscoe Broncos won both 
games with Samnorwood Fri-
day night at Briscoe, so con-
gratulations. 

Wayne and Tola Fay Meek, 
Keith and Kevin went to 
Guymon Satiirday to a hog 
breeding show and sale. 

Rick Bruntmeyer family 
shopped in Elk city Sunday 
and got Regena's glasses. 

Tuesday supper guest at 
Willis and Vernas were Law-
rence Fillingim, Vick and 
Darla Eubanks. 

Wednesday at Willis and 
Vena were Birdell Roberts, 
Carolyn Gregg, James and 
Bea Ogle and girls. 

A baby shower Saturday 14 
at Briscoe cafeteria at 2 p.m. 
for Carolyn (Gilmer) Douglas. 
everyone is invited. 

Saturday afternoon, Jimmy 
and Joann Helton, Tammie, 
Todd and Jason ate supper 
with Helen Helton. 

Sunday Mark and Annette 
Meek and Kaleb came home 
with Helen ate dinner and 
visited. 

Jimmy and Todd was back 
out Sunday. 

All of Cecil and Emma Jean 
Meadows children were here 
over the weekend. Her sister 
Richard and Leona Miller from 
Eakly, Oklahoma came Friday 
visited till Sunday afternoon. 

Sunday night Cecil and 
Emma Jean visited Mrs. Allen 
Meadows and Zane and Mar-
garette Frances in Wheeler. 

Mrs. Vernon Sivage was on 
the sick list Monday with a bad 
cold still a lot of sickness 
around. 

Monday morning not so cold 
around freezing cloudy, maybe 
snow today. 

Visitors at Travis and Rosa-
lee Keelin Sunday were Joey 
and Risa Keelin and children, 
Gene and Norma Keelin and 
Daniel. 

Oden Hudson said his dad, 
Lester was doing real well, but 
not quite able to come home 
yet. 
'Gwen Manning spent week 

with her grandparents, J.O. 

PreedomPhone 3000 
2 Other Freedon Phone Models Available 

(Feb. 17. Only) 
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AK,  

COLD MEDICINE 

VICK'S NYQUIL 
6oz $199  
BTL.  

'47`a 

VICK'S FORMULA 44 

COUGH SYRUP 
VICK'S FORMULA 44.D COUGH 	$ 

SYRUP 
• 7  30, 

BT. 	 BTL. 

59 

COLORADO 

20 LB. 
BAG 

49` 
LB 39` 
LB 29` 

C EACH. 
18.39c 

LBS. 
RUSSET ALL PURPOSE 

-.POTATOES 

S 59 SHURFINE 

FRUIT 2 si  
COCKTAIL 46z   
SHURFINE 
HALVES 

PEARS 
DEL MONTE 

2 16 oz. $1 
Cans 

ti 

PINEAPPLE 
SLICED In Juice 

POST CEREAL 

HONEY 14 oz 	49 COMB  Box 

v.:. 
MM: VICK' 

DECONGESTANT 

S SINEX SPRAY 
OZ 

BTL 	

$ 1 49 

VAPORIZING 
 VICK'S VAPORUB 

$119 1 5 OZ 
JAR 

16 oz. .'
Cans 	1 

80z. $1 
Cans 

SPAM 

12 oz. $ 29 
Can 

WASHINGTON WINESAP FANCY 

APPLES 
CALIFORNIA SUNKIST 

LEMONS 
TEXAS PURPLE TOP 

TURNIPS 	 
SUGARLOAF 

PINEAPPLE 

 

lGGREEN 

CUCUMBERS
SLICERS 

 

HASH 
BROWNS Bag  814 

NICE & soril  
TISSU,ER0ii sp9  

Pkg. 

COKES 
$129 2 Litter 

Bottle 

Whole 

BROASTED 
CHICKEN $389  

SANDWICHES 
B-B-Q 
HAM & CHEESE 
STEAK 

ALL KINDS SALADS 
DINNERS TO GO 

MOUNTAIN WOOD COLLECTION STONEWARE 

SAUCER 
WITH EA. 49. 

55.00 
PURCHASE 

GET YOU VALENTINE 
CANDY HERE 

FOLGER'S 

to MI! 
FLAKED 

$ 1 9 7 
13 OZ. 

CAN 

FROM OUR 
BAKERY 

DONUTS 
ALL KINDS COOKIES 

$189  

COOKIES 
Bit) 1 Doz. Get °70 Doz. FREE 

SPECIALS 

HEAVY GRAIN FED BEEF BONELESS 

CHUCK ROAST 	 LB 

HEAVY GRAIN FED BEEF BONELESS 

CHUCK STEAK 	 
HEAVY GRAIN FED BEEF EXTRA LEAN 

STEW CUBES 	 
OSCAR MAYER REG.:JUMBO 

WIENERS MEAT 

OSACAR MAYER REG. JUMBO 

BEEF FRANKS 	1 LB 
PKG 

OSCAR MAYER SLICED 

VARIETY PAK 	 PKG. 
12 OZ 

OSCAR MAYER 

SMOKIE LINKS 	12 OZ 
PKG 

51 89 

$199 

S199 

69 

$11 79 

$ 1 99 

$ 1 79 

1 LB. 
PKG.  

LB 

LB 

SLICED BACON 910  WRIGHT'S HICKORY SMOKED SLAB 

LB. 

919 	LB. 
STAR KIST 

TUNA 

61/2 oz 1 09  

YOUR THRIFTWAY STORES SELL 
FEATURE ONLY FINE DUALITY 

AMERICAN GROWN GRAIN FED BEEF 
FRESH PORK B. QUALITY POULTRY.  

LIPTON 

TEA BAGS 

$129  
Chunk 
Light 

48 Ct. 
Box 

Can 

qt go 	CENTRAL AMERICAN 

GOLDEN 
BANANAS 

'MORE FOR YOUR MONEY t4 4.4 VAVAVAVA 
TOTAL 

SAVER .4„ 

Let Thriftway By Your Sweet Heart With These Valentine Food Specials 

3  151/2  OZ. 
CANS 

BUSH'S BEST CUT 
GREEN 
BEANS 

es, 	a 	i!ifill*"°41IN"ct"Neb.--\11.11111,- 4  
GUARANTEED 73% LEAN FRESHI 

GROUND 
BEEF 

YOUR CHOICE OSCAR MAYER SLICED 
LIVER CHEESE/OLIVE LOAF/ 

SALAMI/PICKLE 8 PIMIENTO LOAFI 

LUNCHEON MEATS 

ao, 	19  
PKG 

SHURFINE 
Whole Kernel or Cream Style 

16 oz. $1 
Cans 

16 oz. $ 
Cans 

4 16 oz. 
Cans 

$1 
3 

16 oz. *IP I 
Cans 

SHURFINE 

SWEET 
PEAS 
HUNT'S 

TOMATO 4 
SAUCE 

DAIRY SPECIALS 	 FROZEN FOOD FROZEN FOOD SPECIALS 

A 
SHURFINE 

20 oz. Bags 

VICK'S DAY CARE 

6 °' $209  BTL. 

I I PRICES EFFECTIVE 
FEB. 12-14, 1981 

TOMATOES 

3 

SHURFINE CUT 

GREEN 
BEANS 
SHURFINE 
Whole Peeled 

CORN 3 
SHURFINE 

PORK & 4 
BEANS 

NyUUII 

WE ACCEPT 
FOOD STAMPS 

HEALTH & BEAUTY AID 

DIPS and 	2 /9 0 A 

SOUR CREAM we 
4 

CHEESE 24 oz $129 Cut  
BROCOLLI 99c 

BORDEN'S 	 CHEF 

BUTTERMILK 98 SALUTO 

BORDEN'S 

COTTAGE 

BORDEN'S 	
Ctn. 

WITH DECONGESTANT ACTION 

VICK'S INHALERS 

EACH 

129 

1/2  Gal. 	PIZZ 

	 FRENCHF  BREADE  
$179 BUYGT

1
T:E FREE 

FROM OUR DELI 
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