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Bentley, Snapp Named All State • 
The Texas High School sports 

writers have released their selections 
for the 1984 Class lA All State football 
team. Included on the second team 
from Wheeler are Steven Snapp at a 
defensive back position and Wade 

in Bi-District and the Wheeler Mus-
tangs in regional placed only one 
player on the elite team. 

Snapp at 6' 175 pounds, started at 
quarterback for the Mustangs for 
three years and was a 1983 and 1984 

All-District selection at that position. 
He was instrumental in the 1984 
Wheeler effort that ended with their 
17-20 loss to eventual state champion 
Munday in the regional playoff. 

Bentley was one of the leaders of 
the Wheeler defensive unit that shut 
out 8 opponents in 1984. He was a 
unamious 2 year All-District selection 
at both offensive guard and lineback-
er. At 6'1" and 190 Bentley led the 
Mustang special teams with his 
aggressive and dominant play. 

Bentley and Snapp were the only 
district 1-lA players selected. Naza-
ret t. a victim of Wheeler's 1984 
"Black Death" shut-out string placed 
two players on the All-State team in 
running back Chris Gerber and defen-
sh e back Ricky Backus. 

Bentley at linebacker. Paradise the 
number one rated Class A team 
during most of the 1984 season led the 
selection process with four players on 
the first team. The 1984 State Champ-
ion Munday which defeated Paradise 
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M. Andis, SPS Manager, 
Named "Outstanding" 

01 

SWEARING IN: M. Kent Sims and 
Harrison Hall are shown here taking 
the oath of office. the Oath is being 
administered by Co. Judge Wendell 
Morgan (left). The two men will be 

- serving on the Wheeler County Water 

Marshall Andis, local manager in 
Wheeler for Southwestern Public 
Service Company (SPS), has been 
named the electric utility's "Out-
standing Manager" for 1984, in 
communities with populations of 1,100 
to 1,999. 

He was recognized by SPS at the 
company's Annual Marketing Meet-
ing held last week in Amarillo. Four 
other SPS managers, who serve in 
communities ranging in size from less 
than 799 people to more than 8,000. 
also were presented "Outstanding 
Manager" plaques by SPS Vice 
President of Marketing Gary Gibson. 

Andis also won first place awards in 
two SPS "Living Better Electrically" 
marketing contests. No other SPS 
manager won as many as three 
awards this year, Gibson reported. 

Andis has been manager for SPS in 
Wheeler since June I, 1982. He first 
worked for the company in 1958, as a 
groundsman at Lubbock. He became a 
lineman journeyman in 1962. Begin-
ning in 1966, Andis worked for 
another utility, in New Mexico. He 
returned to SPS in March 1972 as a 
lineman journeyman in Pampa, then 
transferred to Wheeler in September 
1973. He became a serviceman in 
Wheeler in 1973, seven years before 
his promotion to manager. 

Southwestern Public Service Com-
pany primarily provides electric ser-
vice to a population of more than one 
million in southwestern Kansas, the 
Panhandle of Oklahoma, the Panhan-
dle and south plains of Texas, and 
eastern and souitheastern New Mex-
ico. 

Local Theatre Will 
Re-open In Near Future 

Wheeler Basketball 

Supply District Board. Kent was 
re-appointed to the board by the 
County Commissioners and Harrison 
was named to represent the City of 
Wheeler; Hall was elected chairman 
by his fellow board members. 0. B. 
"Pete" Burton watches as the two 
men take the oath; Burton, retiring 
board chairman, asked to be replaced 
with the expiration of his term. The 
oath was taken Thursday, January 10, 
at the regular meeting of the board. Colts Win Shamrock Tourney 

This past weekend could be classi-
fied as a time of travel. I left by auto 
Thursday morning—after "coffee" at 
Guthrie's— for the Texas Press 
Convention in Ft. Worth, stopping in 
Wellington to pick up a traveling 
campanion, Henry Wells. editor of the 

' Wellington Leader. We arrived at our 
destination in the late afternoon. 

An early "wake up" call was 
necessary Friday in order to catch the 
7:40 a.m. flight to Austin. Harrison 
Hall, Mack Wofford, Douglas 0. V. 

• Rives had boarded the 6:30 flight from 
' Amarillo; I joined them at Dallas Love 
Field. We made a "fact finding" trip 

,and returned on the afternoon flight 
and it was back to Ft. Worth. 

A lot of new materials and equip-
ment were on exhibit at the convent-
ion. Some of it I would have no use 
for, but the rest would certainly be 
nice if money was no object. 

I parked the car in the hotel 
garage and didn't get out by myself, 
since you know how I am when I try to 
drive in the "big city". I was 
wondering what "unusual" event I 
was going to tell you about this week 
when it happened. 

The Americana Hotel is located in 
downtown Ft. Worth and covers a 2 
block area—the hotel's mezzanine is' 
above the street. In the far corner of 
the building, near the vaccant meet-
ing rooms and blocks away from 
anyone are the elevators which carry 
the people from the different levels of 
the parking garage to the mezzanine 
level. 

Have you ever wondered what your 
reaction would be if you were stuck on 
an elevator? I had and I don't have to 
any more. 

In the trip to the car—to make sure 
it was still there—both elevators 
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A final agreement was reached 
Tuesday for the purchase of the local 
movie theatre by Christain Center. 
The theatre has been closed since last 
November, but will now be reopened 
with a new name, "Manna Theatre". 
All of the projection equipment neces-
sary for the showing of regular theatre 
movies has been retained in order to 
show movies, but additional equip-
ment is being installed that will 
enable theatre-goers to watch "live" 
satellite concerts with well-known 
gospel singers and entertainers such 
as Glenn Campbell and Johnny Cash. 
A satellite dish is being placed at the 
theatre along with a special projector 
that receives the signal and enlarges it 
to project onto the 25 foot theatre 
screen. 

It has also been announced that 
community gospel singings featuring 
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Dorothy McIlhany 
Alvin Sellers 
Ray Dial 
O.W. Pendleton 

4#  Family History Deadline Has Been Extended 

The undefeated Wheeler Colt Boys 
Basketball team won the Shamrock Jr. 
High tournament last weekend defeat-
ing the Childress Bobcats 40 to 27 in 
the finals. the Colts started out slow 
leading the Bobcats 17-14 at the half. 
but increased their lead to 40 to 21 in 
the fourth quarter. Bubba Smith led 
all scoring with 20 points, followed by 
Sammy Zepeda with 11. and Cory 
Cornett scored 7. 

The Wheeler Colts played White 
Deer Bucks in the first game defeating 
them 45 to 36. The Colts played good 
in the first half scoring 35 points to the 
Bucks 24. The Colts widen their lead 
to 44-26 after the third. Leading the 
Colts in scoring was Bubba Smith with 
19, Shane Guest and Sammy Zepeda 
had 8 each, and Cory Cornett scored 
7. 
Smith led the Colts in rebounds with 
12 followed by Jonathan Ellisor with 
8. 

The Colts played Memphis 8th 
Friday night and won 41 to 36. Bubba 
Smith scored 24 points, Sammy 
Zepeda had 8, and Jonathan Ellisor 
scored 4. Wheeler shot poor form the 
free throw line missing 23 times. If the 
Colts would had made half of their 
attempts there would have been no 
contest. 

future generations. 
Copies will be sold for $37.50 plus 

sales tax $1.92(for Texas residents 
only) add $2.50 for postage and 
handling if you wish it to be mailed. 
Otherwise books will be available at a 
convenient location in the County 
Shamrock Pioneer Museum. Make 
checks payable to Pioneer West 
Museum. Mail to Pioneer West 
Museum Box 101 Shamrock Texas, 
79079. 

It isn't too late to write your 
Family History to be published in the 
Wheeler County History Book. 

Five hundred words and one picture 
free. Extra words $0.10 per word, 
typewritten on 81/2  x11 paper double-
spaced. 

New and older Residents, if you 
have lived anywhere at anytime in 
Wheeler County. 3 or 75 years 
inbetween, your history is needed to 
make the Book complete. 

Even if your parents have submit-
ted a history, we need yours too. 

Anything that is or was meaningful 
or influenced your lifestyle, names 
and events you wish to be remember-
ed will be a welcome contribution. 

With your help we can make this 
Book an interesting, colorful, exciting 
and up to date account of Life in 
Wheeler County then and now. You 
will have a great part in preserving 
history and be proud to pass it on to 

Services Held For 
Clinton G. Frye 

KELTON 

Volleyball Tournament 
Kelton Volleyball Tournament, 

March 7-8-9, sponsored by Kelton 
Junior Class. No entry fee, pay only at 
the gate. Men's teams only. For more 
information or to enter tournament 
call Teresa Moore 256-2934 or Lacy 
Buckingham 826-5250 or write Kelton 
School, c/o Lisa Charton, Rt. 1, Box 
157, Wheeler. 

Edna Owen 
Bessie Baird 
C.C. Baird 

1-18 	Jewell Leonard 
1-20 	Shane Francis 

Margaret Heide 
Jess Patterson 

1-21 	James Walker 
NEW ADMISSIONS: 
1-22 	011ie Jaco 

Bernice Farmer 
Brooks McLaughlin 
Willie Morris 
Jessica Hudson 
Dianna Garza 
Joyce Maifield 
Candee Atwood 

1-23 	Levi Reid 
Bynum Smith 
J. D. Beaty 
Andy Thornton 
Troy Bradstreet 

1-24 	David Snapp 
Diana Hudson 
Lorena Adams 
Ray Presley 
David Hamilton 
Florence George 
Kyndal Murray 
Marylu Markham 

1-25 	Ruby Pendleton 
Violet Knight 
Gail Snapp 
Joe Ellison 
Norma Thornton 
Edna Wright 

1-26 	Maria Garcia 
Russell Phipps 

1-27 	William Crutchfield 
Barbara Stuart 
Bob Markham 
Lester Slaten 
Jennie Slaten 
John Wallace 
Trent Copeland 
Jayme Copeland 
Earl Meadows 
Jack Davis 
Daisey Bailey 
Lacey Smith 

1-28 

Dimissals 
1-22 

Wheeler County Citizens lose twice 
in ninety days, two facilities, one 
providing some capacity of recreation 
(Rogue Theatre) for the youth and 
adults, the other a future source of 
much needed water and possibly later 
recreational area. 

Some eight or nine years ago 
Wheeler appeared similar to many 
other small towns that more or less 
have become ghost towns. For sonic 
of them a loaf of bread requires a trip 
of some magnitude. It appears Whee-
ler is destined to become another 
Briscoe, Mobeetie, or other semi-
ghost town in the Panhandle. This is 
very sad for the past five to seven 
years most of the businesses and 
many homes did a facelift in our town. 
People were proud of Wheeler and 
enjoyed the prosperity brought by the 
Petroleum Industry whose money 
re-suscitated this small farm commun-
ity for a short time. The money spent 
in Wheeler was very welcome, all 
enjoyed the much higher than usual 
cash flow. However the human ele-
ment which came with the prosperous 
years was resented by many of the 
local citizens (sad).Maybe the nega-
tive attitude toward progress of any 
kind in our town prevails (I hope not). 
Perhaps our town will suffer again for 
awhile and hopefully survive till 
something restores the much needed 
progress and economics to the area. 

In the loss of the Rogue Theatre and 
the Sweetwater Creek Dam Project, 
you can be assured there were no 
winners in either, only losers, the 
Wheeler County residents and espec-
ially the younger generations, who 
will pay and suffer for present 
selfishness and ignorance. 

T.G. Rcames 

1-23 

Mr. Clinton G. Frye, 75. died 
Sunday, Nov. 18, 1984 in a Texas 
Hospital. 

Services were held on Wed., Nov. 
21, 1984 at 11:30 A.M. in Gross 
Funeral Home Chapel in Hot Springs, 
Ark. Rev. James Bates, officiated. 
Burial was in Greenwood Cementary 
in Hot Springs, Ark. 

Mr. Frye was a retired Founder and 
President of American Dusting Com-
pany, located in Chickasha, Okla. Mr. 
Frye was of Baptist faith.He was 
preceeded in death by his wife, the 
late Dovie Blanton Frye. 

Survivors include one son;Ray Frye 
of Hereford, Texas; 3 daughters 
Barbara N. Frye of Allison, Texas, 
Virginia Newell of Hot Springs, Ark., 
Patricia Frye of Oakwood, Calif., one 
sister; Mrs. R. W. Wilson of Hemitt, 
Calif., six grandchildren, and five 
great- grandchildren. 

Pallbearers were:George McDonald 
Doyle Hargrove, Joe Nichols, Mike 
Newell, Jerry White, Ronnie Reiter. 
Honorary Pallbearers were: Lonnie 
Bates, Carroll Bates, Dewane Bates, 
Gordon Bates. Melvin Hooks. 

Wallace Robinson 
Rites Are Read 

1-24 
3500 x 60 foot landing strip located 
41/2  miles cast of Wheeler and 
replaces the old Holt Field located at 
the northeast corner of the city. 

1-2.5 

1-26 

Dean's Honor Roll 
Murray State College is releasing 

the names of area students who 
qualified for the Fall 1984 semester 
Dean's Honor Roll. To be named to 
the honor roll a student must be 
enrolled in at least 12 college hours 
and make no grade less than a "B." 
Students named to the honor roll from 
this area include:Karen K. Killings-
worth, Wheeler, Veterinary Tech-
nology. 

Wallace Robinson, 94, died re-
cently in Sunray. 

Mr. Robinson was born in Milam 
County and moved to Sunray 30 years 
ago from Wheeler County where he 
had been a farmer until his retire-
ment. He lived on the farm called the 
Old Pruit place and raised his family 
here. His children all graduated from 
the Mobeetie School. 

Survivors include a son; Leroy of 
Sunray. six daughters; lna Faye 
Harris of Huntsville, Alva Elsie 
Gilliam of Midland. Melba Leonard of 
Amarillo, Evelyn Nanning of Fritch, 
Jolene Hall of Vega and Gaye Harp of 
Sunray. a sister; Ferral McBee of 
Bramer Mo., Twenty-One grandchild-
ren and fifteen great grandchildren. 

1-27 
1-28 

Immunization Clinic 
Free Immunization Clinic sponsor-

ed by the Texas Department of 
Health, Wednesday, February 6, 
1985, from 10:00a.m. to 1:00 p.m., in 
the Wheeler High School Auditorium. 
T. B. testing, as well as, routine 
immunizations will be given. This 
service is free of charge to all 
children. 

Briscoe Ex-Student Meeting 
Briscoe ex-students meeting Sun-

day. Feb. 3. at 2:30 in the Briscoe 
cafeteria. 

ZONING BOARD: As the new 
Wheeler Airport nears completion, a 
number of boards and commissions 
will be formed to comply with the 

A Texas Aeronautics Commission rules 
and regulations. These four men will 
represent the City and County on the 
Airport Zoning Board; (left to right) 
David Crossland, Van Baise were 
appointed by the city council and 
Charles Moore and Tommy Puryear 
were named by the county com-
missioners. These four will select a 
fifth person to serve as chairman. The 

_I/ oath was administered on Monday 
morning by Wheeler City Secretary, 
Mildred Ramsey. The three-year pro-
ject of building the new airport is 
nearly complete with the beacon and 
painting of the airstrip being the only 
two items remained . The new 

Making the All-Tournament team 
was Sammy Zepeda and the most 
valuable player selected was Bubba 
Smith. Wheeler record now stands at 
12-0 for the season. 

WHEELER COLTS STAY 
UNDEFEATED 

The underfeated Colt boys basket-
ball team defeated Mobeetie this 
Monday night 48 to 29 to improve 
their season record to 13-0. The Colts 
open the game with a 13 to 5 lead and 
increased it with a 42 to 17 lead at the 
end of the third quarter. Leading the 
Colts in scoring was Bubba Smith with 
38 and Sammy Zepeda had 5. Leading 
scorer for Mobeetie was Stephen 
Batton with 23 points. Smith led all 
rebounders with 18 for the night. 

The Colts will play their final game 
of the season against Canadians 7th 
and 8th grade. The games will be 
played in both gyms at Wheeler. They 
will start at 5:00 p.m. on February 7, 
1985. 

WHEELER VS. ALLISON 
The Wheeler Varsity teams went to 

Allison last Tues., Jan. 22nd., and 
won both games. The girls won 77 to 
16. Dee Ann Jolly was high point with 
18, Mario Hartman had 16, Melanie 
Williams had 14, Melanie Dutson had 
6, and Renee Hogue had 5. Dee Ann, 
Bridgett Wallace and Mario were all 
100% from the free throw line. 

The Boys won 46 to 33. Paul 
Hartman led the scoring with 14 
points, Larry Trevino and Roger 
Brown each had 9, Steven Snapp had 
8, and Joel Dodd had 6. Paul also led 
with 16, rebounds, Joel had 8, and 
Steven had 5. 

WHEELER VS. SAMNORWOOD 
The Wheeler Varsity Teams played 

Samnonvood here, last Friday, Jan. 
25th. The Girls won 61 to 39. Mario 
Hartman scored 22 points, DeeAnn 
Jolly had 14, Shawna Hampton had 8. 
and Tammy Baker had 6, Mario led 
with 14 rebounds, DeeAnn had 9, 
Melanie Williams and Renee Hogue 
had 6, and Angela Presley had 5. The 
Boys won 69 to 29. Paul Hartman led 
the scoring with 18 points, Steven 
Snapp had 17, Larry Trevino and 
Roger Brown each had 8, and Dale 
Hazel hadd 5. Paul, Dale and Robert 
Andis all had 5 rebounds. 

JR. HIGH GIRLS VS. BRISCOE 
The Wheeler Jr. High Girls 

played at Briscoe last Mon., Jan. 21st, 
and won 42 to 5. Samantha Gaines 
scored 14 points, Marcy Smith had 9, 
Misty Weeks had 9. Amy Ivey and 
Tcra Henderson each had 4. 

JR. HIGH GIRLS IN 
SHAMROCK TOURNAMENT 

The Jr. High Girls won first place in 
the Shamrock Tournament this past 
week-end, Jan. 24-26. In the first 
game they beat White Deer 33 to 16. 
Misty Weeks had 11 points, Marcy 
Smith had 10, and Samantha Gaines 
had 5. In the second game they won 
over Memphis 39 to 32. Misty Weeks 
scored 15 points, Marcy had 10. and 
Tera Henderson had 8. In the champ-
ionship game they beat Childress 32 
to 30. Marcy scored 9 points, Tera and 
Misty each had 6, Samantha and 
Tammy Gallagher each had 4, Misty 
Weeks was on the All-Tournament 
team and Marcy Smith was named 
Most Valuable Player. 

JR. HIGH GIRLS VS. MOBEETIE 
The Jr. High Girls played at 

Mobeetie on Mon., Jan. 28th and won 
51 to 13. Misty Weeks scored 26 
points. Samantha Gaines and Dee Dee 
Dorman each had 6. Marcy Smith had 
4. and Amy Ivey had 3. 

LaDonna Barbour 
Maria Garcia 
Maurine Pierce 
Mary Pitman 
Grace Weatherly 
Mildred Graham 
Leon Green 
Creede McQueen 
Candee Atwood 
Martha Williams 
S. B. Hooker 
Joyce Maifield 
Willie May 
Ricky Franklin 
Bernice Farmer 
Levi Reid 
Troy Bradstreet 
David Snapp 
Kyndal Murray 
Jesse Hefner 
David Hamilton 
Nora Hyatt 
Diana Hudson 
William Mason 
Wanda Garner 
Ruby Pendleton 
Neva McLaughlin 
Joe Ellison 
Diana Garza 
Jessica Hudson 

JAMES BRADLEY MASTERS 
Mom and Dad and big brother Kyle 
Are happy as they can be 
Because I'm the second branch 
On our family tree. 
Parents:James and Belinda Masters 
Born:3:49 P.M. Coronado Hospital 
Name:James Bradley Masters 
Wt.:10 lbs. 11 oz. 
Length:24 inches 
Grandparents:Mr. and Mrs. Ed Holt, 
Cordell; and Mrs. Edgar Masters. 
Cordell. 
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Affiion 
Wanda Winer 

Allison is alive and doing well. It's 
just the reporter that I'm not so sure 
of. Since Christmas there has been a 
variety of viruses that has made their 
rounds. Some people have had each 
one, one right after another. But these 
are strong folks who bounce right 
back. I'm thankful I have staved well. 

Our Young People 

Ronal, Jr., 31/2 , Jessica, 3 
months are the children of 
Ronal Wayne and Juanita 
Stas of Sherman, Texas. 
Grandparents are Louis and 
Barbara Stas of Wheeler. 

• For all your prescription and cosmetic 
needs: 	 Age is "at the time the picture was 

taken" 
• Gift Selections 

for all Occasions 
d 	'1%. 	allst• IS

HYLAND'S 
PHARMACY 

w 	 

MAXEY'S 
STEAKHOUSE 

SUNDAY BUFFET 
Thursday Night 

5:00-10:00 P.M. 

All the Fish, Popcorn 
Shrimp, Onion Rings & 
Hushpuppies you Can 
Eat. 
Served w/Cole Slow, 

French Fries & Hot Rolls 

Roast Beef Au Jus 
Beef Buraandv w/Noodles 

Italian Potatoes 
Fried Okra 

Baked Squash 
Salad Bar 
Hot Rolls 

Coffee/Tea 
Dessert 

Tues.-Sat.-6:30 A.M. - 10:00 PM. 
San.—Noon Buffet (Only) 11:30 - 1:30 

• Closed Monday• 

Phone: 806/826-3441 
1 mile South of Wheeler on U.S. 83 

What's Happening 

at WILS•? 
By Lyndol Loyd 

"900 a week for life?" 

RETIREMENT INCOME life in-
surance that will add hundreds of 
dollars per month to your income at 
age 65 (or other age you choose) —
such insurance is available from 
the Rives Insurance Agency. We 
invite your inquiry. 

RIVES 115 W. Tex. St. 

806 /826-3573 
	•••••111=••••• 

The Allison Extension Homemak-
er's met Wed.. Jan. 23, at 2:00 p.m. 
for their first meeting of the year. 
They noted the 1985 yearbook of 
schelduled speakers and lessons in-
cluding the ones given through the 

year by Linda Daughtry, Wheeler Co. 
Extension Agent. These are always 
very interesting and everyone looks 
forward to them. 

Pastor and Mrs. F.R. Johnson and 
daughter, Gwen, recently visited in 
Houston with their other daughter, 
Becky. Becky married Rev. David 
Lucias here in Allison during the 
severe ice storm we had in December. 
It was a time none of us will forget. 
Getting the wedding party, who flew 
into Amarillo. back to Allison took 
about four hours on the icy roads. The 
bride to be was in tears, but it turned 
out to be a lovely, cozy wedding. 
There was no electricity for the entire 
town. My husband hooked his welding 
truck to the church so we could have 
electricity there to go with the 
candles. Becky and David have decid-
ed to come back to Allison to live for a 
while. They and the Johnsons traveled 
back last week. They have moved into 
the center of Allison in the big white 
house we used to live in. We welcome 
them. 

I spent a weekend in Amarillo 
recently with Eddy's niece and her 
family, Jeanette and Denis Hulse. 
Misty and Preston. Two month old 
Preston is the one born with the rare 
skin disease called epedermolysis 
bullosa or EB. Large blisters form on 
varying parts of the body, mainly 
arms, legs, and head. They then scab 
over, but others form almost constant-
ly. He is fortunate that they do not 
scar, as is possible with this disease. 
It is a noncontagious disease that is 
caused from a certain makeup of 
chromesomes in the parents. Each 

THE 

SHIRT SHACK 
114 East Texas Street 

Wheeler, Texas 

Phone: 826-5719 

Bringing the world 
closer to you... VIEW-MOR 

Satellite TV System 
You can enjoy: 
• Better TV Reception 
• More Programming 

Options 
with the easy-to-use VIEW-
MOR Satellite TV System. In-
cludes dish antenna, re-
ceiver and heavy-duty polar 
mount 

VIEW-MOR 

Prices Start At . . 9 300.00 InstalPiolutison Fee 

For a FREE demonstration, 
contact VISE ENERGY, INC .  

112'2 c. Texas St. 

ee: 18er6'  82.5

Texas

6 e 0 	576 

All Sizes 

L and F 
REPAIR 

Mitsubishi 
20-120 Watts 

110 W. Oklahoma St. 
Phone: 806/826-3241'  
Wheeler, Texas 79096 

Some people once be 
lieved that shooting ar 
rows under a fruit tree 
would cause the fruit to fall 
off the tree just as the ar-
rows fall. 

DONLYN'S RESTAURANT 
West Highway 152 	 Phone: 826-9914 

PIZZA BUFFET LUNCH 
"All you can eat" e  4  

TUESDAY ONLY 	'Pa 
12 Noon to 1:00 P.11. 	-L1L1  

• • • or By the Piece . • I sl.50 • 
Drinks and Salad not included 
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Home 
826-3240 

townmennnmennennonne- • era. 

We will try to 
repair any make 
and/or model Ra-
dio and T.V. 

JENNINGS PLUMBING 
& ELECTRIC SERVICE 

Shop 
826.3636 

HESS TRUCK & TRACTOR RADIO G. T.V. 
SERVICE 4 

COMMERCIAL RADIO & TV 

8011-826-3568 
_700 E. Oklahoma St. 

Phone: 826-3568 

Owner: Larry Jennings 
" A flush is better than a full house." 

Roto-Rooter Service—Repairs—Remodeling 
Phone: 806/826-3153 	9 years Experience 	 P.O. Box 423 
1110 South Main St 	Reasonable Rates 	Wheeler, Tx. 79096 

All Types Truck & Tractor Repair 
407 East Oklahoma St. 

Wheeler, Texas 

I've just been busy taking care of sick 
ones. 

Mrs. Bruce Harrison is in the 
hospital in Shamrock. She underwent 
gallbladder surgery. She had been 
coughing as much she felt she had 
pulled a rib loose. When checked it 
was found to be gall stones, and had 
surgery the next day. 

We hope Reuben May is doing well 
after his surgery in Oklahoma City for 
his hearing. They have been kept busy 
traveling back and forth. 

Melvin Stinnett of Buena Vista, 
Colorado has been in Allisoq a few 
days visiting the Kenneth Chandlers 
and the Carl Giddens. 

parent must be a carrier even though 
they don't know it, and there is no test 
known yet to detect this. When both 
parents are carriers, one out of four 
children are likley to have the disease, 
usually the third child. 

Research is being done as there are 
approximately 25,000 to 50,000 people 
mostly children who have the disease 
in the world. So far, it is incurable. 
Organized chapters of concerned par-
ents whose children have the disease 
have been set up in England, Austra-
lia and America. The President of the 
United States signed a proclamation 
that a week in Nov., 1984 would be 
honored as a National E B Awareness 
week. It is ironic that little Preston 
was born during this time. 

Briscoe 
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grand-daughter Susie Luttrell Mon-
day morning. 

Kenneth Childress from Wheeler 
visited them Sunday afternoon. • 

10 a.m. snowing now instead of 
sleet ground is covered good. 

Sunday Cecil and Jean Meadows. 
visited Mrs. Gertrude Meadows in 
Abraham rest home, She was doing 
pretty good, her sister Trula Galmor 
got out hospital visited Dean and 
Shannon Meadows and Michelle on 
way home. 

Visitors at Travis and Rosalee 

came Monday to haul' • 
some hay in ilhelfinor 

Keelin over weekend were Gena and 
Norma Keelin and children, Joey and 
Risa Keelin and children. 

The pancake and sausage supper 
Saturday afternoon and night and 
games of all kinds were to make 
money for the F.F.A and 4-H, some of 
the games were Allison outsiders and • 
Briscoe outsider basketball games, 
PBeiceyWclee race. 

 
Mike 	

they had little kid 

Mike and Shane went to Amarillo 
Saturday to a team roping rodeo. 

Mike and Melody Goad and child-
ren visited Dub and Ida Mae Goad 
Sunday night in Wheeler. 

10:30 a.m. everyones ground is 
covered good now that I talk to. 

Colie visited Les and Sharonda 
Seamster Monday morning. Picked up 
some gifts Debby send down by them. 

Sure thank Doc for coming over and 
hauling us some hay in. Colie and 
Weldon are working on our old John 
Deere maybe before long we will have 
a tractor that will start. 

Claude and Mable Parkers visitors 
Friday were Kevin and June Sheffield 
they went on to Los Angles, Calif, 4111  
they drive a big truck, haul things. 

Bill and Neta Ault were there 
Saturday they went home Saturday at 
home. 

Mable brother Paul Brown some 
knew him he grew up around here, he 
was graduated in Canadian, he was 
valedictorian when he graduated, he 
went to a college in Mass. He 
invented the burner that goes in 
Butane refrigerators etc, in World 
War 11 a F.B.I man needed or 
invention, he went to this Mass-
achusetts school found that Paul made 
the highest grades there he came 
stayed 10 days with Paul, till he made 
this invention Mable was never told 
what it was. He and some men came 
in here several years ago they were 
siesmographing they found 35 wells in • 
one field, that were good producers. 

I can't remember all Mable told 
about him sounded like he was a 
pretty smart man. But Mable said he 
never worried or cared for money now 
that is different to most of us. Jimmy 
Joe Ault went to his funeral. Mary 
Ann started the fog got so bad she 
turned around went back home. 
Jimmy Joe said there were 20 at his 
funeral Jimmy Joe is taking care of his • 
estate things as he had no children. 

There will be a meeting for Briscoe 
Ex-Students officers and anyone else 
interested at the Briscoe school Cafe-
teria on Feb. 3 (Sunday) at 2:30 P.M. 

AUTO 
STEREO 

SPEAKERS 
• 

Wheeler High School was just as 
busy as ever this past week. It seems 
that the further the year progresses 
the more activities there are to take up 
your time. 

The Senior class held a class 
meeting last Friday morning to decide 
upon several matters of class busi-
ness. The first matter of business on 
the agenda was to select a class motto, 
since there was no one motto all liked 
two were combined. The slogan is 
"Anise, go forth and conquer, with 
God's help we will suceed." Then the 
next election was to decide upon class 
colors. Finally, after long debate the 
class decided upon Aqua and Purple. I 
just hope they can find flowers. Then 
one last item was voted upon. The 
class parents were selected and they 
are the Dwayne Childress' and the 
Charles Crocketts. 

Basketball has also been moving 
right along this past week. The 
Varsity Mustangs and Mustangettes 
played Allison Antelopes and both 
teams came out victorious. Then on 
Friday, Wheeler played host a Sam-
norwood played the two teams. The 
Mustangettes and Mustangs came out 
victorious and are still undefeated in 
district play. The boys team has not 
been defeated yet on the year either. 

The W.J.H.S. Colts also had a busy 
week for basketball. The two teams 
journeyed to Briscoe and defeated 
them on Tuesday and then went to the 
Shamrock Tournament on Thursday, 
Friday, and Saturday. The teams 
defeated White Deer in their first 
game, Memphis in the second game, 
and played Childress for the Champ-
ionship. The girls game was close all 
of the way, but it was finally pulled 
out at the end. The boys won easily 
and both teams came home carrying a 
first place trophy. Special recognition 
goes to Misty Weeks and Sammy 
Zepeda for being selected to the 
all-tournament team of which only five 
of each sex were named too, but even 
better than this Marcy Smith and 
Bubba Smith were named Most 
Valuable Players for the entire Sham-
rock Jr. High Tournament. 

The chills of winter are still here. 
but that doesn't mean the effects of 
Spring are not here. Students at 
W.H.S.have already started work on -
materials for U.I.L. 

Now, you know more about What's 
Happening at W.H.S.! 

Rev. and Mrs. Ronnie Chadwick, 
Lee and Sharon Hall and Gary and 
Linda Hall were in Dallas most of last 
week for a church conference. 

Nadine and Monroe Reynolds kept 
Kim and Kevin Hall and also Greg 
Boydston, Clay and Jennifer Lay while 
Vickie was in Kansas for the weekend. 

Monte Markham has returned to 
school after being in the hospital for 
bronchitis. 

Desdrie Coulter has been in the 
hospital with pneumonia. 

I hear my sister Shirley in Arling-
ton, Virginia has been suffering from 
a cold ever since Christmas. They are 
really having some bitterly cold 
weather up there also. I'm thankful 
she works inside. She is a security 
officer in the Federal Reserve Build-
ing in Washington. D.C. She and my 
sister's family, Rev. and Mrs. Mike 
Hulse of Mitchelville, Maryland were 
all able to fly fome for Christmas. It 
was wonderful to have all ten of my 
immediate family in one place at one 
time, besides all the offsprings. We 
also celebrated LaQuinta's 27th birth-
day on Jan. 3rd. Before they flew back 
we received word that our great 
grandmother, Mrs. Maudie Harrison, 
had passed away. Grandmother had 
been living in a rest home in 
Cheyenne for several years and was a 
very special person. She lived to be 
90. 

Our school janitor has had a series 
of mishaps over the past year. Beside 
being in some vehicle accidents that 
could have been serious, he fell from a 
ladder onto cement and was in 
Amarillo for treatment. We hope he 
has better luck in the future. A special 
thanks goes to his wife Connie for 
helping out at the school in his 
absence. 

Henry and Doralea Dupont stay 
with Mrs. Ona Black and their son and 
his wife, Henry and Jane while he has 
a job working in the oilfield near 
Allison. Doralea travels back and forth 
to their home in Muskogee, Oklahoma 
where most of their children and 
families live. They keep busy making 
things and taking them to Arts and 
Crafts Bazaars. she has learned a lot 
trom her sister-in-law, Leota Black. 

Leota is still teaching college 
courses on sewing at the school, as 
well as traveling to Oklahoma City and 
other places to learn from others. She 
also gives classes at Elk City and 
Shamrock. 

Price 
Auto-tech 

• 

PUBLIC NOTICE 
AT&T Communications of the Southwest, Inc. ("AT&T 

Communications"), in accordance with the Public Utility 
Regulatory Act and the rules of the Public Utility Commis-
sion of Texas ("PUC") hereby gives notice of its intent to im-
plement a new schedule of rates for its services. The new 
rates will be effective February 22, 1985. unless otherwise 
determined by the PUC. All customers and classes of 
customers would be affected by the proposed rates. 

AT&T Communications has filed restructured tariffs 
designed to more closely recover access and other costs for 
private line, DATAPHONE* Digital Service. OCC Facilities, 
WATS and 800 services. 

Also proposed is the institution of a charge for directory 
assistance to begin to recover access costs incurred for 
such service, and increases in rates for operator assisted 
AT&T Long Distance calls. 

AT&T Communications is proposing to restructure its 
AT&T Long Distance Service and to reduce its overall 
revenues from basic long distance approximately $25 
million. 

While long distance rates will, in most instances, be 
reduced, certain AT&T Long Distance rates are proposed to 
be increased to more nearly recover the access charges ap-
proved by the PUC for such service. 

The proposed new rates for all services would result in an 
increase in adjusted test period revenues of $123.4, or 11.3 
percent. 

A complete copy of the proposed tariffs are on file with 
the Texas Public Utility Commission. 

Persons who wish to intervene or otherwise participate in 
these proceedings should notify the Commission as soon 
as possible. A request to intervene or participate or for fur-
ther information should be mailed to the Public Utility Com-
mission of Texas, 7800 Shoal Creek Blvd., Suite 400N, 
Austin, Texas 78757. Further information also may be ob-
tained by calling the Public Utility Commission Consumer 
Affairs Division at (512) 458-0223 or (512) 458-0227 or (512) 
458-0221 teletypewriter for the deaf. 
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Buster's Rodeo Shop 
Boot & Saddle Repair 

New Location 
2 MIles South on Highway 83 

826-3072 
	

Roper Boots $5995 

Sweetwater Creek Builders 
• Custom Homes • Additions • Remodels 

• Roofing 
	

• Concrete Work 
Jeff Reid 
	

P.O. Box 55 
845-2104 
	

Mobeetie, Tx. 

obeetie 
editations 

By Goldle Gordon 

Well no matter how you try these 
birthdays catch up with you. Little one 
year old Katy Shipp and I enjoyed 
ours Sunday. Katy now has some 
teeth and is running around. Earl and 

O Mable Tabor and Anna Belle and 
Ariza Carcaran gave me a nice 
birthday supper on Sat. night. 

Another nice birthday present was 
when my Sunday School class came 
down and had Sunday School in my 
home. Those who came were Teacher 
Ruth Hathaway, Ina May Brotherton, 
Anna Belle Corcoran, Lorene Recter, 

.Irene Webb, Estelle Orr, Elizabeth 
• Richardson, Orville Greenhouse, Es-

telle Hodges, Ella Trout, Ethel 
Grimes, and Lisa Newman. 

Orvil and Mary Maddox visited last 
week in Wheeler with Sallie Harris. 

Sympathy to the Bill Britten family 
of the death of Gereldene's father, 
Jessie Hewitt who was buried at Cash, 
Arkansas Jan 26th. 2:00 P.M. 

Welcome to Orvel and Mary Mad-
dox who are the new caretakers at the 

Its Mobeetie Jail. They are from Mary-
land, but Orvel had lived in Elk City. 
Orvel's brother works in the Briscoe 
school system and his niece works in 
the First State Bank so they already 
feel at home. The Maddox are excited 
with their new job and invite everyone 
to come for a visit. The jail hours 
are:Open;10:00 until 5 on week days; 
1:00 until 5 on Sundays; Closed on 

I Tuesday. 
Thanks to Ab Gunter for the new 

load of artifacts he presented the Jail 
many of them Indian ones. There's 
aiway's something new at the Mu-
seum for you to see. 

Happy Birthday to Ab Trout. Hap-• 
piness and hope he has many many 
more. For his birthday Ab and Ella ate 
birthday supper in Lefors with Doro-
thy and R.W. Beck. 

• Mr. and Mrs. R.C. Parker from 
McLean visited Saturday in the home 
of Marie and Gene Gudgel and Byron 
and Novelene Simpson. 

Mattie Williams visited Thursday 
with her old friends Pierce and Nettie 
Walker. She is doing fine after her eye 
surgery. 

Earl and Pauline Barnes and Verna 
Corcoran visited Melba and Dale 
Corcoran on Saturday night. 

Mr. and Mrs. Virgil Rector from 
Havanah Arkansas visited his brother 
Jud and Lorene Rector Wednesday 
night. 

Visiting last week in the home of 
Lcola and Calvin Stuart were Fat and 
Wanda Childress from Briscoe and 
Mrs. Bulah Stewart from Kelton. 

Doyle and Bulah Grimes and Aud- 

• rey Alexander from White Deer 
attended the funeral of a cousin 
Geneva Merrctt whose funeral was 
Saturday at Ardmore, Okla. 

Althea Davis from White Deer and 
Bobbie Combs from the Focus Maga-
zine visited Sallie Harris to see about 
her writing some stories of "Old 
Mobeetie." 

Doyle and Bulah Grimes visited 
Thursday in the Coronado Nursing 

✓ Home with Mary Brewer. She was 
doing fine. 

Teresa Simpson from Shamrock 
visited Saturday in the Joe Darnell 
home. She ate supper and they went 
shopping in Pampa. 

Coronado Hospital at Pampa. 
Orville Greenhouse and Lorene 

Rector visited Orvil and Mary Maddox 
at the Old Mobeetie Jail Museum last 
week. 

Melba and Dale Corcoran spent the 
weekend of Jan. 19th in the home of 
Jerry, Joyce, Rance, and Steve Rector 
and Scotty in Amarillo. 

Mildred Mickey, Ada Lou Lester. 
Sid Harris, Carrie, Elizabeth Richard-
son and Marion and Ethel Grimes 
gathered together Tuesday night to 
enjoy a music session. 

Visitors Sunday in the home of Herk 
and Elnita Atkins were;Tony Atkins 
and friend Loyce and son Cody and 
Herbert and Loretta Atkins and 
granddaughter Melissa Duman from 
Amarillo. 

I am so sorry we are having so much 
sickness at this time but hope by now 
some are improving. 

Bernice Hefley had surgery the first 
of the week on Colorado Community 

Dr. Jack L. Rose 
OPTOMETRIST 

121 Main St. — Shamrock 
Phone 256-3203 

Tues.: 9-5 	Fri.: 2-5 

giocoe ne 13% Vetola Parker 

tv.i 

QR~ME 4 
le 	

4 
,4 

Av FRESH SHRIMP % 
& SEAFOOD — BY AIR! 

From Boston, Portland, Seattle, 

New Orleans, Texas Coast and elsewhere! 

CROSS CAR CENTER 
Saturday, Feb. 2 
11 A.M.-1 P.M. 

ADAMS GENERAL 

CONTRACTING 
Now offering 
Complete Backhoe Service 

• Custom Homes 
• Remodeling 

• Painting • Roofing 

• All Types Steel Bldgs. 
& Grain Bins 

Phone (after 5:00 P.M.): 
806/826-3019 

GERMANI AA P4 MUTUAL 

REASONABLE, SOUND PROTECTION 
for your home and other property, 

Rita Pearson: 375-2379 
R E. A. Zybach: 375-2528 	 t. I, Canadian, Texas  

J.B. Muffler and Mechanics 
ipe Bending—Stock & Glass Pack Mufflers 

Two Blocks South of Simca Station 

Owner 	James Babb 	826-S607 

Try our 

Special: 
Thursday. Friday, 
Saturday & Sunday 

BURRITO $4729 
SUPREME a 

Hours 9:00-9:00 

Harvey's Family 
Restaurant 

Phone 826-3333 

NO JOB TOO BIG 	FULLY INSURED 
WILL SUPPLY COPY OF INSURANCE IF NECESSARY 

BOB UNDERWOOD 
BOX 269 WHEELER, TX 79096 	U BAR 

806-826-3150 	24 HRS. 
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FREE ESTIMATES 24 HR. WRECKER SERVICE 

McCAIN'S AUTO BODY 
117 W. OKLAHOMA BOX 65 WHEELER, TX 79096 

PH. 806/826-3433 

INSURANCE CLAIMS OWNER: BOB McCAIN 

Ralph and Lanelle Riggs grandson, 
Nathan Bailey, spent part of last week 
with his grandparents while his Mom 
and Dad went sking. 

Their son Jimmy and Cindy Riggs 
from Canyon visited Saturday. 

Flora Maye, Jeff and Joe Kelley 
and Ernest attended the wedding of 
Robert Kelleys son Kendell on Sunday 
in Amarillo. 

The Pony Express lady for the 
banks visited Sallie Harris Friday as 
Sallie has had to stay home with a sore 
foot. She is doing better now. Sallie's 
brother Gus Brock of Amarillo had 
been over to visit her. 

Marcella Patterson has been com-
ing down often to help her mother 
take care of Jess in the hospital. Jane 
and Tria Godwin from Canadian 
visited Jess in the hospital. 

Anna Lee Sims spent several days 
last week in Booker with Kent, Carla, 
and the girls. They brought her home 
Saturday. Sunday was Happy Birth-
day for Carla with Clara fixing her a 
dinner and a birthday cake. Carla and 
Cotton and Anna Lee Sims enjoyed 
the party. 

Bill and Virginia Ridgeway visited 
her family Connie Hunter and Big 
John Chesser, Friday who were in 

Amy Morris, Sheila Moffett, Terry 
Seitz, Travis May, Greg Langley, 
Julie Stepps, Pam Smith, Tammy 
Harwell. Stephen Batton, Kelley Will-
iams. John Moffett, Claude Laverty, 
Ronnie Vandifeur. 

Sponsors were:James and Alesha 
Moffett, Kimberly Johnston, Krista 
and Shelley, Paul and Clarice, Gary 
and Caroline May. 

The Baptist Church had a good 
attendance Sunday. Everyone especi-
ally enjoyed the mens quartet made 
up of Claudia Brotherton, Paul Hath-
away, Melvin May, Randy McCurley. 

but doing as good as can be expected. 
Remember Gene and Marie in your 
prayers. 

The Mobeetie Baptist Church took 
the young people Grade 7 thru 12 out 
for a fun night Saturday at the Pampa 
Bowling Alley. 

After several hours of bowling they 
went to the Taco Villa to eat and then 
back to the church where Gary May 
gave a devotional in "Walk Tall and 
Carry a Big Stick." 

Those who went were:Jimmy 
McDanieal, Diane Moffett, Russell 
Laverty. Chris Rowley, Todd Bacon, 

Hospital. 
Earnest Lancaster was to have 

shoulder surgery on Jan. 28th, at St. 
Anthony's Hospital. 

Sandra Randolph had her surgery 
and had a valve in her heart opened 
last week. She came home Sunday. 

Remember dear Jess Patterson in 
Parkview Hospital, in your prayers he 
has been so ill. 1 checked with Gazelle 
today and he was better. 

Jewel Leonard was still in Parkview 
Hospital but hopes to come home 
soon. 

Gene Gudgel is having a rough time 

weekend, Weldon just told me he 
thought T.V. they said to 5 degrees 
now all got colder here than that. All 
thermometers don't register alike. 

Saturday night around 8 p.m. 
Saturday Started to sprinkle, at 10 

its still raining. 
Sunday morning our ground cover-

ed with snow, at 9:30 still little falling 
will be little more moisture, hoping 
not so cold.Coming out of east looks 
like. Chill factor 9 degrees in Amarillo 
Sunday morning. 

Hated to hear, Kyndell Murray had 
surgery last week. Vernon Hall was 
sick with flu, Hoyle Helton had 
another round coughing and being 
trouble, Joe and Nelda Dukes went 
back to Houston for Joe last treat-
ment, sure hope this does the job. 
Colic sick all night and slept in his 
chair Saturday night. 

Sunday afternoon our snow about 
all gone. 

Oh yes Garland and Charlene 
Dukes little boy was sick Sunday 
morning, Red and Anna Dukes gone 
way south where it is warm I think. 

Some of February birthdays Tommy 
Clark 16th. 

Gena Zybach said we got 1/2 inch of 
moisture from our snow and drizzels 
that is good. 

Monday morning 28th cloudy and 
looks like more snow. 

Irene Zybach visited Avis Parker 
Sunday afternoon. 

Colie visited George and Avis 
Saturday morning, she seems to be 
doing real good and can see good, now 
that is something wonderful. 

Eric and Pauline Zybach took Misty 
to Sayre picked her grandparents up 
Truman and Betty Zybach they went 
to Elk City and ate out to celebrate her 
8th birthday on Saturday a little girl 
Anna Marie Grissen from Wheeler 
came out to help her celebrate her 
birthday, her mother made her a cake 
in shape of a schoolhouse. I think 
things like that is nice for kids, Lets 
them know they are loved. So many 
think they are not loved and I guess 
there are so many that are not loved, 
how sad. 

Fat and Wanda Childress took Mrs. 
Clara Childress to Oklahoma City last 
Tuesday they attended the funeral of 
Claras' niece funeral Juanita (Child-
ress) Summerall. She was just 60 
years old, she was Clarence Childress 
daughter. 

Fat and Wanda ate supper Saturday 
night with Calvin and Leola Stuart in 
Mobeetie. 

Wanda was baby setting with her 
Continued Page 2 

I hope everyone in Wheeler County 
or anyone that ever lived in Wheeler 
County is to write their story how or 
where they lived and how they lived . 

I received a letter from one of my 
nieces teaching in Santa Cruz, Balivia 
if you could read it you be glad you 
were living here due to stealing there 
— in Peru was bad. We all have been 
fearing she was on that plane that 
went down in Bolivia — but she 
stopped off to vacation with a friend 
lady in Peru and Bolivia, so she 
missed the plane crash — we were all 
glad. She got off in Florida, to take 
this vacation we could not hear for so 
long. Could not get her at her home 
place, etc. 

Claude and Mable Parker visited us 
Monday afternoon. 

Bob Markham visited us Wednes-
day afternoon. 

I read that a 2 minute heating in 
your microwave ovens restores a fresh 
taste to week old milk, without 
affecting its nutritional value. Milk 
goes bad long before it is unsafe to 
drink. 

Beware of the little 3/8 to 1/2 in 
long, 1/4 to 3/4 in from toe to toe 
spider, or some call fiddle back spider 
it has 8 legs its light yellow to medium 
brown has a distinctive mark shaped 
like a fiddle on its back, oval body, 
victim rarely see the spider, bite 
almost painless, in 2 to 8 hours pain 
and blisters, swelling, hemorrhage or, 
ulceration, some just have rash, 
nausea, jaundice, chills, fever, 
cramps or joint pain, summon the 
doctor, probably take hospitalization 
and 6 to 8 weeks to heal, weak adults 
and children have been know to die. 

Avis Parker had her eye surgery 
today Thursday around 4 p.m., Char-
lene called down at 6 p.m. she was 
back in her room doing ok. she was 
going out to a motel with George and 
Charlene will have to check with her 
doctor in morning then probably get to 
come home tomorrow, we wish for her 
a speedy recovery. 

Debby Clark just called down from 
Denver, Colo. her sister Deanna had a 
car wreck, we sure hope it is not 
serious. 

Les and Sharonda Seamster got 
home from Denver Sunday night, 
drove all night roads not to bad. 

Charlene called, said Avis came 
home Friday around 2 p.m. doing ok, 
now that is some thing wonderful for 
the sight. 

I guess it isn't really to safe to get 
out in a car Deanna was setting at a 
red light behind a cement truck 
another woman in car behind Deanna 
Deanna was in a pickup truck guess is 
what save her, she thought she 
started rolling or moving forward she 
put all force she could on brakes, did 
not help a big pipe came back into her, 
she was also hit in back. this woman's 
front caved in said she was setting 
still, Colic said probably the cement 
truck backed into her, they don't seem 
to be hurt bad Deanna neck hurts and 
is swellling, never know you get so 
shook up you don't really know where 
you are hurt. 

Friday 25 real pretty like sping has 
sprung. But we know better. 

The Mac Purcells are going to ball 
games, they went to Booster Club 
Saturday, there was a pancake 
supper. 

Eunice Edward goes for a check-up 
Monday 28, we are hoping her check 
up is good. 

Mary Hudson and Mr. and Mrs. 
Elgia Welch attended Mr. Gatlin 
funeral in Mobeetie last Monday, she 
got to visit with 2 of her grandsons at' 
the funeral Jot and Rodney Gatlin. 

Friday Mary and Mr. and Mrs. 
Welch shopped in Wheeler and 
visited Lester Hudson. Mary visited 
Ray and Pat Hudson Saturday after-
noon. 

Roy and Willene Waters spent 3 
night at their trailor house in Pampa 
this week. Willene was trying to get a 
nother cold we hope not. 

Correction, Bill and Neta Ault went 
out to California to Paul Browns wife 
funeral they did not got to Pauls 
funeral. 

Bill and Neta Ault instead of Auit. 
Perryton got 1 — 1 degree last 

rzese' 24-HOUR 
DROP SERVICE 

Vogue Drive-In 
Cleaners 

1542 North Hobart, 
Pampa, Texas 

669-7500 

41—

WELCOME TO 

FIRST UNITED METHODIST CHURCH 
8TH AT MAIN - P. 0. BOX 89 

WHEELER, TEXAS 79096 

Church 1806) 826-3114 - Parsonage (806) 826-3079 
Ernie Sunday School 	9:45 a.m. 

McGaughey, 
Pas tor 	 Morning Worship 	11:00 a.m. 

Evening Worship 	6:00 p.m. 

U BAR U 
OILFIELD TROUBLE SHOOTING 

IPS —ROSS HILL CERTIFIED 

• 

BUTCHERING & PROCESSING PRICES 
Beef processed, double wrapped-25C Per Pound 

57.50 for Butchering 
Pork Processing including curing 

Double Wra Double wrapped-32C Per Pound 
$8.50 a head for butchering 

We butcher Mon.. Tues., Thurs. & Fri. until 11.30 A-M. 

CALL FOR QUARTER—HALF—WHOLE 
BEEF PROCESSED 

WE NOW HAVE CUTS OF PORK & BEEF ON SALE 

a NOTED FOR 24HR. SERVICE!! 
is 

INDUSTRIAL 
COMMERCIAL 

OILFIELD 
INSTRUMENTATION 

ELECTRONICS 
SHAMROCK SLAUGHTER PLANT 

North of City Phone: 256-3241 Closing at Noon on Saturday 

/ 

agragoiamasansiewas_ 	_ 

   

ENROLLED TO PRACTICE BEFORE 
THE INTERNAL REVENUE SERVICE 

(Win. 1. C74'zifitstx 

CONSULTANT FEDERAL INCOME TAXES 
RuSiNESS SERVICES 

13 S BALLARD 
F .11PA TEYAS ruy,s 	 80€ 669 :•64 7 



le! 	agent 
RUTH SMITH, Broker GREG SMITH, Salesman 
JOE LEE. Salesman - 375-2380 
LONA WILLIAMS, Salesman - 826-3341 
LANA BRADSTREET Salesman - 826-3354 

Phone: 806/826-5541 or 826-3238 

FOR RENT 
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New Listings 
in Allison 

t 
V 3 bedroon, 2 bath, in. Allison with 	fro 3 bedroom, I bath, in Allison 

2.84 acres 

RESIDENTIAL. .. fro 3 BR, 1 bath, garage, central 
heat and air. Immaculate. 

✓ Live in the country. 5 acres 
with a four bedroom home. Owner 
anxious to move South. 

V 3 br, 2 bath, garage, barns, 30 
acres. South of Wheeler. 
I, Brick home south part of 
Wheeler. Fenced yard and cellar. 
Good starter home. 

V Two bedroom home with 
garage for mechanic. Close to 
school. Could convert garage for 
another business or living area. 

V 4 Bedroom, large game room, 
plant room, double garage. 

✓ Older home in northwest part 
of Wheeler. Has a contract which 
could be assumed by the right 
person. Corner lot. 

V Two bedroom, 1 bath, on corner 
lot. 

✓ Large older home. Four bed-
room, two bath, many, many trees. 
Kitchen has many extras. Owner 
wants smaller home close to down-
town. 

• • FARM & RANCH • 

t". 3 bedroom brick, 2 bath, 2 car 
carport, fenced yard, with storage 
building. Very affordable. 

3 Bedroom, 2 bath, garage, 
barns. 30 acres. south of Wheeler. 
V Recently remodeled two bed-

room stucco home. Would make a 
great rent house. 

V 3 bedroom, 11/4 bath, cellar and 
tots of extras! 
V Home in Allison. Remodeled 

and ready. Call Joe Ire 

Wheeler Game Room. One of 
the only locations downtown 
Wheeler for sale. Could be operat-
ed as is or developed for more 
income. Has full basement. 

• • COMMERCIAL . 

V 1/4 Section close to Allison, 
farm land 
✓ Two sections southwest of 

Allison. Good Hunting. Owner will 
finance part at 10%. 

V Another pretty lot for sale with 
a large garage and double-wide 
Lancer mobile home on it. Good 
neighborhood and beautiful land-
scaping. 

V Three bedroom, two bath. 
stucco home with large garage. 
central air and many other extras. 
Priced well below appraisal. 

✓ One bedroom, one bath home 
decorated to the hilt! Priced to sell. 

V Two bedroom, 1 bath and apart-
ment with sink, bath and washer/ 
dryer hookups. 

V Two story house across from 
school. Three bedroom, two bath, 
fenced yard. Completely remodel-
yd. Priced way below appraisal. 

V Four bedroom, two bath brick 
home. Will sell for appraisal price 
set by qualified appraiser. Cellar. 
large garage and yard. 
V Build a home on this large lot 

in northwest part of Wheeler. Has 
been used for double-wide mobile 
home. 

i" Older home in Wheeler. Fix it 
up and have an investment. Own-
ers will finance. 

pos 1 section southwest part of 
Wheeler County. Large home, 
some farm land, some love grass. 
Assumable FHA loans for qualified 
buyers. 
V 1 section south of Wheeler. 
Large brick home. Lake. Barns. 
Owner will finance part. 
if 400 acres north of Twitty. 

Small home. Part farm land. Part 
grass 
V 1 section south of Wheeler. 

Owner will finance with 20% down. 
srt farm land. Part grass. 

1/4 section with small home 
south of Wheeler. Grassland. 

✓ 1/4 section with large home and 
barns. Good fences. Could assume 
loan. 

1/2 section east of Wheeler. 
Owner has farmed 200 acres in 
past. Rest in grass. 

V 27 acres north edge of Wheel-
er. Large home, two large barns, 
and trailer spaces. Colorado bank 
\till finance for right person. 
V Trailer park in west part of 
town. Has house that could be 
repaired and rented or occupied. 
Owner will finance with $5,000 
down. 
V Acreage north of Wheeler with 
large metal building. Many possi-
bilities and assumable financing. 
V Two remodeled rent houses. 

One rented at present. Owner has 
moved and wants to sell! 
V Remodeled house by Post 

Office. Has been doctor's office. 

LEGAL NOTICE LEGAL NOTICE a/ NOTICE 
The City of Wheeler is 

accepting bids on doing the 
yearly audit. Bids will be 
reviewed at the regular 
meeting Febuary 18th., 
1985. Send bids to City of 
Wheeler, P.O. Box 98, 
Wheeler, Texas 79096. The 
City reserves the right to 
accept or reject any or all 
bids. 

Want Ads 
FOR SALE: King size 
waterbed, Hallmark Oak by 
Harrison Furniture Co.. 4 
large drawers underneath, 
good condition, 2 years old. 
Phone 375-2.343. Adams Rentals 

The Board of Directors, 
North Wheeler County Hos-
pital District, has set Satur-
day, April 6, 1985 for the 
election of Hospital District 
Directors. The election will 
be held jointly with the 
school trustee's election. 

The deadline for filing for 
director of the North 
Wheeler County Hospital 
District is March 12, 1985. 
Three districts will elect 
directors this year. They are 
Allison. Briscoe and Mo-
beetie. These districts are 
currently represented by 
Louis Grayson, Allison; 
Dean Tipps. Briscoe; and 
Melvin May, Mobeetie. 

Any qualified taxpayer 
desiring his or her name to 
be placed on the ballot as a 
candidate for director shall 
file a petition with the 
Secretary of the Board of 
Directors signed by not less 
than five qualified voters 
residing in the candidates 
voting precinct, asking that 
the said name be printed on 
the ballot. Such petitions 
shall be filed at least twenty-
five days prior to the date of 
the election. 

Petitions for filing may be 
obtained from Charles A. 
Hix, Administrator, Park-
view Hospital. 

The sensible, safe way to 
lose weight call Lyndon 
Loyd, 826-5850 or 826-3568. 

wit 

FOR SALE. 640 acres 11/2 
miles S.W. of Wheeler. 400 
acres in cultivation. Beauti-
ful 8 year old 3/2 brick 
home. Beautiful location, 
42'x66' steel building, barn, 
corrals, chickenhouse, ex-
cellent water system under-
ground, fruit trees. Will 
consider selling house with 
smaller acreage. Gary 
Miller. 806-826-5608. 

j
La Grone 

Monument Co. 

Faye Sparlin, Rep. 

806/826-5898 

826-3184 during the day, or 

826-3094 and 826-3019 

LEGAL NOTICE 
The County Judge* 

Wheeler County, Texas, will 
accept applications from all 
banking corporations, asso-
ciations or individual bank-
ers desiring to be designat-
ed as County Depository for 
all Trust Funds. All State 
laws must be complied with 
an if you desire for the 
County to consider other 
items in your bid, thert* 
please include any details 
for those items. Such appli-
cation is to be presented to 
the County Judge, Wheeler 
County, Wheeler, Texas, on 
or before February 11, 1985, 
at 10 a.m. to be considered 
by the Commissioners' 
Court on February 11, 1985 
at 10:00 A.M. in the Com-. 
missioners' 	Courtroom, 
Wheeler, Texas. 

Alfalfa Hay For Sale, 
375-2289 

HOLCOMB 

TRAILER PARK 
West 12th Street 

Phone 806/826-5810 
or 826-5942 

after 6:00 p.m. 
1-4 Bedroom farm home, unfurnished 
1-1 bedroom efficiency apartment, furnished 
1-3 Bedroom house, furnished 
2-2 Bedroom house, 
1 Furnished, 1 unfurnished, 
All Repainted & Cleaned 

1978 Chevrolet 1/2 ton Pick-up 

GENERAL 
CONTRACTING 

Roofing—Painting 
Remodeling—Stuccoing 

Call Al Fancher 
After 5 p.m., 826-5286 

NOTICE 
On April 6, 1985 there will 

be an election to elect three 
members to the City Coun-
cil. Places to be filled is #1 
presently held by Bobby 
Vanpool, #3 by Berniece 
Hall and #5 by Jimmy Hill. 
People desiring to file for 
one of these places have 
until March 6, 1985 to file 
for application to be on.'the 
ballot. 

OVERHEAD DOOR 
REPAIR 

Residential and some 
Commercial 

Also Operator repair. 
Sales and Service 

Call 375-2258 Briscoe 

ROY'S WATER 

WELL SERVICE 
Complete Sales, Service 
& Repairs. for Windmills 
and Electric Pumps at low 
discount prices. 

Roy Hartley, Reydon, Ok 
Phone: 405/655-4438 

If no answer 405/488-3661 

Work of Any Kind Call after 
4:30 p.m. 826-3466 or 
9:00-4:30 at 826-3338 ask for 
Danny 

Tea 
	

MEMBER 1985 

TEXAS PRESS ASSOCIATION 
FREE Color Analysis 
Call 375-2413 for information 

I have all your Beauticontrol needs 

LaDonna Elmore 
Certified Consultant 

LEGAL NOTICE 
BUYERS OF MINERAL& 

Producing & Non-Producing 
Will Pay CASH 

BASIN ROYALTY CO. 
P.O. Box 9940, Amarillo, 
Texas 79105, Phone 373-
2701 

THE 

BUSINESS DIRECTORY  
NOTICE 

The enacted budget for 
Wheeler County for the 
1984-85 fiscal year, includ-
ing Revenue Sharing Funds, 
may be viewed at the• 
County Judge's Office, 
Wheeler County Court 
House, Wheeler, Texas, 
between 8:30 a.m. and 5 
p.m. Monday through 
Friday. 

FOR SALE: Lot 2.30 ft by 140 
ft. residental area. Reason-
able, call Paul Topper 
826-5237. 

ENE \N\AE_O_G.9- 1-1N€_", 
—4411.a 	

rl;11/41-4 FOR LEASE 18' Moving 
Van with driver. Call 
826-5735 after 5:00 p.m. 

WANTED: Irrigation pipe. 
pump, wheel systems. scrap 
pipe, etc. 806/256-2519 
Shamrock. CARRIE'S SEWING BOX 

Everything 1/2 price. 

Chain Saws Sharpened: 
Phone 826-3144. 

LEGAL NOTICE FOR SALE: 20 acres of land 
east of Wheeler. Phone Ken 
or Mary 714/885-7442. rtn 

LEGAL NOTICE A, 
RABBITS: some free and 
some for sale. Call 826-3395. FOR SALE. 14 x 65 Town & 

Country Mobile HOme. 2 
bedroom, 2 bath, central 
heat & air, built-in stove & 
DW. Call 6-3007 after 4 
o'clock. 

P.O. Box 1080 
Phone: 826-3123 

LOSE WEIGHT & FEEL 
GREAT: Fast & Naturally 
with HERBAL PRODUCTS 
Fro more info—Contact, 
Brenda Garner, Day 
826-5968, night, 826-3325. 

Will Do Housecleaning: Call 
826-3392 after Jan. 14. 

Dog Grooming 
Lee Ann Lowery 
Royce Animal Hospital, 665- 
2223. 

Entered as second-class matter December 18, 1933, at the Post 
Office at Wheeler, Texas 790%, under the act March 3, 1879. 

The County Judge. 
Wheeler County, Texas will 
accept applications from all 
banking corporations, asso-
ciations or individual bank-
ers desiring to be designat-
ed as County Depository for 
all County Funds and 
County School Funds. All 
State laws must be complied 
with and if you desire for the 
County to consider other 
items in your bid, then 
please include any details 
for those items. Such 
application is to be present-
ed to the County Judge, 
Wheeler County, Wheeler, 
Texas, on or before 
February 11, 1985, at 10:00 
A.M. t be considered by the 
Commissioners' Courtroom, 
Wheeler, Texas. 

RICHARD'S 
UPHOLSTERY 

The Briscoe Independent 
School District will accept* 
bids for the construction of a 
primary grade classroom 
building. 

Proposals shall be receiv- 
ed in the home economics 
classroom of the scnotn 
building, Briscoe Indepen-
dent School District, Briscoe 
Texas. not later than 4:00 
P.M. local time, February 7, 4D 
1985. 

Detailed plans and speci-
fications may be obtained at 
the office of Shiver-Megert 
& Associates, A.I.A. Archi-
tects & Engineers, at 102 
East Ninth Street, Suite 200, 
Amarillo, Texas 79101. 
(806/372-5662. 

FREE PUPPIES: Mother is 
full blood Bassett Hound. 
Call 826-5697 after five. 

Louis C. Stas, Owner and Publisher 
SUBSCRIPTION RATES: 

Wheeler County... $10.50 Outside County. . . 511.50 

FOR SALE 
43 Mixed Angus cows. 

Many with calves at side. 

Call: 826-3094 after 6 p.m. 

t— 

Furniture, etc. 
Phone: 845-2761 
Mobeetie, Texas FOR SALE: Registered 

ADBA Pit Bull pups. Boud 
reaux Breed. Have both sire 
and dam to show. Phone 
256-5112. 

Wheeler Lodge No.1099 

A. F. & A.M. 
Let Me 11rite It . 

GEO. RICHARDSON 
All Types Of 

INSURAN 

MONDAY 
7:30 P.M. 

FOR SALE. 4 bedroom, 3 
bath house, with or without 
approximately 20 acres. 
Owner moved, make offer. 
1-405/S27-589'i. 	rtn Sandy Willis 

Certified BeautiCare 
& Color Consultant 

806/256-5470 
806/826-5970 

Robert Lane, Sec'y. 

Members Urged To Attend. 

Visitors Welconv. 

FOR SALE: 1976 Chevrolet 
Caprice Classic, excellent 
condition and 1973 Olds-
mobile Delta 88, good con-
dition. Lyndon Loyd 
826-5850 or 826-3568. 

CORN FED BEEF 
Cut and packaged to your 
needs. Call for Half or 
Whole. Satisfaction 
Guaranteed. Delivered for 
$1.35 per lb. 826-5258. 

PECANS FOR SALE 
Wheeler Extension Home-
makers Club has Del Cerro 
Pecans for $3.75 a pound. 
Call 826-3150 or 826-5719. t WHEELER 

REDI-MIX 
	• 

GUARANTEED 
AUTO GLASS 

INSTALLATION 
& Body Repair 

CROSS 
CAR CENTER 
Phone: 826-5515 
Wheeler. Texas 

3ABYSITTING WANTED: 
n my home. All week, Sat. 
Sc Sun. and night time also. 
Phone: 826-3648. RED1-MIX CONCRETE 

SAND 

Washed Gravel—All Sizes 

Office Hours: 7:30 to 5:00 

Phone 806-826-3223 

NOTICE 
I will not be responsible for 
any debts other than my 
own, January 1, 1985, Gary 
Horton 

HOUSE 
FOR SALE 

3 bedrooms, 1 & 3/4 bath. 
utility room, call Sandra 
Christner, 826-3572. 

DATE TO REMEMBER 
The Mobeetie Blood Pressure Clinic 

will be held Feb. 1. in the fellowship 
hall of the Baptist Church, 2:00 P.M. 
until 6:00 P.M. This is a free service 
and each and everyone is urged to 
take advantage. 

was missing; it was. My stay this time 
was of about the same duration and 
just as mysteriously came to an end. 
Needless to say, I found a hotel 
employee to place the second report. 

I had a great time; we returned 
Sunday evening. 

Chat 	 From Page 1 

opened at the same time. I walked in 
and punched the correct button; the 
door closed, the elevator started to 
move and stopped. No indication as to 
what level and the door would not 
open. Without panic I reached down 
to the door marked "phone"—there 
was none. I didn't have the heart to 
push the "Alarm"—it probably didn't 
work either. I calmly waited for some 
sounds of traffic on the other elevator 
operating; there was none. Finally, as 
mysteriously as it stopped, the ele-
vator started, stopped and the doors 
opened. I made my exit, went to the 
hotel phone and reported the prob-
lem. End of story, No . . . 

Chapter Two: later the same day, it 
was necessary to return to the car. To 
play it safe, I used the other elevator. 
Returning from the car, I again 
avoided the elevator with which I had 
the problem. You guessed it, I was 
caught in the second elevator Remain-
ing calm, I looked to see it this phone 

FOR SALE or RENT: 2 
bedroom house, 1004 S. 
Main. Available soon. 
Phone 405/534-2336. 

Oefialfr --- 

F 	..• alp J~ 
Ardecti' Al uminum 

Self-S toring 

PAUL'S REAL ESTATE 
Houses or Land 

Paul Topper 
200 S. Canadian St. 

806/826-5237 
Wheeler, Tx. 

submit their sit offerings no later than 
February 25, 1985 to: Pat H. Mus-G 
grave, real estate representative. 
Field Real Estate and Buildings 
Office. U.S. Postal Service, P.O. 
Drawer 239, Dallas, Tex. 75221-0239. 
Copies of the advertisement for sites 
may be obtained from the postmaster 
at Briscoe. 

After a suitable site has been 
located, the Postal Service will call for 
construction bids for a building that 
will be built with private funds and 
leased to the Postal Service for a long 
term period. 

The proposed new post office 
building will have approximately 
1,034 sq. ft. of interior floor space. 

NOTICE TO PUBLIC 
Any erroneous reflection upon the 
character, standing or reputation of 
any person, firm or corporation, 
which may appear in the columns of 
this paper will be gladly corrected 
upon due notice bang given to the 
editor personally at the office at 110 
East Texas St., Whinier:Tow. 

SITE NEEDED FOR NEW MAIN 
POST OFFICE AT BRISCOE, 

TEXAS 
The U.S. Postal Service is seeking a 

suitable site upon which to build and 
lease a new main post office building 
in Briscoe, Postmaster Lou Dean 
Douthit said here. 

The "preferred area" for site 
consideration is bounded on the north 
by Santa Fe Avenue. on the east by 
Oak Avenue. on the south by Howard 
Avenue, and on the west by Chickasha 
Avenue. 

Minimum site size needed is 12.500 
sq. ft. of land, or a lot with minimum 
dimensions of 100 ft. by 125 ft. 

Property owners are asked to 

CITY DUMP 
GROUND HOURS 

Monday, Tuesday, Thurs-
day, Friday and Saturday 
8:30 A.M. til 5:30 P.M. 

Closed on Wednesday 

STORM-SCREEN 
WINDOWS 

Permanent year-round protection 
Changeable from inside. Easy r 
c lean..prow ler•pcoof Eliminates 
drafts...Cuts fuel bills.... 

WHEELER LUMBER CO. 
Phone 826-5543 Wheeler. Tex 

Fine Ser..ce 4 c' F ne Prcple 

FOR RE,As: Trailer space in 
Moore's Trailer Park, 826-
3364. 

The Wheeler Times does not know-
ingly accept false or fraudulent 
advertang or other advertising of an 
objectional nature, is printed in full 
confidence in the presentation 
made. Readers will confer a favor if 
they will promptly report any failure 
on the part of the advertiser to make 
good any misrepresentation in our 
advertisements. 

APARTMENT FOR RENTT. 
2 bedroom, appliances in-
cluding washer and dryer. 
Call 256-3792 evenings, or 
826-3364 days. 



On Briscoe team were; Keith Horn, 
Jimmy Maddox, Steve Zybach, Joe 
Austin, Mike and Mark Meadows, 
Mike Lehman, Norman Morgan, Rod-
ney Sweet and Bob Rogers. 

There was also a pancake race 
between teachers and school board 
members. Harold Salmon and Gene 
and Rhonda Ferguson got pie in the 
faces. Hope the Boosters will have 
another game night next year. 

Norman Morgan and Mary Slay 
from Wayland Baptist College at 
Plainview were weekend visitors to 
Jack and Pat Morgan and Chad. Nice 
to have them all out to church. 

Terry and Bercky Tipps and Zach- 

Larry and Vickey Nelson and child-
ren visited Elmer and Cathy Harrison 
and Chad and Brad in Wheeler 
Sunday afternoon. 

Bob and Mary Cornell visited David 
and Winnie Gilmer family Saturday 
night. 

Darren Rodenberg was a weekend 
visitor to Frank Hickman. 

Sue Reames and Dustin went to 
Amarillo to see Jeromey Reames at 
Boys Ranch Saturday. They ate dinner 
Sunday with Bob Ratliff family. 

We enjoyed having supper and 
playing 42 at the Dennis Thompson 
home Tuesday night. 

Laverty and Claude. Russell, and 
Caron and Ray and Velma Forbes. 

Laura and Amy Meadows spent 
from Friday fill Sunday afternoon with 
grandparents Roy and Lois Meadows. 
Other Sunday dinner guests were 
Gaye Hale and Sarah, David and 
Elizabeth and Charles and LaJo 
Crownover and Boyce, Jodie, Londa 
and Terri. Good to see Laura and Amy 
at church and the ballgame. 

Joe Woodward visited "Little Bro-
ther" Jimmy Abdo at Lubbock over 
the weekend and took him to see the 
S.M.U.-Texas game. Very large 
crowd but they managed to get 
tickets. 

ary from Amarillo were visitors to the 
Dick Irvine home and out to the games 
Saturday. 

Visitors for the weekend in the Ray 
Hudson home were Brady Hudson 
and Rodney and Cindy Sweet. 

Sorry to hear that Georgia Tipps 
and many others have had the flu. 

Sunday dinner guests at the home 
of J.P. and Martha Meek and Shawn 
were Ray and Pat Hudson and Cheryl 
and Brady, Rodney and Cindy Sweet, 
Mary Hudson and Chuck and Phoebe 
Hartline and Aaron and Tamera. Nice 
to have them all out to church. 

Sunday dinner guests at the Evelyn 
Meek home were Aaron and Claudetta 

TRACTORS 
1-1550 Oliver power drive on butane 
1-A John Deere 

HAY EQUIPMENT 
1-Heston 1014 hydra swing swather excellent 
condition 
1-Heston 5500 round baler excellent condition 

TOOL & IMPLEMENTS 
2-Oliver Superior drills 1610 
1-Krause chisel plow 3 pt 
1-John Deere 3 section spring tooth harrow 
1-6' John Deere Brush Beater 
1-9' grader blade 3 pt 
1-round bale mower 3 pt electric wrench 
1.10' tandem disc drag type 
1-16' stock taller all steel like new 
1.250 gallon butane tank 
34-round bales Alfalfa Hay (26 bales A-1) 

(806) 826.3352 cr 826-3123 

Burrell Oil & Gas Properties 

107 West Texas Street 
P.O. Box 534 
Wheeler. Texas 79096 

Office Phone 
806/826-3519 

A. W. BURRELL 
Res. 806/826-3211 
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Francis and Kerry Hickman for lunch. 
Later Cecil and Marsha and Frank and 
Lisa and Charlie and Edie Phillis 
visited. Peggy Thompson, Esther 
Brown and Jaclyn and Keith Ratliff 
visited Thursday. 

If you didn't get to Briscoe Saturday 
night for the Briscoe Boosters Pan-
cake supper and games. you missed a 
fun time. Two teams of 4-H and 
F.F.A. students from Seniors down to 
4th graders or less raced through a 
well-prepared obstacle course. Very 
close and interesting. There was a 
tricycle race for willing preschoolers 
and a hard fought game between 
Briscoe first and fourth graders 
coached by Carol Watson and Robert 
Hall and second and third graders 
coached by Kevin Ratliff and Shawn 
Everett. The Allison Outsiders in a 
close game. From Allison players 
were; Winston Rainey, Garland and 
Bevard Dukes, Lee and Franklin Lane, 
Bennie Boydston, Johnny Grayson, 
Jay Robertson, Bo Keys, Curtis 
Smith. 

clear and distinct voice for the game. 
Mr. and Mrs. B. A. Hyatt spent the 

w •ekend in Arkansas with Relatives. 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Robertson of 

Vernon, Texas visited Friday with 
Bessie Robertson. 

Lois Johnson of Borger visited 
Friday with Ida Farmer. 

Mr. and Mrs. R.C. Lewis of 
Shamrock visited with friends. 

Katie Glasscock of Shamrock visited 
with Mary Bledsoe. She and Mary 
used to teach together in the Sham-
rock schools. 

Aleine Holt ate supper Thursday 
night with her daughter Ruth Miles. 

We are glad to have Roberta Adams 
as a resident in our Home. We hope 
she will be happy here. 

Ludene Douthit of Briscoe visited 
with her mother Lelan Luttrell. 

Mrs. Laura Eubanks and Fannie 
Mae Bradstreet attended our services 
Sunday and visited friends. 

Mr. and Mrs. Claudie Brotherton 
visited Stella Fields and attended the 
Sunday afternoon services. 

Mr. Tom Britt visited with friends 
in the Home Monday afternoon. 

We welcome Nora Hyatt to our 
Home. We hope she will like being 
here. 

Mr. Frog 
By Ida Farmer 

Mr. Frog wanted a Bug, 
But it ran under the Rug. 
Oh, I'll eat a fish, 
No, no, it flopped out of the dish. 
So he saw a Fly, 
Oh, this I'll try. 
Mr. Fly did not stay, 
He flew away. 
Croak, Croak, said Mr. Frog, 
I'll just sit on this log. 
So, he just sat and sat 
and croaked and croaked and got fat. 

CARD OF THANKS 
We want to thank all of our friends, 

for the cards, prayers, calls, and 
delicious food that was brought to our 
home at the time of the loss of our 
loved one. We also want to Thank 
Louis Holland for his services and 
care. We want to express our 
appreciation for all the memorials and 
beautiful flowers, to Dr. Robert 
Galutia for his care and concern to the 
staff of Shamrock General Hospital, 
and the staff of Wheeler Care Center 
for the care she received as a resident. 

May Gods riches blessing be with 
all of you. 

The Family of Beatrice Clay 

Theatre 	From Page 1 

local talent will be held occasionally as 
well as professional concerts with 
groups like the Royalheirs and the 
Blackwood Brothers. 

Look for the "Grand Opening" of 
the Manna Theatre within the next 2 
to 4 weeks. 

Care Center 

Coniniento 
By Ida Farmer . 

Rena Weatherly spent a few days in 
Amarillo with her daughter Charlott 
Pond. 

Grace Pettit visited with friends 
Tuesday. 

Mildred Hamilton's daughter from 
Pampa visited Tuesday. 

Several have had colds and sore 
throats the last few days. Hope 
everyone will soon be o.k. again. 

We are glad that Mrs. Pittman was 
able to come home from the hospital. 

Thanks to Edna Waters for several 
pairs of mens pajamas. They will 
certainly be used. 

The members of the Methodist 
church comes on Wednesday night for 
a short devotional. We appreciate 
their coming. 

Several of the "Church of Christ" 
members came Thursday and did 
mending. We will miss sister Free as 
she helps with this project. Ladies we 
want to say "Thanks" and we 
appreciate your work. 

Ardie Martin visited in the home 
Friday. 

A reminder! Briscoe Ex-Student 
reunion will be Saturday July 27, 
1985. So plan your vacation to be with 
us. 

Sunday, February 3, at 2:30, Bris- 
✓ Cafetorium to plan the reunion 

and update addresses. Anyone who 
can come help will be appreciated and 
bring your addresses of ex-students or 
leave them at the post office with Lou 
Dean. 

Next Sunday, February 3, will be 
special singing at Gageby Church at 
6:30 p.m. Everyone invited. Ray and 
Pat Hudson will be in charge. 

Briscoe ballgames will be:Friday, 
Feb. 1, Samnorwood H.S. at Briscoe, 
7p.m. Tuesday, Feb. 5, Briscoe H.S. 
at Wheeler 7p.m. Friday, Feb. 8, 
Briscoe H.S. at Allison 7 p.m. 

Happy Birthday to Irene Zybach on 
February 5, Darrell Rodenberg on 
February 7, Jason Miller on February 
9. 

Happy Anniversary to Roy and Lois 
Meadows on Feb. 3, Willa and E. G. 

• Fillingim and William and Elton 
Fillingim on Feb. 9. 

Congratulations to Darren Hefley 
and Carol Watson for being chosen 
basketball King and Queen. The girls 
all looked so beautiful in their formals. 

The girls game with Kelton was 
very close and exciting, Requiring an 
overtime. The Kelton girls finally won 

+ 63-61. Kelton boys won 55-47 , a good 
- game. 

There will be a Jr. High Tourna-
ment at Miami Jan. 31, Feb. 1st and 
2nd. Briscoe will play in the tourney. 

Esther Brown and Jaclyn, Bea Ogle 
and Keith Ratliff went to Booker 
Friday and visited Debbie Brown and 
Bea had a Shaklee Party. Bea is now a 
dealer for Shaklee Products. 

I went by for a little visit with Elgia 
• and Mae Welch and to see their new 

house one day. They really have a nice 
house. So many handy closets and 
built-ins and all decorated so pretty 
with many pretty pictures and mo-
mentoes given by their children, 
grandchildren and friends. Mary Hud-. 
son had walked down to see Mae. Mae 
and Mary Hudson are two of the 
friskiest little ladies. Wish I could get 
around as well as they do. 

• We enjoyed having Stacey Phillis 
and Wendy Stamps from White Deer 
for the weekend. Willis and Stacey 
and Wendy also visited Willa and 
E.G. and saw the animals Saturday. 
The girls were thrilled over the rabbits 
Willa gave them. Other Sunday 
visitors at our house were Dan and 
Chris Fillingim and Lindsay and 

Aol-Eason Oil Company to Sonat 
Exploration Company,1-18-85,See In-
strument 
C/C PROBATE PROCEED-Oris Brun-
ell Climer,dec,1-21.85,Mineral Inter-
est in Sec 33 Blk 13 
DT-Petro-Hunt Corporation to Citi-
Bank,NA,12-21-84,See Instrument 
RDT-Security Pacific National Bank to 
Petro Lewis Oil and Natural Gas 
Income Program Limited Partnership 
1981-11,eta1,12-4-84, See Instrument 
ASSIGN-Panhandle Drilling Company 
to Jack Davis,etal,1-1-85,Pt Sec 71 
and Pt Sec 46 Blk 13 
ASSIGN-Panhandle Drilling Company 
to John H Adger,1-22-85,Pt Sec 97 Blk 
17 
D-Jackie Lee Johnson,etux to Ted 
Boedeker,etux,1-11-85,E1/2  S1/3 Blk 
45,Wheeler,Stanley 
DT-Ted Boedeker,etux to Security 
Federal Savings and Loan Association 
1-11-85. E1/2  S1 /3 Blk45 , Wheeler, Stan-
ley 
JANUARY 24,1985 
No Recording 
JANUARY 25,1985 
C/C PROBATE PROCEED-Katie 
Alice George,dec,1-24-85,Mineral In-
terest N1/2 1‘1 1/3  Sec 7 Blk RE 
OL-Southland Royalty Company to 
Exxon Corporation,eta1,10-2-81,SE1/4  
Sec 2 Certif 5/720 
RATIF OL-Southland Royalty Com-
pany to Exxon Corporation,10-8-84, 
Sec 2 Certif 5/720 
OL-Thomas M Britt,etal to Santa Fe 
Energy Co,11-15-84,Sec 6 Blk 5 B&B 
D-Nan Gilbert to John L Simpson,etux 
1-17-85,S50'N'/3&N25'Lot 3 Blk LVIII, 
Shamrock 
A OF JUDG-Rubie Christner to 
George Bond,etux,12-27-84 
D-Forbus E Blakemore.etal to Royce 
Cantrell Corporation,1-18-85,Lot 5, 
6 Blk 4, Shamrock, HSA 
DT-Royce Cantrell Corporation to 
Forbus E Blakemore,etal,l-18-85,Lots 
5,6 Blk 4, Shamrock,HSA 
RDT-Enertec Corporation to Elan 
Ltd,1-17-85,See Instrument 
ROL-Aikman Petroleum Inc,etal to 
Lester R Arnold,eta1,1-4-85,W1/2 W1/2  
Sec 3 Blk 2,B&B 
AOL-HNG Oil Company to Holden 

We want to thank the ladies for 
coming out and playing Bingo! I 
believe Ila Byers is an old "Pro" at 
calling out numbers. She has such a 

Energy Corporation,1-16-85,Sec 31 
Blk A-3 
AOL-Scandrill Inc to Nicor Explora-
tion Company,12-27-84,SE1/4  Sec 10 
Blk A-4 
LIS PENDENS-City of Wheeler to 
Elva Meek,eta1,1-25-85.5.16ac Sec 1, 
no block given 
DISTRICT CLERKS FILINGS FOR 
THE SAME WEEK 
#8540 Jeffery W Herd VS Texas 
Employers Insurance Association-
Compensation 
#8541 Alvin Oran Arganbright VS 
Sharon Kay Arganbright-Divorce 

ALCOHOLICS 
ANONYMOUS 
meets Thursday Nights 

at 8:00 P.M. 
Commissioner Courtroom 
Wheeler Co. Courthouse 

826-5236 

  

-.NEL 

ji

ARROW 
Water Well 

Service 
Windmill and submersible 
pump .saki • and service. 

Call anytithe: Jerry Koelzeir 

806/826-5906 
Wheelei, Texas- 

    

WHEELER 
PLUMBING 

204 South Main St. 

New Construction 

Remodel 

Repair 

Sewer Service 

Phone: 826-S907 
FREE ESTIMATES 

MAX McQUEEN 
P.O. Box 754 - Wheeler, Texas 

 

HAYDON CHIROPRACTIC CLINIC 

  

 

DR. L.W. HAYDON 
DR. MARK SHERROD 
28th St. at Perryton Parkway 

Mon.-Fri. 8:30 a.m.-5:30 p.m. 
Tues.-Thurs. 6:00 p.m.-8:00 p.m. 
Saturday 8:30 a.m.-12:00 Noon 

Pampa, Tx 	6E5-7261 

 

             

   

LEWALLEN 
INSURANCE AGENCY 

   

             

     

ALL-LINES  

    

             

        

114 W. Tex. St. 
826-5719 	Wheeler, Tx. 

  

  

845-2951 1st State Bk. Bldg. 
Mobeetie Tx. 

 

YOUR 
&wow AGENT 

Ipa,1111 	••••• 

   

         

             

Have your home .. . 

INSULATED 
- Free Estimate - 

Court 
Records 

UST OF INSTRUMENTS FILED IN 
WHEELER COUNTY CLERKS OFF-
ICE FOR THE WEEK OF JANUARY 
21 thru JANUARY 25, 1985 
JANUARY 21, 1985 
SECURITY NOTICE-Earl T Smith & 
Associates Inc,etal to Amarillo Na-
tional Bank,12-27-84, Interest in Sec 7 
Camp Co School,Secs 25,35,34 Blk 
M-1 & Sec 13 Blk RE 
DT-Earl T Smith to Amarillo National 
Bank,no date, See Instrument 
DT-Earl T Smith & Associates Inc to 
Amarillo National Bank,no date, See 
Instrument 
OL-MOnroe Northrop,etal to Panhan-
dle Drilling Company,12-10-84,SE1/4& 
NE'/. Sec 25 Blk 24 
ASSIGN OVERRID ROYALTY-Mur-
exco Petroleum Inc to Gerhard W Hill 
Jr,eta1,11-1-84, See Instrument 
D-Lawrence Lancaster,etux to David 
A Kreyling,etux,1-17-85,Lot 3 Blk 29, 
Wheeler 
DT-David A Kreyling,etux to Law-
rence Lancaster,etux,1-17-85,Lot 3 
Blk 29, Wheeler 
RDT-Forbus E Blakemore,etal to Ray 
Miller,etux,1-17-85,7.15ac Sec 64 Blk 
17 
DT-Donald B Lowrie,etux to Canadian 
Production Credit Association,1-4-85, 
Pt Sec 26 Blk-A4 
EXECUTRIX MD-Orin Brunell Climer 
to Glenda Rose,1-18-85,Mineral Inter-
est NE'/, Sec 33 Blk 13 
MD-Abraham Thomas,etux to Inter-
First Bank Fort Worth,NA Trustee,1-
14-85,1/32Min Int S1/2  Sec 81 Blk 13 
JANUARY 22, 1985 
OL-Johnny Velasquez.etux to A W 
Burell,12-20-84,Sec 16, Blk L,J M 
Lindsey 
D-Jow E Hayes Sr,etux to Zee 
White, etux,12-21-81,290 .4 ' x150', Alli-
son,ExcMins 
D-Zee White,etux to Hector Badillo,1-
22-85,290.4'150',Allison Exc Mins 
C/C WILL & ORDER-Elsie K Cain, 
dec,1-17-85 
MD-Allene A Fisk Trust to Patricia 
Culp Dallas,etal,1-21-85,5/24Int Each 
in 1/6Int E120acNE1/4  Sec 85 Blk A-5 
TRUST AGGREMENT-Elva L Will-
iams to Helen B Allemand,Trustee,1-
14-85,Mineral Interest Sec 24 BkOS2 
JANUARY 23, 1985 
EXT DT-W V Lister,etux to Canadian 
Production Credit Association,1-22-85 
See Instrument 
D-Dillie A Sanders to Charles E 
Sanders,etal, 1-14-85,101/651 Int Sec 
38 Blk 13 
AOL-C-N Ltd 5-80 to Parallel Petro-
leum Corporation,12-14.84, See In-
strument 

B.ILR. INSULATION 
845-2011 or 845-2221 
MOBEETIE. TEXAS 

L. & F. REPAIR 
ZENITH T.V.'s 	R.C.A. T.V.'s 

SATELLITE ANTENNA SYSTEMS 

FRANK E. COATES. 0...tram 

Charles Gatlin, Jr. 
Buried In Pampa 

Auction Sale 
Saturday, February 2, 1985 

10:30 a.m. 
W. A. FUNDERBURK, Owner 

LOCATION: 41/2  miles West of Wheeler then 2.2 miles South of Highway 152 
on county road. Signs will be posted 

  

P.O. Box 220 
	

PHONE 806/626-3241 

WHEELER. TEXAS 70096 	 110 W. OKLA. ST. 

  

  

  

  

       

Relax With 
FOOT REFLEXOLOGY 

* Helps Relax Tension 
* Improves Nerve & Blood Supply 
* Helps Nature To Normalize 

 

• 

       

     

Peggy L Dukes 

	

	 806.375-2544 
Allison, Texas 79003 

 

      

I will be at Deb's Country Curl 
every Friday - 826-3335 

 

           

Services for Charles M. Barney 
Gatlin Jr. were held at 2:00 P.M. at 
the First Baptist Church of Mobeetie 
with the Rev. Ralph Hovey and Rev. 
L.V. Grace, retired Methodist minis-
ter officiating. Masonic graveside 
rites were held at Fairview Cementary 
in Pampa by Mobeetie Masonic Lodge 
972. Arrangements were by Car-
michael Whatley Funeral Home. 

Barney was born in Gray County 
and was a lifelong resident there. He 
was a member of the First Baptist 
Church of Mobeetie and the Masonic 
Lodge #972. He married Leta Mae 
Herd in Pampa in 1937. 

Survivors include his wife, a daugh-
ter Ann Walser of Canadian, two sons 
Charles R. of Mobeetie and Dan of 
Briscoe. Two brothers; Floyd of 
Pampa and Carl of College Station, a 
sister. Carrie Russell of Spearman and 
seven grandchildren. He also leaves 
many friends and neighbors who will 
miss him very much. 

The Pallbearers were:Bill Gething, 
Paul Hathaway, Randy McCurley, J. 
Boyd Smith, J.W. Seitz. Bud Howard, 

All Masonic Lodge Members were 
Honorary Pallbearers. 

• 	 
GATELEY ELECTRIC 

1-cutting torch Hoses and tips 
1-8 ton chain hoist new 
1-fence charger 
1-Lincoln 225 welder on trailer with leads 
1-6' oneway 
1-lot steel post & insulators 
1-cement mixer on wheels 
1-21/2  ton come-along 
1-8' stock tank 
1-belt splicing machine 
1-trailer with axle 2 new tires electric brakes 
1-rotor tiller 
1-12" tank float 
1.11/2  hp drill 
1-1/2  inch drill 
1.3/4 inch drill 
1-1 3/8 electric motor 
1-Forge 
1-antique Pole drill 
;-pick up 1974 G MC electric wrench 

Chris Gateley 

Wheeler, Texas 

"No Job Too Small" 

• New Construction 
• Remodeling Service 

• Residential 
• Lighting Fixtures 

CARD OF THANKS 
To all our friends who have sharec 

our sorrow in so many ways since the 
death of our beloved Barney. Wit) 
heartfelt thanks to Brother Ralph 
Hovey we love you for being with us a 
all times and the comforting words a 
the funeral. Also to our longtime 
friend Reverand L.V. Grace. For the 
prayers, the beautiful flowers, mem 
orials,food brought to our home and te 
the church and to those who served, to 
the Mobeetie Masonic Lodge for their 

our dea 
We wil 

A 

CONSIGNMENTS WILL BE ACCEPTED CONTACT THE AUCTIONL3S 

J&O AUCTIONEERS graveside service and to 
neighbor Audrey Seitz. 
remember and love you all. 

God Bless You, 
Charley (Barney) Gatlin Family 

Col. Larry Overcast 
256.3633 

Col. Jerry Bob Jernigan 	 Shamrock, Texas 
256-2055 	 License No. TXS-015-0608 
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767 

$717 

U.S.D.A. CHOICE BEEF 

STEW MEAT 

SLICED 

BEEF LIVER 

LIPTON 

INSTANT 
TEA 

3 OZ JAR 

SCHEI BERS 

CHEESE SLI CES 

TEIAKING HENS 

U.S.D.A. CHOICE BEEF BONELESS 

ARM ROAST 

LEAN 80°J LEAN 

GROUND BEEF 

12-OZ PKG.  

POUND 

POUND 

POUND 

$ 7  77 
POUND 

POUND 67C  

I 

U.S.D.A. CHOICE 

BEEF CENTER CUT BONELESS 

CHUCK ROAST $ 

POUND 

U S.D.A. CHOICE BEEF LEAN & TENDER 

9V CUBE STEAKS POUND $ 7 97  

HILLSHIRE FARMS BEEF OR 

 

670  SMOKED SAUSAGE POUND $197  

$ 7 27 

DOUBLE 
COUPONS 
Wednesdays 

ONLY 
EXCLUDING 

CIGARETTES & SALE ITEMS 

PURINA 

Puppy Chow 	89° 
BUTTERCRUST 

Cinnamon Twist 98° 
OCEAN SPRAY CRANBERRY 

16 OZ 970  
Sauce 	CAN 

SUGAR SUBSTITUTE 

Sweet & Lowloo.couNTs7 27  

PRICES..EFFECTIVE 
Thur., Fri., Sai., Sun., Mon., Tues., Wed, 

January 31 thru Feb, 6 
WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT ,  

U.S.D.A. CHOICE BEEF VAC-PAC PACKER TRIMMED 

BONELESS BRISKETS 	POUND 

KRAFT MINIATURE 

MARSHMALLOWS 
2 101/2.0z 970 

MEAD'S HONEY 

KRUSHED 

WHEAT SANDWICH 

BREAD 

WOLF BRAND 

CHILI 	19-07 CAN $ 7 77  
PRINCELLE CUT 

YAMS 2 CANZ  97° 
ADOLPH 

TENDERIZER 312-07-87°  

LYSOL BASIN. TUB & TILE 

CLEANER 
VEGETABLE SPRAY COATING 

PAM 
SCHILLING MUSHROOM 	 .75 

GRAVY MIX3p0A,s07c 

$7 17 
17-07 

4-0Z $7 27  

7CAN 9 00 
TV SWEETMILK OR BUTTER MILK 

BISCUITS 

10 OZ PKG.  
WITH CHEESE 

87' BROCCOLI 
BIRDSEYE 

9-07 PKG. 77' PIE SHELLS 
MORNING STAR BREAKFAST 

PET Raz 

PATTIES 80Z PKG.  
$717 

DAIRY 

PILLSBURY WITH ICING 

CINNAMON ROLLS 97°  
KRAFT 	 ONE 	 A.  

TOUCH OF BUTTER Pr 57`.• 

FROZEN. FOOD 

PRODUCE 
-er 

c

°  BANANAS 
\ ,\\ 	POUND 

28' 
CALIFORNIA SUNKIST NAVEL 

ORANGES 

POUND 381 

GREEN 

ONIONS 

BUNCH 790  
WASHINGTON RED ELIGIGUS 

APPLES 

3111 

1'2-POUND LOAF 

DR. PEPPER 
6-PACK 

$139 

'1111111111111111111111110  



wed-wafer 
fia 	Mrs. Joe Flowers 

lectio 

A 

410 South Mai 

j 0 
111

E  
Mks: 806,826-S524 S 

bc. 

WHEELER EtAS 790f* 

All 
WINTER 
Merchandise 

40-50% 
Off 

	4' S S 	5 S 	5 S 5 S 5 5 5 5 S 5 S 5 5 S 5 5 S S S 5 S 55S• 5 

The 
Thomas 
Agency 

110 East Texas 
(Wheeler Times Bldg.) 

Wheeler, Texas 

Delbert Thomas 
Office: 826-5529 
Home: 826-5792 

ottil RE Opt*  
IVE SATELLITE 

CONCERTS •4:1,0  
0 

• 

When the Rogue Theatre ceased operating last 
November, an offer was made to buy it. All of the 
necessary legal papers have been completed to 
consummate the deal, as of Tuesday (January 
29). We are now able to announce to the 
community that we will open the theatre in the 
next 15 to 30 days. 

We are very excited about the avenues open to 
us in using the facilities for various things that we 
believe will be a boost to the community and an 
opportunity for families to have something 
beneficial available. 

First of all, the name is changed. The theatre 
will no longer be called "The Rogue". We have 
chosen to call the- theatre, "The Manna". We 
have purchased a special projector for use with 
the big screen. Also, we have arranged to install 
a satellite dish at the theatre in order *hat we may 
preent "Live" concert with uch people as Pat 
Boone, Phil Driscoll, Glenn Campbell, and 
Johnny Cash. In addition;  community gospel 
singings will be held periodically. If you sing or 
play an instrument or know someone who does, 
let us know so you or they can be scheduled into 
one of these singings. 

Besides all of these things, you will be able to 
see some outstanding Christain movies as well as 
fun "G" rated Walt Disney type movies. One 
movie that is scheduled in the near future is Billy 
Graham's newet release from World Wide 
Pictures, 'The Prodigal". 

We are very happy and greatly thrilled to 
present all of this to this community, and we hope 
you will enjoy it and take advantage of the 
entertainment coming your way at "The 
Manna". , 
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up residence at the Wheeler Care 
Center. Her daughter Wanda Tower 
and her husband trom Oklahoma City 
have been here to get her settled in 
her new home. 

Betty McNeil and Esther Caswell 
visited in Muleshoe last week. Betty 
visited with friends and Esther visited 
with Marie and Bill Darnell. The 
Darnells are former Wheeler citizens. 

Juanita Levitt, who broke bones in a 

ere 	...711 ere 

fall on the ice lact month. is still far 
from well. She is in an Amarillo 
Nursing Home, and will probalby be 
there until she is able to care for 
herself. 

Mrs. Eunice Treadwell is never 
without company for long. She has a 
big family and they love to come 
home. Last week her daughter, Lor-
ene Jenkins of Wellington and Loretta 
Elliott of Pampa. and a son, Dendall of 

Pampa visited with her. And there are 
always children, grand, great and 
great great. She loves them and they 
inclined to want to stay with her. 

Ruth Taylor made a quick business 
trip to Pampa Wednesday morning. 

CORRECTION: 
Chester and Vivian Jones attended 

the Southwest Liturgical Conference 
in San Angelo, Jan. 21-24. Others 
attending from St. Patrick's Catholic 
Church in Shamrock were:Cathy Dan-
ner of McLean, Juanita Hernandez of 
Samnorwood, and Ann Roach and 
Father Paul Sauerbier of Shamrock. 

4 	 By Laura Guthrie 
January 29! Do you realize that one 

month of the New Year is gone? It just 
doesn't seem possible that it is time to 
turn a page on the Calendar. I hear via 
the TV that another Frigid spell is on 
the way. Reminds me cf last February 
when I had no running water in the 
house for over two weeks. Do hope 
that incident is not repeated. 
Granddaughter Melinda and friend 

Dana of Canadian dropped in for a 
little while Tuesday night. Dana's 
mother was having a Tupperware 
party in this vicinity, so the girls rode 
over with her. 

Glady Pannell went to Pampa on 
Monday for eye surgery. Her daugh-
ters, Dorothy Calcote of Kelton and 
Imogene Murry of Wellington were 

s  with her. Gladys came through fine, 
and is at home doing well. She will 
check with her doctor on Wednesday. 

Mrs. Nora Hyatt who has been in 
the hospital for some time has taken 

camera are Ora Lee Underwood and 
Bea Smotherman. On the far side of 
the table, left to right, are Essie 
Finsterwald, Melanie Reed and Ann 
Free. Hattie Lee Smith was missed in 
the picture. We want to thank the 
Auxilary for the machine, and also the 
women who do the sewing. 

'Children's Month At 
First Baptist Church 

CARE CENTER RECEIVES 
NEW SEWING MACHINE 

Wheller Care Center Auxilary has 
purchased a new sewing machine for 
use at the Care Center. We certainly 
needed one. Pictured here are some 
women from the Church of Christ who 
or mending and alterations for the 
residents. With their backs to the 

Rained all night and then snowed. 
Sort of bluffed a lot of the church folks 
out of coming. Forecast says warmer 
each day til Friday and then the 
bottom will fall out again. We'll see. 

Eb Atkinson was elected to our 
school board. They have small child-
ren in school. I was amazed when I 
read all the Roger Mills and Beckham 
school election results. Anywhere 
from about third to a half of the 
patrons voted against the levies in 
each school. There weren't any 
special deals — just the necessary 
ones to keep the schools open. Maybe 
folks didn't realize what they were 
voting for. We do need schools even if 
Johnny is having a hard time learning 
to read. 

Mr. and Mrs. Micky Alexander and 
family of Sayre were out to spend the 
weekend with Edith Alexander. Sun-
day afternoon, Edith and Imogene 
Pickering went to Hollis to see Winnie 
and the Harley Locklears. 

Alvanita North was out to see us 
Tuesday. 

We took in Elk Saturday. Ran into 
Esther Hill and Ruth Taylor of 
Wheeler at K-Mart. Had a nice visit. 
Esther said Harold wasn't doing so 
well. Ruth told us the Glen Waldos 
now live in Wheeler. 

Stopped in the hospital to see 
Lawrence Perkins and Mr. and Mrs. 
Roy Butler who are keeping him 
company. Found Homer Ray of Erick 
was also a patient . He was just back 
from x-ray. We talked to Lena. 

Our cousin Domer Reed is still a 
patient at St. Anthony's in Amarillo. 

We all had a wonderful time at the 
Hodges Nursing home birhtday party. 
Our friend Mabel Lucas was having a 

` February has been designated 
"Children's Month" at the First 
Baptist Church of Wheeler. There are 
many special days and events set. 
There will be "Parent-Baby Dedica-
tion Day". 'I'm Something Special" 
day, fellowships and parties. 

One of the more important ongoing 
programs of the Children's ministry of 
the church is Sunday School. The 
Sunday morning Bible study time 
begins at 9:45 A.M. There is a class 
for any age youngster. The classes 
and teachers are as follows:Crib 
babies-Lona Williams, Bernice Far-
mer; Toddlers-Jackie Cummongs. 
Kim Flanagan; 2 Yr. Olds-JoAnn 
Helton, Cathy Dunn; 3 Yr. olds-Judy 
Morgan, Janie Taylor, Cathy Mont-
gomery; 4&5 yr. olds-Donna Velas-
quez, Melanie Simmons, Delores 
Simmons, Sonya Hill; 1st and 2nd 
grade-Wynema Stewart, Nelda Miley; 
3rd grade-Ann Ellison, Patsy Smith; 
4th grade-Joyce Ford, Donna Moore; 
5th grade-Claudia Marion-Gwen 
McCain. 

You and your family are invited to 
attend Sunday School and the other 
activities of the church. There is also 
transportation available. Please con- 

S tact the church office at 6-522.3 if you 
should need transportation. 

ton and Fanny Fourier. 
I enjoy Patrick Buchanan . He was 

telling about a book by Charles 
Murray — "Losing Ground." Mr. and 
Murray thinks all our troubles started 
about 20 years ago with the Great 
Society. His solution is tak .! every able 
bodied person of work age and cut 
them off all government benefits. 
That would solve the deficit etc. 
People would be dependent on them-
selves. No more refusing to work for 
the minimum wage because welfare 
paid more. People that worked for a 
living would be to tired to be mean. 

The trouble with this idea is — if 
they threw the 10 or 15 million on 
welfare on the labor market plus the 
10 or 15 million case workers who 
work at giving the benefits to the 
qualifying recipients. where would 
they all find jobs? There is already an 
8 or 10% unemployed rate. 

Mr. and Mrs. Randy Stolls have 
purchased the Dale Hagerman house 
are moved in. 

B.V. and Becky Brady nearly had 
their home burn when the hot water 
heater took off in its own. We are 
happy it happened in daytime and no 
one is injured. The house and furnish-
ings were badly damaged. 

We took old "five string" and went 
up to the Johnny Reeds Friday night. 
Other guests were the Douglas 
Reeves family of Wheeler, Mr. and 
Mrs. Tommy Puryear and children, 
Bertha Coffey, Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Jones, Rosalie Keelin, Rhonda Blan-
chard and son, Carls Lofin. Carl had a 
violin he had just made. Fae had been 
in the hospital and wasn't able to be 
there. We had a lot of fun. 

Mr. and Mrs. Melvin Smith and 
family of Pampa visited over the 
weekend with the Lawson Smiths. 
Lawson is improved. 

Ina Brown's injured eagle died, I 
was sorry to hear. They are finding a 
lot of dead wildlife presumably from 
pollution. Our turn is next. In another 
100 years, only those who have 
managed to mutate will be able to 
survive all that is going in the air and 
water. The main concern now is loss 
of water and pollution of what we 
have. Some say bring it in from the 
East but would cost billions of dollars. 

birthday. Believe she was 92. She 
used to hold hands with my daddy 
quite a few years ago. I went to school 
with her son Elmer Lee. 

Kitchen Band members were Joe, 
Bertha, Billy and Basil Doss, Betty 
Brothers, Agnes Francis Rosetta 
Gephart, Troy and Velma Gibson, 
Richardson Crawford, Roy Swagger, 
Jack Criswell, Lela Spencer, Mr. and 
Mrs. Clarence Sanders. 

I enjoyed a visit with Larue Walker. 
She sort of claims Sweetwater since 
she has a son and family over on the 
cast side. 

The Kitchen Band schedule for 
February is 1st Tuesday, 5th at Erick 
Home, 2 Monday, 11th Town Hall 
Estates. 3rd Monday, 18th Hodges 
Nursing home, 4th Tuesday, 26th 
Hensley home. These dates are 
dependent on the weather. It is a far 
piece and, sad to say, we are getting 
old too. 

Clarence and Althea Sanders visit-
ed Tuesday afternoon with Snooks 
Jaggers. 

Little George Hornick, one of the 
children injured in that terrible wreck 
west of Erick (2 were killed) is in the 
Children's Memorial Hospital at 
OKC. Be nice to remember him with a 
card. 

We nearly had a castastrophe at our 
house last week. I dumped a sack of 
beans, 4 cups in a 5 quart pot to soak. 
Next morning, those beans were 
standing up 2 inches above the top of 
the pot. Another hour and they would 
have been out walking. Had to cook 
them in two pots. Didn't have one that 
was big enough. Froze 5 quarts and 
had enough to eat for a week. 

Blanche Kuykendall and Royice 
Roberts went to OKC last Thursday to 
meet the Iry Godwins from Fullerton, 
Ca. While there they went up to see 
C.B. Crook. He was asleep and no one 
with him at the time, so they left a 
note. He is in Room 452 at the 
Presbyterian Hospital. 

Had a nice call from Netty Freeman 
of Manteca, Ca today. She's former 
resident and one of my readers. Her 
sister married one of my cousins long 
ago. Howard and Nell Thompson. 
Both gone now. She's well and happy. 
Particularly asked about Nell Hamil- 

S 
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PUBLIC NOTICE 
In accordance with the Public Utility Regulatory Act and the 

Rules of the Public Utility Commission of Texas, AT&T Com-
munications of the Southwest, Inc. (AT&T Communications) gives 
notice to all of its Texas customers that a new procedure for long 
distance billing was made effective on an interim basis on August 
6, 1984 in Docket No. 5800. 

The procedure referred to is "Rate Period Specific Billing" and it 
applies to all message telephone service (AT&T Long Distance 
calls) including non-REACH OUT Texas calls within the State of 
Texas. This new procedure effects all AT&T, Long Distance 
customers. All intraLATA long distance calls and all interstate long 
distance calls are currently billed using this procedure. 

Under this procedure, customers are billed a specific charge for 
long distance calls according to the rate or rates in effect 
throughout the time of each call. If a call begins in one rate period 
and extends into a different rate period, the customer will be charg-
ed whatever rate is in effect for each portion of the call. 

For example, if a customer places a call at 4:58 p.m. on a week-
day and talks for ten minutes, the first two minutes of the call 
would be charged at the full weekday rate which extends from 8:00 
a.m. to 5:00 p.m. The remaining eight minutes of the call would be 
billed at the evening rate which extends from 5:00 p.m. to 11:00 p.m. 
and includes a 25% discount. If Rate Period Specific Billing were 
not in effect, the entire call would have been billed at the higher day 
rate. Calls which extend from the evening rate period (25% dis-
count) to the night and weekend rate period (40% discount) or from 
the night and weekend rate period (40% discount) to the day rate 
period (no discount) would also be billed according to the actual 
minutes of use during each rate period. 

AT&T Communications anticipates a minimal increase of ap• 
proximately .02% in its revenues or approximately $250,000 an-
nually. 

A complete copy of the "Rate Period Specific Billing" tariff is on 
file with the Texas Public Utility Commission. 

Persons who wish to intervene or otherwise participate in these 
proceedings should notify the Commission as soon as possible. A 
request to intervene or participate or for further information should 
be mailed to the Public Utility Commission of Texas. 7800 Shoal 
Creek Boulevard, Suite 400N, Austin. Texas 78757. Further informa-
tion also may be obtained by calling the Public Utility Commission 
Consumer Affairs Division at (512) 458.0223 or (512) 458-0227 y r 

(512) 458-0221 teletypewriter for the deaf 

.!••••11. 

AT&T 
Communications 
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SHURFINE WH. KERNEL OR CR. STYLE 

GOLD CORN 
17 OZ11 

SHURFINE TOMATO 

CATSUP 

L
32 OZ. 

 B 
. 11111C  

sW; 

AT PARTICIPATING STORES ONLY 
SHEFFIELD FINE CHINA 

DINNER PLATE 
C 

ONLY 
WITH 53.00 PURCHASE 

PURE GRANULATED X148 SHURFRESH QUALITY 
HICKORY SMOKED 

SLICED 
BACON 1 LB. 

PKG. 
BONELESS FULLY COOKED 

93% FAT FREE HALF OR WHOLE 
.n 	SHURFRESH SLICED 

85` BOLOGNA 	 68c 
68c 

$ el re  SHURFRESH SLICED 

1 ' P & P LOAF 	 6 OZ. 
PKG. 68c 

,.. 38  SHURFRESH ASSORTED WAFER THIN 

' I 	SMOKED MEATS . 	38c 

SHURFRESH ALL MEAT 
6 OZ. FRANKS 	  'PKG. 

SHURFRESH ALL MEAT 

BOLOGNA 	  'PKG. 

PORK SAUSAGE 	 ROLL 

COOKED HAM 	 6 OZ. 
PKG. 

PKG. 

rmii HAMS 
$ 1 98 

SHURFRESH SLICED 

98c SALAMI 6 OZ. 
PKG. 

SHURFRESH WHOLE HOG REGULAR OR HOT 

SHURFRESH SLICED 

KG. 

19 	 ALL PURPOSE RUSSET 

OTATOES r 

CALIFORNIA MINEOLA ne 	ALL GRINDS 

I COFFEE 
ANGERINES T 

39c 10 LB. 
BAG 

CENTRAL AMERICAN GOLDEN 

9`  BANANAS 	 LB 29c 
LONG GREEN SLICERS 

LB 2 
LB 1 

CUCUMBERS 
WASHINGTON EXTRA FANCY RED DELICIOUS 

9c APPLES 	 LB 49c 
FRESH SWEET 

YELLOW ONIONS SHURFINE COFFEE 

CREAMER SHURFINE 
DVLS. ED/ WHT/ TEL. SHURFINE SALTINE 

CRACKERS
S 	

fr; 

216 OZ 1 00 

11 02.9 
JAR   

VEGETABLE OIL 
48 OZ. $ 1 99  

BTL. 

CAKE MIXES 
18 1/4  OZ.69C  

BOX BOX 

SHURFINE EVAPORATED 

MILK 

-411  ) &AO 	 BA

SHURFiNE HALVED 

RTLETT PEARS 
SHURFINE SMOOTH OR CRUNCHY 

$139 69c PEANUT BUTTER CAN 
18 OZ 

JAR 
SHURFINE SHURFINE FANCY SHURFINE WHITE 2.PLY 

99c 
99c 
$ 100 
$169 

$169 89c 
sir 
loo 
$100 
spo 

32 OZ 
BTL. 

8 ROLL 
PKG 

46 OZ 
CAN WAFFLE SYRUP 

SHURFINE FRESH PACK KOSHER/ PL/ POLISH 

DILL PICKLES   'JAR 
  

SHURFINE SALAD 

MUSTARD 	2 16 OZ 
JAR 

COOKIES 	 1902  PKG 
SHURFINE SHORT STOP OR BUTTER CRISP 

COOKIES 	 PKG 89` 
$ 100 

TOMATO JUICE BATH TISSUE 
SHURFINE 

PORK & BEANS 3 
SHURFINE DARK RED 

KIDNEY BEANS 	3 
SHURFINE CUT 

GREEN BEANS 	3 
SHURFINE SLICED 

BEETS 	3 
SHURFINE GREEN LEAFY 

SPINACH 	.2 
SHURFINE EARLY HARVEST 

SWEET PEAS 	2 
SHURFINE WHOLE PEELED 

TOMATOES 	2 
SHURFINE 

TOMATO SAUCE 5 

SHURFINE TALL KITCHEN 
15 CI 99`PRO 	if 

16 OZ PLATIC BAGS CANS 
SHURFINE LIQUID LAUNDRY $199 

$149 

IS OZ 
CANS 

64 OZ 
Bit DETERGENT 

SHURFINE CHIPS SUPREME SHURFINE SHEET FABRIC 
16 OZ 40 CT 

PKG SOFTENER 	 CANS 

SHURFINE FREE RUNNING OR IODIZED 

29c 
$ 100 
s 1  99 

16 OZ 26 OZ 
BOX SALT 	 CANS SHURFINE 

WATER OR OIL PACK 5 OZ 
SHURFINE ASSORTED 

1 
CANS 89c BAGGED CANDIES 2 BAGS 

17 	
SHURFINE GROUND 

CAN
OZ

S 89c BLACK PEPPER 	4CAN 
OZ 

SHURFINE RATION 4 15 00 
CANS DOG FOOD 

LIGHT 
CHUNK TUNA 

SHURFINE 

79c 
$289 
919 

TEA BAGS 	100 CT 
BOx 

SHURFINE SHURFINE WATER SOFTENER 

89c 
69c 

Sac 
7 PELLETS 

SHURFINE 

PINTO BEANS 
PANCAKE MIX 	32 OZ 

BOX 
16 OZ. 40 LB 

BAG CANS 
SHURFINE FRUIT sioo 4 LB 

BAG COCKTAIL CAN 
16 OZ 8 OZ.  

CANS 
SHURFINE WHOLE 

C VA 7 	SWEET PICKLES 
99c SHURFINE FROZEN SLICED 

STRAWBERRIES OZ  
CAN 

9 39 
SHURFINE FROZEN MIXED VEGE. OR 

DA
07

C 	 0 CUT CORN 	2 10
PKG0S 

SHURFINE 20 OZ STEW VEGE. OR 16 OZ. VEGE. 

59c 
$500 

SHURFINE GRAPE SHURFINE HIV;SLI YELLOW CLING 	 69 PEACHES 	 16 OZ. 
CAN 99c 

69c 
59c 
99c 
99c 
sr 

16 OZ. 
JAR JAM OR JELLY 18 OZ.  

JAR === SHURFRESH 
9v, OZ. CINNAMON ROLLS CAN 

SHURFRESH INDI WRPPD SLI. AMERICAN SHURFINE FROZEN BRUSSEL SPROUTS OR 
SHURFRESH HALFMOON 

CHEDDAR 99C 
CHEESE VI 

12 OZ BROCCOLI SPEARS 10 12  CHEESE FOOD KG. 
SHURFINE FROZEN 

,200 ORANGE JUICE CAN 
SHURFINE FROZEN WHIPPED SHURFRESH QUARTERED 

2 1 LB 
PEGS 

2 1200 
CANS 

99c SOUP MIX 	 PRG 
8 OZ 
BOWL 

GAL 
RND 
CTN .  

TOPPING MARGARINE 
SHURFINE FROZEN CRINKLE CUT 

POTATOES  	2 LB 
PKG 

AsHBuRN ASSORTED FLAVORS 

89c ICE CREAM 	2 
SHURFRESH TEXAS STYLE REG/ (Mum 

BISCUITS  	 

dirAFFILI
CODSAINC 

TED We're  proud to give you more! 
WE ACCEPT FOOD STAMPS 

WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT QUANTITIES 

COKES 
or Seven-Up 

Six Pack 	
39

.  Cans 	
T 

12 oz  

PRICES EFFECTIVE 
JAN. 27-FEB. 9, 1985 

T F H Thrift' 
McSurer 

MS 


	Page 1
	Page 2
	Page 3
	Page 4
	Page 5
	Page 6
	Page 7
	Page 8

