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Even though the tv weather 
forecasters had said something 
about more weather on the way, 
the norther which hit Winters 
about 4:30 Wednesday morning 
took u lot of us by surprise. At 
the time the high winds hit, the 
temperature was at 40 de- 
gree.s—by 8 a. m., the mercury 
had slipped to 25, and fine snow 
and mi.st blew in spasms all 
Wednesday morning.

This has been an unusual win­
ter for North Runnels County; 
seems that no one hereabouts 
can remember when the coun­
try has ever been as wet as it is 
right now, with all fields wet 
and water-filled terraces the 
common thing.

Wednesday’s norther was on 
the 50th anniversary of another 
norther and storm, according to 
at least two Winters citizens.

February 21! It was on Feb. 
21, 1918. say Mrs. T. V. Jenn­
ings and Fred Young, that this 
area was hit by a real old blue 
norther; plenty of snow, mixed 
with blowing sand; a vicious 
storm. Fred was in school at 
the time the storm hit, he says. 
His class had been invited down 
to Mrs. Jenning’s first grade 
room to see a George Washing­
ton’s birthday performance. 
When the blue norther hit, day 
became as night, with sand and 
snow covering the sun, and the 
temperature skidding.

Fred says that big drifts or 
snow mixed with sand piled up 
around the countryside to the 
top of the fences. He was living 
in the Franklin community at 
the time, and as the snow-sand 
drifts covcr<-d a fence he watch­
ed a big Percheron mare walk 
ovi-r a fence as if it wasn’t 
there—there was so much sand 
mixed with the snow the animal 
found sure footing. It got so 
cold during that spell, he said, 
the block of a Chevrolet the 
Young kids drove to school 
burst.

Marvin Onken lives south of 
town about five miles. He drives 
in to Winters every day to his 
business, and reportedly makes 
several trips daily back out 
home. The road he travels to 
and from home is US 83, now 
being rebuilt. The wet weather 

(Continued on page 8)

CHURCH OF CHRIST FELLOWSHIP BUILDING

Fellowship Building Open 
House Sunday Afternoon

Cozby Resigns 
As Vice President 
O f Winters Bank

The board of directors of The 
Winters State Bank Tuesday 
night accepted the resignation 
of Paul Cozby, who has been 
vice president of the bank for 
about three years.

No announcement was made 
by the board regarding appoint­
ment of a successor.

Cozby has been with The 
Winters State Bank since Jan­
uary 25, 1965. He has made no 
announcement of his future 
plans.

Biizzardettes Hit 
Anson, Now To 
Meet Hamlin

The Winters Biizzardettes de­
feated Anson 50-45 in the first 
game of playoffs to determine 
the district representative in bi- 
district play. The game was 
played in McMurry Indian gym 
Tuesday night before a near 
capacity crowd.

The victory moves the Bliz 
zardettes into the final play-off 
round against Hamlin. Thr 
game will he olayed in Abilene 
Friday at 7:30 at Cooper High 
School gvmnasium in Abilene

In moving to a must victory 
the Biizzardettes dominated the 
game from the opening whistle 
Jumping to an early lead they 
led at halftime 28-19. The lead 
was stretched to 13 points in 
the third quarter with the Bliz 
zardettes ending the frame 
leading by 9. A cold four 
minuses in the fourth quarter 
by Winters saw Anson move 
within four points. Clutch shoot­
ing by Dora Snell. Eileen Fau- 
bion from the field and Carla 
Walker from the fnul line sent 
the Biizzardettes home with the 
win.

Scoring for the Biizzardettes 
were E'leen Fauhion with 20 
pomfs. Carla Walker with 18 
and Dora Snell with 12. Fine 
defensive work was turned In 
by guards Mary Lynn Pritch­
ard. Babs Tatum, and Judy Mc­
Neill. . ^

The Main Street Church of 
Christ in Winters has completed 
construction of a fellowship 
building at 108 East Pierce 
Street, just east of the main 
church building, and will hold 
open house activities there Sun­
day. February 25. from 2 to 5 
p. m.

The building, containing 2340 
square feet, was constructed at 
a cost of $17,000. C. W. Wade 
of Winters was the contractor.

Glenn Gray is mini.ster of the 
Main Street Church of Christ.

The new fellowship building is 
designed for a variety of uses 
such as dinners, receptions. 
Bible classes, and special meet­

ings. Activities which are sched­
uled on a regular basis are a 
Men’s Sunday morning Bible 
class, Tuesday morning Ladies’ 
Bible class, and Sunday evening 
Training class for the young 
people.

Also included in the facility is 
a bedroom and bath to accom­
modate visiting preachers or 
others who might be working 
with the congregation.

Other activities planned by 
the church for Sunday include 
an area-wide Fourth Sunday 
Singing, when the Winters con­
gregation will be host. The sing­
ing is scheduled for 3 to 4 p. m.

The public is invited.

Winters Future Farmer Chapter Joins 
In Celebrating National F . F . A . Week

Vocational agriculture stu­
dents in Winters High School 
ioin Future Farmer« of Ameri­
ca members throughout the na­
tion in activities to focus atten­
tion on the importance of agri­
culture during National FFA 
Week, February 17-24.

•’Challenging Youth In Agri­
culture” is this year’s FFA 
Week theme. The message that 
these young agriculturists are 
’rying to impart to the nation 
is simple. They seek to inform 
*he public of the importance of 
the agricultural industry to 
America and to the world, the 
value of gm>d citizenship de­
velopment. and the role of Fu­
ture Farmers of America in 
helping meet the challenges in 
world food production that faces 
America today.

’’Because of the many pre­
dictions of world hunger in the 
future, many people have 
stopped listening,” said Jimmy 
Smith, vocational agriculture 
teacher and FFA advisor in the 
Winters school. “Now suddenly, 
the future is here! For the past 
seven years, our world has not 
been able to grow as much food 
as it has eaten. And, finally the 
bottomless U. S. surpluse.s have 
melted away.”

’’Let us also point out,” he 
added, ’’that it is estimated 
that the world as a whole will 
need 50 percent more food just 
two decades from now. Meeting 
these challenges will be in the 
hands of young agriculturists 
being trained and developed in

such organizations ns the FFA.”
Membership in the FFA is 

made up of students of voca­
tional agriculture in hi.gh school. 
The org.snization’s activities are 
designed to help develop rural 
leadership and good citizenship 
and to stimulate the students to 
better achievement in their 
study and work toward success­
ful establishment in farming 
and other agricultural occupa­
tions.

The Winters FFA Chapter has 
41 members. Officers are: Ran­
dy Sneed, president: Jim  Mor­
row, vice president; Johnny 
Pritchard. secretary: David
Carrol, treasurer; Gary Antil- 
ley, sentinel; and Dennis Mc- 
Beth, reporter.

The national FFA organiza­
tion has approximately 450 000 
members, with 9.000 local chap­
ters in the 50 states and Puerto 
Rico. The organization is in its 
39fh year in Texas, with over 
46.000 members in 968 high 
schools in Texas. The Winters 
chapter holds the No. 1 Texas 
charter.

The week of George Washing­
ton’s birthday is chosen each 
year for the observance of Na­
tional FFA Week. Although 
usually recognized as a Revolu­
tionary War general and our 
first President, Washington’s 
first love was the farm. He was 
one of the first in the nation to 
practice contour planting, crop 
rotation, fertilization, and other 
soil conservation and improve­
ment methods.

Winters People 
Injured in Crash 
Saturday Night

Mr. and Mrs. Richard Puckett 
and Weldon Clark were injured 
in a two-car collision about two 
miles west of Winters along FM 
53 at 6:45 p. m. Saturday.

Clark was taken to Winters 
Municipal Hospital and then 
transferred to Hendrick Mem­
orial Hospital in Abilene. He 
reportedly received a crushed 
right knee and other lacera­
tions.

The occupants of the other 
car. Mr. and Mrs, Puckett, both 
students at McMurry College, 
were less seriously injured. 
Both were given treatment in 
the emergency ward of Winters 
Municipal Hospital for face and 
body lacerations. Mrs, Puckett 
was admitted to the hospital, 
but was relea':cd Sunday. Mr. 
Puckett was not admitted to the 
hospital.

Pat Pritchard 
Asks Re-Election 
As Commissioner

To the people of Precinct No. 
3, Runnels County:

I would like to take this op­
portunity to ask for re-election 
is  your County Commissioner. 
I have enjoyed serving you in 
the past. I have tried to the best 
of my ability to do a good job. 
I feel that my past experience 
will enable me to do a better 
job in the future.

I have enioyed my associa­
tion at the County court house 
very much and in helping with 
the county government.

The men a County Commis­
sioner has working with him or 
for him ran be a great asset to 
the precinct and to the county. 
I believe we have those men. 
They are fine men and good 
workers.

We have enjoyed more than 
the state average of miles of 
good farm-to-market roads in 
Runnels County.

My wife and I have five chil­
dren and three grandchildren. 
Pat, Jr ., and his wife live in 
San Angelo and have a 10- 
months old baby girl. Marcene 
and her husband live in Odessa 
and have two small boys. Mary 
Lynn is a senior in Winters 
High School. Joe is a freshman 
in Winters High School. Martha 
IS a fifth grader at Wingate.

I plan to see each of you be­
fore the May 4th primary 
Should I miss anyone, I assure 
you it will not be intentional. 

Sincerely,
Pat Pritchard Sr.

Mansell Bros. To 
Present Special 
Program Tuesday

Farming Frontiers ’68. a new 
j program devoted to the busi­
ness of farming, will be held 
here Tuesday, February 27, it 
has been announced.

The program, featuring mo­
tion pictures about the elec­
tronic revolution in agriculture, 
new crop varieties, agricultural 
research discoveries and new 
livestock developments, will be 
sponsored by Mansell Bros., lo­
cal John Deere farm machinery 
dealers.

In addition to the program 
featuring mcney-making ideas 
for farmers, other movies will 
feature TV Newscaster Chet 
Huntley introducing new farm 
equipment that will he available 
for 1968 and a film about Japan, 
a rapidly growing customer for 
North American farm exports.

G. W. Sneed, manager for 
Mansell Bros., said the program 
will present a number of ideas 
to help farmers improve the 
efficiency of their operations 
He said a tractor roll-Gard with 
safety canopy and seat belts 
and other prizes will be award­
ed at the meeting.

The program will be held at 
the State Theatre Tuesday, Feb­
ruary 27, at 7:30 p. m. Guest 
speaker will be W. R (Buddy) 
Gray of the county ASCS office.

Three Candidates 
Now  For Council

Farmers Unlim To 
Kick O ff ^ m b e r  
Drive Monday

I Runnels County Farmers 
I Union will kick off a member­

ship drive next week, with 
I meetings to be held at Ballinger 
i Monday night and a meeting in 
Winters Tuesday night.

Dennis Poe, president of the 
I organization, said the Ballinger 
meeting will begin at 7:30 p. m.

\ Monday in the district court 
room. The Winters meeting will 

: be held at Huffman House at 
^7:.30 p. m. Tuesday, at which 
refreshments will be served.

The Winters meeting will em­
phasize the part of farm wives 
in the Farmers Union. Poe said, 
and all wives of members are 
invited, along with wives of 
other interested persons. Mrs. 

j  Donald Wooten of Crosbyton,
I National Farmers Union reore- 
! sentative, will speak at the Win- 
I ters meeting and will explain 
I the woman’s part in the Farm­
ers Union.

Fred Young Opens 
Economy Food 
On West Dale S t.

Fred Young, who has been in 
the grocery business in Winters 
for 18 years, has purchased the 
West Dale Grocery on West 
Dale Street from Mr and Mrs 
Bo Evans. Mr. and Mrs. Evans 
had operated the store for some 
time.

Young has changed the name 
of the business to Economy 
Food Store and will be open for 
business seven days a week, 
from 6:30 a. m. to 8 p. m.

Young operated the Economy 
Food Store in downtown Winters 
for 18 years, and closed out that 
business last October. He has 
invited alt his friends and cus­
tomers to visit him at the new 
location.

M YF To Conduct 
Canvass In Heart 
Fund Campaign

Young people of the Methodist 
Youth Fellowship will conduct 
a house-to-house canvass for the 
Heart Fund Monday, February 
26 at 5 p. m. Adults working 
with the youths will be Mrs 
Joe Stevens, Mrs. Leon Mounts. 
Mrs. Wayne Seals, Mrs. Bobby 
Blackwof^ and Mrs. O. O 
Funderburg Jr . Randy Stevens, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
Stevens, is president of the 
MYF.

Mrs. W. L. Collins is Heart 
Fund chairman for North Run­
nels County.

All workers in the Heart Fund 
Canvass will wear name tags 
showing they are volunteer 
workers for the drive.

Grocerymen To 
Convention In 
Dallas Sunday

Walker Tatum and Jerry 
Lawrence of Winters Piggly 
Wiggly food store attended a ; 
convention of Affiliated Foods j 
stockholders in Dallas Sunday,, 
and Tatum won two door prizes: 
—a ham and a portable tele-1 
vision set.

The convention was held in ! 
the Dallas Memorial Stadium, i 
and was the twenty-second con-' 
vention of the AF stockholders. i

W. S. (Bill) Byrns announced 
Tuesday as a candidate for 
Alderman in the city election 
set for Saturday, April 6.

Byrns’ signing was the third 
for the three vacancies which 
will occur on the City Council 
this year. W. L. (Bill) Bean and 
Homer Hodge, incumbent aider- 
man, had announced last week 
they will seek re-election to the 
Council.

Deadline for signing as a 
candidate in the April 6 election 
will be 30 days prior to the elec­
tion.

For the first time this year, 
the election will be held on a 
Saturday, as dicta'ed by the 
new election law which was 
passed by the Texas State Leg­
islature last year. Prior to this, 
city elections were held on the 
first Tuesday of April each 
year. The new date for city

Ted Bigham On 
Honorable Mention 
Roll At H-SU

Ted Bigham. senior at Har- 
din-Simmons University from 
Ovalo, was among 22 students 
to be named to the Honorable 
Mention Roll for the fall semes­
ter. To achieve Honorable Men­
tion, a student must be enrolled 
for from 6-11 semester hours 
and have a grade ooint average 
of 3 58.

Bigham is a 1956 graduate of 
5^uth Taylor High School in 
Tuscola. While in H-SU, he has 
been a member of Kappa Pi 
national honorary art fra­
ternity. He is maioring in art.

He is the son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Ted Bigham in Ovalo.

' elections will coincide with 
school elections, and will, in 
some instances, allow both elec­
tions to be held at the same 
place and with the use of the 
same election officials. This 
was said to be the intent of the 

; Legislature when the law was 
passed.

Election to name two mem­
bers to the board of trustees of 
the Winters Independent School 
District has been called for 
April 6. also. The school elec­
tion will be held in the Chamber 
of Commerce building in Win­
ters, while the City Election 
will be held at the city fire 
station.

I

Car Registration 
Has Been Sioiv 
in Winters Office

Registration of automobiles 
and other vehicles required to 
have 1968 license tags has been 

j slow, according to Mrs, Ted 
I Meyer, deputy in the Winters 
j office of the Runnels County 
I Tax Assessor-Collector.
I Mrs. Meyer said that her 
! office had issued about 2.50 
! passenger car tags, about .50 
commercial vehicle tags, and 
about 200 farm vehicle tags. 
Few trailers have been regis­
tered, she said.

The deputy collector remind- 
j ed all vehicle owners that April 

1 is the deadline for installation 
of new 1968 tags, and urged 

! that everyone register their 
I vehicles early in order to avoid 
I the last minute rush

Mrs. A . D. Lee To Observe 18th
Some Cotton Is jBirthday With Open House Thursday
Still In Fields,
5209 To Winters

Quite a bit of the 1967 cotton 
crop still is in the fields, and 
some will never be picked, ac­
cording to sources this week. 
Wet weather during January 
and February has prevented 
stripping of the last cotton, and 
some of it probably will be 
plowed under.

There were a few bales a t , 
gins to be processed, it was | 
said. I

Winters Warehouse Company' 
said Tuesday that .5209 bales! 
had been brought in from two | 
Wingate gins and one Winters; 
gin.

Mrs. A. D. Lee, owner of the Winters Flower Shop, will 
observe her eighteenth birthday Thursday. February 29, with 
open house at the flower shop, 114 South Main Street.

All friends are invited to call from 2:00 to 4:00 o'clock 
Thursday, February 29. Mrs. Lee stated ’’You’all Come.”

Biizzardettes Defeat Anson Girls To 
Earn Share O f District Crown

$154^09 Spent On Construction 
In Winters During Past Year

HONORED—Marine Corporal 
Billy Joe Thomas of Winters, 
behind the man in the wheel 
chair, was one of seven wound­
ed veterans of the Vietnam 
war. who were special guests 
at the San Patricio County Ag­
riculture a n d  Homemakers 
Show January 27. The veterans 
are presently hospitalized at the 
Corpus Christ! Naval Air 
Station Hospital. They are, left 
to right. Staff Sergeant Clay­
ton J .  Meyers, Port Arthur;

Chaplain George B. Hummer, 
York. Pa.; Corporal Thomas W. 
Baker, Galveston; Corporal 

j  Thomas, Winters; Lance Cor- 
: poral Jerry  G. Lambert, Hub-! 
I bard; Miss Betty Bess, San 
! Patricio Coun'y Fair (^ueen. 
Sinton; Corporal Donald Nu I gent, Dallas: an.1 .Sergeant
Thomas H. Hewitt. Midland.

The group of veterans were 
treated to a steak dinner and 
taken on a tour of agricultural 
exhibits at the show.

A good barometer of the 
economic conditions and growth 
factors in a given community 
is the ra»e of residential and 
''ommercial construction. A 
Stagnated area will show little 
if any n»*w constru'tion of any 
ty p e ,  while a ste-Hy rote of 
"onsfrur'icn is a ret|f*rtion of a 
orogressive community.

In Winters, a coofident a'ti- 
tude toward the future of the 
community is displayed in the 
amount of monev which has 
been spent during the past year 
in permanent construction, in 
addition to repairs and addi­
tions of both residential and 
commercial structures.

During the past vear, accord­
ing to information obtained 
'n m  the office of the City Sec- 
"Cterv. cost of ho'h tynes o' 
"onstrurfinn nnd ncrnanrnf re 
nairs to exisfip" s*>u''tures. a- 
mounted to *154 1̂00. Of thi« 
amount $47 000 was for new 
residential buildings.

Commercial construction ac-

' counted for a whooping $81 OOP 
during the reported year. This 
included construction of a new 
building to house additiona' 
telephone equipment, an addi­
tion to Merrill Res* Home, add 
ed s’ructures at Alderman-Cave 
Milling and Grain Co., a new 
educational building for the 
Church of Christ, and a new 
dental clinic building now under 
construction for Dr. T. L. Rus 
sell.

No records can be obtained 
on the number of existing com­
mercial and residential build 
ings which have undergone ex­
tensive permanent lepair or in­
side changes, but the amoun’ 
spent in the past vear in thi" 
nre.T has been estimated at a 
good many thous.ands of do’Inrs

While this activifv in the 
building industry could not h' 
determined in tbe ’’boon” 
'•Rtegory, it is sufficient t© sa" 
that it has been steady and 
evidence of a wholesome con­
fidence in the future of the

Will Offer Golf 
Lessons At Local 
Country Club Soon

A series of golf lessons will | 
be offered at the Winters Coun-1 
try Club beginning in March. i 

Wayne Stone will be the in-1 
structor, and will give lessons! 
to beginners and adults. i

Those interested in these golf, 
lessons may obtain information 
by contacting Stone.

FROM DALLAS
Mr. and Mrs. Bob Anderson 

of Dallas were weekend visitors 
in the home of his parents. Mr. 
and Mrs. Sid Anderson.

Winters Biizzardettes won a : 
must game from Anson Friday, 
night in Anson by the score o f! 
59-51 to win a share of the dis- j 
trict championship. The crown 
is shared with Anson and Ham-1 
lin. In the game the Biizzard­
ettes controlled the opening tip- i 
off and moved to a fast s ix , 
points before the Anson g irls! 
could pet the ball into their end 
of the court. So complete was 
the early domination of th e , 
game by Winters that at one | 
time in the first quarter the 
score stood 16-3 in favor of th e ' 
Biizzardettes.

The Biizzardettes played per-: 
haps their finest gtime of the | 
season as they threw the dis-, 
trict race into a snarl with 
their victory. Outstanding play 
by the forwards and near letter- 
perfect defensive work by the 
guards was more than Anson 
could overcome.

Scoring for the Biizzardettes 
were Carla Walker with 3C 
points, Eileen Fauhion with 17. 
and Dora Snell with 12 as they 
hit for 50 per cent of their shots

from the field. Guards Mary 
Lynn Pritchard, Babs Tatum, 
and Judy McNeill did theii 
usual fine job in the backcourt.

The three-way tie for the 
championship necessitated a 
play-off to decide who would 
represent the district in bi-dis- 
trict competition. The three 
teams drew to determine who 
would play whom. Hamlin drew 
a bye. Winters and Anson were 
set off to play the first game 
of the play-ofL The winner of 
this game will play Hamlin to 
determine the district repre­
sentative who will play Alpine 
in bi-district.

Biizzardettes finished regular 
season play with a 19-5 won-loss 
record with two of the losses 
coming in district play against 
Hamlin and An.-;on. Leading the 
scoring were Dora Snell with 
400 points in 23 games for a 
game average of 17.4: Carla 
Walker with 386 points in 24 
games for an average of 16.1; 
and Eileen Fauhion with 341 
points in 24 games for an aver­
age of 14,2.

town.

FOR SCHOOL — John Wad­
dell Chevrolet Co., presents 
Keys to a new Chevrolet driver

edu(;ation car to Superintendent 
of Schools Carroll Tatom. The 
automobile will be used in the

driver education courses offer­
ed in Winters High School, and 
is provided to the school with­
out cost. (Little photo)
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Mrs. Juanita O’Connor’s Weekly j
Home Demonstration Agent's Column

( hicken in a Paper Bag:
Do you sa\e brown bags" 

Most homemakers c’o, for they 
find 'O m.iny uses for this 
paperuap H.ive you ever tried 
cooking in a brown paper bag" 
Try it with a broiler or fryer, 
and you'll see whv this is a 
favorit-' mtthiKl of preparing 
chii ken in the bayou country of 
Louisiana.

Chicken-in-a bag meals are 
very economical now. for broil­
ers are plentiful 
promise very attractive retail 
prii es

Split a ready-to-cook bird in 
h.ilf Brush the inside and out- 
s'de with butt r Thin sprinkle 
with . mixture of these season­
ing-: Celery salt, onion salt,
g.irlic salt, pepper and paprika.

Place in a heavv brown paper 
bag. allowing plenty of niom for 
both haUes of the chicken, and 
twist shut. Cook on a rack in a 
400 degree oven 'or about an 
hour and fifteen minutes. .\nd 
don't worry — the bag won't

hance the delicate flavor of the 
chicken!

Fashion looks change as fast 
as a woman's mind and this 
year, the look is as varied: a 
touch of the Thirties and the 
military ruffles, short jackets 
and waistlines belted naturally 
or higher The scope is wide 
enough for something for every 
figure, age and personality.

Return of the Thirties in­
farm prices f]ynece has entered the fashion 

pictures. The long skirts .and 
soft blouses look very feminine, 
says Mrs. O'Connor The blous­
es feature tiny yolks, bluff 
sleeves and are worn with a 
wide belted semi-full dirndl or 
skirt Skiits. as one designer 
described them, "bounding, 
swinging. flipping - one for 
everx'where in every mocxl.'’

The tendency goes to a slim, 
trim bodice and case at the 
hemline. The military flavor re- Winters Native 
mams with capes, buckles. _  , .  »7 • •

, , , epaulets and button'd cuff tabs Diecl rridayburn V  u c.'in forget about your ^

.........

H.VRD LANDING for seagulls cam e when .Mallard Lake stvface in San Franriseo's 
Golden Gate Park froze over. Unusual icy condition was caused by poiar wind­
storm which temporarily sent temperatures plummeting and birds sliding.

, . . .  , me .Mao io o k  aaos a new twist w i/- «n
thicken, until he cooking time mandarin collars and 1 «  K e r r V l i l e
IS up. for it will turn out succu* . .  ____, ,  ̂ . . buttons,lent ;!rd fender. It s a gf>od pre- Colors are muted pra\s, inters, died at his

beiges, browns. Victorian pas- Kerrville home at 10:30

Albert Henrv Kiefer. 57, a na-
c.iution to place a pan on a 
Inw.-r r.ick in the oven to catch 
any drippings from the chicken 
Bring the chicken to the table 
in the paper hag. Make a little 
n-remony of cutting the paper 
away from the top with some
kitchen scissors so vou can . . .  u 1. tu
carve the bird easily at the . j .  i_- u • t. . .1.

Children's Summer Reading Program 
Depends On Space A t Winters Library

A reading program for the dren participate in the program 
children of this community has each summer, and the number 
not been planned for next sum-; is increasing, bring “reading

shrimp is new with lots of tur­
quoise and yellow. The big 
question is hemlines: Accord­
ing to Mrs O'Connor, two main

t:ih|p. Serve the chicken with 
«lices of lemon and orange 
What color the citrus slices add 
to the plate and how they en-

tels and bright prints with fa- pndav apparentlv after suffer- f îer due to lack of space in the hapoiness to hundreds in the 
brics showing texture. Coral or a heart attack Winters Public Library to con- Winters area," directors said.

duct such a program. In recent Last summer’s oiogram was 
Funeral was held at 3 p. m̂  years, plans for the summer, highly successful,' 5Iiss Mvra 

Sunday in Kerrville with burial program were made in January | Glover, librarian, said. In t’hat 
*"^re' in order to begin the program - program, the children went on

Mr. Kiefer was bom June 5. - âne 1. a “treasure hunt” —a large
1910 in Winters and moved to I This lack of adequate space I treasure map was placed in the 
Kerrville in liUO. He operated ' for the children’s program has [ library, and when a child read 
a paint ard wallpaper shop in ' been noted by the board of di- twelve books he found the hid- 
Kerrville 39 year-i. He was a I  rectors of the library. They  ̂den treasure: a free order at 
member of Fir.-t Baptist Church stated with regret that because | the fountain of Main Drug Co.

' of the lack of space, and be- ‘ All the children entering the 
Surv ivors include his wife. I P r ^ p r a m  has grown' reading program had an en-

midi. which is between the 
ankle and the knee, highlights 
evening wear. For daytime, 
hemlines will stay 'hort. but not 
mini-short, just above the knee.

One Spanish house showed there, 
skirts which stops precisely 
four centimeters above the
knee. Merle, two daughters. Miss

Buvers freouentlv misunder ' f"’' "f Houston andBuvers frequentlv misunder- Sch'-llhase of New '

SLOW-ACTING KIDNEYS 
(,OT YOU DOWN?
IN J l  ST 24 HOURS.

stood or completely ignored the 
term “colorfast.'’ when pur­
chasing textile furnishings for 
the home. Many overlook the 
importance of securing color- 
fastness in home fabrics be­
cause it is most onmmonlv as­
sociated with the washability of

Provision of adequate space 
for a children’s summer read-

Mrs
Orleans. La.; a brother, Nor­
man Kiefer of Hamilton: a . . .
sister. Mrs. J . B. Templeton of mp propram has been one of the 
Ballinger; his mother. Mrs. W drive to
J. Kiefer of Winters and two raise money for the library. The
gr.indchildren.

so large—to includ" all children ' joyable time reading and talk­
ing about the books as they 
worked to find the treasure. 

The board of directors of the

Million Acres Lost 
Each Year To New 
Construction

Each year we bury another 
million acres of rural land, 
some of it prime farm land, 
under new houses, factories, 
highways, airports, and shop­
ping centers, according to Har­
vey Kahlden, Soil Conservation­
ist with the local Soil Conserva­
tion Service, assisting the Run­
nels Soil and Water Conserva­
tion District. During this same 
neriod, we add another 2.7 mil­
lion people to our population, 
all of whom must live, be fed 
and find recreation on the un­
changed 2.9 million square 
miles of land in the contiguous 
48 states and 555,000 in Alaska 
and Hawaii.

In the past few years we have 
seen water and air pollution in 
feet every major river hasip 
and airshed in America. These 
two elements of the environ­
mental crisis have received a 
large share of public attention 
and justifiably so. But what is 
happening to the Amerir.an land 
also needs attention. At the turn 
of the century, if one had divid­
ed the total amount of land 
evenly among the population 
each American would have had 
25 acres. In recent years this 
has shrunken to 9.7 acres. By 
the turn of the next century, 
each American will be able te 
command only 6.4 acres to feed 
clothe, shelter him; to produce 
the industrial products he 
needs: to find the rerreation he 
will demand in an increasingly 
mechanized world. In the year 
2000, three Americans will live 
where only two live today.

Will we face a land shortage? 
The answer is up to us. If we 
have wise land use, the answer 
is no. But if we continue to mis­
use our land, as we have in the 
nast, we will rapidly become 
land-poor.

Kahlden said, it I? very im­
portant that we have a careful 
ly developed long-term land use 
plan. Today, too much of our 
land use is dictated hy short- 
run economic considerations. 
We can no longer afford to he 
careless and make the same 
land-use blunders that we made 
in the past with this priceless 
and irreplaceable national heri­
tage. If we insist on doing so, 
we will be properly condemned 
by future generations.

Kahlden went on to say that 
we are often using the wrong 
land for the wrong purpose, not 
only agriculture but in urban 
areas. This occurs when large 
parcels of land are developed, 
not by design or plan, but when­
ever a buyer and seller agree 
on a price. Often the bypassed 
land is sold or held for specula­
tion and in an effort to reduce

library stated that they appre­
ciate the cooperation of the 
businessmen who have helped 
in the summer ptngram—one

board of directors believes that summer, free movie tickets
if enough people help in this were given hy the State

, ,  u drive that facilities can be en- Theatre—and regret a new pro-
P- p - m up or your 48c back_ ■ apparel fabrics. j  ,  k • 11 enough to accommodate gram will not be offered until
G.ttin-’ up night, aches and Towels, table and bed linens fure and fabric wall coverings ,he program -if not this sum- more space can be orovided
pain- may show functional kid- and similar furnishings require exposed to sunlight may also ,f,en the following sum- Present facilities in the librarv
rev disorders. Take only 3 gen- dyes which keep their colors show pronounced streakings. . " " ‘ “'J'
t:- BLKETS tabs a day to help fresh and bright through repeat- spotting and other discoinra- jh e  drive to raise funds for ¡tensive program t he v said"
r. t"jro RFGUL.ATE PASS.AGE. ed washings. ' tions if not color fast to sun- (f,e library continues with con- *  ̂ '
NOW MAIN DRUG CO. I Carpeting, upholstered fumi- light. tributions' totaling $1631.,50 by

Wednesday of this week. Latest Thomas L  Wolford

real taxes, buildings are allow­
ed to detei'iorutc, land goes out 
of agiicu'ture and in'o weeds 
and erosion and othei tonservn- 
tion problems multiply. Al­
though we have adequate farm 
land for the forseeable future, 
and while there is nothing 
wrong with using it for inten­
sive purposes, such as housing, 
we cannot indefinitely continue 
unplanned urbanization, as we 
cannot continue to have un­
planned agriculture land. Our 
land use decisions in the next 
few years will determine wheth­
er succeeding generations thank 
us, nr shake their heads sadly 
over our abuse of the American 
land. i

What are you doing with your j 
9.7 acres? If you would like to , 
make a long-range plan on your 
acreage, contaot your loctil Soil 
Conservation Service.
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Sub Deb Club 
.Wet In M.ever Home

The Sub Deb Club met in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Ted 
Meyer with Theresa Meyer 
serving as hostess.

Theresa Meyer presided over 
the weekly business meeting. 
The program was given by 
Gayla Beall on “Wh.it Boys 
Think.”

Refreshments were served to 
toy Await, Eileen Faubinn. Sue 
Hoppe. Gwen Hoppe, Kei Bed­
ford, Janie Paschal. Cindy 
Brown. Goyla Beall, Kathie 
Dillard, Cindy An'illey, Babs 
Tatum. Theresa Meyer, Dionne 
Snell, Brenda Prine. Cindy 
Pinkerton. Jean Mostad. Bever- 
iy Sprinkle. Dianne Davis and 
Edna Ruth Self.

Club was dismissed with the 
benediction.

VISIT IN LOUISIANA
,Mr. and Mrs, Joe Irxin have 

returned home from a visit in 
New Orleans, Louisiana. En- 
route home they visited Mr, 
and Mrs. M. B. Myers, Tammy 
and Guyla in Eunice, Louisiana.

ALL ELE C T R IC  
WATER HEATER

A 10 YEAR DEPENDABLE 
SERVICE 6UARANTEE 

&
FREE WIRING

Free 220 volt wiling to all resi­
dential customers of WTU who 
buy an electric water beater 
from local dealer.

Winters 
Sheet Metal 

and
Plumbing Co.

W e  Don't W ant 
All the Insurance- 

Just Y O U R S !
JN O . W . NOR 1 1 1  u
The InsurancefVIM PI

B i ÿ  B o n d s  
v d i ^  y o u  w o ric .

BITTEII BY THE 
HEW CAR BUG?

contributors were Mr and Mrs.
W.nde W. White, $15.00. ' th« I I I f  ■

In speaking of the children’s , | j| p # l ||| 
summer reading program — V f l t U  I I I  T v I v l Q I D  

, members of the board of direc- 
' tors have pointed out that this 
nrnjpct has been an imoortant 
nhase of the Winters Public Li-

Hospital Tuesday
Thomas L. Wolford. 42, died 

, brary Between 150 and 200 chil-1  ̂ P- Tuesday. February
in the Big .Spring veterans

St. John’s Eveniiijs: 
CJrcle .Meeting:

I On .Monday Nij^ht
' The regular meeting of the 
I Evening Circle of St. John’s 
1 Lutheran Church was held Mon­
day night in the 

I Mrs. Walter Probst was in 
charge of the Bible study,

' “When I Am Frightened” was

hospital. He had ber-n admitted 
to the hospital Monday. He had 
been in ill health for several 
years.

Services were held at 2 p. m. 
Thursday in Spill Memorial 
Chapel, minister of Hatchell 
Church of Christ, and Glen 

parsonage. | Grey of the Winters Church of 
Christ, officiating. Burial was 
in Fairview Cemetery.

Born Feb. 23. 1925. in Del Rio.
the topic of the study. Members | he lived in several border 

j  look part in answering Bible j  towns. His father was a Border 
! questions, sang a hymn and, Patrolman for many years. On
closed with prayer.

Mrs. Walter Spill pave the of­
fering meditation and a free 
will offering was taken.

Mrs. Charles Kruse Jr., pre­
sident, presided. and Mrs. 
Merle Wright gave the secre-

Dec. 17. 1941, he joined the U. 
S. Marines, and served in the 
South Pacific, where he was 
wounded.

Following his discharge in 
1944, he worked for the Good­
year Tire Co. in San Angelo.

Quick! Hurry to your nearest 
First Savings & Loan 

doctor for the sure cure 
a low cost auto loan 

eases the pain immediately!

• •

tary’s report. Miss Helen Lisso'later working for the Merchants 
j gave the treasurer’s report, and Freight Line and Sunset Motor 
Mrs. Willis Whittenberg gave i Line. He was transferred to 
the secretary of stewardship Dallas and then to Oklahoma.

I report. Miss Minnie Belitz gave! In 1965 he was transferred to St. 
the secretary of education re -! Louis, Mo., where he worked 
port. I for Consolidated Freight Line.

The pastor, the Rev. Walter | He married Mary Lehman 
Probst. reported that the Rev. July 21, 1951, in San Angelo. He 
Gaylord Grant will speak for was a member of the Hatchell

F IR S T SAVIN G S
& LOAN ASSOCIATION

SAN  A N O aO  •  10s  W. U A M iO A R D  « M H «  V U LA M

•A U IN O C I •  t03 MUTCHINOS

W IN T in  •  101 SOUTH M A M

the first I,ent Service February 
29. It was also reported that a 
mission study will be held Mon­
day. March 4. and a World Dnv 
of Prayer will be held March I ' one brother. Nelscn, 
at St. John’s Lutheran Church Aneeles, Calif, 
with the Presbyterian women in 
charge.

Mrs, Walter Probst served re­
freshments to Mesdames R. C.

' Kurtz Jr ., Willis Whittenberg.
1 Charles Kruse Jr., Merle 
Wright, Frank Carter. Walter 
Soill. and Misses Minnie Belitz.
Fstella Bredemever. Helen Lig­

and two visitors, Kathy 
Bredemever and the Rev.
Probst. Mrs. R C Kurtz Jr. 
joined as a new member.

Church of Christ 
Survivors include his wife; 

two daughters. Kathye and Cyn­
thia, both of the Winters home;

of Los

Pallbearers were Roy Young, 
B. B. Campbell, Wilbur Phelps. 
Walter Adami. Albert Sudduth, 
Robert Mayfield, Ralph Parker 
and Bill Mayo.

ATTEND FUNERAL
Mr. and Mrs. Lawrence Jacob 

attended the funeral Sunday at 
Kerrx'ille for Albert Kiefer, for­
mer resident of Winters. Funer­
al service was held at Kerrville 
Funeral Home chapel.

He does.

Why do our servicemen buy U.S. Savings Bonds? 
Ilteif lessoas ate the same as yours and mine: 
•aring for the future, supporting freedom. And 
becanae they’re fighting for freedom, too, maybe 
aarriccinen see the need more clearly than many of 
■a. Boy Bonds. In mote than one way, it makes 
you fed good.

New Freedom Shares 
Now, when you join the Payroll Savings Plan or 
the Bond-a-Month Plan, you are eligible to pur­
chase the new type U.S. Savings Notes—Freedom 
Shares. Freedom Shares pay 4.74% when held to

maturity of just 4>/j years (redeemable after one 
year), are available on a onc-for-one basis with Sav­
ings Bonds. Get all the facts where yon work OC 
bank. 1

U S. Savings Bonds, 
new Freedom Shares

a-7
A

Tkt y . S .  f7ov*nimtf)t iott nne pay  fo r  Oiit aJvertU rm rnt. ft  h  prraratrtl a t  a tmhUt 
ttrv t̂a in eooparatian wUh (A. T rtatyry  ü.parimant and T h , A d v tr iitiag  CauneO.



LARGEST OFFSHORE DRILLING platform for the 
 ̂ Gulf of Mexico is this Shell Oil rig, set beside a similar 

* scale model of the 555-foot Washington Monument.
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Blizzard B Team i 
Lost To Anson 
Friday Night

In a game played Friday 
 ̂ night the Blizzard B Team lost 
their final basketball game of 
the season to Anson 45-40 to 
bring their season record to 19- . 8.

In the game Donny Killoiigh 
led the scoring with 19 points 
followed by Johnny Cathey and 
Iteese McCuistion with fi each.

In compiling the excellent 19- 
8 record, the B team, coached 
hy William Grissom, played 
some excellent basketball a- 
gainst some tough opponents.

They dropped their season 
opener to class 4A Pampa. 
Their second loss was five 
games later to class 3A Sweet­
water which was avenged in a 
return engagement four games 
later and in the finals of the 
Winters B Team Tournament 

'when the Blizzards dropped the 
Mustangs in what was perhaps 
their finest game of the season 

.  fo win the tourney. Only two 
teams defeated them twice.

Coleman defeated the Bliz­
zards in the finals of the Novice 
tburney and again in a game 
played in Blizzard gym and 
An.son defeated them twice in 
district play. The two Coleman 
losses were avenged as the Bliz- 
.zards whipped them in a regu­
lar season game and in the 
semi-finals of the Winters 
Tournament.

Season Scoring 
Player Games 
J .  Cathey 
McCuistion 
G. Antilley
S. Wilson 
B. Colburn 
B. Grantz
T. Jones
R. Moore
S. Thomas 
J .  Hodnett

Summary 
Pts. Avg 

2.5 251 10 0 
IfiO 
134 
127 
145 
81 
65 
42 
36 
11

22
10
24
15
22
24
11
20
6

7.3 
13.4
5.3
9.7
3.7
2.7
3.8
1. 8 
1 . 8

The easiest way to sell that 
**whlte elephant” of yours 1s to 
advertise it in The Winters En­
terprise Classified Column.

Blizzards Lose 
Final Game To 
Anson Tigers

In their final game of the 
season the Winters Blizzards' 
lost to the Anson Tigers 67-47 i 
in a game played in Anson Fri-1 
day night. The loss brought the i 
Blizzai^s district record to 0-10 
and their season record to 4-25. '

In the game the Blizzards 
played Anson on even terms for 1 
nearly three quarters when the ■ 
Tigers broke the game wide 
open. Leading the scoring fo r ; 
the Blizzards were Ronny Reel 
with 10 points and Danny Kil-  ̂
lough and Bob Colburn with 9 
each.

Season Scoring Summary
Player Games Pts. Avg. !
Daii Killough 29 .381 13.1
R. Reel 
L. Cook 
Don Killough 
R. Boles 
G. Antilley 
B. White 
T. Antilley 
B. Colburn

29 262 
26 237 
29 182 
29 83
20
22
18

6

75
23
15
12

9.0
9.1 
6.3 
2.9 
3.8 
1.0 
0.8 
2.0

Be Busy Se^'ing 
diib Met Monday

Members of the Be Busy 
Sewing Club met Monday after­
noon in the Home of Mrs. Vada 
Babston. Handwork was done | 
for the hostess.

Refreshments were served to 
Mesdames Bill Milliom. Lewis 
Blackmon. Becky Poe. Nadeen' 
Smith. Bud Parks. George 
Lloyd. G. T. Shott. Billy Mar­
gin. Sam Gray. Louella Wilson, 
and Etta Bryant.

The next meeting will be 
Pebrunry 26 in the home of 
Mrs. Lewis Blackmon.

Entente means an agreement.

L. C. B. MAKES NEW RULE.«: ,
Texas Liquor Control Board j 

issued new rules for its agents, 
including a bar against LCB 
agents bidding for purchase of 
confiscated cars or trucks. A 
Dallas LCB agent’s purchase of 
a confiscated truck was one of 
the incidents that kicked off the 
Board’s current self-examina­
tion.

New rules warn agents 
against revealing any detals of 
investigations, and tighten ac­
counting procedures for keep­
ing track of illicit alcohol that 
has been seized.

MOONLIT PATH leadi to offshore oQ riff. U.S. oilmea 
have been ffivinff increased attention to offshore drlU< 
Inff. Scene Is off GnU C o n st

LEAN and TENDER

Pork Steak 5 9
LEAN _  _

Pork Roast 4 5

> ' ’S? ». . .

r WOODBURY»

L O T IO N

$1.00
VALUE

'  SWIFT PREMIUM

VELVEETA

CHEESE
2-lb. Box

99c

aiï-sf I

,,rî i

^  IK ^  g mu
' '^ -1   ̂ i l  » ,

m m

DECKER’S 

ALL MEAT

FRANKS
12-oz. Pkg.

47c

GOLD BOND STAMPS
with the purchase o f every

$2.00 Size Jergens

HAND LOTION " "

EGGS
LARGE WHITE

Doz. 39c

m m i

GOLD BOND STAM PS^
with the purchase every

lb.

GLADIOLA -  “Paper Bag

FLOUR 25
DEL MONTE — Family Size
CATSUP 20-oz. Bottle . 3
GERBER’S VEG. & FRUIT 
BABY FOOD STRAINED

DIAMOND CREAM STYLE
CORN 303 Can 5
SW IFT’S CANNED WHOLE
CHICKEN IN BROTH
LIBBY’S WHOLE -  300 Can
NEW POTATOES

For

b.4 1.9 9  

$1.00 

4 fo, 39c

For $ 1 . 0 0

99c

4 For 69c

SOLID PACK

OLEG 
2-lbs. 25c

KIMBELL

COFFEE
Pound Can

59c

Squibb No-Calorie

Sweeta ■ 69c Size 

^ 7 . \ GOLD BOND STAMPS
e x t r a  C lAe purchase o f every

Your Choice, 1-Gad. Ctn.

IC EC R EA M

'  j?

...íŜ sü! lg,,.
2 f o t 2 9

FOLGERS INSTANT

COFFEE
lO-oz. Ja r

S1.49

KIMBELL

Shortening
3-lb. Can

59c
N E W ! d i a l  THE
SPRAY Y O U  LIKE!

\ »un !#«.« y'

haïr spray
3 kinds of 
spray in one 
c o ntainer -  
•Soft »Hold 
•Set

4 9 «

LETTUCE-Large Head 
BANANAS LARGE FRUIT

CALIFORNIA SUNKIST

Each 19c 
Ib. 10c

^ 2  \ g o l d  BOND STAMPS
EXTR^ S ^  purchase o f every

3- or 4-Yd. Pkg. New Braunfel

DRESS M ATERIAL

LEMONS 
CARROTS 
CANNED BISCUITS

CELLOPHANE BAGS

KIMBELL

6
2
5

For

For

For

29c
29c
39c

GOLD BOND STAMPS
with the purchase o f every

49c Bag Regular

FRITOS

Coupons Expire Wednesday, Feb. 28th.

KIMBELL
GREAT NORTHERN

BEANS
300 Can

4 4 9

MISSION

PEAS
3tt Ca

3 4 9

KIMBELL

PIMENTOS
4-oz. Can

1 9

Z E E R U S S ET

FA C IA L SPUDS
TISSUE 1 0 ‘ Hi. Bag

Box 200  Count

2 9 *
1 9 * With Purchase of

$5 .00  or More!

BEH’S
save, save GWDBWD stamps



CLASSIFIED A D S STATE

FLOW ERS for SALE
FLOWERS for ALL occasions. 

Orders wired anywhere any 
time. Mrs. A. D. Lee, Florist, 
W inters Flower Shop, Dial 754- 
43tK. 17-tfc

FOR SALE: REDUCE SAFE-1 
LY, simple and fast with Co- ; 
bese tablets. Only 98c. Main 1 
Drug Co. 45-IOtc'

FOR SALE
3-BEDROOM htmse, central 

heat, air-conditioned, fenced 
back yard. Call 7.S4-4237 or see 
Wayne Stone at Harrison Auto 
Parts. 36-tfc

FOR SALE; Pecan, apricot, 
pear, peach, plum, fig and 
shade trees; rose bushes; grape 
and berry vines; over 100 varie­
ties bulk garden seed. Be sure 
and see our trees and vines. 
Get our prices before you buy. 
Simpson Garden Center, 410 
Commercial Avenue, Coleman. 
Texas. 42-tfc

SANF ORD

GET YOUR HUNTING A.ND 
FISHING LICENSE at Western 
Auto Store. Complete line of 
Hunting and Fishmg Needs.

22-tfc

FOR SALE: 3U-acre farm,
owner's share of royalty; owner 
will finance. 6 miles west of 
Winters. Contact Jam es D. 
Elliott, Box 1, Tulsa. Okla, 74102

46-4tc

FOR SALE: IWO Falcon Ford 
Wagon Cheap .A-l Condition.— 
Bill Bell at Bell's Cashway.

36-tfc

FOR SALE: .Mrs. W 11 Cain 
home, 4-room, bath, caiTiort. 
storage ro«im, giKid rep.iir. fruit 
and pecan trees, large garden 
plot. 501 W.Hxl St . Call L Q 
Snor'd, PO 7-3371, or .Mrs. F.lzie
Cox. 4S-3tc I

K 'R  S.ALF: 1W3 pickup,
custom cab, V-S. very clean. 
Richard Bauer, phone 754-4053.

43-tfc

IDXWORTH - G.UBRAITH 
lUMBF.R CO c.in .i — isi you in 
oht.f.nin>a a Title 1 n modeling 
loan for any home lepairs. Ph 
7.")4-,531s 49-tfc

B.ARG.AIN: 3-bedroom house.  ̂
bath, new condition, new car­
pet. duct air, central heat. No, 
down, first payment May I Call 
collect, L. H. Mc.Aden. phone 
92S-544S, Merkel. Tex. 4S-tfc

FOR S.Vl F P.H kard-B 'll TV. 
c.ihip> t 'tyli . gisxl condition 
B.ii L’.on for quii k -ale. Phone 
7.54 T.'ns Itc

FOR S.ALF: 2-bedroom house! 
completely furnished, just re - ' 
cently re-finished inside and out. 
refrigerated air conditioning.' 
fenced back yard. Phone 754- 
4040 or 754-4592. Bob Fenton. |

4S-tfc

FOR SAl F Mrs 1 . A Bru­
ton home or 1' .-i o St See Fred 
A'oung at F nnony F'rxyl Store 
on West D.ile .icross the rail- 
ro.id 49-tfc

F'OR S.ALE: 6-room house on 
F Bmadwav. W J .  Yates. Ph, 
754-49S5, 48-tfc

FO RS.Al F Youn- registered 
hulls. Hereford. Black .Angus. 
R"d .Angus .1 W Dunn. Wm-

FOR RENT

.gate. PI 3-6710

FOR RENT: Nice upstairs
furnished apartment. Mrs. A. D
Smith. 506 Lamar. 44-tfc

Registered Polled 
Hereford Bulls

PFRFORM AM F TESTED 
READY FOR M R V ltE  

(.L \R W TEFD

Michaelis Ranch
W I\(i\TF. TEXAS 

Phone PI 3-6342
49-4tc

F'OR RENT: 2-lH'droom house, 
floor furnace, carport and stor­
age room. Three blocks of 
school Phone 754-5334, 4S-tfc

FOR RENT: My house at 111 
Novice Road. See Rufus W ill- 
lam- at Handy s Liquor Store, 
or call Ballinger 365-3542 betöre 
9 a m after 9 .30 p m 49-2tp

By—Vem Sanford 
Texas Press Association

State attention continues to 
center on the embattled Texas 
Liquor Control Board.

Speaker Ben Barnes appoint­
ed a special subcommittee from 
the House State Affairs Com­
mittee to study possible changes 
in the election laws. Rep. Dick 
Cory of N'ictoria, committee 
chairman, also heads the sub­
committee Other members are 
Reps I.imes Slider of Naples. 
Bill Clayton of Springlake, Cle- 
Uis Davis of Houston and Roy 
Garwo>xl of San .Antonio.

Cory stressed that the com­
mittee will not investigate 
Board operations. It will look 
into the cumbersome liquor 
laws which have not been mod­
ernized since they were first 
adopted in 19.35. Chairman Cory 
says the panel will be ready 
with its recommendations — 
(which conceivably could in­
clude legaliz.it ion of liquor-by- 
the-drink sales) "whenever 
Govt rnor Connally calls a spec­
ial session of the Legislature.”

LCB itself has drafted a set 
of recommendations which in­
clude the provision that no priv­
ate clubs, veterans or fraternal 
organization c.in serve liquor 
over the bar in dry areas with­
out local-option election approv­
al.

•A veteran lawman. O. N. 
(Newt) Humphreys Jr., was 
chosen by the Board to take the 
vacant job as assistant to Ad­
ministrator Coke Stevenson Jr. 
Humphreys. 43, is a native of 
Brenham. His father was chief 
of police there. The new LCB 
assistant chief has been with 
the T*‘xas Department of Public 
Safety since 19 is and for 11 
years has heon head of its in­
telligence division.

His selection led to specula­
tion that the LCB might in a 
few months move Humphreys

up to administrator. But Steven­
son said that he has no inten­
tion of resigning while the a- 
gency is under fire.

In a unique way, the LCB 
situation got involved in the 
governor's race. Lieut. Gov. 
Preston Smith was critical of 
the decision by Barnes to name 
a special committee. Then Eu­
gene Locke of Dallas, one of 
Smith’s opponents in the Gov­
ernor's race, said the liquor 
laws obviously need revision 
and that Smith should have 
provided leadership toward that 
end.

Gov. John Connally’s declara­
tion that state legislators have 
been involved in "influence 
peddling” efforts with Steven­
son, and his refusal to grant 
special treatment kept his 
salary down, led to some check­
ing.

A study of the appropriations 
laws for the past 10 years shows 
that Stevenson’s salary was 
generally held to about $4,000 
less than those of comparable 
department heads. It was only 
last Sept. I that his salary was 
brought to within $1,000 of two 
other agency heads.

after the driver of a car in 
which he was a passenger 
crashed while trying to avoid 
hitting a train.

High court also agreed to 
hear arguments on March 27 in 
a San Antonio case involving a 
father's right to prevent a di­
vorced wife from legally chang­
ing the name of their child.

Court of Criminal Appeals 
affirmed the death penalty as­
sessed 19-year-old Johnny Rudy 
Enriquez for murder of a Bee- 
ville nurse—one of five persons 
he was accused of slaying with­
in six hours April 25, 1966. Trail 
of death extended from Corpus 
Christi, through Beeville and 
into Wilson County.

WANTED

«C;7 ri

SYRACUSE CHINA 
Since 1871

FOR RENT: Parking spaces 
in old Economy F ihkI P-irkinu 
lot buildinu, by the month. See 
Fred Young at Economy Food 
Store on West Date, across tho 
railroad. 49-tfc

WANTED: Scrap Iron. Cables. 
Metals. BALLINGER SALVAGE 
COMPANY. 27-tfc

FOR RENT; Trailer space at 
W, J . Yates Trailer Park. $27 50 
month, bills paid. 22-tfc

WESTERN MATTRESS SER­
VICE pick UD and delivery. 
Save up to 50*?, renovation, box 
springs to match. Guaranteed 
customer satisfaction. Phone 
7.54-455k, |ca\>- name. 23-tfc

FOR RENT: House, 5 rooms 
and bath, at Wingate. Bob Loyd, 
phone 754-4555. 42-tfc

Use Classified Ads
Manufacturer’s of Fina 

China! FOR RENT: 3-room house
and bath at 103 N. Frisco. Call 
7,54-5454 25-tfc

LOST & FOUND
FOUND P.iir of g'.iS'' Own 

er identify at Fmt* rprise offic* 
■ind pay for ad He

M ISCELLANEOUS

PURITAN PATTERII»

FAST OR SLOW, Western 
Auto will charge your battery 

21-tfc

Oven and Dishwasher Proof! 
Child Proof!

3 Year Bre.akage Guarantee! 
Strongest China in the World!

VACANCIES: We have a few 
vacancies, women, men or 
couples, at the Merrill Nursing 
home, phone 754-.5.172 37-tfc

Wanted to Buy

S1.-S5.-S10.
Silver Certificates
I Pay 23'V( Over Face Value 

Silver Dollars $1.30

Half Dollars, 1964 and 
Before 53c

Prompt Payment, Insure Mail

CARL BYNUM
(Real Estate Broker)
H09 Hutchings .Avenue
Ballinger, Texas 76821

47-tfc

Registry Service 
For Your Wedding 

GIFTS!

Bahiman Jewelers

Have you talked to us recently 
about automobile financing? Our 
present plan will save you 
money. The Winters State Bank, 
Winters. Texas. 41-tfc

INCOME TAX REPORTS 
M ADE. $2 50 up. Travis Jordan, 
209 West Pierce St., phone 754- 
4615. 46-4tp

LAST CHANCE
to take advantage of our

L A W N  M O W E R  
T U N E -U P  S P EC IA L
Thursday, Feb. 29, is the last day 
we will be able to offer complete 

Lawn Mower Tuneup for only

^5.88
Bring Your Mower In Now!

lestem Ehto

Commercial
AND

House Wiring
EXPERT SERVICE

SWATCHSUH 
HLLC'rKlC CO.

SPECIAL SESSION TALKS
With all the 1968 candidates 

now on the line and campaigns 
still in low gear, favorite capitol 
speculation is the date of the 
upcoming special legislative 
session.

Governor Connally must call 
one in order to pass a 1969 
budget and a new tax bill. This 
has to be done before Septem­
ber 1. start of the next fiscal 
year. Otherwise, there will he 
no money for continuation of 
state services.

Big question is when?
It has been widely assumed 

that Connally will wait until 
around June 3 when the pri­
mary elections will be over.

Since the governor said that 
he may ask legislators to con­
sider liquor-by-the-drink legali­
zation and conflict-of-interests 
curbs, speculation on the ses­
sion’s date has flared anew. It 
is felt that he may have an 
earlier date in mind, like may­
be March 4. Senate Secretary 
Charles Schnabel "predicted”

I this starting time in a Valentine 
Day letter to senators. Later he 
said he wrote with “ tongue in 
cheek” and wasn’t really seri­
ous.

Arguments run something like 
' this:

FOR JUNE — Legislators 
; won’t vote for a big fax bill with 
elections staring them in the 
face, and will resent having 
campaigns interrupted. Early 
session would put friends as 
well as foes on the spot and 
might result in defeat of some.

' Lawmakers are reluctant to 
vote for tax measures until the 
last minute, anyway; and along 
about July and August, they 
can’t put if off anv longer.

FOR MARCH — After their 
election lame duck legislators 
would be rebellious toward any 
tax program nr other contro­
versial measures submitted by 
the governor. More time might 
be needed to pass a major tax 
bill than would be allowed by 
a June session. New Demo­
cratic nominee for governor 
will be known by June, and the 
legislators may be inclined to 
lofik to him for leadership and 

, ignore Connally’s proposals.
Only man really in position to 

know is John Conna'Iy. He says 
he hasn’t made up his mind— 
and might not for several 
weeks. But adds: “Any date is 
a possibility.”

OIL DEMAND
Continued blockage of the 

Suez Canal and the TAP pipe­
line in the Middle East again 
has zoomed demand for Texas 
oil.

The Railroad Commission in­
creased February oil produc­
tion allowable from 47 to 49.6 
per cent of potential, retro­
active to February 1.

Commission set March factor 
at the same level, responding to 
demand by producers.

New allowable will permit 
maximum production of 3,732,- 
485 barrels a day, compared 
with 3,588,958 under 47 per cent 
factor.

homeowners rates are figured 
on a three-region basis due to 
weather hazards.

If adopted, rates would be ef­
fective June 1. Biggest money 
saving on home owners' prem­
iums would be in 10-county 
Sherman area where rates are 
now high.

SHORT SNORTS
Carl V. Ramert of Yoakum 

has been appointed District En­
gineer by State Highway En­
gineer J . C. Dingwall. . .Texas 
Industrial Commission named 
Jam es J .  Kelly as acting execu­
tive director. . .Texas Commit­
tee on Natural Resources vigor­
ously protested the lease of 
Meridian State Park property 
for a nine-hole public golf 
course.Cotton farmers in Huds­
peth and El P.aso Counties have 
until Feb. 29 to clean their 
fields of stalks to protect a- 
gainst pink bollworm—Gover­
nor Connally approved a re­
gional planning grant of $5.,500

RETURNED TO WINTERS | THE WINTERS ENTERPRISE
Mis Ima Sims has moved 

from ‘. jn ta  Anna to the Merrill 
Nursing Home, Winters, where 
she will make her home. All her 
friends are invited to visit her.
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Receipt Books available at
for the Concho Valley Council j Enterprise office, 
of Governments, San Angelo—*----------------- —  -

Business Services

Political
Announcements

«09 Heaters -  Refrigerators <
a

jT
á HOWARD’S T

• TRADING •
so POST 1
b

NEW A USED
o
a1 FURNITURE •

—t USED TYPEWRITERS -H
E.
9 BUY, SELL, TRADE

ft.

Phone 754-5214-Winters
118 East Dale *4

1 . Heaters ~  Refrigerators 8

DRAFT QUOTA UP SHARPLY
Texas draft boards next 

month must furnish the largest 
monthly quota of young men for 
military service in nearly two 
years.

Col. Morris S. Schwartz, state 
Selective Service director, said 
the local boards have been call­
ed on to provide 1,948 men— 
most since the 2.012-man quota 
of November, 1966. Low point 
in the interim was 674 men last 
February and 1,6.59 in January.

National call for March in­
duction is 39,000 men. All arc 
for the Army.

The Enterprise has been au­
thorized to announce the follow­
ing candidates for public office, 
subject to the Democratic Pri­
mary, to be held on May 4th;

For Slate 'Kepresentative, 64th 
District:
BERT V. MASSEY 

of Brown County 
EVERETT J .  GRINDSTAFF 

of Runnels County 
LYNN NABERS 

of Brown County

For District Judge,
119th Judicial District 
GLENN R LEWIS

SWATCHSUE
ELECTRIC CO.
Electrical and 

Air-Conditioning Contractor 
Sno-Breze and Friedrich 

Air Conditioners 
SALES & SERVICE 

Motorola Radio and TV 
Homelite Chain Saws 

J .  J .  SWATCHSUE, Owned
Jose De La Cruz 

Phone 754-5115 - Box 307

Quality
Commercial

Printing
Winters Enterprise

PROFESSIONAL 
RUG CLEANING 

Call 754-5406 
T. A. McMillan

FIRE RATE CUT PROPOSED
State Board of Insurance pro­

posed its first cuts in seven 
years (average of 3 6 per cent) 
in statewide fire, extended 
coverage and home owners in­
surance premiums.

Rate experts suggested 4.4 
per cent reduction in fire prem­
iums. 3 per cent in extended 
coverage and 3.1 per cent aver­
age for home owners.

Fire and extended coverage 
rates arc set statewide, and

TINA MILLIORN
Now Operating

MINNIE’S 
BEAUTY SALON

500 S. Melwood 

for a short time.

Former customers invited to 
call for appointments.

S I N G E R
SEWING MACHINES 
VACUUM CLEANERS

Sales
and

Service
PHONE 754-«22 
Beauty Center

APPOINTMENTS
ANNOUNCED

Governor Connally selected 
Consumer Credit Commissioner 
Francis A. Misk"ll as a mem­
ber of state Constitutional Re­
vision Commision.

Sen. Ralph Hall of Rorkwall. 
senate president pro tempore, 
has been designated state cam­
paign manager for guber­
natorial candidate John Hill.

William F. (Bill) Carter, 
press seeretary to the governor, 
will r''turn to his old job as 
DPS public information officer 
on M.arch 1.

James J .  Kelly will serve as 
acting executive director of the 
Texas Industrial Commission.

Kyle Thompson, capitol bu­
reau head of United Press In­
ternational. is handling press 
relations for gubernatorial can­
didate Eugene Lo<ke.

SUBSCRIBE NOW TO

Abilene
Reporter - New»

Reasonable subscription rat« 
with the freshest newt and fea­
tures.

CALL LOCAL AGENT
Byron D. Jobe

PHONE 734-4683

COURTS SPEAK
Texas Supreme Court has 

held that: Cities should not li­
cense door-to-door insurance 
salesmen (in a case originating 
in Hillsboro); City of Beau- 

! mont and its music commission 
I are not responsible for iniuries 
to a \joman who fell while at­
tempting to return to her seat 

I at a coficert in the city audi­
torium; Henderson County dis­
trict court must consider a land 
vacancy claim; .A jury trial 
must be  held in an Amarillo 
man's suit against a railroad

Rubbermaid Sale!
Dish Pans, Wastebaskets, 

Turntables, etc. $1.69 val. 99c 
Ecko Stainless Steel Table 
ware, open stock. Keepsake 

Pattern. 66c Sale!
We Redeem 

Gold Bond Stamps!

LAMKIN
HARDWARE

136 West Dale
48-2tc

D IA L
7 5 4 4 5 1 1

Day or Night 
Including Sunday» 

or Holiday»!
im EN  DESIRED

Air Ambulance
CAN BE ARRANGED 

ANY TIME! — ANY PLACEI

SPILL BROS. CO.
Winten, T exu

For Commissioner, Precinct 3: 
DAVID BRYAN 
JACK PATTON 
PAT PRITCHARD 

(Re-election)

PROFESSIONAL
D IR E a O R Y

Machine Shop
Welding

Portable Welding Equipment 
Complete Machine Shop

“CALL US FIRST”

Spill Machine Shop
Phone: Dav 7.54-.5324 

Night 754-4847

BLACKMON 
Repair and Body 

Shop
General Mechanical, Body 

and Paint Work.
Auto Glass Installed 

Auto Air Conditioner 
Service!

Reasonable Prices
126 North Church 

Phone 734-4918

Radio - TV Service
We Service All Makes! 

Satisfaction Guaranteed!

Main Radio & TV
Phone 754-4819 During Dav 

After 6 p. m. 753-4381

W. G. BEDFORD
ATTORNEY-AT-LAW 

General Practice 
Winters, Texas Ph. 754-4919

DR. Z. I. HALE
Optometrist

Tuesday. Thursday, 9-12, 1-5 
Saturday 9-12 

Winters. Texas

Jno. W. Norman
ATTORNEY-AT-LAW 

Winters, Texas

Dr. Loi» L. Belli»
CHIROPRACTOR

X-RAY
Phone 754-4326 Winters, Texas

General Insurance
Real Estate!

Kendrick Insurance Agency
Office 754-4710 Res. 754-4143

Read The Enterprise Classified Ads! ’

ÍRD NTIIR FRONTIER STAMPS ntONTIBI

SAVING 
STA M P iW Ith  Each Purchase!

Ì

SAVING 
STA M P

Visit Our store Often For Fine Foods A t Low Prices!

ROUND STEAK 
FAM ILY STEAK 
ARM ROAST 
PORK CHOPS 
SLAB BACON

lb.

lb.

lb.

lb.

lb.

89c
59c
59c
A5c
59c

IMPERIAL

SUGAR 5 lbs 59c
FOLGERS

COFFEE lb 79c
JEW EL

SHORTENING 3 lbs 59c
DEL MONTE — 303 Cans

CORN 2 For 49c

MISSION — 303 Cans

GARDEN PEAS 3ca.59c
DIAMOND — 303 Cans

CUT BEANS 3c.n.45c

CAKE MIX
GANDY’S

FROZAN

3.» S1.00 

39cI , Cial. 
3 i^-Gal, tins. $1.00

POTATOES 10 *.s 49c
LETTUCE i.i>rKv nwKis Lii. 19c 
BANANAS *> 12c 
Fresh TOM ATOES . 23c

Store Hours 7 :00  A. M. to 8 :0 0  P. M. Seven Days Week

B A L K U M ’ S
GROCERY AND MARKET

Phone 754-4117 202 E. Truitt
Double Stamp» on Wednesday» with $2.50 or more purchase!
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Fat Stock Show 
To Open In San 
Angelo March 6

Thousands of West Texans 
will converge on San Angelo 
next week for the 33th Annual 
San Angela Stock Show and 
Rodeo, and the Queen City of 
the Conchos will have its hos­
pitality polished up for its 
neighbors from surrounding 
communities.

Hundreds of West Texas

youngsters will be tirriving first 
with scores of livestock entries 
for the iiuge show, set to open 
Wednesday, March 6.

Some of the nation’s top rodeo 
cowboys wiil be hitting tlie city 
early, too, in preparation for the 
Sun Angelo Rodeo, one of the 
wildest produced in the country. 
Rodeo performances will start 
Thursday night, March 7, and 
continue through Sunday after­
noon, March 10. Official opening 
ptirade will be held at 4 p. m., 
Thursday, only a few hours be­
fore the first performance is 
held in San Angelo’s million- 
fioltiir coliseum.

County Food 
Service Ass'n.
To Meet Feb. 24

The Runnels County School 
r-'cKxi Service Association will 
meet at the Ballinger Elemen­
tary school cafeteria at 9 a. m. 
Saturday, February 24.

Curley Hays, domestic de­
monstrator for West Texas 
Utilities Co. in Abilene, will pre­
sent a program on isometric 

i exercises.

Buford Green, 
Vietnam Veteran, 
Dies In Hospital

Buford O. Green, 22, of Sweet­
water, died at 5: i5 Suturdtiy at 
Hendrick Memorial Hospital.

His wife is the former DeAnn 
Beilis, daughter of Drs. Dick 
and Lois Beilis of Winters, 

j Green was a Vietnam veteran 
! and had been awarded the 
, Bronze Star with oak leaf clus­

ter.
Luneral was held Monday at 

2 p. m. at the Ci.sco Baptist 
Church, with the Rev. Mark 
Agnew, retired Baptist minister 
officiating, assisted by the Itev 
.lames Hall, pastor of Cisco 

I Baptist Church.
! He was bom .March 1, 1945 
; in Nimnxi.
j He is survived by his wife, 
DeAnn of Sweetwater, whom he 
married Dec. 24. 1965, in Cisco; 

i one son, Roy Allen of Sweet 
water; his parents Mr. and 
Mrs. Buford D. Green of Cisco; 
one brother, Edward of Ctsco;
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one sister, Mrs. Joyce Mitchell 
of Lubbock; his grandparents, 
Mr. and Mrs. J . O. Naylar of 
Scranton and Mr. and Mrs. J .  
D. Green of Cisco.

Ethnology is a study of man­
kind.

Little men cannot pardon.

I -

F'FA WEEK—Governor John 
Connally has proclaimed the 
week of February 17-24 as FFA 
W'eek in Texas. Left to right are 
George Hurt, State Advisor of 
the Te.xas FFA, Governor Con­
nally, and Danny Burns, Presi­
dent, Texas As.sociation of F'u- 
turc Farmers of America.

City Leases 
' Lake Property

The Winters City Council 
Monday night accepted a bid 
from Charlie Grohman for leas 
ing grazing rights at the Win­
ters City Lake. Three bids had 
been received, with Grohman 
bidding $1000 for the rights for 
one year, with a one-year op­
tion. Two other bids were re­
ceived, for $905 and $903.

The Council also gave per­
manent status to C. C. Paske as 
superintendent of the City Light 
Plant. Paske had been on a 
temporary basis since he Uxrk 
over that position when N. D, 
Waggoner resigned s o m e  
months ago.

Council also discus.ced repairs 
and improvements planned at 
the Municipal Swimming Pool, 
and also repair work on the 
equipment at the Municipal 

J  Light Plant,

Miles Building To 
'G e t Historical 
-Marker Soon

The historic Old Thiele Build 
ing in Miles has Ireen named a 
Recorded Texas Historic Land 

I m.trk, significant to the history 
of Ihi“ community and state, and 
worthy of prcservati.'in, Charles 

 ̂ WiMxlhurn of Amaiillo. presi- 
<len' of the Texas State Histori 
cal Survey Committee.

A s a result of me-ting T S H S C  
, reniiiremen-s for this high of- 

field designation, the Texas 
Historic d Building Medallior 
with inlernreiive pl.ale giving r 
cansule h'storv of the structure 
will he affixed to the structure 

• Dedication of the marker wil’ 
he annoiin'-ed bv Rankin Pace 
of Winters, rhairman of the 
Riinne's County Histnrieal Sur­
vey Corn m it tee. A rertificate by 
( t o v . John Connallv. Woorlhurn 
and P.ire will be presented at 
the dedic.ntion.

I he nid I hiele Building was 
htiih in 1901 bv Joe Thiele 
sheep raneher and civic leader 
Native stone dug from Willow 
Creek w;is used in the construc- 

.  tien The building first housed 
the Runnels County National 
Bank, with the second story 
used as ¡m opera house, social 
and cultural center of the town, 
where road shows were staged, 
political rallies and wrestling 
bouts were held. In 1923, the 
school was located in the build­
ing. Later the structure was 
used as a drv good store, gro- 
cerv, post office. Hotel, and a- 
gain a hank.

M r. Winter Keeps 
Grip On Winters

Following a day or two of al- 
most-spring, winter closed in 
again on the Big Country Wed­
nesday morning early, sending 
the temperature plummeting 
from an acceptable 40 degrees 
to 25 degrees within a couple of 
hours.

This section of the country, 
already over-soaked by winters 
dhzzcls and ice storms, faced 
the possibility of more moisture, 
as high winds sent clouds scud­
ding across the sky.

Already, a total of 8.5 inches 
of rain has been received in 
Winters since January 1—this 
has been the wettest winter for 
the area in the memory of 
many. January’s rainfall was 
measured at 5.6, with February 
accounting for 2.9 inches up to 
Wednesday of this week.

Former Resident 
Died Tuesday 
!n California

Mrs. Charles Overholt, 48. 
fill mer Winders school teacher, 
died in Los Angeles, Calif., at 
Id a. m. Tuesday following an 
iilnrss of several months.

The body will arrive in Abi­
lene Saturday evening, and 
funeral «services have been set 
for Monday, under direction o' 
Spill Funeral Home of Winters

Born S e l m a  Chnpmond. 
daughter of Mrs. Earl Chap- 
mond and the late Mr. Chap- 
mond of Winters, March 9. 1919 
at Winters, she attended Win­
ters schools and graduated in 
1937. She received her degree 
from Abilene Christian College 
in 1941 and entered the Armed 
Forces in 1942.

She served three and one-half 
years, part of the time in the 
European The.iter. Following 
her discharge, she taught in the 
Winters school system, later 
moving to San Diego, Calif., 
where she owned and operated 
a costume shop. She was marri­
ed in 1959 in Los Angeles. Calif. 
She worked for CBS Television 
there until retiring in 1964,

Survivors inelude her hus­
band; mother. Mrs. Earl Chap- 
mo;id of Winters: a brother.
Lawrence Chapmond of Winters 
and a nephew of Winters.

RAINFALL RECORD
(Unofficial)

’63 ’64 ’65 66
Jan
Feb
Mar
Apr
May
Jun
Jul
Aug
Sep
Oct
Nov
Dec
Tot

0.0
1.3
0.0
2.8
7.7
2.2
Ö.Ö
5.2 
0.8 
0.1
3.2 
12

1.9 
3 1 
1.8 
2.3
1.5
3.5 
1.0 
3 5
5.2 
0.7
3.3 
0.6

2.5
3.7 
0.3 
2.0 
9.3
3.8 
0.1 
0 8
3.9 
2.8 
2.0
1.9

1.7 
1.0
1.3
7.8
1.2
1.9 
O.I
7.3 
2.8 
2.7 
0.0 
0.0

’67
0.0
0.1
1.2
1.0
1.3
5.0
4.2 
11 
8.7 
0.0
5.3
2.0

’68
5.6
2.9

24.5 28.4 33.1 27.8 29.9 8.5

Mrs. Joe Baker 
Hosted .Meeting of 
Baptist VVMU Circle

Mrs. Joe Baker was hostess 
for the regular meeting of the 
Lounette Templeton Circle of 
the First B îptist Church 
W.M.U. in her home, 201 West 
Pierce.

Mrs. Paul Cozhy, chairman, 
■»resided for the meeting. It was 
innounced the mission study 
■>ook ’’Trumpets in Dixie.” will 
he taught February 27, at the 
-hurch when a covered-dish 
supper will be served.

Mrs. John Q. McAdams gave 
'he call to prayer and Mrs. W. 
R. Kennedy led the prayer for 
missionaries.

Mrs. M. E. Bains was leader 
for the program on “Student 
Work in the U S.A She stated 
“we must strive to keep our 
'lomes Christ centered. The 
'hurch does not produce mis­
sionaries, God does that, but 
missionaries do come from our 
■hurches and homes. Churches 

must envolve youth in being 
toes of the word and not he.ar- 
■»rs only.

“ International students in the 
USA must be given a welcome 
and recognized by church mem­
bers off campus as well as on 
eampus. Become better ac­
quainted personally with these 
students because church mem­
bers must be envolvcd,”

Mrs. Grover Davis gave the 
arnver for the international stu- 
fents and local youth serving 
''ach day more like a Christian 
tor USA future leaders. A love 
offering was taken,

Mrs. Loyd Roberson closed 
'be meeting with prayer.

Present were Mesdames Lee 
'"hoMte, F. D. Gardner, M. E 
Baines. John Q. McAdams. W 
R Kennedy, Grover Davis, 
t ovd Robertson. Paul Cozhy 
he hostess and a euest. Mrs 

Bernice Gardner, W.M.U. pre­
sident.

ATTORNEY GENERAL 
RULES

State Department of Public 
Welfare is required to make 
“medicaid” payments direct t<- 
loetors and hospitals for medi- 
'a l care of welfare recipients 
says Atty. Gen. Crawford Mar­
tin.

In other recent opinions. Mar­
tin held that: Public junior col­
leges are local educational a- 
'’eneies, providing “public free” 
secondary education at public 
expense and subject to public 
supervision and direction; and 
the State Insurance Commis­
sioner does not have authoritv 
to approve an amendment to an ; 
insurance company’s charter 
which, in effect, transforms it 
mto a rmTir’ crcial comorat'on 
**pqui*-ed to ha\'e a charter from 
the Secretary of Sta*e.

The famous folk art toys of 
Alexander Girard will be dis­
played at HemisFair ’68 in Snn 
Antonio.

HURRY
PICK UP rOUR FR£C CMRD HOW 

HO OBIICATIOH 
0 SIMPLE TO PLAY

LUCKY
•6 T 'A' M P E  D e

SNOWDRIFT

SH O R TENIN G  3 ^ c » 6 9
NO. 2 DOLE

P IN E A P P LE Chunk
Sliced
Crushed 3 '

Cans
$ • 1 0 0

GOLD MEDAL

F L O U R

10 -lb . Sack 9 8
DOLE PINK

PINEAPPLE - GRAPEFRUIT

D R IN K  4 6 - O z . Can 25

CARNATION — ALL FLAVORS

INSTANT BREAKFAST 
COFFEE MATE 
BAKED BEANS 
BEEF STEW
303 LIBBY’S

GREENS

IG-oz. Morton House Cans

24-oz. Morton I louse

MUSTARD, TURNIP, MI.XED

P O T A T O E S
Russet ] Q - l b . B a g 3 9

PASCAL CELERY 
FRESH CARROTS 
Red Rome APPLES 
LEn U C E 2

St-jIk

Bag

lb.

15c
15c
19c
25c

MORTON’S

BOOTH

Frozen Food Department 
FRO ZEN M EAT DINNERS n . 39c

Mb Pks $ 1 . 0 9

16-oz. Pkg. 65c 
28-oz. Pkg. 33c 

3 For 89c

Booth

BREADED SHRIMP 
FISH STICKS 
A . F . ROLLS 
AW AKE JUICE 9-oz. Cans

DRUG D E P T . SPECIALS
STYLE — REG. 89c SELLER

HAIR SPRAY 48c
36 TABLETS

EXCEDRIN
SUCRETS

M O N Z E N G E S
SCOPE

MOUTHWASH

Only

Reg. 59c 
Seller

12-oz.

59c
48c
83c

Head & Shoulders-79c

H 0 R A 4 EL
N O  B O N E -N O  WASTE 3-lb. Can *2 ’̂

l b .  3 9 '
H E N S

lO-lb to I2-lb.

HAM
TURKEYS 
PORK STEAK >̂ 59 
PORK ROAST Ik 49

A. F. LUNCH

M E A T
Bologna Your 
Pickle Choice 
Olive 6>oz. Pkg. 29

A. F. SLICED

B A C O N
Pound 6 9 ^
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MOVIES
‘Th'.' Juii”le Book”

Til.' wcn-lt'iful iind special 
ward of Wait Disney anima- 
I on realties its pinnacle with 
t'le musi-'al comisiy, “The 
■lunKie Hiiok." inspired by Rud- 
yard Kinlinp's “Mowpli" stories 
ah 11' a bey who wants to live 
h's life n fb*' iun;l ■ amona the 
aranials he knows and loses.

Th'' final animated fea’ure to 
b” personally produced by the 
master shawman. it represents 
thirty years of cartooninjj ex­
perience — incorpuratin“ the 
tried, the proven and the new 
in style, design and concept, 
and realistically capuirinp the 
inh.ibitants of the júnete and 
tht :r lush, colorful and adven­
turous world.

And in like no other Disney 
nnim.itid feature have the 
voices and personalities of its 
nrinoip'e vocal talent, such as 
the in.iom'*.ible Phil Harris, as 
Baloo, the bear: Sebastian Ca­
bot as B.iyheera. the panther: 
1 ouis Prim.i as Kinc Louie of 
the .apes George Sanders, as 
th»- tig*-r: Sterling Holloway as 
Ka . the python, and .1 Pat 
O N!al'i-y as Colonel Hathi, the 
elephant influeno-'d the de-

velopment of its characters so 
:'erfevtly. Can iequ-.-ntly. the re­
sults are more lifelike and be­
lievable th in anything that has 
gone before.

THE WINTERS ENTERPRISE 
Winters, Texas

P a s : e  6
Friday, February 23. 19S-S

Read The Enterprise Classified Ads!

Thinking of . . .

Remodeling? 
Adding a Room? 
Painting a Little? 
Re-Roofing?
Let us assist ycu in any of these 

projects!

EASY FINANCING AVAILABLE
. . . along with the most reliable 

workmen in town!

Call on Foxworth-Galbraith for any 
undertaking you desire.

FOXW ORTH-GALBRAITH 
LUMBER COM PANY

PHONE 7S4-33I8 WINTERS. TEXAS

STATE Theatre
DOORS OPEN 8:30 P. M. 1 ADMISSION:

FRIDAY M TE Adults 75c
2:00 P. M. Students 75c

SATURDAY & SUNDAY Children 35c
With Continuous Showing (Ages 5 thru 11)

FRIDAY, SATURDAY, SUNDAY
February 23. 24. and 25

IHE ISJUmiPlH’ WITH JOY! 
Walt Disney

★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★

1
.3 c

C/k

IJeavor Valley”
Walt Disney's "B-.-aver Val 

'■■V ■' belongs to his famous 
I True-Life Adventure series that 
'trs won .1 record numh»-r of 
honor.», and includes a notable 
array of individually acclaimed 
subjects.

“Beaver N’allev” ranks lugh 
in the series with an Academy 
.Award as well as .i Venice Film 
Festival Special Prize, a U.S. 

¡Camera Cold .Achievement A- 
I ward a Berlin Film Festival 
, Golden Bear Award, a British 
! Film .Academy Award .and 
'many other honors from civic 
groups and international or­
ganizations.

. Other True-Life Adventures 
I that have wen Oscars include 

“Seal Island,” "Nature's Half 
Acre.” “ Wafer Birds" and 
“Bear Country."

"Beaver Valley,” in Techni- 
; color, tells the story of the 
heaver, nature's leading hui'der 
of dams, and his wildlife neigh 
bors, including moose, deer, 
bear, otter, coyote and many- 
other inhabitants of the sur­
rounding land, vvat* r and air. 
Buen 1 \'ista re-relenses.

The Indian jungle is full of 
surprises and Mowgli und his 
pals, Ual(xi, the bear and Bag- 
heera. the panther stumble on 
a new one as younji girl cross-

Las‘ mcn'h's dcoinim of t’v 
nation's leading securities ex­
changes to lop an hour and a 
half off each day's trading ses- 
'ion has created some new 
iroblems and may have only 

nartially solved old ones. De­
signed to give brokerage houses 
and the exchanges themselves 
a chance to catch up with and 
keep abreast of a rising volume 
of paperwork, the early clos­
ings have irked brokers and in­
vestors in California and other 
West Coast States.

Time Zone LimUaliwu 
The discomfiture and fruì 

traiion of California brokers

WASHINGTON
" A s  i t  lo o k s

fr o m  k o r o "

Phil Harris, Sebastian CuIkh,
Louis Pnma. George Sanders, j 
Sterling Holloway, J. Pat O'-i 
.Malley and Bruce Reitherman. j
Filmed in Technicolor, ; who now- must man their offices

es th.ir patJi in Walt Disney's Jungle Book’ was inspired by | j,, 7 g ^
anima?»-d musical. "The Jungle Rudyard Kipling’s ".Mowgli” | g, breakneck soeed to set the
Rook. With the voice talents of stories. ___ ____ I gj day’s work done by

 ̂ ^  (Pacific Time)
! closing hour of the New York 
exchanges may one day prove 

I to have been a major factor in 
' d»’terminmg new hours for these 
I  exchanges. Already, the disen- 
! '■hantment out West has revived 
i  •'n idea which has heen toved 
, with from time to time—but 
, never taken too seriously— 
' namely, abandonment of the 
! four continental U. S. time 
zones in favor of a two-zone ar-

^ ,  I ... . .. , rangement calculated to drawOn this, the birthdav of our I committed in the name of• .1- u J  . J- 'h e  whole nation closer to-first President, Gecrge Wash- democracy. we must i o .»her
ington. It is natural that w e' tinguish between real de-1
should devote some time to the mocracy and the sham and pre- Of course, a two-zone system 
consideration of the influence tense which seeks to m as-; present some difficulties
which America’s greatest hero, querade under democracy's '** own. For exampl^ under 
soldier and statesman has had 1 cloak. We must remember that ^ “^" arrangement. Boston s

winter sunrise could come af­
ter 6 a. m., with the sun setting 
in mid-afternoon and the dark-

OMAR BURLESON
Congressman 
17rii District

ste.idily in selected business 
circles and among labor lead­
ers. Despite opposition from 
traditionalists and from those 
w.io k-l-I tiiat a move towun 
thr*-e-day weekends would only 
compound present traffic prob­
lems in the air and on th< 
ground, this is the change most 
likely to become a reality, pos­
sibly in the early 1970’s.

in any event, we arc heade< 
for further increases in leisur 
time. Already, both summe 
and winter vacation.' are mon 
common, the number of fami­
lies having leisure-time homer 
is expanding, and travel and 
camping are being brought 
within the reach of more and 
more people. As our horizons 
broaden and our choices in 
crease, the focus will be op 
making the best use of our in 
creased leisure time.

The Family 
Lawyer

For Passengers Only

upon our Republic.
To many, the m'vst outstand­

ing work that Washington ac- 
complish--d was his invaluable 
aid in the formation of the 
American Constitution which, 
although only Ikl years old. is

no government can be auto­
matic; that it depends upon the | 
intelligence, the integrity and 
the loyalty of her citizens.

Washington made himself im -' 
mortal as the founder of our 
Constitution. It is our duty to , 

still the oldest, active, political I administer that Constitution  ̂
document existing in the world a* lo guarantee to our citizens , 
today Since 17S7, when our, those full rights and privileges 
Constitution was adopted, civili- which are inherently American- 
z.ition has been a world of and which have made America 
tumbling t h r o n e s ,  pros- great, 
trated dvnasties. overturned ------------------------------

ness of night falling before 4 
n. m. And East Coast summer­
time sunrise could he as early 
as 3 a. m.. with New York’s 
only minutes later. By con­
trast. sunrise and sunset times 
in California would be less ex-

constitutions—of new empires, 
new republics, new and con­
stantly varying conceptions of 
states—yet in this epoch of up­
heaval, during the last 181 
years, one political entity, and 
one alone, has remained intact: 
that is the Constitution of the 
fnited States of .\merica.

Winters IndeocBdent Schools

SCHOOL MENU
(Subject to Change)

could come as late as 8 a. m.
Time Relative, Not Absolute
To Americans hern in this 

century, our present four zones 
(Eastern. Central. Mountain, 
and Pacific) seem to be so 
traditional as to defy change. 
And they may well prove to be. 
But just to keep the record 
straight, it should be acknow­
ledged that these time zones 
are not exactly hoary with age

Our Constitution is not self- 
perpttu.'ited. If it is to survive.

Monday, February 28
Choice: Smothered iiver and' Only gradually did" thev win

acceptance during the 19th cen-oninns or barbecuf-d weiners 
buttered rice, spinach, dill

it will he because it has public P'^kles, carrot sticks, peanut
ggj butter cookies, corn muffins, 

milk or chocolate milk.
support:support—active 

pas'ive.
The Constitution of the United ' Tuesday, February 27 

States is the final refuge of j Choice; Hot dogs or combina- 
every right that is enjoyed by ' tion sandwich. French fries, 
any .American citizen So long ; catsup, tossed green salad. lem- 
.is it is observed, these rights on-coconut cake, milk or choco-
will be secure. Whenever it falls 
into disrespect or disrepute, or­
derly organiz»-d government, as 
we have known it fci 181 years, 
will bt> at an end.

late milk.
Wednesday, Fehruary 28

Beef and potato casserole, 
black eye peas, fresh tomato 
and Dickie slice, rrange juice, 

Washington was the president sweet rolls, com muffins, milk 
of the Con'titution.ol Assembly 1 or chocolate milk.
which met in Philadelphia in 
1787 and which produced the 
Amf-ric.on Constitution There­
fore. Washington can rightly b<- 
callt-d the Father of his Country 
and the founder of its Constitu- 
'ion.

Thursday, February 29
Fried chicken, cream gravy, 

mashed potatoes, green beans, 
gelatin fruit salad, chocolate 
cake, hot rolls, milk.

Friday, March 1
_ , . , Barbecue on bun, pinto beans.
Every .American citizen today • ,.g|p l̂aw, orange juice, lazv- 

hould study his Constitution
That great body of laws can be 
'•ead in only 30 minutes of time, 
•»nd vet it contains every right 
'hat we have, direct and in­
direct.

daisy cake, milk.

tury following the opening of 
transcontinental railroad ser­
vice. Before that time, local op­
tion ruled, with resultant con­
fusion and frustration.

Holiday Weekends
The idea of tinkering with 

time is not confined to the 
clock, but extends also to the 
calendar. A good many business 
interests—catering to leisure­
time needs or desires—are ac­
tive in advocating calendar re­
form. Other proponents stress 
their belief that a general over­
haul of the calendar would cut 
costs for many businesses. In 
very recent years, the idea of 
calendar change has attracted 
widespread attention, a fair 
measure of support, but no real 
groundswoll of assent from the 
public.

Those who want calendar re­
form fall into two groups: The 
advocates of a sweeping change 
which would realign our months 
so that each would be of uni­
form length, and the advocates

Passengers on a trolley or a 
train, a taxi or a bus, get more 
than a ride for their money. 
They also get the benefit of a 
special legal status. As pass­
engers on a public carrier, they 
arc entitled to an extra measure 
of care for their safety.

In case of accident, this privi­
leged status may make the dif­
ference between cc-Ilecting a 
goodly sum as damages and 
collecting nothing at all. But to 
qualify, you must indeed be a 
"passenger”—as that term is 
defined by the law.

At what moment, legally, do 
you become a passenger, en­
titled to this special protection” 
Consider this case:

A bus driver, failing to see a 
woman coming up the steps of 
his bus. shut the door on her 
leg. When she claimed damages 
for the resulting injury, the bus 
company protested that she had 
not acquired the status of a pas­
senger because she had not act­
ually entered the bus.

Nevertheless, the court up­
held her claim.

“The law is not so narrow,” 
said the judge, “as to conceive 
of the relation of carrier and 
passenger only when a person 
is actually on board. To the con-' 
trary, the law deems that re­
lation to exist when one is prop­
erly on the steps entering.”

On the other hand, a man 
waiting at a sidewalk bus stop 
was held not yet a passenger 
as the bus was pulling up to the 
curb. At that moment he was 
jostled against the bus and in­
jured. Lacking the status of a 
passenger, he failed in his ef­
forts to make the bus company 
pay his doctor bills.

After you are once on board, 
how long does the passenger 
status continue? Generally it i

ends when you disembark—but 
'xily if you are let oft in a place 
if eom,‘iarative safKy.

In one case u cub driver dis­
charged two ehiidreii into a busy 
Ircet, and a passin't car .struck 
hem down. "The cab company 

was held liable for the accident 
because the children, not hav­
ing been delivered to a safe 
place, were still passengers in 
the eyes of the law.

If you are let off at a carrier’s 
depot, you ordinarily remain a

passenger until leaving the 
premises. But nut if you linger 
there too long.

For example, a man who was 
injured after remaining at a bus 
depot for almost two hours, 
waiting to be picked up by a 
friend, was held to have lost his 
passenger status.

The court reasoned that, after 
so much delay, the man had 
shed his special rank and had 
become just another member 
of the public.

USED
CARS

1 10A7 4-Dr. IMP ALA SEDAN
Air, V-8, P, Steer., Power Glide, 28,,000 mi.

1-1966
1-1965
1-1966

BEL AIR 4-dr. SEDAN
Air Cond., 8-cyl., Standard Trans.

BEL AIR 4-dr. SEDAN
Air Conditioned

FORD V-8 4-dr. SEDAN

1-1964

1-1963
1-1963
1-1963
1-1963
1-1961
1-1961

IMPALA 4-door
P. steer., P. Brakes, Air Cond., V-8, 
Power Glide.

IMPALA SPORT COUPE
4-Speed, 327 V-8.

BEL AIR 4-door
V-8, Air Conditioned.

BEL AIR
8-Cylinder, Standard Trans.

PONTIAC SPORT COUPE
Power and Air, Stick Shift!

IMPALA 4-dr. SEDAN
V-8, Air Conditioned, Power Glide.

FORD SPORT COUPE
V-8, Power Steering.

P IC K U P S
1-1965
1-1965
1-1963
1-1960

CHEVROLET V-8
FLEETSIDE!

CHEVROLET 6-cyl.
STEPSIDE!

CHEVROLET 6-cyl.
STEPSIDE!

CHEVROLET
Long Wheel Base, 4-Speed Trans.

WADDELL
Chevrolet Co.

Winters, Texas Phone 754-5310

Thtre are several basic prin­
ciples underlying our Constitu- 
'inn:

FIRST. It establishes a Rep­
resentative form of govern­
ment.

SECOND It establishes a 
dual form of government, each 
'itiz 'n  living under two forms 
■f government, the national and
he state '

THIRD It guarantees to its ' 
■'izens individual liberty, free- ■ 

lorn of speech, liberty of the , 
'ress. right to own property and 
'he right to worship God accord-1
no »o -o-t- tot -1» '-r nscience

FOURTH It establishes an 
Independent ludiciarv. and 
creatert *he Su'ir'm '' fouH |

FIFTH. I' preven's the ron 
'■entr.oti'n of oower in the hand«- 
of one man or a oroup of men i 
by cheeks and balanees. rreat 
mg the three domr*mepts of | 
governmorit — the leoislalive 
be iudieial and the eveeutive— 

■•nrh dopar'ment independent 
and ye* cooperatina w'th each , 
other to th» working of .a har ' 
•nonious government This pro- i 
vision of our Constitution has; 
been the safeguard of the N.o 
tion in the days gone, and the | 
perpetuity of our institutions in 
the future depends upon the in- j 
dependence of these three func- i  
'inns of government '

SIXTH. And. finally, it places ; 
n the hands of the President ] 

■>nd the S'-nate ioint now»r in , 
datrrminin» the foreign affairs | 
of our Nation.

It is especially important in ! 
these days of unrest to become ' 
students of our great funda-1 
montai law. It has been our  ̂
«»uiding genius for almost two ' 
-enfuries. from the time when 
our country consisted of onlv 
3 000.000 people along the Atlan­
tic seaboard In a topsy-turvv 
world in which sins are being i

FILLED MILK SUIT FILED
Wholesome Dairy Inc. of El of a plan which would reshuffle 

Paso filed suit in the 53rd Dis- our major holidays so that each 
trict Court against the State of of these would be observed on
Texas in an attempt to keep 
the State Health Department 
from blocking the sale of “ Far­
mer’s Daughter High Protein 
Drink,” a mixture of dry and 
powdered milk, vegetable oils 
and other materials.

State law prohibits the manu­
facture or sale of “filled milk,”

a Monday to provide a three- 
day weekend.

Leisure-Time Use 
The day when broad agree­

ment on any reduction of our 
present time zones will be 
reached would appear to be 
some distance into the future 
Nor will sweeping calendar re-

any milk or milk product mixed form be enacted any time soon 
will fat nr oil other than milk However, support for the Mon­
fat. day holiday idea is growing

F I R E  I N S U R A N C E
that really covers

Severe damage by fire could result in a claim that might 
pay little more than the amount of your mortgage. But 
this does not protect the full values of your home. See us 
today!

BEDFORD
INSURANCE AGENCY

SERVICE
and GROWTH

This bank has grown because it has always safeguarded 
th,e interests of depositors. All accounts get the same 
careful attention. It is our purpose to give each patron a 
servic.e that is prompt and dependable.

Established in 1906, it has been an important factor in 
community development through the years. Old friends 
have been kept, and new friends have been made. Sound 
policies have resulted in steady growth.

Today we are in a position to be even mor,e helpful to all 
patrons. New depositors will be cordially welcomed.

The Winters State Bank
WINTERS. TEXAS

Capital Accounts $600,000.00
Member Federal Oepotit Insurance Corporation and Federal Reserve Syatem
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B R A D S H A W
“ i'here is n bond of fellow-1 

i !»ip in sorrow that knows no' 
ronvonticnalitics.” —Harold B. i 
Wright.

Those, cut of the nrea, attend­
ing the funeral of Alex 
Bu hanan Wednesday of last 

(Week at Wint'>rs were Mr. and 
Mrs. Hugh Butler and Benny of 
lienorah. Doyle Buchanan of 
Lawton, Okla., Mrs. Elner 
Swann and Mary, Abilene, Mr. 
and Mrs. Nelson Owens, Abi­
lene. Mr and Mrs. George 
Swann of Ballinger, Billy Wayne 
Swann of Austin, Troy Buchan­
an of Hobbs, N. M., Mr. and 
Mrs. Bill Sudberrv, Abilene, Mr. 
and Mrs. Floyd Harwood, Ron- 
nv and Kay Lynn and Leland. 
Mr. and Mrs. Donald Harwood 
of Lubbock, Mr. and Mrs. Willie 
Masters of San Angelo, Mr. and 
Mrs. Chester Scott, Mrs. Beth 
.Buchanan, T. A. and Charles 
of Abilene, Mrs. Junior Talbot 
and Mrs. Teola Little of Abi­
lene, Mr. and Mrs. L. T. Davis, 
Gary, Jennie and Greg, Mr. and 
Mrs. Bobby Creek and ^obby 
Jr ., of Olton, Mr. and Mrs. 
FIcN'd Pyle. Keith and Charles 
/if Abilene, W. T. Buchanan of 
Richmond. Va., Mr. and Mrs. 
Darrell Harwood of Okla., Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Bradshaw, Mr. 
and Mrs. Ben Brazil, Abilene, 
Mr. and Mrs. Armond G. Buch­
anan of Ballinger.

Out of the area, attending the 
funeral of Mrs. Frank Hale 
Thursday of last week at Win­
ters. were her granddaughters, 
Dickie, a Navy nurse stationed 
in Philadelphia, Penn., and

NEW DEALERS 
FOR

LINDSEY
SEED

AW varieties grain, 
silage types, IJnd- 
sey 77H, sorghum, 
Sudan grass.
* David Carroll
 ̂ Phone 754-4225
• Weldon Mills
Phone P 07-3152

49-6tc

Martha, a student at the Uni­
versity of Texas, Austin, Mrs. I 
Walter Griffith, Naldie Hale, 
Mrs. Junior Talbot and Mrs. | 
Teola Little of Abi'ene, Mr. and 
Mrs. Lercy Hale and daughter, | 
Mr. and Mrs, Tom Hale, M r.' 
ind Mrs. Pe-k Hale. Mr. and 
Mrs. Top Hale all of Midland. 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Hale of Big 
Spring. Mr. and Mrs Irvin Hale 
of Dublin. Mr. and Mrs. Donnie 
Oakes and Susan of Merkel. Ar- 
zo Bagwell of Robert Lee, Mrs. 
Mabel Bagwell of Clarksville 
Mr. end Mrs. Rannie Hale of 
Crystal City, Mrs. .1. D. John­
son of Arlington and Mrs. Gus 
Davis of Dallas.

Visitors Sunday mom'ng and 
night at the Mom Baptist 
Church were Rev. and Mrs. Ray 
Lee Best and four children of 
Abilene. Ray Lee dclivert*d the 
Sunday messages. For the 
morning special Mrs. Calwyn 
Walters and Clyde Reid sang, 
Come Unto Me, with Brenda 
Reid at the piano. For the niaht 
specials the Boosters (the chil­
dren) sang Jesus Loves The 
Little Children a n d  God 
Answers Prayer. Mrs. Walters 
and Clvde sang Let Others See 
Jesus In You.

Louis Sneed and Kathey Kelly 
of Hardin-Simmons were morn­
ing visitors at the Drasco Bap­
tist Church.

Saturday night the following 
from the Drasco Church at­
tended a Valentine Banouet at 
the South Side Baptist Church. 
Winters; Randall and Rhonda 
Sneed. Lanham and Leslie Bis­
hop, Cindy West, Melba and 
Terry Lewis, Lynn Giles, Mrs. 
R. Q. West, Mrs. Melvin Ray 
Williams, Mrs. Dick Bishop 
Mrs. L. Q. Sneed and Mr. and 
Mrs. Albert Lewis. Randall and 
Rhonda Sneed were made King 
and Queen from the Drasco 
Church and Linda Roberts and 
Jesse McGallian were King and 
Queen from the South Side 
Baptist Church, Rev. Virgil 
James, pastor of the South Side 
Church, presented a Bible to 
each King and Queen.

Special days next week are 
for; Mrs. Garland Robin.son 
and Cheryl Bryan the 25th; Ce- 
lita Kay Faircloth and Mrs. L. 
Q. Sneed the 26th; Mrs. C. T. 
Conner, Billy Talley, Mrs. Ray­
mond Cornelius, Debra Burch, 
L. Q. Sneed and Warren Foster 
the 28th; Mrs. A. D. Lee, Ken-

WE COMMEND our local and state police authorities for their 
vigorous enforcement of the law. We denounce with equal vigor 
lawlessness and civil disobedience. We deplore the fact that the 
new Code of Criminal Procedure tends to overprotect the offender 
and hinder law enforcement. We urge adoption of a criminal code 
which will strengthen law enforcement rather than weaken It.
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ncth M m'i"'l uiv.l K.iten Mo ' 
stud the 29 h; A. K. Bullard 
anJ a wedding .toniver.sary for 
Mr. and firs. Emmett Shell- 
hou'ie the Ist; M'"s. Billy Joe 
Walker and a w-dd>nt ann'vcr 
snry for Mr and Mrs. Button 
Little the 2nd.

Pas'or W.avne Og!'>sby 
Sunday dinner with the Billi'' 
McCasli nds and supper with 
the MaPolm Hnllid.ays, Pastor 
W. I. Taylor had dinner an'* 
supper with the R. Q. Wests of 
Drasco ond Rev. Rny Lee Bes* 
and family h.ad dinner and sup- 
ner with the Clyde Reids at | 
Moro. I

Mr. and Mrs. J . B. James, i 
Mrs. Freddy Clevenger. Mr. I 
and Mrs. Dan Jam es and two j 
children all of San Aneelo had i 
Sunday dinner at the Roy Rices j 
at Winders. In the afternoon 
Rev. and Mrs. V'irgil Jam es of 
Moro visited with the grouo at 
the Rices. Our last report from 
Virgil’s and J .  B ’s sister, Mrs. 
Lucy Shuffield who was recent­
ly in a car wreck, she is still in 
the intensive care unit at the 
Shannon Hospital, San Angelo.

Mr. and Mrs. Sam Partee and 
Devin of Odessa spent the week­
end with the Weslev Bests.

Visiting at the Eldon Bagwells 
last week were Mr. and Mrs. 
Rannie Hale of Crystal City, 
Mrs. J . D. Johnson of Arling­
ton. Mrs. Gus Davis of Dallas.

Mrs. John McMillan of Dras­
co had surgery Wednesday of 
<ast week at Hendrick Hospital, 
Abilene.

Mr. and Mrs. Finis Bryan of 
Moro visited Thursday of last 
week at the Claude Eubanks of 
Norton. The Bryans had Friday 
supner with the Walker Allens 
at Wingate.

Louis Sneed and Kathy Kelly 
of Hardin-Simmons spent the 
week end at the L. Q. Sneeds 
at Drasco.

Thursday of last week at the 
Milburn Shaffers nt Moro were 
Mr. and Mrs. Calvin Helms. 
Mike and Thresea of Divide. 
Mr. and Mrs. Sammy Nix, Clint 
and Lisa, Lamesa spent Friday 
night at the Shaffers.

Mr. and Mrs. Buck Smith of 
Winters were back to Fort 
Worth for the week end for a 
check up for Mrs. Smith.

Mr. and Mrs. Donnie Oakes 
and Susan of Merkel spent Sat­
urday night at the Grover Orrs. 
Sunday morning they and the 
Orrs attended Church services 
at the First Methodist, Winters 
when Kay Orr was made an 
honorary Youth Life member of 
the WSCS. For a special num­
ber for the morning service Kay 
and Mrs. Oakes sang Where 
Ever He Leads I’ll Follow.

Donny Buchanan was home 
for the week end from NTSU, 
Denton.

Saturday afternoon at the Jim 
Ned High lunch room a wedding

The Hero of Walt Di.sney’s 
Academy Award-winning True- 
Life Adventure, “ Beaver Val­
ley,’’ is the beaver himself. Me 
is shown at home, at work and

iti play among his wildlife 
neighbors in the Technicolor 
Itaturetle. Buena Vista re-re- 
leases.

U N D ER  NEW 
O W N ER S H IP !

W E RE FILLING O U R SHELVES with

FR ES H , LA R G E STOCKS

To Offer You the BEST In GROCERIES
The BEST In Prepared and FRESH M EA TS

PICNIC & CAMPING SUPPLIES -  ICE!
, We invite all our old friends and customer«, auid those of Mr. 

and Mrs. Bo Evans, to visit us in our convenient location.

FRED YOUNG

EC O N O M Y  Food Store
SLirSiSfM Wert Dale

FORMERLY EVANS W EST DALE GROCERY

shower was given for Mr. and 
Mrs. John Bradshaw who are 
both seniors of the school. The 
senior girls sponsored the show­
er.

Friday of last week the John­
ny Walkers of Drasco had sup­
per with the Bob Webbs of 
Grassbur.

Last week Mr. and Mrs. Hor­
ace Abbott were at the Cliff 
Stovalls at Abilene and the 
Truett Smiths of Pumphrey.

Mr. and Mrs. Herman Adams 
of Drasco with Mrs Jack Sose- 
bee, Mike and Patty of Abilene, 
went to Irving lO the Ray i 
Adamses.

Jodie and Frances Sfrieklin 
had Friday of last week d'nner 
at the Cecil Allen Fains of Tye. '

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Mitchell 
and Greg of Peros have visited 
with Mr. and Mrs. James Mit-' 
chell of Drasco. |

Dr. and Mrs. I. 7.. Halo of j 
Winters and daughter, Martha j 
of The University of Texas visit-1 
ed Friday night of lust week at 
the C. W. Smiths. |

John Henry of Chrisfoval | 
spent Friday night of List week ' 
at the Reed McMillans’ of Moro. 
Saturday afternoon at the Mc­
Millans were Mr. and Mrs. Ad- 
rain Kornegay and Cathy of 
Levelland and Rhonda Graves 
of Brownsfield.

Friday night of last week Mr. 
and Mrs. J . D. Aldridge of the 
Victory Community were at the 
A. N. Blackerbys at Winters. 
Saturday at the Aldridges were 
Mr. and Mrs. Amos Aldridge 
and Mr. and Mrs. Oran Eager 
of Lawn.

Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Led­
better and David spent the 
week end at Dallas, at Garland 
with the Sam Williamses and at 
Fort Worth with Mrs. Beulah 
Fisher.

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Saunders 
with Mrs. Carl Hancock of Win­
ters spent the week end at Lub­
bock with the Skin Sheppards.

Mr. and Mrs. C. W. Oates. 
Charles, Susan and Sammv and 
Tandy Reeves all of Odessa 
were at the L. V. Reeveses of 
Guión.

Mr. and Mrs. M.onsfield Fos­
ter received word last week of 
the death of Lloyd Breisch of 
Cheyenne, Wyo., the father of 
Mrs. Kermit Foster of Houston. 
Kermit and Mrs. Foster attend­
ed the funeral.

Mrs. Reba Sanders and son 
Albert of Austin spent the week 
end visiting with Mr. and Mrs. 
Malcoimn Holliday, and at Win­
ters with Mrs. Laura Holliday 
and Mrs. Travis Jordan.

Sunday of last week Mr. and 
Mrs. Luther Pennington of Moro 
had dinner with the Wallace 
Beans at San Angelo.

Recently at the Bruce Webbs 
at Moro were Mr. and Mrs. 
Tommv Webb and Dennis of 
F'ort Worth. Mrs. Bruee is at 
the bedside of her father, G. W. 
Mclver at Abilene who is very 
ill.

Monday of last week Mr. and 
Mrs. Henry Webb attended the 
funeral of B. B. Statzer, 82. at 
Greenville. The Henrys and 
Bruce have visited at Winters 
with the H. H. Webbs.

Mr. and Mrs. Carl Reams of 
Lawn had Sundav of last week 
dinner with the Billy Talleys at 
Moro.

Jeff Hale of Ballinger and 
Gary Bryan of Winters route 
visited last week with the Adron 
Hales.

Mr, and Mrs. C. H. Clark of 
Abilene and Mr. and Mrs. O. L 
Hicks of Tuscola had Mondav 
of last week dinner at the Bud 
Hicks’ at Moro.

In town have been Mrs. Ralph 
Grun, Ruby and Mae Sleen of 
Ovalo. Sherry Vaughn and Nola 
Smith of Lawn, Mr. and Mrs. 
Glenn Seals of Abilene route, 
Carlton Parks of route 2 Win­
ters, Gordon Boulter of Ovalo. 
Troy Pillion of Shep, Noble 
Touchstone of Tusrola. Dovle 
Conner, Butch and David Smith 
of Winters, Bert Helms of Hap­
py Valley. Leon Shedd of Abi­
lene, Bobbv Rogers of route 2 
Winters, Halley Schwartz of 
route 2. Winters, Mr. and Mrs 
Crockett Hodges of Winters and 
Toe Bryan of Wilmeth. Joe at­
tended the stock show recently 
at San Antonin taking 4 lambs 
for show. Joe and familv were 
on a trip in December *o Cali­
fornia visiting with Mr. and 
MTs. Ernest Bark-’r. Mr. and 
Mrs. Clarence Shaffer. Mrs 
Addle Barker. Mr. .■'od Mrs Al­
bert Barker. Mrs. Mary F.weP 
and Mr, and Mrs. Tom Hanes 
and nt Midland with Mr. and 
Mrs. Ronnie Bums.

Crews
Mr. and Mrs. Ray Gray of 

Winters were supper guests in 
the home of Mr. and .Mrs. Mar­
vin Gerhart Saturday.

Rev. and Mrs. Chester Wilker- 
son of Winters visited in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Chester 
McBeth Saturday afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. Allan Bishop of 
Winters were Sunday dinner 
guests in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Marvin Gerhart.

Mr. and Mrs. Marvin Hnm- 
hright received word that their 
son-in-law, Mike Dyess, was 
hack from Vietnam and is back 
in Lubbock with his wife, Shir­
ley.

Mr. and Mrs. Therin Osborne 
and Karen visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Welby Fuller Sunday night.

Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Htindy 
of San Antonio spent the week­
end with her brother. Jack 
Bragg.

Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Moss 
and daughters of Andrews spent 
the week-end with her parents. 
Mr. and Mrs. Owen Bragg.

Mr. and Mrs. Obed Fuller, 
Jamie and Jodie, were attend­
ing to business in Dallas over 
the week-end.

Mr. and Mrs, Junior Fuller 
were Sunday dinner guests in 
the home of Mr. and Mrs. L. 
C. Fuller. Sr.

Johnny Denson of Houston was 
a week-end visitor with Miss 
Linda Fuller.

Week-end visitors in the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. J.oke Presley 
were; Brenda Presley of South­
ern Methodist Hospital in Dallas 
and Mrs. Jerry Terhune of Dy­
ess AFB in Abilene.

Rev. and Mrs. Chester Wilker- 
son visited with Mrs. Effie Diet! 
recently.

Mrs. Carl Baldwin and Mrs 
Clarence Hambright of Winters 
visited with Mrs. Effie Dietz 
Thursday.

Mrs. J . O. Pearce was dis­
missed from Shannon Hospital 
in San Angelo on Tliursday and 
she is at the home of her daugh­
ter. Mrs. George Swann in Bal­
linger.

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Hayward 
of Abilene arc announcing the 
arrival of a baby boy, Russel 
Lee, arrived on the 15th. weigh­
ing 7>4 pounds. He is the grand- 
.son of Mr. and Mrs. Alfred Rus­
sel. Mrs. Russel 's in Abilene 
taking care of her new grand­
son.

lV :4 f iV  V illb O Il  

^ i r c l j  iM u l I n  

l^hillips Home
The rc'tu'ar mont'ily businnss 

mee‘ 'n'’ of the P'-'igy Vin'-on 
Circle of the Fiist Baptist 
'"huroh ri'-t m the home of Mrs 
Elmer Phillips Tuesday morn­
ing, February 13.

Mrs. Bobble B’T'kwood pre- 
.sided for the business meeting 
ani the calendar prayer was 
given by Mrs. Ray Laughon.

Mrs. Wayne Km'; rnodu''ted 
the Bible study on “ Mistorv’r 
First Foreign Missions Confer­
ences,’’ iind gave the closin'; 
prayer. The proernm was con 
du"ted by Mrs. B'lhby R'idgers 

Refreshments of cake and 
."offee were served to Mes- 
dames Rav Laugbon. Bobby 
Rod'gers. W.ayne King, Bobby 
B'ackwood. Gaylan'l Robmson 
Vommy Blackmon and Elmer 
Phillips.

W I N G A T E
The r c ’u'ar meeting of the 

Wing.’ t ■ G:tior Top:; Club met 
M'.n lay I > b I'). :if fh "iirnb! 
Re-re;tlr>' I'all. .’‘l-s. Al.ilicii' 
Mill presid'd and tell call s 
jy .MiS. Waynt Owen.s.

Oiher.s p •: s n’ were .M ■ 
Richard Be;k, Mis. G"or;if 
Ctive. Mrs. James Williams an 1 
Mrs. Bill Hamilton.

Mrs. James Williams is queen 
this week.

Members wark'-'l on b.-.nner'- 
in-l the anniversary banquet 

'.vas discussed.

b'lcn Mr cad M Di .Ra';- 
•'s. i\l- : 11,1 Mrs Cm r 
dr and Mr';. Tray Pillion M:'. 
iiid i 11 . L-. i<- la l'"/  Mrs liii i 

Byrd, Mr. and .’.I ' E ri' r Kbi't, 
M . :,n I Mr,. I.-cp i'd  P'liliips, 
.M" ao'i M’-s c  irlum Rob n'wr, 
l.(*na .M Wlieat.

Refreshmert's of e' ff"e, pun. h 
n l coakics were served.
Mrs. Ad''>ek fell List v/cek, 

,ir is doing niceiy now.

r}oal C'hil'i
■\Aet Mi)iiday Nii<ht

' The Goal Digger Club met 
! Monday night in the home of 
I Mr. and Mrs. David Carroll 
j with Debra serving as hostess.

A program w.as presented.
I scandal was rea:l. and the 
i treasurer’s report heard.
I Refreshments were served to 
Susan White, Sherri Bedford, 
Melainc Bomar, Carla Walker. 
P.'iniella Smith. Debra Carroll, 
Phyllis Smith, Janice Pierce. 
Beckey Mathis, and the spon- 

‘ sors, Mrs. Hal Dry and Mrs 
! Buck Cummings.

Mr. and Mrs. Billie Parr Phil­
lips (if Abilene arc the parents 
of a little daughter named Ra­
mona. Pa’ernal g'-an'Imother is 
Mrs. Annie Phillips of Wingate.

Guests in the Nolan Cave 
I home were .Mr, and Mrs. Char­

lie Duncan of Glen Cove.
The David Bry.ips. Dun-an 

Hensleys and the Buck Hen­
sleys attended the funeral cf a 
brother-in-law, Hugh Dunn, in 
Lubbock M'inday.

Mr. and Mrs. I. C. Briley 
and Bryan. Mr. and Mrs. A. R 
Wheat. Larry an<f Debra June 

I of Midland and Mr. and .Mrs. 
I Gene Wheat and Bill of Winters. 
I were week-e nd guests with Lena 
I M.iy Wheat. Mrs. Nolan Cave 
! wtis a Monday visitor with Mrs 
I Wheat.
I Mrs. Emma Doggett was hos­
tess to a singing Monday night 
Those attending weer. Mr. and 
.Mrs. Bob Phillips. Mrs. J .  W.

RETURNED IIOME
Mr, and Mrs. G'“a:ge P ie re- 

urn'd Tuesday eft r .a few 
flays visit in the home of his 
sis'er, ,\lr. an'J M '‘ . John J. 
Bu;g, at Florence Arizona and 
tbeir daughter, Jtannine Poe at 
Phoenix.
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VOTE 

for

EVERETT J .  

(Ebb)

GRINDSTAFF
for

STATE REPRESENTATIVE

The Things 
We Say

By RUBY SHANNON
My grandmother used, to 

raise black Minorca chickens 
and I remember how strange 
it seemed for jet black hens 
to lay such big white eggs.

Some of Grandma’s hens 
didn’t lay in the henhouse, 
however. They preferred an 
old hollow stump into which 
Grandma always put a white 
doorknob or a glass ball for a 
“nest egg,” so the hen would 
come back theje to lay the 
next day.

“ She’ll make a nest some­
where else and we might not 
find it if we don’t leave a nest 
egg,” Grandma would say.

Once her doorknob disap­
peared, but later she re ­
trieved it from the decayed 
body of an old chicken snake 
that had swallowed it, with 
the result of fatal indigestion.

Nest eggs are seldom used 
today in chicken nests. With 
caged laying pens, there is no 
need for them. The expression 
“nest egg” is still heard how­
ever with reference to a per­
son’s savings.

Like the old hen, when a 
person has a savings or “ nest 
egg” hidden away in his bank 
vault, he is likely to return to 
it and deposit more savings.

GET YOUR 1968

STATE INSPECTION
NOW!

AT

D A LE'S  FO R D  SALES
AVOID THE U S T  MINUTE RUSH!

DUSK to UM!
Light for...

Parking Lots & Driveways • Barnyards
• Farms • Private Streets • Alleys • Out­

door Storage Areas • Commercial Prop­
erty • Churches • Hospitals • Motels
• Resort Cottages • Ranches • Private 

Estates • Firehouses • Roadside Busi­
nesses • Country Clubs.

NIGHT TIME 
SAFETY AND 
CONVENIENCE

Call or write W TU for complete information 

Guard-Ute is a bright idea. .. get one

4
$ j|  ONLY

PER MONTH 

FROM WTU

INCLUDES NORMAL INSTALLATION. 
ELECTRICITY AND MAINTENANCE —  
INCLUDING BULB REPLACEMENT!

W e s t  I f  X .1 s  L' I i 1 i t i 0 ''
Comf'am' i
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then with a single hand, and a 
written examination which con­
sisted of ninth, matching, and 
word meanings.

.After the test was over the 
hungry busload proci'ded to 
Zentners's for a fine lunch of 
what ever their pocket books al­
lowed.

After everyone had finished, 
the new overstuffed crew return- 
i>d home only to be welcomiHl 
by having to go to their seventh 
oerifxl class.

Mr. Richard Carter. Youth 
Counselor of the Texas Employ­
ment Commission, was to he at 
• he hiuh school Thursday. Feb. 
15. to give the resu'ts of the test 
■i) each individual, hut bad wea­
ker postpon'xf his »rip until an­
ther. yet indefinite, date.

U!L Events
On Saturday. March 2T the 

district 5.A.A schoils of Winters. 
Anson, Hamlin. Haskell, Colora­
do City, and Stamford, will miet 
in Wintirs ta compete in this 
district's L'niverslty Int"rschoi- 
astic League literary events.

For th‘‘ last several ye.irs 
Winters h is won these event.' 
We hope to hive just as fine a 
show.ng thi.s year as in the past.

Events m which Winters will 
participate and their sponsors 
are as follows:

Prose reading. Mrs. Kruse.
Readv writing. Mrs Kruse.
Poetry Interpretation, Mr 

Key.
Persuasive Speaking. Mr. Led- 

iietter.
Debate. Mrs Holmes.
Spelling Mrs. Bredemeyer.
Shorth.ind Mrs Rredemeyer,
Typing. Mrs. Schwartz.
Science. Mr Middleton.
Slide Rule. Mr Robbins.
\umb*T S* nse. Miss Grundy
The one-act plav contest will 

he held at an earlier date Mrs 
Bauer will direct the production 
of that play

Jun’or Meeting
By Rill Brock

Th" .lunior Class had a brief 
-ve' tmu Tuesdav. F'eh. 13. in the 
Auditor'um. The nurpose of the 
■neetinu was to distribute candv 
o be sold to raise more money 

■‘"r the .lunior-Senior Banquet to 
')C held March 30.

The lun'ors w.int this hanauet 
o b,' one th.it tbe rutao'na Sen 

■ors will never forget, so please 
' uv a box of caedy It nn'v 
'osts one lifle  ol' bu-k. It’s 
•hi best candy you will ever 
have.

Around WHS

Seniors Are Great
N.AME Thcres i Rav Mover | 
NICKNAME Triev 
WHEN AND WHERE BORN 

Dalhar’ . .T inuarv P. 1050 
FAVORITE FOOD- Che-ken 
FAVORITF, SONG; ".lust As, 

Mu' h as Fver " ,
FAVORITE BOOK Of Human i 

Bondage
MO\'IE STAR

MOVIE Dr Zhi-

T\' SHOW St.ir

Wes'

FAVORITE 
Dons n-i\

FAVORITF. 
vago

FAVORITE 
Tn-k

FAVORITE COLLEGE 
Texas Sta'e

F.AVORITE BOY. John l.ynn 
Patterson

PAST'MF. Sewing 
.AMBITION Be a su-cess 
GREA-^EST Si r t  ESS Mak­

ing 'he Nation il Honor So'-ietv 
WORST DIS\PPOINTMENT 

Being so gnej j t  nothing.

Seniors Go to San 
Angelo

Try-Outs for the ETA one act 
nlay were held this week, but 
so far no results are available 
Mrs. Kruse has her hands full 
(as usual) with this play. ETA 
State Convention. I ’ll, contests, 
ind a grandbabv on the wav.

Miss Grundy has finally brok­
en her eccentric habit of wrap- 
nina while working at the door 
facing while working at the .Alge­
bra II graph-bo ird. Tuesdav. 
while explaining a problem in 
•his position some hall culprit 
took advantage of the turned 
hack to grab a hold of the hand 
A yell was promptly heard all 
through third floor.

"Lune" I edb-.'tter certainlv 
niaved a grea' game a'’ainst the 
Seniors in the Faculty game 
Thursdav.

Somofhing o' a miraole occur- 
ed Fridav of this week The pass­
ing of that day mTked 21 oon- 
-erutive davs th-it Kve Nitsch 
bas not fallen down the stairs 
One teacher savs th« hoy's trou­
ble is 'hat he «implv canno'
• ilk un or d'v.r. tbi stairs an'' 
h<‘w gum. I' 'he same time. No 
omrni rt frii-n this writer 
Polities is in th- air in high 

school now Stud nt Councl elec, 
•ions are se’ for car'v March 
\s ot now Robert Moore ard 
Randy Pendergrass are in the 
••unnine foe Presid nf. Bob Col 
bum for \'ice-Pr'"-'d'nt. Bab' 
T.i'um for Secretary. lean Mos- 
•ad is s-'eking r'‘-cl<-ction for 
song lead'T, and Cin ly Pinker­
ton for pianist As th ■ electing 
dates are the same, anvone in- 
' ‘■rest'‘'l might t. ke t me oic 
frem th- N -w Himp-hm- Pr 
.nvirv to catch the results of this 
election.

defeated the sophomore boys.
Leading yells for the senior 

team were cheerleaders Linda 
Smith, "Rabbit” Bedford. Cheri- 
lyn Beard, Phyllis Smith and 
Lynunne Hill. The senior team 
was made up of Dick McNeil, 
Kye Nitsch. Jim  Morrow, Lanny 
Bahiman. Jim  Vaughan. Benny 
Fine. Jimmy Fine. Larry Ctiok. 
Ronnie Reel. Randall Boles and 
Danny Killough.

Cheerleaders for the faculty 
team were: Sophia (Mary) Stan­
field, Marilyn (Marguarite) Ma­
this. Hedda (Tooter) Harrison, 
Gretta (Nancy) Giundy, Brid- 
gette (Frances) Bredemeyer, 
and Bonnie (Mary) Bauer.

The team was introduced as 
6’ 7", 281 pound rx-Southwest 
Conference Sprint Champ Bear 
Busher.

At 6‘ 6"  and a massive llfi 
pounds, the former Captain of 
the Kilgore Rangerettes Dazzling 
Davis.

Only 5' 4". but a powerful 217 
pstuniis nn<i a four year letter- 
man as a McMurry Cheerleader 
Grubby G.issom.

Standing 6 8 ‘ anf a mere 288 
pi'unds. one of the ration’s fore­
most race horse jockeys. J i t  
Joni’s.

Standing 5’ 3" and a gigantic 
234 pounds, an all pro tackle 
Greer.bav Packers. Krusher

Social Security 
Beneficiaries To 
Get Increase

ivev.
At 5' U " and 101 pounds, he 

made all state at Bradshaw 
Tech, Lumpy Ledbetter.

Standing 6' 2” and 210 pounds 
a former star at Jacksboro A 
& M. Naughty Neely.

At 6' 4" and 113 pounds, the 
all star center for Tea Sipper 
State. Poison Poe.

6' 5" tall and 87 pounds, mem­
ber of the Metrecal for Lunch 
Bunch. Puny Powers.

6’ 1” and 201 pounds, captain 
of the Tech Bam floor sweep­
ers. Smelly Smith,

6’ 3" and 233 Divunds. the ter­
ror of the wrestling world. Sav­
age Swofford.

6' 13 " and 288 pounds, all star 
at the Abilene School of Beauty. 
W'ooly Wilson.

Coach of the Seniors w.as Fred 
die Gardner and the Coach ot 
th- facu’ty was Terrie Tatom.

Officials tor the game were 
"Slick" Mi'ldleton ar.d "Murly" 

Joyce, both from the Texa' 
School for the Blind.

The changes in the social se­
curity law signed by President 
Johnson on January 2 will mean 
a benefit increase of at least 13 
percent in the social security 
checks of about 2349 men, wo­
men and children in the Win­
ters area, according to the San 
Angelo office of the Social Se­
curity Administration.

The social Security Admini 
stration’s high speed eicctronir 
romputers are figuring the in 
creases for all 23.700,000 social 
security beneficiaries around 
the country and will finish the 
task in time to include the in­
creases in the checks delivered 
early in March.

Beneficiaries n-ed not takr 
any action to get the increase 
•he San Angelo office said, f  
will bo sent to them automatic- 
illv.

Residents of the Winters area 
can expi'Ct the first increased 
check on Saturday, March 2 
c.ne day earlier than the usua’ 
third of the month delivery of 
social security benefit checks 
Under a recent erraneemen^ 
with the Treasury Departmen' 
and the Post Office, social se 
curity checks are delivered a 
day early instead of a day late 
when the third of the month 
falls on a Sunday or holiday

Some social security bene­
ficiaries will receive more than 
a 13 percent increase. The

Mary Lynn Pritchard and James 
Ronald Presley To Be Wed In June

I New Directors 
A t Winters

Mr. and Mrs. Pat Pritchard Sr., of Wingate announce the 
engagement and approaching marriage of their daughter, 
Mary Lynn, to Mr. Jam es Ronald Presley of Crews. Ho is the 
son of Mrs. Faye Presley of Crews and the late Hollis Pres­
ley.

A late June wedding is planned. Friends and relatives of 
the couple are invited.

The bride-to-be is a senior in Winters High School. Her 
fiance is a graduate of Winters High School with the class of 
1967. Fie is engaged in stock farming.

Country Club
Directors for Winters Country 

Club were named at a member­
ship meeting at the club house 
Fuesday of last week.

Officers will be elected from 
the directors in the near future.

Directors of the Country Club 
now are George I.loyd, Jiggs 
Nichols, Clarence Shade, James 
West, Ed Roller, Wayne Stone, 
and Art McLemore.

Home Town Talk"
(Continued from page 1)

las made the r^ute plenty 
Tiuddy and slippery, and his 
-ar picks up lots of mud. Now 
it is said that the road building 
contractors are seeking a place 
for Marvin to stay in town until 
the road is finished—they say 
he's hauling off the muddy' 
caliche on the wheels of his car 
as fast as they can haul it in in 
dump trucks.

much water. Figuring a tank 
car 30 feet in length, it would 
take 2,646.000 miles of track to 
hold such a train, reaching 
around the earth 105 times.

A*Femblv

M nd.iv laruarv 29 thirtv- 
nno seniors went to San .Ange 
lo Thev took the G.ATB test at 
the Texas Employment Commis­
sion

The test consisteri of plaring 
w ;vhiTs on r iv ts  ind then plac- 
irv •hem in small h'.les. placing 
pegs in holes with two hands and

Faculty Vs. Seniors
Friday night the "Globe-trot­

ting ” faculty of Winters High 
SchiKil laid defeat at the door 
S t  p nf the s-niors hv a narrow 
m.'irg'n of 54-52 Prior to the 
spotlight game, the Junior boys

In a snecial assemhiv on Feh 
ruary 16. Mr. Jack Hill presen' 
ed to the student Ivdy a nroe 
ram entitled Evelvn Wood 
Reading Dvnamics Institu'e FL 
first explained exactly what thi 
course consisted of and ther 
showed a film interviewinr 

, many of the people who had 
•aken the course After the film 
he again explained how th' 
course operated and how it wa' 
-ommon that persons might in­
crease th-ir reading speed to 
n'Thans 6 00(1 words or even u"" 
to 10 000 words per minute. Then 
it was announc'd that the Read 
:ng Dvniimii's Program would hr 
given in Coleman ard Ballinger 
and all interested s uden's wen 
able to talk with Mr. Hill anf* 
pick up information pamphlets 
.After the program ended. Mrs 
Bredemeyer inquired about 
starting a program in Winter' 
and was told that the matter 
would be looked into.

minimum benefit for workers 
retiring at 65 is increased from 
$44 to $55.

The average benefit payable 
to a retired worker, about $86. 
will be raised to $98. an 
increase of $12 a month. The 
average couple’s benefit, now 
5145. will go up to $165; and th«* 
average aued widow's benefit 
will rise $11, from the current 
average of $75 to $86.

The last increase in socia' 
security benefits .imnunted to 7 
nercent. and was effective Jan- 
uarv 1965.

About three out nf every 10 
beneficiaries receiving an in- 
"reased check earlv in March 
will be someone under 65. many 
>f them the children of working 
'a'hers who have died.

With the increased benefit 
nayments provided under the 
new amerdments to the law, the 
'.are value of social securi'v sur­
vivors in'urtince pro'eetion ir 
■n-reased to about $940 billion 
This is just about equivalent to 
•he value of all th" nrivate life 
n'urance now in force.

Under the amended law 
maximum payments to families 
onw on the social security bene- 
'it rolls will go up from the 
"urrently payable maximum o' 
$309 20 a month to $.322 40. Ip 
•be future, th" maximum pay­
able monthly to anv one family 
-an be as high .ns $434 40.

When it’s dry, one taiks about 
'low dry it is; when it rains, 
'ine talks about how much rain 
has fallen. Wet weather such 
as we’ve been having brings 
the figurers and statisticians 
running, to come up with some 
fantastic unbelievables. Some­
one was wondering how much 
water there would be if the en­
tire state of Texas received a 
1-inch rain, and came up with 
the following (don’t take our 
word for it, though, we just 
copied it); It would take 465.- 
704,588 tank cars of 10.000-gal- 
Inn capacity each to hold that

Still quoting; 43,560 square 
feet in an acre, 640 acres in a 
square mile, and 267,3.39 square 
miles in Texas. Convert square 
feet to cubic feet bv dividing by 
12 then multiply 7 1-2 gallons 
per cubic foot of . . .  .

They already lost us when 
they said 1 inch of ruin! We 
never did get past the 6 
timeses!

CARD OF THANKS
May we take this method of 

thanking our neighbors and 
friends for their kind expres­
sions of sympathy in our be­
reavement. To Mrs. Merrill and 
the staff of the Senior Citizens 
Nursing Home, words will never 
express how much we appre­
ciate the kind deeds and care 
you showed our mother. All 
these expressions have been 
deeply appreciated. Dr. Z. I. 
Hale and family. Itc.

Bob Logan, Social 
Security Field Rep., 
Sets March Schedule

Bob Logan, Field Representa­
tive for the San Angelo Social 
Security Office, has scheduled 
his March visits to Winters. He 
will be at the Chamber of Com­
merce from 9:30 a. m. to 11:30 
a. m. on Wednesday, March 13 
and 27. Anyone who wants to 
file a claim for bcnefit.s, get 
mform.ation, or transact other 
business with the Social Securi­
ty Administration may contact 
him at this time.

Chat and Sew Club 
In Easterly Home

Members of the Chat and 
Sew Club met in the home of 
Mrs. Carson Easterly. Pecans 
were picked for the hostess.

Members present were Mes­
dames B D. Jobe, Carson East­
erly, and Calvin Cavanaugh, 
and one visitor, Mrs. Hillard of 
Norton.

The next meeting will be with 
Mrs. L. Ernst. 1109 West Par­
sonage.

Heart Attack Fatal 
To Mother Of Mrs.
C. L. Winton Tues.

Mrs. Pearl Kidd of New* 
Caney, mother of Mrs. C. L. 
Winton, d i e d  unexpectedly 
Tue.sday night of nn apparent • 
heart attack, according to in­
formation received by the Win­
ton family here.

Funeral arrangements are 
pending at Medcalf Funeral. 
Home in Conroe.

Mr. Kidd is a patient in the 
hospital at the present time.

Mrs. I. VV. Ro>j:ers 
Hosted Dale Sewing 
(31 lib Tuesday

Members of the Dale Sewing 
Club met Tuesday afternoon in 
the home of Mrs. I. W. Rogers 
and sewed on hand work.

Mrs. V. E. Fisher was wel­
comed as a new member.

Refreshments were served to 
Mesdames V. E. Fisher. I.eland 
Hoppe, Bill Mayo, Marvin Tray­
lor, (iarroll Stoecker, Walter 
Kruse. Tip McKnight, E. E.
Thormeyer, Carl Baldwin. Jack

dWhittenberg. I. W. Rogers and 
Herman Spill.

The next meeting will be in 
the home of Mrs. Herman Spill’ 
February 27.

CARD OF THANKS
To those who expressed sym­

pathy in so many beautiful and 
practical ways during the ill­
ness of my loved one and at 
the time of great snrrow I wish 
to extend my heartfelt thanks. 
To Dr. Rives, the nurses at the 
hospital in Abilene and at Win­
ters, for the fexxi. flowers, cards 
and letters I wish to express my 
deepest appreciation. Mrs. J .  S. 
Bourn. Itc.

Read the Classified Ads!

PARENTS OF GIRL
Mr. and Mrs. Gerald Murphv 

of Belmar, N. J .,  are parents of 
a baby girl born February 11 
She has been named Lesa 
Helen. Grandparen's are Mr 
and .Mrs. Elwood Smith of Bel­
mar, and great-grandparents 
.are Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Condra 
nf Drasco.

Shop At Home and You Needn't Fear . . .  
Your Neighbors are your Merchants Here! SHOP

'̂ou have chosen this community to live in because you 
preferred the calmer, more tranquil life of an area in 
which you know and are known by those about you . .

AT
where your jtjrocers and merchants are your nei>ihbors 
and friends. When yiui spend your shopping dollar here 
at home, you are castinjj: a vote for our community way

HOME
of life!

J O IN  O U R  W A S H IN G T O N 'S  B IR T H D A Y

SPECIAL RACK

LADIES’
SWEAÏÏRS

Ladies’ BLOUSES
V'alu.es to $ 10.95

$/l22

CHILDREN’S

CAR COATS
3 to 6x and 7 to 1-1
Values to S 12.95

i O o
/ q

A '

42c
V  C

à̂ìr(>lo r s

EARLY SPRING 
Over Blouses

HI SHADES 
Ladies’ Mirco Stretch

PANTY HOSE
Catalina Cardigan

SLIPOVER
SWEATERS

Gem Pink, Gem Yellow, Gem 
Orange, Gem Green, Taupe.

S23.00 Value

»1.75
$12.22

5 \ e e '

S 16.00 Value

i9.22

CLEARANCE!

AH Better 
DRESSES

Values to $ 12.95

$C22
FINAL

CLEARANCE

LADIES’ BAGS
Values to $5.95

1̂.00
Xorduroy Jeans

Stay Pressed
Valu.es to $8.00

y $4.22
HEIDENHEIMER'S


