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I High school winnort In tho essay District were [Irom left] Billy Ray enia Boyd, 11th grade runner-up; 
contest sponsored by the Middle Riley, 10th grade winner; Lancs Chris Cutler, 12th grade winner 
aear Fork Soil Conservation Perry, 11th grade winner; Staph- end Kan Hogan, 12th grade

runner-up.
Staff photo

Good news on tax rebates here,

Mail loses a faithful reader
by Cloy A. Richards

Wa finally got what I have been 
looking for in the monthly report 
from the State Comtroller’s Office 
on retail sales. We have an 
Increase of almost 11 percent and 
we have just received our largest 
check to date for the city's share 
of the one per cent local option 
sales tax.

The best news of all is the retail 
sales being reported now were 
purchases made here In December 
and that means we had our best 
December ever, as far as sales go.

We whould be proud of ourselves 
for shopping at home this past 
Christmas and should ask oursel­
ves an easy question before 
truning the key'and aiming your 
car East. Old I look here for what 
I need?

With that kind of attidtude, ol* 
Bob Bullock will be sending us 
nothing but glowing reports in the 
future.

College Station. My mother has 
been cooking extra meals for the 
Snuggs' for the past few years, 
and I am sure some of the 
Christmas and Thanksgiving me­
mories my children will have is 
going to their home with holiday 
meals.

Mrs. Snuggs devoted her life to 
her church and her husband and 
her passing leaves us with one less 
person that cares about this 
community.

We should all hope to have a life 
as good as hers, friends as devoted 
as hers, and a future as bright as 
the one she has in her rest.

If you asked my mom now who 
has helped who in the past, my 
mom would be the first to agree 
that noone ever helped Mrs. 
Snuggs as much as Mrs. Snuggs 
helped the ones she touched in her 
days on this earth.

Somebody sure let my answer­
ing machine have it last Thursday 
about Dale's cartoon and my 
editorial on the proposed Federal 
Budget.

They left no name or phone 
number but made their opinions 
clear they disagreed.

That's great as far as I am 
concerned. His response indicated 
that he was concerned, involved 
and educated on the matter. 
\M)ether or not people agree with 
me is coincidental, as long as they 
read, that's all I want.

The Merkel City Council passed 
the zoning ordinances at their 
Monday meeting and they are 
"technically" in place now.

Although Council won't be re­
ceiving the ordinance in its final 
form for a couple of months, the 
rules and regulations are tech­
nically here.

Zoning oroinances are created 
rnanegei’eeouroee, to

obtain public health and safety 
and to prevent "fence wars" 
between neighbors.

The ordinances were created 
from a Comprehensive Plan ap­
proved by council last August and 
the city zoning map was created 
from the map in that compre­
hensive plan.

You will be reading more about 
the new rules and regulations 
implemented by zoning ordinan­
ces.

The benefits of the ordinance gc 
further than protecting people's 
property rights, health and safety 
It will also give the city a tool to 
manage growth in manners tlut 
wilt benefit all. The ordinance will 
also make it easier for the city to 
identify new property tax payers, 
as well as eliminate some people 
from the tax rolls as property 
changes hands.

The HUD Community D e v e lo p ­
ment Block Grant that is ongoing 
here funded the costs of setting up 
the ordinances, and that's a deal 
that is hard to beat.

Tax rebates soar for December

Gas 'N Grub, a Trent grocery 
store and gas station, was com­
pletely gutted early Saturday 
morning by fire.

It's sad to see the building in the 
shape It's in and we hope it is 
re-opened, better than before soon.

It must be getting close to spring 
because there are meetings set for 
Little League Baseball and United 
Girls Softball.

The softball meeting is at 4 p.m. 
at Billy Clark's office here and the 
Little Leage meeting will be held 
Feb. 18 & 19 at 7 :X p .m . at Taylor 
Electric.

Merkelites seem to have done 
more shopping here during De­
cember than in the past according 
to figures released by the State 
Comptroller's Office this week.
, Merkel's sales tax rebates were 
up 10 percent through December 
as the city has so far collected 
$13,853.66 in sales tax rebates. 
Those figures represent retail 
sales in December here.

Merkel received a check for 
$9,825.86, the largest single check 
the city has received to date, 
according to the Comtroller's 
Office.

Tye's rebatas are running 50 
percent ahead of those last year.

as they also received their largest 
check to date, a check for 
$9,642.24. Tye has received $17 
more than Merkel has so far this 
year.

Statewide, payments up an 
average of 6 percent Abilene, 
Buffalo Gap and Impact reported 
decreases In rebates wMio Lawn, 
Merkel, Trent, Tuscola and Tye 
were reporting increases.

Trent received a check for 
$560.84 and they are running about 
4 percent ahead of m i year's 
pace.

The state sent out checks 
totaling $111.8 million to 961 Texas 
cities that levy the one per cent 
*ocal ootlon on sales tax.

Merkel Masons bring home award

Wb lost one or our more avid 
readers Tuesday, a woman that 
lived 300 miles from here but read 
The Mail like It was her hometown 
paper.

Mrs. R. E. Snuggs of College 
Station passed away wfter a long 
and fruitful Ufa. She was, as I 
remember her, one of the "grarvd 
women" of First Baptist Church In

The Masonic Lodoe In Merkel, 
has qualified for the Merit of 
Achievement Award to be presen­
ted at the Grand Lodge of Texas In 
December of this year. To qualify 
for this award, at least nine of the 
eleven lodge officers had to attend 
a Masonic Conference conducted 
by the Grand Master of Texas.

This year, the officers had to 
travel to Brady, Texas for this 
conference. 298 Masons were at 
the conference with 41 Masonic 
Lodges being represented. Only 3 
lodges qualified for the Achieve­
ment Award. They were Merkel

Lodge No. 710, John Sayles Lodge 
No. 1408 of Abilene »''8 a Masonic 
Lodge from San Angafo.

Officers attending this years 
conference were: Dick Leach, 
worshipful Master, Don Orr, 
Senior Warden Trent; Peck Eager 
Treasurer; Roy Mashburn, Secre­
tary; Pete Morgen, Jr. Warden 
(Pro tern); Lesley Pool, Senior 
Stewart; Buddy Hunte, Chaplin, 
David Robinson. Tiler; Charlie 
Baker, Jr. Deacon.

The lodge thanks Lesley Pool for 
providing the transportation with 
the use of his motor home.

City council approves

two zoning ordinances
The Merkel City Council adopted 

the city zoning, subdivision, his­
torical preservation and capital 
improvement plans at their reg­
ular council session Monday night.

The ordinances were passed 
almost intact, vyith courKil calling 
tor some changes in the wording of 
the sub-division ordinance.

Randy Randolph, e consultant 
who wrote the ordinance told 
council members "I had some 
second thoughts about zoning in a 
small town. It can be an emotional 
issue. I think the intention of 
zoning ordinances Is the regulate 
the use of land, not to tell people 
whet to do with their land."

Randolph began his presentation 
by showing council a list of 
projects that require money and 
heading that list is a $271,(XX) 
sewage treatment facility. Billy 
Jacobs, a consultirvg engineer, told 
council members they would soon 
be hearing from the State because 
wster discharged from the current 
trM*(|»enl plant Is not meeting 
M '#'^idelln«e. Jacobs said *he 
C^.oSo figure was a "high quote” 
and feels the city could spend 
about $20,000 less and change 
waste water treatment procedures 
to the "holding pond” treatment 
method where wastewater is 
stored in ponds until contaminants 
are cleansed.

The capital improvements list 
also included additional water 
lines, storage, city hall improve­
ments, central business district 
improvements.

City manager J. S. Sadler told 
council member before they 
voted to pass the capital impro­
vements resolution "Just because 
you approve a comprehensive 
plan, we don't have to go out next 
week and try to come up with 
$271,000."

Randolph added "This is a 
refined plan. It gives you a 
priority listing of things ne^ed so 
the council wilt know what your 
needs are. The resolution states 
that you will try to find funds 
through different sources to fund 
the programs. It needs to be 
updated once a year."

Council also adopted the historic 
preservation resolution. That plan 
emphasizes the history of Merkel 
and the resolution is designed to 
facilitate preservation of unique 
architecture and historical loca­
tions.

Council did request some lan­
guage to be changed in the Sub- 
Division Ordinance. That ordi­
nance sets out the responsibilities 
of developers when they are 
improving parcels of land in the 
city limits.

(Council asked for clarification in 
the ordinance of financial re­
sponsibilities in projects.

(Council passed the Zoning Or­
dinance with no changes

Randolph told Sadler Tuesday 
morning It would be a few weeks 
before tho final rodinartces are 
worded although the ordinance is 
"technically” in place now.

In other action. Council asked 
Sadler to come up with a set of 
rules governing the use of Heri­
tage Hall and the Merkel Emer- 
gertcy Medical Service building 
Ouesticns were raised when peo­
ple have tried to rent Heritage 
Hall and the ambulance building 
for private, profit ventures. Coun­
cil agreed that neither building 
was cor>structed tor "profit” 
making. Council asked Sadler to 
have the guidelines available for a 
special meeting that will have to 
be called for the city council 
etectiOTM in April.

Council also approved an oil lir>e

easement for the Permian Cor­
poration for a 370 foot line near 
Merkel's Waste Water Treatment 
Plant.

Council also discussed the gar­
bage pick-up procedures. Council 
is discussing purchasing a second 
truck to keep a truck running at 
all times. The city approved 
payment of a bill of $3,700 in 
repairs made to the trash truck 
last week.

Council also heard a report on 
the computer that is s«4>poeed to

be printing the cHy weter-eewer- 
sanitatlon bills.

As of Tuesday, the MMe for this 
month were still bataf worked on 
by a programmeK, who was 
getting rid of a fe«h‘‘buoe” in the 
billir>g software.

The bills wore printed Tuesday 
and should have ahwedy been 
delivered to your heme.

Some of the bfhe may include 
numbers that aeanN properly 
aligned, but the information on 
them is correct.

County agent says 

Agriculture taking beating

by Joe Wilson 
Extension Agent, Taylor

in the big country Was s ^sastur 
A severe drouth, plus low'prices 
for agricultural products spelled 
economic doomtf *or producers. 
Now that 1964 M  past history, 
farmers and ranchers are wonder­
ing what prospects does 1985 hold. 
The weather factor looks much 
better, as the drouth has come to 
an end, but most economists agree 
that prospects for good prices are 
very bleak, if not non-exsistant.

An analysis of the piobiem of 
below break-even prices for pro­
ducers is a complicated, multi- 
fauceted reason, difficult to under­
stand, even for the most intelligent 
agriculture producer. It is beyond 
concept of many northern, non 
agricultural politicians, undoubt- 
ably.

Several federal employees and 
Congress members lay the blame 
for the present situation entirely 
on the farmers and ranchers. They 
say they are too greedy and over 
produce. They prefer no govern­
ment support and bel|eve that 
supply and demand should rule 
(supply side economics as some 
prefer to call it).

Producers, on the other hand, 
point to the fact that the blame 
lays on government programs. 
How can supply and demand work 
when the government will not 
allow Markets to work between 
countries? In fact, they point out 
the embarges of the past is one of 
the major reasons that farmers 
are in such a financial bind now.

Another argument of producers 
is, the dollar is so strong overseas 
that it makes farm produce too 
high for them to buy. A fact

producers In their country have no 
control over.

Other proguetrt pelfil out that

most agricultural gooda. This 
makes It Impoaalbla to trade in the 
foreign market at a profit. They 
claim the reason that our coats are 
so high Is partly due to govern­
ment regulations. Thaae can in­
clude a host of things from 
minimum wage 08H A , EPA, FOA 
and USOA regulationa and stan­
dards that foreign producers do 
not have to contend with.

Other producers point out that 
our production coats are higher 
than the world market prices of 
most agricultural goods.

Many other points could be 
made from either side. However, 
there are a few facts that both 
sides agree upon. These Include:

1 . The U.S. produces between 1-4 
and 1-5 of all the world food and 
they could produce nearly one half 
if the price incentive was there.

2. At present, we are producing 
more than our domestic need and 
mors than we are saHIng oversees, 
thus creating a surplus and low 
prices.

3. The percent return from 
invested capitol is much lower in 
agriculture than business or man­
ufacturing and It has declined 
even mors in the past few years. 
This has resulted In declining land 
prices, which in turn has lowered 
equity of the farmers and ranch­
ers.

In times of deficit federal 
budgets, and Increased defense 
spending clamor, agricultura Is 
taking a beating down on the farm 
and unfortunately, prospects for 
them changing in the near future 
are bleak.

Ft. Worth show results

A number of Merkei stuoents 
were among the winners at the 
Southwestern Exposition and Fat 
Stock Show In Fort \Atorth last 
week.

In the Junior Swine Show the 
results are as follows:

Light Wbight Duroc, 7th place 
Kevin Mitchell.

Heavy Wislght Duroc, 7th place 
Otriswell \Miisenhunt.

Light WWght Hampshires, 13lh 
place Chrlswell \M>isenhunt.

Light Wislght Berkshlres, 10th 
place Cassidy Townsend, 11th 
place Chuck Peterman, I3lh place 
Mandy Pack.

Heavy Wisight Berkshlres, 13lh 
placs MItzi Shelton

Light Wlalght Ohaatar White, 6th 
place Russell Morgan, 11th piece 
Dusty Farmer, I3lh place Dusty 
Farmer, 14th place Ruaaall Mor­
gan.

Medium WMght Chastar White, 
3rd place Billy Ray Rilay. 8th 
place C.J. White.

Heavy WMght Chaalar Whites, 
11th place RIoky Doan, 7th place 
Ricky Riley, iS h  place Billy Ray 
Riley.

Medium WWghl Roland China, 
2nd place Lyle Baker.

Medium weight Bpottad Polano 
China, 6th place Lyla Baker.

In the Junior Btaar fhow, Randy 
Toombs placed 3rd with Ms 
Crossbred

' <■
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A stupid calf ruins it for 14 others

A IN T LOVE (;RAND: — Especially on Valentine's 
I>ay. Tim Wozencraft, son of Mr and Mrs. Alvin Woz- 
encraft, is about to present shy little Miss Vickie Mit- 
chel with a box of chocolates to commemorate Feb­
ruary 14. Vickie isThe daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Dwane 
Miteiwll.

Editor's Note: This photo first we thought it appropriate for 
appeared in The Mail in 1962 and Valentine's Day.

H ester se rv ices  held
Shelby Hester, 76. of San Angelo, 

a former longtime resident ot 
Abilene died at 4 40 a.ni. Monday 
at Shannon Hospital in San 
Angelo Graveside services were 
at 2 p m. Wednesday at Elmwood 
Memorial Park, directed by John­
son Funeral Home of San Angelo 
with the Rev. Kenneth Jones, 
pastor of Caps Baptist Church, 
officiating

Born July 2. 1908. in Anson, he 
married Aratha Lee, April 19. 1932

in Anson She preceded him in 
death Both were longtime resi­
dents of Abilene. He had lived in a 
San Angelo nursinq home in recent 
years and was a retired mainte­
nance department worker of Mrs. 
Baird's Bakeries 

Survivors include a son, Eudelle 
Hester of San Angelo; two broth­
ers. J.V Hester of Merkel and 
George Hester of Ozona, two 
grandchildren and four great 
grandchildren

Carrying lead in the pocket was believed to prevent 
poison oak.

Maty Kies of Connecticut was ..^irst woman to be 
gnntad a U .S  patent. It was'^'*'',^ ^  m 1809 for a 
“mmm ana «•«■aut *19 straw, with sW*
or '

by Russell Me Anally

The story I am telling you 
sounds like a mother talking about 
one of her children I think I will 
just tell the story and let you make 
application where it fits best. This 
IS the story about a calf, black 
with a white face It is hard to tell 
you about one calt without letting 
you know that there are really 
fifteen calves I would not want to 
center the whole story on one calf 
that breaks the rules, without 
telling you about the other four­
teen calves that graze in the 
pasture you assign for them that 
day without giving any trouble.

The calf with the white face, 
which I call. Stupid, can go under 
any fence I put up. Once in a 
while, that Stupid calf gets one 
other calf to get out of the legal 
territory with her Sometimes 
there is no better grazing on the 
other side of the fence, but Stupid 
seems to delight in getting on the 
other side of the fence and 
laughing at the others who are so 
foolish to stay in the inclosure. Up 
until this past Monday, I had done 
everything I knew to make that 
calf stay at home I had some help 
from a neighbor who certainly 
didn’t want the calf on them.

I thought I had them fixed to 
stay in and had punished all 
fifteen of the calves by keeping 
them in a small enclosure How do 
you tell a bunch of calves they are 
being punished because of the law 
breaking stupid calf. The fourteen 
restricted calves should have 
butted the Stupid calt into a corner 
so they would not have to be 
punished The calves do not seem 
to know any better Last Sunday 
afternoon, I turned them all out 
again into the big pasture and 
watched them as they grazed close 
to the neighbor property and sure 
enough the Stupid calf couldn't 
wait until under the fence she 
went. I left the comfort of the 
house to run them all back home. 
Stupid saw me coming and got 
back in my pasture and I was 
trying to get them headed toward 
home Stupid kicked up her heels 
and starting running in circles and 
passed close to me two times, t 
missed with alt three rocks I threw 
at her because I could see she wa«.

letting me know she had done and 
intended to keep doing as she 
pleased. Right then and there I 
decided what I was going to do. 
That was all I could take.

Monday, I called in a neighbor 
and we made a yoke out of barbed 
wire, finally flo* a rope around her 
neck and after half choking ner to 
death, had that wire yoke in place. 
Stupid was turned loose and went 
to another part of the pasture and 
stood by herself. Some of the other

calves finally went to the stupid 
calf and before long Stupid had all 
the other calves feeling sorry tor 
her. Stupid is even mad at me now 
and can not understand why she 
has been grounded She will be 
turned out into the big pasture 
again today and we will see what 
happens It will be interesting to 
see how she gets the attention ot 
others now. She will find a way

because that wire yoke is an 
irritation and a constant reminder 
to her *hat she Is being restricted. 
She may prove to me that she can 
still do as she pleases I am 
determined that if she does, I will 
put two yokes, or one twice as big 
on her If that doesn't work, I will 
put her in a small pen, feed her 
until she gets tat, then there is no 
end to this story. Don't Forget 
About Thfc Other 14 Calves

Anricultural Options: A New Marketing Tool
PRICE VOLATILITY ONE OF THE KEY FACTORS 
INFLUENCING WHAT OPTIONS WILL COST

F o r  t h i ’ f i r s t  t in i i-  in  a lm o s t  h a l f  a 
cen tu ry ,  there m i l  soon he trad ing ; in  
" p u l "  and " e a l l "  op t ions  fo r  a ^ r i e u f  
l u r a l  c o m m o d i t i e s  — t n e l u d i n n  
soxheans corn, u hea l. l i r e s to c k  a n d  
co t ton  This IS the  fo u r th  in  a series o f  
f i r e  art ic les d e s r r ih in / i  the  h is to r y  o f  
options, hole th e y  u o rk .  ho ie  th e y  can  
he used, and  th e i r  im p o r ta n c e  to a n y  
one II ho produces, m a rke ts ,  pu rchases  
o r  f inances fa r m  products .

When trading comm**n( »*s in options 
on a»;ricultural commo<litn s, liuyers 
and  sflltTs and  their n 'pn 'scntatives 
will m«t‘t on the trading! floor of the 
nation s futures exchanges and  hej;m a 
pr<Mes> of competitive hiddinj; I ’ntil 
then, officials of the Chicajfo Board of 
Trade acknowledfic th a t  what it will 
cost tobu.van option isan.vone’sjiuess.

Premiums for options will be deter­
mined in the sam e wav as futures prices 
— ihroujih  open outcr.v an d  h a n d  
signals as buyers .s**«‘k to pa.v the low est 
possible am ount and sellers .se«‘k to 
receive the hinhest possible amount.

( 'hicaiio Board of Trade president 
Thom as K. Donovan explains that the 
overall level of option premiums will h«* 
greatly influenc«*d by the volatility of 
the underlying futures prices. The more 
v o la t i le  th e  s o y b e a n  m a rk e t ,  for 
example, the more it's likely to cost to 
purchase a soybean option.

There’s a good reason for the linkage 
U-tween market volatility and option 
premiums, according to Donovan At 
t im e t  .-of vo la ti le  m arkttti,  there a ^

more people interested m ihe protei tion 
that  options van offer This increases 
the dem and for options.

At the same time, volatile markets 
increa.se the risks of selling options. 
T h is  resu lts  in fewer ptuiple being 
willing to sell them unl«ss the pre 
m iu m s a re  h ig h  enough  to ju s t ify  
taking the risks involveri. The result, 
says Donovan, is that volatile markets 
exert upward pressure on premiums 
from both the demand side and the 
supply side

For example, the .same thrw> month 
soyh«*an option that might cost ‘20cents 
a bushel when soybean prices hvive 
been fairly stable might cost 10 cents a 
bushel in a more volatile market. Soy 
bean m arkets in recent m onths have 
b«-en on the volatile side, tluetuating 
over a range that has exetvded a dollar 
a bushel.

.A seeond factor that will always in 
fluence the premium for a particular 
option is the strike price of the option 
relative to the current p n ieo f  the under 
lying fu tu res  co n trac t  In order to 
enableoption huvers lochoose the level 
of p rice  p ro tec t ion  they  w an t ,  ex 
c h a n g es  will conduct s im u ltaneous  
trad ing  in options with a numlHT of 
different strike prices

At a time when the .Niovemher soy­
bean futures priee is S7.IKI, for instani’e. 
buyers might U' able to select from 
options having strike (irues ranging 
from $6.2.^ a bushel to S7.7.‘> a bushel

In the case of put options, w hieh are 
options to sell, an  option with a high 
strike price will he more costly than  an 
option with a low strike price It s tands 
to reason that  an  option that  g ran ts  the 
right to sell soybeans at. say, a
bushel w ill he more valuable and thus 
more ex p en s iv e  th a n  an  o therw ise  
identical option that conveys the right 
to sell soybeans at onl.y $ti.7.'i a bushel.

Donovan points out tha t  an  option is 
really a tyj)«* of price insurance and 
that  chiMismg the option strike price is 
a lot like .sebi ting the size of the deiiuc 
lihle in buying automobile or home 
insuranee. The more protection you 
want, the more it costs.

The th ird  v a r iab le  th a t  affects  the 
option premium is the length of time 
the option h as  rem aining until expira­
tion. .Again, like insurance, it costs 
more to purchase protection for six 
m onths th an  for thre«- m onths But 
biH-ause the premium tends to dwline 
most rapidly a.« an  option gets closer to 
ex p i ra t io n ,  th e  p rem ium  for a six 
month option is generally less than 
double the premium for a thrin- month 
option

As in any  competitive market, says 
Donovan, the pnn'ess through which 
option p rem ium saredeterm inedcan  b«‘ 
summanz«*<l in just thre«* words: supply 
anil dem and

H E R E ' S  T O  Y j p O R  H E A L T H
OPEN 7  am • 8 ^  Moadaf - Sahv^ay 8 am * 8 ^  SaiUay

xt )

l O l B B M

MOZ

w V
H i

• »  POTATOES 
PARADE E66S

b e e f  STEW
60W MEDM. FLAIID f IB 0 7 ^

STEAK PATTIES s be»
CORNBREAO MUFFIN MIX

SUOAR 1 IB  M P B O M  FOW DEREO

VANIUA WAFERS
APPIES RED DELICIOUS

BANANAS »  79^
6 PACK PEPPER PEPSI, nos TAX 

MOUNTAIN DEW, COCA COLA DIET COKE
TOdlATOES S9* ^

TARTAR SAUCE '« " » •  93?
BUTTERMIIK Vt G AU O N  99^ FO R B IO S T

FOREMOST M IIK M il 
etSAREITES
CENERie CtOA R En ES  « > 190»

Handy Food Store
SMC PMCES 0000 WED-SIWDM M 0 0 IM i»9 2 M 9 l2

This week, we are
celebrating our First
Anniversary in Merkel

iWe want to take this 
opportunity to thank
our many customers
for making our first 
year a happy and
successful one.
WE ARE NOW OPEN 9 - 9 7  DAYS A WEEK

SPECIAL MESS^l-FISHi
A FAMILY STYLE ORDER OF ^ U T H E R N  STYLE 
FISH SERVED WITH FRENCH FRIES, COLE SLAW

AND HOT PUFFS

SALE PRICE $ 0 5 0  
TiREGULAR PRICE W ’ ^

! m C E  GOOD THROUGH FEB 17 1-20 928-4349

i
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I  Student! placing in the Middle 
Clear Fork Soil & Water Con­

servation poster contests [shown 
In order of finish from left] are 
Jayma Goldsmith, Phuong Thao

Tran, Marty 
Reagan.

Staff photo

Boyd and Melinda

Douglass named to Millionaire’s club
Paula Douglass, an agent for 

State Farm Insurance Companies 
in the Irving, Texas area has 
earned membership in the firm ’s 
Millionaire Club.

This distinguised sales honor is 
based primarily on the quality and 
quantity of line insurance sold and 
serviced by the agent. Only about 
one in four State Farm agents 
attains membership in the Club. 
Ms. Douglass will join other 
Millionaire Club members for a 
week in Acapulco in April.

Douglass joined State t-arm in 
1963. having come from Abilene, 
Texas. She has two daughters; 
Jill, 19, who is a freshman at 
Tarleton State University in Ste- 
phenville, Texas and Paige, 15, 
who is a freshman at MacArthur 
High School in Irving. Paula Is the 
daughter of Boboy and Ruth 
Dudley, 306 Yucca Street, Merkel, 
Texas. She is a graduate of Trent 
High School.

CHAPTER
WOULD LIKE TO THANK THE 

FOLLOWING PEOPLE FOR 
PURCHASING ANIMALS AT THE 
TAYLOR COUNTY STO(
F & M BANK 2  s te e rs  1 p ig  1 la m b

TAYLOR COUNTY 2«een> 
LIVESTOCK ASSOCIATION 
KENNETH DUNCAN 3 pig. 
WHBENHUNT 
GRAIN&FEED 
ACCO FEEDS 
SEYMORE INSURANCE & 

gED’S FEED &  SEED > p>k 
CARSON’S SUPER MARKET 
& PALMER MOTOR CO. > w
MERKEL MERCHANTS

IMERKEL DRUG STARBUCK CO.
P & L A U T O  BIG COUNTRY
HICKS AUTO DUBOSE OIL CO

_ ED’S FEED & SEED
IDON DUDLEY HI VAL FEED STORE

MID TEX RESOURCES BUZZ PETERMAN

1 la m b

H ig h to w er calls fo r populist 
proposal to save fam ily  farms

uMEmccnoi « f t n s d
IWAUn mOlTD CMCOliTES

(HOUSTON)--“ll’s the eleventh 
hour for thousands of Texas farm 
families.” said Agriculture Commis­
sioner Jim Hightower. In an address to 
the annual convention of the Texas 
Farmers Union. Hightower called for 
the delegates to get behind ”a populist 
proposal from the prairie to save 
America’s family farm system ”

Hightower pointed out that about 
19.000 Texas farms have gone out of 
business in the last four years, and that 
we continue to lose them at a rate of 
more than 100 a week. “More than half 
of farm borrowers indebted to the 
Farmers Home Administration are 
behind on their payments right now, 
and a big percentage of those will not 
get financing for the 1985 crop year," 
Hightower said “In normal years, 
FmH A turns down about 20 percent of 
the farmers who apply for production 
loans Last year, FmHA rejected 42 
percent of those who sought loans to 
continue farming, and this year will be 
worse.

“ It’i not much better for farmers 
who get their loans from private banks 
—the American Bankers Association 
reports that a third of farm borrowers 
are ‘loaned up to the practical limit.*
Overall, the U.S. Department of Agri­
culture says that ‘between 20 and 30 
percent of all commercial farmers are 
facing financuilly stressful conditions, 
requiring decisive steps to improve cash 
flow and profits.’

“These are good farmers-efficieni. 
productive and competitive people 
whom we need if the U .S. is to maintain 
its agricultural abundance They are 
not being squeezed out of business

because of bad management, bad 
weather, or had luck," Hightower said. 
“They are victims of bad farm policy, 
and their loss is as criminal as a subway 
mugging

“What’s happened to them is that 
federal farm legislation has encouraged 
overp ro d u ctio n  and estab lished  
disastrously low commodity prices. 
Since the beginning of 1981, the market 
price of 22 of the 28 major agricultural 
products has suffered an average price 
decline of 19 percent (see attached list). 
In practically every instance, the prices 
that farmers are paid for the 
co m m o d itie s  a re  lo w er--o ften  
dramatically lower-than what it costs 
them to produce the commodity. For 
example, from January 1981 to 
January 1985:

•  The price of wheat has fallen from 
S4.2I a bushel to S3.36 a bushel, 
and it costs farmers $3.95a bushel 
to produce it.

•  The price of cotton has fallen 
from 77c a pound to 57c a pound, 
and it costs farmers 84c a pound 
to produce it.

• The price of rice has fallen from 
13c a pound to 8c a pound, and it 
costs farmers nearly lOc a pound 
to produce it.

•  The price of beef has fallen from 
59c a pound to 55c a pound, and it 
costs ranchers 62c a pound to 
produce it.

•  The price of corn has fallen from 
S3 19 a bushel to S2.S2 a bushel, 
and It costs farmers S3.53 a bushel 
to produce it

(Cost o f  production figures taken from  
I ‘S P A ' t  Economic /ndicainrs n f  the

Farm Sector, I9Ü4 and refer toihe 1983 
crop year.)

“You don^ need a very big 
computer to figure out that these 
numbers add up to bankruptcy,” 
Hightower said. "Incredibly, (hough, 
the Reagan A dm inistration is 
proposing a new Farm Bill, to be 
written this year, that will actually 
establish lower federal price floors on 
tlicse commodities. For example, wheat 
would fall from its current S3.16 price 
to S3.25—70c less than the cost of 
p ro d u c tio n !  U .S . A gricultural 
Secretary John Block claims (hat these 
are ‘market clearing price»'to help sell 
more U.S. commodities on the inter­
national market, but what they really 
amount to are ’farmer clearing’ prices, 
clearing about a third of our 
commercial family producers out of tlie 
farming picture. Their program is such 
an ugly anti-farmer profwval that it will 
wnnkie your shirt just to read it,” 
Hightower, said.

“What w e\e got to have is a first- 
class, full-scale farmer rebellion against 
the Big Mo Jos in W ashington who are 
trying to ram this bit of idiocy dow n our 
throats. Working with true family farm 
organizations and public officials from 
Texas to Minnesota. v*e at TDA have 
been developing our own pragmatK, 
populist proposal to save the family 
farm. We’re not talkingabouta bail-out 
scheme, but a commonsenie policy to 
allow efficient farmers to get their 
surplus production back in balance 
with demand so they can gel a fair price 
in the marketplace
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§ We turn disc brdr'fes 
and drums

P & L ALMo Parts 
135 Edwards 
928-4738

/ --'O'
ANNON SFA'VI 
groups id ' 
Merket Ç' 
wee»'-,
Ca 328̂  

49-TPC

s
. Y
r>e'p A 

-p IS meeting 
"e mornings 

92Í-5067

The Classifieds

Alfa 'a na, 
!) 7̂  : . • ba'e

-■8-433'’

One middle sized five 
year old mare and Tier 
18 month old colt 
CHEAP Call 928-505C 

96-TFNC

<iO S KOr \EO  OAY 
C^ARE C E \” E'^ 2no A 
Oar Open ’/o ''c  r - 
cay b X  a r. , 5 30
pm Ca' 928-i3b'

66-tfc

Babysitting m my
home 2 years old and 
UP Cai! Shen 928-4905 

96-4tc

Insurance Agen need­
ed Eopener'ce prefer­
red Local agency Con­
tact Chris Young at 
928-5151 

100-tfc

Germar'ia i nsura' :■ 
Company *or yOu' in­
surance needs Locally 
represented by Donna 
Carter 928-5348 

33-TFC

For Sale 8 acres edge 
of Merkel City Limits 
Also 1610 gram drill 
Will trade drill for live­
stock Call 928-5204 

96TFC

Registered border col­
lies for sale Two fe­
males $100 926-5194 

96TFC

General houseclean- 
mg Reasonable rates 
Call between 8 & 5
928-5387 

96-3tc

For
rent

Shannonside
Apartments

l=i

For Sale Metal sto­
rage building 8 X ’ 2 in 
good condition Insula­
ted 7 foot walls Inside 
paneled $550 676-5968 

96-4tp

Now taking applica­
tions for all shifts and 
3ll departments Apply 
m person Starr Nursing 
Home Highway 80 West, 
Merkel 

96-TFC

(QUAt HOUSIMC 
OPPORTIIWITV 

1.2 & 3 bedroom apart- 
tnents, all electric, cen­
tral heat & cooling For 
more information, call 
928-5038

89-TFC

Nice 2 bedroom apart­
ments with 3ceilmg tans 
per apartment, central 
air and heat, refrigera­
tor and stove, upstairs 
$250 00. downstairs with 
dishwasher, $275 00 
Workman's lease, pay 
halt first of month and 
other half 15th of month. 
$150 00 deposit Call 928- 
5194

100-TFC

FOR RENT 1 bedroom 
house at 306 Runnels. 
Partially furnished, $175 
per month, $100 deposit, 
couple preferred, call 
928-5787 or inquire at 401 
Runnels 

100-ltp
Furnished 1 bedroom 
apartment. No Children 
or pets 902 Rose, Leo 
Harris 

100-ltp

Real Estate

House for sale m 
SoLfh Merkel 2 bed­
room. large den, sepe- 
rate dining area Nearly 
finished wth repairs 
and remodeimg Owner 
finance 15 percent down. 
676-5988

98-4tp

For Sale Living 
room. 2 bedrooms, di­
ning room. kitchen, bath 
garage, peach tree, in 
good location- close to 
town, a Desirable place. 
Call Cyrus Pee. Agent 
928-5613 

100-TFC •

John Deere Roto Tiler, 
new motor, call 928-5796 

I00-2fp
1976 Chev Scottsdale, ’/ i 
ton L\A^ Heavy Duty 
pickup New 350 engine 
from Reeder’s Automo- 
ttve, just installed New 
ball joints, brakes, seat 
covers, f -̂ es, ETC Good 
tool box, price negoti­
able Trent 862-6370 

100-ltc
FOR SALE, good, stur­
dy, medium finish din­
ing table with 5 ch;»irs, 
$50 00 Call 928-5060. 

100-2tc
WINNEBAGO Camper 
Shell for LWB pickup, 
insulated, removeable 
rear door, sliding win­
dows with curtain rods, 
nice $350 00 Price nego­
tiable Trent 862-6370 

100-ltp
FOR SALE. Magtag 
washer, 21 in. color 
T.V., 1 chrome show 
bumper, tits 76 to 78 
Chevrolet pickup, call 
928-4166
Write 3G inch GE stove 
with deep well and 
drawer storage See at 
402 Locust or call 928- 
4712.

Registered child care 
in my home, Monday - 
Friday 5 30 am - 6 pm. 
Children from 1-5 &
after school Balanced 
meals and snacks. Fen­
ced yard Call 92B-40X 
or come by # 7 Pioneer 
Ct Drop-in's welcomed.

96-4tc
3 loming in Mer*>e 

Saturdays Call 92 -̂ 
- i . -  after 6 p.m i.̂

O'," ntment.
92-TFC

For Sale; Twenty four

Apartments tor rent; 2 
bedroom, refrigerator & 
stove Upstairs $250 per 
month with $150 depcs«’ 
downstairs with dish­
washer $275 per month hundred square foot 
with $150 deposit 6 brick home with 2 acres 
month lease required PLUS carport, covered 
Call 928-5194 patio with cement storm

58-TFC cellar under patio, 36
-------------  gallon per minute irri-

bedroom Saf'on well with 12 
sprinkler system. City 
water, over 30 fruit &

1, 2 or 3 
mobile home for rent in 
Merkel 928-4973 

27TFC

Reliable electrical se­
rvice Ceiling fans in­
stalled Applicance re­
pair, complete wiring, 
free estimates Pat Gal­
loway 928-5366 

86TFC

For rent; 2 bedroom 
house with built-in range 
& oven, side-by-side re­
frigerator. washer &
dryer, ceiling fans, fen­
ced yard & storage
building, $150 deposit 
$250 per month. 406 Ash 
928-5194

89-TFC

nut trees, joining Merkel 
City Limit, plus up to 25 
additional acres Call 
928-5613, Cyrus Pee, 
Agent 

96-TFC

For Sale 3 bedroom, 
brick home near school 
$39,000 Contact Century 
21, Martha Thorn agent 
673-2502 

99-4tc

Experienced sewing & 
alterations Soft scul­
ptured dolls made to 
order, doll clothes. Mrs 
L B Rackley & Jan 904 
S 3rd 

96-4tp

$ Lost Dogs avsilabte 
tor adoption Hm>o\ clai­
med. ^ ^ le  Ddoerman; 
Female German Shep­
ard Croat; Fem al, small 
mixad brood- very cute. 
Contact the Merkel Ve­
terinary Clinic at 
328-5235.

Country Home 5 miles 
southeast of Merkel on 
FM 1235, large 2 bed­
room, one bath, kitchen 
with stove, side by side 
refrigerator, washer 
and dryer, central heat 
and air, with four ceiling 
fans, new storm win­
dows, vinyl siding and 
insulation, ferKed yard, 
garden and pens for 
horse, $325 00 a month, 
$150 X  deposit. Call 928- 
5194

100-TFC

Garage Sales

GARAGE SALE: F r i­
day only Starts at 9 
a m. East side of county 
barn in double wide 
trailer, weather permit­
ting.

100-ltc

Public notice
THE STATE OF TEX­
AS
t-To; Charlene Jack- 
son Residence Address 
Unknown

You are hereby com­
manded to appear by 
filing a written answer 
to the P laintiff’s Peti­
tion at or before ten 
o’clock A M of the first 
Monday after the expi­
ration of forty-two days 
from the date of the 
issuance of this citation 
same beino K 
the 4th day of March, 
1905, at or before ten

Mobile Home- 1962 
Champion 14 X 42. New 
carpet. Central Air $500 
Equity and take up 
payments of $181 X  928- 
5220.

96-4tc

o'clock A M before the 
Honorable l04th Dis­
trict Court of Taylor 
County, Texas, at the 
Court House of said 
County in Abilene, Tex­
as

Said Plaintiff s Am­
ended Petition was t i l­
ed in said court, on the 
9th day of November 
A D 1964, in this cause, 
numbered 16.136-B on 
the docket of said 
court, and styled, IN- 
TERFIRST BANK AB­
ILENE. N A Plaintiff, 
vs. CHARLENE JACK- 
SON, Individually and 
as the Sole Heir of 
Stanley Willis Jackson, 
Deceased Defendent.

The names of the 
parties to the cause are 
as follows: INTER-
FIRST BANK ABI­
LENE, N A are Plain­
tiffs and CHARLENE 
JACKSON, Individual­
ly and as the Sole Heir 
of Stanley W ilis  Jack- 
son, Deceased are De­
fendants.

A brief statement of 
the nature of this suit is 
as follows, to wit:

Stanley W ilis  Jack- 
son, now deceased, did 
execute and deliver to 
Interfirst Bank Abilene 
certain promissory 
notes dated on July 25, 
1983: February 15, 1983 
and October 21, 1983. 
The notes were com­
munity debts of Defen­
dant, Stanley W ilis  
Jackson, now deceased 
and Defendant Char­
lene Jackson is now 
solely liable for this 
community debt. Due 
to Defendant's failure 
to pay the notes. Plain­
tiff requests the Court 
to enter judgment aga­
inst the Defendant,

For sale or rent: 3 
mobile homes located in 
the Bettis Heights Ad­
dition. Terms offered. 
Call Cyrus Pee, Realtor 
928-5613.

97-4tc

FOR SALE
APARTMENTS Tl UNITS PLUS 

LAUNDRY AND MINI STORAGES 
100% OCCUPIED ,
ONLY 2 YEARS OLD, 

EXCELLENT TAX SHELIER 
CALL 915 728-8619 or 737-2485

ALL WORK GUARANTEED
ALL T Y P E S  

P LU M B IN G  SUPPLY

CONSOLIDATED PLUMBING
Radio Olapatchad Trucks 

For Faat Oopartdablo Sorvico 
102 KENT  

9064627 or 9QS-52B3 
OLD A N E W W O R K  

BACKHOfc A TRENCHER

BRONCO 
ELECTRIC CO.

RESIDENTIAL - 
COMMERCIAL 

24 HOUR EMERGENCY 
SERVICE

928-4554
Free Estímalos Reasonable Rates

The Merkel Mail

Cloy A. R ichards-Editor-Co-Publlshor 
Melanio Richards-Co-Publishor 

Publiahod at 316 North ^ d ,  
Morkol. Texas

Entard aa Second Class Mail at the 
U. S. P oat Offica, Morkal, Taxas 79636

Subscription Ratea
$10 per year in Taylor County 

$11.75 Anywhere in Texas 
Sl2.S0por year out of state

TEXAS PRESS ASSOCIATION  
NATIONAL NEWS PHOTOGRAPHERS  

ASSOCIATION

NOTICE
'^ypo9'^*pKl44l OT ether errors must be 

brought to our attention before the 
secortd insetlen or claims for refund will 

not bo racognixod.

BILLY E. CLARK

CERTIFIED PUBLIC 
AC C O U N TAN T

INCOME TAX «  TAX REPORTS 
COMPUTER BOOKKEEPING' 

AUDITING A ACCOUNTING

112 EDWARDS 84A^3281 HOME 
MERKEL 928-J663 OFFICE

CHERRY STREET 
SELF STORAGE

FOR ALL YOUR 
, STORAGE NEEDS 
'CALL US AT 928-4336  

OR COME BY 
701 CHERRY STREET 

APT. G

V IC ’S ROOFING
S YEAR CUARANHE 

OVER 10 YEARS..EXPERIENCE 
IN MERKEL AREA ALONE 
FOR FREE ESTIMATE CALL 

928-470S 
I'IC TO R  U R M A  

OWNER b  OPERATOR -

* ♦ # * « * *
6  ^
p  O reBwt '  Orhri
»

*  RIGGAN DIRT CONSTRUCTION

CLASSIFIED RATES  
Clasaitiods are $2 lor the first 18 words 
and 10 cents tor each additional word 

paid In advance a 75 cant billing fee la 
added to all charged adds

LEGAL RATES
Legal notices are 56 cants per line for the 

first insertion and 46 cents per lino lor 
each additional insortion.

Business Phono [9151 926-5712 
Recorder on sttor hours or when out 

Correspond to Box 428. Merkel

M orkel’t  OidosI Business 
Publishing Weekly since IBM

Congress shell moke no law abridging 
^he Freedom et the Press

Pubitshef reserve the right to cancel any 
sdvarlisamant at any time

Ì 928-4481

Ownip T rua ia  
•aa kh M

OMHafd
RaaManflal

Conaervatton

GUARANTEED
RCX?FING

SpaalellM In S U M . Comp. 
Roppira and R w l  THe

w m i Triple AAA Releranae 
In Merkel

IBYeore Experlenae 
SYeoi W arranty

Jerry J<

fu n e r a l  p l a n s
CEMETERY 

HEADSTONES 
iURIAL INSURANCE 

LIFf INSURANCE

j s T A R S U C K  F U N E R A L  H O M U J

Charlene Jackson, for 
Foreclosure of Plain­
tiff s security interest 
m 1977 Chevrolet, for 
the 3 notes mentions 
above, for prejudgment 
int on all notes, post- 
judgment interest at 
highest legal rate, At­
torney fees, cost of 
court, and further re­
lief to which plaintiff 
may show itself entitl­
ed. as IS more fully 
shown by Plaintiff's 
Petition on file in this 
suit.

If this citation is not 
served within ninety 
days after the date of 
its issuance, it shall be 
returned unserved.

The officer executing 
this process shall 
promptly execute the 
same according to law, 
and make due return 
as the law directs.

Issued and given un­
der my hand and the 
Seal of said Court, at 
office in Abilene, Tex­
as, this the 18th day of 
January A.D. 1985. 

Attest:
Rilla Mahoney Clerk, 
104th Dist. Court, 

Taylor County, Texas 
By Joann Lackey 
Deputy.
99-4tc 
115 lines

NOTICE OF 
DISSOLUTION 

OF PARTNERSHIP 
AND INCORPORATION 
-The partnership of 
JACKSON BROS 
FEED & SEED, a par­
tnership composed of 
WAYLON JACKSON. 
BOBBY JACKSON, 
DAVID JACKSON and 
RANDAL FIT2HUGH, 
IS dnsolved effective 
January 1, 1965 and the 
firm shall continue as a 
Texas corporation of the 
name of VOLUME 
FEED & SEED, INC. 
and doing business as 
JACKSON BROS 
FEED & SEED with all 
partnership assets tran­
sferred to the corpora­
tion effective January 1, 
1985 and this notice is 
published pursuant to 
Article 13 02 - 2.02 of the 
Texas Miscellaneous 
Corporation Laws. 
98-29-4fc

CAM HAL'l. U lM l , ^
ROCK A GRAVEL f  
l e v e l  a r e p a ir

DRIVEWAYS 
FREE ESTIMATES

HAROLD 
WALKER 

( 928-5872 (
302 CHERRY ’

SALES S E R V 1 ^
STANFORD'S 

FISHING ^ HUNTING 
STEREO

123 KENT

•'i

6
LESTE» HUMPHREY 

TERMITE AND PEST CONTROL

4

677-2413 I1202 PINE

V T T & B PLUMBING CO.
R « M i B J 928-5936 or 928-6088
mABb* } I LICENSEO G BONDED

¡ 1  25 YEARS PLUMBING EXPERIENa
{  I  COMMERCIAL 0  RESIDENTIAL REPAIR ' |  
J  I ALL TYPES OF NEW CONSTRUCTION !  
» 1  FOR FAST SERVICE G |
J  I  G O OD QUAUTY W ORKMANSHIP |  

•  I ^ ^ ^ SS4I LARRY HARTUNE OWNER |

I

FOR ALL YOUR 
INSURANCE NEEDS 

SEYMORE INSURANCES
P reparty, Gbnaral L la M liiy  

Crap. H aalth. U fa . OlaaMHty. Tax-ahallara. 
rad ra fnan l. EPucatianal plana

102 EDWARDS 928-53791
FARMERS UNION SERVICE POINT

COUNTRY 
UPHOLSTERY SHOP
LOWEST PRICES AROUND

FREE ESTIA^ATES 
LOIS GAI IOW AY 

'/2 MILE EAST OF STUCKEYS 
928-5356

MERKEL
VETERINARY CLINIC

IS N O W  OPERATED BY

BRADLEY R. BANNER. DVM  
KATHRYN L. BANNER. DVM
SAME LOCATION FM 126 NORTH 

HOURS; MON-FRl 8 :3 0 -5 :3 0  
CLOSEO FROM 12 - I FOR LUNCH 

SATURDAYS 8 UNTIL N O O N

928-5235 FOR APPOINTMENTS 
928-4176 POP. FMERGENCIFS

CAL-TEX
FEED YARD

»■«SSiSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSS

WE BUY 
CAHLE & HAY

•iSSSSiiSSSSSSSSSASSSSHS

% 862-6111
TRENT

'e=MEwaBe**w«*SÄ*ewi

862-6179 I

L _
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Check your cats for leukemia

f  The following were winners in 
the Middle Clear Fork Soil and 
Water Conservation Essay con­
test. 7th grade winners included

[shown from left in order of 
placement] Laurinda Powell. Jen­
nifer Hatley, Susie Brandon, Sus­
an Hammond. Amy Coleman.

[Bottom row from left] Bth graas 
winner was Walter Beat and Oiem 
Tran was second.

Staff photo

1
ma
1
1

m
(B

by Kathryn Banner, DVM Merkel 
Vet Clinic

Fjime leukemia is a devastating 
disease that kills cats. This 
jlisease is caused by a virus and is 
transmissable from cat to cat 
There has been no conclusive 
evidence that the virus can be 
transmitted to other animals or to 
people Prolonged, close contact 
seems to be necessary for trans­
mission to occur The leukemia 
virus is spread by saliva, respir­
atory secretions, m ilk, urine, and 
feces The virus can even spread 
from a pregnant cat to her unborn 
kittens

The time between infection with 
the virus and signs of the disease 
are extremely variable Some cats 
tested and found “ positive”  for 
leukemia may never get sick from 
the virus. Others may have many 
bouts of illness. Still others may 
get sick and die because of the 
virus. The virus can cause many 
problems such as tumors, anemia, 
abortion and fetal resorption. One 
additional action the virus can 
have IS suppression of the cat's 
immune system, leaving the cat 
more susceptible to other viral 
infections as well as bacterial and 
fungal infections. Some of these 
signs are fever, pale mucous 
membranes (gums, lining of the 
eyes), little  to no appetite, lack of 
energy, dull hair coat, difficult 
breathing, dehydration, weight 
loss, and chronic diarrhea.

Diagnosis of feline leukemia is 
by a laboratory test using a small 
amount of the cat’s blood. Treat­
ment of leukemia w ill vary 
according to the individual case 
and the situation at home (number 
of cats at home, if the cat is used 
for breeding). Euthanasia may be 
recommended because of the 
severity of the disease and 
because of the potential for spread 
of the disease. After the death or 
removal of a cat with leukemia, 
all food bowls, toys and litter pans 
should be discarded The premisis 
should be cleaned with a 1.32 
dilution of bleach and at least 
three months should pass before a 
new cat or cats are brought into 
the household. Cats already in the 
household should be tested for 
leukemia. It the decision is made 
to treat a cat with leukemia strict 
isolation will decrease the possibi­
lity of spreading the disease to

othor cats LeuKemia has been a 
difficult disease to treat and the 
results ot treatment have often 
been less than successful but new 
means of treatment are being 
tried and may prove very effec­
tive

There is good news, though, a 
vaccine is now available for the

pi cvuiitiuii oi feline ieukem,a. 
Cats that are “ negative' can 
receive the vaceme Kittens can 
be star'ed at nine weeks of age A 
second booster should be given in 
two to three weeks and a third 
booster two to four months later. 
Older cats should probably receive 
three doses as well as annual 
boosters should be given.

Trent poster winners
The winners of the Trent Soil 

Conservation Poster Contest are 
as follows

Kindergarden: Tammy Clark
1st, Laura Griffith 2nd, Keith 
Jones 3rd, D.J. Bland 4th.

1st Grade Suzette Horne 1st, 
Jody Horton 2nd, Teri Brazelton 
3rd, Jennifer Raines 4th

2nd Grade Justin Williams 1st, 
Brad Clark 2nd, Amanda Staut- 
zenburger 3rd, Sarah Griffith 4th.

3rd Grade. Jason Rea 1st, 
Sherrie Clark 2nd, David Barnes 
3rd, Jennifer Mashane 4th 

4th Grade: B ritt Sipe 1st, 
Jennifer Cabral 2nd, Erik Arm­
strong 3rd, Jesus Carrasco 4th.

5th Grade; Janet Marshall 1st, 
Anna Rios 2nd, Scott Bloodworth 
3rd, Patricia Clark 4th.

6th Grade: T.J Armstrong 1st, 
Ginger Massey 2nd, Lisa Penton 
3rd, Jamie Masonheimer 4th.

UNITED STATES 
DEPARTMENT OF 
AGRICULTURE 
Rural Electrification 
Administration 
APPENDIX A 
Statement of 
Nondiscrimination 

Taylor Electric Cooperative, 
Inc. has filed with the Federal 
Government a (^mpliance Assur­
ance in which it assures the Rural 
Electrification Administration 
that it will comply fully with all 
requirements of Title VI of the 
Civil Rights Act of 1964 and the 
Rules and Regulations of the 
Department of Agriculture issued 
thereunder, to the end that no 
person in the United States shall, 
on the ground of race, color, or 
national origin, be excluded from 
participation in, be denied the 
benefits of or be otherwise subject­
ed to discrimination in the conduct 
of its program and the operation of 
its facilities. Under this Assurance 
this organization is committed not 
to discriminate against any person 
on the ground of race, color or 
national origin in its policies and 
practices relating to applications 
for service or any other policies 
and practices relating to treat-

ment of beneficiaries and partici­
pants including rates, conditions 
and extension of service, use of 
any of its facilities, attendance at 
and participation in any meetings 
of beneficiaries and participants 
or the exercise of any rights of 
such beneficiaries and partic i­
pants in the conduct of the 
operations of this organization.

Any person who beiieves him- 
seif, or any specific class of 
individuals, to be subjected by this 
organization to discrimination pro­
hibited by Title VI of the Act and 
the Rules and Regulations issued 
thereunder may, by himself or a 
representative, file with the Secre­
tary of Agriculture, Washington, 
D C. 20250, or the Rural E lec trifi­
cation Administration, Washing­
ton, D.C. 202S0, or this organiza­
tion, or all, a written complaint. 
Such complaint must be filed not 
later than 180 days after the 
alleged discrimination, or by such 
iater date to which the Secretary 
of Agriculture or the Rural 
Electrification Administration ex­
tends the time for filing. Identity 
of compiainants w ill be kept 
confidential except to the extent 
necessary to carry out the purpose 
of the Rules and Regulations.

THE TRENT FFA 
WOULD LIKE TO EXPRESS ITS APPRECIATION!

TO THE FOLLOWING BUSINESSES W HO  
PURCHASED LIVESTOCK AT THE

SHOW

GOOCH
TRENT GIN

COMPANY
V

NE LIVESTOCK SH O W  
ASSOCIATION .,
A WOULD ALSO LIKE TO THANK ALL THE 
ND MERCHANTS OF TRENT, MERKEL & THE 
AREA FOR THEIR DONATIONS TO THE 1985

■ ^ '■ ■■
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Kiss Farming 
Goodbye

Gone would be the sweet smell 
ot the alfalfa.

Gone would be the sprawling oak 
next to the field, where you always 
stopped for lunch.

Gone would be the smell of the sticky, 
muddy earth after a rain.

Gone would be the bam  where you 
layed as a child. And pondered 

ife as an adult.

Maybe not today, tomorrow, or next 
year. But someday, unless you invest in 
the future of farming b>̂  investing in the 
Future Farmers of America.

In your estate planning, consider a tax- 
deductible gift or a bequest to FFA.

For information call or write the Future 
Farmers of America today.

Farming is too important to 
leave behind.

m a t i o n a l  

p o u n d a l K M i

c.ont«ct FF.A Fi>und«it»on
PUnned Giving Ottic» • r  O  5117 

M aJivm  W153705 «Of call coH«t 238-4222

Ne wsbriefs
Art group

C

The Merkel Art Asso­
ciation met February 
7th at Taylor Telephone 
Building

Lora Mann, of Abilene 
gave a lesson on cera­
mics. She demonstrated 
different types of mate­
rial used in ceramics 
and different types of 
medium for painting the 
ceramics and how to fire 
and glaze the material. 
Members found that cer­
amics can be beautiful 
and make interesting 
art works Co*
presided over a short 
business meeting.

Evelyn Stribling read 
the minutes of the last 
meeting and called roll. 
Members discussed old 
and new business with 
an arts and crafts show 
planned for May.

Attending were Ruth 
Buster, Lorene Lee, Gay 
Featherston, Pat Neff, 
Elizabeth Hicks, Ethel 
Pee, Mane Beaird, Ted 
Allen, Imogene Cole­
man, Ruth Cox, Evelyn 
Stribling. Ruth Hogan,

Mabel Vaughn, ot Abi­
lene, was a v is ito r.
Xi Nu Eta

Xi Nu Eta, Chapter of 
Beta Sigma Phi, met 
February 5, in the home 
0* D»»e McCollum for 
their regular meeting.

Programs were on, 
“ Our Place In Life, Who 
and V\Aiat We Are", 
AND “ Marriage-V\/hat Is 
A Successful Marriage". 
Members also enjoyed 
exchanging Secret Sis­
ter Valentine Gifts.

Members attending 
were: Kathy Dacy, Dee 
McCollum, Jana Nelson, 
Carol Portie, Marilyn 
Tittle and Cathy Pack.

The next meeting will 
be March 5 in the home 
of Carol Norman, Mer­
kel.

Allen’s daughter

Inroe, son of Mr & Mrs. 
Herbert Smith of Clyde.

The couple is planning 
a June 22 wedding at the 
First United Methodist 
Church here.

M iss Allen is a senior 
at Merkel High and her 
fiance is employed by 
General Paint & Body of 
Abilene

The meeting Is open to 
all interested in girls 
softball this summer 
and will be held at 112 
Edwards Street here

Hewitt is 
sweetheart for

Preceptor Eta Omega
Birth to Barry’s

Mr. and Mrs Rick 
Barry, (Pamela King), 
of Austin, announce the 
birth ot a daughter, 
Lauren Nicole, born on 
February 7. She weigh­
ed 5 pounds and 4*/̂  oz. 
and was 18'/!t inches 
long. Grandparents are 
Janie J. King, formerly 
of Trent, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Gene Barry of 
Sundown.

engagement told Softball meeting
Mr & Mrs. Dan Allen 

of Merkel have announ­
ced the engagement of 
their daughter, Leigh 
Anne, to Tony Lane Mc-

An orginizational me­
eting for United Girls 
Softball w ill be held 
‘Saturday at 4 p.m. at 
the office of Billy Clark, 
CPA.

Preceptor Eta Omega 
Chapter of Beta Sigma 
Phi met Tuesday, Feb. 
5, 1966 for their Valen-' 
tine Party honoring 
Blanche Hewitt, Sweet­
heart, in the home of 
Betty Conley.

They went to the 
Gourmet Shack for din­
ner and back to Betty's 
for desert and skip bo.

The following ladies 
were present; Betty 
Conley, Betty Satter- 
white. Opal Garner, Val 
Patterson, Louise Ou- 
Bose, Kathy Leverich, 
Ruth Tipton, Blanche 
Hewitt, Connie Ybarra 
and Bobbye Mansfield.

The next meeting will 
be Feb. 19. 1966.

David L. Wagner, Attorney at Law, 
is pleased to announce the opening
of a branch office located at 116 
Edwards. Office hours will be from 
9 to 12 am & 1 - 5 pm each 
Wednesday beginning Feb. 20. To 
make an appointment, please call 
(Monday - Friday) 1-695-2242 or 
928-5921 on Wednesdays.

V A L U E S  A T  
G R E A T  S A V m G

GM

TOMATOES
49  ̂ IS

POTATOES
♦129 Z

MILK
♦ 1 8 9

^ [ tw a iT A U  bread

J L  w*
SEED POTATOES

RS OR MATE IS

ONION SETS
MUTE YBiOW RED
e n w  DOS FOOD

3/»1

V /t ÌB  

UMF

SEVEN UP
ftM CT SEVEN UP

2 UTERSDE ♦ I  1 9  

06RMVS

POTATO CHIPS
R E # - r

MO EGGS
69^

« GAS

15 O Z 
CANS

♦ 10S.8

RE#
MCT CAPUTS

★  COMING SOON ITALIAN NIGHT ★

EACH WEDNESDAY

BECTRIC #'/>*

SM I SAW
M IR  MASE ♦ B V ^

MIDOL
79^

VALENTINE CANDV
VNRMBIESPSD

snuiesAW
RES

*45»*

NWTN STREET 6R0CERV 
K M 0 « L 6 A S _

WOP STAMPS m um TM . uw s wi sr

E X IC A N  D W N E l^  
B U F F E T

EACH FRIDAY
S H R IM P  N IG H T

YES RAY PACK WE WILL HAVE 
FRIED SHRIMP ! ^  w rn i.g n
★  FBIED ★  SHRIMP CREOLE

WITH REGULAR BOITET 
ALL TOUCAN EAT $ |A S O

BEGULAR BTIITET $ eS 0
^  EVERY SRTDRDAT NI6HT 

PRIME RIB $g2S
1  SPECIALTY OF THE WEEK
i  STEAK a  LOBSTER
É  * 1 2 * ®

pThe Gourmet
OPEN 6 am unbi 10 pm Daily

PLEASE ACCEPT OURlELHA N APOLOGIES FOR RUNNING  Q O Q  A i \Q O
t O U O  IT  Qp pQQp W EDNESDAY 5 F A O - W O O
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Sandusky is Lambda Beta Sweetheart
Lambda Beta's 1965 Valentine 

Sweetheart is Debbie Sandusky. 
Her husband is Jerry Don and her 
two children are Joe and Jay 
Debbie and Jerry Don were 
ho^red with a Mexican Supper 
and 42 Party on the 9th. And 01 the 
16th, they will be honored in* 
Abilene at the yearly Beta Sigma 
Phi Valentine Dance.

Our meeting on the 5th was 
hosted by Pat Schuknecht at 
Pleasantville. Rita Moore gave the 
program on Hobbies with a lesson 
on cross stitching handwork.

Members present were: Annette 
Clark, Kay Bishop, Janet McKee- 
han, Virginia Pirraglin, Debbie 
Robertson, Debbie Sandusky and 
Sheri Walton.

State musicians
do well In class

A survey of the most outstand­
ing high school musicians in Texas 
revealed that they are also high 
academic achievers. According to 
Texas Music Educators Associa­
tion President Sally Schott, the 
survey was designed to demon­
strate the parallel between out­
standing musical accomplish­
ments and high academic stand­
ing.

The survey was conducted dur­
ing the convention of the Texas 
Music Educators Association In 
San Antonio, February 7-9. It 
included members of the All-State 
Band, Orchestra and Choir. The 
selection process for these organi­
zations involves a series of 
rigorous tryouts in which only 812 
students from the X,000 who 
audition win places.

Twenty-eight National Merit 
Scholarship F nalists and Semi- 
Finalists performed with these 
All-State organizations. Although 
membership in National Honor 
Society is open only to juniors and 
seniors, disqualifying a significant 
number of underclassmen all­
staters, 229 students have attained 
membership in the National Honor 
Society. Six hundred and seventy- 
two students returned surveys 
which were verified by their 
school counselors.

The most significant measure of 
the academic achievements of 
these gifted musicians is their 
average score on SAT tests: 1965 
Texas All-Sta*e'T|*#irfofffiya Sv*^- 
age-1061, 196!̂  National average- 
893. 1962 Texas average-868.

Averages by performing group: 
Jazz Ensemble—981, Symphonic 
Orchestra—1136, Philharmonic 
Orchestra—1172, Choir—1036, 
Symphonic Band—1074, Concert 
Band—1068.

EDUCATIONAL 
SEMINAR

[TAX FAVOREO 
INCOME 

TUESDAY OR
THURSDAY 

MARCH 5 
MARCH 7

HERITAGE
HALL

7 pm
CASH DOOB  

PRIZE CALL
928-5151 FOR 
RESERVATIONS

v V S E  E L e : ( j j .

B
★  C0MMERC!4l -k REI^DEflTIAL 

★  MRIN6 *  REPHRIN6 
*  INSTAUATION

692-8009 VIEW, TEXAS

Writer says protect credit
»

Dear Editor:
i recentiy came across this 

article in a Fort VAtorth Star 
Telegram, dated August 31, 1925. 
After nearly sixty years, business 
people still have the same pro­
blems, and I believe this article 
speaks tor itself, without any 
further explanation.

Credit is "Good Faith"
To Keep Faith,
Pay Promptly

Any merchant who "charges" 
your purchases in his store, 
whether on "open" or "install­
ment" account, does so as a 
matter of convenience to you, and 
because he believes that you are 
able and intend to settle up in due 
course. He makes the sales to you 

, r K ' " '  • r ”' *■-
On your part, good faith calls for 

prompt payment when payment Is 
due, or it calls lor a frank 
statement to the merchant you are 
indebted to, explaining your fail­
ure to live up to the agreement. He 
has fulfilled his part of the

transaction. You should fulfill 
yours.

Protect your credit, pay prom­
ptly.

Mrs. Waymon Adcock

SuperSat 
Electronics

At a loss for Words? 
But not for Weight?
Try ALLF(X)DTABS — the food 

of the future . . . here toddy. 
Complete, balanct*d vegetable 

nutrition in delicious 
20-calorie tablets.

Owned by Donna Ray  ̂
} Are you tired of the same J 
{old shows on TV ? WouldJ 
i  you like to be able to t 
} choose from over 100 } 
; channels including movie I

chctnnels. education2tl
îchannels, sports networks Î 
j and much more ? If so, * 
;call or come by and let us Î 
Î tdSk with you about a Î

EMMA SHUGART 
DAYTIM E 928-4762 
NIGHTIM E 928-5027 
MEETING AT HERITAGE HALL 
MONDAY FEB. IS, 7:30 pm

I satellite dish. Phone: t
♦ 862-6397 in Trent.

^i(e3(c4e]|e4eiMe3|e>|ci|c3|ci|c3|ti|c#3|c3|M|aMa|i4t

Merkel
Bargain House

102 Lamar 
OPEN

10 am - 5 pm 
Tuesday 
- Sunday

CLOTHES 
!★  TOOLS ★  
I'U R N ITU R E 
I ★ M U CH  
I MORE
I WE TAKE 
t ITEMS IN ON ,

ONSIGNMENTl
SEE SHIRLEV
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FFA opens up the world to people in agriculture.
The National FFA Organization provides International exchange 

programs for FFA members and alumni.
 ̂ In addition to^sending FFA participants abroad, FFA chapters and 
in terested  farm families host young people from other countries.
tTake this opportunity to make new discoveries about yourself and 
(the world around you. Participate in an exchange abroad or host a

foreign visitor.

For more information write:

International Programs 
National FFA Center 
P.O. Box 15160-P 
Alexandria, VA 22309-0160 
Phone (703) 360-3600

liie re  is
purpose 
L?fe.

Many things inakt* lite riclier and 
fu l le r  an d  g ive  it p u r p o s e -  
family, friends, and meaninghil 
work, Jesns C'hrist comm ended 
all of those as Ix ing g<Mxl and 
blessed. But to a young man who 
had a l l t h e s e  things He said, 
“T here  is one thing you are still 
la< king.” (Luke 18:22) The one 
thing lacking was a right rela­

tionship with G(k1. O ne can have 
ev e r \ th in g  else and miss this 
r ig h t  r e la t io n s h ip  w ith  G od . 
T here  is more to hum an life 
than a stomach to stuff, a l>ody to 
clothe, and a m ind to fill. He 
said, “What profit is it to us, if 
we get ever> th ing  in the world 
and lose our soul.” (Matthew 
16:26)

FIRST BAPTIST CH U RCH
301 LOCUST STREET
MERKEL, TEXAS 79536

928-5351

J
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P R .C E S 3 0 0 0  
Thur*Fri-Sat 

Fab. 14. 15&16
STORE HOURS 

7; 30 a .m .-6; 30 p.m. 
Mon thru Sat 

Cloaad Sunday

JOHNSON
6ABV0IL

4 0 Z
Borru

NABISCO
CHIP-A-HOY

COMSTOCK NO. S C M
PIE

RLUN6
TEXSUN

C N E R R V
I 0RW6E J U IC E

B E A N S  2 ^
2 FOR

*  PARADE SOS CUT

i GREEN
*  PARADE SOS CS

i 6OL0BI
*

$  FRENCH IDAHO

I  INSTANT
*  V E 6 A U S 0 3

$ MIXED
t  VAN CAMP SOO

 ̂ WHITE

C O R N  
P O T A T O ES  

V E G E T A B LE S  2 for 9 3

16 OZ 
BOX

* 1”
\̂t9

a y

CAMPBEUS
M U S H R O O M

SOUP

19 OZ

2 TAU
C M S SS♦

fr

H O M IN Y  
J U IC E
DO

REFRIED B E A N S

t FOR 
«FOR 6 9 *

K m  CROCKER
BROWNIE

Z

M M NEU HOUSE
C O FFEE

We'fe Crornug Ahoiil fhese f'm

K m  CROCKER
BISQUICK

4 6 «  *1*»

z
eOOMES

i\l9

1

CREAMV
CfitSCO

3 IB S |9 8
CAN B

m i  IM TRAPf OR m o r ì

a a u m  o p  a m e n p s

#
¥t
*9f>
*
*
»
*

*
*

FROZEN FOODS

PARADE
O R A N G E
J U IC E
AIW TJBM M A

12 OZ 
CANS 8 Î *

w m E s r  ' n
JB tO S  6 «

PBM ROUS "* 98^
TOTWOS 10 O Z è ^ A A

P IZ Z A S  “ “  ^ 1® ’
ASSORTED

PARADE

O L E O
SOFT 

16
W SBÍ

4 9 1

«tt
*
•N

*
*
«
«
*
*
*t

</t MOON

C H E E S E  
* i * ’ t10 OZ 

PK6

PARADE

RAISINS
C O C A C O IA

«909
IS  O Z 6 3 *

2UTER
BOTTIE

ARMOURS

TREET
UM CNEONM EAT

12 OZ 
CAN

S|19

HUNTS

PARADE
NONO

MILK
GAL
JUG

CATSUP
WS2 0Z

JUG

PARADE
RED PUIM

JA M
18 OZ 
0IA5S 99^

«**•N«SE«»SE
SE

HEINZ HB M U

PieMES
7 9 *16 OZ

JAR

SE
SE
SE
SE
SE
SE
SE
SE
SE
SE

J E

PARARE
UWFAT

16 OZ 
CRTN

12 OZ

$  ARMOUR STAR

SEOOOCH BIO COUNTRY

fH A M S
SE HICKORY SMOKED 
*  B O U

____FOREMOST

^ C R E A M  
CHEESE

CREAM
mm PUDDING'

¥AN_|^
“  OR CHIU 2 FOR

ORANCfS
CRUFCRFW

N M E l

fB A O O N  ^  
S A U S A G ESsizziER

m s  UASTO HENS

IB
4 9 «

FRESH C B iO lfi

CARROTS
MASH DBieiOOS

RED APPIES
FRESH

CELERY
FRESH ____ __
HONEY DEW
YELLOW

ONIONS

SE
SE
SE
SE
SE
SE
SE
SE
SE
SE
SE
SE
SE
SE
SE
SE
SE
SE
SE
SE
SE

2 F 0 R

S IB  BAB

ID S T A U

12 OZ 
PKG

*  ARMOUR STAR K)
SE

t
SE

f
T O R K EV S IB

«#
CLEANSER

COMET
i s n s o f

UQUID
IVORY

« «  «|4 9
1ÉP ilr ilr

DOUBLE
GHTBOND
STAMPS

««•WEDNESDAY
«• '< OR aORf ■ IRAN

S T E P S '

C A  R  S O  N  ’ S
S U P E R  M A R K E T

VF («-r K  K AS (
,M . T ’ f ’ ABI ES ^  ^ ^  ^ BE ^ EATS IN TO

í í^


