
Voi. 2 No. 20 Brackettville, Fort Clark, Spofford, K inney County, And Gampwood , Texas June 2 8 ,1 9 9 0

-**»!—■ - ' ■> «i i.»
"<3f a man 1p á  Ijalf as mud3 Ijmdsigfyt, as ip has insigijt, Ip ínnuld 1}arrt tinirr as mart ftrrestglft” 1

J.D. “Jack” Huey and Tencha Pena

Silver Haired Legislator

Great R eviews For 
Opening Night

Chief Yellow Wolf, Paco Pere? and 
his warriors.

Cavalrymen, Tom McNew, Tim 
McNew, Tim Ward, and Scotl Sims.

Harrell Floyd portrays the Rancher 
in “ The Glory Road” .

uGlory Road y'

Birthday Wishes 
From President 
and Mrs. Bush

Essie Coker, Richard Schafer, Tellis 
Boutwell.

By DORTHY PAYNE
STAFF REPORTER

J.D. “ Jack” Huey of Brackettville 
has been elected to the Silver Haired 
Legislature of Texas. Jack will 
represent Kinney, Val Verde, and 
Real counties in the Silver Haired 
Legislature.
The members of this group are an 

elected representative, non-partisan 
body of citizens 60 years and over in 
age, elected by their peers. 
Candidates can be any citizen sixty 

years of age or over prior to January 
1, 1990. They must be registered 
voters residing in the area in Texas
from which he or she is applying for 
candidacy and who will uphold the 
responsibilities of the elected office. 
The Texas Silver Haired Legislators 

met in the Texas Capitol in 1989 for

In a special meeting held Tuesday, 
June 19, 1990, the Brackett Indepen­
dent School District Board of

Trustees approved the purchase of a 
two classroom portable building for 
use during the 1990-91 school year. 
The cost of the building will be 
around $ 30,000 or $ 19.00 per square 
foot.

Superintendent Bob McCall told the 
Board that this building would be 
necessary if Kindergarten and third 
grade exceeded the 1:22 ratio. Board

Carl Esser with his family and 
guests were very surprised to see a 
mountain lion on Schubach Lane 
while they were returning to the 
Schubach Ranch Saturday night at

about 10:30 P.M. Carl ran over the 
lion but did not kill it. The .223 rifle 
in the car was not loaded at that time, 
so no shots were fired at the lion.

After Carl hit the cat again with the

the purpose of considering and 
voting on proposed legislation that 
concerns the needs of both present 
and future older Texans.
The Legislature offered this oppor­

tunity to become more knowledgable 
about the legislative process through 
involvement, to deveìop a forum for 
older Texans, for discussion of senior 
citizens issues, debating mese issues 
and establishing legislature to con­
sider, to provide advocacy training 
enabling delegates to continue their 
role within the community, to offer 
informed assistance to policy 
makers, and to provide an avenue 
through which older citizens may 
serve as a resource to public and 
private sectors, boards and commis­
sions. The senior citizens have the 
utmost confidence in Mr. Huey and 
are happy to be represented in the 
Silver Haired Legislature of Texas.

President Jim Bader appointed Zack 
Davis, Beth Ann Smith, and Eloy 
Garica to a building committee. The 
committee will explore future build­
ing needs, construction costs, and 
funding options and report to the 
Board in July.

In further action, the Board 
accepted administrative recommen-. 
dations and approved the contract of

Mr. Ken Campbell. Mr. Campbell 
will coach at Brackett High School 
and teach math.

car, it ran through the fence into the 
Earwood Ranch. Rusty Brown was 
notified of the chase and brought his

dogs to the Earwood Ranch. The 
dogs found the cat in a tree where it 
was shot by 14 year old Richard Esser

at 1:00 A.M. Sunday morning. The 
male lion weighed 107 pounds and 
measured 6 feet and 3 inches in 
length.

By EES ROPI R
STAFF REPORTER 
“ The Glory Road” , was presented 

this past Saturday evening at the 
Amphitheater on Fort Clark 
before a full house. Early reviews 
have declared the production a 
smashing success by exceeding the 
expectations of the viewers and the 
critics. Remarks such as “ Wonderful 
. . .Absolutely fantastic . . . Great 
Acting . . . Well Written . . . Would 
not mind seeing it again . . . ” could 
be heard from members of the 
audience as they departed following 
the final curtain.

From the very opening the tempo of 
the presentation was brisk and lively 
as the first scene opened with a large 
portion of the cast dancing onto the 
stage while singing, “Skip To My 
Lou”. Once the characters realized 
they had captured the audience they 
really went to work, never at any 
time allowing themselves to be 
overcome by lethargy.
Harrell Floyd was outstanding in his 
role as the Rancher. The audience 
was captivated as he presented a 
running commentary of the history
of Fort Clark from the days of the

cavalry and the Indians to the present 
day of fun and recreation. John 
Ward did an excellent job of 
portraying Oscar Brackett while 
Kitten Daly, playing his daughter, 
Ora lee, was breathtakingly beautiful 
in her part. Tom McNewv Jr. was 
brilliant in his role as Lieutenant Tim 
Riley. The raves go on and on as each 
cast member completely evolved into 
the character they were playing, 
making the presentation a very 
memorable event.

Director, Fred Brockwell, and 
producer, Betty Inman, worked long 
and hard and the fruits of their labor 
paid off with a very successful 
project. The rewriting of the script by 
local historian, Ben Pingenot, contri­
buted heavily to the success of the 
play. His creative ability to put into 
writing the events of the past 
certainly compliments his ingenuity 
and sincerity of research into Texas 
history and the events leading up to 
Fort Clark as we know it today.
The play will again be presented this 

coming weekend, Friday, June 29, 
and Saturday, June 30, starting at 
8:30 p.m. Information regarding 
ticket sales can be attained by 
contacting Margaret Holt.

BY DORTHY PAYNE
STAFF REPORTER

The annual Birthday Celebration for. 
Essie “ Big Mama” Coker was held 
June 23rd at the N.C.O. club at Fort 
Clark Springs.

This was Essie’s eightieth birthday 
and a special presentation was the 
highlight of the evening when United 
States Navy Retired Air Controller 
Chief Tellis Boutwell in full Navy

dress uniform delivered to Essie 
birthday greetings from Barbara and 
President George Bush, with their 
best wishes for health, happiness,

love and God’s Blessings making 
Essie a member of the President’s 
White House Octogenarian Club.

Hostesses and Hosts for the happy 
occasion were Essie’s children and

Money No 
Available
The City of Brackettville up to 

about 1977 was using a parcel of 
County land for the City’s landfill 
which was located north-west of 
town. At that time and a few years 
later the City was receiving money 
from the Federal Government called 
Revenue Sharing, which the City 
Council voted to use to defray the 
cost of running a landfill. This 
money is not available to the 
Counties or Cities any longer.

In 1977 the City had to moved their 
landfill to another location. The City 
and Mr. Joe K. York, Sr. entered 
into a contract with terms and 
conditions one of which being that 
the City could have the landfill for 10 
years free as long as it didn’t charge 
the citizens of Brackettville for the 
use of the landfill. The landfill was 
and still is located on the Spofford 
road.

In 1987 the 10 year contract signed 
between the City and Mr. Joe K. 
York, Sr. expired. The City and Mr. 
Joe York, Jr. entered into a contract 
for three years with terms and 
conditions to be followed by the 
City. On re-entering a contract with 
Mr. Joe York, Jr. the City agreed to 
"pay Mr. York a fee of $200.00 per 
month paying in 6 month payments. 
Total charges for the lease of the 
landfill being $2,400.00 per year.
The City of Brackettville had two 

employees working at the landfill 
until the latter part of last year. The 
cost of running a landfill is great and

grandchildren; Bobbie Schafer, Dan 
Foreman, James Foreman, Wesley 
Robinson, Jewel Robinson, Melba 
Foreman, and Roy Hensley and 
Dimple Henry.

Out of town guests were Mr. and 
Mrs. James Cross of Shreveport, 
La., Grandson, Mr. and Mrs. Billy 
Robinson and children Julie, Jim, 
Kirk and Merideth from Copper 
Canyon, Texas, Mr. and Mrs. Jerry 
Henry from Bellviile, Texas, Darla, 
Rachel and Leah Fuller from La 
Grange, Texas, Mr. and Mrs. Larry 
Henry and daughters Jennie and 
Jessie from Houston, Texas, Jerry, 
Judy and Jennifer Henry from 
Austin, Texas, Mark Junker and 
Amy Oberlin from Irving Texas.
After a delicious supper, visiting and 
dancing was enjoyed by “ Big 
Mama” atid her guests to the music 
of Ken Wells and his Saddle Tree 
Band of Devine, Texas.

Longer

the rules and regulations are stiff and 
will soon be getting tougher.
Several years ago the City put a 

landfill fee on all utility customers to 
try and defray the cost of the landfill 
lease, but at that time did not take in 
consideration the salaries, landfill 
permit fee, digging of new ditches 
and equipment and so on.

The City receives about $4,800.00 
per year from collection for the 
landfill from the utility customers 
and a few dollars here and there on 
extra charges for tires, metal and 
appliances.

The cost to the City to have an 
employee, pay liability, workers’ 
comp., social security, vehicle insur­
ance, equipment purchase and maint­
enance including diesel and oil, 
landfill lease, digging new pits, 
(which by law the City must have 
several pits for different waste), extra 
personnel to pick up litter along the 
Spofford "road and around the

landfill that is from people hauling 
trash that is not tied down or covered 
as required. All these things ment­
ioned above loses the City around 
$20,000 or more per year and the 
City has no way of recovering this 
sum. This money could be used for 
repairing more streets badly needed 
in the City.

The City Council is now in the 
process of studying this problem and 
hope to soon come up with a feasible
answer for everyone.

Board Approves 
New Class Rooms

Left to right: Walt Esser, Richard 
Esser, Rusty Brown, and Carl Esser.

14 Year Old Kills Big Cat
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Sheriff’s Corner
By Sheriff Norman H. Hooten

V \ \  I Kinney 

County

The owners of the VCR machine 
that was recovered during our recent 
investigation of two burglaries of 
vehicles came into the Sheriff’s 
Office on Sunday, June 24th, to 
identify the property taken from 
their residence during a burglary that 
is believed to have occured the night 
of June 9th. The owners, Mr. & Mrs. 
A.L. Bacon of Unit 12, Lot 6, Ft. 
Clark Springs had been out of town 
on vacation and upon their return 
discovered their home had been 
burglarized. Upon reporting the 
crime they learned that we had 
already recovered some of their 
stolen property and had been unable 
to file on the suspect because we were 
unable to determine the location of 
the crime. As a result of their 
identification of the recovered stolen 
property and other evidence in the 
case, 1st degree felony charges "have 
been formally lodged against Hugh 
Wayne “ Hootie” Martin, 30, of 
Spofford. Martin now faces three 
felony charges as a result of his 
week-long crime spree that culminat­
ed with his arrest by this writer and 
Chief Deputy Sheriff David Luna on 
Thursday, June 14th. Martin has 
now been formally charged with two

3rd degree felony charges of Burglary 
of a Vehicle and one 1st degree 
felony charge of Burglary of a 
Habitation. He remains in the 
County Jail at the time of this writing 
in lieu of bonds totalling $20,000.;; 
set by Justice of the Peace Alvin 
Hall.
Another local investigation into 

alleged voting irregularities during 
the City election on May 5, 1990 is 
being conducted by Texas Ranger 
Johnny Allen of Del Rio at the 
direction of District Attorney Tom 
Lee.
The allegations are that at least 9 

people voted in the City election 
illegally and that the on-duty election 
Judges/Clerks failed to properly 
carry out their duties and responsibil­
ities by allowing the 9 to vote without 
properly and correctly determining 
their place of residence and/or 
issuing a challenge to their eligibility. 
Under Texas election laws only 
legally registered voters whose phys­
ical and officially registered address 
is within the city limits may legally 
vote in a city election. At least 9 
persons are believed to have voted 
illegally in the May 5th election. 
Anyone who knowingly votes in an 
election illegally is guilty of a 3rd 

—

Big Mama
Ses!
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We get too soon old and too tare 
smart.

We are now mailing subscriptions. 
If you want to subscribe, please clip 
this application and mail to: The 
Brackett News, P.O. Box 1039, 
Brackettville, Texas 78832, or drop

I

by our office at 507 S. Ann St. (by I 
the bank). Our rate is $15.00 per {' 
year. Please include check or money 
order with the order form.

Thank you J 
The Staff of The Brackett News s

NAME
ADDRESS

BILLING ADDRESS 
(IF DIFFERENT)
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The Brackett News welcomes letters 
to the Editor. The Editor reserves the 
right to edit all letters submitted for 
length and context.

Letters will be edited to avoid the 
use of profanity or libelous state­
ments pertaining to the rights of

M EM B ER  1990

citizens.
Letters published and columnists 

viewpoints do not necessarily reflect 
the beliefs of this newspaper.
All letters must be signed and 

include an address and phone 
number. Thank You.
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degree felony and an election judge/ 
clerk who allows improper voting 
procedures to occur without issuing a 
formal challenge is guilty of a Class B 
misdemeanor. The results of the 
investigation will be submitted to the 
Kinney County Grand Jury by the 
District Attorney.

Rabies has always been a dreaded 
disease that affects wild animals, 
domestic livestock, household pets, 
and sometimes, humans. Rabies 
affects the nervous system and 
mammals that contract the disease 
die a slow, painful, horrible death. 
Anyone who has ever witnessed an 
animal or most tragic of all, a 
human, die from rabies infection will 
never forget it.

Hot, dry weather such as we are 
currently experiencing is a factor that 
seems to stimulate rabies outbreaks 
that usually start in the wild animal 
population and spill over into 
domestic animals and pets exposed to 
bites or scratches from the infected 
animal, often the injuries being 
undetected by the owners until it’s 
too late. Never, ever should the 
owners of pets that have been 
vaccinated against rabies assume that 
the vaccination will protect their pet 
from contracting rabies if bitten by 
an infected animal. The pet that does 
obtain a bite or injury from an 
unknown source should be isolated 
for at least 14 days (21 to 45 days is 
even better).

On May 27, 1990 a Ft. Clark 
resident reported that his dog had 
been bitten by a skunk and though 
the dog had been vaccinated against 
rabies, further investigation was 
needed. The skunk was luckily 
identified, located, and killed with 

i the head sent to Austin for examinat­
ion. The dog was placed in isolation 
for observation for 45 days. The 

, skunk has been determined to have 
had rabies at the time the dog was 
bitten and all Kinney County resid­
ents, and most especially those with 
livestock and family pets should take 
precautions against the dreaded 
disease.

All family pets (cats, dogs, and 
other mammals) should be vaccin­
ated against rabies annually and 
anyone observing a wild animal that 
appears unusually tame or sick 
should immediately get away from 

■ that animal and report it to the 
Sheriff’s Department. Anyone who 
has cats or dogs or other pet 
mammals that run loose and appear 
to have been bitten or scratched and 
the source is unknown should 
immediately isolate that animal for at 
least 14 to 21 days. And, most 
im portantly, anyone bitten or 
scratched by a dog or cat or a wild 
animal should immediately report the 
incident and attempt to have the 
guilty animal identified, isolated, 
and/or killed and it’s head sent off 
for examination.

I certainly do not want to cause 
panic or over-reaction by this report, 
just plain old common sense and 
basic rules of caustion and .pre­
caution will provide adequate pro­
tection against the dreaded disease of 
rabies. Vaccinate your pets annually, 
use common sense and caution when 
handling pets or walking in areas 
where wild animals are known to 
roam, report all bites, scratches, or 
sick animals. The danger lies in 
assuming that just because a pet has 
been vaccinated against rabies he is 
therefore immune, this is just not 
100% guaranteed.
Be careful out there!

THAT’S ALL!
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Thou are many facets to Kinney 
County and Brackettville. At one 
time there were basically only two; 
Ft. Clark and ranching. Ranching is 
certainly the backbone of the econ­
omy of the County. Though Ft. 
Clark has been de-activated the aura 
it created still hovers over the area. 
The fascinating history of Ft. Clark 
makes it one of the most historic 
spots in all the Southwest. It is 
certainly fitting that there be a 
museum to keep alive much of that 
history.
Don Swanson and his cohorts have

Letter 
to the 
Brackett
News
Just want you to know how much I 

enjoy your newspaper. It gave me 
information about the candidates 
before elections last April, The 
Dallas News published a section on 
the Sunday before election. Your 
paper was published a week before. 
It gave time to study them. . . .

Love, Hazel Sullivan.

Unsung Hero
by Joe Townsend

A lady moved to Brackettville and 
married a local man. The man had a 
young son and the mother did a 
wonderful job in helping the boy 
grow into manhood. This lady has 
always been a hard worker. For a 
number of years she has been a 
waitress at Ft. Clark Springs. She is 
always warm hearted and friendly. 
Her capable and friendly service has 
endeared her to the heart of every 
Rotarian. She indeed is a likeable 
individual and faces every problem in 
up-beat fashion. Surely Bonnie 
Goula is an “ Unsung Hero.”

$500.00 REW ARD
For Information Leading To The 

Arrest and Conviction Of 
Anyone Stealing Livestock In 

Kinney County.

Norman H. Hooten 
Sheriff\ Kinney County

The Bible Says
Jesus said, “ Let not your heart be 

troubled.” The entire thesis of the 
Bible and the teachings of Jesus is, 
“ Don’t Worry.” Worry is always an 
evidence of lack of Faith in God. 
With confidence in Him generated by 
a firm faith, there is no need to get 
stomach ulcers or a nervous break­
down from worry. Jesus sounds the 
Key when He says, “ Ye believe in 
God, believe also in me,” “ I and the

done a masterful job with the 
museum at Ft. Clark. It is a most 
difficult job to establish a museum 
and even more difficult to maintain 
one. The museum at Ft. Clark is a 
most entrancing and fascinatiing 
point of interest. It shows a 
tremendous amount of hard work 
yet it takes a capable leader to direct 
the project. Don has done an 
outstanding work. I realize that 
many people are not at all concerned 
with museums but as years pass and 
hair begins to turn gray or turn loose, 
we all have a tendency from time to

time to become nostalgic. Then our 
interest in museums increases. This 
generation owes a great deal for the 
preservation of artifacts and mem­
entos of the relatively recent past. A 
great word of appreciation is due 
each person who has contributed to 
the museum. I know of no small 
town and few cities that have a 
museum comparable to the one in Ft. 
Clark. It’s wonderful that Ft. Clark 
Springs provides the building and 

. facilities for the museum. If you have 
riot seen it, a real treat awaits your 
visit.

Smoke From
Nakai
By Nakai Breen

Some Spanish games were intro­
duced to the Southwest Indians 
among the Rio Grande Pueblos. One 
of the games was the Corso de Gallo 
or the Chicken Pull. The Spanish 
brought such games from Spain. It is 
a contest of riding skill traditionally 
performed on San Juan Day (June 
24) even though it can be performed 
any other time on seperate events 
such as a native ceremony. The 
Papago Indian version of the chicken 
pull takes place on a sandy race track 
several hundred feet long. Half 
down the track a live rooster is 
buried up to its neck in the loose 
sand. Individual riders galloping at 
full speed lean out of their saddles 
and attempt to pull the rooster out of 
the ground. It usually takes many 
tries before a rider succeeds in 
grabbing the fowl free.

The tribes that adopted the Chicken 
Pull gave it a religious connotation 
To the Rio Grande Pueblos, it has an 
agricultural significance with the 
planting and subsequent removal of 
the rooster is regarded as symbolic of 
sow ing an d  reap ing . T he b lo o d  and  
feathers of the fowl represent the 
sunrise and clouds. The foam and 
lathered horse represent rain and is 
also considered to be a blessing for 
the earth which promotes fertility.

The June 24 or San Juan Day is 
recognized among the pueblos as a 
day to cut a woman’s hair and to 
bathe in the river real early in the 
morning; and it is considered a day 
for rain.

Ahoe,
Nakai
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BREENG4LLERY

507South A n
BuckettviUe 563-2961

Father are one.” You can have God 
with you in every time of need if you 
simply put your faith in His Son, 
Jesus Christ. The choice is yours, 
worry, fret, fear, or through Jesus 
Christ know peace in your heart 
under any circumstances.

“ Let not your heart be troubled, 
you believe in God, believe also in 
me.”

Have Your 
Government Check 
Sent Directly to Our 
Bank with
DIRECT DEPOSIT.
Stop in anytime and let us help you fill out the 
application for Direct Deposit . . .  the sooner the

T h e  F ir s t  S t a t e  B a n k
b r a c k e t t v il l e . T exa s  78832

PHONE (812) 862-2481
M K M B B II r . o . i . c
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The Golf Course Management 
Committee met this past Thursday 
morning at 10:00 A.M. in the Saber 
Room. Highlighting the discussion 
was the resignation of one the 
committee members. Tom 
Faulkenberry, citing personal rea­
sons, submitted his resignation to the 
G.C.M.C. and it was unanimously 
“ accepted with regret” . A replace­
ment was discussed to fill this 
vacated spot and it was agreed by the 
four remaining members to contact 
Ralph Viestenz in regards to this 
vacancy. Mr. Viestenz was contacted 
and he responded with an affirmative 
answer. His expertise and leadership 
qualities should make him a valuable 
addition to this committee.
This time last year a small conting­

ent of golfers were serving on the 
Golf Committee as it was known 
then. They were a very enthusiastic 
group who became very well known 
dueTo their creative and innovative 
ventures. Twice each month they 
sponsored a twilight putting tourna­
ment and supper. Twice each month 
they sponsored a twilight 9 hole
scramble and supper. Their batting 
average for successful fun evenings 
-was a big .1000. This group of fun 
lovers were headed by Vicki Nichols, 
Helen Miller, Hubie McKelvy, and 
jerry “ Fat Boy” Adams. They put in 
many long and hard hours to assure 
the golfers a good time of fun and 
fellowship.
The ladies, seeing a need to be more 

diversified, met and decided to

sponsor a fashion show. Vickie 
Nichols, who was an expert with 
many years of experience in this 
field, was a member of the Golf 
Committee so she was called on to 
head up the project. Vickie jumped 
in and “ wrote the script” fbr one of 
the most successful projects ever held 
at the golf course. The rest is history.

The Men’s Golf Association spons­
ored a summer golf league and had 
full teams with a waiting list. 
Excitement surrounded the play from 
week to week until the tournament 
was over with a winner declared. A 
big party was thrown and the winner 
and his team were awarded trophies.
The good times that took place last 

summer could make an individual 
very nostalgic if he or she would just 
sit down and reminisce for awhile.

Now come the questions...what has 
happened to the twilight putting 
tournaments and supper with your 
friends...what has happened to the 
twilight 9 hole scrambles and supper 
with your friends...what has happ­
ened to the summer parties the 
golfers used to have... what has 
happened to the Men’s League Play 
that worked so good during the 
summer months...what has created 
this lackadaisical attitude by one of 
the best group of fun lovers in 
Texas???

Golfers...it is “ get busy time” . 
When the winter Texans get wind of 
this summer slump they will get a 
kick out of pointing their fingers and 
saying, “ 1 told you it wouldn’t Work

with us gone.” Vickie...Helen...Fat 
Boy...Hubie...where are you when 
we need you most? Helllp!!!!!
While visiting with Bob Young the 

other day he mentioned that he was 
still concerned with Hubie’s erratic 
game of golf. When asked how Old 
McKelvy could be spotted on the 
course Bob replied, “ His golf cart is 
the only one on the course with a 
stretcher on it and his bag is white 
with a red cross on it.” "

Ralph and Hilda Viestenz hosted 
the couple’s scramble this past 
Thursday and need we say more...it 
went off without a hitch and after it 
was over the results were very 
carefully compiled and turned in to 
the office for this reporter to pick up. 
This man wrote the book on 
consideration and efficiency. What a 
gentleman!!!

Leading his team to a first place tie 
with a flawless round of golf was the 
ageless Robbie Robinson, who was 
assisted by his wife Ruth, and Patti 
and Bob Barnett as they posted a net 
score of 39.75. Matching this best 
score of the day were the long hitting 
Tom McNew, his wife, Lynn, and 
E.W. and Louise Williamson with an 
identical net 39.75. But alas, as luck 
would have it, the Williamsons and 
the McNews lost the match on a 
scorecard playoff, thus awarding the 
first place trophy to the Robinsons 
and the Barnetts. Winning third 
place outright was “ Chip off the old 
block” Kerry Viestenz and his wife 
Janice and Ray and Cubie Kurtz.
With 16 couples signed up this past 

week the weekly couple’s tournament

continues to be one of the real bright 
spots on the calendar as a very select 
and faithful group of golfers contin­
ue to support it from week to week. 
Sondra Meil reports that 17 players 

turned out this past Monday morning 
for their weekly 9 hole scramble. She 
also would like to remind her group 
of golfers that starting next week 
they would be teeing up for play at 
8:00 A.M. due to the intense heat 
wave that is now scorching our area. 
All golfers should try to show up 
early and get signed in by 7:45 A.M. 
assuring themselves a spot on one of 
the teams.

After a shaky start Bill Koons and 
his team of Harold Gallion, Dwight 
Gilliland, and Frank Eckenroth 
butchered the opposition by record­
ing a net 24 to haul down the 
winner’s share of the prize money. 
Second place was won by Patti 
Barnett, Lou Sofaly, Dave Blair, 
Harold Miller, and Elmer Schrantz 
with a net score of 27.
Twenty three bubbling beauties en­

tered a game of low net. Playing with 
the consistency of a real professional 
Mary Stephenson mopped up on the 
opposition with a net 59 to nab first 
place. Second place, as the 
Stephensons continued to roll, was 
Shirley Stephenson recording a net 61 
while Eileen Voracek battled back 
for a net 64.

Two golfers were sitting in the 
expectant fathers’ lounge at a 
hospital. In a few minutes a nurse 
walked over to one and said, 
“ Congratulations. You have a little 
daughter.” The other golfer leaped 
up and shouted, “ Hey, that ain’t 
fair. I was here first!”
WORDS OF WISDOM: In the 

game of life it’s a good idea to have a 
few early losses, which relieves you 
of the pressure of trying to maintain 
an undefeated season.

BY DORTHY PAYNE
STAFF REPORTER

The closing ceremonies to the 
T-Ball, Little League and Senior 
League were held on June 23, 1990 
at the Brackettville Little League 
Baseball Park.

David Dorrough brought the 
Invitation to Prayer and led the 
pledge of Allegiance. Judy Burks
sang , a. beau lifu l ren d itio n  o f  the
“The Star Spangled Banner”. 
President Sonny Harrison spoke to 

the players, parents, grandparents 
and other spectators, thanking every­
one that helped make this years

baseball season a success. Especially
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important this year was an addition 
of Girls Little Leagues and a Senior
boys Team “ The Rangers.” 
Individual Trophies were presented 

to all the players, then trophies to the 
League Champions of both girls and 
Boys teams.
The Girls Team, “ The Silver Roses” 
was champion of the Girls Little 
League, the Little League team 
“ Lions” WaSiChampion of the Boys 
Little League. The Senior Boys 
Team “ The Rangers” Were champ­
ions and All Stars.
All Star Teams for boys and Girls 

were named for Little League, which 
were “ The Silver Roses” (girls) and 
the “ Lions” , (Boys).

Kinney County Little League would like to 
thank the following for their generous 
donations during the 1990 season:

tin**
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Hjlda Aguirre, Gracie Terrazas, 
Arianna DeLeon, Jo Lee Jones, 
Monique Pierce, Courtney Harrison, 
Maiissa Martinez, Zandra Negrete,

Little League Girls Champs 
Silver Roses

Leilani Williams, Melissa Terrazas, 
Edwina Banta, Debra Frerich, 
Denise Frerich, Vianna Pierce, Linda 
Sharp—Manag

Senior, Little League, and girl’s 
softballs sponsors.

Brackettville Lions Club 
La Fonda Ranch 

Texcor Industries Inc.
T-Ball Sponsors.

Brackettville Lions Club 
Nash Dry Goods 

Rotary Club 
Lloyd Davis Ranches 

LaFonda Ranch
Kinney County Cavalryman and 

Slubar Insurance 
Alvin Hall 

Super S
Jewel Robinson 
First State Bank 

Spring Ranch c/o Bruce Sciba 
Kinney County Little League 
Donations.
Mr. and Mrs. Bob McCall, Mr. and 

Mrs. McKelvy, Knights of Colum­
bus, Kinney County, C.P.&L., Mr. 
and Mrs. Pete Perez, Mr. and Mrs. 
Richard Smith, Rob’s Candy Jar,

Stop and Shop, Sunshine Garden 
Center, Rob’s Mini Shop Grocery, 
Kinney County Land Co., Fort Clark 
Springs Association, Fuentes Groc-i 
ery, Smiley’s Bike Shop, Ballew 
Feeds, Southwest Windmill, Mr. and 
Mrs. Sonny Harrison.

The League would also like to 
extend a big thank you to Albert 
Payne and his crew for coordinating 
a most successful fund-raising bar-b- 
que, and to Julia Terrazas for 
running a most profitable concession 
stand for the past three months. Julia 
was voted volunteer of the year at the 
last meeting, and everyone is certain­
ly proud of her untiring efforts to 
help the league.

This is the first year Kinney County 
Little League has sponsored three All 
Star teams, and we hope the 
community can follow these teams 
with pride as they advance to the 
district tournaments.
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Girls Little League All-Stars— Seniors League All-Stars, Rangers

Softball, Samantha Luna, Edwina 
Banta, Reagan Spring, Denise 
Frerich, Courtney Harrison, Debra 
Frerich, Valerie Jimenez, Deborah 
Villarreal, Amy Bader, Lindy

LaMascus, Francisca Garza, Rebecca 
Payne, Melissa Terrazas, Jessica 
Payne. and Linda Sharp as manager 
—Elena Luna as coach.

' ^ 1  A , ,

J .J. Sandoval, Frank Guajardo, 
Rumaldo Serrano, Michael Munoz, 
Jesse Terrazas, Gerardo Cedillo, 
Angel Jaso, Lynn Floyd, Marty

« r

Schermerhorn, Wil Shahan, Ruben 
Terrazas, Doug Spring, and Manny 
Pena as coach.

f

M
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Boys Little League Champs-Lions
Boys Little League 
All-Stars Hardball

Jose Aguirre, Jamie Collins, Marcus 
Garley, Ryan Spring, Nat Terrazas, 
Miguel Aguirre, Beau Smallwood, 
Ignacio Aguirre, Ramon DeLeon,

Andres Garley, John Smith, 
Wayne Ballew, Nacho Aguirre 
manager and Buck Smallwood
coach.

Ramon DeLeon, Moses Hernandez, 
Nacho Aguirre, Jorge Rodriguez, 
Beau Smallwood, Miguel Serrano, 
Andres- Garley, Tim Hale, Ignacio

Lopez, Jared Shahan, Josh Crumley, 
Miguel Aguirre, Munchie Falcon, 
Demitrius Williams, and Nacho 
Aguirre as manager.

Del Rio
commiJnitv"RESOURCT^tN IF R

SU PPO R T  G RO UPS J O T  J H E  COMMUNITY

The following groups and special 
classes are FREE to the community 
and are provided by the Del Rio 
Com m unity Resourse Center. 
Should you need any more informa­
tion, please feel free to call us at

775-9282. We look forward to 
having you join us. All of these 
groups/special classes are confiden­
tial and members are expected to 
maintain this confidentiality. Thank 
You.

‘GENESIS - 9:30 a.m. to 11:00 a.m.
*F.A.M,E. - 6:30 p.m. to 8:00 p.m.
♦GENESIS - 6:30 p.m. to 8:00 p.m.
Narcotics Anonymous (NA) - 8:00 p.m. to 9:00 p.m.

Parent Support Group - 11:30 a.m. to 12:30 p.m.
Adult Aftercare - 5:10 p.m. to 6:05 p.m.
Children’s Aftercare - 6:20 p.m. to 7:05 p.m.

Generations - 6:00 p.m. to 7:00 p.m.
Teen Group - 7:00 o.m. to 8:00 p.m.
feen Aftercare - 6:00 p.m. to 7:00 p.m.
Narcotics Anonymous (NA) - 8:00 p.m. to 9:00 p.m.

THURSDAY ‘Quality of Life - 6:30 p.m. to 7:30 p.m.

♦ Denotes special Classes

MONDAY

TUESDAY

WEDNESDAY

CATCH SUMMER FEVER 
A T  

CECIL 
A TKISSI0N .*- V

SUMMER %

CLEARANCE

SALE!
199» BUICK LE SABRE

List...................................... *18,454.00
Pkg. Disc...............................*1,000.00
Dealer Disc........................... *1,709.00

Your Price *15,745.00

1990 BUICK CENTURY

"37 tt:: -Or;»

List....................................... *15,418.00
Pkg. Disc.....................   *750
Dealer Disc......... ................. *1.419.00

Your Price  ̂13, 249.00
SUMMERSAVINGS

*89 Buick* '89 Buick* 
Century Skylark

Buyer's Choice

$9,459
'89 Olds* 

Cierra
'89 Olds* 
Calais

*Plus Tax, Title & License

Cecil Atkission Motors
2630 E. Main »Uvalde • 278-4124

ji g T | j Keep Thai Great GM Feeling With Genuine GM Paris 
la f t i i l "The Dealer That Cares After The Sale"
P a rts

i
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Nueces Canyon 
News by Karen Collins

School Board Meeting
The Nueces Canyon School Board 

met in regular session on Tuesday, 
June 19th, in Mary B. Powers Hall 
on the NCHS campus in Barksdale. 
Board members present were Don 
Jackman, Steve Jechow, George 
Sweeten, Carl Walzel, L.A. Field, Sr. 
and Billy Boatright. Jerry Halsell was 
not in attendance.
Others at the meeting were school 

superintendent James Deatherage, 
Kenneth Perkins, Ruth Ward, Betty 
Connell, Stella Burkholder, Tommy 
Ferrell, Karen Collins, Laura and 
Steve Evans, Arvil, Betty, and Sidney 
Shipman, Jimmie May Baxter, Louis 
and Connie Webb, Debbie Cox, and 
Emma Dean.
After the meeting was called to 

order, and the invocation given by 
Carl Walzel, the audience was asked 
to participate in the open forum. No 
one in the audience had comments.
The minutes of the previous meeting 

were read, corrected, and approved. 
The superintendent reported that the 
cafeteria operations in the school had

lost $4500 during the last school year, 
and board members discussed ways 
to cut costs including talking to 
different suppliers, serving less pre­
pared foods, and reducing staff size. 
Cooking food in one cafeteria and 
transporting to the other was also 
discussed. Board members agreed 
not to make any major changes at 
this point, and to further study the 
situation.

Deatherage reported that the NC 
school would possible benefit financ­
ially from the school plan recently 
passed by the legislature, but that he 
would know more about this by the 
July Board meeting. Board members 
talked about the possibility of 
offering an insurance plan to school 
employees when the budget is set for 
next year. Deatherage reported that 
he planned to take his vacation right 
away and then attend the superin­
tendents conference in Austin, so 
would not be in the office until after 
the Fourth of July.
Board members went into executive

session at 6:55 with Deatherage, Ken 
Perkins, Ruth Ward, and Steve and 
Laura Evans invited to attend the 
session. The meeting was called to 
order again at 7:45 with board 
president Don Jackman reporting 
that the board had discussed the 
recent resignation of office employee 
Laura Evans and the employment of 
a band director. Deatherage agreed 
to set up a time for board members to 
interview a prospective band direct­
or.

Problems with Dramala Construct­
ion Company were then discussed 
with Deatherage reporting that he 
hoped everything would be resolved 
by Christmas, and that company 
representative seemed to be more 
cooperateve now than previously. 
Plans were submitted for new 
restrooms for the elemantary campus 
but board t members agreed to 
postpone this construction until 
Dramala completed their work.
The need for paving several areas at 

both campuses was discussed with

the superintendent agreeing to adver­
tise for bids for the job.

Board members voted to change the 
local policy on teacher absenteeism 
to allow employees to use two of the 
auxiliary five days sick leave for 
personal days with the employee 
paying the cost of a substitute for the 
days.

Deatherage requested the board to 
change his salary schedule to include 
his travel allowance in his salary, and 
they voted 5 to 1 in favor of this 
request.

Bills were paid and Boatright 
requested that space on the agenda 
for the next meeting be allowed for 
the consideration of extra pay for 
teachers who work with UIL academ­
ic activities. The possibility of a new 
teacher being needed because of the 
size of one of the elementary classes 
was mentioned, with Deatherage 
agreeing to check into this before the 
next meeting. The meeting was 
adjourned at 8:20 p.m.

P B U I H T I H G  IN  C E N T E R  R IN G -  
T H E  a R E R T E lT  SHOW ON E A R T H !'

FORT CLARK VIDEO 
PREMIER PARTV

» Ä T t «  JU LY  1 P LA C E : TOW N MALL T IM I :  7 :30PM

P O PCO R N * B U R *  P E A N U TS *  COKES 
FREE!

?THE GLO 
ROAD

l

VIDEOS AVAILABLE
EVSM fM B OF J U t r  1

COME JOIN THE CIRCUS!

NOTICE
DON’T FORGET TO ATTEND 

Kinney County Preservation Society 
Meeting. 7:00 P.M. Thursday June 
28th. County Courtroom.

AS MORAS INN
,[  •  RESTAURANT! . 
j  •Satiratiy* Juts 30* 5-Spro

»¿SOUTHERN STYir "
» 5 P  BUFFET 4

Kristi Collins 
Wins Tourney

Kristi Collins brought home the 
championship trophies from both the 
Cypress Days Invitational Tennis 
Tournament and the Hondo Tennis 
Association Tournament held on 
June I4th and 22nd, respectively.
Kristi drew a bi in the first round of 

the Sabinal tournament, then de­
feated Annette Nichols of Pecos 6-0, 
6-0 and Tanya Cornejo of 
Journdanton 6-0, 6-l to win the high 
school girls singles division of the 
tournament.

In Hondo the next weekend, Kristi 
won 6-0, 6-0 over Lianne Cubellis of 
San Antonio in the first round, then 
defeated Tanya Cornejo of Journ­
danton 6-0, 6-l in the second round. 
She was victorious over Jennifer 
Hubbard of New Braunsfels in the 
finals by a 6-0, 6-l score to win the 
girls 16 singles division of the 
tournament.

EMS Board of Directors
By JAMES O. GREER
CONTRIBUTING REPORTER

The EMS of the Nueces Canyon 
Board of Directors met for their 
regular monthly meeting on Monday, 
June 18, at the Firehouse Conference 
Room.
“ Bubba” West, president, presided 

over the meeting. The minutes of the 
previous meeting and financial report 
were given and approved as read.
The Bingo Committee said bingo 

was doing great since we have moved 
to the American Legion in downtown 
Camp Wood. The EMS recently 
purchased a lighted board and 
machine. We would like to take this 
opportunity to invite all of our 
friends from Leakey, Rocksprings, 
Uvalde and Brackettville to come and 
join us at 7:30 on Thursday nights.

We have two new board members. 
Earl Haggerton replaced Kathleen 
Womack, who resigned a few months 
back. Stella Burkholder turned in 
her letter of resignation on Monday 
night, and recommended that Beryl 
Mitchell be put on the board to 
replace her.
Beryl Mitchell was elected to the 
board of Directors, and also a new 
team member and Ambulance driver.
Beryl just recently finished the EMT 

course that was given here in Nueces 
Canyon.
Marion Roberts, who is also one of 

our ambulance drivers was promoted 
to a full time driver.

The Board of Directors voted to 
purchase two new pieces of equip­
ment needed on the ambulance. One 
piece of equipment is the Laeddal 
BVM and the other is a LSP 
Pediatric Immobilizer.

County Agent 
News

by Alian L. McWilliams________

As l am around town on clientele 
visits, I often notice mulberry leaf 
discoloration, single branches on 
other trees, and area damage on 
others. Typical leaf symptoms in­
clude yellowing in a mottled or 
irregular pattern, veins that are clear 
to translucent, some brown leaf 
margins and early defoliation of 
affected leaves. These leaf symptoms 
may have been present earlier in the 
growing season, but in relatively 
undetected areas of the tree. As limb 
and root growth have progressed this 
season, the problems have increased 
to the point of being obvious.

It is human nature to seek causes 
beyond the bounds of simply home- 
owner inattention when it comes to 
these type problems. Exotic fungus 
and “ new diseases” often get 
undeserved blame. Unfortunately, 
the majority of the tree problems 
seen each year are caused by 
incorrect use of herbicides. Many 
people are unaware that herbicides 
are weed killers and vice versa. Users 
mistakenly feel that weed killers 
remove only unwanted plants from 
yards and surrounding areas.

Tree root growth is poorly under­
stood by some. We often hear that 
the feeder roots of the tree may 
extend to the dripline. This is not 
entirely correct. The roots of a 
healthy tree will extend beyond the 
dripline. The leaf problems originate 
when weed killers are used within the 
root zone of a tree.
This year’s root zone has 

the potential of extending l-4 feet 
next year and encountering almost 
anything in the soil. This is why 
herbicides with soil residue action 
can cause trouble years after being 
applied. Herbicides make little or no 
distinction between broad leafed 
weeds and trees. Non-discriminatory 
weed killers are often called soil 
sterilants and apply to the following 
products: Borocil, Com Pleet, Triox, 
Pramitol, Hyvar, Velpar, Spike and 
Krovar. There are others and they are 
all excellent products-if they are 
used the way the label states. These 
herbicides all have a non-cropland 
label. They may or may not be 
labeled for other purposes. Now the 
labels of these herbicides may clearly 
state that the product may be used on 
driveways, brickwalks, along fences,

curbs and gutters and under gravel 
where no plant growth is desired. 
This is where future root growth does 
not get consideration.
Soil sterilants can be present in the 

soil for a long time. Tree and shrub 
problems have been associated with 
herbicides used in alleys, in asphalt 
paving, on asphalt streets, along 
curbs, along fences, along right of 
ways, near tanks and ponds, along 
highways, on gravel and on storage 
yards. There are hundreds of weed 
killers currently on the market. 
Homeowners, commercial applicat­
ors, city, county and state persons 
must read the product label, under­
stand potential problems and make 
applications at the correct rate. If 
you do not understand the label, 
always ask someone and do not apply 
anything that you do not understand.

“ The information given herein is 
for educational purposes only. Ref­
erence to commercial products or 
trade names is made with the 
understanding that no discriminat­
ion is intended and no endorsement 
by the Cooperative Extension Service 
is implied.”

Energy Assistance
AUSTIN- some low-income Texans 

may be eligible for help in paying 
cooling bills this summer through the 
Home Energy Assistance Program, 
according to Texas Department of 
Human Services Commissioner Ron 
Lindsey.

Lindsey said the one-time payment is 
available to many low-income house­
holds. Applications for energy 
assistance were mailed to households 
that received food stamps, Aid to 
Families with Dependent Children, 
or Supplemental Security income in 
May. If those house-holds have at 
least one member who will be 60 or 
older in 1990 or a member with a 
medical condition that is aggravated 
by heat, they may qualify for 
assistance. Other low-income indivi­
duals may request an application by 
calling the toll-free number 1-800- 
252-8060 during the enrollment 
period of June 25 through July 31.
Eligibility is limited by gross income 
and resources. Aid is available for 
one-person household having less

than $598.49 gross income per 
month. The gross income limits are 
$802.49 for households of two 
persons, $1,006.49 for three, 
$1,210.49 for four, $1,414.49 for 
five, and $1,618.49 for six.
Households are eligible if the cost 

for cooling is included in the rent 
payment of if the household pays a 
portion of its home energy costs.

Energy assistance checks are sent 
directly to the people who are eligible 
for assistance. However, the checks 
are made payable to the energy 
company.

Persons receiving one of these 
energy assistance checks should mail 
it or take it in person to the energy 
company business office with their 
regular energy bill. The check can be 
cashed only by the energy company. 
If the HEAP check is more than the 
energy bill, the additional amount 
will be credited to the person’s 
account for the next month’s bill. If 
the energy bill is higher than the 
check, the person is responsibe for 
paying the difference.

TA MEMBER

TEXAS PR ESS  
ASSOCIATION

Summer Camp
Members of the Panther Band Flag 

Corps are busy preparing for summer 
camp which will be held in San 
Angelo the week of July 15th.
The flag corps next year will be led 

by captains Bambi Renfro and 
Carolyn Hodge. Others in the group 
are Janie Aguero, Carie Fontenot, 
Toby W inston, Shelly W atters, 
Sandy Raborn, Chanda Walzel, 
Shonda Davis, Michelle San Miguel, 
Donna Welfring, and Elsie Nevarez.

Drum major for the Panther Band 
next year will be Elaine Valenzuela, 
and she will also be attending camp 
in San Angelo in July.

W elcom e
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James O. Greer

t  —
) HAPPY

H  Ni
Vm

(5 1 2 / 5 6 3 -2 5 8 0
• O X  5 2 « ,  I Ä A C K FTTVU.IE. TECAS 7 M 3 Î

f i r *  E N J O Y  
a  4 th  O F  J U L Y , ,  
H A T  H 

A L A M O  w 
"  V I L L A G E

8 Shows every  day Open 9A M

BORDER FEDERAL 
CREDIT UNION S

SUMMER CAR LOAN RACE IS ON!

WIN GREA T PR ÏZES 
•  SAVE WITH LOWER RATES

•  REFINANCE AND LOWER 
YOUR MONTHLY CAR PAYMENTS
•  FREE NIGHT ON THE TOWN!!!!

CALL US AT 1-800-580-3503
OR 774-3503
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Your Home For Quality Furniture And Floorcovering
EDWARDS FURNITURE

PROUDLY ANNOUNCES FOR YOUR SAVINGS AND PLEASURE
Ju ly  4  FREEDOM OF CHOICE

ALL-AMERICAN HOME SALE
DOORS OPEN 8 A .M . THURSDAY /  \  /  \  CLOSED ON

JUNE 28 ^  FOURTH OF JULY
Freedom  Means H aving A Choice A n d  A t E D W A R D S  You Do Have A C hoicei. 
Save hundreds, even thousands of dollars on quality home furnishings & floorcoverings during this 

special Pre-market Markdown Sale. It's for a limited time & limited to stock. So Hurry! Hurry!
Choose these and more at the store!!!

fioice Living Rm.
Pick Style, Color Seme lour Pricq

Any Sofa l  Chair *799* i *  

Any Sofa A loveseat *899”

Reg

r*999«

-Z -B o y  S le e p e rs ^ V jf

Terr Choice

59995
|AR With firm, Com forteti»,

inner spring *  offrisses

Bedroom Suites 
Your Choice

>  DRESSER, MIRROR,

%  CHEST, HEADBOARD

L+ I¡Perfect For The Kids. Guest l 
Fi Room Or Any Bedroom

Other Sleepersg. Values I« *1,29'

r ^ V  \ .
<*/Table Lamps*

$49995. *39995

' ( A l l  Wood, B ra ss or G las-'*
£*-• V

Coffee and
Lamp Tables .

A ll Lacquer, Wood, \  y LIATDLUo

V *39« y-Rrass and Glass Styles 
*6!

Others
.Even Less

$4995

DAYBEDS or BUNKBEDS
Your Choice 

Complete With Beddinq

$29995s
White With Brass 

Upper and Lower Units
Two Innerspring Mattresses D l  I A I I / r » r - r » «

All Assembled and Delivered dUNKBEDS
FREE OF CHARGE Solid Wood, Separates Into 

At Edwards You Twin Beds With Ladder
Get Full Service and two mattresses

Fishing
Report

AMISTAD—Water clear, 83 de­
grees, 24 feet low; black bass are 
fairly good to 8 pounds on spinners 
and Zara Spooks, purple worms are 
good late in the day; striper are good 
with several limits to 20 pounds each 
on 2 ounce green and white Banana- 
head jigs or live bait; crappie are 
slow; white bass are slow; catfish are 
good with limits, some in shallow 
early; larger fish are caught in 20 feet 
of water on shrimp and cheese 
stinkbait. Most fishermen are going 
out early and late, few fishermen out 
on lake during the middle of the day.

Your Choice of ' Sectionals
g % All In Stock In Uvalde!

r. - N Y o u r  Choice 01 Styles In 
Rechners • Indiners • Chaise 

<7 Lounges • Comer Tables
$7QQ95

To $2.295 How From 1 3 3

"All-American" Bedding Buys

i ' - s

V  " V  f  SWIVEL-ROCK-RECLINEl j! '5 S> - lour Choie*
Over 40 Chairs To Choose From 

Rediners s j ggas 
-  wall Rechners s29995 

Rocker Rechner s34995
J a-t Bor. Benchc!lnNi,on *„h m!?.4995

CJ.. dining suites

I A \-ir~
i ! -

Live The A m e r ic a n  Dream By Sleeping On Quality 
Mattresses Such As SPRING AIR. March Right 

in  Today And Choose For Yoarself.

Twin Set * 1 4 9 95 Queen Set J2 4 9 95 
Full Set s1 9  9 95 King Set s3 4 9 95

(B e h in d  P o s t O ffic e I

115 S. W est St.

T O  S A V E  , Your Choice
■ ’ • .‘/TV  ' 3' Pc- Table & 2 Chairs S1 9 9 95

5-Pc. Table & 4 Chairs s2 6 9 95 
Or Choose From S v e n Tatl,e & 6 Chairs S3 4 9 95 ,

________________ Ohur Sets To Choose F ro T v* T  ?S U “ 'e5 ^  Sol"‘ -Wm'1 i---------- — From. Variety oi s tyles onO Sires. |

EDWARDS FURNITURE
Furnishing Your Home With Happiness

EASY CREDIT FREE DELIVERY
278-5694

aji num  Sutmci 
To Pncr 5j * 

mo i mu me to S a o
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Grandma’s 
Kitchen

By Grandma

My, my, 1 can’t believe July 4th is 
here again, where did last year go to? 
Did you know this is our 214th year 
ot freedom, so Happy Independence 
Day to everyone! I hope each one of 
us will take a minute from our 
regular busy routine and thank God 
lor letting us be born in America.
To be free seems so commonplace 

to us that we tend to take it for 
granted. We go to church on 
Sundays, sit on padded seats in a 
temperature-controlled atmosphere 
pleasantly decorated with flowers. 
We are warm enough in winter and 
delightfully cool in summer, and yet 
we have the gall to complain.

Cucumbers are plentiful, I hope 
you’ll get enough to make some of 
these. We spent 2 months visiting my 
cousin, and as we pulled away, she 
handed me a jar of her homemade 
pickles. I can’t begin to tell you how 
good they were and what a sweet 
thing for her to do. These are 
delightfully crisp and will keep a year 
in the refrigerator. With this recipe 
you can add cucumbers at anytime. 
Just lift out what are already in the 
container and put fresh slices in the 
bottom. You then return the pickles 
that are ready to use back on top.

Mom’s Refrigerator Pickles 
3 quarts sliced cucumbers 

2 large onions-sliced 
2 green peppers-sliced 

1 tea celery seed 
Vi cup salt 

2 cups white vinegar 
3 cups sugar

Mix all ingredients together and let 
stand in glass container, covered. 
These pickles are ready to eat in one 
day. Then refrigerate in smaller jars 
and enjoy them all summer.
Here’s a good recipe to have for the 

Fourth of July, don’t let the name 
scare you off. It makes a meal in 
itself and is not too highly spiced for 
some.

Taco Burgers 
1 pound ground beef 

1 cup canned tomatoes with juice 
1 tea chili powder 

1 tea Worcestershire sauce 
1 tea prepared mustard 

Zi tea sugar 
!4 tea garlic salt 

8 hamburger buns-split 
Vi head of lettuce, finely shredded 

1 cup grated cheese (chedder is best) 
In skillet, cook meat until brown, 

drain off excess fat. Add undrained 
tomatoes, chili powder, worcester-

Beyond The 
Horizon

Bv Dorthy Payne

Kit Carson was an illiterate mount­
ain man and trapper and became a 
legend in his own time as a Western 
Guide.

Carson was born in Kentucky on 
December 24, 1809. He grew up in a 
stockade home in Mississippi where 
the ever threat of Indian attacks was 
a way of life.

In 1811 Carson took the famous 
guide Thomas Fitzpatrick as a 
pardner in a trapping venture to the 
north. For over over a decade, 
Carson was a trapper in the Rocky 
Mountains. There he met Jim 
Bridger, fought Indians and other 
elements and married an Arapho 
woman who bore him a daughter. In 
1824 Kit Carson met John Charles 
Fremont, “ The Pathfinder” , who 
took him as a guide on his first two 
expeditions'.

When the Mexican War began, 
Carson served in the Army in

California. He guided Kearny’s 
Cavalry from New Mexico to

California, and fought in the Battle 
of San Pasual.

He was sent to Washington with 
dispatches in the summer of 1847. 
there he was well received because of 
his association with Fremont an 
manner of dress. He returned to 
Taos, New Mexico where he was 
appointed Indian Agent in 1853.

When the Civil War started he was 
given a commission with orders to 
suppress the Apaches and Navajos in 
that area. He was sent to Texas and 
at Adohe Wells, Carson held off an 
attack of four thousand hostile 
Indians with only four hundred men 
and two cannons, which made him 
famous in Texas.
Only in the last years of his live, 

while serving in several military 
posts, did he finally learn how to 
read and write.

Grapevine
by Gus Gaïcia

The first days of summer, looks like 
ts gonna be a loooong one! The 
nercury has already hit the century 
nark.
If you didn’t go to Arabela Abrego 

^uinceanera, you missed some good 
nusic and fun. Arabela had her 
debut last Saturday, I really enjoyed 
it.

Mr. and Mrs. Richard Jaso are 
content and happy now, they just 
tied the knot last weekend also. 
Beautiful wedding, just beautiful.
Does anyone know a Beatriz Reyes? 

No, Yes, Well anyway, she’s home 
until July 8th, then she’ll be off to 
fabulous Frankfurt Germany with 
the Army. Good Luck Beatriz!!!

After all that I said last week, I still 
see some places with the water on full 
blast at the hottest time of the day! 
Now, do 1 have to name names or 
can I get them to just conserve water 
and start being wise. Don’t they 
know that the aquifer is the lowest 
level ever right now? Can’t they get it 
through their thick skulls!!!

ENOUGH OF THAT,
Now for the brighter side. I do see 

some people starting to conserve 
water, and use biodegradable pro­
ducts. Thaks guys, Mother Earth 
and 1 appreciate you.

Didja ever notice how tacky some 
people can be when asked a simple 
n n p ctin n ?

I was hoping not to bring this up, 
but since it has happened to me 
several times and to other people, I 
figure that it is time for a change.

When walking into a “ respectable” 
business, I discovered many products 
whose packages had been opened. 
When I asked the person in charge

what would be done about it, I was 
answered rudely and offensively. The 
individual suggested that if I thought 
something should be done about it, I 
could do it myself.

Was I doing something wrong? 
After all, curiosity killed the cat... 
maybe I shouldn’t have asked how or 
who opened the packages. However,

as a consumer I figure I have the 
right to know if giant rats are lurking 
around opening packages, or grem­
lins for that matter. I Want To 
Know!!!!

Anyway, It really doesn’t bother 
me, it’s just that when a salesperson, 
who is supposed to be representing 
the establishment, upsets a person or 
just downright insults them, that’s 
when I get steamed. I wish there 
really was a super hero that could 
stop all that kind of bologna, then 
the world would be a better place.
Well folks, see you later, like next 

week.

Answers to  SuperCrossword

shire sauce, mustard, sugar, and 
garlic salt to meat. Reduce heat and 
simmer uncovered about 10 minutes, 
stirring occasionally. To serve spoon 
m ea t m ix tu re

shire sauce, mustard, sugar and 
garlic salt to meat. Reduce heat and 
simmer uncovered about 10 minutes, 
stirring occasionally. To serve- 
spoon meat mixture on to split buns 
and top with shredded lettuce and 
cheese. Makes 8 sandwiches, they’re 
really good when served with french 
fries.
Have you ever tried any rhubarb 

recipes? There’s some that love it, 
and some that don’t, but I certainly 
want to please all I can, so let’s cover 
that base.

Rhubarb Cobbler 
5 cups chopped rhubarb 

1 ‘/2 cups brown sugar 
plain flour 

Z) cups sugar 
Zt tea salt

1 Zi tea baking powder 
Zi cup fnargarine-melted 

Zi cup milk
Toss rhubarb with brown sugar and 

3 TBS flour and put in a one-quart 
casserole. Combine one cup flour, 
sugar, baking powder and salt in a

bowl. Mix together margarine ana 
milk and stir into flour mixture with 
a fork, just enough to moisten all

ingredients. Spoon evenly over rhu­
barb and bake in a preheated 350 
degree oven for about 35 minutes. 
Serves 4 or 5.
Now if you’re having company and 

need a little different dip to go with 
the chips or snack crackers this 
weekend, this one fills the bill.

Chip Dip 
2 eggs

2 TBS sugar 
3 TBS Vinegar 

1 8 oz. cream cheese softened
Finely chopped celery, green pep­

per, and onion to taste. Cook eggs, 
sugar, vinegar and salt over moderate 
heat in a heavy saucepan until thjck. 
Pour mixture into bowl, add soft­
ened cream cheese, blend until 
smooth. Add prepared vegetables 
and set in refrigerator overnight to 
blend flavors. Stir will before 
serving.
Thought for the week: Historians 

tell us the past: economists tell us the 
future, only the present is beyond 
human understanding.

Special Hugs and Love 
Grandma—

Brackett Ladies Excell

Beatriz Reyes
By GUS GARCIA
STAFF REPORTER 

51-K Plumbing Engineer, Beatriz 
Reyes is in town until July 8. Beartriz 
just returned from basic training at 
Ft. Dix in New Jersey and A.I.T. in 
Ft. Leonard Wood, Missouri.

While at basic, Reyes won Certific­
ates of Achievements in Leadership 
and course and camp completion. 
When asked why she entered the 
plumbing field, she stated, “ It was 
something different, I wanted some­
thing that would challenge me.” She 
also added, ‘I didn’t know all the 
different kinds of wrenches there 
were in the world.”  ”
Beatriz was the only female in her 

class, making things a bit tougher, 
but she held together and made it 
through. “ When I saw all the tools, I 
remembered when I helped my dad, 
making me wish that I would have 
paid attention when I helped.” To 
complete the course, Beatriz has to 
help set up a pipeline from a 
watertower, and check for leaks.

Beatriz will leave on July 8, for 
Frankfurt, Germany, where she will 
be stationed for 2 years. Good Luck 
Beatriz!

Sara Morse
Sara Morse of Brackettville was 

honored with four merit and achieve­
ment awards at the 1990 awards 
presentation ceremony for ROTC 
students attending colleges and uni­
versities in the U.S. Army Third 
ROTC Region, held April 27 at 
Assembly Hall University of Texas at 
Arlington.

Sara was presented the following 
awards:
Military order of the World Wars 

ROTC Merit Award “ In recognition 
of outstanding achievement in mili­
tary and scholastic studies while 
demonstrating, through individual 
endeavor and enthusiastic partici­
pation in the ROTC program, 
patriotism and desire to serve.”
The Lanny Bassham Trophy (silver) 

“ For exceptionally distinguished 
involvement in myriad and signifi-

cant academic, athletic, social, 
organizational, ceremonial and pro­
motional activities manifesting a 
degree of dedication, spirit, leader­
ship and consistancy that favorably 
enhance a positive image of ROTC 
program throughout the community.

U.S. Army Infantry School, FT 
Benning, GA. a) 50 mile club 
(certificate, with patch) for running 
50 miles during a limited period.
100 mile club (certificate, with patch) 
for running 100 miles during a 
limited period.

Sara represented her ROTC 
command in completing her fresh­
man curriculum at UT Arlington as 
an ROTC Dedicated Nursing 
scholar.
Sara is currently attending summer 

university classes in Political Science 
and Nutrition while awaiting the fall 
semester program.

The first meeting for the readers 
group of the summer reading pro­
gram met Wednesday, June 20, 1990.
We had fourteen young people and 

they heard two stories, spent time 
reviewing the library rules, and 
discussing mysteries. They were sent 
home with two secret coded messages 
for the next meeting. The read-to-me 
group meets Wednesday, June 27, at 
3:00 p.m. Parents, get your young 
children together and come to the 
Library Wednesday at 3:00 p.m. We 

-are going to have fun together.
We want to remind all you readers 

out there to come by and see the new 
books we’ve gotten in. Also, go 
through those video movies you have 
at home and are tired of and donate 
those to your County Library. We 
can provide some free entertainment 
for many, many citizens of our 
county. Your donations to the 
Library are tax deductible.

V -

Quality Craftsmanship 
at Reasonable Prices!

M

FREE ESTIMATES 
FREE ROOF Inspections

Roofing & 
Remodeling

563-2192 J
RAILWAY FEEDS

H o rn  Shaap 
Catti» Goats
Hog Chicken

ALFALFA &  
COASTAL HAY

BABY CHICKS 
All Year

DOG &  CAT FOOD 
& Health Care 

Products

.7744706

FARM PRODUCTS
COMPLETE UNE OF FEED •  SEED 

SUPPLIES & FERTILIZER 
VETERINARIAN SUPPLIES

Marvin Graham 
Manager

0

Del Rio 101 N. Main

Geld Star Exterminators’
109 B A U E R  A V E N U E  • D E L  R IO , T E X A S  70840 <*

Are those pesty little ants driving you 
buggy? Lei Gold Star Exterminators 

help solve your problem.

• L awn & Tree spraying »Termite Treatment 
•Lawn Fertilizing «Residential & Commer. Pest C ontrol,

•Ants, Fleas, Ticks, Rogches

Ask about our route discount for  
Brackettville and Ft. Clark 775-6477<

FREE CHECK-UP FOR 
AUTO. HOME & UFE

A new baby? A new car? A new addition to the 
house? Time to make certain your insurance is up to date 
with a Farmers Friendly Review

It checks out ways to save you money For example, 
you may earn a discount il both your auto and home in 
surance are insured with us

Check in tor a check up today

PRATT INSURANCE ASENCY 
2116 Awenue F 

775-5183
I Aim ru « Jit <li |K ml um I Jfnit

Carefree Fourth

Speaking of donations, we wish to 
extend a public “Thank You” to Mr. 
J. T. “ Happy” Shahan for his very 
generous donation of $500 to the 
Library for desperately needed 
shelves.
Also to Mr. & Mrs. Francis Larson 

for the donation of a new mystery 
fiction for our Library.

If we continue to work cooper­
atively, we can have the best stocked 
Library for a community/county of 
this size. We definitely need it as our 
Library is used by a very large 
portion of the population, for our 
size, we are a very busy Library. 
Don’t believe it? ome to the Library, 
you’ll see many of your friends. We 
are nearly as busy as the Post Office 
around 10:00 a.m.

We’re still the coolest and friend­
liest place in town. Come see us!
The Library staff and volunteers.

AUSTIN—Ah, a check tablecloth, 
some cold chicken, a French cheese, 
a crisp pear, a cold bottle of...Now 
wait a minute. That sounds like a 
piquenique not a picnic and certainly 
not a Fourth of July picnic. A Fourth 
of July picnic means burgers, 
watermelons, peaches, potato salad, 
barbecue, beans, fried chicken, ribs, 
chips, dips, salsa, carrot sticks, 
pickles, onions, chow-chow-whew; 
you get the drift. It means food, the 
real thing, and, afterwards, fire­
works, the biggest fun night of the 
whole summer.

But be careful...Yes, even on the 
Fourth of July there’s something to 
worry about. That something is food 
poisoning. Food poisoning is more 
common when the weather is hot, 
and unless it rains all day, it’s bound 
to be hot on July 4 in Texas. Here are 
a few cool suggestions from Texas 
Department of Agriculture home 
economist Carol Guthrie to make 
your holiday healthy as well as a lot 
of fun.

1. Plan ahead. The night before the 
picnic pack non-perishables—plates, 
napkins, utensils, tortilla chips. Take 
enough plates and utensils to ensure 
that any used for raw meat or poultry 
will not be reused. Salmonella 
spreads easily from raw to cooked 
food. Set out a jug of water, soap 
and paper towels to wash hands and 
clean up spills.

2. Include “ problem-free” foods in 
the menu. Summer is the time for 
peaches, home-grown tomatoes, wat­
ermelons, cantaloupes and other 
fresh produce. Check out the local 
farmers market for the freshest fruits 
and vegetables. Until vou cut into a

melon, you don’t have to worry 
about it spoiling.

3. Make sure you have a well 
insulated cooler. The day of the 
picnic, pack it with items that must 
stay cold—drinks and such perish­
ables as potato salad, hamburger 
patties, cooked meat, deviled eggs 
and the like. You’ll need plenty of 
ice. Pre-chilled beverage bottles will 
also help keep food cold. Wrap food 
containers tightly, and put raw 
perishables into plastic bags. Make 
sure the cooler lid closes tightly. At 
the picnic site keep the cooler in the 
shade.
4. If you’re grilling meat or poultry, 

be sure to cook it thoroughly to 
destroy any organisms that might 
cause illness.

5. Don’t let cooked food sit around 
too long. Bacteria grow between 40 
and 140 degrees F. When foods are 
left out for more than two hours at 
these temperatures, bacteria grow 
rapidly. Milk products, eggs and 
seafood should remain on ice until 
you’re ready to use them.
Surprise. The U.S. Department of 

Agriculture says that, contrary to 
what most people think, mayonaise 
does not increase the risk of food 
poisoning. Most commercial mayon- 
aises and salad dressings contain 
lemon juice or other acid flavoring, 
which slows bacterial growth. Salt in 
mayonaise also retards bacterial 
growth. A little mayonaise in food, 
therefore, actually decreases chances 
for food poisoning slightly, says 
USDA. That’s no excuese, however, 
to leave dishes containing mayonaise 
out in the heat. The best rule of 
thumb-keep them on ice.
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Wanted

Used Band Instruments

Brackett Independent School 
District is interested in purchasing 
used band instruments of all types. 
Instruments do not have to be in 
working order, but they do have to 
be repairable. If there are people in 
the area who have old instruments 
they would like to sell or donate (tax 
deductible), please contact:

Mr. Don Sims, High School 
Principal

Miss Lynette Crane, Band Director 
Telephone: 512/563-2491 

You may also come by the high 
school office between 7:00 a.m. and 
4:30 p.m. Monday through Thursday

Notice To All Brackeltville Citizens

The Brackettville Water Dept, 
failed to collect 1 of 2 satisfactory 
samples during the month ol May 
1990, as required by the Texas Dept, 
of Health “ Drinking Water Stand­
ards” and the “ Safe drinking Water 
Act” Public Law 93-523. Bacterio­
logical samples monitor water quality 
and indicate if water is bacteriologic- 
ally acceptable for drinking.
The notification is in compliance 

with the Tex. Dept, of Health 
Drinking Water Standards and the 
Safe Drinking Water Act Public 
93-523 as a means of keeping the 
public informed. 2 of 2 June 1990 
samples were submitted and prope 
in all respects.

Utility Superintendent

O’ROURKF. REALTY 
563-2713 

FOR RFNT
1 bed efficiency townhouse. $160 ( 

'per month.

2 bedroom 2 bath townhouse ( 
.unfurnished. $300 per month.

2 bedroom 2 bath mobile home, 
partially furnished.

FORSALE
f Doublewide mobil home. Unit 15, 4 
¿bedrooms 3 baths. O’Rourke Realty.
n56 3-271 L

t

1

OPEN HOUSE

For Sale Hi $60’s 
New 2 bedroom 2 bath

} Built by Elquezabal Construction 
of Eagle Pass, Tx.

Saturday Coffee and Donuts 
10 AM to 7 PM

Sunday Bar-B-Que 
10 AM to 7 PM

Unit 31 on Bowlegs St. on 
Fort Clark.

nj$j|

Georgia and Kenneth Logue

You’ll Be Missed!

Job Announcement

The Middle Rio Grande Develop­
ment Council is looking for qualified 
applicants interested in the position 
of Planner/Job Developer. The 
preferred requirements for this posit­
ion are that: (1) the person be a 
graduate from an accredited college 
or university with a degree in

Business Administration, Public Ad­
ministration, Economics Political 
Science or other related field and (2) 
that the person have two years 
experience in financial packaging or 
analysis, grant preparation, and job 
development administration or relat­
ed activities. The position requires 
traveling within and outside the 
region and will office at the MRGDC 
Uvalde Planning office. All qualified

persons interested in applying for this 
position should mail resume or

position should mail resume or 
application to Middle Rio Grand 
Development Council, P.O. Box 
1199, 403 E. Nopal, Carrizo Springs, 
Texas 78834, attention Ramon S. 
Johnston, Deputy/Director. Applic­
ations will be accepted until 5:00 
P.M., Friday, July 13, 1990. Salary 
will commensurate with exper­
ience. 2640.

FRANK GOMEZ 
CONSTRUCTION COMPANY

Painting Fencing & Roofing
Free Estimates 

Comer Gove & Spring Phone 563-2794

Video filmcrew, Karel Davis and 
Michelle McKenzie, filming the 
nature area.

Fort Clark Video
By EASHAWN WARDEAW

Presenting in center ring Sunday, 
July 1, 7:30 pm at the Fort Clark 
Springs Town Hall will be the 
premier party for the Fort Clark 
Springs Video. For years many 
people have been requesting a 
professional video to be produced 
about Fort Clark. It has been 
completed and is ready for viewing.

April 6 and 7, Fort Clark was a 
happening place. People showed up 
from everywhere to participate as 
“ actors and actresses” fbr the film. 
Women were swimming-and the sun 
wasn’t even out (dedication!). Bird­
watching galore. Horseback riding, 
golfing, tennis and all the other 
activities a person could enjoy were

occurring. The RV Park, homes, 
restaurant and anything else to do 
with the Fort were also included. 
This is definitely a show you don’t 
want to miss!

All members and members’ guests 
of the Fort Clark Springs Association 
are invited to come to enjoy the 
video. Popcorn, peanuts and all the 
circus goodies will be on hand. It’s a 
free night of fantastic fun!
Videos will be available for $10.00, 

two for $20.00 and three for $25.00. 
Door prizes will be given away. Join 
us in celebrating this great visual aid 
which benefits Fort Clark and the 
area. Absolutely the greatest show on 
Earth.

Community
Calender
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Rotary Club: Every Thursday 12:00 
p.m.
Bass Club: Every last Thursday 

7:00p.m.
Chamber of Commerce: Every 1st 

Thursday 7:00p.m.
Drivers License: Every 1st, 3rd, and 

5th Friday 9:00a.m. to 4:00p.m. 
Duplicate Bridge: Every Sunday 

1:30p.m. and Every Tuesday 
Masonic Lodge: Every 2nd Tuesday 

7:00p.m.
VFW and Ladies>Aux. (Ft. Clark):

Every 4th Wednesday 7:00p.m.

BY DORTHY PAYNE
STAFF REPORTER

Six and a half years ago, Kenneth 
and Georgia Logue retired to Ft. 
Clark Springs and bought a house on 
the Golf Course Road. Kenneth has 
worked in the Maintenance Depart­
ment on both golf courses on the 
Fort.
Georgia was retired from Texas Tech 
where she was a registered nurse.

Kenneth holds four Volunteer Certi 
ficates from the Governor’s office ii 
Austin. He will be missed at the 
Nutrition Center for his cheerful 
assistance.

While here the Logues made many 
friends they hate to leave, buy they 
plan on coming back to visit. They
will make their home in Lubbock and 
plan to see the country in their travel 
trailer.

Masonic Lodge 
Installation

The Las Moras Masonic Lodge will 
hold an open meeting in the Masonic 
Lodge Room for the purpose of 
installing the newly elected and 
appointed officers for the year 1990, 
at 10:00 A.M. on Saturday, June 30, 
1990. The Installing Officer will be 
Past Master James F. Harber, and 
the Installing Marshall will be Past 
Master, Past D.D.G.M. Ray Kurtz. 
The Officers-elect to be installed 

are: R.W. Schafer, Worshipful Mast­
er; R.C. Ward, Jr., Sr. Warden;

CALL US AT 563-2852

Terrific Teen Theater Thespians
will present

a musical melodrama directed by Betty Inman
“Virtue Is Its’ Own Reward” 

or
“All That Glitters May Be Gold”
parts for 5 women and 2 men 

tryouts
July 5 at Town Hall 

July 6 at Amphitheater 
Fort Clark Springs

Church Directory
Frontier
Baptist
News

“L E A R N  TO 
E A R N ”

SAN ANTONIO 
TRADE 8CHOOL - 
DEL RIO BRANCH
•SECRETARIAL SKIII-S 
WORD PROCESSING. 
DATA ENTRY 

•AIR CONMDITIONING 
A REFRIGERATION 

•ELECTRICAL 
• WELDING

FINANCIAL AID AVAILABLE 
IF QUALIFIED

774-5646
HT W MARTIN'

r
775-6557 j

Tues. — S«t. 10 -5  p.m. =

[New Merchandised 
| in from LA Mart, |
j One Of A Kind \
I 519 Bedell [ j Del Rio, TX (

)-«■»-( ><W*( >•«■►< >•«■►11

Tickets
See you at the raffle of the Monte

OVERHEAD DOOR COMPANY
OF DEL RIO

Carlo on July 4th, at the City Park at 
twelve o’clock noon. Come and eat Ken Schilling
some Bar-B-Que. Tickets will be sold 
until twelve o’clock noon. Good 7 7 5 -7 2 4 2
Luck!! !$$$ 105 Kings Way
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•AA: Every Monday 8:00p.m. 
AlAnon: Every Monday 8:00p.m. 
Commissioners Court: Every 2nd 

Monday 9:00a.m.
Shriners: Every 4th Tuesday 

6:30p.m.

Lions Club: Every 1st and 3rd 
Thursday 6:30p.m.
Kinney County Kickers: Every 2nd 

and 4th Thursday 7:30p.m.

Southwest Texas Genealogical 
Society: 10:00 A.M. to 12:00 noon 
on Saturday, June 2

i
3LSU

SUNDAY
9:45 A.M. Bible Study for All 
11:00 A.M. “The Happy Hour’

5:00 P.M. Youth Meeting 
7:00 P.M. “Prayer Surprises” 

Welcome
First Baptist Church
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Happy Birthday

L.M. Mahefky, Jr. Warden; A.B. 
Clements, Secretary; Joe York, Jr., 
Treasurer; R.A. Mountain, Chap­
lain; J.R . Haga, Tiler; J.C . 
Foreman, Sr. Deacon; W .H. 
Outlaw, Jr. Deacon; D.E. Woodson, 
Sr. Steward; and L.C. Schafer, Jr. 
Steward.

Refreshments will be served follow­
ing the installation. All Members, 
Visitors, and their Ladies are invited. 
A.B. Clements 
Secretary

Ernest Hall 
Inez Hutchenson 
Mabel Parham 
Dolores Raney 
Jane Custard 
Zack Davis 
Jackie Truesdell 
Sonny Crowell 
Lonnie Barrett 
Roy Max Hensley

June 29 
July 2 
July 3 

June ¡28 
July 3 
July 3 
July 4 
July 4 
July 5 
July 5

l i ;h o If f VS

Ruben J ames Talamantez July 1

FAXIT
‘mm

COUNTY 
HAND CO

(512) 563-2446 
(512) 563-2447 
P.O. Box 1035 
Brackeltville, Tx 78832 Excellent Condition-2 bedrm 2 bth , 

mobile home next to green belt on Ft. 
Clark. Central air and heat,screened 
porch, double door refrig, dishwash­
er, good stove. Only $22,500.00 
with membership.

Lovely 3 bedrm, 3 bath home in 
North Brackett. Huge den with 

^ fireplace and wet bar. Guest house, 
' landscaped yd. Open to offer

,T

+ landscaped yd. Open to otter.

St. Andrews Episcopal Church-
Henderson & Fort, Sunday Church 
Service 10:30 A.M.. Vicar; Rev. Bill 
Koons - 563-2071

St. John Baptist Church-West
Crockett St., Sunday School 10:00 
A.M., Sunday morning worship 
11:00 A.M., Wed. prayer & Bible 
study 7:00 P.M. - Rev. Walter A. 
Johnson, Pastor 563-9551.

Frontier Baptis Church (A Southern 
Baptist Church)-Sunday Morning 
Worship 11:00 P.M., Sunday Even­
ing service 6:00 P.M .. Joe
Townsend, Pastor 563-2158.

First Baptist Church (A Southern 
Baptist Church)-307 N. Ann Street. 
Sunday School 9:45 A.M., Worship 
service (Sun) 11:00 A.M. and 7:00 
P.M., Worship Service (Wed) 7:00 
P.M. Rev. Preston A. Taylor 
563-2245.

Church of Christ-Sunday School 
9:30 A.M., Worship Service 10:30 
A.M., Bible Study (Sun) 6:30 P.M., 
Bible Study (Wed) 7:00 P.M. 
Community Church—Corner of El 
Paso and Grove Streets. Sunday, 
Praise and Worship Service 10:45 
a.m., Wednesday, Prayer Service 
7:00 p.m., Charles Belknap, Pastor.

St. Mary Magdalene Catholic 
Church-Masses Mon. and Fri. 7:00 
A.M., WED. AND Sat. 6:30 P.M., 
Sun. (Spanish) 8:00 A.M., reg. 10:30 
\.M ., Confessions Wed. and Sat. 

6:00 P.M., Religion Classes Wed 
7:00 P.M., Religion Classes Sun. 
9:15 A.M., Praver Meeting (Spanish) 
Wed. 7:00 P.M. Father David G. 
Zumaya, Pastor.

First United Methodist Church 
“ Celebrate and Witness” -Morning 
Fellowship 9:30 A .m., Church 
School Classes 9:45 A.M., Service of 
Worship 11:00 A.M., Choir Re­
hearsal Wed. 5:00 P.M. Rev. J. 
Roland Cole, Pastor 563-2823 or 
563-2376.

Frontier Baptist Church will have 
the regular monthly Fellowship 
Luncheon Sunday. At the close of 
the Morning Worship will be observ­
ance of the Lord’s Supper. The 
Fellowship Luncheon will follow.

In the early church in the New 
Testament times the church observed 
what they called the Agape as Love 
Feast. They all brought food and ate 
together then observed the Lord’s 
Supper. The Fellowship Luncheon at 
Frontier Baptist Church this week 
will take the form of a picnic lunch.

Everyone is invited to come worship 
at Frontier Baptist and enjoy the 
“ Agape.” Joe R. Townsend is 
pastor.

Rev. David Zumaya

Zumaya Celebrates Thirteenth
BY DORTHY PAYNE
STAFF REPORTER

Rev. David Zumaya, pastor of Saint 
Mary Magdalene Catholic Church in 
Brackettville celebrated his thirteenth 
anniversary at the ten thirty mass on 
the twenty-fourth of June, 1990.
The English choir from Sacred Heart 
Church in Uvalde sang the mass.

Rev. Zumaya was ordained June 
twenty-fourth 1977 at San Francisco 
de Asis Catholic Church in Guadala 
jara, Mexico.

Victor Sanchez and Gilbert Villar­
real Jr. received the Grand Cross of 
the Knights of the Altar. The Grand

Cross is given to the members of th 
Knights of the Altar who hav 
completed three years of Service an< 
are in the ninth grade. Grandparent 
Antonio and Della Sanchez presentei 
the Cross and Sash to Victor on th 
Altar.
Parents Gilbert and Maria Villarrea 

presented the Grand Cross and Sasl 
to their son Gilbert.

Guests were present from Rev 
David’s former parishes and Rev 
Walter Johnson and family were alsc 
present to help celebrate Rev 
David’s Anniversary.
Rev. Zumaya will leave Wednesda; 

tor a tour to Russia and various area

July 20VaCati° n' He WiI’ retUm ° r

t X
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YOUR HOROSCOPE
by Charles King Cooper

ARIES (March 21 to April 19) 
Your dash and vigor bring admira­
tion from others. Er\joy recreational 
pursuits. Close friends are the 
source of much happiness. Curb a 
tendency to slack off on the job. 
Avoid escapism, for the late after­
noons will bring a genuine oppor­
tunity for good times.

TAURUS (April 20 to May 20) 
Good fellowship marks the week. 
Speak up at group meetings. Plan a 
special time with a close friend. 
Capitalize on your creative gifts. 
Keep career expectations within 
reasonable bounds, even though it’s 
a good time to go after what you 
want. Initiative brings revenue.

GEMINI (May 21 to June 20) 
Others are prone to exaggerate. 
Make plans for travel or school. 
Don’t be careless with details. Enjoy 
popularity at a party. Money can 
come and go quickly now. Be alert 
for chances to improve income, but 
don’t let expenses escalate. Safe­
guard your assets.

CANCER (June 21 to July 22) You 
can overdo the togetherness theme 
now. Mingle with others to keep 
your relationship vital and exciting. 
Seek mental stimulation. You'll meet 
with new work opportunities, but 
you must be sure to complete 
current assignments.

LEO (July 23 to August 22) Social 
life is active, but be careful not to 
keep others waiting. You're popular 
now, and friends will bring you 
desired benefits. There’s plenty of 
activity on both the career and 
domestic fronts. Afternoon hours 
bring the chance you’ve been wait­
ing for.

VIRGO (August 23 to September 
22) Relations with others are very 
cordial. Travel and distant matters 
are highly beneficial, but make sure 
arrangements are carefully planned. 
Go all out in business. Contact those 
in a position to help. Some receive 
recognition. Don’t let financial luck 
lead to extravagance.

LIBRA (September 23 to October 
22) Don’t let boredom lead to an 
ill-advised shopping expedition. 
Others are reluctant to cooperate 
financially, which may be just as 
well. Stay away from dubious invest­
ments. Work pressures require that 
you save time for sufficient rest. 
Health may be a bit sluggish now.

SCORPIO (October 23 to Novem­
ber 21) Be less suspicious of others’ 
motives. An antisocial mood could 
result. Don’t blame your troubles on 
others. Practice self-analysis. You're 
easily distracted now. Self-discipline 
is needed to counteract daydream­
ing tendencies. Duty may conflict 
with social life.

SAGITTARIUS (November 22 to 
December 21) Business and plea­
sure don’t mix at present. Still, try to 
remain optimistic about career 
potential. Shun all negative thinking. 
A family member may drain some of 
your energy. Don’t let a money delay 
lead to anxiety. Double-check the 
cost of legal advice.

CAPRICORN (December 22 to 
January 19) Financial matters are 
complicated now. It’s not a good 
time to sign papers or seek credit. 
Self-consciousness is possible after 
dark. A confusing situation con­
cerning money could arise with a 
close friend. A withdrawn mood 
interferes with social harmony. 

AQUARIUS (January 20 to

This Week In History
On June 28,1776, Col. Moultrie's 

batteries at Charleston, S.C. 
repulsed a British sea attack ... July 
1, 1847, the first adhesive U.S. 
postage stamps went on sale: Benja­
min Franklin 5 cents, George 
Washington 10 cents ...July 1,1863, 
the Battle of Gettysburg commenced 
... June 26, 1876, Col. George 
Armstrong Custer and 264 soldiers 
of the 7th Cavalry were killed in the 
famous “last stand" Battle of the 
Little Big Horn, Mont., in the Sioux 
Indian War ... June 26, 1917, the 
first U.S. troops arrived in Europe ... 
June 28, 1938, a national minimum 
wage was enacted ... July 1, 1943, 
wage and salary earners were sub­
ject to a paycheck withholding tax ... 
June 29, 1949, U.S. troops were 
withdrawn from Korea ... June 27, 
1950, President Truman ordered the 
Air Force and Navy to Korea after 
North Korea invaded the South

Vision Teaser MagicMaze
D e s c rib e

Y o u rs e lf

Find at least six differences in details between panels.

February 18) Distractions can inter- June 27, 1950, U.S. sent 35 military 
fere with work performance; so advisers to South Vietnam, and 
could a lackadaisical attitude. Ignore agreed to provide military and 
a friend’s indifference after dark, economic aid to anti-Communist 
Don’t let hypersensitivity affect your government ... June 30, 1930, 
relationship with a close friend. Truman approved ground forces and 
Career priorities will take prece- air strikes against North Korea ... 
dence over pleasure needs.

PISCES (February 19 to M.
20) Acquaintances are hard to 
comprehend at present. Don’t let a 
friend’s indecisiveness tie your 
hands. Advisers may be critical. A 
vague approach to career matters 
could be detrimental. It’s a poor time 
to initiate agreements. Search for 

ends.

je6uo| si j|Eh 9 '6utsstuj si lured jo aqni g jauogs S| qsnjQ p ja6jB| 
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p L U F E T S A W Y O D E E X

E T F E U L G A L N E Y X L T

X N Y S S R A D O D P T V B R

T E L Y E I R C N F R U G A L

H C R N G A W A I A X L E T A

G I E E G N H Y V M R G N I V

I F S G G N I A N E O E E R I

T I I M E C G T S N U N R A S

M N M P<£ A V I s h) e E O H Y

S U O I N O M I s R A P U C O

P M Y T F I R H T I G H S H E

Find the listed words in the diagram. They run lit all 
directions — forward, backward, up, down and 
diagonally.

Tight
Miserly
Penny-wise
Charitable

Frugal
Thrifty
Niggardly
Extravagant

Stingy
Wasteful
Openhanded
Parsimonious

Lavish
Generous
Munificent

Super Crossword
ACROSS

I Energetic
6 Moisten
I I  Wise ones
16 “Candide," 

for one
17 Broadway 

musical 
smash

18 Cancels
20 Desert wan­

derer
21 He was Mr. 

Chips
22 Foundation
24 Include
25 Colonize
27 “Two — in

Three Quar­
ter Time”

29 — pro nobis
30 Small brook
32 Hindu gar­

ment
33 Hwys.
34 Barbecue 

rod
35 Run, as color
37" — and

Lovers"
39 Wading bird
40 USMA fresh­

man
41 Six-line 

poem
43 Breaks the 

cipher
45 Napped 

leathers
46 It's some­

times shed

48 Renowned
49 Kind of avis
50 Mississippi 

channel
54 Actress 

Hagen
55 Dresses 

cheaply and 
showily

59 Omnia vincit

60 Occupy with­
out authori­
zation

62 Soothing 
ointment

64 Noble, in 
Bonn

65 Boater
66 Prefix for sex 

or cycle

ness 
89 In a 

weakened 
condition 

91 Pluperfect 
and others

95 Palm cocka­
too

96 Plum parts
97 Grande and 

Bravo
99 New Hamp­

shire city
100 Radio folk
101 Make a loud 

noise
102 Profits 
104 Faithful 
105"Rose —

rose ..."
106 — d'etre 

67 New Zealand 108 Flattened at
honey eater

68 Belgian 
resort

69 Dyer's vat
71 Salon offer­

ing
73 Concise
75 Pile
76 King Arthur's 

loyal knight
78 King-topper
80 Campers' 

gear
82 Wither on 

the —
83 Computer 

command
85 Pintado fish
86 Her — High-

the poles
110 Irritate
111 “Don’t let the 

— bite!"
113 Debbie or 

Daniel
115 English poet 

and dramat­
ist

117 Ups
118 Concluded
119 Mythical king 

of Athens
120 Stone pillar
121 Movers and 

shakers
122 Deuce- 

beaters
DOWN

1 Oars
2 DDE s 

domain
3 Name of 12 

popes
4 Wields a 

crowbar
5 Female gos­

sips
6 White sale 

material
7 Cry of bac­

chanals
8 Gunga —
9 Greenland 

base
10 Boudoir flood 

hazard?
11 French 

cavalry 
swords

12 Assists
13 Zeus and 

Apollo
14 Blunder
15 Condes­

cended
16 Seat in the 

chancel
19 Professional 

penman
20 Pointed 

remarks
23 Actress Mul- 

grew et al.
26 walked (on)
28 Aconite
31 Bette Davis 

vehicle (with 
“The")

34 Corruption

36 Caribou
38 Tonto's 

horse
39 Inspirations
40 Indian yellow
42 Dinner

checks
44 Baseball's 

Mel
45 Marquis de

47 Obligate
49 Edits
50 The harlot of 

Jericho
51 Mirror sight
52 Cast a ballot
53 Actress Irene
55 Book jacket 

ad
56 One of the 

Fords
57 Tibet's 

neighbor
58 Strikes
61 Three-toed 

sloths
63 Corroded
70 TV's Joan
71 Descartes
72 Wins through 

effort
73 Domingo,

eg.
74 Redact
75 “The Green 

—" of comics 
and radio

77 Ancient 
musical 
instrument

79 El —, Span­
ish hero

81 Smell of
83 Say good­

night (to the 
kids)

84 Hotel guest 
request, 
often

86 Indian title
87 Classroom 

need
88 Spanish-Am- 

erican arbors
89 Narrow inlets
90 “The First 

—" (carol)
92 Grave
93 Habituates
94 Searches out
96 Crinkled

fabric
98 — Mater

101 Roll with a 
hole

103 Guide
106 Deception
107 Something 

forbidden
108 Unique per­

son
109 Advantage
112 Computer

datum
114 Lyric poem
116 Actress 

Susan

;A 
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Service Directory
mgjgr
Harris 
Auto Parts
408 East Gibbs 
Del Rio, Texas 78840 
Phone: 1-512-774 2741

Open:
Mon - Sat 8: 00-6:00 

9:00-1:00

/ïraiïrcfivfrn /TfflfflfT?
4 9 T O  S ïïF F IrY

A/C Spark Plugs 774~6532 Monroe Shocks
Quaker State 1700 Bedell Wix Filter,

AU Parts Auto Supply
775-7441
508 Griner

InnriR H ) g (T trB ~ rrrB ~ o '^~ rtn rrrrirr ir8 ^~ (rB ~ o 'o 'a  a iT n n n n n n n n n m '

Free Complimentary Facial To Bearer O f This ad

COSMETICSIndependent ® W

iSt (fie  (ÿ . c^cu¿i/¿a-, dSeattitf ~& omuÛast/
(512) 775-79401

204 Foster Dr Del Rio. TX 788401

610 Margarita, Del Rio, Tx 78840'

,3 VCR, COLOR TV SERVICE 
' CUSTOM CAR STEREO 

CAR ALARMS

FREE ESTIMATES ON COLOR TV’S 
(512) 775-5359

A lfred o  M o nto jan o  
Service Manager

‘Jerry Calderon  
Owner

ieen City Electronics & TV Service
TV Service A t Its Best!

Quasar Authorized Dealer
•Electronic Parts •Satellite Antennas ‘ VCR’s 

•T V s ‘ Home Stereos

I S er iou s Business 
SERGIO GARZA 
Service Manager 
Bus.: (512) 775-1280

905 Ogden 
Del Rio, TX

Plaza DH Sol 
2205 Ave. F 
Dd Rio, Texas 78*40

Catering Party Trays
Private d in in g  room

I I »
Sunday 11:00 - 7:00 p.m. f eri-,aillJo Quiz 

od Eating General Manager
438

Cleaning Supplies & Paper Products'
Pool Supplies

Cleaning Alternatives
Janitorial, Industrial and H ousehold

10% o ff all clean ing products with this ad.
D oes not include paper products.

W e Sell F loor M achines!!
(512) 774-0664

. . _ , . 2400 Ave. F No. 25 „  M illa r
John D. Lissner La Vj||jta S h o p p jn g center *  M .

7gQ4Q Pablo Mota

Bob Corey 
Owner/Certified Applicator 
30514P/T

DAVIS HARDWARE & RANCH SUPPLY
P. O. Box 976  Phono: 6 63 -2 5 2 3

Brackettville, Texas 78832

Originally a part of Petaraan A  Co. 
3 tn c a  1876

General H a rd w a re  
Plpea A  Fencing  
P a in t

8toek Medicine* 
Ranch Supplica 

Am m unition

FREE

Corey's Term ite & Pest 
Control Services

Estimates
p.o. Box mo
Brackettville. TX 78832 
13121 363-2121

KREIGER Insurance
★ ★ ★

General Insurance
Representing Top Rated Companies

512-563-2408
P.O. Box 5
Brackettville. Texas 78832

Studer’s Decorating Center
Ceramic Tiic •  Mini Blinds

Fabrics •  Custom Bedspreads & Window Treatments

123 West Nopal Uvalde, TX 7880
512-278-8885

Open
9:00 A M. - 7:00 P.M. 

Mon. - Fri.
9 A M. - 12 P.M. Sat.

2015 E. Main St. 
Uvalde, Texas 

278-1483

V



June 28, 1990 Page 8 €ft* Srattaft Hems

Sale Starts Today Red Tag Specials
UP TO 65%  OFF ORIGINALTIGKET PRICE!

Select Group 
Mens' 

Summer 
Sportswear

CLEAR
EXAMPLES

Ladies' «Tank Tc ps »Knit Tops «Camp 
Shirts «Shorts «Skirts «Pants 
•Swimwear «Dresses & Dorm Shirts
Original Ticket Price: A
$16.99 to $49.99 X
Red Tag Price:
$12.00 to $38.00 '  OU PAY 6 Ì 19
Ladies' «Handbags «Wallets «French 
Purses & Cosmetic Cases
Original Ticket Price 
$5.99 to $22.99 
Red Tag Price 
$4.00 to $16.00

$0 $
YOU PAY TO

Boys'(4-7 8-18) 
•Shorts & Short 'Sets

EXAMPLE
Original Ticket 
$19.99
Reduced Ticket 
$14.00
YOU PAY:
S"700

SSS»
EXAMPLES

Mens' «Short Sleeve 
Knit Shirts
Original Ticket Price:
$9.99 to $15.99 
Red Tag Price:
$8.00 to $10.00 4„$5

i Original Ticket Pnce: 
! $4.99 to S I5.99
i Ree Tac Price:
I . $4.00 to'$10.00

$0 $
YOU PAY TO S T O R E

Infants, Toddlers & Girls' (4-6x 7-14) 
•Short Sets «Rompers «Tops «Shorts 
•Swimwear «Dresses & Coordinates
Original Ticket Price:
$4.99 to $15.99 m  ■ ■
Red Tag Price: t  I  Jp
$4.00 to $10.00 YOU PAY £m  TO W

Special Selection «Figurines «Travs 
•Plaques «Mugs y
Original Ticket Price: 
S6.00 to $20.00 
Red Tag Price:
$4.00 to $16.00

$
YOU PAY

• i:!.-- S u p in ic . 1 .1 : M .i .nu  V i.-A  A rliv i ..«■ > I > | = I i)! iic l: . rii:!- I Ir . ,  I ,.C l - i l i!- . • i f l i t :  i!

Located S. Main Downtown Del Rio Also in Eagle Pass
Nl ' Av/l ;/1|iir: INAU STORfS

Savings may van from 60% - 65%

. i

2000700008991


