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KVAW-TV Makes Proposal To City

Irene Bland from Glen Ellyn. Illinois, chats with Theresa Plummer, 
F0H Clark Springs’ PR Director.

Charles Downing, Fort Clark Springs’ historian informs Orlyn Zeiman 
of Appleton, Wisconsin of the history of the area.

Plummer Hostess To 
41 Elderhostelers
By JEAN FAULKENBERRY
Brackett News Editor

Sunday afternoon, September 8, 
When I met Theresa S. Plummer at 
the Wainwright House on Fort 
Clark, she told me she was very ner­
vous. She didn’t look, or act, it 
though. She was very poised, very 
charming, very busy trying to be 
several places and do several things 
at one time, and succeeding.

Forty-one Elderhostelers had 
arrived an hour or so before. 
Theresa had met them at the Mem­
bers Service Office, gotten them 
registered for the conference, and 
with the help of volunteers Walt 
Bauguess and C. E. Batchelor, and 
the ladies in the front office of cour­
se, gotten them settled into their 
hotel rooms.

Theresa is the public relations 
director for Fort Clark Springs, and 
this was her first Elderhotel activity 
although five groups came to Fort 
Clark last year.

Seventeen of this group calls 
Texas home, twenty-four are from 

! some other state. Their first 
scheduled event was at the Wain­
wright House where Peter Pohl had 
made the arrangements'for a recep­
tion to be held. Volunteers May 
Roper, Mary Lee Trollinger, Pat 
Callnan, Ken Callnan, Wilma Lewis, 
and 1 were to help Theresa, serve 
refreshments, conduct tours of the 
house, and see that everyone met 
everyone else. We weren’t needed 
for that though. Although these for- 

. ty-one people had not met each 
other, nor us, before, chatter and 
laughter filled the house. They got 
acquainted fast! Theresa was 
everywhere, everybody already 
knew her, she knew "them, and she 
had answers to all the questions.

Elaeriiostel, an educational, 
recreational, and social program, 
was created for adults at least 60 
years old, although companions may

At 7:04 p.m., Monday, September 
9, 1991, Mayor Pro-Tern Diane 
Bravo called the City Council to or­
der with Councilmen Ralph Gon­
zalez, Bernie Cervantes, and 
Richard Terrazas answering roll 
call. Visitors were acknowledged.

Jean Faulkenberry offered the In­
vocation and Police Chief Johnny 
Fritter led the pledge of allegiance.

Minutes of the regular and special 
council meetings were accepted as 
printed on a motion by Bernie Cer­
vantes and seconded by Richard 
Terrazas.

City and Utility Department 
Financial and Operating Reports 
were viewed and approved.

Ignacio Trujillo, Reg. sales, mgr. 
news reporter, and Juan M. 
Wheeler, Jr., vice president and 
general manager of KVAW 
Telemundo of Eagle Pass made a 
presentation offering the City an op­
portunity to add KVAW’s station to 
the Falcon Cable service. Falcon has 
agreed to do so if the City was 
agreeable. KVAW has already 
checked out the area confirming that 
their equipment could sufficiently

serve the area. No charge will be 
made to the City, and no additional 
charge will be added to customer 
service. KVAW Telemundo’s plans 
include an area newscast, as well as 
public service announcements for 
the City, County, community - civic 
activities, churches, and schools. 
They are a commercial station and 
will be offering paid advertising ser­
vices to area businesses. Their ser­
vice area includes Acuna, San 
Carlos, Jimenez, Musquiz, 
Zaragoza, Nava, Morelos, Allende, 
Cleote, Sabinas, NVA Rosita, Palau, 
Agujita, Guerrero, V. Union, and 
Piedras Negras. In Texas they will 
reach Del Rio, Brackettville, Spof­
ford, Quemado, Normandy, Eagle 
Pass, El Indio, Uvalde, LaPryor, 
Crystal City, Carrizo Springs, 
Asherton, and Batesville. They will 
be promoting the new “Free Trade 
Agreement” with Mexico and the 
United States. Richard Terrazas 
moved to support KVAW Telemun­
do in their quest to be added to the 
Falcon Cable Service. The motion 
was seconded by Bernie Cervantes, 
and it carried.

The Council went into Executive 
Session'for a matter dealing with 
personnel. Approximately ten 
minutes later they re-convenect in 
open session.

Jose Escamilla appeared before 
the Council to inquire as to when a 
bridge would be built on Pafford/ 
Thomas Street since the absence of 
one posed a fire hazard. He remin­
ded the Council that he had made 
this request for the past two years. 
He was assured that priority would 
be given his request and he could 
expect construction to begin about 
January. The bridge would be built 
by City personnel and equipment.

The next agenda item was to 
discuss - appoint/not appoint a 
mayor. Mrs. Bravo stated that at the 
time former Mayor Moore resigned, 
City Attorney Ralph Brown advised 
the Council that a council member 
could serve as mayor pro-tem for 
only 90 days (and those 90 days are 
up). She had checked with Texas 
Municipal League late last week and 
was advised that there was no law 
specifying a given number of days a 
Mavor Pro-Tern could serve, and

legally, one could serve until the 
regular election in May. Richard 
Terrazas suggested that he would 
like to delay a decision until the full 
Council was present. Ralph Gon­
zalez moved to table the item until 
all Council members were present. 
The second came from Mr. 
Terrazas and it carried.

Ralph Gonzalez moved, and Ber­
nie Cervantes seconded to send 
Randy Castilla • and Domingo 
Villarreal to school to become cer­
tified as Animal Control Officers 
since Chief Fritter is now the only 
City staff member who is certified. 
The motion carried.

Mrs. Bravo announced that in the 
executive session consideration to 
award a merit pay raise- to Randy 
Castilla as a result of his having 
completed certification for both 
Water License, and Waste Water 
License had been approved.

Mr. Gonzalez moved to adjourn 
and the motion was seconded by Mr. 
Cervantes. The motion carried and 
the meeting was adjourned at 7:46 
p.m.

Cowboy Cauldron A Great Success

be as young as 50. This group will 
be at Fort Clark Springs for the 
week of September 8 - 13. Most of 
them have been involved in one or 
more Elderhostels elsewhere before 
coming here. When around them, 
you can’t determine what is 
educational, what is recreational, 
and what is social. They just mix it 
all up together and have a great 
time.

The week’s program includes 
studying the history of the area, 
visiting the Museum, and touring 
Fort Clark with historians Don 
Swanson, Charles Downing, Ron 
Buckles, and Richard Thompson as 
instructors/guides.

Bob Young will be giving golf in­
structions and putting together a 
tournament...and maybe just 
playing golf with them.

Happy Shahan and Richard 
Curilla will be sharing moviemaking 
history and techniques, showing 
movies made at Alamo Village, Fort 
Clark. Moody Ranch, and the area. 
They also will host a guided tour of 
Alamo Village and serve a Texas 
barbecue dinner at the Cantina.

Most meals will be served by the 
Las Moras Restaurant. Trolleys 
from Del Rio provided transpor­
tation around the Fort and to Alamo 
Village.

Believe it or not, there has been 
free time. Some of them even visited 
Breen Gallery. And, there have been 
lots of surprises. And, Theresa has 
been everywhere!

Graduation will be Friday at a 
farewell luncheon, and graduation 
certificates will be awarded. Then, 
these forty-one delightful people, 
welcome guests on the Fort, and all 
through Kinney County, will be 
leaving. God speed to each of you 
and come see us again.

And, Theresa is already getting 
ready for another Edlerhostel group 
scheduled to arrive September 22.

The First Annual Cowboy Caul­
dron is history! It is a fine page in the 
Kinney County Chamber of Com­
merce’s fttemory book. The effort put 
forth by our chamber as a whole is 
commendable. We have several spec­
ial people that went way beyond the 
expected to make this a spectacular 
first effort. Larry Sofaly, you are 
amazing! From day one and A to Z if 
we needed it, you came up with it. 
With three nights of little or no sleep 
I still do not know how you worked 
as hard as you did without dying! 
Mary Seaver, you had the hardest job 
organizing booths and keeping those 
people happy (thanks also Mona), 
and Cash Letsinger all we had to do 
was ask for you to do it and it was 
taken care of. Dennis Dodson, Mona 
Miller (our newest member), Archie 
Woodson, Glen Seaver, and Allen 
Kreiger-you are the hardest working 
committee yet!

Despite the heavy rain we had a 
wonderful turnout. There were fifty- 
four booths showing everything from 
jewelry to horseshoe artwork. 
Plenty of any variety of food was 
enjoyed by all. Chili teams, horse­
shoe and washer pitchers, tortilla 
tossers, greased pole climbers fought 
the rain and competed anyway. 
Gunfighters got our attention and did 
several shows during the day. The 
fiddle contest was a treat and 
gathered one of the biggest crowds. 
The highlight of the day still belongs 
to the cowboy poets, storytellers, and 
musicians. They made many friends 
while they were here, had a great 
time, and are already making plans to 
be back next year.

Winners of the chili cookoff are as 
follows: first place plaque, showman­
ship, and $100 went to the Mudders 
Chili Team from Fort Clark Munic­
ipal Utility District with Larry “Slow 
Hand Sofaly” "^rank “Take No 
Survivors” "Sanchez, Kevin “ Cab­
oose” "Cavender, and Mark “ Jaw 
Bone” ^Johnson. Congratulations, 
you deserved your awards hands 
down- great wagon! Second place

Budweiser’s Outhouse Chili from Del 
Rio, and third place went to Alvin 
and Tanya McClure’s Potbelly Chili 
from Spofford. Special thanks to 
Tim Ward, Felix Hernandez, and Jim 
Runyan for judging the chili so 
superbly. Thanks to Carol Gene 
Cottle and Ronnie Hobbs for judging 
showmanship. Cash Letsinger, you 
kept it all together and made it work 
despite the rain.

Bill Baxter and Russell Herndon 
from Uvalde won first place in 
horseshoes and washers. Second 
place in horseshoes went to Howard 
and Louise Cottle. Second place in 
washers went to Bernie Cervantes and 
Reyes Diaz. Thanks go to Howard 
and Weegie Cottle for helping Cash 
Letsinger set up the pits and keep the 
games organized. Special thanks tQ

Tom Faulkenberry of the Brackett 
Lions for getting horseshoe sets to be 
donated from Rio Grande Electric, 
and thanks Dan Lewis.

The fiddle contest could not have 
happened without the help of Mar­
garet Bomer of Spofford and Irving 
Ballard from Sabinal. The over all 
grand champion and first place 
winner of the 49-70 year age group 
was Carolyn White of Uvalde. Sec­
ond went to Chester Derrick of 
Odessa, and third place went to 
Rodney Cottle of Carrizo Springs. In 
the 71-79 age group first place was 
W.W. Martin of Spofford, second 
place was Pete Whitworth of Barks­
dale, and third place went to Bill 
Clepper of Utopia. In the 20-24 age 
group first place was Darryl Earwood 
of Del Rio, second place was Todd 
Monroe of Reagan Wells, and third 
place went to Nick Myers of Camp- 
wood. Our judges had hard decisions 
to make and did a fine job. Thanks 
go to Lynette Crane, band director 
for our own Brackett I.S.D.; Rocco 
Fortunato, local long time player in 
several bands; and Thalis Cook, 
fiddle restorer from Del Rio.

The Tortilla Toss was on and then 
off and then on again, but we still 
have a new grand champ with a throw 
of 192 feet and 2 inches. One hundred 
dollars and a trophy went to Billy Joe 
Pierce of Brackettville. Second place 
went to Mike Woodson and third 
place went to Alvin Tovar. Thank 
you Linda Woodson for trying so 
hard to keep it going in the rain.

Tina Krai Smith was the lucky 
winner of the golf package from Fort 
Clark Springs and the Fort Clark 
Golf Course.

A special, special thanks to Bar­
bara Davis, from Lubbock (wife of 
Performer Alvin Davis) who worked 
all day Saturday taking admissions.

And another special thank you to 
Evetta (Mrs. Bob) Kahla who helped 
at the information/sales booth all 
day.

Our sponsors for this event made it 
possible to bring the cowboy poets, 
storytellers, and musicians here. 
Team effort from the whole comm­
unity is a must for events to be

brought here and to be a success. We 
appreciate the fact that each of the 
following understands that—WE
THANK-YOU EVERYONE! Gulf 
Publishing, Fort Clark Springs’ Mai­
ntenance, M.U.D., and Las Moras 
Restaurant, Alamo Village, Shahan 
Ranch, Davis Hardware and Ranch 
Supply, Texcor, Kinney CountyWool 
and Mohair, Burger and Shake, 
Eagle Nest Ranch and NJona Miller, 
Kinney County Land Company, Pa- 
pco Service Company, Debbie Trant 
of Janita Hinds Real Estate, Com­
munity Against A Radioactive Envi­
ronment, Jean’s, B And S Grocery, 
Rory’s Video Review, Sunshine Nur­
sery, Rio Grande Electric, The Lions 
Club, Fort Clark Old Quarry Society, 
O’ROurke Realty, Larry Sofaly, The 
Letsingers, Trey Smart, Bobby Hunn 
and family, Glen and Mary Seaver, 
Sondra Meil, Russell White, Knights 
of Columbus, Billy Joe Pierce, and 
Rodney and Carol Cottle. We owe a 
special thanks to both of our local 
papers for their help in publicizing 
this event. Look what a difference it 
made!

The most thanks should go to the 
performers who did so much for so 
little in return. Thank you Clay 
Lindley and Alvin Davis for helping 
to organize the performance, Curt 
Brummett, John Campbell, Enid 
Morris, Don Cadden, Charles Will­
iams, Gil Prather, Dave Crow, Bob 
Kahla, and Jim Fish, They were 
wonderful and will be remembered 
for a long time. See you again next 
year!

“Slow Hand Sofaly’

Tax Rate Set
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Jim Fish at the mike.

Kinney County Judge Tim Ward 
called the Commissioners Court to 
order at 9:05 a.m., Monday, Sep­
tember 9. with all Commissioners 
and County Attorney Shahan 
present.

Attorney Shahan gave the In­
vocation and Judge Ward led the 
pledge of allegiance. Minutes of 
August 8 , 12, 14, 16, 19, 22, 26, and 
30 were read and approved.

The rental contract on the office 
occupied by Justice of the Peace 
Alvin Hall was extended for a year.

Nine applications for County 
Road Administrator were reviewed 
and the applicants were asked to be 
available for interview in executive 
session beginning at 3:30.

Action was deferred on reviewing 
a County and District Retirement 
System Resolution. August bills 
were examined and approved. 
Emergency amendments to transfer 
line items to meet current expenses 
were approved.

Two bids were received from out­
side audit firms. After reviewing 
both, the Court voted to award the 
contract to EDE Firm. Knippa, at a 
cost of $8500.00.

Excel Company and Blue 
Cross/BlueShield were the only fir­
ms to submit bids for the County 
Employee Insurance Program. Af­
ter a lengthy discussion. Com­
missioner McClure moved to stay 
with Blue Cross. The motion was 
seconded by Commissioner Fuen-

tes, and it carried.
After a lunch break, the Court 

reconvened. Commissioner Fuentes 
moved that the tax rate be set at 
.6846. The motion was seconded by 
Corhmissioner Frerich. The motion 
carried although Commissioner 
McClure voted no.

Commissioner Sheedy led a 
discussion on the use of the Civic 
Center. It was agreed that although 
the Court might choose to waive a 
rental fee for special community ac­
tivities, the cleaning charge and 
utilities still must be paid by the 
user.

The Court then went into 
Executive Session to interview ap­
plicants for the County Road Ad­
ministrator.

When the Court completed the 
executive session, it was announced 
that one additional person was to be 
interviewed before a decision was 
made, and it could take a week.

At 4:15 an amended redistricting 
plan for Kinney County, Plan GLIA, 
was reviewed. The change would be 
to drop the precinct line dividing 
three and one a block from Spring 
Street to Highway 90 before con­
tinuing due west. Commissioner 
McClure moved to approve and 
submit the amended plan. Com­
missioner Fuentes seconded the 
motion and it carried.

The Court was adjourned at 4:40 
p.m. on a motion by Commissioner 
Sheedy.

1
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Sheriff’s Corner
By Sheriff Norman H. Hooten

Kinney

County

Vandals struck an expensive and 
destructive blow to Texcor Ind­
ustries headquarters the night of 
Monday, September 9, 1991. Paul 
Salsman, head representative of the 
company, called the Sheriffs Depar­
tment at approx. 8:05 am Monday 
morning to report the incident and 
this writer arrived at the scene at 
8:15 am to investigate. It was ob­
vious from evidence at the scene, 
which included two broken windows 
and window screens, that the in­
cident was one of criminal mischief 
and NOT an attempt at burglary as 
no attempt was made to enter the 
building which is located in a remote 
area of Highway 90 near the inter­
section of Hwy. 131. Damage is 
estimated at between $100 to $200 
dollars. There are no suspects at the 
time of this writing.

Another case similar in nature 
was investigated by this writer at 
11:15 am Monday, September 10th, 
after a report of a break-in was made 
to the Sheriff’s Department by 
Charles “Ford” Dodson, caretaker 
of a residence belonging to Joe King 
of Houston, Texas. The residence,

located at Lot 1, Unit 35, Ft. Clark 
Springs, had been entered by at 
least one person through a broken 
window at the rear of the building. 
The burglars took beer and whiskey 
valued at an estimated $50.00. 
Damage to the broken window is 
also estimated at $50.00. It is not 
certain exactly when the crime was 
committed as it had been several 
days since the building was 
checked.

FOOD FOR THOUGHT: “I f  he 
who carefully picks holes in the 
character o f  others would but expend 
same skill upon him self what could 
prevent him from breaking through 
the bonds o f  ignorance?''

Destructive criticism leads to a 
train of disruptive habits and 
passions. Because it has long been 
given such free scope, it has become 
such a persistent and insidious habit 
that even after the aspirant has 
conquered other errors and the 
grosser aspects of criticism, it often 
insinuates itself on his unsuspecting 
mind and once more drags him into 
the mire of it’s own plane. There is

only one way to handle destructive 
criticism, and that is to throttle it in 
its incipiency, whenever and 
wherever it appears.

A critical mind not only in itself 
checks progression but it leads to 
the more destructive quality of con­
demnation. If one does not begin by 
criticizing, he will not end in con­
demning. Condemnation is a two- 
edged sword which very few are 
capable of using, and in­
discriminately handled, as it is 
today, infused with the harmful 
elements of anger, hatred, and 
revenge, it is wholly destructive.
“Rays o f  the Dawn" by Thurman 
Fleet -  copyright 1950

Big Mama
Ses!

Some people are like french bread - little dough 
and lots o f crust.

P L E A S E  REM EM BERtliat we attempt to include 
something fo r  everyone within the pages o f our paper. We 
realize that that some folks enjoy fin d in g  fault and f a n  
those readers we thoughtfully include a socially acceptable 
number oferors within our publication.

MEMBER 1991

Tljq  B ra ck e tt News welcomes letters to the Editor. The Editor 
reserv es the right to edit all le tte rs  su bm itted  for length and co n text.
S Letters will be edited to avoid the use of profanity or libelous statemen­
ts pertaining to the rights of citizens.
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the beliefs of this newspaper.

All letters must be signed and include an address and phone number.
Thank You
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Letter To 
The Editor
The September issue of the Amer­

ican Rifleman warns all of us who 
own and use firearms, (safe in the 
knowledge that we are completely 
protected by the second amendment 
to The Bill of Rights) are in jeopardy.

In an article headed “ War for your 
Guns,” they show that the fight has 
shifted to the U.S. House of Repre­
sentatives. They ask if our Cong­
ressman (Bustamante) will vote to 
control career criminals or to control 
law abiding citizens and gun owners.

They cite a list of bills before the 
house at this time, most of which are 
anticipated to be attached to the 
President’s ' upcoming crime bill. 
These are:
Gephardt/Schumer Crime Bill: Bans 
semi-autos and magazines over 
rounds, registers semi-autos when 
transferred, sponsored by Richard 
Gephardt (D) Mo. and Charles 
Schumer (D-N.Y.)
H.R. 19: Bans and registers Semi­
autos, bans magazines over 7 rounds, 
sponsored by William Hughes (D- 
MO)
H.R. L770: Bans handguns, sponsor­
ed by Larry Smith (D-FLA)
H.R. 282: Registers Handguns, spon­
sored by Cardiss Collins (D -lll) 
H.R. 3104: Bans semi-autos, maga­
zines and their parts, sponsored by 
Pete Stark (D-Cal)
H.R. 436: Bans Ammunition, spon­
sored by Ted Weiss (D-N.Y.)

In  th e  U .S .  C o n g re ss  to d a y , th ere  
are total, nationwide gun owner 
registration proposals. Bans on long 
guns. Bans on handguns. Even bans 
on bullets; Sen. Daniel Patrick 
Moynihan (D-N.Y.) wants to ban 
9mm, and .32 and .25 cal ammuni­
tion — ammo you primarily use for 
self-protection.

On an equally serious note, the 
following news item shows what is 
becoming more common all the time- 
a citizen being “held-up’Vfcnd what 
he did about it. Guess he deserves a 
medal. I’ll t>etcha he’s a member of 
The National Rifle Association. Any 
takers?

David T. Blair

Reprinted with permission from the 
Friday, September 6. 1991 edition o f  
the San Antonio Light.

Quick-drawing Californian 
guns down gang of crooks

LOS BANOS, CALIFORNIA- 
One robber aimed a shotgun at 
Jaime Alonso’s temple. Another 
held a knife to his throat. Two other 
intruders rifled through his small 
gun and bait shop.

Trapped behind the store coun­
ter, Alonso asked to sit down. If he 
made one wrong move, he knew he 
could be dead.

But it was not Alonso who would 
die Tuesday afternoon. Instead, 
Alonso turned from victim to folk 
hero in a few chilling seconds.

Reaching for a 9mm handgun 
hidden under a counter, Alonso 
made like a character in a cops-and- 
robber movie and blasted his in­
truders with a daring display of 
marksmanship and firepower that 
left three of them dead and a fourth 
fleeing down Highway 152.

With quick precision, Alsono 
fired the gun over one shoulder, 
stunning and wounding the robber 
who wielded the knife.

Next, Alonso turned and fired 
point-blank at the bandit holding the 
shotgun. The man dropped his 
weapon and staggered, bleeding.

In a flash, Alonso spun and shot a 
third robber whose arms were full of 
weapons taken from a gun case.

The fourth ingruder fled out the 
front door as Alonso fired in his 
direction.

When the smoke cleared at the 
San Luis Outpost, Alonso was 
unharmed. So was co-worker Ben­
nie Cotter, who was rousted by the 
robbers from a walk-in refrigerator.

“The good guys won this time,” 
said Lt. Bill Blake of the Merced 
County Sheriff’s Department. " It ’s 
nice to see the bad guys lose one. 
They never got a shot off. They 
never had a chance.”
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Between Us

By Joe Townsend

It’s truly amazing how the 
American people are continually 
ripped off by purveyors of doom 
who seem to be afraid of their own 
shadows. With the help of the 
irresponsible news media there is an 
amazing train of false fears that cost 
the American public millions of 
dollars.

All the dire predictions of the 
Three Mile Island incident have 
proved to be the blatant babbling by 
pseudo-authorities. All the claims of 
danger of Agent Orange have 
proved to be totally false. The 
“Love Canal” incident caused the 
federal government to buy an entire 
town at inflated prices. When it was 
proved there was no danger now the 
houses are being sold for living at a 
tremendous cost in tax payer 
dollars.

An entire town in Missouri was 
forcibly evacuated by the Federal 
Government. Now it is proved the 
highly touted dangers of dioxin do 
not exist and the Federal will resell 
the houses at a loss to the taxpayers.

American people are being daily 
ripped off under the claims of the

horrible fate to be caused by the 
destruction of the ozone layer. The 
latest scam regarding freon in air- 
conditioning units is a case in point.

Now reputable scientists have 
proved the fallacy of the whole idea. 
The so called “green house effect” 
has been totally disavowed. There 
has been less than V2 degree of 
variance of temperature world wide 
in the 150 years records have been 
kept. Cyclamates were said to cause 
cancer and were taken off the 
market. New sugar substitutes at a 
much higher price were developed. 
Then it was proved; no danger from 
cyclamates.

Schools, businesses and public 
buildings were the victims of a 
phobia that asbestos causes cancer. 
The tax payers were fleeced of 
millions and millions of dollars. One 
major business was destroyed 
because of the panic. Now it is 
proved to be a baseless fear. In fact 
it is more dangerous to replace sur­
faces using asbestos than to leave it.

Hysteria has been promoted 
nation wide about radio-active 
waste. Now it is proved to be such a

low incidence of problems that 
reputame scientists now say the 
emanations are so low the biggest 
problem is in measuring it.

The stupidity of the Endangered 
Species act becomes more apparent 
daily. The claim of the “Environ­
mentalists” that the loss of any 
species endangers the entire chain 
of existence is ridiculous. Every 
year at least 1000 species cease to 
exist because nature herself accom­
plishes it. The millions of dollars 
cost to the taxpayer because of the 
snail darter in Tennessee is 
ridiculous as is the idea of federal 
control of the Edwards Aquifer 
because of endangered species in 
some of the springs. Incidentally, in 
my. memory those springs have gone 
dry years ago. I can’t help but won- - 
der how long the Nader Nuts will be 
able to control judges and 
legislators.

Until the American people begin 
to examine facts and refuse to listen 
to negativists and liberal news 
media we will all continue to pay and 
pay and pay.

Your coverage'll1 the’,Cít:y'Coun­
cil’s dismissal of an honest and ex­
perienced City Manager/Secretary 
failed to cover hidden facts that reek 
of Nepotism, skullduggery, ethnic 
manipulations, secret terrorism 
(control by fear), and other highly 
unethical practices and procedures 
being carried on by what I saw at the 
“Special Meeting” as blatant inex­
cusable tyranny (wearing the cloak 
of authority laughingly/sadly labeled 
“City Council — one of whom 
doubles as a “Mayor-Pro-Tem”).

The data I uncovered is very 
likely known to you but not men­
tioned in your paper, nor even 
questioned. Mr. Felix Gonzales 
proved too honest for the Hispanic 
vise that hired him in preference to 
the other candidate (Mr. Blanken­
ship, an Anglo), for the primary 
reason 2 or 3 dictating Hispanics 
thought they could control Mr. Gon­
zales; (according to some lifelong 
local Hispanic residents).

. Perhaps what is most galling to 
American customs that abhore 
secret government, is the comment 
by Councilman Cervantes (whose 
oath of office includes the upholding 
of the U. S. Constitution which was 
the primary cause that built the U. 
S. Cavalry Fort Clark that 
made/makes “Braekettville”
possible). I heard the Councilman 
say that they resented the fact that 
Mr. Gonzales had taken information 
about what was happening to 
Braekettville to outside media.

“Government by Secrecy” may 
be the tyrant’s way but it is not the 
American way. Probably the most 
crucial reason that Hitler and the 
Nazi Tyranny was stopped in 
Europe, was because a few people 
like Journalist Alan Cranston (now 
U. S. Senator Cranston) were brave 
enough to go the “extra mile” to 
alert the “outside world” about 
what was happening under Hitler’s 
autocratic dictatorship.

Border Banditry was once fought 
by my father, a Cavalry Stable 
Sergeant at Fort Clark, when his 
troop was ordered to chase Pancho 
Villa in the “Punitive Ex­
pedition”;...before he (William M. 
McFarland) went with Pershing to 
Europe to fight on French soil in 
WWI, to assure Human Freedoms. 
How can I do less here and now, 
than to speak out about the injustice 
I witnessed at the so-named City 
Council meeting that quickly fired 
Mr. Gonzales and closed the session 
seconds later (on motion by Ralph 
Gonzalez to abet Mayor Bravo who 
wished to avoid certain questions 
about her own curious actions that 
appear to have conflict-of-interest-

status, etc.). The wall-to-wall citizen 
assemblage was cleverly prevented 
from questioning a whole series of 
matters involving the methods of 
Brackettville’s local government’s 
alleged officials, who appear to have 
turned a small Texas town into a 
Totalitarian Bastion. Isn’t it time to 
have an elected Mayor? Or at least 
have the local newspapers report all 
the facts that bear investigation to 
uncover how the long-standing mess 
in local government has been 
allowed, — while honest men who 
try to bring reliability and integrity 
into local government are either 
“fired” or find their stand is so un­
supported by the citizenry they quit!

What’s it to be? People like me 
are having second thoughts about 
settling here, and the outflow will 
outnumber the inflow as long as the 
County of Kinney and town of 
Braekettville continue to be 
autocratically controlled by a small 
ethnic-minded group secretly 
promoting the good of a few as more 
important than the good of all. the 
intense emotions and energies I saw 
on display at that meeting could 
surely be put to more proper and 
more beneficial use, if the entire 
citizenary had access to all the 
truths about what is happening at 
Braekettville.

Dictatorship, autocratic unan­
swerable power and control by fear 
through government-by-secrecy, 
must not be permitted on American 
soil, — no matter how close we are 
to an international border where the 
cultural differences are not 
amenable to the American way of 
freedom of speech. Felix Gonzales 
attempted to use these freedoms and 
was scarificed for doing so. He 
wasn’t the first.

How long will the local 
newspapers and citizens allow this? 
The free press has always been the 
“watchdog” of citizen power and

freedom. An uninformed public 
cannot rule itself wisely. Take the 
muzzle off your reporting respon­
sibilities, and let the public retain 
power over citizen destiny 
here;...not meekly standby and let a 
few dictate the lives of all. This is 
too small a town for this publisher 
and editor not to know what 
questionable actions and situations 
are being perpetrated without in- 
depth reporting by local papers. You 
claim to be professional newspeople; 
do your job on these matters before 
it’s too late!

One of the first rules of conquest 
strategy is to keep the “opponent” 
confused! It is quite apparent to my 
own investigation, local officialdom 
has succeeded very well in keeping 
the public confused! It is the duty of 
newspapers worthy of their name to 
cut through such confusion and 
present the facts clearly in terms the 
average person can understand. A 
mere stating of dates and times and 
“allowed” data as your last issue 
presented, is not enough to clarify 
the whimsical use of power now in 
effect. Please, do it right and ad­
dress the undermining situation and 
persons causing the confusion. 
Thank you.

S. McFarland 
P. O. Box 1636 

Del Rio, Tex. 78840

Dear S. McFarland:
Your letter dated (on the second ; 

page) 9/1/91, and passed through the • 
door at noon on Wednesday, Sep­
tember 4, was received past our 
deadline and could not be printed in 
the September 5 issue.

Thank you for reading The“ 
Brackett News. Readers are impor-” 
tant to us. If you have facts you care! 
to share with the public, on this or . 
other issues, you already know howl 
to reach us.

Cause 20117-N o t G uiltv
T'Vmr-erl nu ,---1_ 1 ... *At 2 p.m. Thursday, September 

5, 1991, in the County Court Room, 
Judge Hall declared court in session 
to hear Cause #20117 which Felix 
Gonzales had filed on August 23 af­
ter an incident in his office on 
August 22.

The case was against Diane Bravo 
charging assault with intentionally 
or knowingly threatening bodily in­
jury. Mr. Gonzales reported that 
Mrs. Bravo had attempted to strike 
him with his tape recorder after a 
disagreement between the two of 
them. Mrs. Bravo denied picking up 
the tape recorder and said she had 
only tapped it with her hand while it
was sating °n Mr. Gonzales’s desk

Mr. Gonzales and Mrs. Bravo

each testified, then two c 
ployees - Deborah -Blai 
Josephine Gomez - were c 
the stand. Neither could giv 
witness account but both s; 
heard loud voices.

Mr. Gonzales was represt 
Attorney Tully Shahan of 1 
tville, and Mrs. Bravo was r< 
ted by Attorney Robert Ca 
Del Rio.

Judge Hall ruled not 
discounting the testimony fr 
Bland and Ms. Gomez as 
and ruling the testimony fr 
Gonzales and Mrs. Bravo c 
of two people giving oppos 
sions of a situation, and guilt 
been established.

1
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Grandma ’s 
Kitchen

Mi

By Grandma /ÿ y ®
We’ve heard the word lots of 

times, but I’ll bet not too many 
people even know what it looks like.

Alfalfa is a perennial herb com­
monly found on the edges of fields, 
in low valleys and is widely 
cultivated by farmers for livestock 
feed. An erect, smooth stem grows 
from an elongated taproot to a 
height of a foot or more. Flowers are 
blue-to-purple during the summer 
months, finally producing the 
characteristic spirally coiled seed 
pods.

Alfalfa was used by the Persians 
to feed their horses to make them 
look sleeker and feel stronger. The 
Arabs designated this common hay 
feed for livestock, “The Father of all 
Foods.”

Some modern herbalists have 
gone even further than this. Charac­
terizing alfalfa as being “The Big 
Ipaddy of ’em all” in terms of 
rjutritional value, considering that 
t|iis plant is so rich in calcium that 
tjie ashes of its leaves are almost 
99% pure calcium.

Since the herbalists were ignored, 
we had to wait until it was clinically 
proven that high levels of 
cholesterol were reduced when 
alfalfa meal was eaten.

Based on these findings, it’s 
therefore strongly recommended 
that we take 2 capsules of good 
quality alfalfa powder with every 
meal, especially when too much 
cholesterol might be a problem.

The rich chlorophyll content 
found in alfalfa, and other green 
plants like it, was used by some doc­
tors in major hospitals in the 40’s for 
treating infections resulting from 
surgical incisions, bed sores and 
minor ear problems.

Better than the capsules would be 
fresh juice made from new alfalfa 
sprouts whipped up in a blender, or

else run through a juicer. About 4 to 
6 ounces of this juice taken at one 
time and also great applied exter­
nally on any surface infected, try it.

To make your own sprouts, soak 
a teaspoon of alfalfa seeds in a quart 
of tepid water overnight. Next mor­
ning, rinse the seeds thoroughly 
with tepid water and drain. Place 
them in a jar tightly covered with a 
damp cheesecloth. Store in a dark 
place. Twice a day, rinse the 
sprouting seeds and drain them well, 
returning them to the dark after 
every rinse. After 4 or 5 days, place 
the sprouts in the sunlight for a few 
hours to green them, then store in 
the refrigerator.

You can use alfalfa sprouts in­
stead of lettuce, since they are far 
more nutritious. In 1984 it was 
proven that alfalfa extracts 
definitely improved the condition of 
a diabetic who failed to respond to 
insulin. I’m definitely going to get 
me some alfalfa capsules for these 
tired old bones.

Now, let’s get on with cooking 
something good. Let’s try this one.

BACON CHEESEBURGER 
CASSEROLE

1 lb. ground beef 
1 Tbs. instant minced onion 

1 can (2 oz) mushroom stems and 
pieces, drained 

6 slices bacon, crisply cooked, 
crumbled

1 can (16 oz) whole tomatoes, 
drained

1 can (11 oz) condensed Cheddar 
Cheese soup 

1 cup potato flakes 
1 cup shredded cheddar cheese

All Eastern Star Members 
Tuesday, September 17, 1991 
Covered Dish Supper 6 p.m.,
Initiation 7 :0 0  p.m. Del Rio Masonic Hall

Beyond The 
Horizon

By Dorthy Payne A

.. >A

“Mountain Men,” the pioneers of 
the Rocky Mountain West, came 
first as fur trappers, lured to the 
West by beavers as these animals 
were lured to traps by castor bait.

With virgin streams producing 
the prize catches, there was reward 
for trail blazing and so the trappers 
became the explorers of the Far 
West.

Frenchmen, most experienced of 
fur trappers, mingled with 
Americans and Spaniards at St. 
Louis in the first part of the 19th 
century and made this the great 
western fur trade. From here went 
trapping parties and trading goods 
for the mountain trade. A season or 
two of trapping and you could be 
considered a “Mountain Man.” 

Mingling with the Indians, the 
mountain men adopted the Indian 
way of life, his food, shelter, morals, 
and usually his superstitions. He 
adopted buckskins, adorned with 
dyed procupine quills, or colored 
beads.

An Indian buffalo skin lodge 
provided winter shelter. His rifle, 
steel traps, skinning knife, and hor­
se made him independent and free.

Jim Bridger, Kit Carson, Thomas 
Fitzpatrick and old Bill Williams

were examples.
There were three classes: the 

hired trapper, paid annual wages by 
a fur company; the skin trapper, 
who dealt with the company only; 
and the free trapper, who trapped 
and disposed of his furs when and 
where he pleased.

The summer rendezvous at Green 
River, Wyoming, or other mountain 
valleys, started the typical fur trade 
day. There white trappers and In­
dians gathered. Fur companies from 
Missouri brought trade goods to 
barter.

With drinking, gambling, races 
and contests of skill the “Mountain 
Man” made holiday. His regular 
meat diet was now varied by flour, 
coffee, etc., from “the States.” In a 
few days, he usually spent his entire 
year’s earning.

With the popularity of the silk 
hat, beaver skin went from $6 or $8 
a piece to $2 or less. The “Mountain 
Man” sold his traps, became a 
trader with the Indians, or went to 
the trading post and became a 
government scout, or guide, to lead 
new comers to the West.

Thus, “civilization” rubbed out 
the “Mountain Man.”

Crumble ground beef into 2 qt. 
microwavable casserole, add onions 
and mushrooms. Cover loosely and 
microwave on high for 3 minutes. 
Break up beef and stir. Cover 
loosely and microwave until very lit­
tle pink remains in beef, 3 to 4 
minutes longer, drain. Stir in bacon 
and tomatoes. Reserve 'A cup of the 
soup, stir the remaining into beef 
mixture. Cover tightly and 
microwave until hot - 3 to 5 minutes.

Prepare the potato flakes as direc­
ted on the package for 4 servings. 
Stir in the reserved soup. Spoon the 
potatoes around edge of casserole. 
Sprinkle top of casserole with 
cheese. • Cover loosely and 
microwave until hot and cheese is 
melted, about 3 to 5 minutes. Soun­
ds good, doesn’t it?

I remember the first guacamole I 
tasted when I came to Texas was a 
bit soured, and completely turned 
me off guacamole. Since then, I 
learned to make my own. It is 
delicious, and I want to share my 
recipe with you.

GUACAMOLE

2 large, or 3 small ripe avocados 
1 ripe tomato, chopped 

Juice of 1 lemon 
1 small clove garlic, pureed 

2 to 3 Tbs. minced onion 
'A Tea. ground cumin 

Salt to taste
Lettuce leaves for serving and sliced 
tomatoes for garnish.
Mash avocados in a bowl, add 
tomato and continue to mash toget­
her. Stir in lemon juice, garlic, 
onion, cumin, and salt. Transfer to 
an attractive serving bowl. Place let­
tuce leaves on individual plates and 
serve with tomato slices.

Here’s a good thought: when in­
sects take over the world, let’s pray 
they’ll remember with gratitude 
how we took them along on all our 
picnics.

Have a safe and happy week.
Big hugs and special love,

Grandma

L ib r a r y
N otes

Well, just when you husbands 
think you are ready to sit down and 

watch Friday night football, you are 
informed that it is time to do your 
fall yard preparation, and plant your 
fall garden. Yes, it is time.

However, with our charac­
teristically mild falls, you can plan 
these activities over the next few 
weeks. We suggest you begin your 
fall garden preparation immediately.

There is an excellent book 
available at the library entitled Bugs, 
Slugs & Other Thugs which has ex­
cellent suggestions for solving some 
of your garden problems. For exam­
ple, did you know that corn oil 
mixed with warm water suffocates 
nematodes when sprinkled near 
plant roots, used as a soil drench, or 
used as a root dip for transplants.

African marigolds release 
nematode poisons through their 
roots and discourage other harmful 
insects as well.

As. faotas.yoyr laiÉhris concerned, 
if there has been ^(lpuild up of thatch 
because you haven’t been using a 
grass catcher, removing it will help 
drainage and discourage insect 
habitation through the winter.

A close mowing just before winter 
will encourage basal shoots, which 
will thicken the grass.

If your lawn is heavily compacted 
aeration will improve the lawn struc­
ture. A slow release fertilizer is 
critical to your lawn to assist it in 
going through the winter with 
minimum stress.

This and other information regar­
ding your lawn and garden can be 
found in the National Gardening 
Association’s book Gardener's 
Questions Answered.

For your roses, clematis, 
hydrangea, crape myrtle, hibiscus, 
woody vines, and most trees of this 
area, fall pruning is recommended. 
Later, winter pruning is not 
prohibited provided it is not ex­
cessive. Winter pruning will result 
in faster regrowth of wood often at 
the expense of fruit and flowers. 
Other pruning information can be 
found in the book Pruning Simplified 
by Lewis Hill.

To avoid being labeled “sexist,” 
let us quickly add that all the above 
duties with proper equipment can be 
performed equally well by women. 
Perhaps one person could obtain the

proper information from the above 
sources so that they might suitably 
supervise the other in his/her ac­
tivities. (This is always most ap­
preciated by the person being 
supervised, we are told.)

Now that we have fully stimulated 
conversation among the members of 
your household, may we recom­
mend the following books which 
have, or are, on the best seller list: 
The Seventh Commandment by 
Lawrence Sanders; The Fourth K  by 
Mario Puzo; and The Firm  by Jon 
Grisham.

During the month of August, we 
had memorial donations from 
William & Sandra Herman in 
memory of Raymond Fuentes. Dick 
and Molly Schroeder made a 
memorial donation to the Friends’ 
Library Expansion Fund in memory 
of Edith Tribby. Books have been 
purchased in their memory.

Books were donated to the library 
th is  p a st  w e e k  b y  M r .  a n d  M r s .
Tucker, Pat and Ken Callnan, and 
Irene and Dave Blair. Thanks to 
these loyal supporters of the Library 
as well as those who attended the 
public meeting Friday, August 30.

September 17 - 23 is Constitution 
Week. With the events which have 
occured in the U. S. S. R. during the 
past few weeks, we have even more 
cause to consider the great foresight 
exhibited by its creators.

As always, we invite you to visit 
the coolest, friendliest little Library 
in Kinney County.

Kinney County Library 
Staff & Volunteers

New Library Hours 
October 1,1991

Tues. - Fri. 11:00 a.m. - 7:00 p.m. 
Saturday 9:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m.

READ
A BOOK. . .  
READ TWO!!!

y N O W  LEA SIN G
Brackettville Seniors Apartments

1 6 0 0  N orth Spring St.
A cross from  Kinney County W ool & Mohair Co.

Rental Assistance Available
R e n t B a se d  on In co m e

• Energy Efficient A partm ents • Central Heat & Air«
• E lectric  Range & F ro st Free  R efrigerator#

• Fully-Carpeted •A ctivity Room®
• W ash er and D ryer Connections • A larm  System s#

• Mini Blinds #
Call Pete

512 - 563-2705
"Com e Live W ith U s."

&
" H a n d ic a p p e d  U n its  A v a ilab le "

Equal Homing 
^Opportunity

Las Moras Lounge,
512-563-2290 Fort Clark Springs

New Hours:
Monday thru Thursday 5:00 p.m. to 12:00 a.m 

Friday thru Saturday 5.00 p.m. to 1:00 a.m. 
Enjoy Monday Nite Football With Us! 

Food Service Available In Lounge

Community
Calender

i f

FT-CLARK

|W,0 >hlli/it

AA: Mondays 8 p.m. Slator Hall, 109 W. James St.
Al-Anon: CAN HELP. Call 563-9205 for tune & location of meetings. 
Altar Society: 1st Monday 5:30 p.m. Parish Hall 
Band Booster Club: 1st Tuesday, 7 p.m. High School Band Hall 
Bass Club: last Thursday 7 p.m.
Chamber of Commerce: 1st Thursday 7 p.m. Court House 
City Council: 2nd Monday 6:30 p.m. City Hall 
Commissioners Court: 2nd Monday 9 a.m. Court House 
Del Rio Christian Women’s Club: 1st Wednesday 12 noon AFB Reser­
vations required.
Drivers License: 1st, 3rd & last Thursdays 9 a.m. - 12 noon; 1-3 p.m. 2nd 
floor, Court House-
Duplicate Bridge: Sundays 1:30 p.m., Tuesdays 7 p.m. Sabre Room 
FCS Art Club: Work days Mondays and Saturdays 11 a.m.; Meeting 1st 
Monday 1 p.m. Art Studio
FCS Community Council: 2nd Saturday 9 a.m. Sabre Room 
FCS Board of Directors: 3rd Saturday 9 a.m. Board Room 
FCS Historical Society: 4th Saturday 10 a.m. Sabre Room 
FCS Muscum/Sutler's Store: Saturdays & Sundays 1-4 p.m.
FCS Ladies Luncheon: 2nd Wednesday noon Las Moras Restaurant. 
Make reservations at Adult Center.
FCS VFW & Auxiliary Post #8360: 4th Wednesday 7 p.m. NCO Club.
Pot Luck dinner at 6 p.m.
FCS Bingo: Friday 8 p.m. Town Hall
FCS Las Vegas Night: 4th Saturday 8 p.m. Las Moras Restaurant 
FCS Old Quarry Society: 1st Monday 7 p.m. Sabre Room 
Friends of Library: No regular schedule. Call the Kinney County Library 
for information
KC Historical Preservation Society: 4th Thursday 7 p.m. Court House 
KC Kickers: 2nd and 4th Thursday 7:30 p.m. NCO Club 
Knights of Columbus: 1st Sunday 12 Noon Parish Hall 
Lions Club: 1st and 3rd Thursday 6:30 p.m. Las Moras Restaurant 
Masonic Lodge: 2nd Tuesday 7 p.m. Lodge Hall, Ann St.
Order of Eastern Star #204: 1st and 3rd Tuesdays 7:30 p.m. Masonic
Hall, 407 Bedell St., Del Rio Texas
Shriners: 4th Tuesday 6:30 p.m. Las Moras Restaurant
Rotary Club: Thursdays 12 noon Las Moras Restaurant
Methodist Ladies luncheon: 3rd Wednesday noon Slator Hall. Please
make reservations.
BISD School Board: 2nd Monday 6:30 p.m. Board Room 
Sorority: Preceptor Theta Sigma - 3rd Monday 7:00 p.m.
NA: Thursdays, 7 p.m., St. Andrews Episcopal Church Parish Hall.

f l ' t U M  1

Where were you born:
Lampasas County, Texas. 
What Is Your Favorite 
Food: Red beans and corn 
bread with iced tea.
How do your friends 
describe you: Hard but 
fair.
Describe yourself: A
mystic mourner - a classic 
Pisces.
What is your favorite 
movie: High Noon and 
Lonesome Dove 
What is your favorite 
book: Something o f  Value 
by Robert Roark. 
If you could go anywhere, 
where would you go: 
Australia.
What would you like to be 
if you could change your 
life: Be less judgemental, 
and more compassionate.

I  ! Encino

Just F o r The  
Fun Of It

If you could change 
Brackettville, how would 
you change it: Load up all 
the malcontents and 
agitators, and ship them 
out of town.

Magazine
can be as close as your mail 

box every month 
SUBSCRIBE TODAY

A MAGAZINE OF THE ARTS; 
WESTERN ARTS

Ride the old and new trails of the 
American cowboy; read his poetry 
and sing his songs: learn the 
philosophies: read and see the art 
of your western heritage, yester­
day and today.

Send:
Plus tax
(Texas residents) 
Shipping & handling

To: Encino Magazine 
P. O. Box 664 
Sonora. TX 76950

Suzy Immel September 12
Rose Adams September 12
Bryan Gidge September 12
Helen Burkepile September 14
Gerald Gallion September 14
Milton Gallion September 14
Joyce Barrett September 15
Inez Ray September 15
Josie Sanchez September 16
Claude Owen September 17
Margaret Batchelor September 18
Maria Reschman September 18

A■
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“ Friday the Thirteenth” "ft the 
date set for the Twilight Golf Party 
It’s ' “ pot-luck,” "io stir up your 
favorite dish and come with a big 
appetite. If this supper is anything 
like the others I have been to, you can 
expect the best food you ever put a 
fork to.

This month’s "handicaps are out 
and it seems nearly everyone has been 
suffering from the same disease 
“Golfer’s Slump.” 0ne gal told me 
that her handicap had soared to an all 
time high. Now she is back on her 
game—so look out ladies, she will be 
known as the “Unbeatable Helen 
Miller.”

Bill Mitchell and James Stafford 
have taken over in Jack Legge’s 
absence. Things are going smoothly 
with Bill supervising the course and 
James running the Pro Shop.

The course is looking better each 
day as truck load after load of limbs 
are hauled to the dump. All the trees 
are being trimmed so it will be easier

for you to get at that ball that has 
lodged against the trunks.

It seems that each morning this 
past week has given us a promise of 
cooler weather and the return of our 
Winter Texans. I wonder what good 
things they will do for us this time. 
With Hoagy at the helm you can bet 
it will be a job well done.

Carl and Jan Cmsm have taken off 
by motorcycle for New Mexico. 
They are loaded with camping gear, 
gold panning equipment and a big 
spurt of adventure. That Jan is a real 
trooper. Neither snow, rain or sleet 
can keep her from pitching a tent.

Couples
1st Charlie Smith, Mary Stevenson, 
Dan and Marty Isenberg 60 
2nd Bob Gaston, Vicki Nichols, 
E.W. and Louise Williamson 61 
3rd Ralph and Hilda Viestenz, Carl 
Spray and Jan Chism 62

Fishing Report

AMISTAD: Water clear, 84 degrees, 
1 foot low; black bass are fair in 
shallow water early to 3V2 pounds on 
spinners, during the middle of the 
day fishermen use worms in 15 feet 
of water; striper are fairly slow and 
spotty in 80-100 feet on 2 ounces 
Bananahead jigs in the river chan­
nels; crappie are slow; white bass 
are fair around the dam and highway 
90 bridge on slabs and spoons or 
minnow, night fishing has been 
productive; catfish are very good in 
35 to 50 feet of water on shrimp and 
cheese bait.
BRAUN1G: Water murky, 91
degrees, 1 foot low; black bass are 
slow; striper are fair to 5 pounds on 
liver; catfish are excellent to 5 
pound average on liver; redfish are 
fair to 15 pounds downrigging 
spoons in 15 to 20 feet of water. 
CALAVERAS: Water murky, 90 
degrees, 1 foot low; black bass are 
good to 6 pounds on shad; striper 
are good to 4 pounds on chicken 
livers; crappie are slow; catfish are 
good on Bob’s Cheese Baits; corvina 
are good to 11 pounds on live perch; 
redfish are excellent to 20 pounds on 
livd perch.
CHOKE: Water clear, 92 degrees, 
16W feet low; black bass are fair to 8 
pounds on topwaters and Rattle 
Traps early, after 9 a.m. bass are in 
10-20 feet of water and are caught 
on 4-inch Carolina rigged worms; 
striper are slow; crappie are slow, a 
few caught at night in 15 to 30 feet 
of water in river channels on min­
nows; white bass are slow; catfish 
are fair along river channels from 
Calliham Point to Four Fingers in 15 
to 40 feet of water on cheese bait, 
shrimp and nightcrawlers, best cat­
fishing is early.

COLETO CREEK: Water clear, 87 
degrees, normal level; black bass 
are fair to 5 pounds on live perch 
and worms; striper are slow; crappie 
are slow; catfish are fair to 3 pounds 
on perch and soap baited trotlines. 
CORPUS CHRISTI: Water clear, 85 
degrees, 7 feet low ; black bass are 
slow to fair to 4 pounds off points on 
DB#3s and dark worms; striper are 
fair to m  pounds near buoy 
markers on shad and Bananahead 
jigs; crappie are good off state park 
piers and around trees standing in 
12-15 feet of water on minnows; 
white bass are fair under birds near 
Hog Island and buoy birds near Hog 
Island and buoy markers on chrome 
slabs and Roadrunners; blue and 
channel catfish are good to 4 V2 
pounds in baited holes in the river 
channels on prepared cheese baits. 
FALCON: Water clear, 85 degrees, 
16 feet low; black bass are fairly 
good to 9>/4 pounds on jigs in 10 feet 
of water; striper are slow and un­
predictable; crappie are slow; white 
bass are working in the Tiger area 
on top, limits are fairly easy; catfish 
are good to 5 pounds on rod and reel 
in the river channel baited with 
shrimp.
MEDINA: Water mostly clear, 40 
feet low; black bass are fair to 3 
pounds on spinners early; striper are 
slow; crappie are slow; white 
bass are slow; catfish are good to 6 
pounds on nightcrawlers and 
shrimp.
TEXANA: Water murky, 82
degrees, normal level; black bass 
are slow with a few smaller under­
sized fish caught in the jungle area 
on worms; crappie are slow; catfish 
are slow but should be picking up 
because of recent rains.

Bandera
Downs

Officials from Bandera Downs 
have released the schedule of events 
for the first annual Bandera Classics 
Festival, September 16-22, 1991.

The Festival will open with an 
18-hole golf tournament on Monday, 
September 16 beginning at 1:30 p.m. 
at Tapatio Springs Resort in Boerne. 
The tournament format will be a 
four-man, A-B-C-D scramble, and it 
is open to the public. Prizes will be 
awarded to the top teams, longest 
drive and closest to the pin. The $75 
entry fee includes green fees, cart 
rental, range balls, tee and tourn­
ament prizes, and beer and soda. 
Sign-up deadline is Friday, Septem­
ber 13, and the tournament is limited 
to the first 120 paid entrants. For 
more information, contact Mike 
Zlaket at Bandera Downs, (512) 
796-7781, ext. 228.

Cycling will take center stage later 
in the week, as some of the area’s tbp 
cyclists compete in the 1991 Tour De 
Bexar (a.k.a. the San Antonio Cyc- 
cling Championships). This exciting 
race will take place in the heart of the 
beautiful Texas Hill Country beginn­
ing at 7:30 a.m. on Saturday, 
September 21. The challenging 22- 
mile course begins at Mansfield Park 
in Bandera and traverses along 
Highway 16 toward Medina, across 
Highway 2828 and then back down

Highway 3240 to Bandera. Award 
ceremonies and refreshments will 
follow the race and are included in 
the $15 entry fee, as are a pair of 
passes to the horse races and an 
official race t-shirt. For more info­
rmation, contact Bill Simons at (512) 
828-5558.

Runners will be the focus on 
Sunday, September 22, as competit­
ors in the first annual Bandera 
Breeders’ Classics 8K hit the pave­
ment beginning at 8:00 a.m. The race 
will begin at Bandera Downs, travel 
north on Highway 16 to the Bandera 
Chamber of Commerce, and then 
return to the track. An official race 
t-shirt, awards, refreshments, and a 
pair of passes to the horse races are 
all included in the $10 pre-registrat­
ion fee ($12 mail-in; $15 day of race). 
For more information, contact John 
Purnell at (512) 732-1332.

Of course, Bandera Downs will 
also feature exciting Thoroughbred 
and Quarter Horse racing throughout 
the weekend. Post time is 3:00 p.m. 
on Friday, 1:00 p.m. on Saturday and 
Sunday. Sunday’s Card will be high­
lighted by the prestigious Southwest 
Breeders’ Classics Races for top 
Quarter Horses of all ages.

For more information on any of 
these races, contact Don Rhine at 
Bandera Downs, (512) 796-7781, ext. 
227.

u s e  
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★  ★  ★  ★  ★
F o r a free copy of the 248- 
page T exas State T ravel 
G uide, call 1 -8 0 0 /8 8 8 8 -  
T E X . I t ’s the most complete 
guide to Texas cities, parks, 
forests and lakes.

★  ★  ★  ★  ★

AUSTIN-Urban trails to moun­
tain biking trails and all trail subjec­
ts in between will be discussed at 
the Texas Trails Symposium, Nov. 
14-16 at the Crest Hotel here.

The symposium, sponsored by 
the Texas Parks and Wildlife Depar­
tment and the National Park Ser­
vice, is designed to provide technical 
information to recreation pro­
fessionals and citizens wishing to

assist in trail projects, build a trails 
constituency, create an opportunity 
for participants to initiate partner­
ships for new trail projects and 
gather input for statewide and 
regional trails strategies.

Anyone with a trail interest is en­
couraged to attend the symposium 
and its many workshops, field trips 
and strategy sessions, said Kathryn 
Nichols, symposium coordinator.

1 here will be concurrent sessions 
on November 14 and 16. Topics of 
discussion include resolving user 
conflicts on multi-use trails, ad­
dressing landowner concerns, ex­
ploring rail-trail opportunities in 
Texas and developing and main­
taining trails while protecting 
resources.

On Nov. 15, the general session 
will deal with rail-trail benefits.

B ridge Anyone
by Dot Burrow .AS\ 

#

Ladies
Ladies Day Scramble:
1st 43.5 Chick Cruse, Eileen 
Voracek and Gene Graham 
2nd 43-7 Helen Miller, Patti Barnett 
and Betty Inman
3rd Luella Gilliland, Marty Isen­
berg, Betty Dennis and Dorothy 
Wood.

Postscript
A quote from an unnamed golfer 

when it looked like he might make a 
hole in one on #11. “ If that ball goes 
in the hole, I’ll "give each of you 
$10.00 if you won’t fell anyone. I 
can’t tâfford another ‘hole in one 
party.’

Ladies, don’t forget to register for 
the “ Sugar and Spice” tournament 
October 18 and 19. It includes the 
Fiesta and Fashion Show.

Pesticide
Conference

AUST1N-A special conference on 
pesticides and health in the state of 
Texas will be held October 7-9 at the 
Wyndham Hotel in San Antonio, 
Agriculture Commissioner Rick 
Perry today announced.

The conference is being sponsored 
by the Texas Department of Agricul­
ture, the University of Texas Health 
Science Center-San Antonio, the 
Southwest Center for Occupational 
and Environmental Health, the Na­
tional Migrant Resource Program, 
the Texas Department of Health, the 
U.S. Environmental Protection 
Agency and the University of Calif- 
ornia-Davis Agricultural Health and 
Safety Center and School of Medic­
ine.

On October 9, a special symposium 
will review the process of regulating 
pesticides, with a particular emphasis 
on health risk assessment for pestic­
ide chemicals.

“ Contemporary agriculture is a 
major user of pesticides,” Wirry said. 
“ As a regulatory body, we’rer conti­
nually striving to improve the already 
stringent pesticide regulation system 
to further ensure that America’s food 
supply is produced in the best way 
possible for consumers, farmers and 
the environment.”

The conference will address the 
most salient issues in pesticides and 
medicine, including toxicology, tre­
atment of pesticide emergencies, 
respiratory diseases, neurobehavioral 
effects and other chronic conditions. 
Seminars are targeted at health care 
personnel who are likely to treat 
patients exposed to pesticides, agric­
ulture officials with responsibility for 
pesticide regulations, insurance spec­
ialists and attorneys in the agricultur­
al health field, pesticide applicators, 
farm worker representatives and 
others concerned about the health 
hazards of agricultural pesticides.

“ We’vtf assembled a very talented 
group to share their expertise on 
health and human effects from 
pesticide exposure,” Perry said. 
“This outstanding conference will 
provide training in preventing, rec­
ognizing and managing pesticide 
illnesses and offer guidance to the 
regulatory policy makers for these 
chemicals.” ""

The U.T. Health Science Center- 
San Antonio is offering continuing 
education credits for the conference. 
TDA will award 18 continuing educ­
ation units for pesticide applicators 
for participation in the conference 
for all three days.

For further information and tele­
phone registration, call the U.T. 
Health Science Center at (512) 567- 
4444.

On Tuesday, September 3rd the 
Fort Clark Duplicate Club met with 5 
tables playing the Mitchell Move­
ment. In North-South position, Hel­
en Lynch and Flo Stafford won 1st 
with Ann Hibler and Betty Inman 
coming in 2nd. East-West direction 
had Eileen Voracek and Joan Lindley 
winning 1st and Anita Korbel and 
Tina Bauguess second. On Sunday 
with 4 tables playing the Howell 
Movement, 1st place was won by 
Norma Gould and Anita Korbel with 
a tie for 2nd between the pairs of Ben 
Pingenot, Tina Bauguess, Ruth Wilks 
and Marge Batchelor.

Rotary Club 
Hole In One Contest

Time: 1:00 to 5:00 p.m.
Date: Sat., Sept. 14, 1991 , , r

Place: Hole #2 - - - Par-3 Course

HIT! THROW! KICK! I OSS! ROLL! 
(We don’t care)

>\ A GOLF BALL TO #2
N 3 shots for $1.00 Everyone Welcome

For A Hole In One
$100 Savings Bond -  First State Bank 

Prizes Will Be Given Each Hour
Super “S ” Store 
Bumper - To - Bumper

Jean's Nash Dry Goods 
Kinney County Wool & Mohair

Davis Hardware 
Conolv Ranch

SymposiumTo DiscussTrails

Days Past
by D o n h y  Pavne

i

September, 1773 - Daniel Boone, in 
defiance of both Indian and Colonial 
wishes, heads into Kentucky, where 
the Indians attack and rout his par­
ty-
September 7, 1778 - Shawnee In­
dians attacked and laid siege to 
Boonesborough, Kentucky, but the 
town didn’t fall.
September 3, 1783 - Britain and the 
united States signed the Treaty of 
Paris, formally ending the 
Revolutionary War. Under terms of 
the treaty, the United States 
receives all territory as far west as 
the Mississippi River. Florida was 
ceded by England to Spain. 
September, 1784 - Pennsylvania 
allowed Connecticut settlers in the 
Wyoming Valley area of Pen­
nsylvania to return to their lands, 
thus ended a conflict.

September 22, 1784 - The Russians 
founded their first permanent set­
tlement in Alaska on Kodiak Island

(Three Saints Bay). The group of 
192 settlers was led by the Russian 
fur trader Gregory Shelikov. Bet­
ween 1784 and 1786, the little party 
was harassed by the local Eskimos, 
but they became secure in two 
years.
September 10, 1791 - Indian ac­
tivity in the Ohio Territory made the 
construction of Forts necessary at 
Hamilton, Saint Clair, Jeffer­
son,Greenville and Recovery. 
September 29, 1804 - Settlers in 
present day Missouri held a conven­
tion and sent a memorial to 
Congress demanding a redress of 
grievances and a greater measure of 
self-government.

September 23, 1805 - Lt. Zebulon 
Pike represented the U. S. Army 
and purchased from the Minnesota 
Sioux for $2000 in wares a nine- 
square mile tract at the mouth of the 
Minnesota River. Here, he helped

set up a military post, Fort Snelling, 
the first United States Government 
presence in this region. This was the 
first of many treaties and 
negotiations (to 1889) by which the 
Sioux lost their ancestral lands. 
September, 1807 - A large three-

company expedition including a 
military wing under Lt. Joseph 
Kimball and Ensign National Pryor 
left St. Louis hoping to join Manuel 
Lisa who was building Ft. Raymond 
on the Yellowstone River, at the 
mouth of the Big Horn.

Selma Pathfinders To Visit
For the third year, the Selma 

Pathfinders Volkssports Club is com­
ing to Fort Clark Springs. The Club 
will be celebrating their 10th Anni­
versary by sponsoring 10 Volkssport- 
ing events held at historic old Fort 
Clark on September 20, 21, and 22.

Selma Pathfinders invite and en­
courage area residents to participate 
in these Volkssports events. Phyllis 
Eagan, President of the Selma Pat­
hfinders, stressés that Vol- 
kssporting is a family sport which is 
noncompetitive. “The events are 
noncompetitive - not tests of speed or 
endurance - and participants are 
encouraged to take each event at their 
own individual pace” Recording to 
Phyllis.

Volkssporting began in Germany 
and literally translates into “ Sport of 
the people.” "nie International Volk- 
ssport Verband (IVV) was formed to 
establish volkssporting throughout 
the world. In the United States, the 
national organization is the American 
Volkssporting Association (AVA).

The aim of Volkssporting is to 
promote good health and consists of 
organized events designed to appeal 
to people of all ages. SO YOUNG OR 
OLD OR IN BETWEEN, everyone is 
invited to participate in Selma Path­
finders 10th Anniversary Volkssports 
events.

Events include two night walks and 
two day walks of 10 kilometers (6.2 
miles) each, two 25 kilometer Bike 
Rides, and four 300 Meter Swim. 
Night Walks will be Friday, Sep 20 
and Saturday, Sep 21, with partici­
pants registering to start anytime 
between 4:00 PM and 6:00 PM, and 
finishing no later than 9:00 PM.

The two day walks, 10K each, will 
start between 7:00 P.M. and 12:00 
Noon on Saturday, Sep 21 and 
Sunday Sep 22, finishing by 3:00 
P.M. The four 300 M swims will start 
10:00 A.M. to 3:00 P.M. on Satur­
day, Sep 21 and Sunday, Sep 22, 
finishing by 4:00 P.M.

Those who register and complete 
the required distances are declared

winners and are eligible to receive the 
appropriate awards. This year the 
awards are photoetched with epoxy 
domes on a 1 1/4” hSt pin, depicting 
areas of historic significance on Fort 
Clark. A patch has been designed in 
the shape of a horseshoe to accom­
modate the hat pins.

For those who pre-registered be­
fore September 10, cost of the medals 
are $3.50. After that date, cost is 
$4.00 fprr the rppjjals. Cost of the 
patch is $4.00.

Those participants who desire IVV 
credit only, the cost to participate is 
$1.50 for each event. If no medal or 
credit is desired, anyone may walk, 
bike, or swim for free.

Join the Selma Pathfinders and 
other AVA members in celebrating 10 
years of Volkssporting, exercising in 
Fort Clark Springs stress-free and 
beautiful environment.

For information, contact Phyllis 
Eagan, President, Selma Pathfinders, 
at (512) 496-1402.

Digging For Your Roots
Did you ever think you would like 

to trace your family history—to see 
where you came from: whether you 
are related to royalty or your 
ancestors helped fight for America’s 
independence? Perhaps there is a 
town that your ancestors settled and 
that town bears your family name.

Many of us want to know our 
roots, but think it would be too 
difficult. We fear we would have to 
travel from courthouse to courthouse 
between here and Plymouth Rock. 
The first place to go, is to the Church

of Jesus Christ of Latter-day Saints 
Family History Center on Ruth Street 
in Uvalde. What a gold mine for 
genealogists, and it is easy and 
interesting! The volunteers working 
at the Center are friendly and helpful. 
There is a plethora of information on

microfilm, microfiche, and ROM 
computer discs. The volunteers teach 
how to look for family roots and how 
to use their equipment.

If you are at all interested in 
Finding out who you are and where

you came from, you will want to 
attend Southwest Texas Genealogical 
Society’s Beginners Workshop on 
September 28, from 1 to 4 p.m. in the 
Reading Room of the Uvalde Civic 
Center. To cover costs of copying 
material and payment to the instruct­
or, there will be a registration fee of 
$10.00 before September 21. After 
September 21, the fee will be $12.00. 
For further information and for 
registration, contact Hannah Castell- 
aw, 201 E. Oppenheimer Uvalde, 
78801 or call (512) 278-5454.

EYE SPECIALIST 
RICHARD D. SHINDLE M.D.

4600 Broadway - Suite No. 118 
San Antonio, Texas 78209

A N N O U N C E S
O PEN IN G  O F E Y E  C A R E  S E R V IC E S

UNITED MEDICAL CENTER 
201 JAMES STREET 

BRACKETTVILLE, TEXAS 78832 
(512)563-2434

Thursdays: 10:00 A.M. to 5:00 P.M.

Former Patients and New Patients Welcomed 
Medicare And Medicaid Accepted - No Optical Services Provided

CALL 1-800-255-1502 OR 1-512-826-8040  
FOR AN APPOINTMENT

"Dedicated To The Preservation O f Sight //
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In 1990 the Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service initiated a 
program to try to assist in reducing 
the amount of material going onto 
landfills. The “Don’t Bag It” 
program is designed to have an at­
tractive lawn that is mowed more 
frequently with the shorter grass 
clippings left on the lawn. These 
dippings left on the lawn contribute 
to lawn nutrient needs and do not 
need to be hauled away to fill 
precious landfill space.

There are a variety of materials 
placed in landfills. Some of these 
materials are recyclable and some 
are not. One significant solid waste 
product that does not have to go into 
landfill at all and is certainly 
recyclable is grass clippings. Across 
this country, ton after ton of grass 
clippings is deposited each year in 
city and county landfills. The clip­
pings not only take up space, but 
cost thousands of dollars to tran­
splant.

Grass clippings are a valuable 
resource. They contain ap­
proximately 4 percent nitrogen, 2 
percent potassium, .5 percent 
phosphorus and the essential 
micronutrients. Each cutting of 
grass blades decomposes quickly to 
serve as a season-long nutrient sour­
ce.

When the clippings are sup­
plemented by a 5 pound per square 
foot lawn application of 3-1-2 ratio 
slow release fertilizer on May 1 and 
a similar application with a quick 
release fertilizer in October, there 
will be fewer, if any lawns that look 
as good.

Golf courses are characterized as 
the optimum example of turf 
management. Golf courses do not 
bag their lawn clippings. Instead 
they are left on the turf and provide 
nutrients to the existing grass. 
Remember, the; key to this concept 
is mowing more frequently.

Remove your lawn bagger and 
put the chute door in place. Some

- mowers have an automatic door that 
falls in place when the bagger is

- removed. Other mowers have a 
manual guard that must be bolted in 
place.

Mow the lawn every four to six 
days whenever the grass has added 
one half of its mowing height. (2 in-

'ch mowing height - mow at 3 inches)
Water to keepThe lawn green and 

only when it needs it. The turf needs 
water when your foot impression 
lingers in the grass or when you

- notice a slight color change.
In this county, you will need to 

water about every five to six days.
■ Most hose sprinklers put one-fourth

to one-third of an inch of water per 
hour. If the water runs off, let the 
water soak in, for about one hour, 
then continue watering. The best 
time to water is early in the mor­
ning.

It’s that time of year; time when 
football games are being played, the 
days begin to get shorter and 4-H 
projects and activities get going.

Experts who sift through the 
alarming statistics on teen pregnan­
cy, high school drop-outs and 
juvenile crime tend to agree that 
many troubled youngsters suffer 
from low self-esteem.

Building self-esteem has been a 
part of the 4-H program from the 
beginning. Programs are designed 
to help young people develop life 
skills and form attitudes that enable 
them to become self-directing, 
productive and contributing mem­
bers of society.

Most of these programs are aimed 
at reaching youngsters before they 
make critical mistakes in life.

Last year, more than 300,000 
young Texans participated in 
varioius projects and activities in
2.500 4-H clubs and other groups, 
3,400 school enrichment programs 
an 319 camping sessions.

The 4-H member learns by doing, 
which has always been the rule in 4- 
H. Youngsters participate in various 
projects that deal with public 
speaking, forestry and wildlife, 
marine science and many other 
topics.

Kinney County 4-H members are 
active in projects such as: foods and 
nutrition, shooting sports, beef, 
sheep and goats, swine, rabbits, 
clothing and textiles and activities 
like method demonstrations and 
illustrated talks.

More than 70,000 adults and
7.500 older teens volunteer to help 
guide 4-H members. These volun­
teers serve as role models for such 
traditional values as free enterprise, 
work ethics and community service.

In Texas, 64 percent of all 4-H 
participants live in towns and cities 
with a population larger than 
10,000. Of these, 42 percent live in 
cities, 14 percent live in towns and 8 
percent live in suburbs. Twenty 
percent of the youngsters are in 
towns with a population less than 
10,000 and 16 percent live on farms 
and ranches.

Our'cbiinty 4-H club has 91 mem­
bers enrolled and 21 adults serving 
in a volunteer capacity. If you are in­
terested in volunteering your time or 
joining the 4-H club, call or come by 
the Kinney County office of the 
Texas Agricultural Extension Ser­
vice.

W ildlife Field  Day
The Texas A&M University station 

at Sonora is planning its first wildlife 
management field day Oct. 8.

Organizers hope the program will 
offer something for everyone inter­
ested in native Hill Country wildlife, 
whether it’s the white-tailed deer or 
the black-capped vireo.

The research station has conducted 
research aimed at improving range- 
land in the Edwards Plateau for more 
than 75 years, said Dr. Dale Rollins, 
extension wildlife specialist.

“The station is best known for its 
sheep and goat work, but it also has 
documented the effects of various 
range and livestock management 
practices on the area’s 'wildlife,”
Rollins said.

The morning session will begin at 9 
o’clock under the direction of Sutton 
County Extension Agent Preston 
Faris, the moderator. The first 
speaker is Dr. Butch Taylor, superin­
tendent of the station, who will talk 
about “ How Range Management 
Affects Deer.” “*■'

“ Sheep, Goats and Deer: Who’s 
Competing, Who’s Winning?” IS the 
subject of a talk by Dr. Ken 
Risenhoover, assistant professor with 
Texas A&M University’s Wildlife and 
fisheries department.

Following a break, the program 
will resume with Dr. Fred Smeins, 
professor in A&M’s Department of 
Rangeland Ecology and Manage­

ment, speaking on how cedars affect 
wildlife. The morning session will 
conclude with two talks: “ Managing 
Wild Turkey” lfy Don Davis, Texas 
Parks and Wildlife Department bio­
logist, and “ Why Aren’t There More 
Quail in the Hill Country” *̂ >y 
Rollins.

John Allen, Edwards County ext­
ension agent, will moderate the 
afternoon session. The program in­
cludes two talks -- the first, “Why 
Deer Management Fails,” ^¡11 be 
given by Dr. Charles DeYoung, 
research scientist with the Caesar 
Klebert Research Institute at Kings­
ville. The second, “ Mixing Sheep, 
Goats, Cattle, Deer and Hunters,” 
will be given by Forrest Armke, 
foreman of the Ford Ranch at 
Melvin.

The day’s Activities will conclude 
with five field tours — the station’s 
deer research facilities, prescribed 
burning for deer management, deer 
diets, cool-season food plots, and 
electric deer-proof fencing.

The program is sponsored by the 
Texas Agricultural Experiment St­
ation, the Texas Agricultural Exten­
sion Service, the Texas Wildlife 
Association, and the Texas Section of 
the Society for Range Management.

The registration fee is $7 at the 
door. Further information is avail­
able from Butch Taylor, telephone 
(915) 387-3168, or Dr. Rollins, (915) 
653-4576.

R A R K S D A L E C A F E
ROBBIE IS COOKIN' NOW !
OPEN 6 DAYS A WEEK!

All You Can Eat Catfish on Saturdays $5.95 
CLOSED MONDAYS

Tuesday, Wednesday, and Thursday, 7 a.m. - 9 p.m.
Friday & Saturday, 7 a.m. - 9 p.m.

Sunday, 7 a.m. - 2 p.m.
512-234-9153 Barksdale, T exas Great Home Cooking g

K.C. Committee Charles Foust, Raymond Frerich and Gordon Lackey 
count wool ballots.

The Kinney County ASCS Office 
has just conducted a referendum on 
Advertising and Promotion of Lamb 
and Wool to determine whether wool 
producers approve of a new agree­
ment between the Administrator, 
AMS and the American Sheep Indus­
try Association, Inc., (ASI). If 
producers approve the referendum, 
deductions will be made from shorn 
wool and unshorn lamb payments for 
1991 through 1995 to finance ASI’s 
activities.

In June, the ASCS office conduct­
ed a mohair referendeum. The mo­
hair producers voted to continue 
deductions from the U.S. Depart­
ment of Agriculture’s 'Commodity 
Credit Corporation mohair incentive 
payments to finance promotion of 
mohiar. The referendum passed by 
90% in Texas.

Jan Wanoreck, County Executive 
Director of the Kinney County ASC 
Committee, said the federal support 
price for 1991 shorn wool marketings 
is $1.88 per round, 6 cents per pound 
more than the 1990 level. Mohair 
marketings will be supported at 
$4.448 per pound, about 8.4 cents per 
pound less than the 1990 rate.

Tony Frerich, K.C. Wool and 
Mohair and Jan Wanoreck, CEO, 
K.C. ASCS.

The price support payments are 
computed as a percentage of each 
producers’ returns from grease basis 
sales. The percentage is the amount 
required to raise the national average 
price for 1991 wool up to the 
$1.88-per-pound support price.

Mohair will be supported at 85 
percent of the percentage of parity at 
which shorn wool is supported. The 
payment rate will be determined in a 
manner similar to shorn wool.

Farm Safety Week
By DORTHY PAYNE
Brackett News Staff Writer

September 16 - 22 is National 
Farm Safety Week.

Practice farm safety, follow the 
ten commandments of farm safety:

1. Keep machinery in repair.
2. Operate tractor safely. Know 

and obey all traffic laws.
3. Be a safe driver.
4. Be “fire-sighted.” Don’t smoke 

around barns.

5. Speak to animals when ap­
proaching them.

6. Keep your things systematically, 
have a place for everything.

7. Watch your step to prevent falls, 
keep ladders in repair.

8. Follow printed safety instruc­
tions.

9. Don’t let small children ride on, 
or drive machinery.
10. Apply first aid promptly. Keep a 
first aid kit in the home; in the barn; 
and on the tractor.

Totally Texas Menu
By RICK PERRY
Texas Agriculture Commissioner

Americans today enjoy the most 
plentiful, healthful and affordable 
food supply in the world. Our 
farmers and ranchers generate a 
bounty of the highest quality and 
purity. And they do so with such 
efficiency that we spend less for food 
than any other country in the world.

In Texas, our food and fiber 
system is our state’s Second largest 
industry. We are a leading producer 
of a host of food products. In fact, it 
may surprise you to know the extent 
of the commodities raised here. 
They’rê as diverse as the people who 
grow them.

Texas is known for its beef, red 
grapefruit, winter vegetables, spring 
onions and a whole range of Mexican 
food products. But did you know 
that we also produce flavored rice, 
wild game, gourmet cheeses, tilapia, 
free-range chicken, rabbit sausage, 
cottonseed cooking oil and even 
specialty herbs?

If you didn’t,'if  you are surprised 
by any of the Texas-grown goods I 
just mentioned, I want to encourage 
you to contact us at the Texas 
Department of Agriculture. Use us as 
a resource. Our marketing specialists 
can serve as a link between consumers 
who want to buy menus, too. The 
diversity of our goods makes a

Identify 
The Picture

The first 
person to 
come by The 
Brackett 
News and 
correctly 
identify this 
picture will 
be given a 
Brackett 
News Cap.

No Winner Last Week. Try again.
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Dr. Mario Leal
Family Practice & Geriatrics

Minor Surgery ;
G raduate o f U.N.A.M. 
Post Graduate U.A.N.L.

□

“Totally Texas” menu totally poss­
ible. Think about it -  a special menu 
featuring a full array of Texas 
products. It will be a meal your guests 
will never forget.
A “Totally Texas” ''ttienu might 
feature:

Fresh Gulf Coast Shrimp Cocktail 
French 1015 Onion Soup

Grilled Axis Venison 
or Texas Beef Tenderloin

Winter Garden Vegetables Medley 
Aromatic Rice with Texas 

Mushrooms

Fresh Blueberry-Peach Cobbler 
or Chocolate-Pecan Decadence Cake

1988 Cabernet Sauvignon 
& Texas Sparkling Waters

Whether this particular menu 
tempts your taste buds or not, my 
point is this: Texas produces a wide 
variety of wholesome and exceptional 
commodities — grown, in some cases, 
not far from your tables. So why not 
take advantage of the proximity and 
the quality? Buy Texas whenever you 
can. We all benefit, producer and 
consumer alike.___________________

Nutrition 
Center Menu

September 16-20 ,1991
Mo n d a y , s e p t . 16

Baked Chicken 
Pork & Beans - Cole Slaw 

Hot Rolls - Applesauce 
TUESDAY, SEPT. 17 

H. B. Patties 
Potatoes W/Tomatoes 
Cauliflower W/Cheese 

Biscuits - Chocolate Pudding 
WEDNESDAY, SEPT. 10 

Ham - Candied Yams 
Mixed Vegs. - Hot Rolls 

Carrot Cake 
THURSDAY, SEPT. 19 
Beef Tips W/Noodles 

Creamed Potatoes 
Fresh Garden Salad 

Hot Rolls - Fruited Jello 
FRIDAY, SEPT. 20 
Charbroiled Steaks 

Creamy Noodles - Corn 
Biscuits - Pears

Milk. Margarine, and Beverage 
Served With Every Meal

Doctors O ffice in :
F arm acia  Plaza

Where you will find extensive m edicines 
perfum es at low  prices.

Galeana 205 ORIENTE on corner Home Phone 2-07-96 
of Mqtamoros
Consults Everyday 10 AM -10 PM Cd. Acuna,

B 1 = E 3 FII

Las Moras Inn 
Restaurant

Fort Clark Springs 
512-563-2290 

MEXICAN BUFFET 
Friday Ni^ht Starting At 5:00 p.m. 

Hot Food And Salad Bar 
With Tea or Coffee 

$5.95
Menu Available 7:00 A.M. -10:00 P.M.

MEDICAL CONSULTANT 
SPECIALISTS

DR. HECTOR A. GUTIERREZ G.: U.A.N.L. Orthopedic & Fractures -  
Micro Surgery of the Knee

DR. JOSE G. RODRIGUEZ VILLAREAL: U.A.N.L. General Surgery & 
Castro Intestinal Endoscopia -  Proctology

DR. LUIS ALBERTO CRUZ GANDURA: General Surgery

DRA. ELIZABETH RODRIGUEZ XÓCHIHUA: U.A.N.L. General 
Median"
DR. HECTOR MARTINEZ GARCIA: U.A.N.L. Urologist

DR. JUAN JOSÈ CERVANTES GARCIA: U.N.A.L. Neurology - 
Neurosurgeon

h t : t a k e  m e d ic a l  In su r a n c e

9:00 - 8:00 
Mon. - Sat.
Office Phone: 2-34-60

Madero 285 Ote. 
1 Block from 

International Bridge 
Acuña. Mexico

2 |3 14 5 6 7 8 9 10 11 12 .3
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i * i  Daytime Television Guide
FRI, SEP 13 - Weekdays THU, SEP 19

6 AM 6:30 7 AM 7:30 8 AM 8:30 9 AM 9:30 10 AM 10:30 11 AM 11:30
KLRN CD Q (:15) Wthr Varied Varied Rogers Sesame Stnrat ITV Programming
UNI (D Hola America Maria Noticias La Movida El Lobo Cristal
KM OLCSO News Today Regis & Kathie Lee Hd. ol Cover One on Closer
KENS ®  e News CBS This Morning Sally Jessy Raphael Price Is Right Young S Restless
KSAT 03 O Good Morning S A Good Morning America Varied Home All My Children
FAM O Batman Popeye Augle Littles Waltons 700 Club Sheila Paid Program Varied
TBS E Q Tom & Jerry Jeannie Bewitched Little House Varied Perry Mason
WGN 03 Success-N-Ufe Banana Bozo Varied Magnum, p.l. Joan Rivers Geraldo
ESPN œ (Coni) Nation’s Business SportsCenter Varied Ivaried Getting Fit Workout Body Body
NICK <B Wizard Yogi Insp. HeathcliH Lassie Maya Bee Eureeka's Castle Elephant Penner David, Little
LIFE œIt Figures Workout Attitudes Growing Baby Gourmet Sister T. Ullman Open Image Workshoo
TNN (B Oil Air VideoMoming Cookin' Varied
DISC <D OH Air Assignment Discovery | Varied Your World Pasquale Do It Sell So.
MAX <B (5:301 Varied Varied Varied
TMC S3 Varied Varied Varied Varied
HBO 03Varied Babar Wizard ol Varied Varied Varied
DISN © Mickeyl Care Donald Pooh Tree Dumbo Varied Lunch Box Music Box

TBS © O  
WGN___ Œ)

NICK (B 
UFE (B
TNN
DISC
WAX
TMC

DISN

News
News
Varied
Varied
News 
Body by 
Noozles 
Supernal*.
Top Card 
Rendezvou. Antiques 
(:15) Varied 
Varied

I A. Gritllth ¡Honeymoo.
Tom and Jerry's 
Varied

Shop Drop 
Be a Star

Util' Bits I Lassie
Moonlighting 
Crook, On Stage 

Your

Varied
Attitudes

Varied
Varied

Top Card
Pasquale

Varied Monstr

Varied Ivaried Varied

Varied
Varied

Varied

Varied
Varied
Supermark.

Read 
Noticiero 
NBC News 
CBS News 
ABC News 
New Zorro 
A. Griffith 
Jeannle
Up Close 
Varied
Shop Drop

Club Dance
Do H Sell ISq.

V ld e o P M _____________ __________
M Nature IWIIdIHe I Beyond 2000

Varied Varied

1Varied Varied

Varied Varied Varied

Varied Raccoons Pound Kids. Inc. I Mickey ¡Varied"

Seasoning-Jar Sower: An easy 
way to sow tiny seeds like carrot, 
lettuce, or radish is to use a 
seasoning jar with a shaker lid. Ch­
oose one with the right size holes for 
your seeds, then just shake it along 
the garden row.

Plastic film containers - that come 
with rolls of 35-mm film make good 
containers for traveling vitamins. Be 

i sure to clean and dry them com­
pletely before you pop in those pills.

Coffee-Can Applicator: A coffee 
can makes a handy shaker for ap­
plying ashes to your garden. Simply 
punch holes in the plastic lid with a 
leather punch, fill the can with 
ashes, and you’re ready to go. Keep 
an extra unpunched lid to use as a 
cover when storing the ashes.

We Care!

T . V .

Guide
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Las M oras Inn 
R estaurant

Fort C lark Springs
512-563-2290

EARLY BIRD SPECIAL 
Sunday Ni^ht Through Thursday Ni^ht 

10% DISCOUNT ON ALL MEALS 
5:00 p.m. Until 7:00 p.m.

s s s s  I

FRIDAY Prime Time SEPTEMBER 13 FRIDAY Wee Hours SEPTEMBER 13
6 PM 6:30 7 PM 7:30 8 PM 8:30 9 PM 9:30 10 PM 10:30 11 PM 11:30

KLRN CD Q 321 Bus. MacNeil/Lehrer D.C. Week Wall St San McLaughli. Conflrm. Hlg iillght Dr. Who
UNI CD Estrella II Came Dona Beija/Dona Bella De Nadle Paul Rodriguez Noticiero La Movida
K M O L ffiO Wheel Jeopardyl Real Ufe Expose Movie: Amityville: The Evil Escapes News (:35) Tonight Show (:35) Mdng.

KENS CS B News In Edition WKRP Anniversary Movie: Aiwa)s  Remember 1 Love You News (:35) Cheer. (D5) Cosb. Jettersons
KSAT © ONews EnL Fmly I Comedy Strangers | Grow'g 20/20 News (:35) Boss. (D5) Hunter
FAM OMovie: Legend ol Prince Valiant Scarecrow and King 700 Club Maniac VWeosyrcrasy Rascals
TBS SO Hillbillies Major League Baseball Dodgers at Braves (L) 1:15) Movie: Legend ol Billie Jean (:15) Dead and Buried
WGN Q3 Niqht A. Griffith | Movie: Oh, Godl You Devil News Malor League Baseball White Sox at Angels (L)
ESPN (DSports Major League Baseball (L) Major League Baseball (L)
NICK IBInsp. Looney Morir I Get Smart Get Smart I Dragnet I Hitchcock Green Mr. Ed Am. Morii Doble
LIFE (BT. Ullman Open L A  Law Movie: Ruby and Oswald Spenser For Hire H’s Garry Molly
TNN <BIConl) Be a Star On Stage |Texas Nashville Now I Crook, On Stage Texas Nashville Now
DISC <D Rendezvou. Wld. Creatures War Firepower War Years Wildlife Wild Side Discovery Showcase
MAX <D A Star Is Bom Movie: Whispers Prevw. Movie: Desperate Hours Corporate Attairs
TMC S3 Movie: Flattiners I Movie: Air America Movie: Navy SEALS
HBO ED Karate Kid III Movie: Friday the 13th ----1Movie: Friday me 13m, Pari 2 £ 2 E !______ Movie: Cast a Deadly Spell
DISN © Quarterback Princess Movie: Son of Lassie Movie: Good Old Boy ___________ Ready Gol | Here

SATURDAY Morning SEPTEMBER 14
6 AM 6:30 7 AM 7:30 8 AM 8:30 9 AM 9:30 10 AM 10:30 11 AM 11:30

KLRN CD B Sociologie. Sociologie. Grow'g Grow'g Spanish Spanish Being Being Psycholog. Psycholog. Fam Fam

UNI CD N. Familia Buena World Vision Chlspavtsion Carrusel Ches pi rito

KMOLCDO Farm Chip Yo, Yogil Captain N ProStars Wish Kid Spacecats By the By the Paid Program

KENS ( £  B New Popeye Capi Mother Garfield and Friends Teen Ninja Turtle Back Waldo? Ballad ol Smokey Bear

KSAT ©  B (Cont) Bob Vila Winnie Land ol Darkwing Beedej ulc. Hammerm. Dark Bugs & Twenty Ghostbusl IWknd

FAM B Gerbert Littles Augle Doggie F’stone New Popeye Backstge Burt WoH Virginian

TBS (SO Bonanza WCW Power Hour National Geographic Explorer Happy College

WGN CDLarry World Farm People Challando Chicago Business Paid NWA Pro Wrestling Soul Train

ESPN (D Outdoor Fly Ultimate Outdoors Fishin’ Fly J. Houston Mark College GameDay College

NICK (B Kids Court CL HeathcliH Insp. Insp. Yogi Yogi Out SK8 TV Dennis Dennis

LIFE œSell-Improvement Guide Baby E.R. image Workshop Attitudes Gourmet Sister

TNN (B OH Air Backyard Garden Aleene Country Side by Go Our Remodelin. Great

DISC <BOH Air Deal An. Profile World Wildlife Wild Side Creatures

12 AM 12:30 1 AM 1:30 2 AM 2:30 3 AM 3:30 4 AM j 4:30 5 AM 5:30
KLRN ® Q OH Air
UNI (D (Cont) ¡World Prog. Fortuna Estrella II Came ¡Dona Bejja/Dona Bella ¡De Nadie El Libro de Piedra

K M 0 L ® O (:05) Letterman (D5) Friday Nite (D5) News l(:40) Famil. (:10) Movie: Arthur CNN News

KENS ( D O Mama's Paid Trump News Movie: Johnny Rocco l(:45) Say ¡Movie: Captain Mephisto
KSAT ©  O (:05) NighL (:35) News (:10) EnL (:40) E.DJ. OH Air
FAM O Little Rascals 700 Club Paid Program Paid Program

TBS ©  O Dead and Buried (:15) Movie: Dark (:15) Night Tracks ¡Hogan Gomer Between

WGN (D (Cont) Movie: Conan the Barbarian Movie: Local Hero Lou Grant
ESPN (D (Cont) Sports NFL Glory Days Up Close College Football Houston at Miami (R) School

NICK © Patty Duke My 3 Sons Donna America Get Smart Dragnet Hitchcock Am. ¡Doble ¡Patty Duke Lassie Llttr Bits
LIFE (B Sell-Improvement Guide Sett-Improvement Guide
TNN (B (Cont) Crook, Club Dance OH Air
DISC © Wld. Dive to Creatures OH Air
MAX 03 (Cont) (:4D) Movie: Hardware (:15) Movie: Night Angel l(:45) Movie: Backstreet Dreams Von
TMC S3 Movie: Red Surf Movie: Flattiners Showcase Bom Yesterday
HBO €D (:10) Inside me NFL (:10) Movie: Weekend Warriors l(:45) Movie: Further Adv., Buck (¿0) Crypt Tates Running on Empty
DISN ff i Here Comes Jordan <:05) Movie: Herbie Goes Bananas ¡Movie: Cheetah ¡Oz. Mousercis. ¡Tree

SATURDAY A fte rn o o n  SEPTEMBER 14

m a x  tm
TM C ___ 8j)
HB0
DISN

(5:30) Movie: Von Ryan’s Express | Movie: Mad About You
Bom Yesterday
Running on Empty
Pooh I Dumbo

Movie: Kentuckian
Babar
Wuzzles

Wizard of
Pound

E. Brown
Fraggle

Movie: Rebel Without a Cause Mister Roberts
Movie: Return oi Swamp Thing | Movie: Pick-Up Artist

Movie: Big Bad John I Inside die NFL~
Donald Movie: Here Come the Utiles Mouse

Police Academy 4
Crystalstone

12 PM 12:30 1 PM 1:30 2 PM 2:30 3 PM 3:30 4 PM 4:30 5 PM 5:30
KLRN ® 0 Travels New Joy of My Studio Nancy Holidays Cooking Gourmet Gourmet Victory New House
UNI ® Johnny Canales Boxeo Telemuslca Ballando Tu Musica Toda Risa Noticiero
K M 0 L ® Q Golden Quarterback NBC SportsWorid Olympic Showcase Miss America Special News NBC News
KENS ®  O Star Trek: Next This Is ¡Baseball Major League Baseball Split-National Broadcast (L) News CBS News
KSAT ©  O College Football Louisiana State at Texas A&M. College Football Notre Dame at Michigan (L) (JIP)
FAM O (Cont) ¡Wagon Train ¡Big Valley Gunsmoke Bonanza Bordertow. ¡New Zorro
TBS © O (11:30) College Football UCLA at Tennessee jL) CHIPS CHIPS Wrestling
WGN 03 Movie: Sidney Shorn A Girl's Best Friend ¡Movie: Navy Wife 21 Jump Street Hangln' In
ESPN m (11:30) Colleige Football Louisville at Ohio State (L) ¡Ftball GoH PGA Golf Hardees Classic, 3rd round (L) Sports
NICK © Lassie Flipper White ¡Cricket Around the World Cani on Make Double ¡Salute Would Freshmen
LIFE (B Supermark. It's Garry Moonlighting Hotel Spenser For Hire L A  Law e
TNN (B Special Cel. NASCAR R8dng The Splittire Spark Plugs 200. |(:35) American Sports Cavalcade Bassmaste. ¡Buckmasle.
DISC © An American Album Creatures ¡Discovery Showcase ¡Creatures ¡Coast to Coast Beyond 2000
MAX © Mister Roberts Movie: Shrimp on the Barbie |(:45) Movie: Scavengers ¡Movie: Cinema Paradiso
TMC S3 Movie: Pumi Up the Volume ¡Movie: Wltnrss ¡Movie: Taking Care oi Business 1(551 Glotv
HBO ED (Cont) Movie: Nate and Hayes Att. Movie: Aloha Summer |(:45) Movie: Firefox
DISN © (Cont) Animals ¡Movie: Olile Hopnoodle’s Danger Movie: Honey, 1 Shrunk the Kids |Hector's Bunyip

SATURDAY Prime Time SEPTEMBER 14 SATURDAY W e e  H o u r s SEPTEMBER 14
6 PM 6:30 7 PM I 7:30 8 PM I 8:30 9 PM 9:30 j 10 PM 10:30 11 PM 11:30

KLRN ®  0 Lawrence Welk Austin City Limits American Masters Chasing a Rainbow Movie: Stranger's Hand
UNI ® Sabado Gigante ¡Tu Musica ¡World Vision
K M O L® O Wheel ¡Jeopardyl Golden Glris Empty ¡Nurses Miss Amer. Pageant ¡News Sal Night
KENS ®  B Star Search Movie: Throw Momma From the Train Rewrite for Murder ¡News ¡Star Trek: Next
KSAT ©  O Texas Triathlon Gymnastics ¡College Football Penn State at Southern Cal (L) ¡News (:35) Vend.
FAM O Rin Tin ¡Blk Movie: Raid on Rommel ¡Dirty Dozen Series Bordertow. ¡Bonanza Zola Levitt
TBS © Q Malor League Baseball Dodgers at Braves (L) |(:45) U.S. Olympic |(:45) Bugs Night Tracks ¡Fear No Evil
WGN (E) A. Griffith $100.000 | Major League Baseball Montreal Expos at Chicago Cubs ( L ) . News Movie: McQ
ESPN (D Ftball College Football Alabama at Florida (L) Ftball B'baH Sports Expedition Earth
NICK © Doug Looney Looney ¡Get Smart ¡Donna ¡Mr. Ed My 3 Sons Patty Duke Doble Hitchcock Dragnet ¡Green
LIFE (B Last Prostitute Movie: Fear Stalk Veronica Clare Hidden Confession. Spenser For Hire
TNN (B Hank ¡Church SL Opry ¡Ole Opry Barbara Mandrell Music Texas t o ______ Ole Opry Barbara Mandrell
DISC © Disappearing World Creatures Wings Nudear Wild TDC-TV Strange ¡Terra X
MAX © (Cont) ¡Prevw. Movie: Why Me? Movie: Wild at Heart (:15) Adv. Ford
TMC ffi) (5:55) Movie: Glory ¡Movie: Pump Up the Volume Movie: Dragonard Ir ani Out
HBO EDFlrelox ¡Movie: Two Jakes ¡Crypt HBO Comedy Hour | Presumed Innocent
DISN © Movie: Story of Snow White ¡Shrunk ¡Movie: Parent Trap (:10) Movie: Funny Girt

SUNDAY Morning SEPTEMBER 15
6 AM 6:30 7 AM 7:30 8 AM 8:30 9 AM 9:30 10 AM 10:30 11 AM 11:30

KLRN ®  O OH Air American American Govt Govt Rogers Sesame Street Long Ago Newton
UNI œ Blblia Santa Debates Dueña World Vision Chlspavtsion Carrusel Chespirtto
K M O L® Q Drawing Met to Christ Jimmy Swat»art Larry Memories Sunday Todi )f Meet Home NFL Uve
KENS (DO Cowboys Branded Crime 800 Reporter CBS Sunday Morning Face West Trav. NFL Today
KSAT ©  a Insight Closeup R. Schuller Kenneth Copeland Miracles Castle Hits World First Baptist
FAM o D. James Kr nnedy Swiss Gerbert Super Captain N Popeye P. Valiant Maniac Brother Brothers O’Toole
TBS © a Tom Flintstone. FBntstone. Planet Andy H ,ppy ÜSEX_ Movie: Devil s Brigade
WGN as Miracles Schuller (15) Whal Heritage Mass Beaver Star Search Movie: Rodeo King and the Señoril»
ESPN <D Sports Body Lee Haney Baseball In PGA Senior SporisWeekti Reporters Sports NFL GameDav
NICK Eureeka Kids Court a HeathcliH Kablooey Insp. Doug Rugrats Ren Salute Clarissa
LIFE œSett-Improvement Guide Diabetes Physician Fam Internal Cardtotogy 0B/GYN
TNN CD OH Air Truckin' Truck Winners NHflA Winston Motorspor. NASCAR Ra
DISC ID OH Air Medical TV Medical Medical Medical Medical FHms lor the Famllv
MAX ID Movie: Macomber Attalr ¡Movie: Maid Movie: Armed and Dangerous Movie: Ski Palmi
TMC œListen to Me Movie: Anolfler Thin Man Movie: Freshman Droop Beverty Hills
HBO ED Matter/Conscience Babar Wizard ol Movie: All Dogs Go to Heaven When it Was a Game Movie: Gremlins ?
DISN © Wuzzles Pound Fraggle Donald Movie: DuckTales: Movie Back

12 AM 12:30 1 AM 1:30 2 AM 2:30 3 AM 3:30 4 AM j 4:30 |5 AM 5:30
KLRN ® B OH Air
UNI ® Johnny Canales Sabado Gigante _______________________________________ _________________ ¡Toda Risa ¡Johnny Canales
KM OL® O Saturday Nil ht Uve Byron Allen Movie: Harper OH Air
KENS ® B (Coni) Dracula Monsters Darkslde ¡Buckaroo Sherifl I Heroes ol the Saddle Movie: Cape Canaveral Monsters ¡Radar
KSAT ©  O (11:35) Movie: Vendetta (:35) Movie: House on Garibaldi Street |(:35) News OH Air
FAM O Paid Program Jewish Paid ¡Praise the Lord Paid Program NewSight J. Robison
TBS © Q Fear No Evil Night Tracks Night Tracks World It’s
WGN 03 McQ Super Monsters Day at Runaway ¡Movie: In This House ol Brode Documenta. Day at
ESPN (D History/Coll. Ftbl Sports Motoworid Senior College Football Alabama at Fionda (R) B'ball
NICK IB Patty Duke America Get Smart Donna Mr. Ed My 3 Sons Hitchcock ¡Dragnet ¡America ¡Doble ¡Lassie uttr Bits
LIFE IB Sell-Improvement Guide ¡Sett-Improvement Guide
TNN ID Music ¡Texas Church S I I On Stage OH Air
DISC © Rotten World About Us Creatures Oft Air “  '  ----------------------------------
MAX 03 Adv. Ford Fairiane Movie: Del by Temptation |(:40) Movie: Body Chemistry IciD) Move-
TMC © Out of the Dark (:10) Jogger ¡Movie: Takln£C are  of Business ¡(50) Movie: Pick-Up Artist r-im i w »„ u .
HBO Q) Presumed Innocent (:15) Movie: Masquerade j.«5) Movie. Kkkboxer_____ ¡(25) Movie: Vietnam. Tn.as
DISN © Funny Girl Movie: Olile Hopnoodle's Movie: Honey, I Shrunk the Kids H o T  fSTouserds. ¡Tree-----------

¡SUNDAY Afternoon SEPTEMRFR151
12 PM 12:30 1 PM 1:30 2 PM 2:30 3 PM 3:30 4 PM 4:30 5 PM 5:30

KLRN ® 0 Un. lo
Wonderworks

UNI GD Debates Portada Futbol/Soccar [Panorama Deporthn
KM OL® Q  
KENS (B  B  
KSAT ©  O  
FAM a 
TBS © P  
WGN ©  
ESPN a> 
NICK IB

NFL Foothal 
NFL Footbal 
D. Brinkley 
Brothers 0 T  
(: 15) CHiPs 
Hangin' In 
CART Racln 
Freshmen

M am i Dolph 

Philadelphia

oole

Baseball
Pioneer Elec 

Would

ins at Detroit lio n s  (L) 
Eagles at Dallas Cowboys 

Bus. ¡Doctor Is 
Movie: Child’s Cry 
Major League Baseball C 

Lead-oH ¡Major Leapt 
Ironies 200 (L)

Hare ¡Man ol

L)
Horse Radno__________

odgers at Braves (L) 

e Baseball Montreal Expo; 

Target ¡Trtalhlon 
Moonstone Gem

N R  Football AFC Reninna 

NTL I Albertville $
Gymnastics World Champ 

Movie: I’d Climb ttie High 

l(:«5) Tom A
at Chicago Cubs (LI 

PGA Goll Hardees Classic 

Can't on Make

1 Games (L)

2 __________
onships (LI 
«al Mountalr

final round 1

Dr. CroH

Planet
Twiltte

¡=L

CBS News 
News 
Brother 
WCW Main 
Gentleman J 
Baseball Tor

News 
ABC News 
Maniac 
ivent
m________
tght

LIFE IB  
TNN IB

Internal 
(11:00) NASC

0B/GYN 
AR Racing P

Physician ¡Carriloloav
eak Antifreeze 500 from D

Dentistry ¡Internal
tver, Del. (L)

Infectious ¡Getaway Ostaoarth.
Motorspor.

Fifteen
Medicine
Winston

Would 
TBA_______

Clarissa • 
Hyperions!.

MAX ID Movie: Kentuckian |(:45) Movie: Harvey Girts L '-T  / ^ Creatures_______ __ Creatures
TMC ff l Troop Beverly Hills Riders ol the Badlands ¡Movie: Listen to Me w ore------------------  ¡Overboard

DISN © Best ol Disney
hffivle: Pretty kr Pink______________ ]j:45) Movie: My B l u e ^ ---------- 1--------------r ® L _ ----------------------------  :

Mmrie: S h p ^  B T P .d o .  [Anne ol Green Gahlw ,p.„  ,  Cl,m |D’ ^  01 ™undaf---------

I
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[SUNDAY Prime Time SEPTEMBER 15]
6 PM 6:30 7 PM 7:30 8 PM 8:30 9 PM 9:30 10 PM 10:30 11 PM 11:30

KLRN Œ O Connection. (SO) Connections (:40) Prev. Masterpiece Theatre May Being 'Alio, 'Alio Stand By
UNI CD Siempre en Domingo Movie: La Cucaracha les El Grito
K M O L®  O Martí Eerie, Ind. Man/ Pac. Movie: Problem Child News Roggln’s Sports Candid
KENS 3 ) 0 60 Minutes Murder, She Wrote Movie: P.S.I LUVU News Cheers New Dr. Croft
KSAT ©  O Lite Goes On Funny Funny Movie: A Fish Called Wanda 1:15) News (SO) 3's |20| Living Proof
FAM O My D°fl You Asked Blk New Zorro M l_____ Witness Chartes Stanley Paid Progra T1
TBS 1 9 0 Movie: Adventures ol the Wilderness Family II Netwk Paid Program World
WGN (0 Gentleman Jim Movie: Sahara I nbws |(:40) Repla. Monsters Rlker On the
ESPN EDNFL PrimeTime Major League Baseball Boston Red Sox at New York Yankees It I SportsCente NFL PrimeTime
NICK IB Rugrats Looney Looney HI Honey Donna Mr. Ed My 3 Sons Patty Duke Hitchcock Dragnet Green
LIFE (B Milestone. Milestone. Internal Fam Cardiology Internal OB/GYN Fam Physician Prescribing Into
TNN <DAmerican Sports Cavalcade NHRA Winston Bill Dance Bass maste Fkehawk Road Test Truckin' Truck Winston
DISC IB Best ot the BBC Signatures ol the Soul Mafia Wars Whigs Best ol the BBC
MAX QD(5:30) Movie: Overtioard Movie: Maid rican Girt (:35) Movie: I Love You to Death
TMC © Movie: Red Scorpion Movie: Troop Beverty Hills Movie: Death Warrant Echoes ot
HBO Q>Days ol Thunder Movie: Die Hard 2 (1J5) Drea. 1:35) Prev. Movie: FlaUlners
DISN © Movie: Peter Pan Iftaady Go! I Ready Go! (55) Achle. 01

I SUNDAY W e e  H o u r s  SEPTEMBER 15
12 AM 12:30 1 AM 1:30 2 AM 2:30 3 AM 3:30 4 AM 4:30 5 AM 5:30

KLRN ®  O OH Air
UNI (Coni) World Vision Movie: La Cucaracha Johnny Canales Debates Chispavision
K M 0 L ® Q Siskel Movie: Day for Thanks on Waltons Mountain OH Air AG Day CNN News 1st NBC News
KENS ( B O Reunion Missing Emera. On Scene New Adam Reporter Movie: Relax, Freddie (:45) I Tell CBS News Morning
KSAT ©  Q (11:20) Movie: Living Proof (50) News (25) Current Affair OH Air ABC News
FAM o Paid Program |Pald Program Paid Larry Lea With J. Robison
TBS 1 9 0 Paid Program WCW Main Event Hogan CNN News 1 Love Flintstone.
WGN © (11:30) Movie: On the Riviera Darkside Trapper John, M.D. Movie: Inside Out Documenta. Faith 20
ESPN <DBaseball Toniaht SportsCenter Lee Haney PGA GoH Hardees Classic, 3rd round (R) SportsCenter Nation's
NICK (BPatty Duke America Paid Program Hitchcock Dragnet America Doble Lassie Kids
LIFE © OH Air Seff-lmprovement
TNN (BNHRA Iwinners Ichampionship Rodeo OH Air
DISC ID Malla Wars OH Air
MAX © (¿0) Movie: Private Benjamin (:15) Movie: Moon In Scorpio (:45) Movie: Key Exchange 30 Secs
TMC © Echoes ol Paradise Movie: Red Scorpion (:45) Movie: Freshman Go West
HBO ED Movie: Women & Men 2 I Movie: Exorcist ill I (25) Movie: Bad InHuence (:10) Joe Vs the
DISN © Movie: Adventures of Johnny Jones Movie: Sleeping Beauty (:35) Movie: Peter Pan Mouserds. You & Me

MONDAY Prime Time SEPTEMBER 16l
6 PM 6:30 7 PM 7:30 8 PM j 8:30 9 PM 9:30 10 PM 10:30 11 PM 11:30

KLRN (5) B 321 Bus. MacNeil/Lehrer Conflrm. Highlight
UNI CD Estrella II Came De Nadie Dona Beija/Dona Bella Portada De Noticiero La Movida
K M O L®  Q Wheel Jeopardy! Fresh Blossom Movie: Living a Lie News (:35) Tonight Show (:35) Candi.
KENS ( S B News In Edition Even’g Major Dad Murphy Brown News (:35) Cheer. (55) Cosb. Jeflersons
KSAT (SI O News EnL MacGyver ABC Monday Night Football Chiefs at Oilers (L) News (:35) Hunte.
FAM a WaHons P. Valiant Blk Scarecrow and King 700 Club T a n d T Movie: Kartsas Raiders
TBS 1 9 0 Hillbillies Sanford Movie: Perry Mason (:45) Explo.
WGN © Night iNews Magnum, p.i. Biggies:
ESPN ID Sports NFL NFL Match Schaap Women's Volleyball AWSA Water Skiing B'ball SportsCenter NFL Great
NICK © Insp. Insp. Motk Get Smart Get Smart | Dragnet Hitchcock Green Best ol Mr. Ed Looney Doble
LIFE © T. Ullman Open LA. Law Movie: Last Prostitute Spenser. For Hire Ifs Garry Molly
TNN © (Coni) Be a Star On Stage On Stage Nashville Now On Stage Nashville Now
DISC © Rendezvou. Wld. Wildlife Wild Side People of the Forest The Chimps of Gombe Wild Things Beyond 2000
MAX © Meet Me in SL Louis Movie: Diplomatic Immunity I Movie: Dishnbed Movie: Whispers |(:35) Ero«.
TMC © Movie: Great Balls of Fire! Movie: Communion (:« ) (:!5) Movie: Narrow Margin
HBO ED Young Guns II Movie: Presumed Innocent |(:10) Prev. HBO Corned- Hour (:35) Movie: Doublecrossed
DISN © Splash, Too Avonlea Movie: Escape From Fort Bravo ___________h _______ Movie: Sign of Four

MONDAY________Wee Hours SEPTEMBER 16
12 AM 12:30 1 AM 1:30 2 AM 2:30 3 AM j 3:30 4 AM 4:30 5 AM 5:30

KLRN OQ OH Air
UNI œ (Coni) World Prog. Estrella II Came Dona Beija/Dona Beila Portada De Chispavision
KM O L®  O (55) LeHerman (55) News (:40) Famil. (:10) Bob (:40) CNN News AG Day CNN News 1st NBC News
KENS ( D O Jenny Jones Twtlite News Nightwatch CBS News Morning
KSAT ©  Q (Coni) (:35) Night (55) News (:40) EnL (:10) EDJ. OH Air ABC News
FAM Q (Coni) Paid 700 Club Paid Program Larry Lea With J. Robison
TBS 1 9 0 (11:45) Explorer (:45) Cousteau (:45) Stoog. Family IHogan I Gomer CNN News I Love Flintstone.
WGN © (11:30) Movie: Biggies: Adventure Darkside Fact ol Soap Movie: Foolin’ Around Documenta. Faith 20
ESPN © (Cont) NFL NFL Sports Up Close PGA GoH Hardees Classic, final round (R) GetUng Fit Sports NaHon's
NICK © Patty Duke My 3 Sons Donna America Get Smart Dragnet Hitchcock |Mr. Ed Doble Patty Duke Lassie Kids
LIFE © Self-Improvement Guide Self-Improvement Guide
TNN © (Cont) Crook, Club Dance OH Air
DISC © Wld. Sport'g Challenge OH Air
MAX © (Coni) (55) Movie: Real Lite l(:35) Movie: Bob & Carol... I (25) Movie: Corporate Affairs (30)
TMC © Movie: Deathstalker III Picture IMovie: My Favorite Blonde IMovie: Great Balls ol Flrel Holiday In
HBO © (Cont) Crypt Movie: Oulck Change Movie: Two Jakes Immediate Family
DISN © (Cont) Movie: Son ot Lassie Movie: Splash, Too Avonlea Mouserds. You & Me

TUESDAY Prime T im e  SEPTEMBER 17
6 PM 6:30 7 PM 7:30 8 PM 8:30 9 PM 9:30 10 PM 10:30 11 PM 11:30

KLRN ® 8 321 Bus. MacNeil/Lehrer Mexico Mexico Mexico Conflrm. Highlight
UNI 3 ) Estrella II Came De Nadie Dona Beija/Dona Bella Brigada Espedal NoUdero La Movida
K M O L®  0 Wheel Jeopardy! M. Landon Memories Law & Order News (35) Tonight Show (:35) Candi.
KENS ( B O News In Edition Rescue: Movie: Coming to America News (:35) Cheer. (55) Cosb. Jeflersons
KSAT ©  O News Ent Full House Home Roseanne Slbs 20/20 News (:35) Boss. (55) Hunter
FAM O WaHons P. Valiant Witness Scarecrow and King 700 Club T a n d T Movie: Lucy Gallant
TBS 1 9 0 Hillbillies Sanford Movie: Walking Tall, the Final Chapter Major League Baseball Braves at Giants (L)
WGN © Night Major League Baseball Chicago Cubs at Pittsburgh Pirates (L) News I Magnum, p.i. | Kennedy
ESPN © Sports Major League Baseball (L) Major League Baseball (L)

NICK © Insp. Looney Motk Get Smart Get Smart Dragnet Hitchcock Green Mr. Ed I Am. Looney Doble
LIFE © T. Ullman Open L A  Law Confession. Hidden Veronica Clare Spenser For Hire Ifs Garry Molly
TNN © (Cont) Be a Star On Stage Church SL Nashville Now ICrook, On Stage Church SL Nashville Now
DISC © Rendezvou. Wld. Arabia Beyond InvenHon Coast to Coast wing?____________ War Years
MAX © I Could Go on Singing Movie: Downtown Movie: Wild at Heart Movie: Satan's Princess
TMC © Man...Loved Women Movie: Taking Care of Business Movie: CalHki, Monster Movie: Air America
HBO © Immediate Family Movie: Short tim e HBO Corned- Hour AIL Movie: Cast a Deadly Spell
DISN © Rich and Animated Big Bird In Japan Movie: Thin Man (35) Read. (55) Oz Movie: Fantasbc Voyage

• >.- h(j otunnutij______zM&T {(&>{ jo .vbA ,¡ g,#

WEDNESDAY P r im e  T im e  SEPTEMBER 18
6 PM 6:30 7 PM 7:30 8 PM I 8:30 9 PM 9:30 10 PM 10:30 11 PM 11:30

KLRN ® Q 321 Bus. MacNeil/Lehrer In Shadow of Love Mystery! Encorel
UNI ® Estrella II Came De Nadie Noche de Gigantes Noticiero La Movida

*
K M O L®  O Wheel Jeopardy! Unsolved Mlrsteries Night | Seinfeld Ouantum Leap News (35) Tonight Show (:35) Candi.
KENS (D  8 News In Edition Royal Teech Jake and the Fatman 48 Hours News (:3S) Cheer. (55) Cosb. Jeflersons
KSAT © O News EnL Dinosaurs Grow’g Movie: Stop at Nothing News (35) Boss. (55) Hunter
FAM OWaHons Brother Maniac Scarecrow and King 700 Club T and T Movie: My Darting Clementine
TBS 1 9 0 Hillbillies Sanford Movie: Alcatraz The Whole Shocking Story (:45) Movie: Defiance
WGN © Night A  Griffith Movie: Hanoi Hilton News Twtlite Magnum, p.i. Kennedy
ESPN © Sports Great Baseball Major League Baseball (L) Sports B'ball Women's
NICK © Insp. Looney Mork Get Smart Get Smart I Dragnet Hitchcock Green Mr. Ed Am. Looney Doble
LIFE © T. Ullman Open L A  Law Forever James Dean Women ol die Night II Spenser For Hire Ifs Garry Molly
TNN © (Cont) Be a Star Calun Country Nashville Now Crook, Calun Country Nashville Now
DISC © Rendezvou. Wld. Challenge Wings Profile World Beyond | Invention War I Firepower
MAX © (550) Movie: A Star Is Bom Movie: Red-Blooded American Girt Movie: Body Chemistry Black Rain
TMC © Hope and Glory Movie: Think Big IMovie: Shrimp on the Barbie Movie: Watchers II |(:45) Navy
HBO © Inside the NFL Movie: Dirty Harry ICrypt I Dream On Movie: Flatfiners
DISN © Chipmunk Adventure Movie: Herbie Goes Bananas (35) Tribute to John Lennon Ready Go Animals Are People

¡TUESDAY W e e  H o u r s  SEPTEMBER 17
12 AM 12:30 1 AM 1:30 2 AM 2:30 3 AM 3:30 4 AM 4:30 5 AM 5:30

K LR N ®  8 Off Air •
UNI CD (Cont) f r o ! ______ Portada Estrella II Came Dona Beija/Dona Bella Brigada Espedal Chispavision
KMOL® O (55) LeHerman (55) News (:40) Famil. (:10) Bob (:40) CNN News AG Day CNN News 1st NBC News
KENS H Q Jenny Jones Twilite News Nightwatch CBS News Morning
KSAT ©  O (55) NighL (:35) News (:10) EnL (:40) EDJ. Off Air ABC News
FAM O (Cont) Paid 700 Club Paid Program Larry Lea With J. Robison
TBS 1 9 0 (:15) Movie: Penitentiary II Movie: Circle ol Iron CNN News I Love Flintstone.
WGN © (11:30) Kennedy (Pt 1 of 3) Soap Movie: Scruples Documents. Faith 20
ESPN © (Cont) Sports Run Surfing Up Close CART Radrx Pioneer Electronics 200 (R) GetUng FH Sports
NICK © Patty Duke My 3 Sons Donna America Get Smart Dragnet Hitchcock Am. Doble Patty Duke Lassie Kids
LIFE © Sell-Improvement Guide Sett-Improvement Guide
TNN © (Cont) Crook, Club Dance Off Air
DISC © Wld. Profile World Away Off Air
MAX © (55) Movie: Batman (55) Movie: Tango & Cash (55) Movie: Wild at Heart
TMC © (25) Movie: RelenUess Movie: Karate Kid III (55) Movie: 'm No Angel (25) Perry Mason
HBO © (:10) Drea. (:40) Crypt |(:10) Movie: Rude Awakening 1(55) Movie: Cobra (25) AtL Murder Karate Kid III
DISN © (Cont) Movie: Golden Treasure Movie: Dead Reckoning Best of Disney Mouserds. You & Me

WEDNESDAN Wee Hours SEPTEMBER 18
12 AM 12:30 1 AM 1:30 2 AM 2:30 3 AM 3:30 4 AM 4:30 5 AM 5:30

KLRN ®  8 Oft Air
UNI QD (Cont) World Prog. Estrella II Came Noche de Gigantes Chispavision
KMOL® O (55) LeHerman (55) News (:40) Famil. CIO) Bob (:40) CNN News AG Day ¡CNN News 1st NBC News
KENS ®  Q Jenny Jones TwilHe News Nightwatch CBS News Morning
KSAT ©  O (55) NighL (35) News CIO) EnL (:40) EDJ. Oft Air ABC News
FAM O (Cont) Paid 700 Club Paid Program Larry Lea With J. Robison
TBS ©Q (Cont) (:45) Movie: Speed Trap (:45) Stoog. AH Family IHogan Gomer CNN News I Love Flintstone.
WGN © (11:30) Kennedy (Pt 2 ol 3) Paid Fad of Soap Movie: Day ttie Loving Stopped Documenta. Faith 20
ESPN © (Cont) Target In PGA Sports Up Close Outside Hie Lines Anaheim Cat Show GetUng FH Sports Natton's
NICK © Patty Duke My 3 Sons Paid America Get Smart Dragnet Hitchcock Am. Doble Patty Duke Lassie Kids
LIFE © Self-Improvement Guide Sett-Improvement Guide
TNN © (Coni) Crook, Club Dance Off Air
DISC © Wld. Adventurer. Wild Motor Oft Air
MAX © Black Rain (55) Movie: Ninja Academy (35) Movie: Rlkkl and Pete (20) Movie: Action Jackson
TMC © (11:45) Movie: Navy SEALS Movie: Hope and Glory Movie: Institute for Revenge Pick-Up
HBO © Movie: Blood Money (:35) Movie: Friday 13lh, Pt 2 I (.-05) Movie: Graveyard Shift (:40) America Big Bad
DISN © (Coni) Movie: Devil's Hill Movie: Amazing Mr. Blunden Oz Mouserds. You & Me

THURSDAY Prime Time SEPTEMBER 191 I THURSDAY W e e  H o u r s  SEPTEMBER 191
6 PM 6:30 7 PM 7:30 8 PM | 8:30 9 PM 1 9:30 10 PM 10:30 11 PM 11:30

KLRN ®  8 321 Bus. MacNeil/Lehrer Eat Smart Mystery! Conflrm. Highlight

UNI ® El XIV Festival Nacional le la Candon 0T1 Fortuna Con el NoUdero La Movida

K M O L®  O Wheel Jeopardy) Cosby loffi World Cheers 1 Wings Flesh | Dear John News (35) Tonight Show (35) Candi.

KENS ® Q News In EdiUon Top Cops Trials ol Rosie O'Neill Knots Landing News (35) Cheer. (55) Cosb. Jeflersons

KSAT ©  Q News Ent Movie: Jewel of the NHe Prime Time Live News (35) Boss. (55) Hunter

FAM 8 WaHons Mv Dog |You Asked IScarecrow and King 700 Club T and T Movie: Tomahawk

TBS © 8 Hillbillies Sanford Movie: Meatballs Part II Major League Baseball Braves at Padr ss (L) (:45) Mach.

WGN © Night Malor League Baseball Chicago Cubs at New York Mets (L) |News Magnum, p.i. Kennedy

ESPN © Sports Speed College Football Virginia t Georgia Tech (Lj B’ball SportsCenter Monstr

NICK © Insp. Looney Motk iGet Smart Get Smart 1 Dragnet I Hitchcock iGreen Mr. Ed Am. Looney Doble

LIFE © T. Ullman Open LA. Law Movie: Deaffi Dreams Spenser For Hire Ifs Garry Molly

TNN © (Cont) Be a Star On Stage Music Nashville Now Icrook, On Stage | Music Nashville Now

DISC © Rendezvou. Wld. Strange Terra X Beyond 20 ©  lAdventurer. |Dlve to Movie: Myst Brious Miniature World

MAX © For Me and My Gal Movie: Triumph ol thè Spirti 1 Movie: Voodoo Dawn Movie: Corporate Affairs

TMC © Pick-Up Artist Movie: Raw Deal l(:45) Movie: WHd Orchld (:35) Movie: Strapless

HBO © uiuiaiw i Rem in's IMovie: Another 48 Hrs. Ilnside the NFL |Dream On |Two Jakes

DISN & Here Come the Littles IMovie: Black Stallion |Movie: Out ot Africa

12 AM 12:30 1 AM 1:30 2 AM 2:30 3 AM j 3:30 4 AM 4:30 5 AM 5:30
KLRN ®  8 OH Air
UNI (11:30) La Movida Estrella II CrtsUna I NoUdero Fortuna Con el Chispavision

KMOL® O (55) LeHerman (55) News (:40) Famil. (:10) Bob (:40) CNN News AG Day CNN News 1st NBC News

KENS ® 8 Jenny Jones Twiine News Magnum, p. Panama Sal (:15) Crim. (:45) Wate. CBS News Morning

KSAT ©  o (55) NighL (:35) News (:10) Ent (:40) EDJ. Off Air ABC News

FAM O (Coni) Paid 700 Club Paid Program Larry Lea With J. Robison

TBS 1 9 8 (11:451 Moiri b: Macho Ca ahan I:45l Movie: Shootout in Town (:15) Stoog. |Hogan Gomer CNN News I Love Ftlntstone.

WGN © (11:30) Kennedy (Pt 3 ol 3) Paid Fact ol Soap Movie: Middle Age Crazy Day at Faith 20

ESPN © Auto Glory Days Thoroughb. Sports Up Close Road Race AWSA Water Skiing School GetUng FH Sports Natton's

NICK © Patty Duke My 3 Sons Donna America Get Smart Dragnet Hitchcock I Am. Doble Patty Duke Lassie Launch

LIFE © Sell-lmprove meni Guide Sett-Improvement Guide
TNN © (Cont) Crook, Club Dance Oft Air
DISC © Wld. World Coast to Coast Otl Air
MAX © Movie: Maid Movie: 1 Love You to Death (:10) Movie: Coilege Dormitory ICrazy About Movies

TMC © (20) Movie: Pump Up the Volume Movie: Raw Deal |(:45) Movie: Power

HBO © (11:30) Movie: Two Jakes (50) Movie: Vietnam, TexBS (20) Movie: Another 48 Hrs. Police Academy 4

DISN © Movie: Cool Change Movie: Good Old Boy | Movie: Petri Mouserds. You & Me

C h a n i , e l  
A m erica 'i  F*ovDy Network ■

CALL TODAY

1-800-292-4502

FALCON CABLE TV
OFFER AVAILABLE IN SERVICEABLE AREAS ONLY. OTHER RESTRICTIONS MAT APPLY. OFFER EXPIRES 9/30/91

I
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Tom Faulkenberry, Brackettville Lions President welcomes Edward A 
Gonzales, Rocksprings Lions President.

Brackettville Lions 
Sponsor Rocksprings

The Rocksprings Lions Club was 
chartered Saturday night, Septem­
ber 7, 1991, at the Rocksprings 
High School Cafeteria. Brackettville 
Lions Club is the sponsor.

Dr. John Seale, Del Rio Host 
Club, District II Chairman was 
master of ceremonies. Rev. John 
Quigley, Rocksprings United 
Methodist Church, gave the in­
vocation. Brackettville’s Clif Lewis, 
Zone Chairman, led the pledge of 
allegiance and Mary Simons led 
group singing.

Brackettville Lions Club 
President Tom Faulkenberry ex­
tended the welcome. Past District 
Governor T .J. Tijerina, Del Rio San 
Felipe Club, inducted the new 
members and installed the officers. 
District Governor Kevin Dinnin, San 
Antonio, and Faulkenberry presen­
ted the charter. M.P. “Mike” 
Butler, Past International Director 
from San Antonio was the "guest 
speaker.

Rocksprings officers are: 
president, Edward A. Gonzales; first 
vice president, Heriberto M. 
Gallegos; second vice president, 
Presley Hatley; third vice presid­
ent, Richard J. Simone; 
secretary/treasurer, LaWanda 
Whalen; tail twister, Fructuoso G. 
Cerda; lion tamer, Vicente Malton; 
and membership chairman, John C. 
Quidley. These along with Jim R.

Adams, Nitza E. Benavidez, Charles 
D. Cowsert, Jane Evans, Alicia 
Franco, Gus C. Goller, Michael D. 
Grooms, Dorothy Hatley, Margaret 
Henderson, Wylie J. Hurley, Don G. 
Letsinger, Marjorie Merritt, Yvon­
ne Quigley, Mary C. Simone, Milton 
Smith, James Sorrells, and Kenneth 
D. Sorrells, Sr., became charter 
members.

Faulkenberry presented the new 
club with a large brass bell and 
gavel, indentical and symbolic of the 
same items Del Rio Host Lions 
presented the Brackettville Club 37 
years ago when it was chartered. 
Rocksprings President Edward 
Gonzales accepted gifts to the 
Clubs. Clif Lewis will serve as the 
Guiding Lion.

The Brackettville Lions chartered 
a bus for Lions Tom Faulkenberry, 
Peter Pohl, Wilma Lewis, Clif 
Lewis, Sid Sponholtz, Lou Sofaly, 
John Frank, Walt Bauguess, Felix 
Gonzales, Frances Larsen, Helen 
Lynch, Anne Owens, Claude 
Owens, and their guests Marion 
Young, Evelyn Sofaly, and Jean 
Faulkenberry to make the trip to 
Rocksprings. Other guests included 
Lions from several San Antonio and 
Kerrville Clubs. Del Rio Host 
President Allan MacGillavray and 
Del Rio San Felipe Fred Carranza 
brought delegations from their 
clubs.

Justin Lamar Shamblin
Justin Lamar Shamblin, .born 

August 26 at 5:15 pm in Holistoj} 
weighed 8 lbs and 7 oz.

Parents are Mr. and Mrs. Lamar 
Shamblin, grandparents are Joyce 
and Ruben Fuentes.

Penny Nixon Stops By

Penny tVixon prepares to take several copies of The Hunters Guide 
issued by The Brackett News back for distribution in Austin, Texas.

Penny Nixon, formerly of 
Brackettville, Alamo Village and 
Fort Clark Springs stopped in The 
Brackett News office on her way 
back to Austin Tuesday. Penny is 
the legislative assistant of District 
68 State Representative Pete 
Gallego, D-Alpine, Rep. Gallego, Sul

Ross State University and several 
state agencies sponsored the highly 
successful “West Texas Education 
Seminar” in Alpine on September 7.

Penny works in Rep. Gallegos' 
Austin office and can be reached at 
(512)463-0566.

A Hearing Loss Is More Noticeable... 
Than A Hearing Aid.

EASY FINANCING 
NOW AVAILABLE
The All-In-The-Ear The Canal Hidden 

HearingAt a Low, Low price

$350
iV o  Coupons -  -  iV o  Gimmicks

SOUTHWEST TEX AS HEARING INSTRUMENTS

$495

Plaza del Sol Mall 
(Next to JCPenney)
SALES AND SERVICE, SERVICE, SERVICE..

774-1272
Mon.-Thurs. 10-5

. .FREE HEARING TESTS

Ite Itacfeß
Local Artist, Bill Edwards 
Makes Name F o r H im self
By DORTHY PAYNE
Brackett News Staff Writer

At the Cowboy Cauldron in 
Brackettville Saturday 7, Bill Ed­
wards of Fort Clark Springs manned 
a booth featuring his 200 pound 
sculpture of a turtle that he is pretty 
proud of and he has reason to be.

Using tools, such as saw, rasp, 
chisel, axe, he sculptured the turtle 
out of one mesquite root. No only is 
it beautiful on the shell and head but 
Bill turned the turtle over for me and 
the feet are just as amazing. It took 
him a little over a month to complete 
it.

Bill, the son of Aldine and the late 
Jack Edwards, lives in Fort Clark 
Springs with his mother Aldine. Bill 
was born and lived in Quemado, 
went to school in Uvalde, and took 
his first art course at Southwest 
Texas Junior College under art in­
structor Mildred Horn of Uvalde.

From there, he attended South­
western University of Georgetown 
where he received a BA degree in 
Fine Arts.

John William “Bill” Edwards was 
featured in the October-November 
1990 issue of Modern Maturity 
where his combination pencil, 
watercolor and acrylic painting, 
‘UFO,” and aerial view of the family 
home in Quemado won the 
“distinguished” achievement award 
in the third annual Seasoned Eye 
Art Competition. Along with his 
award a photograph of Bill was 
featured on the back cover.

Bill is presently working on a 
grant from the State Fine Arts 
Commission and commission 
requests received from the exposure 
in the Seasoned Eye Competition.

Bill works in a lot of mediums and 
welcomes visitors to look at his art 
in his studio in Fort Clark.

Work Continues On Brackettville Streets

Correa's Carpet Cleaning
Wo now scdl L.I). Brickm an Carpets.

Brickm an is A m erica's largest d istributor of 
carpet and floor products.

Saltillo tile, congoleum and wooden floor tiles 
available too. Shop around and com pare. You’ll like 

°u r com petitive prices on quality carpet and floor covernings.^j

Call Robert At: 5 6 3 -2 7 6 7  or go by Sw eets N Things 
107 South Ann — Brackettville. Tx

200 pound sculptured turtle created by Bill Edwards, pictured as 
displayed at the Brackettville Cowboy Cauldron.

FALL FOOTBALL LOAN SPECTACULAR!
BEGINNING SEPTEM BER 3rd AT

BORDER FEDERAL CREDIT UNION

8 .9 %  & 9 .9 %
financing on new vehicles. Special lowered interest 

rates on used vehicles too!

For your best deal on wheels, come by

BORDER FEDERAL CREDIT UNION

600 E. GIBBS 774-3503 LAFB

STARTS THURSDAY 9 A M -9 P M

LA Z BOY Ü B R O Y H IL L M  KINCAID

ROCKER RECLINER

$29995As Lo* 
AS Free 

Delivery
$ 2 5 ° ° PER M O N T H  

YO U R  CHOICE OF 
COLORS

BEDROOM SET

$79995 s l ,
$25°o PER M O N T H  
IN CLU DES: DRESSER, 

M IR R O R  H D B D  A N D  NT. 
STAND  M A T C H IN G  

CHEST »229»»

SOLID OAK

$5999 5 ..
Delivery

$25°° PER M O N T H
Y O U R  C H O IC E  OF 
B E D R O O M  PIECES 

DRESSERS M IR R O R S , BEDS, 
CHEST

SEALY
BEDDING

$9995
TWIN SIZE EACH

PIECE SH O P  THE AREAS 
LARGEST SELECTION OF SEALY 

& RESTON IC  BEDD ING  
ALL O N  SALE

STOREWIDE SAVINGS IN EVERY DEPARTMENT

„  BRASS PLATED 
a i L  SOFA CADDY

C A SH -N -C A R R Y

RICKS  L O W  MONTI ILY 
PAYMENT CHART

PlKC'IIASi:
LP in

S X25 
S 1125 
5 1425 
S 1725 
S 2(125

MOM 111.5 
PAYMKNT

S 25 
5 55 
S 45  
S 55 
S 65

PURCHAM  AS M I  C H A S H H  I CM A M )  M A M  S O  
D O W N P A Y M IN I .  M >  PAY M l  M  A M )  V )  I N O R I S I  

III AC ARC H 1‘1' U __________________

AFFORDABLE
STORAGE:

$3988
TICKETED 

AT »89*»
4 DRAW ER 
ALL W O O D  

CHEST 
IN W A RM  

O AK  FIN ISH 
CASH  AN D  

CARRY

rHE AREAS LARGEST SELECTION OF NAME BRAND QUALITY HOME FURNISHINGS... ALL ON SALE

O V ER  200  
R E C H N E R S  IN  
ST O C K  TO C H O O SE  | 
FRO M

O V ER  75
LIV ING  RO OM S IN  
ST O C K  TO C H O O SE  | 
FR O M

O V ER  100 
DIN ING  R O O M S IN  
ST O C K  TO C H O O SE  | 
FRO M

Open Thursday Til 9 p.m.

O V ER  75 
B E D R O O M S  IN  
ST O C K  TO C H O O S E  \ 
FR O M

SIN CE 1947

O V ER  100 
M A T T R E SS  SETTS IN  I 
ST O C K  TO C H O O S E  | 
FR O M

SPECIAL PURCHASE

2 PIECE LIVING ROOM  
SOFA AND LOVESEAT

$59995
TICKETED AT ‘899.95

THAT ENTIRE HOUSEFUL 
OF FINE FURNITURE CAI 
BE YOURS. BUY 3,4, 5 O 
MORE ROOM FULLS ANI 

SAVE HUNDREDS AND 
HUNDREDS OF DOLLARC 

AND MORE

1/2 P R IC E
KINCAID SOLID OAK 

QUEEN SIZE
PENCIL POST BED

$3999S
TICKETED AT >1099,!

SLEEPER SOF/
f u l l  s iz e  s l e e p e i

SO F A  IN  D U R A B L I 
H E R C U L O N

$39995
TICKETED AT *599.95

PR IC E  G U A RAN TEE
It lakes more than a tremendous selection, good service 
and courteous sales people to deserve your business. It 
takes great prices too AND WE GUARANTEE THEM! It 

within 30 days of your purchase, you find a lower tagged or 
advertised price in our m a rk e t  area...we ll beat it quickly 
and courteously. Ask your sales person (or lull details.

RELAX AND SHOP 
WITH CONFIDENCE!

FREE DELIVERY
SUBJECT TO CREDIT APRO VAL 18N, APR STARTS a c t . .

N O T  APPLY TO PR IO R  PURCHASE. AU ”  p̂ CE
•DEPOSIT REQ U IRED  O N  SPECIAL O R D ER S  ^

FURNITURE
C O M P A N Y

AVE. F AT10TH.
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n D H S Sports
Tigerette Volleyball

By ESMERALDA TALAMANTEZ
Brackett News Sports Writer

GAME 1
The Brackett Varsity Volleyball 

Team went to Utopia September 7, 
1991 and participated in a volleyball 
tournament. The opponents were 
Comfort and Utopia. The first game 
scores were Brackett 5 and Opponent 
15. The second part of the game 
Brackett 9 and Opponent 15. Kim 
Ahrens had 8 straight serves in a row 
in game #2. There were no injuries. 
GAME 2

The second game played in the

Varsity Volleyball Tournament was 
played against the Asherton Tojan- 
etts. The scores were Brackett 15 and 
Asherton 11. The second part of the 
game Tigerettes 15 and Tojanettes 1. 
Kim Ahrens served 11 in a row. The 
game had some powerful spikes: 
Wendy McDaniel, Rene Diaz, Jessica 
Taylor and Michelle Brandt.
GAME 3

The third game played in the 
volleyball tournament was played 
with Asherton. Scores Brackett 12 
and Aherton 15. Second part Brack­
ett 8 and Asherton 15. Jenifer Shahan 
served 5 in a row. She also had some 
good digs.

Thanks Super S For 
Apples For Students

Super S Assistant Manager Mark Hernandez (far left) stands next to 
Store Manager Jesse Melendez while presenting Superintendent of 
Schools, Bob McCall and Jones Elementary Principal Steve Mills (far 
right) with new Apple IIGS which were made possible by the Super S 
Apples For Students program.

In the above photo Brackettville school students excitedly gather 
around to look at their new Apple computers.

New Apple IIGS computers made 
:heir debut at Jones Elementary 
oday. Three enhanced color com- 
auters and five Apple Image Writer 
II color printers were “purchased” 
ay the Brackett Independent School 
District by redeeming Super “S ” 
jold cash register receipts.

An informal presentation was 
leld Tuesday afternoon at Jones 
Elementary. Representing our local 
Super “S ” were Jesse Melendez, 
Store Manager, and Assistant 
Managers Mark Hernandez and 
Mex De Leon. Superintendent of 
Schools, Bob McCall, and Jones 
Elementary Principal, Steve Mills, 
accepted the new equipment on 
behalf of the school. Also present 
were Gloria Benacci, second grade 
teacher, Mrs. Jamie Ballew, parent, 
and thirty-eight very excited studen­
ts from grades two through six.

Students and faculty would like to
express their great appreciation to 
all members of the community who 
saved and turned in their gold

receipts. Those extra few minutes of 
your time enabled our school to 
“purchase” a total of six computers 
and six printers over the eighteen 
month period Super “S ” sponsored 
the Apples For The Students 
Program.

Mr. Melendez expressed his 
amazement at the commitment of 
our local citizens. Other com­
munities with twice the population 
of Brackettville only obtained a frac­
tion of the equipment our school 
received. Again, Thank you, fellow' 
citizens, for supporting our schools, 
and most importantly, thank you for 
your commitment to provide our 
students with the best instructional 
materials possible.

To Super “S ”, a heartfelt thank 
you. And, we’re ready to do it again 
whenever you are.

S p o r t s

Student Body of BISD brave the sweltering heat of the high school 
gymnasium to cheer their team on before the first home game.

Sabinal Yellowjackets 
Luck Out On Tigers

By BLACKIE HABY
Brackett News Sports Writer

On September 6 on Tiger Field the 
Yellowjackets of Sabinal edged out 
the Brackettville Tigers in a very good 
defensive game. In the 1st quarter of 
play neither team was able to move 
the ball for more than 2 series of 
downs. Brackett’s 'downfall seemed 
to be fumbles and intercepted passes. 
Sabinal was plagued with penalties 
and a fair share of fumbles.

In the middle of the second quarter 
Sabinal fumbled and Brackett recov­
ered, but was able to make only 2-lst 
downs before the Yellowjackets inte- 
ercepted a pass. This play set up 
Sabinal’s Only touch down. It took 
the Yellowjackets 4 series of downs to

reach pay dirt. The point after fell 
short of the goal posts due to the 
Tiger hard-charging line. The remain­
ing minutes of the 1st half was a hard 
fought defensive game.

Sabinal received the 2nd half, but 
was unable to move the ball for a 1st 
down. They kicked on 4th down, and 
Brackett fumbled the ball. Sabinal 
recovered it, but could not gain much 
yardage. The remainder of 
the 3rd and 4th quarter was an 
exchange of the football and hard 
tackles.

A light rain started as the 3rd 
quarter ended and fumbles and 
incompleted passed ran rampant. The 
Tigers threatened late in the last 
quarter but an intercepted pass 
caused them to give up the ball and 
the Yellowjackets ran out the clock.

Brackett Tigers attend pep rally before first home game.

Brackett Tigers
1 NAME HEIGHT WEIGHT POSITION CLASS

10 A d r i a n  Pena 5 ’ 9 " 1 65 Q B / S a f e t y 1 1
17 J o h n  Ingram 5 ' 9 " 1 6 5 T B / S a f e t y 1 1
18 F r a n k  G u a j a r d o 5 ' 8 " 1 3 5 Q B / C o r n e r 10
2 0 Lynn F l o y d 5 ' 1 0 11 1 80 WB/QB/End 1 1
22 J ^ s s e  T e r r a z a s 5 ' 6 " 1 35 S E / C o r n e r 10
24 J . J .  S a n d o v a l 5* 9 " 1 45 S E / C o r n e r 11
25 J u a n  Dominguez 5 ' 6 " 1 6 0 TB/End 11
27 L e s l e y  F l o y d 5 ’ 5 “ 1 5 0 T B / C o r n e r 12
32 I s a u r o  R i v a s 5 ' 6 " 1 7 0 SE/D T a c k l e 12
33 G i l b e r t  V i l l a r r e a l 5 . 5 » 1 45 S E / C o r n e r 12
35 L u i s  G o n z a l e s 5 ’ 4 " 1 4 0 WB/End/LB 12
44 M i c h a e l  F l o r e s 5 ' 6 " 200 F B / L  Ba ck 12
54 Angel  J a s s o 5 ' 7 " 1 9 5 G / F B / L  Back 1 1
56 P e t e r  P e r e z 5 ’ 1 0 " 1 9 0 C / L  B a c k e r 12
63 B r i a n  S c i b a 5 ' 1 1  " 16 5 G/End 10
64 S c o t t  Sims 5 ' l l " 201 C/G/D Ta c k 12
65 P e d r o  Abr ego 5 * 8 " 2 1 0 T/D T a c k l e 12
7 0 Gl enn T h a rp 5 ' 1 0 " 1 9 0 G/D T a c k l e 12
71 Tommy F o s t e r 5 ’ 1 1 " 202 T/D T a c k l e 1 1
7 2 David S e a r g e a n t 5 . 7 » 1 6 0 G/D T a c k l e 12
74 V i c t o r  S a n c h e z 5 ' 8 " 1 7 5 T/D T a c k l e 1 1
75 G u adal upe  R o d r i g u e z 5 * 9 " 2 4 0 T/D T a c k l e 10
81 J o s e p h  J i m e n e z 5 ’ 8 " 1 80 TE/D T a c k l e 12
85 A l b e r t  C or onad o 5 ' 8 " 1 4 0 S E / C o r n e r 1 1
8 7 R o g e r  P i na 5 ' 1 0 " 1 6 0 S E / C o r n e r 1 1
88 Davi d Dor rough 5 ' 1 0  " 1 7 5 TE/D T a c k l e 10
99 T e v i n  Senne 5 ' 1 1 " 1 80 S E / S a f e t y 12

MANAGERS: Jimmy M a r t i n e z ,  Danny M a r t i n e z ,  Ma tt he w Rocha
ATHLETIC DIRECTOR: Gr eg g  Nowlin
COACHES: C a r l  G l a s s ,  C a r r o l l  P e t r o s k y ,  J a c k  P h i l l i p s ,

David B u r t o n ,  F r a n k  T a y l o r

U n s u n g  H e r o
by Joe Townsend

There is a fine young lady who 
as spent her entire life in Bracket- 
/ille. She is a beautiful young lady 
lat her parents can be justly proud 
f. She is a fine student and a very 
opular student among her fellow 
tudents.

Her academic accomplishments 
tark her as a serious student. Her 
utside activities in the rodeo arena 
lark her as a most exceptional 
oung lady. It is impossible to fail to 
ke this lovely young lady.

Surely Kelley Hall is an “Unsung 
lero.”
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See You At The Pole
Fourteen Christian young people 

from Brackettville representing 
three denominations of church af­
filiation gathered at the Flag Pole 
on the Brackett School Campus at 
7:00 a.m. Wednesday morning to 
join an expected 60,000 Texas 
young people and others from 
across the nation in the largest 
simultaneous youth prayer meeting 
in history.

“See You at the Pole" was laun­
ched by Texas Baptists last year 
and drew more than 45,000 high 
school and junior high school 
students to pray around the 
flagpoles at about 1,000 Texas 
schools.

Christian students from different 
churches and denominations saw 
they weren’t alone in making a 
stand for Christ on their campuses. 
The simultaneous prayer meeting 
to call upon God’s intervention in 
the lives of each person in the 
school has spread across the nation 
to thousands of campuses.

Chuck Flowers, youth associate 
in the Texas Baptist Evangelism 
Division said, “The school campus 
is one of the great mission fields of
ourn(Aioni|Meefin^oi^iejCiUn^usi

to pray is a symbol of our confiden­
ce that God will work in the lives of 
students, if Christians boldly agree 
with His desire to have all come to 
know Him: Students are en­
couraged to pray for their teachers 
and other leaders and for God to in­
tervene in student problems such 
as drug and alcohol abuse, sexual 
immorality, depression, suicidal 
tendencies and satanic cult in­
fluences. The purpose is not to 
make a militant stand against 
organizations that oppose any 
Christian influence on campus. We 
want these prayer gatherings to 
focus on the real purpose, and that 
is prayer. To avoid potential con­
flicts, it is essential that “See You 
at the Pole” prayer meetings be 
student-led."

Adults were encouraged to pray 
for the students, perhaps 
organizing their own prayer groups 
to meet near the school campus or 
around the flagpole at a court 
house or city hall at the same time 
as the students.

Youth leaders are urged to call 
1-800-880-0789 to report the par- 
ticipation at schools in their area.

M y  P la c e
Hurrah For Football Season!

We Have M ums Supplies &
Ready Made Mums 

C A L L : (512) 775-7234. >
Business Hours: 1 0 :0 0  a.m. to 9 :0 0 p.m.

PLAZA DEL SOL MALL

BISD School Menu
Lunch

Breakfast

MONDAY, SEPT. 16 
Peanut Butter 

Toast - Fruit Juice 
Milk

TUESDAY, SEPT. 17 
Sausage/Biscuit 

Fruit Juice - Milk 
WEDNESDAY, SEPT. 18 

Scrambled Eggs - Toast 
Fruit - Milk

THURSDAY, SEPT. 19 
Cheese Toast - Fruit Juice 

Milk
FRIDAY, SEPT. 20 

Sweet Roll - Fruit Juice 
Milk

è

ë

MONDAY, SEPT 16 
Sloppy Joe on Bun

Tator Tots - Veggie Sticks 
Cookie - Milk 

TUESDAY, SEPT. 17 
Tacos - Taco Salad 

Ranch Beans 
Spanish Rice 
Fruit - Milk

WEDNESDAY, SEPT. 18 
Hamburger 

French Fries 
Burger Salad 
Jello - Milk 

THURS. SEPT. 19 
Pizza

Green Beans 
Apple Cobbler - Milk 
FRIDAY, SEPT. 20 

Fried Chicken 
Whipped Potatoes 

Fruit - Roll 
Milk

SALAD BAR AVAILABLE

Kinney County Chamber o f Commerce 
You need it! It needs you!

Las Moras Inn 
Restaurant

Fort Clark Springs 
512-563-2290

SUNDAY BREAKFAST BUFFET 
7:00 a.m. - 10:30 a.m. $4.75

LUNCHEON BUFFE^
11:00 a.m. - 2:00 p.m. $6.95

Menu Available 7:00 A.M. - 9:00 I\M.

!
FORUM 4 THEATRES

UVALDE. TEXAS * SHOWTIME » 278-6618

Rated R 
Held Over
Mon.-Fri. 7:30, 9:30 and 11:45 
Sat. and Sun. 2, 4. 6. 8 and 10

Julia Campbell 
Roberts Scott

Dying Yxing
It’s not just a lo w  story. 

It’s a life story

R l^ m

Rated R
Mon. - Fri. 7:30, 9:30 and 11:45 
Sat. and Sun. 2. 4. 6. 8 and 10

8 1 .0 0  Dollar Off ¡
Regular Admission |
Ticket Price With |

This Coupon. |

F R  
D

THE FINAL Nl
Rated R
No Dollar Night
Mon.-Fri. 7:30, 9:30 and 11:45
Sat. and Sun. 2, 4. 6. 8 and 10

I JEAN-CLAUDE VAN DAMME

IM P A C T
Rated R 
Held Over
Friday 9:30 and 11:45 
Sat. and Sun. 8 and 10

101Rated G
Held Over DALMATIANS
Fri. 7:30 Only
Sat. and Sun. 1:45, 3:15, 4:45 
and 6:15
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Legislature Pulls 
Fast One

Let’s stand up and be counted! 
There are obviously lots of 
legislators in Austin who have no 
idea how much good bingo does for 
communities all over Texas. Surely, 
if they knew, they’d treat our 
charities differently.

Eighteen hundred (1,800) 
charities play bingo in Texas. 
Worthy causes. The way it should 
be, not crying for government han­
douts.

So what did our legislature do in 
their latest session? At the last 
minute, without giving the public 
adequate time to mount a real op­
position, they passed a whopping 
tax bill to tax bingo charities and 
players as well.

This unfair tax could put many of 
our games and charities out of 
business!
Here’s what they did:
'Reduced the tax on horse racing 
'Reduced the tax on dog racing 
'Increased the tax on bingo 
charities from 2% to 5% of the 
gross receipts
'Added a 3% tax on all bingo win­
nings!

So now, when you’re lucky enou­
gh to finally win that big one you’ve 
been waiting for you’ll have to turn 
around and give back 3% to the hall, 
who will be collecting the tax for the 
state. That means on a $500 pot, the 
government will take first $15.

I suppose that we can probably 
grit our teeth and swallow this, in 
spite of the irritating fact that the 
government will again have its han­
ds in our pockets. After all, most of 
us are just out to have a good time.

The most ludicrous part of the 
new tax is the increase in taxes the 
charity pays to the state. Many of 
the charities who operate games 
barely make enough to keep their 
doors open as it is. Many of the 
games are operated by volunteer 
workers trying to help some very 
good causes. For these people to 
have to pay their proceeds to the 
state instead of their charities is a 
crying shame.

I am sure, to someone, it makes 
sense that money being earned for 
a charitable cause should be taxed at 
a higher rate than that which goes to 
the fat cat race track owners, but I 
fail to see the logic.

As one VFW operator told me, 
“This could easily put a lot of small 
halls right out of business. Many 
just can’t survive this type of tax. It 
could be devastating.”

I am hoping that, although this 
bill has passed, it can be changed in 
the next session. But it will take a 
mounted effort from everyone.

Some quick decisions were made 
in the last budget session that con­
firm the old saying, “Haste Makes 
Waste.” If our legislators are given 
enough information and a little 
pressure to change, we can make a 
difference.
! I urge you to write your represen- 

thtives and the governor. Do it now! 
Bingo can’t afford this tax.

------------------ ;-------------- 5 ----------------

Collins
Scholarship

Kristi Lynn Collins of Camp 
Wood has been awarded a two-year, 
$3,000 Abell-Hanger Foundation 
scholarship by the Texas Inter­
scholastic League Foundation.

This year the Abell-Hanger 
Foundation awarded 55 grants to 
students who have participated in 
the UIL academic state meet con­
tests and who have compiled an out­
standing record of academic and ex­
tracurricular achievement.

A graduate of Nueces Canyon 
High School, Collins placed fourth in 
the 1990 state meet keyboarding

She has also participated in the 
UIL poetry interpretation, oral 
reading, persuasive speaking, solo 
and ensemble, current events, band, 
tennis, basketball, headline writing, 
and editorial writing contests.

; Her high school activities and 
honors include National Honor 
Society (all four years), valedic­
torian, Miss Nueces Canyon High 
School, band sweetheart, class vice 
president, Student Council 
president, band president, band 
reporter, Nueces Canyon best 
citizen, and yearbook awards for 
three years.
• Collins plans to attend Angelo 
■State University to prepare for a

’ teaching career. She is the daughter 
of Floyd and Karen Collins.
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Nueces Canyon News
By JAMES GREER

EMS Report
The E.M.S. received memorials 

for Nemo Webb from L.A. and Bon­
nie Rummell, David and Virginia 
Courtney, Joe and Doris Mills, Ray 
and Stella Burkholder, Clifford and 
Maxine Hicks, Bill and Joyce 
Phillips, Lee Sweeten, Reta Hubble, 
Mr. and Mrs. Kelso Vernor, T  Sgt. 
and Mrs. Eugene Rogers, and 
Henry and Nova Clements.

Memorials for Robert Sone were 
received from Joe and Doris Mills, 
David and Virginia Courtney, Stell 
and Ray Burkholder and the Bank of 
Frio Canyon.

Memorials were received for 
Calvin Merritt from Henry and 
Nova Clements, Stella Merritt 
Burkholder, and Doris and Morris 
Merritt; for Juanita Arredondo from 
Joyce and Bill Phillips; and for 
Morris Merritt, from Stella 
Burkholder, Joe and Dori Mills, and 
Lee Sweeten.

These people gave of their time 
to sit in the office as a dispatcher for 
the EMS and Fire Department:

Lola Patton, Jeanne Rains, NC- 
VFD Ladies Auxiliary, James Con­
nell, R.E. Hudson, Rick Rains, 
Virginia Courtney, Imogene Hoh- 
man, Alice Welch, Tommy 
Tolleson, Floyd Kinley, Janet Wells, 
Susie Jechow, Dot Wells, Delores 
Brandenstein, Stella Burkholder, 
Beryl and Marjorie Mitchell and 
Elva Connell.

The night dispatchers were 
Tommie Tolleson and Rick Rains.

Many thanks to the dispatching 
volunteers. Without their support, 
the EMS would not be able to stay 
open for 24 hours every day of the 
year.

There will be an emergency care 
attendent course given for anyone 
who wants to be able to help either 
their family or the community. This 
will start in October.

More information is on the 
bulletin board in the office, so come 
by and sign up for the course. More 
team members are needed.

Cemetery
Donations

The Camp Wood Cemetery 
Assocation received a donation from 
Lester Livingsailor and one from 
S.A. Wooldridge in memory of 
Nemo Webb.

Your donations to the Camp 
Wood Cemetery Association is 
greatly appreciated, and the 
cemetery needs your help in order to 
keep some one hired to keep the 
cemetery looking nice.

Trip To Lake 
Livingston

This writer and my wife, Bryce, 
decided it was time to get away from 
the old grind for a camping trip on 
Lake Livingston, so that is why I 
didn’t have any news in the paper 
this past week.

We enjoyed swimming, going to

an Arts and Craft show, visiting 
with other campers, and just 
relaxing. We enjoyed the trip, but I 
found out that our two dogs don’t 
like camping out as they had to be 
tied up.

While gone, we did get to visit 
with our children, the Terry John­
son family, and the Ronald Johnson 
family in Willis, and the Robert 
Sergent family in Conroe, and the 
Jimmie Johnson family in Cut-N- 
Shoot.

Also we got to see our great- 
grandson, William Allen Fanestiel 
for the first time. We had a good 
time in spite of all the rain, but it is 
nice to be back home.

Obituaries
Bobbie Joe Talley

Bobbie Joe Talley of Port Man­
sfield died August 14, 1991, in 
Valley Baptist Medical Center in 
Harlingen. He was 62.

Bobbie Joe Talley was born 
November 15,1928, in Camp Wood.

Survivors are his wife, Ellie Bea 
Talley of Port Mansfield; son, Ike 
Morgan of Kasilof, Alaska; 
daughter, Pat Halsell of Camp 
Wood; three brothers, R.C. Talley 
of Camp Wood, Bill Ed Talley of 
Falfurrias and W.D. Talley of 
Gilchrist; four sisters. Hazle Roberts 
of Prescott, Arizona, Evelyn Hut­
cherson and Neva Bingham of 
Uvalde, and Eulalia Parker of 
Castroville; seven grandchildren; 
and three great-grandchildren.

A memorial service was held 
August 16 in Duddleston Funeral 
Chapel in Port Mansfield.

Graveside services were at 10 
a.m. August 17 in the Camp Wood 
Cemetery under the direction of 
Nelson Funeral Home.

The family suggests memorials 
be made to the American Cancer 
Society.

Samuel M. Bowman

Services for Samuel M. Bowman, 
Jr. of Barksdale were held Tuesday, 
august 3, 1991 in the First Baptist 
Church in Vance. The Rev. Homer 
Stephens of Barksdale officiated, 
assisted by the Rev. Paul Carleton of 
Vande.
Special music was by the Rev. 
Bruce Ford of the First Baptist 
Church of Crystal City and Anne 
Cox of the First Baptist Church of 
Barksdale, accompanied by Beverly 
Jackman.
Internment was in the Vance 
Cemetery under the direction of 
Nelson Funeral Home.
Pallbearers were his nephews, Bob­
by Burleson, Steve Nance, Brad 
Shoopman, Court .Bradford, Staf­
ford Thomas, Sherwood Thomas, 
Gary Tumlinson, Hollice Ward, 
Mark Ward, and greatnephew, 
Wally Burleson.
Bowman, 65, died August 30, 1991. 
He was born in Eola on Nov, 23, 
1925, the son of Samuel M. and Alva 
Bowman.
He and Anna Marcellene Burleson

were married Sept. 8, 1946, in Fort 
Stockton.
Mr. and Mrs. Bowman had been 
living in Barksdale since his semi 
retirement from Bowman Lease 
Services in Carrizo Springs. Since 
living in Barksdale, he had been ac­
tive in the ranching business and 
was assisted by Leroy Connell. 
Bowman was a member of the First 
Baptist Church in Barksdale. 
Survivors include his wife, Marcy, 
of Barksdale; son and daughter-in- 
law, Larry and Becky Bowman of 
Harper; son, Sam Bowman III of 
Carrizo Springs; and three gran­
dchildren, Cody, Allison and Kathy. 
He is also survived by a brother, 
Wiley Bowman of Menard; sister 
Ala Mae McMahon of Beeville; and 
numerous nieces and nephews.

Daniel Morris Merrit

Daniel Morris Merritt of Camp 
Wood died August 27, 1991, at his 
home.

Services were held Saturday at 
the First Baptist Church in Camp 
Wood with interment in the Camp 
Wood Cemetery under the direction 
of Nelson Funeral Home.

Merritt was born April 25, 1913, 
in Hackberry, Texas. He married 
Dorris Maddux on April 7, 1935, in 
Uvalde.

He worked for the Southern 
Pacific Railroad for 31 years, with 
injury free service. He retired and 
moved to Camp Wood in 1972.

Merritt spent his retirement years 
traveling, fishing, hunting and en­
joying his family and friends. His 
wife was his biggest competitor, be 
it fishing or hunting and his co-pilot 
and navigator while on the road in 
the family’s recreational vehicles.

Survivors include his wife Dorris 
of Camp Wood; son, Morris D. 
Merritt of Las Vegas; two 
daughters, Laverne Neff of 
Maryland and Peggy Hickman of 
Houston; a sister Dorothy Hope An­
derson of Camp Wood: seven gran- 
children; eight great grandchildren; 
a niece; a nephew; and numerous 
cousins. He was this scribe’s cousin.

Robert Lee Winans

Services for Robert Lee Winans, 
76, of Celeste were held at 2 p.m. 
August 31, 1991 in Taylor Funeral 
Home Chapel in Leonard. Thomas 
Willess officiated.
Graveside services were held at the 
Barksdale Cemetery with Roland 
Fry officiating.
Winans died August 29, 1991, in 
Citizens General Hospital in Green­
ville. He was born Feb. 21, 1915, at 
Barksdale, son of Lee and Emily 
Lacey Winans.
He and Lucille Sansom were 
married December 23, 1944, at 
Camp Wood. Winans was a retired 
rancher, Army veteran of World 
War II, and a member of the Church 
of Christ.
He is survived by his wife, Lucille 
Winans, of Celeste; four daughters, 
Lois Cato and Mary Ann WinanS of

Celeste, Lena Fay Byrd of Temple, 
and Julia Maria Slade of Austin; 
seven grandchildren, and two great 
grandchildren.
He is survived by a sister, Viola 
Taylor, of Cleburne; and two 
brothers, Arthur Winans of Del Rio 
and Luther Winans of Uvalde.
A son, Milton Lee Winans, preceded 
him in death in 1975.

Louis Nemo Webb

Louis Nemo Webb of Camp Wood 
died August 21, 1991, at age 81. He 
was born April 8, 1910, in Camp 
Wood.

Survivors are a son, Lonnie Ray 
Webb, Camp Wood; daughter-in- 
law, June Webb, Camp Wood; 
grandsons, Louis Ray Webb of 
Camp Wood; and Robert Woodrow 
Webb of Wayne, Michigan; gran­
ddaughter, Effie Lee Jackman of 
Camp Wood; brother Rupert Webb 
of Hawaii; sisters, Ollie Ray Edwar­
ds of Belton and Gwen Dunsworth 
of Arlington; six great­
grandchildren.

Services were held at 4 p.m. 
Friday, August 23, in the First Bap­
tist Church of Camp Wood followed 
by burial in Camp Wood Cemetery. 
Rev. Mike Smith, pastor of the First 
Baptist Church of Camp Wood and 
Rev. Homer Stephens pastor of the 
First Baptist Church of Barksdale 
officiated.
Pallbearers were Carrol Vernor, Ed 
Vernor, Milburn Vernor, Kelso 
Vernor, Calvin Vernor and Jerry 
Gildart.
Arrangements were by Rushing- 
Estes-Knowles Mortuary.

Robert A. Sone

Robert A. Sone of Camp Wood, 
former County Attorney for Real 
County, died August 23, 1991, in a 
Kerrville hospital following a brief 
illness. He was 97.

Services were held at 3 p.m. 
Monday, August 26 at the Barksdale 
United Methodist Church, followed 
by burial in the Vance Cemetery1 un­
der the direction of Nelson Funeral 
Home.

Sone was born November 1893, in 
Collin County, Texas, to James 
William and Martha Ballew Sone. 
He served in the United States Navy 
during World War I and was 
stationed in France.

He attended Oklahoma Univer­
sity and the University of Texas

Law School, and was licensed to 
practice law in Oklahoma in 1925 
and in Texas in 1926.

In 1927, he was married to Violet 
West of Muleshoe.

Sone served as County Attorney 
in Bailey County and Floyd County 
and practiced law for 26 years in 
Corpus Christi where he also served 
as City Attorney for a period of time.

He retired at the age of 91 after 
serving 22 years as County Attorney 
in Real County.

Sone was a member of the Texas 
Bar Association, Barksdale United 
Methodist Church, Nueces Canyon

Nueces Canyon- 
School News
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Band Readies 
For Contest

Members of the Panther Band 
and band director Louis Webb have 
been very busy preparing for this 
year’s marching season, according 
to drum major Elaine Valenzuela.

The UIL District Marching Con­
test has been scheduled for Satur­
day, October 26th, and will be held 
in Hondo agains this year.

The top two Class A bands will 
qualify for area competition which 
has been set for November 2nd. Top 
winners at the area contest will mar­
ch in state competition on Monday. 
November 11th, at Memorial 
Stadium in Austin.

The drum major and the flag line 
are all sporting new uniforms this 
year, and were a real class act at the 
football game last week, according 
to spectators in the Panther crowd. 
Almost 90 students from 7th 
through 12th grades are marching in 
the band this season.

Members of the flag line are Janie 
Aguero, Jenny Finn, Sandy Raborn, 
Kandy Pruitt, Donna Welfring, 
Toby Winston, Shonda Davis, and 
Bambi Renfro, flag captain.

TAAS Testing
Nueces Canyon school officials 

have announced that TAAS tests 
will be administered to students on 
October 8, 9, and 10 this year. Tests 
are given in writing, reading, and 
mathematics.

These tests are required for 
students in the third, fifth, seventh, 
ninth, and eleventh grades by the 
Texas Education Agency. Tests 
taken by students in the eleventh 
grade also function as exit-level 
tests, and all students must pass 
these tests before being allowed to 
graduate from any Texas school.

Junior students who do not pass 
the October test will be tested again 
in April, 1992, and then may take 
the tests again in October and April 
of their senior year. The test is very 
important since a diploma will not be 
awarded until passing scores are at­
tained.

Parents are asked to mark these 
dates and be sure students come to 
school as prepared as possible to do 
well on the tests.

Yearbooks 
Are Here!

Members of the NCHS Annual 
Staff are happy to report that the 
NCHS 1990-91 yearbooks are here 
and are currently being distributed.

Persons who did not order in ad­
vance may purchase the extra copies 
for $22 each by calling yearbook ad­
visor Karen Collins or a member of 
the yearbook staff.

Working on the annual staff this 
year are Ben Cox, Courtney Ewing, 
Carolyn Hodge, Tonya Whittley, 
Jana Merritt, Melissa Hurt, and 
Patricia Hamilton.

Board Adopts 
Budget

Meeting in special session on 
August 29, 1991, members of the 
Nueces Canyon Board of Education 
unanimously voted to adopt a 
$2,252,091 budget for the 1991-92 
school year.

All seven board members were 
present for the special budget 
meeting as were Bobby W. Hatley, 
Ken Perkins, and Tommy Ferrell.

In other action, board members 
voted to join the area School Board 
Association and appointed Bobby 
Hatley as the NCCISD represen­
tative; adopted Policy Update 40 as 
related to employee complaint 
policies; elected Ola B. Creech and 
George Sweeten to the Edwards 
County Tax Appraisal Board of 
Directors; agreed as per the superin­
tendent’s recommendation to keep 
TASB as the group insurance 
carrier; approved the substitute list 
as presented by the administration: 
amended the 1990-91 budget; and 
approved payment of bills.

The next scheduled board 
meeting will be on the third Tuesday 
in September.

Season Opener

Panthers Outscore Dilley

The Nueces Canyon High School 
Panthers outscored their counter­
parts from Dilley by a 12-0 margin in 
the football season opener for both 
teams on Friday, September 6, at 
Northcutt Stadium in Camp Wood.

Oscar Saucedo intercepted a Wolf 
pass in the opening minutes of the 
game and ran 60 yards into the end 
zone to give the Panthers a 6-0 lead 
with 10 minutes left to play in the 
first quarter.

The extra-point kick was blocked, 
and the score remained at 6-0 until 
just minutes before the first half en­
ded when Panther quarterback 
Jason Horner connected on a pass to 
Paul Nevarez for a 40-vard touch­
down. 'Fhe PAT was again unsuc­
cessful, leaving the score 12-0 at the 
half.

Both teams played tough defense 
during a scoreless second half, and 
the Panthers claimed their first vic­
tory of the 1991 season as the game 
ended on a 12-0 note.

Coaches James Russell and Rod­
dy McDougald were very pleased 
with the victory and with, the strong 
defensive showing made by the Pan­
ther players.

Students on the team this year in­
clude seniors Arthur Nevarez, Jason 
Horner, Gilbert Hernandez, Paul 
Nevarez, Will Baker, John Pannell, 
and Oscar Saucedo; juniors Brian

Chamber of Commerce and Nueces
Canyon Civic League.

Survivors include his wife, Violet 
West Sone of Camp Wood; son, the 
Rev. Robert A. Sone Jr.; and his 
wife, Sharon, of Evanston, Wyo.; 
daughter, Rosemary Sone Sherman 
of Corpus Christi; grandson, Capt. 
John A. Sone, and wife, Marla of 
Mesquite; two granddaughters, 
Susan Rose Sherman of New Braun­
fels and Laura Lynn Sherman of 
Austin; and two great-grandchildren 
Jeffrey Adam Sone and Stephanie 
Lynn Sone of Mesquite.

Pallbearers for the service were 
L.H. West, Thomas Ferrell, Pat 
O’Bryant, Harry Wilson, G.W. 
Twilligear and John Hohman.

The family suggests memorials 
be made to the Barksdale United 
Methodist Church or a favorite 
charity.

Recognition 
Program 

Honors Deer 
Habitat 

Managers
AUSTIN - The Texas Big Game 
Management Awards Program, 
designed to recognize the importan­
ce of habitat and population 
management and stimulate that in­
terest in Texas was approved by the 
Texas Parks and Wildlife Com­
mission.

The program will emphasize the 
importance of management and 
promotion of proper habitat and 
population management which are 

necessary for producing quality 
white-tailed deer, and most other 

wildlife species benefit from these 
habitat management activities.

Deer were used because antler 
development generally reflects 
habitat quality. Herd health can be 
measured and documented by antler 
length and beam diameter. Other 
indicators include fawn < production 
ahd'-Sdi ÎVaWHty,1 genettedaand the 
age structuré1 of the herd.

The program will recognize the 
land manager, the hunter and the 
quality of the animal itself. A listing 
will be published annually for white­
tailed deer, mule deer and antelope. 
The white-tailed deer category will 
be broken down into as many as 
eight regions so a manager can see 
what type of animal can be produced 
in a particular area of the state with 
proper management. There may 
also be a category for the first deer 
taken by a hunter.

The program will recognize good 
management practices, with cer­
tificates given regionally and 
statewide. No prizes with a 
monetary value will be presented 
since the goal is to stimulate interest 
in management and hunting.

Borchardt, Paul San Miguel, and 
Jerry Arredondo; sophomores 
Frank Karnes, Juan Gonzalez, Bill 
Newman, and Jesse Gomez; and 
freshmen Gama Saucedo, Heath 
Walzel, Billy Van Winkle, Dan Cox, 
Adam Hidalgo, Abel Hidalgo, and 
Johnny Hernandez.

Captains chosen for this year’s 
team arc seniors Oscar Saucedo, 
Paul Nevarez, Jason Horner, and 
Arthur Nevarez.

The Panthers will play in La 
Pryor on Friday. September 13th, at 
8:00 p.m. The Bulldogs lost their 
season opener 16-0 to Rocksprings 
last week. The Panthers will again 
play at home on September 20th 
when they are scheduled to meet the 
Tigers from Brackettville.

Junior High 
Football

The Jr. High Panther football 
team will open the 1991 season on 
Thursday, September 12th, when 
they challenge their counterparts 
from La Pryor at Northcutt Stadium 
in Camp Wood at 6:30 p.m.

The young Panthers are coached 
by Tike Burleson and Roddy Mc­
Dougald.

Cheerleaders for the Panthers are 
April Jablonski, Brandy Ward Kacv 
Fairchild, Maria Flores, Jennifer 
Allen, and Shannon Duran.

ja



ite fcactefi itws.
State seeks 
top artist

Friday, The Thirteenth
Watch Out For Black Cats

The State of Texas will recognize 
its outstanding artists for their con­
tributions portraying the proud 
spirit of Texas with the selection of 
the 1991 Texas State Artists.

Nominations are open statewide 
to any artist who resides in the state 
and wishes to be considered for the 
honor.

Interested artists are asked to send 
photographic samples and biograph­
ical sketches in a ring binder note­
book to Rep. Bruce Gibson, P.O. 
Box 2910, Austin, Tx. 78768. All 
materials will be returned to the 
artist.

The deadline for application is 
Sept. 23. Any artist selected as a 
semi-finalist should have three rep­
resentative pieces of their work 
ready to exhibit in the Capitol dur- 
ing mid to late October.

Learn About 
Constitution

By DORTHY PAYNE
Brackett News Staff Writer________

September 17 - 25 is Constitution 
Week.

Since 1955, Presidents of the 
United States have proclaimed Con- 
sitution Week to remind all 
Americans that the Constitution is 
an important part of our daily lives.

It protects our rights. It shapes 
our public debates. It is what 
millions have taken an oath to 
defend.

Take time this week to learn 
about the Constitution!

By DORTHY PAYNE
Brackett News Staff Writer

Friday, the thirteenth, is sup­
posed to be the unluckiest day of the 
year. There are many superstitions 
associated with this day, so be a cool 
cat, and watch your step.

According to Webster’s Dic­
tionary, superstition is a belief in, or 
fear of, what is unknown, 
mysterious, or supernatural,

opinion, or practice based on belief 
in divination, magic or omens.

And, believe me, there are plenty, 
like: don’t walk under a ladder; or 
let a black cat cross in front of you; 
or don’t light three cigarettes on one 
match; or knock on wood for good 
luck; or see a penny and pick it up.

Of course, in present time I guess 
most people would let a penny lay, 
but I think I would probably pick up 
a dime.

Cholesterol Awareness Month
By DORTHY PAYNE
Brackett News Staff Writer________

September is National Cholesterol 
Education and Awareness Month. 
Cholesterol is a steroid chemical, 
present in certain foods, mainly fatty 
foods. Small amounts are essential 
for making and maintaining nerve 
cells and for synthesizing natural 
hormones. You do not have to eat 
cholesterol--rich foods such as fatty 
meats and dairy products in order to 
have your daily quota of this sub­
stance. Your liver can utilize other

foods to manufacture all the 
cholesterol you need.

If you cut all cholesterol rich food 
out of your diet you could lower the 
cholesterol content of your blood 
about 15%. That 15%, however, 
might make the difference between 
having a functional system and the 
development of a life threatening 
disorder. So if you include only 
small amounts of saturated fats and 
few eggs in your normal diet, you 
could lower your blood cholesterol 
level and also lower your risk of 
atherosclerosis (a form of arthritis).
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Seminole Indian Scout Cemetery Association 
Seminole Days Celebration

September 21 & 22, 1991 9 :0 0  a.m. until—
Carver School Grounds

Brackettville, Texas

Parade
September 21, 9 :30  a.m. 
line up at Southwest Communications 
Parade will end at Carver School 
Parade Awards at 11:00 a.m.

Booths 
^  Games

Exhibits

Disco Dance
Pipo’s Place

Bar-B-Que
12 O’clock pan.-Lunch 

Plates $3.50, 1 meat 
$4.00, 2 meats 
$5.00 all meats

Singing 
Music

For information contact Beverly Wright, 563-2422
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PUBLIC NOTICE
BRIEF EXPLANATORY STATEMENTS 

OF PROPOSED

CONSTITUTIONAL AMENDMENTS
SPECIAL ELECTION 
NOVEMBER 5, 1991

PROPOSITION NO. 1 
ON THE BALLOT

Lady Luck Dies 
At Fort Griffin

ALBANY-Lady Luck, queen of 
the State of Texas Longhorn herd, 
died Aug. 9 after a short bout with 
pneumonia at Fort Griffin State 
Park.

Sired by Manchadita in 1974 at the 
park, the 17 year old cow produced 
13 calves. Her bloodline continues in 
two sons, three daughters, two 
grandsons, three granddaughters and 
one great grandson.

Lady Luck’s horns measured long­
er than 50 inches and she was believed 
by many to be the best Longhorn cow 
in the breed today, said Lester 
Galbreath, park superintendent at 
Fort Griffin, located 15 miles north 
of Albany on U.S. 283.

The cow won every show she 
entered, including Champion Senior 
Longhorn Cow and Champion Ma­
ture Longhorn Cow at the 1985 Fort 
Worth Livestock Show, 1987 World 
Champion Mature Cow and 1987 
World Champion Cow.

“ Lady Luck was a very special 
Longhorn cow and one I will not 
forget,” *3albreath said. “ She has 
been the number one cow in the state 
herd since 1978 and her legacy will be 
carried on by her daughters and 
granddaughters for many years to

Texas - Mexico 
Negotiate Unique 
Joint Program

AUSTIN-Tourism industry of­
ficials from Mexico and Texas 
negotiated a unique joint 
marketing program for Texas - 
Mexico border tourism in an­
ticipation of the North American 
Free Trade Agreement. The 
program aims to increse commerce 
and international tourism to Mexico 
and the United States.

The marketing program, known 
as “The Two Nation Vacation,” was 
formalized as a Texas-Northern 
Mexico initiative at the VI United 
States-Mexico Border Tourism Con­
ference, hosted by the Texas Depar­
tment of Commerce Tourism 
Division in Laredo on July 25-17.

The initiative encourages inter­
national travelers to visit Texas and 
the Mexican border states of 
Tamaulipas, Nuevo Leon, Coahuila 
and Chihuahua as a joint travel 
destination.

Tourism officials participating in 
this meeting, hosted by the Texas 
Department of Commerce Tourism 
Division, included members of the 
Mexican Ministry of Tourism 
(SECTUR) and the Mexican states 
of Tamaulipas, Nuevo Leon, 
Coahuila and Chihuahua. Officials 
from the Texas Hotel and 
Highways, the Texas Hotel and 
Motel Association, Texas Travel 
Industry Association and GSD&M 
Advertising also participated in the 
meeting.

"The Two Nation Vacation pac­
kage will promote the regions 
music, food, heritage, architecture, 
sports, special events and 
celebrations to the international 
traveler. The officials agreed that 
further research is needed to shape 
the marketing strategy.

House Joint Resolution 114 pro­
poses a constitutional amendment 
that would authorize home rule cities 
having a population of 5,000 or 
fewer inhabitants to amend their 
city charters by a majority vote of 
a city’s qualified voters at an elec­
tion held for that purpose. The 
amendment makes clear that home 
rule cities that have declined in 
population below the population re­
quired to initially adopt a charter 
may nevertheless continue to amend 
their charters.

The proposed amendment will be 
described on the ballot as follows: 

“The constitutional amendment al­
lowing home-rule cities with a 
population of 5,000 or less to 
amend their charters by popular 
vote.”

PROPOSITION NO. 2 
ON THE BALLOT

House Joint Resolution 10 pro­
poses ^  constitutional amendment 
that would allow the legislature to 
authorize the Texas Department of 
Transportation to expend money, 
from any source available, for the 
costs of the turnpikes, toll roads, or 
toll bridges of the Texas Turnpike 
Authority, provided that any monies 
expended from the state highway 
fund shall be repaid to the fund 
from tolls or other turnpike rev­
enue.

The proposed amendment will be 
described on the ballot as follows: 

“The constitutional amendment 
mandating the repayment to the 
Department of Transportation of 
monies expended to assist the 
Texas Turnpike Authority in the 
construction, maintenance, and op­
eration of turnpikes, toll roads 
and toll bridges.”

PROPOSITION NO. 3 
ON THE BALLOT

Senate Joint Resolution 26 pro­
poses a constitutional amendment 
that would authorize the Veterans’ 
Land Board to invest, as authorized 
by law, moneys of the Veterans’ 
Land Fund which are not immedi­
ately committed to the payment of 
principal and interest on bonds 
issued by the Veterans’ Land Board, 
the purchase of lands, or the pay­
ment of expenses. Investment of 
such moneys would no longer be re­
stricted to investments in bonds or 
obligations of the United States. The 
proposed amendment would also 
authorize the Veterans’ Land Board 
to invest, as authorized by law, 
moneys of the Veterans’ Housing 
Assistance Fund which are not im­
mediately committed to the payment 
of principal and interest on general 
obligation bonds issued by the Vet­
erans’ Land Board for the benefit 
of the Veterans’ Housing Assistance 
Fund, the making of home mor­
tgage loans, or the payment of ex­
penses. Investment of such moneys 
would no longer be restricted to in­
vestments in bonds or obligations of 
the United States. The proposed 
amendment gives the legislature 
power to implement the amendment 
and to delegate such duties and au­
thority to the Veterans’ Land Board 
as it deems necessary.

The proposed amendment will he 
described on the ballot as follows: 

“The constitutional amendment to 
authorize the legislature to further 
implement and enhance the ad­
ministration of the veterans’ 
housing assistance and land pro­
grams and to expand the invest­
ment authority of the Veterans’ 
Land Board.”

PROPOSITION NO. 4 
ON THE BALLOT

Senate Joint Resolution 4 proposes 
a constitutional amendment that 
would allow the legislature to au­
thorize the issuance of a maximum 
of $1.1 billion in general obligation 
bonds. The proceeds of the bonds are 
to be used to acquire, construct, or 
equip new prisons and substance 
abuse felony punishment facilities, 
mental health and mental retarda-

tion institutions, and youth correc­
tions institutions, to repair and reno­
vate existing facilities of those 
institutions and to acquire, repair, 
or renovate other facilities for use 
as state prisons or substance abuse 
felony punishment facilities. The 
$1.1 billion is in addition to the $900 
million currently authorized by the 
constitution to be expended on bond 
issues for facilities of correctional 
and mental health and mental re­
tardation institutions. The bonds 
would constitute a general obligation 
of the state. The bonds and interest 
on the bonds would be paid from the 
first money coming into the state 
treasury that is not otherwise ap­
propriated by the constitution, less 
any amount in a sinking fund at the 
end of the preceding fiscal year that 
is pledged to payment of the bonds 
or interest.

The proposed amendment will be 
described on the ballot as follows: 

“The constitutional amendment 
authorizing the issuance of up to 
$1.1 billion in general obligation 
bonds for acquiring, constructing, 
or equipping new prisons or other 
punishment facilities to confine 
criminals, mental health and men­
tal retardation institutions, and 
youth corrections institutions, for 
major repair or renovation of 
existing facilities of those institu­
tions, and for the acquisition of, 
major repair to, or renovation of 
other facilities for use as state 
prisons or other punishment fa­
cilities.”

PROPOSITION NO. 5 
ON THE BALLOT

Senate Joint Resolution 39 pro­
poses a constitutional amendment 
that would allow a county, junior 
college district, or municipality to 
exempt tangible personal property 
from ad valorem taxation if : (1) 
the property is acquired or brought 
into the state in an enterprise zone 
to be forwarded outside the state, 
(2) the property is assembled, 
stored, repaired, maintained, manu­
factured, processed, or fabricated 
in the enterprise zone, (3) the prop­
erty is transported outside the state 
not later than 175 days after being 
acquired or brought into an enter- 
prize zone, and (4) the person who 
acquired or brought the property 
into an enterprise zone is a qualified 
business. A county, junior college 
district, or municipality may exempt 
such property by entering into a 
written agreement with a qualified 
business that states the duration of 
the exemption and the terms on 
which the exemption is granted. Any 
action to exempt property must be 
taken before April 1 of the first 
year in which the property would 
otherwise be taxed. The term “enter- 
prize zone” means an area that (1) 
has been designated as such by a 
state agency responsible for econom­
ic development, and (2) has per­
vasive poverty, unemployment, and 
economic distress. The term “quali­
fied business” means a business that 
meets the qualification established 
by general law. and requires that 
the qualified business is actively en­
gaged in a new business in the enter- 
prize zone or is expanding a business 
that is already active in the enter­
prise zone. An enterprise zone is 
created to foster economic develop­
ment in an area of pervasive pov­
erty and unemployment.

The proposed amendment will be 
described on the ballot as follows: 

“The constitutional amendment 
authorizing the exemption for ad 
valorem taxes of certain property 
in an enterprise zone.”

PROPOSITION NO. 6 
ON THE BALLOT

Senate Joint Resolution 8 proposes 
a constitutional amendment that 
would establish a Texas Ethics 
Commission with the powers and 
duties provided by law. The com­
mission would consist of eight ap­
pointed members selected as fol­
lows: two members of different
political parties appointed by the 
governor from a list of at least ten 
names submitted by the members of 
the house of representatives from 
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members of different political par­
ties appointed by the governor from 
a list of at least ten names sub­
mitted by the members of the senate 
from each major political party; 
two members of different political 
parties appointed by the speaker of 
the house of representatives from a 
list of at least ten names submitted 
by the members of the house from 
each major political party; and two 
members of different political par­
ties appointed by the lieutenant 
governor from a list of at least ten 
names submitted by the members of 
the senate from each major political 
party. A major political party is a 
political party required by law to 
hold a primary. With the exception 
of the initial appointees, commission 
members would serve for four-year 
terms. A member who has served for 
one term and any part of a second 
term would not be eligible for reap­
pointment. The commission would 
be authorized to recommend the 
salary of the members of the legis­
lature and may recommend that the 
salary of the speaker of the house 
of representatives and the lieutenant 
governor be set at an amount higher 
than that of other members. If  the 
commission recommends a change in 
salary, the voters would be autho­
rized to accept or reject the salary 
change at the next general election 
for state and county officers. If  the 
voters approve the recommended 
salary, that salary would take effect 
January 1 of the next odd-numbered 
year; if the voters reject the recom­
mended salary, no change in salary 
would occur. The commission would 
set the per diem of the members of 
the legislature and of the lieutenant 
governor. The per diem could be 
raised or lowered biennially as 
necessary to pay members’ costs, 
but could not exceed the amount al­
lowed as of January 1 that year as 
a federal income tax deduction for 
living expenses incurred in a legis­
lative day in connection with a mem­
ber’s business as a legislator, disre­
garding any federal income tax ex­
ception for legislators residing near 
the Capitol. The commission would 
have other powers and duties pro­
vided by the commission’s enabling 
act (Senate Bill 1, 72nd Legislature, 
Regular Session). The amendment 
would also provide that an increase 
in the emoluments of the office of 
Lieutenant Governor would not make 
a legislator ineligible to serve in the 
office of Lieutenant Governor.

The proposed amendment will be 
described on the ballot as follows:

“The constitutional amendment 
creating the Texas Ethics Com­
mission and authorizing the com­
mission to recommend the salary 
for members of the legislature 
and the lieutenant governor, sub­
ject to voter approval, and to set 
the per diem for those officials, 
subject to a limit.”

PROPOSITION NO. 7 
ON THE BALLOT

Senate Joint Resolution 6 proposes 
a constitutional amendment that 
would allow the board of trustees of 
each statewide public retirement 
system to invest the funds of the 
system in such manner as the board 
considers prudent. The board would 
no longer be limited to investing the 
funds of the system in securities.

The proposed amendment will be 
described on the ballot as follows:

“The constitutional amendment 
to allow the board of trustees of 
a statewide public retirement sys­
tem to invest the funds of the 
system in a manner that the board 
considers prudent.”

PROPOSITION NO. 8 
ON THE BALLOT

Senate Joint Resolution 21 pro­
poses a constitutional amendment 
that would permit the legislature to 
create debt by or on behalf of the 
state if the legislature submitted 
the debt question to the voters of 
the state in the form of a proposi­
tion and a majority of those voting 
approved the proposition. The legis­
lature may call the election, by joint 
r-°> uti°n approved by at least two- 
thirds of the members of each house, 
during any regular session or dur­
ing any special session if the subject 
of the proposition is included in the 
Governor’s proclamation for that 
special session. A proposition must 
clearly describe the amount and pur­
pose for which debt is to be created 
and must describe the source of pay­
ment for the debt. The amount of 

in the proposition may

not be exceeded and may not be re- 
newed unless the right to exceed or 
renew is stated in the proposition. 
The legislature may enact laws 
necessary to implement the authority 
granted by a proposition. A law en­
acted in anticipation of the election 
on a proposition is valid if, by its 
terms, it is enacted subject to ap­
proval of the related proposition. 
State debt that is created following 
voter approval of a proposition and 
that is approved by the Attorney 
General is incontestable for any 
reason.

The proposed amendment will be 
described on the ballot as follows:

“The constitutional amendment 
authorizing the voters of this state 
to consider state debt questions in 
the form of ballot propositions 
that must clearly describe the 
amounts, purposes, and sources of 
payment of the debt only after 
approval of the propositions by a 
two-thirds vote of each house of 
the legislature.”

PROPOSITION NO. 9 
ON THE BALLOT

Senate Joint Resolution 11 pro­
poses a constitutional amendment 
that would authorize the commis­
sioner of the General Land Office 
to issue patents for certain public 
free school fund land for which 
there is not a valid transfer of title 
from either the State or the Republic 
of Texas to a private party. A patent 
is a document of title issued by the 
state. On application to the School 
Land Board, a person is entitled to 
receive a patent if : (1) the land is 
surveyed public free school fund 
land, (2) the land was not patentable 
under the law before the adoption of 
this proposed amendment, (3) the 
person acquired the land without 
knowledge of the title defect out of 
the State of Texas or the Republic 
of Texas and held the land under 
color of title, the chain of which 
dates from at least January 1. 1941, 
(4) the person has a recorded deed 
on file in the county courthouse 
and, in conjunction with his prede­
cessor in interest, has claimed the 
land for at least fifty years as of 
January 1, 1991. and (5) the per­
son, in conjunction with his prede­
cessor in interest, for at least 50 
years has paid taxes on the land 
together with all interest and pen­
alties associated with any delin­
quency. If  the applicant is denied a 
patent, the apDlicant may file suit 
against the School Land Board in a 
district court in the county where 
the land is located within 60 days 
from the date of denial. The pro­
posed amendment does not apply to 
beach land, submerged land, or 
islands, and may not be used to 
resolve a boundary dispute. The pro­
posed amendment also does not apply 
to land found by a court to be state- 
owned or to land on which the state 
has given a mineral lease that is in 
effect when a patent is sought. A 
patent under this proposed amend­
ment for land within five miles of 
mineral production shall reserve 
minerals to the state in the manner 
provided bv law for reservations of 
minerals in sales to claimants of un­
surveyed school land within five 
miles of production. An application 
for a patent under this proposed 
amendment must be filed with the 
School Land Board before January 
1, 1993.

Th;s proposed constitutional 
amendment is similar to the version 
of article VII. section 4A, that was 
in effect between 1981 and 1990. 
The main difference is that under 
the earlier version the applicant for 
a patent to land had to have a chain 
of title that dated back to at least 
as early as January 1, 1932.

The proposed amendment will be 
described on the ballot as follows:

“The constitutional amendment 
authorizing the commissioner of 
the General Land Office to issue 
patents for certain public free 
school fund land held in good faith 
under color of title for at least 50 
years.”

PROPOSITION NO. 10 
ON THE BALLOT

Senate Joint Resolution 15 pro­
poses a constitutional amendment 
that would allow the legislature to 
pass general laws to exempt proper­
ty owned by a nonprofit corporation 
organized to supply water or pro­
vide wastewater service from ad 
valorem taxation. A nonprofit cor­
poration would be eligible for the 
exemption if its bylaws provide that

on dissolution, the assets remaining 
after the discharge of the corpora­
tion’s indebtedness will be trans­
ferred to an entity providing water 
supply or wastewater service, or 
both, which is exempt from ad 
valorem taxation. The transferred 
assets must be property that is rea­
sonably necessary for and used for 
water supply and wastewater ser­
vices.

The proposed amendment will be 
described on the ballot as follows: 

“The constitutional amendment 
authorizing the legislature to ex­
empt from ad valorem taxes cer­
tain property of a nonprofit 
corporation that supplies water or 
provides wastewater service.”

PROPOSITION NO. 11 
ON THE BALLOT

House Joint Resolution 8 proposes 
a constitutional amendment that 
would allow the legislature to pass 
laws to authorize the State of Texas 
to operate lotteries and to enter into 
a contract with one or more legal 
entities that will operate lotteries on 
behalf of the State of Texas.

The proposed amendment will be 
described on the ballot as follows:

“The constitutional amendment 
authorizing a state lottery.”

PROPOSITION NO. 12 
ON THE BALLOT

Senate Joint Resolution 34 pro­
poses a constitutional amendment 
that would increase the total amount 
of bonds that may be issued by the 
Texas Water Development Board to 
provide wholesale and retail water 
and wastewater facilities to eco­
nomically distressed areas of the 
state. The proposed amendment in­
creases the maximum principal 
amount of the bonds from 20 per­
cent to 50 percent of the $500 million 
amount authorized by article III, 
section 49-d-7, of the Texas Constitu­
tion. The proposed amendment would 
increase the maximum aggregate 
dollar amount of bonds that the 
Texas Water Development Board 
could issue from $100 million to 
$250 million.

The proposed amendment will be 
described on the ballot as follows:

“The constitutional amendment to 
increase from 20 percent to 50 
percent the percentage of Texas 
water development bonds previ­
ously authorized by Texas voters 
that may be issued for economical­
ly distressed areas.”

PROPOSITION NO. 13 
ON THE BALLOT

Senate Joint Resolution 2 proposes 
a constitutional amendment that 
would allow the legislature to pass 
general laws authorizing Texas 
Higher Education Coordinating 
Board or its successor to issue and 
sell up to $300 million of general 
obligation bonds to finance educa 
tion loans to students. The maximum 
net effective interest rate to be 
borne by the bonds would be set by 
law. The amendment would also 
authorize the legislature to provide 
for the investment of bond proceeds 
and to establish an interest and 
sinking fund to pay the bonds and 
provide for the investment of such 
fund. Bonds authorized under this 
amendment would be paid from the 
first money coming into the treasury 
in each fiscal year that is not other­
wise appropriated by the constitu­
tion, less any amount in an interest 
and sinking fund established at the 
end of the preceding year that is 
pledged to the payment of the bonds 
or interests.

The proposed amendment will be 
described on the ballot as follows

“The constitutional amendment 
providing for the issuance of gen 
eral obligation bonds not to exceed 
$300,000,000 to continue existing 
programs to provide educational 
loans to students, with repayments 
of student loans applied toward 
retirement of the bonds.”

E sto s  son  loa in fo rm es  explanad- 
to rios  so b re  la s  en m ien d as p rop u ­
es ta s  a  la  constitución  qu e a p a ra -  
cerán  en la  bo leta  e l  d ia  6 d e  
n ov iem bre de 1991. S i  u sted  no h a  
recib id o  u n a cop ia  de los in fo rm es  
en  españ ol, p o d rá  ob ten er  u n a  g ra t is  
p o r  lla m ar  a l  1/80O /252/868S o p o r  
es c r ib ir  a l  S e c r e ta r io  de E sta d o ,  
P.O. B ox  12060, A u stin , T ex as  
78711.

Published by the office of the
Secretary of State of Texas
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Your Horoscope \

by Charles King Cooper
Vision Teaser

ARIES (March 21 to April 19) One 
conversation now appears to be going 
nowhere. Though someone’s lack of 
manners could leave you feeling 
slighted, don’t make a mountain out of 
a molehill. You could become upset 
with someone’s behavior on the job. A 
family situation is not as bad as it 
seems.

TAURUS (April 20 to May 20) A 
friend is inscrutable, manipulative, and 
perhaps best left to his or her own 
devices now. You don’t have the time 
for games. Watch excess spending in 
connection with pleasure pursuits. 
You’re just not in the mood for hard 
work now, and it would be easy for you 
to let things slide.

GEMINI (May 21 to June 20) You 
can’t call all the shots all the time. Try 
to be cooperative with others and listen 
to their ideas. A relative may need 
extra consideration from you now. 
Your chief danger now is that you’ll 
waste money in the pursuit of good 
times. Your expensive taste could lead 
to extravagance.

CANCER (June 21 to July 22) No 
sense arguing with a person whose 
mind is already made up. There may be 
a tendency to let things slide on the job 
and a co-worker may be unduly sensi­
tive now. A relative is not ready to 
compromise yet. Small talk and super­
ficiality seem to go together now in 
business dealings.

LEO (July 23 to August 22) A close 
tie may seem set in his or her ways 
now. Be selective about which invita­
tions you accept or you’ll be spending 
time now at a pretty dull affair. If you 
run into too many obstacles now, you 
just might put a project aside for the 
time being.

VIRGO (August 23 to September 
22) It will take effort on your part, but 
do meet a partner halfway now. The 
personal touch doesn’t seem to work 
for you careerwise now. Be 
businesslike in your dealings. Some­
one you deal with now is stubborn. Be 
careful that you don’t inadvertently 
hurt a friend’s feelings now.

LIBRA (September 23 to October

22) You may do an old friend a favor 
now. Try to be on time for appoint­
ments. Happiness comes through 
family interests and home-based ac­
tivities now. You’ll certainly be put­
ting your house in order now, but try 
not to be dictatorial with family mem­
bers.

SCORPIO (October 23 to Novem­
ber 21) There’s a favorable accent on 
both work and play now. You’ll take 
the lead now in planning good times, 
and new opportunities await you on the 
job. Self-discipline combined with in­
itiative brings you progress on the job 
now. Enjoy happy times.

SAGITTARIUS (November 22 to 
December 21) This is a time when 
others will gladly cooperate with you, 
that is if you’re not too demanding! It 
should be a plus week for you regard­
ing career interests. Also, it’s a week 
that favors investment moves. Leisure 
activities are fun-filled this weekend.

CAPRICORN (December 22 to 
January 19) What seems like a lucky 
break could bring you success and 
recognition now in business. You have 
extra incentive now and will make 
things happen for you in your career. 
This weekend you’ll definitely be in 
the mood for socializing. Look for­
ward to good times!

AQUARIUS (January 20 to 
February 18) You may be organizing a 
party now, but you could also get in­
volved in a dispute with a friend. 
Financial developments at present are 
definitely in your favor. You'll want to 
get some unfinished tasks out of the 
way now. Do a good job, however, and 
don’t be in so much of a hurry.

PISCES (February 19 to March 20) 
You’re raring to go now, but could 
easily ruffle someone’s feathers. 
Avoid bossiness and coming on too 
strong. Career strivings, however, 
should meet with success. Though 
you’re self-disciplined on the job now, 
you’re inclined to impetuousness 
when shopping. Evening hours accent 
fun times.

©1991 by King Features Synd.

This Week In Kinney County

Week September 12 -18,  1991

Varsity Football, D’Hanis 
Volleyball Tournament, Eagle Pass 
FCS Community Council 

1IV ■ Var. Volleyball at Lackland 
' Methodist Ladies Luncheon

' FCS Museum/Sutler’s Store 
' Bingo

Friday. Sept. 13. 8 p.m„ Here 
Saturday, Sept. 14 

Sat.. Sept.. 14. 9 a.m., Shafter Hall 
Tues.. Sept. 17. 5 p.’in,- 

Wednesday, September 18. noon

Every Sat. & Sun. 1:00 - 4:00 p.m. 
Every Friday, 8:00 p.m., Shafter Hall

 ̂Rotary Club 
k Kinney County Library

Every Thursday, Noon, Las Moras Inn 
Monday - Friday

MATERNITY*
s
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A //J )

Find at least six differences in details between panels.

MATERNITY
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MagicMaze
BRAIN -

Q R W B G L Q V A F K P U Z E

J C O T Y D I N S X C H M R W

B G A L T Q V A F K P U Z E J

O T Y S G D I N S X C H M R W

B G U L E N O M R O H T A E D

O R V A 1(CH I L 3 E F K G K P

T U E Z E J S H V N W A R C O

T Y D s I N s A s I M O X I C

H M R w A B w G w A W E P S L

Q V A F K E P U D R W Z T E J

O T Y M R O T S D D I N S S X

Find the 1listed words in the diagram.. They runi in
all directions-forward, backward, up, down and 

diagonally.

Case
Child
D am age
Death

Drain
H orm one
Power
Sick

Stem
Teaser
Trust
W ashes

W ashing
W ave
Work

Answers on page 5

¡Tacfott
Super Crossword

ACROSS
1 Master, in 

song
6 Farm er's  

luture?
10 Nursery word
14 G rape jelly
18 British 

actress Eli­
zabeth

19 Frog genus
20  Philippine 

dyewood tree
21 Addis —
23 John W ay­

ne's classic 
western

25  Alfred Hitch­
cock thriller

27 Noel C ow ­
ard's 1933  
AA winner

28 Minstrel,, in 
India

29  Treated  
badly

30  Splinter 
group

31 Fertilizes, in 
a way

32  W estern  
movies

33  —  Paolo
3 6  "The Night of 

the —  ”
39 Slugger's 

need
4 0  Robert 

Young 1972  
T V  movie

50  R enew  or 
restore

51 Motel's fore­
runners

52  Part of

Bozo's
get-up

53 Sister of 
Ares

54 —  Green  
(elopers' 
destination)

55 Glasgow  
negative

56 Fem ale  
parent

57 Evening TV  
soap

59 French con­
nections

60  Advance, in 
cribbage

62 “ —  Town"
63 Depends
64  Julie 

Andrews hit 
musical

69  Large scis­
sors

71 O ne ol the 
Caesars

72 Kimono sash
73 Girl of song
76 Sufficient 

supply
77 It might be 

electric
78 The heart
80  Jerusalem

thorn
83 Home of the 

leprechaun
84  “Long —  and 

Far Away"
85  Sergeant's 

command
86 Repossessor' 

document
87 David Niven 

1946 hit

92 Smell a  —  
(suspect)

93 Small hollow: 
biol.

94  American  
humorist

95 O ranges and 
Indians

99  Church 
areas

101 Pro —
105 Job-hunter's 

need
106 C ul-de—  

(dead-end  
streets)

107 Dum as hero
112 Bogart/Berg-

man classic
114 Oscar-winner 

based on 
Shaw's “Pyg­
malion"

115 Growl fier­
cely

116 Look closely
117 Pickler's 

plant
118 Brave's 

shelter
119 "West —  

Story"
120 M akes a 

boo-boo
121 Parisian 

papa
122 Onset

DOWN
1 Not fern.
2 Canadian  

prov.
s 3 Serb or Bul- 

gar
4 Scandinavian  

tales

5 Anoint
6 Form er Euro­

pean king­
dom

7  Electric ca t­
fish

8 At —  ! 
(pronto)

9 N ew  Zealand  
native fort

10 Kitchen cloth
11 Dism ay (alt 

spelling)
12 Reduces the 

calories
13 W hole
14 Day of rest
15 "All —  Eve"
16 Hesitate
17 O ne of the 

Doubledays
22 Says further
24  N ew  Deal 

org.
26  River and 

town in 
Luzon

28  Wedding  
proclam a­
tions

31 Battleship to 
rem em ber

33 Top kick
34 Air raid 

warning
35  Leather oil 

flasks
37  Foreigner, in 

Latin 
America

38 Arm bone
39  Electronic 

listener
41 It m ay say 

“W elcom e"

42  Yang's com ­
plement

4 3  W indow  
dressing

44  Doc or 
D opey

45  G oal
46  Purposive
47  Perry's c re a ­

tor
48  N arrow  inlets
49  Draft org.
56 Couple
57 Had a crav­

ing
58 O nce called  

Clay
61 Kind of curve
62  Like 3. 7. 29. 

etc.
63  Polish vigor­

ously
6 4  Doctrine
6 5  Under one's

—  (secret)
6 6  “W hat is the

—  bre­
vity...?"

67  Nothing
68  “M ore safe I 

sing with —  
voice..."

69  Pickens or 
Sum m erville

70  Q ueen of the 
gods

73  Novelist 
Francoise

74  Friendship
75  M achine tool
76  Fowl or hen 

lead-in
77  O ne kind of 

trip?
78  C offeehouses

7 9  Bread  
spread

81 O ld times, 
once

8 2  Golf gadget
8 4  Actor Carney
8 5  Engages
88  Quiver
89  Atelier stand
90  Native sail­

ors, in India
91 Tell a story
9 5  G ram puses
9 6  C onnery and 

O 'C asey
9 7  Brazilian  

palm
9 8  W ord after 

color or 
Coast

99  H e was ' 
Grant"

100 Expectant 
father, once?

102 N ew  Zealand  
tribe

103 Fruit pies
10 4  M etal tip at 

end of shoe­
lace

10 7  Unit of force
108 Southwest 

wind
10 9  California  

valley
110 Biblical name
111 N o, in M os­

cow
113 Tarzan 's  fol­

lower
114 Motorist's 

need

"Lou

18

23

27

95 96

119

97

41

64

98

42

65

92

24

43

6

19

36

60 61

89

84

113

16

120

37

51

55

77

99

106

8

38

66

71

100

31

67

90

93

28

62

85

10

20

25

44

56

78

114

121

52

79

107

12

45

108

13

26

39

63

91

101

r k H

29

32

57

80

86

102

14

21

58

81

103

118vti
122

15 16

46 47

53

82

104

/ tS

73

94

109

17

48

74

110

: > ■

22

49

75

111

n  .

School Activities Need Y ou r Suppoi

Service Directory
Davis Hardware & Ranch Supply
Originally a part of Petersen & Co. Since 1876

101 East Spring Street P.O. Box 976
Brackettville, Texas 78832

G eneral  Hardware 
P ipes  & F en c in g  

Paint
Phone: 612-563-2528

Stock Medicines 
R a n ch  Supplies 

Amm unition

^ U & S  ?
BUGMOBILES

716 S. GETTY 
P.O. BOX 1457 

UVALDE, TX 78802

UVALDE BUGMOB1LE COMPANY 
SCIENTIFIC PEST AND TERMITE CONTROL

TERMITES
Scorpions Mice Rats
Roaches Ants Silverfish

(512) 278-3914 
(512)278-4903

\

v/l
Dr. Miguel A. Torres Portales 

Cirujano Dentista 
V U.A.N.L.

Dr. Office 
Hidalgo #365 Ote. 
i/2 Block from International Bridge 
(877)2-14-71 
We Accept 
Dental Insurance

(Free Examination)

Home Phone 
(877)2-08-22 
Bus. Hours 

9:00 AM - 6:00 PM 
Mon. - Sat.

Cd. Acuña Mexico

r Protect our children...

DRIVE
SAFELY

SCHOOL

SLOW

K R E IG E R  Insurance
General Insurance 

Representing Top Rated Companies
y

512-563-2408 P.O. Box 5
BRACKETTVILLE, TEXAS 78832

m m m n
O ne H ou r S n ap sh o ts

TX T I T JLLU

• 1 Hour Processing • Passport Photos •
Reprints, Copywork, Studio 

Enlargements, E-6 Slides, Black & White
9 -  6  M onday th ru  F rid ay
1 0 - 2 Saturday

P h o n e: 7 7 4 - 3 6 8 6  
1 7 0 0  B ed ell -- Del R io

Lions Club Rummage Sole 
Saturday, November 2, 1991

Donations of clothes, furniture, dishes, 
knick-knacks, or anything else accepted.

For donation pick-up, call 563-2169

Brackett Athletic Booster Club 
Will Meet

Monday, September 16, 7:00 p.m.
High School Library 

Officers Will Be Elected 
Coach Nowlin will present video & program 

Concering OUR football team!

Service

County - State - Federal

BAIL BONDS
FREE BAIL BOND INFORMATION

AMISTAD
BONDING COMPANY

DORA E. LEON
Bond !»•(>.•••" <***»•

NE Corner oTûrenory Dr Ph.(512)298-3066
& Texas Hwy. 2523 P .O .B o x 420143

Del Rio, Texas 78842

o o o o eo o o o o o o o o ei
Del Rio Chamber of Commerce

PANCAKE/SAUSAGE MEAL

BREAKFAST LUNCH
G:30 - 8:30 AM 1 1:30 AM  - 1:30 PM

Thursday, S ep tem b er 1 9 , 19 9 1
Ole Distributors - Engle Room - 1991 Bedell Avenue

$4.00 Per Men I (All You C.m E.U)
fooMseeeeeeeecioeeeeeeeeeseeeaooeeeoMi

FARMERS INSURANCE GROUP OF COMPANIES

W IL L IA M  S. P R A T T
Agent

PRATI' INSURANCE AGENCY 
Auto e Fire • Life • Commercial • Home 

Boats e Mobile Homes • Motorcycles • SR-22's 
SE HABLA ESPANOL 

2116 Ave. F, Del Rio, TX 78840 
Business: (512) 775-5183 • Residence: (512) 775-1568 

______________Fax: 15121 775-4876__________________

N O T I C E !
To all people who can’t tolerate spirit 
generating airhorns at football games-

FR EE EAR PLUGS!
Compliments of . . .

South West Texas Hearing Instruments
Open M o n .-T h u rs .  1 0 - 5  p.m. Del R i o ,  T x .  774  l 2 T >

’ L.
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563-2852
Only $2.00 for 15 

words or less and only 
.1511 per word thereaf­
ter.

®S5Âffi563-2852
REAL ESTATE
O’ROURKE REALTY 

512-563-2713

FOR SA LE-3 Bd, 1 bath. Big yard, 
roof less than 1 year old. MS in­
cluded. $26,000.

M EMBERSHIPS AND RENTALS 
AVAILABLE

CREDIT UNION

Border Federal Credit Union 
wants you! If you are living in Kin­
ney, Maverick, or Val Verde county 
you are eligible for membership at 
Border Federal Credit Union. Stop 
by one of our offices today and join 
us as a member-owner!”

BAIL BONDS
AMISTAD BONDING COMPANY 
Dora E. Leon - Bond Representative 
County - State - Federal Bail Bonds. 
Free bail bond information. 24 
Hours Service. NE Corner of 
Gregory Dr. & Texas Hwy. 2523. 
Del Rio, Texas 78842.
Ph. (512) 298-3066 
P.O. Box 420143

We Have The Key To The fail

PUBLIC NOTICE
City of Brackettville 

Texas Community Development 
Program -  Swimming Pool Project 
Project Completion Public Hearing

The City of Brackettville will hold 
a public hearing at 6:00p.m. on Sep­
tember 16th, 1991 at the Kinney 
County Court House, downstairs 
Court Room, in regard to the 
Swimming Pool Project, financed 
through a Texas Community 
Development Program (TCDP) 
grant. The purpose of this meeting 
is to allow citizens an opportunity to 
review and discuss the completed 
project. The City encourages 
citizens to participate and offer com­
ments and to make their views kno­
wn at this public hearing. Citizens 
unable to attend this meeting may 
submit their views to Ginger Dod­
son, City Clerk,1 at City Hall: Hah- 
dicapped individuals that wish to at­
tend this meeting should contact 
City Hall to arrange for assistance.

TA N N IN G

Start your summer tan. Come to 
B ’ANN’S TANNING SALON 

3810 Highway 90 West, Del Rio 
774-6378

FOR SALE
3 Fort Clark Springs Units for 
sale. Motivated seller (512-829- 
5307 or 657-0163 ext. 262)

Guy Carroll
Licensed Real Estate Agent

APPLICATIONS
ACCEPTED

The City of Brackettville is now 
accepting applications for the 
position of City Secretary.

Minimum Qualifications: At least 
an Associate of Arts from an ac­
credited College or University with 
3 years minimum experience in City 
Management and Public Utilities. 
Submit resume to:
City of Brackettville 
P.O. Box 526
Brackettville, Texas 78832

All applications must be received 
by September 19th, 1991 by 5:00 
P.M,

City of Brackettville is an equal 
opportunity employer.

ACCEPTING
APPLICATIONS

Middle Rio Grande Development 
Council Area Agency On 

Aging Ombudsman
The Middle Rio Grande 

Development Council Area Agency 
on Aging is accepting applications 
for an Ombudsman on a contractual 
basis. Responsibilities include over­
seeing volunteer advocacy functions 
in 8 long-term care facilities (Nur­
sing Homes) and coordinating ac­
tivities with community-based care 
providers for senior citizens in nine 
(9) county service area, promote the 
Ombudsman Program throughout 
the nine (9) county area, recruit and 
support qualified volunteers to serve 
as Ombudsman for longterm care 
facilities (Nursing Homes) in 
MRGDC/AAA service area. 
Qualifications: High school or
G.E.D., bi-lingual, experience 
working with human service 
organizations, experience with 
volunteers and public speaking help­
ful. All interested parties should 
send applications or resumes to 
Ramon S. Jphpston, Deputy Direc­
tor of Administration, MRGDC, 
P.O. Box 1199, Carrizo Springs, 
Texas 78834. This notice will be 
kept until position filled. Area 
Agency on Aging gives preference 
in hiring (full/part-time) to persons 
60 or older, subject to the 
requirements of state of local gover­
nment merit employee system, for 
!any Utaff^^feitiohs fdr which such 
individual qualifies. #2911

FEEDS
R A IL W A Y  F E E D S

WENDLAND’S FARM 
PRODUCTS

Complete line of Feed & Seeds 
Supplies of Fertilizers 

Large Round Bales Hay 
Cane - Kline - Coastal 

Deer Corn - Milo 
Marvin Graham Manager 

101. N. Main 
Del Rio, Texas 774-4706

FOR SALE
2 commercial lots with 30x50 ft. 
metal building (could be turned into 
home). $13,500. 563-2192.__________

REQUEST FOR 
PROPOSALS

The Middle Rio Grande 
Development Council is requesting 
proposals for the training of 9-1-1 
emergency telecommunicators
and/or dispatcher in call-handling 
procedures in Dimmit, Edwards, 
Kinney, La Salle, Maverick, Uvalde, 
Val Verde and Zavala Counties.

MRGDC is requesting a total of 
four(4), eighty-hour (80) courses to 
be provided to personnel operating 
Primary Safety Answering Points in 
the eight (8)-county region. One (1) 
course will be offered during calen­
dar year 1991 and three (3) in calen­
dar year 1992. The content of all 
courses must be certified by the 
Texas Commission on Law Enfor­
cement Officer Standards and 
Education. The courses must be of­
fered within the Middle Rio Grande 
Region.

MRGDC’s award to the suc­
cessful bidder for this service will be 
contingent upon the signing of a 
contract that will run through 
December 31, 1992. The contractor 
will be reimbursed for allowable 
costs incurred under the contract.

All public and private 
organizations knowledgeable about 
emergency 9-1-1 call-handling 
procedures are encouraged to sub­
mit proposals. Each proposal must 
be signed by an authorized official of 
the submitting organization, and 
each proposal becomes a public 
record when it is received by 
MRGDC.

For a copy of the proposal kit, 
contact Berta Rocha, 9-1-1 Coor­
dinator, MRGDC Central Office at 
(512)876-3533.

Proposals will be accepted until 
5:00 p.m., September 20, 1991, at 
the Middle Rio Grande Develop­
ment Council’s Central Office, 1904 
North First Street, Carrizo Springs, 
Texas 78834. Mailing Address: P.O. 
Box 1199, Carrizo Springs, Texas 
78834. Proposals must be marked: 
9-1-1 Telecommunicators Training 
Proposal, Attn: Ramon S. Johnston, 
Deputy Director. Proposals received 
after 5:00 p.m., September 20, 1991 
will be considered late and unaccep­
table.

MRGDC is arti affirmative ,ac- 
tion/equal oppartunity Contractor. 
MRGDC reserves the right to accept 
or reject any or all proposals.

YARD SALE
2 FAMILY YARD SALE-Love 
seat, round table, lapidary rock, 
loads of goodies. Unit 15 -  Bliss Cir. 
9-5, Friday & Saturday, Sept. 13 & 
14.

MOVING SALE
MOVING SALE-Saturday, Sep­
tember 14; Fort Clark near Town 
Hall. Garage door lift, furniture, 
toys, brass, wrought-iron, pottery, 
books, typewriter/computer printer, 
wine-making equipm’t, drafting 
supplies, etc.

JOB
ANNOUNCEMENT

The Middle Rio Grande Develop­
ment Council is looking for qualified 
applicants interested in the position 
of JTPA Instructor. The preferred 
requirements for this position are as 
follows: (1) graduate of an ac­
credited college or university with a 
Degree in Education (TEA Cer­
tificate preferred), (2) two years 
teaching experience in a classroom 
setting with the ability to clearly 
communicate ideas and concepts, (3) 
bilingual experience in English and 
Spanish preferred. This position will 
require some traveling and will of­
fice at the Carrizo Springs JTPA 
and Education Center. All qualified 
persons interested in applying for 
this position should mail resume or 
application to the Middle Rio Gran­
de Development Council, P.O. Box 
1199, Carrizo Springs, Texas 78834, 
attention Ramon S. Johnston, 
Deputy Director of Administration. 
This position will be kept open until 
tilled. Salary range for this position 
is $15,009 to $31,733. #2948

BIDS & PROPOSALS 
REQUESTED

Kinney County Commissioners 
Court is requesting bids and 
proposals for computer, software 
and training for a governmental en­
tity. Specifications may be obtained 
from and bids mailed to:
Tim Ward, County Judge 
P.O. Box 348
Brackettville, Texas 78832 
512/563-2401
Bids to opened and reviewed Oc­
tober 15, 1991.

Kinney County Commissioners 
Court

By: Tim Ward, County Judge

JOB
ANNOUNCEMENT

The Middle Rio Grande Develop­
ment Council is looking for qualified 
applicants interested in the position 
of JTPA Instructor. The preferred 
requirements for this position are as 
follows:. (1) gradual, of an afifin 
credited college or university with a. 
Degree in Education (TEA Cer­
tificate preferred), (2) two years 
teaching experience in a classroom 
setting with the ability to clearly 
communicate ideas and concepts, (3) 
bilingual experience in English and 
Spanish preferred. This position will 
require some traveling and will of­
fice at the Eagle Pass JTPA  and 
Education Center. All qualified per­
sons interested in applying for this 
position should mail resume or ap­
plication to the Middle Rio Grande 
Development Council, P.O. Box 
1199, Carrizo Springs, Texas 78834, 
attention Ramon S. Johnston, 
Deputy Director of Adminstration. 
This position will be kept open until 
filled. Salary range for this position 
is $15,009 to $31,733. #2936

KÌI
COUNTY : 
>LAND CO

(312) 363-2446 
(312) 363-2447 

O. Box 1033 
Brackeilvillc. Tx 78832

Large home on corner lot (Ann and 
4th St.) A-l condition. Large rooms, 
including enclosed porch. Central 
Air and heat, pine and hardwood 
floors, landscaped yd. Only 

4^49,900.00.

CONDOMINIUM 
Outstanding two bdrm, two bath 
retirement or investment property, 1 
completely furnished, even T .V .j 
cookware, linens etc. Overlooks first t 
fairway of 18 hole golf course on , 
Fort Clark. 40,000 with member­
ship.

SCOTT & WHITE 
OPTIONS FOR HEALTH

Laser Treatment for 
Birthmarks
Charles N. Verheyden, M.D.
Department o f Surgery at Scott & White 
Hospital and Clinic and Associate 
Professor o f Surgery, Texas A&M University 
College o f Medicine

i I have a five-year- 
old daughter who has a 
portwine stain birthmark 
covering the right side o f her 
face. I am concerned that 
she may be ridiculed by 
other children and am 
wondering if  anything can 
be done surgically to remove 
the birthmark. Also, can any­
thing be done cosmetically 
to conceal the birthmark?

.• Laser treatment is 
one possibility for removing 
birthmarks. A tunable dye 
laser can be used to make 
the color in the birthmark 
disappear. Laser treatment 
does not require surgery, 
rather the laser converts 
light energy to heat energy 
and coagulates the blood ves­
sels that make up the 
birthmark, making the color 
disappear. Multiple treat­
ments must be applied to 
make the birthmark disap­
pear completely. A local anes­
thesia may be used during 
the treatment and scarring 
can occur, especially in 
people with darker skin. The 
doctor will experiment with 
a test spot on a patient 
before beginning treatment

because the treatment has 
different effects on different 
people.

Because laser treatment in­
volves several sessions, 
camouflage makeup may be 
used during treatment to 
help conceal the birthmark.
In fact, those with 
birthmarks may prefer using 
camouflage makeup rather 
than having laser treatment. 
Scott and White has a skin 
care specialist on staff who 
can help a patient with 
camouflage makeup techni­
ques and applications. There 
are many types of this 
makeup available and the 
skin care specialist can give 
the patient an analysis of 
what camouflage makeup 
can do for that individual,.. 
The makeup is wearable for 
24 hours and some types of 
it are sold in the Scott and 
White Medical Supplies 
Store. The most important 
part of camouflage makeup 
is learning proper applica­
tion in order to achieve a 
natural look.

I f  you have a  question p lea se  write to Scott & White 
Options Fo r H ealth" in c a re  o f y o u r local new spaper.

P u b l ic  N o t ic e
On June 28,1991, Southwestern Bell Telephone Company 

(Southwestern Bell) filed an application with the Public Utility 
Commission of Texas (Commission) to add a new optional service 
offering Tor business Private Branch Exchange (PBX) Trunk customers 
called Digital Loop Service. The application has been assigned Docket 
No. 10461;

Digital Loop Service provides digital transmission of circuit 
switched voice and data communications between the customer's 
premises and the central office. This service allows the customer to 
use a 1.544 Mbps facility capable of delivering up to 24 line termina­
tions. Southwestern Bell will provide Digital Loop Service within the 
customer's serving central office where facilities are available.

If approved by the Commission, the rates for the Digital Loop 
Service facilities will be $445 per month for each digital transmission 
loop arrangement which provides a capacity of up to 24 line termina­
tions plus $5 per month for each line termination and $9 per month 
for each channel termination. The proposed rate for the unlimited use 
of the central office varies from $12.25 up to $18.90 per month for each 
line termination depending on the rate group classification, deter­
mined by the customer’s location. Southwestern Bell estimates 
revenue of $2.1 million from this offering during the first year.

As proposed by Southwestern Bell, customers who currently 
receive digital loop compatibility through facilities Installed under a 
special construction agreement will have the option to receive their 
current digital loop arrangements pursuant to the Digital Loop Service 
Tariff or continue to pay their current charges until they make a 
chance of location or accounL Any Increase In the number of line 
terminations to a customer's current digital transmission loop arrange­
ment will be provided pursuant to the proposed Digital Loop Service 
Tariff' however the customer will continue to have the option or 
paying current Charges for the existing digital transmission loop 
capacity Southwestern Bell's proposal to "grandfather existing digital 
loop facility arrangements Is subject to review and approval by the

C° — nswho wish to Intervene or otherwise participate In these 
nroceedlnes should notify the Commission as soon as possible, but not 
faUM-han Clctober 15,1991. A request to Intervene, participate, or for 
urther Information should be mailed to the Public Utility Commission 

of Tex a 7800 Shoal Creek Blvd., Suite 4O0N, Austin, Texas 78757. 
Further information may also be obtained bycallingjthe Public Utility

t l c e  for the deaf (TDD) number Is
(512) 458-0221.

@
Southwestern Bell
Telephone

Congratulations Chamber

a

§

«

g
A big thanks from all of us goes to Kathv I.etsinger, Glen Seaver, Mary Seaver and Dennis Dod­
son for all the hard work and leadership ability to organize the very successful first annual 
Cowboy Cauldron held at the Civic Center last Saturday. We hope to have an even bigger one 
next year. We also wish to thank the many others who were there helping with all the work who 

_  are not pictured here.
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M editations

If someone should say false and 
wicked words about your family, 
would you defend that family name? 
Most people would.

If someone insults another race of 
people, are you ready to speak a 
word of defense for the ones being 
talked about?

We may “fight among our­
selves,” but we come to the aid of 
one another. The Blacks, Whites, 
and Browns -  if such distinctions 
are possible -  are prone to defend 
our own races.

But what do we say or do when 
another drags the name of our 
Heavenly Father in the gutter? Most 
people do not even give a nod of 
disapproval -  some even smilp or 
snicker when oaths and profanity is 
heard. And by such approval, one 
shares in the guilt.

To curse, swear, and take God’s 
name in vain is a far greater insult 
than to talk about a mortal being. 
Profanity is wicked. It is a defiant, 
blatant act against the God who 
made us.

God says that whoever uses His 
name in a light way will have to give 
account to Him for such foul actions. 
The Bible says, “God will not hold 
him guiltless who takes His name in 
vain.” This is a frightening warning.

We are alarmed about air 
pollution. Of far greater concern 
should be the spiritual and moral 
tragedy of profanity (linked with 
many other forms of corruption 
from pornography to the end of the 
line) that is now engulfing our 
people and is destined to bring the 
fiery judgment of God upon our 
heads.

St Mary Magdalene 
Catholic Church

By DORTHY PAYNE
Brackett News Staff Writer

Sunday, September 15, 1991 our 
parish joins with parishes across the 
country in honoring those in­
dividuals who have made the com­
mittment to serve as catechists this 
year. Catechetical Sunday is a day 
we honor these individuals who give 
of themselves to this ministry.

St. Mary Magdalene are proud of 
the teachers listed below who 
volunteer their time to teach our 
children.

Director Dorothy Roberts
Co-ordinator Julia Terrazas

TEACHERS
Kindergarten Frances Franklin
1st - Beatrice Rocha, 2nd - Amelia 
Reyes, 3rd - Mary Jane and Andrea 
Garcia, 4th - Elena Luna, 5th - Julia 
Terrazas, 6th - Ramona Falcon. 7th - 
Lina Falcon, 8th - Bernie Cervantez, 
9th - Jimmy Bader, 10th - Tammy 
McNew, ll/12th - Ben and Terry 
Terrazas.

SU BSTITU TES
Anna Cano, Susana Castillo, Nena 
Pena.

Ben. A. Nelson
Bennel Alden Nelson was born 

October 23, 1915, in Cosmos, Min­
nesota. At the time of his death on 
September 6, 1991, he and his wife, 
Virginia, whom he married in Ben- 
tonville, Arkansas, on February 2, 
1951, lived on Airport Road, Fort 
Clark Springs.

Besides Virginia, he is survived 
by a son, Dr. Brian Nelson, W. 
Lafayette, Indiana; a daughter, Lena 
Rose Dooley, Hurst, Texas; 2 gran­
dsons; 2 granddaughters; 2 great 
grandsons; a brother, Lowell 
Nelson, Parker, South Dakota; and 
two sisters - Etta Anderson, 
Wayzatta, Minnesota, and Virgie 
Miller, Litchfield, Minnesota. He 
was preceded in death by one 
daughter, Shirley Nelson.

A memorial service was held in 
the First Baptist Church Monday, 
September 9, at 10:00 a.m. Rev. 
Preston Taylor, pastor, read Mr. 
Nelson’s favorite scripture Psalm 
103:1-2. The Voices of Fort Clark, 
accompanied by pianist Merry Beth 
Mills, offered two numbers - “In 
The Garden” and “Amazing 
Grace.”

Dr. Brian Nelson gave a beautiful 
tribute to his father and Rev. Taylor 
brought the message as he remem­
bered Ben Nelson.

Bruce Clements, Worshipful 
Master of Las Moras Masonic 
Lodge #444 led the Masonic Ser­
vice.

After the Benediction, a reception 
was held in the Fellowship Hall of 
the Church for family and friends.

Upon retirement from the U.S. 
Fish and Wildlife Commission, the 
Nelsons moved to Fort Clark 
Springs and have been active in 
community life. Mr. Nelson served 
on most of the Fort’s committees in­
cluding the Municipal Utility 
District (MUD). He was a deacon of 
the First Bantist Church belonged to

THANK YOU
Dear Friends of Ben Nelson family: 
Thank you so much for your cards, 
visits, food, and prayers during 
Dad’s illness and after his death.

Your support for Mom is comfor­
ting to us at this difficult time.

Brian Nelson, and Lena Dooley 
and Families

Defensive
Driving
Offered

A Texas safety Defensive Driving 
Course will be offered in Bracket- 
tville September 17 and 24.

The Tuesday night sessions will 
be in the fellowship hall of the First 
Baptist Church from 6:00 until 
10:00 p.m.

Cost of the course is $15.00 per 
person. Completion of the course 
insures lower insurance rates, as 
well as protection from one 
speeding ticket.

The instructor will be from San 
Angelo.

Las Moras Masonic Lodge #444, 
Del Rio Chapter Order of the 
Eastern Star #204, Del Rio Past 
Matrons and Past Patrons Club, 
Lions Club, and the Gideons. He 
was an avid sports fan with the 
Arkansas Razorbacks his favorite 
team.

In lieu of flowers, the family has 
suggested memorials be made to the 
First Baptist Church of Bracket- 
tville.

ggS

ite  tratteli Stes. 

Papayas Growing 
At Fort Clark

Sunday will be another important 
day at Frontier Baptist Church. 
Every Sunday is a special day at 
Frontier Baptist Church becasue 
that’s the day when people set aside 
the time to gather there and worship 
God.

Realizing worshiping God is the 
most important facet of life, they 
take advatage of the opportunity and 
meet for that purpose.

There is a period of fellowship for 
those who come early. The worship 
service is characterized by sim­
plicity. The absence of ritual and 
liturgy makes for a relaxed and en­
joyable worship. Singing is of 
familiar hymns that the 
congregation enjoys. Earnest prayer 
is made for individuals whose needs 
are pointed out.

The message by the Pastor is a 
simple Gospel message from The 
Word of God, The service closes as 
the congregation sings,” Blest Be 
The Tie That Binds Our Hearts in 
Christian Love.” There is no better 
place to worship on the Lord’s Day 
than Froniter Baptist Church.

Come and See.

Doc and Elaine Crane

By DORTHY PAYNE
Brackett News Staff Writer________

Doc and Elaine Crane are raising 
papayas these days in their front 
yard on Simms Street on Fort Clark.

They ate lunch with Doc’s sister 
last spring and part of the menu was 
papayas. They saved the seeds and 
planted them in pots which they 
kept in the house through the win­
ter.

This spring, they planted them in 
front of their mobile home. Today, 
they have blooms, and papayas.

Papayas are not a native plant and 
do not usually grow where there 
might be freezing weather.

The Cranes gave me some seeds 
which I shared with friends. So, I, 
along with some friends, am going 
to try to grow papaya trees, too. If I 
have any success, I will let you know 
about it next year.

The Bible Says
“Real circumcision is a matter of 

heart, spiritual and not literal.”
God has a difficult time getting 

people to realize that relation to Him 
is a spiritual matter. Many feel they 
must have a medal, image or some 
material substance to help them con­
tact God.

Circumcision was the physical 
mark God imposed to show faith in 
Him. Now that Jesus has come and

Happy Birthday 
Matie!

From Mama Nopy.
J orge  S a y s . “ M e  T oo! "

died there is no physical mark or 
material- substance that identifies or 
enhances a persons relationship to 
God.

Any relationship is not marked by 
any apparel, ornament, or material, 
it must be a spiritual relationship. 
This is the only relationship God 
recognizes.

“Real circumcision is a matter of 
the heart, spiritual, not literal.” Rom
2:29

Clean Up 
Fix Up 

Paint Up

Church
Directory
St. Andrews Episcopal Church: Henderson & Fort, Sunday Church Service 
10:30 A.M. Vicar; Rev. Bill Koons - 563-2071.
Frontier Baptist Church (A Southern Baptist Church(: Sunday Morning 
Worship 11:00 A.M., Sunday Evening service 6:00 P.M. Joe Townsend, 
Pastor 563-2158.
First Baptist Church (A Southern Baptist Church): 307 N. Ann Street. 
Sunday School 9:45 A.M., Worship service (Sun) 11:00 A.M. and 7:00 
P.M., Worship Service (Wed) 7:00 P.M. Rev. Preston A. Taylor 563-2245. 
Church of Christ: Sunday School 9:30 A.M., Worship Service 10:30 A.M., 
Bible Study (Sun) 6:30 P.M ., Bible Study (Wed) 7:00 P.M.
St. Mary Magdalene Catholic Church: Masse? Mon. & Fri. 7:00 A.M., Wed. 
and Sat. 6:30 P.M., Sun. (Spanish) 8:00 A.M. reg. 10:30 A.M. Confessions 
Wed. and Sat. 6:00 P.M. Religion Classes Wed. 6:00 P.M. Religion Classes 
Sun. 9:00 A.M. Prayer Meeting (Spanish) Wed. 7:00 P.M. Father David G. 
Zumaya, Pastor.
First United Methodist Church: “Celebrate and Witness” Morning 
Fellowship 9:30 A.M., Church School Classes 9:45 A.M., Service o f’ 
Worship 11:00 A.M., Choir Rehearsal Wed. 5:00 P.M. Gordon Miller, 
Pastor.

I t s  your Lucky Day

f l l M
And For Those Who Dare...

Ford Trucks Best Never Rest
F-150 4x2 
Super Cab

I
-

M-S-R-P......................................... 12,810.00
Factory Discount........................ 2,139.00
G.B. Discount....................... ..........  672.00
Cash Rebate.................................. 1,000.00

êêM . $8,999.00
Stock #2393

M.S.R.P........................................15,498.00
Factory Discount....................... 1,460.00
G.B. Discount.............................  1,539.00
Cash R ebate............................... 1,000.00

* * Commercial Rebate.................  1,000.00

>Total Savings* 
$4999

Ranger XLT 4x2 
Regular Cab

$10,499.00 □

"M u s i  own commercial business lo i|imIiTv. 
'P lu s Tax. Title & License

* Stock #2467

ART IS FOR ILLUSTRATION PURPOSES ONLY

GRAF &  BARTON FORD L/M, INC.
2700 Hwy. oow “BIGGEST COUNTRY DEALER IN THE SOUTHWEST” 775-7481

L


