
Published in Sonora. Texas -  "The Capital o f the Stockman's Paradise"

Eighty-Fifth Year, Fifth Week The Devil’s River News,'Sonora, Texas 76950 Thursday, October 2, 1975 Price 15c

4n n f>
li H

i W f 'h  Ä

i i l i l -  i
I f lit ; 

m m â

t  ì

f .
Ti

The 38th A n n u a l Lions Cluh Auction held September 23 at the 4-H Center netted a total 
of $9,360.00. The proceeds of the sale will go to various Llon-snpported activities.

After First Defeat Of Season 
Broncos Travel To Eldorado

By Bob Granger
Using a crunching fourth 

quarter ground game, the 
Dilley Wolves overcame a 7-6 
Sonora lead to grind out two 
long touchdown drives, crush­
ing Sonora’s hopes of an 
undefeated season.

Giving up four fumbles, the 
Wolves managed to hold the 
Broncos to one touchdown 
and kept the Sonora offense 
in check most of the night, 
ending the game with a 2l-7 
lead.

Dilley opened the scoring 
in the first quarter when they 
drove from their 34 yard line 
to the Sonora two where 
Quarterback Mike Urban 
sneaked in for the first TD. 
The try for point after was 
not good and Dilley led 6-0.

In the second quarter 
Sonora started from their own 
39 yard line and from the 
Dilley 33 yard line Hector 
Perez fired a 33 yard pass to 
Jeff Doan for Sonora’s only 
TD of the game. John David 
Cook booted the PAT to give 
Sonora a 7-6 lead which held 
up until halftime.

During the third quarter, 
each team was unsuccessful 
in denting the scoreboard and 
the third quarter ended with

Soiiofa To Have 
New Pharmacy

Joe Kiowski has announced 
his intention to open a new 
pharmacy in Sonora. The 
business will be located in 
the Bud Smith building next 
door to the C. G. Morrison 
Variety Store.

According to Kiowski, the 
pharmacy will open in 
approximately th ree weeks 
after some remodeling is 
done on the building.

The new business will be 
called Bronco Pharmacy.

Foster Families 
Needed In Sonora

Foster fam ilies...fam ilies 
who can share their life and 
love with children other than 
their ow n...are needed in 
Sonora, according to Ms. 
Susan Hays, Foster Family 
Caseworker.

Ms. Hays says if you have 
room in you home and heart 
and would like to consider 
becoming a foster parent, 
contact her at Box 951 in San 
Angelo, Texas 76901, in care 
of the Texas Department of 
Public Welfare.

Sonora still on top 7-6.
In the fourth quarter. 

Hector Perez punted and the 
ball rolled dead on the Dilley 
one yard line. It looked like 
Sonora was in good shape, 
but Dilley showed trem en­
dous poise as the Wolves 
drove the ball 99 yards for 
the go ahead touchdown. The 
scoring play was a 29 yard 
jaunt by Juan Rodriquez to 
climax the drive. Juan Garcia 
then passed to Yancy Moore 
for the two point conversion 
to send the Wolves out front 
14-7.

Later in the fourth quarter

Screwworms
Reported

Sutton County’s fifth 
screwworm case of the year 
was reported by Jerry  Don 
Balch on the Duke Wilson, 
Stewart Ranch, 24 miles 
Southeast of Sonora on Ross 
Road.

The case was in the navel 
of a calf. With fall calving in 
full swing and some fall 
shearing in progress, ranch­
ers are being urged to check 
all livestock regularly, treat 
all wounds, spray sheep and 
goats at shearing and report 
all worm cases to the Mission 
Laboratory.

Post ONice 
issuing New 
Postage Stamp

The local post office is now 
issuing the commemorative 
stam p, “ World Peace 
Through Law’’ for those 
collectors who have not 
already purchased one.

This commemorative stamp 
them atically highlights the 
importance of World Peace 
Through Law. In October, the 
International Conference on 
The Law of the World will 
convene in Washington with 
more than 4,000 judges, 
lawyers and law professors 
from more than 100 nations 
in attendance.

7 6  Fords To Be 
bilroduced

Sonora Motor Company will 
hold open house Thursday 
and Friday for the purpose of 
introducing the 1976 Fords,

Refreshm ents will be 
served both days according to 
Joe Hull, owner.

Dilley marched from their 
own 43 yard line where 
Rodriquez plunged in from 
the one yard line to put the 
game away. Ricky Carpin- 
teyro booted the extra point 
to end the scoring for the 
night, and give Dilley a 21-7 
victory.

Sonora travels to Eldorado 
this week. Eldorado gained 
their first victory of the 
season last Friday by 
defeating Winters.

Statistics
Sonora Dilley
6 First Downs 20
58 Yards Rushing 323
33 Yards Passing 15
7 Passes Attempted 4
1 Passes Completed 2
1 Fumbles Lost 4

4-N Shearing 
Dale Changed

The Sutton County 4-H 
Livestock Show committee 
met Monday and made the 
following changes concerning 
the 1976 4-H Livestock Show.

The weighing and shearing 
date for all market and 
carcass lambs will be 
Saturday, October 18, 1975. 
All lambs must be brought to 
the 4-H Center by 5 p.m . 
Friday, October 17, and 
shearing and weighing will 
start at 8 a.m . Saturday 
morning.

There will be a minimum 
weight limit of 80 pounds for 
all lambs and there will be no 
upper weight limit for lambs 
in the carcass or market lamb 
classes at the County Show. 
The final weigh day will be 
Monday, January 5, 1976.

The live judging of carcass 
lambs will be Monday, 
January 5. The judging of all 
other livestock classes will be 
Friday, January 9. Lamb 
carcasses will be displayed at 
10:30 a.m. Saturday, January 
10.

A barbecue luncheon will 
be served at 11:30 a.m. and 
will be followed by the sale of 
lambs.

W hite's Auto 
Leases Space

W hite’s Auto Store has 
leased the Tom Keilman 
building on Main S treet, 
downtown, to house their 
home furnishing displays. All 
furniture items, carpet sam­
ples and other household 
goods are on display there.

The building formerly 
housed Jerry  Shurley’s law 
firm and later was the office 
of Pool Company.

Mrs. Belle Steen was among 
the large crowd of donors and 
buyers at the annnal barbe- 
cne and sale.

City Manager and Mrs. Bob Nevill find activities at the 
sale amusing.

Harvey DnRnssel displays 
Package, purchased by him

the controversial Mystery 
for $360.00 at the auction.

Auction Nets $9,360
Lem Jones of Scotsdale, 

Arizona opened the 38th 
annual Lions Club Auction 
September 23 as he has for 
so many years in the past, 
with the fam iliar words —  
“ What am I bid?’’ 

Auctioneer Jones’ ques­
tions and the generosity and 
support of the townspeople 
had replenished the Lions’ 
treasury  to the tune of 
$9,360.00 by the close of the 
auction. These funds will be 
appropriated to the many 
regular projects supported by 
Lions Club.

Festivities got underway 
with donors and buyers 
meeting at the 4-H Center for 
a barbecue supper with all 
the trimmings. Goats for the 
barbecue were donated by 
Willie Miers, the Sonora Fire 
Department, George Wallace 
and the Harrison Ranch. 

Immediately following the

meal, bidding got underway 
with the auctioning off of 
something new ...a  p ig ... 
which right away netted the 
Lions $70.00. Several goats 
were auctioned off and 
donated to other local 
organizations for future use.

The Mystery Package was 
re-donated and purchased 
this year by Harvey DuRussel

THE WEATHER
COMPILED BY PAT BROWN 

Rain Hi Lo
September 23 80 40
September 24 82 42
September 25 77 42
September 26 82 42
September 27 87 50
September 28 88 51
September 29 89 57

Rainfall for the month, 
3.58; rainfall for the year, 
17.94.

National 4-N Week October 5-11
4-H boys and girls through­

out Texas and the nation will 
join in a salute to America’s 
B ic e n te n n ia l c e le b ra tio n  
during National 4-H Week, 
Oct. 5-11.

The annual observance, 
with this year’s them e of 
“ 4-H -’76...Spirit of Tomor­
row,” is designed to accent 
the history, ideals and goals 
of the 4-H program , points 
out Dr. Don Stormer, state 
4-H and youth leader with the 
Texas Agricultural Extension 
Service.

“ Many county groups are 
planning special events, ser­
vice projects and recruitment

John Wade 
Enrolled In 
Ranch Program

John Richard W ade is 
among 34 ranchers enrolled 
in the 19th Ranch Manage­
ment Program class at Texas 
Christian University this year. 
Participants come from 
Mexico, South Africa, Central 
America and five states.

An extensive nine-month 
program for study of all 
aspects of ranching, the TCU 
program was inaugurated in 
1956 on the recommendation 
of Southwestern ranchers. 
Since that time members of 
the annual classes have 
gained skills, techincal know­
ledge and practical exper­
ience in preparation for a 
life’s work in ranching.

Wade is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Bill Wade.

drives during National 4-H 
Week,” notes Stormer. “ It’s 
a special time when 4-H is 
recognized for its contribu­
tions to the growth and 
development of youth.”

The 4-H program is active 
in all 50 states, the District of 
Columbia, Puerto Rico, Guam 
and the Virgin Islands as well 
as in more than 80 countries. 
It is adm inistered by the 
Cooperative Extension Ser­
vice, and Extension profes­
sionals play an active role in 
recruiting, train ing and 
assisting volunteer leaders 
who help with local 4-H 
activities.

According to Stormer, 
some 7.2 million youth 
between the ages of 9 and 19 
are currently enrolled in 4-H, 
with more than 215,000 of 
these in Texas. More than
21.000 volunteer adult and 
youth leaders assist with local 
4-H programs in the state.

“ Although the majority of 
4-H m embers still live on 
farms and in rural communi­
ties, 24 per cent now come 
from larger urban and 
suburban areas,” notes the 
4-H leader. “ Well over half 
the Texas 4-Hers live on 
farms or in towns of under
10.000 population.”

Texas 4-Hers participate ^  
more than 60 educational 
project areas, with the most 
popular being food and 
nutrition, clothing and tex ­
tiles, and horses and ponies.

“ Since its beginning 
around the turn of the 
century, 4-H has offered 
practical learning and citizen­
ship experiences to millions 
of young people ,’’ Stormer 
points out.

for $360.00.
A complete list of donors, 

purchasers and prices may be 
found elsewhere in this 
newspaper.

i

Sutton Included 
In Block Grant

Governor Dolph Briscoe 
announced his approval re ­
cently of two grants, totaling 
$75,310 for continued support 
of probation and police 
train ing projects in the 
Concho Valley area.

The money comes from the 
Criminal Justice Division of 
the Governor’s Office. CJD 
administers the state’s block 
grant from the Law Enforce­
ment Assistance Administra­
tion under the Crime Control 
Act of 1973.

A $46,210 grant to Kimble 
County will continue funding 
of a regional probation 
project, serving Bandera, 
Kimble, Kerr, Gillespie, 
Kendall and Sutton counties. 
Since the project’s beginning 
in 1973, the u n it’s three 
officers have served over 565 
adult and juvenile proba­
tioners.

A second grant to the 
Concho Valley Council of 
G o v e rn m e n ts  p ro v id e s  
$29,100 for continuation of 
the regional police academy. 
An anticipated 450 police 
officers will receive basic, 
i n t e r m e d i a t e ,  a n d /o r  
advanced train ing through 
the academy. Selected offi­
cers will be sent to 
specialized training schools 
approved by the Texas 
Commission of Law Enforce­
ment Officers Standards and 
Education.

The grants were among 38 
approved by Governor 
Briscoe, totaling $2,682,210 
for improvements in law 
enforcem ent and criminal 
justice at state, regional and 
local levels.

Benefit Dance 
Termed Success

Sonora Jaycees report that 
their benefit dance held 
Saturday night at the 4-H 
Center was a trem endous 
success. Proceeds from the 
dance tickets are to be 
donated to the San Angelo 
Concho Valley Home For 
Girls.

Jaycees also remind Bronco 
supporters that they still have 
stadium  seats and will be 
selling them at all hometown 
games. Proceeds from these 
seats will go to the Bronco 
Booster Club.

School Offering Adult Classes
Sonora Independent School 

district is again cooperating 
with the San Angelo Inde­
pendent School D istrict in 
offering Adult Education 
classes. Classes will be 
offered two nights per week, 
from 6:30 to 9:30. Course 
offerings will again be in 
English and m ath. Mrs. 
Nelda Hernandez and Mrs. 
Leticia Galindo Reyes will be 
instructing the classes.

There is no cost at all, and 
books are furnished without 
cost to adult students.

Anyone who is eighteen

Steak Nduse 
Plans November 
Opening Dale

A November opening has 
been planned for the Sutton 
County Steak House and 
Lounge located adjacent to 
the Devil’s River Motel. Mr. 
and Mrs. Bob Pennington will 
manage the establishm ent 
and will employ fifteen to 
twenty persons. Mrs. Pen­
nington is presently assistant 
m anager at the Z entner’s 
Daughter Steak House in San 
Angelo.

The decor of the 5000 
square foot building will be in 
red, white and black. Steaks 
will be featured on the menu 
along with sea foods.

The building will be 
separated  into four depart­
m ents including a main 
dining room that will accomo­
date eighty persons and a 
smaller dining room for 
breakfast and lunch patrons. 
There will also be a meeting 
room and a lounge area.

Kimble kbedu les 
'76 Celebration

A tentative schedule has 
been set for the Kimble 
County Centennial and Amer­
ican Bicentennial celebrations 
June 11 through June 20, 
1976.

Plans include parades, 
pageants, barbecues, state 
and area dignitaries, games 
and Mexican Fiesta celebra­
tion, horse racing, dancing 
and church services.

years of age or older who 
does not have a high school 
education, and who is not 
now enrolled in a public 
school, is eligible to enroll in 
the classes. Special emphasis 
is given to preparing adults 
to pass the General Educa­
tional Development Examina­
tion. Many from Sonora have 
taken the GED tests and have 
passed the examination, 
making them  eligible to 
receive a High School 
Equivalency Certificate from 
the Texas Education Agency.

Anyone who qualifies and 
is in terested  in attending 
these classes should im­
mediately contact Mrs. Her­
nandez in person or by 
telephone at 387-2874 after 
school or 387-2414 during 
school hours.

There must be at least 
fourteen students enrolled for 
Sonora to be able to offer 
these classes.

Norse Q inic 
Saturday, Oct. 11

B. F. Yeates, Extension 
Horse Specialist from Texas 
A&M University, will conduct 
a 4-H Horse Clinic at the 
Sonora Park Association 
Arena Saturday, October 11 
at 9 a.m.

The purpose of the Clinic is 
to give adult leaders and 4-H 
members training in develop­
ing and conducting a county 
4-H Horse Program.

Training will be given in 
basic horsemanship, training 
horses for special uses and 
preparing 4-H members to 
participate in county, district 
and state 4-H horse events.

Demonstration Classes will 
be set up to provide training 
in the different horse show 
events.

4-H Horse judging will also 
receive special emphasis with 
both halter and performance 
classes being set up to give 
training in placing classes 
and presenting oral reasons.

All area 4-H Horse leaders 
and all boys and girls 
interested in receiving horse­
manship training are invited 
to attend the clinic.

Anderson Sells 
To Odessa Firm

G.H.M. Construction Com­
pany of Odessa has pur­
chased W. S. Anderson and 
Son Construction Company, 
along with all buildings and 
the ten acre tract of land 
where the company is 
located.

The sale was effective 
September 15.

Ben Montgomery will be 
the local manager. The new 
company will be know as W. 
S. Anderson and Son, Inc., 
and will provide general oil 
field construction.
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COMMUNITY
CALENDAR

Thursday, October 2
4:30 p .m ., 7th and 8th 

grade Colts vs Oiona, there
7:15 p .m ., Bronco Junior 

Varsity vs Ozona,.there
12:30 p .m ., Sonora Wo­

m an’s Club m eeting at 
Clubhouse

Friday, October 3
8 p.m., Sonora Broncos vs 

Eldorado Eagles, there
Saturday, October 4

2- 5 p.m., Sonora Woman’s 
Club Library open

Sunday, October 5
Services at the church of 

your choice
Monday, October 6

9 a.m .. City Aldermen 
meeting at City Hall

Tuesday, October 7
12 noon. Downtown Lions 

Club luncheon in fellowship 
hall of First United Methodist 
Church

3- 5 p .m ., M iers Home 
Museum open

5 p.m.. Historical Society 
m eeting at M iers Home 
‘Museum

7:30 p .m .. Booster Club 
meeting at School Cafeteria 

Wednesday, October 8 
3-5 p.m., Sonora Woman’s 

Club Library open

T e xa co -T o o n s

By —  JAMES

1#/

“We got him right out of the 
woldorf!"

Our service is just as 
attentive. Drive in and 
see!

Blackman's
Texaco

"Best Service In Sonora"

801 N. Crockett 
Phone 387-2422

from  HISTORY'S SCRAPBOOK
D A TE S  AN D  E V E N TS  FROM  Y E S TE R Y E A R S

October 7, 1965
Halfback Noe Chavez was 

quarterback Laney Cook’s 
choice receiver in the game 
against the Rankin- Red 
Devils Friday night. The 
Broncos won this game by a 
score of 25-6.

Funeral services for Regi­
nald R. Trainer, Sonora Post 
Office employee for 19 years, 
were held Wednesday morn­
ing at the First Baptist 
Church.

Marion Elliott has pur­
chased the butane business 
from Joe Nance and Sonora 
Gas Company, and has 
named it the Sonora Butane 
Company.

Miss Margaret Sanchez has 
been elected recently as 
president of the senior class 
of Texas Woman’s University 
College of Nursing.

The Lion’s Auction replen­
ished the depleted funds of 
the club when the fund­
raising event was held at the
4- H Center Tuesday night. A 
total of $4,524.50 was added 
to the club’s treasury.

October 7, 1955
Following the killing of two 

rabid foxes near here 
recently, dog and cat owners 
are urged to have their pets 
vaccinated against rabies. 
Howard Espy killed a rabid 
fox near his ranch home 
when the fox ran into the 
yard attacking and biting a 
shepherd pup.

Joe Turner’s Big Red and 
Black continued to roll last 
week when they turned back 
the Rankin Red Devil’s 40-7. 
George Johnson took the 
fourth down punt on the
5- yard-line and ran it all the 
way back for a TD.

Mrs. Pat Lyles feted her

Cecil Westerman

Would

Like

TO

Be

YOUR

Pharmacist
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son, Gaddy, on his eighth 
birthday with a theatre party.

Wesley Sawyer traveled to 
Kansas City, Missouri, where 
he is taking an intensive 
course in diamond grading 
and merchandising.

The F irem en’s Auxiliary 
met at the fire house last 
Wednesday night with Mrs. 
L. D. Hollmig as hostess. 
Mrs. Katie' Brasher and Mrs. 
Robert Rees won high bridge 
scores.

October 12, 1945
The Rev. F. L. Meadow 

retired  from the M ethodist 
Ministry after 36 years.

The Sonora Broncos won 
the decision on penetrations 
in the scoreless game they 
played against the Junction 
Eagles last Friday in Junc­
tion.

Six more Sonora men have 
arrived home with service 
discharges. They are Pfc. 
Jack C. Baysinger, Pfc. Pablo 
Rodriquez, Pfc. Juan F. 
Yanez, Sgt. Jefferson A. 
Harris, Louis E. Ratliff, and 
Lawrence Nichols.

Miss Kathryn Ross was 
chosen Miss Mohair of 1945 
at the annual m eeting in 
Kerrville.

Thousands of allied prison­
ers are being liberated firom 
Jap prison camps all over 
Asia where many of them  
have been over three years. 
Prisoners are found to be Ul 
and starved in primitive 
conditions in the prisons. 
They were given no medical 
supplies.

63 Years Ago
M arried at Maxfield, 

Maine, September 28, 1912 at 
the home of the groom ’s 
sister, were Mr. E. E. Sawyer 
and Miss Mae Clough. Mr. 
Sawyer is a well known 
ex-ranchman and stockholder 
in the First National Bank at 
Del Rio. They arrived in 
Sonora Thursday and are at 
home with Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
Brasher. They will spend the 
w inter in Texas and the 
summer in M aine. Mr. 
Sawyer has one car in Sonora 
and a large one in Maine.

Dr. P. B. Scott, who has 
been cleaning the ticks out of 
Crockett County, was in 
Sonora Friday. He will 
superintend the dipping of 
the O. T. Word horses.

Owing to the inclement 
w eather, the services were 
not held at any of the 
churches in Sonora Sunday.

Joe Berger, the contractor, 
has finished a three roomed 
house and gallery, also a 
bam, for Ed Fowler on his 
new ranch north of town.

Tim Liefeste has been  
named to head the newly 
authorized Texas Parks and 
Wildlife Department’s Infor­
mation and Edncation D i­
vision Field Office in San 
A ngelo. His newly estab ­
lished district encompasses 
36 counties inclndlng Sutton, 
which includes seven  state  
parks, two fish  hatcheries, 
regional law enforcem ent 
offices and num erous w ild­
life and fisheries projects.

THE DEVIL’S RIVER PHILOSOPHER SEZ..............................

la ck  Of Children's Permissiveness 
Taking The Fun Out Of Parenthood

Editor’s note: The Devil’s 
River Philosopher on his 
bltterweed ranch on the Dry 
Devil’s River switches from 
the international scene to 
parenthood this week, we 
guess.
Dear editor:

You hear a lot these days 
about permissiveness, about 
how parents are letting their 
children do as they please 
with some unhappy results, 
but you don’t hear anything 
about the lack of permissive-' 
ness by children toward their 
parents.

I mean, while it’s true that 
a lot of children, under the 
philosophy of le tting  them 
flower without hindrence, of 
leaning over backwards to

A Bishop Looks at Life
By Everett H. Jones, Retired 
Bishop of Episcopal Church

On Knowing 
Our Limitations

During the recent tennis 
finals at Forest Hills, N.Y., in 
the decisive match between 
Chris Evert and Evonne 
Goolagong, one of the 
commentators remarked that 
Evert knew her lim itations. 
Though hard-pressed at 
tim es, she stayed with the 
kind of game she played best. 
This was one secret of the 
victory that made her the new 
U.S. Women’s champion.

The Bible is full of 
rem inders tha t in our 
spiritual life we need to 
rem em ber our lim itations, 
especially our need for help 
beyond our own. Paul wrote 
to the Christians in Corinth; 
“ Let him tha t thinks he 
stands take heed lest he 
fa ll.”  In his le tte r to the 
Romans he said: “ I say to 
every man among you, not to 
think of himself more highly 
than he ought to think.”

The most fam iliar Bible 
example of what happens to a 
person unaware of his own 
weakness is Peter. He 
boasted on the day before 
Good Friday, “ though I 
should die with thee, yet will 
I not deny thee.” It was this 
very over-confidence that led 
to his three shameful denials 
in C hrist’s last hours on 
earth.

We often see the sad 
results of a person’s b lind­
ness to his own limitations in 
the world of business and 
professional life. A young 
man rising in his chosen field 
of work is offered a

SCHOOL

LUNCH MENU
Monday, October 6

Mexican Food 
Pinto Beans 
Green Salad 
Hot Rolls 
Pudding 
Milk

Tuesday, October 7
Steak Fingers with Gravy
Spinach with Cheese Sauce
Mashed Potatoes
Hot Rolls
Cake
Milk

Wednesday, October 8
Tuna Salad 
Tator Tots 
Green Salad 
Hot Rolls
Peanut Butter Squares 
Milk

Thursday, October 9
Fried Chicken
Scalloped Potatoes
Fruit
Hot Rolls
Jello
Milk

Friday, October 10
Meat and Spaghetti
Green Beans
Celery and Carrot Sticks
Corn Bread
Ice Cream
Milk

Ice cream is easier to serve if 
it is transferred from the 
frozen food compartment to 
the refrigerator shortly be­
fore serving: about 10 min­
utes per pint.

OZONA W AHR WELL SERVICE

Randy Upham

SUBMERGIBLE PUM f DISTRIBUTOR

Pump & Windmill Repair Service

PHONE 392-2334

Box 714 Ozona, Texas

promotion that means a great 
increase in responsibility. He 
cannot be objective enough to 
see tha t the new position 
calls for maturity and ability 
beyond his own, at least until 
he is older. So he accepts. 
The results are almost always 
a painful experience for him 
and for his associates.

It is also im portant to 
recognize our lim itations if 
we are to keep our physical 
health . The human body is 
capable of surprising endur­
ance in the midst of stress, 
but it has definite limits that 
cannot be ignored. The body 
tries to warn us when we are 
in danger--it speaks to 
us-but we often fail to heed. 
Practically everyone of us has 
an area of physical weakness 
that calls for special attention 
and care.

This whole m atter of 
accepting limitations becomes 
of crucial importance as we 
reach our retirement years. 
Here it is a spiritual as well 
as a physical challenge. The 
secret is to keep doing all we 
can without becoming de­
pressed over what we cannot 
do. A good rule is to find 
constructive uses for all the 
energy we have but to avoid 
making dem ands on energy 
we do not have.

Mapyp^

Thursday, October 2
George D. Chalk 
Mrs. Charles Howard 
Mrs. Nelson Stubblefield 
Darla Moore Berkley 
Mrs. Herman Pettiet 
Groucho Marx 
Gaddy Lyles

Friday, October 3 
Mrs. Leroy Whitworth 
Mark Shurley 
Bill Whitehead 
Lee Ann Byer 
Mrs. Neil Wilson

Saturday, October 4 
G. H. Hall 
Alfired Schwiening 
Mrs. Belle Steen 
Bobby Wayne Granger 
Brenda Granger 
R. L. Hardgrave 
Greg Morrison 
Edward Gonzales 
Jean S. Campbell 
Ruth Drennan Easley 
Rev. John Weston

Sunday, October 5 
Harold C. Saunders, Jr.
Alvis Johnson, Jr.
Joyce H. Chalk 
Ernest Castro 
Ronnie Paxton

Monday, October 6 
Mrs. Melvin Shroyer 
Libb Mills Wallace 
Renee Adkins 
Ethel Olson 
Betty Jo Cooper

Tuesday, October 7 
Arther Trainer 
Pam Powers 
Cyndy Hopkins 
J. D. Bishop

Wednesday, October 8 
Albert Ward 
Mrs. Juanita McCoy 
Ray Lancaster 
Kay Archer Jones 
Carlos Gallegos 
Toni Duran 
Kay Louise Allen

F F c T

Life is a struggle.

avoid suppressing their per­
sonalities or damaging their 
free spirits, have turned into 
rather strange teen-agers, 
nobody seems to be studying 
the effect children have on 
parents.

While the children are 
demanding freedom for 
them selves, have they ever 
stopped to ask if th ey ’re 
being too stem, too firm, too 
dictatorial with their parents? 
In many households the 
child’s dem ands, not his 
needs, come first. Life is 
ordered around his whims.

Why, I understand there 
are some parents who can’t 
decide whether they’re going 
out for the evening until they 
check with their children, and 
it’s this lack of the children’s 
permissiveness that’s spoiling 
the parents, with untold 
psychological damage prob­
ably resulting.

I’ll tell you, if kids don’t 
relax, loosen up, get a little 
more lenient with grown-ups, 
they’re going to take all the 
fun out of parenthood.

Why hasn ’t a parent got 
the right to be just as 
peculiar as his child? It’s sort 
of like professional football 
players, after striking against 
the owners, being shocked 
and outraged at the owners 
striking against them.

Actually, I don’t know 
which is the better system for 
bringing up a child, being 
stem or being lenient, but I 
suspect the goal of most 
parents is about the same -  
to try to see that our kids 
don’t do what we did when 
we were kids.

Yours faithfully, 
J. A.

Fantasy
What reality becomes when 
we ask enough questions of it.

Save 50%
By Using Your 
Present Cotton

IN  A  COMPLETELY  
REBUILT MATTRESS

Western 
Mattress Co.
San Angelo, Texas 

387-2222

H ealth  Tips
1exas Medical Association
1801 North Lamar Austin Texas 78701

Dogs and Cats Often 
Bearers of Harmful Bacteria

The chances are good that 
the family dog or cat is 
carrying around a microscopic 
organism that can cause a 
nasty infection if the animal 
nips you.

The offender is known to 
physicians as Pasteurella 
Multicoda. It is often found in 
the mouths of healthy dogs 
and cats, and is a common 
cause of infection following 
bites or scratches.

Researchers have found the 
offending organism  in the 
mouths of up to half of all 
dogs and up to almost 
three-fourths of all cats, the 
report says.

Some 550,000 domestic

animal bites and scratches 
are reported each year, most 
of them dog bites. Many of 
them transm it Pasteurella 
Multicoda. This infection 
responds well to penicillin 
and some other antibiotics, 
but it is so common that it is 
often not diagnosed promptly, 
a recent study declares.

The research report is 
based on a 10-year study at 
the Oregon State Public 
Health Laboratory, Portland.

The only prevention is to 
avoid getting bitten.

The researchers advise 
physicians to consider that 
the bite might be infected 
until proved otherwise, and to 
institu te proper antibiotic 
treatment.

SONORA YOUTH CENTER
Pool - Snooker • Pin Ball 

Air Hockey - - Deutscher Ball

Good Clean Family Entertainment 

GAMBLING & IN TOXICAT ING  LIQUOR 

NOT ALLOWED

Located On Main St. Sonora 
Open At 1 P.M. Daily 

Close At 9:30 P.M. Daily 
Except Wednesdays and Sundays

Owners; Mr. 8i Mrs. H.E. Moore

BUILD FOR LESS

We stock top-grade lumber. We 

also have all types of paneling for you 

to choose from. Come in soon and check 

our prices.

Foxworib G albrallh Lumber Co.
Phone 387-2536 Sonora

TIME
AND
OUR
INTEREST 
WORK 
FOR YOU

Time is m oney.  A  p a r t ic u la r l y  true 
statement if your money is in a S A S A  
savings account. Your S A S A  savings 
earnings are compounded daily which 
means each day  you earn money on 
the m on e y  S A S A  p a id  you  the d a y  
before.  All S A S A  s a v in g s  a ccoun ts  
a re  in su red  up to $ 4 0 , 0 0 0  b y  the 
F SL IC .  Put y ou r  m oney  to w o rk  at 
S A S A  w here  it e a rn s  interest d a i ly  
a n d  S A S A  will put y o u r  m oney  to 
work building the Concho Valley.

f f i m
San Angelo Savinas 

AssoGiation
YOUR FAMILY F IN AN C IAL  C fN T fR
5 So. Chodbourne / Knickerbocker of Jackson 

115 Eost M a in *S o n o ro  / 1002 Avenue E *O zo n a

=(
EARNINCS COMPOUNDED DAILY
ANNUAL NATE ANNUAL YIELD*
7.75% E lilt cm -Ei.ooo mu. 8.06% 
7.50% 4 Year Cert.—$1.000 nm. 7.79% 
6.75% 30 Mo cm.-Ei.iioo mii.6.98% 
6.50% I Year Cert.—$1.000 oiiR. 6.72% 
5.75% 90 O il Cm.-SI.ODO mn.5.92% 
5.25% PaubiM k-$5 nia. 5.39%
'b a n d  on d o ily  com pounding of lo rn in g s  fo r  12 months
k »tistaiitial iRterest peRatty is required lor early 
withdrawal ol certificate accounts
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FOODWAY
S u p e f  ‘M a r k e t s

The Beef 
People

Specials Good Wed.
Oct. 1 thru 

Sat. Oct. 4, 1975

Rights Reserved to Limit 
Quantities • N o  Soles to Oeolers

Cudahy Bar<S

Franks

w
m

Ground
Chuck

la

DANKWORTH 
GERMAN

12-01. $ 1 0 9  
Pica. I

FOODWAY
S u p e f  M a r k e t s

Lb. Can

Boneless

Round Steak . Lb.
> 1 5 9

_ Round

Steak
i b M ' «

Kountry Fresh Produce
Jonathan, Red D elicions or 
Golden Delicious

I ^ A p p l e s

USDA Choice Beef Tenderized Round

Steak................ $ 1 5 9
Lb.

Boneless

Rump ^

The Í-
l ^ o ^ e

Roast
FWD sliced bacon

a
; - a 5

DOLD
FWD

SlicedBacon
12-oz. 
Pkg.

SIRLOIN TIP

3# Bag

Colorado Bartlett

Pears
SmaU, Yellow

Lb.

Swift

Round Steak .Lb.
$ 1 4 9 1

Squash |5‘
Seedless or Red Tokay

Grapes
Rodeo Buckboord

Bacon
Vac Pack

7 5
Lb.

'The Hatural Snack''

Morrell Spiced
Luncheon Meat 2-ib. can

Family Needs
Aim

Hormel, Pork Links

Little Sizzlers

Frozen Foods
M r. G Crinkle Cut

French Fries

06

Aunt Jemima Reg. or Blueberry

Pancakcf°"^ 0°̂

Kold Kountry

Cut Okra Bog

g  Kountry Cut

O 7  Broccoli '°Bog
Night Hawk Top-Chop't

Steak ° , 2 o c
Kold Kountry Whipped

Topping

Hefty 30-Gal.’t; ‘ ____

Trash Bags..................... 'pkg'
Kimbell Thrown No. 510 _

Stuffed Olives "m: 8 9 * "
Ko! Kan Chunk Beef by-Products Dinner ^  ^

Dog Food........................33*=

Pkg.

Puffs Printed

Facial T issue ................. ' B̂of'
Kimbell White, Yellow or Devils Food

Cake M ix ..................... '.b°x'
Texize with Spray or Trigger

Glass P lu s......................

Hunt's Tomato

Catsup

3 l i iT 24 Oz. Jar

FRENCH’S

Mustard

39‘

Toothpaste
Johnson's Baby Shampoo 

Schick Super II Blades 

Prell Liquid Shompoo

6. 4- 01.
Tube

Cortridge

$ 1 S 9

n.o,. $ 1 3 9

Green Giant

Sweet Peas  Con

Kimbell

Pork & B eans...................'con 2 3 ‘

Spray 'N  V a c .................... xan ^ 2 ° ’
Austex _  _

Beef Stew........................ 'can 9 3 ^
Assorted Flavors m ^
Mr. Koogle.....................  jar 68*^

Spot Lifter........................ ¿an

FRENCH’S

Instant

Potatoes 69?i

FRENCH’S 
Brown Gravy Mix 
Taco Seasoning Mix 
Spaghetti Sauce Mix

MIX OR MATCH

Pkgs.

M/Jf L ' : « n s v y  j

Joan of Arc

Pork&
Beans

#300

Cans

Dairy Products

DEL MONTE Sliced

Carrots

Heavy Duty

Detergent
Tide's tn... Dirt's (

Tide

Pillsbury 9V2-oz. Can
Kountry Fresh Halfmoon _  n

_ ,  Cinnamon Rolls
L o n g h o r n  Kountry P r» h

Sour C ream  C h

^ B l  H 1 ?  Kraft Deluxe American 12-oz. Pkg. $ 1 2 1

■  A c  Sliced Cheese ^  I
I  m l'’ « „ n g r y to . ,^  O  d  C |■ w  P'« Biscuits Buttermilk Can

303
Glass

Franco American

d^Pk Spaghetti
15-oz. 
Cons

Reynolds Aluminum

Foil
$ |9 9

200' X 12'
Roll

Palmolive Liquid

Detergent
^ ^ ^ ^ Y o u P a y  j j ^  (I You Pay

22- 01.
Bll.

Everyday Low Price!

Kimbell

Cut

« A c  WITH THISSave  10 COUPON
on Purchase of 1-Lb. Box

Zusta Soltin«

CrackersluT«f On# Coupon P#r Fomdy
Void After 10/A/75 ot Buddies Only

F O O D W A Y
Super'

Irish Spring

Kountry Fresh

Red Plum Jam ..........
Texize Fluf .

Fabric Softener............pô  goi
Kimbell Dry Baby ^

Lima Beans  Bog

Vito Pep Semi-AAoist Burgers

Dog Food ....................... î rtg“
Tillie Lewis Whole Kernel

Golden Corn......................coi
Kroft Jet Puffed

Marshmallows
Kraft Tongy

Spaghetti Dinner  Box
1 0 0 %  Pure Instant

Nesteo ...........................
Wolf Brand

Plain Chili.......................

18-oz. 
. .Tumb.

10-oz.

GreenBeans
#303
Cons

eChicken Needle 
eCreom of Chicken 

eVegetoble 
eCreom of Mushroom^

I At

Campbell's I ««tj

Soup
10 % -o z .

Cons
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Hospital
Auxiliary News

By Jan Vander Stncken
The Lillian M. H udspeth 

Memorial Hospital Auxiliary 
held its first meeting of the 
year Monday at the Joseph 
Vander Stucken home.

M rs. Charles Browne, 
president, conducted a short 
business session. P repara­
tions were made to send a 
delegate to the Texas 
Association of Hospital Aux­
iliaries Area meeting in San 
Angelo. A report will be 
given at the next meeting.

Mr. Jerra l W hitehead, 
Hospital and Nursing Home 
Administrator, made a speech 
on duties of auxiliary mem­
bers. Dr. and Mrs. David E. 
Owensby were' special guests 
at the meeting.

Hostesses were Mrs. Louie 
Trainer, Mrs. Ernest McClel­
land, Mrs. Dick McCalmont, 
Mrs. Charles Browne, Mrs. 
Joseph Vander Stucken, and 
Miss Jan Vander Stucken.

A bride-to-be's 
First Stop . . .

[ 7 ^  SAun/U^
The following brides and brides-to-be have made 

their selections VfHh u s .............

Pamela Lear, bride-elect of Matt Davenport

STORE HOURS:

Monday - Friday 9:00 To 5:00

Band ^ \ \ 
News j  \

By Denise Neal
This past week, the SHS 

Band has been working on 
their UIL Contest show for 
November 1. They have been 
working hard and striving for 
a “ one” this year.

This Friday the band will 
march against Eldorado in 
Eldorado.

Bronco Bandsmen for last 
week were Denita Mobley 
and John Mormon. Bronco 
Bandsmen for this week are 
Donna Schaffner and Ricky 
Hard.

That day the Lord made a 
covenant with Abraham, say­
ing: “ Unto thy seed have I 
given this land.”

Hospital
News

Patients receiving treat­
ment from Tuesday, Septem­
ber 23 thru Monday, Septem­
ber 29 Include the following:
Mary Bruton, Eldorado*
Rudy Perez*
Joseph Necessary*
Katie Pearl 
Ramona Porras*
Della Kissleburg 
Joe H. Taylor*
Billy Green*
Evelyn Zook*
Edward Moija, San Angelo* 
Luz Artega*
Nova Olenick*
Bob Vicars*
Lupe Ramos 
Kathy Lofters

*Patlents dismissed during 
the same period.

Mrs. Neville 
Hosts Club 13

Mrs. Durwood Neville was 
hostess Septem ber 25 to 
members and guests of the 
Club 13 Bridge Club. Mrs. 
Ken Braden was high club 
winner with M rs. Richard 
Olson winning high for 
guests. Second high was won 
by M rs. Wayne Herrm ann
and Mrs. Clay Cade won the 
bingo prize.

O ther m em bers in a tten ­
dance were M rs. R. W. 
W allace, Glen Richardson, 
Fred Campbell, Jim Cusen- 
bary, J. W. Neville, Bill 
Gosney and Doyle Morgan.

M rs. Penn Baggett was 
also a guest of the club.

Caramel Apples For Family Night Fun

« 0

M agnificent tapestries, sometimes tak ing years to complete, decorated  the w alls o f m any  

hom es a n d  churches in the M idd le  Ages. W ove n  with richly co lored  strands of silk a n d  wool, 

they often p ictured scenes from the Bible. To create a  beautiful tapestry required  patience  

, . , skill . . . devotion.

Today each of us w eaves a  tapestry  —  the fabric of our lives. W e  sit at a loom, w onder­

ing  whether the pattern of ou r lives will be of bright rose, green or go lden  threads, or 

whether the events will show  as som ber, dark  colors.

A  w eaver in the M idd le  A g e s  w orked  on the re v e rs e  side of his tapestry. By  /o o lc in g  up 

at a  mirror, he could see how  the entire design  looked  on the right side.

W h en  we look up to G o d  in worship, we can see with clarity the pattern of our lives. 

Attend the church of your choice for perspective on your life 's tapestry.

During the fall, plan some 
family night fun. Spend an eve­
ning making one of everybody’s 
favorite treats — Caramel Ap­
ples; or shape up some Confetti 
Mallow Popcorn Balls, delicious 
crunchy treats studded with 
chopped gumdrops.

To make Caramel Apples, 
you'll need a 14-oz. bag of car­
amels and some water. Just 
melt caramels with water in a 
covered saucepan and dip ap­
ples into the hot mixture. Invite 
your family to decorate apples 
with cereal or miniature marsh­
m allows. Set out ra isins, 
chopped nuts and coconut too; 
they’re all tasty toppings for 
delicious caramel apples.

Although crisp, juicy apples 
and creamy caramels are avail­
able year ’round, apples are in 
greatest abundance in autumn. 
The International Apple Insti­
tute reminds you that you can 
use your favorite harvest-time 
variety for Caramel Apple-mak­
ing, making sure that the fruit 
is firm and vivid in color. They 
also suggest you wash and dry 
apples thoroughly for best re­
sults.

The apple industry expects a 
bumper crop this fall, so, you’ll 
find plenty of apples in the pro­
duce section of your supermar­
ket. You’ll find caramels there 
too, as well as on the candy 
shelf, with sticks for making 
Caramel Apples right in the bag.

Caramel Apples
49 (14-oz. bag) Kraft caramels 
2 tablespoons water 

4 or 5 medium size apples, 
washed, dried 

Wooden sticks
Melt caramels with water in 

covered double boiler or in 
saucepan over low heat. Stir 
occasionally  until sauce is 
smooth. Insert a wooden stick 
into stem end of each apple.

St. John’s 
Episcopal Church

Rev. Ray Nations, Rector 
Service Schedule:
Holy Communion
Each Sunday 8 & 11 a.m.
Church School 10:00 a.m.

First Baptist Church

Co}ifjriu.ht 1970 Kcislvr Service, Inc., ^irashurg. Va

Scripfur« selected by the American Bible Socieltj

Sunday Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday Saturday 
Proverbs Matthew II Timothy Psalms Psalms Psalms Psalms 
3:13-26 4:1-11 3:10-17 3:1-8 4:1-8 27:1-14 91:1-16

5 - f -  < x T 7 )  (x t r > - f - ,  c r i ? ?  +  - f -  - f -  c n ? ?  - h '  a i T ?  - f -  ' c n ? ?  - f - . j r r T O

RATLIFF - KERBOW

FUNERAL HOME

NEVILLE’S

Yonr Complete Dept. Store

The
RUTH SHURLEY 

JEWELRY

DEVH’S RIVER NEWS 

Sonora, Texas

SOUTHWEST TEXAS 
ELECTRIC COOPERATIVE 

INCORPORATED 
Owned By Those It Serves

“ R ighteousness 
exalteth a nation...” 

—  Proverbs 14:34

Rev. Clifton Hancock, 
Pastor

Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Morn. Worship 10:50 a.m. 
Training Union 6:00 p.m. 
Evening Worship7:00 p.m. 
Wed. Services 7:00 p.m.

First Latin American 
Baptist Church

Rev. Pablo Gomez 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Worship 11:00 a.m.
Training Union 6:00 p.m. 
Worship 7:00 p.m.
WMU, Monday 7:00 p.m.

First United 
Methodist Chnrch

Rev. Paul Terry, Pastor 
Church School 9:45 a.m. 
Worship 10:45 a.m.

If you do not worship at 
some other church we will 
be very happy to have you 
worship with us.

Church of Christ

Bible School 10:00 a.m. 
Mom. Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Youth Group 5:00 p.m. 
Sunday Evening 6:00 p.m. 
Wed. Evening 7:30 p.m.

St. Ann’s Catholic Church
Rev. Michael Fernandez 

Weekday Mass:
Tues., Thurs., Fri.

8:00 a.m.
Evening Mass:
Mon., Wed., Sat.7:00 p.m. 
Sunday Masses 8:00 a.m.

10:00 a.m. 
Holy Day Masses7:00 a.m.

7:00 p.m.

Hope Lutheran Chnrch
A. B. Wagner, Pastor 

Sunday School 10:20 a.m. 
Worship 11:00 a.m.
“The Lutheran Hour” 6:30 
p.m. Sunday on radio 
KGKL, 950. “This Is The 
Life”  8:00 a.m . Sundays 
on KCTV, Channel 8

The Chnrch Of The 
Good Shepherd 

Preshyterian U.S.
Jim Miles

Sunday
Study Qass 10:00 a.m.
Fellowship 10:45 a.m.
Worship 11:00 a.m.
Wednesday
Bible Classes 3 & 4 p.m.

Dip into hot caramel sauce; 
turn until coated. Scrape off 
excess sauce from bottom of 
apples. Place on greased waxed 
paper; chill until firm. Keep in 
a cool place.

Variation: Before chilling ap­
ples, roll in crisp rice cereal 
or dot with Kraft miniature 
marshmallows, cut in halt.
Confetti Mallow Popcorn Balls
4 cups Kraft miniature 

marshmallows 
Vz cup Parkay margarine 
Vz teaspoon vanilla 
14 teaspoon salt 
3 quarts unsalted popped 

corn
1 cup chopped gum drops

Melt marshmallows with mar­
garine in saucepan over low 
heat; stir occasionally until 
smooth. Stir in vanilla and salt. 
Pour mixture over combined 
popped corn and gum drops; 
toss lightly until well coated. 
With hands slightly moistened 
with water, shape into ltd-inch 
balls; place on greased baking 
sheet.
3 dozen balls

For more information and 
other mouthwatering recipes 
featuring caramels and apples 
send for a free brochure entitled 
“Sweet Surprises from Caramels 
and Apples.” Write, Caramel 
Apple Recipes; Box 6768; Chi­
cago, Illinois 60677.

if it’s living 
'you want 

most

if you’re feeling 
very well

have a 
checkup 

) yearly

or if you’re feeling 
queerly

Many cancers can be cured 
if detected in time. That’s 
why it’s important for you 
to have a thorough health 
checkup each and every year 
...no matter how well you 
may feel.

AMERICAN CANCER SOCIETY

KVk -k -k ic ic -k • k ' k - k ' k - k i r - k - k - k ' k - k - k - k ' k i k -

WEDNESDAY. OCT. 8
KING SIZE 
W illEI 
CREATIVE 

COLOR 
PORTRAITS 
FOR ONLY

f o r
G R O U P S

Gfl PICIUHS MIDI OF CUNDPl, 
CUHDHl, DID. MOM AND A lt IHF 

t in u  OXH AT IHUE SAMI LOW PtICES!

SHUGART 
C # 1 > 0  

PHOTOS ^

M itch's Sonora Foods
105 East Main

A S K
About Our

THE DECLARATION OF INDEPENDENCE CONIES
,A L IV E~T h is  18-foot reproduction of Independence Hall is 
one of the highlights of the 1975 State Fair Food and Fiber 
Pavilion, according to Agriculture Commissioner John C. 
White. Visitors to the Pavilion can see George Washington 
presiding over the 1787 Federal Convention in the 
audio-visual diorama. Another diorama depicts the drafting 
of the Declaration of Independence. The State Fair will be 
held October 3-19.

Food and Fiber Pavilion 
Observes Bicentennial

AUSTIN-A sock knitting 
machine, a chance to win 
$25 worth of Texas beef, a 
replica of a frontier tiading 
post, and free brochures and 
recipe booklets are only a 
few of the attractions 
awaiting visitors to the 1975 
State Fair Food and Fiber 
Pavilion.

This year’s Fair, to be 
held October 3-19, will 
commemorate the American 
Bicentennial. This theme will 
be carried out at the Pavilion 
with red, white and blue 
decorations and exhibits 
em phasizing  agricultural 
highlights of the past 200 
y e a r s .  A g r i c u l t u r e

GIRL SCOUT NEWS 
By Clalene Stewart

We met at the Scout Hut at 
4:00 September 29, 1975. We 
wrote get-well cards to Mrs. 
Halford. Refreshments were 
brought by Clalene Stewart 
and Debra Maldonado. 
Leaders names are Mrs. 
Tinney and Mrs. Clawson.

BROWNIE NEWS 
By Rebecca Powers

Brownie Girl Scout Troop 8 
met Tuesday with ten girls 
present. We discussed our 
campout to be held October 4 
and 5 at the Scout Hall. 
Velma and Connie served 
refreshments at the meeting 
and we played games. Mrs. 
Glenna Hulsey is our leader.

Peach Harvest 
Shows Decline; 
Freeze Blamed

AUSTIN-Harvest of the 
1975 Texas peach crop is 
complete and production is 
expected to drop to only 
313,000 bushels as a result 
of a late freeze that hit much 
of the state in March, 
Agriculture Commissioner 
John C. White said.

“This compares with a 
harvest of 375,000 bushels 
last year. In good years, 
production usually averages 
b e tw een  5 0 0 ,0 0 0  and 
7 00,000 bushels,” White 
noted.

Most o f th is year’s 
peaches came from the Hill 
C o u n try , where peaches 
sized well and were of good 
quality.

Peaches in North Texas 
and the High Plains were 
hardest hit by the freeze.

VS*®
GENERAL TIRES 

DEPENDABLE 

SAFE

R.S. Teaff 
Oil Company

FINA GASOLINE

Phone 387-2770 Sonora 
9«  • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • #

Commissioner John C. White 
said.

An 18-foot reproduction 
of Independence Hall, on 
loan from Time, Inc., will ’ 
c o n t a i n  an anim ated 
audio visual diorama of the 
Federal Convention of 1787 
and another diorama of the 
drafting of the Declaration 
of Independence.

Free food samples or 
recipes will be available at 
every booth.

BUSINESS
AND

PROFESSIONAL
DIRECTORY

HOUSE PAINTING 
Commercial Residential 

Raneh
FREE ESTIMATES 

Felipe “Tito” Vargas 
Cali 387-3205

Mario Duran 
Water Well Drilling 

and Clean Outs 
Phone 387-2752

SONORA

MELVIN GLASSCOCK 
SHELL STA'nON 

Phone 387-2669 

West U.S. 290 Sonora

TH E R E D  BARN 
BEAUTY SALON

Monday Thru Saturday 
8:00 A.M. To 5:30 P.M. 

Ph. 387-2671 
506 Bock Ave.

CUSTOM 
Carpet Draperies 

FREE ESTIMATES 
BROWN FURNITURE CO. 

Ozona, 392-2341

H & H FEED  
AND

TRUCKING COMPANY 
Call 387-2806 

Purina & Godboid Feeds

ENEDINA’S 
HAIR FASHIONS 
330 SW G<ozaIes 
Phone 387-3342 

Open Tuesday—Saturday

Sonora Flight Service

Instruction - Charter 
Rental - Hot Shot Service 

Robert Kelley 387-8324 
Sonora Airport 387-9927 

387-2061

TAN-DE BEAUTY SHOP 
Shar(Hi Kemp, Operator 
Becky Hard, Operator 

511 E . 2nd 387-2216

Tuesdays - Fridays

MERLE NORMAN 
COSMETICS 

Maxine Locklln, Consultant 
Bettye Stewart, Clerk 

Call for demonstrations



Bob Krueger's W eekly RepoH
Sometimes the actions 

taken by M embers of 
Congress are designed more 
for “ home consumption” and 
for how they hope actions will 
look to the ir constituents, 
ra ther that for genuine 
formation of national policy. 
The passage of a major 
energy bill (H.R. 7014) by the 
House of R epresentatives 
which it has been working on 
since July is an example of 
this attitude.

Although I have been 
working on this bill in

committee and on the Floor 
since February, I am frankly 
deeply disappointed with the 
final resu lt, and those who 
voted for many of its 
objectionable provisions and 
for final passage did so 
knowing that the bill cannot 
become law and is certain to 
be vetoed. They wanted, 
however, to be able to tell the 
people back home that the 
Congress had passed a major 
energy bill and then try to 
blame the President for 
vetoing it. It is the same

attitude of confrontation poli­
tics that many Members 
elected to Congress said they 
would try to avoid once they 
took office. But this attitude 
exists both in Congress and 
in the Administration in both 
Republican and Democrat 
parties and w herever it 
occurs, it does not, in my 
judgment, contribute to good 
national policy.

The part of the bill to 
which I take strong objection 
is the oil pricing provision. 
The Congress voted to pay 
producers five different prices 
ranging firom $5.25 to $12.50

ANGELO PORTABLE BUILDINGS
T A CK  ROOM  
PUMP HOUSE 
CABINS H E i

FARM STORAGE 
SEED BINS 
FEED BINS

Portable Offices

Many Sizes Available 
Custom Built 

Steel Buildings
CARPORTS

Durable all-aluminum or steel 
construction. Wide choice of 
exciting trim and fascia colors. 
Engineered for strength, depend­
ability and protection. Available 
in single or double, attached or 
free-standing models.

Ind iis iria l
Chain Link & Cedar Fences 

THE BEST IN  FENCING

Telephone Number 949-4653
SAN ANGELO FENCE COMPANY

3206 Sherwoodway 4052 Arden Rd.

for the same product. That 
kind of irrational approach 
seems to me indefensible and 
is certain to be vetoed. 
Nothing in the bill was done 
to decrease our heavy 
dependence on foreign im­
ports which now constitute 
about 40% of the oil we use. 
Were the bill to become law, 
it would make our nation 
weaker rather than stronger.

The bill gives the Federal 
Energy Administration power 
to require cities, states, and 
businesses to convert from 
the use of natural gas to oil 
or coal as a boiler fuel to 
produce electricity. Ninety- 
five percent of the electricity 
in Texas is produced from 
natural gas.

The bill requires all cars 
produced in the country by 
1985 to average 28 miles per 
gallon in country and city 
driving. Such a provision is 
clearly unrealistic. On the 
floor of the House, some of 
the proponents of that 
provision argued tha t cars 
producing 28 miles per gallon 
already exist. I, in tu rn , 
pointed out that they them­
selves did not choose to buy 
them and drive them and I 
couldn’t see why they would 
require the American people 
to buy cars which they 
themselves were unwilling to 
buy.

The list could go on, but 
the pattern  is clear. Some­
times Members of Congress, 
like any other group, get 
tired and, in their fatigue, are 
willing to support almost any 
sort of policy just so they can 
report to others tha t they 
have “ done something.” In 
this case, the balance of 
power which our Constitution 
wisely set up will have to be 
exercised by the Executive 
Branch when the bill is 
vetoed. After tha t, perhaps 
there will be a possibility of 
compromise by the majority 
of the Congress and the 
Executive that will lead to an 
intelligent policy for the 
nation. I hope so, and will 
continue to retain  my 
optimism because of the long 
tradition of good government 
in America and because of 
my confidence in the basic 
good sense of the American 
people.

\o < ^

One Year, In Sutton County $5.00

One Year, Out Of County $6.30 (Including tax)

One Year, Out Of State $6.85 (Including lax)

Nine M m fh Student Subscription $5.25 (including lax)

Send Check or Money Order to:

FHE DEVIL'S RIVER NEWS 
220 N E MAIN 

SONORA, TEXAS 76950

LXI] i S
Published in Sonata. Texas • *‘The Capita! af the Staektnaa's Paradise*'
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Daini 
Queen

Tburs. 
Oct. 2

Erl. 
Oct. 3

Sat.
O cl.4

Sun. 
Oct. 5

Belt-Busters
99c

Coffee
Free

(No Thermos Please)

D.Q. Frisbee 45c
(Last Week To Get This)

MENU

BelfBusters 
w ith cheese 

HungrBusler 
Cheeseburger 
Chillburger 
Chili Dog 
Hot Dog 
Corn Dog 
Ham Sand.
Ham & Cheese Sand. 
GnTled Cheese 
D. 0 . Dude 
Fish Sand.

$1.05
$ U 0

75<
85<
85<
50«
40«
50«
85«
99«
55«
90«

Malts, Shakes & Freezes 59«

90«
Tacos 50« or 3 fo r $1.45 
Burriios (ch ill & cheese) 75«
French Fries 40« & 80«
Onion Rings 50« & 99«

BASKET ORDERS

Steak Finger Bskts. $1.50
FisbBskls. $1.50
Shrimp Bskl. $2.49

Floats 50«
Sundaes (AH flaven ) 37« & 53«
Parfays 80«
Fiesta Sundaes 80«
Banana Spills 80«
Plain Cones 20«& 35«
Dipped Cones 25«& 40«
D illy  Bars, D.Q. Sand. ,Choc.

Bananas 20«
Buster Bars 35«
D.Q. Quarts $1.09
D.Q Pint 59«
Sundae Supreme 89«
Ice Tea 20« & 35«
Coffee 15«
M ilk 20« & 35«

DRINKS

Coke
Dr. Pepper 

Sprite 
Reel Beer 

20« -  30« - 50«

CALL FOR ORDERS TO GO
387-2118

Dairy Queen
Frank Porras, Mgr.

Open 7 Days A Week

10 A.M. To 10 P.M. Daily 

10 A.M. To 11:30 Fri. & Sal.

Daini 
Queen



' Ì  tO T C

Ruth Shurfey Jewelry -  O FFHUM W ÉNtÊ

e m A TE S T STORE-WIDE S A IE  IN OUR 1

Lady’s 14K White Gold

D IA M O N D  
S O LIT A IR E

2.21 Ct. Good Color,] 
Good Cutting, imp. 
Truly a Beautiful 
Fiery Stone

$ 3 4 9 5
0 0

w

Man’s

D IA M O N D
R IN G

1.45 Carat 
14K YeUow Gold

S 1 9 9 9 0 0

D IA M O N D
e a r r in g s

Reg. $140.00 .15 ct. T.W. - Sale $79.50 
Reg. $175.00 . 25ct. T. W. - Sale $99.50
Reg. $350.00 .45ct. T.W. - Sale $199.50
Reg. $495.00 .64ct. T.W. - Sale $295.50
Reg. $550.00 .82ct. T.W. - Sale $329.50

S T A IN LE S S  
S TE E L

T ^ Q u e e n ’s Fancy”

Marqnise Diamond

W E D D IN G
SET

14K White Gold 
Was $1025.00

26-Diamond-3 Carat

D IN N E R
R IN G

14K White Gold 
Was $2650.00

Lady’s Diamond & 
Genuine Sapphire

D IN N E R
R IN G

1.17 Ct. Total Gem Wt. 
Was $995.00

Man’s .50 ct.

D IA M O N D
R IN G

14K Yellow Gold 
Was $550.00

Fine Qnality - 1 carat

D IA M O N D
W E D D IN G

B A N D
18K WUte Gold 

Was $995.00

^ H 2 5  Diamond - 3 Carat T.W.

1  D IN N E R 1 12 Gen. Sapph. & 
4-Diamond

1  R IN G UNDE STAR RING
m  14K W hite Gold

i
1 14K WUte Gold

0  Was $1950.00 Was $329.95

R „_ s iw o ,o o $199.50,

Lady’s
1.50 Carat - 2 row

W E D D IN G
B A N D

14K White Gold 
Keg. $1350.00

f . .

10 Diamond Set

IWEDDING BANDS!
2 Tone Gold 
Reg. $325.00

J188 .00

L a d y ’s

D IA M O N D
S O LIT A IR E

14K White Gold 
Was $1100.00

Lady’s Gnster

D IA M O N D
P E N D A N T

14K WUte Gold 
Was $427.50

$

... ,$W A8
® .................... r .

Men’s Genuine Leather

m o c k  A LLIG A TO R ] 
B ILLF O LD S

$ A 9 9

1

3 Piece

W E D D IN G
SET

14K YeUow Gold 
Reg. $465.00

= J 1 6 $ j|

Entire Stock —  Plain and Carved

Bands to V2 Off

1.92 Carat

M A R Q U IS E
D IA M O N D

R IN G
14K WUte Gold 
Reg. $3250.00

11
Complete Stock

STERLING SILVER
. . , a c e  * « £ £ 0  a  B A R T O N

D ^ o w i - E  • i n t e r n a t i o n a l .

50% to  15% Oft
^ P a t t e r n ^ ^ l ^

9i
.96 Carat I

PEAR  S H APE
f ' Ä

D IA M O N D
R IN G

^ A i l C  \ A / K U a

Reg. $2295.00

»»«■a—

ROYAL DOULTON CHINA
“Etude” “Pastorale’

“ Rondelay”
20 Pc. Ser. For 4 
Reg. $120.00................. $59A8

Norllake China
“ Up-sa-Dalsy”

$119.90
LARGE GROUP CHINA*

ODDS & ENDS 75% OFF

’Blue Moon”
45 Pc. Ser. 8 
Reg. $200.00.

Ruth Shurley Se
: I would like to take tUs oi 
 ̂ new partner and store ma 

^  celebrate this event we
fJIHF $200,000.00 STOCK REDE 

the years this store has at

on a poUcy of fair, forthright and honest dealings ' 
30%-40%-50%...even on DIAMONDS-WATCHES-^G 
promises to be the greatest sale ever held In tUs enti 
future gift giving occasions....Be at our door when i l  
beautiful GIFT ABSOLUTELY FREE.

SALE 
10 A.M. THURS

OPEN 7119 P.M. 1 
FRIDAY AND SATUR

FREE GIFT  
Com e Early  

N o  P u rch ase  
N e ce ssa ry !

FREE GIFTS FC 
PEOPLE THURSI

Save 30%-40%-5a!
DIAMONDS - WA

■ Ij

I

Buy Now On layav 
And All Future Gift

[Greatest Store^Wide

I

STORE- W IDE SALE 
STARTS 10 A.M. 

THURSDAY M O R N IN G
OPEN H L  9 P.M. THURSDAY EVENING. 

FRIDAY AND SATURDAY 10 A.M. TO 6 P.M.

Complete 

neck 

BELEEK

Va Off
204 Eai 

Oowntein

. i - .



N

Sonora. T e x a«  T h r

ré m

'^t-y ->ríí
■ ■.■ .-.■ I •..” .. .f.f Í ., i

v:

REDEEM THIS 
VALUABLE COUPON

Salurday, October 4lh
AND

RECEIVE A FREE GIFT

I

, ^
i- iirJlity to introduce my 

r, Mr. J. T. HIU...T0 
having a fabulons 

)N jSALE. Throughout 
continue to operate

leach and every customer. Boy now and save 
[¿This $200,000.00 STOCK REDUCTION SALE 
iBa...Bny now on layaway for Christmas and all 
life starts THURSDAY MORNING and receive a

TARTS
Y MORNING

SDAY EVENING. 
lY 10 A.M. TO 6 P.M.

ACT NOW!
You Must Save On 
Every Purchase!

FIRST 500 
Y MORNING

Even More On
HES - GIFTS

ly For Christmas 
iving Occasions!

ale In Our History

uriey
lin

BankAmericard

•••

LADY'S 4-DIAMOND WATCH 
14K W hile Gold Butova

-  NO OBLIGATION -
Will be given away on last day of our big sale.

(No Purchase Necessary)
YOU DO NOT H AVE TO BE PRESENT TO WIN! 
Register each time you are incur store during the salel

Bulova —  Seiko -
&  O THER FAM O U S BR AN D S

Wyler
Ladies' &

Men's

WATCHES
UP TO

%
OFF

With Trade

m a n y  watches t o
CHOOSE FROM

I '

Man’s 23 Jewel

Day-Dale
BULOVA
W AKH

Expansion Band 
Reg. $85.00

Lady’s 17 Jewel

S E IK O
BR AC ELET

W ATCH
Reg. $95.00

With Trade With Trade

Man’s 17 Jewel

W yler 
CALENDAR 

> WATCH
Yellow Expansion Band 
Reg. $69.50

$37.70 With Trade

Man’s 23 Jewel

SEIKO
WATCH
Handsome Mesh Band 

Reg. $120.00

Men’s •

DIGITAL 
WATCHES

' Calendar M odel 
Push Button, Spacej 
A ge  Timekeeping
Reg. $125.00

Man’s 17 Jewel

BULOVA
W AKH
Self-winding 
Bracelet Band

Reg. $75.00

With Trade

Lowest A  
Price *  I 
Ever 44.40 with trade

■ c i
4 4

50 WATCHES AND 
2 DIAMDND RINGS
H ave B e e n  P la c e d  In  O u r 

M y s te ry  B o xe s
DDN'T MISS DUT -  

SHDP THIS
GREAT SALE!

>x-: -

v̂ v-̂ wv '   ̂ * * * - . * ^ :

s « . d e iw „ c h

“  3 5 %  o W

Ĵ 's Zodiac

i ^ I I  ■ Leather

billfolds
S5.00 Value.. ’5^*99

Man’s 17 Jewel
S E IK O  

N A V IG A TO R  
W A T C H

Selfwinding Calendar 
Was S95.00 

$ 4 7 . 5 0  With trade

Lady’s 17 Jewel
GIR AR D

P E R R EG A U X
W A TC H

14K White or Yellow 
Reg. $125.00 

S 5 9 . 9 0  with trade

Man’s

TUNING-FORK
ELECTRIC

WATCH
Day-Date Model 
Reg. $185.00

with trade

Lady’s 17 Jewel

SEIKO
BRACELET

WATCH
selfwinding calendar 

*eg. $145.00
4 7 9 . 5 0  with trade

lA L

FEATURE
.« » J O

BINOCULARS
t « 9 . 8 8  :

'''V' Wii-s'" With Case,:;

B AR G AIN
COMPIUETE STOCK

PIERCED . , ,  
EARRINGS 1 /3  W r

HELD BACK!
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l u n n i ^ n D S
For Sale

TEN ACRE residential tracts, 
five and ten acre commercial 
tracts. Five miles north of 
town. 29 percent down, terms 
available. Call 387-2524. tf4

3 bedroom house, storage 
shed. Freshly painted inside. 
2t0 Hudspeth. Call 387-2965.
_________________________m

Richline 14 foot fiberglass 
boat with 40 h .p . Evlnrude 
motor. Motor Guide trolling 
motor on front, and trailer. 
Call 387-3270 or 387-2303.

tf4

5 to 18 acre plots adjacent to 
city limits. Call 387-2524. tf4
Football season and no mum 
again? Tell Dad, tell Mom,
tdll you beau__ Saunders
Flowers has ’em. Drop a
h in t__Saunders does the
rest. Ic5

Two half Simmental bull 
calves and one half Chianina. 
Call Jim Cahill, 387-2947. 2c4

Good buy. 1972 Schwinn, 5 
speed bicycle. Front suspen­
sion, rear shocks, disc 
brakes. Call 387-2775. Ic5

For Sale
JUST ARRIVED! I Ivy! Ivy! 
Ivy! 150 pots. Also, new 
fluffy-ruffle fern. All types of 
green plants. W e’re full 
up....come take some off our 
hands. Saunders Flowers. 
387-2554._______________ 1 ^

2 bedroom, 2 bath home. 
Brickstone construction and 
large den. Lot 75’x l40 ’. 
Located 206 S.W. Chestnut 
S treet. Contact Doyle Mor- 
gan. 387-2676._________ 2c52

2 underground gas tanks to 
be dug up. Cheap. Call 
387-3046. Ic5
1973 V-8 jeep . Canvas top 
and doors, power steering, 
radio, heavy suspension, 
good condition. $3,600. 
655-3378, San Angelo, Texas 

lp5

14x65 2 bedroom, 1 bath 
mobile home. 1971 model. 
Call 387-2309. Ic5

Hogs’ heads for sale. Call 
Mat Adams, 387-2462. Ic5

2 bedroom house for sale. 
Furnished or unfurnished. 
Call 387-2436 after 5 p.m. 4c5

STARTING THURSDAY  

At

The Hurry Up 

A ll Beef Hamburgen

Come By And Try One

For Orders To Go 

Call 387-3314

St. Ann's 
Aulumn Carnival

SHOW S - RIDES - CONCESSIONS  

Sonora Park Assn. Race Track

Starling Thursday, October 2 
and

Continuing Througb W eekend

J L . . ,  I l  m «.:

Makeyoiip mobile home 
more livable.

At a price that’s easy to live with.
Add stylish dimension to your 

mobile home. Install the Howmet line 
of mobile home accessories.

For instance, a Howmet carport 
gives protection with built-in beauty. 
And Howmet skirting eliminates 
unsightly understructure, turns 
wasted areas into extra sheltered 
storage space.

Howmet awnings protect your 
windows and keep your home interior 
cooler. Howmet railings add elegance 
to your patio or entranceway.

Now add a Howmet patio cover. 
With ornamental columns. Maybe 
even translucent panels. You've 
added an extra "garden room”, more 
family living space outdoors.

Howmet. The finest quality and 
largest selection in mobile home 
accessories, all specially designed to 
f it  the clean lines of today's mobile 
homes. Let us help you make your 
mobile home more livable. At a price 
that's easy to live with.

Call us today for a free estimate.

M O B IL E  H O M E  SERVICES

ANCHORING, SKIRTING, 

PATIO COVERS

MENARD LUMBER CO., IN C  
P. O. BOX 888 

MENARD, TEXAS 76859 
(915)396-4567

NIGHT PHONES 
(915)396-4352 
(915)396-2353 
(915)396-2261

For Sale
3 bedroom, 2 bath , fully 
carpeted and paneled home. 
Large pecan trees and nice 
fenced back yard. Located 
near school. Shown by 
appointment only. Call 8 to 5, 
512-257-5088; or after 5 p.m., 
512-367-2356, Kerrville. 4c5

Macramè hanging pots and 
lam ps. Call or see Pam 
Wilson, 106 Dollie, 387-3267.

Ic5

Carl Pool products at Saun­
ders Flowers. Potting soil, 
20-80 lb. bags. Also many 
types plant food. Call 
Saunders, 387-2554. Ic5

Livestock For Sale
Make your choice early! 
Coming 2-year-old registered 
Angus bulls. JUNO RANCH 
COMPANY, Frank Fish. Call 
JY4-6804. tf4

Garage Sale
Friday - Sunday. Hair dryer, 
record player, ironing board, 
clothing. 312 Lorene lc5

Curtains, bedspreads, miscel­
laneous. Thursday and Fri­
day. 206 Ben Juarez St. Ic5

701 W ater Ave. W esting- 
house electric stove. Singer 
sewing machine. Royal type­
w riter, double dresser, 
clothes, games and m iscel­
laneous items. 9-6 Thursday, 
Friday, Saturday. IcS

Yard sale. 1205 Tayloe. 
Friday and Saturday. 9 until 
dark. Ip5

Business Services
BE gentle, be kind, to that 
expensive carpet, clean it 
with Blue Lustre. Rent 
electric sh an^ooer $1.
White’s Auto Store. Ic

FOR EXPERT HELP and 
quality home furnishings, see 
the friendly folks at BROWN 
FURNITURE COMPANY in 
Ozona. We have “ everything 
for your home’’. tf4

STA-PUT CARPET Company. 
1110 Avenue E, Ozona, Free 
estimates and measurements.

tf4

Help Wanted
Need weekday maid Mon­

days th ru  Fridays. Apply 
mornings. Western Motel. tf4

Cashier. 4-11 p .m ., 6 days 
per week. Apply in person at 
the Hurry-Up. Experience 
preferred but not necessary.

Ic5

Cook. Experience preferred 
but not necessary. Apply in 
person at Park Inn Cafe. tfc5

W anted
Park Lane Jewelry needs 3 
ladies to show line of costume 
jewelry. No investment. Call 
915-392-3092 after 5 :30 p.m.

4c2

For Sale
FOR SALE

NEW 2 and 3 bedroom 
homes irom 1,000 to 1,700 
square feet of floor space, 
built under city inspec­
tions.
IVi or 2 full baths with 
ceramic tile showers and 
dressing tab les. Large 
kitchen-family room com­
binations. Lots of cabinets 
and snack bar. Built-in 
dishwasher and range with 
hood. Utility rooms or 
areas. All gas or all 
electric. Central heating. 
Fully carpeted with win­
dow drapes installed. 
Completely finished and 
delivered to any place in 
W est Texas Area $12.75 
per square foot. Can also 
brick all or part if desired 
and include refrigerated  
air all as an extra.

We invite you to come and 
look at what we have to 
offer. We have been in 
this business for over 20 
years and guarantee satif- 
faction.
Call CRAIG HARDEGREE 
Barley Lumber Company 

San Angelo, Texas 
655-3127

Public
Notice

OTA'nON BY 
PUBUCATION 

THE STATE OF TEXAS 
TO: LEE GAUNA, Defen­

dant, Greeting:
YOU [AND EACH OF 

YOU] ARE HEREBY COM­
MANDED to appear before 
the D istrict Coart 112th of 
Sutton County at the court­
house thereof, in Sonora, 
Texas, by filing a written 
answer at or before 10 o’clock 
A. M. of the first Monday 
next after the expiration of 
forty-two days from the date 
of the issuance of this 
citation, same being the 22nd 
day of September A.D. 1975, 
to Piaintiff’s Petition filed in 
said court, on the 22nd day of 
September A.D. 1975, in this 
cause, numbered 1922 on the 
docket of .said court and 
styled IN THE INTEREST OF 
EDWARD GAUNA, A 
MINOR.

A brief s ta tem ent of the 
nature of this su it is as 
foUows, to-wit: PETITION TO 
CHANGE NAME OF MINOR 

If this citation is not served 
within ninety days after the 
date of its issuance, it shall 
be returned unserved.

The officer executing this 
writ shall promptly serve the 
same according to requ ire­
m ents of law, and the 
mandates hereof, and make 
due returmas the iaw directs.

Witness, Erma Lee Turner, 
Cierk of the 112th D istrict 
Court[s] of Sutton County, 
Texas.

Issued and given under my 
hand and the seal of said 
court at Sonora, Texas this 
the 22nd day of Septem ber 
A.D. 1975.

Erma Lee 'Turner Clerk, 
112th District Court 

Sutton County, Texas. 
By Vivian Crites, Deputy.

4c4

A New Pharmacy 
Soon To Opon 

In Sonora

Bronco
Pharmacy

116 N.W. Concho

Joe KlowskI, R. Ph.

For Rent
TRAILER SPACES available.
Cahill-Young Park #2. Call
387-2524. itf4

Trailer spaces available in 
Eldorado. Call 853-2126,
Eldorado. 4p2

Notice
Anyone in terested  in doing 
student teaching in Ozona for
spring sem ester call
392-3471. 2c4

Reeling
ALL TYPES ROOF REPAIR 
and quality roofs. Kent Elliott
Roofing. 655-2800, San
Angelo, Texas. tf4

Brucellosis 
Regulations 
Still In Effect

AUSTIN-Texas Animal 
Health Commission (TAHC) 
officials are awaiting federal 
response to the commission’s 
re je c tio n  of p roposed  
changes in b ruce llo sis  
regulations.

“ TAHC’s vote applied 
only to proposed changes,’’ 
Dr. H. Q. Sibley, executive 
director of TAHC, said. 
“This decision does not 
mean that all brucellosis 
regulations are suspended in 
Texas.”

The brucellosis control 
program under which Texas 
has been operating is still in 
effect. Dr. Sibley stressed.

Federal response to the 
TAHC’s action may come at 
the United States Animal 
Health Association meeting 
in  P o r t l a n d ,  Oregon 
November 2-7.

The commission rejected 
by a 5-3 margin at a 
September 4 hearing the 
proposed changes which 
w o u l d  h a v e  b r o u g h t  
regulations on brucellosis in 
Texas up to the minimum 
standards set by the United 
S t a t e s  Depa r t ment  of  
Agriculture (USDA).

A possible result of the 
commission’s decision is that 
the USDA could refuse to 
recognize the status of 
bruceUosis-free counties in 
T e x a s  or  t he  s ta te ’s 
modified-certified status if 
Texas does not conform with 
national standards.

A l a r g e  crowd of 
cattlemen was present at the 
h e a r i n g  a n d  v o i c e d  
opposition to the proposed 
changes.

/WANTn 
A D S l  

 ̂A WORLD OF/ 
^ R E S U L T S ^

Fall Time Delights

1 6-oz. pkg. (1 cup) 
Sem i-Sweet Real 
Chocolate Morsels 

H cups unsifted flour 
54 teaspoon baking powder 
5Í teaspoon baking soda 
54 teaspoon salt

cup milk 
tablespoons butter 
teaspoon salt 
6-oz. pkg. (1 cup) 
Sem i-Sweet Real 
Chocolate Morsels

Chocolate Surprises
54 cup butter, softened  
54 cup sugar
J>4 cup sour cream  
1 teaspoon vanilla extract 

A bout 60 miniature 
marshmallows (about 54 cup)

Chocolate Frosting
1 teaspoon vanilla extract
2 cups sifted confectioners’ 

sugar

Preheat oven to 375°F. M elt over hot (not boiling) water 
N estle Sem i-Sweet Real Chocolate Morsels; remove from heat 
and set aside. In sm all bowl, combine flour, baking powder, 
baking soda and salt; set aside. In large bowl, combine butter 
and sugar; beat until creamy. B eat in egg. Add melted choco­
late, sour cream and vanilla extract; mix well. Blend in flour 
mixture. Drop by slightly rounded teaspoonfuls onto greased 
cookie sheets.

B A K E  at; 375°F. T IM E ; 8 minutes
Im m ediately push 1 miniature marshmallow into center oi 

each warm cookie. Cool completely; frost top of each cookie 
w ith Chocolate Frosting.

CHOCOLATE FRO STING : In small saucepan, combine 
milk, butter and salt. Bring just to a boil; remove from heat. 
Add N estle Sem i-Sweet Real Chocolate Morsels and vanilla 
extract; stir until morsels m elt and mixture is sm ooth. Transfer 
to sm all bowl. Add confectioners’ sugar, beat until smooth.

M akes about 5 dozen 2" cookies.
Butterscotch Covered Apples

1 6-oz. pkg. (1 cup) 2 tablespoons shortening
Butterscotch Morsels 154 teaspoons water

2 tablespoons corn syrup 4 apples 
Combine over hot (not boiling) water, N estlé Butterscotch'

Morsels, corn syrup, shortening and water; stir until morsels 
m elt and mixture is sm ooth. Place wooden stick in each apple. 
D ip apples, one at a time, into butterscotch mixture. Place 
on waxed paper. Chill in refrigerator a t least 15 minutes.

M akes 4 covered apples

ü: Lu:

iM R7erAM T$TCr
TOWARPS (Soot?

psycHoLoeicAL h ea lt h  i6
EATIN6 WELL. OEIEMTAU  

W ISPO M  MAS UAIG SEGOMMCMDEP 
A ROOT T E A  (jHOT A LEAF TEA 
UkiE WE ARE Osep To)CALLEP  
tSlHSEMG, A  WATURAL HERB  
RICH IN M INERALS . SUCH AS  
CALCIUM^ m a g n e s iu m  AND  
IBON^ A nP  IMPORTANT 

v it a m in s - SUCH AS B I  ANP B y -  
IT’S  CAREFOaV CULTIuaTEP IN 
RICH S O IL  FOR S IX  V EAR S, 
THEN PR O C ESSED  INTO AN 
APPET1ZIN& n u t r it io u s  
BEV ERA G E. FDR. A  FREE  
B o o k l e t ^ W k it e  t o  -• G inseng  
T E A  Co u n c il , S 6 i  t h ir d  A \jE y  
ROOM z c o o ,  new  y o a c jt i i . io o z z -

HAVE YOU

PAID YOUR SUBSCRIPTION??

iib & S H U G A R T  c o u p o n  bbb 
Milch 's Sonora Foods

105 East Main

WEDNESDAY, OCT. 8
9

WALLET SIZE 
COLOR PORTRAITS

99<t
A S K  * *

Î  Extra charge
. 8  X  1 0 /

**^2Z%** GROU PS
for

**************^ r.T.T.TT.T».T.T.T.T.Ä

SISTER JUANITA  
PALMIST - READER & ADVISOR  

Del Rio, Texas

Everyone welcome at Sister Juanita’s home. What you see 
with your eyes your heart will believe. Are you suffering? 
Do you need help? Do you have bad luck? Bring your 
problems to Sister Juanita today and be rid of them 
tomorrow. She advises on all affairs of life; there is no 
problem so great she can’t solve (how to hold your job when 
you have failed, and how to succeed, call your friends and 
enemies by name without asking you a single WOTd, and 
reunites the separated). Upon reaching womanhood she 
realized she had the Godgiven power to help humanity. Sister 
Juanita has devoted a lifetime to this work. From the four 
corners of the world they come to ha". Men and women of 
all races and walks of life. ’There is no pity for those knowing 
they are in hard luck and need help and do not come. For 
one visit will convince you. She gives lucky days and hands 
you out of sorrow and darkness and starts you on the way 
to success and happiness. Don’t fail to see this gifted wwnan 
who invites you to her home.
Del Rk), Tex. Ave. F (across from Wards) Look fw the Palm 
Sign in front of the house. Open daily & Sun. 7 a.m. - 
10 p.m. No appm’t needed.

Phone 512 - 775-9923

B lg -O "
Thealre

Ozona, Texas

Opens 7:30 P J i, 
Show Starts At Dusk

Thursday 
"Las Biboras 

Cambian De Piel" 
Jorge Rivero 

Pedro Armendariz

Friday & Saturday 
"The Night They 

Robbed Big Bertha"" 
(R )

Sunday & Monday 
"The Drowning Root"

Paul Newman
(PG)

Tuesday & Wednesday
""The Garden 

Of The Dead""

Tuesday Night 
Is Popcorn Night 

Buy One - Get One Free

Combinafion indoor & outdoor 
Drive In Movie

Concession Stand and 

Restaurant

'Biggest Little Theatre 
The World"

In

SALE
Plants

Stereos - Tapes 
Electrical Appliances

Winter and summer clothes for men, women and 
children

Assortment of toys, games, books,--̂  wall hangings, 
jewelry, macramè

A  few pieces of furniture and many other house­
hold items.

205 E. PECAN 
9 A.M. T IL  7 P.M.

SATURDAY & SUNDAY  
OCTOBER 4 & 5

WANTED
IMMEDIATE OPENINGS

Tram port Truck Drivers -  To Haul 

Propane Gas. Good Pay, A ll Com­

pany Benefits.
An Equal Opportunity Employer

CONTACT: MELTON MURFF 

H.N.G. PROPANE CO.

HI W AY 290 WEST

BIG GAME

HUNTING
Deer *  Elk *  Bear

•  EXPERIENCED GUIDES

•  HORSES - JEEPS

•  PACK-IN HUNTS

•  LODGING - D IN IN G  - LOUNGE

•  HOT SPRINGS POOL

For more information, write

Buddy Surles
Waunito Hot Springs Ranch 

Route 2, Box 56 

Gunnison, Colorado 81230 

l o a o o o c K K



Sonora Youth Center
Herimin Moore

GOSNEY'S
Famous Name Brands For Less

BRIHAIN
Construction Company

General Oilfield Gmstruction

Compliments of

Tim & Tommy Thorp

' N A T I O N A L  O A N K

Ktif r.O. lU  7fl SO IO It .lfM S  7W5«

- l

Divide Cable Corporation
Community Antenna

Barrow Jewelry & 
Sporting Goods
John and Dell Tedford 

Fine Jewelry —  Class Rings 
The Hunters' Headquarters

C.G. Morrison
Variety Store

Ken Braden Motor Co.
Chevrolet - Buick - Oldsmobile - Pontiac 

'The Dealership Where Service Is 
Standord Equipment"

FRENCH'S
Big Tree Restaurant

Fay & Leon Parks

O f 'J o - O o a R 1

\i

OPEN

10KX) - 6:00 

6 days a week 

Phone 387-2324

GulbRestaurant
Open 24 Hours

Thompson's Texaco 
Service Station

Bill & Gene Thompson, Mgrs.

The Devil's River News
Phone 387-2222 

Commercial Printing

■K

SONORA BRONCOS
VARSITY 1975

No. Name Pos. Wt. Class

5 Larry Finklea -------- ---- ----------------  E-CB 124

7 Will Wallace ---------------------  E-S 137

9 John Elliott ..... — ....................  QB-S 142

11 Hector Perez ------- ------ — .......—  QB-S 146

12 John David Cook ----------------- ----—  SE-CB 135

18 Craig Parker ........ — -----------------  WB-S 156

20 Frank Gallegos ------- -------— .......  - FB-E 161

21 Gregg Parker ------- -------------------- - E-E 150

23 Zeke Gamez ......   WB-CB 150

33 Garry Jones -----------------------------  FB-LB 167

40 Tony Mathews — .............   FB-LB 144

41 David Snodgrass - ------    TB-CB 151

50 Tom Valliant --------------------   C-T 192

52 Scott Brasher --------------------------   C-N  156

60 Johnny Creek ------------------------- —  G-LB 166

62 Jack Lawson ------------------    G-N 143

64 Steve Chandler ----------------------- —  G-N 138

65 Mark Hemphill ---------------- G-LB 141

66 Jimmy Black ------------------------------  G-T 181

70 Bo Carroll ----------------------------------  T-T 169

71 Clayton Wadley ---------------------------  T-T 172

72 Clay Hicks -  -   E-E 158

75 Larry Jones -------------------------------  T-LB 161

80 Robbie Herd --------------------  E-S 158

85 Jeff Doan ....................   E-CB 161

86 Mike Stokes .........    K 131

Coaches: Bill Bundy (head coach) - Roland Pfeiffer- 
Tommy Miller - Don Patton - Bob Snodgrass

Managers: Jeff Stokes, Tommy Mounce 

Drum Major: Gary Wuest

Twirlers: Lucy Morriss, Flaire Lane, Becky Cavaness, 
Jane Wallace, Joyce Noriega

Cheerleaders: Marsha Finklea, Cindy Favila, Janice 
Grider, Nancy Mooney, Abby Sanchez
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SONORA

BRONCOS

VS

ELDORADO

Friday, October 3 
Eldorado Stadium 

8dl0 P.M.

DATE

September 5

8:00 P. M.

Sonora 20 
Coleman 6

7:15 p.m. 4:30 - 5 :45 P. M.
8th Grade 7th Grade

September 11
Mertzon Varsity 12 
Sonora 0

September 11
Sonora 0 Sonora 18 
Ozona 0 Ozona 0

September 12
Sonora 6 
Junction 0 ,

September 13 Ozona COth) - Here

September 18
Sonora 22 
Big Lake 13

September 18
Big Lake 16 Sonora 22 
Sonora 0 Big Lake 12

September 19
Sonora 7 
Mason 0

September 25 Rocksprings - Here

September 26
Dilley 21 
Sonora 7

October 2 Ozona - There

October 2 Ozona - There

October 3 Eldorado -  There

October 4
(10:00 a. m .) 

Ozona ( 9h) - There

October 9 Rocksprings - There

October 9 

October 10

Mertzon - Here

Llano - Here

October 16 Ozona - Here

October 17 Crane - There

October 18 Lakeview - There

October 23 Big Lake - Here

October 23 Big Lake - Here

October 24 Ozona - Here

October 30 Ozona - Here

October 30 Ozona - Here

October 31 Big Lake - There

November 7 OPEN

November 13 ............. Crane - There

October 14 McCamey - Here

Twin Oaks Motel
Go "Big Red"

City of Sonora
Home Owned Water, Sewer & 

Electric Systems

Westerman Drug
Cecil Westerman Would Like To 

Be Your Pharmacist

The Dairy Mart
Joella & Charles Graves 

Invite You To
FAMILY D IN IN G  &  FAMILY FUN

Carl J. Cahill. Inc.
Dirt Contrae...

Devil's River Motel
Phone 387-3516

EAGLES

OPENING SOON

Bronco Pharmacy
Joe Kiowski

r
San Angelo Savings 

Association
EQUAL HOUSING "A ll The Way Broncos" 
L E N D E R

ruojtps.
" IM / N - D K Y

Neville's Dept. Store
Cooper & Neville 

Compliments of

FOOD CENTER, INC.

White's Auto Store
Home Decor Headquarters 

Carpet, Custom Made Draperies & 
Armstrong Floor Coverings 

Free Estimates

r
The Ruth Shurley Jewelry

John Roberts Class Rings

H-

Hurry-Up
Restaurant & Grocery
"Home of the Bronco Burger"

Lerendo Well Servicing Co.
Swobbing Units 
Phone 387-3502 

LE. Brookover, Owner
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1 100 Lb. Pig
2 Four Steak Dinners
3 German Choc. Cake
4 Sweater and Cap
5 Goat
6 $10 Gift Certificate
7 Gun Case
8 Case Beer
9 Kant Slide Griddle
10 Goat
11 Rabies, Distemper Shot
12 Smoked Turkey
13 Orange Nut Cake
14 Case Anti-Freeze
15 Goat
16 Room Night of Fling Ding Western Motel
17 6:50x16 Tire Big Boy’s Shamrock
18 Revson Make-up Westerman Drug
19 Beef & Beer The Chapparal
20 Goat J-F Ranch
21 Wash, Grpase, Oil Change Thompson Texaco

Lions
Jessie Barton 
Big Tree Restaurant 
Mrs. Alvis Johnson 
Ann Herrmann 
Willie Miers
Merle Norman Cosmetics 
Barrow Jewelry 
Chavarria Grocery 
West Texas Utilities 
Herbert Fields 
Veterinary Clinic 
Branding Iron Smokehouse 
Mrs. Hershai Davenport 
John’s Chevron 
Willie Miers

22 5th Old Charter
23 Loaf Bread 
23B Cherub 
23C Book
24 Humming Bird Feeder
25 Goat
26 Windmill Leather Job
27 Cured Ham 16#
28 Flower Arrangement
29 High Intensity Lamp
30 Lamb
31 3 Mo. Cable TV
32 Stetson Hat 7 3/8
33 Pecan Pralines
34 Gun Rack
35 Goat
36 Four Passes
37 Air Conditioner Ehimp
38 Automatic Wood Heater
39 4 rolls roofing
40 Goat
41 Dinner for 4
42 Golf Bag

Pat’s Pkg. Store 
Annabelle Wuest 
Mrs. C. W. West 
Lem Jones
Bill & Ruth Shepherd 
Willie Miers 
Thorp’s Well Service 
Modem Way Grocery 
Sonora Floral & Gifts 
Sonora Electric 
George Wallace 
Divide Cable Corp. 
Gosney’s
Mabel Vander Stucken 
Sonora Wool & Mohair 
Willie Miers 
Caverns of Sonora 
Sonora Heating & Cooling 
Hank Hull Butane 
Kent Elliott Roofing 
Jessie G. Barton 
Holiday Host Buffet 
White’s Auto Store

Hunters' Special
3 days only

THURSDAY - FRIDAY - SATURDAY

WmCHESIlR 
DOVE & QUAIL LOAD

20 ga. - $2.45
12 ga. - $3.25
sale limited to stock on hand 

John & Dell Tedford

Auction Sole Results
Aliie Askew 
Nathan’s 
Walter Pope 
L. P. Bloodworth 
Neville’s Dept. Store 
Jo Hardgrave 
Mrs. Haynie Davis 
Don Lawson 
Martha Wallace 
Mary L. Shurley 
Lea Roy Aldwell 
Mabel VanderStucken 
Alice Jones 
Bob Nevill 
Howard Const. Co. 
Loise Fields 
Cliff Johnson 
Nathan’s Jewelry 
Gene Wallace 
Robert Halbert 
Martha Wallace 
Lea Roy Aldwell 
Bill Saveli 
General Telephone 
Walter Pope 
Mrs. Ben Cusenbary 
Joseph VanderStucken 
Collier Shurley 
Ben Cusenbary 
Mabel VanderStucken 
Gene Wallace 
First National Bank 
Bob Hardgrave 
Nathan’s 
Twin Oaks Motel 
Ruth Shurley 
Rex Cusenbary 
Haynie Davis 
Eddie Smith 
Reliable Equip. Co. 
Eddie Smith 
Martha Wallace 
Mabel VanderStucken 
Walter Pope 

I

Complete

INSURANCE SERVICE
RESIDENTIAL COMMERCIAL 

INDUSTRIAL

ALL TYPES OF INSURANCE  

Fire • Travel - Bonds - Casualty - Livestock - Auto

WEB ELUOn AGENCY
209 E. Main Sonora, Texas

AUSTIN-According to 
the September crop report 
released recently, Texas 
co t t o n  p r oduc t i on  has 
dropped almost 75,000 bales 
while pecan production is 
expected to increase by 20 
million pounds over last 
y e a r’s crop, Agriculture 
Commissioner John C. White 
said.

C o t t o n  p r o d u c t i o n ,  
estimated at 3.1 million 
bales, decreased because of 
weather and insect damage 
on the High and Low Plains. 
A yield of approximately 
3,025,000 bales is expected 
in 1975.

This year’s cotton crop 
still is almost 23 percent 
above the 2,462,000 bales 
ginned in 1974, which was 
one of the smallest crops in 
30 years. White noted.

The Texas pecan crop 
estimate reflects an increase 
of 53 percent over last year’s 
crop of only 38 million 
pounds.

Sweet potato production 
also increased from August 
and the crop currently is 
estimated at 950,000 pounds 
per hundredweight.

Estimates for most crops 
remained the same as for 
August. Corn remained a 
near-record crop at 115.5 
million bushels; wheat, 131.1 
million bushels; rice, almost 
24.9 million pounds per 
hundredw eight; sorghum, 
394.4 million bushels; and 
soybeans ,  9.1 mi l l ion 
bushels.

70.00 43 Box Divinity Candy Mrs. Alvis Johnson Pryce Taylor 90.00
30.00 44 Turkey Caller Barrow Jewelry Mrs. Fred Campbell 35.00
65.00 45 Goat Willie Miers Robert Halbert 75.00
35.00 46 Custom Made House Sign Joe Longoria Nancy Bloodworth 70.00
45.00 47 Chafing Dish Ruth Shurley Jewelry Rex Cusenbary 100.00
20.00 48 Case Oil Sonora Enterprise Lawrence Finklea 40.00

100.00 49 Bag Potting Soil Saunders Flower Shop Honey Hicks 30.00
25.00 50 Goat Bill Tittle Sonora Wool & Mohair 65.00
25.00 51 2 Mexican Dinners Gulf Restaurant Hemphill-Wells 25.00
50.00 52 Hunting Vest Neville’s Dept. Store Ruth Shurley 40.00
25.00 53 Cake Nadine Porter General Telephone 40.00
90.00 54 Case Beer Chuck Wagon Hemphill-Wells 25.00
45.00 55 Goat Willie Miers Nathans 75.00
45.00 56 1 Day Bulldozer Work Cahill, Inc. Mrs. Hattie Epps 240.00
75.00 56B 2 Gal. Anti-fi-eeze Glasscock Shell Lea Roy Aldwell 35.00
55.00 57 Practice Whistle Sonora Broncos Dr. Owensby 35.00
30.00 58
15.00 58 1/2 Gal. Vodka Tim’s Liquor Joe Bill Averitt 25.00
45.00 59 Jumper Cables Rogers Machine Shop Lea Roy Aldwell 70.00
45.00 60 Goat Bill Wade WTU 80.00
55.00 61 Two Shrimp Dinners Dairy Queen Rev. Paul Terry 20.00
40.00 62 Revson Make-up Westerman Drug Bobby Granger 25.00
60.00 63 1 Qt. Shelled Pecans Mrs. Alvis Johnson Dorothy Pope 70.00
20.00 64 12” Float Reliable Equipment Co. Ben Cusenbary 30.00
60.00 65 Goat Harrison Ranch Producers Livestock Co 65.00
25.00 66 1 yr. spraying for 2 trees Saunders Spraying Service Branding Iron 60.00

110.00 67 Bonnet Barrow Jewelry L.P. Bloodworth 20.00
120.00 68 Tape Labeler Devil’s River News Ruth Shurley 25.00
100.00 69 Case Anti-freeze Teaff Oil Co. Lea Roy Aldwell 95.00
35.00 70 Goat Ben Cusenbary Joseph VanderStucken 80.00
20.00 71 1 passenger car fill-up Dairy Mart John Elliott 60.00

110.00 72 Ice Chest Pearl Beer Dist. Co. Bill Saveli 60.00
40.00 73 Loaf Bread Annabelle Wuest General Telephone 45.00
40.00 73B Currency ($20) Hemphill-Wells Bob Hardgrave 40.00

100.00 74 Cattle Spray H&H Feed Co. Collier Shurley 35.00
30.00 75 Goat Willie Miers Paschal Allison 75.00

105.00 76 $35 groc. certificate Foodway Howard Const. Co. 110.00
25.00 77 God’s Eye Mrs. Emma Hamilton Twin Oaks Motel 55.00
15.00 78 Diaper Stacker Melissa Teaff Doyle Morgan 30.00

160.00 79 Stetson Hat 6 7/8 Gosneys WTU 40.00
30.00 80 Goat Joe Nell Queen Sonora Wool & Mohair 75.00

105.00 81 2 Mexican Dinners Park Inn Lonnie Pollard 15.00
40.00 82 Case Oil Carroll Texaco Sonora Vet. Clinic 65.00
60.00 83 Pint Agarito Jelly Mrs. Alvis Johnson Mrs. Paschal Allison 45.00

84 Party Plates & Napkins Barrow Jewelry Mrs. Wes Granger 15.00"1 85 Goat Harrison Ranch Haynie Davis 65.00
86 Room Night of Fling Ding Devil’s River Motel Herbert Fields 55.00
87 Water Can Whitworth’s Drive Inn City of Sonora 50.00wn 88 Dutch Oven Sonora Wool & Mohair Leo Merrill 45.00

iport
89 Case Beer Glasscock Picknic Supply Lin Hicks 20.00
89B Dance Ticket for 2 Sonora Jay-Cees Joe David Ross 35.00
90 Goat Jim Cusenbary Joseph VanderStucken 60.00

i'AH/'i III'’
nil

Man Is — A creature who 
lives not upon bread alone, 
b u t pr incipal ly  by ca t ch­
words.

NOW AT

The Hurry Up
Dally Dinners

1 Meat, 2 Vegetables, Hot Rolls, Salad 

Tea or 0>ffee

To Go Or To Stay 

7 DAYS A  WEEK

Serving From 11:30 A.M. - 10 P.M.

TO BE CONTINUED

2 Tbsp. peanut butter 
2 Tbsp. jelly or Jam 
1 Tbsp. milk
1 pkg. refrigerated unbaked 

raisin cinnamon rolls

Q U IC K  C O FFE E  R ING

Combine peanut butter, jelly and milk. Separate rolls and spread one 
side of each roll generously with peanut butter mixture. On a lightly 
greased cookie sheet slightly overlap rolls, spread side up, to form a 
circle. Press rolls together lightly where they overlap. Bake in a 
preheated 375 degree oven for about 20 minutes. Frost with icing 
that is included in package. Serve hot.

MEXICO TAIWAN FRAMES 
Now In

EAGLE PASS, TEXAS

Wholesale Only - Not Open To Public
D ealers & Artists fiiat paint for resale. Only.
Located at Western edge of City lim its  on 277 West. 
Turn on Farm Rd. 1589 at blinker. Take first road 
right. Red Tile house on coiror. To com e later. Call 
fior appointment Jim mie Turpén, 773-9094.

CtRCLE BAR TRUCKING COMPANY

SPECIALIZED LIVESTOCK HAULING  

AN D  HEAVY EQUIPMENT

Bonded & insured 

24 Hr. Service 

Ozona, Texas

Day Pb. 392-3523 
Nighf Ph. 392-3004 or 392-3246

(Zoop HVTUtrioM  1$ CKX)p 
P#VCMoU?6V. A h ealtht  

P i e t  coNTeiBuTes to 
a l e r t n e s s , VITAUTV AWPA  

&OOP FPAME O F  AAIMP.THERE'S 
S O VU P  REASONING IN T H E  
PH RA SE  : A  MIWP IN
A  BO Py.' 1 ' -

c l u b  M E e T lH 6 S  ARE HELP 
AT yoUR HOUSE, AN EASy WAV 

TO BElWiSTHESESSliPW-IOAWeiOD 
IS TO SERVE THE MEMBERS TEA 
M>P A SHACK. HOT TEA CAM SOCHHE 
AWAY TEMFEP-S AMP TIEEPHESS AMD 
Ê MP THE MEETIIIG o n  A PLEASAMTHOre

A  L a n d  B a n k  
lo a n  a t w o rk
Once you’ve decided to 
make major improvements 
on rural property, ask your 
ocal Land Bank Association 
about long-term financing, 
-inding a better way to 
jorrow is as important as 
inding a better way to farm.

Long-term  
IMPROVEMENT 
LOANS at 
reasonable cost.

Santa Says

H's Ihal lim e of year again, the 
tim e when Christmas card manu­
facturers start sending out Christ­
mas card catalogues. There's a 
card here that expresses your 
exacf holiday wishes, whether 
they be of a trad itiona l or mod­
em  nature.

Choose from a catalogue by one of the following 
manufacturers:

*  Wesfern TradKion
*  Century
*  Masfeipiece
*  Grant

(executive, business and professionai)

Federal Land Bonk of 
Sonora

A. E. Prügel, Mgr. 
3S7-2777 Published in Sonora, Texes -  "The Capital o f the Stockman's Paradise"



FOOD CENTER INC
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4 -D a ^  S p e e ia ls !
Wed. 10-1-75 Thru Sat. 10-4-75

600 Crockett Ave. Soiwra, Texas 76950

Your Home Owned & Itome Operated Grocer

Pb. 387-3438
Store Hours Open 7:30 A.M. - Close 7dl0 P.M.
Coupon Check Books How Available For Your 
Shopping Convenience A t Food Center

W H O U  ONLY

Fryers J

Russet
Potatoes

10 Lb. Bag

59c lb
- ■

89c

Returnable Quart Bottles

Plus Deposit

M Vi Oz.

Schilling Taco Cassrole
Or

2114 Oz.

Schilling Tamale Pie

69c

~ ÌQQgVWaQOfìQOnOQOQonOfìQQQQQOOgQf

Schilling
VANÌLLA771

Big Boy ^51/2 Oz. Size

Dog Food 6/S1.00
5 Oz. Size

2 & 2 Verm icelli 7/S1.00
40t OFF LABEL 7° L®- 7 Oz.

Family Size Tide $4.22
Von Qimp ^  ^

U ghtM eal T u n O ^ M P f  2 / $ 1

1 LB. Package

32 Oz. Size

Stokelys Gatorade 49<
Cream Style or Whole Kernel

Stall Yellow CORK 3/$1.00
3 LB. 1 Oz. K X  OFF LABEL

Oxydol -  Giant Size $1.19
5 to 8 Doz. Per Pkg. 21 Oz. Pkg.

Allison's Assl. Cookies 99<
1814 Oz. Pkg.

Duncan Hines Cake Mixes . 59<
3 LB. Can

Minuet Shortening $ 1 i9
Quart Size

W agner Assl. D rin k s ............ 39<

Mountoin Pass
Casserole

Pinto 2 Tomato Sauce 
Beans for79c 6 for $1

Morning Star 
ProdiKfa

8 Oz. Breakfast Slices 

8 Oz. Breakfast Links

8 Oz. Breakhist Patties 
525 Oz. Breakfast Strips

99c Ea.

Dankworth 
Steak Fingers

9>/2 Oz.

Ea.99^

Dankworth 
Chopped Sirloin

PKS. of 2 8 9 ^

Fryers cut u p ............ LB. 63^
Fryers sp lit LB. 62^
Fryer Quarter Breast Quarter LB. 69<
Fryer Quarter . LB. 65<

12 oz. PKG. , , 0,

SwIH P r«n tun tB acon '*rr~ $4 ;39  

Beef Tripe Menudo . . LB. 39^
Swifts Premium

Cornish H ens............ e a ch $ 1 i9
14 Oz. PKG.

Mrs. PauTs Fish Slicks Each $1.29
Fresh Frozen

Rainbow T ro u t.......... I f i.  $1.69

9^

714 Oz. Can

1 LB.

I Schi"'"®

AUlHORIZtU  USDA 
fOOO STAMP 

RfDLMPTiÜN STORf

Schilling Mixes
M IX  OR M ATCH  

Brown Gravy Mix %  Oz. 

Taco Seasoning Mix 114 Oz. 

Spaghetti Sauce Mix 114 Oz. 

Chili Seasoning M ix 114 Oz.

Nabisco Salfine Crackers 59< 

25 Lb. Stafl Flour $3.99
Gerber 414 Oz. Size

Strained Baby Food 6/$1.00

P illsbury 
Cookies

18 Oz Sugar 
18 Oz. Oatmeal Raisin 
15 Oz. Butterscotch Nut 
18 Oz. Cinnamon Sugar
15 Oz. Peanut Butter
16 Oz. Chocolate Chip

^ each 99< _

S io r S I M en 's  #211 10 Oz. Size

Tomatoes
OHlfAlllf/lì̂ /ìonn 4 for $1

Uno tienda autorizada pora aceptar cupones 
U.S.O.A.en la compro de comestibles.

PRODUCE
BANANAS LB. 19^
TOMATQES LB. 49<

LEHUCE Head49<
CANTALOUPES LB. 19«
Thompson

Seedless GRAPES LB. 59«
TOKAY GRAPES LB. 39«
YELLOW ONIONS LB. 29«
COCONUTS Each 49«

P U R E  G R O U N D

BLACK PEPPER

4 Oz. Size 59c 5 LB. Bag

nxAS

Oranges

59c

à 0 S % u M

Biscuits
Butter Milk or Homestyie

8 Oz. Tube
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♦ ^ P o lic e  Reports*—
A two car accident on 

September 27 was investigat­
ed by City Policeman Joe 
Fincher. The accident occured 
in the Dairy Mart parking lot. 
Cars were driven by Randell 
E. Owen of Sonora and Dicky 
L. Schultz of Del Rio. No 
injuries were reported.

At 10:30 p.m. on that day, 
a call regarding a vehicle 
stolen from Mexico was 
investigated.

A disturbance on a 
Crockett S treet Bridge was 
investigated at approximately 
11:30 p.m . One subject 
involved in the disturbance 
suffered minor knife wounds 
but refused treatment at the 
local hospital.

On Septem ber 28 at 8:10 
a.m. ,  Elizabeth Goad of 
Castle Courts reported a 
missing purse. The purse was 
lost at a local service station 
and was turned over to the 
local police officer by service

station attendants.
On Monday afternoon 

Officer Fincher investigated 
an accident at the parking lot 
of a local liquor store. An 
auto, driven by Felipe Bernal, 
Jr., collided with a parked car 
belonging to D .P .S .'P a tro l­
man Walter Walicek.

Chief of Police Bill Webster 
investigated an attem pted 
burglary at an Edgemont 
residence.

A total of ten citations were 
issued during the past week.

In Hungary at one time only 
a man who had slain a Turk 
might wear a feather.

Cannot»
John & Dell Tedford

In keeping with our efforts to offer you only the 

very best in quality merchandise, we bring you 

H ALLM ARK  cards for Christmas.

The 7975 H ALLM ARK  collection is available in 

the store awaiting your pleasure.

* Imprinted or plain

•"Personal Touch" imprinted with your 
signature.

• Self-seal envelopes

When You Care Enough to Send the Very Best

-

The
Consum er
Alert

by John L. Hill 
Attorney General

AUSTIN—In previous col­
umns we’ve talked about prob­
lems people sometimes have 
when overuse or unwise use of 
credit have gotten them into a 
financial bind.

But what about those per­
sons who are on the other side 
of the fence—those who may 
have money problems because 
they cannot get credit?

Such persons, for various 
reasons, have been unable to 
obtain credit at all, and there­
fore must  pay cash for 
purchases or do without them.

Many times these people are 
young people, retirees, work­
ing women, or persons with a 
low income. The questions 
most often asked by such per­
sons are how they can build up 
a credit record if no one will 
grant them credit, and what it 
is that credit grantors look for 
when extending credit.

What many credit grantors 
look for is a steady income, 
prompt payment of bills, a 
regular savings record, and 
cautious use of credit.

Part of the answer to build­
ing up a credit record is realiz­
ing that special efforts may be 
needed if you cannot meet 
these standards.

If you are still in school, it 
may be a good idea to set up a 
savings account if you have a 
job. Later, apply for a loan 
using your savings account as 
collateral—and be sure to pay 
the note on time. This is one 
way to begin a good credit rat­
ing.

If you have recently joined 
the working world and are 
having difficulty establishing 
credit, contact the credit man­
ager of several department 
stores to see if they have 
special limited credit accounts. 
If so, apply for one, make 
some purchases on the ac­
count, and pay your bills

promptly. This is also a step 
toward a good credit record.

A retired person who plans 
to purchase on credit should 
apply for it while still em­
ployed, since it likely will be 
easier to get then than when 
retired. Or, plan to build up a 
savings account before retire­
ment to use as collateral for 
any loans that might be de­
sired in the future.

Women sometimes have 
had difficulty in obtaining 
credit, and if they are married, 
occasionally have been unable 
to get credit in their own 
name. However, under new 
federal laws soon to be in 
effect, women who meet other 
credit tests must be given 
equal consideration for credit. 
They can request that such 
credit be in their own names, 
if they are married and wish to 
do so.

Low-income people may 
also have more difficulty get­
ting credit. In some cases, it 
can be helpful to ask for credit 
at neighborhood stores where 
you trade regularly. If you 
have patronized a local dry 
cleaner for several months and 
have paid your bill on each 
trip, it may be a simple matter 
to ask that an account be 
opened in your name. After a 
period of using such credit and 
paying promptly, you can use 
this establishment, as a credit 
reference.

If you have problems ob­
taining credit, you may want 
to get special advice from a 
banker, a credit manager, a 
credit counselor, or other ex­
perts.

If you have other consumer 
complaints, get in touch with 
the Attorney General’s Con­
sumer Protection Division, 
your county or district attor­
ney, or your local Better Busi­
ness Bureau.

Sonora Motor Company
ANNOUNCES THE 1976 FORDS

WITH BUILT-IN QUALITY AND VALUE
DESIGNED FOR

TODAY’S  DEMANDING CAR BUYERS.
You could pay hundreds more for 
value features and luxury like this:
• Vinyl roof
• Hidden headlamps
• 351-cu, in. V-8
• SelectShift Cruise-O-Matic
• Power front disc brakes
• Power steering
• Front cornering lamps
• And more

October 2 & 3
REFRESHMENTS SERVED ALL DAY 

Come by and see the new Fords.

The closer you look, the better vte look.

^̂ 1̂ FORD Sonora Motor 
Company

Bronco Sideline Shots
By F .b Granger

This is the week of one of the great football rivalries in 
West Texas as the Broncos travel to Eldorado to battle the 
Eagles. The Eagles just came off a second win over 
Winters and will be ready for the Broncos. When these 
two clubs get together, you can throw past records out the 
window as it is played with a lot of emotion. At one time 
Eldorado held an 18 game winning streak over Sonora 
which was broken in 1946 or 1947; don’t remember which 
year. The longest winning streak since that time was a 10 
game streak Sonora started in 1963 and extended to 1973 
when the Eagles wrapped up a district championship.

***««**«***«
The Broncos have somewhat of a unique situation this 

year as there are two sets of twins on the club— Craig and 
Gregg Parker and Larry and Garry Jones. I have seen 
several ball clubs with one set of twins but don’t 
remembers seeing one with two.

]|e 9|( * * *
All Sonora teams will be in action this week. The 7th, 

8th and J.V. squads travel to Ozona Thursday to tangle 
with Ozona. Here’s hoping the 8th grade Colts can get 
their first win and the seventh grade can bag win no. 3. 
The J. V. will be looking for their second victory in three 
tries for the year.

i|: :|cik )|c rtok 4c
I would like to thank the cheerleaders for asking me to 

say a few words at the Pep Rally Friday. It was a fine Pep 
Rally. Just hope I wasn’t a jinx as the Broncos lost to 
Dilley. If at all possible, all citizens are urged to attend the 
Pep Rally this week. Really pack the gym and give the 
Broncos a boost. They are a great group of young men and 
your support at the Pep Rally would surely help their 
attitude.

:|( 4: ])(9ie« rte lie )|e sk 9k

Family Film  To Be Shown
TIME TO RUN, a film that 

is a mixture of problems and 
solutions, will be shown at 
First M ethodist Church at 
Sonora on Sunday, October 5 
beginning at 7 p.m., and at 
the Lutheran Church at 7:30 
p.m . on that date. The 
feature is filmed in Eastman- 
color by World Wide Pic­
tures.

Filmed on location in the 
Southern California area, 
TIME TO RUN stars Ed 
Nelson, Randall Carver, Bar­
bara Sigel, Joan Winmill and 
Gordon Rigsby.

Viewed on an emotional 
level, TIME TO RUN is the 
deeply moving drama of the 
conflicts tha t are tearing  a 
family apart - conflicts that 
develop between husband 
and wife, and between father 
and son. In an attempt to 
find freedom from the 
evergrowing hostilities, Jeff 
takes to the road, hoping to 
discover some meaning in his 
confused life.

Approached from a re ­
ligious perspective, TIME TO 
RUN is also a story of friction 
between Je ff and his g irl­
friend, M ichelle, played by 
Barbara Sigel, who is a 
fam iliar face to television 
viewers. M ichelle has dis­
covered a spiritual dimension 
in her life, and this aspect is 
very confusing to Jeff, who 
has little  time for “ a God 
who would allow war, hatred, 
and suffering on earth.’’ But 
his life is shattered  by an 
avalanche of personal prob­
lems, and he finds himself at 
a Jesus people gathering with 
Michelle, where he glimpses 
the possibility of a new 
life-style based on love and 
understanding.

TIME TO RUN is a film 
that can help strengthen love

"You forgot the 
monthly report?"

Too frequently, an in­
sured loss occurs when 
the insured has failed 
to renew, or has de­
faulted on the premium 
payment, and forfeits 
the right to collect in­
surance. Be sure to keep 
your insurance policies 
in force at all times.

M0R6AN&HUNT
INSURANCE

210 E..MAIN SONORA 
Prt. 387-2Ó76

relationships between people. 
It’s a film that was made for 
families to attend -  together. 
There will be no admission 
charge but a Freewill 
Offering will be taken.

RealEslafe
Transfers

WD - Mary Lee Hull et vir 
to Author A Hull Lots 10, 11 
& 12, Block E-27

WD - Charles F Browne et 
ux to Sonora Independent 
School D ist., Lots 7 & 8, 
Block 26-E

DT - Wayne Brasher et ux 
to D & M Company 1 acs out 
of Sur 94, Blk A, HE&WT Ry 
Co.

Mech Lien - Joe W Lane et 
ux to Nick Rodriquez 6.84 acs 
out of SW pt Sur 106, Blk B, 
HE&WT Ry Co.

To save space when freezing 
cut-up poultry, freeze only 
fleshy pieces. Cook the bony 
pieces, such as wings and 
backs, for immediate use 
or store as cooked meat 
picked off the bone..

Green News
Mary Owensby caused 

much excitem ent Sunday 
afternoon when she made a 
Hole In One on number 9. 
This was Mary’s third time to 
play the Sonora Golf Course. 
Jane Archer, Faye Wood and 
Jo Neville were playing with 
Mary. She has the score card 
proudly displayed on her desk 
at Dr. Owensby’s office.

-GN-
The Men’s Senior Partner­

ship Golf Tournament will be 
held this weekend, October 4 
and 5. Tee times, both days, 
will be shot-gun start at 8:30 
and 12:30. Sonora and out of 
town golfers will make up the 
64 team s. There will be a 
hamburger supper Saturday 
night for contestants and 
families.

The Golf Auxiliary now has 
49 active m em bers. Ladies 
Day is the third Wednesday 
of each month with a 
luncheon, business meeting 
and golf.

The Golf Club Membership 
now consists of 72 Regular 
Active M embers, 42 Local 
Associates, 7 Out of County 
and 6 Junior Members.

A  Farnily Is — A unit com­
posed not only of children, 
but of men, women, an 
occasional animal, and 
common cold.

the

B & G Feed
FEED SALT

can

MINERAL  
LIVESTOCK HAULING  

HAY HAULING

Pasture Aide Liquid Feed will be delivered or 
be picked up. Feeders will be furnished.

GEORGE SCHW IEN ING  
800 Glasscock 
Sonora, Texas

Phone 387-3620 387-2063 Res.

ADCO
W afer W ells, Inc.

Berkeley
Goulds
Submergibles

Sonora 
Bobby Doran 
915-387-2071

Well Testing 
Turbine Pumps 

Aeromotor Windmills

SALES & SERVICE 

Owners:

Ozona Mountain Home
Kenneth Ahrens 

915 - 392-3535 512 - 866-2654

BRITTAIN

Constnicllon Company

GENERAL OILFIELD CONSTRUCTION

Radio Equipped

Odessa

366-4491

Pumping Service 

RRC - Permit 5387

Sonora

387-2457

FAVORITE LA B O R -  
^  SAVING DEVICE TOCiAYx

i s To a a o r r o w  “

FOR YOUR CHILD’S COLLEGE EDUCATION 
tomorrow....save today! Think of it - oniy $10 banked 
each week will add up to $6000 in 10 years, thru 
compound interest. Bniid that Education Fund now 
with regular savings at FIRST NATIONAL BANK.

■ Mi ' N A T I O M A L  B A N K
g / A / C g  /a O O ~

P.O. BOX 798 SONORA,TEXAS 76950

Serving the DeviTs River Country i .


