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'82 Game Dinner 
draws over 700 people
From all accounts, this has been 

the best and biggest Game Dinner 
yet. There were over 560 meal tickets 
sold, and door prizes tickets sold 
amounted to 8100, with an estimated 
guess of from 700 to 800 people 
present.

Here is an reprint from the 
DALLAS TIMES HERALD written 
by Candy Sagon, Food Editor: 

p  For 14 years, Sutton County in 
southwest Texas has sponsored one 
of the best meal deals in the region.
It began as a goat roast back in 1968, 
says organizer Bill Stewart, and 
rapidly evolved into a wild game 
dinner with local hunters donating 
the meat and local merchants 
donating door prizes. This year’s 
dinner, held last Tuesday, was three 
days after the opening of deer 
hunting season.

V  “ It’s really a goodwill thing 
between the hunters, the merchants 
and the residents,” says Pascal 
Allison, a Sonora rancher who help­
ed with the cooking. “ Hunting is a 
big part of the economy of the area - 
it’s our cash crop.”

The dinner is held in the spartan 
4-H center in Sonora, a town of about _ 
3,400 south of San Angelo. The meal 
annually draws between 500 and 600 
people who pile their plates with 
nine kinds of wild meat that have 

^  been slow-barbecued or deep-fried 
in huge cookers by area ranchers and 
businessmen. Baked beans, tangy 
cole slaw, white bread and home­
made peach cobbler are provided by 
a local caterer.

The cooking is done in the center’s 
parking'‘lot. Visitors looking for the 
center can spot .it by the billowing 
smoke and the tantalizing smell of 
roasting meat.

The cooks this year prepared 600 
^  doves, 400 pounds of beefalo (a cross 

between beef and buffalo), 18 deer, 
four barbado (wild sheep), 200 quail, 
300 goats, plus boar, antelope and 
turkey.

The men who do the cooking are 
serious about it. They arrive at the 
center at 7:30 a.m. pulling trailers on 
which are mounted huge black 
barbecues they usually have 
constructed themselves. Many take 
their barbecues to compete in cook­
offs around the state. They all claim 

^  to have their own secret sauce for 
basting the meat.

Visitors to the cooking area are in 
for a little roasting themselves, as 
the cooks, fortified with beer and the 
camaraderie of their friends, offer 
tidbits as well as teasing.

“ Try this,” says former county 
attorney A1 Elliott, shoving some­
thing small and brown under a 
visitor’s nose. It turns out to be 
barbecued dove wrapped in bacon. 

Q  The visitor takes a bite.
“ Howzit taste?” Elliott asks, help­

fully wiping the visitor’s chin with a 
towel.

“ Wonderful. How do you cook 
it?”

“ Wrap it in bacon, marinate in 
Italian dressing, barbecue it ‘til it’s 
light brown, then brush on our secret 
barbecue sauce and barbecue it 
some more.”

“ How long do you barbeque it 
sauce?” the visitor asks. 

“ Till it’s done,” he answers in a 
tone that implies doubt about his 
guest’s native intelligence.

“ Clay Hicks is our cook,” Elliott 
adds, gesturing vaguely at a man 
partially enveloped by a cloud of 
smoke, poking more doves onto the 
barbecue grill. “ We figure each of 
these doves cost us $4.32 each, 
counting shells and beer.”

Bill Mobley, standing in front of 
^ two large deep-fryers, offers sam­

ples of fried vension and quail. The 
Dowell Co. manager says his quail is 
prepared Cajun-style - brushed with

mustard; dusted with flour, salt, 
cayenne pepper and deep-fried. The 
vension is soaked in milk for 48 hours 
dusted with flour and cayenne 
pepper and deep-fried.

The results prove his method. The 
vension’s normally strong flavor is 
absent and the meat is tender. The 
quail also is tender and the mustard 
and pepper add the right touch of 
spiciness.

As he gazes at the bubbling oil, 
Mobley is asked how he can tell 
when the meat is done. “ They float 
to the top,” he replies.
- The fanciest barbecue rig (com­
plete with cattle skulls) belongs to 
the soft-spoken duo of Bill Thomp­
son, 31 and his brother Gene, 28, 
otherwise known as the Thompson 
Brothers Cooking Team.

The brothers have been cooking 
competitively since 1978, winning 
second place in the 1981 World 
Championship Brisket Cookoff in 
Pecos and winning the Sonora goat 
cook-off three times.

We didn’t do much cookoff compe­
ting this year, though. Bill says. 
“ Too busy having babies,” says the 
father of two.

The Thompsons, along with Tom­
my Tims of Big Lake, prepared the 
beefalo like brisket. “ I wrap it in foil 
and baste it with my own sauce for 
about seven hours. When if feels 
soft, it’s d o n e/’ he says.

The most controversial dish at the 
dinner is the son-of-a-gun stew 
prepared by rancher Corky Schwien- 
ing.

“ Do you know what goes in it? 
aftorney Elliott asks. “ I wouldn’t 
touch the stuff.”

The stew’s creators recite this 
litany, when asked about the ingre­
dients: “ Heart, light, liver and 
lungs, bjank-blank-blank and not a 
bone in it.”

“ You write that and every West 
Texan will know what those three 
blanks are,” laughed one cook.

Whatever they are (we know, but 
we can’t say in print(, Elliott is 
wrong. The stew is spicy and good.

Although we couldn’t get specific 
recipes from the Sutton County 
Game Dinner cooks, we found some 
similar versions that can be made at 
home from Austin caterer Mary 
Faulk Knock’s “ The Texas Cook­
book” (1982, Little, Brown and Co.)

The following merchants donated 
these prizes: Bensons Repair Service 
1 gal. Antifreeze and 8 spark plugs;
Dowell-Model 94 Winchester 30-30; 
N.L. Well Service-1 Gott ice chest 30 
qt., 1 Schrade (uncle Henry) Fillet 
Knife, 1 Kabar hunting knife, J.S. 
Swabbing Service-2 boxes Reming­
ton 30-06 shells, American Blade 
pocket knife, 1 American Blade 
hunting knife; Brittain Construction 
■and Trucking Inc. $50.00 check; CRC 
Wireline Inc.- 1/2 gal. Old Weller 
Bourbon; Jimco-243 Browning lever 
action; Pearls Pizza-3-$15.00 gift 
certificates; Chapparal Motors-Tool 
box for Pick-up; Halliburton-48 qt. 
Igloo ice chest and 1 qt. steel 
thermos jug; Hills Jewelry-Pocket 
knife with case and sharpener; 
Tedford Jewelry-Tackle box; Sutton 
County Steak House-KC for 2 with 
drinks and another KC for 2 with 
drinks; Hurry-Up Grocery-Igloo wa­
ter can and cap; Halliburton-151 qt. 
ice chest igloo; Sonora Animal 
Hospital-1/2 gal. Wild Turkey, P.M. 
Office Supplie's-Boot bag; G&L Tool 
Co.-Boot bag; Hayne Const. Co.- 
Remington 700 BDL 6 mm rifle and 
rifle case; Thurman McGlothlin Inc.- 
48 qt. ice chest Igloo; Industrial 
Specialties and Supply-3 gal. Gott 
water can; AMOCO-48 qt. Gott ice 
chest; Location Builders-M77 Ruger 
257 Roberts, 1 box shells, scope and

Doskocil Gun guard; Big Country 
Industries, Inc.-Coleman cook stove- 
2 burner; Perry’s-1 Khyber Pocker 
knife: Such-A-Deal-1 leather check
book wallet; Devil’s River Ranch 
Supply-4 Deer Blocks and 20 sacks 
wildlife feed; Modern Way Grocer 
and market-4 T-bone steaks; 1 
sportsman lantern, 1 gun case, 1 old 
timer hunting knife, 1 scope mount 
spot light, and 1 hand held spot 
light; H&H Feed Store-2 Deer 
Blocks; Teaff Oil Co.-fillet knife; 
Westerman Drug-$50 check; San 
Angelo Savings-$25.00 savings acct.; 
Spains-S25.00 gift certificate; Image- 
$25.00 gift certicate; Devil’s River 
News-pocket calculator; Kerbow 
Furniture-Cowboy Statue; Gosneys- 
$25.00 Gift Certificate; Sears Cata- 
log-$25.00 gift certificate off any 
catalog order; Casparis Wireline 
Service-2 big beam hand lanterns; 
Soiiora Auto Parts-Western hunting 
knife and case; The Jug- 1 gal. 
Canadian Club Whiskey; Sonora 
Ozona Oil Co.-l case uniflow oil; 
HNG-220 Swift Ruger M77; Canyon 
Air-Goose Down Jacket; Fide’s Muf­
fler Shop and Gulf Station-$10.00 
cash; Food Center-TV Butter me not 
turkey cert, and TV whole boneless 
ham; Carl J. Cahill Inc.-Gold Eagle 
22-250 rifle; Chamber of Commerce- 
20 ga. win pump shotgun; Hunter of 
the Year (Leo Hearn)-30-30 win. 
Model 94; Western Auto-Rosse 22 
cal. rifle; Freds Gunsmithing-Scope- 
3 x 9  weaver; Claude Thomas 
Driskell-Sharps 45-70 Rep.; Her- 
shel’s Foodway-case coffee; Sutton 
Brothers Inc.,-Gun Vault; Lions 
Club-binoculars; Gully and Son- 
$50.00; Hunting Party-W in. 12 
gauge Semi auto Shotgun; Hunting 
party-Win. Model 94 32-40 John 
Wayne Commemorative; A&R Salt 
Water Disposal-Gott 50 qt. ice chest; 
Republic Supply Co. Big beam hand 
lamp; Sonora Wool & Mohair Co.- 
Hunting Seat Water can and meat 
grinder; Dresser Atlas-Kabar hun­
ting knife; Dresser Titan-Uncle Hen­
ry hunting knife; Eddins Walcher- 
Butane Bottle; Sutton Specialties 
Electric Inc.-K erosene heater; 
Southern Farm Bureau Ins.-Gun 
sling; Busters Liqior Store 1/2 gal. 
Chivas Regal; Sonora Ford Sales- 
Choice: case antifreeze or case of oil; 
Circle S. Automotive-Spark Plug tire 
pump; Well head safety control- 
Marlin 22 Mag.; Hunting party-Am- 
bassador rod and zebco reel; J.W. 
Elliott and Albert C. Elliott-$25.00 
cash; Light Electronics and Animal 
Care Clinic-7 x 50 mm Binoculars; 
Doyle Morgan Ins.-Real Estate­
hunting knife with sheath; Grider 
Trucking Co. Inc.-86 qt. Igloo ice 
chest; Pool Well Servicing Co.-igloo 
ice diest; Hunting Party-Model 870 
Rem. 20 gauge shotgun. Win. Model 
70 Rifle 270, Browning Auto. 12 
gauge shotgun, and Rem. Model 700 
BDL 7 mm-08; Morriss Brothers- 
Chain saw; J.&J. Ranch-Gott 48 qt. 
Ice chest; Hooper Trucking-Hunting 
knife; Freds Gunsmithing-Weaver 
scope; Up, Up, and Away-Fruit and 
cheese basket; Frontier Fur and 
Taxidermy-Choice-Deer-Turkey-Ja- 
velina mount; Dallon Permenter-1/2 
gal. Chivas Regal; Lions Club-Bi­
noculars; First National Bank-4 
$100.00 Savings Bond; Hunting Par­
ty- 19” Quasar Color TV; Hunting 
Party-1/2 gal. Johnnie Walker Red, 
Champion Bourbon, Johnnie Walker 
Black, Cutty Sark, Jack Daniels, 
Seagrams 7, Old Charter, Wild 
Turkey, J&B Scotch, Bacardi, Smir­
noff Vodka, and Gin; Pelicans-$50.00 
gift certificate; Rafter “ L” Chemi- 
cals-Box of T-bone steaks.

So many people entered into this 
undertaking and did such a superb 
job, our thanks and appreciation to 
each and everyone for a job well 
done.

Tickets for Los Amigos dance on Sale
Tickets for the New Year’s Eve 

Dance sponsored by Los Amigos 
Club will go on sale beginning this

week. Tickets will be sold in advance 
only.

Anyone interested in purchasing a

ticket or desiring more information 
may contact any Los Amigos Club 
member.

Emergency Service purchases new ambulance
The Sutton County Emergency 

Medical Service purchased a 1982 
Ford Ambulance in September. The 
service now has two ambulances

servicing the County, and presently 
has 12 crew members.

The crew consists of Lenora Bul­
lock, Georgia Luckie, Louise Hulsey, 

^Tim Thorp, Lousi Olenick, James

Blackman, Joe Luttrell, Wayland 
Dobbs, Harold Martinez, Georee
Keese, and Sammy Odom. N"ot 
pictured Troy Heffernan.

Chamber of Commerce meeting Dec. 2nd
The Chamber of Commerce has 

set up a meeting with the public to 
discuss the Santa Fe Depot as the

decision of the disposition of the 
depot will have to be made before

many months as the City of Sonora 
wishes to open Water Street for 
traffic, and as the depot sits across 
part of Water Street, it will have to 

' be moved.
The Chamber of Commerce 

wishes to welcome any and all

interested citizens to this meeting to 
discuss this situation.

This joint meeting will be held 
December 2, 1982 at 7:00 P.M. at the 
School Snack Bar.

Tedford Jewelry announces 
its big grand opening events

Grand opening festivities have 
begun at the newly-enlarged Tedford 
Jewelry. The store has tripled the 
size of its fine jewelry department, 
featuring not only a wider selection 
of moderately priced jewelry, but 
also collections from Rosenthal and 
other fine New York and European 
jewelrv houses.

Tedfords has added a complete 
Hallmark department, offering to 
Sonora for the first time a wider 
selection of Hallmark everyday

cards, partyware, candles, Christ­
mas cards, albums, stationery, and 
Christmas giftwrap.

Another new addition to the store 
is a collector’s gallergy, featuring 
limited editions porcelains, pewters, 
and bronzes, as well as museum 
quality paintings by 19th and 20th 
Century artists. Several noted artists 
will be represented exclusively in 
West Texas by Tedford Jewelry.

Grand opening events include a 
fine jewelry showing by Mr. Maury 
Baum, of Rosenthal. Inc., New York,

who will b.e in the store Wednesday, 
Dec. 8, 8:30 until 2 p.m. On Friday, 
Dec. 10, Dallas artist Marilyn Goss 
will be at Tedfords with a showing of 
her works. One of her paintings was 
selected for "the 1982 Leukemia 
Association Christmas .Card, and the 
original work is on display at 
Tedfords.

Tedfords is celebrating their grand 
opening by giving away twenty-five 
$25 gift certificates, with the draw­
ing to be held Dec. 11.

The Old Yuletide Spirit 
is just around the corner

By Kristi Nunn

Christmas shopping this year is 
taking a slow kick-off here in Sutton 
County. It seems that 1981 was a 
littler better than that of 1982. But it 
is still early in the season and it 
should begin to pick up soon.

1 talked to a few merchants here in 
Sonora and asked them how well 
Christmas shopping was taking place 
in their store.
Here are the following comments:

Gibson’s [Tony Jordan]-“ It is a
slow start this year. 1 don't think 
things will really begin until about 
two weeks before Christmas. People 
are buying things now but they are 
mostly putting things on lay-away.”

'Food Center (Les Robertson)-
“There is a slight increase. 1 think 
there will be a good Christmas 
season.”

Perry’s [Wally Padgett]-“ It hasn’t 
been anywhere close as it was last 
year. November wasn’t very good 
and we are hoping that December 
will pick up.”

Western Auto [Gil Trainer]-“ It
was running a little bit slow at first 
but in the last week it has begun to 
pick up. If it continues to go like it 
has in the last week, I think we will 
have a good Christmas season.”

Kerbow Furniture [Bruce Ker­
bow]-“ So far it is not as good as it 
was last year. It is a little off but it is

beginning to pick up. We are seeing 
an increase in Christmas shopping 
now.”

Spain’s [Hal Spain]-“ It is hard to 
tell from this point. Since November 
1 our sales have been better. We 
have been wrapping a lot of pack­
ages and things are now beginning 
to get under way. I think we will have 
a very good Christmas season this 
year."

Hill’s Jewelry [J.T. Hlll]-“ If is
hard to tell now. It hasn’t really 
started full force. It was late last year 
and it has been about the same this 
year. But it should pick up.”

Hang in there merchants, the 
Christmas spirit is just arousing.

Tougher trespassing laws 
effective in Texas

Reprint from The San Antonio Light
Texas Parks and Wildlife Depart­

ment officials said hunters and 
fishermen in the state should be 
aware that the state’s trespass laws 
now have more teeth.

House Bill 717 enacted by the 67th 
Texas Legislature went into effect 
last September 1 and it increased 
fines and/or jail sentences for those 
caught trespassing.

Persons trespassing to hunt with 
firearms or bow and arrow are 
subject to “ Class A” misdemeanor

charges, wnich carry a fine of not 
more than $2,000 and/or not more 
than one year in jail. The Class A 
misdemeanor trespass also includes 
entering a person’s habitation, 
whether or not the trespasser is 
carrying a weapon.

Trespassers not carrying a weapon 
are subject to Class B mismeanor 
charges, which carry a fine of not 
more than $1,000 and/or 180 days in 
jail.

Officials also remind sportsmen 
that they can be charged with 
trespassing on property even if the

area is not posted with signs. 
Crossing any fence or other enclo­
sure designed to keep livestock in or 
trespassers out constitues trespass­
ing. Also, “ no trespassing” signs 
are sufficient to keep out trespassers 
in the absence of a fence.

Further, if a landowner notifies a 
person orally or in writing that he 
cannot trespass, that person is 
obliged to stay off the land even if it 
is not fenced or posted with signs.

Further questions about trespass 
laws can be answered by your local 
game warden.

CVAE collects toys for 
less fortunate families

We members of the Cooperative 
Vocational Academic Education 
(CVAE) classes at Sonora High 
School and Sonora Junior High are 
trying to do our part for those less

fortunate families in our community 
during the coming holiday season.

If you have old, broken, or 
out-grown toys to contribute to us,

we will repair your donation (if it 
needs repairing--of course, toys in 
good repair are welcome, too), and 
make sure that it reaches a deserving 
child on Christmas morning.

If you can help us in this project by 
donating either toys or cash, please 
give us a call at the high school office 
(387-3055), leaving your name and 
address, and we will be happy to call

on you, or call Reggie Williams, 
Home phone: 387-2108, 120 Castle 
Hill Road, #4, Sonora, 'Texas 76950. 
Wednesday, December 15th is the 
last day.

We hope you can help us and the 
children of Sutton County in this. 
May you and yours have a happy 
holiday season.
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Around Town
Hazel McClelland

Obituary - Eusebio Garza

Thanksgiving has come
and gone - did you have as 
many things to be thankful 
for I did - I have my 
children and grand- 
ichildren - I have a home - 
and food to eat and clothes 
to wear - and a fire to keep 
me warm - and so many 
dear friends - Thank you 
God.

Congratulations to Bobby 
Smith - who has received 
her Real Estate license.

Mrs. Davie Taylor and 
Mrs. Güila Vicars spent 
Thanksgiving in Ft. Stock- 
ton visiting Davie’s niece 
and family.

Visiting Mr. and Mrs. 
Ray Fllnn over the Thank.s- 
giving holiday were her 
father' - Russell Oliver, of 
Van Horn, Mrs. Louise 
Glasscock of Austin, Mr. 
and Mrs. Joe Oliver and 
children of Kermit.

Chip Saveli of Pleasan­
ton, Cody Saveli of Waco 
and Scott Saveli of Big 
Springs visited their 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Saveli over the Thanks­
giving holidays. Chip is a 
football and track coach at 
Pleasanton, Cody is in 
College at Waco and Scott 
is in College in Big Springs.

Mr. and Mrs. Jesus 
Flores of San Antonio, 
Texas and Mr. and Mrs. 
Filiberto Gonzales of 
Bridgeport, Texas were 
visiting Mr. and Mrs. 
Ralph Gonzales Thanks­
giving.

Mrs. Juanita Gander and 
Hazel McClelland visited 
their families in Sweet­
water over the Thanks­
giving holidays.

Mrs. Nelson (Mary Belle) 
Stubblefield is in the 
Shannon Hospital in San 
Angelo.- Sure do hope you 
are better Mary Belle.

Mr. Ralph Gonzales was 
in Del Rio Tuesday on 
business.

Matt and Saveli Shannon 
of San Angelo were here 
over the holidays with their 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Charlie Shannon. Matt and 
Saveli are both students 
at Angelo State University.

As it will be Christmas 
time soon, the Sonora 
Ministerial Alliance again 
ask for help for our Christ­
mas boxes for the needy. 
We give about 40 boxes of 

■food, candy and fruit to the 
less fortunate people who 
need our help. You may 
leave your donations with 
Mrs. Roberta James at 
First National Bank or 
Hazel McClelland, Sec. of 
the Alliance. We will 
appreciate any thing you 
give to help. Thank you. 
Hazel McClelland.

Mr. and Mrs. Marion 
Smith and Lee of San 
Angelo were here over the 
T h an k sg iv in g  h o lidays 
visiting her parents - Mr. 
and Mrs. Louie Trainer.

Mrs. Beth Byrnes of San 
Antonio and Mr. and Mrs. 
Gerald H ardgraves of 
Corpus Christ! were here 
Thanksgiving to see then- 
mother, Mrs. Lola Archer.

Lea Allison of San 
Angelo was here Wednes­
day visiting friends.

Mr. and Mrs. Jerrell 
Young of Brownwood and 
their daughter,’ Mrs. Butch 
Baker and her children. 
Will and Shelly of San 
Angelo and Mr. and Mrs. 
Bob Jones of San Antonio 
were visiting friends in 
Sonora over the Thanks­
giving holidays. Will, son 
of Mrs. Baker went hunting 
for the first time, and he 
killed a turkey - Will is 6 
years old.

Mrs. Jo Nell Johnson has 
returned from Dallas, 
where she visited her 
daughter. Janet and Jo 
Addah and their families.

Eusebio Garza, 78, of So­
nora died Tuesday, Nov. 23 
in Hudspeth Hospital. 
Funeral Services were held 
Friday, Nov. 26 at 10:00 
a.m. at St. Ann’s Catholic 
Church with Father Gilbert 
Rodriquez officiating. Bur-

ial followed in Sonora Cem­
etery under the direction of 
Kerbnw Funeral Home.

•Mr. Garza was bom Mar. 
5, 1904 in Sonora. He was 
married to the former Briji- 
da Hernandez. He was a

retired sheep shearer.
Survivors include his 

wife of Sonora; 6 sons: 
Eusebio, Jr., Jacinto, Pole, 
Benancio, Julio, and Juan 
all of Sonora; 4 daughters: 
Remedios Acosta of U- 
vaide. Carmen Escobar,

Catalina Auces, and Maria 
Castilleja all of Sonora. He 
is also survived' by 38 
grandchildren and 44 great­

grandchildren.
Grandsons served as 

pallbearerss

Tedford Jewelry
Bridal Registry 387-3839
Pattle MerrUl, bride-elect of David CatbLrth , 
Lesa Smith, bride-elect of Charlea Kins ' 
Rachel Oehler, bride-elect of Lóala HaO

Anniversary
Mr. and Mrs. Willie Abelos

New Arrival
Mr. and Mrs. Jesse C. 

Gutierrez would like to 
announce the arrival of

their son, Jason Daniel. 
Jason arrived on October 
19,1982. He weighed 6 lbs.

14 oz., and was 20 inches 
long.

Maternal grandparents 
aire Mr. and Mrs. Mario 
Duran Sr., Paternal grand­
parents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Jose Gutierrez Sr. Maternal

great grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. Sabino Mendez, s 
all of Sonora. Paternal

great grandmother is Mrs. 
Lazarita S. Gutierrez of | 
Piedras Negras, Coah.

Headquarters For
H u n n N a

and

F I S H I N G

SUPPUES

1: LaJa U A J a i 1 Â A 1 JjL 1 aL  1 A*JKLKLlAIJ-1J. 1 ,M■

Hill’s Bridal Registry
Lesa Smith, bride-elect of Charles King 
Pattle Merrill, bride-elect of David Cutbirth

Hill’s Jewelry
387-2755
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The Old Shop
Cordially invites you to a

Christmas Open House
on Sunday, December 12th,

from two until eight o'clock 
and

on Monday, December 13th 
from ten until eight o ’clock 

Featuring
A Special Showing of

Estate and Designer fewelry 
at investment prices 

Antique Guns and Weapons 
Silver and Antique Dolls

2140 Hunt Street Sonora Tx. 387-2713

< X ' '• ••’■ '' 'íJlv' a'  a V  ¿

Select Yours Ekrly!

C h r i s t m a s  

T  r e e s :
'd
■m'

Good Selection-All Sizes- 
All Shapes- All Prices-

■f * s * r-f '?  '1'% I  i  %
I - r  c* i t  'I 'Y i $:-)>■ I 1 1
l i .  ¡3 X  1 . 1 . /  ..M. i

.. .^'«’c a T i  1 , 'i e e ,$  -  s e v e r a l  

# . A . p r i c i / t  T r e e s  

# P i n e a p p l e  P e a r  T r e e s

Dedicated To Beautification 

Next Door To The Hurry-Up

H u r i y - U ^

Stores
No. 1-1001 N. N.W. Croekott S i 

Open 24 hours everyday
No. 2-1021 S.E. Crockett S i 

Open 6:00 am ttl 10:00 ^m
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Icy road
conditions cause 

semi-truck 
to Jack-knife

JACK KNIFED-Chria Fletcher Weatherford from 
San Antonio was traveling on MO when the Icy 
conditions at 6t00 a.m. caused him to run off of the 
road. He hit the guard rail on the bridge before, 
managed to stay on the road and then apparently ran 
off the Hwy. In front of the Sutton County Steak House. 
Weatherford got a mitjor cot on his head out of the 
accident.

I  Victoria’s
f  Ceramics
%
% has a good selection of 
^  Christmas Gifts.

y •

h 10% off all
\ Christmas Items.

Effective Dec. 1st 
^  through Christmas Eve 
^  Mon. - Fri. 9-5 Sat. 9-12 
^•105 1st Sinaloa 387-3118

ifft' ^  jft) ^  3ft j j t '  aft'

Community Calendar

LIP & NAIL 
COUNTRY COORDINATES

The following is the 
Community Calendar for 
December 1982:

12/2 at 7:00 p.m. Cham­
ber of Commerce.

12/2 at 7:00 a.m. Inde­
pendent Cattlemen Assn.

12/4 at 2:00 p.m. Coupon 
Drawing at Courthouse 
Lawn and Water Street.

12/6 at 7:00 p.m. Library 
Board

12/6 Duplicate Bridge 
Club.

12/7 at noon Lions Club.
12/7 at 7:30 p.m. Desk & 

Derrick.
12/7 at 7:00 p.m. Kappa 

Gamma.
12/7 at 8:00 p.m. OLA’s 

Inc. Sutton County Park 
Board.

12/8 at 8:00 p.m. Sonora 
Fire Department.

12/8 at noon Ministerial 
Alliance.

12/9 Halliburton Ladies 
club.

12/9 at 7:30 p.m. Garden 
Club.

12/11 at 2:00 p.m. Cou­
pon Drawing at the Court­
house Lawn and Water 
Street.

12/13 at 9:00 a.m. 
Commissioners Court.

12/13 Stitch & Sew.
12/13 at 3:00 p.m. Hos­

pital Auxiliary.
12/14 at noon Lions 

Club.

12/14 at 8:00 p.m. Senior 
Citizens Gun Club.

12/14 at 1:00 p.m. Aging 
Advisory Bd.

12/14 at 7:00 p.m. 
Sonora ISD Board.

12/15 at 7:30 p.m. 
Conservation Dist. Direc­
tors.

12/16 at Noon Pétroettes 
12/16 at 7:30 p.m. DeOra

: Terrific colors for 
■ lips and fingertips 
, make a great 

K stocking stuffer gift 
' idea. Four shade- 
' coordinated choices 
; of creamy Merle 
y Nonnan Lip Makeup 
Land long-lasting Nail 
' . Glaze with Protein:

Plum Mocha Frost & 
Smoked Mauve,

^  Ambei^Frost,^' ^  
"I Double batel 

Peruvian Bronze & 
Hot Bronze Glacé 
or a Florentine 
Ruby duo.

EA. $9.50

A .

Shop Santa 
Drawing Dec. 4

Lodge.
12/16 at 4:00 p.m. 

American Cancer Society.
12/18 at 2:00 p.m. Cou­

pon Drawing at the Court­
house Lawn and Water 
Street.

12/20 Duplicate Bridge 
Club.

12/21 at Noon Lions Club 
12/21 at 9:00 a.m. City 

Council.
12/21 at 7:45 p.m. East­

ern Star.
12/22 at Noon Sonora 

Golf Aux.
12/22 at 8:00 p.m.

Sonora Fire Dept.
12/24 at 2:00 p.m. Cou­

pon Drawing at the Court­
house Lawn ■ and Water 
Street.

12/25 Merry Christmas. 
12/28 at Noon Lions Club 
12/28 at 7:30 p.m'. 

American Heart Assn.

»

A Celebration of American Taste
From

The Silver Palate 
Has just arrived at
Thè Old Shop

Vinegah Oils Mustards - 
Chutneys Dessert Sauces

Homemade Style Preserves 
Fruits in Liquer

A Feast of Holiday Delights

SHOP SANTA IN 
SONORA-First drawing to 
be held Saturday, Decem­
ber 4, 1982 at 2 P.M. in 
front of the Courthouse 
Lawn -and Water Street. 
Every one welcome, bring

Christmas Is Special at C a v o l  S
mGRLGnoRmnn H id ,  2 7 7  N  i

The Place for the Custom Face- S o n O T O  387-203

your tickets - you may be a 
winner.

Businesses taking part 
in this drawing are: Food 
Center, First National 
Bank, Gosney’s, H ill’s 
Jewelry, Spain’s Dept, and 
Westerman Drug.

You can use old percolator 
stems, painted in bright 
enamel co lo rs as single 
cand leho lders fo r  tiny 
Danish tapers.

DeviTs River News
Published Every Wednesday 

Established in 1890
i s K  à i '  -¿ ' .S t  i

Gus Allen..................... Publisher

The Devil’s River News (155-920) is published each 
Wednesday by West-Com, Inc., 220 N. Main St. 
Sonora, Texas, 76950. Second class postage paid at 
Sonora, Texas. Postmaster: Send address changes to 
the Devil’s River News, 220 N. Main St. Sonora, TX 
76950

M EM BER 1982
T U
T E X A S  PRESS A S S O C IA TIO N

Hamburgers may cook 
faster if you poke a hole 
in the centers when 
shaping.

I
_  _

l»i I  ̂ ‘ 1
Tedford Jewelry’s

I CHRISTMAS TIME FROM
Citizen

Affordable and beautiful. Just in time for the holiday season.
You will find just the one you want, with the features you’re looking for. 

Come in today. $55 to $150.

CITIZEN^Q UARTZ

Hill’s Jewelry
Downtown Sonora 387-2755

%

GRAND OPENING I
The celebration of our new store has begun

I
j

Rosenthal

Oh, so 
beautiful on 
Christmas 

morning. And 
ever after. Give 
her the gift the 
years make 
more precious.

Rosenthal Jewelry
Represented exclusively by

Tedford Jewelry

I

As a part of our Grand Opening 
festivities, Mr. Maury Baum of Rosenthal, 
Inc., will be in the store Wednesday, 
December 10, from 9:30 until 2. He will 
have the entire collection of this famous 
New York jewelry house. This will be 
their only showing in southwest Texas 
this season. Don’t miss it!

TEDFORD JEWELRY
Downtown Sonora 387-3839
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Seeing Red
by Elizabeth Allen

; This week, Thursday 
through Saturday is the 
date of the Sonora Invita­
tional Basketball tourna­
ment for girls and boys, 
both Varsity and J.V. The 
schools coming include Del 
Rio, Eldorado, Lakeview, 
Menard, Ozona, Mason, 
Ballinger, Ft. Stockton, 
Brady, and of course 
Sonora.

Tuesday-1st game at 
12:00 noon.

Friday-1st game at 1:30 
p.m.

Saturday-1st game at 
9:00 a.m. (Semi-finals and 
finals)'

On Monday at 6:30 p.m. 
the Spanish Club has their 
Christmas supper. It will be 
typical Mexican meal with 
food brought by students. It 
will be at the Parish Hall at 
the Episcopal Church. 
Spanish Christmas carols 
will be sang by the 
students.

Monday. November the 
6th. the Spanish Club will 
be having their Christmas 
supper. Tlie food, furnish­
ed by students will be a 
typical meal. The Christ­
mas supper will be held at 
the Parish Hall of the 
Episcopal Church. Then the

students get a test on their 
vocal cords by singing 
Spanish Christmas carols. 
All Spanish students please 
attend. It should be a 
welcome relief to work on 
your Spanish without being 
under pressure of grades!

The cast for the SHS 
Drama Dept, musical, “ A 
1940’s Radio Hour,’’ has 
been announced! Auditions 
were crowded and James 
Buchanan thanks everyone 
who triedout. The set build­
ing by the Drama classes 
has already been started, 
and everyone is building, 
painting, and nailing away.

Cast: Clifton Feddington- 
Ronnie Munns; Lou Cohn- 
James Dixon; Pops Bailey- 
Cody Childress; Ann 
Collier-Laura Preston; Gin­
ger Brooks-Claylene Ste­
wart; Johnny Cantone- 
Mike Polocek; Connie Mill­
er; Elizabeth Allen; Neal 
Tilden-Drew W allace; 
Genava Lee Browne-Kath- 
ryn Parker; Biff Baker- 
Rodney Speers; B.J. Gib- 
son-Craig Hopper; Wally 
Ferguson-Greg Stewart; 
Dottie Doubleman-Char­
lotte Wilson; Percussionist- 
Victor David Fuentes; 
Stella-ClaAnn Cates.

High
School
Honor

Roll
Senior All A’s 
Kelly Cooper 

Sonya Ridgeway 
Albert Chavez 
Donna Moore 
Phillip Kemp 

Homer Samaniego 
Marney Sorenson

A’s & 1 B 
Betty Garza 
Zeke Duran 

Donna Adkins 
Kandi Brazee 
Zee Wooten 

Jennifer Spencer
Vicki DeMarco

Juniors All A’s 
Barry Graves 

Lora Lea Kordzik 
Ronnie Munns

Juniors A’s 1 B 
Kathryn Parker 
Lynn Duckworth

Soph. All A’s 
Doug Martin 
Marsha Pohl 

Joe Will 
Rebecca Powers 

Patsy Powers 
Patsy Perez

Soph. A’s 1 B 
Carol Cayce 
Mario Sotelo

Freshmen All A’s 
Carrie Sorenson 

Jim Cooper 
Craig Hopper

Freshmen A’s 1 B 
Keri Kropp 

Sidonna Ridgeway 
Stacy Snider

Lunch Menu
Breakfast

Monday, December 6
Grape Juice 

Glazed Donut 
Milk

Tuesday, December 7
Orange Juice 
Corn Flakes 

Milk
Wednesday, December 8

Grape Juice 
Blueberry Muffin 

Milk
Thursday, December 9

Orange Juice 
Cheese Toast 

Milk
Friday, December 10

Grape Juice 
Sausage 

Biscuits/Jelly 
Milk

Lunch
Monday, December 6

Frito Pie 
Pinto Beans 

Tossed Salad 
Cinnamon Rolls 

Milk
Tuesday, December 7

Steak Fingers 
Mashed Potatoes/Gravy 

Buttered Corn 
Fruit Salad 
Hot Rolls 

Milk
Wednesday, December 8
Hamburger Steak/Gravy 

Seasoned Rice 
Green Beans 
Cheese Rolls 
Pudding Cup 

Milk
Thursday, December 9

Batter-Fried Fish 
French Fries 

Cole Slaw 
Corn Bread 

Rice Krispie Cookies 
Milk

Friday, December 10
Chili Dogs 
Tator Tots 

Tossed Salad 
Ice Cream 

Milk

For Breakfast-Lunch-Dinner 
or Anytime In Between

Stop At The
Big Tree Restaurant

Sam D echearo, Owner 
Hwy 290 & 277

■ ■ i i; M

LISTED
SAVE 80% ON HEATING COSTS

w ith the E-Z F irep lace Insert

H undreds of custom ers report big savings. H enry 
B ru ton , Lufkin. Texas. 'T  saved 80% over electric 
h e a t.” Roy Vinson, H enderson, Texas, "S aved  100%. 
Never lit our pilot on our cen tral un it allw inter." You 
too can save big. m oney using your fireplace and an 
E-Z Fireplace Insert.

• Available in tw o sizes
•E asy , self-installation . . . sim ply in sert in to  your 

ex is ting  fireplace 
•G lass doors and blowers included 
•Double-walled co nstructed  steel

f i r e p la c e  P lu s ,  In c
SAN A N G E LO  

no Westland Ave. 944-9180

Bronco Basketball players 
are now in action tor the 

1982-83 a season

G IB S O N 'S  
P H A R M A C Y

LET US FILL YOUR Í4EXT PRESCRIPTION '

SONORA 387-2500

CHRISTMAS

S A L E

DISEOUnt center
WEEK-LONG SALE

P rices Good Dee. 2 T ill Dec. 8

WILDFIRE Electronic Pinball Gome

SiB"CSCUBE

1 /

ts SWU or

Reg.S5.97

' tUOHlC. «NN n*l I

Electronic pinball compact enough to take 
anywhere. Features include authentic pin­
ball sound effects, lighted bumpers and 
targets, rollovers, digital scoring, and tilt. 
Ages 7-adult, 1 or more players.

Parker Bros.

SPLIT
SECOND

Electronic Gome
Reg. $49.57

PRICE

Reg. $46.97 PRICE

col... q u a r t e r b a c k
Bath time

I

BABY DOLL

1 5 ”
Reg.

$19.97

PLAYskCPL Aiphie
Electronic Robot

o
Reg. $28.97

PRICE

R U N  *  B LO C K  

S A C K  Q U A R T E R B A C K

S C O R E  S A F E T IE S

K IC K  F IE L D  G O A L S  
OR P U N T

Milton Bradley

POCKET SIMON
M in ia t u r e  v e r s io n  o f  th e  w o r ld ’s 
m o s t  p o p u la r  e le c t r o n ic  ^am e . T o te  
a n d  p la v  a n y w h e r e ,  a n y t im e !  A g e s  
7 - a d u l l,  1 o r  m o re  p la v e r s .

Reg.
$21.33

You c a l l  th e  o ffa n s tw a  p la y »  — 
th e  c o m p u ta r  t a t s  th a  d a fa n s a l

Reg.
$34.77 2 9 ”

A

Power Tow Truck
A "Big Rig” tov; truck that 
lifts and tows without 
the help of a single 
battery

Reg.
$23.49

o

h rbbro

r Price

Reg. $14.97

&

Mattel
See 'N Soy

TALKING
CLOCK

Reg. $11.33

F is h e r-P ric e  SINK sn
14-piece play sink set that really works! 
Sink has built-in refillable water reservoir 
and pump handle faucet with spray 
adjustment nozzle head.

DOLL
She s two do lls  in one ' 
For tw ice  the  lu n ' Doll 
stands 16’ / '  to  18 " tall 
and com es w ith  
accessories fo r both  play 
s itua tions A lso available  
B lack BABY GROW S UP 
doll, so ld  separa te ly

Tea Set & Tray
This gorgeous 18 
piece tea set features 
a carrying tray and 
dishes large enough 
for real or imaginary 
tea parties

rioDD^",
n

Reg. $13.77

A

A

27

MATTEL Preschool
T u f f  S t u f fWagon

Reg. $9.29 PLAYskcPL

2

1 3
Mjltel Inc 1919

DOLLS
Each sold separately.

Reg. $6.79

PEG DESK
With magnetic »pelling board. 

Super for playing ichool

Reg.
$25.99

LITTLE
RED RIDING HOOD

VEHICLES
heavy load »

DUMPTRUCK
maxi lift

TDW TRUCK
big ladder..

FIRE TRUCK

r a i n b o w
r i n g s

CREATE BEAUTIFUL DESIGNS

•  Ohhh! Look at the Rainbow! 
Kids ' cooh and aaah" as they 
watch Play-[toht colors mix, 
blend and fotim multicolor de­
signs right before their eyes.

' ^ 4Th;iri-.-̂ 'r.

F A s r m ^ ,
x t r t u e u c B B E i u ì n r “

>A gleaming total of 38 FAST 
I l l ’s *  cars to collect, race, 
and show-off!

• 38 authentically detailed cars 
in va rious  d ram atic  co io r 
combinations, with their own 
ONE-OF-A-KIND LICENSE 
PLATES™ .. .  makes FAST 
111's* the most exc ited ly  
co llectib le die cast cars in 
America.

• Co¥ect them by styles, colors, 
and even by state plates.

BABY'S BASKET
Combination picnic basket 

and shape sorter

Reg. $6.29

Letter Block Wogen

Reg. $8.59

255^L e tte r  B lo c k  W agon  (V/z to 5 years)
A wagon, complete with pull cord, filled with 24 wood letter 
blocks Blocks are embossed with letters on two sides and 
printed on four sides with large, easy-to-read letters and 
numbers.

P U Y s k c P k
Tyke Bike
Reg. $13.77

491 T yke  B i k e f l ’/z ^ „ ^ e l  is fun to ride.

C h T o n i^ -p la le d V a n d le b ^  s o ft p la s tic  g r ip s  and  s p if fy
S ie a m e rs  C o n to u re d  le o p a rd -p r in t se a t p lu s  p u n c tu re -p ro o f 
“ W h ite  w a l l"  w h e e ls . A d u lt a ss e m b ly  re q u ire d .
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Loeffler 
blocks effort 
to prohibit 
Compound 

1 0 8 0
During Subcommittee 

markup of the 1983 Interior 
Appropriations bill, Con­
gressm an Tom Loeffler 
beat back a Congressional 
effort to indefinitely prohi­
bit the use of Compound 
1080, only weeks before a 
final decision on the matter 
is expected from the Envi- 
romental Protection Agen­
cy.

Loeffler, a member of the 
Interior Subcommittee of 
the Appropriations Com­
mittee, by a vote of 6-2, 
successfully struck langu­
age banning the use of 
Compound 1080 during the 
markup session for the 
Interior Department’s 1983 
funding bill.

Until' 1972, Compound 
1080 was available for use 
to control the loss of live­
stock to oredation. It was

removed from the list of 
registered pesticides at that 
time.

An administrative Law 
Judge from the Enviromen- 
tal Protection Agency con­
ducted three field hearings 
on the subject, including 
one in San Angelo, May 
25-June 4 to determine 
whether "substantial new 
e v id e n c e ”  w a rran ted  
future use of the pesticide.

On October 22, the 
Administrative Law Judge 
recommended that, due to 
the new evidence present­
ed, a new restricted use of 
Compound 1080 was justi­
fied. The final decision will 
be made by EPA Adminis­
trator Anne Gorsuch in the 
near future.

"My amendment allows 
the normal administrative 
process to continue toward 
a final decision on a most 
responsible, effective, and 
selective method of preda­
tor control. Had the Sub­
committee not acted as it 
did today, it is conceivable 
that we might never have 
been able to use Compound 
1080 against the explosive 
coyote population growth 
threatening our livestock," 
said Loeffler.

Refineries pro­
cess in August

ture of motor gasoline total­
ed 58,783,592 barrels, 
compared to 58,168,621 
barrels in the year-earlier 
month and 62,064,389 
barrels in July of 1982.

Texas refineries manu-
Railroad Commission- 

Chairman Jim Nugent 
announced that 63 refine­
ries in Texas processed 
131,596,343 barrels of 
crude oil and hydrocarbon 
blends during August 1982. 
Through the first eight 
months of 1982, Texas 
refineries ran 1,014,555, 
305 barrels.

August’s volume com­
pares with 137,936,722 
barrels in the same month a 
year ago, the Commission’s 
Oil and Gas Division report­
ed in its monthly recapitu­
lation of Texas refinery 
operations. Inputs in crude

oil and blends totaled 
137,174,565 barrels in July 
1982.

Texas refineries ran 
100,753,083 barrels of 
crude oil in August com­
pared to 108,505,825 bar­
rels in August 1981 and 
103,139,235 barrels in July 
1982.

Products manufactured 
in august 1982 totaled 
134,105,497 barrels, down 
from 139,989,470 barrels in 
the same month the pre­
vious year, and down from 
the 138,875,614 barrels in 
July 1982.

August 1982 manufac-

McMillon
T ir t  and Sanrina

Car & Truck Tires 
Service Truck

An Independent Good Year D ealer

610 $E Crockett 387-2131

Devil’* River New*, Wedneidey, December 1, 1982P»ge 5
factured 7,842,197 barrels 
of home heating oil in 
August 1982-a decrease of 
1,729,562 barrels from the 
year earlier volume. July 
1982 output was 11,569,142 
barrels.. - ■ . , v  ~ ----

Save
General T ires 

Michelin 
Fina Gasoline
R.S. Teaff 

Oil Company
387-2770 Sonora

Hair care in the 
humid weather

y  —in
PRE-CHRISTM

prolessional
mTh ncXJND £MD MISTiES 

RECOUUENDED BY C3ENTISJS

“ It won’t be the cold 
winter that damages your 
hair the most this winter,” 
according to a leading skin 
care authority. “ It will be 
the drop in the relative 
humidity that causes the 
real damage to your hair.”

Dr. Myra 0. Barker, vice 
president of research and 
development for Mary Kay 
Cosmetics,' Inc. says “ It’s 
so important to condition 
your hair and restore it to 
its maximum possible good 
condition before the rela­
tive humidity begins to 
drop this winter.

"When the relative hu­
midity begins to drop, 
damaged hair can’t main­
tain its moisture balance. It 
begins to get very brittle 
and will start to dry out, 
split and break,” she says.

Most people have al­
ready damaged their hair 
this past summer which has 
left it virtually defenseless 
against the winter. Damage 
from chlorine, salt water 
and especially the sun has 
tended to damage the pro­
tective outer layer of the 
hair shaft and dried out the 
hair.

Hair has an ideal mois­
ture balance that needs to 
be preserved in order for 
the hair to be elastic and 
smooth. When this balance 
is lost, the hair gets into 
trouble.

“You need to think of 
your hair as if it was a $100 
silk blouse. You wouldn’t 
throw a silk blouse into the 
washing machine with your 
jeans and socks. You’d 
treat it very carefully,” 
says Dr. Barker.

Hair is primarily com­
posed of keratin, a highly 
complex protein substance. 
The only living part of each 
hair shaft is the root which 
is under the scalp. The hair 
we see it actually old cells 
that have been pushed out 
from the scalp as new cells 
have been formed in the 
root.

Hair grows an average of 
half an inch per month 
making it one of the body’s 
fastest growing organs or 
tissues.

“ There are several 
things you need to do right 
now to prepare for winter. 
First, go to a hairdresser 
and have the ends cut 
blunt, removing as much of 
the split ends as possible,” 
Dr. Barker suggests.

Start using an intense 
conditioner once a week 
and, when smoothness re­
turns to your hair, taper off 
to a couple of times a month 
during the winter. A condi­
tioner smooths down the 
outer layer of the hair shaft, 
which resembles the scales 
of a fish. “This makes your 
hair shinier because it’s the 
reflection of light off the 
cuticle scales that deter­
mines how shiny your hair 
is,” she says.

A conditioner also seals 
moisture in the inner layer, 
the cortex, by making the 
cuticle scales lie down, 
which makes your hair less 
susceptible to damage 
through combing and 
blow-drying. Mechanical 
and thermal damage 
actually breaks off the cu­
ticle leaving the protein 
fibers of the cortex exposed 
and causing them to un­
ravel and break.

Once you have restored 
your hair to its best condi­
tion, there are several ways 
to protect it from damage 
during the cold months 
ahead. Wearing a scarf or 
hat on your head when 
outdoors is one way to 
protect your hair. This 
keeps your body’s warmth 
and moisture close to your 
hair.

“Cold, dry weather tends 
to dry out your hair quickly 
just as it dries out your skin 
and it can make your hair 
very, very brittle,” she 
says. “Covering your hair 
does not give complete 
protection, but at least 
you’re keeping your body’s 
warmth and moisture close 
to your hair to a certain 
extent.”

Switching from a sham­
poo for oily hair to a gentler 
shampoo for normal to dry 
hair in the winter and using 
an intense conditioner 
twice a month will also help 
keep your hair in its. best 
possible condition.

“ If you wear your hair 
down the middle of you 
back as many young women 
do,” Dr. Barker adds, “the 
ends of your hair are 3 to 4 
years old. If your hair 3, 4, 
or 7 times a week, as many 
young women do, you have 
done a tremendous amount 
of mechanical damage to 
those four-year-old ends 
from.just washing it alone. 
“ So be gentle with your 
hair and keep that silk 
blouse in mind,” she says.

discount ceNTE
I ADULT DELUXE

Adult Professional

M f V .  TOOTHBRUSHES

PtPStCOU p e p g  PEP

Prices Good Thurs—Sat.
301 H ighway 277-N Phone 387-3523

7 9 C  R e t a i l  
V a l u e

PEPSI-COLA 
DR PEPPER BIG RED 

MOUNTAIN DEW.| gg
12-oz. Cans 6-Pack |

R egular o r C innam on Register For free  b ic y c le  To Be

18-oz. ■i 67 *

3 ’“ 8 9 ’

LISTERMINT

A LET H ER  f r o m

F R O M  S A N T A  C L A U S  
SANTA C LAU S, IN D IA N A  
THE PROOF IS IN THE

POSTMARK!
Visit our Santa Post Office and 
select a colorful letter FREE! 
It’s our way of saying Merry -- 
Christmas to children of all ages

m i o v ^
COOKWARE
Bacon Rack Baking 
Sheet, Versatility 

Pan, Roast Rack

9 9

I
^  Liquid Brano

32 oz. 
^ 6 3

Solo
DISPENSER 
No

Cozy
ST 
No

^  SHOP SANTA IN ^  
SONORA AND 

SAVE
★ SAVE ON GASOLINE
★ SAVE ON TIME
★ SAVE ON PRICES 

AT
★ Food Center
★ Gosneys
★ Spains, Inc
★ Western Auto
★ Westerman Drug
★ Hills Jewelry
★ First National Bank

SHOP WHERE YOU SEE 
THE POSTERS 

SPONSORED BY 
CHAMBER OF COMMERCE

KOTEX
R egular DR 
Super ' 

12’s

D or C 
2-Pack

AA 
4-Pack

EN-L Ration
Dog Food 4 For
15-oz. i  0 0  

can I

tf

runs in  th<

i-Dri 
PAPER 
TOWELS

DR 1 0 0

_  Delsey 
BATHROOM 
TISSUE

~  4-R o ll Pak

H AMALIE 
MOTOR OIL

g l0 W - 4 0 H D  4  1 9

j  Case o f 24 £ 0

SAEIOW-̂  Motor Of/

9 Volt

Scotch Brand 1
Magic Transparent Tape ^

^ 3 / 4 ” X  300“

16-oz.

L iqu id

GE GOFFEEIÏIATIC® II
DRIP COFFEEIYIAKER

(Demo)
• Fo r m orn in g  fresh coffee 
that’s e a sy to m ake. B rew s 

2-10 cups of y o u r favorite 
coffee. C ounter-efficient, 

spa ce-sa ving design.

Zebco*1545 COMBO
Fish this powerful combination 
anywhere ■a Ä 9 9

Zebco 404™ Reel Zebco’®̂̂ 4040 Rod

Zebco'-' 33’“
• R ust-res is tan t, s ta in le ss  

s tee l covers.
•  W ide-range drag.
• S e lective  anti-reverse.

FOOD PROCESSOR
IFPI)

• Slices, chops, shreds,
grates, crum bs. 

M ixes yea st bread d ou gh .
• 2-ln-1 reversible F o o d

P ro c e sso r Disc. 
• Stainless-steel serrated- 

e d ge  knife blade. 
• O N / O F F  and 

P u lse -O n  switches.

Tilhouetf'eJeriej
AC/DC Cassette 
Recorder
Slim Profile  WH 
styling fo r 
added portab ility

Black and Silver with 
simulated woodgrain 

side panels

Sleek, slim  size for 
easy portability .
E lectrical Pause con­
tro l. Tone con tro l, Sensitive 
bu ilt-in  condenser mic. Autom atic Re­
cord ing Level Control (ALC). jacks for 
optional accessories and three-way 
power capability. Autom atic end-of- 
tape shut-off.

K -.

MODEL 5592— 1-gal capac­
ity, provides up to 10 hours 
of operation.

HANKSCRAFT 
VAPORIZER
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Highway 277 North, Sonora

Christmas r ' T T

NOW OPEN LATE TILL OHRISTMAS !

*sl'J

Soundesign Cassette 8 Track 
Phono AM/FM Stereo 

w ith 2 Speakers
Reg 259 ”  Now 1 Q Q 9 9
^•••Btfaiiesaiieteteteoiiiiaeoisf eiM>teoeoefeeiiiî r̂eieel̂ ^Tieê ^nitiies«eseaeeoieietiesiiiisMiiieeetssiieeesBeii«eeBeeoeeeeoee

pide Forge 5 Piece 
knife Set

Reg. 8 ’’” Now g  9 7

6’Ft Househoid Extension Oord
Reg. Now 6 3 °

9Ft Househoid Extension Cord
Reg. Now T T c

Proctor Silex to Cup
Automatic Drip Coffeemaker 

Reg. 29”  Now 2 1

G X lie c tr ic  Can Opener
W hite or Almond Reg. 17”  NoWj 4 ^

G.E. Portable Mixer
W hite or Almond 

Reg. 17”  How 1 4 «

2 Lane Road Racing Set
40 Piece

Compare At 29”  Now Only 1 0 9 5

All Kodak Cameras Reduced
20 to 50 %  Off Regular Price

Eveready C & D Batteries 
Reg 69 ' Now 2 Pkg For 100

Merlin Electronic toy
Was 29”  Now 1 0 8 8

Coieco Head to Head Electronic
Football or Oaseball
Reg. 49”  Now 2 0 8 0  ,,

Hershey’s Milk ChocolSe
Colored Kisses 9 oz. Cniy j

Special
Including ChristmasTapes

(  Ì  ^
\ J /

Value to 7”
Now 3 For 1 0 o o

14 Ft Long Only 1̂ ^
Mens WinterWeight thermal 

UnderWear 
Only 499

Sale
25 Light Outdoor Light

.... ......... Set 8^^_______
100 Light 5 way Flashing 

Light Set Only 6^^

35 Light 2 way Flashing 
Light Set Only 2 ^

8 ct. Glass Ornaments 
Only ______

1000 strand Icicles 
0nly37°

18 ct Satin Covered tree 
Balls Only 2̂ ^

Scotch Pine 6 Foot Artificial 
Christmas Tree 

Only 18®®

Scotch Pine 4 Foot 
Artifical Christmas Tree 

Only 14®®

13oz. Spray Snow 
Only .00®

Only 36 >
Mattel Hot Wheels Cars or 
Match Box Cars Reg i ”  Now 199

20” ÀMF Boys Red 
Motocross Bicycle
Was 109”  Now 7 0 9 5

Parker Brothers 
Monopoly Game

Compare At 9”
Now Only 7®®
Bontempi

Oattery Cperated Crgan

Only 17®®
Automatic Single Control 
Electric Blanket Only 26‘‘

□ :



Flu and drug experts at Baylor College of medicine show 
pointers on how to avoid the dreaded common cold

Devil’* River Newe, Wedneaday, December 1, 1982 Page 7
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The s ta te ’s 1982-83 
influenza season is not 
expected to be severe. But 
Texans by the thousands 
will once again rush to the 
drugstore--seeking relief 
from sneezes, coughs and 
fevers—only to be confused 
by the number of over-the- 
counter (OTC) medications.

Flu and drug experts at 
Baylor College of Medicine 
have a few pointers on how 
to avoid the emotional 
trauma.

Deciding what to choose 
begins with thinking about 
the symptoms you have, 
and treating only the seri­
ous symptoms, Robert 
Couch, M.D., director of 
Baylor’s Influenza Re­
search Center, said. 
Ingredients are listed on 
the packages of OTC medi­
cations.

If you a re ‘‘stopped up,” 
or congested, look for a 
medicine that has a decon­
gestant, such s phenylpro­
panolamine hydrochloride 
or pseudoephedrine.

A runny nose can be 
controlled by an antihista­
mine, which drys up fluids, 
but it is recommended only 
for a very runny nose. One

of the popular ones is 
chlorpheniramine.

Coughs can be helped by 
suppressants, such as those 
containing dextrometho^ 
phan. A dry cough may 
require an expectorant-one 
is guaifenesin-to loosen 
lung fluids.

Most OTC medications 
for colds, and flu are combi­
nations of ingredients to 
treat a number of symp­
toms, but in this case more 
is n(vt necessarily better.

‘‘Many concoctions that 
contain three or more drugs 
will probably have some­
thing • unnecessary in 
them,” Couch said. "And 
the niore drugs you take the 
more likely you are to have 
reactions to one of them.”

He also said the amount 
of one or more of the 
combined ingredients may 
to be too little.

The aspirin in some 
medications may not be 
enough to control your 
headache. It might be 
better to use a medication 
with two ingredients, such 
as a decongestant and 
cough suppressant, and 
then take aspirin or an 
aspirin substitute.______

The form medications are 
in—nose spray, nose drops, 
liquid, tablet or capsule- 
should be considered.

Frank Bennett, a regis­
tered pharm acist and 
Baylor graduate student, 
said that decongestant nose 
sprays and drops are effec­
tive for short term use.

“ They have a fairly quick 
action because they are 
administered at the site 
where needed,” he said. 
"But people can develop a 
tolerance to these in a 
matter of days, and get 
what is known as “ rebound 
congestion.”

Liquids usually act faster 
than tablets or capsules and 
the elderly and children 
seem to tolerate them 
better.

Bennett said that there 
are some individuals who 
should be careful about 
cold and flu OTC medi­
cations.

People with glaucoma, 
an increased pressure in 
eye fluids, should not take 
antihistamines. They tend 
to increase fluid pressure.

D e co n g es tan ts  may 
cause problems for diabe- 
tics and those with high

Extension County News
by Rachel Oehler

to
With colder weather soon 

arrive and concerns 
about energy costs, it is 
important to think about 
clothing, radiant heating, 
humidity, drafts, activities, 
physical fitness, and ther­
mostats. All of these can 
work for or against each 
other.

(1) Thermostat setting 
can work for you, only, if 
the area in which the 
thermostat is located has 
the same conditions as the 
room(s) you want heated. 
Close off unused rooms 
when possible.

(2) Clothing offers insu­
lation. Wearing layers of 
relatively thin clothing

traps air between the lay­
ers. As you warm up, 
remove a layer or two. As 
you .cool off,.add some.

(3) Radian Heat w* he'at* 
from sun rayv or bea* t that 
bounces off he bri'cks in 
your fireplace.

(4) Humidity can undo all 
the good you’ve done with 
other methods of comfort. 
High humidity causes cool 
temperatures to feel even 
cooler.

(5) Activities generate 
heat, especially when large 
muscles of arms and legs 
are involved, so stay active.

(6) Drafts have a cooling 
effect, so locate them.

(7) Your nhysical fitness

blood pressure. They can 
increase blood sugar levels, 
and interact with blood 
pressure medications.

“ There is probably little 
difference between brands 
of over-the-counter medi­

cations for colds and flu,” 
Bennett said, “ if they have 
the same ingredients in the 
same dosage level.”

But to be sure. Couch 
and Bennett suggests that 
people ask their doctor or

pharmacist for information 
on cold and flu medica­
tions. And above all, see a 
doctor if coughing, fever or 
other symptoms continue 
for more than three to five 
days.

1̂1 mm
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Pee Wee Taylor
Vick Plumbing

387-2766 o r 387-3743 
Have a p lum b ing problem ?
Heed some re p a ir w ork o r 

rem ode ling  done? Stopped up 
line?  4] 7 S.E.Concho I

BridgetU Griffin Lolaheth Jones Derm Porter Patti Strauch 
Láveme Benton Marie Holhnig Joy leen Robbins

» I

“The More the Merrier’’ 
Invites you to their third

H o l i d a y  S a l e
Handcrafted Items 
Delectable Baked Goods

Rena Elliott

\W A \

Christmas Gifts 
and Decorations

is the final key-those who 
are physically fit adapt 
easier to tem perature 
changes. _

Events
Immunization Clinic-A 

Clinic was held Tuesday, 
Novemt?er 30 at the Senior 
Center (106 Wilson) from 
1:30 - 4:30 p.m. Children of 
all ages attended this free 
clinic sponsored by the 
Texas Departm ent of 
Health. x a »-

Pecan & Bake Show— 
Friday, December 3. Any­
one who would like to enter 
is encouraged to partici­
pate. Rules are available at 
the County Extension 
Office.

First Baptist Church 
Sonora, Texas

Dec. 4, 
1 0 : 0 0 -

1982 
4:00 p.m.

Sharon Hogue Ruth Hester Carolyn Williams Freda Shepherd 
Aileen Hayes Corrie Lane Anna Eustace Debbie Farrar Pat Gentry

m ® m

Í

- J 3

Tedford's exclusive 
Jewelry & China 

Department

Tedford 
Jewelry’s

GRAND OPENING
The celebration of our new store has begun

We are pleased to announce that we 
^now feature a f u l l d e p a r t m e n t , !
offefing partyware, candles, individual 
and boxed Christmas cards, stationery 
and notes, albums, and Christmas 
giftwrap. We hope you’ll visit us often.

I o n l y  a t

m

Tedford Jewelry

FR EE!
CARIBBEAN FANS

$ 1 0 ^ 0 0
$500.00 ■  7  J P  WITH

VALUE ■  B r  LIGHTS
COMPLETE WITH f

• Your Choice of 6 Beautiful Light Fixtures
• Wood Blades (With Cane Inserts)
• 52 Inch Blade Span
• 5 Year Warranty

COME BY AND PICK OUT YOORS

0  B lack a D ecker.
A  BENCH MODEL 

\ r  POWER TOOLS

7  Drill Press
^  No. 9414

Reg. $121“
NOW

$ 0 0 9 5

Black & Decker
SfNCH MODll
pom» roo is

BAND  S A W
No. 9411

Reg. ‘235”
NOW

$ 1 A Q 9 5

Downtown Sonora 387-3839
V/S4*

SOCKET &
TOOL SET 
IN PLASTIC Ci
Retail ‘ 69.95 
OPENING SPECIAL . . . .

40 Pi«c* Sock«! & Tool Sol to Iho 
FIRST 5 CUSTOMERS with 
$10.00 Purehaso or moro. 

EVERY DAY.

[fficy B la ck & D ecker.
BENCH MODEL 
POWER TOOLS

8 "
TABLE SAW

NO. 9419 Reg. »227«’
NOW

$ 1 6 4 ’ s

■¥

4134 SHERWOOD WAY 

942-9388 942-9488 

SAN ANGELO
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We Support Bronco Basketball
1982-83 Basketball Schedule

Boys
Date Opponent
Nov. 29 Del Rio JV
Dec. 2,3,4 Sonora Varsity & JV Tournament
Dec. 7 Iraan
Dec. 9,10,11 Ozona Varsity Tournament
Dec. 9,10,11 Junction JV Tournament
Dec. 14 Eldorado *
Dec. 17 Sanderson
Dec. 21 Junction
Jan. 4 Iraan
Jan. 7 Menard
Jan. 6,7,8 Big Lake Varsity Tournament
Jan. 11 Del Rio JV
Jan. 14 tColorado City
Jan. 18 tBallinger
Jan. 21 tCrane
Jan. 27,28,29 Eldorado JV Tournament
Jan. 28 fCoahoma
Feb. 1 tOzona
Feb. 4 tColorado City
Feb. 8 tBallinger
Feb. 11 tCrane
Feb. 15 tOzona
Feb. 18 tCoahoma

tDenotes District Games

Place
Here

There

Here
Here
Here
Here
There

There
There
There
Here

Here
There
Here
Here
There
Here
There

Time
6:00

5:00

6:00
6:30
6:00
5:00
6:00

6:00
5:00
5:00
5:00

8:00
5:00
5:00
5:00
5:00
5:00
5:00

Teams 
Var, JV 
Var, JV 
Var, JV 
Var, only 
JV only 
VAR, JV 
Var, JV 
Var, JV 
Var, JV 
JV & Fr. 
Var, only 
Var, JV 
Var, JV 
Var, JV 
Var, JV 
JV 
Var
Var, JV 
Var, JV 
Var, JV 
Var, JV 
Var, JV 
Var, JV

■Girls-
Date
Tues. Nov.9
Tues. Nov.16
Mon.Nov.22
Tues.Nov.23.
Tues.Nov.30.
Dec.2,3,4
Tues.Dec.7
Dec.9,10,11
Dec.9,10,11
Dec.14
Dec.16,17,18
Dec.21
Tues.Jan.4
Fri.Jan.7
Tues.Jan.il
Fri.Jan.l4
Jan.14,15
Tues.Jan.l8
Fri.Jan)21
Sat.Jan.22
Tues.Jan.25
Jan.27,28,29
Fri.Jan.28
Tues.Feb.l
Fri.Feb.4
Tues.Feb.8
Fri.Feb.l 1

Opponent 
Brady 
Lakeview 
Reagan Co.
Eldorado 
Del Rio
Sonora Tournament 
Eldorado
Iraan Tournament 
Junction Tournament 
Menard
Colorado City Tournament 
Iraan
Reagan Co.
*Coahoma
*Ozona
♦Colorado City 
Del Rio Freshman 
♦Ballinger 
♦Crane
Sonora Freshman Classic 
Iraan
Eldorado Tournament
♦Coahoma
♦Ozona
♦Colorado City
♦Ballinger
♦Crane
♦ Denotes District Games

Place
Brady
Sonora
Sonora
Sonora
Sonora

Eldorado

Menard

Iraan
Reagan Co.
Coahoma
Sonora
Colorado City

Ballinger
Sonora

,, r -
S o n o i^

S o n o r ^
Ozona ' 
Sonora 
Sonora 
Crane

Time
5:00
4:00
4:30
5:00
4:30

5:00

5:00

5:00
4:30
5:00
5:00
5:00

5:00
5:00

5:00
5:00
5:00
5:00
5:00
5:00

Teams
Scrimmage
Scrimmage
Fr.,JV.,VAR
Fr.,JV.^VAR.
Fr.,JV.,VAR.
JV.^VAR.
Fr.,JV.,VAR.
VAR.
JV.
JV & Varsity 
VAR.
JV..VAR. 
Fr.,JV.,VAR. 
JR.,VAR., 
Fr.,JV., VAR., 
JV., VAR.
FR.
JV..VAR.
JV.,VAR.,
Fr.
Jr.,VAR.
JV.
VAR.
JV., VAR.
JV., VAR.
JV., VAR. 
JV.,VAR.

o

;o

o

Sonic

Busters Liquors
Hershel's
Foodway

Tims Liquors

JIAACO

Doyle Morgan 
Insurance

Big Tree V i

Commercial
Restaurant

Carl J. Cahill 
Inc.

First National 
Bank O

D i C o n

Triangle 
Tire Service

»

Ray Holmes 
Sand and Gravel

Hurry-Up No. 1
Country Fried 
Chicken 'n Fish

Zola's Motel
O'Bryans
Fashions

Charles Howard 
Construction Hurry-Up No. 2
Chaparral

Motors Chuck Wagon

Chavarria
Grocery

Physical 
Fitness Center Westerman Drugs

Devil's 
River News

This space for sale. Sonora Shell Eldorado
Instruments Super Sports O

Food Center Perry's Dresser Atlas AAorriss Brothers



Texas Society to Prevent Blindness
urges Christmas Shoppers to use 

common sense in selecting

Devil’s River News, Wednesday, December 1. 1982 p^gg g

Joe Sentena and Zane Benson receive the Youth 
Appreciation award from the Optimist International 
and the Optimist Clubs of San Angelo. They both 
attend Lincoln Junior High School.

Two students from 
i^San Angelo receive 

Appreciation 
awards

The day after Thanks­
giving marks the traditional 
opening of the Christmas 
shopping season. Many 
shoppers will be searching 
high and low for just the 
right toys that they hope 
will light up the eyes of 
their youngsters on Christ­
mas morning. The Texas 
Society to Prevent Blind­
ness urges shoppers to use 
common sense in selecting 
gifts for the special children 
in their lives. Some types of 
toys can pose serious injury 
hazards to children, and 
particularly to the young 
eyes they are intended to 
light up.

P re v e n t  B l in d n e s s  
reports that over 4,200 
Americans ended up in 
hospital emergency rooms 
last year as a result of 
toy-related eye injuries and 
that nearly 70 percent of 
the victims were under the 
age of fifteen.

“ Most of these injuries 
vere caused by commonly 
available toys,” said R.E. 
Margo, M.D., state medi­
cal chairman for the 
Society.” These include toy 
guns, projectile toys, self-

propelled and flying toys, 
slingshots, and even such 
relatively ‘safe’ toys as 
dolls and stuffed animals.”

Particularly alarming, 
according to Margo, is the 
fact that over half of these 
injuries were caused by 
bows and arrows, BB guns, 
pellet gi^ns and other air, 
gas, or sprin.g operated 
guns. “ Weapons such as 
these, when handled as 
toys, can obviously be 
extremefy dangerous,” 
Margo said.

“ There are two prime 
safety factors that should 
be considered in selecting 
toys,” Margo continued. 
“ First, is the toy appropri­
ate for the child’s age. And 
second, how much adult 
supervision will be requir­
ed, and available, when the 
child uses the toy. It is also 
very important that a child 
be instructed on how to use 
the toy properly and 
safely.”

Prevent Blindness offers 
the following suggestions 
to help shoppers choose 
safe toys for their young­
sters this holiday season: 

Look for toys made from

shatter proof and flame 
resistant materials.

Avoid toys with sharp 
edges, points, nails, or 
screws that are exposed or 
can be easily exposed.

Check for rigid interior 
frames or springs that can 
easily puncture soft outside 
fabric or plastic coverings.

Remember that all 
projectile, flying, and self- 
propelled toys can be 
dangerous.

Be sure to consider the 
child’s age and physical 
coordination when select­
ing toys.

Margo concluded by say­
ing, “ A little forethought 
and good judgement can 
help make this a safer and 
happier holiday for all our 
young Texans.”

The Texas Society to 
Prevent Blindness is an 
affiliate of the National 
Society to Prevent Blind­
ness, the oldest voluntary 
health agency nationally 
engaged in sight conserva­
tion through a comprehen­
sive program of community 
service, public and pro­
fessional education, and 
research. ,

Optimist International 
and the Optimist Clubs of 
San Angelo have recogni­
zed the contributions of 
youth throughout the years 
in a variety of ways.

Recently, during the 
Youth Appreciation Week 
banquet, Zane Benson and 
Joe Sentena were honored 
as the Optimist Club

honorees from Lincoln 
Junior High School. Both 
Joe and Zane are excellent 
students involved in the 
academic program as well 
as the extra-curricular acti­
vities offered at Lincoln 
Junior High. Joe is the son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Joe Sen­
tena and Zane is the daugh­
ter of Mrs. Mitzi Benson.

West Texas Chamber of Commerce 
meeting held Nov. 11-12

An Aulhonred Bu>i(

MITCHELL
I MeUi 6u>k)i'>9 Sysltmt

M ITC H ELL  E N G IN E E R IN G  C O M PA N Y  
O vtton  ol The C k o  CorpOfAhon

in US U  PART OF 
TOUR NEW lUILDIHC PUN

snvme WIST nxAS t
HlWMlXKOfOK OVIK 

34 rUKSl

IN C . P.O BOX 3036

SAN ANGELO. TX. 653-6707

€
BUILDER of READY 

BUILT HOMES

COMMERCIAL • RESIDENTIAL 
REMODELING

DELIVERY & SET UP ANYWHERE IN W.T.• •  •  •

CUSTOM DESIGN SERVICE FROM 
YOUR PLANS OR SPECIFICATIONS
LICÍN5ÍD INSUREDBONDED

FREE ESTIMATES

CONCHO CONSTRUCTION CO 
653^4535

4302 N. CHAD. SAN ANGELO, TX. 
0PEN 8A .M .-5  P.M. MON.-FRI.

NIGHTS OR WEEKENDS CALL 653-1585-658-7428

The Board of Directors of 
the West Texas Chamber of 
Commerce has unanimous­
ly adopted a position urging 
the 98th Congress to expe­
dite decontrol of natural 
gas prices. The action was 
taken by the Regional 
Chamber at its Mid-Year 
Meeting and Legislative 
Conference held November 
11-12 in Fort Worth.

According to WTCC Mi­
neral Resources Committee 
Chairman Dan Mendel! Ill 
of Midland, decontrol will 
be one of the most impor­
tant issues Congress will 
consider early next year.

“The chamber position 
urges total phased decon­
trol of prices of natural gas, 
with prompt decontrol for 
new supplies and decontrol 
of old gas by the 
mid-1980’s,” Mendell said.

“We also expect decon­
trol to produce an increase 
in the supply of natural gas, 
similar to the increase we 
have seen in the supply of 
oil since it was decontrol­
led. Following decontrol, 
the WTCC recommends 
that there should be no 
decontrol excise tax that 
would dilute this much 
needed supply response,” 
he added.

The WTCC position also 
calls for repeal of the 
prohibition under the Fuel 
Use Act against use of 
natural gas by some con­
sumers on the basis that 
this is counter to the most 
efficient use of the resource 
and competing fuels.

Characterized as counter 
to free market determina­
tion of the most efficient 
use of natural gas, the 
so-called incremental pric­
ing provision of the Natural 
Gas Policy Act, whereby 
large volume users pay a 
disproportionate share of 
higher prices, should also 
be repealed, the chambe 
suggested.

Mendell said the WTCC

came to its position on 
decontrol after careful con­
sideration of the best policy 
as it would affect both 
industry and all categories 
of consumers.

“Decontrol will have a 
number of beneficial im­
pacts on Texas and its 
residents including a se­
cure and adequate supply 
of natural gas, new jobs 
created by greater explora­
tion for and production of 
natural gas, encouraged 
development of Texas’ 3.2 
billion tons of proven coal 
reserves, and reduced de­
pendence on Middle East 
im p o r t s ,”  M en d e ll 
concluded.

The key to 
farm success

Landowners need to be 
aware of what is involved 
when they lease their land 
for oil and gas exploration 
and what oil companies will 
do in terms of land manage­
ment. Proper site prepara­
tion and restoration by oil 
companies is important if 
landowners want their land 
to be productive again and 
not be an eyesore, says a 
waste management engi­
neer with the Texas Agricu­
ltural Extension Service, 
Texas A&M University Sys­
tem. The keys to the 
success of this effort are to 
preserve and reuse the 
topsoil. Once the site is 
restored, a good seedbed 
should be prepared and 
appropriate grasses should 
be planted.

W I N T E R  IS  IN  T H E  A IR !!!

I

SK I W EAR bv 
C-B Sports 
Black Bear 
Hot Gear 
Breezin'
Allen -  A  
Lotto
Ridgeview

SKIW EAR
CHECKLIST

JACKETS
B IBS ST
PANTS IZ
JUM PSU ITS Z
GLOVES Z
UNDERW EAR z
HATS z
SO CKS z

LAYAWAY NOW: 25% DOWN WILL HOLD 
ALL YOUR W ARM U PS Et 
EQUIPMENT FOR 90 DAYS.

W ARM UP

ffîÈÂ
W ARM UPS bv CHECKLIST
Bonnie K ID S' Z
Activo LADIES' z
Active Image M EN 'S z
Wilson VELOURS z
Jog Joy KEYROLAN z

^ Guts ACRYLICS
POLYESTERS

z
z

GREAT CH R ISTM A S GIVEAW AY-$100 DRAW ING EACH SATURDAY UNTIL 
C H R IS T M A S -S IG N  UP FOR THIS GREAT GIFTI NO PURCHASENECESSARYII

ßjipm à ltâ  X
» i r  A

"San  Angelo's Winter Sports Headquarters" 

Southwest Plaza 944-2014

lllñlé

Sonora Church Directory
Primera Baptist Charch 
Rev. Morris VUlarreal

Sunday School 9:15 a.m. 
Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Training Union 5:30 p.m. 
Worship 7:00 p.m.
WMU 'Tuesday 6:00 p.m. 
Wed. Serv. 7:00 p.m.

Hope Lutheran Charch 
Dennis McKaln-Pastor

Sunday School 10:
Hymn Study 10:00 a.m. 
Worship Serv. 11:00

First United 
Methodist Chnrch 

David W. Griffln-Pastor
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Worship 10:55 a.m.
KVRN 98 AM 11:00 a.m. 
Children’s Choir 5:00 p.m. 
UMYF 6:00 p.m.
Wed. Chancel Choir 7:00

Jehovah’s Witnesses 
Sunday

Public Talk 10:00 a.m. 
Watchtower Study 10:50 
a.m.

Tuesday
Cheoeratic School 7:30p.m. 
Service Meeting 8:30 p.m. 

Thursday
Bible Study 7:30 p.m.

’ Saint John’s Episcopal 
Charch

Rev. John W. Fritts 
Pastor
Sunday

Holy Eucharist 8:(X) a.m. 
Holy Eucharist 11:00 a.m. 
(2nd and 4th Sunday MP) 

Wednesday
Holy Eucharist 7:00 p.m. 
Holy Days as announced

Charch Of Jesus 
Christ of Latter Day 

Saints
Bishop: Bryan GaUoway 

San Angelo 658-4797 
2817ChristovalRd. 
Priesthood 9 a.m. 

Primary 9 a.m.
Relief Society 9 a.m. 

Sunday School 10 a.m. 
Sacrament meeting 11 a.m.

Hill’s Jewelry

Devil’s River News
Sonora, Tx.

Live Oak Baptist Church 
4th and Menard 

Pastor: Donalles Provines
Sunday Services 

10:30 a.m. and 7:00 p.m. 
Wednesday 7:00 p.m.

First Assembly of God 
Rev. Louis Halford-Pastor

Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Morn. Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Eve. Serv. 6:00 p.m.
Wed. Serv. 7:00 P.m.

First Baptist Church 
Rev. Clifton Hancock 

Pastor
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 

Morn. Worship 10:50 a.m. 
Eve. Worship 7:30 

Wed. Serv. 7:30 p.m.

Church of Christ 
Minister Don Jones

Bible School 10:00 a.m. 
Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Sun. Night 6:30 p.m. 
Wed. Night 6:30 p.m.

The Church of the 
Good Shepard 
Presbyterian

Church School 10:00 a.m. 
Fellowship 10:45 a.m. 

Worship 11:00 
(Communion first Sunday 

of each month.) 
PCUS/UPCÜSA

Sonora Tabernacle 
United Pentecostal 
Rev. Kenneth Doyle 

Pastor
Sunday Schol 10:00 a.m.

Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Eve. Worship 7:30 p.m. 

Wed. Serv. 7:30 p.m.

St. Ann’s 
Catholic Church 

Rev. Gilbert Rodriquez
Sat. Vigil Mass 7:00 p.m. 
Sunday Mass 8:00 a.m. 
Sunday Mass 11:00 a.m. 
Holy Day Mass 7:00 p.m.

Kerbow Funeral Home

Southwest Texas 
Electric Coop, Inc.

Owned By Those It Serves

OAKWOOD MOBILE HOMES OAKWOOD MOBILE HOMES OAKWO

SAVE UP TO H 5 ,0 0 0  AND 
EVEN MORE. Based on our
new S IM P L E  IN T E R E S T

«3 financing with interest rotes 
equivalent to 1 3 % .
(Based on Full Payments 
every 25 Days).
Come in and let us show you how 
quick we can put you in a new home, 
and how much you can save

•T3

i / f

Ok OAKWOOD
MOBILE HOMES

4422 North Chadbourne

SAN ANGELO, TX. 
(915)658-8569

iNIMUn 1 Sa V K l SIMCI 1949 WltH 49 lO C i r ^  tKlUDINO 5 «  JlXAsi

OAKWOOD MOBILE HOMES OAKWOOD MOBILE HOMES OAKWQQP

(Call tor Free Delivery!),

GET A _

Scotch®
B R A N D

Post-it Note TRAY 
with these Post-it Note Deals 
AT SAVINGS
PW-D3-NT-4-DEAL
Buy twelve 
each 3" X 3" 
and 1V2" x 2" x 2"
Post-it Note Pads 
and get one Note Tray free!
List $15.55/Deal
PW-D3-NT-5-DEAL
Buy twelve each 3" x 5" and 
IV2" X 2" Post-it Note Pads and 
get one Note Tray free!
List $19.03/Deal

Plus FREE
10-sheet sample of new Post-it 
Routing-Request and Telephone 
Message Pads per deal.

P.M.Office 
Supplies

Hwy277S Sonora 387-3774

Discount on B O S T O N
A IR  C L E A N E R S

Removes 
unpleasant 
odors due to 
smoke, mijdew, 
dampness, 
chemicals and 
airborne particles.

^COLOGIZER II
2-speed dual filtering system 
Recirculates airin a 14' x 18'room 
every 33 minutes!
Includes extra replacement filter 

06-2579 Brown 06-2580 Putty 
^List $44.95 _______________

CONFERENCE ROOM 
AIR CLEANER

» 3-speed filtering system 
• Recirculates air in a 6000 cu. ft.

room in 1 hour or less 
• Quiet & Compact 

06-2581 List $119.95 Each

Beauty, Quality and Value Plus
10 % OFF on MPOIM
WOOD OFFICE FURNITURE
CHAIRS
• Hardwood frames in rich 

walnut finish
• Posture engineered for seating 

comfort. Executive Swivels, 
Executive Posture Chair, 
Captain’s Swivel, Judge's Chair, 
Side Arm Chairs, Secretarial 
Swivels

D ESKS
• Walnut finish hardwood frame 

and legs
• Mar-proof laminate top
• Center drawer overall locking 

device

SINGLE PEDESTAL Size 48 x 30 
DOUBLE PEDESTAL Size 55 x 26, 

60 X 30 and Conference 72 x 36 
SECRETARIAL WORK CENTER 

Main Desk Size: 60 x 30; Return 
Size: 40 X I 8V2

FILES
• Quality hardwood construction
• Locking full suspension drawers
• File letter or legal size folders
• Worry-free walnut laminate tops 
TWO DRAWER LATERAL FILE

36 w X 1 9V4 d X 29 h 
TWO DRAWER VERTICAL FILE 

15V 2W X  27d X 29h
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Sutton County Ag Corner A

Mohair
team

returns
from

overseas
A mohair market survey 

team returned last Tuesday 
from overseas after visiting 
spinners and topmakers in 
Spain, France, and the 
United Kingdom.

Those on the team repre­
senting the Mohair Council 
of America and the Texas 
Wool and Mohair Ware­
house Association were 
Donnie Taughlin, President 
of the Warehouse Associa­
tion, Herman Moore, Presi­
dent of the Mohair Council 
of America, and Fred 
Campbell, Executive Direc­
tor of the Mohair Council. 
“ Mohair is definitely in 
fashion,” Laughlin report­
ed. “ And in spite of the 
serious recession in 
Europe, it continues to sell 
well, particularly the hand- 
knitted yarns. “ Even 
though we have a higher 
worldwide production, the 
1982 clip will be sold down 
to low levels by the end of 
the year, resulting in low 
carryover stocks in ail three 
major producing count­
ries,” he added.

Laughlin reported that 
the team was well received 
in ail countries, and that 
the meetings were produc­
tive. “ We have come a 
good way in improving the 
image of Texas mohair, 
although I can't say the 
same about prices. I guess 
we are fortunate, though. 
The pipelines are fairly 
empty and the spinners are 
able to use the mohair, this

should result in better 
prices to our growers when 
ec o n o m ic  c o n d i t io n s  
improve,” he said.

Moore noted the big 
increases of mohair ship­
ments to certain countries 
in 1982, indicating some 
shifts in the traditional 
heavy shipments to the 
mills in Bradford, England. 
“ Shipments of grease 
mohair overseas, for the 
first nine months of the 
year, are up 8 percent, 
whereas those to the United 
Kingdom are down almost 
20 percent,” Moore said. 
“ Countries showing sub­
stantial increases are Italy, 
Spain, France, and Ger­
many. Although we have a 
good friends and customers 
in England, we are glad to 
see competition and diver­
sification in markets,” he 
added.

On the upcoming mohair 
referendum, Moore noted 
some “ out of context” pub­
licity released by the 
United States Department 
of Agriculture during the 
past several weeks con­
fused some growers. 
According to the news 
release, the referendum 
allowed an increase in 
deductions from incentive 
payments from 1 1/2 tp 4 
1/2 cents per pound.

“ This statement is mis­
leading because it ignores 
the fact that we have the 
Texas Mohair Producers 
Board, through which 
growers have already been 
contributing 4 1/2 cents per 
pound for at least three 
years. We are not asking 
for an increase in funds, 
only a shift from warehouse 
collections to deductions 
from incentive payments,” 
Moore said.

The referendum will be 
conducted through local 
Agricultural Stabilization 
and Conservation Service 
offices, with voting taking 
place from December 6 -17, 
1982.

Cutting Horse event 
to take place Dec. 2-12

In what will be the rich­
est arena competition in 
equine sports history, 780 
th re e -y e a r-o ld  cu ttin g  
horses will compete for a 
purse of more than $1,000, 
000 at the National Cutting 
Horse Association’s 1982 
Futurity. The event will 
take place December 2-12 
at Fort Worth’s Will Rogers 
Coliseum.

“ Cutting purses are 
growing at a faster rate 
than in any other equine 
sport,” said Zack Wood, 
NCHA secretary-treasurer. 
“ The Futurity purse alone 
has doubled from what it 
wasin 1980.”

The 1982 Futurity is the 
21st anniversary of this 
annual competition for 
unproven three-year-olds. 
The first Futurity was held 
in 1962 in Sweetwater, 
Texas. That year, 36 horses 
competed for a purse of 
$18,375. The event has 
been held in Fort Worth 
since 1967.

“ The 780 entries this 
year are coming from 36 
states and Canada,” said 
Wood. “ However, since 
none of the horses have 
ever been tested in compe­
tition, there really can’t be 
any favorites. Some folks 
will pick a favorite' by the 
horse’s pedigree or by who 
is riding, but with these 
animals anything can 
happen,” Wood said.

In 1981 Futurity Cham­
pion was Colonel Lil, owned 
by W.B. Wood of Brenham,

Texas. His winnings last 
year were $194,62ff.60. The 
1982 Champion will take 
home more than a quarter 
of a million dollars.

Five judges will score 
this competition of the 
western working horse in 
first and second elimination 
go-rounds then in semi­
finals and finals. In a 2 & 
1/2-minute period, each 
entry will display skills of 
quickness and intelligence 
as it works to “ cut” a 
yearling calf from the herd 
and keep it from returning.

All entries will work in 
the first go-round trials 
December 2-7, then the 180 
top-scoring horses will 
compete in the second go- 
rounds December 9 and 10.

The non-professional finals 
will take place on Friday, 
December 10, with the 15 
high scoring non-profes­
sional riders competing. In 
the open semi-finals on 
Saturday, December 11, 
7:30 p.m., only 60 horses 
will work to eliminate all 
but the top 20 to compete in 
the Championship Finals 
on Sunday, December 12, 
at 7:30 p.m.

Arena tickets are sold out 
for the non-pro finals, the 
open semi-finals and the 
C h am pionsh ip  F in a ls . 
However, on Saturday and 
Sunday, December 11 and 
12, closed-circuit viewing of 
the competition will take 
place to the Will Roge'rs 
main arena. General 

*
H&H FEED & T R U C K IN q

Jack & Allen H eam  owners 
Teeds by Goldbold Sweetwater Stockton Acco

Jack & Alien appreciate your business!

admission to the closed- 
circuit seats is $4, with 
children under 12 admitted 
free; General admission 
seats are also available for 
any of the first and second 
go-round trials, which 
begin at 8 a.m., December 
2-7 and December 9 and 10.

The 1982 Futurity is one 
of six national events spon­
sored annually by the 
NCHA. The NCHA also 
sanctions more than 750 
other regional events each 
year that are held through­
out the United States and 
Canada. Founded in Fort 
Worth in 1946, the Associa­
tion has a current member- 
iship of 9,000.

4 Cecil 
f  Westerman
I  Would Like 

4 To . Be 
f  Your 
I Pharmacist

T R U E H E A T

t

THSe
•UL Approved 
•Heat Circulating 
•Optional:
Outside Air:
Glass Doors 

•36" Firebrick lined 
Firebox

•25 Year Limited 
Warranty

Fireplace, 9 ft*, pipe, 
cap, Flashing, and 
coilor.

Complete
Reg.$557

NOW•400»o
HOUSE OF FIREPLACES

1121 S^Chadbounw. .-. ..... 653-3140

I

M
According to the AMA, beer 
can make hair easier to set 
if used in the final rinse.

! Appleton Fur’s 
I  Will be buying turs & deer 
!  hides again this year. We will j  
! be located at the same place | 
j as last year 300 Glasscock 
j Across trom the Commercial
! Restaurant We appricate you
I business We will be

Open Dec. 1. !Í

li. I

Livestock producers look into 

Fever Ticks more heavily
. Livestock producers in 

this area are being urged 
by the Texas Animal Health 
Commission to Continue 
surveillance efforts as a 
result of a recent fever tick 
outbreak in Webb County.

Dr. John W. Holcombe, 
executive director, Texas 
Animal Health Commis- ’ 
sion reported that combin­
ed efforts of state and 
federal animal health offi­
cials are showing progress 
in eradication of the out­
break. “ But we need the 
continued cooperation of all 
livestock producers,” he 
said.

An outbreak of fever 
ticks was found Nov. 2 
about 10 miles northwest of 
Laredo. As a result, about 
20,000 were placed under 
quarantine involving more 
than 35 premises.

An 11-day roadblock in 
the area has been termina­
ted, but spot checks are to 
be continued. Dr. Hol­
combe said.

Two species of fever ticks 
can transmit tick fever to an 
animal. Presently, there is 
no cure. Tick fever is not 
known to exist in Texas, but 
parts of Mexico are infest- 
ed.

Cattlemen are being re­
quested to continue to 
“ scratch” or inspect their 
cattle for ticks. “ Early 
reporting of ticks has been 
the most beneficial and 
important factor in our 
eradication efforts,” Dr. 
Holcombe said.

ATTENTION HUNTERS AND TRAPPERS
Fur buyer will be in Sonora at Freddy’s 
Shamrock each Sunday from 8:15 a.m. till 
9:00 a.m. beginning Dec. Fth. We buy 
green and dry turs ot all kinds, 
all furs (like opossum). We also buy deer 

’ hides. Well handled turs bring Top Prices!

D & W Fur Comoany Inc.
400 N. Texana 

Hallettsville, Tx 77964 
Phone No. 512-798-5057 or 5058

SOUTHWEST SUPPLT CO.
For ail your plumbing needs

ir Pipe-cut & threaded fromV2” to 2” . ^  Water heaters

'k Pipe fittings-b iack, galvanized ^  Faucet parts.

★ Piastic Pipe Scheduie 40. ^  Lavatories in coiors y

u . . « . .  * M . r b l , t o p .0™M.rrDVat S *l"*® T a n k .

★ Seat., knoba, eommodas in co lo n . *  

k  Fibergiass tubs & showers in coiors

Highway 277 North  ̂ 387-2561

STORACE • CREENHOUSE 
WAREHOUSES 

FIELD HOUSES • CARACES

MORGAN BUILDING SYSTEMS 
3220 SHERWOOD WAY 

944-8696
S a n  A n ge lo , T e x a s

~ -. ".■’i l.

H. R. LITTLE CONCHO BUICK PRESENTS

%  A.P.R. 
FiNANCiNG

From  Nov. 1-Dec. 31,1982

ON ALL 1982
BUICKS & GMC LIGHT DUTY TRUCKS

SAVE AN 
AVERAGE OF
D ealer Contribution s M a y  A ffect C onsum er Cost

PLUS

“Wouldn't You Roally Rather Have A  Buick From H. R. Little

•B—od On N«w Car Rnarscing By G.M.AX.ln Sapt., 1982

Up To ^2500 OFF

1982 BUICK 
CENTURY

H.R.LIHLE

m BUICK- OPEL- MERCEDES - GMC

1909 W. BEAUREGARD

GMAC

655-9171

PROTECT YOUR FUTURE

You can make ketchup 
flow faster if you stick a 
straw  in to  the b o ttle  
when you first open it.

A brand 
for the future

Wade A, Moaiey 

Mgr.

WELCOME Tp 
BUSTER’S

Sonora’s Newest and Finest Liquor St^re.

★ Liquors
★ Beer
★ Wine
★ Gift Items

At Sensible Prices!

u
I «m _

I ia b e e r  .W IN E

b u s t e r s

Welcome Hunters
Sam DeChaero Owner

512 S.E.Crockett 387-2846

You’li Have Benefits Today, Retirement Income For Tomorrow And The Strength and 
Security Of First Hational Bank Of Sonora Throughout. A new federal law has made 
the benefits of an Individual Retirement Accoun« available to everyone, even those 
already covered by a pension plan. Previously, this plan was available only to those 
not covered by a pension plan. And the benefits are great both fo r today and fo r the 
retirem ent years to come. . _ -------

Retirement Benefits for 
Tomorrow

At End of Total Amount
Balance in 
Account

Year
5 $10.000

1 mieie»,i
$ 14.541

10 $20.000 $ 41,035
15 $30.000 $ 89.311
20 $40.000 S 177.277
25 $50.000 S 337.559
30 $60.000 $ 629.614
35 $70.000 $1.161.772 .
40 $80.000 $2.131.427

T h»ch»it to baled on $2.000 depiaiteJ at the fim  »rfeach y w  a* a 
latt o fl2%  uimpounded cuntinuouily.

Come in The First National Bank of Sonora and see Joy Kemp or Jo Ann Jones today 
and set up yo iir Individual Retirement Account Start accumulating your retirem ent fund 

as soon as possible.

Your INDEPENDENT Dank S ince 1900 

’■RATIO M A I.  I

S onora, Texas M em ber FDIG
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Joint Venture 
fo r Crippled

Children O ilfie ld  
Dec. 1Sole

Have you ever wanted 
to own a piece of the oil 
patch? An opportunity to 
bid at the Joint Venture for 
Crippled Children Oilfield 
Equipment and Services 
Sale Wednesday, Decem­
ber 1st at the Abilene Civic 
Center could make this 
dream come true!

C h alm ers  O p era tin g  
Company and Smalley 
Drilling Company are 
assigning to the West 
Texas Rehabilitation Cen­
ter a l/4 th  working interest

two Jones county leases 
for the JVCC Auction which 
benefits the handicapped 
children and adults of the 
Southwest.

The leases are 81.25 
percent working interest 
leases, aggregating 269 
acres (538 acres on a 20

a c re  c h e c k e r b o a rd e d  
basis), located two miles 
west of Stamford, Texas 
in the heart of Swastika 
country. Four separate 
interests of l/16th each will 
be auctioned at the sale. 
Chalmers Operating Com­
pany and Smalley Drilling 
Company will pay for all 
costs of this l/4th interest 
to the casing point, how­
ever, any completion and 
operating costs will be on a 
prorated basis. Chalmers 
Operating Company will be 
the operator of these 
leases.

Mr. and Mrs. Joseph L. 
Brown and their company. 
Energy & Mineral Explora­
tion, are also donating a 
l/32nd overriding royalty 
interest in a gas well locat­
ed in Eastland county. This

producing well has a good 
long payout history and is 
in the Marble Falls strata. 
Mr. and Mrs. Brown also 
are donating to the auction 
a 14 ct. gold-plated replica 
of an offshore drilling rig. 
The beautiful piece of art is 
33 inches tall, 24 inches 
long, and 17 inches wide 
and sits on a T-shaped 
walnut base. The drilling 
rig operates on batteries.

Clamers, the president­
elect of the WTRC Board of 
Directors, is looking for­
ward to presenting his 
donation to the sale audi­
ence. “ Every year we really 
have had a good time at the 
auction, and this year will 
be the same,” Chalmers 
stated. “ 1 look for hundreds 
of oil men to come and bid 
on this particular opportu­
nity to drill in Swastika 
country.”

The Joint Venture for 
Crippled Children cam­
paign is a joint effort bet­
ween the oil and gas indus­
try and the West Texas 
Rehabilitation Center for 
the treatment of handi­
capped children and adults. 
These patients are treated 
at no charge at the WTRC 
campuses in Abilene, San 
Angelo, and Snyder.

Production fo r December 
totaled 100 percent to r the 

70th month in a row

mian Lorp., 194,890, up 
5,147; Scurlock Oil Co., 
98,600, up to 3,600; and 
Western Crude Oil Inc., 
39,726, down 2,913.

Nugent reported that 
crude oil and petroleum

Democrat Party picks up 
26 new seats in House

In the election just com­
pleted, the Democrat Party 
picked up 26 new seats in 
the House of Representa­
tives while remaining even 
in the Senate. We hasten to 
add that the Permian Basin 
Petroleum Association does 
not endorse or work for or 
against any particular can­
didate or political party. 
We are only interested in 
their position on the free 
enterprise system and the 

■ domestic petroleum indus­
try.

After analyzing the 
changes in the House of 
Representatives, we con­
cluded that the House will 
be more liberal, and there­
fore, more likely to vote 
against the oil and gas 
industries. *

Shortly after the election.

the Chairman of the House 
Ways and Means Commit­
tee in Washington, Dan 
Rostenkowski, Spoke to the 
American Petroleum Insti­
tute in Houston. Rosten­
kowski said if President 
Reagan refuses to cut 
defense spending, and 
Congress balks at massive 
new social cuts, then major 
tax increases are a logical 
possibility.” He continued, 
“ The first place to look will 
be the energy industry... 
The oil industry will be 
in the line of fire.”

In other news. President 
Reagan is supposed to be 
leaning toward an increase 
of 5 cents a gallon in the 
Federal Gasoline Tax. If 
this becomes law, the 
money would be used for 
highway and bridge pro­
jects.

In the Permian Basin our 
rig count for this week is 
324. Last week 306 and one 
year ago, 491.

The Railroad Commis­
sion today set the Texas oil 
production rate for Decem­
ber 1982 at the market 
demand factor of 100 per­
cent for the 70th month in a 
row and the 126th time 
since the Commission first 
went to the ceiling level in 
April 1972.

Chairman Jim Nugent 
and Commissioner Mack 
Wallace directed the 
continuance of the maxi­
mum statewide allowable 
after receiving and review­
ing purchaser nominations 
for Texas oil in December 
totaling 2,468,988 barrels 
per day, a decrease of 6,210 
barrels daily when com­
pared with November 1982 
buyer requests. December 
1981 nominations totaled 
2,458,556 barrels dailv.

Next month’s permissi­
ble rate of output is calcu­
lated to average 2,920,027 
b/d with actual production 
estimated at 2.395 million 
b/d. The maximum allow­
able applies to all but 10 
fields in Texas that are 
assigned lower legal rates 
of flow for conservation 
purposes. Actual produc­
tion in December 1981 was 
2,434,982 barrels daily.

Nugent reported that 
December 1982 nomina-

J e z livingI
\  * Home^

NEW
Ju st Arrived

14x56  2 - b e d r o o m
VoM 'te ii ce iling  

F.'lh. F iirr. 'jlied

PER MONTH
Av̂ osonite'«
»15435

Cash P rice  $ 12,995 D e live red  8. set up 
$1,300 down IS yea r financ ing

14% annual percen tage  ra te
Open 

Sunday 
655 6784

EZ LIVING HOMES
2930 N. Bryant Blvd.

Wayne Walker 
Larry Hatfield

RISC Hotline
cuts, Gauges,

O il &  Gas Industry  
P lains Sales &  Service

Meiers
a n d  In d u s tr ia l  

O iK ie ld  an d

The Petroleum Industry, 
Security Council (PISC) oil 
field theft hotline became 
operational June 1, 1982. 
Thanks to the cooperation 
of many publications across 
the state, people are calling - 
1-800-OIL-COPS toll free to 
report oil field thieves. 
Information received on 
this hotline is being for­
warded directly and imme­
diately to law enforcement 
officials.

Oil field theft in Texas is 
costing citizens millions of 
dollars in higher prices and 
lost tax revenues. The 
OIL-COPS hotline, which 
offers anonymity to its call­
ers and a reward up to 
$5,500, is an ideal tool to 
fight this costly crime.

The OIL-COPS hotline 
programs must be made 
well-known to the public to

REPORT OIL FIELD THIEVES
1 -8 0 0 -O IL -C O P S

TOLL FREE • REWARD

be effective. PISC is a 
non-profit organization 
formed to support law 
enforcement efforts to deal 
with oil field crinjes and we 
need the public’s help.

I N f i l !
YOU CAN OWN 

YOUR HOME FOR 
LESS THAN YOU PAY 
RENT. INTEREST IS 
TAX DEDUCTIBLE 

EXAMPLE: 2 BEDROOM 
FULLY FURNISHED-FREE 

DELIVERY & SET UP 
WITHIN 100 MILES.

^ 9 9 5  DOWN AND

$ 1 3 0 ®° PER MONTH
15%  A.P.R.

Q - ^ U A
&  1,2, & 3 Bedroom Units

All-Electric Kitchens 
Yf Company Long Term Rentals

^ LUXURY APARTMENTS  
NOW LEASING 

Korner of Dollie & Tayloe 
(Sonora)

Mrs. Debbie Farrar 
203 E. Chestnut 

For Lease Agreements Sonora, Tx. 76950
& Information Contact:

Get m ore tru c k  fo r  ^ r l l u c k

DISCOUNT 
HOMES of

Son Angolo, Inc.
2502 N. Bryant Blvd. 

OFFItti (915) 658-3760 
OFFICE: (915) 658-3344 

HOME PHONE
SAA4MY........  655-5901
KEN.............  944r3915
DON....... ...653-1648

Burn iP -K a t in  yo u r,p icku p
Ifs Omn f  rovDH tkDusands of timos fhil oloan-burning LP- 

[gas oaa doHbla angiaa Ufa. Siaoa tha niost usad angina on tho 
]ranoh It |óur pieknp, this it tho ono that oan savo you tho 
most monoy. An Lf-gas powarad pickiir wM start faster, 
[Mrtorm hattar and oast lau to opara .̂ 
inn  W  por gaHoiTiy hnnlng propani.

[302-3013
Ozona Butano Op.

. , E m .Ava. E. Olona

tions for the purchase of 
Texas gas totaled 
21,971,593 Mcf/d (thou­
sand cubic feet per day). 
Gas nominations for 
November amounted to 
21,445840 Mcf/d. Decem­
ber 1981 gas nominations 
totaled 24,946,341 Mcf/d.

The next statewide oil 
and gas hearing will be 
held Thursday, December 
16, at 9 a.m. in Austin at 
the Railroad Commission 
headquarters building, Rm. 
107.

Major purchasers filed 
these floor nominations for 
Texas oil in December: 
Amoco Production Co., 
182,000 barrels daily, down 
1,745 from the previous 
month; Cities Service Co., 
74,000, unchanged; Cono­
co, 56,000, unchanged; 
Diamond Shamrock, 15,400 
down 500; Exxon, 278,200, 
down 1,800; Gulf 103,000, 
u n ch an g ed ; M ara th o n , 
67,420, unchanged; Phil­
lips, 70,000, unchanged; 
Shell, 167,300, up 1,500; 
Sun Refining and Market­
ing, 77,425, unchanged; 
and Texaco, 95,000, 
unchanged.

Significant changes in

nominations were submit­
ted in writing by these 
purchasers of Texas crude 
oil: Arco Petroleum Pro­
ducts, 125,000, down 1,000; 
Clayco Inc., 25,115, up 
1,975; Falcon Crude Trans­
port & Trading, 5,799, 
down 1,137; Geer Tank 
Trucks Inc., 10,665, up 
1,065; International Crude 
Corp., no nomination, 
down 12,500; Koch Oil Co., 
70,124, up 4,004; The Per-

products imported into the 
U.S. averaged 4,910,000 
barrels daily for the four 
weeks ending November 5, 
an increase of 37,000 per 
day for the same period last 
year.

J SS WABBING SER VICE
JIM nance:

Box 571
Eldorado, Texas 
I 76936

1

* ;

A i

915/853-320foi
915/853-337T}^¡

riji,

Eddins-Walcher
Propane Heating Fuel For Homes, 

Ranches, Mobile Homes. Ask About
* ■ ’ ■ .i

consigned gas and monthly b illing  
system. Located in Sonora to serve 
you better. 387-2319

3p;

OILFIELD DIRECTORY
The following OU Compuilee Support & Appreciate your Patronage In helping Sonora gfow

3flj„

amO 
■jnft

*1

Hurry Up 1 & No. 2
Q tmiii

oogcccooAccc*^^-^^
• Co. ii*c.§ Brooks Drilling Corporation!

KENNETH MINATRA
M INATRA ENTERPRISES, IN ili

R O T A TiN G  HEADS 
FLOAT EQ U IPM EN T (.ar> Mi.u.,.
AIR MIST ‘ ‘

«t-oiim__V

»oecccccioooooooeoeoeccovsccoso
Morris Brothers Const

G eneral O il Field C o m ra tio r  
2-wav R ad io  D is|)atched

Hwy. 277 S.

P.O.Box 1211 Sonora

Sononi I X
r i n i l  EING C H E M IC A I^

oecce ce eo e oe o sccccccceo co cco i«^

P O. Box H26 
Sofiora. Texas 76950

9I5/387-50ÍH 
915/3Ii7̂ 2676 
915/SS72H7

Localh, owned and opemted

'í j I
' s

>00900^

Hum

Wes-Tex Drilling 
Company

B ud Q uattlebaum
Í15/387-2115 Res. 915/3S7-3067

Raymond Brooks 
Presidevyi 

Kenneth .\iinotra
Vice-Prendent-Opemtions ------- ieyvuit-a

> O O O G C C O G C C C O G C C C e O G C O C C O S C C O ^ > ^
Texas Gulf Western Truck Lines 

Pole Trucks -  ^

o o o o c o s o o o o s e e c c c c e c c c c c e o o s e

m m v B N
AIR DRILLING- r i N C

■IpNRr

Heavy equipment M ovin f^  S 
Wench Trucks Rig Movesavb 
’ ickup Truck
all Den 387-3445 Lowboys^ S

Hot Shot Work
Pickup

Oilfield FioafsCall Don 387-3445eoso9oooso6GOoeeoeeecoooo990Qc<
Jimmy Condra 

387-3843 387-3179

,nA !

Ranch

00» SS2 
.3 'e»dS 769S0

t o s e o !
O il Fie

■'»ANDlLB
Mobile # 3 8 3964 
Ho"'e 387-56^9

»oaeoiseooQoaat w w i itai
Re»idciuial Commercial 

Farm
West Texas Portable Sandblasting

Sandblasting Pamiing C oaiing

Phone: 915/655-9030 Wall Rt. Terry Hann
OIT: 915/658-3491 San Angelo. Texas 76901 

Fgoccooeoocogcog»8?oooi^»BW h *4 w iw w oB»Poo^
Machine Shop

915-387.5367

Co - Bob Enterprises, Inc.

0ON 0HIDDLEHOOVER 0'-- 00» ’ '73 ' '
»sosooesoooeoococccccoeoeeeaeoQCCooooot

REESE WELDING  
& CONSTRUCTION

387-2167 387-2687
»aooogoaaooo&pecoaooooocooco ecoooeo

Hom^ Cooked Food! 387-9926
BIG TREE RESTAURANT^

24 H our Service fo r  
24 H our A Day W orking People
SAM ^ECHEARO. Oumer

»eoeoooeeooeooeoooeoeceeoeoooooscoeo

C rr/ /. Cahill, Inc. b
O ILFIELD  C O N TR A C TO R  ^

^ Telephone (915) 387-252  ̂ ^
Sonora, Tx. 76950

JincD • ;o
Jim m y T ia in e i r ? ‘ S  •’ ’ -an fia n  Q

Complete Oilfield m n  
■Services ^"*^8

,soooesoooeGOOOOQCcco'seoecoco6cccor^

WESTEX c o m m u n ic a t io n s ;^ h
OlTiH'f H l^ I VYirxHil«» T 0

{ ■j 'Ù Q
Ida 8
aJl 0

Direct dial mobile phone Land 
mobile radio .system 387-3831 

or Enterprise 80127
802 S W - Crockett

>eoo80ooaa<a<g<aao oaoeooooogigc<g^

ongbraitch Saloon
Free Buffett while you watch

Monday R ight F oo tba ll
E ro c k .tt---------------------------------

Sonora Auto Parts
We make Hydraulic hoses

105 S.W. Crockett

>UD 
ariiS  
\  fi
3 f l í  S  
b3j ^

laq
387-3255^

CHARLES HOWARD
General O.ilfield Contractor

387-S0&S 387-2270 387-2551
2 ie  HucLfpeth SonoraiooooooeioaoooaooBCCCCCCCCCccccccc<

haul trees 
work.

»ecoeccosoGO
PAINTING AND s m a ll  REPAIR INTERIOR/EXTERIOR

r

ELTON (DOC) ENGLISH
36 »EARS EXPERIENCE 

REFERENCES FURNISHEt

1103 Saveli 915-387-5142

Atlas Electric
Oilfield Industria l 
Residential .Servijrc 

387-56% H a / e l ( o n
ooeooooooooeooeooo:

We trim, cut & 
and we do yard 

387-5265
ask for Ramirez

ioasooaooeooeiooapococciccosecogig

TREY TRUCKS INC.
24 Hour Service 

853-2186

Dresser AHas

Bil UitkNi, Manager

Mesirl Harding 
‘Swabbing Sp>ecialists’ 

PO Box 504 S87-3502

»O O CCCCO G CO SCeCO pO G ^

ding Inc. ^
pecialists” |

S o n o ra -Ozona 
Oil Company

Jim EUiott Sonora Manager

u LI ij  ‘ '}'yo L y 7 \ loooooo o o o o o o co o o ni^o

OILFIELD SERVICES
387-3526 Acidizing Fracturing Cementing

Sand Control Products Tools Casing Hardware
Call
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Another new division 
of Tedford Jewelry

^ ^ S a v e  Money For The Holidays Save Monr

Santa Can't 
Bring It

But...
Pat Walker's 

Can!
Give your loved one 

a gift certificate 
from Pat Walker’s 

for Christmas.
And now through 

December 25th 
you can save $25.°°

Petroettes make
Thanksgiving baskets

for the boyscounts 
to pass out.

i
J.

5 r r

Blood Drive 
Dec. 2nd

A blood drive will be held Thurs­
day, Dec. 2 from 1 to 7 P.M.

It will be held in the Founders 
Room at the First National Bank.

We encourage you to give the Gift 
of Life.

'S é  i
R E ST A U R A N T  '

A Family Tradition of Fine Mexican Foods 
“Who says ^eat food has to be expensive?"

w..-

Landowners be 
aware when 
leasing land

PLAN TO EAT WITH US DURING YOUR CHRISTMAS SHOPPING AND 
TAKE ADVANTAGE OF OUR DAILY SPECIALS ALONG WITH OUR NOON 
BUFFEn SERVED SUNDAYS THROUGH FRIDAYS 11 A.M. - 2 P.M.

"OPEN 7 DAYS A WEEK FOR YOUR DINING PLEASURE/'
3108 Sherwood W ay  ̂ . 949-8275

janD ^JlE H E JlE H S nE H H JlS enE H Z JlE H lflE M a

CD

:ca
in

CALL TO D A Y  (o make your appointment for a FREE 
figure analysis and com plimentary first session. W e'll 
tell you how much you need to lose, how lo ng .il w ill 
take and the cost, based on a per session fee o f only 
S5.00.

Figure Perfection Salons International

211 Hwy 277 N Sonora Tx. 76950 387-3874

VISA Hrs. Mon-Fri. 7:30 a.m.-8:00 p.m.

Sat. 9:00-12:00 Noon

Save Money For The Holidays Save Mon

Leasing land for oil or 
gas exploration may seem 
like a windfall to some 
landowners, but it’s not all 
a bed of roses. Drilling 
activities can rape and rav­
age the land unless certain 
precautions are taken.

“ Landowners need to be 
aware of what is involved 
when they lease their land 
and what oil companies will 
do in terms of land manage­
m ent,’’ said Dr. John 
Sweeten, waste manage­
ment engineer with the 
Texas ‘Agricultural Exten­
sion Service, Texas A&M 
University System.

“ Proper site preparation 
and restoration by oil com­
panies is important if land- 
owners want their land to 
be productive again and not 
be an. eyesore,’’ noted 
Sweeten. “The keys to the 
success of this effort are to 
preserve’ and reuse the 
topsoil.’’

He suggested these land 
management steps before, 
during and after drilling 
operations.

To preserve topsoil dur­
ing site preparation:

-Remove and stockpile 
topsoil at the upslope edge 
or on one side of the drilling 
pad and working pit.

-Move subsoil down- 
slope to level the drilling 
pad.

-Excavate working pits 
and trash pits from the 
subsoil.

--To excavate reserve 
pits, push topsoil to form 
end walls and then subsoil 
to form side walls.

During drilling and im­
mediately therefifter, dili­
gent housekeeping is nec­

essary to prevent spills ot 
chemicals, mud, salt water 
and other materials, added

¡Tedford Jewelry’s

Sweeten.
Emptying wastewater 

and mud pits according to 
state guidelines as soon as 
possible facilitates backfill­
ing and land restoration.

Backfilling follows the 
reserve order of site pre­
paration:

-Redistribute subsoil 
from side walls over the 
reserve pit floor.

--Redistribute topsoil 
from end walls of the 
reserve pit. •

-Backfill working and 
trash pits with subsoil.

-Move subsoil back up­
slope from the downslope 
edge of the drilling pad.

-Redistribute stockpiled 
topsoil over the pad and 
working pit areas.

-Smooth the entire dis­
turbed area with a dozer.

To complete the site re­
storation process, Sweeten 
advised preparing a good 
seedbed and planting ap­
propriate grasses. Fertiliz­
ing, mulching to conserve 
soil moisture and control 
erosion, controlling weeds 
and protecting the area 
from grazing until grasses 
are well ' eltablished are 
also important practices.

■ çgip;.,-

For the
¥

" R i S T "  of
Your Life

WATERBEDS
TAKE ADVANTAGE OF OUR DISCOUNTS 

THROUGHOUT THE HOILDAY SEASON

WATERBED SHOP
3130 SHERWOOD W AY SAN ANGELO

J iLw  .c:WSt0383 -r., J Vj;; OStcJ
FREE SET UP AND DELlVERYh^

o

GRAND OPENINQ
The celebration of our new store has begun

Win one of twenty-five $25 gift 
certificates to be given away. Between 
now and December 11, register e\%ry
time you visit the store. No purch^e is 
necessary.
•You must be 16 or over to register for drawing 
•Gift certificates may be applied to new purchases 

only, not to existing charge account balances.
•You may win only once.
•Gift certificates must be redeemed by December 24 
•Drawing will be held Decemberl 1. ^

TEDFORD JEWELRY |
I

Downtown Sonora 387-3839 ^

Where

Good Food

IS our
Speciality

5 A.M .to 10 P.M.

The Fiddler invites you to 
join us for Cocktails & Dining

I

I 4 p.m. to 10 p.m.
\ Lounge Open 4 p.m. to 12 a.m.

i Daily except Sunday.

1603 Crockett
i

387-5559 i
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CCCIASSIFIED ADS sure to get resultQ^
Bmbjness Services'

H  Watch 80 channels in you 
home. Satellite antenniiB 
from S299S.00. For more 
information, call 858*8491 
or stop in at comer of 
Beauregard and Bryant in 
San Angelo. —- — ^

You can have a pleasant 
and profitable career sell­

ing  custom made lubricants 
to industrial, commercial, 

^  and farm accounts in your
area. Company paid train­
ing program. No invest­
ment or overnight travel.

I Must have experience with
diesel equipment. Call 

I collect, 1-214-638-7400.
Be a Tri-Chem Instruc­

tor. Have fun while you' 
earn. Call 387-2292 after 
6:00 p.m.

^  All types of roof repairs 
(9) and quality roofs. Kent

I Elliott Roofing 655-2800.
San Angelo, Texas.

Anderson
Bookkeeping Service 

-General ledger bookkeep­
ing-complete payroll ser­
vice-accounts receivable- 
accounts payable.

387-2450
Process mail at home: 

^  $30.00 per hundred! No
experience. Part or full 
lime. Start immediately. 
Details, send self-address­
ed, stamped envelope. 
Haiku Distributors, 115 
Waipalani Rd., Haiku, HI 
96708.

I will rake and bag your 
leaves. Call Sean Peek 387- 
5338 after 3:30.

A  Texas Refinery Corp. 
^  offers plenty of money plus 

cash bonuses, fringe bene­
fits to mature individual, in 
Sonora area. Regardless of 
experience, write A.B. 
Sears, Pres., Texas Refin­
ery Corp., Box 711 Fort 
Worth, Texas 76101.

Host Tri-Chem class and 
get free gifts for Christmas. 
Call 387-2292 after 6 p.m.

Real Estate
Wanted-land to lease for 

deer hunting. 4-8 people. 
Call (713) 447-3124. (8-10) 
p.m.
Large city lots. 10 per- ? 

cent down, 12 percenf'ln- 
terest for 2-5 years on 
balance. Restricted. Live- 
oak Valley Subdivision. Call

« Tommy Thorp at 387-2666 
or Charlie Graves at 387- 
I 3072.

Large restricted trailer 
lot in Eldorado for sale. 
853-2058.

20 acres river ft-ont in 
very scenic country. Cystal 
clear water. Great for fish­
ing and recreation. 995.00 
down payment >200.39 per 

^  month. Call owner 1 - ^ -  
W  292-7420.

125 acres hunting, $1095 
down. 220.27 per month. 
Big deer, javelina, quail. 
Owner will finance. Call 
1-800-292-7420.

Business
Building Materiats-2 alli 

steel buildings, brand new 
unassembled. Will sell 
cheap. Also, Dealer wanted 
for International Manufac­
turer, high profit margin. 
Call Wedgcor factory 
1-800-525-9240.

Business Opportunity- 
Dealer for International 
Steel building Manufactur­
er, full line of steel build­
ings including patented 
Agri. Building, high profit 
margin. Call Wedgcor fac­
tory 1-800-525-9240.

Wanted
8 Homes That Need 

Painting

Eight homeowners in this 
general area will be given 
the opportunity of having 
new United States steel 
siding applied to their 
homes with optional decor­
ative work. This new pro­
duct has captured the inter­
est of homeowners though- 
est of homeowners 
throughout the United 
States who are fed up with 
constant painting and other 
maintenance costs. This 
product can be used over 
any type of home, frame, 
stucco, brick, concrete and 
etc. It is guaranteed for 50 
years, and comes in a‘ 
choice of colors. It is now 
going to be introduced in 
this area, and we can make 
it worth your while if we 
can use your home for 
advertising.

Mail to
National Exteriors 

905 E. Walker 
Breckenridge, Tx. 76024 

or call collect 817-559-6725

Name______________
Address..- __
City . ^
Telephone - '

Mail coupon within ’ 3 
days for free gift.

Homes For Sale

House for sale-3 bed­
room, 1 bath, $18,500. 
387-3469 or 387-5475.

For sale by owner. 3 
bedroom, 2 full bath. Living 
room and large family 
room. Storage shed. Priced 
for quick sale. Call 
387-5386 for appointment.

For Sale-House for sale, 
2 bedroom, 1 bath. Priced 
for quick sale. Call 
387-3759 after 5 p.m.

Business & ^
^Professional Directory;

I Good, Used Furniture ^I  ......... . ,
9  Appliances, Antiques k  
9  New Linoleums k  
k  Gonzales Welding 2  
k 2 7 ^ o u t h 3 8 7 O 0 0 ^ 9

Barber Hairstylist 
Rebecca’s Style Shop 

Alley behind 
San Francisco St. 

Open Tues.-Sat. 9-5 
Phone 387-2056

A.P. Avila & Son 
SPRINKLER SYSTEMS 

Manual S> Automatic 
Reps rs and.
Trei chlng 

Call 387-3769

V ------------------------------TfiABC Fun Factory 9  
^Day Care Learning Center ̂  
9469 East Poplar-387-2120 k  
«Mon. Thru Fri.-8:00-5:00 k  
k  Ages 2 to 10 K

*------------ 5S The Window Charmer 
•• It you need drapes, blinds,

9  , bedspreads or any decorating 

%  I service, call and I will come 
k  to you. 653-6763 944-2328. 
k  1900 N. Bryand Blvd. ^  
2  San Angelo, Texas 769021

John’s Body Shop 
387-2802

N 24 Hour Wrecker Service !k 
k  387-2802-Day
k  387-2140-nlght C
g g

Live Oak 66 Station 
Diesel and Tire Repair 

Wash Jobs 
Phone 387-2740

5  Vasquez Carpentry Work k  
9 Welding, Carpentry :k 
k  Remodeling & Painting ^

P = 3
9  Continental Welding Ser- 
% vice
llron works, Fences, Ollfleli 
kOwner-Juan Manuel Mor- 
k  ales
?  387-5103 2

3  Coat^^Traile^oo^k  
k  AL HURLBERT k
^  387-5320 S
k  Price based on size- K 
lev erag e  price 12 x 60-$150S 

1^^ Materials Includedj J

.Ml Types 
Fencing.' Yard Work 

ustaboiii Ci.ntractors
RICHARD p. Sa n c h e z
105 Central'24 Hour Call 

. 387-5382
Sonora, Tx. 76950 •
¡CYNTHIA'S CAKES

. Hqcaemade ‘All Occminons 
Specialty Cakek Pio, Cookica, 
Cupcakes Bakes to ofder

106 Central Ave. -Sinalno
Sonar», Tx. 915-387-52S5 ’

2 dayi notice Plew

You can 
/advertise here’ 

for $2.50 
a week. ,

House for sale-3 bed: 
room, 1 bath and a half.. 
Carpeted, draped, paneled,' 
heated and cooled. Fire­
place. On lot and a half, 
close to school. Call 
387-3658.

Used Cars

1980 Chev. 3 1/2 ton, 
4-speed transmission, air 
conditioning and power 
steering. 31,000 miles. 
Very good condition. 
Asking $6,500. Phone 
392-3797 or 387-2053.

1977 Ford Courier Pick­
up, 5 speed transmission, 
41,000 miles. Asking 2,200. 
Good condition. Phone 
392-3797 or 387-2053.

For sale 1979 Ford half 
ton pick-up 460 engine, air 
conditioned, automatic, 
long wide bed. Call 
387-2068 or 387-2098.

For Sale-1981 Ford Cus­
tom Pickup, short wheel 
base, low mileage, top con­
dition. Call J. Galindo at 
First National Bank 
387-3861.

For Sale--1980 Chevy 
Chevette 4 door standard, 
air conditioned, low mile­
age, Call 387-3018 after 6.

1982 Silverado for sale- 
short wide bed, 4-wheel 
drive. Completely loaded 
plus extras. Take up 
payments. Call 387-3956.

1969 Chevrolet Malibu 
Hardtop $900 or best offer. 
Call 387-3835.

1969 Buick with 4 new 
radials. Call '387-3784 9-12 
and 1-5.
• For Sale-1976 Oldsmo- 
bile Cutlass Supreme. New 
oaint and tires, nice. Fully 
loaded. 392-3440 after 5:00.

Mobile Homes

For sale-14 x 80 Berkley- 
3 bedroom, 2 bath Central 
air all electric, located in 
J&V Trailer Park. Evenings 
387-5207.

1982 14x75 Redman Mo­
bile Home, furnished, 2 
bedroom, 1 1/2 bath, lots of 
storage space, dishwasher. 
387-2255 or 387-2671.

For Sale!
2 Bedroom 

1 bath 
Priced for

Comrriercial
Building

For
Lease

With Shop Are* & 
A W un Rack 

On Farm Road 1691 
Inside City Limits 
Call Frank Adidnt 

387-3154

For Sale-1980 14 x 64 
Breck Mobile Home. Excel­
lent Condition. Call 
853-2419.

Trailer house for rent in 
Sonora. Call 949-6463 or 
655-8720 or 658-5603.

1981 Mobile Home 14 x 
70 Fleetwood, 2 hr., 2 bath, 
Contact J. Galindo Jr. at 
FNB.

12 X 50 Mobile Home in 
good shape. $4800.00-- 
would make a fine hunter’s 
cabin. Call 387-3784 9-12 
and 1-5.

For Sale -8  x 35 2 bed­
room trailer. $2200 or best 
offer. Make a good hunting 
cabin. Call 387-5415.

Cervantes Mobile home 
repairs tractor with loader 
and blade, dump trucks to 
haul anything. Phone 
387-3^0.

For Rent
For rent-Kasey’s Korner 
1,2, & 3 bedroom units. 
Contact Debbie at 
387-2214

Storage units, $35.00 per 
month. Well lighted. 407 
S. Concho. Inquire at Long- 
branch Saloon.

Shurley E n terp rise s . 
Mini Storage. 8X12, $20.00 
monthly, 12X24, $45.00 
monthly. Phone 387-3619 or 
387-2140.

For rent in Sonora-2 
bath all electric trailer. Call 
Sonora 387-2261 or Com­
stock (915) 292-4610.

Help Wanted
RN’s needed on rotating 

shifts, full or part time work 
available. Contact Lillian 
Hudspeth Memorial Hospi­
tal. 387-2521.

Help wanted. Apply in 
pe r s on .  Longbr a nch  
Saloon.

Wanted: Semi-retired
couple to manage apart­
ments. Call Debbie at 
387-2214.

Taking applications for 
cashier at Hurry-Up. Apply 
in person at the Hurrv-Uo.

Will do housecleaning- 
mornings only. Call 387- 
5682 before 10 a.m. or after 
6 p.m.

Bobbie S m ith 
Real Estate 

For Sale

2 bedroom, 1 bath, furnish­
ed Mobile Home.

Lovely, Spacious, 4 bed­
room, 4 bath home, kitchen 
with bnlltins, study, 2 fire­
places, formal dining room, 
pool with guest house, sit­
uated on 5.27 acres. Owner 
will consider financing. 
Shown by appointment 
only,

Large 4 bedroom, 2 bath 
brick home with 2 fire­
places, basement, on large 
corner lot, doable car 
garage and doable carport.

20 acres near town. Ideal 
building site for quiet conn- 
try living.

tn
Call for details: 
Bobbie Smith 

Broker 
387-2728 

After 5:00 p.m.

Morgan Roofing 
&

Remodeling
Travis Morgan

Box 91
Sonora Tx. 76950 

387-5604 
Free Estimates 

15 Years Experience

We need assistance in 
evaluating and responding 
to daily work reports sub­
m itted by our agents 
throughout the state. No 
experience necessary; Pail 
to complete training. Work 
at home. For information 
s e n d  s e l f - a d d r e s s e d ,  
stam ped envelope 91/2 
inches long to AWGA, 
Dept. E, Box 49204, Atlan­
ta, Ga 30359. Earn $4.87 an 
hour.

Livestock

William B. Wilson Angus 
Production Sale at 12 Noon 
on Oct. 5th at the ranch 
near San Angelo, Tx. 59 
Performance Lots sell 2 
year old bulls, pairs trans­
plants. Big, Big Angus 
Cattle. For Info. Call: 915- 
465-4259.

Horses for saIe-2 gentle 
ranch horses $400.00 each. 
10 miles N or Sonora. No 
phone. Write Folks-Drake 
ranch Eldorado Rt. 4 Son­
ora Texas 76950.

For Sale

For sale-struction pipe 
and rods. 2 3/8 inch, 2 7/8 
inch 41/2 inch 3/4 inch and 
7/8 inch. Call after 5:00 
853-2473.

For sale-Frigidaire elec­
tric range. Call 387-2736.

For sale-Brand new box 
springs, mattress, and 
frame. $50.00. Call 387- 
2945 after 5:00 p.m. or 
387-2507 and ask for Kristi 
before 5:00 p.m.

For Sale-2 bicycles in 
almost new condition.

1. Ladies 3-speed green 
bike, named “ Escape” . 
Needs no repairs. Reduced 
price due to depressed 
economy. $65.00.

2. Girl’s bike (blue). Cus­
tom designed handlebars to 
simulate “ 10 speed” . Ex­
cellent condition. Outgrown 
early, so is for sale for only 
$55.00.

387-5570 after 4 p.m.

For Sale-Tool box for 
wide-bed pickup $30. Prac­
tical handyman encyclope­
dia set, 22 volumes, $75. 
Call 387-3400 or come by 
Lot No. 41, J&V Trailer 
Park after 5 p.m.

For Sale-Good used car­
pet. 387-3658.

For Sale-House sitting 
on two large lots corner of 
104 4th St. Sinalovia. Phone 
915-653-4614 in San 
Angelo.

For sale-plywood deer 
blinds. 853-3314. . Fred 
Logan.

1973 Midstream. 30 ft. 
5th Wheel travel trailer. 
Clean and pulls good. 
$5745.00 Call 387-3667. ,

Angus 2 year old bulls for 
sale. Grain fed commercial 
quality Angora billy goats. 
Juno Ranch Co. Frank Fish. 
387-3980.

“Horizon”
Now Taking 

Booking For End 
Of Year Parties.

Professional 
Progressive Country
Call Pefe Akel

942-0069

Tri-Chem liquid em­
broidery sale and other 
items til August 5. Call 
387-2292 after 6:00 p.m'.

Pool tables for sale. In­
quire at the Long Branch 
Saloon. 407 S. Crockett.

Off ice For Rent

Small retail or office 
space. 35 x 13 available 
Hwy. 277 N. Shopping Cen­
ter. 387-5235.

Wanted
Wa n t e d -  - Tu t o r  for  

French course--must be 
college level French, tutor­
ing for explanitory 
purposes. No homework or 
papers. Call Nancy at 
387-3157.

We can do for work. 
Many things: telephone
lines, water sewar lines, 
backhoe, rock sawing or 
boarding. 915-653-4888 or 
658-7034.

Big Tree Restaurant
Breakfast

Hot Biscuits & Gravy 

•Lunch 

•Dinner 

•Short Orders 

Steak 

•Chicken 

■Catfish

•Mexican Food 

Homemade Pie

Oj>en Every Day 
24 Hours

Sam DeChaero 
Owner

1009 S.W. 387-9923 Crockett

82 CLEARANCE
HERE’S ONE EXAMPLE OF OUR LOW PRICES!

1982 C hevro le t F leetside P ickup
LIST $10,635°°

Air Conditioned 
Power Steering 
Power Brakes 
Automatic Speed Control 
AM/FM Stereo 
5.0 Litre V8 Engine

3-Speed Automatic Shift

$9,325 ’•I'miiniiHuii

WE HAVE A GOOD SELECTION OF ‘82's LEFI
i

1982 Buick Riviera
DieseLEngine Loaded .  n e n  

7200 Miles $14,350

1982 Chevrolet 3/4 Ton Pickup
Stepside 4 Wheel Drive 

Automatic Shift ipO fSfSID

1980 Ford Thunderbird
Automatic Shift Power 

Air Conditioned Economical C R  D Q R  
_______6-cylinder Engine ^

1979 Pontiac Grand Prix L J >
All Power Accessories A j -  0 |||> 
One Owner 36,000 Miles, v O y O w f U

Buis
At

See Sam Dillard or Tony Wallace

Chaparral Motors
(Formerly Ken Braden Meters)

IH -10 a t Golf Couroa Road 381-2629
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BEffl m  CBMPElinOM FOOD TflLDB M
Charmin

T oiletTissue 4 roU Pkg.

Tide

D etergen t
Nabisco,
Prem ium  ,

C rackers bL

5 lb. 4 ox. Box

Keebler, 
Pecan Sandies

C ookies 13 oz, Bctg
. •

Prego Plain,
ivith meat or mushrooms

S p agh etti
Sauce 32 ox. Jar

Parade

T om ato  
Sauce 8 ox. Ckm

Parade
Creamy or Chunky

P eanutB u tter  18 ox. Jar

Downy

FabricS o ften er  64 ox. Bottle

Cascade

D ish w ash er  
D etergen t

G ebhardt’s

R efried

5 / S l

50 ox. Box

Beans 16 ox. Cans 3 / $ I

I S

Solo, Clear Plastic

D rin k in g
G lasses Pkg. o f 50 16 ox.

H andi'W ipes Package o f 8

L iqua 4

S k in  C leanser

A rtic-X

A nti'F reeze I  G al

5 ox.

2 1/2 ox.

^ LKHD O UKES 
i \  MARGARINE LandrO-Lakes

Oleo 1 lb. 1/4’s 2/89 '
> SPERRY AND < 

HUTCHINSON 1

C huck
R oast
C huck
S teak
A rm

R oast
E nglish  

C ut R oast

U.SD.A. B eef

U.SD.A. B eef

U.S.D.A. B eef

U.SD.A. B eef

A rm
S w iss S teak  U.SD.A. B eef

G round
C huck
G round
R ound

Price’s

Cheese and  
Bacon Spread

U.SD.A. B eef

U.SD.A. B eef

7 1/2 ox. Tub

Carl B udd ig ’s

Lunch M eats 2 V2 ox. Pkg.

Texas, Brick

C h ili
C h ili Meat

1-lb. pkg.

U S.D A. B e ^

L s

Bananas

P otatoes

Cabbage

O ranges

Lem ons

O nions

Del M onte

U.S No. 1 10 lb. Bag

A ll Green

Calif. Sunkist Navels

Calif. Sunkist
each10/$1

Yellow

G rapefru it R uby Red
each 4 / S l

STORE HOURS 
7:30 AM to  6:30 PM

' VALUE 1 Î/3  MILLS
ESTABLISHED ! 

1896 •

FOODWAY
SPERRY AND  

HUTCHINSON

We Accept 
USDA

Food Stamps

L 1 MMMV 4 H I«.

Locally Owned and Operated

387-3708

E ffec tiv e : W ed. D ec. i  
T h ru  T ues. D ec. 7 th .

VALUE 1 3/3 MILLS ‘
ESTABLISHED c 

1896 5

T uesdays

D ou b le  S&H G reen S tam p s  
^  5 W ed. an d  F ri. w i t h  a $5®» 

r Z b  p u rch a se  or m ore,
e x c lu d in g  B eer an d  W ine.


