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According to a news release 
received this week from the 
West Texas Chamber of 
Commerce, Texans will pay an 
estimated S24 billion in 
Federal Taxes.

That figure is just over 5% 
of the total estimated Federal 
tax of $1,440 billion.

Pause with this country boy 
for a few minutes and try to 
figure out how much 24 billion 
is.

ps

Pause

ps
Well, I still can’t compre­

hend that much money, but as 
near as 1 can compute it would 
take about 700 years to strike 
24 billion characters on this 
typewriter at the rate now 
used to publish the Free Press 
each week. * *

ps
According to the WTC of C 

news release $24 billion is ten 
times the total profits of the 
400 largest corporations in 
Texas during 1973. After 
recent comments concerning 
obscene profits of large 
corporations, J. Fike Godrey 
of the WTC of C suggest 
senators discuss obscene Fed­
eral taxes and spending.

ps
Don’t forget the Haskell All 

Sports Banquet February 12, 
at the Elementary School 
Cafeteria at 7 p.m.

WORKSHOP
The annual Haskell Crime 

Prevention and Drug Educa­
tion Workshop will be held 
Thursday, February 3rd, 7:00 
p.m., at the Haskell National' 
Bank Community Room. Mrs. 
Betty Davis, Haskell and 
Rochester school counselor, 
has announced that the 
subject will be, "A  Study of 
Drug-Taking Teen-agers.”  
The workshop will be conduct­
ed by Aubrey Headstream, 
Director of Tri-County Mental 
Health Clinic. The public is 
invited and there is no charge 
for the workshop.

Newspaper 
Seminar At 
PC School

An interesting seminar was 
conducted recently by Mrs. 
Maxine Hamilton, County 
School Librarian, who was 
assisted by Mrs. Shirley 
Medford during her English 
classes.

The classes had a two hour 
seminar to study newspaper 
arrangement, terminology, 
and influence on public 
opinion. November 3 was the 
target date. Newspapers from 
24 states were ordered for this 
issue.

The students compared the 
amount o f news coverage 

-3'ven to the candidates by 
different states. One of the 
most interesting features was 
how the headlines carried the 
election. The letters varied in 
height from one to four inches. 
They, also compared the price 
of groceries, rent, cars, 
appliances, and employment 
ads. Some students enjoyed 
different comic strips found in 
other papers.

Two of the more interesting 
papers came from St. Louis 
and Honolulu. The photo­
graphs of “ The St. Louis 
Dispatch”  were almost com­
pletely in color. It had 
beautiful colored photographs 
of Missouri fall scenes as well 
as many other colored photo­
graphs including the St. Louis 
Cardinals. The Honolulu 
papers had only the hrst page 
in English. The rest of the 
paper was written in an 
Oriental language. As a 
result, not much was read past 
the first page.

Topics studied included 
syndicated columns, types of 
editorials, sources of news and 
photographs, and journalistic 
writing styles.

Haskell-Aspermont 
Split Two Games

Haskell Indians and Maid­
ens continued district play 
with 2 games last week. The 
Maidens defeated Aspermont 
69-43 with Kern Kemp power­
ing in 41 points. Kemp was 
extremely hot throughout the 
games. At times, she looked 
as if she could not miss. 
Sherrie Everett also played 
well at forward with 11 points. 
Jeanette Randle scored 17 
points. On Friday night, the 
Maidens did not fair as well as 
Rotan defeated them 67-51.

Kemp again had a good 
game as she scored 29 points. 
Randle had 20.

The Indians also won one 
and lost one last week. 
Aspermont defeated the In­
dians 61-58. The Indians led 
almost the entire game but 
could not hold off the hot 
shooting Hornets in the last 

T  quarter. Gary McAdams was 
the high point man in 18. 
Jimmy Browning and Chris 
Colbert played their best 
games of the season. Colbert 
scored 13 and Browning 12. 
On Friday, the Indians defeat­
ed Rotan 59-29. McAdams

was again the high scorer with 
14.

The Jayvees had their local 
tournament last weekend with 
the boys taking first and the 
girls third. The Albany girls 
drove Haskell to the losers 
side by defeating them to the 
tune of 46 to 34. High point 
was Terri Therwhanger with 
20 points. On Saturday, the 
Maidens defeated Wylie for 
3rd place by a score of 40-31 
with Therwhanger getting 19 
points.

The Jayvee Indians defeat­
ed Albany in the 1st round by 
a tally of 64-42 with Gideon 
getting 22 points. Then on 
Saturday, the Indians played 
their best game of the season 
edging out Aspermont 54-53. 
The scoring was well balanced 
with Gabriel Capetillo getting 
21. Greg Gideon scoring 10 
and Don Horton, playing his 
best game, scored 10.

In other games last week 
the boys defeated Aspermont 
63-56 and Rotan 35-25. The 
girls lost to Rotan 36-20.

Stats on Page 2
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FIRST PLACE WINNERS in the District 111 Food Show held Jan. 
22, in Wichita Falls were Gena Fischer and Kay Campbell. Gena 
placed first in breads and desserts and Kay placed first in main 
dishes. Both will compete in the State Food Show in June. 
Receiving blue ribbons in the junior division were: Ember Miller, 
Kathy Campbell, Julie Patty, and Kim Campbell received a red 
ribbon in the senior division. (Staff Photo)

Fair Board Elects Officers
The board of directors of the 

Haskell County Fair Associa­
moli met January 20, with 
twenty-two members present 
to elect new officers for 1977.

H. V. Woodard, president, 
conducted the business ses­
sion and election of officers.

Bob Beauchamp, secretary- 
treasurer, gave the final 
financial report from the 1976 
fair.

C. A. (Bud) Turnbow was

Flippin 
Is Named 
New Coach

elected president for 1977. 
Other officers are: first vice- 
president, Bill Comedy, 
second vice-president, C. A. 
Thomas and secretary-trea­
surer, Ted Elliott.

It was decided that a 
membership drive will be 
conducted during the near 
future. All members of the 
board announced that they 
were extremely pleased with 
the 1976 fair and are currently 
making plans for an even 
better event for 1977.

DON FLIPPIN 
New Head Coach

The Board of Trustees of the 
Haskell Independent School 
District has hired Don Flippin 
of Iowa Park as head coach 
beginning with the school year 
this fall.

Flippin is a graduate of 
Colorado City High School and 
McMurry College. He has 16 
years experience as a coach in 
Hale Center, Dallas. Ballinger 
and Iowa Park.

While head coach in Ballin­
ger he had a 20-2 record.

He is currently looking into 
the possibility of coming to 
Haskell the last month of this 
school year, and plans to move 
here sometime in July.

He and his wife. Sheila, 
have two sons, Kirk. 14, and 
Lane. 11. They are members 
of the Baptist Church.

Flippin will replace Tommy 
McAdams as head coach. 
McAdams resigned his posi­
tion after football season last 
fall, following five years as 
head coach.

McAdams said he will begin 
a construction business in 
Haskell and will do residential 
and light commercial con­
struction.

Engineer 
Addresses 
City Council

Billy Jacobs, of Yeatts and 
Decker Engineering reported 
to the members of the Haskell 
City Council Tuesday night 
that with approximately two 
months of good weather, the 
construction on the new 
wastewater treatment plant 
will be finished.

Jacobs told the council that 
the weather had been the 
biggest problem faced in the 
project and that they were 
looking forward to better 
weather for a speedy comple­
tion of the plant.

In other council action 
Mayor Belton Duncan announ­
ced that the City had received 
a Sales Tax Check in the 
amount of $2.268.67, and 
discussed new regulations on 
Revenue Sharing funds.

Members of the council also 
agreed to lease a dozier for a 
two month trial period. The 
machine will be used at the 
City Dump and the trial period 
is to decide what type of 
machine will best suit the 
needs of the City.

Councilman Guy Kennedy 
opened the meeting with 
prayer. Others attending were 
Mayor Duncan, Councilmen, 
E. J. Stewart, Bob Philpot, 
Earl Proctor. Loraine Johnson, 
City Attorney Joe Williams. 
Water Supt. Marvin Collins, 
and City Sec. Desmond 
Dulanev.

WEATHER SUMMARY 
January 18-25 
By Sam Herren 

TEMPERATURE
H i............. 5 8 ° ................21st
L o ..............1 7 ° ................18th

RAINFALL .
Total..................................0.26
Total to D ate ..................  0.99
Normal to D a te ..................075

Chamber Banquet Feb. 25
The date for the 41st annual 

banquet of the Haskell Cham­
ber of Commerce has been set 
for Friday, February 25th. at 
7:30 p.m., in the Elementary 
School Cafeteria, according to 
information released by Mrs. 
J. A. Bynum, banquet chair­
man.
. Dr. Thomas K. Kim, presi­
dent of McMurry College of 
Abilene, will be guest speaker 
for the occasion. Dr. Kim is 
widely known and much in 
demand as an after dinner 
speaker and chamber officials 
are elated that he accepted the 
invitation to serve in that 
capacity for the annual event.

Dr. Thomas K. Kim became 
the eighth president of Mc­
Murry College on June 1, 
1970. He came to McMurry 
from Texas Tech University, 
where he served as professor 
of Economics. He was on the 
Tech faculty from 1965 until 
1970. While at Texas Tech, 
Dr. Kim was active also in 
administrative capacities. He 
was elected by his colleagues 
in the School of Business 
Administration as the Chair­
man of the Faculty. In this 
capacity. Dr. Kim helped 
reorganize the faculty and the 
curriculum in the School of 
Business Administration.

Dr. Kim was born in 
Shanghai, China, of South 
Korean parents. Dr. Kim 
came to the United Slates in 
1948 to attend Berea College 
in Kentucky and has been in 
this country since that time. 
He became an American 
citizen in 1960. After receiving 
his Bachelor of Arts degree in 
Economics from Berea College 
in 1952, Dr. Kim received his 
master of Business Admini­
stration degree in general 
business at Indiana University 
in 1954 and his Ph.D. in 
Economics at Tulane Univer­
sity in 1961. Dr. Kim was 
awarded the Honorary De­
gree, Doctorate of Humanities, 
by Southwestern University in 
Georgetown, Texas.

He met the young lady who 
was to be his wife at Berea 
College while she was a 
student and while he was 
teaching there in 1957-1958. 
Dr. Kim and Martha now have 
two children, Larry and Cathy.

Dr. Kim is an active United 
Methodist layman, holds 
many memberships in pro­
fessional organizations, and is 
author of several works. His 
book. "Introductory Mathe­
matics for Economic Anayl- 
sis,”  has been published by 
Scott, Foresman and Com­
pany.

During a special meeting of 
the board of directors of the 
chamber Monday evening the 
following officers were elect-

Rule P. 0.
Contract
Awarded

The U. S. Postal Service has 
awarded a contract to build 
and lease a new post office in 
Rule, Postmaster Wanda 
Townsend said here.

The contract was awarded 
to Mr. and Mrs. Jack Proctor. 
Southern Construction and 
Maintenance Co., 1416 Irvin 
Lane, of Irving. Texas.

The new post office building 
will have 1,454 sq. ft. of 
interior floor space and will be 
located on a 19,600 sq. ft. tract 
of land on the northeast corner 
of Sixth St. and Sunny Ave.

Construction costs will be 
paid with private funds and 
the building will be leased to 
the Postal Service for a basic 
period of ten years with 
renewal options of 20 addition­
al years.

The new building is expect­
ed to be completed in August 
1977.

ed: President, Wayne Lehrer; 
first vice-president. John 
Wayne McDermett; second 
vice-president, John Sam Rike 
111; treasurer, Franciene John­
son.

Holdover directors are: 
John Rike III, Joseph Thig­
pen, Gene Long. Wayne

7 To Show 
In Ft. Worth

Seven youth from Haskell 
will be entered in the Junior 
Show at the 81st annual 
Southwestern Exposition and 
Fat Stock Show during its 
ten-day run Jan. 28 through 
Feb. 6.

They are Kim Hager, Stan 
Hager, Reida Mullino, Cindy 
Thomas, Mikeana Wilcox, Joe 
Wilfong, and Zack Wilcox.

The young people will be 
competing for premiums total­
ing almost $60,000. Entries 
have been posted in divisions 
for steers, beef breeding 
heifers, dairy cattle, breeding 
sheep, lambs, barrows, and 
student teams in judging 
contests for livestock, poultry 
and eggs and identification of 
range plants.

” We are encouraged by the 
increasing numbers of young 
people who exhibit each year 
at the Stock Show.”  said W. 
R. Watt Jr., general manager. 
"It gives us a brighter outlook 
for the future of the agricul­
tural and livestock industry.”

In addition to prizes earned 
in competition, youngsters 
showing prize-winning live­
stock receive additional money 
when their animals are sold in 
the Sales of Champions for 
steers, barrows and lambs. 
Young showmen last year 
received more than $123,000 
from the three auctions with 
many using their money for 
further education and train­
ing.

The Stock Show recognizes 
youth with a Special day. 
Rural Youth Day is Saturday, 
Jan. 29, and Tarrant County 
Public Schools Day is Monday, 
Jan. 31. First National Bank of 
Fort Worth will honor young 
exhibitors at a Sunday break­
fast at 7 a.m. Jan. 30 in the 
Round Up Inn on the show 
grounds.

Lehrer, Busier Ghols<in. Don 
Comedy. Joe Cortez. Larry 
Gilliam and John Wayne 
McDermett. Newly elected 
directors from the recent 
ballot mailed to the member­
ship are Jim Bynum, J. B. 
Gipson. J. A. Carroll. Edith 
Wheatley, Franceine Johnson 
and Ted Elliott. These elected 
directors with the nine hold­
over directors will comprise 
the 15 member Board of 
Directors.

The tickets for the banquet 
will be $5.00 each and will go 
on sale in the immediate 
future and it is hoped that an 
exceptionally large turnout of 
members and guests will be 
present for the annual event 
on February 25th.

Other special features of 
this year’ s banquet will be 
announced later.

Lions Club
Soliciting
Applications

Applications for summer 
camping fun for diabetic 
children in the Haskell are 
now being sought by members 
of the, Haskell Lions Club.

The Texas Lions League, 
which has operated a crippled 
children's camp at Kerrville 
for 24 years, is again offering 
two camping sessions at two 
different locations for its 1977 
program.

A two-week .session at 
Camp Manison near Friends­
wood for diabetic children 
from six through sixteen, from 
June 6 through June 17, is 
limited to 150 campers.

Another two-week session is 
scheduled from Monday, 
August 1 through Friday 
August 12, at Texas Lions 
Camp for Crippled Children, 
Kerrville, for 150 diabetic 
children from six through 
sixteen years of age.

Both sessions are free for 
eligible campers.

For more detailed inform­
ation about the various Lions 
Camp programs, you are 
urged to contact Jimmy 
Owens. President of the 
Haskell Lions Club at 864-2181 
or 864-2077.

1

TOO COLD FOR SNAKES... Books and articles tell you that in 
cold weather snakes are hibernating in deiis and will not be seen, 
but these two four foot long rattlers proved last week that snakes 
can't read They were killed by Morris Haynes near his house.

(Staff Photo)
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NOTICE

Due to the hookkeeping 
Involved and the high postal 
rates,we ask that you please 
remember that classified ads 
are cash in advance uniess you 
are a business firm or have an 
established credit with the 
Haskeli Free Press. Either 
mail your ad with check or if 
you need assistance in writing 
It we will be happy to help 
you. Rates are 5c per word 
first insertion, 4c thereafter or 
minimum of Si.50

NOTICE 
The Haskell Free Press 

reserves the right to edit 
and/or delete all news stories 
and locals for length and 
liability and to refuse to print 
anything deemed not newS' 
worthy, ;i,'.

NOTICE
Please'notify 'us of your 

change'^of address. If you do 
not, the Post Office charges us 
25c for each time the Haskell 
Free Press is'returned to ns, 
this plus the cost of stencils, 
time and labor can make your 
move costly to ns. In the 
future, fyilnre to notify us will 
result in one month being 
deducted from your sub­
scription.

FOR SALE: Baled hay. Call at 
night 817-658-3868. 2-7p

McCu llo ch  c h a in  s a w
HEADQUARTERS. A saw for 
every job. See new. Woodard 
Farm Sale. 7tfc

WOODARD FARM SALES— 
Ford tractors, equipment, 
Jong harrows, Lilliston-Hes-
ton-Oliver plow parts. 4tfc*.__________ •:> __
FOR SALE: Iron at wholesale 
prices. Rounds, flats,'' sheets, 
square tubing, channel etc. 
Haskell Trailer Builders. 20tfc

DUE TO ILL HEALTH am 
selling 4020 JD tractor & full 
line of 6 & 7 row equipment: 
Ford tractor; Danuser post 
hole digger. T. B. McMeans, 3 
miles SW of Rule. 53-5c

FOR SALE;'  ̂"Johnson CB, 
telephone type, $125.00. Cali 
864-2306 after 5:00 p.m. 3-4c

FOR SALE: • ¡Used Kenmore 
range. Reasonable. Call 864- 
2837 after 5:00 p.m. or See at 
1703 N. Av G after 5:00 p.m.

3-4p

FOR SALE: Regulation Snook­
er table $300.00 Call 743-3332 
Rochester. 3-4p

FOR SALE: Massey Ferguson 
510 Combine, 20 ft. header, 
diesel engine, 72 model, real 
good. Vernon Wofford, Rt. 2, 
Stamford, 915-773-2089 . 4-6p

VERY LIMITED SUPPLY 
Desk Pad Calendars now in 
stock. Haskell Free Press.

FOR SALE: 1976 Chev.
Cheyenne pickup, long-wide 
bed, loaded; 1972 Pontiac 
Granville; 1962 Chevy II. Call 
864-3631 or 864-3602 . 4-5c

FOR SALE: 1968 Ford pickup, 
SWB, clean. Call 864-3512. 4c

ONION PLANTS 35c, Pecan 
Trees $7.25, Fruit Grees, 
$3.95; Fruit less Mulberries, 
$4.95; Rose Bushes, $1.89; 
Flowering shrubs, bushes, 
hedge plants and much more 
at Gann’s Greenhouse and 
Nursery 1 'A ! blocks north of 
the depot in Rule. Call us at 
997-2169 or 997-2469. 4c

r .  MISCELLANEOUŜ
DON'T wet that carpet. See 
HOST Dry Cleaner. Sher­
man's Carpets & Interiors.

I 33tfc

WANTED: Good used furni­
ture and appliances. We buy 
and sell. Lee Used Furniture 
120 N. Swenson St. (one block 
north of red light on hiway 
277) Stamford, Texas. Phone 
773-5608. 42tfc

f Ĵ ISCELLANEOOŜ
LET^US SHOW you State 
Farm's Hospitalization and 
Disability Policies. 6% New 
Car Financing. 15% deviation 
on auto. 20% on Home 
Owner’ s and Fire. 75% 
Dividend on Life Insurance the 
23 year. Leo Fetsch Insurance, 
422-4259. 38tfc

LECITHIN! Vinegar! B6! 
Kelp! Now all four in one 
capsule, ask for VB6-I-, 
Johnson Pharmacy. 3-4p

WANTED

ATTENTION: We will have an 
auction Sat. Jan. 29th starting 
at 10:30 a.m. We would like to 
have your consignments, cars, 
trailers, boats, farm equip­
ment, furniture, appliances 
and anything of value. No 
worthless junk please. We 
have a fenced in area under 
lock and key so you can bring 
your merchandise at anytime, 
inside or out. Phone (817) 
864-3197 for more inform­
ation. LACKEY’S Hiway 380 
East, Haskell, Texas 3-4c

WE MAKE pictures from 
pictures, restoration work as 
well as copy work from color 
and black & white prints. 
Blackstock Studio. 4c

HAVE A HIGHLY profitable 
and beautiful jean shop of 
your own. Featuring the latest 
in jeans, denims and sports­
wear. $13,500.00 includes 
beginning inventory, fixtures 
and training. You may have 
your store open in as little as 
15 days. Call any time for Mr. 
Wilkerson (501) 847-2241 or 
847-4050. 4-5p

SOUP’S ON, the rug that is, 
clean with Blue Lustre. Rent 
electric shampooer $1.00. 
Perry’s. 4c

THE NORTHEAST DOOR will 
be open Tuesdays & Satur­
days from 9:00 until 5:00. Will 
sell on 50% commission or will 
buy outright. Mill ends, 
zippers, patterns, etc. Prices 
slashed to rock bottom. Must 
make room for new merchan­
dise. Behind Christene’ s 
Beauty Salon, 208 N. Av E, 
Haskell. 4c

THREE FAMILY Garage Sale 
Sat. only, 9:00 to 5:00. Boy’ s, 
girl’ s, ladies’ . Men’s clothing, 
coats & sweaters. 1410 N. Av 
K. 4p

FLEA MARKET on highway, 
Rochester. Novelities, Re­
cords (78-45), antiques, furn­
iture, refrigerator, rock equip­
ment, Little League bulbs. 
Steer stadium seats. Lots of 
new stuff. Coffee 5c cup. 
Sluefoot. 4c

WANTED: All kinds of elect­
rical work. Call Eddie Mc- 
Keever 864-2464. If no answer 
call 864-3653 . 3-4p

WANTED: Custom plowing. 
Call 864-2320 or 773-5155,3-4p

BABYSITTING AVAILABLE 
Contact Carolyn Abila 1010 N. 
Av D. Haskell. 4p

BABYSITTING DONE In your 
home or my home. Will 
babysit Monday thru Satur­
day. Pre-school age preferred. 
If interested call 864-3498.

4-5p
FOR CUSTOM Treflan Appli­
cation, call Donnie King, 
422-4795. 4-5p

WANTED: Experienced trac­
tor driver and farmhand. Don 
Nanny. 4tfc

WANTED: Rattlesnake dens 
to be hunted. Call days, 
864-3033 or nights 864-3672, 
askforGwvnn. 4-6c

I H I E f SUIWD
LOST: Norwegian Elkhound. 
Missing since Jan. 15. If found 
please notify Alvin Singleton, 
505 North Av B, Haskell, 
Phone 817-864-2754. 4p

REWARD: For information
leading to the arrest of person 
or persons breaking windows 
at Aline’s Antiques (corner at 
red light). Contact Mr. and 
Mrs. Floyd Bristow, Rule, 
Texas. 4c

WANTED

cFOR RENTf

FOR RENT: 2 bedroom brick 
veneer apt., carpeted, central 
heat & cooling, carport. 
Available to look at. Call 
864-3272 or 864-2631. 3-4c

IN STAMFORD: McHarg
Manor, 2 bedroom unfurnish­
ed apartment, upstairs, no 
children or pets, all electric 
kitchen. Call 915-692-5797. 4c

FOR RENT: 2 — one bedroom 
furnished apartments, bills 
paid. Contact Dee Lamed, 
864-2611. 4-5c

FOR SALE: 235 acres, 3 
bedroom modern house, 2 
tanks and 2 good wells. 200 
cultivation Phone 915-823- 
2918. 3-6p

FOR SALE: House at 205 N. 
Av F. If interested contact 
Shelby Johnson, 864-2565.2tfc
. ■ - --<■ . -------  - - .

FOR SALE: Well-built 3
bedroom home in excellent 
condition; 1385 sq. ft.; good, 
quiet neighborhood conven­
ient to town and school; 
70x165’ lot with large cellar; 
house comes with dryer and 
double-oven stove. Shown by 
appointment only. 704 N. Av 
F. Call 864-2018 after 5:30.3tfc

XEROX
COPIES

Haskell Abstract & 
Title Company

10 N Av D 
Haskell, Texas

864-3610 Itfc

NOTICE
HUNTERS & TRAPPERS 

BIG DEMAND FOR 
COON AND OTHER 

FURS
Fur Company Buyer vfiU 

be in Haskell from 
12:15 tiU 1:00.

Every Sat. in Dec. & Jan.
West side of Court House 

Your buyer is 
Vernon Hayden 

Pbone 817-559-3584 
Red & Loresta 
Veale Fur Co.

Route 3 Ranger, Tx 76470 
Phone 817-647-1906 
“ Yon Catch ’ em and 
We wiU Stretch ’ Em 

Traps for Sale 
Balts for Sale

WANT TO LEASE FOR OIL 
DRILLING: 200 acres near 
Jud, was leased for 2 years, 
but turned back without 
drilling. Has enough oil under 
it to float a battleship. If 
interested see L. B. White at 
Leisure Lodge, 864-3337 or 
Ben Charlie Chapman. 2-5c

W f . ) )

NOTICE
Notice to banks of Haskell 

County, as authorized and re­
quired by Article 2544 V.C.S. 
State of Texas, the Commis­
sioners Court of Haskell 
County at their regular meet­
ing place will accept bids for 
designation as County De­
pository for Haskell County 
Funds and Haskell County 
School Funds until 10:00 
o ’clock A.M. Monday, Feb­
ruary 14th, 1977, Any banking 
concern within the county 
desiring appointment as de­
pository will file their bid 
applications with the County 
Judge of Haskell County, and 
must be in his hands by 10:00 
o ’clock A.M., February 14th, 
1977. B. O. Roberson, County 
Judge. 3-4c

PUBLIC NOTICE
Commissioners Court of Has­
kell County, Texas will take 
bids for the sale of two 
pickups. One 1974 Ford Half 
Ton pickup, radio, heater and 
air conditioner. Wide box, 
short wheel base. One 1961 
Chev. half ton pickup, long 
wheel base, step side bed. 
Can be seen at Free. #1 barn, 
Rochester, Texas. Bids will be 
opened at 10:00 A.M. Feb­
ruary 22, 1977. Commission­
ers Court has the right to 
accept or reject any and all 
bids.

B. O. Roberson
County Judge
Haskell Co. Judge 4-5c

STOCKHOLDERS MEETING
Notice is hereby given that a 

meeting of the stockholders-of 
THE HASKELL NATIONAL 
BANK of Haskell, Texas will 
be held in the Community 
Room in the City of Haskell, 
State of Texas on the second 

' Friday iri ^February, A.. D. 
1977, the,same being the Tlth 
day of said month, at 3 o ’clock 
in the afternoon, for the 
purpose of electing a board of 
directors for said bank and the 
transaction of such other 
business that may properly 
come before said meeting.

Pauline Couch
Asst. Vice-Pres. and Cashier 

4-6c

NOTICE TO BIDDERS;
Haskell County precinct #3 

wants bids on new motor 
grader of newest and latest 
design, with operating weight 
including cab not less than 
twenty-six thousand pounds 
(26,000).

Machine to be powered by 
four cycle diesel engine not 
less than (125) one hundred 
twenty-five SAE net horse 
power. Transmission can be 
either power shift or constant 
mesh not less than six forward 
& three reverse, steering may 
be mechanical with hydraulic 
booster. Frame can be either 
rigid or articulated with power 
steering. Tires to be 1300 X 
24-12 ply, four wheel hydrau­
lic brakes on equal hydraulic 
controls.

Cab to have tinted glass, 
heater & defroster, front and 
rear windshield wipers and 
ROPS Protective. Moldboard 
to be Thirteen foot (13) with 
two foot extention, power 
sliding right or left and end 
bits. Warranty to be Factory 
warranty for one year.

As partial payment, one 
Huber 4D-115 and one Huber 
10-D motor graders. Trade-ins 
may be inspected at Commis­
sioners shop. Precinct #3. Bids 
will be opened and read at 
10:00 A.M. Date: February 
14, 1977. County reserves the 
right to reject any or all bids.

4-6c

FOR SALE 
GOING BUSINESS 

CAR WASH 
Lot 100x288 
NElst St.

Haskell. Texas 
HERRENINSURANCE 

PHONE 864-3322
27tfc

INSTANT CASH for any 
good merchandise, modern 
or old. Phone 864-3197 
anvtime.

LACKEY’ S
Throckmorton Highway 

Haskell, Texas
____________________ 21tfc

I I U M . I
AN ORDINANCE PRO­

HIBITING THE SALE, DELI­
VERY OR GIFT TO ANY 
PERSON UNDER 17 YEARS 
OF AGE OF CERTAIN TYPES 
OF GLUE AND CEMENTS: 
MAKING IT UNLAWFUL 
FOR A PENALTY NOT EX­
CEEDING $200.00 FOR VIO­
LATION AND DECLARING 
AN EMERGENCY.

WHEREAS, the Police De­
partment of The City of 
Haskell has advised there 
have been reported cases of 
juvenile sniffing of airplane 
glue during the past year; and

WHEREAS, the practice 
results in harmful effects upon 
the health of individuals 
employing this practice; and

WHEREAS, current easy 
access and availability of 
certain types of glue and 
cements to juveniles consti­
tute an aid to said harmful 
practice; and

WHEREAS, it is in the 
public interest and welfare to 
regulate the sale of glues and 
cements containing volatile 
solvents; NOW THEREFORE: 
BE IT ORDAINED BY THE 
CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY 
OF HASKELL:
SECTION 1. Except as other­
wise provided herein no 
person shall sell, offer for 
sale, deliver or give to any 
individual under the age of 17 
years any glue or cement 
commonly known as model 
airplane glue, plastic cement, 
household cement, cement, or 
any other similar substance, if 
such glue or cement contains 
one or more of the following 
volatile solvents:

1. Toluol
2. Hexane
3. Trichlorethylene
4. Acetone
5. Teluene 

Ethyl Acetate
7> Methyl Ethyl Ketone
8. Trichloroethane
9. Isopropanol

10. Methyl Isobutyl Ketone
11. Methyl Cellosolve Acetate
12. Cyclohexanone 

SECTION 2. The provisions of 
Section 1 of this ordinance 
shall not apply where the glue 
or cement is sold, delivered or 
given simultaneously with and 
as part of a kit used for the 
construction of model boats, 
model airplanes, model auto­
mobiles, model trains or other 
similar models.
SECTION 3. It shall be 
unlawful for any person to 
inhale any glue or cement 
containing one or more of the 
solvents named in Section 1 
hereof with the intent of 
obtaining intoxicating or nar­
cotic effect thereby.
SECTION 3A. Any person who 
shall violate any of the 
provisions of this ordinance 
shall be deemed guilty of a 
misdemeanor and, upon con­
viction thereof, shall be 
punished by a fine not to 
exceed $200.00.
SECTION 4. WHEREAS, an 
emergency is apparent for the 
immediate preservation of 
order, good government and 
public safety that requires this 
ordinance to become effective 
at once: therefore, upon the 
passage of this ordinance by a 
majority vote of the members 
of the Council, it shall be 
effective from and after the 
date of its passage.

PASSED AND APPROVED 
this 11th day of January, 1977. 

J. Belton Duncan 
Mayor

ATTEST:
Desmond Dulaney
City Secretary

__________________________ 4c

FOR ALL YOUR GENERAL 
PLUMBING NEEDS.
Call Philpot’ s Supply 

& Service Center. 
864-3010

4 Itfc

GIBBS PAINTING
.Acoustical ceilings; Panel­
ing; All wood shingle roofs; 
Small repairs. Ph. 915- 
773-5488. l-8p

ELECTRIC SEWEROOTER
Cleans clogged pipes, 
drains, sewers. NO dig­
ging. NO damage.
Philpot’ s Supply & Service 

864-3010

Obituaries
Mrs. Adams

■Mrs. Howard Lee (Georgia) 
Adams, 44, of Abilene died at 
7:20 p.m. Tuesday, Jan. 18 
after a lengthy illness.

Born March 3. 1932, in 
Burkburnett, she grew up 
there. She married Howard 
Lee Adams Sept. 20, 1958, in 
Abilene. They lived there from 
1958 to 1965 when they moved 
to Odessa. They returned to 
Abilene in 1975. She worked 
for Mobil Oil Co. until she 
moved to Odessa in 1965. She 
was a member of the Baptist 
Church.

Survivors include her hus­
band; three sons, David 
Wayne, Brian Lee and Mich­
ael; all of the home; three 
sisters, Mary Hendricks of 
Modesta, Calif., Lillie Beckett 
of Burkburnett and Emily 
Trivitt of Fort Walton Beach, 
Fla.; and two brothers, Mike 
Hrazdil of Burkburnett and 
Donnie Hrazdil of Wichita 
Falls.

Mr. Adams is the son of Mr. 
and Mrs. W. J. Adams of 
Haskell.

PUMPS
Irrigation-Domestic 
Formation Testing 

Well Drilling
We pull & repair all makes. 

REA PUMP CO. 
Throckmorton Highway 

Haskell, Texas 
Call 24 hrs.—864-3372

4 Itfc

PHILPOT’S DITCHING 
SERVICE

Plastic pipe & fittings, 
sewer pipe. Water & gas 
lines run. Call Philpot’ s 
Supply & Service.

864-3010
15tfc

ELECTRIC MOTOR repair 
& service. New & used 
motors in stock.
Philpot’ s Supply & Service 

864-3010
2 Itfc

JUNK-A-TIQUES, glassC 
ware, furniture, baby bed, 
books, dishes, bottles, doll 
Kleenex box, dolls, misc. 
We buy, sell or trade. We 
trade books. 1704 N. First 
St. Mrs. Harley Langford.

ANDRESS ROOnNG 
Winfred Andress

Residental and Commercial 
713 S. 10th St.
P. 0. Box 463 
Ph. 864-3078 

Haskell. Texas 
_____________________ M iv

PENNSYLVANIA DUTCH
Candies for those with 
more good taste than 
money. Sassafras Drops 
59c pkg. Root Beer Sticks. 
49c pkg.

Sherman’s Interiors 
& Antiques 44tfc

HOT WATER HEATER 
HEADQUARTERS

State-Rheem-Phillips 
A. 0 . Smith (Glaseóte) 

Gas or Electric 
864-3010

Philpot’ s Supply & Service
15tfc

CARD OF THANKS
We would like to express 

our sincere thanks to our 
friends and neighbors for the 
prayers, visits, flowers, food 
and many acts of kindness 
shown us at the death of our 
loved one. May God share his 
blessings on each of you. The 
family of D. C. Wester, 
mother, Dewie E. Wester, 
sister, Jo W. Fry and nephew 
Billy K. Fry. 4c

CARD OF THANKS
We would like to express 

our sincere thanks to our 
friends and neighbors for the 
prayers, visits, flowers, food 
and the many other acts of 
kindness shown ns during the 
illness and death of our dear 
mother and grandmother. Our 
special thanks to the Haskell 
Doctors and Rice Springs Care 
Home in Haskell for the 
special care during the 13 
years she lived there. May 
God’ s blessings go with you 
always. The family of Olive B. 
King 4p

î ^ a s k r l l  \Sxvq&
Established January 1. 1886 

PUBLISHED EVERY THURSDAY
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T E X A S
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BILL COMEDY—Publisher 
DON COMEDY— Editor

Entered as second-class matter at the postoffice at Box 
577, Haskell. Texas 79521, under the Act of March 3. 
1870.

SUBSCRIPTION RATES 
In Haskell and Adjoining Counties ^

Sub T^x Total f
One Y ear......................................... $ 5.00 .25 $ 5.25
Six M onths......................................$ 3.00 .15 $ 3.15
Two Years....................................... $ 9.50 .48 $ 9.98

Elsewhere in Texas
One Y ear......................................... $ 6.00 .30 $ 6.30
Six Months......................................$ 4.00 .20 $ 4.20
Two Years......................................$11.50 .58 $12.08

Outside of Texas
One Year.................................................................. S 8.00
Six Months...............................................................S 4.50
Two Years................................................................ $15.50

NOTICE TO PUBLIC—Any erroneous reflection upon 
the character, reputation or standing of any firm, 
individual or corporation will be gladly corrected upon 
being called to the attention of the publishers.

Statistics
GIRLS PF FTA FTM FG
Haskell 20 18 14 17 69 25 24 15 27s
Aspermont 11 16 8 8 43 24 24 9 17

Leading Scorer: Kem Kemp, 41
hHaskell 14 14 14 9 51 17 22 11

Rotan 15 14 18 20 67 21 20 9 29
Leading Scorers: Kemp, 29; Randle, 20.

BOYS PF FTA FTM FG
Haskell 20 14 10 14 58 20 6 4 27
Aspermont 16 16 12 17 61 14 24 15 23

Leading Scorer: McAdams, 18
Haskell 8 17 20 14 59 19 31 19 19
Rotan 2 9 10 8 29 22 19 7 U

LeadÍDg¿coror: McAdams 14 J«.T. --it ’C

Violations
Concern
Police

Haskell Chief of Police Jim 
Toland this week expressed 
concern over the growing 
number of empty alcoholic 
beverage cans and bottles 
being discarded along streets 
in Haskell.

Chief Toland said that it is 
unlawful to consume alcoholic

beverages on a street or 
parking lot in the city limits 
and that if the littering 
continues, suspected violators 
will be checked and pro­
secuted in an effort to stop the 
offenses.

Toland also expressed con­
cern over the increase in 
vandalism to street signs and 
automobiles parked along side 
streets.

He asked that any citi^n 
witnessing any act of v5n- 
delism call the police depart­
ment and that violators will be 
prosecuted. ^

PUBLIC TOOL 
AUCTION

NAME BRANDS INCLUDE
Rockwell - Skill - Chicago Pneumatic - Rodac - Fuller - 
Cummings - Miller - Her Brand - Brown - Marflow - 
Shopmate - Wright - Wen - McGraw Edison - Diamond 
Loy - Lufkin - Ingersoll Rand - Waterloo Channel Lock - 

Remington - Falls

Location: 3rd and Gail Street 
Munday, Texas
Date: January 29, 1977 Time: 1:00 P.M.

FLOOR JACKS AIR COMPRESSORS TABLE SAWS

Air impact wrenches 3/8 - 'A - % - 1"; Circle Hand 
power saws; Saber Saws; Orbital sanders; Electric . 
impact wrenches: Disk Grinders and Buffers: Electric 
drills (all sizes); Air power chisel, drills & sanders; 
Bench vises (large and small): Hydraulic jacks: Bench 
grinders; Large assortment of socket sets Sizes 'A, 3/8,
'A, Vi\ Extension Cords; Open and boxed end 
wrenches; Paint Brushes: Impact sockets, 3/8, '/:,
Torque wrenches; Pipe wrenches; Fire Extinguishers: 
Allen wrenches; Electrical tape; Truck tarps; Work 
Gloves; Tap & Die sets; Drill bit sets; Universal socket 
sets: Battery chargers; Channelock tools; Hand tools 
(hanimer, pliers); Carpenters tools; Metric socket .sets; 
Metric Wrenches; Framing Squares; Drop cords; Cable 
power pulls; Hacksaws; Hacksaw blades; Creepers; 
Trouble lights: Yard lights: Jumper cables; Reciprocal 
saws; Adjustable wrench; Air hoses: Torch hoses; 
Screwdriver sets; Transistor radios.

Auctioneer Note: Sale items can be inspected 
One Hour Before Sale Time!

CASH OR APPROVED CHECK WITH PROPER I.D.
Not Responsible for Accidents or Property After Sold.

Not Responsible for changes Due to Strikes 
and Shipping Schedules.

If Tax Exempt - must show Number.
-Merchandise Guaranteed- 

By Factory Warranty
OWNERS WREN'S TOOL SUPPLY c o m p a n y .

Route Two. Box 182. Celeste, Texas 75423

Auctioneer: Rocky Ash
License No: TXGC-77-0095 

Clyde, Texas 915-893-5663



Big Country 
RC&D Has 
Meeting

V  The Board of Directors, Big 
^^Country Resource Conserva­
is tion and Development Area 
i* held its annual meeting at 
Ï; Hickman’s Restaurant in As- 
is permont last Wednesday, 
is Representatives from the 
i' nine counties in the Big 

Country Resource Conserva- 
Js tion and Development Area, 

Scurry, Mitchell, Nolan, Fish- 
Jt er, Jones, Kent, Stonewall, 

Haskell and Knox were 
present.

Kent County Judge Norman 
Hahn, of Jayton, Chairman of 
the nine county Big Country 
RC&D Area presided.

Soil Conservation Service,

Area Conservationist Joe Mc- 
Entire of Abilene, designated 
SCS representative to the Big 
Country RC&D Area and Big 
Country RC&D Chairman 
Hahn reviewed activities and 
accomplishments in the Big 
Country Resource Conserva­
tion and Development Area 
during 1976. McEntire also 
reviewed the status of Re­
source and Development 
Areas and Projects in Texas as 
of this date. He and Hahn also 
made assignments for deve­
lopment of additional resource 
date during 1977.

The goal of the Big Country 
Resource Conservation and 
Development Area is to 
improve the economic and 
social environment of the 
area.

Von Kleibrink, Project Co­
ordinator, Four Winds RC&D 
Project presented a slide 
program on projects and 
activities in the Four Winds

w
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Vbur C h a n c e  
to  S a ve  on 
Fam o u s

ONE BIG 
GROUP

BIG COUNTRY RESOURCE CONSERVATION AND DEVELOPMENT AREA OFnCIALS— left 
to right: Soil Conservation Service Area Conservationist Joe McEntire, Abilene, designated SCS 
representative to the Big Country RC&D Area. Kent County Judge Norman Hahn, Big Country 
RC&D Chairman: Mitchell SWCD, Chairman Jimmy Harrison, Big Country RC&D Director; 
George Rhoads, Stonewall County, Big Country RC&D Vice-Chairman: and Walter Stiri, Upper 
Colorado SWCD representative to the Big Country RC&D Area.

Bone,Brown

and Black 
Pat

Reg. $26.99 

and $28.99

NOW $19.99
 ̂ HEIDENHEIMERS

RC&D Project during the past 
year.

Judge Norman Hahn of 
Jayton was re-elected as 
Chairman; George Rhoads of 
Old Glory was elected Vice- 
Chairman, and J. Morgan 
Wright of Roscoe was elected 
Secretary-Treasurer. Direct­
ors are Jimmy Harrison of 
Colorado City and Jimlee 
Baucum of Anson, Chairman 
of the California Creek SWCD.

The Big Country Resource 
Conservation and Develop­
ment Area serves Counties in 
the Big Spring, Abilene and 
Vernon Soil Conservation Ser­
vice Administrative Areas. 
SCS Area Conservationist 
attending were McEntire of 
Abilene, Earl D. Archer of Big 
Spring and Joe P. Henson of, 
Vernon.

California Creek Soil and 
Water Conservation District 
Secretary-Treasurer R. V. 
Earles serves as the District’ s 
representative to the Big 
Country RD&D Area.

Attending from Haskell 
County were California Creek 
SWCD Director R. V. Earles 
and Soil Conservation Service

District Conservationist J. C. 
Yeary of the Haskell Field 
Office.

STOCK M A R K E T ^
The market at Haskell 

Livestock Auction was higher 
on a run of 1080 head of cattle, 
142 hogs, and no sheep and 
goats at its sale Sat. according 
to James Powell reporter. All 
classes higher, plenty buyers 
on hand.

Butcher calves: choice, 30- 
32; good, 28-30; standard, 
26-28; rannies, 24-26.

Cows: fat, 23-26; cutters, 
20-23; canners, 15-20; stock- 
ers, 24-26. 160-200.

Bulls: bo logna, 30-34; Stock­
ers, 33-36; utility, 26-30.

Stocker Steer Calves: choice 
36-40; good, 33-36; medium, 
30-33; common, 25-30.

Stocker Heifer Calves: choi­
ce, 30-33; good, 28-30; med­
ium, 26-28; common, 23-26.

Feeder Steer Yearlings: 
choice, 35-38; good, 33-35; 
medium, 30-33; common, 26- 
30.

Feeder Heifer Yearlings:

VALUE « 
SPEEJAÜULAR

28” 6IANT-SCREEN CONSOLES
DIAGONAL

featuring ZENITH COLOR SENTRY.:, 
the automatic picture control system

Í-

Z e n ith ’s Color Sentry’" does it all 
for you: controls the color picture 
when the scene changes, or the 
channel changes, even when the 
room light changes. You get that 
great Zenith picture—automatically.

M ed ite rran ean
The CORSICA • H2526

Dark Oak color 
(H2526DE) or Pecan color 

(H2526P). Genuine wood veneers 
and select hardwood solids on top. 
Front, ends and base of simulated 
wood in matching finish. Casters.

m

Early A m erican
The PEMBROKE • H2524M

Genuine Maple veneers 
and select hardwood solids 

on top. Gallery, front, ends and 
bracket feet of simulated wood 

in matching finish. Casters.

T ransitional
The WHITBY • H2522E
Genuine Oak veneers and 
select hardwood solids on 
top and ends. Front and 
base of simulated wood. 
Entire cabinet finished in 
Antique Oak color. Casters.

C ountry F rench
The BRITTANY • H2530E

Genuine Oak veneers and select 
hardwood solids on top and ends. Front 

and base of simulated wood. Entire cabinet 
finished in Antique Oak color. Casters.

E V G -E lectron ic  Video Guard Tuning  
System
O ne-Knob VHF and UHF Channel 
Selection
100% Soiid-S tate Titan - Chassis 
Power Sentry Voitage Regulating System

STOP IN TODAY-choose the style that's right fbr you!

Owens Radio & Electric

choice, 30-33; good, 28-30; 
medium, 26-28; common, 24- 
26.

Cows & Calves: good,
250-300; plain, 200-250.

Top hogs 37.75 to 40.00 cwt. 
Sows 29.00 to 33.00 cwt. 
Boars 17.00 to 24.25 cwt. 
Shoats 30.00 to 35.00 cwt. 
Pigs 8.00 to 17.50 head.

- H o s p i t o I ^ I M o t e s

ADMISSIONS
MEDICAL: Avila Cosildo,
Haskell; Martha Darr, Knox 
City; Jewell Matura, Knox 
City: Jack Harvey, Haskell; 
Carl Fischer, Haskell; C. W. 
Whittemore, Rule; Jo Ann 
Perez, Haskell; Annie Vrzalik, 
Stamford; Donna Martin, Has­
kell; Otie Mayfield, Weinert; 
Gerry Cox, Haskell. 
SURGICAL: Richard Fagan, 
Haskell; Vera Geraldine 
Josselet, Weinert.

DISMISSED
Morris Jones, Hilary Stone, 
Rose Phillips, Joe Martin, 
Lucy Tennon, Thelma Barker, 
Noia Covey, Alice Lewis, 
Kattie Wolf, R. W. Tumbow, 
Wilma Kardokis.

The ladies from the First 
United Methodist Church 
came out Monday morning 
and led the group in singing 
and a devotional. This was 
enjoyed by all the residents.

Elgin Wright from Rule 
visited Sam Wright.

Melba Stowe from Olney 
and Floyd Stewart from 
Seymour visited Mrs. Eunice 
Stewart.

Jean Bell from Rule visited 
her father W. F. Goad.

Jo Simpson was back after 
the icy weather and gave a 
very inspiring devotional 
Wednesday morning. Mr. 
Randolph Wilson taught the 
Bible Study Class Wednesday 
night. We are studying the 4th 
and 5th chapters of James.

Mr. and Mrs. Leon Biffle 
from Rule came Wednesday 
afternoon and showed the 
residents some of their films 
of the animals and the hunting 
trips which they have taken 
while living in Alaska.

The C. B. Rhea Musical 
group came Thursday night 
and entertained the residents 
with some good old time toe 
tapping music.

Mrs. Johnny Pumphrey 
from Old Glory visited Mrs. 
Elizabeth Yakey.

Bill Mannings from Knox 
City visited Claude Sanders.

Netia Leggitt, Bettye Sue 
Wolfe and Lesia Leggitt from 
Abilene visited Mrs. MaeBelle 
Turnbow.

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Vojkufka 
Gay, Ray Timms and Jackie 
Davis from Lubbock and Mr.

and Mrs. Henry Vojkufka from 
Weinert visited Mrs. .Annie 
Vojkufka.

Mrs. Irene Yarbrough and 
Mrs. Hazel Almond from Rule 
visited Mrs. Dessie Marion 
and Miss Velda Carter.

Mrs. Mary Place from Rule 
visited Mrs. Mary Bradley and 
Mrs. Charity Bradley.

Also visiting Mrs. Bradley 
were Mrs. Eva Pennman from 
Knox City. Mrs. Irene Yar­
brough. Mrs. Hazel Almond, 
and Mr. and Mrs. Arlis 
Brothers and daughters from 
Rule.

The ladies from the Haskell 
First Baptist Church WMU led 
by Mrs. Tom Holland and 
Mrs. C. V. Schwartz gave a 
very inspiring service.

We welcome two new 
residents to Rice Springs this 
week, Mrs. Ethel Johnson and 
Mrs. Maude Bowman. Both 
ladies are from Haskell.

Davis Jones from Stamford 
visited his brother. Willard 
Jones.

Mr. and Mrs. Leon Stewart 
from Rising Star, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Jimmy Stewart from 
Abilene visited Mrs. Eunice 
Stewart.

Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Mc­
Guire from Weinert visited 
Mrs. Maggie McGuire.

Mr. and Mrs. Hollis Rucker 
from Sunray, Mr. and Mrs. 
Grady Bristow, Mr. and Mrs. 
Raymond Smith from Rule, 
and Johnny Johnson from 
Lubbock visited Trudie Bush.

Mr. and Mrs. Gentry Day 
and Mrs. Mertie Barnard from

Knox City visited Mrs. Emma 
Banner.

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne 
Phemister and Helen Boykin 
from Weinert visited Mrs. Ida 
Phemister.

Mrs. Zina Bills. Mr. and 
Mrs. E. O. Morgan from Rule 
and Mrs. Parish Keller from O 
'Brien visited Mrs. Ora 
McCollough.

Mr. and Mrs. G. A. 
Bradford from Peacock and 
Mrs. Faye Cox from Claire- 
niont visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Sam Bradford.

Mr. and Mrs. Johnny 
Spitzer and son from Sagerton 
visited Mrs. Lillie Spitzer.

Mr. and Mrs. Gary Posey 
and children from Longview. 
Mr. and Mrs. O. O. Posey and 
Juanita from Knox City visited 
Mrs. Edna Collins.

Mr. and Mrs. A. E. 
Brothers and Sandra from 
Rule visited Joe Teague.

Mrs. Lucy Yarbrough from 
San Angelo visited her mother 
Mrs. Eunice Thornhill.

Otto and Lula Peiscr from 
Lubbock visited Mrs. Martha 
Peiser.

Louise and Jo Tucker from 
Lubbock visited John Diggs 
and A. T. Lassetter.

We extend our heartfelt 
sympathy to the families of 
Mrs. Olive King and Mrs. 
Annice Parish. Mrs. King 
passed away Thursday. Jan­
uary 20. Mrs. King had been 
a resident at Rice Springs 
Care Home since March 18. 
1964.

Mrs. Parish had been a Rice 
Springs resident since Feb­
ruary 1976. She passed away 
in the Haskell Hospital Jan­
uary 17th.

Try the new “ Sharpie”  pen. 
Permanent on most surfaces. 
Ideal for labeling frozen food 
packages. In 8 Colors. Only 
49c. Haskell Free Press.

THE INSURANCE 
ENGINEERS

When it comes to your money . . . take o tip from 
us and trust your security problems to the best. 
Our engineered insuronce progrom shows up when 
trouble comes. Why not come in ond let us look at 
your present policies. We ore qualified to give you 
expert advice on any insurance problem you moy 
hove.

LANE DURHAM AGENCY
510 N. 1st St.

Phone 864-3216 
Haskell, Texas

NC

LET’S VISIT...
Solomon looked around one day and saw 
the many things to which he had given 
emphasis: learning, pieasure, and the 
accumulation of money. He asked himself 
if it was ail worth it (Eccl. 2:22) No! It 
wasn’t worth it! After trying everything 
the world had to offer man, Solomon 
concluded it was all “ vanity” (Eccl. 2:11).

Interesting, isn’t it? Life without God isn’t 
life at all!

LARRY SUTTLE, MINISTER

The Bible Says: “ Let us hear the conclusion of the whole matter: Fear 
God, and keep his commandments: for this is the whole duty of man.” 
(Eccl. 12:13).

CHURCH OF CHRIST
510 N. Avenue E.

‘DEDICATED TO THE RESTORATION OF 
NEW TESTAMENT CHRISTIANITY”

Schedule of Services: 
SUNDAY
9:45 — Bible Study 

10:30 — Worship 
6:00 — Worship & Classes

WEDNESDAY 
9:30 — Ladies Class 
7:00 — Bible Study

NAME

ADDRESS

Q  Please enroll me in a free Bible Correspondence Course 
Q  1 would like to study further the Bible 

□  I need transportation to Bible study and worship services

(Clip & Mail)

Want your children to attend Sunday School? One of our colorful joy 
buses will gladly pick them up and return them safely to your home. 
Just call 864-3101 or 864-2772.
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“ WHERE YOUR DOLLAR BUYS MORE”

DOUBLE
S & H GREEN STAM 

WEDNESDAYS
With The Purchase 
0I S2.S0 Or More

Specials Good 
Jan. 27-Feb. 2

JEWEL

GAL. PLASTIC JUG
(NO RETURN JUGS)

SHORTENING

^ " ^ g o l d m e d a l \

f FLOURS
5 LB.
BAG

4 2 0 Z C A N _____________________

S | S | V

SHOP M-SYSTEM FOR 
FINEST QUALITY MEATS

RIGHT
■CSIRVID
TO LIMIT

---------------------------------------

BAG

• f lou'

<r.-

ROUND STEAK

! Z "
I WE

Kool Whip 
Topping

C o li;
\ MEDAL/

EN RlCH ED fl^L ’^
'J  AU PURPOSE

4V2 OZ 
CARTONS

LB

PIKES
PEAK

OR RUMP ROAST LB $1.19
BISCUITS PILLSBURY

BUTTERMILK
CANS

SLICED SLAB

LB « 1 .1 9

TOMATOES THRIFTY MAID  

303 CANS 3 '^ 4 1 - 0 0

KIMBELL

DRESSING
QUART

JAR

GERBER STRAINED
i; ,íííj -rti|
W.im J f  '• U  i *  ¡5__  >A

BABY FOOB

JARS

Kountry Fresh Pickies
"'«'«fe,

DILL
48 OZ JAR

KIMBELL

TUNA
£ SIRLOIN RIG HT

RISIRVID
TO LIM IT

FLAT
CAN

INSTANT
InHianl

— --------------------------------------------------------------- --------  | L i p t a n

T-Bone Steaks___________ !?•_* 1.591
f&, Decker's Hot Links_________ « '  _79‘ |

Kraft’s Cheese Slices__ 12 OZ pkg $1.191
Fresh Beef Cutlets___ _____ !l® - _ 9 9 ‘ |

im Nu-Spread Soft Oleo.

Upton’s TEA

t r y  IT HOT!!! 

3 OZ JAR

WE
m  GIVE
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GIVE

^fR IE N D lY
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ON M SYSTEMS BETTER FOOD BUYS! specials Good

SUGAR PURE SUGAR I Shop ^

112 N. AVE. D HASKELL, TEXAS r
“ W HERE YOUR DOLLAR BUYS MÒRE”

BARREL CANE

5 LB BAG

R 'A

N

M-SYSTEM COUPON
REDEEM THIS COUPON NOW and

SAVE10«
ON YOUR NEXT PURCHASE OF 18 OZ.

POST TOASTIES
(ktyaeir <d>r/(». v

CASH VALUE 1/20 OF A CENT1 PACKAGE 5 9 <  WITH COUPON
ONE COUPON PER FAMILY •OFFER EXPIRES FEB. 4, 1977

1Q(

10<:

And Save 
Every Day

AT
M-SYSTEM

MORTON HOUSE
C H I L I

15-OZ.
CAN

DRY
Pinto Beans

DOUBLE
S & H GREEN STAMPS 

W EDNESDAYS
Wi t h The Purchase 
Of $2 . 50  Or More

THRIFTY MAID

46 OZ CAN

BOUNTY KIST GOLDEN
W H O L E  o  B  M
K E R N E L

12-OZ.
CANS » 1 .

M A C A R O N I  
& CHEESE

KRAFT
Dinners

A 2 > « 3 9 (  3 7^4 OZ. 
BOXES

ICE
CREAM

KOUNTRY

FRESH

1/2 GAL

■' .JH*''®!

U  •  .L
SALTINESrlK

m
DETERGENT

ARROW
I'.v*-

GIANT  

[é BOX

Cottage Cheese
CRACKIN' GOOD
CRACKERS

1 -lb. BOX
KOUNTRY

FRESH

1 LB CARTON

THRIFTY MAID

PEAS
17-OZ.^
CANS

System’sFinestFresh Produce
U.S. NO.1 r u s s e t

. POTATOES
lap ' ^

■ . ' X '  / ' i n  I ^  A
LB. i 1 2 9

BAG

GLADE SOLID

ROOM
FRESHENER each

ARROW

LARGE

ROLL

TOWELS

.  .eV’’ - •

LS
'fe

CALIF. NAVEL

ORANGES
LBS.

y

'^WEET P 0 T A T 0 E S J « L ’ i? «
"^BOLDEN DELICIOUS APPLES. _ 3 i «  _$1.
¿60LDEN RIPE BANANAS_ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ 5 !̂» _$1.

I ’̂ '

&ÍALIFORNIA AVOCADOS _ 3 J 0 L $ 1 .

KIMBELLS SNOWFLAKE

14 OZ PKG
7 9 C

DEEP
SOUTH Grape Jelly

2 LB JAR

KIMBELL SALAD

32 OZ JAR 4 9 t
ZEE NAPKINS_____
UPTON’S TEA BAGS

360 COUNT PKG

100 COUNT PKG $1.79
A R R O W

FACIAL T I S S U E _  _
C L OR OX  EFFECTIVE

BLEACH _________
A N A C I N - $ 1 . 3 9  v a l u e

ARTHRITIS FORMULA
M A A L O X - $ 1 . 7 9  va l ue

LIQUID

2 0 0  C O U N T  
P A C K A G E

GA L L O N  P L A S T I C  JUG

EFFERDENT- $ 2 . 1 5 v a l ue

DENTURE TABLETS

39‘ 
79'

BOTTLE *1.19 
12 OZ. BOTTLE *1.49

6 0  C O U N T  *1.99
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Gun Collection On Display In Lubbock
One of the world’ s finest 

gun collections, assembled by 
the Belgian government for 
the American Bicentennial, 
will have its first showing 
outside Washington, D, C., on 
Jan, 30-March 13 at The 
Museum of Texas Tech 
University.

The exhibit, "Belgian Gun 
Making and American His­
tory," is sponsored by the 
West Texas Museum Associa­
tion (WTMA), with a gala 
pre-showing Friday, Jan, 28, 
7:30 p.m. Members, guests 
and friends are invited. 
Special invitations have been 
issued to collectors, gun club

State
Revenues
Increasing

Comptroller Bob Bullock 
said Wednesday that state 
revenues are continuing to 
flow into the treasury at 
flood-tide levels, totaling $1.6 
billion during the first three 
months of fiscal 1977.

Bullock said that Septem­
ber, October, and November 
revenues were 11 percent 
more than during the same 
period in fiscal 1976, which 
itself was an all-time record 
year.

In his January financial 
statement, the Comptroller 
reported that fiscal 1977 sales 
tax collections are 15 percent 
ahead of 1976 levels, and that 
the natural gas production tax 
is reaping 36 more revenue.

“ Meanwhile,”  said Bul­
lock, "state expenditures dur­
ing the first three months of 
fiscal 1977 totaled $1.7 billion, 
only $4.5 million more than 
was spent during the first 
three months of fiscal 1976. 
Partly as a result, the state 
closed out its books at the end 
of November with a cash 
balance of $1.4 billion."

The Comptroller’s January 
financial statement also re­
ports on a Brookings Institu­
tion study that ranked Texas 
43rd among the states in 
expenditures on state and 
local governmental services, 
and a Tax Foundation study 
showing Texas ranks 31st in 
per capita state and local 
property tax burden.

members and engravers.
The Belgian consul general 

at Houston. Ignance van 
Steenberge. will be an honor­
ed guest, as well as Prof. Rene 
Dcicour, Belgian engraver, 
who will demonstrate his art in 
silver, gold and steel.

Each of the approximately 
150 guns in the exhibit is a 
work of art. Engravings on 
some models not only demon­
strate the specialty of Belgian 
gunmakers but are also 
miniature masterpieces.

Circulated by the Smithson­
ian Institution Traveling Ex­
hibit Services, the exhibit was 
shown during the Bicentennial 
at the Smithsonian in Wash­
ington. It was organized for 
the presentation in the United 
States by the Belgian Ministry 
of Economics Affairs and the 
Liege Arms Museum in 
collaboration with Belgian 
gunmakers and collectors, the 
Browning Arms Company of 
Morgan, Utah, and the Bel­
gian Fire Arms Proof House 
and the Liege Gun School.

The exhibit will be shown in 
only a few U. S. museums and 
only one other in Texas. It will

return this tall to .Midland.
•Most of the exhibit items 

will be seen by the American 
people for the first time. Manv 
had never been thoroughly 
described in previous catalo- 
gues.

The exhibit's three-fold 
purpose is to record the 
history of sales of Belgian- 
made weapons to the U. S. at 
various periods in the new 
nation’s development, to show 
the contribution of American 
technology to Belgian gun 
manufacturing, and to demon­
strate the association between 
American inventors and Bel­
gian manufacturers.

American Indians as well as 
trappers and settlers used 
Belgian sporting arms. Both 
the War of Independence and 
the Civil War were fought with 
large quantities of Belgian 
weapons, similar to the ones 
on display.

Traditionally, the weapons 
industry has been concen­
trated in the Liege area in 
eastern Belgium. Originally a 
home-based industry, it deve­
loped into a mass production 
system, which still retains the

SECOND PLACE WINNERS in the District III Food Show held 
Jan. 22, in Wichita Falls were Kerrie Kemp and Linda Fischer. 
Kemp placed second in the senior side dishes and Fischer placed 
second in the junior main dishes. Kemp will serve as first 
alternate at the State Food Show in June. (Staff Photo)

rA
/

L ike  Y o u r  F a m ily

ROLLING PLAINS PCA 
HAS GROWN

Finance provided by Rolling Plains Production Credit Asso­
ciation has grown. There must be a reason for:
•  30 percent increase in outstanding loan volume over 1975.
•  25 percent reduction in interest rate in the last two years.
•  Increased capital, sui'plus and reserves.
•  More farmers and ranchers being served.
PCA can meet your financial operating requirements, plus 
your capital investment and other needs.
Yes, there’s a reason why Rolling Plains PCA has grown. 
Find out how you can grow, too. Check with a neighbor who 
is a PCA stockholder. Or come in and talk to any of our 
professional staff in

Stamford Childress Matador
915/773-3644 817/937-2553 806/347-2226

Munday Spur
817/422-4323 806/271-3361

Serving farmers and ranehers in Hriseoe. ( hildress. 
( ’ (illingsworth, ( ’ottle. Dickens. Donley, l-oard. Hall, 
Hardeniiin. Haskell. Jones. Kent. King. Knox. Motley. 
Shackelford and Stonewall count ies. The Go Ahead People!

craftsmanship that made it 
historically famous.

For 200 years Americans 
have favored Belgian fire­
arms. Speeial models have 
been designed to suit Ameri­
cans, ranging from the Ken­
tucky or Plains rifle to the 
American break-action shot­
gun or the modern inlaid piece 
for sportsmen.

Belgian gunmakers have 
borrowed from American in­
ventors. Colt. Le Mat. Sharps. 
Winchester, Remington. 
Lewis and Browning, who 
inspired Belgian craftsmen 
and industrialists to manu­
facture either copies and 
variations of the original 
models or to mass produce to

Washington
“ As It Looks

From Here” 
OMAR BURLESON

Congressman — 17th District

WASHINGTON, D. C.— 
MOST PEOPLE WILL AGREE 
THAT WELFARE programs 
need reform. Most people will 
agree that there should be a 
willingness on the part of all 
able-bodied people to work. It 
is neither economically nor 
morally right for the Govern­
ment to make it more 
attractive not to work than to 
work. Sure, there have to be 
jobs available but, as mention­
ed last week, jobs are going 
begging and something is 
wrong. The several jobs-train- 
ing programs have turned out 
people who either can’t get 
work or don’t want it.

THE NEXT THING IS HOW 
CAN THE GOVERNMENT 
GIVE MILLIONS of people 
employment without running 
the public debt higher and 
higher, decreasing the value 
of our money, thus raising the 
cost of living for everyone? 
Who gains? - just about 
everyone loses.

IN SEEKING SOLUTIONS 
IS THE DANGER of ’out of 
the frying pan into the fire." 
The State of Massachusetts is 
advancing a plan which has as 
its purpose to turn Govern­
ment welfare and unemploy­
ment benefits into paychecks. 
Massachusetts has one of the 
highest rates of unemploy­
ment and one of the most 
generous welfare payments of 
any State. Placing the jobless 
in self-sustaining economic 
enterprises rather than the 
familiar succession of dead 
end, "make work”  Govern­
ment employment has an 
appeal and could catch the 
attention of the Carter Ad­
ministration and the Congress 
as it considers pumping 
billions into public employ­
ment.

FROM WHAT HAS AP- 
FEARED ON THE PLAN,
nonprofit corporations would 
be set up for such activities as 
building renovation and fe- 
pairs; lead and paint removal: 
energy-saving insulation of 
old housing; harvesting of 
forest on state-owned land; 
day care child facilities to free 
welfare mothers for work; and 
rehabilitation of railroads.

GOVERNOR DUKAKIS OF 
MASSACHUSETTS says any 
able-bodied and employable 
person who has been jobless 
for six months and is 
collecting Government assist­
ance payments should be 
required to go to work or face 
cutoff of such payments. 
Workers would be recruited 
from welfare and unemploy-

meet .American orders.
.American technology, too. 

contributed precision en­
gineering. which led the way 
to modern niamifacturing 
methods in Belgium.

The museum display re­
quired the work of many, 
including Dr. Claude Gaier. 
director of the Liege .Museum 
of Arms; Georges Charles 
Cools of the Belgian .Mnistry 
of Economic Affairs; and 
Delcour. professor of arms 
engraving at the Ecole de Fine 
Mécanique in Liege.

J. Peters, head armorer, 
and C. Strauven. armorer of 
the Liege Museum of Arms, 
and Dr. Craddock Goins, 
curator of military history at 
the National Museum of 
History and Technology, pro­
vided documentation so that 
viewers see the guns in their 
historical context.

Fine woods, inlay, carving 
and engraving lend historical 
significance for artisans as 
well as for those interested in 
weaponry.

Those wishing to attend the 
preview opening, arranged by 
the WTMA Women’s Council, 
should call Mrs. Dottie John­
son, area code 806-742-2424.

! ;>
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JOE WILFONG — RESERVE CHAMPION STEER

I» m-
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ment rolls.
THE THEORY OF THIS 

APPROACH TO WELFARE 
REFORM has its appeal. The 
assumption is that the new 
job-providing business would 
get an infusion of capital from 
money that would otherwise 
be paid out in direct welfare 
benefits and unemployment 
compensation. There seems to 
be the further assumption that 
the corporate enterprise would 
be well managed and would 
not only be self-sustaining but 
would make money to support 
permanent jobs and hire more 
people as it developed.

AS MIGHT BE EXPECT­
ED, THIS PLAN, like most, 
has some fine print. The 
Governor and his 30-person 
Task Force on Job Creation 
reckons that their plan will 
require an ongoing subsidy 
and an additional $6 million to 
get it off the ground. (This is 
not one of the assumptions but 
a requirement.)

WELL, IT MIGHT BE SAID 
that about anything is better 
than the welfare mess we have 
now. This adds an incentive to 
this venture in reform. But 
there is another ingredient in 
this scheme. It comes down to 
this: Should the Government 
get into business for. itself? 
Where would such operations 
end and how good is the 
Government’s track record in 
managing the business it’s 
already in? In socialist econo­
mics. business is run by 
Government. Although there 
is a sort of desperation to "do 
something," this sort of thing 
may not be it.

m

REIDA MULLING — RESERVE CHAMPION HEIFER

ili

MARK LEWIS — GRAND CHAMPION LAMB

Increase 
Sought In 
Weinert

Weinert, Jan. 24—Lone 
Star Gas Company’s local 
manager, Leon Ivey, today 
filed an application for a rate 
increase to provide the com­
pany an 8% rate of return.

Ivey said Lone Star’s 
distribution system serving 
Weinert earned a (3.82)% rate 
of return in 1975 and that 
$5.373 is required to correct 
the utility’s revenue deficien-

H enry  W. B lock

“We do more 
than just 
fill out tax 

forms. We can help 
you save money.”
Reason No. 1 why H&R Block 

should do your taxes.
People don't come to H&R Block just to 
have their tax forms filled out. They come 
because Block can help them save 
money. We dig for every honest 
deduction and credit. And we see that 
you get the benefit of the latest changes 
in the tax law.

H&R BLOCK
TH E IN C O M E  TAX PEOPLE

115 N. Ave E 864-3322
OFFICE HOURS 8:00 to 5:00 

Monday Through Friday

cy. He explained that Lone 
Star has experienced in­
creased costs of operation due 
to the current inflation, and 
unrecovered costs of pur­
chased gas which substantial­
ly eroded utility earnings.

In June of last year, the 
Railroad Commission author­
ized Lone Star to recover 85% 
of its ingrease in the average 
cost of gas (above a base of .72 
cents) from residential and 
commercial deliveries at the 
city gate. During the fourteen 
months ended August, 1976, 
Lone Star had unrecovered 
gas costs of $14.2 million for 
gas delivered at the city gate 
for residential and commercial 
customers.

"These costs result from 
the rapidly rising gas prices 
during the last few years. For 
example, our average cost of 
gas climbed from 18c per 
thousand cubic feet in 1971 to 
$1.03 in June of this year, a 
472% increase. Utility earn­
ings declined from $23.3 
million in 1971 to $13.1 million 
in 1975. or44"(i," Ivey said.

The company’s application 
would raise the average 
residential customer’s bill 
about 3.23 cents per month, 
based on 8 Mcf (thousand 
cubic feet) consumption.

Abilene 
Stock Show 
Results

Kim Hager exhibited the 
reserve champion steer during 
the Abilene Livestock Show 
last week. The steer was 
second place heavyweight 
crossbred, and reserve 
champion crossbred also.

She also showed the second 
place heavyweight Hereford 
and the reserve champion 
Hereford.

Joe Wilfong showed the

first place middleweight Here­
ford. Stanley Hager showed 
the second place middle­
weight Hereford and Donna 
Gilleland showed the third 
place middleweight Hereford.

Other 4-Hers showing 
steers were Reida Mullino, 
Mikeana Wilcox, and Julie 
Patty.

Mark Lewis exhibited the 
Champion Hampshire Lamb. 
Others showing lambs were 
Kerry Therwhanger and Russ 
Lewis. Showing barrows were 
Rufus, Maryann. Janie and 
Eusebio Lopez, and Jackie and 
.lohnnie Fave Morrow.

IT ’S PLANTING

The oldest golfing club in the 
world is the Honorable Com­
pany of Edinburgh Golfers, 
w h ich  came i n t o  b e i n g  
March, 1744.

INEXPENSIVE Pen i  Pencil 
sets by Papermate ic Sheaffer. 
Haskell Free Press.

We Have A Complete Stock Of

Pecan Trees
All Kind Of

Fruit Trees
SHRUBS IN CANS 

ROSEBUSHES

CONNER NURSERY 
AND FLORAL

Haskell, Texas



Aoudads on increase; hunters too
The aoudad population in 

.he Panhandle continues to 
increase steadily, and as the 
herd grows so do the number 
of hunters.
/ Although aoudads are found 

'statewide, the only regulated 
season is in an eight-county 
area around Palo Duro Can­
yon. In other areas of the state 
they are considered exotics 
and may be hunted year 
round, with landowner’s con­
sent.

This year; hunters took 134 
sheep during the week-long 
season, according to figures 
tabulated by Texas Parks and 
Wildlife Department field 
biologists.

“ Over the last several 
years, we have experienced 
an almost continual rise in the 
number of hunters that suc­

cessfully hunt for aoudads and 
it relates back to the relative 
abundance of the animal,” 
says Charles Winkler, P&WD 
big game program director.

As has been the case for the 
last several years, the 
majority of aoudads taken 
this season were in Randall, 
Armstrong, Briscoe and Floyd 
Counties. The largest reported 
ram during the Nov. 13-19, 
1976, season field-dressed at 
212 pounds with 34Vi-inch horn 
length. It was taken in Arm­
strong County.

According to field bio­
logist’s estimates, there are 
1,500 aoudads in the Pan­
handle region. A 1974 estimate 
placed the statewide popula­
tion at some 3,551 rams, ewes 
and lambs.

“ Because there was a good 
lamb crop last year, the herd

registered at 19 percent in­
crease. This population in­
crease stimulated hunter 
interest, which improved the 
hunter success ratio. Simply 
stated, hunter success rate is 
the number of hunters in rela­
tion to the number of sheep 
harvested,”  said Winkler.

Population estimates of the 
Panhandle herd show a steady 
increase from approximately 
1,200 sheep in 1973 to the 1,500 
figure of 1976.

Hunter success rate on the 
62 sheep harvested in 1973 was 
31 percent, 35 percent on the 
72 harvested in 1974, ’and 40 
percent on the .100 killed 
during the 1975 season.

P&WD biologists expect the 
Panhandle aoudad population 
will continue to rise steadily, 
since carrying capacity has 
not yet been approached.

Jr. High 
Teams 
Split Four

The Haskell Junior High 
played Hamlin 4 games last 
Monday evening winning 2 
and losing 2. The 8th boys, 
playing probably their best 
game of the season, defeated 
Hamlin 43-19. All the boys 
played a great deal. Nine 
different boys scored. The 8th

girls continued undefeated, 
defeating Hamlin 36-24.

The 7th boys lost to Hamlin 
20-17 in a very exciting game. 
They were far behind but 
came back to make an exciting 
game. The 7th girls lost 23-8.

The Junior High tourna­
ment will begin this Thursday 
at 10:15. It will resume 
Saturday at 10:15. The teams 
entered are Aspermont, Sey­
mour, Knox City and Haskell. 
Next Monday, the Junior High 
plays Rotan in their last home 
game.

PUBLIC NOTICE
Lone Star Gas Company, in accordance 

with Section 43(a) of Articie 1446c V.A.T.C.S., 
hereby gives notice of the Company’ intent 
to implement a new schedule of rates for 
natural gas service to be charged to the 
residential and commercial consumers in the

City of Weinert, Texas 
effective March 1, 1977.

The rate schedule is expected to furnish 
a 24.01 percent increase in the Company’s 
gross revenues in the City of Weinert

A Statement of Intent has been filed with 

the City of Weinert. ,
and' is available for inspection at the Com­
pany’s business office located at 126 West Main 
Munday, Texas

) Lone Star Gas Company

Derby Race 
Set Jan. 29

It may not be Indianapolis to 
some but to a 8, 9, and 10 year 
old Cub Scout it will be just as 
exciting. The Third Annual 
Chisholm Trail Council Pine- 
wood Derby Race will be held 
Saturday, January 29th, in the 
Westgate Shopping Center 
mall. Registration will begin 
at 1:00 to 1:45 p.m. The flag 
will be dropped at 2:00 for the 
first race.

Each car entered will be 
hand carved by the boys and 
their dads from a block of soft 
wood. It will be no longer than 
7 inches, three inches wide 
and weighing five ounces or 
less. The styling will be as 
varied as each boy’s imag­
ination.

A special designed patch 
will be given to each boy 
entering. The cars will be 
judged for Best Design, Most 
Original, and Most Unusual. 
These winners will receive 
trophies. Also trophies will be 
given for speed in each age 
group and over-all winners.

Each entrant will have to be 
a Cub Scout registered with a 
pack. A cover charge of $1.00 
will be charged to cover 
expenses.

Leo Gonzales, Southern 
District Cub Scout Activities 
Chairman is in charge of this 
event.

Sen. Bentson 
Seeks Backing 
For Bill

Senator Lloyd Bentsen 
Thursday told a Senate Sub­
committee that decisive action 
is needed to keep stolen U. S. 
military weapons from falling 
into the hands of drug 
peddlers and guerrillas in 
Mexico.

“ U. S. law enforcement 
agencies have given me 
example after example of 
cases in which smugglers in 
Mexico have exchanged drugs 
for stolen U. S. military 
weapons,”  Bentsen said to the 
Permanent Subcommittee on 
Investigations in testimony 
submitted Thursday. The Sub­
committee is holding hearings 
on the drugs for weapons 
problem.

Bentsen urged members of 
the panel to support a bill he 
introduced in the last Con­
gress to increase security 
measures on military wea­
pons. He plans to offer the bill
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Small ads...BIG RESULTS

.............................................

STEAK
SPECIAL

EVERY NIGHT

KC Strip Steak $3.75

Family Style
Sirloin Steak

FamUy of tw o .................................. $7.95
Family of four................................$14.95
Family of six.................................. $20.95

BOTH STEAKS SERVED W ITH BAKED POTATO 

OR FRENCH FRIES. TRIP TO SALAD BAR, HOT 

ROLLSJEA OR COFFEE.

Haskell Steak House
STAMFORD HIGHWAY

Every Friday night Fish Buffet 
All You Can eat $2.50

in the new Congress.
"Testimony at earlier Con­

gressional hearings reveals 
that the Defense Depanment 
has had more than 10.000 
weapons stolen over the past 
decade, more than enough to 
equip 10 combat battalions." 
Bentsen said.

"And the number is un­
doubtedly much higher than 
that, since stolen weapons are 
frequently written off as 
inventory errors without an 
investigation to determine 
whether there had in fact been 
theft or loss."

Senator Bentsen said much 
of his information about the 
drugs for weapons trade came 
from the Drug Enforcement 
Administration and the U. 5. 
Customs Bureau.

"I was told of one case in 
which M-14 rifles, stolen from 
the Midwestern U. 5. were 
traded in Mexico. The drug 
trafficker who received them 
was connected with a guerrilla 
leader, now deceased,”  the 
Senator said.

“ U. S. agents have also 
documented efforts to use a 
subversive organization in

Mexico to obtain marijuana in 
exchange for automatic wea­
pons."

The Bentsen bill would (1) 
establish a centralized Wea­
pons and Munitions Security 
Office within the Defense 
Department, responsible for 
tightening weapons security 
programs of the individual 
armed services; (2) tighten up 
reporting requirements to end 
the practiee of chalking up 
weapons losses to "Inventory- 
error" with little or no 
investigation; and (3) require 
a eooperation between mili­
tary officials and law enforce- 
m.ent agencies which has not 
always existed in the past.

"It is imperative that we 
share our 2.000 mile southern 
border with a strong, stable, 
democratic neighbor. If stolen 
arms are being provided 
revolutionary groups in Mex­
ico—and there is evidence 
that they are—then it is a 
threat not only to the people of 
that country but also to the U. 
S.—and it is a threat which we 
must work together to solve," 
Senator Bentsen said.

AGRICULTURE
FLYING

AERIAL SPRAYING

I WORMS — GREEN BUGS

Russ Matthews, Owner

C all 8 6 4 -2 0 3 5

Haskell, Texas

USE TOUB SEAT BELT

CHUCK t r i m m e d , AND " J f t x  

ROAST t e n d e r  LB y J I l J RADISHES -  1 5 0
C H U C K t r i m m e d , AND T A j l

STEAK I  y Q YAMS 2 9 c
GROUND C R A  

MEAT D J U HENS CHICKEN LB 5 9 c
CHILI -  Q Q A

MEAT LB 00 V W HITE HOUSE P "  A  .1

Apple Juice 5 9 0
s i a b  n o  a

BACON you GEBHARDT ^  ^

TAMALES “ 3 9 C
STORE MADE O  A  X

Fresh Saus$e ■ bU C SKINNERS 8 OZ PKG A  A

^  Noodles 2 9 C
BREAD “ . r o “  3 9 c ARMOURS CAN 4  A  X

Potted Meat 1 9 CFLOUR = .  $ 2 .9 8 DEL MONTE SIZE 303 CAN f t  f t  1

M  Peas 0 9 CDUNCAN HINES P "  A  1

CAKE MIX -  5 9 C SCOTT LARGE ROLL | h  a

TOWELS 5 9 CTOM SCOTT 12 OZ CAN A  f t  X

MIXED NUTS 9 o C
VEL “  3 “" $ 1 .MAZO LA f t  f t  X

NO STICK'  8 9 0
SUNKIST ^  f t  ^  X

LEMONS 3 '° '2 5 0
28 OZ BOTTLE ^

PINESOL $ 1 .3 9
POGUE GROCERY

— Extra Parking Behind The Store. Home Owned And Operated— 1 

113 NORTH AVENUE E PHONE 864-2015 HASKELL, TEXAS 1
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Escobedo, ParkerRepeat Vows
Cynthia Ann Escobedo and 

David Lee Parker were united 
in marriage in a candlelight 
ceremony solemnized at eight 
o’ clock Saturday evening, 
January 22, in First Baptist 
Church, Haskell. Rev. Dudley 
Bragg, pastor, officiated the 
double-ring rites.

The bride is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Fidencio S. 
Escobedo and the groom’s 
parents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Kenneth J. Parker.

Greenery decorated four 
seven-branched candelabra 
flanking a central cluster 
candelabra which formed the 
background for the exchange 
of vows. White tapers were 
lighted preceding the cere­
mony by the bride’ s brothers, 
Nati and Jackie Escobedo.

Mrs. Charles E. Dyer, II of 
San Antonio, sister of the 
groom, registered guests. 
Ushers were Nati and Jackie 
Escobedo and Richard Parker 
of Dallas, brother o f the 
groom.

The organist, Mrs. Carl 
Bailey, played traditional wed­
ding music. She accompanied 
Mrs. Doyle High, who sang 
“ The Lord’ s Prayer”  as the 
ceremony concluded.

Attending the bride as Maid 
of Honor was her sister, 
Louisa Escobedo. Bridesmaids 
were Miss Patricia Arredondo, 
Miss Janice Casey, and Miss 
Sara Cortez. They wore formal 
gowns of blue chiffon; sheer 
scallops on- the bodice were 
caught at the waistline with a

blue chiffon bow. Tiny sprays 
of Baby’ s Breath were worn in 
the hair, and they carried 
nosegays of blue and white 
carnations and Baby’s Breath 
tied with blue satin streamers.

Craig Foster attended the 
groom as Best Man. Grooms­
men were Jim Pippen of 
Austin, Bobby Hall of Amaril­
lo, and Kenny Parker, the 
groom’s brother of Canyon.

Ring-bearer was Angie 
Rodriguez, cousin of the 
bride, of Stamford. She was 
dressed in a long gown of 
white lace over blue chiffon 
and wore Baby’s Breath in her 
hair. The rings were carried 
on a white satin pillow with 
ribbon streamers.

The bride, given in marr­
iage by her father, wore a 
gown of white silk organza 
over taffeta. The fitted bodice 
and the high neck-line were 
trimmed with Venise lace 
which also enhanced the 
Victorian sleeves. The skirt 
was panelled with matching 
lace and lace motifs, flowing 
full to the back into a chapel 
train circled with matching 
lace.

Her chapel veil of silk 
illusion, held by a lace cloche, 
was circled with matching lace 
motifs, and she carried a 
cascade bouquet of white 
roses.

In carrying out the bridal 
tradition, for something old 
she carried a tiny carved 
wooden cross which had been 
given to her father and an

„iji

MRS. DAVID PARKER 
...nee Cynthia Ann Escobedo

PLAN A FUTURE WITH US
incentive piece rate based on 

$2.75 per hour.
Group insurance 

Retirement Benefits 
Paid Hoiidays & Vacations 
No Experience Necessary

Stamford Mfg. Co.
104 E. HAMILTON, STAMFORD, TEXAS 

915-773-5371

1887 penny from her mother. 
For something new, the bride 
wore earrrings given her by 
her sister; for something 
borrowed she wore a diamond 
cross belonging to her mother. 
For something blue, she wore 
a blue garter.

For her daughter’s wedd­
ing, Mrs. Escobedo wore a 
formal gown of mint green 
chiffon. The empire waist-line 
held the full flowing skirt, and 
an attached capelet draped 
softly from the shoulder. A 
design of silver beads accent­
ed bodice.

The groom’s mother wore a 
formal gown of deep turquoise 
blue shirknit. It was styled 
with long slim sleeves and a 
softly fitted bodice with full 
flowing skirt. The V-neckline 
was accented with matching 
beaded design.

Both mothers wore white

Jones Cox & Co.
AND

Sprague& Carleton
invite you in to shop and save during 

their three day winter saie.
THURSDAY, FRIDAY, SATURDAY — JANUARY 27, 28, 29

ONE TABLE ONLY:
Reg. S529.95 Sale:

$369.95

See us for other select­
ions of Sprague & Carle- 
ton bedroom, dining 
room, and living room 
tables.

Save S160.00

ONE CHINA ONLY:
Reg. $699.95 Sale:

$489.95 Save $210.00

All Sprague & Carleton 
items reduced 25% 
during this spectacular 

3 day sale.
SALE BEGINS 9:00 A .M . 

THURSDAY.

Around Town
by Lois and Lisa

No News This Week So, we 
would like to again ask you to 
please call us when you have 
visitors or go visiting. Our 
subscribers who live far away 
from home are always inter­
ested in the comings and 
goings of their friends and 
former classmates. So please 
remember to call 864-2686 and 
ask for Lois or Lisa.

Mr. and Mrs. Randy Shaw 
were in Abilene Saturday 
visiting with Mr. and Mrs. 
Danny Stocks.

Congratnlatlans to Ed 
Honea, who was 80 on 
January 26. To celebrate this 
occasion, an early birthday 
dinner was held Sunday 
January 23 in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Honea. Present were 
Jo and Bill Connally, Jack and 
Pody and Sarah Williams, 
Levelland, Margaret Dunnam, 
Emily and Matt, San Angelo, 
Janice and David Honea, Jeff 
and Adam, Dallas, and Bud 
and Bill Comedy, Don and 
Nene Comedy of Haskell.

Charley Redwine is in 
Odessa this week for an eye 
checkup.

Visiting in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Shaw last

orchids.
The bride’s parents were 

hosts to a reception in the 
Haskell National Bank Com­
munity Building after the 
ceremony. Silver and crystal 
appointments were used on 
the refreshment table, cover­
ed with blue satin overlaid 
with white net and lace. 
Centering the table was an 
arrangement of blue and white 
Carnations and Baby’ s 
Breath. The four-tiered wedd­
ing cake was white with blue 
roses and was served to guests 
by Mrs. Felipe Arredondo

Alternating at the punch 
bowl were Mrs. Joe Cortez 
and Mrs. Rufino Escobedo, 
aunt o f the bride. Other 
reception assistants were Mrs. 
Kenny Parker and Mrs. 
Richard Parker, Mrs. Jimmy 
Browning and Mrs. C. V. 
Schwartz. Crystal plates held

G R A N D
Stamford 773-3181

Fri. 28-Sat. 29-Sun. 30 
“ Midway”

All Star Cast

D R IV E - IN
Stamford 773;3272

Fri. 28-Sat. 29-Sun. 30 
“ Hawmps”  

James Hampton

Wed. Feb. 2-Thurs. 3 
XX-Adults Only 
No One Under 18 

“ Bottoms Up”  
Nude Color

Thursday were Mr. and Mrs. 
L. L. Phemister and Mr. and 
Mrs. Calvin Fitzhugh all of 
Dallas. They along with Mr. 
and Mrs. Randy Shaw went to 
Abilene to visit the Fitzhugh’s 
son, Donnie and family and 
Mr. and Mrs. Billy Bob Shaw.

• X

B&PW Club 
Meets

The Business & Profess­
ional Women’s Qub met 
Tuesday, Jan. 18 in the City 
Cafe with all Committee 
Chairmen as hostesses. The 
tables were centered with 
turquoise velvet, an open 
Bible and sprays of flowers.

President Callie Robison 
called the meeting to order, 
the Collect was read in unison, 
the minutes were read and 
approved and the treasurers 
report was given.

Ozelle Frierson introduced 
Georgeen Meadors who used 
as her theme “ The Fragrance 
of Beauty.”  She used many 
quotes from the Bible and 
emphasized that women 
should not be carbon copies of 
other women.

After pie and coffee were 
served, Clara Biard closed the 
meeting with the Emblem 
Benediction.

The next meeting will be 
Feb. 1 at 7 p.m. in the 
Community Room with Royce 
Adkins as guest speaker. 
Legislation and World Affairs 
Committee will be hostess.

HASKELL

Jannaiy 31-Febnuuy 4 
MONDAY

Hot Dogs Mustard 
Tater Tots Catsup 
Pork and Beans 
Chilled Fruit Cocktail 
Milk

TUESDAY
Chicken and Rice 
Seasoned Green Beans 
Carrot Sticks 
Hot Rolls Butter 
Fruit Jello 
Milk

WEDNESDAY
Chili Con Came 
Oven Browned Potatoes 
Seasoned Greens 
Combread Butter 
Sliced Peaches 
MUk

'THURSDAY
Beef and Spaghetti 
Buttered Cora 
Cabbage Slaw 
Hot Rolls Butter 
Cranberry Crunch 
Milk

FRIDAY
Turkey Tetrazzini 
Blackeyed Peas 
Garden Salad 
Hot Rolls Butter 
Plum Cobbler 
Milk

Engagement Announced
PAUL G. WHITE of Artesia, New Mexico, announced the 
engagement and approaching marriage of his daughter, Jeretta 
Ellen, of El Paso, to David N. Fischer of El Paso. The prospective 
bridegroom is the son of Mr. and Mrs. Herbert Fischer of 
Haskell. The prospective bride is a graduate of Artesia High 
School and New Mexico State University. The prospective groom 
is a graduate of Haskell High School and Texas Tech University. 
They plan a March 19, wedding in the First United Methodist 
Church in Artesia.

IRS News
Many taxpayers will not 

obtain early refrinds this year 
unless they receive their W-2 
forms from their employers 
soon.

The Internal Revenue Ser­
vice today reminded employ­
ers that next Monday, January 
31, is the last day to have' 
completed W-2 forms in the 
hands of their employees.

IRS Publication IS, “ Circu­
lar E—Employer’s Tax 
Guide,”  available free from 
local IRS offices, contains 
additional information on the 
proper handling of W-2 forms.

Haskell’s Market Place 
The Gassifled Ad Page

PUBLIC NOTICE
Lone Star Gas Company, in accordance 

with Section 43(a) of Article 1446c V.A.T.C.S., 
hereby gives notice of the Company’ intent 
to implement a new schedule of rates for 
natural gas service to be charged to the 
residential and commercial consumers in the

Haskell, Texas 
February 1, 1977

City of 

effective
a

The rate schedule is expected to furnish 

a 9.16 percent increase in the Company’s 

gross revenues in the City of Haskell

A Statement of Intent has been filed with 

the City of Haskell, Texas 

and is available for Inspection at the Com­

pany's business office located at 
304 N. 1st Street 
Haskell, Texas

^  Lone Star Gas Company

Matrons 
Club Meets

The Weinert Matrons Gub 
met January 20 in the 
Community Center. Mrs. Vera 
Derr, president, presided at a 
business meeting. Then she 
called upon the director o f the 
program for the day.

Mrs. Floyd McGuire, pro­
gram director,- introduced the 
theme of the program. Mrs. 
M. W. Phemister spoke on“ A 
First American Views His 
Land”  and “ Land Uses and 
Taxes.”  Mrs. McGuire spoke 
on “ City Malls and Sky­
scrapers.”  Mrs. D. L. Moody 
spoke on the ideas of five 
outstanding men who predict 
unusual changes in the future.

Members answered roll call 
by telling about trash pro­
blems in their homes.

Mrs. W. A. King was 
hostess for the day.

lanuary Clearance

white aiiu uiue rice bags.
After a trip to New Mexico, 

the couple will be at home in 
Amarillo where the groom is 
Production Trainer with Iowa 
Beef Processing.

Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth 
Parker were hosts to the 
rehearsal dinner Friday night 
at Haskell Steak House.

COATS
GROUP FALL DRESSES

Misses and Juniors

GROUP LONG DRESSES
Misses and Juniors

GROUP PANT SUITS
ALL SPORTSWEAR

Misses and Juniors

LONG SKIRTS
Only Six Left

Price

BAGS
V4 to V2 Off and Less 

PANTSUITS
Many just added to our SALE

V3 OFF
DRESSES 

Just Now Reduced 
1/3 OFF

LONG DRESSES 
Both Misses and Juniors 

Just Added 
1/3 OFF

ROBES - GOWNS - LOUNGEWEAR 
1/4 TO 1/2 OFF



County HDC 
Holds Meeting
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The Haskell County Home 
Demonstration Council met 
for its regular monthly meet­
ing on Wednesday, January 
19th at 2 p.m. in the meeting 
room of the County Extension 
Office. There were sixteen 
members and two visitors 
present.

Mrs. Adell Thomas, Vice 
Chairman presided over the 
meeting. Mrs. F. A. Ulmer of 
the LOC Club at Sagerton 
gave the opening by reading a 
poem entitled “ Gold Nug­
gets.”

The secretary, Mrs. Paul 
Fischer called the roll with 
each club president giving a 
club report.

The minutes of the last 
meeting were read and ap­
proved and Mrs. Carl Bailey 
reported on the treasury.

Mrs. Paul Fischer read a 
thank you note from County 
Judge and Mrs. B. 0.

 ̂Roberson.
Mrs. Adell Thomas, Year­

book Chairman reported a 
leader training meeting on 
“ Preparing Casseroles”  
would be held on Wednesday, 
February 26th at 11 a.m. in 
the meeting room of the 
County Extension Office. A 
discussion was held concern­
ing the March program and it 
was decided to ask City Floral 
to do a program on decorating 
with house plants.

Mrs. Eldon Anderson, Edu­
cation Chairman discussed 
plans for a spring tour of 
homes open to the public. The 
tour will be held on Sunday, 
May 1st. The Council also 
discussed plans for an Educa­
tional Tour to Lubbock and the 
Home Demonstration
Achievement Day which will 
be April 20th.

Mrs. Gus Rueffer, Finance

ONE GROUP OF 
MEN'S

LEISURE
SUITS

PRICE
MENS

100% POLYESTER

SUITS
NowReg.

49.95 $34.
59.95 $39.
79.95 $50.
89.95 $60.
99.95 $70.

Knit Dress Pants
s : ? . r is .2 2 ..............$ 1 0 . 0 0

ssiiroS....... $12.00
Reg. $18.00.............$14.00
Reg. $20.00... .........$15.00

HEIDENHEIMER'S

Chairman reported that the 
sale of the cookbooks was 
excellent and the council 
discussed ordering 500 addi­
tional cookbooks.

Mrs. J. P. Perrin reported 
on the Christmas Party which 
was held on December 7th in 
the meeting room of the 
Haskell National Bank. The 
Weinert Home Demonstration 
Club was complimented for 
the excellent program.

Mrs. Tom Yates, 4-H 
Chairman reported on the 
County Food Show. The Home 
Demonstration Council pro­
vided silver trays to the eight 
winners and also provided 
award ribbons.

Mrs. J. R. Davis reported 
$9.50 was donated to the 
Sheltered Workshop from 
Haskell Home Demonstration 
Members who donated at the 
Christmas Party.

THDA: Mrs. J. P. Perrin 
reported the THDA Training 
Meeting would be held in 
Seymour on Feb. 25th. The 
meeting will be for the THDA 
Council Chairman and County 
Extension Agent. Club mem­
bers were reminded that the 
$1.00 THDA Contribution 
could be turned in at the 
February Council.

Mrs. Tom Yates, Weinert 
Home Demonstration Club 
member, was elected to attend 
the RPEP Planning Meeting in 
Jayton, on Feb. 17th.

County Extension Agent, 
Barbara Elliott reported on the 
Family Living Meeting held in 
the County Extension Office 
on Jan. 7th. The Home 
Economic Indepth area for 
1977-78 will be in the area of 
Family Health.

Miss Carla Shearer, Health 
Specialist will be in Haskell on 
February 3rd to help the

Future 
Optimistic 
For Ag

Optimism for agriculture's 
future was expressed here 
Jan. 21 by the president of 
Utah-ldabo Farmers Union, 
Roy Holman of Ogden, Utah.

Holman addressed the con­
vention of the Texas Farmers 
Union in the Hilton Inn in 
Amarillo. Citing the Utah- 
Idaho convention last week, he 
said, “ We feel that the ‘new 
day' started with the inaugur­
ation of President Jimmy

Carter. "W e now have people 
in high places who know- 
agriculture, a Secretary of 
Agriculture who is a farmer, 
and we must expect better 
days ahead."

Holman said they won't 
come easy. "W e must now 
work as vigorously as we ever 
have before to help direct the 
future of government policy 
now being considered. At 
least now we will have a 
listening ear." he said.

Holman said an important 
answer to the agricultural 
dilemna is in successful 
cooperatives. “ Farmers are 
now receiving less than 40 
cents of the consumer dollar,”  
he said, "Co-ops could in­

crease that amount consider­
ably by cutting out some of the 
middlemen."

“ In Utah.”  he said, "we are 
building a consumers super­
market cooperative which will 
benefit both farmers and 
consumers. We will buy direct 
from farmers as much as 
possible. The co-op concept 
will return dividends to 
consumers and to farmers. We 
must tie these two groups 
together. And farmers must 
take the initiative. Farmers 
are large consumers, but most 
consumers aren't farmers. We 
must take the responsibility of 
educating consumers. It will 
benefit both groups.”

PREPARING A SIDE DISH that could be served in a gourmet meal at the County Food Show were 
the above girls: back row (left to right) Donna Gilleland, Karon Gray, Kerry Kemp, Tauniya 
White and Linda Wells. Front row; Holli High, Kathy Kemp, Denise Burris, Missy Briscoe, Kay 
Carmack, Leigh Ann Greeson, and Ember Miller.

Family Living Committee 
make program plans.

Plans for a Sew Fair to be 
held March 9th was announc­
ed to the Council.

Following a summarizers 
report by Mrs. Eldon Ander­
son, the meeting was adjourn­
ed for refreshments served by 
members of the LOC Club.

Leisure LodgeNews

Rochester 
Baptist To 
Show Film

EIGHTEEN, a new drama­
tic film, will be shown at First 
Baptist Church, Rochester on 
Saturday, January 29 at 7:30 
p.m.

EIGHTEEN is a true story 
adapted for film from the best 
seller 18: No Time To Waste. 
It is the story of Connie 
Callaway, a lovely, lively, 
California teenager who 
brought fun, some heartbreak, 
lots of noise and finally joy and 
pride to her bereaved family.

Life for Connie ended in a 
tragic freeway crash as she 
journeyed home from a 
northern California Christian 
camp. She left behind a host of 
friends whose lives will never 
be the same because she came 
their way. -it’ -

The triumph of <• Connie 
Callaway’s life, even though 
brief, stands as a monument 
to young people who find real 
answers to life’ s great quest­
ions. It is also a beacon to 
parents who are troubled by 
the lives of children whom 
they do not understand.

EIGHTEEN is a timely film 
coming at a moment when its 
unique message will make its 
greatest impact on the lives of 
all who see it. It is a classic 
from Gospel Films, Inc. of 
Muskegon, Michigan, pro­
ducers of numerous award­
winning films.

LOVE AND INSPIRATION 
signature editions. Tiny books 
on I^ve, Faith, Friendship. A 
thoughtful idea to send to 
someone you care about. Only 
$1.35 at the Haskell Free 
Press.

Mrs. Joyce Hardin from 
Munday has been with us this 
week while our Administrator, 
Dewie Wester has been away.

Ben Charlie Chapman 
brought the devotion on 
Sunday from the Presbyterian 
Church.

The Four Square Church 
from Weinert had the Tuesday 
devotion. Mr. Crane taught 
the lesson from the Chapters 
of Isaiah and John as well as 
several other scriptures. The 
lesson was very interesting.

Rev. Shipman was unable to 
teach due to his voice so the 
entire evening was spent in 
singing, on Thursday night.

Visiting Mr. W. O. Lewis 
were Mr. and Mrs. Vernon 
Routen from Goree, also Mr. 
Roy Moore from Goree. Mr. 
Lewis visited the G. C. 
Brocketts in Weinert, on 
Friday.

Mrs. Bessie Piland spent 
the day with her daughter, 
Mr. and Mrs. John Bartley.

Mrs. Nancy Howard went 
out with her son, Mr. Hubert 
Wilson from Rochester.

Mrs. Leola Cox and Marie 
Davis from Rule visited their 
mother, Mrs. Mazel Herron. 
Other visitors of Mrs. Herron 
were Oleta Jackson, Mrs. 
Wayland Baugh and Mrs. 
Bryce Weaver ali of Rule.

Mr. and Mrs. Vernon 
Routon from Goree, Mr. and 
Mrs. Tom Lewis, Tommy and 
Robbie from Chickasha 
Okla. and Mr. Roy Moore 
visited Mr. Pies Routon.

We appreciated the Junior 
Choir from the First Methodist 
Church in Rochester coming 
out along with their sponsors, 
Mrs. Calvin Stone and Mrs. 
Keith Fry to sing to us on 
Wednesday afternoon.

Mrs. Carrie Edwards spent 
the day on Friday with Mr. 
and Mrs. J. M. Pickering.

Mr. and Mrs. Billy Howell 
and children from Chilicothe 
visited Mrs. Clara Hendrix.

Mae Speck, Zula Hanson, 
Vera Keeie, Johnnie Mae 
Love, Biance Corley, Isla

One Down Four To Go!

When you list your property for sale with 
Granddad, he has several avenues of 
advertising and a very good mortgage loan 
connection. Let him work with you. Kyle

[ThB HARTSFIELD AGENCY
I

E V E R Y T H I N G  I N  I N S U R A N C E

Corley all of Rochester, Mr. 
and Mrs. Mike Van Horn from 
Weinert visited Mrs. Mary 
Bowman.

Mr. and Mrs. Grady Bris­
tow, and Helen Pierce from 
Rule visited Mrs. Olga Trib- 
bey.

Jean Hayne of Munday and 
June White from Rule visited 
Mr. L. B. White.

Dorothy Spann from Mun­
day visited Mrs. Tommye 
Hawkins.

Mr. and Mrs. Bud Cousins 
from Seymour visited Mrs. 
Elsie Mitchell.

NOTICE
The regular Fifth Sunday 

Singing Convention is sche­
duled for Sunday, Jan. 30, 
1977 at 2 p.m. at the Haskell 
Foursquare Church, 200 S. 
Avenue F. Pie and coffee will 
be served following the 
“ Sing”  by the United Four­
square Women for donations.

LIMITED SUPPLY of large 
print. King James Version of 
Bibles, also, Living Bibles and 
Children’s Living Bibles. 
Haskell Free Press.

January Clearance Sale
STILL IN FULL SWING

All Fall and Winter Merchandise 
Regrouped and Reduced 

Further For Final Clearance

Price &LESS

Drastic Reductions 
In Every Department

Shop Today For Greater Savings

THE

SHO0PC

DRUG STORE THE DRUG STORE THE DRUG STORE THE DRUG STORE THE

DOYLE HIGH'S

BHUC STORE
IIJ 100 S. AVE. E OPEN 8:00-6:00 864-2515

ROSE MILK
12 OZ $129

MID-WINTER SPECIALS

OIL
6 OZ

OF OLAY
$3.69 REG. $5.55

UJ

3 cM6WRYh*»<xwo _  VIckB”

¡Victors
Menthol 
Eucalyptus 
c d u ^  drops

CHERRY OR MENTHOL 
EUCALYPTUS

VICTORS 29«

HASKELL PH. 864-2665

HERE’S TO YOUR HEALTH 
from Kenneth Jones

The quantity of the medicine your doctor 
prescribes for you is as important as the drug 
itself. We are tempted to discontinue the 
medicine as soon as the symptoms disappear. 
However, medication should be taken as 
prescribed until finished, unless your doctor 
indicates otherwise. Usually the complete 
medication is necessary to prevent a 
resurgence of the virus and the illness.

ROBITUSSIN
6-8 HOUR

REG. $1.79 
NOW

NON-NARCOTIC

REG. $1.29 
NOW 4 OZ

3U01S o n a a  3 h ±  3 a o is  o n a a  3 h i  3 a o is  o n a a  3H 1  3 a o is  o n a a  3 H i m
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Sagerton
January 20

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Clark, 
Evangelyn, Kyle and Judson, 
and Mr. and Mrs. Steve Clark 
all of Abilene visited in the 
home of the Charles Clarks 
Sunday. Mrs. M. Y. Benton 
and Mrs. John Clark were also 
guests.

physical education major. 
Keep up the good work, Vicki.

James Darden of Dallas 
visited here with friends 
Monday. The Dardens are 
former residents of Sagerton, 
and he was back visiting his 
mother, Mrs. Nita Darden, of 
Stamford who is ill.

Congratulations to two FFA 
boys from the Sagerton area. 
Kraig Kupatt’ s purebred 
heavyweight placed first at the 
Haskell County Swine Show 
last weekend and his medium-' 
weight spot placed third. Jeff 
Thane’s lightweight purebred 
placed first. Congratulations, 
boys!

Guests in the home of 
Clarence Stegemoeller Sunday 
evening were Mr. and Mrs. 
Marvin Stegemoeller, Dennis 
and Brenda of Rochester, Mr. 
and Mrs. Mac Hearne and 
Leslie of Rochester, Mr. and 
Mrs. E. A. Schaake of Paint 
Creek, and the following 
Sagerton residents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Leon Stegemoeller, Cly­
de, Carl and Clifford, Mr. and 
Mrs. Alvin Bredthauer, Mr. 
and Mrs. F. A. Stegemoeller, 
Mr. and Mrs. J. A. Hertel, 
Mr. and Mrs. A. C. Knipling, 
Mr. and Mrs. Otto Schaake, 
Mr. and Mrs. J. B. Toney, 
Rena and Bruce, and Rev. and 
Mrs. Gary Kleypas. The 
occasion was a birthday party 
honoring Clarence and his 
son, Marvin, who had birth­
days on Monday, January 17.

Vicki Hertel, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Hertel, has 
been visiting home during the 
holidays, but has returned to 
Angelo State University. 
While she was home she was 
notified that she had made the 
Dean’s Honor Roll with a 
grade point average of 3.55 for 
the fall semester. Vicki is a

P r o p e r  E n e rg y  
M a n a g e m e n t 

Can SaveYou M oney!

Don't be an oven-peeper. Every time yon open 
the door, yon lose 20",'i of the heat.

t i ’ Plan oven meals to accommodate more than 
one dish at a time, or time yonr baking for 
mnlliple dishes. Most recipes can stand a 25 ' F. 
temperature variation,

tV  Get foods for baking into the oven the moment it 
reaches the right temperature. Remember, you don't 
have to pre heat the oven for broiling or roasting.

tir Use the high setting to bring foods to steaming 
then switch to the lowest heat needed to complete 
cooking. Turn off surface units before cooking is 
complete and let the retained heat finish the job.

Pick up your FREE copy of 
■ ENERGY CONSERVATION ' 

Booklet from

B1H[M] Frigidaire
H«m« Cnvironmtnl Diviiion of General Melon.

WEST TEXAS UTILITIES COMPANY

A MnnU'r of •tiuf N»uih Wt-M

carnival chairman, did a fine 
job. Other thairmen were: 
Mrs. Judy New, Mrs. Joyce 
LeFevre, Mrs. Jean Meier, 
Mrs. Joyce DeBusk, and 
Clyde Stegemoeller and Del­
bert LeFevre and Alvin Ulmer. 
They thank | all those that 
helped in any way with their 
time, money, and food dona­
tions. It takes everyone in our 
community to make this a 
success, so we can keep our 
Community Center going and 
pay our bills each year. And it 
is more fun to have a good 
time while we are doing it.

Mr. and Mrs. Herbert 
Niereieck and Melissa were in 
Abilene Sunday for a birthday 
party at the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Tommy Cook honoring 
their son, Jimmy.

Mr. and Mrs. Terry Strem- 
mel and Mrs. Viñeta Strem- 
mel, of Abilene visited in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Monse and DeWayne Sunday. 
Other guests were Donnie and 
Diane Barbee and Eric of 
Rule.

Mr. and Mrs. F. A. Ulmer 
met Mr. and Mrs. Winston 
Ulmer and family of San 
Antonio in Brady Sunday and 
visited awhile.

January 27
In spite of the cold rainy 

weather Saturday night, over 
three hundred people gather­
ed in the Sagerton Community 
Center Auditorium for the 
annual production of the 
“ Sagerton Hee-Haw” , and 
from all reports they enjoyed 
the show. In all the evening 
netted approximately S525.00 
including the game and food 
booths.

Mrs. Joe Clark, who pro­
duced the “ Hee-Haw”  and 
Mrs. F. A. Ulmer, who was

Mr. and Mrs. Louis Manske 
of Stamford and Mrs. Theda 
Manske of Dallas visited with 
Mrs. Oscar Manske Sunday. 
Other guests were Mr. and 
Mrs. Jerry Manske and family 
and Mr. and Mrs. Tommy 
Manske and family and 
Johnny Manske.

Guests in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Leo Monse, Sr. 
Sunday were: Mr. and Mrs. 
Virgil Vahlenkamp and Char­
les and John of Denton, Mr. 
and Mrs. Jack Monse, and 
DeWayne, Mr. and Mrs. 
Norvell Lehrmann and Marla 
of Rule, Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Mrazek, Dana and Bubba of 
Aspermont, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bobby Don Smith of Rule, and 
Randy Lehrmann of Snyder. 
The occasion was Mrs. 
Monse’ s birthday.

Get well wishes go to Mrs. 
Otto Lehrmann who has been 
suffering with an ear infection 
and to Sam Neinast, who is a 
patient at Hendricks in Abi­
lene and Joe Clark, who was a

lïÂ-ÿftÎWiÿiÇfiiÿÎm m m rn
agri-
facts

Pat Hala

Ever Me ■ itllir
cattle track? It looks as 
though that's where things 
are headed with the an­
nouncement by m ajor air 
carriers that 74Ts are going 
to be converted to livestock 
haulers for international 
m arkets. Officials say live 
cattle ' transportation to 
countries outside North  
America is already 80 percent 
by air with both the volume 
ind the percentage expect^  
to increase during the coming 
years. For the animals them­
selves it’s all first class. In­
teriors are redesigned and 
structured to resemble a barn 
with separate pens or stalls. 
Special temperature control 
and ventilation systems are 
bein^ designed and separate 
«tudies are underway to de­
termine other ways to in­
crease animal comfort. No one 
has yet decided whether to 
include in-flight movies but it 
sounds as if they may not be 
far away.

HALE FARM  
SUPPLY

P ^ ne 864-2692

patient at the Stamford 
Hospital last week.

Willie Dee Lehrmann and 
son, Marc, of Richland Hills 
visited with Mrs. Otto Lehr­
mann last weekend.

We left out some names in 
last week’s paper of the swine 
exhibitors at the Haskell 
County Show. They should 
read: Marc Thane, seventh 
place in Medium weight 
duroc; Kraig Kupatt, seventh 
place in Heavyweight duroc; 
Kraig Kupatt, third place in 
Medium weight spot; Kris 
Kupatt, fifth place in Heavy 
weight spot; Jeff Thane, 1st 
place in light weight pure­
bred; Kraig Kupatt, 1st place, 
heavy weight purebred; Kris 
Kupatt fourth place, heavy 
weight Hampshire. We are 
proud of all their places and 
did not intend to leave any 
out, because they all worked 
hard for the honors.

The congregation at Faith 
Lutheran Church were pleased 
to have a former pastor, Rev. 
M. Shatto, as a guest Sunday 
morning, accompanied by his 
wife. They were here on their 
way from Ontario, Canada to 
South Texas. Rev. Shatto, who 
was a minister here in the 
1950’s, is retired from the 
regular ministry, but he 
brought a Bible skit entitled 
“ Call of Abraham”  and he 
and his wife acted out the 
parts of Abraham and Sarah. 
They were guests in the home 
of Mrs. Edwin Thane while 
they were here.

The Golden Age group met 
at the Sagerton Community 
Center Monday, Jan. 24, with 
Mrs. Judy New, Mrs. Lorene 
Hugeins and Mrs. Velma Lou

Hertel as hostesses.
Those present were: the 

Mmes. Alice Newton. Maude 
Kittley, Frankie Jackson, R. 
E. McKnobb, Marie Kohout. 
Faye Hanson, Emma Lam- 
mert, H. L. Hewett. Myrtie 
Robbins, all of Stamford, and 
Beno Hertenberger and Katie 
Gerloff of Old Glory and B. 
Kupatt, John Clark, Louise 
Stegemoeller, Claude Bland, 
M. y. Benton, Vela Meier, G. 
A. Leach, and John Wende- 
born of Sagerton and Mrs. 
Clara Hines and Mrs. Lucy 
Williams of Rule.

Happy Birthday was sung to 
Mrs. B. Kupatt. Mrs Faye 
Hanson, Mrs. Frankie Jack- 
son, Mrs. R. E. McNabb and 
Judy New. ---------

Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd Cleve­
land and family of Brecken- 
ridge visited the J. A. Hertels 
last weekend. Dewayne Hertel 
of Denton also visited with 
them. ---------

Mr. ana Mrs. Larry Cornel- 
son of Lewisville visited with 
Mr. and Mrs. August Balzer 
last weekend.

Cotton
Prices
Dropping

Local cotton prices offered 
to farmers ranged from 20 to 
24 cents per pound over CCC 
loan rates, according to B. B. 
Manly in charge of the 
U.S.D.A. Cotton Classing 
Office in Abilene. The market 
was strong early, but weaken­
ed late during the week 
ending January 20. Demand 
was moderate, and trading 
was slow to moderate. Most 
available qualities of cotton 
brought prices ranging from 
48 to 56 cents per pound.

Cotton grade distributions 
continued fairly consistent 
even for late season ginnings. 
Grade 42 continued as the 
predominant grade classed, 
comprising 33% of the total 
classings. It was followed by 
grade 52 at 19%, grade 32 at 
12%, grade 51 at 11%, and 
grade 41 at 8%. About 51% of 
the samples were reduced in

grade because of bark or 
grass.

5taple lengths were 60% 
staple 32. 29'’ 'o staple 31. and 
9®'o staple 33.

Micronaire readings were 
68 percent within the 3.5 to 4.9 
range. 31 percent 3.4 or lower, 
and 1 percent 5.0 or higher.

A total of 16.000 cotton 
samples were classed a; the 
U.S.D.A. Cotton Classing 
Office in Abilene during the 
week ending January 20. This 
brought the seasonal total to
478.000 samples classed, 
which compares to only
336.000 samples that had been 
classed bv the same time last

Label
Speeds
Refund

Taxpayers can receive their 
refunds faster by using the 
preaddressed peel-off label on 
their returns, the Internal 
Revenue Service said.

The label, which appears on 
the cover of the ta.\ package" 
'mailed to taxpayers, list?''’| 
name, address and sociaT'‘;| 
security number. tp^f

The 1RS emphasized that 
any information on the label ï^»| 
incorrect, the taxpayer shdUgjfr 
make corrections right on the-J 
label.

Married taxpayers filing 
joint return should check tQ̂ ;| 
see that two social security^! 
numbers appear on the labeU-'| 
If only one social securityvl 
number is shown, the other-J 
spouse’s number should bif 
entered on the appropriate^, 
line.

According to the IRS,,-,! 
taxpayers can also ensure â-'T 
faster refund by mailing theif'. 
return in the coded envelope-J 
also included with the tax;| 
package.

ALL PURPOSE SHEARS, finbj 
cutting quality, durable. Carr] 
ries Good Housekeeping and! 
Parents Magazine Seals at th%| 
Haskell Free Press.

- W e  Reserve the Right to L im i t -

Congratulations to Jill Le­
Fevre, who was selected as 
FFA Sweetheart of the Rule 
FFA Chapter. Jill is a junior 
and daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Delbert LeFevre.

rV  506 North Second USDA Food Stamps Coupons Gladly Accepted

Home OwneiK

Parker's Super Market
Phone 864*3454.

Guests in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. A. C. Knipling 
Friday evening, Jan. 21, at a 
birthday party honoring Mr. 
Knipling were: Mr. and Mrs. 
Herbert Lammert and Mr. and 
Mrs. Herbert Vahlenkamp of 
Old Glory, Mr. and Mrs. Ervin 
Schaake of Paint Creek, Mrs. 
Emma Raphelt and Erna and 
Walter Schaake of Stamford, 
Mr. and Mrs. Leonard Kieke, 
Mr. and Mrs. Eugene Teichel- 
man, Mr. and Mrs. Lewis 
Corzine, Mr. and Mrs. Her­
bert Nierdieck, Mr. and Mrs. 
Alfred Hertel, Mr. and Mrs. 
Otto Schaake, Mr. and Mrs. J. 
B. Toney, Bruce and Rene, 
Mr. and Mrs. F. A. Stege­
moeller, and Clarence Stege­
moeller and Mr. and Mrs. 
Alvin Bredthauer.

QUAUTY-

\  ---------------- ------------------
Ig f r e s h  g r o u n d  A A  IBEEF 69C

LB

12 OZ PKG

B̂ÂON 89{
^  USDA “ CHOICE”

^ROUND 1 0
S STEAK LB 
S-------------
g Fruit QQa
»Cobblers a s s t  k i n d s  iw y

KEITH ’S PRE-COOKED

S  O  s i W A Z / z y s ’

Î
 RUSSET 10 LB BAG A  JL

^Potatoes bUC
^  ÉAST TEXASI YAMS LB

9  FANCY GOLDEN

SDelicious 
SApples LB

^  SUNKIST JUMBO LB O f t X

^Tangerines ZUC

CUDAHY 
“ GOLD COIN”

CANNED
PICNIC

FULLY COOKED! 
3 LB CAN

BEST
MAID

WAFFLE
SYRUP

32 OZ 
SIZE

W HITE SWAN FANCY 15 OZ CANS ^

WHITE HOMINY 5 ' ’ $1.|
W HITE SWAN WHOLE OR M

SUCED BEETS “ • “ “  4  “ S1.|
W HITE SWAN W ITH OR W ITHOUT M

Hackeye Peas““" 4 '° S1.|
W HITE SWAN 8 OZ CAN a

Tomato Sauce o " " SI.
W HITE SWAN EARLY JUNE 17 OZ M

Luncheon Peas 4 $1.
FINE FARE PURE VEGETABLE ^  ^

SHORTENING $1 .29
FOREMOST ASST FLAVORS #  

BIG DIP " CARTON } I9C
BORDEN GALLON PLASTIC JUG 4

HOMO MILK i  1.691
HI-DRI O  f

Paper Towels Z I9 (
BAGGED

RED

Delicious
Apples

/i

fflll0CÂÎ

Tide's'lnrrOirl'i Out

Â A f m o i ’s s

FAVORITI S
Tide's In... Dirt s Out SI
FAMILY

SIZE
BOX



TH€ HASK€Ll S ^ F R € €  PR€SS
VOLUME NINETY-ONE HASKELL, TEXAS, 79521, THURSDAY, JANUARY 27, 1977 NUMBER FOUR

RULE ROUND-UP
BY OLETA CORNELIUS Phone 997-2167 With Your News

BOUNCING BALL
The senior high boys and 

girls journeyed to Goree the 
18th of January for a district 
26-B basketball game and lost 
both games. In the boys game 
it was Goree 45 and Rule 27. 
Tumlinson scored 11 for high 
point boy for Rule and Echols 
scored 11 for high point boy 
for Goree.

In the girls game it was 
Goree 46 and Rule 38. 
Williams was high point girl 
for Rule with 20 points and 

L. Skelton led the Goree girls 
scoring with 34 points.

Playing Rochester Friday 
night, the 21st, Rule split the 
games with the boys winning 
and the girls losing. In the 
boys game it was Rule 54 and 
Rochester 44. Tumlinson led 
the scoring for Rule with 26 
points and Townsend was high 
point boy for Rochester with 
12.

The girls score was Rule 35 
and Rochester 38. Williams 
had 18 points for Rule for high 
point girl and Beauchamp had 
20 for Rochester.

High school played Weinert 
last Tuesday night and will 
host Goree on Friday, January 
28, beginning play at 7 p.m. 
On Tuesday, Feb. 1 they host 
Rochester and on Friday, Feb. 
4, they journey to Weinert and 
close out basketball play for 
the year.

r  The junior high hosted 
Weinert the 17th and took 

^̂ f̂eoth games. The boys score 
was Rule 44 and Weinert 12. 
In the girls game it was Rule 
33 and Weinert 19.

Playing in the junior high 
Knox City Invitational Tourn­
ament last Thursday in the 
O’Brien gym, the girls played 
Munday for their first game 
and won 33 to 21. Playing 
again Saturday, they were 
defeated by Knox City by the 
score of 32-33 and placed 
second in the tournament.
■ In the boys game played last 

Thursday in the tournament, 
they also played Munday and 
won by the score of 39-30. 
Playing Saturday also, they 
were defeated by the Knox 
City boys 23-38 and they also 
placed second in the tourna­
ment.

The junior high hosted 
Goree last Monday night, 

 ̂ January 24 and will host 
Rochester Monday night, Jan. 
31st. Thursday, Feb. 3 they 
 ̂play at Rochester. On Monday 
night the 7th of Feb. they will 
journey to Weinert and close 
out their basketball season at 
that time.

FHA COOKBOOKS
Cookbooks may still be 

purchased from any FHA 
member for $3 and is called 
“ Cook’ s Delight.”  The Rule 
Future Homemakers of Amer­
ica Chapter have published 
this chapter and community 
cookbook which contain re­
cipes donated by ladies of the 
Rule and Sagerton commun­
ity. The cookbook features a 
variety of recipes as well as 
basic kitchen information.

Jill LeFevre is cookbook 
chairman and Mrs. Becky 
Baker is FHA Advisor.

BOOK CLUB
Members of the Rule Book 

Club will meet in the home of 
Mrs. Frances Campbell on 
Tuesday, Feb. 1 at 1:30 p.m. 
to receive their new books for 
the 1977 year. Members will 
exchange books on the first 
Tuesday of each month at 1:30 
p.m., meeting in the members 
home in alphabetical order of 
those in town.

SOCIAL SECURITY
A representative of the 

Abilene area office for the 
social security will be at the 
Rule City Hall on Wednesday, 
February 9, between the hours 
of 1-2 p.m. Anyone needing 
assistance with their social 
security should be present at 
this time.

U.M.W.
Members of the United 

Methodist Women met in the 
Fellowship Hall of the church 
on Tuesday, Jan. 18, with 
Mrs. Allen Forbis as hostess.

Mrs. Olis Macon, president, 
called the meeting to order. 
Mrs. J. N. Cornelius gave the 
opening prayer. Mrs. Macon 
introduced Miss Irene Stewart 
of Stamford who presented an 
Officers Training Program. 
Miss Stewart spoke of each 
officer and their duty in the 
organization and read the 
creed of the United Methodist 
Women to the group. She 
spoke of how far women had 
come in the work of the church 
and also suggested that the 
women keep a history of their 
womens organization and also 
assist the church in the 
keeping of their local history 
for future generations.

Following her talk Mrs. 
Macon presented a gift to 
Miss Stewart from the 
U.M.W. in appreciation of her 
talk. Mrs. A. R. Eaton 
dismissed the meeting with 
prayer and those attending 
enjoyed fellowship and re­
freshments of coffee and 
various kinds of cake.

PHIL CLUB NEWS
The members of the Rule 

Philadelphian Club met on 
Thursday, Jan. 20, at 2 p.m. 
for their annual business 
meeting. Mrs. John Greeson, 
president, heard reports from 
various department chairmen 
and reports were submitted. 
Mrs. Greeson read a news­
letter from Mrs. Charles 
Boyd, Mesquite District Pres­
ident, reminding members to 
begin planning to enter the 
Fashions for Fun contest 
which will be judged at the 
Mesquite District Convention 
to be held in Abilene, March 
23-24th.

Mrs. Audie Verner review­
ed the plans for the upcoming 
programs. Members will hear 
Jackie Wharton speak in 
February on combating crime 
locally, guests will also be 
welcome for this meeting.

Mrs. A. D. May, Chairman 
for the Texas Heritage Depart­
ment, read a letter from the 
Texas Federation of Womens 
Clubs, announcing an essay 
contest on our Texas Heritage, 
to focus attention on youth. 
Entries will be judged at a 
District level and State level. 
Rule members voted to offer 
this contest locally and offer a 
small prize for first and second 
places. There are four titles 
from which to choose and 
these will be announced later.

Mrs. Qyde Grice was 
Director for the meeting. Mrs. 
A. R. Eaton led the pledge of 
allegiance and Mrs. C. A. 
Jackson gave Federation 
News, an inspirational reading 
entitled, "What America 
Means To Me.”

The Club meeting was 
closed with members repeat­
ing the Club Collect in unison.

Hostesses were Mrs. J. E. 
Geer and Mrs. Frank Camp­
bell.

LOCALS
Visiting recently in the 

home of Mr. and Mrs. Joe B. 
Smith were Mr. and Mrs. Bob 
Smith of Midland.

Mr. and Mrs. J. B. 
Hendricks of Plainview, visit­
ed with Mr. and Mrs. J. N. 
Cornelius last week.

Congratulations to Mark 
Lewis on showing the Champ­
ion Intermediate Mutton 
Breed Lamb at the Abilene

Bluebonnet Cafe 
Rule

Noon Buffet 11:00-1:30 
5:30 P.M . Buffet

WED. MEXICAN FOOD THURS. STEAK NIGHT 

FRI. CATFISH CHUNKS

LUNCHROOM MENU 
Jan. 31-Feb. 4

MONDAY 
Pigs in Blanket with 

Mustard or Mayonnaise 
Blackeyed Peas 
French Fries with Catsup 
Cheese filled Celery Sticks 
Chocolate No Bake Cookies 
Milk

TUESDAY 
Chili Con Came 

With Beans 
Baked Potato 
Lettuce & Tomato Salad 
Combread & Butter 
Yellow Cake with 

Creme Icing 
Milk

WEDNESDAY 
Meat Slices with 

Mustard or Mayonnaise 
Vegetable Soup 
Lettuce Leaves 
Sliced Bread &  Crackers 
Graham Cracker Cookie 
Milk

THURSDAY
Burritos 
Buttered Corn 
Tossed Green Salad 
Pineapple Cobbler 
Milk

FRIDAY 
Hamburgers on 

Buttered Buns 
Mustard or Mayonnaise 
French Fries with Catsup 
Lettuce, Tomato 

Pickle & Onion 
Congealed Cranberry & 

Orange Jello 
Milk

GARDEN CLUB
The Rule Garden Club will 

meet on Wednesday, Feb­
ruary 2, at 2 p.m. in the home 
of Mrs. W. S. Cole. Theme for 
the meeting will be, “ The

Best For Today and Tomor­
row.”  Director for the day will 
be Miss Jessie Vick. Mrs. C. 
E. Franklin will report on 
Organic Gardening.

Hostesses for the meeting 
will be Mrs. E. O. Morgan and 
Mrs. W. S. Cole.

Livestock Show regional lamb 
judging Tuesday, Jan. 18, in 
Abilene. 542 lambs were 
entered from 33 counties in 
the competition. Mark also 
placed first in the heavyweight 
medium wool and mutton 
breeds and their crosses.

Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Ray 
and Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth 
Anderson attended the funeral 
of Powers Carnes in Odessa 
last week.

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Cornel­
ius and Jeffrey of Carrollton, 
visited over the weekend with 
Mr. and Mrs. Vernon Mahler 
and Melissa and Mr. and Mrs. 
J. N. Cornelius and Tommy.

Rev. and Mrs. Ailen Forbis 
visited in Amarillo with his 
family this week.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Dunnam 
and, Mrs. Leatha Flippo 
attended an AARP workshop 
held in Abilene last week.

BULLETIN BOARD
Jan. 29 Rule hosts Goree 7 

p.m.
Jan. 30 5th Sunday Night 

Services
Jan. 31 Jr Hi hosts Rochester 

6 p.m.
Feb. 1 Book Qub 1:30 p.m.

Mrs. Frances Campbell 
U.M.W. 2 p.m.

City Council
Feb. 2 Garden Club 2 p.m. 
Feb. 3 Jr Hi at Rochester 
Feb. 4 Rule at Weinert 
Feb. 7 Jr Hi at Weinert 
Feb. 8 U.M.W. 2 p.m.
Feb. 9 Social Sec. Resp.

City Hall 1-2 p.m.

SAVE BOXTOPS
The Rule Elementary School 

is saving Post Cereal box tops 
for playground equipment. 
Those who use the cereal, are 
asked to please save the tops 
and turn them in to a Rule 
Elementary student or to Mr. 
Lusk, Elementary School Prin­
cipal.

Deadline is March 31, 1977, 
so please help in the collecting 
of box tops to help the grade 
school students to acquire 
additional playground equip­
ment. —

WINS TRIP
Karan Sharp McClure (Mrs. 

Jeff McClure of Roby) and 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Melvin Sharp of Rule, is the 
recipient of a three day trip to 
Austin. Mrs. McClure won the 
trip by having the highest 
score during competition 
while attending Cosmetology 
at Western Texas College at 
Snyder.

Accompanying Mrs. Mc­
Clure on her three day trip will 
be her instructor, Mrs. Val- 
lene Turney. They will tour 
the State Board and meet the 
Executive Board members at 
Austin. ---------

5TH SUNDAY NIGHT
Fifth Sunday night com­

munity wide services will be 
held in the First Baptist 
Church of Rule Sunday, Jan. 
30, at 6 p.m. Rev. Allen 
Forbis, pastor of the First 
United Methodist Church will 
be the speaker. Others assist­
ing on the program will be 
Rev. Jack Key, pastor of 
Sweet Home Baptist Church, 
Rev. Jack Slayton, pastor of 
Calvary Baptist Church and 
Rev. J. R. Williams, pastor of 
First Baptist.

^ S I ^ U  ̂   ̂ 864-2003

Fri. 28-Sat. 29-Sun. 30 
John Wayne 
Lauren Bacall 

“ The Shootlst”  
Rated PG Color

TO W ER
RULE PHONE 997-2124

Fri. 28-Sat. 29-Sun. 30 
Peter Fonda 

Blythe Danner 
“ Futureworld”  
Rated PG Color

Thurs. Only Feb. 3 
All New Spanish Picture 

$3.00 Carload

PUBLIC NOTICE
Lone Star Gas Company, in accordance 

with Section 43(a) of Article 1446c V.A.T.C.S., 
hereby gives notice of the Company' Intent 
to implement a new schedule of rates for 
natural gas service to be charged to the 
residential and commercial consumers in the

City of Rule, Texas 
effective February 22, 1977 

The rate schedule is expected to furnish 
a 16.43 percent increase in the Company’s 

gross revenues in the City of Rule
A Statement of Intent has been filed with 

the City of Rule, Texas
and is available for inspection at the Com­
pany's business office located at 

' 304 N. 1st St
Haskell, Texas

c j  Lone Star Gas Company

years. Mr. Doss was also a 
veteran of World War 11.

Survivors include his wife; a 
daughter, Jane Snellen of 
Dallas; two sisters, Mrs. Ora 
Cront of Anaheim, Calif, and 
Mrs. Boyce Foil of Rule; a 
brother, Marvin of White 
House; three grandchildren; 
and two great-grandchildren.

AARP
Members of the Rule 

Chapter of American Associa­
tion of Retired Persons 
(AARP) met in the Rule 
Recreation Clubhouse on 
Monday, January 17, at 6 p.m. 
for a dinner meeting and 
installation of officers for the 
new year.

Out going president O. G. 
Lewis presented the gavel of 
president to the new president

Bill Dunnam. Other new 
officers are: vice president- 
Leatha Flippo, secretarty-Opal 
Grice and treasurer-Mary Sue 
Henry.

Committee chairmen ap­
pointed for 1977 are as 
follows: program-Faye Dun­
nam, legislature-0. G. Lewis, 
membership-Nora Macon, 
community service-Peggy 
Kittley, publicity-Linnie Yar­
brough, telephone committee- 
Oleta Jackson, Estella Nor­
man and Frances Foil, 
nominating committee-Ruth 
Eaton, Hazel Lewis and Dovie 
Anderson.

A total of twenty six 
members and two guests 
attended. Guests were Dee 
Sprayberry and Rose Coker. 
Hostesses for the meeting 
were Ellesa Mason, Ola Mae 
Lisle and Estelle Norman.

Next meeting of the AARP 
will be on Monday night, 
February 21, at 6 p.m. 
Hostesses for that meeting 
will be Mmes. Doc Pointer, 
Lucie Williams and Belle 
Turner. Anyone interested in 
joining the AARP are welcome 
to attend their meetings.

B I R T H S
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Phillip 

Dunnam of Weinert announce 
the birth of a son. Jeffrey Hoyt 
Dunnam, born January 19, 
1977 at the Haskell Memorial 
Hospital weighing 5 lbs. 15‘/2 
oz.

Haskell Memorial Hospital 
weighing 8 lbs. 2'/2 oz.

Mr. and Mrs. Dale Franklin 
Thompson of Stamford an­
nounce the birth of a son, 
Kenneth Dale Thompson, 
born January 24, 1977 at the

Mr. and Mrs. Ted Wilson of 
Plainview announce the birth 
of twins, born Jan. 13. 1977. A 
son, Robert Keith, weighing 5 
lbs. 4'/2 oz. and a daughter. 
Kyla Beth, weighing 5 lbs. 
1 2 ‘/2  o z . Grandparents are Mr. 
and 'M rs. Elton Wilson. 
Plainview, and Mr. and Mrs. 
G. B. Therwanger of Stanton. 
Great grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. Alfred Tumbow, of 
Haskell and Mrs. Lola Keene 
of Plainview.

DANCE
RHINELAND GYM
SATURDAY, JANUARY 29

Tom Shaw & The Shawnees
Continental Record & “ Fiddlin’ Preacher”

8:30-12:30 Admission $3.00

REPORT OF CONDITION
Consolidating domestic subsidiaries of the 

THE FARMERS NATIONAL BANK

In the state o f .

Name ol Bank

TEXAS

. o f . RULE,

. at the close of business o n .

Cily

DECEMBER 30 ____1976
published in response to call made by Comptroller of the Currency, under title 12, United States Code. Section 161. 

Charter num ber_________ 14539_________________________  National Bank Region Number_________ H____________

NAME OF BANK: t h e  f a r m c b s  n a t i o n a l  b a n k — r u l e , T e x a s —
BALANCE SHEET at the close of business on __________ 1976

.CHARTER NUMBER;

INFORMATION ABOVE UNE NOT TO BE PUBUSHED
Statement of Resources and Liabilities

Thousands of dollars

(0

OBITUARY
Funeral services for Martin 

W. DoSs, 68, of Euless, were 
held Saturday, Jan. 22 in the 
First Baptist Church of Rule. 
Rev. J. R. Williams, pastor, 
officiated. Burial was in the 
Rule Cemetery. Mr. Doss died 
at 6 a.m. Thursday, Jan. 20 in 
the Arlington Memorial Hos­
pital.

Born February 6, 1908 in 
Rule, he married Edna Fae 
Bell, in February of 1928. He 
was a member of the First 
Baptist Church at Euless, a 
member of the Masonic Lodge 
and a retired employee of the 
Pilot Paper Company. He had 
lived in Euless for the past 25

111

951

1,-909-

CdBh and due from b an ks....................................................................
U.S. Treasury securities........................................................................
Obligations of other U.S. Gov't, agencies and corps...............................
Obligations of States and political subdivisions...............................
Other bonds, notes, and debentures..................................................
Federal Reserve stock and corporate s to ck .....................................
Trading account securities....................................................................
Federal funds sold and securities purchased
under agreements to resell ................................................................

Loans, Total (excluding unearned incom e).................................
Less: Reserve for possible loan losses............................ , ..........
Loans, N e t .............................................................................................................................

Direct lease financing ...............................................................................................................
Bank premises, furniture and fixtures, and other assets representing bank premises .
Real estate owned other than bank premises......................................................................
Investments in unconsolidated subsidiaries and associated companies.................. ...
Customers' liability to this bank on acceptances outstanding .........................................
Other assets................................................................................................................................
TOTAL ASSETS ............  ............................................... ...........
Demand deposits of individuals, prtnshps., and corps............................................... ..................
Time and savings deposits of individuals.

prtnshps., and corps.............. .............................................................................................
Deposits of United States Government.................................................................................
Deposits of States and political subdivisions .......................................................................
Deposits of foreign govts, and official institutions.....................................................................
Deposits of commercial banks.................................................................................................
Certified and officers' checks .................................................................................................

Total demand deposits ........................................................................................
Total time and savings deposits .....................................................
Total deposits in foreign offices.......................................................
TOTAL DEPOSITS IN DOMESTIC AND FOREIGN O FFIC ES.....................................

Federal funds purchased and securities sold
under agreements to repurchase ..............................................................................................

, Liabilities for borrowed money...................................  ..................................................................
Mortgage indebtedness .....................................................................................................................
Acceptances executed by or for account of this bank and outstanding ..................................
Other liabilities................................................................................................................ ....................
TOTAL LIABILITIES (excluding subordinated notes and debentures).....................................

_ Subordinated notes and debentures ............................................................................................
Preferred stock No. shares outstanding-----------------------------(par value) ..........................
Common stock a. No. shares authorized---------5QQQ----------

b. No. shares outstanding____ 3 0 0 0 ------------ (par v a lu e )............................
Surplus ................................................................................................................................................
Undivided profits ...............................................................................................................................
Reserve for contingencies and other capital reserves................................................................
TOTAL EQUITY CA PITAL...............................................................................................................
TOTAL LIABILITIES AND EQUITY CAPITAL..............................................................................

Average for 15 or 30 calendar days ending with call date:
Cash and due from b an ks ..........................................................................................................
Fed. funds sold and securities purchased under agreements to resell...................................
Total loans ....................................................................................................................................
Time deposits of $1(X),000 or more in domestic offices..................................................................
Total deposits...............................................................................................................................
Fed. funds purchased and securities sold under agreements to repurchase .........................
Liabilities for borrowed m oney..................................................................................................

Standby letters of credit (outstanding as of report d ate).............................................................
Time deposits of $100,000 or more (outstanding as of report date)

Time certificates of deposit in denominations of $100,000 or m o re ...................................
Other time deposits in amounts of $100,000 or more .........................................................

HENRY TOWNSEND

THOUSANDS

1 . 4 2 5
1 .0 9 7

2 ^

7OQ

948

1?6

5 .5 7 H

1 . 7 7 7
_2Û_

_55_
^4-091

s .o q s

_50_
A M -
118

-4285-
5, 5m-

1 , 2 ^

1 ,0 2 8

^ , 909

I.
We, the undersigned directors attest the correctness 

of this statement of resources and liabilities. We declare 

that it has been examined by us, and to the best of our 

knowledge and belief is true and correct.

C A S H ' ER

Tille

of the above-named bank do hereby declare that this Re­
port of Condition is true and correct to the best of my 
knowledge and belief.

Signature

/  0 - 7  7

/  I r ' t l -  (7^  .

C:- Directors,
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SUPERMARKETS
PRICES GOOD JANUARY 27 THROUGH FEBRUARY 2

 ̂ r T T T TIT
3 RING

SALAD 
IDRESSING

QUART

49<

UPTON

NSTANT
3 OZ

PARADE

POTATO
CHIPS

REG. 79c 69<

1

«»ONU?

DEL MONTE 
SLICED OR HALVES

PEACHES
303 CAN

3 / $ l

GERBER STRAINED

Baby Food
EXCLUDING MEAT

7 / $ l

lì

Double Stamps Wednesday & Saturday

USDA HEAVY BEEF

Chuck 
Roast

USDA HEAVY BEEF ^ m a  , . . . . r , . . uu...

Chuck Roast.... ................. Swiss Steak

BLADE CUT LB 

USDA HEAVY BEEF

USDA HEAVY BEEF

Steak Family Cut. LB USDA HEAVY

Arm Roast

ROUND BONE CUT LB

LB

Beef Liver
MARKET SLICED

Ground Beef small package lb DECKER EVERGOOD
B a c o n . . . . . .

:  ■ > A  X  a r m o u r  sta r

Calf Liver...... ."f.".!'."!':".“.... .“ . 4 7 t  Hot Dog......

12 OZ PKG lb

BEEF OR REGULAR
12 OZ EACH

A » *
Ground Beef

FAMILY PACK 
3 LBS OR MORE

ARMOUR CAMPFIRE
Hot Links... LB 0 0  A a r m o u r  [SMOKED, GERMAN POLISH,........... .7 7  V Sausage.K.uLB.Assyj.|
ARMOUR SWANEE 3 LB BOX ROYAL ROCK o m A w c D A P c  CO A
Bacon Ends & Pieces.. .̂«"J l.29 Turkeys.... ........................

ARMOUR STAR

[BOLOGNA, SALAMI] 

12 OZ PKG e a c h

JRB MEATS ARE U. S. GOVERNMENT INSPECTED. IF FOR ANY REASON 
YOU ARE NOT SATISFIED, WE WILL CHEERFULLY REFUND YOUR MONEY.

V .u

HEALTH & BEAUTY AIDS

Bismol 8 OZ REG. $1.49

MISS BRECK REG. $1.09

Aspirin 100 COUNT REG. $1.44

Rolaids SPEARMINT OR REG. 
REG. $1.24

SUN
ALL PURPOSE

DETERGENT
GIANT 
SIZE

' ^

mil
Hill
Hill
i i a i !

mil
mil



I^PARADE I

i  BODENS 

ORCHARD

DRINK
64 OZ

mil
i m
m i l

m i l

m i l

mil

FLOUR
5 LB BAG

nm
m i l

m i l

m i l  _____

mil' MORTON HOUSE
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SUPERMARKETS
WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT QUANTITIES

DAIRY & FROZEN FOODS
JRB

PARADE

GALLON

W ITH BEANS 
24 OZ 79i

BISCUITS 10 COUNT

PARADE

SUNBEAM

Cookies REG. 3/$1.00 4 / $ l
SOFT SPREAD 49C
PARADE

WHIPPED TO P P IN G -4 9 0
M IX  OR M A T C H

Ranch Style Beans n  / ( T 1
^VAN CAMP 1
Pork & Beans 300 can |

WHOLESUN _  ^

Orange Juice A  |
PALMOLIVE i l  / n i
Bar Soap “ /  1

Corn k i s t  mm M

Macaroni & Cheese^Q^O/ 3  1
Potted Meat 3oz J  1
GOLD TIP £ £ /  ^  1
Tomatoes • /  4P N

ARGO » “

Peas 0  A M
BRUCES CUT J  / H  1
Yams 0 /  ^  1

' ' ‘■LENS ^
Cut Green Beans can J  / ( T  1
PARADE A  /  ^  1
Macaroni & Cheese? o i t /  «k  I

GLADIOIACORNBREAD ^ H IT E  OR — A» 4  Pouch Mixes yellow IT  V u  j
PARADE ^  I

Tomato Sauce w #  4F ■
Dog & Cat Food C / f r i  
Vermicelli 0 /  ^  |

PARADEShoestringPotatoes^n r  /(h  4
KOZY KITTEN ^  ^  1
Cat Food 300 CAN U /  J |  1

CARNATION ^  -

Hot Cocoa ' Q  / ( T 1
BUFFALO f l  /  ^  I
Tomato Puree «^.oz u /  4P ■

JOHNSON

FRDZEN PIES 89t
IMPERIAL LIGHT BLEND

MARGARINE QUARTERS

WE HONOR FOOD STAMPS

HORMEL

¡¡II Vienna Sausage
5 OZ

[ ¡ IH o rm o l^
V ic in a  

{Sausage

FOR

BONUS SPECIALS

ARMOUR

12 OZ PKG

PLUS ONE SUPER DISCOUNT BOOKLET

AKMUUH

FRANKS
BONUS SPECIALS

JRB V2 GALLON

IC ECR EA M  59(
PLUS ONE SUPER DISCOUNT BOOKLET

JRB

BONUS SPECIALS

V2 GALLON

PLUS ONE SUPER DISCOUNT BOOKLET

BONUS SPECIALS

RUSSET

POTATOES°°69C
PLUS ONE SUPER DISCOUNT BOOKLET

PRODUCE VALUES
RUSSET
Potatoes
15 LB

ORANGES 
AVOCADOS 
LETTUCE 
Yellow Squash 
TANGERINES

CALIFORNIA NAVALS

LARGE SIZE

LARGE HEADS

NEW CROP

CALIFORNIA SWEET

3/$l
3/$l

39« 
49< 
39<

EACH

LB
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PARTICIPANTS IN TIffi BREADS DESSERT Division of the Haskell County Food Show 
were: (left to right) Julie Patty, Melinda Blakley, Donna Kemp, Joanne Cloud, Laurie Reynolds, 
Lynn Weatherly, Gena Fischer and Becky Medford. Standing in front is: Denise Young, Kami 
Madina and Chris Dean.

(Conservation Viewpoints]
USDA Soii Conservation Service

Assisting
California Creek and Wichita-Brazos

. Soil and Water Conservation Districts

WATER To Meet a Growing 
Thirst was the topic of 
discussion led by James M. 
Rose, Executive Director of 
the Texas Water Development 
Board, at the annual meeting 
of the Texas Council of 
Chapters of the Soil Conser­
vation Society of America, at 
Texas A&M University last 
summer.

Mr. Rose stated that the 
Texas Water Development 
Board had been charged by 
the Texas Legislature with 
providing the water for Texas 
agriculture, industries and 
muncipalities.

“ This water must be of 
suitable quality and provided 
at reasonable cost, and at the 
same time, the environment 
must be protected,”  Mr. Rose 
said.

The staff of the Texas Water 
Development Board is cur­
rently calculating water needs 
for the future, the year 2000, 
2020 and beyond. Texans, 
statewide, are currently using 
about 23 million acre-feet of 
water per year. That is I Vi  
trillion gallons.

Texas current population is 
12.3 million people, by 1980 it 
is expected to reach 13.5 
million, and by 1985 it will be 
14.7 million. With the expect­
ed increase of ‘A million 
people annually, it will not be 
too long before our supply of 
water available for all uses will

be too small. Food and fiber 
production from the estimated 
10 million acres of irrigated 
land in Texas now, and the 
increased production that 
would be realized from the 20 
to 25 million acres that could 
be irrigated, can be a powerful 
force in a hungary world. Our 
food and fiber needs steadily 
increase, so the importance of 
the expansion of irrigation and 
the increased water needs 
most be foremost in our local 
thinking as well as that 
state-wide, nation-wide, and 
world-wide.

“ Water supply for small 
towns and communities, al­
ready one of the state’ s most 
pressing problems, will be­
come more acute as a result of 
the passage of the Safe 
Drinking Water Act,”  quoted 
Mr. Rose. This act will 
necessitate the improvement 
or replacement of a large 
number of public water supply 
facilities in Texas.

Much emphasis has been 
given by the Texas Water 
Development Board and other 
agencies to water conservation 
as a means of extending 
supplies of irrigation water, 
especially in those areas 
where the water supplies are 
declining more rapidly than 
they are being recharged.

This is where the Soil 
Conservation Service and the 
local soil and water conserva­

tion districts come into the 
picture. Our systems of 
parallel terraces, contour 
farming, crop residue man­
agement, minimum tillage, 
irrigation systems—both 
sprinkler and surface, timely 
water application, proper 
management of irrigation 
water, and the many other 
practices that we promoted 
will assist in conserving water, 
helping the irrigator to reduce 
pumping costs, and other 
production imputs.

Mr. Rose’s imput in this 
discussion period was much 
too great to publish at one 
time. But I hope you, my 
readers, will see that conserv­
ing water on the local basis, is 
the first step. The SCS would 
like to help in planning the 
proper irrigation for your 
farm. Let us know your needs.

J. C. Yeary, Jr.
District Conservationist

tional Director in churches 
over Texas. He has pastored 
churches in Abilene, Here­
ford, Marlow and Lawton, 
Okla, Kileen and Anaheim, 
Calif. He has served on the 
Executive Board of the Baptist 
General Convention of Texas, 
Board of Directors of Highland 
Lakes Encampment, Trustee- 
Mexican Baptist Bible Insti­
tute in San Antonio, Trustee of 
Mary Hardin Baylor College, 
President of the Baptist 
Pastors Conference, President 
of the Community Clergy 
Association and has held 
several Associational posi­
tions.

Other speakers for the 
Conference include Bob Ca­
meron, Pastor of First Baptist 
Church, O’Brien, H. B. 
Graves, Jr., Pastor of First 
Baptist Church, Munday, T. 
O. Upshaw, Director of 
Missions, Double Mountain 
Area, Stamford.

Special music will be 
provided by the Griffin Family 
Singers during both sessions 
of the conference. The group 
includes Jim Bob, wife, 
Louverl and their five daugh­
ters. They are experienced 
concert and crusade musi­
cians.

Combined choirs of all the 
churches in the Double 
Mountain Area will provide 
music for the evening session. 
Choir practice at 6:15 and 
everyone is invited to partici­
pate.

GENERAL
REVENUE
SHARING ACTUAL USE REPORT
GENERAL REVENUE SHARING PROVIDES FEDERAL FUNDS DIRECTLY TO LOCAL AND STATE GOVERNMENTS. YOUR GOVERNMENT MUST PUBLISH 
THISREPORTADVISING YOU HOW THESE FUNDS HAVE BEEN USED OR OBLIGATED DURING THE YEAR FROM JULY 1. 1976. THRU DECEMBER 3 1 *  “j 
1076. THIS IS TO INFORM YOU OF YOUR GOVERNMENT S PRIORITIES AND TO ENCOURAGE YOUR PARTICIPATION IN DECISIONS ON HOW FUTURE 
FUNDS SHOULD BE SPENT. NOTE: ANY COMPLAINTS OF DISCRIMINATION IN THE USE OF THESE FUNDS MAY BE SENT TO THE OFHCE OF 
REVENUE SHARING, WASHINGTON. D.C. 20226. __________________  - t —

ACTUAL EXPENDITURES (Includ« Ob»Q<tkw)

(A) CATEGORIES

1 PUBLIC SAFETY

2 ENVIRONMENTAL 
PROTECTION

3 PUBLIC 
TRANSPORTATION

S RECREATION

6 LIBRARIES

7 SOCIAL SERVICES 
FOR AGED OR POOR

6 FINANCIAL
ADMINISTRATION

9 MULTIPURPOSE AND 
GENERAL GOVT.

10 EDUCATION

11 SOCIAL
DEVELOPMENT

12 HOUSING & COM> 
MUNITY DEVELOPMENT

13 ECONOMIC 
DEVELOPMENT

14 OTHER (Specify)

15 TOTALS

(B) CAPITAL

4,727

(C) OPERATING / 
MAINTENANCE

U O O D -

THE GOVERNMENT 
OF HASKELL C I T V

has received Ger>eral Revenue Sharing
payments totaling % 2Q , 1 7 8

during the period from July 1. 1976 thru December 31. 1976 

ACCOUNT NO. 4 4  2 1Q4 0 0 1
HPiSKELL C I T V
tiftVOR
C I T Y  HPl.L
HASKELL TEXAS 7 9 5 2 1

7 5  1

NONDISCRIMINATION REQUIREMENTS HAVE BEEN MET 
(El CERTIFICATION; I c e rti^  that I am the Chief Executive Officer i 
with respect to the entitlement funda-raported hereon, I certify that l 
have not been u s ^  in v io la t io n  of q the r the priority expendí]! 
requ lrem eprrfiec tlw  103] or thp matching funds prohloi*
1 » )  of t h / A l l f . ^ ^ A ¿ ^  ^  ^

Date

/  (D) TRUST FUND REPORT (refer to instruction D)
1. Balance as of June 30. 1976 *
2. Revenue Sharing Funds
Received from July 1. 1976 thru [)ecember 31. 1976

3. Interest Received
or Credited (July 1. 1976 thru December 31.1976)

4. Funds Released from Obligations (IF ANY)

5. Sum of lines 1. 2. 3. 4

6. Funds Returned to ORS (IF ANY)

7. Total Funds Available

8. Total Amount Expended
(Sum of line 15. column B and column C)

9. Balance as of December 31. 1976__________

1 1 . 1 5 4

2D , 1 7 8

- J M 3 2 -

3 1 .3 H n
4 , S 5 t

(F) THE NEWS MEDIA HAVE BEEN ADVISED THAT A COMPLETE COPY OF THIS 
REPORT HAS BEEN PUBLISHED IN A LOCAL NEWSPAPER OF GENERAL CIRCU­
LATION. I HAVE A COPY OF THIS REPO.PT AND RECORDS DOCUMENTING THE

CONTENTS. THEY ARE OPEN FOR PUBLIC SCRUTINY AT

Conference 
Set Jan. 31

The Double Mountain Area- 
Wide Evangelism Conference 
will be held on Monday, 
January 31, 1977 in the First 
Baptist Church, Anson begin­
ning with the afternoon 
session at 2:00 and the 
evening at 6:45.

Guest speaker for the 
conference will be W. Robert 
(Bob) Harris, Pastor of Fellow­
ship Baptist Church, Houston. 
Harris was born in Alanreed, 
Texas. Attended Lubbock 
Public Schools, Texas Tech 
University and Hardin- 
Simmons University where he 
majored in Bible. Harris has 
been Youth, Music/Educa-

COLD WEATHER SPECIALS

Cotton Prints 7 7 1a B B B B B ^  99 cYD .  "  T

REG. A A xuinghom Chocks,$1.59 YD Y Y Ç

I T h A A  I J l « l t ^ ° T O p "  ^ L o r C I  a a
K n G G  lliy il REG. 49c ^

Alcohol 21 (
Listerine 7 7 i

Cosmetic Bolls 57«
Bayer A s p i r i n 8 7 t
Vz GALLON SIZE ETC.
^ 0 1  1 ■ # REG VShampoo Lotion $1.44 $ 1 b 1 #

Prostono ̂ nti-freeze $3.33
Polish Remover CUTEX A Q x  

REG. 35c X O C

PERRY^S HASKELL,

50.6 MILLION
IN ASSETS

THANK YOU FOR HELPING 
US REACH THIS GOAL

ON THE GROW TO BETTER SERVE YOU
f you Are A Savings Customer O f First F e d e ra l 
S avings and L oan  A sso c ia t io n  o f  Stam ford 
You Can Receive All O f These G ood Services

NO DUES TO PAY. Nothing to sign or 
join . If you’re not a savings customer 
of First Federal Savings and Loan Asso­
ciation of Stamford wouldn’ t now be a 
good time to become one? At First Fed­
eral Savings and Loan Association of 
Stamford you get the best combination 
of earnings, safety and convenience. 
PAYROLL SAVINGS PLAN. For em­
ployers who wish to encourage the hab­
it of thrift with their employees.
HOME LOANS. Tailored to suit your 
individual needs.
SAVINGS ACCOUNT LOANS. A con­
venient means o f retaining earnings 
when a withdrawal becomes necessary. 
RENEWAL NOTICES. On Expiring 
Certificates.
AUTOMATIC DEPOSITS... from your 
bank checking account to your savings 
account, the easy way to save regularly 
and systematically.
PREFERRED RATES on Improvement 
Loans.
AFTER HOURS DEPOSITORY at the
HOME OFFICE

To open a savings account, visit 
any of our 3 conveniently located 
offices or call us.

INDIVIDUAL RETIREMENT 
ACCOUNTS

DIRECT DEPOSIT of Social Secu­
rity Checks
DIRECT DEPOSIT o f Federal 
Recurring Payments
FREE CHECK DRAFT SERVICE.
For those who desire automatic 
payment to savings or loan ac­
counts.
FREE TRAVELERS CHECKS . . .
issued by American F.xpress, one of 
the world’s leading travel services.
FREE MONEY ORDERS as issued 
by the Federal Home Loan Bank. 
FREE NOTARY SERVICE.
FREE SAVE-BY-MAIL SERVICE- 
a convenient method of adding to 
or withdrawing from your savings 
or certificate account.
FREE PARKING at all offices.
FREE DRIVE-UP SERVICE at the 
HOME Office,
DISCOUNT on Xerox copies.
♦OTHER SERVICES TO BE ADDED

DO YOU REQUIRE SECURITY AND RELIABILITY IN YOUR SAVINGS PLAN?
W H fR E  YOL/R SA V IN G S INTEREST IS C O M P O U N D E D  DAILY-PAID QUARTERLY

PASSBOOK
Annual Rale

5.25%
Annual Yield

5.39%

90 DAY NOTICE 500.00 
CERTIFICATE MINIMUM

Annual Rate

5.75%
Annual Yield

5.92%

12 MO CERTIFICATE  
1 ,0 0 0 .0 0  MINIMUM

Annual Rale

6.50%
.Annual A’ield

6.72%
Interest on Passbook Accounts 
Paid From Date Of Deposit To 
Date Of Withdrawal.

Interest on Certificate Accounts 
Paid From Date of Deposit To Dale 
Of Maturity. In By The 10th,,
Earn From the 1st.

3 0 -M O  CERTIFICATE
1,0 0 0 .0 0  M IM M L M

.Annual Rale

6.75%
Annual Yield

6.98%

4 8  MO. CERTIFICATE  
1 ,0 0 0 .0 0  MINIMUM

.Annual Rale

7.50%
Annual Yield

7.79%
1,000.00 MINIMUM DEPOSIT: 
Automatically Renewable; Compounded 
Daily and Paid Quarterly.

A Substantial Interest Penalty 
Is Required For Early Withdrawal.

FIRST FEDERAL SAVINGS AND 
LOAN ASSOCIATION

M fM SfR

F s n r
NAfU Sevomi *  Iwn hoyiww Ceip

Vowr t o v ^ t  InMifod 10 040.000

Abilene 
CUSTOMERS 
Toll Free Call 

Dial -O- Ask For 
ENTERPRISE 84015

Home Office:
122 W. McHarg 
P.O. Box 511 

Stamford., Texas 79533 
915-773-2714

Branch Office:
#  3 Avenue D 
P.O. Box 444 

Haskell., Texas 79521 
817-864-3179

Division Office:
Quanah Federal Savings and Loan ■ ■ ■ ■ ■ B *-

313 South Main St. I I I I I I
Quanah , Texas 79252 I I I I | V

817-663-3388


