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Rates

Lockneyites 
to hear talk 
on dumping
Friday, May 27. the Rotary Interna­

tional meeting will feature speaker 
Delbert Diven. Mr. Diven is a represen­
tative of STAND (Serious Texans 
Against Nuclear Dumping) who will 
speak on the effects of nuclear dumping 
in the Panhandle. He will be able to 
answer any questions anyone might 
have on the subject.

STAND was formed in November of 
1981 when concerned citizens of the 
Swisher County area foresaw dangers 
and hazards to present and future 
generations of the area. There are many 
oppositions to putting a nuclear waste 
dump in this area.

A bedded salt site in the Texas Pan­
handle will be officially chosen by the 
U.S. Department of Energy (DOE) by 
June 1983 as one of five potential 
locations for the nation’s first commer­
cial nuclear waste repository. The site 
will be in either nortneastern Deaf 
Smith County or north central Swisher 
County. If selected as the disposal site, 
up to 70.000 metric tons of spent fuel, 
the equivalent of what the 70 operating 
nuclear power plants produce in 50 
years, would be transported across the 
country to the west Texas site.

Specific Issues Related to The 
Texas Site

Although DOE has determined that 
bedded salt formations surface, are 
potential repository horizons and has 
spent over S25 million on work in west 
Texas, various technical issues are 
unresolved.

1) Inadequate salt thickness In Swish­
er County. Salt at least 200 feet thick is 
preferred, though DOE’s screening 
criterion is 125 feet thick in Texas. The 
December 1981 Draft Area Geological 
Characterization Report showed that 
Swisher County preferred areas do not 
have salt even 70 feet thick.

2) Salt dissolution, especially In Deaf 
Smith County. Salt being dissolved by 
water is an unfavorable condition for 
burying nuclear waste. Such dissolution 
has occurred in the Seven Rivers salt 
formation above the proposed reposi­
tory horizons in Deaf Smith County.

3) Salt depth and strength. Salt is 
relatively easy to mine at shallow 
depths, deeper salt closes up. making 
mining and retrieval of wastes, should 
that be necessary, very difficult. The 
Texas Panhandle salt may not allow a 
repository below 2.500 feet deep, which 
eliminates Swisher County completely 
as ivell as portions of Deaf Smith 
County.

4) Faults and seismic activities. One 
significant fault or fault zone has been 
identified running northwest through 
Swisher County. Other faults are pos­
sible and rock fractures (lineaments) 
exist throughout the area.

5) Potential contamination of the 
Ogallala aquifer. This essential re­
source for millions of people could be 
contaminated by leakage from the 
repository resulting from the five shafts 
going through the Ogallala to the 
repository. Additionally, water from the 
Ogallala flowing down to the repository 
could accelerate dissolution.

6) Impact on private agricultural land. 
Deaf Smith and Swisher counties are 
among the leading agricultural counties 
in Texas. A waste repository would 
require condemnation of at least 4,000 
acres of land. The WIPP military waste 
site in New Mexico covers over 10.000 
acres. The value of surrounding farm 
land could decrease because of concern 
about possible contamination from acci­
dents at the repository or during 
transportation of the wastes.

7) Inability to scientifically compare 
Texas to other salt sites. Though a 
sound scientific, publicly acceptable 
and legally adequate waste manage­
ment program requires that comparable 
technical information is available on all 
of the potential sites, less data is 
available on the Texas sites than on the 
other salt areas.

Though the possible site of the dump 
is not in Floyd Countj(, it could effect 
the water in this county and could have 
other unknown effects on our county. 
Anyone interested in hearing Mr. Diven 
speak is urged to attend the meeting at 
the Rebekah Lodge at 12:20 to hear this 
informative meeting.

Junior high students recoginized
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1983 EIGHTH GRADE graduating class of Lockney Junior High.

8th graders given awards
The Lockney Junior High eighth 

grade graduation was held Friday in the 
high school gym. At this time the eighth 
grade students received some of the 
awards for this school year. Students 
with perfect attendances were Steve 
Cates, Henry Silva, and Rusty Teeter.

Mrs. Terrell presented awards in 
several categories to her outstanding 
students. Mrs. Terrell presented pla­
ques to three students for outstanding 
contributions in speech. Guy Cartjiel 
received the creativity award and Amy 
Nance and Johnny Silva were named 
outstanding girl and boy in speech for 
the year.

8th grade English Scholastic Awards 
were presented to Julie Davis, Lisa 
Terrell, Steven Cates, Matt Mitchell, 
Wyman Rexrode, David Lemons, Ben­
jamin Moya, Johnny Silva, Sherre 
Kinnard. Inez Gibson, Amy Nance. 
Rusty Teeter. Christy Coffman. Allen 
Stallings, Dickie Hernandez, Terri 
Luna, Henry Silva, Corny Luna, Soyla 
Luna, Dee Ann Hernandez and David 
Rodriquez.

Eighth grade speech scholastic a- 
wards were given to Wyman Rexrode, 
Allen Stallings, David Lemons, Benja­
min Moya, Johnny Silva, Sherre Kin­
nard, Inez Gibson. Christy Coffman. 
Dee Casey, Amy Nance. Rusty Teeter, 
and Eddie Garza.

Receiving 8th grade reading scholas­
tic awards were Dickie Hernandez, 
Terri Luna, Jerry Reyna and Patsy 
Sanchez.

Recipients of special speech awards 
were Guy Carthel, 1982-83 Speech 
Creativity Award; Amy Nance, 1982-83 
Outstanding Girl in Speech; and Johnny 
Silva, 1982-83 Outstanding Boy in 
Speech. These three students were 
presented plaques.

UIL oral reading certificates were 
awarded to Dee Casey. Lisa Terrell, 3rd 
place District; Julie Davis, 1st place 
District; Chad Frizzell and Rusty Tee­
ter.

UIL one act play award recipients 
were Julie Davis, Best Actress at UIL 
District competition; Lisa Terrell, All 
Star Cast, District; Amy Nance. All Star 
Cast, District; Dee Casey, Honorable 
Mention. All Star Cast. District; Steven 
Cates, Honorable Mention, All Star 
Cast, District; Matt Mitchell, Rusty 
Teeter, Christy Coffman. Chad Frizzell, 
Scott Howard, Johnny Silva, Eddie 
Garza, Sherre Kinnard. and Inez Gib­
son.

Achievement awards for the greatest 
growth in academic areas were given to 
Dee Casey, Ricardo Bernal, Phillip 
Luna, and Linda Coronado for English; 
Ricky Basaldua, reading, and Ricky 
Brotherton, speech.

Corny Luna and Henry Silva were 
recognized for maintaining an A ave­
rage in reading for the year. Mary Ellen 
Hernandez and Frankie Mendez show­
ed the most improvement in the second 
semester and Shere Kinard received a 
UIL ready writing participation award.

In the resource class Phillip Luna was 
recognized as showing the most im­
provement.

Steve Cates with a 97 average and 
Julie Davis with a %  were recognized as 
the top math students in the 8th grade. 
Mrs. Millhollen gave awards to Steve 
Cates, Benjamin Moya, Henry Silva, 
and Eddie Garza for UIL science 
participation. Lisa Terrell, Julie Davis.

Henry Silva and Corny Luna had 90 or 
above averages for the year in history.

Mrs. Whittington recognized the four 
8th grade students who competed in 
Austin. They were Lisa Terrell, Julie 
Davis, Matt Mitchell, and Steven Cates. 
Also named as outstanding art students 
were Hulio Cortez and Dickie Hernan­
dez.

Mr. Whitis awarded Julie Davis as 
the outstanding 8th grade band member 
for her contributions and leadership

The proclamation and will were read 
and Mr. Lusk recognized the valedicto­
rian, Julie Davis and salutatorian Lisa 
Terrell and the diplomas were present­
ed by Mr. Hallmark and Mr. Lusk.

Julie Davis read a poem she had 
written to the 8th grade graduates: 

Memories
As people come and go, some are 

more special than others.
But I think we can say of this eighth 

class, that all the girls have been like 
sisters, and all the boys, like brothers.

We’ve all had our differences as we 
all know.

Yet for this special occasion, all our 
flaws have disappeared and our faces 
are aglow.

I know that deep down we all hold 
something special in our hearts

For this dear old building in which 
we found our first real sweethearts.

The teachers. “ The Best,” we say 
with a sly. quaint grin.

When we know we really mean it 
somewhere deep within.

How much we have learned can be 
determined only by each person him­
self.

But whatever it may be. it should be 
stored in the back of each brain on an 
unused shelf.

This way we’ll know it will be there 
forever to make our short life on earth 
just a little bit better.

As we accept our diplomas and shed a 
salty tear.

We will know that we have matured 
as much as was expected through the 
past year.

Though we will never return as a 
class to our dear old Junior High,

Some of our fondest and dearest 
memories of growing up will here 
forever lie.

Friday the Lockney Junior High 
school held an awards assembly for the 
6th and 7th grade students. The 
students received certificates for their 
accomplishments for the year in several 
areas, including math, English, science, 
UIL activities, and sports. Also recog­
nized were the students with perfect 
attendance. These included, 6th grade - 
Debbie Hernandez, Feliciano Mandra- 
gon, 7th grade - Jimmy Ballejo, Troy 
Bigham, Kathy Davis, Michael Gatica, 
Julie Hernandez, Efren Perez, Ester 
Silva, and Mary Elizabeth Solis.

Mrs. Terrell presented awards to the 
seventh grade students in her English, 
speech, and oral reading classes. Re­
ceiving scholastic awards were Jimmy 
Ballejo, Linda Cruz, and Lupe Cortez. 
Dolores Mariscal received the 7th grade 
English achievement award for showing 
the greatest improvement through the 
year. Receiving awards for UIL oral 
reading were Todd Hallmark, who 
placed 4th in district. Matt Williams, 
who placed 3rd in district, Colt Golden, 
Erik Anderson, Sundai Workman. Jes­
sica Marks. Rayna Damron, Tonya 
Elam, and Gwen Lane, who placed 5th 
in district.

Miss Morgan presented the cheer­
leaders with certificates for all the hard 
work they put in this year and the 
cheerleaders gave Miss Morgan a
present for “ putting up with them” this 
year.

Miss Morgan also gave the student 
council officers and representatives 
certificates for their work through the 
year. The student council officers and 
m em bers are; Steve C ates, p resid en t; 
Rusty Teeter, vice president; Lisa 
Terrell, secretary; and Matt Williams, 
treasurer. Other council members re­
cognized were Qay Adrian. Todd 
Hallmark, Tonya Elam, Sundai Work­

man, and Debbie Hernandez.
Cheerleaders for 82-83 were Lisa 

Terrell, Christy Coffman, Gwen Lane, 
Missy Hayes and Connie Vasquez. Miss 
Morgan also presented certificates to 
the 6th, 7th. and 8th grade UIL spelling 
students. They were 6th grade, Isaias 
Ramirez, Ronnie Villa, and Loretta 
Turner; 7th and 8th grade, Amy Nance, 
Christy Coffman, Ruth Elaine Wilson 
and Julia Segovia.

New this year was the 100 club for 
students who made 10 or more lOO’s. 
Students with the most 100s for the year 
were: Pat Briggs, Margie Torres, Isaias 
Ramirez, and Sonia Garcia.

Mrs. Vernon gave awards to out­
standing students in her homemaking 
classes. Melissa Molina received the 
cake decorating award, Linda Cruz 
received the cooking award, and Linda 
Tijerina was given the sewing award. 
Esther Silva received the willing worker 
recognition.

Mrs. Whittington recognized the 
gifted and talented students who com­
peted in Austin in the Future Problem 
Solvers contest. They were Joel Mitch­
ell. Boyd Jackson. Carrie Parrish, and 
Margie Torres. She also recognized her 
outstanding art students, who were 
Oscar Reyna and Rosellen Arjona.

Students recognized in math were 6th 
graders Carrie Parrish with a 95 
average and Isaias Ramirez with a 95 
average; and 7th graders. Margie 
Torres with a 99 and Joel Mitchell with 
a 97. Margie Torres also received an 
aw ard in UIL science. M arg ie took a te s t 
with 100 questions on it. some of which 
were high school level questions.

Coach Grissom presented the 7th and 
8th grade girls with individual pictures 
of the basketball teams they played on

this year. 7th grade team members 
were: Rosellen Arjona, Lincinda Maha- 
gan, Julia Segovia, Jolie Diepenhorst. 
Amy Ansley, Donna Vernon, Lori 
Smith, Ruth Elaine Wilson, Veronica 
Blanco, Ester Silva, Elizabeth Salus, 
Connie Vasquez, Carol Gonzales, Gwen 
Lane, Kathy Davis, and Missy Hayes. 
Members of the 8th grade teams are; 
Julie Davis, Christi Coffman, Lisa 
Terrell, Amy Nance, Shere Kinard, Dee 
Casey, Dee Ann Hernandez, Betty 
Villon, Inez Gibson, and Karla Hutton.

Coach Cotham presented all of the 
7th and 8th grade boys who participated 
in football, basketball, and track with 
plaques for their year’s accomplish­
ments. These include 7th graders. 
Javier Bernal, Gay Adrian. Jimmy 
Ballejo, Oscar Reyna. Dewayne Mc­
Donald, Todd Hallmark, Matt Williams. 
Troy Bigham, Fernando Elias. Salvador 
Martinez, Pat Briggs. Tracy Carlton. 
Efren Perez. Albert Martinez, Michael 
Gatica. Tino Aguilar, Ron Cates, John 
Herrera. Ruben Valdez. Aaron Kidd, 
Boyd Jackson. Clay Harrison. Eddie 
Wood. Jerome Widener, Joel Mitchell. 
Chad Diepenhorst; and 8th graders. 
David Lemons, Allen Stallings. Scott 
Howard, Eddie Garza, Benjamin Moya. 
Steven Cates, Rusty Teeter. Joe Torrez. 
Chad Frizzell, Matt Mitchell, Daniel 
Rodriquez, Dickie Hernandez. Johnny 
Silva, Corny Luna, Ricky Brotherton. 
George Basaldua, Steve Woods. Ricky 
Basaldua, Guy Carthel. David Rodri­
quez. Wyman Rexrode, Hulio Cortez, 
Ricardo B ernal, Lupe B aaaldua, Je rry  
Reyna and Shayne Damron.

After all of the awards were given 
principal Raymond Lusk dismissed the 
6th and 7th grade students for the 
summer.

45 seniors receive diplomas
The graduation exercises for the 

Lockney High School were held Friday, 
May 20. at the First Baptist Church. 
Music for the ceremony was provided 
by Mrs. C.L. Record. Following the 
processional, Tim Winter, vice presi­
dent of the senior class gave the 
invocation.

Salutatorian Mary Huffman, in her 
address to the seniors and families and 
friends gathered, thanked everyone for 
their contributions to the lives of the 
seniors. She thanked parents, grandpa­
rents, friends, and teachers for all they 
had done to guide and teach these 
students all their lives. Mary then read 
the poem which Julie Davis had read to 
the graduating 8th grade class.

Valedictorian Maribel Torres then 
gave her address. She urged the senior 
class to set goals for the rest of their 
lives and strive to achieve them. She 
stated that parents and friends could no 
longer set the paths for the students to 
follow and urged the graduates to 
choose which path is right for them as 
an individual, whether it be pursuing 
their education, a job, or marriage to 
strive to succeed in whatever they 
chose.

Following an address to the gradu­
ates by Mr. Hallmark, superintendent

of Lockney schools, diplomas were 
presented by James Poole, principal, 
Mr. Hallmark, and Eddie Foster, presi­
dent of the school board.

In closing, they sang the school song 
and the benediction was given by

Maribel Torres. Mrs. C.L. Record 
played the recessional.

Marshalls for this year’s graduation 
were Libby Williams and Paul Castro. 
The 1983 graduating class was made up 
of 45 members.

PA'TRICK GRIFFITH received his diploma from Eddie Foster and W.H. Hallmarii 
at Friday’s high school graduation.

Seniors treated to supper
The graduating seniors for 1983 were 

honored with a progressive supper on 
Thursday, May 17. The meal consisted 
of four courses, all served at different 
homes of the seniors.

Starting from the high school with 
Mr. Dcgg driving. 46 seniors boarded a 
bus to begin their evening. The meal 
started at the Charlie Carthel home with 
the appetizers. Chips with cheese and 
spinach dips, fruit kabobs, fresh straw­
berries and finger sandwiches were 
served. Parents who helped prepare 
this course were Barbara Carthel, Viola 
Mangum, Mrs. Boyd Reay and Mrs. 
Winter.

From the Carthel home in town the 
students went to the Tom Coffman 
home, southwest of town. Here the 
students were treated to a salad bar, 
prepared by Barbara Coffman. Dalia 
Hight, Lavem McCarty and Margie 
Ferguson. The tossed salad was accom­
panied by carrots, cucumbers, cauliflo­

wer, bell peppers, bacon bits, crackers 
and four kinds of dressings and tea.

Next the students went on to the 
Charles Huffman home, north of town. 
The main course was chicken spaghetti 
with cheese, pickles, rolls, and tea. 
Mothers who prepared the main course 
were Molly Huffman. Maria Arellano, 
Pat Adams, Dovie Davis and Dixie 
Johnson.

From the Huffman home, the stu­
dents traveled back to town to the 
Kelton Shaw home. Here the students 
were treated to dessert, chocolate chip 
and sugar cookies, brownies, and four 
kinds of homemade ice cream. The 
desserts were prepared by Mrs. Shaw, 
Charlotte Brock, Mary Jean Moore. 
Barbara Mathis. Mavis Reecer. and 
Dixie Ford. Following the dessert the 
students were treated to baby pictures 
and pictures of themselves when they 
were growing up.

This Week
VFW

Monday, May 30, the VFW will 
hold a memorial flag raising ser­
vice. It will be at the cemetery at 
7:30 a.m. Also the VFW Post #7993 
will be holding its annual “ Buddy” 
poppy sale to raise funds to benefit 
disabled American veterans. The 
Hospital Auxiliary will be aiding the 
VFW in selling the poppies. They 
will be for sale all over town. 
Donations to this worthy cause are 
also accepted. Poppies will be on 
sale Friday, May 27, and Saturday, 
May 28.

Masons meet
Lockney Lodge #867 will have an 

E.A. Degree ceremony Thursday, 
May 26, (tonight). All Master 
Masons are invited to attend, the 
meeting will be held at 7:30.

Memorial service
The Lockney Cemetery Associa­

tion will hold a memorial service 
Monday, May 30, at the American 
Legion Building on East 8th Street 
at 10:00 a.m. Ray Starns. minister 
of the Main Street Church of Christ, 
will be the speaker.

A business meeting will follow . 
The annual report of the associa­
tion’s expenses and receipts will be 
discussed and new officers will be 
elected.

Vacation Bible school
The First Baptist Church will hold 

Vacation Bible School from June 
6-10. Hours will be from 8:30-11:30. 
Children from 2 years to 8th grade 
are urged to attend. Saturday, June 
4, will be preparation day. Bicycle 
races will be held from 10:00-11:30 
at the elementary school grounds.
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GIRLS
Obstacle Course: 1st Josie Palomin. 

2nd Amanda Watson, 3rd Kay Lynn 
Lusk, 4th Jennifer Grimaldo, 5th Rachel 
Gon/ales, 6th Amy Arjona, Honorable
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102 S, Main St.

Mention: DeDe McCarty, Joann Garcia, 
Amy Ruiz, and Maiva Martinez,

Bean Bag Throw: 1st Lisa Vargas, 
2nd DeDe McCarty, 3rd Priscilla Rame- 
riz, 4th Pam Grimaldo, 5th Josie 
Palomin, 6th Mary Lindsey Poole, 
Honorable Mention: Shirley Torres, 
Trudi Lambert. Misty Hennagon, and 
Amy Reyes ~

Vertical Jump: 1st Lisa Vargas, 2nd 
Prisilla Rameriz, 3rd Shirley Torres, 4th 
Jennifer Grimaldo, 5th Amy Arjona, 6th 
Rachel Gonzales, Honorable Mention: 
Anna Butler, Jennifer Castro, Mary L. 
Poole and Amanda Watson 

Long Jump: 1st Priscilla Ramirez, 
2nd Mandy Hunter, 3rd DeDe McCarty, 
4th Amy Ruiz, 5th Josie Palomin, 6th 
Melva Martinez, Honorable Mention: 
Joann Garcia, Rachel Gonzales, Kay 
Lusk and Mary Poole.

25 Yd.; 1st Kay Lynn Lusk. 2nd Josie 
Palomin, 3rd Mandy Hunter, 4th Shir­
ley Torres, 5th Jennifer Grimaldo, 6th 
Jennifer Castro, Honorable Mention; 
Abby Blanco, Amy Ruiz, Victoria Guer­
rero, Amanda Watson 

40 Yd.: 1st Priscilla Rameriz, 2nd 
Jimmie Harris, 3rd Rachel Gonzales, 
4th Maiva Martinez, 5th Mandy Hun­
ter, 6th Trudi Lambert, Honorable 
Mention; Joann Garcia, Anna Butler, 
Victoria Guerrero, Misty Hennagon 

100 Yd. Relay: 1st Kay Lynn Lusk, 
Mary Lindsey Poole, Amy Arjona, and 
Mandy Hunter; 2nd Lisa Vargas, Misty 
Hennagon, Amy Ruiz, and DeDe Mc­
Carty.
Continued on page 3

6 receive 
diplomas

Lockney
l * * i

Six students from Lockney received 
diplomas from South Plains College 
during SPC’s 25th commencement cere­
monies Friday, May 13

Students receiving diplomas in­
cluded: Randy Davis, associate of 
applied science, respiratory therapy: 
Susie Hernandez, associate of applied 
science, commercial art; Rosalind Hill, 
associate of arts, elementary education; 
Angela Ochoa, certification of profi­
ciency, vocational nursing; Victoria 
Ortegon, certificate of proficiency, voca­
tional nursing; and Carisa Sue, associ­
ate of applied science, secretarial.

A record number of 583 graduates 
crossed the stage Friday in Texan Dome 
to receive diplomas or certificates. Ms. 
Jana Bilberry of Elida, New Mexico, 
received an associate o f applied  science 
degree to become the college’s 5,000th 
graduate.

Dwight Jackson Jr. of Lockney has 
been awarded fifth prize of $1000 in the 
first Milton Friedman National Student 
F.ssay Contest, sponsored by the Ame­
ricanism Educational League of Buena 
Park, California.

Jackson, son of Mr. and Mrs. Keith 
Jackson of he Providence community, 
will be a junior this fall at West Texas 
State University in Canyon where he is 
majoring in economics in the School of 
Business.

The top three winners were honored 
at a dinner Saturday in Los Angeles. 
Keynote address at the dinner was by 
Nobel Laureate, Dr. Milton Friedman, 
the 1976 recipient in Economic Science, 
who personally ranked the top essays.

The contest was sponsored by the 
Americanism Educational League as an 
extension of its educational film pro­
gram. The league offers a free loan 
print of the 10-part "Free To Chose” 
film series, featuring Dr. Friedman, to 
colleges and universities. Students in 
classes utilizing the series were eligible 
to enter the essay contest.
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The total prize package in the essay 
contest was $19,000, including $100 
each for the top three student’s profes­
sors.

AEL, founded in 1927, is a non-profit 
corporation dedicated to enhancing 
public education about constitutional 
principles and the American free enter­
prise system.

Dwight Jackson is a graduate of 
Lockney High School where he was 
president of the Future Farmers of 
America and of his Junior class. He also 
was a Student Council representative 
and was selected by the faculty as best 
all-around senior boy. He was sixth in 
his class of 66. He attended Ohio State 
University before enrolling at West 
Texas State University where he has 
been listed on the Dean’s Honor Roll for 
the past two semester and was selected 
for membership in WTSU chapter of Phi 
Eta Sigma, national scholastic honor 
society for freshmen and sophomores. 
Recently Jackson was awarded a $300 
Hershel Coffee scholarship in econo­
mics.

Following are excerpts from Jack­
son’s award-winning essay:

"The freedom to decide is most often 
infringed when well-meaning outside 
regulations are imposed upon market 
action. Individuals are told what to buy, 
how much to buy and when to purchase 
what is to be consumed."

“ This well-intended regulation is 
often brought upon the system through 
certain benevolent father ideals. This 
attitude was popularized in the nine­
teenth century and perpetuated into our 
own time.”

"The public has been led to believe, 
often through clever manipulation, that 
big business as a whole, is a cruel, 
greedy monster; a monster which will 
not rest until it has devoured and grown 
fat off every widow’s last penny.”

From the San Angelo Standard Times
Jeff McCormick, a 1982 graduate of 

Lockney, was named the offensive Most 
Valuable Player in the Angelo State 
University’s Sixth Annual Media-Fan 
Bowl football game.

The Blues, the team McCormick 
played with, defeated the White team 
14-10 during the contest marking the 
end of spring practice.

At one point during the game, the 
Blue team was down 10-7. They 
received a break when holder McCor­

mick made a ten-yard scramble off a 
bouncing snap. The Blues were attemp­
ting a field goal when the snap wiyit 
wild.

“ It was just a bad snap.” the Lockney 
wide receiver said after the game. "It 
just happened. It was a reflex action. 1 
saw it was wide open to the left and took 
off.” His run put the ball on the four 
yard line, setting up the winning score.

McCormick is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Audry McCormick.
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Little horn relay results
Continued From Page 2

KINDERGARTEN BOYS 
Obatade Course: 1st Erik Martinez. 

2nd Obriem McDonald, 3rd Jeremy 
McGee, 4th Chris Guerrero, 5th Robert 
Delgado. 6th Frank Gutierrez. Honor­
able Mention: Jeff Price, Scott Turber- 
ville, Michael Hernandez, Michael Dur­
ham

Bean Bag Throw: 1st David Pedia, 
2nd Jeremy McGee, 3rd Michael Dur­
ham, 4th Erik Martinez. 5th Lalo 
Chavira, 6th Lorenzo Reynas, Honor­
able Mention: Victor Rendon. Travis 
McConell, Michael Henandez, and A- 
drian Rodriguez

Vertical Jump: 1st Joe Cruz, 2nd 
Travis McConnell, 3rd Jeremy McGee, 
4th David Pedia. 5th Jeff Price. 6th 
Michael Hernandez, Honorable Men­
tion: Chris Guerro, Reymond Mendez, 
Ramon Pedia, Mathen Raiess.

Long Jump: 1st Michael Durham, 2nd 
Jared Mosley, 3rd Alfred Martinez, 4th. 
Obrien McDonald, 5th Ashes Patel, 6th 
Lalo Chavira, Honorable Mention: Ro­
bert Delgado, Mark Terrell, Mark 
Ochoa, and Adrian Rosales 

25 Yd. Run: 1st Michael Luna, 2nd 
James Hernandez, 3rd Adrain Rodri­
guez, 4th Nino Garcia, 5th Lalo Chavira. 
6th Travis McConell, Honorable Men­
tion: Jason Perales, Mark Terrell, Scott 
Turbeville, and Mike Gonzales 

40 Yd. Run: 1st Alfred Martinez, 2nd 
Jeremy McGee, 3rd Adrain Rodriguez, 
4th Erik Martinez. 5th Frank Gutierrez, 
6th Raymund Mendez, Honorable Men­
tion: Ramon Pedia, Joe Cruz, Ashes 
Patel and David Pedia 

100 Yd. Relay: 1st Frank Gutierrez, 
Lorenzo Reyna, Ramon Pedia, Jamie 
Ascensio; 2nd Michael Durham. Obrien 
McDonald, Jared Mosley, Adrain Rod­
riguez; 3rd Erik Martinez, Travis Mc­
Connell, Nino Garcia, Mark Terrell; 4th 
Robert Delgado, Alfred Martinez, Coby 
Marr and Mark Ochoa.

1st GRADE GIRLS
Obstacle Course: 1st Amy Hernan­

dez, 2nd Cindy Perez, 3rd Jennifer P., 
4th Mary Luna. 5th Erica Martinez, 6th 
Patricia G., Honorable Mention: Chris­
tina, Holly Ascensio, Angie Hooten and 
Melissa Guerrero. «

Football Throw: 1st Danielle McDon­
ald. 2nd Nancy Peralez, 3rd Angie 
Garke, 4th Rosa Martinez, 5th Mary 
Luna, 6th Valarie Canol, Honorable 
Mention: Valarie Jones.

Verticle Jump: 1st Holly Ascencio, 
2nd Danielle Steele, 3rd Peggy Rendon, 
4th Rachael Vasquez, 5th Mary Luna, 
6th Valerie Carrol, Honorable Mention: 
Melissa Guerrero, Cindy Perez, Valarie 
Jones, and Maggie Duenas.

Long Jump: 1st Angelica Mercado, 
2nd Erica Martinez, 3rd Nancy Peralez, 
4th Cindy Perez. 5th Rainey Whitting-. 
ton, 6th Amy Hernandez, Honorable 
Mention: Pangie Hooten, Jennifer Col­
lins, Cristina Banda and Rachael Vas­
quez.

35 Yd. Run: 1st Nancy Peralez, 2nd 
Melissa Salas, 3rd Angelia Mercado, 
4th Holly Ascencio, 5th Danielle Mc­
Donald, 6th Crestina Banda, Honorable 
Mention: Erica Martinez, Rosa Mar­
tinez, Cindy Peralez and Angie Garke.

50 Yd. Run: 1st Melissa Salas, 2nd 
Josie Cavazos, 3rd Angelica Mercado, 
4th Amy Hernandez, 5th Rainey Whit­
tington, 6th Natalia Rodriguez, Honor­
able Mention: Angie Hooten, Amy 
Kirby, Jennifer Pierce and Peggy 
Rendon

100 Yd. Relay: 1st Melissa Salas, 
Josie Cavazos, Natalia Rodriguez and 
Angie Hooten; 2nd Nina Peralez, Angie 
Clarke, Holly Ascencio, Stella Garcia; 
3rd Stephanie Rodriguez, Jennifer 
Pierce. Rainey Whittington, Amy Kir­
by; 4th Nancy Peralez, Valarie Jones, 
Maricilla Luna, Peggy Rendon; 5th 
Christina Banda, Erica Martinez, Rach­
ael Vasquez, Melissa Guerrero.

1st GRADE BOYS
Obstacle Course: 1st Phiness Ridd- 

ley, 2nd Julio Ramirez, 3rd Tony Banda, 
4th Daniel Munoz, 5th Jarod Glasson. 
6th Oscar Palomin, Honorable Mention: 
Jr. Guerrero, Allen Martin, Jr. Marti­
nez, Shane Hooten 

Football Throw: 1st Arnold Peralez, 
2nd Oscar Palomin, 3rd Shane Hooten, 
4th Rey Gomez, 5th Gregory Chivira, 
6th Mike Rodriguez, Honorable Men­
tion: Manuel Banda, Jarod Glasson, 
Allen Martin, Jr. Ochoa 

Vertide Jump: 1st David Turbeville. 
2nd Leo Vargas, 3rd Manuel Banda, 4th 
Gregory Chivira. 5th Jr. Martinez, 6th 
Daniel Munoz, Honorable Mention: Rey 
Munoz

Long Jump: 1st Max Green, 2nd Luke 
Harris. 3rd Rusty Purser. 4th Shane 
Hooten. 5th Julio Rameriz. 6th Oscar 
Palomin, Honorable Mention: Phiness 
Riddley, Leo Vargas, Jarod Glasson, 
Ricky Felan

35 Yd, Run: 1st Rusty Purser. 2nd 
Max Green. 3rd Mike Rodriguez. 4th 
Shane Hooten. 5th Jr. Guerrero. 6th 
Manuel Banda. Honorable Mention: 
David Turner, Tony Banda. Brian 
Thyen, Julio Rameriz

50 Run: 1st Rusty Purser. 2nd Arnold 
Palomin, 3rd Leo Vargas. 4th Max 
Green, 5th Jarod Glasson, 6th David 
Turner, Honorable Mention: Allen Mar­
tin. Jr. Ochoa. Jr. Guerrero

100 Relay: 1st Rusty Purser. Jason 
Thacker. Leo Vargas. Brian Thyen: 2nd 
Luke Harris. Gregory Chivira, Phiness 
Riddley. Abel Reyna: 3rd Ricky Felan. 
Oscar Palomin. Arnold Peralez. David 
Turner: 4th Max Green. Jr. Guerrero, 
Tony Banda, Glenn Truett; 5th Daniel 
Munoz, Rey Gomez, Jeff Griffith, 
Mickie Rodriguez.

2nd GRADE GIRLS 
Obatade Course: 1st Rachel Ruiz. 

2nd Melissa Hernandez. 3rd Rebecca

Silva, 4th Kori Kellison, 5th Jeri 
Lambert, 6th Elisa Rodriguez, Honor­
able Mention; Dana McCarty, Yolanda 
Rodriguez. Carol Turner and Paulina 
Gonzales

Football Throw: 1st Carolyn Turner, 
2nd Rebecca Silva, 3rd Priscilla Beltran, 
4th Lisa Munoz, 5th Tami Vernon, 6th 
Jerri Lambert, Honorable Mention: Lori 
Rodriquez, Raquel Ruiz.

Vertide Jump: 1st Elisa Rodriguez, 
2nd Kori Kellison, 3rd Pauline Gonza­
lez, 4th Tami Vernon

Long Jump: 1st Melissa Griffith, 2nd 
Carolyn Turner, 3rd Lori Rodriguez, 4th 
Jeri Lambert, 5th Dana McCarty, 6th 
Kori Kellison, Honorable Mention: 
Pauline Gonzales, Priscilla Beltram, 
Malini, Sandra Elias 

35 Yd, Run: 1st Melissa Hernandez. 
2nd Kori Kellison. 3rd Carolyn Turner, 
4th Jeri Lambert, 5th Sara Silva. 6th 
Rebecca Silva, Honorable Mention; 
Sandra Elias, Linda DeLeon, Chris 
Ramirez, Joann Amador 

50 yd. Run: 1st Chris Ramirez. 2nd 
Melanie Carthel, 3rd Charleen Tellez 

100 Yd. Relay: 1st Sarah Silva, Lori 
Rodriguez, Lisa Munoz and Yolanda 
Rodriguez; 2nd Pauline Gonzales, Jo­
ann Amador, Raquel Ruiz and Elisa 
Rodriguez.

2nd GRADE BOYS 
Obstacle Course: 1st Jason Lusk, 2nd 

Damian Luna, 3rd Daniel Perez, 4th 
Orlando Garza, 5th Andy Stapp. 6th 
Chris Gonzalez, Honorable Mention: 
Mark Hernandez, Tony Elias, Randy 
Rendon and Richard Guerrero

Football Throw: 1st Ricky Herrera, 
2nd Lance Patridge, 3rd Richard Guer­
rero, 4th Damian Luna, 5th Jason 
Anderson, 6th Chris Gonzales, Honor­
able Mention: Renee Salas, Casmo 
Blanco, Andy Stapp, Randy R.

Vertide Jump: 1st Patrick Monroe, 
Cosmo Gonzales, Mark Hernandez 

Long Jump: 1st Oriando Garza, 2nd 
Cosmo Gonzales, 3rd Lance Patridge, 
4th Timothy Manley, 5th Ricky Herrera. 
6th Jason Lusk, Honorable Mention: 
Patrick Monroe, Renee Salas, Chris 
Gonzalez and David Turbeville 

35 Yd. Run: 1st Antonio M., 2nd 
Richard Guerrero, 3rd Ricky Herrera. 
4th Timothy Manley, 5th Patrick Mon­
roe, 6th Joey Adams 

50 Yd. Run: 1st Antonio Mercado, 
2nd Richard Guerrero. 3rd Orlando 
Garza, 4th Renee Salas, 5th Cosmo 
Gonzales, 6th Andy Stapp. Honorable 
Mention: Lance Patridge, David Turbe­
ville, Jason Anderson and Mark Her­
nandez

100 Yd. Relay: 1st Damian Luna, 
Chris Gonzales. Renee Salas. Patrick 

.Moivoe; 2nd Lance Patridge, Jason 
Lusk, Daniel Peralez, Tony Eliast 3rd 
David Turbeville, Timothy Manley, 
Jason Johnson, Orlando Garza.

3rd GRADE GIRLS 
Obstacle Course: 1st Becky Rodri­

guez, 2nd Rosanna Rendon, 3rd Alma- 
dena Basaldua, 4th Anjelica Bernal, 5th 
Yolanda Reyna, 6th Jessica Lemons, 
Honorable Mention: Amy Gonzales, 
Daisy Blanco, Cynthia Riddley and 
Jennifer Fortenberry.

Football Throw: 1st Calixia Guerro 
Vertical Jump: 1st Becky Rodriguez 
Long Jump: 1st Michelle Delgado, 

2nd Anjelica Bernal, 3rd Cynthia Rid­
dley, 4th Amy Gonzales. 5th Calixia 
Guerro, 6th Jessica Lemons, Honorable 
Mention: Martha Harris, Lisa Smith, 
Rosanna Rendon. Juanna Arebalo 

50 Yd, Run: 1st Michelle Delgado. 
2nd Amy Gonzales, 3rd Jodie Hayes, 
4th Almadena Basaldua, 5th Rosanna 
Rendon, 6th Yolanda Reyna. Honorable 
Mention: Cynthia Riddley, Jennifer 
Fortenberry, Jessica Lemons. Becky 
Rodriguez

75 Yd. Run: 1st Michelle Delgado, 
2nd Amy Gonzales 

200 Yd. Relay: 1st Almadena Basal­
dua, Jennifer Fortenberry, Daisy Blan­
co. Angelica Bernal; 2nd Juanna Arca- 
balo, Jodie Hayes, Michelle Delgado, 
Becky Rodriguez; 3rd Jessica Lemons, 
Amy Gonzales. Jennifer Mangum, Mar­
tha Harris

3rd GRADE BOYS
Obstacle Course: 1st Cody Jackson, 

2nd Coy Davis, 3rd Clay Golden. 4th 
■John Torres, 5th Robert Campos, 6th 
Curtis Briggs, Honorable Mention: 
Matt Workman, Lanny Hardy, Robay 
Reyes. Shawn Jones 

Football Throw: 1st Curtis Briggs, 
2nd Matt Workman, 3rd Cody Jackson, 
4th Robert Campos. 5th Raul Molina, 
6th Lanny Hardy, Honorable Mention: 
Shawn Jones, Ranee Ford, Brandon 
Poole, Chad Cook

Vertical Jump: 1st Cody Jackson, 2nd 
Matt Workman. 3rd Robby Reyes. 4th 
Cody Montandon. 5th Freddie Felan 

Long Jump: 1st Nachy Luna, 2nd 
Joan Vargas. 3rd Shawn Jones. 4th 
Robert Campos, 5th Cody Montandon, 
6th Raul Molina, Honorable Mention: 
Coy Davis, Chad Cook, Cory Armstrong 

SO Yd. Run: 1st Cody Jackson, 2nd 
Cory Davis, 3rd Juan Vargas, 4th 
Manuel Solis, 5th Tony Ascensio. 6th 
Robert Campos. Honorable Mention: 
Domingo Luna, Gay Golden. Brandon 
Poole, Joe Perales

75 Yd. Run: 1st Manuel Soliz, 2nd 
Juan Vargas. 3rd Tony Ascensio, 4th 
Robby Reyes. 5th Curtis Briggs. 6th 
Brandon Poole, Honorable Mention: 
Joe Perales, Domingo Luna, Shawn 
Jones, Lanny Hardy 

200 Yd. Relay: 1st Coy Davis, Ranee 
Ford. Tony Ascensio. Matt Workman; 
2nd Joe Perales, Cody Montandon, 
Manuel Soliz. Domingo Luna; 3rd Gay 
Golden. Juan Vargas, Robby Reyes. Lee 
Truett
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CEDAR HILL ASSEMBLY 
OFtiOD CHURCH 

Rev. Vance Mitchell
Sunday School 
Morning Worship 
Evangelistic Service 
Wednesday Bible 

Study

10:00 a.m. 
11:00a.m. 
6:00 p.m.

7:00 p.m.

ASSEMBLY OF GOD CHURCH 
Lockney

Sunday School 10:00
Morning Worship 11:00
Evening Worship 7:00
Prayer Service Wed. 7:00

Eddie Kendall, Pastor

LOCKNEY LATIN 
ASSEMBLY OF GOD 

Manuel Rendon, Pastor
Sunday School 9;45
Morning Worship 11:00
Evening Worship 7:30
Men’s Fellowship, Tuesday 

Evening 8:00
W.M.C. Thursday 8:00
Christ’s Ambassadors, Saturday 

Evening 7:30

SPANISH ASSEMBLY OF GOD 
TEMPLO GETSEMANI 

308 E. Mississippi 
A.C. Botello, Pastor

Sunday School 10:00
Morning Worship 11:00
Evening Evangelistic 

Service 6:00
Wednesday. Family 

Night 7:30

CARR’S CHAPEL 
Rev. Jerry Kunkle 
Petersburg Pastor 

Services Every Sunday 
Morning Worship 9:30 a.m.
Sunday School 10:30 a.m.
No Evening Services

HRST ASSEMBLY OF GOD 
CHURCH 
Floydada 

Pastor Jim Guess
Sunday School 
Morning Worship 
Service
Sunday Evening 

Evangelistic 
Wednesday Night 

Service
Thursday Womens 

Missionary

9:45 a.m. 
10:50 a.m. 
5:00 p.m.

6:00 p.m.

7:00 p.m.

9:00 a.m.

SAN JOSE CATHOLIC CHURCH 
Lockney

Father Terry Burke, Pastor
Sunday morning Mass 9:00
Saturday Evening Mass 8:00
Wednesday Evening 8:00 p.m. 
Friday Evening 8:00 p.m.
Confessions Saturday 6:30

ST. MARY MAGDALEN 
CATHOLIC CHURCH 

Floydada
Father Terry Burke

Sunday Mass 11:30 a.m.
Monday Mass and 

Ultreya \ 9:00 p.m.
Thursday Mass 9:00 p.m.

CITY PARK 
CHURCH OF CHRIST 

Floydada
Perry Zumwalt, Minister

Sunday Bible Study 9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship 10:30 a.m. 
Evening Worship 6:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Bible Study 7:30 p.m. 
Ladies Bible Study,

Wednesday 9:30 a.m.

LATIN AMERICAN 
CHURCH OF CHRIST 

Lockney
Bible School 9:45
Morning Worship 10:45
Evening Worship 6:00
Wednesday Service 8:00

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
Lockney

Bible Study 9:30
Morning Worship 10:30
Evening Worship 6:00

Wednesday
Ladies Bible Gass 9:30
Bible Study 8:00

WEST COLLEGE 
CHURCH OF CHRIST 

West College & Third, Lockney 
Frank Duckworth, Evangelist

Sunday Morning Worship 
Services 10:30

Sunday Evening Worship 
Services 6:00

Wednesday Evening Prayer 
Services 8:00

WEST SIDE 
CHURCH OF CHRIST

Sunday Morning 
Worship 10:30 a.m.

Sunday Evening 6:00 p.m.
Wednesday Evening 7:00 p.m.

CHURCH OF THE NAZARENE 
Lewis Shapp, Pastor

Sunday School 9:15 a.m.
Morning Worship 10:45 a.m. 
Evening Worship 6:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Bible Study 5:30 p.m.

HRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
[Disciples of Christ] 

Minister, Karl Bunjes
Sunday

Sunday School 9:45 a.m.
Worship 11:00 a.m.

TRINITY LUTHERAN CHURCH 
Providence Community 
Gary Kleypas, Pastor

Sunday School &  Adult Bible 
Gass 10:00

Worship Service 11

FIRST UNITED 
METHODIST CHURCH 

Lockney
Rev. Michael O’Connor

SUNDAY
Sunday School 9:45
Worship Service 10:55
UMY 6:00
Evening Worship 7:00
United Methodist Women. First 
Tuesday of Month Circles. Mon­
day (2nd & 4th Monday nights) 
Tuesday & Wednesday mornings.

HRST UNITED 
METHODIST CHURCH 

Floydada 
Jim Smith, Pastor

Sunday School 
Morning Worship 
Youth Fellowship 
Sunday Evening 

Worship
EVANS CHAPEL 

BAPTIST CHURCH 
Rev. Bennie Anderson

Pastor
Sunday School 
Morning Worship 
Training Union 
Evening Worship 
Wednesday Prayer 

Meeting
Sunday Afternoon 

Worship

9:45 a.m. 
11:00 a.m. 
5:00 p.m.

6:00 p.m.

10:00 a.m. 
11:00 a.m. 
6:00 p.m. 
7:00 p.m.

7:00 p.m.

SOUTH PLAINS 
BAPTIST CHURCH 
Rev. Cecil Osborne

Sunday School 10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m.
Training UniOTi 6:00 p.m.
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m.

CALVARY BAPTIST 
Floydada 

Rev. Hollis Payne

2:00 p.m.

PRIMER IGLESIA 
BAUTISTA 

Rev. Agustin Rey
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Worship Service 11:00
Training Union 5:00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m. 
Prayer and Study Group 

Monday 7:30 p.m.
Mid-Week Service 

Wednesday 7:30

TEMPLO BAUTISTA SALEM 
Lockney

Sunday School 9:45
Worship Service 11:00
Christian Training Time 5:00
Evening Worship 6:00
Wednesday Prayer Meeting &

Choir Practice 7:30

BIBLE BAPTIST CHURCH 
Floydada 

Bob Chapman
Sunday School 10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship 10:45 a.m.
Sunday Evening Prayer

Meeting 6:00 p.m.
Sunday Evening

Services 6:30 p.m.
Wednesday Evening

Services 7:30 p.m.

DOUGHERY BAPTIST CHURCH 
Richard Rhodes

Sunday Services 10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m.

HRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
Lockney

Murle Rogers, Pastor

Sunday School 9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m.
Bible Study 6:00 p.m.
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m.
Wednesday Evening 7:00 p.m.

MT. ZION BAPTIST CHURCH
Floydada

Otis Cook, Jr., Pastor
Sunday School 10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m.
Bible Study 4:00 p.m.
Evening Worship 5:00 p.m.
Wednesday Prayer

Meeting 8:00 p.m.

AIKEN BAPTIST CHURCH
Sunday School 10:00
Morning Worship 11:0()
Training Union 6:00
Evening Worship 7:00
Prayer Service Wed. 7:30
Brotherhood. W.M.U. and

Auxiliary Wednesday 7:30

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
Floydada

Floyd C. Bradley, Pastor
Sunday School 
Morning Worship 
Church Training 
Evening Worship 
Wednesday 

Evening

9:45 a.m. 
10:55 a.m. 
6:00p.m. 
7:00 p.m.

6:45 p.m.

Sunday School 9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship 11:00 a,.m
Church Training 6:00 p m
Evening Worship 7:00 p,.m
Prayer Meeting,

Wednesday 7:00 p..m
Adult Choir.

Wednesday 8:00 p.,m
High School Youth (B.Y.F.)

Wednesday 7:00 p.m.
G.A. and Mission Friends

Wednesday 4:00 p.m.
R.A.’s Sunday 5:00

CEDAR HILL 
BAPTIST CHURCH

Sunday School 10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m.
Evening Worship 7:30 p.m.

LONE STAR BAPTIST CHURCH
Sunday School 10:00
Morning Worship 11:00
Training Union 5:00
Evening Worship 6:00
Prayer Service. Wednesday 

Evening 6:30
Brotherhood, First Saturday 
Morning of Every Month.

VICTORY BAPTIST CHURCH 
Floydada

Gary Grant, Pastor
Sunday School 10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m.
Evening Worship < 7:00 p.m.
Wednesday Services 7:00 p.m.

NEW SALEM PRIMITIVE 
B A P T IS T  C H U K C h  ■’* 

Floydada 
Joe M. Jackson

Sunday Congregational
Singing 10:00 a.m.

Morning Worship 10:30 a.m.
Evening Worship hv30n.m.

SPANISH BAPTIST 
MISSION 
Floydada

Eloy Felan, Pastor
Sunday School 
Morning Worship 
Church Training 
Evening Worship 
Wednesday 

Evening

9:45 a.m. 
11 ;00 a.m. 
5:00 p.m. 
6:00 p.m.

7:00 p.m.

If you appreciate your church directory, please let your sponsors know.

Adams Well Service
720 N. 2nd 983-5003

Martin & Co,
216 S. Main 983-3713

Brownes Department Store
106 N. Main 652-3831

Byrd Pharmacy
320 N. Main 652-3353

Moore-Rose Funeral Home
402 S. Main, Lockney 652-2211
329 W. California, Floydada 983-2525

Oden^s Chevrolet-Olds,
221 S. Main 983-3787

Cates&Dawson
231 W. California 983-5322

Pay-N-Save
210 N. Main 652-2293

City Auto
Plains Electric Co,

106 S. Main 652-2133

201 E. Missouri 983-3767

Consumer's Fuel
210 E. Missouri 983-3394

Producer's Cooperative Elev,
301 E. Missouri 983-2821

Davis Lumber Co,
Reecer^s Master Cleaners

121 S. Main 652-2262

102 E. Shubert 652-3385 Reed Ford
Ralls Hwy. 983-3761

Bill Gilbreath Exxon
lOI N. 2nd 983-3323

Jackson Tire Co,
101 S. Main 652-3366

SchachCs Flowers & Jewelery
112 W. Poplar 652-2385

Sun-Vue Fertilizers
E. Hwy 70 652-3326

Lee White Auto Store
119 W. College 652-2145

Thompson Pharmacy
200 S. Main 983-5111

Lockney Coop Gin
W .o fG ly

Willson&Son
111 N. Wall 983-3113

652-3377
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Dr Gary meets 
requirements

Dr. Gary B. Mangold of Lockney has 
completed continuing education re­
quirements to retain active membership 
in the American Academy of Family 
Physicians, the national association of 
family doctors. The Academy formerly 
was called the American Academy of 
General Practice.

The requirements call for members to 
complete a minimum of 150 hours of 
accredited continuing medical study 
every three years. Members become 
eligible for re-election at the end of the 
third year following their election to 
membership. The Academy, the coun­
try’s second largest national medical 
association, was the first national 
medical group to require members to 
keep up with medical progress through 
continuing education.

The Academy, founded in 1947 and 
headquartered in Kansas City. Mo., 
was instrumental in the establishment 
of a new primary specialty in family 
practice in 1969. The new specialty is 
expected to increase the number of 
family physicians available to serve the 
public in the future. The Academy’s 
continuing education program is the 
foundation of eligibility for family 
doctors now in practice who apply for 
certification in the new speciality.

LOCKINEY
HOSPITAL

NOTES
May 16-26

Bertie Gunn. Romot. adm. 5-12. dis. 
5-20

Leona Vardell. Silverton. adm. 5-13. 
dis. 5-19

Maria Vasquez. Roydada. adm. 5-13. 
dis. 5-18

William Whitlock. Lockney.
5-13. dis. 5-23

Gussie Boedeker. Lockney.
5-13. continues care

Johnny Adams. Lockney. adm. 5-13. 
dis. 5-18

Diana Ivory. Silverton. adm. 5-15. 
baby boy Isaiah, born 5-15. dis. 5-17

Clarence M. Conner. Turkey, adm. 
5-15. dis. 5-23

Sylvia McCready. Lockney. adm. 
5-16. baby bov Stephen, born 5-16. dis. 
5-18

Elsa M. Garcia. Ralls, adm. 5-17. dis. 
5-17

Elvira Muniz. Lockney. adm. 5-18. 
dts. S-20

Nadine Rice. Quitaque. adm. 5-18. 
dis. 5-21

William J. Hallingsworth. Silverton. 
adm. 5-20. continues care

Hal Thomas. Floydada. adm. 5-20, 
continues care

Loran Lee Rhodes. Lockney. adm. 
5-21. continues care

Lydia Rodriquez, Plainview, adm. 
5-22, continues care

Marvin Hooten. Plainview. adm. 
5-22.

adm.

adm.

Y o u ’v e  neveir 
fe lt  so  f it !

2124

A favorita! 12" Pecos with 
slip-resistant cushion crepie 
soles and heels, inch-wide 
steel shank, cellulose insole 
and rich brown cowhide 
leather 

ViuSet.riwd 
>our W ings!

R e d U / i ^
Brown’ “

kne

Lockney Care Center Capers

Hubert Frizzell. 
Brotherton and

Our week was nothing short of 
fantastic! We started our week off by 
having a balloon lift off commemorating 
the start of National Nursing Home 
Week. Monday was designeated as 
Volunteer Appreciation Day. A lunch­
eon of turkey and dressing w as served 
to approximately 40 volunteers. Our 
volunteers are very important to us. 
They add so much joy and love to our 
lives that they will always have a special 
place in our hearts.

Volunteers attending the luncheon 
were Mr. and Mrs. John Francis, Mr. 
and Mrs. J.D. Nance, Mr. and Mrs. 
Wade Steel, Margie Turner, Mildred 
McDaniel, Mr. and Mrs. Ray Starnes, 
Alvin Vernon, Mr. and Mrs. G.A. 
McAda, Ann McCormick, Hazel John­
son, Rev. and Mrs. Michael O’Connor,

Olive Myers, Nita Holland, Mr. and 
Mrs. Fred Fortenberry, Sylvia Yeary, 
Emnd Thomas, Rebecca Truitt, Mr. and 
Mrs. John Truitt, Lynn Roy Smith, 
Dowell Brewer. Jack Gibson, Mertie 
Gibson, Kay Martin,
Mable Foster, Lena 
many others.

We played a new guessing game 
Tuesday, “ Tbis is Your Life” . A 
summary of three residents was read 
and the residents were asked who they 
were. Different lifestyles are very 
interesting such as: which resident was 
born and raised in England, lived there 
during the London blitz, came to U.S. 
1950, started corresponding with a 
fellow from Roydada and married him 
July 24, 1954. They were blessed with 
three children. This lovely lady is Mavis 
Barton. Our next gentleman was born in 
Bruno, Arkansas and was raised in 
Paul’s Valley, Oklahoma. The story he 
likes to tell everyone is: one day he and 
his brother were riding horseback and 
passed this farm and saw a girl coming 
out of the barn with snoot all over her 
face. He told his brother. "That’s my 
girl if 1 ever get her.” They were 
married in May 1914 and were blessed 
with six children. This fellow is Esker 
Pyle.

On sale May 27 and 28 
all over town. 

----------- ★

BY VICKIE HUTTON
This lady claims to be a procrastina­

tor. She was born in Gasoline, Texas, 
November 21, 1912. Her brother carried 
her to school by carrying her on his back 
when the weather was bad. Her life one 
motto is, “ Put it off and you might not 
have to do it.” Mary McCracken is this 
lady.

After "This is Your Life” we had our 
Family Barbecue. We barbecued haml- 
burgers on the grill in our front lawn 
and served them with potato salad and' 
the many delicious dishes our families 
brought. We had a large majority of our 
families with us and thank them for 
coming and we missed the ones that 
were unable to attend.

Our bingo winners Tuesday and 
Friday were Mamie Wofford, Jewell 
Miller, Hallie Roberts, and Mary Mc- 
Cracker. We were saddened to learn 
that DeLinda Glasson will not be calling 
bingo this summer. She wants to spend 
more time with her children and we all 
understand that. Children are very 
precious, they grow up so fast. We will 
miss De Linda. Bingo won’t be the same 
without her.

Wednesday morning we had two 
special guests. Coco and Claudette, two 
p<x)dles. Coco is the daughter of Mr. 
^nd Mrs. Charles Hawkins and Claud­
ette is my baby. They spent the morning 
with us and we had a ball. Claudette 
even tried to help the Methodist church 
sing!

That afternoon we had our bake sale 
for the Lockney General Hospital. It was 
a big success and we thank everyone for 
the help they gave us.

Thursday was a very fun day. That 
morning we tried to guess who the 
residents were in pictures we had of 
their younger days. The one picture that 
stood out was the one of Bill Holt, 
William Poole and a friend that was 
taken before World War 1. No one could 
guess who they were and were real
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; Subscriptions 
due in May

In order to continue to receive 
your Beacon uninterrupted, if 

lyournam e appears below, pleasei 
remit by mail to Box 187, 
Lockney, Texas 79241 or 

► bring paym ent by Beacon office.^
In County -4 1 .5 0  

Out of County - 4 2 .5 0
Rossie Beedy 
Bill Bigham 
Opal Blount 
Dowell Brewer 
Byron Brock 
Gary Cawley 
B.G. Chapman 
Ruel Cook 
W.T. Cooper 
J.D. Copeland 
Edna Cox 
J.H. Deavenport 
Randy Duckworth 
David Foster 
Jody Foster 
Melanie Foster 
Donnie Jackson 
Melissa Johnson
Moore-Rose Funeral Home

For fast and reliable 
service with your 
prescriptions, 
come see us!

surprised when told. That picture was 
looked at the most. That afternoon 
"Katie’s Kitchen Band” from Loving- 
ton, New Mexico came and entertained 
us. This senior citizen band has 26 
members with the combined age of 
1900; 95 children. 246 grandchildren, 
and 175 great grandchildren. They were 
organized in 1973 in Katie’s kitchen and 
they entertain mostly in West Texas. 
We enjoyed these ladies and gentlemen 
very much and thank them for adding 
this special time in our lives.

Friday was a very busy day! We had 
our Mexican Luncheon to raise money 
for the Lockney General Hospital. Alot 
of work went into this and it was a big 
success. We thank all the people in the 
community who helped us make the 
luncheon the success it was. We were 
able to raise $500.00 from our luncheon 
and the bake sale. We were very 
pleased with the support and help we 
received from the community and the 
families.

We have added a new member to our 
family, Donie Hanson from Roydada. 
We welcome her and are looking 
forward to having her join in our 
activities. A special invitation is extend­
ed to all her friends to come and visit 
her.

During our bus trip Monday we went 
to the home of Ruth Carthel and saw her 
lovely flower gardens. Her flowers were 
beautiful and we spent most of the time 
trying to identify the flowers. We thank 
Mrs. Carthel for inviting us to see her 
garden.

Olive came Wednesday and we 
painted ceramics. This was Olive’s last 
visit with us. She and her husband are 
moving to Lubbock where she will 
attend Tech and work on her master’s 
degree. We will miss her. Her replace­
ment is Janice Nichols. She is a very 
sweet girl and 1 am sure we will grow to 
love her as we have Olive.

5 0 .

______ ________
LAVERN CHRISTIAN AND VICKIE HUTTON presented hospltJ administrator, 
Guy Hailett with a check for $500.00, which the Care Center raised during Nursing 
Home Week

1 am ending my column on a sad note. 
1 have resigned as Activity Director at 
the Care Center. The residents, past 
and present, their families, and the 
many volunteers have touched my life in 
a very special way. The residents have 
became like members of my family and 1

love them very much. I send a special 
thanks to everyone who helped me 
make my activity program a big 
success. I will miss the residents and 
they will always have a special place in 
my life. Thanks again! God bless you 
and good bye.

[ G u l f ] Save On
GASOLINE or DIESEL

Use our key pump. Main Street Lockney

For Information or Prices- Call COLLECT

DOUGLASS OIL CO.
Phone 293-1579 Plainview. Tevas

Distn Gulf Oil Products

SAVE 20%

Eddie Kinard 
Beulah Fae McClure 
Thad McCormick 
Clay Muncy 
Edgar R. Musser 
Joe Nance 
Wiley D. Nance Jr. 
M.F. O’Connor 
R.H. Parker 
Pat Patterson 
Donald Reecer 
Joe Neil Rexrode 
Cherilen Russell 
Melton Schaeffer 
Walter Taack 
O.D. Tarpley 
M.A. Ulmer 
Thomas K. Withey

_______________ JUST WHEN YOU W Ii USE IT MOST!
Here’s an opportunityto buy a gas grill at a big savings. . . and havethe whole summer ahead to enjoy it. That’s 
a real bargain! You will make the most of our great West Texas evenings and weekends cooking outdoors. Gas 
grills give food that wonderful outdoor flavor without the mess of charcoal or the bother of LP tanks. And, while 
you are having a hot time in the backyard, your kitchen stays cool. The money you save by buying now will put 
a lot of hamburgers and steaks on that grill. Now’s the time to move up to gas grill cooking while prices are down.
Prices in this ad reflect corrections from those iisted in Energas statement enclosure on gas grills.

I TPATIO KITCHEN
PK grills provide the convenience of natural gas 
fired barbecuing . . . have heavy top and bottom 
aluminum castings and H-shaped stainless steel 
burners for years of long wear. and exclusive 
Range Rock briquettes with controlled porosity 
for even heal anri less flare-up

PK DELTA 1
Single-burrter model with 
270 sq in chromed sieel 
cooking grid and 120 sq 
in step up grid

ONLY $6.73 
PER MONTH*

DUCANE

List price 
Lets 20%

5 %  sales tax 
Plus installation 

tCASH PRICE 
tB U D G ET PRICE*

$155 00 
-31 00 
124 00 

620 
70 00 

$200 20 
$242 28

PK REGENT 1
Dual burner and controls let 

you use or>e-half or all of 
burner. 325 sq m cast iron 

cooking grid, plus 120 sq in 
chromed steel step-up grid for 

warming

ONLY $8.79 
PER MONTH*

List price 
LessZOSV

5 %  sales lax 
Plus mslallation 
tCASH PRICE 
tB U D G ET PR ICE-

$228 00 
-45 60 
162 40 

9 12 
70 00

Ducane cast-aluminum grills feature top-ported 
aluminized-steel burners, which last longer and 
save gas. and a unique coal grate designed to 
prevent flare-ups Some models have Rolis-A- 
Grate. a separate vertical burner for rotissing 
from behind the meat, and p>orcelainized-steel 
cooking grids

r I . luL

$261 52 
$316 44

Budget terms no down payment. 
$8 79 per month for 36 months

DUCANE 1502
Dual burners, dual controls —  one for each 
side, when you don't need to use the full 
4 l0sq  in porcelainized-steel cooking grid, 
plus 108 sq in chrome warming rack and 
Vermont Maple side shelf

Budget terms rK> down payment. $6 73 per month for 36 months

ARKLA

P R E S C R I P T I  0 ~ ^

>4 ( I T
NEEDS

We will be closed Memorial Day

Phone 652-3353

l o c k n e y !

Arkla aluminum grills are feature- 
packed for all the pleasures of cooking 

out . with easy-cleaning porcelain 
enameled cast-iron cooking grids, 

up-front control center, stainless 
Steel H-shaped burner, and 

natural lava rocks.

ARKLA GRB40-EU
Real value for big families 374 sq 

in cooking grid with 166 sq in 
elevated chrome wire cooking surface, 

independent dual controls for each side 
of burner, and lid-mounted heat 

indicator

ONLY 
$10.90 

PER 
MONTH*

ONLY
$12.85

PER
MONTH*

List price 
Less 20%

5 %  sates tax 
Ptus installation 
TCASH PRICE 
tB U D G E T PRICE*

Budget terms no down payment. 
$ 12 85 per month lor 36 months

$372 00 
>74 40 
297 60 

14 88 
70 00 

$382 48 
$462 60

DUCANE 802 Single-burner model with 3t0 
sq in nickel-chrome plated cooking grid and 108 sq

in warming rack

ONLY
$8.45
PER

MONTH*

List price 
Less 20%

5 %  sales tax 
Plus installation 
tCASH  PRICE 
tB U D G E T PRICE*

$216 00 
-43  20 

172 80 
8 64 

70 00
$251 44 
$304 20

Budget terms no down payment. $8 45 per 
month for 36 months

DUCANE 2002 Three burners —  two for grilling 
and one Rotis-A-Grate vertical burner for rotissing. 310 

sq in porcelaini^ed-steel cooking grid. 108 sq in 
Chrome warming rack, automatic ignition, rotissing 

motor and spit, and Vermont Maple side shelf

Lift price 
Lets 20%

$324 52 
$392 40

Budget terms no down payrrient. $10 90 per month for 36 months

5%  sales tax 
Plus installation 
tCASH PRICE 
tB U D G ET PRICE*

$303 00 
-60 60 
242 40 

12 12 
70 00

ONLY
$16.33

PER
MONTH*

List price 
Less 20%

5 %  sates tax 
Plus installation 
tCASH PRICE 
IB U D G E T PRICE*

$495 00
•̂ 99 00 
396 00 

19 80 
70 00

$465 80 
$587 88

Budget terms no down payment. $16 33 per month 
for 36 months

ASK
ANY ENEROSS

d u c a n e  4000 Two burners —  one mam and one 
Rous A Grsle verlicai burner eiecironic ignilKm 310 sq in 

porcelami/ed-steel cooking grid, rotissing motor and spit 
all packaged in an elegant cart with large storage 

area, redwood-stained side shelf, heavy duly dual 
* wheels, and connection hose

ONLY $21.59 
PER MONTH*

J

List price 
Less 20%

5 %  sales tax 
Plus installation 
tCA SH  PRICE 
tB U D G E T PRICE*

$711 00 
>142 20 

568 80 
28 44 
45 00 

$642 24 
$777 24

Budget terms r>o down paynient. 
$21 59 per month for 36 months

EMPLOYEE
$AAD

Budget terms available at 12 75»« annual mieiesi on declining balance 
I Prices include tales tax and normal post-type ihttaltaiion 
except for Ducar>e 4000

Sale Ends July 31 , 1983
fNCeoAt itas

J


