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Bumper 1988 crop lifts spirits
Floyd County citizens ended 1988 on 

an upbeat note and headed into 1989 in 
a spirit of optimism, according to a sur­
vey by these newspapers.

In fact, that spirit of optimism, an­
chored on one of the best cotton crops in 
recent years, was so pervasive through­
out the County that it was rated one of 
the top stories of the year ending. Near 
perfect growing conditions for the cot­
ton crop was crowned with even better 
harvest weather as area gins reported 
being far ahead of last year, which itself 
was an exceptionally good year. And the 
quality of the crop, having escaped late 
season storms, was uniformily reported 
as good. One area farmer told us “I’ve 
been farming for 31 years, and this year 
was the best I have ever had.”

A review of the pages of the Floyd 
County Newspapers indicates the mood 
spilled over into various community 
events held during the year. The Old 
Sealers Reunion was generally rated as 
one the “best ever” by participants and 
onlookers alike. Crowds lined the 
streets and parking was at a premium as 
residents and visitors applauded the 
parade and took part in the festivities.

It was the year of the quadrennial 
homecoming for both Floydada and 
Lockney High Schools. Floydada 
alumni outdid themselves as upwards of 
1,000 former students returned to their 
Alma Mater to renew old firiendships 
and swap stories.

And of course the now annual 
“Punkin Days” celebration would have

Floydada review shows 
busy year of activity

January:
January started off with freezing rain 

and haz.ardous streets. It continued that 
way with a week of sub-freezing tem­
peratures. Heavy ice falling on lines 
created problems for Lighthouse Elec­
tric. Vandals turning on fire hydrants 
caused water main breaks, paving dam­
age, and loss of water to residents with 
repair expense costing up ip $7,236 and 
315,400 gallons of lost water.

The first baby of the year, Marla Noel, 
was bom Jan. 21, to the proud parents of 
Mike and Stacy Reeves. She weighed 7 
pounds 8 ounces, and has an older 
brother, Justin, who is 3 1/2.

The first week, more hats were 
thrown into the political ring. Randy 
Hollums announced he was seeking the 
democratic nomination for the 13th 
Congressional District. Ray Macha 
announced his candidacy for Sheriff, 
and D.R. Sanders filed for the position 
of Precinct Three Commissioner. War­
ren Chisum announced his candidacy 
for 84th Disuict Texas Representative.

City Council declined to tax vehicles, 
travel trailers, boats and airplanes, and 
the school board extended the contract 
of Superintendent Jerry Cannon, giving 
him a raise of $1,100 per year, bringing 
the salary to $49,332.00.

Work continued on a wildcat well 
being drilled seven miles southeast of 
Floydada. Ernest Smitherman posted a 
hole-in-one at the Floydada Country 
Club golf course. The ace was posted on 
the 136-yard, par 3, two hole, using a 
five iron.

Whirlwind boys captured first in JV 
tournament and Whirlwind girls came 
in second.

Wamie Hilton turned 106 on January 
16.

Entering the sixth bidding period 13% 
of die county’scropland was subscribed 
to the Conservation Reserved Program, 
representing 60,182 acres.

Mr. and Mrs. Henry Buder, Mr. and 
Mrs. W.O. Newberry, Mr. and Mrs. 
R.C. Patton, and Mr. and Mrs. Silas 
Wheeler, celebrated their 50th anniver­
saries in January.

February:
A school bus, specially equipped for 

handicapped transportation overturned 
on icy roads, on FM 207, the first week 
in February. The driver sustained 
bruises and abrasions and the two chil­
dren on the bus were uninjured.

Floyd County banks closed 1987 with 
a $2.6 million increase in deposits over 
the previous year. On the first day of 
Continued on Page Two

Hilton, Floydada's oldest 
resident dies at age 106

Floydada’s oldest resident, Wamie 
Hilton, passed away Tuesday, Decem­
ber 20, at 9:00 p.m. in the Floydada 
Nursing Home. He was 106, Just shy of 
his 107th birthday on January 16.

He was bom January 16, 1882 in 
Jacksboro. In an interview with The 
Floyd County Hesperian on January 15, 
1987, he attributed his longevity to, 
“never smoking, chewing tobacco or 
drinking coffee.”

He told The Hesperian that he had 
seen numerous changes occur in this 
county since arriving here in 1906. He 
and his late wife, Lola, traveled in a 
covered wagon pulled by four mules 
from Jacksboro. “It was a hard trip.”

M.

to be listed as one of the top stories 
covered by these p ^ r s  during the year. 
Starting as merely an idea nurtured by 
lots of hard wtMk, the occasion blos­
somed with loads of community in­
volvement. It garnered recognition far 
and wide as state and area newspapers 
and television stations noted the unique­
ness of the occasion. Even the far off 
village of Morton, Illinois, heretofore 
the “world’s pumpkin capitol” took note 
of the affair and wondered what to do 
about i t

The improving agriculture picture 
locally, coming as it did off a generally 
good 1987 agricultural year, (for those 
who escaped the hails) was reflected 
among County businesses as well. In the 
face of bank failures all across the state.

— t

the local banks stood out as solid, safe 
havens, indeed. County businesses were 
almost unanimous in reporting a good 
year. And, perhaps because of the year 
just ending, or perhaps because opti­
mism is a trademark of West Texans, 
almost all reported optimism for the new 
year as well.

Fred Byrd, of Byrd’s F*harmacy in 
Lockney told us he was looking forward 
to 1989 and only “hoped it is as good as 
’ 88.”

Tommye Perry at Floyd County 
Implement in Floydada said, "We had a 
real good year. We hope 89 is as good as 
’88.” And Steve Brown at Brown’s 
Implement in Floydada echoed her 
statement. They also “had a good year.” 
He said he too was “optimistic” about

Happy New Year?

t y
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He was the son of a rancher, J.P. 
Hilton and Laura Owens, He was the 
oldest of a family of four and outlived 
his one brother and two sisters.

Mr. Hilton married the former Lola 
Scoby in 1905 in Jacksboro. They were 
married 57 years prior to her death in 
1962. A daughter, Gladys Johnson, also 
preceded her father in death.

He was reputed to be Floyd County’s 
first barber. He barbered from 1915 to 
1972, retiring on his 90th birthday. He 
farmed prior to that

Mr. Hilton maintained his own resi­
dence and drove his car prior to breaking 
his hip at 103. He then took up residency 
at the Floydada Nursing Home on Feb. 
20,1986.

He was a Methodist He was also a 
Mason for over 65 years.

Funeral services were December 22, 
in the chajjel of Moore-Rosc-White 
Funeral Home with the Rev. Bill 
Wright, pastor of First United Methodisi 
Church officiating. Burial was in the 
Floyd County Memorial’ Park by 
Moore-Rose-)^ite Funeral Home.

Pallbearers were: Doyle Walls, Bill 
Gray, JimmyWillson, Allen Bingham, 
Bob Kendricks, and Roger Poage.

Survivors include a daughter, 
Blanche Grundy of Port Aransas; two 
grandchildren; seven great-grandchil­
dren; and five great-great-grandchil­
dren.

MARLA NOEL, Floydada's first new citizen of 1988, rings out the old year and 
welcomes the new, perhaps a little apprehensively, at the home of her parents, 
Mike and Stacy Reeves of Floydada. Marla seems to reflect what many Floyd 
County residents think: It's been a good year, and I'm hopeful, but not real 
sure, about 1989. Marla is approaching her first birthday, having been born in
January 1988 in Floydada Hospital. Staff Photo

A new fitness center will open in 
Floydada on January 3. The business, 
located at 109 S. 5th, will be owned and 
operated by Sharkey and Sheryl 
L ^ ro y , of Floydada. The center has 
been named, Floydada Boxing Club, 
Aaction Kenpo Karate and Family Fit­
ness Center.

It will feature one large room for men 
and women to work out with weights, 
treadmills, bicycles, and universal ma­
chines. Two private suntanning beds are 
also available.

In another large room there will be a 
floor level practice ring for boxing. It 
will also be equipped for karate and kick

’89.
All three Floydada automobile deal­

ers reported a good year. Floydada Ford 
said “Yes, definitely.” They reported 
“Good Christmas sales.” City Auto 
reported “As good a year as we’ve ever 
had.” On second thought they reported 
“One of the best years we’ve ever had” 
with a good Christmas “rush.” Oden 
Chevrolet also reported a good year and 
speculated that the cotton crop will be a 
help for next year’s sales.

Claude Brown, Lockney, owner of 
Brown’s Department Store, and always 
the master of the understatement, noted 
that he was “pleased with the Christmas 
business.”

Lane Kirk, of Kirk and Son’s Furni­
ture and Hardware, reported that tlie 
“rebound at the end of the year due to the

New fitness center to open 
in Floydada January 3rd

boxing lessons and workouts.
“I have just received my certification 

from the USA Amateur Boxing Federa­
tion,” saidLeCroy. “This certifies me as 
a national coach enabling me to teach 
boxing. I will also teach karate and kick 
boxing.”

“The hours may change,” said 
LeCroy, “depending on the needs of the 
people using the facility. At this time the 
hours arc set at Monday-Friday 12 noon 
- 8:30 p.m. We will be open on Satur­
days, but are not sure what hours at this 
time.”

The doors will open to the public 
January 3 and everyone is encouraged to 
stop in and see the new facilities.

cotton harvest was great. “In November 
and December we did a lot of catch-up.” 

Jerry Thompson, of Thompson’s 
Pharmacy in Roydada, reported “In 
general, yes, business was good.” He 
said he too thought “ 1989 will be a good 
year.”

Nancy Willson at Willson and Son, 
reported that “ 1988 was better than 
1987. Things appear to be picking up so 
we’re looking forward to 1989.”

Davis Lumber also reported business 
“holding up and looking forward to it 
being belter in ’89.”

In Lockney, Schacht’s Rowers and 
Gifts also reported “A pretty good year 
overall, and looking forward to 1989.” 

All in all, and considering all the 
alternatives, it was a good year for the 
folks in Royd County.

Lockney's top stories 
seen in 1988 review

January
Matthew Lee Barrientos became the 

first Royd County baby of 1988. He was 
bom in the Lockney Hospital. His par­
ents are Janie and Joe Angel Barrientos 
of Roydada.

Stetsons were tossed into the political 
ring. Ray Macha joined Fred Cardinal in 
the race for sheriff. Richard Sanders 
filed along with Thomas Warren and 
George Taylor for commissioner of 
Precinct three. Randy Hollums threw 
his hat into the ring as a candidate for 
U.S. Representative of the 13th Con­
gressional District Penny Golightly and 
Carolyn Redding were both seeking to 
become county tax assessor-collector. 
Connie Bearden, Hulon Carthel, Bill 
Hopper, Delmas McCormick, and Sam 
Spence were vying for the position of 
commissioner of Precinct One. Candi­
dates with no opposition were Bill Har­
din, county judge, Kenneth Bain, county 
attorney, and Kay Crabtree, commis­
sioner, Recinct Four.

Schools were let out early because of 
the weather. ACP signup at the ASCS 
office was set for January 11-15. Dan 
and Reeda Cay Smith, 1987 recipients 
of the Farm Bureau Outstanding Young 
Farmer/Rancher Award attended the 
American Farm Bureau Federation 
convention in New Oricans.

Twenty seven building permits were 
issued in 1987 amounting to $252,245. 
II Penseroso and Athena Study Clubs 
plan a facelift for the lobby of the Lock­
ney General Hospital-Cogdell Clinic. 
Todd Hallmark and Connie Vasquez 
were named Mr. and Miss L.H.S. Carlos 
Amador was named employee of the 
year at Tye and Company. Tiger Cubs 
and Cub Scouts are OTganized and hold 
first pack meeting.

Lockney churches are hosts to a 
family film series that will last six 
weeks. Lockney holds Junior Livestock 
Show. Shea Jackson, representing the 
Lockney 4-H and Rajeana Van Cleve, 
representing the Lockney FFA arc cho­
sen as sweethearts for the Royd County 
Junior Livestock Show.

February
One hundred and two animals were 

shown at the local junior livestock 
show. Senior Citizens established a 
memorial fund for those wishing to 
make donations to the Center in the 
name of a loved one.

Rhanda Hickerson exhibited the 
grand champion lamb and David Turner 
the grand champion barrow in the Royd 
County Junior Livestock Show. The 
Lockney High School computer team 
won second in regionals. The team 
consists of Joel Mitchell, Scott Arm­
strong, Clay Adrian and Boyd Jackson.

Eight local musicians, Kathy Davis, 
Ruth Elaine Wilson, Wesley Teeter, 
Amy Turner, Jessica Lemons, Coy 
Davis, Allen Martin, and Linda 
DeLeon, earned all-region band desig­
nations.

Laura Wilson opened Lattice and 
Lace in the former Baker building. W.T. 
and Lavem Cooper celebrate their fifti­

eth wedding anniversary. Lockney 
schools spend $3,402 in expenditures 
per student, of which 64% comes from 
the stale. Fair Board holds organiza­
tional meeting. Lena Pratt marked her 
100th birthday.

March
Ron Cates and Todd Hallmark are all­

district basketball team picks and hon­
orable mention went to Jimmy Ballejo 
and Javier Bemal.Thc local Dairy 
Queen was an award winner in the qual­
ity, value, service and cleanliness in­
spection held recently. They scored 91 
out of 100 points.

Brenda Mangold, Terry Keltz and 
Jim Bob and Kay Marlin were named 
elite citizens at the annual Chamber of 
Commerce banquet. Matt Williams 
angus heifer stood as grand champion at 
the Houston Livestock Show. The Sal­
vation Army opens a store here. Long­
horns win Whirlwind Relays. Kathy 
Davis and Ruth Elaine Wilson received 
Division I ratings at the U.I.L. Solo and 
Ensemble contest and will represent the 
Lockney Band at the state contest

Leonard Gilroy was named police 
chief for the city of Lockney. The 
School Board approved annexation of 
the South Plains School property. Reeda 
Cay Smith was named president of the 
Royd County Fair Board, Johnny Ar-

J&B Variety 
Outlet opening 
set Ttiesday
J & B  Variety Outlet will be hosting 

their Grand Opening on Tuesday, Janu­
ary 3. The opening, starting at 10:00 
a.m, will be sponsored by the Women’s 
Chamber of Commerce and refresh­
ments will be provided.

The new business, owned and 
operated by James and Virginia 
Dcchant, and Bobby and Sabrina Emert, 
will be located a t208 S. Main (where the 
old radio station used to be).

According to Dechant, “At the present 
time we have a full line of turquoise 
jewelry, gold chains, sweatshirts, cus­
tom T-shirts, workshirts, socks, hand­
crafted wood items, childrens jeans, 
ladies denim western shirts and custom 
hats.

“In the future we will be carrying 
ladies Chic and Jordache jeans and mens 
Wranglers, Gitano, and Rustler. We will 
also have a full line of western shirts for 
men and women, and will have bull rider 
and roper hats.”

James Dcchant and his Floydada na­
tive wife, Virginia, moved to town in ’85 
from Wisconsin. They have been mar­
ried five years. Partners, Bobby and 
Sabrina Emert are also Roydada natives 
and have been married two years.
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Review shows *88 as busy year of activity
Continued Trom Page Une
business at Floydada’s First National 
Bank, Jan. 4, over $2 million was depos­
ited. Deposits at the conclusion of the 
day stood at $51,668,907 (a record for 
deposits).

Producers Cooperative Elevatw an­
nounced the purchase of Consumers 
Fuel Association in Floydada.

The local stock show divisions were 
won by: Chad Edwards, Grand cham­
pion steer and Steer Showmanship; 
Dean Smith, Grand champion Iamb; and 
Chad Quisenberry, Grand champion 
barrow. The county stock show local 
winner was: Chad Edwards, Grand 
champion steer. 164 animals were auc­
tioned at the Floyd Stock show.

50lh anniversaries were celebrated by 
Claude and Anna Mae Hartsell, Mr. and 
Mrs. Clay Henry, and Mr, and Mrs. 
Lewis Spears.

The 1957 Study Club launched a proj­
ect to revitalize rooms at Cajxock Hos­
pital.

The Floydada Overnight RV park was 
opened with the erection of the sign on 
Hwy 70 adjacent to the swimming pxxjl.

March:
County gins report handling 108,851 

bales of '87 cotton crop, surpassing 
previous year by 40 bales.

The Justice Department approved 
single balloting site for the city of 
Floydada, and the Floydada Develop­
ment Company met with a Director of 
the South Plains Association of Govern­
ments to discuss a “feasibility study” 
concerning a proposal by the Atchison, 
Topeka and S ante Fe Railroad to sell the 
“Lubbock Cluster”, which includes the 
27-mile spur between Floydada and 
Plainview.

There were several contested local 
races in the March 8 primary, on the 
democratic party ballot. District Attor­
ney Randy Hollums, sought the position 
of District 13 U.S. Representative. 
Other democratic candidates for that 
position were Bill Sarpalius and Ed 
Lehman. Local contested races were: 
County Tax Assessor-Collector being 
sought by Penny Golightly and Carolyn 
Redding; Precinct 1 Commissioner 
being sought by Connie D. Bearden, 
Hulon Carthel, Bill Hopper, Sam 
Spence and Dclmas McCormick; and 
Precinct 3 Commissioner contested by 
D.R. Sanders, George Taylor, and Tho­
mas Warren. Another hotly contested 
race, but not in the primary, was that of 
incumbent Sheriff Fred Cardinal, demo- 
craL and republican contender Ray 
Macha.

This Week
WEATHER

Courtesy of Energas
DATE HIGH 1LOW
Dec. 21 65 27
Dec. 22 55 42
Dec. 23 66 32
Dec. 24 54 28
Dec. 25 61 36
Dec. 26 66 52
Dec. 27 46 40

GRAND OPENING
J&B Variety Outlet will have an 

open house sponsored by the 
Women’s Chamber of Com­
merce, to celebrate their grand 
opening on Jan. 3 at 10 a.m. The 
business, owned by James 
Dcchant and Bobby Emcrt, is 
located at 208 S. Main, where the 
old radio station was located.

OFFICES CLOSED
Both Floydada and Lockney 

banks and post offices will be 
closed Monday, Jan. 2, in obser­
vance of the New Year holiday.

Have a Safe and 
Happy New Year!

Two county races were decided on 
Super Tuesday. In the race for County 
Tax Assessor, Penny Golightly polled 
1,492 votes to Carolyn Redding’s 391. 
George Taylor became the new Precinct 
3 commissioner with 199 votes. Thomas 
Wanen polled 95 and D.R. Sanders 24.

A run off was required in the Precinct 
1 Commissioner’s race. Hulon Carthel 
and Connie Bearden survived among 
the five vying for the position.

Candidates filing for municipal posi­
tions were Nancy Willson, Don Green, 
Amado Morales, and at-large positions 
of Frank Breed and Wayne Russell.

Candidates for school board were 
Cyndi Williams, Clar Schacht, and Jerry 
Livingston for precinct Two; Freddie 
Morren and Andy Hale for Precinct 
One.

Fred Thayer, Melba Vickers, and 
Aldine Williams filed as candidates for 
hospital board.

The trustees of the South Plains Inde­
pendent School District asked that the 
FISD board consider a resolution to 
accept the annexation of the SPISD to 
Floydada. The closure of the South 
Plains school would see the transfer of 
12.81 sections to LISD and the remain­
der to FISD.

Randy Duke was named local man­
ager of Floydada’s SPS office, and 
Tommie Rice was appointed the new 
Postmaster.

Dr. A.E. Guthrie became the first 
recipient of Floydada’s Chamber of 
Commerce Citizen Through the Years 
Award. The Citizen of the Year Award 
went to Jimmy Willson, Employer of 
the Year Award went to Bob Alldredge, 
and a special “Extra Mile Award” went 
to Bill Hale.

Chosen for the All-District Team 2- 
3A were Chad Pemell and Ty Stovall 
representing the Whirlwinds and Angie 
Bertrand and Amanda McDaniel repre­
senting the girls all- district basketball 
squad;

A 60th wedding anniversary was cele­
brated by the Rev. and Mrs. James Jen­
kins. A 50th anniverary was celebrated 
by Mr. and Mrs William H. Smith. 

APRIL
County Commisssioners accepted a 

bid to renovate the Floyd County jail. 
September 16 and 17 were named as 
dates for the 1988 Whirlwinds Home­
coming.

Connie Bearden won the democratic 
primary runoff election for county 
commissioner place one, edging out 
Hulon Carthel. Floydada Independent 
School District trustees approved 
$47,950 in new construction for Duncan 
Elementary School, and named John 
Odam as band director.

Good rains fell across the county, 
practically assuring ample crop mois­
ture, and county banks reported a 
healthy rise in deposits. The Floydada 
Chamber of Commerce reported that the 
first “Punkin Day” celebration was such 
a success that it will be expanded to two 
days this year, and the Care Link heli- 
c(^ter operated by Methodist and Lub­
bock General Hospital began patient 
flights from Floydada.

Floyd County Sheriff Fred Cardinal 
and Deputy David Hart were named as 
defendants in a suit filed April 20 on 
behalf of C.L. Henderson and Marie 
Henderson.

May
Seventy-seven receieved diplomas in 

high school commencement exercises, 
and the Old Settlers Day brought in the 
largest crowd remembered by anyone.

Andy Hale and Cyndiann Williams 
were elected to the school board. 
Amando Morales beat incumbent Don 
Green and became the new councilman 
from District 1. Nancy Willson running 
unopposed in District 4, received 41 
votes. Also unopposed were Frank 
Breed and Wayne Russell who once 
again became the councilmen at large. 
The new hospital directors elected were 
Fred Thayer and Melba Vickers.

Angie Bertrand and Daniel Medrano 
established new school records in 800 
meter run.

Opening
FLOYDADA BOXING CLUB

109 Fifth Street Floydada 

IVaining offered in
AMATEUR BOXING & KICKBOXING  

Certified by the
USA Amateur Boxing Federation 

Certified Coaching
For information call: Sharkey LeCroy

983-3803

Becky Bybee McPherson announced 
her candidacy as a write-in candidate for 
district attorney of the 110th district.

County commissioners presented a 
profX)sed yearly budget of $1.4 million.

Judge Arthur B. Duncan was inducted 
as the first Hall of Famer in Floyd 
County’s Hall of Fame.

June
While parts of the United States were 

suffering from drought, Floyd County 
crops were in excellent condition after 
3-4 inches of rain was received through­
out the county.

Dr. Andrew McCulley retired after 34 
years of local dental practice.

Don Green Auto Parts Store was bur­
glarized with stolen merchandise loss 
estimated close to $10,000.

The Chamber of Commerce chose the 
official Floydada logo created by Bill 
Standiforth which reads, “Floydada 
Pumpkin Capital, USA”.

July
Continuing rains benefit some crops, 

such as com, but was too much and too 
late for the onion crop. Lightning struck 
the Ford home, north of Aiken, knock­
ing out electricity and sending a fire ball 
through the livingroom. Dean Stewart’s 
home, of South Plains, also suffered 
lightning damage.

Floydada City Council approved a 
signed purchase agreement with Helen 
Hammonds, bringing to an end the 
ongoing land dispute between the two 
parties. The agreement stated that 
Hammonds agreed to sell to the city 
48,999 acres plus a 1.8 acre roadway 
easement needed for expansion of the 
city landfill qreration. In exchange, the 
city agreed to pay Hammonds 
$24,499.95 for the acres and $4,500 for 
the easement

Deposits at the First National Bank 
were up slightly at mid-year compared 
to deposits the same time last year.

Departing Hesperian editor, Jim Rey­
nolds, received a certificate from Mayor 
Parnell Powell naming him “Honorary 
Floydada Citizen.”

Another business, Nielson’s Restau­
rant, suffered a loss of over $1,100.00 
from a burglary.

Dr. Randell Griffin opened his dental 
practice, taking the place of retiring 
dentist Andrew McCulley.

An explosion destroyed a home at 210 
W. Virginia. The couple and their two 
children were not at home at the time of 
the explosion.

Leonard and Lahoma Matsler cele­
brated their 50th wedding anniversary. 

August
Commissioners Court conducted a 

public hearing concerning the proposed 
1.8 cent tax increase. Proposed for 1988 
is a 29 cent per $100 valuation rate, and 
the Whirlwinds opened fall drills.

Tom West, Briscoe County attorney, 
announced his write-in candidacy for 
110th district attorney.

Summit Savings q>ened under the 
new name of Sunbelt Savings, after the 
Federal Home Loan Bank Board 
merged Summit with seven other troub­
led institutions. The new thrift, with 143 
branch offices in 89 Texas cities will be 
operated by federal regulators.

Frank and Paulie Webb celebrated 
their 50th anniversary.

September
Homecoming for FHS exes began 

September 16 with registration at the 
high school library. Approximately 
1,000 former students of Floydada High 
School showed up to celebrate the occa­
sion and see Blanca Medrano named 
Homecoming queen for 1988, and a 
capacity crowd of some 5,000 watched 
the Floydada Whirlwinds shut out the 
Lockney Longhorns 35-0.

The Floydada City Council set the tax 
rate for 1988 at 40 cents per $100 valu­
ation, representing no increase over the

previous year. The County Commis­
sioners, on the motion of Commissioner 
Sam Spence, voted to join neighboring 
counties in the Rural Rail Transporta­
tion District in an effort to preserve 
railway services.

Johnny Summers, manager of 
Floydada Pay-N-Save, joined with 
owner Roger Lowe and Mayor Parnell 
Powell to break ground for the store’s 
expansion.

October
“Punkin Day” plans were finalized 

with publicity received from all types of 
media, including T.V., radio, maga­
zines, and newspapers throughout the 
state. The weather was breezy and cool 
in the morning but turned into a perfect 
day for the celebration, held OcL 29 on 
the courthouse square. Oct. 28th was 
also cold and windy, but did not hamper 
the spirits of downtown merchants who 
dressed themselves and their windows 
in pumpkin and Halloween motif.

The school bus bam, located at the 
junior high was burglarized. An ’88 
Suburban belonging to the school was 
taken and set on fire. Andrews Ward 
was also burglarized and several rooms 
were ransacked. Three people were later 
arrested in connection with these bur­
glaries.

Mr. G.W. Smith was presented the 
annual bonus check for bringing in the 
first bale of cotton.

Mr. and Mrs. Harvey Tardy cele­
brated their 60th wedding anniversary.

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Russell cele­
brated a 50th wedding anniversary. 

November
Floyd County voters cast a majority of 

their Allots for Republican Presidential 
candidate George Bush, reelected 
Democratic U.S. Senator Lloyd 
Bentsen, elected Becky McPherson as 
their new District Attorney, kqrt Penny 
Golightly in the office of "rax Assessor- 
CoUecter, gave Republican Kent Hance 
a new term as Texas Railroad Commis­
sioner; elected Democrats Warren 
Chisum and Bill Sarpalius to the Texas 
House of Representatives and the U.S 
House, respectively; elected Demo­
cratic candidate Steve Carriker as their 
new State Senator, kept Fred Cardinal as 
County Sheriff; elected Connie 
Bearden, George Taylor and Kay 
Crabtree as County Commissioners, 
along with Bill Hardin as County Judge. 
And City voters retained Kenneth Bain 
as City Attorney.

Domingo Robledo, of Ralls, who was 
being held in the Floyd County Jail, 
charged with the burglary ofiAndrews 
Elementary Ward, escaped at 12:30 
p.m., November 1. He later turned him­
self in to the Crosby County Sheriffs 
office.

An open house was held to celebrate 
the completion and opening of the new 
band hall.

Winners of the Miss Floydada pag­
eant were Miss Floydada Janet Himes, 
first runner-up Trish Pemell, second 
mnner up Kathy Himes and Miss Con­
geniality was Deanna Watson.

Ricky Mosley of Lockney was de­
clared the winner of the Hesperian foot­
ball contest, taking home two tickets to 
the Thanksgiving Day Dallas Cowboys 
football game.

George and Elwauna Taylor cele­
brated their 50th wedding anniversary.

December
With ginning not yet complete, Floyd 

County Gins report a county total of 
140,847 bales, some 40,000 bales more 
than last year at this time.

Moore-Rose Funeral Home was sold 
to Don and Billie White Everett of 
Tahoka, and Parker Furniture, of 
Floydada, announced they were closing 
their doors aftw 47 years of service.

Jana Davis was hospitalized after an 
accidental shooting left her with a gun-

THANK YOU
After 47* years o f business we*re 
closing our doors and Vd like to 
thank all our friends who made 

all these years possible.
They were good years and we could 

not have done it without you.

Our best wishes to you all. 
Newell Parker

shot wound in the shoulder. Ms. Davis’s 
father, Joe Lewis Davis reportedly was 
handing the gun to his daughter when it 
went off.

Winners of the home and business 
lighting contest were: L.V. Assiter and 
City Hall both placing first. Second 
place in both divisions were garnered by 
Sue’s Gifts and Bob Hambright Third 
place winners were Bishop-Ramsey 
Pharmacy and Jerry McGuire.

Ten burglaries in Floyd County were 
cleared with the arrest of a Plainview 
man.

The combined efforts of the Chamber 
of Commerce, the City of Floydada, A1 
Galloway’s general mechanical repair 
shop. Lighthouse Electric and SPS, 
transformed the city streets with festive 
and colorful Christmas decorations.

The chamber of commerce erected a 
sign to encourage Floydadians to shop at 
home with the slogan, “If You Don’t 
Shop Floydada Who Will?” displayed 
on Hwy. 62 south.

1504-Her’s and their parents attended

the4-H banquet Stacy Hinsley recieved 
the “Gold Star Award”; Gary Brown 
and Pat Rowan were cited as “Silver 
Spur Award” winners; “I Dare You 
Awards” were presented to Grant Cage 
and Loretta Turner; “Friends of 4-H 
Awards” went to Johnny Summers and 
Kenneth and Juanita Broseh; “Rookie of 
the Year Awards” went to Kaci Mathis 
and Stacey Lloyd.

School board members accepted a bid 
to resurface the school track.

Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Guffee cele­
brated a 65th anniversary. Mr. and Mrs. 
Fred Jackson, celebrated their 50th 
anniversary.

All district players named included 12 
Whirlwinds. They were: Adam Cates, 
Leonard King, Armando Morales, 
Grant Stovall, Jacob Galvan, Ismail 
Delgado, Frank Suarez, Joe Cisneros, 
Jay Mendoza, Chad Quisenberry; Jesse 
Suarez and Danny Caballero received 
honorable mention.

Varsity girls snagged first at the 
Lorenzo basketball toumament

Community responds to 
pleas of Child Welfare

“It is a wonderful thing when a com­
munity joins together to help those who 
are less fortunate,” said Shalane 
Wesley, of the Floyd County Child 
Welfare Board. “The response to our 
request for fall clothing for the children 
maintained in foster care by Floyd 
County was overwhelming. In fact it 
was such a success, we will probably 
have a spring clothing drive in April or 
May.”

In keeping with the spirit of the sea­
son, local churches, civic organizations 
and individuals donated money to be 
used for Christmas gifts for the foster 
children. Wesley expressed her grati­
tude to all involved in making 1988 a

Happy New Year!

memorable Christmas for the seven 
children.

Wesley reminds readers that anyone 
wishing to donate money to assist with 
the care of the children In need of foster 
care may do so by contacting her at the 
Texas Department of Human Services 
in Floydada or by contacting any 
member of the child welfare board.

LIFE - HEALTH 
GROUP-ANNUITIES 

DISABILITIES- 
^MEDICARE SUPPLEMENTS})

Tom McCaleb
Representative

Mutudl**" Omaha United^Oraoha |
Lubbock District Oftice 
4412 74th, Suite D-100 
Lubbock, TX 79424 
Phone 792-7098

THANK YOU THANK YOU THANK YOU 

The Salvation Army
Friends, with your help we were able to deliver sacks of canned food, 
chicken and a gift for young children to 96 people in this area. The 

Texas Department of the Salvation Army included boxes of toilet 
accessories for several adults.

The store will be open except in very cold weather. Please think of 
us when you no longer need used clothing, furniture or utensils. 

We miss Elmo Savage who worked very hard for this store. 
Thank you Elmo!

Thank you to the following people who helped deliver - 
Lupe Banda, Jerry  Reyna, Edythe Cooper, Sayla C. Luna 

Alicia Luna, Manager and Art Barker, Treasurer

DISCOVER
*

MDBOOVBiramm
Floydada C able TV subscribers will begin 

receiving The Discovery Channel on cable channel 
15, W ednesday, December 28. The new cable 
television service focuses on entertaining non-fiction 
programs in five general programming areas; nature, 
history, people and places, human adventure and 
science and technology.

119 E. Kentucky 
983-2911 CABLE TV
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Lockney s top stories seen in 1988re vie w
Continued from Page One
jona, vice-president. Nellie Webb, sec­
retary, and Betty Hayes, treasurer. The 
Lockney City Council approved a rate 
decrease for Southwestern F*ublic Serv­
ice.

Vera Cox celebrated her 80th birth­
day. Dates were chosen for LHS home­
coming. Tandi Gant took 3 first place, 2 
second places and 1 third place in the 
1988 National Baton Twirling Associa­
tion regional meet Olan Poteei was 
appointed to serve as deputy sheriff for 
the Lockney area.

Lockney High School one act play 
“The Taming of the Shrew” won first 
place at district. Gwen Lane and Clay 
Adrian were named best actress and best 
actor. Matt Williams and Cindy Cook 
were named to the all-star cast. Popula­
tion of Lockney shows slight decrease. 
Joe Castro qualifies for state power lift­
ing meet.

Consumer’s Fuel holds annual meet­
ing. Jerry Cawley and Louie Bybee 
were elected to Consumer’s board. Dale 
Ross was presented a special award for 
having worked at Consumers for 21 
years.

April
Elizabeth G uerrero opens hair styling 

shop on North Main. Athena Study Club 
held a pre-school clinic f(x students 
entering the Lockney school system for 
the first time. The Charles Ball fishing 
tournament was held.

The Lockney Beacon won five 
awards in the annual Panhandle Press 
Association newspaper contest for 
weekly papers. The City of Lockney 
ended their fiscal year “in the black”. 
Charlie Walser, grandfather of Betty 
Hayes, celebrated his lOOth birthday. 
The Lockney FHA chapter assisted the 
girl scouts in a pie making workshop. 
PFC Martha Reyes earned a State Guard 
distinction.

Hospital holds open house to show- 
off new lobby renovation. City ordi­
nance prohibits livestock and poultry 
inside city limits. Dilapidated structures 
were discussed at a public meeting. 
“Country Jubilee” was selected as the 
theme for the Floyd County Fair. Lock- _ 
ney Scouts held their first pinewood 
derby. ^

The senior class was treated to a night 
“Down on Broadway” by the juniors. 
Voted Most Courteous were Veronica 
Blanco and Troy Bigham; Most Repre­
sentative were Gwen Lane and Todd 
Hallmark; Most Friendly were Mary 
Lou Gonzales and Aaron Kidd; Most 
Likely to Succeed were Joel Mitchell 
and Kathy Davis; Most Popular were 
Connie Vasquez and Matt Williams.

The Lockney Longhorn track team 
qualified for eight events at regionals. 
Sundai Workman and Shedia Hill rq)re- 
sented Lockney at the regional track 
meet for girls.

Competing at regional U .I i .  events 
were the one-act play, Donna Vernon in 
newswriting and headline writing, 
Orlando Mondragon in typing, Rosellen 
Arjona in feature writing, Sonia Garcia 
in newswriting, Gwen Lane in poetry 
intrepretation, Jennifer Turbeville in 
ready writing, and Cindy Cook in liter­
ary criticism. Alternates were Fernando 
Elias in feature writing, Joel Mitchell in 
calculator, and Elida Luna in account­
ing.

A donkey basketball game held in 
gym. LHS athletes were honored at an 
all-sports banquet Joel Mitchell, Boyd 
Jackson and Kathy Davis were recipi­
ents of college scholarships. Joe Castro

placed eighteenth in state power lifting 
contest.

May
School, city, and hospital elections 

were slated for Saturday. Lockneyite 
Becky McPherson is to conduct a write- 
in for the District Attorney post El 
Tejano Restaurant opens on Main 
Street O.C. Allison was installed as 
leader of VFW Post 7993. Kathy Davis, 
Gwen Lane, Donna Vernon and Connie 
Vasquez were selected for citizenship 
honors by the El Progreso Study Club.

Lockney Junior High was the site of 
district U.I.L. competition. Coby Mart, 
Mary Lindsey Poole, O ’Brien 
McEtonald, Lee Ann Galloway, Aubrey 
Kirit Allison Mangold, Kelly Clark, 
Tiffany Ellison, Mandy Hunter, Amy 
Ruiz, and Ryan Smith placed in several 
categories.

Placing in Junior High at U.1I-. were 
Rhanda Hickerson, Max Green, Allen 
Martin, Amanda Marts, Jarrod Glasson, 
Kori Kellison, Shawn Hill, Ryan Ford, 
Lance Patridge, Chad Cook, Ranee 
Ford, Ignacio Luna, Calixta Guorero, 
Clay Golden, Cody Jackson, and Lila 
Booker.

Joel Mitchell and Ruth Elaine Wilson 
were top honor grads for the Class of 
1988. “Super ’88" was picked as the 
theme for homecoming. Andy Rodri­
quez was the sole tractster headed for 
state.

Six incumbents and one newcomer 
were elected to governing bodies. Eddie 
Teeter and Jim Bob Martin were elected 
to the school board. J.D. Copeland, Gary 
Marr and Ronnie Aston were re-elected 
to city council posts. Chester Carthel 
and Les Ferguson were elected to hospi­
tal board.

Linda Terrell and Kay Williams were 
selected to participate in a writing pro­
gram at Tech. Andy Rodriquez placed 
fourth at the state track meet. The Long­
horn Band won first place in the “small 
school” classification at the World of 
Music Festival held in Arlington. Band 
Director Les Ross was named the 
“Outstanding Music Educator” at the 
festival. Tandi Gant received a superior 
rating and Lori Gonzales an excellent 
rating for their twirling.

Brenda Mangold, Sandra Cummings, 
Carol Huggins,Tracy Prater,Reeda Cay 
Smith Kathy Allen and Laura Wilson 
were elected P.T.A.officers for the 
1988-89 year.

38 Lockney High School class mem­
bers receive diplomas. Troy Bigham, 
Clay Harrison, Matt Williams, Loretta 
Turner, and Raetta Starnes earned the 
Lone Star Farmer Degree. Zane Bauer 
was chosen as new vo-ag instructor. 
South Plains School held a reunion May 
29. The South Plains School will be 
closing May 31. It opened its doors as 
the South Plains School in 1929.

June
Herman and Helen Huffman were 

honored as the pioneer couple, Hubert 
Frizzell as the Pioneer Man, and Uibute 
was paid to Frank Brown at the Floyd 
County Old Settlers Reunion. Senator 
Phil Gramm toured the Tye Company. 
The swimming pool opened and refur­
bishing of the water tower was okayed 
by the city council.

Norman Caldwell celebrated his 70th 
birthday. Lockney junior high names 
Ignacio Luna and Ranee Ford as top 
graduates.Les and Faye Ferguson cele­
brate fifieth wedding anniversary.

Scarecrow contest and pet show 
added to Fair agenda. Dryland wheat 
harvest did not last long and came up

Countdown to a wonderful 
New Year and a bright new beginning.

\X/e hope you shine In '89.

Floydada Chamber of Commerce
Directors

Nettie Ruth Whittle, manager

short The Loclmey school board hired 
seven new faculty members. Twirlers 
win in state competition. Local students 
fared well on the TEAMS test Lions 
Club governor visited the local club. 
Junior High awards were presented in 
assembly.

July
School Board members present long 

range plans. Darrell Dodds joins First 
National Bank as trainee. Hospice of the 
Plains scheduled a fund raiser. Lockney 
City Council raised tax rate 3%. Plans 
were finalized for a Fun Run in conjunc­
tion with Royd County Fair. The fair 
board begian making final plans. James 
Race was named Wichita County Farm 
Bureau manager.

Jerrod Glasson, Allen Martin, Lila 
Booker, and Lance Patridge attended a 
4-H leadership lab in Levelland. Richie 
Crow was a sponsor. Kay Tannahill was 
artist of the month at the First National 
Bank. Lockney Cooperative hosted its 
31st annual meeting. The Class of 1978 
planned its 10th year reunion. Myra 
Applewhite honored by Chinese with 
letters of praise.

Use of cotton in ^parel shows 51 % 
increase. Lockney Chamber to spotlight 
members in newspaper. Lightning 
storm downed power in city of Lockney. 
Mary Lou Bollman discusses her favor­
ite hobby, geneaology. Football physi­
cals are scheduled. Thompson’s Phar­
macy has the champion softball team. 

August
Rotary Club accepting consignments 

for annual auction. Lockney Longhorns 
begin two-a-day drills. Nelson Wofford 
talks on windmills and wine. The Royd 
County Fair opened its doors. Events 
were scheduled over a three day period. 
1988 Lockney Longhorn football 
schedule is listed.

The Lockney Beacon was cited for 
“General Excellence” at the West Texas 
Press Association convention. Jessica 
Lemons was named 1988 Miss Royd 
County. Randi Duke was named Little 
Miss Princess. Little Miss Royd County 
honors were given to Gretchen Quebe 
and Lacy Golightly was named Jumior 
Miss Royd County. The first Fun Run 
was deemed a success.

Members of the San Jose Catholic 
Church celebrated the church’s 2Sth 
Jubilee. Winners in the various divi­
sions at the fair were listed.

September
Lockney Independent School District 

adoptedatax rate of 72 cents. Lockney’s 
football team faced Ralls in the season 
opener. New teachers in the school sys­
tem were introduced.

Brandon Widener was the first foot­
ball contest winner. Lockney High 
School set its open house for parents. 
The Lockney P.T. A. held their member­
ship drive. Treena Aston and Kathy 
Becker participated in the state In- 
service conference for home economics - 
teachers held in Dallas.

Neighbors turned out to harvest E>oug 
Bradley’s com after he was injured in a 
farm accident City CoutKil discusses 
dumpground problems. School enroll­
ment tops 700. Perry Zumwalt became 
the pastor at the Main Street Church of 
Christ Future Homemakers of America 
held a “Back to America” styleshow.

Lockney P.T.A. hosted spaghetti 
supper for members. Times and activi­
ties are set for homecoming. Mayor Dan 
Smith signs Constitution Week procla­
mation as Vera Jo Bybee watches.

LISD enrollment increased 23 stu­
dents over last year. The circus came to 
town. Stella Gonzales, Sonia Garcia, 
Jennifer Fortenberry, Shedia Hill, Kima 
Blanca, Valency, Zumwalt Sundai 
Workman, and Shea Jackson vyed for 
the title of 1988 Homecoming Queen. 
LISD approved use of drug dogs in the 
schools.

October
741 Lockney ex-students attended 

the 1988 Homecoming. Valency 
Zumwalt was named Homecoming 
Queen. Homecoming honorees named 
at the class meeting were Madge Huff, 
earliest graduate returning, class of 
1912 and her brother Glen Watson, class 
of 1912, oldest man attending.

Scott Armstrong was designed as a 
Commended Student by the National 
Merit Scholarship Corporation. John 
Tye gave a talk at a small business 
seminar held at Wayland. At a regular 
meeting of the City Council they 
handled taxes, grant, and trash pickup. 
The Volunteer Fire Department held 
open house. Local churches hosted a 
drug abuse seminar. The Longhorns 
shut out the Hale Center Owls 13-0.

Bobby Pinner was named bank artist 
of the month and displayed his wood 
carvings. The Boy S ^ t s  launched a 
food drive for the needy. AP. Sanders 
was honored on his 90th birthday. The

First United Methodist Church held its 
annual harvest festival.

Varsity Cheerleaders for the year are 
Shana Stapp, Laura Perez, Anna Cortez, 
Cindy Co<A, Sundai Woilunan, and 
Aimee Green. Dr. Gary Mangold was 
named a Fellow of the American Acad­
emy of Family Physicians. John M. Tye, 
president of the Tye Company was 
named Farm and Industrial Equipment 
Institute Chairman. P.T.A. is making 
final plans for the Halloween Carnival.

Candidates address issues at Cham­
ber of Commerce political forum. Lock­
ney Longhorn twirlers, Tandi Gant, 
Jennifer Turbeville, Lori Gonzales and 
Tnidi Lambert earned a Superior I rating 
at the U.II.. contest held in Lubbock. 
The Longhorn Band earned an Excel­
lent II rating at the marching contest 
held in Lubbock at Tech Stadium. 7.ane 
Poison is director of the band and Me­
linda Basaldua is the drum major.

Lewzetta Gloyna displays a bit of 
history inside the Plains Electric Com­
pany on Main Street. She had a collec­
tion of arrowheads and indian artifacts 
that she has found over the years. A farm 
group from Royd County toured the 
Cotton Incorporated research facilities.

The ASCS office is taking drought 
relief applications from those whose 
crops won’t pay to harvest. Lockney 
Junior Varsity cheerleaders for 1988-89 
are Daisy Blanco, Jessica Lemons, 
Shedia Hill and Jennifer Fortenberry. 
Representing Lockney Junior High as 
twirlers are Jennifer Collins and Nancy 
Peralez. Leading the cheers at Junior 
High are Racquell Ruiz, Cindy Perez, 
Nicole McDonald, Kori Kellison and 
Melissa Salas.

November
The Lockney Independent School 

District is rated in the top ten in the state 
of Texas in academics. Others listed are 
Clear Creek, Daingerfield, Lone Star, 
Hallettsville, Mason, McAllen, Mis­
sion, Nazareth, and Plano. Superinten­
dent W.H. Hallmark gave credit for the 
listing to the teachers, school board and 
the community.

George and Elwauna Taylor cele­
brate their fiftieth wedding anniversary. 
Robin Marks, Jessica Marks, Loretta 
Turner, Raetta Starnes, and Lila Booker 
are named new FHA officers.

The Lockney boys Cross Country 
team won the district meet in Lubbock 
and will go on to Regionals. Amy

Turner was the top finisher in the girls 
race.

The Cross Country team placed third 
at the regional meet and are headed for 
state. Members of the learn are Mark 
Gatica, Jorge Bernal, Juan Vargas, 
Henry Ruiz, Andy Rodriquez, Au­
gustine Pena, Chris Villa, Kip Holt, and 
Gilbert Ruiz. Robin Bowden is the 
coach for the cross country team.

1988-89 Lockney Basketball sched­
ule was listed. Alice Gilroy, editor of the 
Lockney Beacon presented Sarah Sand­
ers with the tickets to the Dallas Cowboy 
- Houston Oiler game.

The City Council has contracted 
Triple C Waste to haul the trash for the 
city to a landfill in Crosby County. The 
landfill north of Lockney will then be 
open only on Tuesdays, Thursdays and 
Saturdays.

The Lockney P.T.A. named Stacy 
Bigham, Nicole Mosley, Danny Hug­
gins and Johnathan Martinez as their 
reading contest winners. Brenda Man­
gold, P.T.A. president, presented Mrs. 
G.B. Johnson with a check for $190.00 
for the purchase of books. A.L. Newton 
brought in the largest turnip grown in the 
county. It was 23 inches in circumfer­
ence.

The Cross Country team placed sixth 
at State. The Lockney U.I.L. Math team 
placed second in competition in Plain- 
view. The Senior Citizen organization 
marked their first anniversary. Eighteen 
students were inducted into the Lockney 
High School National Honor 
Society .Richard and Sharon VanHoose 
opened the Longhorn Video Store on 
Main Street Ten winners received tur­
keys in the Lockney Beacon turkey 
contest.

December
Ten burglaries were solved by the 

arrest of a Plainview man. The serial 
number on a Remington shotgun was his 
downfall. The South Plains Associa­
tions of Governments were seeking seed 
money to purchase a local railroad spur.

Two Lockney teachers are co-wdi- 
nating a writing workshop for Lockney 
teachers. Lloyd Duvall opened the 
Country Craft Store featuring hand­
made woodwork. The Arts Association 
presented an original Christmas play, 
“The Night Before Chrisunas”. The 
Lockney Hospital held a blood drive.

Eldon and Eva Lee Roberts and Nor­
man and Marguerite Caldwell cele­

brated their fiftieth wedding anniversa­
ries. Randy and Kelly Nielsen have 
opened Nielsen’s Electronic Repair 
business in the former Mize Pharmacy 
building. A shooting at Lone Star hos­
pitalized a county man. Michael 
DeLeon, Phillip Glasson, Wesley Tee­
ter, Michael Martinez, Gilbert Ruiz, 
Lupe Coronado and Joe Luis Guerrero 
were named to the All-District football 
team.

Eula Bramlet was honored at her 80th 
birthday. Mr. and Mrs. J.M. Tye cele­
brated their fiftieth wedding anniver­
sary. The Longhorns placed third in 
Springlake-Earth tourney. The Lock­
ney Landfill cleanup is complete and 
trash hauling will begin today. Athena 
Study Club holds their annual home 
tour. The Hospice Tree of Life project is 
underway at the First National Bank.

Mr. and Mrs. Bert Elam celebrated 
their fiftieth anniversary. The Longhorn 
Varsity basketball team won their Holi­
day Classic tournament for the second 
year in a row. The City Council ap­
proves payment of the landfill bill owed 
to the county. Mr. and Mrs. T. Owen 
Thornton celebrated their fiftieth wed­
ding anniversary. Veronica Blanco was 
awarded an Ethnic Missions Scholar­
ship by the Baptist General Convention.

The second grade at Lockney Ele­
mentary School presented the play 
“Why Chrisunas Trees Are Not Per­
fect”.

The staff of the Lockney Beacon 
would like to take this opportunity to 
wish each and every one of you the very 
best in the year to come!

May you have a Safe 
and Happy New Year!

TAX

KtVIN f l A T f

Si E d w a r d  D . 

415 BALTIMORE

TAX FREE BOND

7.35%

& Co.
293-9551

FLOYDADA
FO R D  I  MERCURY CHRYSLER O adgE

FLOYDADA, TEXAS

We Are Your New
CHR YSl .ER-DODGE

DEALER
and we have 20 new 

Chrysler-Dodges headed this way

SO . .  .WE NEED TO MOVE 
SOME VEHICLES

F - SERIES 
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* Automatic Transmission 
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After

COME SEE US!!
983-3761 763-1234
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Senior Rockin'  s
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MARCH WEDDING SET—^John and Carmaleta Hooten of Lockney wish to 
announce the engagement of their daughter, Symantha to Rex Pinkerton, son 
of Ruby and W ard Pinkerton of Halfway. The bride-elect is a graduate of 
Lockney High School and Pinkerton was graduated from Plainview High 
School. He is currently employed by Jolly Rogers. The couple plan a March 4, 
1989 wedding at Seth W ard Baptist Church in Plainview.

—Portrait by Tim Thompson

Lockney Care Center
By Dianne Galvan

Volunteers! Volunteers! Volunteers! 
We have been blessed with many volun­
teers during this Christmas season here 
at the nursing home. Volunteers bearing 
gifts, fruits and joyous spirits!

We have received lots of beautiful 
poinsettias from Mr. Jimmy Dietrich 
who gifted one to each of the residents 
and which were delivered by his mother. 
Sue Dietrich. Poinsettias for the resi­
dents and staff were also given by 
Lambert Spraying Service, Mrs. Joe 
Burrell, Eleanor and Margaret Schacht 
and by the family of Mrs. Sylvia Yeary.

The residents have also received 
many gifts of fruit, homemade bread, 
cookies and lots more by various groups 
and individuals.
, The ladies of the West Side Church of 
Christ arrived on the ISth to deliver 
Christmas cheer boxes. Those making 
the deliveries were Barbara Cunyus, 
Claudia Belt, Latona Davis, Joanna 
Carthel and Glenna Miller.

Elmo Savage, Alicia Luna and Jerry 
Reyna passed out fruit and gifts to each 
resident a week later compliments of the 
Salvation Army.

Tomas Galvan, Dona Browning and 
Pearl Rattan prepared special treats for 
everyone.

Soila Reyes and grandson, Anthony 
Galvan delivered fruits and gifts on 
Christmas Day given by the Primera 
Iglesia Bautista. Mrs. Nina Teuton 
made four batches of peanut brittle for 
the staff, which was found to be quite 
delicious.

Among some of our gift givers were 
the children’s choir of the First Baptist 
Church who gave lotion, powder, 
houseshoes, socks and handkerchiefs. 
Lanita Cantwell gave to each of the 
gentlemen a red handkerchief and to 
each of the ladies a necklace and for our 
Christmas party she baked several 
batches of cookies.

Christmas carolers have been fre­
quent visitors to our home. We have had 
groups from Turkey Church of Christ, 
West Side Church of Christ, the 4-H

Club and our local Girl Scouts with their 
leaders Pauline Monroe, Bertha Hooten 
and Debbie Galloway. Mrs. Lanita 
Cantwell also donated hair combs and 
socks for the needy residents and the 
kind ladies from Schacht’s gifted Mrs. 
Maria Lopez with some pretty items.

Our Christmas party on the 22nd 
went quite well. We had an excellent 
turnout and everyone seemed to have 
had a nice time. Mr. Terry Westbrook, 
brother of our administrator, Steve, en­
tertained us all with his beautiful sing­
ing. Mrs. Larue Garvin of Silverton 
played the piano for us while we all 
Joined together to sing Christmas carols.

To each and everyone of our volun­
teers we would like to express our sin- 
cerest gratitude for all that each of you 
do for us, not only at Christmastime, but 
throughout the entire year. We love and 
appreciate you and wish you all a very 
joyous holiday season. May God richly 
bless you today and always!

The residents and staff of 
The Lockney Care Center

Lockney 
School Menu

January 3-6
Tuesday:
Breakfast — Cereal, fruit cocktail, 

milk
Lunch — Fried fish, cheese cracker, 

green beans, hot rolls, peaches, milk
Wednesday:
Breakfast — Rolls, eggs, orange, 

milk
Lunch — Sausage, pinto beans, 

combread, tomatoes, fruit cocktail, milk
Thursday:
Breakfast — Oatmeal, milk, pears
Lunch — Italian spaghetti, tossed 

salad, buttered com, roll, milk
Friday:
Breakfast— Apple, toast, eggs, milk
Lunch — Hamburger, tossed salad, 

FreiKh fried potatoes, baked apples, 
graham crackers, milk

James and Myrt Hill spent Christmas 
Eve in Plainview visiting Myrt’s son 
and family, Dickie, Donna, Blake and 
Brent Barton.

Visiting Bertha Rolling Christmas 
Eve were Billy Dan Rolling of Lubbock, 
Mr. and Mrs. H.L. Smith and Crystal of 
Wofford.

Guests in the home of Eddie and 
Embre IDouglas Christmas day were Mr. 
and Mrs. Johnny Belt, Mr. and Mrs. 
Lanny Barnett, Mr. and Mrs. Joey Davis 
and Bertha Rolling, all of Lockney; 
Billy Dan Rolling of Lubbock and Mr. 
and Mrs. H.L. Smith and Crystal of 
Wofford.

Cliff Hardy of Lubbock visited in the 
home of Bertha Rolling Christmas Eve.

BIRTHDAYS
December 31: Bernice Miller 
January 1: Nettie Williams 
January 4: Pat Stansell

ANNIVERSARIES
December 31: Norman and Marguer- 

ita Caldwell
January 3: Loyd and Verna Duvall 
January 4: Paul and Zora Reecer

RECIPE
Everyone has eaten so many sweets 

over Christmas holidays, here’s some­
thing different:

Chili Con Combread 
Chili under a delicious 

layer of combread.
Pour in well greased pan:
2 cans (15 ozs.) chili or4 c. of home­

made chili
1 package of Martha White’s Gladi- 

ola combread, any variety. Mix as di­
rected on package. Add 1 cup grated 
cheese. Pour over chili; bake at 400 
degrees, 30 to 35 minutes. Cool 5 min­
utes. Serves 6 to 8.

NEWS
Saturday night, Dec. 31, 6 p.m. a 

barbecue brisket supper. Please bring 
salad, dessert, or vegetable.

The center will be open Jan. 2 and 
serving meals again. Let’s all back the 
center and have a lot of people to eat 
each day. A lunch will be delivered to 
the participants that are not able to get 
out

BerthaRolling is hostess for January.

Hh-

_____!

olutions

h

A s  time draws 
near we'd like to 

say, "thanks”  
for your business. 

Enjoy the 
year to come.

We will be open till noon 
on Saturday, December 31 
and then we will be closed 
Monday, January 2

Phene 652-3353

Anyone that would volunteer to help 
would be appreciated.

Thursday, Jan. 5, will be potluck 
supper at 6 p.m.

MENU
Jan. 2-6
Monday: Butter beans and ham, cole 

slaw, pickles, onions, combread, cob­
bler, coffee, tea

Tuesday: Roast and gravy, buttered 
com, blackeyed peas, green salad, pud­
ding, roll, tea, coffee

Wednesday: Frosted meatloaf, pinto 
beans, pickles, onions, combread, cake, 
tea, coffee

Thursday: Chicken fried steak, 
gravy, mashed potatoes, green beans, 
tossed salad, cookies, roll, tea, coffee

Friday: Ham, baked potato, mixed 
greens, orange jello with carrots and 
pineapple, brownies, roll, tea, coffee

LOCKNEY

RANDY RACE

LOCKNEY GRADUATE PLAYS 
FOR ENMU-Randy Race, a 1986 
graduate of Lockney High School, 
played football this year for the East­
ern New Mexico University Grey­
hounds in Portales. Race is a 6-1,255 
pound sophomore, is nose guard for 
the Hounds. This was his second year 
to play for ENMU. Randy, a physical 
education major, is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Bill Race of Lockney. The East­
ern New Mexico University Grey­
hound football team is a member of 
the NCAA II Lone Star Conference 
and is under the direction of Don 
Carthel.

/

i

COUPLE ENGAGED—Mr. and Mrs. Andrew Bink of Marsy ville, California, 
wish to announce the engagement of their daughter, Michele Elizabeth Ander­
son to Johnny Chris Johnston, son of Mr. and Mrs. G.B. Johnston of Lockney. 
The couple will exchange vows on January 21,1989 at Cooper Avenue Baptist 
Church in Yuba City, California. Michele is a graduate of Marysville High 
School. She is credit manager for Windsor Door Co. in Sacramento. Johnston 
is a graduate of Lockney High School and Texas Tech University. He is a pilot 
for Northwest Airlines.

Lockney Hospital Report
Dec. 19-26

Ray Hunter, Quitaque, adm. 12-15, 
continues care

Mario Garcia, Floydada, adm. 12-15
Jack Chandler, Quitaque, adm. 12- 

17,dis. 12-21
J.M. Tye, Lockney, adm. 12-17, dis. 

12-22
Ike Gonzales, Lockney, adm. 12-17 

dis. 12-26
Viola Ramos, Plainview, adm. 12- 

19, continues care
Mary Atkins,Plainview, adm. 12-20, 

dis. 12-26
Anita Delgado, Floydada, adm. 12- 

21, baby boy Aurclio, bom 12-21, dis. 
12-23

Janie Ochoa, Roydada, adm. 12-20, 
baby girl Jessica, bom 12-20

lllin

iSt

J /

--X./

GOLDEN ANNIVERSARY—Mr. and Mrs. W. Dale Lacewell of Plainview 
will celebrate their golden wedding anniversary on Saturday, Dec. 31, with a 
reception from 2:00 until 4:00 p.m. at their home, 511 Portland. The reception 
is hosted by their children and their spouses, M ark and Lauretta Langley of 
Idaho Falls, Idaho; Randy and Sharon Lacewell of Norman, Oklahoma; and 
Ron and Jane Lacewell of Bryan, Texas. Their friends are cordially invited. 
The former Maysel Terrell and Dale were m arried on January 1,1939. They 
lived in the Irick community from 1945 to 1965. The Lacewells have eight 
grandchilren and are retired from farming.

Texas unemployment rate down
“Unemployment rates are down 

again in Texas and both business and 
labor are beginning to breathe a little 
easier,” said Commissioner Mary Scott 
Nabers of the Texas Employment 
Commission.

Statistics just released show that the 
statewide unemployment rate is 6.6% - 
down from 6.8% last month. “While 
statewide statistics show only a small 
decline,” Nabers said, “at least we are 
headed in the right direction. This is the 
third consecutive month of a declining 
statewide rate and the figures even look 
better when we remember that the rate 
was 7.9% this time last year,” Nabers 
concluded.

In mid-November 1988 there were 
551,000 jobless Texans. That compares 
with the 650,000 plus that were out of 
work a year ago.

Almost all of the 27 Metropolitan 
Statistical Areas for which data are cur­
rently available mirrored the statewide 
trend in unemployment, with rates fall­
ing slightly in November. Rates in two 
MSA’s were unchangedover the month, 
and one (Wichita Falls) rose slightly 
from October to November.

Bryan-College Station continued to 
record the lowest rate in November, 
with a 4.1% rate which was its lowest 
since April of this year. Lubbock had the 
second-lowest rate, at 4.5%. Three 
MSA’s had a rate of 5.3% - Austin, 
Dallas and Midland.

Highest rates continued to be along

the border, with McAllen-Edinburg- 
Mission leading, at 15.9% in mid-No­
vember. Laredo’s rate was 11.6%; 
Brownsville-Harlingen had a rate of 
11.1%; and El Paso’s rate was 10.2%. 
These were the only MSA’s with rates 
above 10% in November.

Look
Who's
New

QUISENBERRY
Tammie and David Quisenberry of 

Sudan are proud to announce the birth of 
their son, Nathan Dean, bom at 10:29 
p.m. Tuesday, Dec. 20, at Methodist 
Hospital in Lubbock. He weighed 8 lbs. 
9 ozs. and was 21 inches long.

Nathan has two sisters, Sarah Eliza­
beth, 3 -1 /2 years old, and Leah Rebecca, 
2.

Grandparents are Denny and Johnnie 
Quisenberry of Lockney and Jerry and 
Mary Beth McKibber of Tahoka.

Great-grandparents are J.W. and 
Mary Francis Gardenhire of O’Donnell 
and Eldred and Velma Bonner of Lock­
ney.

w p i m

Nielsen
Electronic & Repair

(Fqrm friy  M ite

102 S. Main 652-2435
General Electronic Rejpalr 

TV’s-VCRs 
Service calls in town 

or out town 
8t00 - 6:00 M-F S;3O-I2j00 Set,

Pedro Regalado, Petersburg, adm. 
12-20, continues care 

Wade Steele, Silverton, adm. 12-20, 
continues care

Gladys Fewell, Lockney, adm. 12- 
22, continues care

R.W. Landrum, Lockney, adm. 12- 
21, continues care

Bette Minter, Lockney, adm. 12-25, 
continues care

Christy Palmore, Plainview, adm. 
12-24, baby girl Amber, bom 12-24, dis. 
12-26

Toribio Rodriguez, Lockney, adm, 
12-23, continues care 

Roseann Martinez, Silverton, adm. 
12-26, continues care

Debbie Cagle, Quitaque, adm. 12-25, 
continues care

SCHACHT FLOWERS AND GIFTS 
will be closed Friday and Saturday, 

December 30 and 31.

CHRISTMAS
MERCHANDISE

will be H 2  price
January 2 through January 7

SCHTLCHO
Tlofitn,

112 W. Poplar 652-2385
8:30to5i30

Monday - Saturday Q T 5
“ Our pleasure la to serve you.”  ^avtSTi ' '
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Kimble and Bridges pledge marriage promises

M RS. STACY K EY  BRIDGES 
Photo by R Photography

Sorority has ornament and gift exchange

The 240ih meeting of Texas Alpha 
Mu Della #9314 was called to order by 
President Brenda Hellin at 6 p.m. on 
Tuesday, Dec. 20, in the home of Tami 
Wofford. Roll was called with two ex­
cused absences. Minutes from theprevi- 
ous meeting were read and approved.

The group received their insurance 
policy from International. Easter Seals 
has sent a letter wanting them to donate 
money and lime to the Easter Seals 
Telethon but they have found that the 
telethon has been cancelled in Lubbock.

Look Who^s New!
MILLER
Erika, Laura and Rachel Miller wish 

to announce the birth of their brother, 
Mathew Jay. He was bom December 12 
at Lockney General Hospital at 3:16 
p.m. He weighed 8 lbs. 10-1/2 ozs. and 
was 20-1/2 inches long.

His parents are Mr. an d ^ rs . Hugh 
Jay Miller of Roydada.

Grandparents arc Maudinc Miller of 
Floydada and Mr. and Mrs. Harvey 
Burke of Plainview.

Grcal-grandparcnls arc E.W. 
McMillin of Plainview and Roy 
Mathews of Bangs.

The treasurer’s report was given with 
two ousianding bills and one oulsuind- 
ing check that is written to the Floyd 
County Child Welfare Board in the 
amount of S250.(X).

The group had their annual ornament 
and gift exchange so there was no desig­
nated program. The next meeting will be 
at Kay Brock’s at 6:30 p.m. They will be 
donating their check to Mrs. Wesley on 
Thursday at 2:00 p.m.

There being no further business the 
meeting was adjourned with all Joining 
hands for the mi/.pah. They llicn pre­
ceded with ornament exchange and then 
opened gifts. Everyone received gifts 
from their sisters.

Hostesses for the evening were Tami 
•Wofford and Dora Ross. They served 
baked potatoes with queso dip and 
salad, chocolate cake and iced tea. 
Tammy Wilson also brought some 
homemade delicious fudge.

Those in attendance were: Dara 
Ware, Brenda Heflin, Shcrese Coving­
ton, Sidney Jackson, Dora Ross, 
Melanie and Taylor Bccdy, Tammy 
Wilson, Tami Wofford, Kay Brock, 
Dana Pyle, Julie James, Sandra 
Schwcrlncr, Cindy Fortenberry and Jan 
Bccdy.

Nancy Susan Kimble and Stacy Key 
Bridges were united in marriage at Saint 
Luke’s United Methodist Church in 
Lubbock on Saturday, Dec. 17, at 7:00 
in the evening. The sanctuary of the 
church was decorated with red jxtinset- 
tias wrapped in white paper and adorned 
with emerald green bows. White satin 
bows were hung on all of the pews up the 
center aisle. The couple stood at the top 
of a flight of stairs in front of a 20-lighl 
candelabra arch and two 15-light spirals 
which were decorated with silk holly 
greenery and large red satin bows.

At the bottom of the stairs, on each 
side, were seven-light candelabra 
arches decorated with silk holly green­
ery and red satin bows. These candles 
were lit by Erin Rourkc, cousin of the 
bride, of Shaker Heights, Ohio, and 
Kelley Crozicr, younger brother of the 
bride, of Monahans, Texas.

The couple arc the children of John 
Kimble 11 of New Mexico, Mrs. Kenny 
Crozicr of Monahans, Rex Bridges and 
Mrs. Bill Daniels, bolhofLubbcKk.Thc 
bride is the granddaughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Wilson M. Fowler and Mrs. John 
Kimble, all of Floydada.

Traditional vows for the double ring 
ceremony were read by the Reverend 
Earl Blair of the United Methodist 
Church. Musical selections for the cere­
mony were presented by JoAnn Hanson 
of Lubbock on the piano and Beverly 
Eubanks of Lubbock on the organ.

Music before the ceremony included 
Silent Night, Holy Night for the lighting 
of the candles and The Wedding Song 
which was performed by Mrs. David 
Bailey of Floydada. The bridesmaids 
entered to the hymn Jesu, Ode of Man’s 
Desiring and the bride followed with the 
processional of Trumpet Voluntair on 
the organ and piano. After the couple 
exchanged rings, Mrs. David Baltcy 
performed The Wedding Prayer and 
then the couple and wedding party ex­
ited to the recessional of Joyful, Joyful 
We Adore Thee.

Given in marriage by her grandfa­
ther, WiLson M. Fowler of Floydada, the 
bride wore a magnificent gown styled of 
while crystalline and designed by San 
Martin of Beverly Hills. It had a bateau 
neckline edged in lace and pearls, and 
had short cap sleeves of multi-rows of 
ruffles with while satin rosebuds at the 
shoulders. The long-line fitted satin 
bodice was designed with a basque 
waistline, overlaid with appliques of 
lace embroidered in pearls and ir- 
ridcsccnt sequins. The back of the bod­
ice was cut in a low V neckline, and had 
a large satin candy box bow with satin 
roses on it at the waistline. Chantilly 
lace outlined the low V neckline in the 
back. The flowing skin had appliques of 
embroidered lace and pearls, and two 
ruffles of the crystalline were at the 
bottom in front, and topping the rufllcs 
was a row of embroidered lace, coming 
up to points at the sides where a satin 
rosebud was featured over a tiny cas­
cade of ruffles. A cascade of ruffles of 
the crystalline began at the waistline in 
the back and swept down the full cathe­
dral length u-ain.

The bride wore a tapered illusion veil 
with .seven beaded poufs. The headpiece 
came down to a point and was adorned 
with handsewn irridc-sccnl sequins and 
pearls. The left side of the headpiece had 
three satin rosebuds and long sprays of 
lilly of the valley. The veil was designed 
especially for the bride by her mother. 
The bride carried a cascade bouquet of 
white satin roses and lace leaves ac­
cented with sprays of red silk babies 
breath, irridcscenl pearls and beading, 
and backed with white bridal satin 
streamers and narrow sU'ands of red 
bridal satin. She al.so wore opera length 
while satin gloves and two triple-rope 
pearl bracelets over the left glove.

The Palace
118 West California 983-3005 

After Christmas

112 price sale

We have a good selection of 
VALENTINE 'S available

For something old, the bride had a 
silk handkerchief pinned to her bouquet 
which belonged to her great-grand­
mother and her grandmother, Mrs. John 
Kimble. Something new was the bride’s 
attire and pearl and diamond earrings 
given to her as a gift from the groom. 
Something blue was the bride’s garter. 
She wore two 1966 pennies in her shoe 
for good luck.

Attending the bride as matron of 
honor was Mrs. Thomas Rourke, aunt of 
the bride, of Shaker Heights, Ohio. 
Bridesmaids were Shannon Phillips of 
Duncanville and Laura Esquivel of 
Dallas. They wore emerald green ir- 
ridcsccnt taffeta floor-length dresses 
and opera length black satin gloves. 
They carried while silk irridescenl poin- 
setlias accented by glittered red and 
green ling ting and lied with while bridal 
lace, red and gold satin.

Acting as flower girl was Carly 
Rourkc, cousin of the bride, of Shaker 
Heights, Ohio. She wore a tea length 
dress of emerald irridcscenl taffeta that 
fell into a scalloped bubble skirt. Erin 
Rourkc, who acted as a candlclightcr, 
wore an identical dress.

Jason Kimble, younger brother of the 
bride, served as the ring bearer and wore 
black tails and while accessories.

Acting as bc.sl man was Ken Files of 
Lubbock. Groomsmen were Kceley 
Ferguson, cousin of the groom, of Fort 
Worth and David Bosquez of Lubbock. 
Seating guests were ushers Jim Kimble, 
brother of the bride, of Lubbock; Gerald 
Ward, brother-in-law of the groom, of 
Lubbock; Tony Rotondo of Houston; 
and Kevin McCoy of Lubbock. All of 
the men in the wedding party wore black 
tails and white accessories.

A reception following the ceremony 
was held at Hillcrcst Country Club in 
Lubbock and was given by Mr. and Mrs. 
Wilson M. Fowler, grandparents of the 
bride. Mrs. Marly Covington of 
Floydada registered guests names in a 
white satin wedding album decorated 
with tiny red satin roses which the 
bride’s mother made for the occasion.

The bride’s table was highlighted 
with a three tiered red velvet cake with 
cream cheese icing. The cake was 
adorned with while icing roses and satin 
string work effect and was topped with 
fresh white roses accented with red and 
gold lushes, backed with bridal tule, 
babies breath, and Christmas greenery. 
Also served were red satin punch and 
while chocolate mints with red or green 
omamenlalion on them. Presiding at the 
bride’s table was Mrs. Jeff Bertrand of 
Floydada.

The groom’s table served a light 
chocolate double-heart cake decorated 
with dark and while chocolate roses and 
monogrammed with an Old Engl ish “B” 
which stood for the groom ’ s in ilial. Also 
served was apple bundl cake, mints and 
coffee. Serving at the groom’s table was 
Leslie McBride of Pampa.

Another table featured assorted fin­
ger sandwiches, shrimp cheese ball and 
crackers, and was decorated with red 
poinscllias wrapped in gold foil and two 
si nglc gold and crystal candlesticks with 
red candles. All of the tables featured 
gold serving pieces and were decorated 
with large Christmas arrangements 
made of gold leaves and holly greenery.

Maria Ochoa
is now working at 

Maya's Beauty Shop 
for your needs 
in Manicures, 
Haircuts, etc.

Call for an Appointment
983-5251

Walk-ins Welcome Open Saturday.

The guests were seated at round tables 
decorated with Christmas centerpieces 
that had a red candle in them.

Red and white satin roses filled with 
rice were displayed in large white bas­
kets handpainted with holly greenery 
and decorated with red velvet bows and 
babies breath.

JoAnn Hanson of Lubbock played 
selections of Christmas music and eve­
ning music on the piano throughout the 
reception.

For their departure on a honeymoon 
to Cancun, the bride wore an after five 
dress that was a black silk top which 
flowed into a white taffeta bubble skirt 
and was accented with a large black bow 
trimmed in rhinestones at the waist. The 
couple will be residing in Lubbock fol­
lowing their return.

PRE-N U PTIA L C O U R TESIES

MCKINNEYS HONORED—Mr. and Mrs. James McKinney and daughter, 
Deborah honored their parents, Mr. and Mrs. John McKinney with a recep­
tion on their 50th wedding anniversary Dec. 24 in the home of Mrs. Elizabeth 
Armstrong. The former Lorena Denison and .lohn McKinney exchanged 
wedding vows Dec. 24, 1938 in Floydada.

J and B Variety
All Clothing 2 5 %  off 

through GRAND OPENING

Come and see our variety of custom T-Shirts, 
Sweatshirts, Jewelry, Children’s Jeans, 

Western Shirts and Custom Hats.
Much More

We will customize Shirts for your Basketball and 
Baseball Teams - Order Early for Best Selection

208 South Main (Next to Thompson’s)

The bride was formerly honored with 
a shower on Sunday, November 13 in 
the home of Mrs. Garland Hoover of 
Lubbock. Hostesses for the event were 
Miss Shannon Phillips and Miss Kathy 
Means. She was also honored with a 
shower on Saturday, November 19 in 
the home of Mrs. C.E. Leathcrman of 
Floydada. Hostesses for the event were 
Mmes. Fred Marble, Jeff Bertrand, 
Weldon Pruitt, Louis Lloyd, Jerry Perry, 
Jerry Bailey, Melvin Lloyd, Jim 
Simpson, W.L. Davis, Connie Bearden, 
Pcle Hickerson, Marty Covington, Jerry 
Cannon, Howard Gregory and Mrs. 
Doris McLain.

The bride was honored with a lunch­
eon on Saturday, Dec. 3, at noon at the 
Plainview Country Club. Mrs. Fred 
Cardinal, Mrs. William Slaniforth and 
Barbara Barnard hosted the event.

>:.A

COUPLE MARRIES—Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Perry, F'loydada, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Mike HarrLson, Lockney, wish to announce the marriage of their chil­
dren, Tana Gaye Perry and Clayton Doyle Harrison on December 17, at the 
home of the bride’s parents. The bride Ls a May ’87 graduate of Floydada High 
School and attended South Plains College in Levelland. Harrison is a 1988 
graduate of L<Kkney High School and also attended South Plains College. The 
couple will reside in Lockney.

Start the new year right at
Billie's

Hairstyling for the entire family
210 West Houston 

983-2130
Billie will be returning to the salon on January 3

V

1-10x13
(W a ll  P h o t o )

8x10 
5x7 
3x5

King Size Wallets 
Regular Size Wallets

30
Color

Photos

904 Deposit 
$10.00 Due at 

Pick up
(plus tax)

Q99
WE USE 

KODAK PAPER

SHOP RITE
309 South Wall 

Thursday, January  5 
PHOTO HOURS: 9 - 7

Group charge 
99* per person

PAPER
.lor a Good Look

FOR CREA TIVE COLOR POR TRAITS

W e
u s e
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Floydada Nursing Home Happenings
By Jo  Bryant

Hi, must say that we really enjoyed 
all the people who came and shared 
some of the holiday joys with us.

Monday, Irene Wexler came and 
played some Christmas hymns for us. 
Bro. Bill Wright shared from Luke the 
birth of Jesus, he talked about the sign, 
being of love. At 2:30, the residents 
shared and had popcorn.

Tuesday, Bro. Neeley and Zelma 
came and brought some bananas and 
shared the word of the birth of Jesus. At 
2 p.m. the third grade class came and 
sang some carols for the residents. 
Thanks children.

Wednesday Bro. Sammy came and 
we sang some songs, and he shared the 
birth of Jesus taken from Matt. At 2 p.m. 
the residents played bingo, Ottis 
Johnson had the First bingo. Mary Alice 
came and helped and brought the resi­
dents some cookies.

Thursday, Helen Lipham came and 
played the banjo for us. At 2 p.m. the 
residents listened to some carols and 
talked about how they used to spend 
Christmas, as a kid, or child, and in their 
early years. Thanks go out to the Bible 
Baptist Church for the bags of fruit for 
the residents.

Friday the ladies of the First Baptist 
Church came and shared. Mrs. Nettie 
Adams came and told the Christmas 
story from memory. She and Letha

Mulder also brought some cookies. 
Letha opened with a prayer. Evelyn 
played the piano.

We want to thank Moore-Rose- 
White Funeral Home for the huge apples 
and oranges.

Tuesday we had our annual staff 
party. We had a delicious meal of ham 
and all the trimmings, exchange of gifts 
and played Bingo. Thanks Jim and 
Sandra Crawford for the ham.

This week’s visitors were: Frank 
Breed, H.C. and Marge McElyea, David 
and Jan Campbell, Delwin and Winona 
Brooks, Paducah; Frances and Peck 
Badgett, Tina Verona, Doug Wolford, 
Michael, Angela Verona, Angelita 
Reynolds, Mel and Marjorie Holcomb, 
Ray Holcomb, Tommy, Carol and Ch- 
elsey Holcomb, Chris Holcomb, Myria 
Dade, Morris Keele and Holly and 
Tammy Holcomb, Travis and Gladys 
Jones, Joe, Anne, Juradee and Tate 
Jones, Emily, Kathy, Lychells, Don, 
Shelia Troy, Misty Faulkenberry, 
Shirley Kirkland, Nancy and Dwayne 
Myrick, Grand Prairie; Mr. and Mrs. 
Glen White. Sally and Jessica Arnold, 
Willie Galloway and Betty, Dwayla 
Myrick, Phillip Wilson. Rudolph and 
Iva McCurdy, Opal Kratzer, Willie Mae 
Smith, May Sue, Dana Scott Galloway, 
Rev. Sammy Rodriquez, Paula Bryant, 
Brainerd, Minnesota; Nila and Jack Ball 
and sons, Cody, Johnathan and Brian, 
Plainview.

Alpha Sigma Upsilon holds 
Christmas party Dec. 20

By Karen Elliott
Alpha Sigma Upsilon met in the 

home of Karen Elliott Dec. 20 at 6:30 
p.m. President Mitzi Nixon called the 
meeting to order with all members 
standing for opening rituals. Roll was 
called and minutes of the previous 
meeting were read and approved. Jodie 
McGuire gave the treasurer’s report 
New business was discussed.

There being no further business the 
meeting was adjourned with all mem­
bers standing for closing rituals and 
mizpah.

After our meeting we were joined by 
our husband’s for our Christmas party 
and we all enjoyed a wonderful Christ­
mas meal prepared by all members. 
After supper Secret Sisters and their 
husband’s exchanged gifts. A spectacu­
lar time was had by all during this spe­
cial time of year.

Those present were the following 
members and their husband’s Karen 
Elliott Rhonda Guthrie, Sheryl LeCroy, 
Jodie McGuire, Mitzi Nixon, Judy 
Schacht, Sheri Tumbow, Brenda Ward, 
Hope Warren, Sara Coursey, Dana 
Brown and Robbie Odom.

Rebekahs meet for regular session
By Artie Webb

On Tuesday night, Dec. 20, Floydada 
Rcbekah Lodge met for a regular ses­
sion. Kathy Green, Noble Grand, and 
Ruth Gilliland, vice grand, presided.

The Noble Grand opened lodge and 
the sick were reported on. Kathy 
Green’s niece in California was improv­
ing. Fay Hart has been back in a Lub­
bock hospital but is better.

A short business session was held. 
Then Kathy, Noble Grand, presented 
each member with a beautiful little

Christmas stocking she had crocheted 
herself with a candy cane inside. Every­
one thought they were beautiful.

Lodge then closed for a snack s u i^ r  
with all the Christmas goodies.

A program was delited because 
Kathy had a class to teach at 6:30 Tues­
day night

Everyone enjoyed visiting and recall­
ing old Christmases they had enjoyed in 
the past Goodbye was said by everyone 
wishing them a Merry Christmas and a 
Happy New Year.

CARPORTS & PATIO COVERS

Protect Year Aoto, Vaa or RV Fron HbH & S m  Damage 
Fimuuing ArmitahUl

7105 Oltoa Rd., Drawer 369, Plainview,Tx. 
Call Now: 1-M6-293-9526E U X

Senior Citizens News

COUPLE MARKS 50 YEARS—Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Lawson celebrated their 
50th wedding anniversary Saturday with a dinner prepared by their grand­
children at the home of their son. They were also honord guests at a party Dec. 
3. Lawson and the former Queen Annie Powell were married Dec. 24,1938 in 
Crosbyton. Their children are Dale Lawson of Floydada, and a daughter and 
son-in-law, Carol and Dale Redd of Weatherford and Five grandchildren.

—Photo by R Photography

WELFARE BOARD RECEIVES DONATION -  Brenda Heflin, left, presi­
dent of Alpha Mu Delta Sorority, is pictured with Shalane Wesley of the Floyd 
County Child Welfare Board as the club's donation to the welfare board was 
presented. The local club contributed $250 to the community effort to insure 
that all children in the custody of the board would have a nice Christmas.

Staff Photo

Letters to The Editor

By Thelma Jones
Wishing everyone a luqjpy and pros­

perous new year in 1989.
The seniors offer their sympathy to 

the family of Wamie Hilton. He was our 
oldest senior citizen. He was 106 years 
old.

We still have a lot of sickness among 
our group. Kate Crabtree, Rebecca 
Smith, Myria Dade, Peggy Medley 
doing very well. Haven’t heard from 
others.

Mrs. Ethel Warren spent Christmas 
with her son, Johnny Lynn and family in 
Lubbock.

The Harvey Tardy’s had their son, 
Harvey Dale and Nancy, Larry and 
family, Joel and family of Lubbock and 
Todd Tardy and wife of Dallas visiting 
them during the holidays.

Mattie Wester had a lot of company. 
Her son and family from Shallowatcr 
were here. He also visited his sister, 
Mrs. Watson Jones and Watson.

Mr. and Mrs. B. Hatley had a lot of 
company also during the holidays. They 
visited Rebecca Smith Sunday after­
noon.

Mary Smith and Sue Mahon spent 
Christmas in Petersburg with their sis­
ters and Mary’s daughter, Mrs. Paul 
Willis.

Mrs. Nettie Adams had as her guest 
her son, Boone Adams and wife and 
other relatives Christmas Day.

Senior Citizens 
Menu

Jan. 2-6
Monday: Liver or beef patty/crcole 

sauce, mashed potatoes with milk, green 
beans, yeast roll, margarine or butter, 
peach cobbler, milk

Tuesday: Baked ham, sweet potato, 
peas, whole wheat bread, margarine or 
butter, applesauce, milk

Wednesday: Enchiladas/chile sauce, 
pinto beans, carrot and raisin salad, 
combread, margarine or butter, choco­
late pudding, milk

Thursday: Chicken fried steak/ 
gravy, mashed potatoes/milk, Italian 
vegetables, pickles, hot whole wheal 
roll, margarine or butter, peaches, milk

Friday: Oven baked chicken/gravy, 
mashed potatoes/milk, spinach, cran­
berry sauce, toasted bun sticks, marga­
rine or butter, banana bread squares, 
milk

Dear Editor,
This letter is to the people of Floyd 

County and I’ll begin by saying I hope 
none of you have to transport your sick 
mother, a sick child or a sick daddy from 
Methodist Hospital or nursing home by 
ambulance from Floydada.

On Dec. 19th we had to bring our 
mother from Lubbock to the nursing 
home. It fell my lot to ride with her.

It was cold and windy and the wind 
whistles through the cracks. The person 
responsible for the patient can’t com­
municate because of the noise the dows 
rattle and it reminded me of a ride in an 
iron wheel wagon, when I was a child. 
This old ambulance is a disgrace to our 
community. We are a fairly affluent 
community and we do about what we 
want to.

I beg all of you, the commissioners, 
the city, the churches, study clubs and 
right down the line to individual fami­
lies to help in a campaign county-wide.

Let’s please buy an ambulance be­
fore your poor old sick mother has to 
ride in this one.

WESTERN TEXAS COLLEGE Spring 1989

REGISTRATION: Crosbyton Extension
COURSE COMP# COURSE DAYS PERIOD CREDIT HOURS INSTRUCTOR LAB FEE

Bk). 247 890 Microbiology T 6:30-9:20 04 Bennett
Lab Th 6:00-10:00 Bennett

Eng. 131 888 Composition 1 M 6:30-9:20 03 Stair
Lab (1 hour ) TBA TBA Staff

Eng. 231 889 American Lit T 6:30-9:20 03 Staff
His. 132 886 US His 1865 TH 6:30-9:20 03 Durham
Spc. 131887 Fund/Speech TH 6:30-9:20 03 McCathern

FOR INFORMATION: Fred Crawford
806/675-2611

REGISTRATION: Monday, January 9 
HIGH SCHOOL 11:00 a.m. -1:00 p.m.

2:30 p.m. - 5:30 p.m.
6:30 p.m. - 7:30 p.m.

COST: 3 hours $83.00 plus lab fees and books
6 hours $131.00 plus lab fees and books

MASTERCARD and VISA accepted 
Classes Begin: January 18 Classes End: May 10
Last Day to Register: January 24 Last Day to Drop: March 3 

FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION ON EXTENSIONS: Western Texas College 
ADULT EDUCATION & EXTENSION SERVICES DIVISION 

South College Avenue,. Snyder, Texas, 79549 915/573-8511, Ext. 240^90

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Alldredge had all 
of their children and grandchildren 
home for Christmas.

Mrs. Earl Baker spent the Christmas 
with her daughter in Ralls.

Myrtle Switzer spent Christmas in 
Plainview with her niece, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bill Hood in Plainview.

Mr. and Mrs. Clay Henry had their 
daughter and family with them during 
the holidays.

Mr. and Mrs. Lyndell Spears of Dal­
las arc here visiting her mother, Mrs. 
W.M. Spears.

Mr. Pat Shelby of Ralls came and got 
his mother, Myria Dade for Christmas.

Mr. and Mrs. Dock Botkin had their 
son and family and daughter and family 
home for Christmas.

Mrs. W J. Wilks’ granddaughter 
from Carlsbad, New Mexico, spent 
Christmas with her.

Mrs. Snow Drop Gant and Josh of 
SpringField, Missouri, spent Christmas
with her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
Dunn.

Mrs. Beady Owens has had alol of 
company during the holidays.

Mrs. Deeota Odam spent Christmas 
in Hale Center with her daughter, Vir­
ginia Waits and family.

Mrs. Valrcc Turner has had a lot of 
company during the holidays. I>orman 
and wife of Hobbs were here.

Alma Smith and Thelma Jones spent 
Christmas Day with their niece, Mr. and 
Mrs. Bobby Caldwell and family and 
stopped in Idalou and visited with their 
nephew, Bobbie George Smith and 
family. Mrs. Earl Pierce was there also.

1 am sure there is a lot more news but 
haven’t been able to get them as the lines 
were busy or didn’t answer.

Signed
Mac & Marjorie McElyea

Dear Editor,
This writing will be different to my 

usual writings I have often wanted to 
write a personal letter to the Editor and 
this seems to be the time to do just that.

First I want to give credit to the whole 
Hesperian staff for a remarkable edition 
in letting the letter writers, Santa Claus 
writers give their views on the subject 
and meaning of Christmas. To me it was 
extra good and very interesting reading, 
and I am sure it will be inspiring and 
thought-provoking to many that read the 
articles.

The Editors and staff have been very 
good and kind to me over the years I 
have written pieces about old times. I 
never had a chance to learn typing and I 
am sure the ones getting my writings 
ready for printing have had their pa­
tience tried to the limit I had a sttoke in 
the past that affected my right hand. I 
hope the Hesperian will permit me to 
keep writing. Many thanks to all of you 
for past favors. May I express my sym­
pathy to Mr. Towery for his recent mis­
fortune knowing he will take them with 
courage and faith as most of us try to do.

May we all have a Happy and Pros­
perous New Year.

Yours sincerely. 
Will Martin

FLOYD DATA
Mrs. J.C. Odam spent Saturday 

through Monday in Hale Center in the 
home of her daughter, Stanley and Vir­
ginia Waits.

Others visiting in the home during the 
time and enjoying a bountiful Christmas 
and a gift exchange from a beautifully 
decorated tree were: Debra Rushing, 
Christy, Angie and Michael of Plain- 
view, John Waits, Irving; Kerry and 
Elaine Siewert and Leah, Tony and 
Karen Rastettcr and Josh, San Angelo; 
Gary and Cathy Hill, Jeremy and Candy, 
Lockney; Odessa Cage and Jackie 
Burch of Lubbock. Also James and Jana 
Gage and baby of Lubbock visited 
briefly Sunday afternoon.

Inventory
Tax

Clearance
Sale!

And Here Are Some 
Great Reasons To Buy Now!

WE MUST REDUCE INVENTORY TAXES!
So we don’t have to pay outrageous inventory 
taxes on January First, we're making the best 
deals all year on every new Oldsmobile in stock!

SAVE UP T 0 1500
o r  get 3 .9%  F in an c in g

Member.

Oldsmobile Dealers

ODEN CHEVROLET - OLDS
)lti 221 S. Main 983-3787

• Y«i n M  1 ^  " j a  <kl«.nr h n i  <>m I«  fUck bMwMo Nooenbat JO and Daoamln J1, 19M OMAC financio. lalaa 
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4th Calvary seeking donations 
to march in Inaugural Parade
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The Calvary is coming! The Calvary 
is coming!! The Cavalry is coming to 
Washington, D.C. by special invitation 
to inarch in the 1989 Bush Inaugural 
Parade.

The most pressing need at this time is 
the large funds needed by January 15, to 
finance the trip for the 20+ men and their 
horses. Without sufficient funds this 
trip will not be possible.

The invitation to participate in the 
parade commemoitating the inaugura­
tion of President-elect George Bush, 
came about through the efforts of Con­
gressman Larry Combest, Texas Rail­
road Commissioner Kent Hance, and 
United States Senator Phil Gramm.

Working with members of the Lub­
bock-based cavalry, Gramm, Combest 
and Hance contacted Mr. Bush’s Inau­
gural Committee about the unit and 
secured the invitation.

“The 4th U.S. Cavalry Regiment 
Memorial is an educational organiza­
tion which reenacts South Plains history 
for the benefit of schools, community 
celebrations, and special events,” Hance 
told the committee. “I believe this non­
profit military reenactment organiza­
tion will certainly enhance the day’s 
activities.”

Sergeant Thomas expressed the 
group’s excitement when he said this 
was the biggest thing which has hap­
pened to the unit. “We’ll have 10 to 20 
mounted troops in the parade,” he said. 
“The major hurdle facing us is funding 
to get to Washington and back. We also 
need to know if anyone in the area has 
some dark colored horses, 14 to IS 
hands, which they would loan us for this 
parade.”

The 4th Cavalry was organized in 
1985 for the purpose of contributing to 
the education of the people of this area 
on the Indian Wars period of our history 
(1869-1876).

The 4th Calvary has the support of the 
Lubbock Chamber of Commerce and is 
seeking the financial sup|X)rt of the 
businesses and individuals in the West

Texas region. It would be a shame for 
the people of this area to miss out on this 
powerful opportunity to be represented 
on the national scale by such a unit as the 
4th Calvary because of lack of funds, 
stated Congressman Combest.

“We are a reenactment group that is 
dedicated specifically to the period of

time when Colonel Ranald S. Mack­
enzie and his 4th Calvary actually 
operated in this area,” said Major Larry 
Goldston, adjutant/executive officer of 
the regiment. “All of our uniforms, 
equipment, weapons and saddle gear are 
period replicas or authentic antiques. 
We pride ourselves in recreating the 
trooper as he actually was and not as he 
has been portrayed by artists and the 
movies.”

Because the group is registered as a 
non-profit organization, it relies on 
membership dues and tax-deductable 
donations of cash as well as horses and 
equipment. “We need horses,” Major 
Goldston said. ‘There may be some 
people who have horses which they are 
not using. They might realize more out 
of their horses by donating them than 
they could by selling them; with the 
assurance that the mounts would be well 
cared for and would be providing a 
useful service. We will even come get 
them.”

He also stated the 4th Cavalry will 
accept donations of wagons, horse 
drawn ambulances, weapons and saddle 
equipment, the donors will be given a 
receipt for their tax purposes.

Lieutenant Colonel Robert Marlett, 
commander of the regiment, said the 4th 
Cavalry has a place for everyone. “We 
realize that nothing wOTthwhile ever 
gets accomplished by limiting partici­
pation to a few,” He said. “We welcome 
all to come join and share in the thrill.” 
LTC Marlett said it is not mandatory to 
own a horse, and a member will be 
advised by the board or standards the 
method of obtaining the correct items.

4TH CALVARY REGIMENT

We Salute...
HAPPY BIRTHDAY
Thursday, Dec. 29: Carlos Arellano, 

Jesse S uarez. Amber Ford, Julie Ellison, 
Shelly Van Cleve

Friday, Dec. 30: Jaynette Hamson, 
Elvin Jones, Bill Starkey

Saturday, Dec. 31: Ricky Gonzalez
Sunday, Jan. 1: Jim Green, Samuel 

Segura Sr.
Monday, Jan. 2: Kristie Reyes, Eve­

lyn Sparks, Zan Daniels, Fleecy Ham- 
bright

Tuesday, Jan. 3: Garry Peel, Tiffany 
Bennett, Martina Barrera

Wednesday, Jan, 4: Brenda Perez, 
Jennifer Trevino, Ashley Norrell

HAPPY ANNIVERSARY
Friday, Dec. 30: Roy and Sheri Turn- 

bow
Sunday, Jan. 1: Mr. and Mrs. Bonifa­

cio Cuevas
Wednesday, Jan. 4: Doyle and 

Dorothy Turner

FEDELA NUNCIO
Services for Fedela Nuncio, 66, of 

Lockney were held on Wednesday, 
December 28 at 2:00 p.m. in San Jose 
Catholic Church with Rev, Jack Gist 
officiating. Assisting was Deacon Joe 
Garcia of San Jose Catholic Church. 
Burial followed in Lockney Memorial 
C«mctary under the direction of Moore- 
Rosc-White Funeral Home. Nuncio 
died December 26 in the Lockney Care 
Center.

Bom Fedela Alcarez on April 24, 
1922 in Pecos, she was married to Nick 
Nuncio and moved to Floyd County 
from Pecos in 1960 was a housewife 
and was a member of the Catholic 
Church.

Survivors include a daughter, Susie 
Nuncio of Lockney, two sisters, Maria 
Nuncio of Lockney and Carmen Agui­
lar of Brady, two brothers, Manuel 
Alcarez of St. Johns, Michigan and 
Raymond Alcarez of California.

Pall bearers were Felix Nuncio Jr., 
Domingo Nuncio, Joe Nuncio, Isabelo 
Gonzales Jr„ Eddie Garza and Paul 
Serna.

CHURCH DIRECTOR Y

tVttrr H<-arin;! ’niniuf."h Carr

Beltone of Lubbock 
2821 74th St. 

Lubbock, TX 79423 
Phone 745-7878

CEDAR HILL ASSEMBLY 
OF GOD

Rev. H.D. Morton J r., P u to r
Sunday School 10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m.
Evangelistic Service 6:00 p.m.
Wednesday Evening 

Bible Study 8:00 p.m.

LOCKNEY LATIN ASSEMBLY 
OF GOD

Rev: Juan Herrera
Sunday School 9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m.
Evening Worship 5:00 p.m.
Prayer Service - Friday 7:30 p.m.
' Corner of Washington and 

1st Street 
652-2181

SPANISH ASSEMBLY OF GOD 
TEMPLO GETSEMANI 

308 Mlaalaalppl
Samuel Rodriguez, Pastor 

Sunday School 10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m.
Evening Evangelistic 

Service 6:00 p.m.
> Wednesday, Family

Night 7:30 p.m.

CARR’S CHAPEL 
Service Every Sunday

Morning Worship 9:30 a.m.
Sunday School 10:30 a.m.

; No Evening Services

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
Rev. Dale M. Harter, Minister

Sunday School 
Sunday Worship

9:45 a.m. 
11:00 a.m.

“ ABUNDANT UFE 
FELLOWSHIP’’ 

nR ST  ASSEMBLY OF GOD 
CHURCH 
Floydada

Ron Dysart, Pastor
; Sunday School 9:45 a.m.

Morning Worship 10:50 a.m.
Sunday Evening

Evangelistic 6:00 p.m.
Wednesday Night 

Service 7:30 p.m.

SAN JOSE CATHOUC CHURCH 
Lockney

Pastor: Fr. Jack Gist
Mon.-Fri. Liturgy 8:00 p.m.
Saturday Vigil Mass 

of Sunday 7:30 p.m.
Sunday Mass 12:30 p.m.

ST. MARY MAGDALEN 
CATHOUC CHURCH 

Floydada
Father Terry Burke

Sunday School 10-11:15 a.m.
Sunday Mass 11:30 a.m.

I Wednesday Mass 7:00 p.m.
Ultreya 8:00 p.m.

Office Phone 983-5878

WEST SIDE 
CHURCH OF CHRIST 

Floydada
Sunday Morning 

’ Worship 10:30 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6:00 p.m.
Wednesday 7:00 p.m.

LATIN AMERICAN 
CHURCH OF CHRIST 

Lockney
Bible School 9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship 10:45 a.m.
Evening Worship 6:00 p.m.
Wednesday Service 8:00 p.m.

CITY PARK 
CHURCH OF CHRIST 

Floydada

Sunday Bible Study 9:30 a.m.
Morning Worship 10:30 a.m.
Evening Worship 6:00 p.m.
Wednesday Bible Study 7:30 p.m. 
Spanish Assembly,

Sunday 3:00 p.m.

MAIN STREET 
CHURCH OF CHRIST 

Lockney
P erry  Z um w alt, Pastor 

Bible Study 9:30 a.m.
Morning Worship 10:30 a.m.
Evening Worship 6:00 p.m.
Wednesday
Ladies Bible G ass 9:30 a.m.
Bible Study 7:30 p.m.

WEST COLLEGE 
CHURCH OF CHRIST 

West College ft Third, Lockney 
Frank Duckworth, Evangelist

Morning Worship 10:30 a.m.
Evening Worship 6:00 p.m.
Wednesday Service 8:00 p.m.

TRINITY LUTHERAN CHURCH 
Providence Community 

Rev. Bruce Adamson
Sunday School & Adult 

BibIb G ass 10:00 a.m.
Worship Service 11:00 a.m.

FIRST UNITED 
METHODIST CHURCH 

Lockney
Rev. Robert Kirk

Sunday School 9:45 a.m.
Worship Service 10:55 a.m.
UMY 5:00 p.m.
Evening Worship 6:00 p.m.
United Methodist Women. First 
Tuesday of Month Circles. Mon­
day (2nd & 4th Monday nights) 
Tuesday & Wednesday mornings.

GRANT CHAPEL CHURCH 
OF GOD IN CHRIST 

John Williams, Pastor
Sunday School 10:00 a.m.
Monday Worship 11:00 a.m.
Evening Service 7:30 p . m.
Prayer Service-Tuesday 8:00 p.m. 
Service-Wednesday 7:30 p.m.

SOUTH PLAINS 
BAPTIST CHURCH 
Tom Fisher, Pastor

Sunday School 10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship 11:00a.m. 
Evening Service 6:30 p.m.
Wednesday Service 7:00 p.m.

TEMPLO NUEVA VIDA 
Rev. Herman Martinez 

308 W. Tennessee
Sunday School 10:00 a.m.
Evening Worship 6:(X) p.m.
Tuesday Ladies

Prayer 2:(X)p.m.
Thursday Service 7:30 p.m.

FIRST UNITED 
METHODIST CHURCH 

Floydada
Bill Wright, Pastor

Sunday School 9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship 11:00 a. m.
Youth Fellowship 5:00 p.m.
Sunday Evening 

Worship 6:00 p.m.

EVANS CHAPEL 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Rev. Sammy Hoilaway
Sunday School 10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship 11:00a.m.
Training Union 6:00 p.m.
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m.
Wednesday Prayer

Meeting 7:(X)p.m.
Sunday Afternoon 

Worship 2:00 p.m.

PRIMER IGLESIA 
BAUTISTA 

Rev. Pedro Reyea
Sunday School 9:45 a.m.
Morning Service 11:00 a.m.
Training Union 6:00 p.m.
Evening Worship 6:00 p.m.
Wednesday Service 7:30 p.m.

TEMPLO BAUTISTA SALEM 
Lockney

TIvuraio Villarreal
Sunday School 9:45 a.m.
Worship Service 11 :(X) a.m. 
Christian Training 

Time 5:00 p.m.
Evening Worship 6:00 p.m.
Wednesday Prayer Meeting

7:30 p.m;

BIBLE BAPTIST CHURCH 
Floydada 

Bob Chapman
Sunday School 10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship 10:45 a.m.
Sunday Evening Prayer 

Meeting 6:00 p.m.
Sunday Evening

Services 6:30 p.m.
Wednesday Evening

Services 7:30 p.m.

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
Lockney

Gairy D. Higga, Paator
Sunday School 9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship 10:45 a.m.
R.A.’s 5:00 p.m.

.Church Training 6:00 p.m.
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m.
Wednesday:
Prayer Meeting 7:00 p.m.
Youth Bible Study 7:00 p.m.
(Jr. High & High School)
Kids of The King...

Children’s Choir 7:00 p.m.
E¥e-school Choir &

Mission Friends 7:(X)p.m.
Adult Choir 8:00 p.m.
Baptist Women 
1st and 3rd Mondays 
Saturday:
Men’s ftayer Meeting 7:30 a.m.

CALVARY BAPTIST 
Floydada 

Dr. R ld ^  Johnson
Sunday School 
Morning Worship 
Bible Study 
Evening Worship 
Wednesday Evening

9:45 a.m. 
11:00 a.m. 
6:00 p.m. 
6:00 p.m. 
7:00 p.m.

MT. ZION BAPTIST CHURCH 
Floydada

Rev. Ralph Jackson, Pastor , 
Sunday School 10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. H
BTU 6:00 p.m.
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m.
Mid-Week I^rayer 

Wednesday 7:00 p.m.
Bible Study

Thursday '7:00 p.m.

AIKEN BAPTIST CHURCH 
Rev. Ray Starnes, Pastor

Sunday School 10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m.
Evening Worship 6:00 p.m.
Wednesday Bible Study 7:30 p.m. 
Brotherhood breakfast last 

Saturday each month 7:00 a.m.

HRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
FLOYDADA

Rev. Howell E. Farnsworth, Jr 
Pastor

Sunday School 9:45 a . m. ;
Morning Worship 10:55 a.m. 
Church Training 6:00 p.m.
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Evening 6:45 p.m.

LONE STAR 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

M.B. Baldwin, Paator
Sunday School 10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Training Union 5:00 p.m.
Evening Worship 6:00 p.m. 
Prayer Service, Wednesday 

Evening 6:30 p.m.
Brotherhood, First Saturday 
Morning of Every Month.

VICTORY BAPTIST CHURCH 
Floydada

Travis Curry, Pastor
Sunday School 10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m.
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m.
Wednesday Services 7:00 p.m.

NEW SALEM PRIMTITVE 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Floydada
Jim Jackson, Pastor

Sunday Congregational 
Singing 10:30 a.m.

Morning Worship 11:00 a.m.
Evening Worship 6:00 p.m.

SPANISH BAPTIST 
MISSION 
Floydada

 ̂ Rev. Lope Rando

ADVERTISEMENT

Hearing Tests 
Set For
Senior Citizens
Floydada ~ Electronic hearing tests will 
be given at the Senior Citizen's Center 
on Tuesday, January 3, from 10:00 a.m. 
to 12 noon.

A professionally trained Hearing Aid 
Specialist will be present to perform the 
tests.

Everyone should have a hearing test at 
least once a year - even people now 
wearing a hearing aid or those who have 
been told nothing could be done for 
them. Only a hearing test can determine 
if you are one of the many a hearing aid 
can help.

The free hearing tests will be given 
Tuesday, January 3 from 10:00 a.m. to 
12:00 p.m. at the Senior Citizen Center, 
301 East Georgia.

Batteries and service will be available 
for all makes of hearing aids.

l ^ e ^ to T ie * ___________ __

Sunday School 
Morning Worship 
Church Training 
Evening Worship 
Wednesday Evening

9:45 a.m. 
11:00 a.m. 
5:00 p.m. 
6:00 p.m. 
7:00 p.m. ;

¥

TRINITY CHURCH 
Meets at the Y 

G.A. Van Hoose, Pastor
Sunday School 9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6:00 p.m.
Wednesday

Night Prayer 7:30 p.m.
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WEEKLY TELEVISION SCHEDULE
THU, DEC 29C IM • Weekdays - WED, JAN 4

MORNING

9:05 (XI Three's e Crowd (1969
Comedy) Larry Hagman, E J Peaker Man 
finds himself an madvenent bigamist

AFTERNOON
12:05(X  Genesis II (1972. SciefKO 

Fiction) Alex Cord. Mariette Hartley 
Scientists are buried alive and discovert 
two centuries later

EVENING
7:05 ( X  W.W. and the D iiie Dencakings

(1975. Musical Comedy) Bun Reynolds. An

Carney. Easygoing con anist loves country 
music, a girl singer and trouble 

10:05 ( X  Love at First Bite (1976. Comedy) 
George Hamilton. Susan Saint James 
Count Dracula hits the Big Apple m this 
spoof of the vampire legend 

1 t :3 0 a  ***><% The Pink Panther Strikes 
Again (1976. Comedy) Peter Sellers. 
Herben Lorn Clouseau's former boss 
threatens to destroy the world with a ray 
gun

12:00 (Qi “Lett Reson" CBS Lete Night
(1986. Comedy) Charles Grodin. Robin 
Pearson Rose A man's vacation plans go 
awry in a seedy Caribbean reson 

12:05 (X  Love Me o< Leave Me (1955. 
Musical Biography) Doris Day. James

Cagney A Chicago gangster pushes a small 
time singer into the big time.

1 :3 0 0  *w The Brothers (1947, Drama) Will 
Fyffe Two brothers fall in love with an 
orphan girl on the English coast 

2:35 (X  Tennessee Champ (1954. 
Comedy Drama) Shelley Winters. Keenan 
Wynn Young boxer works to reform his 
crooked manager with religion.

4 : 0 0 0  Tales That Witness Madness Kim 
Novak. Joan Collins Four eerie stories 
linked together by a ghostly old 
bookstore

FRIDAY C) 19M  Thp TV LftwtQ Qroup. loc Ft tAtofttr. TX December 30

MORNING EVENING

9:05 (X  * *  Stranger in Our Houae (1978. 
Suspense Drama) Linda Blair. Carol 
Lawrence A young girl has a terrifying 
encounter with witchcraft.

AFTERNOON
12:05 (X  * *  McHale's Navy (1964. Comedy) 

Ernest Borgnine. Joe Flynn Crew of WWII 
PT boat tries to pay oft gambling debts

7:00(□) WWW* “The Sound el Music" NBC 
Movie of the Week (1965. Musical Drama) 
Julie Andrews. Christopher Plummer The 
sentimental true life story of the Von Trapp 
family in Austria
0  w*</k Cannery Row (1982. Romance 
Comedy) Nick Nolle. Debra Winger. A 
mismatched couple plays a tug of war 
romance in the 1940s

7:05 (X  * * *  The Far Country (1955. 
Adventure) James Stewart. Ruth Floman 
Men bringing a herd of cattle to Alaska run 
up against lawlessness

8:00 QD Grant Performances (1988. A rare 
interview with Sir John Gielgud highlights 
this tribute to him Q

11:30 0  Star Trek: The Cage (1964. Science 
Fiction) Jeffrey Hunter. Leonard Nimoy 
The original crew of the starship Enterprise 
begin their odyssey

12:0010) **-kVt Northwest Passage (1940. 
Adventure) Spencer Tracy. Robert Young 
Expedition searches (or a mythical North­
west passage

1:30 0  * *  Fighting Back (1982. Drama) Tom 
Skerritt. Patti LuPone A hard working 
shopkeeper organizes a community patrol 
to tight crime

SATURDAY O  I98« The TV Liilir.; Ginuti me FI Wailti TX D ecem b er 31

MORNING

11:05 o r  Themt (1954. Science Fiction)
James Whitmore. Edmund Gwenn Giant 
ants devastate the countryside from New 
Mexico to Los Angeles

Dvorak A oambling casino crumbles during 
the great San Francisco earthquake 

3 :0 0 0  WWW Barctoot In the Park (1967. 
Comedy) Robert Radford Jane Fonda An 
uninhibited young woman marries a stodgy 
businessman

AFTERNOON EVENING

1:05 CX Money from Home (1953.
Comedy) Dean Martin. Jerry Lewis A young 
lockey falls into the clutches of a 
loanshark

2 0 0 d )  wwvk Flame e l the Berhary Coast
(1945. Adventure) John Wayne. Ann

7:00( X  WWW The Fear Seasons ,
Comedy Drama) Alan Alda. Bess r,... 
strong Experiencefoor stages of friendship 
among three middle aged couples 
0  “Superman III" ABC Movie 
Special (1983 Comedy Adventure) Chris 
topher Reeve. Richard Pryor Superman

(1981.
Arm

once again defends the American way
0

7 :(» (X  * * * *  M*A*S*H (1970. Comedy) 
Donald Sutherland. Elliotl Gould A pair of 
surgeons at a Mobile Army Surgical 
Hospital create havoc

12:30 iQi She Wore a VeHow Ribbon
(1949. Western) John Wayne. John Agar A 
cavalry outpost makes a dosperate atlompt 
to repel invading Indians

1:30 0  wwvk Caeeery Row (1962. Romence 
Comedy) Nick Nolle. Oebre Winger A 
mismatched couple plays a tug of war 
romance in the 1940s

M S iQ  * *  IS (1979. Comedy) Bo Derek. 
Dudley Moore

SUNDAY January 1
TBS
(D

KTXT WGN
®

KCBD
O

KLBK
S3)

KAMC
O

KJTV
« HBO SH O W ES PN

AHaeta PBS CMcaga Lahback Ubback U k to ck LuM M k

c AM T t  J Ba«|amln NBC Nows C B S T h it Morn Ag Rpl GIdgal Woman Movie V a r M
D 30 •* Jam •• Morniag Body By Jaka Thundtrca ls Variad "
7 AM ( 05) HMII Baza Today (toad Morning Ghoslhuttart Moyia » ■
/ 30 ( 35) B 'w lc (:45) Wthr ■ • Am trica Oannit " " Variad

Q AM ( 05) Little Sostm o Smarts ” SHvar Spoon ■ C O P S . " •* -
o 30 Haute SIroot Gumby Varied V a rM - J. Swaggart Variad Variad

Q AM (:0S) Movie Mr Rogors A llc t " D o n ihu t Succa ts  N Variad Movla
y 30 •* Varlod Bunkar Varied V a rM " U la Varied

1 0
AM - 321 Contact V a r M " V ir i td Hour - - "
30 Shapo Up " Varied " V a r M M iga z ln a Varied Varied

1 1
AM (:0S| Perry Varlod V a r M " V irtad - Gong Show Variad " "

30 M e io e Varlod " " " " O ilin g  G im n •* •• Variad

1 2
PM (:05) Movie Varlod " - Newlywed » -

30 - Varlod - Varied " •* Hollywood Sq •• " Variad

i PM - " . " Variad •• D ivo ica Cl. Varied - "

1 .30 ( 50) Varied Varlod Varlod " ” On T r i l l " " "

o PM " V a r M Variad > w Curr A lla n Varied •a V a rM
L 30 ( 35) Flint Satam a " " " " Group 1 Mad - "

Q PM ( OS) Flint Straat " > " H Yogi Bear - V a rM
0 30 |:3$) Brady M r Rogors Variad " " - DuckTalet Varied Variad

A PM (:0S) Muns. Squara Ona Variad Varied B r id y  Bunch (:15) Variad " Variad

30 ( 3$) L A S 321 C a n lK t V a r M Variad M W absinr •* V a rM Variad

C PM ( 05) t  Day S it A  Ba Fit - Jaopardyl G im m i " Variad

0 30 (:3S) 9 to Bu t Rpt V a r M CBS Nasrt Too C la s t •* ** Variad

•

THURSDAY (£>1966 Th# TV LfSt.na loc Fi Worth. TX December 29
TBS
GD

KTXT WGN
®

KCBD
(a

KLBK
S3)

KAMC KJTV
(» HBO SH O W E S P N

Aflnntn PBS CMcaga Lobbacii LubOock LubOack Lubbock

c PM (:0S) Andy MacNall C h ta rt Newt Nawt Nawt Family T i lt (Cant) Mov King SporttCantar
D 30 ( 3$) Sant' Lahrat Night Ct Win. Lose W hatl Cathy Curt A t l i ir Mov: Jana and Solamon'f NFL F llm i

7 PM ( OS) W.W Houta Mavla Cosby 48 Hours tea Capadtt Success tha Lott Minas Collaga
30 ■ml Iht D iilo Victory Gdn. out World " with Kirk - City " Football

p PM Oanctking i M ytlaty l Chaars P a ra d it i C im tran Friadom Mov: Mov: ••
0 30 " Nows Daar John " •• Bowl Suparm in IV NIghniyart

Q PM (:0S) G riham Upstairs Collage L.A. Law Knatt Landing ABC Nawt - • -
y 30 B iska lha ll " Spaclal " Undaicovat Mav; Blue "

1 0
PM (:0S) Lovo at Body Elacl. Nawt N tw t N iw t •• Intida NFL Valval w

30 First BIta Bu i  Rpl Tonight Shaw 3 't  Company M-A*$*H > - - SportsCin lar

1 1
PM Sign on Drksida Night H ta l Lava Conntcl Cha irs Mov: ■ Haittnan

30 Movla Laltarman " Nlghtllna Pink Panihat Overboard (:3S) Cart! Year la  Spar

MORNING

5:15 0  w Lipstick (1976. Drama) Margaux 
Hemingway. Chris Sarandon Gorgeous 
model IS brutally raped m her apartment 
bedroom

9:35 ( X  * * *  The Glenn Miller Story (1954. 
Biographical Musical) James Stewart. June 
Allyson Story of Glenn Miller, from his first 
gig to the height of his career

Enrico Caruso's rise to operatic fame 
2:20 ( X  * * *  High Society (1956. Comedy 

Musical) Frank Sinatra. Grace Kelly. 
Presence of reporter and photographer at a 
wedding causes confusion 

5:00 ( X  WWW Champions: A Love Story (1978. 
Drama) James Vincent McNichol. Shirley 
Knight Two teenagers from different 
backgrounds draw on each other tor 
help

AFTERNOON EVENING

12:05 (X  * fk*  The Gnat Caruso (1951. Musical
8:00 CX Man of the West (1958. Western)

gone straight, is forced by his uncle to loin 
a holdup

8:00 dS NBC Sunday Night at the Movies □  
33) “Tha Karon Carponlor Story” CBS
Sunday Movie (1988. Cynthia Gibb. 
Mitchell Anderson. Karen Carpenter s life is 
traced, until her death at age 32 □
0  w* "A View to a Kill" ABC Sunday 
Night Movla (1965. Adventure) Roger 
Moore. Tanya Roberts Bond fights a 
Nazi-bred monster who aims to destroy 
Silicon Valley Q

10:45 0  WWW* The Last PIctura Show (1971. 
Drama) Cions Leachman. Cybill Shepherd

MONDAY Inc Ft Worth, TX January 2

TBS
®

Allin ta

KTXT
®
P tS

WGN
®

Chlcaps

KCBD
( Q

Lubbock

KLBK
O

Lubbock

KAMC

Lubbock

KJTV
(3$

Lubbock

HBO SH O W ESPN

(:05) Andy M ic N t i l Talathan News Nawa News Family TIat In t id i NFL (5:00) I Taka SportsC in lar
0  30 ( » )  Sant' Ltbrar WM. Lbsa W hM l Qatby Curl AHafi " M tn Spaadwaak

PM ( OS) Far D C. Wank Mov: Sound ol Beauty A the S ltangan Mov: Cannery Mav: flavinoa Mav Hallo Collaga
• 30 Country Wall St " Music Baasi Full Houtt Row o lth e  Nerds Again Faolball

n  PM ■ Mav: G ra il •• Ktnnady Balvadari - ■ « -

0  30 " Partormancaa " - C an tir Honors G. Pa int - Mov: Rvngt (:40) Cmdy -

( 05) Audubon > Nawt - ■ 20/20 - Nards 2 Brothers V

y  30 * Mark R u tta ll " - " - Tati Garry ”
( OS) Tracki On the R a id Talatbon Nawt N iw s N tw t Cha irs tat A to Davt SportsCtnlar

l U  30 Bus Rpt caatlauns Carton 3 't Company M*A‘ S 'H S t ir  Trek Mov: Vacation Mov: Lady "

(:0S) Trsekt Austin City > ■ Guntm ahi Lovt Conntcl " ■ B tw iia Advanluri
I I  30 " Lim its " L itltrm an • Nlghttina Star Trak •*

TBS
®

Atlanta

KTXT
®
POS

WGN
®

Cblcaga

KCBD
I!)

Lahback

KLBK
(!3)

Lubbock

KAMC
(JS

Lubbock

KJTV

LuOback

HBO SH O W E S P N

C  P** (:05) Andy M acN til (5:00) (3:30) F ia s li Nawt (3:45) Rota Family Ties (Cant) (5:30) SpailCantar

0  :30 (:3S) Sant' Lahrat SargaanI York Bawl Wheal Bawl Curr. AHalt Encyclopedia Corsican Bra Magic V ta r i

- 7  PM ( OS) E a il at Power Gama Mov: Orange Bowl TV 101 Mov: Brazil Mav Data Mov: Wall Adv in lu ie

* 30 Edan. Part 1 - Apirtm anl " - USFAG Sugar • with an Straat

o First Edan " Murphy Bawl Angel - U S P io

0  30 - " " Dtsigning - " - Skating

( 05) E i t i  at Slaw Firas Almost - F i l l  Guy Mav Rvnge (:05) TBA

9  30 Edan. Part 2 - (:4$) News " Grown " N i id t  2 Something

i n
as Ivoy  E lict. - News N iw s Chaars Wild LighI Side

1 0  :3p Bus Rpt Mov: Ordinary Cartan 3 't  Company S t ir  Trak: (:35) House- SportCanlnr

i  i (05) Grow'g Bus. Paop li - Hunitt News N a il G. Mov Hollo Ciunch Tima

1 1  :30 E ip lo rtr Sign on ' ** L ittirm an Lava Cannact A lc i t t i z ' l i8 P Again V ,

MORNING

9:0S(X  * * *  Batch Party (1963. Musical 
Comedy) Bob Cummings. Dorothy Malone 
An anthropologist takes to the beach to 
research teen sex habits

3:00 (X  WWW* Mutiny on the Bounty (1935. 
Adventure Drama) Clark Gable. Charles 
Laughton Captain Bligh faces mutiny from 
his crew on board the H.M S Bounty 

5:00 (X  WWW* Sergeant York (1941. Drama) 
Gary Cooper. Walter Brennan. Story of a 
mountain boy who captures a German 
position

AFTERNOON
12:05(X  Pajama Party (1964. Musical 

Comedy) Tommy Kirk. Annette Funicello. A 
Martian scout on earth to prepare for an 
invasion faffs in love.

1:00 (X  * * *  Boys Town (1938. Drama) 
Spencer Tracy. Mickey Rooney In Father 
Flanagan s Boys Town, there s no such 
thing as a bad boy____________________

EVENING
7:00 ( X  WWW* The Apartment (1960. Comedy 

Drama) Jack Lemmon. Shirley MacLaine 
An ambitious clerk lends his apartment to 
others in the company 
0  WW Brazil (1944. Musical Romance) 
Tito Guizar. Virginia Bruce An authoress

composer
7:05 (X  East ol Edon. Part 1 (1981. Drama) 

Jane Seymour. Timothy Bottoms Two 
brothers fall in love with a beautiful but evil 
woman

9:05 QD East ol Edon. Part 2 (1981. Drama) 
Jane Seymour. Timothy Bottoms Two 
brothers tall in love with a beautiful but evil 
woman.

10:30 (X  W W W *  Ordinary Poopio (1980. 
Drama) Donald Sutherland. Mary Tyler 
Moore A family slowly deteriorates after 
the eldest son dies

11:30 0  WW Alcatraz Eipross (1961. Mystery 
Drama) Robert Stack. Bruce Gordon 
Combination of 2 segments of TV series 
The Untouchables

TUESDAY January 3

TBS
®

A tlin t i

KTXT
®
PBS

WGN
®

Chicago

KCBD
(II)

Lubbock

KLBK '
US

Lubbock

KAMC
&

Lubbock

KJTV

Lubbock

HBO SHOW E S P N

c AM (:0S) Larry Jo n a i (Cant) Public People W otm a ICant) Spa rttC sn ltr

b 30 Guntmoka World Tam 'w Oanvar " Mov: Over the Mov: 1 T ha raugM nd

7 AM (:05) Bonanza Farm Rapart Kltaytur Raggedy Ann S p id irm in Funtastic Top Accusal Outdoor Lite

/ 30 " CharlM do GummI Boars Superman Winnie the World *• Sportsman

Q AM 1:05) T i l  Tips an P io p la Smurfs Muppet Pooh " Sport's - Fishin ' H oti

0 30 E ip lo ia i Tape C h ic i| o " Babies R a i l - Golden Age Mov: Motorwnak

n AM ( 05) CHIPS C in t d i:  T ru i M inority But Chipmunks Pat-w ea Ghastbustars Johnny Inside NFL M oon th in i A m tr Pulling

y 30 North Happen A ll Garfield Scaoby Dao C a n ila t " Wat Sunklst KIDS

i n AM (:05) Fueling Hia D u k tt at " Hey, Vam! Bugs and Pollard Ford Mov: Cry - SportAm artci

1U 30 WrasHIng Futuri Hazzard Ed Grim lay Tatn  Wall Twenty S h i ShariH Freedom Mav: Foul NFL GamaOsy

i  i AM (:05) Thamf G lobal Rivals Soul T ra il Punky B. Mighty OIno Riders Wrestling " Play Woman's

30 *• •• Pollard Ford S loryh ra ik Robacop •• - " Vo llayhall

1 0
PM " Contumar Movla NFL Uval O u irt irho rse S i So Puadaf Poach Bowl •» » Champianship

30 - P o w it o l Cho •• AFC Pollard Show Gold G ro its •• (:45) Mov: Ruaiwr

i PM (:0S) Monay Woodwright " Divisional NFL Today Guinness » Superman II Stumbles F ig u n
1 30 tram Hama H ous i - PtnyoH NFC Honay Halo " Skating

0 PM - Mtrwk M a y  Flame Divisional C tla b ra li •• - -d 30 " Mark Rusta ll o l Iht ” PtnyaH M irbclas " - Loula IMSA

Q PM (:0S) Baava S a n k  Prav. Barbary C a a il n " Baal War of Mav: B ir i t o o l Mov: A n d irtan IHRA Drag

0 30 (:3S) B a iva Neurtan Apple " Potl-gam q - Stars la tha Park SortMthlng Mov: Racing

PM (:05) R. M l Artists at T and T TBA P. Preview East - Specia l Dalacllva Spa rtAm trka

30 (:3S) 0. Wl Amartca Good T imas - Tap Tan " Mov: Splash Dropouts "
c PM W riattlng Mystaryl Charia i TBA Benton This Is NFL Friday Hia ” Mov: Bach to Advantun

D 30 Scratch " WhI. Fartuni ABC Nows 13th " tha Beach "
(bUM) U p t t i ln Shartn Ntws Hh  Haw Niws Slat Trak: (Coni) (5:00) Back SpartsCantar

u 30 W riit lin g " Benton T i entry Rpl " Suparboy Natl G Mov Ovtr tha to tha B ia c PrimeTIm i

7 PM (:05) Live tram Mov: Four King Orangt Dirty D inc 'g Mov: Raparlart Top Mov Muscle Mag1 30 M “A*S*H Lincain Saasaas Panda Miranda Suptrman III - ■ F lit h d in c i -
Q PM Cantor Gold Girls Simon A " Beyond Mov: CBA
0 30 • • Empty Nasi SIman - Tomorrow Ranl-a-Cop ( 35) Elian B a tk ilb a ll

Q PM ■ Happy N tw Nawt Hunter Wast STIh Wat ol tha John *a
30 ( 35) Famll Year. U S A •• • - - Worlds - -

i n
PM ( 05) A im T Zona Nawt Nawt Nows Freddy's Comedy Hour TropIctI

1 u 30 (35) " Baw ta r't N iw Saturday Happy Now Naw Vr Nightm an LIvt " SparttCtnIer

1 1 PM Ju M lila ■ Y a it 't  Eva Night Uva Year. Recking Eva Monitars ( 05) On G la r ii Collaga
1 1 30 ( 35) Tu ck • " Amarfci " O irktlda Lacatlon EtIalanI B a ik a tb ill

TBS
®

Allan li

KTXT
®
P8S

WGN
®

CMctgo .

KCBD
O

LuOback

KLBK
(S)

Lubbock

KAMC
l a

LuhOack

KJTV
a

Lubbock

HBO SH O W E S P N

C  PM ( OS) Andy M tcN a ll C illagn Nows Nawt Ntws Family Ties Sport's (5:00) Turk SporttCantar

b  38 (:3S) S a il ' L th n r B a tk tib a ll Win. L o tt Whaal Coshy Curr. AH iir Goldan Ago 1121 Pull Sartos

- 7  PM (:85) NBA Pawar Gama - Matlock Tour i t  Duty Who's Bast? Mov: Blood Mov Walk Mov Muscla M sg

7  38 Batkan itH - - Rosainna Ties Lika a Man Firaw ilkut -

Q  PM - Amartca Hogans Haro In H t i t  ol Mov: CBS thklysomath •• - - Top Rank

0  30 « E ipartanc i Tw ilitt Zona Night T u ttd iy Haaparman Mov. S it l lt . ( 45) CItaU Ba ling

(:2B) Young Monty In Nows Midnight Movie Ihirtysamalh TBA Sister Brothers ••

9  30 Warrtart Amartca " C a litt " lag " Garry -

i n
- Body Elect. Hmoonar News Nawt Nows Chaars Undarcovir Mov Foal tor Spo rtsC in lir

• D  30 - But Rpl HIM Straat Canon 3 't  Company M -A 'S 'H Star Trek 1st A  to Love C a litg t

1 1  ^ ( 28) Night Sign on Bluat " Night H i l t Lava C annK i " Mov: Made In *• B is k itb a ll

n  30 P a a u ga H inovar SI Ltnarmnn " NIgMIina Artania Hall Haavin *

MORNING EVENING

9:05 CX Muscle Beach Party (1964. 
Comedy Musical) Frankie Avalon. Annette 
Funicello. Wealthy contessa likes a 
handsome muscle man

AFTERNOON
12:05(X  WWW Ski Party (1965. Comedy 

Musical) Frankie Avalon. Dwayne Hickman 
Two guys dress as girls on skiing trip to find 
out a friend's secret

7:00 0  WWW Blood Tios (1986. Drama) Brad 
Davis. Tony Lo Bianco A young American's 
lather is kidnapped by the Sicilian Mafia 

B:00 33 CBS Tuesday Movie 
9:20 (X  Young Warriors (1963. Drama) 

Richard Roundtree. Ernest Borgnine. A 
young man seeks help in avenging his 
sister's death

11:20 (X  * * *  NH|M Pissago (1957. Adventure 
Drama) James Stewart. Audie Murphy. An 
outlaw gang tries to steal railroad workers 
payroll

11:30(X * *  Hanovor Stroel (1979. Drama) 
Harrison Ford. Lesley Anne Down Two 
lovers in . WWII Britain must choose 
between desire and honor 

12:00 33 WW “S li Wooki" CBS L it*  Movie 
(1962. Drama) Dudley Moore. Mary Tyler 
Moore Two strangers come together at a 
time of personal crisis

12:30 0  WWW My Favorite Year (1982. 
Comedy) Peter 0 Toole. Mark Linn Baker A 
former matinee idol has problems coping 
with a live TV performance

1:20( X  Ruby Gantry (1952. Drama) 
Jennifer Jones. Charlton Heston Girt from 
the Carolina swamp claws her way up the 
social ladder

WEDNESDAY January 4
TBS
®

Atlanta

KTXT
®
PBS

WGN
®

Cblcaga

KCBD
( U

Lubbock

KLBK
(Q)

Lubback

KAMC
l a

LubbKk

KJTV
I S

Lubbock

HBO SH O W ES PN

fi (:BS) Andy M K N a ll Chaars Nawt Haws Nnws Family Ttas (5:00) Mov SportCantar
D  30 (:3S) S in f Lnhrar Night Court Win. Lota Whaal Cosby Curr AH ilr Orignat H iriaquin School Sport
- f  PM (:K )  D rign tI Pawar Gama Mav: PartacI Untalvad TV 101 0. P i lo t Mov Mov: Amazon Ram inct: Collaga
1 30 " Frtd iy M ys itr ta i " Hd C las t UnlorgKran Woman Cloud B a tk iH ii ll

InHnHa •• Night Cl. Mov: Man in Wonder Y i i r s " Mov Trick or
b  30 (:50) Oragnal V iy ig a Baby Beam Brown SuH Haaparman " AHrictians T ra il

Q - Primahma Nows TaHIngars China B o K h - 1st A  to C a ll ig i
3  30 Japaa " *• * " T a il Mav Wall (:3S| D iva B iiktH )aH

in ™
Bady Elect Hmoonar Nows Nawt Nawt Chaars Straat Mov m

I w  30 ( SO) Onvid Bu t Rpt H ill S trati TonigM Shaw 3 't  Company M*A‘ S ‘ H SItr Trak - Apbrodili -

1 1
CapptrntW Sign on Bluas " Night Hn it Lava Cannact " - (:20| C ia sa r SportiCanlar

I • 30 Being Thera LaHarman NlghHina Artbolo Hall ( 45) On La 20thl StarShal

MORNING EVENING

9:05 ( X  * * *  Bikini Beach (1964 Musical 
Comedy) Frankie Avalon. Annette Funicallo 
Frankie and Annette deal with the British 
rock invasion

AFTERNOON
12:05 (X  * w w  FlrakaU 500 (1966. Drama) 

Frankie Avalon. Annette Funicello. A stock 
car racer is hired for an evening cross 
country rKe

7:00(X  * * *  PartacI Friday (1970. Suspense 
Comedy) Stanley Baker. Ursula Andress A 
banker turns to crime when he agrees to 
help pull a heist
0  WWW The Unlor|lvta (I960. Drama 
Western) Audrey Hepburn. Burt Lancaster 
Two pioneer families come into conflict 
with I  warlike Indian tribe 

7:05(X  * * *  Drafaal (1954. Suspense 
Drama) j K k  Webb. Ben Alexander When 
a syndicate man is killed. Sgt Friday cracks 
tha case

8:00 33 "Agatha ChritUa'i Tha Mae la the

Browa Suit" CBS Special Movie (1989. 
Stephanie Zimbalist. Tony Randall An 
American girl in Egypt encounters a cruise 
ship full of odd people

8:50 ( X  WW DrafiM l (1969. Mystery Drama) 
jK k  Webb. Harry Morgan An officer and a 
sergeant investigate tha disappearance of a 
model

10:50 ( X  WWW Davtd CopperfWd (1935. Classic 
Drama (Colorizad)) LiontI Barrymore. 
Freddie Bartholomew Dickens classic tala 
of a boy growing up m 19lh century 
England

11:30 ( X  wwvk Batag Thera (1979. Comedy 
Drama) Peter Sellers. Shirley MacLaine



1988 cotton crop tops 1987
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Texas High Plains cotton producers 
in 1987 produced the area’s first billion 
dollar cotton crop. And they’ve hit that 
mark again, and probably topped it, in 
1988.

So says Plains Cotton Growers, Inc., 
Lubbock, the organization that repre­
sents producers in the 25-county area 
included in the calculation. While the 
final 1988 bale count isn’t in, virtually 
all responsible estimates range between 
2.9 and 3.1 million bales. In its estimate 
of crop value, PCG uses the more con­
servative figure. “I guess you could say 
we’re counting on 2.9 million and hew­
ing for 3.1,” says Executive Vice Presi­
dent Donald Johnson.

The crop volume compares to an offi­
cial 2,668,550 bales reported for 1987 
by the Texas Agricultural Statistics 
Service and would rank as the area’s 
third largest crop, behind 3.5 million in 
1981 and 3.2 million in 1977.

Using an estimated 50 cents per 
pound average price, PCG puts lint 
value of the 2.9 million bales at $696 
million. Seed, at a season average of 
about$108,isestimatedat$125 million. 
Target price deficiency payments, fig­
ured at a minimum 19 cents per pound of 
program payment yield on planted 
acres, are expected to add another $249 
million. The total, $1.07 billion, is $64 
million above the $1,006 billion esti­
mated on the 1987 crop.

Should the more optimistic 3.1 mil­
lion bale 1988 estimate materialize, the 
value of the crop would rise to $1,127 
billion, PCG figures. “Either way, we’re 
looking at a new record,” Johnson 
states.

Until 1987, the previous, high dollar 
mark for the High Plains’ number one

cash crop was reached in 1973. I*CG 
estimated the gross return from that 
year’s 2.9 million bale production at 
$900 million.

That figure, at the time, meant much 
more to farmers and to the area economy 
than the billion dollar plus crops of 1987 
and 1988, Johnson points ouL He ex­
plains that according to Dr. Ron Gilbert, 
Chairman of the Economics Depart­

ment at Texas Tech University, it lakes 
about $2.60 in 1988 to equal the buying 
power of $1 in 1973.

“While back-to-back billion dollar 
crops are a strong plus for our industry 
and the overall area economy,” Johnson 
concludes,”our expectations have to be 
tempered by the fact that it would take a 
crop worth $2.34 billion to have the 
same economic impact as the 1973 
crop.”

Cotton Incorporated works to 
increase awareness o f consumer

Commitment and determination are 
two key words that have helped direct 
the efforts of the nation’s Upland cotton 
producers since the beginning of their 
self-help research and promotion pro­
gram some 22 years ago.

Even then, that first group of forward- 
thinking industry leaders realized that 
adequate funds would be needed if they 
were going to effectively promote their 
product and strengthen cotton’s com­
petitive position, thereby ensuring the 
future of this $500 billion industry.

The Cotton Research and Promotion 
Act, formally creating the producer- 
funded Cotton Research and Promotion 
Program, was passed by Congress in 
1966. Since then, through various re­
search and promotion activities. Cotton 
Incorporated has implemented market­
building projects designed to strengthen 
cotton’s competitive position in the fi­
ber market; worked to maintain and 
expand cotton’s domestic and foreign 
markets; aided in the development of 
new cotton products, and worked to

Underground water threatened by 
improper handling of chemicals

Agricultural chemicals can enter 
groundwater supplies in many ways. 
The High Plains Underground Water 
Conservation District No. 1 reminds 
producers to use special care when 
applying or handling pesticides or in­
secticides. ***'

Labratory analyses of composite 
groundwater samples from 90 irrigation 
wells within the 15-county water district 
service area show almost no pesticide 
residues in the groundwater.

Out of 589 analyses, only 14 showed 
trace amounts of one of six different 
chemicals. The small amount of chemi­
cal found indicates that no serious prob­
lem has developed as a result of the use 
of large quantities of agricultural chemi­
cals over a long period of lime in the 
water district’s service area. Agricul­
tural chemical users are urged to use 
even more care when handling chemi­
cals in the future.

To reduce the risk of ground water 
contamination, the water district offers 
the following safety lips for handling 
agricultural chemicals;

* Avoid chemical spills when filling 
nurse tanks or spray tanks near wells. 
Check valves should be used in hoses to 
prevent back-siphoning from the tanks 
into the well. If check valves arc not 
used, the fill hose should be secured 
above and out of the tank.

* Never leave fill tanks unattended 
since they could overflow and cause 
chemicals to enter the well. Tanks 
should be filled at a safe distance from 
the well and then moved to the field

where they wnill be used before adding 
any pesticides.

* Join two or more hoses together to 
extend the distance from the well when 
filling the nurse lank.

* Agricultural chemicals must be 
stored away from the well site. An in­
ventory of pesticides may invite spills or 
leakage. Producers should buy as 
needed to avoid these situations.

* Follow label directions exactly 
when applying chemicals, and use the 
recommended lowest effective rale.

* Exercise extra care when applying 
chemicals near ponds, playa basins or 
streams.

* Pay close attention to the proper 
cleaning of sprayers and pesticide con­
tainers after use. When cleaning spray 
equipment, use a minimum amount of 
water and spray it back on the field.

* Pressure rinse or triple rinse pesti­
cide containers. Afterward, add the 
rinse water to the solution that will be 
used on the field. Pesticide containCTS 
must never be used for any purpose 
other than a refill of the same chemical.

* Pesticide containers and spray 
equipment need to be checked often for 
possible leaks.

* Pesticide containers must be se­
curely tied down during transport.

* Pesticide containers should be dis­
posed of only at approved landfill sites.

For additional information on pesti­
cides and groundwater, contact the High 
Plains Underground Water Conserva­
tion District No. 1, 2930 Avenue Q, 
Lubbock, Texas or call (806) 762-0181.

Marble Brothers Farm Gin receives 
1987-88 Distinguished Service Award

It’s the backbone of this nation. We depend 
on this great industry for many things, from 
the food we eat to the clothes we wear and 
much more.

PRODUCERS COOPERATIVE
FULL SERVICE CO-OP STATION

G aso lin e  8i O il -  W holesale 8i Retail 
Propane • D iesel Fuel - K erosene  

On The Farm Tire Service

Ice Scrapers - .85C 
Cokes

$1.89 6 pack

GOODYEAR
REMINGTON

FALLS
CO-OP

Peak Anti Freeze 
$8.00 gal. 
$7.25 Bulk 
(5 gal. Min.)

Sale December 15 to January 2

983-3394
P.O. Box 69

210 E. Missouri, Floydada

increase consumer awareness of, and 
demand for, cotton products.

The following list represents only a 
few of the many ways Cotton Incorpo­
rated continues to work for U.S. cotton 
producers:

...In 1986, barky cotton cost growers 
in Texas alone, about $22 million. 
Under the coordination of the Barky 
Cotton Research Task Force, six current 
studies are aimed at reducing the prob­
lem. Early results point to two things 
growers can do now to reduce barkiness. 
According to Dr. William Lalor, senior 
director of agricultural research for 
Cotton Incorporated, the first thing is to 
ensure an early crop. The second recom­
mendation is to modify harvesters to 
produce a more gentle stripping action. 
The Barky Cotton Task Force involves 
the Plains Cotton Growers, the Texas 
Extension Service, Texas Experiment 
Station, Cotton Incorporated and the 
USDA.

...Cotton producers using the modu­
lar system of seed cotton storage, devel­
oped Jointly by Cotton Incorporated and 
Texas A&M University, now have a 
solution to module-marking problems. 
“Brand-A-Bale™ ” — a black ink that is 
durable to weather conditions but can­
not withstand textile jx-ocessing — was 
developed by Cotton Incorporated to 
prevent farmers from using spray paint 
to mark their modules and bales of cot­
ton. Cotton Incorporated has entered 
into a new licensing agreement with 
Stern Chemtech Corporation of 
Monroe, LA, for the right to produce 
“Brand-A-Bale™.”

...Cotton Incorporated and USDA’s 
Agricultural Research Service and Ag­
ricultural Marketing Service have en­
tered stage two of their tests on light 
spotted cottons. The testing is con­
ducted to determine how cotton classed 
light spotted performs as a finished 
fabric. Final results of this study are 
expected early in 1989. The test was 
called for by producers when the per­
centage of the crop classed light spotted 
reached a critical high in 1986, and 
Preston Sasser, senior director of fiber 
quality research, has coordinated the 
work for Cotton Incorporated.

...Cotton Incorporated has an­
nounced plans to research the factors 
contributing to “pepper trash,” small 
rash particles found in cotton fiber that 
can be difficult to remove during textile 
processing. The study will be conducted 
at the USDA Ginning Research Labora­
tory in Lubbock, TX, under the direction 
of Roy Baker. The project will be sup­
ported by Colton Incorporated’s Agri­
cultural Research Division.

...The Cotton Seal is an integral part 
of the True Performance identification 
system available for use on 100% cotton 
and cotton-rich products. Testing has 
proven that tags with the Cotton Seal 
and True Performance fabric qualities 
work to boost retail sales of cotton prod­
ucts. Round the Clock, a major manu­
facturer of pantyhose, saw a need for a 
cotton-top product because of cotton’s 
comfort and soft touch against the skin. 
The company successfully developed a 
60 percent cotton-top pantyhose that 
became available in November. The 
new line features the Seal of Cotton.

...The nonwovens market represents 
one of the most dynamic areas of pro­
jected growth for U.S. Upland cotton 
usage, which is why Cotton Incorpo­
rated is working so hard to strengthen 
cotton’s presence in this area. In No­
vember, Cotton Incorporated intro­
duced its prototype all-cotton dispos­
able diaper at IDEA ’88, the premier 
event of the nonwovens industry, and 
received rave reviews. Surveys of moth­
ers and doctors indicate not only support 
for an all -cotton diaper but also revealed 
that some customers believe the product 
is already made from mostly cotton.

An ongoing commitment and invest­
ment by U.S. cotton producers in this 
program is needed to keep the future 
bright for cotton.

BUY COTTON

The Cotton Board recently presented 
its Distinguished Service Award to 663 
gins that processed 5,071,039 bales of 
cotton during the 1987-88 ert^  year. 
The annual award is given to gins with 
grower participation levels above 80 
percent in the Cotton Research and 
Promotion Program

Marble Brothers Farm Gin in Floyd 
County was one of the recipients.

‘This program’s objective is to main­
tain and expand markets for U.S. Up­
land cotton growers,” says Cotton 
Board chairman Jim Hansen. “With 
consumer purchases of cotton products 
at a record level, both in parentage 
share of fiber and in absolute value, 
there is no doubt that cotton’s self-help

program is working.
“These gins, and the growers they 

serve, have done a tremendous service 
for the cotton industry with their out­
standing support for Cotton Incoipo- 
rated.”

The gins that achieved a support rale 
about 80 percent represent approxi­
mately one-third of all gins across the 
cotton belL Of the 663 award-winning 
gins, 127 were first-time recipients.

“By their own dollars and their own 
direction, cotton producers established 
Cotton Incoporated to put the competi­
tive edge back on their product,” says 
Hansen. “Their investment is paying big 
dividends and every segment of the

cotton industry is in their debt for the 
tremendous support they have shown 
for a research and promotion program 
that is achieving solid, verifiable re­
sults.”

Through the first nine months of 
1988, cotton commanded a 51 percent 
share of the retail apparel and home 
furnishings market, more than it has at 
any time since the 1960’s when the 
market development program was cre­
ated.

‘Thanks to the belief that a continu­
ing investment in this program is the 
most viable way to hold cotton’s com­
petitiveness in the fiber industry and the 
fashion world, these gins are helping 
make this goal a reality,” says Hansen.

Wheat crop off to less than perfect start
By C. Mark Brown 
Extension Agent- 
Entomology (PM) 

Crosby-Floyd Counties
The 1989 Crosby-Floyd wheat crop 

has gotten off to a much less than perfect 
start. The lack of moisture throughout 
the fall has been detrimental of 
greenbug populations, necessitating a 
fall insecticide tq)plication for several 
area fields. However, there are also two 
disease organisms attacking wheat, 
which are responsible for the general 
yellow appearance of many fields.

Common dryland root rot has been 
severe this fall. According to Dr. Harold 
Kaufman, Extension plant pathologist 
at Lubbock, this disease caused by the 
fungus Biopolaris sorokiniana. Being 
favored by warm temperatures, it is 
more damaging when wheat is planted 
very early and we have a late fall. The 
Biopolaris fungus infects the sub­
crown intemode of young wheat seed­
lings. It is most severe if secondary root 
formation is slowed by drought, etc. 
Early season infection can kill entire 
plants. Later season infection turns 
older leaves yellow, then brown. The 
recent cold weather should greatly slow 
the common root rot problem. When 
planning next year’s crop, producers 
should keep in mind that this disease is 
controlled by seed treatment and crop 
rotation.

The other disease that is prevalent in 
our area is leaf rust The most probable 
cause for the current severity of leaf rust 
is the occurrence of frequent morning 
dews several weeks ago. Leaf rust is 
caused by the fungus Puccinia recon- 
dita. Leaf rust occurs on either side of 
the leaf and on the leaf sheath as small, 
reddish-orange pustules. It can cause a 
reduction in the number of and size of 
kernels, and also reduces forage produc­
tion. Heavy infection now does not

necessarily mean we will have bad rust 
problems in the spring. Rust spore 
numbers will decrease during the cold 
winter months as old, infected leaves die 
and conditions are not favorable for new 
infection. The major factor that will

determine the severity or leaf rust next 
spring is the amount of spring rainfall. 
The appropriate control measure at this 
lime is grazing, to reduce the amount of 
infected foliage and lower the number of 
spores that can cause new infection.

Accidents and fatalities in rural 
areas are high during holidays

Accidents and fatalities in Texas dur­
ing December have been high histori­
cally, according to a safety expert with 
the Texas Agricultural Extension Serv­
ice.

This is particularly true of accidents 
that occur in rural areas as many city 
dwellers migrate to farms and ranches to 
spend the holidays with their families, 
said Thomas D. Valeo.

He said a newly-released 1987 farm 
fatality report supports the December 
danger trend.

Valeo, an agriculural engineer, said 
13 deaths occurred on Texas farms last 
December, representing 18 percent of 
the year’s total.

Other factors also contribute to the 
December fatalities, the safety expert 
said. Firearms account for a significant 
number of the farm fatalities, with hunt­
ing-related activities making up about 
30percentof December fatalities, Valeo 
said.

“Another large group includes fatali­
ties that are related to animals, compris­
ing about 15 percent of the total. These 
result primarily from falls that occur 
from horseback riding,” he said.

Vacro said fires, bums and explosions 
comprise another 15 percent of the total 
December fatalities.

He said that in Texas, winter docs not 
stop farming activities completely but 
does slow them somewhat. Thus, acci­

dents and fatalities involving ttactors 
and machinery did not cease during the 
winter.

“Much of these farm fatalities again 
can be attributed to the increased traffic 
in rural areas relating to holiday activi­
ties,” Vacro said.

All of these December statistics can 
spell danger for Texans if they don’t 
practice good safety habits, Vacro .said.

“Follow all sporting, tractor and 
machinery safely rules. Don’t allow 
children to ride on or play with farm 
equipment. Above all, don’t take a holi­
day from safety,” said Vacro.

NEW  AN D  USED FARM EQUIPMENT
“ LubTcx" Sweeps and Disks

ADAMS FARM EQUIPMENT CO.
HIGHWAY 62 & 82 EAST 
ROUTE 7, BOX 890 
LUBBOCK, TEXAS 79401

P h o n e  ( 8 0 6 )  7 6 2 - 2 5 1 0  
7 6 2 - 1 8 7 6

SALES:
HOWARD ADAMS 
BERLE ROBB 
WES UNDERWOOD

P & C Tractor
1983 JD 
1983 JD 
1983 JD 
1983 JD 
1981 JD 
1979 JD 
1979 JD

4650
4450
4450
4450
4440
4440
4240

1930 hrs. 
1490 hrs.

- 2900 hrs.
- 2200 hrs
- 2700 hrs.
- 3900 hrs.
- 3800 hrs.

Contact Bill Pigg
Quitaque 806-455-1473

FLOYDADA 
IMPLEMENT CO.

Floydada 983-3584

FIRST NATIONAL 
BANK OF FLOYDADA

Floydada 983-3717
D||CCC| I >C

EQUIPMENT & SUPPLY!

R u s s e i r s

Fluv dada 98.T-37.S I

FLOYD COUNTY 
IMPLEMENT

Floydada 983-3732

FLOYDADA 
COOPERATIVE GINS 

INC

f c o o ^
Floydada 983-2884



Page 10 - The Floyd County Hesperfan & The Lockney Beacon - Thursd^fjJOece^

Bishop nominated to 
West Point by Boulter

Congressman Beau Boulter has an­
nounced that Travis Bishop of Floydada 
has received his primary nomination for 
appointment to the United States Mili­
tary Academy at West Point.

Bishop came in first over 30 other 
highly qualified candidates in Con­
gressman Boulter’s 13th Congressional 
District. Nationwide, 20,000 apply but 
only 1,400 are picked.

“Bishop had excellent grades, good 
scores on his SAT and ACT tests, and 
had an impressive interview with repre­
sentatives of the military academies,” 
said Boulter.

Bishop is the son of Kfnneth Bishop 
Jr. who is with the U.S. Army and is 
currently serving in Germany. Travis 
resides in Floydada with his grandpar­
ents, Kenneth and Joyce Bishop. His 
gi^t-grandfather was Baird Bishop, a 
longtime resident and druggest in 
Hoydada.

During high school. Bishop has been 
a member of the National Honor Soci­
ety and Speech and DramaGub. He has 
played football and has been active in 
the First Methodist Church.

He has also been included Who's Who 
in American Hieh Schools.

Shine of *89

TRAVIS BISHOP

Floydada businesses plagued by burglaries
Police are investigating a rash of bur­

glaries of downtown businesses which 
occurred sometime between the night of 
Dec. 26 and the early morning of Dec. 
27. All the business were located within 
one block of each other.

“Jt appears that they were looking for 
money only,” said Sgt. Harold Snell, of 
th; Floydada Police Department. 
“When they found some money then 
they quit for the night.” ̂

Business broken into and ransacked 
were: Builders Mart, 111 N. Wall; Re­
sale Shop, 213 E. Missouri; Producers 
Co-op Elevator, 301 E. Missouri; and 
Feature Attractions, 211 E. Missouri.

"There was nothing taken in any of the 
stores, except for money that was taken 
from Feature Attractions,” said Snell. 
There was a lot of damage done to the 
inside of Feature Attractions looking for 
money. Several doors were damaged 
and also a wall. The safe was also broken 
open.”

An '81 Peterbilt, parked in the 200 
block of W, Houston, was also burglar­
ized sometime between Dec. 22 and 
Dec. 23. The left vent window was bro­
ken and stolen out of the truck was a 
Cobra CB-radio, Realistic CB radio, 
Colt Radar detector, and a .38 Special 
pistol.

A man reported to police that a hang­
ing bag was stolen out of his car some­
where between Vernon and Floydada. 
He left Vernon on Dec. 23 with his 
hanging bag and stopped twice. It may

have been taken in Vernon or the 400 
block of W. Lee. The bag contained 
mens and womens sweaters, jeans, curl­
ing iron, shoes, and makeup, all valued 
at a total of $380.00.

A home in the 400 block of East 
Grover was burglarized sometime be­
tween Dec. 23 and Dec. 25. The home 
was entered through the back door and a 
Curtis Mathis VCR and eight Uqies were 
taken. The value of items taken was 
placed at $870.00.

On Dec. 22 sometinae between 4:30 
p.m. and 6:45 p.m. a “Team Murry”, 20" 
red and white bike was stolen from the 
southwest side of Pizza Gold. The bike 
was parked there while the owner went 
inside Pizza Gold. When he returned the 
bike was gone.

Also on Dec. 22 police investigated a 
criminal mischief call. Sometime be­
tween 7:10 and 7:20 p.m., a man and his 
son were driving down the alley be­
tween Jeffie and Hallie when the rear 
glass in the pickup shattered. It appears 
to police to have been shot out with a BB 
gun. No one was injured.

Police also received a call last week of 
a woman’s poodles being attacked by 
two larger dogs. The big dogs broke 
through the fence dividing the two 
homes, located in the 100 block of J.B. 
Ave., and attacked the poodles. One 
poodle was killed and the other was 
severely injured.

Only one accident was reported to 
police during the week, on Dec. 21. It

Lockney Police Report
On December 20, a 1987 Nissan 

pickup truck was burglarized on North­
east First Street Taken in the burglary 
was approximately $525.00 worth of 
miscellaneous items.

On December 21, a 1980 Pontiac 
Firebird was burglarized on Southeast 
First Street. Taken in the burglary was a

Pioneer stereo, two Pioneer speakers 
and a new Die Hard battery, valued at 
approximately $555.00.

On December 25, officer Jerry Ed­
wards stopped a vehicle and arrested the 
driver for D.W.I. There were three in­
toxicated passengers in the vehicle that 
were also arrested and charged with 
public intoxication.

Plains Blue Stem 
WW Spar 

Klein Grass

CRP Grass Seed 
and

Grass Sowing

Contact: Hulon Carthel - 983-2377 
or: Monroe Shannon - 983-2363

By Christy Lopez 
The two Floydada High School sen­

ior spotlighted this week are Rachel 
DeLeon and Isidro Sanchez.

Payne's
Appliance Service
All Brands of Home Appliances repaired 

Also Vacuum Cleaner Parts and Repair 

FRFK Local Pickup and Delivery

CALL: Don Payne 
at (806)983-2939

school band all four years, serving as 
band representative her junior year. She 
was chosen the outstanding band mem­
ber last year. This year she is the drum 
major and band secretary. She has 
served on the student council for three 
years and has been a pastor chairman of 
her class for three years. Rachel sttends 
S t Mary Magdalen Church and is a 
member of the CYO (Catholic Youth 
Or nization). She plans to attend West

y
involved three cars at the intersection of 
200 N. 2nd and 400 West Jackson. A 
1980 Ford Thunderbird was stopped on 
North 2nd waiting to make a left turn, a 
1980 Pontiac Bonneville was sitting 
behind the Thunderbird when it was 
struck from behind by a 1981 Cutlass 
Supreme. The impact pushed the Bon­
neville forward striking the rear of the 
ThundCTbiid. All vehicles were driven 
away except for the Cutlass which was 
towed.

Courtroom

Activities
In county court on Decembo’ 22, 

Ronald Lance Ragland was charged 
with pulling a trailer with no license tags 
on a public road. There was no disposi­
tion on this case.

December 27, Mark Edward Griffith, 
32, of Hoyd County, was charged with 
DWI. He pled guilty and was fined 
$400.00 plus court costs of $90.50 and 
180 days confinement in the Floyd 
County Jail, which was probated for two 
years. His fine and court costs must be 
paid by Feb. 1,1989.

Also on Dec. 27, Jose Miguel Ramos, 
42, of Floyd County, pled guilty to DWI. 
He was fined $100.00plus court costs 
$88.50. He was sentenced to 45 days 
confinement in the county jail, and his 
drivers license was suspended for 120 
days.

Hinojosa ends 
Army training 
for leadership

Spec. Arturo Hinojosa Jr., son of 
Amada H. Hinojosa of Ralls, has com­
pleted a U.S. Army primary leadership 
course.

Students received training in supervi­
sory skills, leadership principles and 
small unit training techniques essential 
to a first-line supervisor in a technical or 
administrative environment 

Hinojosa is a cavalry scout at Fort 
Irwin, Calif., with the 63rd Armor.

His wife, Belinda, is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Pete Vallejo of Roydada.

M o t o r c y c l e  
operator safety 
courses offered

Texas has over 700,000 persons li­
censed to ride motorcycles. To sharpen 
riding skills, the Department of Public 
Safety (DPS) provides motorcycle 
operator training courses throughout the 
state to beginning and experienced rid­
ers in major urban areas. In addition, a 
mobile motorcycle operator training 
program is available for areas of the 
state that cannot support a permanent 
training site.

Since September 1, 1981, young 
adults age IS through 17 are required to 
take a motorcycle operator training 
course in addition to the classroom por­
tion of a regular driver’s education 
course in order to get a motorcycle li­
cense.

If you are a beginner or an old-timer 
wanting to improve your riding skills, 
call (512) 465-2021 for information on 
the course nearest you.
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RACHEL DcLEON

Rachel is the daughter of Domingo 
and Paula DeLeon. She is one of a fam­
ily of seven, which includes her twin 
sister, Rita. She has never attended 
school anywhere except in Floydada. 
She has been very active in the high ISIDRO SANCHEZ

JV girls play in Lockney
Floydada’s junior varsity girls bas­

ketball team got off to a strong start in 
the Lockney Classic Tournament on 
December 15. The JV team met and 
defeated the Smyer Varsity Girls 28 to 
26 in their opening match of the tourna­
ment. According to coach Regina 
Smith, “This was a good win for us, 
beating a varsity team. We had ten girls 
suited up and six of them were fresh­
men.”

Scoring for the Floydada JV were 
Lesha Black, 9; Tonya Powell, 8; Ker- 
rie Pitts, 5; Branda Breed, 4; and Amy 
Hinsley, 2.

Score By Quarters

Floydada 2 9 17 28
Smyer.........5 11 20 26

SPRINGLAKE-EARTH
TAKES JV GIRLS
December 16 found the girls hitting 

the boards against the varsity girls of 
Springlake-Earth. The juniw Whirl­
winds were defeated 62 to 42 in this 
second round competition.

Scoring for the Floydada girls were 
Black with 13, Powell with 7 and Nora 
Cisneros with 5. Breed and Hinsley 
each scored 4 points. Pitts, Kalli Hicks, 
Jennifer Crow and Christie Benjamin 
each made 2 points and Shonda Guthrie 
scored 1.

Score by Quarters

Floydada.... 3......16.....25.,...42
SE............... 19.....36.... 52.... 62

PETERSBURG CLAIMS 3RD
Playing for third place in the Lockney 

Classic, the Floydada junior varsity 
girls were beaten by Petersburg with a 
score of 47 to 37. “We were playing for 
3rd place, but lost the game,” said 
Coach Smith. “This was good experi­
ence for us, playing in a varsity tourna­
ment.”

Black and Powell each toted up 11 
points during the game. Pitts and Hicks 
made 4 each and Cisneros, Breed and 
Crow scored 2 tqiiece.

Score by Quarters

Roydada.... 7..... 12.....24.....37
Petersburg.. 7.... 23.... 37.... 47

COTTON CENTER OVER
FLOYDADA JV GIRLS
Again facing a varsity o{qx>nent, the

Whirlwind JV girls were edged out by 
two points on December 20 by Colton 
Center. The Floydada girls maintained 
the lead until the beginning of the fourth 
period when Cotton Center went ahead 
and never regained it.

According to Coach Smith, “We out 
rebounded 36 to 28 and even shot as 
well as they did. The thing that cost us 
the game was turnovers. We had 34 and 
they had only 15.”

Pitts led the scoring with 13 points, 
including a three-pointer. Linda Suarez 
made 8 points. Cisneros and Powell 
each posted 6, Tasha Poriee made4 and 
Hinsley had 2.

Score by Q uarters
Roydada 12 24 28 39
CC.................6 18 27 41

Texas State University and become a 
social worker. When asked what she 
likes best about Roydada High School, 
she replied simply, “It’s fun and it s my 
senior year!”

Isidro Sanchez is the son of Susie and 
Isidro Sanchez, Sr. He has one brother, 
Eddie, and one sister named Tammy. He 
has attended school in Roydada for 12 
years. He plays the saxaphone in the 
band and is also in show band, which 
happens to be his favorite subject. Isidro 
plans to attend West Texas State Uni­
versity and wants to major in business 
education. Another future plan that 
Isidro has is to visit France one day. 
When asked what specific thing about 
Roydada High School, he quickly said, 
“The snack bar,” When asked who he 
admires most, he replied, “My grandfa­
ther.”

Floydada  
School Menu

January 3-6
Tuesday:
Breakfast — Grape juice, pancakes, 

syrup, milk
Lunch — Hamburger pizza, com, 

pickle spears, applesauce, milk
Wednesday:
Breakfast — Orange juice, hot rice 

cereal, toast, milk
Lunch — Spaghetti w/meat, fried 

squash, green beans, oatmeal cookie, 
hot roll, milk

Thursday:
Breakfast — Pineapple juice, dry 

cereal, milk
Lunch — Bean beef chalupas, tossed 

salad, Spanish rice, jello w/applesauce, 
milk

Friday:
Breakfast— Apple juice, toast, jelly, 

milk
Lunch — Hamburger w/mustard, 

French fries, lettuce, tom iux;.s, pickles, 
peach cobbler, milk

STOP!
Check These Prices Before You 

A ll New 1989 Models 
PONTIAC

StK # V e h ic le ............. .........  L is t  D iscount
879 L e M a n s C p e ................................ .$7021 $486
700 G ra n d  A m  L E  C p e ................... $13,297 $1431
375 6000 L E  S edan ............................ $14,742 $1939
577 G ra n d  P r i x L E ........................... $16,257 $2128
036 Bonneville , L E ........................... $17,173 $2258
103 B onneville , L E ........................... $17,539 $2313

BUICK
027 S ky la rk  Sedan................................$13,080 $1371
026 S ky lark  L T D  S e d a n ................... $14,865
983 Century C o u p e ............................. $15,270 $2015
118 Century S e d a n .......................... ..$14,865 $1951
445 Century L T D  Sedan......................$16,618 $2202
446 R e p a lL T D .................................... $16,849 $2218
952. LeSabre  Sedan..... ..................... $17,319 $2273
028 LeSabre  L T D  S e d an .................. $18,701 $2462
457 E le ctra  P a rk  A v e n u e ................$22,391 '$2961

CMC
481 S -1 5 P / U .....................................$8877 $513
195 S -1 5 P / U .................................... $12,694 $1416
299 V] Ton  S ierra  P / U ...................$15,277 $1875
192 Vi Ton  S ierra , 4W D............... ....$17,466 $2155
985 Ton  S u b u rb a n ..........................$21,345 $2664
545 Ton  S u b u rb a n ..........................$22,556 $2833
726 'h i Ton Suburban, 4W D .......... $24,575 $3103

Buy!

Sell
Rebate Price 

$500 $ 6035 
$500 $11,366 
$500 $12,303 
$500 $13,629 
$600 $14,315 
$600 $14,626

t

$300 $11,409 
$300 $12,979 
$500 $12,755 
$500 $12,414 
$500 $13,916 
$400 $14,231 
$400 $14,646 
$400 $15,839 
$500 $18,930

$500'$7864 
$$00 $10,780 

2 . $13,402
2 $15,311
2  ̂ $18,681 
2 $19,723
2 $21,472

Limited Time Offer on Rebates ~  Hurry!
City Auto Inc.
Buick — Pontiac — GMC

Floydada 983-3767 Lubbock 765-6143
P le as in g  C ustom ers  since I960

aiimimimmiiiiiimimiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiHiiiH
=  H H H H H  Before the need . . .  You need your E
=  Insurance Agent. =

Don CasUebeny 
8954613

No matter how careful 
you are, you can't predict 
what other drivers will do. 
Make sure that you won’t

face financial problems that 
you can’t handle due to an 
auto accident Clar Schacht 

Agency Manager 
983-2906FARM BUREAU 

INSURANCE I
S  KenncIhHott UKXNEY - 6S2-2242 FLOYDADA - 983-3777 S
=  652-3456 101 S. WalL Ftoydada, Texas, 79235 =
iiuiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiia
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P U B L IC  NOTICE
NOTICE OF MEETING

A regular meeting of the Board of Directors for Floyd County Central 
Appraisal District will be held on Thursday, January 5 , 1989 at 9:00 A. M. 
in the Appraisal Office Board Room, Room 107, County Courthouse. 

_____ 12-29C

NOTICE TO BIDDERS

Floydada Independent School District is now taking bids for the sale of 
the school building located at South Plains, Texas.

OPTION 1: Building to be demolished and site left clean.

OPTION 2: Building to be bought as is with land as determined by the 
description below:

Being a 2.09 acre tract out of the north part of the South Plains School 4 
2/3 acre tract (300 foot by 680 foot) out of the northwest part of Survey 
No. 29, Block D-1, Floyd County, Texas;

Beginning at a 1/2 inch steel rod set at the northwest comer of the South 
Plains School 4 2/3 acre tract out of the northwest part of Survey No. 29, 
Block D-1, Floyd County, Texas, said rod being 460 feet S. 89'55'52" E. 
(based on the north line of said survey) of the northeast comer of Block 42 
of Original Town of South Plains, Floyd County, Texas, as recorded in 
Voluntje 52, page 336 of the Royd County Deed Reccx'ds;

Thence South (based on the west line of said survey) 439.1 feet along the 
west line of said school tract to a point SO feet South of the south line of 
main school building;

Thence East 147 feet along a line parallel and 50 feet South of the south 
line of said main school building to a point 11 feet East of the east line of 
said main school building;

Thence north 266.2 feet along a line parallel and 11 feet East of said main 
school building to a point 25 feet North of the north line of community 
center building;

Thence East 153 feet along a line parallel and 25 feet North of the north 
line of said community center building to the east line of said school tract;

Thence North 172 .^  feet to a 1/2 inch steel rod set for the northeast 
ccxner of said school tract;

Thence N. 89’52"W. 300 feet along the north line of said tract to the 
POINT OF BEGINNING aixi containing 2.09 acres.

For information and specifications contact Jimmie Collins, 
Administrative Assistant, 226 West California Street, Roydada, Texas 
79235. Phone 806-983-5167.

The bids will be opened at the regular board meeting of the Roydada 
School Board Monday, January 9,1989, 7:00 p.m.

Roydada Independent School District reserves the right to reject any or all 
bids and to waive any formalities of the bid.

12-29C

CLASSIFIED ADVERTISING
CARD OF THANKS

We fVe this means of thanking all our 
dear friends and relatives for being so kind 
and thoughtful to us while I was in the 
hospital and since returning home.

Your comforting words of encourage­
ment by telq>hone and visitation are appre­
ciated. The cards and flowers have helped so 
much but your prayers most of all gave us 
strength to see us through the ordeal artd has 
made each day brighter for us. It’s a joy to be 
home among friends I love the best The food 
brought in will tide us over for days to crane.

May all of you have a blessed New Year 
and may peace be with you and yours.

Peggy Medley 
12-29p

AUTOMOTIVE

HARD LUCK DRIVERS 
Automobile Insurance. Reasonable Rates. 
Small Down Payment. Monthly Pay. SR22 
Filings. Call David Cates.

983-3284
116 W. CALIFORNIA

tfc

FOR RENT
FOR RENT: 2 bedroom house, garage, 
$200 a month. Dqrosit, no pets, references. 
Inquire at 601 W. Grover, Floydada.

12-29p

HOUSES FOR SALE
FOR SALE: Lone Star Baptist Church 
Parsonage. 3 bedrooms, bath, living room 
and utUity. Call 296-0744,652-3600 or 652- 
3685.

l-19p

FARM SERVICES

WE CUSTOM MAKE AND FIT hose for 
all types of machines.

Brown Implement 
983-2281

MISCELLANEOUS

FOR SALE: two short couches, green-gold. 
Almost new. 983-2755.

12-29p

SERVICES

APPLIANCE SERVICE REPAIR: All 
kinds of household appliances. CaU Gene 
Lowrance, 983-2763.

3-2p

FOR SALE: Game table with 2 extra leaves 
aiKl 4 chairs to match, $150.00. Call 652- 
3567 or 652-3830.

l-5c

FOR SALE: Fresh pecans. $1.00 per 
pound. Austin Beedy. 652-2413.

12-29p

LONG DISTANCE SERVICE: Use Tri- 
State Communications, Inc. and save 15% - 

45%. No service fee if paid promptly. 
Donna FuUingim, 667-3480 or 667-3661.1- 
800-248-1097.

tfc

PUBLIC NOTICE 
For Sale

The City of Roydada, Roydada Independent School District and 
Mackenzie Municipal Water Authority have acquired certain real estate 
properties through Sheriffs Sales and are offering the following properties 
for sale to the general public:

1. £. 10' Lot 7, LolC ' Lots lOQ.through 18, Block 7. Htaierhea
Addition. ' ♦
Location - On north side of E. Lee Sl between 12th & 13th Streets.

2. Lots 15 - 16, Block 79, Original Town.
Location - North side of E. Mississippi St. on comer of 11th Street

3. Lot 8, Block 31, Original Town.
Location - South side of E. Grover S t on comer of 9th Street

4. Lot 15, Block 9, Original Town.
Location - North side of E. Ross St. between 9th & 10th Streets./

5. Lot 1, Block 36, Original Town.
Location - South side of E. Lee S t on comer of 10th Street.

6. Lot 16, Block 117, Original Town.
Location - North side of E. Georgia S t on comer of 8th Street.

7. Lot 9, Block 12, Original Town.
Location - North side of Grover S t on comer of 11th Street

8. Lot 12, Block 33, Original Town.
Location - North side of E. Lee S t between 11th & 12th Streets.

9. Lot 2, Block 33, Original Town.
Location - South side of E. Grover St. between 11th & 12th Streets.

10. Lot 5, Block 54, Original Town.
Location - South side of E. Jackson S t between 10th & 11th Streets.

11. Lot 1, Block 57, Original Town.
Location - South side of E. Virginia S t on comer of 11th Street

12. Lot 9, Block 48, Original Town.
Location - North side of W. Virginia S t on comer of 5th Street.

13. Lot 16, Block 98, Original Town.
Location - North side of Kentucky Street on comer of 11th Street

14. Lot 4, Sl/2 Lot 5, Block 1, Honerhea Addition.
Location - East side of 12th S t between East Lee and East Virginia 
Streets.

15. Lot 1, Block 33, Original Town.
Location - West side of 12th S t on comer of E. Grover S t

16. Lots 22-3, Pt. Lot 1, E. 20' of Lot 4, Block 141, Original Town. 
Location - South side of Houston St. (Hwy. 70) between 9th Street 
and Railroad.

INSTRUCTIONS:
1, Bids to be submitted by 5:00 P. M., Thursday, January 5,1989,

2 All bids shall be sealed and mailed or delivered to the City Secretary 
Office at City Hall, 114 W. Virginia S t, P. O. Box 10, Roydada, 
Texas 79235-0010.

3 The award of the bids will be made as soon as each taxing entity 
reviews and approves the bids.

4. Payment will be made in cash.

5 The above taxing entities reserve the right to accept or reject any and al 
bids submitted.

City of Roydada 
By: Parnell Powell, Mayor

12-29C

SHERMAN’S NEW raop shelled pecans. 
$3.50 Ib. In SheU, $1.00 lb. Custom Shelling, 
50^ per pound. 652-3405.

l-12c

WANTED
FARM LAND WANTED: To buy. rent or 
cash lease. Preferably dryland in the Lock­
ney, Sterley, South Plains, Cedar Hill area. 
Contact Larry or Wayne Bramlett. 806-652- 
3441.

l-26p

SHOP AT HOME!

â t t e n t io n I
Classified Users

Deadline for placing 
classified ads and cards 

of thanks is 3 p.m. 
on Tuesday

ALL CLASSIFIED
A D Y E R T I S m a M liS T .f i£

PAID IN ADVANCE.

Cards of Thanks are $3.00.
First run dasaiflcd ads np to 12 words 

arc $2.50.
Each additional word Is 20 cents. 

Repeal classified ads up to 10 words 
are $1.50

Each additional word b  15 cents.

Bordered classified ads are $2B0 per 
column Inch and will appear at the 

bottom of the page.

PERSONALS

If you drink, that is your privilege. 
If you would like to stop, let us help.

ALCOHOUCS ANONYMOUS
MEETS TUESDAYS AT 8:00 P.M. 

5th & Kentucky 983-3635
2nd floor - east wing_____ 983-5460

^fzipJ/our U PS

IT
b ish o p -^is(yP /ia rm a ^ i

C R H  System s
Com puters ,  Pr inters ,  

Software 
Programming  

Suppl ies
Accounting Service

122 W. C a l i fo rn ia  St. 
( 8 0 6 )  9 8 3 - 2 4 4 5

PUBL IC  NOTICES
NOTICE OF SHERIFFS SALE 

THE STATE OF TEXAS 

COUNTY OF FLOYD

By virtue of an Order of Sale issued out of the Honorable 1 lOTH Judicial 
District Court of Floyd County, on the 2nd day of December, 1988 by the 
Cledc thereof, in the case of
FLOYDADA INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT. ET AL VS. 
HUERTA, AMADO
Cause #4391-TS and to me, as Sheriff, directed and delivered, I will proceed 
to sell, at 2:00 OCLOCK P.M. on the 3RD DAY OF JANUARY, 1989 
which is the first Tuesday of said month, at the OFRCIAL door of the 
Courthouse of said Royd County, in the City of FLOYDADA Texas, the 
following described property, to wit:

TRACT 1: Lots 2 and 3 and those parts of Lots 5 and 15 now included in 
the Right-of way of the P&NT Rwy. Co., Block 98 of the 
Original Town of Roydada, Floyd County, Texas 
TRACT 2: Lots 9 and 10, Block 41 of the Original Town of Roydada, 
Royd County, Texas

Levied on the 2nd day of December 1988 as the property of

AMANDO HUERTA BY VIRTUE OF A DEED RECORDED IN 
VOLUME 197, PAGE 316 AND TWO WARRANTY DEEDS IN 
VOLUME 194, PAGE 622, VOLUME 198, PAGE 185

to satisfy a judgment amounting to $986.93 with interest from the 1ST 
DAY OP JUNE, 1988 at 10 per cent, per annum, and all costs of suit in 
favor of Q TY  OF FLOYDADA/MACKENZIE WATER AUTHORITY, 
FLOYD COUNTY, FLOYDADA INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

GIVEN UNDER MY HAND THIS 6th day of December 1988.

/s/ Fred A. Cardinal 
SHERIFF FLOYD COUNTY, TEXAS

BY /s/ Irene Miller DEPUTY 
12-15, 22, 29c

MOBILE HOMES J
ATTENTION FIRST time home buyers: 2 
and 3 bedroom mobile homes. No credit 
needed. We deliver. Call 806-894-7212.

l-19c

HOUSE: 3/2/2, large utility, patio, fire­
place, 2 storage houses, comer lot, close to 
school. Call after 6 p.m. 983-3078.

12-29p

REPOS: 2 & 3 bedroom mobile homes. No 
credit needed. Low down payment. Low 
monthly payments. Call 806-894-8187.

l-19c

3 BEDROOM, one bath, near Duncan 
School, covered patio, $19,000. Call Larry 
S. Jones Real Estate, 983-5553.

l-12c

HELP WANTED J
FULLTIME FARM hand wanted: irriga­
tion experience necessary. References re­
quired. Contact Ronnie Graham. 983-2470.

l-12p

CONTEMPORARY STYLING in this 2 
bedroom, one bath, with large kitchen, 
study, living room, formal dining, large 
sunroom; central heat and air, 1640 sq. ft. 
$46,500. Call Larry S. Jones Real Estate, 
983-5553.

l - 1 2 c

SEVERAL NICE 2 and 3 bedroom homes 
for sale. Call Sam Hale Real Estate, 983- 
3261, or come by 106 South Main S t

tfc
URGENTLY NEED dependable person to 
work without supervision for Texas oil 
company in Floydada area. We train. Write 
H. V. Dickerson, Pres., SWEPCO, Box 
961005, Ft. Worth, Tx. 76161.

12-29p

SELL OR TRADE large house with 3 
renUl units. 425 W. Mississippi Street. 
Shown by sqjpointment only. Would con­
sider farm land on trade. Call 983-2930 or 
983-3979

tfc
PART TIME SALES job: Straight 
commission, good opportunity, man or 
woman. 983-2671.

l-12p

3BEDROOM, 1 balhnear Junior High with 
central heat and air; good rental pnoperty; 
$22,500.00. Call Larry S. Jones Real Estate, 
983-5553.

l - 1 2 c

URGENTLY NEED depoidable person to 
work without supervision for Texas oil 
company in Lockney area. We train. Write 
H. V. Dickerson, Pres.. SWEPCO, Box 
961005, Ft. Worth, Tx. 76161.

12-29p

2 BEDROOM, one bath on 4 lots, central 
heat and air, over 1400 sq. ft. of living space; 
$3Z000.00. Call Larry S. Jones Real EsUte, 
983-5553.

l-12c

TEXAS REFINERY CORP. needs mature 
person now in Lockney area. Regardless of 
experience. Write T. R. Hopkins, Box 711, 
Fort Worth, Tx. 76101.

12-29p

A T T E N T I O N - G O V E R N M E N T  
HOMES from $1 (U-repair). Delinquent tax 
property. RqMssessions. Call 602-838- 
8885 Ext. GH2671.

l-12p

BO N D  LAN D S, INC REAL ESTATE
107 S. 5th Street P. O. Box 487

806-983-2151 Floydada, Texas 79235-0487
Dale Goen, Broker Frances Ashton, Office Manager

General Land Services, Sales, Leases, and Management

Probasco
Flying Service

OfTke at Floydada Municipal Airport
983-2314 or 983-5061

AERIAL PESTICIDE APPLICATION

Nights Call; Mitch Probasco - 983-2368 Craig Ellison - 652-3842

POOLE
WELL SERVICE

Sales & Service 
on all types 

submersible & turbine pumps
407 E. Houston 983-2285

Script Printing 
& Office Supply

*Commercial Printing 
*Offlce supplies & 

Famiture
*Buaineu Machines 

108 S. Main Floydada 983-5131

LAND LEVELING 
PUMP PITS

TERRACES
BENCHING

Np charge for road time - engineering 
Dewie Parson Fred Parson 
983-2646 293-4768

ALTERNATOR & STARTER 
REPAIRS

Norrell Tractor Parts 
215 S. Main 983-3417

I Windshields up to 40% off 
and a $50 rebate on most 

American made 
cars and trucks

ISTAPP BODY SHOP  
652-2354 or 652 3429

STORAGE SPACE
West Texas Mini Storage

c/o Assiter Insurance 
206 W. California 

983-2511

POOLE
MUFFLER & RADIATOR 
Sales and Installation 

Free pickup & delivery 
407 E. Houston 

983-2285

iOavid McGcmen ConstmetiorF:
Terrace#-Waterwaya- 
Water plta-Waab«a

983-3031

^ECONOMICAL STORAGE' 
TRY BARKER’S

Jewel Box-Mini Storage
and save your time and money. 

Phone 652-2642 
Comer Main & Locust 

Lockney, Texas.
BARKER BUILDING

• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •

ADAMS 
WELL SERVICE

Complete irrigation service 
5 years warranty, domestic pump

720 N. 2nd
983-5003

• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •
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BIG BLUE BONUS 
SPECIALS

2 liter Bottle

COCA-COLA
WITH ONE FILLED BIG BLUE BONUS BOOKLET I 
WITHOUT BIG BLUE g 7 0

ly WITH ONE FILLED BIG BLUE BONUS BOOKLET  ̂
WITHOUT BIG BLUE c O  ^
BONUS BOOKLET

*1 ■». • <..

GROCERY SPECIALS
ASSORTED REG OR DIET

SHASTA b  
SODA POP
HIDDEN VALLEY RANCH

HEALTH & BfAUTY

ALKA-SELTZER
PLUS 20 CT. 

PKG.

REGULAR

PHISODERM
CLEANSER 5 OZ. 

SIZE *2®* P B

SHELF SPECIALS
HORMEL SLICED

DRIED
BEEF 2.5 OZ. 

PKG.

p a r t y
-R a n c h  DIP 1.0 OZ. 

PKG

J0int!i.Moore.
DINTY MOORE

BEEF 
5 STEW 15 OZ. 

CAN

ALKASELTZER
D l l ie  n ig h t 20 CT.
r L U b  tim e  pkg

ALKA-SELTZER 
PLUS 36 CT 

PKG.

FOR RELIEF

BAYER 
ASPIRIN T̂̂L̂

REGULAR

CHAPSTICK 9  $  1
LIP BALM £ .  pV?s I

A' \ VLASIC

PICKLES 16 OZ. 
JAR

GLAZED CHICKEN/COD

‘ a o p

48 MED./32 LG. DIAPERS

SNUGGEMS
u l t r a BOX

SHELF 10 OZ. 
BOX

FROZEN FOODS 0  DAIRY

DRY ROASTED/COCKTAIL

PLANTERS 
PEANUTS

OUAIITY AND »IIVICI

MICROWAVE CR. STiaK»FILLETS

16 OZ. 
SIZE

10 3/8 ' COMPARTMENT

CHINET 
PLATES

WE WILL NOT INTENTIONALLY SELL ANY GROUND BEEF 
UNDER 80% LEAN AND WE PLEDGE TO MAKE OUR GROUND 
BEEF AT LEAST TWICE A DAY.

GDRTDN
FISH 7 8 OZ. 

BOX

15 CT. 
PKG.

HORMEL CURE 81 FULLY COOKED HALF OR WHOLE 'J'.Vv ?•

ijC il^ JP IZ Z A

PILLSBURY PEP./COMBO

MICROWAVE 3 9
B9 OZ 
PKG

Boneless HamsI

O

Voters
MALUMU.4

LUNCH 8 3/4" SIZE

CHINET
PLATES

$ 0 1 9
40 CT M  
PKG m m

ASSORTED

HIC
DRINKS a 79*
SUNSHINE CHEEZ IT/HI HO

SNACK $ 1 5 9
CRACKERS 16 OZ. ■  

BOX ■

SUNSHINE TRU BLU CHOC./VAN./LEMON

, SANDWICH $ 1 3 9
I COOKIES 24 OZ 1  

PKG ■

SUNSHINE

( VANILLA $ 1 3 9
j WAFERS 11 OZ ■  

BOX ■

■ '-'.Vi .a*.'- ' ■ •

■ ’W
Pact

REG OR JALAPENO NO BEANS

WDLF PLAIN 
CHILI

PILLSBURY ORIG./BUTTER

MICRDWAVE 
PDPCDRN lOVi OZ. 

PKG.

TOTINO'S ASSORTED

PARTY 
a g f ;  PIZZA

1 9
10 OZ. 
PKG.

PEPPERIDGE FARM VANILLA/COCONUT/ 
GERMAN CHOCOLATE/

3 LAYER ̂ u”SSe°̂ "̂
CAKE 17 OZ. 

BOX

WILSON'S'

S liced

 ̂Bacon

BORDEN'S EAGLE BRAND ASSORTED

ICE CREAM "c?r
BORDEN'S ORIG./CRISPY/TOFFEE

FROSTICKS . . .  . PAK.

8 0Z 
CTN.

1 LB. 
PKG.

15 OZ 
CAN

PACE HOT/MILD/MEDIUM

PICANTE 
SAUCE

FOR NEW YEARS

DRY SALT JDWLS
WILSON'S REG./POL./BEEF/CHEESE

SMDKED SAUSAGE lb
HORMEL'S CHUB SAMPLER

49^

n 99

OSCAR MAYER SLICED

LUNCHEON MEATS
CLAUSSEN KOSHER THE REFRIGERATED

QT
..............  JAR

BORDEN'S DIPS
BORDEN'S

SOUR CREAM . . .  CTN
BORDEN'S LOW FAT

CHOCOLATE MILK 1:?^
BORDEN S

BUHERMILK 'h GAL. 
CTN.

HEALTH b
DILL PICKLES
WILSON'S SLICED

16 OZ. 
JAR SUMMER

OSCAR MAYER CHUB

BRAUNSCHWEIGER

) SAMPLER < 0 9 Q  VVILSON S  S L IC E D  O f l C

SAUSAGE Vk°g"-Z^^ m e a t  b o lo g n a  V̂k°g" 33'^
8 OZ 
PKG.

29 WILSON'S

MEAT FRANKS
RED RIPE 
SLICING

* .

Comatoes
C

YOUR
CHOICE:

CALIFO RN IA

LEMONS
OR JEWEL

LIMES

PRODUCE SPECIALS

89®

PureSeot
SOKAcr

Saline
Solution

.5 OZ 
BTL

SNOW WHITE

CAULIFLOWER
FRESH GREEN

CABBAGE
SUPER SELECT

CUCUMBERS

EA.

LB

LB

MURINE CONTACT

LENS CLEANER
MURINE

LUBRICATING DROPS
MURINE DISINFECTING

SOLUTION
MURINE

SALINE SOLUTION »b?l"
MURINE STERILE ^ 0 9 Q

SALINE SPRAY

PRICES EFFECTIVE 
DECEMBER 2&31. 1988

DOUBLE STAMPS ON WEDNESDAYf ’ 
[Exclading Cigarette*]

DOUBLE COUPONS ON SATURDAY! 
[Roles Posted In Store]

ASSORTED

COLGATE 
TOOTHPASTE

4 6 OZ 
TUBE

WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIM IT QUANTITIES

VALUE BRAND

COLGATE 
TOOTHBRUSH

1 CT 
PKG


