
Health concerns cloud pesticide issue 
By JOHN BROOKS 

News Editor 

As Agriculture Commis-
sioner Jim Hightower, farm 
groups, farm workers and 
others wrangle with new pro-
posed standards for pesticide 
use and applications, health 
problems 	concerning 
agricultural chemicals have 
come to the forefront of the 
debate. 

Unknowns abound on each 
side of the issue. No studies 
have been done concerning the 
short — or long — term effects 

any pesticides may have on 
humans. Tests have been done 
in laboratories on rodents, apes 
and human-like simians, but 
there have been no concrete 
facts determined on what ef-
fect exposure to ag chemicals 
has on those most direclty ex-
posed to them: the farmer and 
his co-workers. 

During the past month, the 
Texas Dept. of Agriculture and 
the House Agriculture Com-
mittee have conducted hear-
ings accross the state, trying 
to determine the best stan- 
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dards for regulating the use of 
pesticides. 

In many instances, farmers 
and farmworkers gave conflic-
ting testimony concerning the 
use and effect of pesticides. 

Aerial applicators and others 
who have been directly 
targeted' by the proposed 
regulations have been vehe-
ment in their opposition to the 
regulations; in fact, one state 
official, asking to remain 
unidentified, proposed that "a 
new Olympic event, outright 
lying, should be introduced, 
and we should pick some of our 
nation's representatives from 
the people who testified at the 
hearings." 

The official told the News 
that an aerial applicator 
testified under oath that he 
"had been literally bathing in 

Parathion for 35 years, and had 
never suffered any ill effects." 
The official said, "The man was 
obviously lying. If he had got-
ten Parathion all over him 
every day for 35 years, he 
would be dead. That's just one 
example of the exaggerated 
testimony we have heard 
throughout the hearings. One 
side (those against the propos-
ed regulations) tells how safe 
and harmless these chemicals 
are, while farmworkers and 
others who want even more str-
ingent regulations are telling 
how they have been sick every 
day of their lives. There's a cer-
tain amount of truth being 
told, but neither side is telling 
the full truth." 

Since testimony began a 
month ago in public hearings 
on the regulations, health con- 

siderations have risen to the 
top. State officials with the 
TDA and the Texas Dept. of 
Health have learned how acute-
ly undertrained a majority of 
the state's doctors are in iden-
tifying and treating pesticide 
poisonings. 

"Our biggest problem is with 
the lack of training provided to 
medical school students con-
cerning pesticide poisoning," 
said Andy Welch, TDA 
spokesman. "Medical schools 
in this state and elsewhere pro-
vide little, if any, training con-
cerning pesticide poisoning 
and toxicology." 

Welch pointed out the case 
of Bryan farmworker Zacarias 
Ruiz as an example. 

Ruiz was exposed to a cotton 
pesticide not labeled for use in 
Texas, became ill and went to a 

physician. According to THD 
spokesman Bobby Davis, Ruiz 
did not tell the physician about 
the pesticide poisoning. The 
doctor, after taking Ruiz's 
temperature, gave Ruiz two 
aspirin to combat the man's 
fever. 

"That was the last thing the 
doctor should have done," 
Welch said. "If Ruiz had told 
the doctor what had happened, 
or if the doctor had any train-
ing concerning pesticide 
poisoning, he could have 
prescribed proper treatment. 
Instead, the aspirin caused the 
man's heartbeat to accelerate 
to the point where he died of 
cardiac arrest. The pesticide 
poisoning was not found until a 
toxicologist studied the man's 
blood sample." 

(Continued on Page 5) 
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uestions abound for school board 
year, beginning with the 
1986-87 school year, and the 
addition of a half-year of com-
puter literacy required in the 
eighth grade. The computer 
literacy course will be taught 
beginning next fall. 

The new high school courses 
will include advanced English 1. J.  1 

If you're in a quandary about 
the changes in Texas schools 
proposed by the State Board of 
Education, join your friends 
with the Dimmitt School 
Board. 

In a lengthy meeting Mon-
day, the board discussed some 
of the new programs already 
set forth by state law, and 
policies that will probably be 
adopted by the SBOE by 
March, 1985. 

However, superintendent 
Robert Ryan said, "We don't 
know just exactly what the 
final mandates are going to be 

IV, Correlated Language Arts 
III and IV, Computer 
Mathematics I and II, World 
Geography, Personal Business 
Management, Business Data 
Processing, Vocational Data 
Processing and Vocational 
Computer Programming. 

(Continued on Page 15) 

in many areas. We probably 
won't know before March, 
because these changes will re-
quire three readings before 
they are formally implemented. 
Of course, there's always a 
chance the new legislature, 
when it convenes in January, 
may make some changes in 
House Bill 72 (the law passed 
by the last legislature that 
called for the massive changes 
in the state's education 
system)." 

The board okayed the addi-
tion of 10 new classes to be 
taught at DHS every other 

Preston named 
new assistant CEA 

`IT'S IN THE BAG, SANTA—or barrel, that is,' Dimmitt Police 
Lt. Larry Edwards reports. Police say that public response to 
their Operation glue Christmas has been very good, so far. Items 
placed in the blue barrels located around town will be distributed 
to needy families in Dimmitt to help them have a merrier 
Christmas. Mainly used items have been placed in the barrels, 
but some new items have been given. Police Chief Don Franklin 
remarked that more food donations are needed. 

Sifuentez plea-bargains 
probation in slaying 

Man dies in accident 
Louis "Pete" Moreno, 19, of 

Dimmitt was killed in an acci-
dent early Tuesday morning on 
the lot of the North Gin just 
north of Dimmitt on US 385. 

An employee of the gin, 
Moreno was crossing the gin 
lot on foot, heading south 
toward the gin, at about 2:45 
a.m., when a tractor driven by 
a co-worker began heading in 
the same direction. 

Sheriff's deputies reported 
that the driver of the tractor 
said he did not see Moreno on 
the darkened gin lot until he 
was almost upon him. 

Apparently Moreno tried to 
avoid the tractor by dodging 
toward the right, but then slip-
ped and fell. The startled 
driver had also swerved to the 
'right, but thought he missed 
Moreno, officers said. 

Curtis Preston, a recent 
honor graduate at Texas Tech 
University, has been named 
assistant extension agent for 
Castro County. 

Preston was hired by the 
Commissioners Court Monday 
to replace outgoing CEA Men-
zies McWilliams, who is leav-
ing to pursue a master's degree 
at Iowa State University. 

Preston was born in Welch, 
and moved to Wolfforth in 
1972. He graduated from Fren-
ship High School at Wolfforth 
in 1980. In Wolfforth, he was 
active in 4-H and FFA, raising 
livestock and participating on 
judging teams. While at Tech, 
he participated in collegiate 
FFA and 4-H, and recently at-
tended the National Student 
Teacher Conference, a part of 
the National FFA Conference. 
He received his B.S. in 
Agricultural Education this 
month. 

"I'm really looking forward 
to working with the people of 
Dimmitt and Castro County," 
Preston said. "I'm looking for-
ward to working with the 4-H 
program — my family has been 
involved in 4-H for 25 years, 
and I hope we continue the 
strong 4-H program in the 

CURTIS PRESTON 
. . . New county agent 

county." 
CEA Seth Ralston said 

Preston "will work primarily 
with 4-H, as the program coor-
dinator, and with the ag pro-
gram. There were over 40 ap-
plicants for this job, and 15 
people were interviewed, and 
Curtis was number one." 

Ralston said Preston will 
start his duties Jan. 1. 

He was originally treated at 
Plains Memorial Hospital, 
then transferred to Deaf Smith 
General Hospital, where he 
died shortly after 8 a.m. 

Sifuentez was taken into 
custody without incident about 
30 minutes later by Dimmitt 
police, who found a butcher 
knife thought to be the murder 
weapon in the house. The knife 
had been washed, but had 
traces of blood on it. 

Sifuentez had been held in 
Castro County Jail since Aug. 
18 in lieu of $50,000 bond. He 
was released under the terms of 
his probation. 

"We don't usually like to 
give anyone probation when 
someone has been killed," said 
Davis. "We felt like we had a 
good case, but didn't know if 
we could get the murder con-
viction. I'm sure the defense 
felt they didn't want to gamble 
and were willing to settle for 
the involuntary manslaughter 
charge." 

Deputies reported that 
Moreno died of massive head 
injuries. A ruling in the death 
by Justice of the Peace Mar-
shall Young is still pending. A 
spokesman of the Sheriff's 
Dept. said no charges are an-
ticipated. 

Funeral mass for Moreno 
was scheduled for today 
(Thursday) at 3 p.m. at Im-
maculate Conception Catholic 
Church in Dimmitt. 

Band concerts 
are planned Greetings 

deadline 
is today Chamber banquet 

slated Jan. 17 Lighting 
contest 
tonight 

Two area schools are plann-
ing Christmas band concerts. 
Dimmitt's will be tonight 
(Thursday) and Nazareth's 
bands will play Tuesday night. 

The Dimmitt concert will be 
at 7 p.m. in the high school 
auditorium. Admission is free. 

Performers will include the 
sixth grade band, junior high 
band and high school band. 

Tuesday at 8 p.m., the 
Nazareth fifth grade, sixth 
grade, junior high, and high 
school bands will perform in 
the school cafetorium. There 
will be no admission charge. 

The public is invited to at-
tend both concerts. 

Wet 

Dimmitt homes should be 
aglow this evening for the an-
nual home decorating contest, 
sponsored by the Dimmitt 
Chamber of Commerce. 

Out-of-town judges will be 
touring the city this evening, 
searching for the most artistic, 
most original, and best 
lighting effects among homes 
entered in the contest. 

An entry blank appeared in 
the Nov. 29 issue of the News, 
and may be submitted by 4 
p.m. today to the Chamber of-
fice at 115 W. Bedford. 

Winners in the three 
categories will receive $25 gift 
certificates, which may be 
redeemed at many Dimmitt 
businesses. 

(Readings recorded at 7 a.m. daily for 
the preceding 24 hours.) 

Hi Lo Pr. 
Thursday 	 34 	18 
Friday 	 50 20 
Saturday 	71 25 
Sunday 	 76 42 
Monday 	 67 	23 
Tuesday 	 65 36 
Wednesday 	63 	43 
December Moisture 	 0  10 
1984 Moisture 	 20.08 

KDHN RADIO 
US Weather Observer 

Today is the deadline for 
signing up for Community 
Christmas Greetings projects 
in Dimmitt, Hart and 
Nazareth. 

Operation 	Christmas 
Greeting, sponsored by the 
Plains Memorial Hospital Aux-
iliary in Dimmitt, benefits the 
purchase of special items for 
the hospital. Donations may be 
given to any auxiliary member, 
or to the First State Bank in 
Dimmitt. 

Donations for the, Hart 
Cemetery Fund may be made 
at the Farmers State Bank in 
Hart. 

Nazareth residents may 
make donations at the Holy 
Family Catholic Church or 
Home Mercantile. Those funds 
benefit the Nazareth Cemetery 
Fund. 

Community residents are 
asked to donate the amount 
normally spent on cards and 
postage to send greetings to 
local friends. The names of all 
donors will appear in next 
week's Christmas edition of the 
News. 

Ignacio Sifuentez, 17, of 
Dimmitt, was sentenced to 
four years felony probation last 
Thursday, after pleading no 
contest to the Aug. 18 stabb-
ing death of Toribio Garibay of 
Dimmitt. 

Sifuentez was indicted by a 
Castro County Grand jury for 
murder in Garibay's death, but 
county-district attorney Jim-
my Davis and defense lawyer 
Jim Durham of Amarillo 
agreed to ask for a mistrial and 
Sifuentez' nolo contendre plea 
to the lesser charge of involun-
tary manslaughter. 

Sifuentez will pay $4,000 
restitution to Garibay's fami-
ly, plus $120 court costs and 
$15 per month reporting fee to 
the Adult Probation office. 

The trial threatened to 
become a violent affair before a 
jury was seated, as family 
members scuffled briefly out-
side 64th District Judge Jack 
Miller's courtroom last Tues-
day. Observers told the News 
that "angry glances" were ex-
changed between the Garibay 
and Sifuentez families, and the 
families were escorted from the 
courtroom after the plea 
bargain arrangement was an-
nounced to avoid any further 
conflict. 

Garibay was fatally stabbed 
in the heart and left lung short-
ly before 4 a.m., Aug. 18, dur-
ing a domestic disturbance at 
Sifuentez' residence at 635 N. 
W. 6th. According to 
eyewitness Eddie Gonzales, he 
and Garibay had gone to La 
Estrellita Dance Hall to play 
pool, then went to the 
residence of Irene and Nellie 
Ramirez on N. W. 6th. Si-
fuentez and his brother-in-law 
were there, and words were ex-
changed between Sifuentez and 
Garibay, according to Gon-
zales. 

Witnesses said the two went 
outside to argue, and that no 
blows were exchanged or 
weapons produced at that 
time. 

Gonzales testified that 
Garibay and others later went 
across the street to Sifuentez' 
house, where Garibay was 
stabbed in a fight that involv-
ed five persons. 

JACK JACKSON 
. . . Chamber speaker 

four years manufacturing ex-
perience with the Boeing Com-
pany, he gained greater insight 
into the corporate world with 
23 years as an instructor with 
American Airlines. 
. Tickets will go on sale Jan. 1 

at the Chamber office. 

Jack Jackson, chairman of 
the board of LDI Inc., a 
management consulting firm in 
Oklahoma City, is slated as the 
featured speaker for the annual 
Dimmitt Chamber of Com-
merce banquet Jan. 17 at the 
Expo Building in Dimmitt. 

The Citizen of the Year, 
Citizen Through the Years, and 
Teacher of the Year will also be 
honored at the banquet. 
Nominations are being ac-
cepted through Jan. 2 at the 
Chamber office for the honors. 

"Anyone may pick up a 
nomination form at the 
Chamber office, or we'll mail 
one out if they'll give us a call," 
said Chamber manager Delores 
Heller. 

"We're really looking for-
ward to our speaker this year," 
Heller said. 

Jackson served in the US Air 
Force, followed by employment 
with the Civil Service. After 
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Snow falls and puts a beautiful white 

blanket over the mountains, and even 

before this one is gone, others will fall. 

It will become deeper and deeper until 

the spring, when it begins to melt and 

provides life giving waters to many 

streams. These streams meet with 

others and become rivers and provide 

water for irrigation and lakes through-

out our land. 

Our Lord, Jesus has said that He will 

give to any that seek Him 	"a well 

of water springing up into everlasting 

life." — John 4. 14 

The Church is God's appointed agency in this 

world for spreading the knowledge of His love 

for man and of His demand for man to respond 

to that love by loving hit neighbor. Without 

this grounding in the love of God, no govern-

ment or society or way of life will long 

persevere and the freedoms which we hold so 

dear will inevitably perish. Therefore, even 

from a selfish point of view, one should support 

the Church for the sake of the welfare of him-

self and his family. Beyond that, however, 

every person should uphold and participate in 

the Church because it tells the truth about 

man's tile, death and destiny; the truth which 

alone will set him free to five as a child of 
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11:00 

Annul Mit Ourrii 
Of Uour Thula 

8:00 LA ASAMBLEA CRISTIANA 
"Full Gospel" 400 NE 5th 

PRIMERA IGLESIA 
BAUTISTA MEXICANA 

300 NE 7th 
Pastor Van E. Hughes 

Secretaria Sara Salinas 
Tesororo Gabriel Montlel 

Domingo: 
Estudios Biblicos 
El Sermon 	 
Miercoles: 
Instruction Biblico 

BIENVENIDOS A TODOS! 
ASSEMBLY OF GOD 

Tom and Linda Mullins, Pastor 
302 SE 2nd 

Once again it is pheasant 
hunting season. If you were in 
town you saw from one to six 
hunters in every vehicle. Phea-
sant hunters were all over the 
place on Saturday. They 
started the day with a 
breakfast sponsored by the 
Kiwanis Club at the Expo 
Building at 3 a.m. 

Guy and Oleta Walser enter-
tained several during the phea-
sant hunting weekend — Ben-
nie Gollehon and his son, Lee, 
and friends, Vernon Walton 
and Terry Andrews, all from 
Bay Town, Oleta's nephew, 
Rusty Boling, and friend, Bill, 
from Dallas. 

Randy Morgan told me he 
knew he would have company 
at least once a year — pheasant 
hunting season! He entertain-
ed nine on his farm, including 
his cousins from Uvalde. 

Glenn and Mona Merritt in-
vited relatives to hunt on their 
farm — Mark and Kay Merritt 
and Lori from Midland, Ed and 
LeAnn Kramer from Kings-
ville, Brock and Susan Mer-
ritt and boys Brian and 
Derek and Mable Brock from 
Dimmitt, John and Dorothy 
Street, and Mike and Sharla 
Blanton from Lubbock. They 
celebrated little Lori's second 
birthday on Saturday. 

The Vaden Kirbys and An-
thony and Mary Mays enter-
tained several from the Dallas 
area: H. P. and Elsie Smith, 
Jay and Geneva Bratton, Mr. 
and Mrs. Griffin, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe Fectol. 

The Howells cooked dinner 
for 44 hunters coming from 
Amarillo, Turkey and other 
places. Hattie Howell came in 
from Weatherford for all the 
excitement. 

R. D. Stewart, Don Lesley 
from Lubbock, Jack Cook and 
friend, Prentess, from Paris 
were among the group. 

The Jim Wrights invited 25 
hunters to hunt with them, one 
coming from as far away as 
Chicago. 

I asked Marietta Smithson if 
she had some hunters at her 
home and she said, "always!" 

Beash Bradford entertained 
her niece and husband, Doris 
and Bob Davis for the phea-
sant hunt. 

Garner Ball did not go hun-
ting but two of Ysleta's 
nephews did and they brought 
their two dressed pheasants 
and set them on the back porch 
while they were visiting. When 
they were ready to leave they 
picked up their sack and left —
but they picked up a sack of 
peanuts instead of the sack 
with the pheasants! So the 
Balls have pheasants to eat. 

The only accident I heard 
about was one man cut his 
finger while dressing a phea-
sant. It required six stitches. 

Louise Kemp had a wonder-
ful trip to Atlanta, Ga. where 
she spent a month with her 
daughter and family, Dr. 
Leland and Ginger Ward and 
little 3-year-old Jinsie. They at-
tended the Thanksgiving pro-
gram for Jinsie's nursery 
school and Louise enjoyed 

MACEDONIA BAPTIST 
412 North East Street 

Sunday— 
Sunday School 	..... 	 9:45 

Morning Worship 	  11:00 

Training Union  	6:00 

Evening Worship 	 7:00 

Monday— 
W.M.U. 	 4:30 

Tuesday— 
Brotherhood 	 7:55 

Wednesday— 
Prayer Meeting 	 7:30 

Friday— 
Sanctuary Choir 	 

Pastor Ruben Velasquez 
Sunday School 	  10:00 

. 9:45 Morning Worship  	11:00 

11:00 Sunday Night 7:00 

600  Wednesday— 
Wednesday Night 	 . 	. 7:30 

7  00 Friday— 
Friday-Prayer 7:30 

Sunday—
Sunday School . 
Morning Worship 	 

Evangelistic Service 

Wednesday—
Mid-Week Service 

visiting and seeing all the in-
teresting places in Atlanta. 
She reported the trees were in 
their "full beauty" — the 
golds, reds, yellows, and 
browns. 

Mary Pyatt and Jauvada 
Curtis of Amarillo were guests 
in the home of Morgan and 
Geneva Dennis over the 
weekend. They all went to Lub-
bock where they met Decimae 
Dennis from Midland, Debbie 
and Connie Dennis from Lub-
bock, and Betty Dennis and 
they were all guests in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Charles 
Graham. Geneva's niece, Wan-
da Swager, from Milton-
Freewater, Ore., was in Lub-
bock visiting so they had a 
family get-together. 

Johnnie Vannoy was hostess 
to the Thursday Bridge Club 
that met at the Senior Citizens 
Center for lunch and a day of 
bridge. Johnnie won high score 
and Faun Welker won second 
high. Others playing were 
Helen Richardson, Rosalie 
Hawkins, Beash Bradford, 
Cleo Forson, Emily Cling-
ingsmith, Alice Collyer, Ber-
nice Hill, Jo Gregory, Loranell 
Hamilton, and Jean Christian. 

The shower for Laura 
Shelton, bride-elect of Joe Col-
lins, was held in the pretty 
home of Nancy Fuller. Joe's 
mother, Darlene and his grand-
mother, Katy Collins, and his 
aunt, Mrs. Jim Collins were in 
the receiving line. I met 
Laura's mother, Sandra 
Shelton, from Fort Worth and 
her grandmother, Mrs. 
Shelton, from Akron, Ohio. 
The Collins family is another 
one of my special families since 
I have known them all through 
the years since we moved to 
Dimmitt. 

Jack and Charlene Howell, 
Don and Coby Moke went to 
Weatherford to see Mr. and 
Mrs. Moss Howell recently and 
they reported a lovely time. 

Zonell Maples had a fun 
time for Thanksgiving. She 
spent a couple of weeks with 
her son, Tomie and Chris 
Maples and their children in 
Spencer, Okla. All the children 
were involved in basketball 
tournaments while she was 
there, even the six-year-old, 
Garrett. The twins, Kellie and 
Kylie, who are 10 now, were 
playing in the same tourna-
ment, but Jarrett and Garrett 
were playing at different places 
— in fact, across town — so 

Zonell saw a lot of the city. 
Wade, Walter, and Wyette 

Maynard attended the Dinner 
Theatre in Amarillo where they 
saw the play, "Ready when you 
are, C.B." They reported a fun 
time. 

A bridal shower and tea 
honoring Sandy Hoff, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Bud Hoff of 
Dalhart, bride-elect of Kirk 
Farris, son of Mrs. and Mrs. 
Billy Joe Farris of Dalhart, 
was held at Dalhart Country 
Club Sunday Dec. 2, from 3:30 
to 5:00 p.m. 

Attending from Hart were; 
Augusta, Suzanne, Peggy and 
Stephanie Farris, Retta Cluck 

9:45 
11:00 
6:00 
7:00 

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
1201 Western Circle Drive 

Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 
Morning Worship 	  
Training Union 
Evening Worship 	 
Wednesday— 
Prayer Meeting 
Choir Rehearsal 

BIBLE BAPTIST CHURCH 
501 SE 3rd - 647-2402 

Rev. Kenneth Carroll, Pastor 
Sunday— 
Sunday School   10:00 

Morning Worship 	 11:00 

Evening Worship 	  6:00 

Wednesday— 
Wednesday Service 	 7:00 

7:30 
8:10 

HOLY FAMILY CATHOLIC 
Nazareth - 945-2616 

Very Rev. Harold L. Waldow, Pastor 
Sunday— 
Sunday Morning Masses 	 9:00 

Saturday— 
Saturday Night 
Obligation Mass 	  7:30 

Week Days— 
Morning Mosses 	  7:30 

Baptism—lost Sunday of each month. 

ST. JOHN'S CATHOLIC CHURCH 
Hart 

Very Rev. Harold L. Waldow, Pastor 
Sunday— 
Sunday Morning Moss . 	 11 :30 

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
SW 4th at Bedford 

Dale wells, Minister 
Sunday— 
Bible Study  	9:30 

10:30 
6:00 

Morning Worship 	  

9:45 	Evening Worship 	  

11:00 Wednesday- 

6:00 	Bible Class for all 	  7:30 

LEE STREET BAPTIST 
Ronnie Travis, Pastor 

Phone 647-2300 
Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 
Morning Worship 
Training Union 
Wednesday— 
Mid-Week Services 7:30 

and Jewell Scott of Dimmitt. 
It's beginning to look a lot 

like Christmas! My neighbors 
down the street, Mike and Jan 
Baca have beautiful deocra-
tions, as well as Jan's sister 
and family, Gene and Shari 
Bradley. Some of the homes I 
have seen with pretty decora-
tions are: the Howard 
Smithsons, the Andy Mays, 
the Lonnie Bells, the Garland 
Colemans, the Lint Merritts, 
the Virgil Justices, the Ken-
neth Heards and others I will 
try to mention next week. 

Carol Lantz took Faye and 
Christy Killough Christmas 
shopping on Saturday. Christy 
said they just ate and shopped 
all day and had lots of fun. 

The FBC choir enjoyed sup-
per and practice on Saturday 
night — the tables were 
decorated with green tinsel 
down the center with red velvet 
filled with pine cones, and red 
Christmas balls. The group en-
joyed stuffed potatoes, salads, 
and desserts. 

On Sunday evening, 
"Christmas Praise" was 
presented by the choir at the 
FBC under the direction of Joe 
Higgs. Several sang solos and 
gave their testimonies in-
cluding Cheryle Pybus, Ann 
Murphy, Zelda Ellison, Walter 
Maynard, Linda Davis, Shirley 
Peggram and Debra Ball. 

Jean DuLaney and her 
daughter, Poppy Head from 
Hereford were in town for the 
Young Homemakers Bazaar. 

The Week of Prayer for 
Foreign Missions was held last 
week. The theme was: 
"Because I Love Him." On 
Monday the group met in the 
home of Ruth Hays with Max-
ine Tidwell bringing the pro-
gram. Ruth's little grand-
daughter Brooke Jarecki from 
Amarillo was there to help with 
hostess duties. 

Tuesday they met in the 
home of Esta Vandiver with 
Irene Carpenter bringing the 
program. 

On Wednesday night the 
church members enjoyed a 
covered-dish supper and Deb-
bie Annen showed a film on the 
story of Lottie Moon. 

Thursday morning the group 
met in the home of Joyce Davis 
with Debbie Annen giving the 
program. 

A baby shower was given for 
Jennifer Miller and her hus-
band, Tom, who have a little 
baby girl, Diana Renee, who 
was born Nov. 28. 

On Friday morning they met 
in the home of Ginger Olson 
with Ettie McDermitt bringing 
the program. 

Sharon Barker, who is a 
medical missionary at Womens 
Christian Hospital in Multan, 
Pakistan, arrived in Amarillo 
Saturday night where she was 
met by her parents Elvis and 
Joy Barker, and her grand-
parents Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Lamm of Sayre, Okla. Sharon 
is a registered nurse-midwife. 
She will be spending her six-
month furlough visiting family 
and friends in Dimmitt, Sayre, 
and Erick, Okla., her sister 
Pam and James Crookham and 
boys Chris and Jason in 
Evansville, Ind., and friends 
in Philadelphia, Pa., Dallas and 
San Antonio. 

10:00 
11:00 
7:30 

FRIDAY & SATURDAY, DECEMBER 14-15 

Carlene, 4 
7:30 

NEW HOPE MEMORIAL 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Rev. James Alexander, Pastor 
Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 
Morning Worship 	 
Evening Worship 	 
Wednesday—
Mid-Week Services 

10:00 
11:00 
7:00 

Surma 	R'NGWALU 

A UNIVERSAL 
PICTURE PG 

7:00 

CHURCH OF GOD OF PROPHECY 
309 NW 4th - 647-3403 
Wayne Mullin, Pastor 

Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 
Morning Worship 	 

Evening Worship 
Wednesday—
Wednesday Service . 

CARLILE 74eatee 

IMMACULATE CONCEPTION 
CATHOLIC CHURCH 

Rev. Norman Boyd, Pastor 
1001 W. Helsel! • 647-4219 

Saturday Evening Mass — 

In English 	 .7:30 

Sunday Morning Masses— 
In English . 	 .8:D0 

In Spanish .. 	 .10:00 

Catechism 	 9.00  
Holy Day Masses— 
In English, Morning 	 700  
In English, Evening 	 TOO  
Reconciliations— 
Friday Night 	 7:30 

Saturday Afternoon 	 400  
Saturday Night 	 700  

Baptism by appointment. 

Misa del Sobado— 
En Ingles  	.7:30 

Mises Dominical— 
En Indies ... 	 8:00 

En Espanol . 	 10:00 

Doctrine .... 	....... 	.. 9:00 

Mises de Guarder— 
En Ingles, a la monana 	 7:00 

En Ingles, a la noche 	 .7:00 

Reconcillacion— 
Viernes  	 .7:30 

Sobado, o la torde 	 4:00 

Sabado, a la noche 	 .7:00 

... 10:00 
• 11:00 

Dimmitt, Texas 

Happy 
anniversary! 

7:00 

PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH 
Western Circle Drive 

Edward D. Freeman, Pastor 
Sunday— 
Church School 
Common Worship 
Wednesday—
Bible Study 

9:45 

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
600 Western Drive - 647.5478 

Terry L. Griffith, Minister 

Sunday— 
Bible Study . 
Morning Worship 
and Lord's Supper 
Evening Worship 
Wednesday—
Bible Study 

10:50 
7-00 

7:00 

FIRST UNITED METHODIST CHURCH 
Hart 

Steve Uirey, Pastor 
Sunday— 
Sunday School 	  10:00 

Morning Worship 	  11:00 

UMYF   5:00 

Evening Worship 	 6:30 

SUNNYSIDE BAPTIST CHURCH 
Bently Gwyn 

and Benny Villareal, Pastors 
Servicios en Espanol 

Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 10:00 
Morning Worship 	  11:00 
Training Union  	6:00 
Evening Worship 	 7:00 
Wednesday— 
Prayer Service 	 7:30 

VOGEL 
CATTLE CO. 

Hereford, Texas 

is interested in 

CONTRACTING 
FEEDER CATTLE 
for future delivery. 

Contact: HERB VOGEL, Owner 
806-364-6151 

LA IGLESIA DE DIOS 
DEL PRIMOJENITO 

East Helsel! St. 
Sunday— 
Sunday School  	10:00 
Sermon  	11:00 

Lord's Supper 
and Feet Washing 	 11:30 

Evening Worship 	 7:30 

Wednesday— 
Wednesday Services 	 7:30 

9:30 
10:30 
6:00 

IGLESIA DE CRISTO 
E. Lee and SE 3rd 

Evangelista - Jose Valdez 
Sunday— 
Bible Study 	  
Morning Worship 	  
Evening Worship 	  
Wednesday— 
Bible Classes for all 	 

9:45 
10:45 
5:30 

FIRST UNITED METHODIST 
Vernon O'Kelly, Pastor 

110 SW 3rd - 647-4106 or 647.4107 
Sunday— 
Sunday School 
Morning Worship 	 
MYF, Jr. Hi 8 Sr. Hi 	 

Evening Worship 	..... 	6:30 

Wednesday— 
General Meeting 
WSCS, Morning 	  9:30 

Choir, Night 	7:30 

(Compiled from the Community Birth-
day Calendars sponsored by the 
Castro 	County 	Extension 
Homemakers, the Nazareth Swift 
Band, and the Hart Band.) 

DECEMBER 14 — Mr. and Mrs. 
Jose Ibarra Sr. 

DECEMBER 15 — Jimmy Ray and 
Greta Davis, Kenneth and Marilyn 
Covington. 

DECEMBER 16 — Jerry and Carol 
Kern, Tom and Raylene Hoelting. 

DECEMBER 17 — Ed and Kim 
Watson, Melvin and Mary Malone. 

DECEMBER 18 — Harold and Deb-
bie Morgan, Albert and Letha Key, 
Coy and Nancy Ringwald. 

NOW LEASING 

WEST TEXAS 
MINI-STORAGE 
Lock it and leave it! 

647-3427 or 296-6372 

8:00 

Published Through The Cooperation Of The Local Ministerial Association 
And Sponsored By The Undersigned Individuals And Business Institutions 

HAYS IMPLEMENT CO. 

DIMMITT TV CABLE CO. 

SEALE FLORIST 

HIGGINBOTHAM-B-ARTLETT CO. 

DIMMITT EQUIPMENT CO. 

THE CASTRO COUNTY NEWS 

FIRST STATE BANK 

C & S EQUIPMENT CO. i  

GOODPASTURE, INC. 

• 



risco C. 

M M'S 
SUGAR SAM CUT 

YAMS 	 
s, 00 OFF LABEL-FAMILY SIZE 

MARGARINE SPREAD 

BLUE BONNET ' 
CHEESE LOAF 

VELVEETA 
KRAFT HALFMOON CHED COLBY LONGHORN 

CHEESE 
KRAFT PHILADELPHIA 

CREAM CHEESE 

$ 1 39 

$189 

979 

89; 

T
3 

1

B L
B 

1 UB 
BOX 

10
KG•

OZ 
P 

PKG 

CHEESE BALLS 
DEL MONTE FRUIT 

COCKTAIL 	 
GREEN TAINT WHOLE OR SLICED 

PKG 89` 
i4d 89c 
26 OZ 

PKG 

BOW 

$219 
80,L 79c 

10 OZ 

79C 

14OZ
N 

$ 1 °9 
CA 

PKG  
$ 179 

6 OZ 
JAR CHERRIES 

SWEETENED CONDENSED MILK 

!IIGIE,ITBDRAND 

DATES 
LARGE ROLL 

SCOTTOWELS .  

SPECIALS GOOD DEC. 73 

THRU DEC. 79, 1984 

STORE HOURS' 

Monday thru Saturday 
7 a.m. to 8 p.m.  

Sunday 
8 a.m. to 7 p.m. 

Thrifty 
MeSayer 

December 13, 1984 	3 Castro County News 
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	Tir FESTIVE FOODS FOR  
11APPY HOLIDAYQ 

I CALIFORNIA SUNKIST NAVEL 
NEW CROP!  

TEXAS PECANS 
BETTY CROCKER 

ASST. SUPER MOIST LAYER 

CAKE 
MIXES 

ORANGES $ 1 59 LB. 
EXTRA FANCY WASHINGTON RED DELICIOUS 

LB 49c 
B. 49c 

EA 39; 
39c 

LB 19c 
LB 59c) 

APPLES 
CALIFORNIA ZIPPER SKIN 

TANGERINES 
CALIFORNIA GREEN PASCAL 

CELERY 	 
PORTALES MARYLAND SWEET 

YAMS 
IDAHO SWEET YELLOW 

ONIONS 
CALIFORNIA GREEN 

BROCCOLI 

LB. 
5 LB. 
BAG 

KAHN'S HICKORY GROVE BONELESS FULLY COOKED 
12-14 LBS. AVERAGE 

WHOLE HAM COCA-

COLA 

x199 REGULAR 

'411L.......0011111°1° 32 OZ. BOTTLES 
OR DIET , 

6 PACK 

HALF OR PORTION 
4.7 LBS. AVERAGE 

$ 1 79 
PLUS DEPOSIT 

LB $21 9 LB. 
5 LB. 
BAG 

SLICED SLAB 

1 BACON 	LB S 29 
HEAVY GRAIN FED BEEF BONELESS HORMEL PORK LINK SAUSAGE 

11 OZ $ 1 19 
PKG. • 

oz 
C 
0.0 NZ 

8 oz 09c 
PKG 

9 69 
LITTLE SIZZLERS CHUCK ROAST LB 
FRESH GULF COAST FRESH 73., LEAN 

GROUND BEEF $ 
1 09 RUFFLES 

POTATO CHIPS OYSTERS ALL GRINDS COFFEE 

FOLGER'S 
OSCAR MAYER MEAT OR BEEF SLICED USDA CHOICE HEAVY GRAIN FED BEEF 	$ En 89 

ROUND STEAK LB. I 

$ 99 16 OZ. BAG 
BOLOGNA 

59 
1 LB. 
CAN 

• OCEAN SPRAY 
CRANBERRY SAUCE 
WHOLE OR STRAINED 

SWANSON 

CHICKEN BROTH 

3 $ 1 °° 14.5 OZ. CAN 	FOR 16 OZ. CAN 59 C 
monalawavoT id 

Jellied 
~GaTlberryS'411.1"1111"1"1111.1.1 5/. 

REGULAR OR BUTTER FLAVOR 	LESUEUR MINI 

SWEET PEAS 	17 OZ.6 
GLADIOLA 	OR YELLOW 

MINUTE MAID 

ORANGE JUICE 
REG., REDUCED ACID, OR MORE PULP 

10 TO 12 OZ. CAN 

9
; 	DEE & C HALVES OR PIECES 

PECANS 
8o, 959 
PKG 

$ 'I 99 

ilopz 9 59 
$159 

1 A( 0G , 
B OZ si99 
CAN 

$21 9 
6480 

JAR 59c 

CORNBREAD
WHITE 	 MIX FOR 4 ,,,,,,, I suoo 

siviiiiiiii 
$249 

3 LB. 	

DEL MONTE 

PINEAPPLE 

MINCE MEAT 

CRISCO 
I/ MILK/SEMI-SW. 

15 1/ OZ. 59; CHOCOLATE CHIPS 	 
REESE'S PEANUT BUTTER FLAVORED 

$ 299 28 OZ. 

9.6 OZ. 419C 
PKG. N 

C 23 OZ.79 

171 OZ. $649 
BOO • 

15 OZ. 
$in 

	 CAN 

BORDENS NONSUCH 

BAKING CHIPS CAN 
HERSHEY GROUND BONUS PACK PLAIN OR PEANUT 

COCOA 	 
HERSHEY UNSWEETENED BAKING 

CHOCOLATE 
KRAFT MARSHMALLOW 

CREME 

MARSHMALLOWS 
KRAFT MINIATURE 16 OZ .

79; 
 

12 OZ. CORN/RICE, 15 OZ. WHEAT 	
$1 49 

DURACELL D OR C 969 

959 

$199 

BATTERIES 	 $279  
DURACELL 9-VOLT 

BATTERIES 

PEG. 

1 CT. 
PKG. 

BATTERIES TIDE 	 
GREEN GIANT WHOLE SPEARS OF 

ASGARAGUS 
PLANTERS 

DURACELL AA OR AAA 

BATTERIES 
DURACELL 9-VOLT 

$ '1 59 9.25 OZ. BATTERY CHEX 	 BOX 

$179 
12 OZ. 

	 PG 89` 
150 CT.79; 

Sur. 79c 
s999 

20 LB. 

40 „ $299 
Bit 

69; 

DURACELL AA PLANTERS 

CA 

7. 79C 
O
N
Z 

41/2 OZ. $119 
JAR 

LCOCKTAIL NUTS 

ONION SOUP 

4 CT. 
PKG. 

GREEN GIANT 4 EARS 

CORN ON THE COB ..99 
C $359 2 CT. 

PKG. MUSHROOMS 	 
REYNOLDS HEAVY DUTY ALUMINUM 

FOIL 	18 IN., 371/4 SQ. FT. 

SHURFINE FROZEN SPEARS OF 

BROCCOLI 	 Do oz. 59c KLEENEX SOFTIQUE SYLVANIA LIGHT BAR 

99; 5179 

5119 

919 

$399 
YR: 

VASELINE INTENSIVE CARE 

LOTION $1 89 	iooz. 

FACIAL TISSUE ... 
CHIFFON DINNER 

NAPKINS 
FLIP-FLASH 	 PKG. EACH 

GREEN GIANT BUTTER SAUCE OR CREAM STYLE HOLSUM THROWN MANZANILLA 

STUFFED OLIVES 	7,5 $ 1 09 
MINK DIFFERENCE REGULAR OR DRY 

NIBLETS CORN 
PEI RITZ DEEP DISH 

PIE SHELLS 
MRS. SMITH'S 

CHERRY PIE 
REGULAR OR EXTRA CREAMY 

COOL WHIP 

7 OZ .  
BTL SHAMPOO 

CONC. DETERGENT SHURFINE RED MARASCHINO PUMP TOOTHPASTE 

ALL 	  
40' OFF LABEL-LIQUID CLEANER 

PINE-SOL 

4.5 OZ 
PUMP COLGATE 

EXTRA STRENGTH CAPSULES 

TYLENOL 	 

GMAFFILIATED 
We're proud to give you more! FOODS INC 

WIMP SIOPE WE 
GIVE 

WE ACCEPT F000 STAMPS 
WE RESERVE THE RIGHT 10 LIMIT QUANTITIES 

DOUBLE ON WEDNESDA Y! 
WE HAVE GIFT CERTIFICATES! 

GIVE FOOD FOR CHRISTMAS! 



FOR SALE OR TRADE 
13/4  acres, two houses, mobile 
home connections. Main 
house has three bedrooms, 
nice kitchen, nice carpet, 
covered patio and garage, 
and is in good condition. 

1607 SUNSET CIRCLE 
Join a beautiful neighbor-
hood! Lovely 3 bedroom, 13/4  
bath, basement office and 
many other nice advantages. 

1005 MAPLE 
Very personable home in a 
well established neighbor-
hood. 3 bedroom, 2 bath, 
large kitchen. 

1109 W. BEDFORD 
Good house for rental or to 
start your family in. 3 
bedrooms, 1 bath, garage 
and storm cellar. 

HOUSE FOR SALE 
Would make good rental pro-
perty! 

600 JONES 
3 bedroom, 1 bath, large kit- 
chen, corner lot. 

162 ACRES 
IRRIGATED FARMLAND 
With 6-in, irrigation well on 
natural gas, 2,800 ft. of 
underground tile. Milo crop 
is included. West of the 
Easter community. Financ-
ing available. This land "lays 
good." 

-1.11 intim* A t 	1•11•1T4Or 

4••• 
• hi+ 00... Of 4.1.4.00.11 C-11111C110111 	MC 

aspen wl• 	%Kt .00 

CALL US AT 647-3141 
Jim Killingsworth, Broker 

647-5262, Res. 
Debbie Felts, Sales 

647.3419, Res. 

Choice 5 '. section Castro County. Texas ranch 
with approximately 800 acres of wheat land. Will 
divide easily Into different combinations of grass 
and farmland if buyer desires smaller acreage. 
Priced to sell at $230 per acre. 

Please call for details on choice 8 V. section ranch 
In Deaf Smith County, with approximately 1031 
acres In wheat land. 

SCOTT LAND CO. 
Da G. Scott, DamItt. Texas 79027 
Phone 806-647.4375 or 647.5562 

YARD 
SALE 

501 West Jones 
Friday & Saturday 
9 a.m. to 5 p.m. 

Toys, Clothes 
and Miscellaneous 

LOOK 
at the good selection 

of new and used 
vehicles for sale at: 

STEVENS 
CHEVROLET 

OLDSMOBILE 
N. Highway 385, Hereford 

364-2160 
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Classified Advertising & Notices 'WM
GN  

F E135  
PLUTO 

1 	REAL ESTATE,  

HOMES & LAND 
3 - FOR SALE, MISC. 	The Castro County News 1- REAL ESTATE, 

HOMES & LAND 

1 	REAL ESTATE, 

HOMES & LAND 
647-3123 	 P.O. BOX 67, DIMMITT, TEXAS 79027 FOR SALE: 1979 Chevrolet Suburban 

4x4 with recent overhaul; excellent 
condition. 647-3265. 	3-8-tfc 

LADIES, you'll never know how good 
your face can feel until you have had a 
MARY KAY facial. Call today for 
your complimentary facial, 647-2321 
after 5 p.m. 	 3-45-tfc 

1pt*********************** 
• 

OUTSTANDING TERMS to 
qualified buyer on this 3 bedroom 
house on NW 12th. 

Published each Thursday in Dimrnitt, Texas. by the News Publishing Co.. 108 
W. Bedford, Second Class Postage Paid at Dimmitt, Texas, Publication Number 
092980. 

Member of the Texas Press Association, West Texas Press Association, 
Panhandle Press Association and National Newspaper Association. PRICE REDUCED on 2 bedroom 1 

both home. New countertops, 
plumbing, and more. $15,000. 

LARGE 3 BEDP- 	home 
located 

r'' 
	 and. Built- 

ins
5 

 or 0 • .ie trimmings. 
! 

$45,000.1   

3 BEDROOM. I 'ea at 611- 

S 
NW 7th •OW 
storage 	 carport. 
Complete 	.:none. $27,500. 

SMALLER 3 BEDRr -  %. 1 bath 
located at 621  O •1V port, 
single re 0 	sarage, gas 
grill. 	....kyard. Perfectly 
compac 

SUBSCRIPTION RATES 
School Year. 69.46 	 Six Months, S7.36 THERMOPHORE (the automatic 

moist heat pack) by Battle Creek now 
available at Parsons Drug. 	3-9-tfc 

One Year, S11.56 

DEADLINES 
Display and Classified Advertising 	 Tuesday Noon 
Agriculture, Business & Industry News 	 Monday, 10 A.M. 
Sports, Society, Church News 	 Monday Noon 
Community Correspondence 	 Monday Noon 
Personal Items 	 Monday, 5 P.M. 
General News, City and County   	Tuesday Noon 

FOR SALE: MAC Tool Boxes, 
HMB910, 1MB920, 1MB903, 
1MB505. All in like new condition. 
For more information call 945-2646. 

3-10-1 tc 

ATTENTION Under new manage-
ment, VOA National Housing. Low 
rent apartments for senior citizens and 
handicapped. Come see our apart-
ments and make your home with us. 
Join the Village of Senior Citizens for 
fun and fellowship. MID-TULE 
Village, 321 SE 7th, Tulia, Texas, Ph. 
806-995-2442 or 806-765-8134. 2-12-tfc 

ENGAGEMENT and wedding rings 
for sale - never used. Womens size 
4'/2, mens size 7. 647-5706 after 5 p.m. 

3.11-2tc 

8- SERVICES 9-HELP WANTED 

DIMMITT TV Cable Co. is now taking 
applications for receptionist- 
bookkeeper. Apply at 103 NW Third 
St. 	 9.10-tfc 

CLEARANCE SALE!!!!! Save $$$$$ 
Must Sell Over 50 Pre-Owned Mobile 
Homes and 4 Travel Trailers. All Sizes 
8x21 to 14x80. Rebuilt, Like New, 
Small Down, Low Monthly Payments. 
Financing Available. Affordable Hous-
ing Inc., 7903 S. PanAm Expressway 
(Zarzamora Exit) 927-7821; 3300 SW 
Military Drive, 1512) 927-5960, San 
Antonio, Texas. 	 1-12-1tc 

DIMMITT 
FENCE CO. home 

a 
• utility 

 more. 

NEW 3 BEDROO 
with sines,- 
area, h
Done in 	se. $39.000• 

"LADY FINELLE COSMETICS" Let 
me show you what a good skin care 
will do for your complexion and also 
show you the "Fun of Color." Lorena 
Cates, 407 NW 3rd, Dimmitt, Tex., 
79027, 647-4210. 	 3.5-13tp 

647-5739 

PANHANDLE BUILDING SER-
VICES now taking applications for 
part time night/weekend janitorial & 
general housekeeping work. Contact 
Jerry Stump, 106 W. Bedford, 9 a.m. 
to 11:30 a.m. weekdays. 	9-12-tfc 

SPECIALIZING 
IN QUALITY 11' acres 

• ..som, 1 
built-ins, 

COUNTRY HOME 
East of tow-
3/4  bath ANY TYPE FENCING 
raised be 	.J ceiling ... $43,000. FOR SALE: 1983 Double-wide Mobile 

Home, has refrig. air, fireplace, many 
extras. Contact Robert McLean, 
647-2115. 	 1-104 fc 

FOR SALE: Pinon, Oak and Mesquite 
Firewood, will deliver or you can pick 
up. High school boy needing to earn 
money. Ph. 1-238-1620. 	3.2-tfc 

FOR SALE: Oak firewood special 
price thru Nov. 30, pickup only. 3 mi 
north Nazareth. 945-2538. 	3-6-tfc 

REPAIR WORK DONE 
LET US REPAIR YOUR 

FENCE NOW AND SAVE 
YOU MONEY! 

COMMERCIAL 
One of the better liquor stores in 
Castro County. Been in the some 
family for 25 years. 2 buildings. 
Good location. 

APPLICATIONS for training and 
employment for persons fifty-five and 
older may be completed in Dimmitt on 
the first and third Mondays of each 
month from 1:00 p.m. until 4:00 p.m. 
Staff assistance will be available. Com-
munity Action. 112 E. Jones. 9-12-1tc 

MUST SELL: (Moving) 1982 14x60 
Fleetwood Mobile Home, like-new con-
dition, central air conditioning, $1,000 
equity and take over payments. Ph. 
647-2453. 	 1.3-tfc 

If you want to install 
yourself, let us furnish 

materials, and dig post- 
holes or set posts. 

FARMS 
We have over 12,000 acres of 
farm land in Castro County from 
dryland to the best of water. DUE TO the death of my husband, I 

will be selling my 160A. farm with 
lovely brick home, located 2 mi. E. of 
Lazbuddie on Hwy. 145. If interested 
call 965-2969. 	 1-11-4tp 
REDUCED FOR QUICK SALE: 2 
bedroom house, completely remodeled. 
500 NW 10th. Ph. 647-2609. 	1-52-tfc 

11-LIVESTOCK, PETS GEORGE 
REAL ESTATE 

Dimmitt Day 

Care Home 
CHILD CARE FOR 

WORKING MOTHERS 
Charlene Heath 
614 W. Andrews 

647.5548 
or 647.4543 

FOR SALE: JUST IN TIME FOR 
CHRISTMAS, two Male AKC Cocker 
Spaniels, tan, 8 weeks old. Would 
make the perfect gift for your loved 
one. Call 938-2530 after 6 p.m.11-10-tfc 

HWY. 385 SOUTH 
JINUYIIE R. GEORGE, Broker FOR SALE: Farm 460.60 acres, 4 

wells - 3 electric, 1 gas. Plastic 
underground waterline about 6.690 
feet. Pasture land 75 acres, lake in the 
middle. Petronilla Birkenfeld, Box 203, 
Nazareth, Phone 945-2512. 	1-11-4tp 

OFFICE 	 647-4174 
K. Moyers 	 6-47.4747 
M. L. Schmucker 	945-2679 
J. Cartwright 	 647-2302 

FAT CAT needs new home with warm 
windowsills and kind owners. 11-12-1tp 

TWO-BEDROOM HOUSE for sale, 
609 W. Andrews. Call for an appoint- 
ment at 647-4338 after 5 p.m. 1.48-tfc 

4 - HOUSEHOLD GOODS • 

************************ 
FOR SALE: 1978 14x70 Mobile Home 
with appliances, Ph. 647-5726. work, 
or 945-2668. 	 1.12-8tc 

• PART ALASKAN HUSKY puppies 
to give away. 204 NW 11th, 647-3235. 

11-12-1tx 
FOR SALE: 5 Maple Swivel Bar 
Stools, a Maple Hutch, and a Kenmore 
Clothes Dryer. Ph. 647-3278, Mrs. Don'.  
Carpenter. 	 4-11-tfc,_ 

REMODELING & REPAIR: Pain- 
ting, paneling, sheet-rock, dry-wall and 
textone, wallpaper and flooring. Sandy 
Parsons 647-4553. 	8-32-tfc [- HOLIDAY BONUS. 2-FOR R ENT 

13-LOST & FOUND 
FOR SALE: Queen Size Hide-A-Bed, 
$350; Double Hide-A-Bed, $200; Rock-
ing Chair, $30; Green Velvet Chair, 
$30; Large Footstool, $20; 2 end 
tables, $15 & $20; 1002 Pine St., 
647-5629 after 5:00 p.m. 	4.10-tfc 

1642 SUNSET CIRCLE - The 
epitome of beauty, convenience 
and Luxury in this 3 BR, 2 
baths, massive den, kitchen/din-
ing, sun room, fitted utility, 3 
car garage, boat garage, 
sprinkler system and quality 
throughout. Low utilities a 
BONUS! 

APARTMENT FOR RENT, Country 
Arms Apartments. 111 NW 11th, 
647-3318. 	 2-23-tfc 

DIMMITT MOTEL has rooms for 
rent, remodeled, new beds. Call 
647-2436. 	 2-14-tfc 

"WE SELL SLEEP" DIRECT MAT-
TRESS CO., Mattresses -Renovated, 
New Mattresses and Box Springs, 
Water Beds, any size. For appoint-
ment, call Running M Boot Shop.  
647-4264. 	 8-20-tfc 

LOST: Opal ring, reward offered for 
return. 605 W. Lee, Ph. 647-3229 after 
6 p.m. 	 13-12-1tc 

14-CARDS OF THANKS 
RENT TO OWN 

NEW TV'S & APPLIANCES 

No credit checks. 

KITTRELL ELECTRONICS 
647-2197, Dimmitt 

BROCK'S CUSTOM Upholstery 
Shop, 20 years experience in this area. 
Ed Brock, 807 SW 6th, (806) 647-2648 
or 647-4630. 	 8-4-tfc 

TRAILER SPACE FOR RENT. 
Water, sewer, furnished. Nazareth 
Trailer Park. 945-2501. 	2-94 fc 

FOR RENT: Rickert's Trailer Parks. 3 
locations, trailer spaces and overnight 
camping available. Call 647-5533 or 
647-4409. 	 2.3-tfc 

FOR RENT: Bedroom, come by my 
house to see me, 309 W. Jones, Apt. 1, 
or call 647-5660. 	 2-10-tfc 

CARD OF THANKS 
I want to express my appreciation 

and to thank you for your concern 
when I had eye surgery. 

Your prayers, cards and telephone 
calls have been a great comfort to me 
while I was in Lubbock and since I 
have been at home. A special thank 
you to Mary Hestand for driving me to 
Lubbock for my check ups and to my 
family for standing by during the 
surgery and taking care of me after I 
came out of the hospital. 

MARY LOU WEBB 
14-12-1tp 

PHEASANTS MOUNTED - 
Dwayne Smith. 647-5649. 	8-11-3tc 

FOR SALE: GE refrigerator, table top 
range, convection oven, girl's bike, 
Whirlpool washing machine and dryer. 
1972 Monte Carlo. Call Menzies. 
276-5594. 	 4-12-1tp 
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MONOGRAMMING DONE, goof' job 
at low price. Call Joyce, 647-2239 after 
5 p.m. on weekdays. 	8-9-5tc 101 BAILES -Super family 

home, close to schools, corner 
lot in this 3 BR. 11/4  baths, kit-
chen/bar, LR/fireklace, large 
well built storage a BONUS! 

1632 SUNSET CIRCLE - One 
of the best buys in town for 3 
BR, 2 baths, den/fireplace, kit-
chen/dining, utility, storage 
plus, 2 car garage, RV drive a 
BONUS! 

YARD CLEANING, mowing, rototill-
ing. Call Sam Raper Jr., 647-4415. 

8.35-tfc 
FOR SALE: King-size waterbed, 
household goods, exercise equipment, 
chair and ottoman, odds and ends. 221 
N. Broadway. 	 4-12-tfc 

gpimminumnimummimilinummiimmilim 

785 acres grass, 500 acres 
cultivated, 4-eight inch wells, 2 
sprinkler circles, 2 sets good im-
provements. Ideal farm and ranch. a 
80 acres, 1 set liveable im-
provements. 1 eight inch irrigation - 

1285 ACRES 

CAKES for birthdays and special oc-
casions. Zelma Thomas, 647-4230 or 
647-5630. 	 8-21-tfc 

CARD OF THANKS 
We would like to express our sincere 

thanks and appreciation to every one 
for all the kindness shown us in the 
loss of our loved one. For the prayers, 
cards, and visits we are grateful. 

ELMER YOUTS FAMILY 
CLARA GLADDEN 

14-12-lip 

FOR SALE: Fireplace screen. 
647-5733. 	 4.12-tfc 

SMALL APPLIANCE REPAIR: 
Vacuums, irons, sewing machines, 
toasters, etc. Call Walter Spinhirne, 
647-4412. Will pick up and deliver. 

8.4-tfc 

well. 5-FARM EQUIPMENT 
C 320 ACRES 

Dodd area, 2 Zimmatic sprinklers, 
1 return system. Good farm house 
with several buildings. Ideal stock 
farm 

WE REPAIR all makes of fence 
chargers. Dimmitt Consumers Electric 
Shop, NE 3rd & Etter. 	5-16-tfc 

1005 MAPLE - Charming 
HOME, 3 BR, 2 baths, utility, 
kitchen/den/dining, large back 
yard, 2 car garage, storage plus. 
pretty does it and 2 story is a 
BONUS! 

614 W. DULIN - Another one 
of those ageless beauties with 2 
BR, 1% baths, Lft, kitchen/din 
ing, utility/study, lovely den, 
carport, 1 car garage, spotless 
and brick patio a BONUS' 

15-LEGAL NOTICES FOR YOUR HOLIDAY BAKING 
breads, pies, cookies, cakes - call 
647-4363. MARGARET'S COOKIN' 

8-4-12tc 

Ta  

7- BUSINESS 

OPPORTUNITIES 

LEGAL NOTICE 
PUBLIC NOTICE 

The supplemental report of the re-
quired audit of the Revenue Sharing 
fund of Castro County. Texas is now 
available for the news media and the 
public. This report is available in the 
office of Mrs. M. L. Simpson, Jr., 
Castro County Judge. 	15-12-2tc 

140140 ACRES 
1 8 inch well with sprinkler system. 

iy HOMES 
I have several homes in ideal loca-
tions. May be seen by appoint-
ment. Please call our office for in-
formation and appointment. 

CUSTOM FARMING: We specialize 
in minimum tillage, regular plowing, or 
wheat sowing. Laverne Wilhelm fami- 
ly. Mobile No. 647-3561. 	8.3-tfc 

BEAUTY SALON for sale, fully 
operational. Call 647-3413 for appoint- 
ment to see. 	 7.12-tfc 

kir 

RENT TO OWN 
NEW TV'S & APPLIANCES 

No credit checks. 

KITTRELL ELECTRONICS 
647-2197, Dimmitt 

••••••... 

WILSON 
REAL ESTATE 

LOCAL ROUTE FOR SALE: Collec-
tion only, no selling. Will net approx. 
$400 per week. Requires 3-4 hours per 
week. Will take $12,000 cash. Write, 
including your telephone number and 
address with zip, Box 67, c/o this 
paper. 	 7-12-1tc 

Two pretty, well kept trailers on 
"convenient to town" lot, most-
ly furnished, appliances go and 
fenced yard/trees a BONUS! 

500 NW 10TH - Pretty little 
doll house with 2 BR, 1 bath, 
LR, kitchen/utility, corner lot, 
new carpet, paint, and paneling 
a BONUS! 

NEWTON 
ELECTRIC 

Contracting & Repair 

FARMS - RANCHES, 
RESIDENTIAL & COMMERCIAL 

PROPERTY 
Thliniimmilimmoutintiniumnimumminingt 

WILL DO LIGHT f: = 
CARPENTRY WORK! =-E = 

Also will rebuild 	=- = = 
and refinish furniture. 

A whole group of good rental property or one at a time will do it. 
Large, medium, and small and the price is the BONUS! 

YES ... we have land for sale! YES ... the price is right! BONUS is 
location, water, and a good LAY OF THE LAND!! 

Excellent buy near Paris, Tx. - hunting, fishing, woods, garden, 
fruit orchard, comfortable house, water well and another price 
BONUS! 

647-5318 

1516 Ruskin Circle Drive 
LADIES-Become a Certified Color 
Consultant. Earn up to $200.00 per 
day. $500 Investment. Amarillo train-
ing seminar - Dec. 12, 13, 14. For 
more information, call 806-285-7798. 
(Leave message). 	 7-10-3 tc 

102 W. Bedford, Dimmitt 
Office, 647-4487 

EDD WILSON, Broker 

Marshall "Corky" Longford 
Salesman, 647.4633 Call TED SHEFFY CALL YOUR 

LOCAL USED 
COW DEALER 

inimummmulimminumilimmumniniiin at 647-2576! 
niminininimitimminniummiumimmio Comfortable mobile home in Ruidoso on leased lot (reasonable) fur-

nished, microwave, color TV, skirted, porch, BONUS priced! 

Apartments by the dozen, right downtown, beautifully decorated, 
beautifully arranged and beautifully priced. You won't believe it!! 
Full tenancy/waiting list is the BONUS! 

Specializing in 
FARMS, RANCHES and 

COMMERCIAL PROPERTY 
Call Us Before You Buy! 

Farmers - Ranchers 

7 DAYS A WEEK 
DEAD STOCK 

REMOVAL 

RUBLE L. LEE, Broker 	 DANNA BECK, Salesperson 

Rude L. fee Justice Real Estate INDEPENDENT 
REAL ESTATE BROKER 

	 647.2329, Office 	647-2427, Residence 
t(iLiiihi 	106 N.W. 3rd, Dimmitt 

11!)) % c\A1\ VIi/J2.1  

364-0951 

Liiii-rici 	Virgil Justice 
647-2159 

Collect or 

1-800-692-4043 
Toll Free 

106 West Bedford 
647.4101 



WHILE SUPPLIES LASTI 

Thrie 
H 	OM YOUR FAVORITE ARTIST 

• ROCK. COUNTRY AND SOUL GREAT GIFT IDEAS 

15.12-1tp 

[ 	  

Ministerial 
Alliance 

Castro County Ministerial Alliance 
had their Christmas party at the 
Methodist Church on Tuesday, Dec. 4. 
After enjoying a bountiful dinner, 
Renise Blair entertained with ancient, 
traditional, and contemporary 
Christmas carols. 

Dale Wells will lead the Ministerial 
Alliance in a study of Acts. chapter 12, 
on Tuesday at 10:30 a.m. at the Fourth 
and Bedford Church of Christ. 

./  

2  CT. $169 pn. 
• 

DECKER, 1 LB. 
BACON 	 1°9  

• 

CONVENIENCE STORES 

THERE'S ALWAYS SOMETHING 
GOOD _ C001011 AT ALLSMP'S 
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15— LEGAL NOTICES Please shop Dimmitt first! More about  

Pesticide problems 
TULIA LIVESTOCK 
AUCTION REPORT 

LEGAL NOTICE 
Castro County Commissioners 

Court is taking bids on (1) pick-up for 
Castro County Extension Service. 

The pick-up will have the following 
features: 

1984 H.D. Crew Cab, Diesel, Factory 
air conditioner and heater, automatic 
transmission, 3.73 positive track axle, 
spare tire and wheel, Dual Fuel Tank, 
tinted glass, speed control, AM/FM 
radio and cassette tape player, Gauges 
(oil, pressure, fuel, water & others), 
super cooling radiator, heavy duty 
power brakes, (2) swing lock mirrors; 
light group, cloth seats, H.D. hitch, 
long wheel base, steel belted radial 
tires. 

Bids will be opened on Friday, 
December 28, 1984 at 10:00 a.m. 
Castro County reserves the right to re-
ject any or all bids. 

MRS. M.L. SIMPSON, JR. 
CASTRO COUNTY JUDGE 

15-12-2tc 

A total of 2834 cattle and calves sold Friday, December 7 at 

Tulia Livestock Auction. Good stocker calves were steady, 

good and choice feeder hfrs. were steady to $1.00 higher, 

choice feeder steers were fully steady. Packer cows and bulls 

were mostly $1.00 higher. 

REPRESENTATIVE SALES INCLUDED: 

Dale Miller - Canyon - Red Bull Calf - No. 340 - $76.00 

Earl Patrick - Quitaque - Hol. Str. - No. 870 . $49.00 

Ronnie Gfeller - Dimmitt - Blk. Wf. Cow - No. 1015 - $38.50 

Joe Price - Happy . Blk. Str. - No. 775 - $66.70 

Shane House - Turkey - Wf. Str. - No. 735 - $66.00 

Will Chamberlain - Clarendon - Red Wf. Str. - No. 440 - $73.00 

Larry Ballard - Hale Center - 6 Mix Bulls - No. 662 - $61.70 

Jay Johnson - Tulia - Red. Wf. Bull - No. 1425 - $47.50 

V.A. Danner & Son - Happy - 13 Wf. Hfr. - No. 665 - $62.30 

Doyle Culwell - Vigo Park - 4 Blk. Wf. Bull - No. 380 - $71.50 

Lester Schulte - Hereford - 6 Rd. Wf. Str. - No. 642 - $69.00 

Alvin Kiernan - Nazareth - 7 Hol. Str. - No. 921 - $48.50 

Bill Lane - Turkey - 2 Red Hfr. - No. 558 - $62.00 

Johnny Nix - Tulia - 6 Blk. Wf. Str. - No. 689 - $69.30 

Nelson & Joel Bochardt - Tulia - 24 Blk. Str. - No. 677 - $68.30 

Darrell Johnson - Quitaque - 26 Mix Str. - No. 649 - $67.00 

Smith Cattle Co. - Happy . 35 Mix Str. • No. 588 - $68.25 

Thomas Fuston - Turkey - 6 Blk. Str. - No. 436 - $74.00 

Mrs. Verd Briggs - Happy - 9 Blk. Hfr. - No. 631 - $61.00 

Randle Eddleman - Matador - 4 Red Wf. Str. - No. 678 - $68.50 

• • • 

there is no need for alarm. This 
could be a hereditary thing —
there could be a number of 
causes. Exposure to pesticides 
may have no bearing on what is 
happening." 

"It's a crude analogy, but 
look at simple table salt," 
Davis said. "The human body 
must have at least trace 
amounts of table salt to live, 
however, an overdose can kill 
you. You have to be cautious if 
you suffer from high blood 
pressure. You can sprinkle salt 
on a puddle of water and kill 
mosquitoes, 	it's 	that 
poisonous. 

"Or, you could use anti-
coagulants as an example," 
Davis pointed out. "There are a 
lot of people who use anti-
coagulants, whether it's 
aspirin or other form of medica-
tion. Some people need it to 
live. It's also one of the best rat 
killers ever devised. It doesn't 
require just common sense, but 
it requires education, too. Salt, 
or aspirin, or anything else, us-
ed in moderation and used 
wisely, can do more good than 
anything in the world. But peo-
ple are literally killed by salt 
and aspirin every day. The use 
of pesticides requires a little 
common sense and education, 
too." 

children playing in treated 
fields are picking up pesticide 
overdoses through their hands 
in the fields," the staffer con-
tinued. "I don't have any con-
crete facts to support this, and 
no studies have been done. 
Some universities have applied 
for grants to do studies, but 
their funding requests have 
been turned down. There has to 
be some sort of research done 
soon. We need to know what ef-
fect exposure to pesticides has 
on pregnant women and 
children." 

David said the TDH "would 
be interested in seeing a study 
conducted in the area, but 

(Continued from Page 11) 
Both sides have used the 

Ruiz example during the hear-
ings. Farmworkers claim 
Ruiz's employer forced him to 
use the unapproved chemical, 
while farmers and others claim 
Ruiz should have read the label 
on the chemical before using it, 
and should have told the doctor 
what had happened. 

"That pointed out what the 
big problem is," Davis said. 
"Farmers, farm workers, aerial 
applicators and others need 
more education. It's simple 
things like reading the label, 
knowing when to apply and not 
to apply the chemicals, and 
what to do in the case of ex-
posure to the chemicals. Both 
sides agree that more educa-
tion is needed." 

Davis said simple precau-
tions, such as washing hands 
or showering, and not smoking 
or eating during the course of 
application, can prevent many 
poisinings. 

"Many poisonings occur via 
hand-to-mouth contact because 
people will smoke a cigarette, 
or eat something, during the 
course of application, or before 
they wash up," Davis said. 
"It's just like washing your 
hands after you go to the 
bathroom. It's a simple thing 
that should be done by rote, 
but it's not." 

Davis, and others with the 
TDH and TDA feel that not on-
ly is there a need for further 
education, but there is also a 
need for more research and 
more data on pesticide poison-
ing. One TDH staffer, asking 
to remain unidentified, said, "I 
feel certain there is a link bet-
ween exposure to pesticides 
and the increasing number of 
deformities and maladies afflic-
ting the children of transient 
farm laborers." 

The staffer said, "There is a 
terrifically high number of 
cases in agriculturally-intense 
areas of the state of children 
who are being born with 
various afflictions. In some 
cases, these do not appear until 
the children are a little older." 

"I'm convinced that preg-
nant mothers are being over-
exposed to pesticides, and that 

FOR INFORMATION OR CONSIGNMENTS 

CALL 995-4184 or 995-3763 or 627-4486 

Watch for $$$ 
Ten "dynamic Dimmitt 

dollars" began circulating in 
Dimmitt Monday in an effort 
to record just how far a dollar 
can go. 

Dimmitt Chamber of Com-
merce Manager Delores Heller 
encased the dollars in plastic 
with a note enclosed explaining 
the special project. 

Merchants are asked to call 
the chamber when they handle 
one of the special one-dollar-
bills, which are numbered. 
Everyone is asked to help keep 
them in circulation. 

"At the end of the project 
period, we'll have an idea of 
how often money turns over in 
Dimmitt," Heller said. 

LEGAL NOTICE 
OPEN ADMISSION POLICY 
FOR CANTERBURY VILLA 

OF DIMMITT 
It is the policy of the C. V. of Dim-

mitt to admit and to treat all residents 
without regard to race, color, creed, 
age, handicap or national origin. The 
same requirements for admission are 
applied to all, and residents are assign-
ed within the Nursing Home without 
regard to race, color, creed, age, han-
dicap, or national origin. There is no 
distinction in eligibility for, or in the 
manner or providing, any resident ser-
vice provided by or through the Nurs-
ing Home. All facilities of the Nursing 
Home are available without distinc-
tion to all residents and visitors 
regardless of race, color, creed, age, 
handicap, or national origin. All per-
sons and organizations that have occa-
sion either to refer residents for admis-
sion or recommend the C. V. of Dim-
mitt are advised to do so without 
regard to the resident's race, color, 
creed, age, handicap, or national 
origin. 

Equal opportunity without regard 
to race, color, creed, age or national 
origin, is also the policy in the hiring of 
personnel. 
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1.1 Ever 
wonder 
where to 
get the 
most for your car 
insurance dollar? 
Many of your neighbors 
enjoy State Farm's good 
coverage and good service—
all at a good price. Ask one of 
them about State Farm, then 
give me a call. 

KENT BIRDWELL INSURANCE 
116 E. Jones St. 

Dimmitt, Texas 79027 

Phone 647-3427 
State Farm Mutual 
Automobile Insurance Company 
Home ()glee Bloomington. mmois 

k. • CASSETTE 
TAPES 

WHILE SUPPLIES LAST 
VALUES TO t1.90 

YOUR CHOICE • 

41 

DR PEPPER 
12 OZ. CANS 

6 PACK 

1 79  
• 
• 

R B 

Christmas ... 

make it the merriest! 

Now 	MEI MOMS IMUMI  IMO  

la 

III  di  49  A 

• WIOME FOR TIVOLIDA ffx 1 	" 	
si  1 9 70BUTT RMILK SQUEEZE-UPS BORN 

BiORDENL'S 	 BORDEN'S 

P 6  99' 
OPEN 

Monday through Friday 

9:00 a.m. to 8:00 p.m. 

Saturday 

9:00 a.m. to 7:00 p.m. 

• % 

COOKED FOOD SPECIALS 

HOT 2 if 99c GERMAN 2  / 99c 
LINKS .. 	 SAUSAGE 

•' LARGE SELECTION OF CLASSIC TITLES TO CHOOSE FROM 	 98  1  
VIIIE0 CASSETTE For the active men on you list ?  

JOGGING SUITS 

Ideal for Lounge Weor 

'413c• to '75°" MOVIES V.H.S. FORMAT 
WHILE SUPPLIES LAST YOUR CHOICE 

fikinfrab. 	°6B4 
MMUS PACK PIANI OR PEANUT 

& Its 	
1.II OZ. an c 

Give o 

COBB'S GIFT CERTIFICATE 

for Christmas! 

C. ea e. SITE UTTERS 

DURACELL  
tUE nun 

SPREAD 
PAJAMAS 

Nylon or Cotton Blend 

'18" to '24" 
1130Wi
a  $1 39 - 

t 

.1. 
DECKER JUMBO 

16 OZ. 	
$ 11 59  FRANKS 	 

S.F., 1 LB. 
 MARGARINE 

ORIGINAL SCULPTURES 
created by 

MICHAEL ANTHONY RICKER • 

99 DECKER, 12 OZ. 

BOLOGNA 	 
Joymar 

Sonsabelt 

SLACKS 

'36' to '48°° 
SWEATERS 

By Jantzen 

and Jockey 

'19" to '48" PRICES EFFECTIVE 
DECEMBER 13.15, 1984 
OPEN 24 HOURS EVERYDAY-ICE-MILK- 

MEW FRESH PRODUCE- SOFT DRINKS- 
SNACKS-GROCERIES' MONEY 01109M- COOK- 

ED FOODS- AND SELF SERVE GAS 

WHILE SUPPLIES LAST 

• 

ARROW SHIRTS 

Button Down 

and Dress 

'18°.° to '2400  

Sculptures 

'1's to '650 

Limited Editions 

'15 to '8,000 117 E. Bedford, Dimmitt 



We dial- 
Figure Perfection Salons International 

Pre-Christmas Special 
2 For 1 Down Payment 

Bring a friend to Pat Walker's and receive a 2-person 
down payment for the price of one. Enjoy this personalized 
program for as little as '15' a week per person. Our trained 
professionals will show you a sensible approach to healthful 
eating habits and our Symmetricon Unit will tone and firm 
your body tissue as it gently provides the exercise you need 
to lose weight and inches in just the right places. 

Offer expires Fri., Dec. 21, 1984 

GIFT CERTIFICATES AVAILABLE 

407 N. Main 364-8713 
SALONS INTERNATIONAL 
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Wilhelm enters pageant People  

Lavern Wilhelm Family 
' Custom Farming. 

IT'S BEEN ANOTHER BANNER YEAR for the Dimmitt FFA, 
as the quiz team of Becky Schroeder, Reagan Frye, Greg Gentry 
and Tammy McMillon placed sixth at the State Meet in Hunt-
sville last Saturday. Holding the banners won this fall are (bot-
tom, from left) Frye, Russell Cowen, Anessa Scott, Sue Crozier, 
Cinnamon Cox, Tiffany Braafladt, Zay Bradley and Pam An- 

thony; (middle, from left) Kim Gleghorn, Sherla Richards, Karen 
Clayton, Laura Nelson, Bill Patton, Danny Dutton, Curtis 
Daniel, Gentry and McMillon; (top, from left)Toni Gabel, Mark 
Standlee, Todd Durham, Karen Nelson, Woody Glass, David 
Stephens, Schroeder, Ricky McKay and Mark Coker. 

Shower fetes Shelton Nazareth  Laura Shelton of Fort strawberry-flavored cheese ball 

Clinic set Friday 
A free immunization clinic 

will be offered in Dimmitt Fri-
day from 9 a.m. to 12 noon at 
the Dimmitt City Hall 
assembly room. 

Vaccines will be given that 
offer protection against several 
childhood diseases, including 
polio, diphtheria, lock jaw 
(tetanus), whooping cough (per-
tussis), measles, rubella and 
mumps. 

Classifieds get results! 

Theresa Rose Wilhelm, 17, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Lavern H. Wilhelm of 
Nazareth, has been selected to 
compete in the Amarillo Miss 
TEEN Pageant to be held in 
Amarillo March 2. 

Contestants between the 
ages of 14 and 18 from 
throughout the Amarillo area 
will be competing for the title 
and prizes including a $500 
cash scholarship and an 
expense-paid trip to the Texas 
Miss TEEN Pageant in Dallas. 

Contestants will be judged 
on scholastic and volunteer ser-
vice achievements, appearance, 
poise, personality, speech or 
talent, and formal presenta-
tion. Contestants are required 
to participate in the Volunteer 
Service Program, which re-
quires 12 hours of service to 
some worthwhile charity or 
civic work. 

The Amarillo pageant is an 
official preliminary for the 
state pageant, which will be 
held Labor Day weekend. The 
state winner will advance to 
the National Miss TEEN 
Pageant, competing for over 
$25,000 in awards and scholar-
ships. 

Wilhelm is sponsored by Jay 
White of the Castro County 
Farm Bureau, Dimmitt Equip-
ment Co., the First State Bank 
of Dimmitt, Mr. and Mrs. H. 
A. Berry of Amarillo, and 

Worth, bride-elect of Joe Col-
lins, was honored with a bridal 
shower Saturday in the home 
of Mrs. Bruce Fuller of Dim-
mitt. 

Guests were greeted by the 
hostess, the honoree, the pro-
spective groom, and his 
mother, Darlene Collins of 
Dimmitt. 

Special guests included the . 
honoree's mother, Sandra 
Shelton, and grandmother 
Margaret Shelton, both of Fort 
Worth. 

The centerpiece for the serv-
ing table was a large basket 
with green poinsettias, pine 
branches, white leaves, holly 
and white branches, serving as 
the back drop for miniature 
drummer boy figures and 
children's blocks. Other 
decorations followed a 
Christmas theme. 

Shirley Wise aided in serving 
refreshments of fruit breads, a 

1IIMIMIIMMINISR01111~11111MINSMIRMRIKKIIIIIRIMMINIMIO‘iiMinini 
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rolled in coconut, apple slices• 
and cheese cubes, along with 
coffee and hot cranberry tea. 
Christmas china and brass ap-
pointments were used for serv-
ing. 

The couple plan to wed Dec. 
29 in Westcliff United 
Methodist Church in Fort 
Worth. 

C 
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accessories 
at Tots and Teens 

Area schools 
set holidays 

Area schools will be dismiss-
ing classes on three different 
days next week for the 
Christmas holidays. 

The last day of classes this 
year for the Dimmitt schools 
will be Tuesday. Dismissal 
time will be the same as usual. 
Lucky U Christian School will 
also dismiss Tuesday, but at 
noon. 

Nazareth schools will 
dismiss earlier than usual, 2:30 
p.m., on Wednesday. Buses 
will run at that time. 

In 1-tart, the holidays won't 
begin until next Thursday, 
with classes dismissing on an 
early schedule at 2:30 p.m. 
Buses will run at that time. 

All of the schools will resume 
classes Jan. 2. 

Wallets for men ... Ladies, handbags ... 
Billfolds ... Cosmetic bags ... Eyeglass cases ... 
Belts ... Cigarette cases ... Jewelry rolls ... 
Checkbook covers ... Coin purses ... Business 
card holders ... Toiletry cases ... Attache cases 
... (There's still time to order if you come in 

By Birgit &trim, 945 -2669 

in Gruver, several weeks ago at 
the home of a friend, Mrs. Val 
Winger. 

A bachelorette shower, 
honoring Sharon Gerber was 
held Sunday afternoon at the 
home of Sandy Oliver. 

Bill and Etta Mae Sellers of 
Tahlequah, Okla., and JoAnn 
Bowen and sons of Plainview, 
Denny and Dolores Heiman 
and family and Walter and 
Easy Schulte enjoyed an early 
Christmas pheasant' dinner at 
the home of Fritz and Julene 
Gerber. They also celebrated 
the birthday of Dolores 
Heiman. 

Mr. and Mrs. Cletus Stork of 
Geneseo, Ill., J,R. and Clara 
Stork of Gruver and Helen 
(Stork) Brown of Aniarillo 
visited with their aunt Meta 
Stork and other family 
members Monday. 

Funeral services were held 
for Gerald Hudgins, 61, of 
Stephenville on Monday. He 
was buried in Mount Olive 
Cemetery in Fort Worth. He 
was a nephew of Meta Stork. 

Denny Heiman, Kenny 
Schulte, Danny Gerber and 
Dwayne Schulte went to 
Merkel for deer hunting. 

PICTURES BY JODY 
Specializing in Weddings 

Weddings. portraits, anni- 
versaries, reunions, com- 
mercial and industrial pho- 
tography. 	Professionally 
schooled; member of four 
professional photographers' 
associations. 

Call for appointment: 
627-4676, Tulia 

CAKES 
& PIES 

For Birthdays, Special Occasions.  
Showers. Anniversaries 

and Weddings.  

Call Rebecca May at 

647-2542 

Our sympathy to Sister Her-
man Joseph and Sister Anita 
on the death of their mother, 
Mary Elizabeth Berkemeyer, 
87, of Morrilton, Ark. They feel 
fortunate to have been with her 
this past summer for several 
weeks and again at Thanksgiv-
ing. They attended funeral 
mass 'for her at Sacred Heart 
Church in Morrilton. 

Members of Holy Family 
Parish Council, Council of 
Economic Affairs and guests 
:were treated to an Apprecia-
tion Dinner at the American 
Legion Hall Sunday evening. 

Mary Ann Schulte is still a 
patient in Plains Memorial 
Hospital receiving treatment 
for broken ribs and pelvis that 
she suffered from an accident 
Thursday evening, Nov. 29 as 
she was traveling with her 
family to . attend a wedding. 
Clarence and Odelia Schulte, 
David and Michelle Schulte 
were involved but not hurt. We 
wish her well. 

Albert 	Gerber 	is 
recuperating at home after 
having surgery Nov. 29 in Lub-
bock Methodist Hospital. 

Paul and Lillian Venhaus 
spent a long weekend 'in 
Yukon; Okla, with Ed and 
Eileen. Gerber and family. 

Marie Brockman hosted Sun-
day dinner on Dec. 2 for 
members of her family. Those 
attending were Elizabeth 
Rickwartz, Herman and Viola 
Rickwartz, Bernard and Irene 
Kleman and Elsie Rickwartz 
all of Amarillo and Joe and 
Georgie Rickwartz of Chann-
ing. 

Billy Lee of Perryton is a pa-
tient at Lubbock General 
Hospital, after breaking his 
neck in a Rugby game being 
played between Perryton and 
Lubbock. His wife Anna 
(Huseman) Lee reported he is 
doing okay, but will be in the 
hospital for some time. 

The Lions Club sponsored 
their annual pheasant hunt 
this year with a good turnout 
of 157 area hunters. 

J.C. and Jocelyn Pohlmeier, 
Rex and Vera Ramaekers, Jay 
and Patty White and Kent and 
Theresa Birkenfeld enjoyed a 
weekend at Las Vegas. 

Karen Birkenfeld, bride-elect 
of Tim Peddy of Amarillo was 
honored with a bridal shower 
Dec. 2 at the home of her sister 
Darlene Schulte. Another 
bridal shower was held for her 

UNIQUE 
WATERBEDS 

DECEMBER SPECIALS! 

5 STYLES CIF WATERBEDS 

SALE PRICED $393.00 

Complete Bed 

King Chinn or Super S.nglit. 

COMPLETE BASIC WATERBED 

$199.00 

ilVo down payment through Dec 10. 

• PERCALE SHEETS AND PILLOW CA5E51E36.93 

COMFORTERS 	 $39.93 

DRINK TAMES 	 $12.30 

90-cloy interest free losonoy 

MoveKord 	vivo 	Fmancing 

CALL 290-9533 

Sy TG4T In Plainview 

Theresa Wilhelm 
ear 
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WHO SEZ 
Friday the 13th 
is unlucky??? 

To all our special friends 
Both far and near 
Come share with us 
A little Christmas Cheer — 

on Saturday morning the twenty-second 
from 10 a.m. till noon or so 

116 West Andrews 

Hostesses: 
Maxine Tidwell 
Mona Merritt 

Geneva Schaeffer 
Pat Bagley 
Mary Cluck 
Shirley Wise 



CREATIVE WEDDINGS 
426 Western, Hereford 

364-6711 
A Personalized Catering 

Service for 
•1nvitations 
•Flowers 
•Silks 
•Custom Decorated 
•Custom Decorated Cakes 
•Gold & Silver Appointments 
•Tablecloths 
•Napkins 
•Finger Foods 

Rant %Warm to Racer)au 
Come by and let Martha help 
you with your wedding, anni-
versary, or party plans. 

Fresh Fruit Trees 
IN WAREHOUSE NOW 

What is not spoken for will be 
commercially planted after Christmas. 

FLAGG FERTILIZER 
647-2241 Flagg, Texas 

Cfrtio two 
Special 

Stark Trees Bear Fruit. Si in. 181(3 

NAZARETH INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT 
NAZARETH, TEXAS 

BALANCE SHEET 
August 31, 1984 

ASSETS AND OTHER DEBITS 

Cash 
Investments 
Receivable 
Land. Buildings, and Equipment 
Other Debits 

TOTAL ASSETS 

LIABILITIES AND FUND EQUITY 

Current Payables 
Deferred Revenues 
Bonded Debt Payable - Non-Current 

Total Liabilities 

Fund Balance - General Operating 
Fund Balance - Special Revenue 
Reserve for Retirement of Funded Indebtedness 
Reserve for Investment in Fixed Assets 

Total Fund Equity 

TOTAL LIABILITIES AND FUND EQUITY 

$ 156,994.80 
( 	242.01) 

54.10 
688,188.11 

CONSOLIDATED STATEMENT OF REVENUE AND EXPENDITURES 
For The Fiscal Year Ended August 31, 1984 

REVENUE: 
General Operating Fund 
Special Revenue Fund 
Debt Service Fund 

Total Revenue 

EXPENDITURES 
General Operating Fund 
Special Revenue Fund 
Debt Service Fund 

Total Expenditures 

NET REVENUE 

-The above condensed statements were prepared from the financial 
appears in the audit report for the fiscal year ended August 31, 
contains the auditor's opinion. 

GARY LUTHER LANCASTER 
CERTIFIED PUBLIC ACCOUNTANT 

MATADOR, TEXAS 

$ 81,012.58 
97,292.00 
47,483.82 
688,188.11 
59,000.00 

$ 972,976.51 

$ 32,938.70 
36,042.81 
59,000.00 

$ 127,981.51 

$ 844,995.00 

$ 972,976.51 

$ 738,806.86 
28,664.01 
19,261.88 

$ 786,732.75 

$ 733,680.70 
36,014.82 
19,245.00 

$ 788,940.52 

$( 2,207.77)  

information which 
1984, and which 

IRA 
Now's the time to do your planning for the best 
retirement program allowed—your Individual 
Retirement Account. The deadline for making 
your IRA desposits for 1984 is April 15, 1985. 
(Extensions are no longer allowed.) 

Immediate 
Tax Savings 
All IRA contributions are fully tax deductible. 
You pay less tax and keep more of your hard-
earned dollars! 

[41Tax Deferred 
High Interest 
Your IRA earns higher than average interest. 
and it's all tax-deferred until withdrawal. You 
build an even greater financial advantage! 

NA Retirement 
Security 
Contributions plus interest grow rapidly to 
help assure your future comfort and security. 

Ask about transfers or rollovers of fund. We 
have the answers. 

And check with us for our BEST current in-
terest rates on ALL savings programs. 

Branch Office: 
3rd & Bedford 
Dimmitt, Tex. 
647-2189 

Home Office: 
119 East 4th 
Hereford, Tex. 
364.3535 

EQUAL SOUSING 
LENDER 
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By Tang Bowden, 6417-5703 Sunngsidt 
John and Nicola Furr have a 

new son born Monday in Nor-
thwest Texas Hospital in 
Amarillo. He weighed 8 
pounds, 6 ounces, and was 201/2  

inches long. He was named 
Brandon Shelby. 

J.R. and Ethel Ethridge and 
Lanette visited in Plainview 
last Sunday with their new 
grandson Joshua Lee Sullivan, 
who was born the 25th. He 
weighed 6 pounds, 3 ounces. 
His parents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Charles Sullivan. 

Euless and Hazel Waggoner 
have another great-grandson 
born the 28th in Abilene to 
Kayla and Andy Hancock. She 
is the daughter of Frances and 
Jesse Pharis. He was named 
James Colby. 

Alton and Betty Loudder 
and Hazel Waggoner attended 
the funeral services of Edd 
Sweatt in Dimmitt Tuesday 
afternoon, and visited with the 
family before the services. 
Hazel also helped with the din-
ner. Mr. and Mrs. Sweatt and 
their children, Nolan, Warren, 
Louie, Oma, Lois, and Patsy 

A unique and personal way 
to say you core 

Basket Gifts Unlimited 
FREE DELIVERY 

Phone 647-3558 
704 Maple 

DIMMITT, TEXAS 79027 
JANICE SHELTON 

[

Presbyterian] 
happenings 

fixed dinner for the men and 
Verna Sadler and Kathy, 
Christi, and Holly Gwyn. 

Howard Spencer of Red 
River met some friends from 
Fort Worth here Saturday for 
some pheasant hunting. He 
also visited with his mother, 
Mrs. John Spencer while he 
was here. 

D.N. and Cyble Gamblin of 
Avery, spent Friday night with 
her sister, Ruth and Noah 
Spencer. 

Leona Blanton spent last 
weekend in Rails with her 
brothers and sisters for an ear-
ly Christmas together and to 
help their oldest sister 
celebrate her 75th Christmas. 

Ronald Blanton spent this 
weekend in Plainview in his 
National Guard training. 

Francis and Mary King and 
their son Mike of Amarillo 
spent the day Saturday hun-
ting with Billie and Marshall 
King and visiting with Emma 
Jean and Kaye King, Lance 
and Lincoln. 

Jeanette Walling of Bovina, 
daughter of the J.C. 
Holbrooks, was hospitalized in 
Muleshoe again last weekend 
with respiratory difficulties. 
She was dismissed Wednesday. 

Howard Bridges, grand-
father of Bruce Bridges, had 
his 83rd birthday in Plains 
Memorial Hospital Friday. 
Bruce and others have visited 
with him this week. His niece, 
Beatrice McCoy of Morse, 
visited with him Thursday. 

Tommy and Louise Alair and 
her mother, Rachel Elsea 
hosted the Cox reunion over 
the weekend. Fred and Jessie 
Cox of Arlington arrived for 
lunch Wednesday. He is 
Rachel's brother. Others pre-
sent for the weekend were Car-
roll and Addie Hinds, Lavada 
Evans, and Jack Ogletree from 
the Coleman area, Ira and Nell 
Hopper and sons Marty and 
Ira Jr. from Abilene, Myers 
and Iverleen Ogletree of Alpine 
and their sons and wives, 
Monty and Cara Ogletree and 
Blake of Alpine, and Windell 
and Lisa Ogletree of El Paso. 
Grace Ogletree was unable to 
come. In the afternoon, Aileen 
Smitherman of Dimmitt and 
her son Tony and wife Monti 
Jean of McLean visited with 
them. Also present during the 
weekend were the Alair 
children, Jimmy and Mindy 
Alair, Jon and Will, and Eddie 
and Sharon Alair and Trey, 
and Louise and Marvin Den-
ton, Tommy, Mere and Chelle 
of Hereford. Johnny didn't get 
to come. 

moved to the Sunnyside Com-
munity in 1930. The children 
attended Sunnyside School and 
graduated from Dimmitt. 
Velma was already married 
and never lived here. Oma mar-
ried Eldon Lilley and they were 
the only ones to raise their 
children in the community. 

Teeny Bowden visited with 
April Guy in High Plains Bap-
tist Hospital in Amarillo Mon-
day afternoon while L.B. 
dialyzed at the dialysis center. 
He dialyzed at home Wednes-
day and Friday without pro-
blems. April started taking a 
new experimental drug Friday 
in her battle with cancer. 

About an inch of snow was 
received Tuesday afternoon 
following freezing drizzle Tues-
day morning. 

Ezell and Verba Sadler 
returned home from Weather-
ford Tuesday night. They had 
dinner Monday with Hollis and 
Dolly Sweatt who were the 
first superintendent and house 
parents for the boys at Boys 
Ranch Farm here in 1947. 
Hollis is not in good health. 

Leslie Loudder left Wednes-
day to spend a few days with 
cousins in the Gunsight com-
munity of Stephens County. 
Both are gravely ill. 

Dr. Myles Sadler and 
Gregory of Lubbock hunted 
Saturday with Embree Roy 
Sadler, Gale Sadler, and Rev. 
Bentley Gwyn. They killed six 
pheasants. Willie Mae Sadler 

There is a Sunday Church School 
class for everyone every Sunday at, 10 
a.m. The Adult Bible class meets at 
the home of Mrs. Emily Cling-
ingsmith. All other classes meet at the 
church. 

"Mary, the Mother of Jesus" will be 
the subject of Pastor Edward D. 
Freeman's sermon at the Sunday mor-
ning church worship service at 11 a.m. 

The annual congregational meeting 
to elect new officers and to adopt the 
budget for 1985 will be held im-
mediately following the morning wor-
ship service. 

There will be a family Christmas 
covered-dish dinner following the con-
gregational meeting. This will be in the 
hospitality room of the Courthouse. 
It is rumored that Santa Claus will be 
there. 

The First Day of Hanukkah will be 
celebrated at the Church on Wednes-
day at 7 p.m. 

DR. JAMES E. 
WOHLGEMUTH 

OPTOMETRIST 
300 West Bedford 
Phone 647-4464 
Dimmitt. Texas 

Sandoval takes leave 
Sgt. Judith Sandoval of Dim-

mitt, daughter of Emigidio and 
Maria Luisa Sandoval of Dim-
mitt, is presently on terminal 
leave from Royal Air Force, 
Bentwaters, England. 

She plans to study computer 
business at the University of 
South Carolina after spending 
the Christmas holidays with 
her family in Dimmitt. 

'AWAWag'fl-g*A20AW-A WAX-A* 

"CAPTURE THE 
SMILES OF 

CHRISTMAS" 

Lucky U 
Christian 
School 
wishes you 
a Merry 
Christmas! 

What Christmastime Means To Me 
Christmas is a special time. We like to give presents 
to people. We love to celebrate Jesus being born on 
Christmas Eve. Its a time when all our family 
gathers to celebreate this joyous season. Its a time 
of warm cozy fires and the smell of the turkey 
cooking at Grandmas. I love christmas time. 

GET YOUR PICTURE MADE 
WITH SANTA CLAUS ... 

and have a CHANCE TO WIN "Maggie- ty 
KriSti", a CABBAGE PATCH PREMIE 

DOLL for your own!! 

GET A BIG 5"x7" COLOR PHOTO OF YOUR CHILD 
WITH SANTA ... made in 35mm and printed on Kodak 

paper. 

What Christmas Time Means To Me 
Christmas time to me means a very quite time. I 

think of Jesus on Christmas Day. My Christmas 
tree smells too good! When Christmas is here, I 
have the joy in my heart. I can hardly wait when 
Christmas is here, so I can share my presents with 
people. On Christmas Day the carolers are singing 
at my door. I am thankful for Jesus, and Christmas 
Day!! 

WHERE: 

WHEN: 
TIME: 
COST: 

KILLINGSWORTH 
True Value Hardware 
Saturday, December 15th 
Noon Til 2 p.m. 
5300 
el" from each picture purchase 
will be donated to Kids Inc.) 

What Christmas Means To Me 
Christmas is the time to care and share. Christmas 
means to love and give, because God gave us Jesus. 
And He loves us. Christmas is also a time for 
families to show their love. And it is also the 
prettest season. 

••Those purchasing the photos 
will be entered for drawing to u'in the doll. 



Gerber Minshew 

F. Huseman Steffens 

B. Huseman Nino Smothermon Glass 

BUILDINGS 
BUILT TO ORDER 
Ask us about our prefab 
multiuse shelters for: feed 
and grain, equipment, boat, 
plane, car storage, tem-
porary enclosures, 
maintenance and repair, 
greenhouses, and swimming 
pool covers. 

GERBER WELDING 
205 Wheat, Dimmitt 647-5726 

We've sold 
more than 100 

vehicles this 
year. Our goal 

is 150! 

HOLIDAY SPECIALS 
1983 CHEVY CELEBRITY 

Four-door, maroon. Loaded 	$6,950 

1982 FORD LARIAT SUPER CAB 

White, local one-owner pickup. 

Clean 	 $6,950 

1983 CHRYSLER 

New Yorker, Fifth Avenue. 
Only 33,000 miles 	 $12,500 

1980 CHEVY CAPRICE CLASSIC 

Four-door with 45.000 miles. 

White.....  $5,450 

1982 VVeyOr 

Limit ad 	
s. 

.01,500 198LC AM 
00Nitais  05,400 Re 

1982 JEEP RENEGADE 

Only 12,000 miles. 4x4 	  $6,750 

1982 MERCURY LYNX 

Four-door. Nice and clean 	 $4,950 

1982 CHEVY 5-10 PICKUP 

Only 37,000 miles 	 $5,850 

1982 CHEVY SUBURBAN 

Silverado diesel model. Black 	$11,500 

1982 FORD EXPLORER 

16,000 miles. Nice 	  $7,500 

$2,850 

1979 BUICK CENTURY 

Four door. Nice. Low mileage, 
one owner 

1979 LINCOLN CONTINENTAL 

Four-door. Local car with 
61,000 miles . 	 $5,500 

1979 DODGE 4x4 RAM CHARGER 

Brown. 60,000 miles. Needs tires 	$4,950 

1982 CHEVY SILVERADO PICKUP 

Looded! Power windows and locks. 
Topper to match, carpeted 	$8,450 

1977 DODGE MAXI CUSTOM VAN 

Loaded, with TV, sink, ice box, etc. 

45,000 	 $6,500 

Call WADE or WALTER MAYNARD at 647-3402, or ROBERT DANIEL at the Dimmitt 

Car Wash. Or call ROBERT DANIEL at home, 647-2372. 

Auto thitimited 
IF I DON'T HA VE IT, I CAN GET IT! 

Wade Maynard 647-3402 

We've got a Christmas gift for you. 
Get a jumbo enlargement 

FREE 
KIS® 1-Hour Photo 
Processing Center 

In just minutes we'll give you perfect, clear, 
colorful prints on genuine Kodak' paper from 
your 110, 126, 135 and disc film. Enlargements 

in just minutes! During December and 
January, get one 5"x7" enlargement free with 
each 135 roll you bring in, or one 41/4 -x6-  free 

with each roll of 110. 

PHOTO 
KILLINGSWORTH 

True Value Hardware 
508 S. Broadway, Dimmitt 

We use Kodak paper for a good look:' 
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Sports  
Gerber, Minshew take 2-A honors 

cond team honors at offensive 
tackle and as a defensive 
lineman. 

Receiving honorable mention 
were tight end Kevin Hoelting, 
guard Lance Brockman, tackle 
Howard Steffens, defensive 
backs Benny Schacher and 
Todd Hill, and defensive end 
Mike Huseman. 

"I'm proud of all these peo- 

13 Nazareth Swifts have 
been named all-district, in-
cluding the Player and Coach 
of the Year honors in District 
2-A. 

Coach Rex Minshew, who 
guided the Swifts to an 11-1 
record, was named Coach of the 
Year. Chris Gerber, who was 
named unanimous all-district 
at four positions, was the 
unanimous pick as Player of 
the Year. 

Gerber was the premier selec-
tion at running back, secon- 

ple," said Minshew. "I'm 
especially proud for Chris, 
because he dominated the 
district, and no one even 
thought about voting for 
anyone else as player of the 
year. I'm tickled about the 
Coach of the Year honor, of 
course, but I'm glad we were 
able to honor these kids for the 
great job they did all year." 

dary, kicker and punter by 
District 2-A North Zone 
coaches. 

Other unanimous selections 
included Billy Steffens at 
center and defensive lineman; 
quarterback Ricky Backus; 
and linebacker Frankie 
Huseman. 

Guard Kenneth Kleman, 
tackle and defensive lineman 
Billy Huseman, and Backus in 
the defensive secondary were 
also named to the first team. 

Randy Leavitt, received se- 'Cats, Naz in Reese 

Yes, Virginia, 
there is a Mojo 

It's almost inevitable, it 
seems — Nazareth and Dim-
mitt are going to play. 

By JOHN BROOKS 
Mojo is for real, folks. I have 

seen it, and I believe. 
I was in Lubbock Saturday 

to see Odessa Permian play 
Midland Lee in the Class 5A 
quarterfinals. So were about 
36,000 others — 35,000 or more 
to see a HIGH SCHOOL foot-
ball game. 

slated for 10 a.m. Saturday, 
with the consolation finals at 1 
p.m. The third place game is at 
4 p.m., with the championship 
at 8:30 p.m. 

The lower half of the bracket 
includes Littlefield, Dallas 
Tyler Street Academy, Cana-
dian and Shallowater. 

The President's Trophy divi-
sion includes Morton, Canyon, 
Snyder, Clovis, Fort Worth 
Arlington Heights, Roswell. El 
Paso Cathedral and Lubbock 
Dunbar. 

With nine minutes left in the 
game, THE DRIVE happened. 
It wasn't flashy — just power 
football, as Permian drove the 
ball 60 yards for the go-ahead 
touchdown. The Permian line 
blew the Lee line apart, 
linemen who'll play their col-
lege football on dormitory 
lawns using fundamentals to 
out-play larger enemies. 

Mojo had come through 
again. 

LILLISTON 
CULTIVATORS 

AT 

HAYS 
IMPLEMENT CO. 

The Bobcats and Switts are 
entered in the Commander's 
Trophy division of the Reese 
AFB Christmas Classic this 
weekend on the base, west of 
Lubbock. 

16 teams are entered in the 
field, with two divisions. The 
Bobcats are one of the few 
teams who have won cham-
pionships in both divisions. 

The Swifts open the Com-
mander's division at 1 p.m. 
against Hale Center, while the 
Bobcats face Colorado City 
tonight at 7. 

The winners of the two 
games play at 7 p.m. tomor-
row, with the losers squaring 
off at 2:30 p.m. 

The seventh place game is 

It wasn't JUST a high school 
game — it was Permian 
against Lee — archenemy, 
district rival, the only people 
who have found a cure for the 
Mojo blues on a consistent 
basis. 

Three 'Cats nab 
first-team honors 

if---R\ Week's 
schedule 

How real is Mojo? I stood in 
line for 25 minutes outside 
Jones Stadium Saturday, 
amidst a sea of black and white 
clad Permian rooters, most of 
whom wore "Mojo" caps and 
were carrying "Mojo" key 
chains with the official dyed 
rabbit's foot on the end. Under-
dressed Permian rooters, like 
me, could buy caps, rabbit's 
foot key chains, flags and more 
at any of the three official Mojo 
souvenir stands located in the 
West stands at Jones Stadium. 

THURSDAY—SATURDAY 
Bobcats, Swifts in Reese Tourney 

Longhorns, Lady Longhorns in 
Farwell Tourney. 

FRIDAY 
Bobbies at Idalou - 8 p.m. 

MONDAY 
Dimmitt 7,8,9 Bobcats at Tulia. 
Tulia 7,8,9 girls at Dimmitt. 

TUESDAY 

Lazbuddie at Hart - 5 p.m. 
Amherst at Nazareth — 5 p.m. 
Littlefield at Dimmitt — 5 p.m. 

Happg birthday! 

Three Dimmitt Bobcats have. 
been named to the Littlefield-
dominated District 2-3A all-
conference team. 

Littlefield breezed through 
the district race, and reached 
the quarterfinals before falling 
to Vernon, 35-7, last Saturday. 
The Wildcats filled 10 of the 32 
first team spots. 

Running back Mark 
Smothermon and tackle Bobby 
Nino were named to the offen-
sive first team. Wide receiver 

Nathan Nelson was named to 
the second unit, while center 
Greg Sava, quarterback 
Woody Glass, and Nino at 
kicker received honorable men-
tion. 

On defense, Glass and Nino 
were named to the second team 
at safety and lineman, while 
Smothermon and Eddie Jor-
dan, at linebacker, lineman 
Milton Carrasco and punter 
Todd Durham received 
honorable mention. 

Does Mojo work? Yes, it 
does. If you are not 
superstitious, do not accept 
work in Odessa. It's no fun 
cheering for Odessa High 
School, and you can't be a Per-
mian fan if you don't have any 
superstitions. 

DECEMBER 17 — Tony Fritz, 
Caleb Hartman, Dwayne Schulte. 

DECEMBER 18 — Jacalyn Thomp-
son, James Welch, Deryl Clevenger, 
Dustin Raemakers. 

DECEMBER 19 — Stephanie Ryan, 
Johnny Stanford, Pat Martinez, Ron-
nie Truelock, Dario Carrasco, Carina 
Martinez, Teresa Birkenfeld. 

DECEMBER 13 — Randy Burnam. 
Shirley Henderson, Lucia Beruman, 
Val Hatla, Janet Schmucker, Angie 
Wilhelm. 

DECEMBER 14 — Glen Black, Kel-
ly Davis, Jimmy Henderson, Penny 
Jorecki, Chuck Birkenfeld, Sister 
Josetta Catalini, John Kleman, 
Weldon Wilhelm, Sonny Hochstein. 

DECEMBER 15 — Tim Lust, 
George Sides, Josephine Ball, Kathy 
Birkenfeld, Mary Rieman, Sonya 
Schulte. 

DECEMBER 16 — Durward 
Strickland. Dale Ball, Bryan 
Huseman, 

AN OSTRICH egg equals the size of 
about 24 ordinary hen eggs, says Inter-
national Wildlife magazine. One 
ostrich egg can provide breakfast for 
ten people. 
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DIMMITT BRAKE & MUFFLER IM••• 

111•1 

v Brakes 	 v Minor Tune Ups 	I--- 

E- v Mufflers 	 v Minor Auto Repairs g: 

sA Complete Exhaust Systems 	v State Inspections 
8-6 Mondays through Fridays 

 =  
= 8-12 Saturdays  
= 

Permian was down, 14-3, in 
the second quarter when we 
heard the first murmurs-- the 
chant built momentum: "Mojo, 
Mojo, Mojo." The rabbits feet 
were being shaken, flags were 
waving, and special "Rebel 
Buster" towels were being 
tossed. It worked, as Mojo 
scored to make it 14-9 at 
halftime. Of course, the Per-
mian fans had no doubts about 
the Mojo — and neither did the 
fans from Lee. 

Kenneth Hollums 
:74 Mike Odom 

Mojo had to be brought out 
when Lee apparently scored a 
touchdown on the first play of 
the fourth quarter, a brilliant 
85-yard screen pass. The score 
was called back on a motion 
penalty, wiping out Lee's 
chances. 

647-5717T-- 

211 E. Jones, Dimmitt 
N11111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111101  
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Scoreboard 
JV Swifts 52, Muleshoe 39 Dec. 3 

Nazareth 8 18 14 12 
Muleshoe 8 8 10 13 

— 52 
— 39 

SCORING: Kenny Kern 19. Hart 
Olton 

TAYLOR & SONS 
FOOD STORE 

JV Swiftettes 56, Clovis 43 
Nazareth 	7 14 15 20 — 56 
Clovis 	13 13 11 	6 — 43 

SCORING: Barbie Steffens and 
Missy Brockman 13. 
(JV Swiftettes first, JV Swifts 
seventh I 

Bobcats 69, Roosevelt 56 
Roosevelt 	18 14 	6 18 — 56 
Dimmitt 	14 16 13 24 — 69 

SCORING: Pat Mcdonald 6R. 8C: 
Love 9R, Danny Martinez 13C. 

FG: 25/53 — 47% 
FT: 19/29 — 66% 

7th Lady Longhorns 20, 
Olton 15 

6 12 0 2-20 
4 4 4 3-15 

Hart 
Olton 

JV Bobcats 44, Roosevelt 40 

8th Lady Longhorns 18, 
Olton 31 

8 3 4 3-18 
10 	14 4 3 — 31 

Roosevelt 6 13 16 5 — 40 
Dimmitt 8 14 10 12 — 44 

STORE HOURS: Monday through Saturday, 8 a.m. to 9 p.m. 
Sunday, 8 a.m. to 8 p.m. 

PRICES GOOD DECEMBER 13 - 19, 1984 

Hereford Jr. High 
Tournament 

7th Longhorns 22, Olton 17 
6 — 22 
8 — 17 

Hart 2 10 2 
Olton 1 6 2 

SCORING: Todd Durham 13, Scott 
Hill 10. 

FLOOR PLAY: Martin Alvarez 
13R, 5C; Mark Bennett 11R, John 
Wait 6C. 

FG: 18/59 — 31% 
FT: 8/14 — 57% 

7th Bobcats 17, Canyon 31 
Dimmitt 	 1 8 4 4 — 17 
Canyon 	 5 6 6 14 — 31 

SCORING: Leo Torres 8. 

8th Longhorns 38, Olton 20 
Hart 	 4 13 13 8 — 38 
Olton 	 3 4 6 7 — 20 

Canyon Classic 
Swiftettes 66, Canyon 27 

Nazareth 	16 16 18 16 — 66 
Canyon 	3 6 9 9 — 27 

SCORING: Ramona Heiman 20, 
LaDawn Schmucker 16. 8th Bobcats 22, 

Plainview Red 30 
Dimmitt 	 5 8 5 4 — 22 
Plainview 	5 8 10 7 — 30 

SCORING: Rodrigo Jackson 8. 

Lady Longhorns 46, Farwell 20 
Farwell 	3 9 2 6 — 20 
Hart 	 12 15 12 7 — 46 

SCORING: Susan Montiel, Susie 
Reyna 8. 

Swiftettes 60, Clovis 26 
Nazareth 	16 14 13 17 — 60 
Clovis 	 6 	5 8 	7 — 26 

SCORING: Ramona Heiman 24, 
Kelly Schilling and LaDawn 
Schmucker 11. 

FLOOR PLAY: Heiman 5R, Schill-
ing 3R. 7th Bobcats 19, 

Plainview Red 41 
Dimmitt 	6 2 6 5 — 19 
Plainview 	12 13 3 13 — 41 

SCORING: Leo Torres 4. 

Longhorns 44, Farwell 45 
Farwell 	6 12 10 17 — 45 
Hart 	 15 10 12 	7 — 44 

SCORING: Paul Ramirez 18, Rusty 
Ammons 10. 8th Bobcats 25, 

Canyon Purple 18 
Dimmitt 	 4 8 2 11 — 25 
Canyon 	 4 8 2 4 — 18 

SCORING: Emilio Arce 12. 

JV Longhorns 43, Farwell 45 

COKE Witato 
Cu*? 

Bobbies 58, Borger 40 
Dimmitt. 	14 11 18 15 — 58 
Borger 	 8 7 10 15 — 40 

SCORING: Stacie Jackson 10. 
FLOOR PLAY: Nelson 10R, Kim 

Howell 6C. 
FG: 28/53-53% 
FT: 2/3-67% 

Swiftettes 72, Abernathy 40 
Nazareth 	22 16 21 13 — 72 
Abernathy 	12 8 11 	9 — 40 

SCORING: Ramona Heiman 22, 
Kelly Schilling 21. 

FLOOR PLAY: Schilling 8R. 
Heiman 7R. 

8th Bobcats 33, 
Canyon Valleyview 16 

Dimmitt 	7 10 10 6 — 33 
Canyon VV 	2 0 6 8 — 16 

SCORING: Emilio Arce, Kevin Pet-
ty 9. 

Friday Bobbies 57. Canyon 61 
Dimmitt 	14 8 17 18 — 57 
Canyon 	11 23 16 11 — 61 

SCORING: Becky Schroeder 20, 
Lisa Nelson 17. 

FLOOR PLAY: Schroeder, Nelson 
8R, Kim Howell, Tammie Washington, 
Camille Summers 4C. 

FG: 22/44-50% 
FT: 13/24-52% 

32 OZ. BOTTLES 
6 PACK 

$ 1 79  PLUS DEPOSIT 
12 OZ. CANS 

6 PACK 

Bobcats 42, Levelland 46 
Levelland 	12 14 	7 13 — 46 
Dimmitt 	7 15 12 8 — 42 

SCORING: Pat McDonald 21. 
FLOOR PLAY: McDonald 10R. 

James Alexander 8R, Nathan Nelson 
6c. 

FG: 15/56.27% 
FG: 12/23-52% 

JUICY 
LEMONS OR LIMES 	10 / $ 1 
GOLDEN OR RED DELICIOUS 0 

9
4 

APPLES 	 3 LB. BAG 
FRESH BUNCHES 
GREEN ONIONS 	4/$1 
1 LB. CELLO BAG 
CARROTS 	 3 BAGS$  1 

CELLO BAG 
RADISHES 	4FORS 1 

169  WA SPECIALS 
Bobbies 47, Abernathy 66 

Abernathy 	12 10 18 	7 — 47 
Dimmitt 	16 24 11 15 — 66 

SCORING: Lisa Nelson 20. 

FLOOR PLAY: Schroeder 7R, 
Jackson 5R, Camille Summers, Sonc- 
cia Tischler 6C. 

FG: 18/40-45% 
FT: 4/16-25% 

TUNA 	 61/2  02.6 9 
IGA 4 

IGA 

TEA BAGS 
$ 11 99 

	 100 CT. 

$'29 
32 OZ. 

IGA 

SALAD DRESSING 
IGA 

TOMATO SAUCE 	8 02.5 FOR 1 

RUFFLES 
POTATO CHIPS 

7 OZ. PKG. 
ALL FLAVORS 

IGA 

CRACKERS 	1 LB. BOX 594  
IGA 99c GRAPEFRUIT JUICE ...46 OZ. 

DIMMITT 
MONDAY — Cheeseburgers, 

French fries, lettuce, pickles, onions, 
peaches and milk. 

TUESDAY — Combo sandwiches. 
potato chips, lettuce, dill spears, 
oranges and milk. 

WEDNESDAY — Christmas holi-
day. 

HART 
MONDAY — Sloppy joes, tossed 

salad, ranch style beans, peach cobbler 
and milk. 

TUESDAY — Enchilada casserole, 
tortillas, tossed salad, mex-hominy, 
pineapple cake and milk. 

WEDNESDAY — Cheeseburgers, 
tossed salad, French fries, apple sauce 
and milk. 

THURSDAY — Turkey and dress-
ing, sliced bread, green beans, but-
tered corn, oatmeal cake and milk. 

FRIDAY — Sandwiches, tossed 
salad, potato chips, peaches, cookies 
and milk. 

Swiftettes 55, Canyon 31 
Nazareth 	21 12 12 10 — 55 

Canyon 	6 8 7 10 — 31 
SCORING: Ramona Heiman 18, 

Leona Gerber 12. 
FLOOR PLAY: Heiman 7R. 

(Swiftettes took first, Bobbies fourth) 

JV Bobcats 50, Levelland 42 
Levelland 	6 17 10 	9 — 42 

Dimmitt 	11 13 14 12 — 50 
SCORING: Scott Hill. Jerry Gon-

zales 10. 
FLOOR PLAY: Martin Alvarez 8R, 

7C; Mark Bennett 7R, Gonzales 10C. 
FG: 23/54 — 43% 
FT: 418 — 50% 

Swifts 59, Olton 35 
Nazareth 	8 14 20 17 — 59 
Olton 	 5 5 8 17 — 35 

SCORING: Russell Hoelting 15, 
Randy Leavitt and Chris Gerber 10. 

Lady Longhorns 60 
Cotton Center 18 

CC 	 4 10 2 2-18 
Hart 	 18 16 10 16 — 60 

SCORING: Diane Montiel 14, Susie 
Reyna 10. 

Muleshoe JV 
Tournament 

Longhorns 74, 
Cotton Center 27 

CC 	 8 9 4 6 — 27 
Hart 	 20 21 18 15 — 74 

SCORING: Mark Castillo and Bruce 
Finch 12. 

NAZARETH 
MONDAY — Burritos, chili, tossed 

salad, corn, pudding, milk. 
TUESDAY — Turkey and dressing, 

cranberry sauce, green beans, hot but-
tered bread, fruit salad, milk. 

WEDNESDAY — Sandwiches. 
potato chips, pickles, oranges, milk. 

CHRISTMAS HOLIDAYS. 

JV Swifts 35, Friona 42 
Nazareth 	9 6 10 10 — 35 
Friona 	 4 8 15 15 — 42 

SCORING: Kenny Kern 13, Russell 
Acker 10. 

HOSPITAL NEWS 
IGA 

239  COFFEE 	1 LB. CAN Tuesday 
JV Swiftettes 54, Friona 30 

Nazareth 	12 15 12 15 — 54 
Friona 	 8 4 8 10 — 30 

SCORING: Rachel Huseman 16, 
Sheila Acker 12. 

CORN 
CREAM STYLE OR WHOLE KERNAL 

SPINACH, TOMATOES 
PEAS & GREEN BEANS 

IGA, 16 OZ. CANS 
MIX OR MATCH 

3 FoR  $ 00 

JV Swifts 38, 
Springlake-Earth 40 

Nazareth 	11 10 	5 12 — 38 
S-Earth 	10 12 10 8 — 40 

SCORING: Kenny Kern 12. 

Bobbies 49, Roosevelt 42 
Roosevelt 	5 15 9 13 — 42 
Dimmitt 	16 10 8 14 — 49 

SCORING: Becky Schroeder 12, 
Lisa Nelson 11, Tammie Washington 
10. 

FLOOR PLAY: Schroeder 6R, 3C: 
Stacie Jackson 5R. 

FG: 17148 — 35% 
FT: 15122 — 68% JV Swiftettes 66, 

Springlake-Earth 18 
Nazareth 	9 16 26 15 — 66 
S-Earth 	0 	5 	2 11 — 18 

SCORING: Tracy Hill 17, Barbie 
Steffens 16. 

JV Bobbies 34, Roosevelt 18 
Roosevelt 	2 6 4 6 — 18 
Dimmitt 	6 10 10 8 — 34 

SCORING: Molly Waggoner 12. 

Patients In Hospital: 
Howard Bridges 
Robert Brotherton 
Nlozelle Lilley 
Suzanne Mendez 
Clara Neumayer 
Marie Rivera 
Mary Ann Schulte 
Trellis Summers 
Rebecca Vargas 
Okle Young 

Patients Dismissed: 
Pedro Rodriquez 
Marci Halencak 
Joy Baker 
Roxanne Rivera 
Irma Rodriquez 
Maria Chavez 
Sue Ellen Dones 
Pauline Adams 
Jaci Holcomb 
Miguel Rodriquez 
Mary Ornelas 
Juan Garcia 
Trinity Rohb 
Rosa Carrasco 
Bud Hill 
Roxanne Oltivero 
Lorenza Rodriquez 
Corina Ellis 
Natividad Aranda 
Peggy Homfeld 

KRAFT 

VELVEETA CHEESE 
16 OZ. BOX 

$1" 

TV 
HALF MOON 

Fire calls 

CHEESE 
10 OZ. PKG. 

$ 1 39 

TV 
MEAT 

FRANKS 
12 OZ. PKG. 

PAT McDONALD sails basket-high for a Dimmitt shot after 
stealing the ball in the fourth quarter of the Bobcats' Friday 
night game against Levelland here. McDonald scored half of 
Dimmitt's points (21), but the rest of the team had trouble fin-
ding the basket as the visiting Lobos won, 46-42. 

ARMOUR 1877 BONELESS 
HAMS 	 LB. $249  
ARMOUR 1877 HONEY-CURED 
HAMS LB $259   	. 
FRESH CUT 
ARM ROAST 	 LB.$  1 79 	‘ 
FRESH CUT 
ARM STEAK 	 $ 1 89  
FOR CHICKEN FRYING 
CUBE STEAK 	 LB .$ 229  
TV 
BACON 	 LB .$ 1 59  794 

The Dimmitt Volunteer Fire 
Dept. answered three fire calls 
in the past week. 

Saturday morning a phea-
sant hunter had to exit his 
pickup rather quickly as the 
engine burst into flames. Joe 
Wilcox of Crane had been hun-
ting about a mile north of 
Taylor Feed Lot when the inci-
dent occurred. The vehicle sus-
tained extensive damage to the 
engine and passenger compart-
ments. Eleven men and two 
units reported to the fire. 

Sunday at 3 p.m. seven men 
and two units reported to a 
grass fire on Roger Schilling's 
land just north of KDHN 
Radio, north of Dimmitt. No 
damage was reported. 

Fifteen men and two units 
helped extinguish a fire in a 
cotton trailer at Easter Gin 
Monday at 7:39 p.m. Damage 
was light. 
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Good Luck, 
BOBBIES 

against 

IDALOU 
Friday, There, 7:00 p.m. 

(First District Game) 

and 

LITTLEFIELD 
Tuesday, Here, 6:30 

57, Dunbar 63 

53, Hereford 66 
69, Adrian 41 

LIONS CLASSIC 
TOURNEY 

71, Caprock 59 
60, Monterey 87 
50, Plainview 41 

(Third Place) 
65, Canyon 70 

42, Levelland 46 
69, Roosevelt 56 

37, Morton 53 
53, Hereford 58 

69, Adrian 35 
LEVELLAND TOURNEY 

61, Lubbock High 63 
27, Morton 48 

46, Canyon 55 

CANYON CLASSIC 
TOURNEY 

58, Borger 40 
57, Canyon 61 

47, Abernathy 66 
49, Roosevelt 42 

REESE A.F.B. 
TOURNAMENT 
Thursday, Friday 

and Saturday 
(Opening Game: 

Dimmitt vs. 

Colorado City, 

7:00 p.m. Thursday) 

and against 

LITTLEFIELD 
Tuesday, Here, 8:00 

(First District Game) 

Thurs.-Sot., Dec. 13-15 	 REESE TOURNEY (Bobcats) 
Friday, Dec. 14   *IDALOU, There (Bobbies Only) 
Tuesday, Dec. 18 	  *LITTLEFIELD, Here 
Friday, Dec. 21 	... 
Thurs.-Sat., Dec. 27-29 

Monday, Dec. 31 	  
Friday, Jan. 4 	 *MULESHOE, Here 
Friday, Jan. 11 	  'JULIA, There 
Tuesday, Jan. 15 	 *FLOYDADA, Here 
Friday, Jan. 18 	  *IDALOU. Here 
Tuesday, Jan. 22 	 *LITTLEFIELD, There 
Friday, Jan. 25 	  *FRIONA, Here 
Tuesday, Jan. 29 	 *MULESHOE, There 
Tuesday, Feb. 5 	  *JULIA, Here 
Friday, Feb. 8 . 	......... 	*FLOYDADA, There 
Tuesday, Feb. 12 	 *IDALOU, There (Bobcats Only) 

*FRIONA There 

CAPROCK TOURNEY 

MORTON, Here 

Support the Boosters Who Support Our Teams, Schools and Community! 
Dimmitt Consumers 

Dimmitt Equipment Co. 
Dimmitt Feed Yard 
Dimmitt Motor Co. 

Dimmitt Printing & Office Supply 
Dimmitt Ready Mix 

Dimmitt TV Cable Co. 
Don's Wrecker Service & Body Shop 

E.M. Jones Ditching 
First State Bank of Dimmitt 

Five Point Farmers Gin 
Flagg Farmers Gin 

Flagg Grain Co. 
George's Exxon 

George Real Estate 
Don Hargrove, Contractor 

Hays Implement Co. 

Hereford Texas Federal Credit Union 
Hi-Plains Savings & Loan Assn. 

Horizon Seeds 
Garner Ball 

Higginbothom-Bartlett Co. 
J & R Paint & Body Shop 

Jerry's Automotive & Machine 
Jones-Rawlings Insurance Agency 

K-Bob's Steak House 
Keith Lowe Insurance Agency 

Killingsworth True Value Hardware 
La Coiffures 

Modern Carpet & Furniture 
Nelson Drilling & Pump Service 

The North Gin 
Parson's Rexall Drug 

Production Credit Assn. 
Bill Harmon 

an Fructose Corp., Dimmitt. Operations 
Anthony's 

Autos Unlimited 
B & W Aerial Spray 

Big T Pump Co. 
Braafladt Transport 

Bruegel & Sons Elevators 
Bryant's Sales & Service 
Stan Byrnes Motor Co. 
C & S Equipment Co. 

Castro Co-op Gin 
Castro County Abstract & Title 

Castro County Grain Co. 
Castro County Oil & Gas, Inc. 

Cobb's 
The Diet Center 

Dimmitt Aerial Spray 

Ruby Lee Real Estate 
Riverside/Terra 

Seale Florist 
Smith Insurance Agency 

Thelma Smith 

Stanley Schaeffer 
Jerry Stump Insurance Agency 

The Sweet Shop 
Thriftway Supermarket 

Tidwell Spraying Service 
You're The One Hair Design 

Vardell Fuel Co. 
The Village Shop 

Wjlson Real Estate 



Who's New? 
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First Class, 
First Choice. 

For many farm owners and 
operators, Production Credit Associa-
tion is the First Choice for financing. 
With over 50 years of lending strength 
behind us, we try to provide each 
member customer with First Class ser-
vice and planning. 

We're ready to help you finance or 
enlarge your operation, repair or add to 
your equipment, buy cattle; or moder-
nize your business operation. 

Call or stop by our office soon. Put 
over 50 years of PCA lending strength 
to work for you. 

Bill Harmon 
Vice-President and Office Manager 

Ann Armstrong 
Assistant Vice-President 

Janet Morgan 
Secretary 

114 E. Jones, Dimmitt 
647-3169 

( U S Government Guaranteed Bonds 

11.75% 
Guaranteed as to principal & interest 

Insured Federal Income Tax-Free' 
Municipal Bonds, 	, 

9.80% 
'Interest may be subject to state & local taxes 

IRA and KEOGH Retirement Plans .\\ EL  

13.00% 
	„...1
'Based on A-rated Corp Bonds 

rpm Edward 
D. Jones 
& Co. 

Aimbo. 0.10. 1px 5.10C1 (.01.010 
'MelnDer Sikurdies Invisic. ProtKliOn C*(00,1144 

Call, or drop by my office for more 
information. 

IKE STEVENS 

508 S. 25 Mile Ave. 
Hereford, TX 79045 

(806) 364-0041 

Rates Expressed As Yield To Maturity 

I Would Like Further 
Information: 

Name 	  

Address 	 

City 	  

State 	 Zip 	 

Phone 	 
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AB! A riculturt Business Industr 
Food drive 

is planned 
The Dimmitt High School 

Chapter of the National Honor 
Society is sponsoring a food 
drive Sunday from 2 to 4 p.m. 

NHS members will be going 
door to door in Dimmitt to col-
lect food items for needy 
families to be distributed dur-
ing the holiday season. They 
are asking for canned goods 
and non-perishable items. 

There is growing demand for-
Castro County hunting land. 
Hunters are willing to pay for 
the experience. 	• 

Can we recognize the oppor- 
tunity and capitalize On it? 

) 	We would like to have Your 
ideas at the Castro County 
Economic Development Com-
mission. 

TEXAS DEPT. OF HIGHWAYS and Public 
Transportation breaks ground for new 
facilities in Castro County just south of Dim-
mitt on US 385. Participating in the ceremony, 
held last week, are (from left) Charlie 
Lankford, maintenance technician 3 crew 
chief of the Lubbock Special Crew, Doyle 
Wassom, maintenance construction supervisor 

Check 5afetg  
Zo Make Zhe 
Holidays 
Bright 3 for Castro County, and Chamber of Com-

merce members Virgil Justice, George Sides, 
Jim Killingsworth, Gene King, Delores Heller 
and Jerry Stump. Wassom said the lot will be 
levelled and fenced, but building may not 
begin for two or three years. "We'll use it for 
stockpiling materials and storage," he added. 

Hance to join law firm At 

will, no doubt, provide in-
valuable counsel to our current 
clients while continuing to 
serve those he advised prior to 
entering politics." 

Hance began practicing law 

in 1968, following his gradua-
tion from the University of 
Texas Law School in Austin. 
By 1974, Hance had developed 
a four-lawyer Lubbock prac-
tice. 

"Ater.; 1̀4%,isyraseix.: xst.iy; 

4),Wit /pc" 

OUT OF TOWN 
John and Nacola Furr of Dimmitt 

are the parents of a son, Brandon 
Shelby, who was born in Northwest 
Texas Hospital in Amarillo Dec. 3. He 
weighed 8 pounds, 6 ounces and was 
201/2  inches long. He has three big 
brothers. Shaun 5, Shane 3, and 
Jeremy 19 months. Grandparents are 
A.L. and Topsy Conner of Springlake 
and Ruth Furr of Earth. 

`t. 
, 	. 

Before hanging strings of lights, 
spread them on the floor and.check for 

frayed •orbare wires, cracked insula-
tion, !dose connections,'-and damaged 
• - plugs or light sockets. 

❑ Cgck extension cords for 
wear or damage and don't run 

them across walking areas. 

 	itst lights before putting them,on the 
tree. Unplug them before making repairs 

or replacing bulbs. 

Still uncommitted about his 
political future, Dimmitt 
native Kent Hance has joined 
a McKinney-based law firm to 
resume his legal practice in 
January. 

Hance is retiring from the 
US House of Representatives 
after three eventful terms, and 
is going to be out of public of-
fice for the first time in 10 
years. Hance narrowly lost the 
Democratic party's US Senate 
nomination to Lloyd Doggett, 
who was whipped by 
Republican Phil Gramm tor the 
seat being vacated by long- 

' term Senator John Tower. 
"We are very pleased that 

Kent has decided to join our 
firm," commented William M. 
Boyd, a senior partner with the 
firm of Boyd, Veigel, Gay & 
McCall. "He has forged a 
reputation as a dynamic, effec-
tive and independent public 
servant and has proven himself 
an equally capable lawyer. He 

PLAINS MEMORIAL 
Danny and Rosa Dones of Dimmitt 

are the parents of a new baby girl, 
Priscilla, born Dec. 8 at 5:41 a.m. She 
weighed in at 4 pounds and 3 ounces 
and was 191/2  inches long. Other 
children in the family include Jessica, 
4, Daniel, 2, and Jacob, 9 months. 
Grandparents are George Dones of 
Austin, Estella Leyva of Dimmitt and 

' Lupe Ramirez of Dimmitt. Great-
grandparents are Jose and Chavela 
Rodriguez of Dimmitt. 

It's a boy for Pete and Corina Ellis 
of Dimmitt. Israel was born Dec. 7 at 
7:39 a.m., weighing 7 pounds and 
measuring 19 inches long. Other 
children in the family are Yvonne, 6, 
Pete II, 2, and Sonia. 1. Grandparents 
are Martha Ellis of Dimmitt and Cuca 
Cervantes of Hereford. 

Jacob and Barbara Sears have a 
daughter, Jennifer Laura, born at 4:54 
p.m. Dec. 11 in Swisher Memorial 
Hospital in Tulia. She weighed 7 
pounds and 11/2  ounces, and was 19 in-
ches long. Grandparents are Alvie and 
Gwen Sears and Harold and Laura 
Broadstreet, all of Dimmitt. 

By JERRY MARVIN 
HANNERS 

The pheasant hunters have 
arrived. They have come from 
far and near to stalk the color-
ful game birds. 

In the six months prior to 
the season, the Dimmitt 
Chamber of Commerce will res-
pond to hundreds of inquiries 
from hunters who are seeking 
hunting leases, motel rooms 
and overnight RV parking 
facilities. 

The Texas Game and 
Wildlife Commission estimates 
that Castro, Parmer and Deaf 
Smith counties will attract as 
many as 10,000 hunters during 
the pheasant season. As many 
as 50,000 hunters *may roam 
fields in other sections of the 
Panhandle. 

For some, the arrival of the 
pheasant hunter is an 
unwelcome 	intrusion. 
However, many communities 
are now viewing the hunting 
season as an opportunity to 
add big dollars to the local 
economy. 

And why not? Why 
shouldn't landowners lease 
their lands for a profit? Why 
can't motels, restaurants and 
gas stations do their best 
business of the year during the 
two week hunting season? Is 
there any reason why we can-
not involve our entire com-
munity in this exciting 
phenomenon and create a ge-
nuine tourist attraction. 

Can we not initiate a well 
planned promotional effort, 
organize our acreage to ac-
comodate maximum numbers 
of hunters, plan other special 
events in conjunction with the 
season and capitalize on the de-
mand for Castro county 
farmland as a hunting ground? 

Tourism is now the second 
largest industry in Texas, pro-
ducing over $13 billion per 
year. Castro County produces 
over $8 million in tourist in-
come each year. 

The Texas Tourist bureau of-
fers these suggestions for 
developing tourism: 

(1) Provide an enjoyable ex-
perience. 

(2) Tell the world about it. 
(3) When they come, treat 

them right and they'll come 
back. 

 	Overloading circuits with too many 
lights, can cause fire. Follow manufac- 
' turer's instructions about the number 

of lights allowed on one circuit. 

Choose a fresh, green tree, trim its 
pg' and keep it in plenty of water. If the • 

needles are brown and break-off 
easily, it-could be a fire risk. 	z, 

-D if You buy di artificial free, make'sure 
it has been tested for flammability by 

Underwriters Laboratories (UL). 

 	PlaCelyour,tree away from the 
fireplace or other heat sources 

and out of the traffic pattern. 

❑ Never string lights on a nietallic 
- 	tree. Light strings with -damaged insulation 

can electrically charge a metallic-tree. 
Instead, shine unattached colored floodlights 
• or spotlights on the tree. 

❑ Always turn off lights before leaving 
home orgoing to bed. You'll save money 

and be safer, too. 

11 t 
Never use lighted candles on a tree or 

near evergreens. An& don't burn ever-
'greens in the fireplace. 

Do not•use inside lights on the outside. 
All outside lighting equipment, including 

lights, cords and plugs, should be 
waterproof and made for outdoor use.. 

Also, hang sockets downward and.  
don't leave a -socket empty. 

El When hanging lights on the rooftop 
or 	trees outdoors. stay clear of 

electrical lines. Make sure you or 
your decorations don't conic 
• in contact With them, 

Should you receive a CB radio or 
television this. Christmas, let a qualified 

"serviceman install the CB base unit 
or televisiOn antenna for you. 

This delicate job is best left to the 
prefessionals. 

 	Be sure-  electrical toys are tested for 
safety. Look for the UL mark. 

Wishing You A Safe, 
Happy Holiday 

44,  

••••%. s, • 

SOUTHWESTERN 
PUBLIC SERVICE COMPANY 

SPS1984 ?:i0 I 



Shop our great 
selection of Gifts 

for Your 
Someone Special. 
You are sure to find the 

right gift to please 
everyone on your list from 

Mom and Dad to that 
special toy for the kids. 

Dimmitt Printing 
• • 

CROSS' 
SINCE 1846 

By Ace Reid 

Precious Moments — 

a gift that lasts.,. 

WE HAVE 

PRECIOUS 
	

rt 
MOMENTS 

COLLECTOR 
DOLLS 

0 

System with 

9-ft. dish 
as low as 

9,095 
We will install It. or 
work with you to cut 
your Irish:W.:Won costt 

Where you get 
S&H Green Stamps 
on Parts & Service 

on all new FORD, CHRYSLER, PLYMOUTH 
and DODGE cars, trucks and vans! 

$49 OVER 
FACTORY INVOICE 

rt 
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Climmitt Business and Industrial Review 
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YOU NEED TO CONTACT US FOR . . . 
10 5  

llti 

KILLINGSWORTH 

S. Hwy. 385, Dimmitt 
True Value Hardware 

647-3141 

illife,  

• Chairs 

*Briefcases 

•Electric Typewriters 

*Deluxe Pen & Pencil Sets 

•Electric Pencil Sharpeners 

•Hand-held and Printing Calculators 

& Office Supply 
200 East Bedford 	 647-3286  

1E1 E ISTM /IS 
\z1-  SPE] A 	S 

We have the materials and skill to give you expert service on all 
of your LPG equipment. You will save time, money and trouble 
by letting us put your LPG equipped vehicles and equipment in 
first class working order. 

SEE US ABOUT YOUR BOTTLED 
BUTANE NEEDS! 

WE HAVE 
IRRIGATION MOTOR OIL 

WE CARRY 
ARCO MOTOR OIL, GASOLINE and DEISEL! z 

VARDELL FUELS 

LPG CARBURETOR 
CONVERSIONS & 

; 	LPG REPAIRS 

Highway 86 East 	 Phone 647-3174 
" MAMA MA Mairt MA NOMA !%411111411!Mit ?VI! WI NAV!! AMA 

Women: bring your 
aching feet to us! 

CoinfortShoes 
for work and play. 

SIZES 5-10 
Narrow/Medium/Wide 

Saes/widths vary by Style 

Colors-  white, 

— 	
black, tan, 

1004‘‘‘, 	brandywine 
and navy.  

Red Wings 

PORCEUVN BISQUE C01.1ECI1ON 

Women's 

FOR THE MEN ON YOUR "CHRISTMAS LIST" 
ELECTRIC RAZORS by Remington, Norelco and Schick 

WATCHES by Timex and Lorus 
BILLFOLDS by Torel and Amity 

The magic of friendship 
comes alive in this beautiful 
ornament with the look 
of sparkling crystal. $6.00. 

Light up your little ones eyes 
on Christmas morning with a 
"plush" toy from Applause 
or Ross.  

COW POKES 

A 

Satellite Systems 

C R ANTHONY C O. 

Dimmitt, Texas 

NINA NOMA AM Nat ktOtAMISIII NANA Refill WA IBM MAMA /101 MIK BiLf ; 

9 '“ 

Pawn Mug 
NA NM NOMA Nif MAMMA Kfi NA /BMW BMW /111011rilic Nifs; 

NOW! Mane Elite Plus Heat Pump System... 
Our Most Efficient Energy-Saver Ever 

keep unrusimas 
magic alive! 

With Keepsake Ornaments from Hallmark you 
can capture Christmas magic year after year! 

"Awright Jr., now I know why I've spent my 
whole life working hard to save ... so in my 

old age I can give it to my doctor!" 

W&W COMMUNICATIONS 
102 E. Belsher 	647-3215 (Office) 	647.2572 (Home) 

First State Bank of Dimmitt 
Member FDIC 

K-13eit'o Steak time 

* OVERHAUL 
* TUNE-UP 
* TRANSMISSION WORK 
* BRAKES 
* AIR CONDITIONING & HEATING 

647-3228 t 201 E. Bedford 

K-13oltia 
Dimmitt Motor Co. c steak Hem  

Stan McDaniel — Ricky Nutt 	 c 2D0i0mmWit.t  Bedford 

Cools in summer ... 	away energy costs. The 	than copper-aluminum 	gj, 
Heats in winter .. , 	Elite Plus system 	combination coils. 	tr 
Helps save on energy 	delivers up to 112 SEER. Weathertroe heat  
all year! 	 The big "plus" is the 	pump ... America's :a 

0 	The Trane Elite Plus 	Trane Elite heat pump 	selling brand! I 
. for super-efficient 	combined with the 	Find out how you can 	it., 

year around comfort 	Trane Plus air handler. 	be more comfortable ... 	x 
control. Now you can 	Trane's all-aluminum 	and control energy 
cool ...and heat ... 	Spine FinTM coils 	costs. Call your local  
while controlling run- 	perform better, longer 	Thine dealer.  

if 

it 
	Bryant's Sales & Service 

	

647-3149  
 MANE' 

We con supply and 
instoll almost any 
brand of satellite 
dish. from the most 
economical to the 
state-of-the art 
models 

We con finance at the 
LOWEST AVAILABLE 
INTEREST! 

Glee as a call today 
— and bring more 
then 125 channels 
Into your home with 
excellent picture 
qualify, 	ge• 

121 SE 3rd, Dimmitt 

0 
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NOONIMPINA 111011 Bikli WWII NMI Wit NA NM NA NA NANA "WIWI 	 1110 	 ?Mg MR NWN NOI NM MARLA AWN NA 	MB WA /kW NM Wait AM Nadi NA WI PlIgal Yal 

n. ___ 
/ 
/ 	c 803 N. Broadway 

Stan Byrnes 
Motor Co. 

We do it ALL on 

1CHEVROLETS, PONTIA CS 
and all other makes of cars, pickups and trucks S 

OPEN 7 DAYS EACH WEEK 
11 a.m. to 9 p.m., Week Days 

11 a.m. to 2 p.m., Sundays 

v SALAD BAR 

✓ WE DO CATERING 

v PARTY ROOMS FOR RESERVATION 

YOUR PATRONAGE IS APRECIATED! 



At InterWest, 
It Gives Us 

Great Pleasure 
To Say 

. • 

No 
No Service Charges. 
No Transaction Fees. 
No Minimum Balance. 
No Check Writing Limit. 
No Charge For Travelers 

Checks. 
Plus We Pay You 51/4 % 

Interest 
On Your Checking. 

Totally Free Checking is the InterWest way of 

introducing you to our many financial services. It's 

just another way of letting you know that we want 

your business. 

InterWest 
	 Savings Association 

"Eutreittio, ?cue Aievezes 74849kg ?atilt-ceded fl &sea 24-2. %lad Even daze 

FSLIC 
DIMM1TT 	216 N BROADWAY 	(806) 647-2118 

EQUAL NIMING 

LENDER. 
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Obituaries Letter 
Daughter questions obituary 

and Albuquerque, New Mex-
ico. My husband and I own a 
home in both cities. 

The article stated the family 
suggests memorials to the 
American Diabetes Founda-
tion. How can you use 
"family" when I was not ever 
consulted on this matter? I 
prefer, as one of Dorothy 
Chance's three surviving 
children, that at least one-third 
of any memorials be given to 
the "Rest Home for the Elder-
ly in Dimmitt." 

Dr. Julia Chance Sublett, 
Ph. D. 

Mary Berkemeyer great-grandchildren. 
Pallbearers were grandsons. 
The family suggests 

memorials to the Sacred Heart 
Church or Sacred Heart 
School. both in Morrilton. 

memorials to Texas Baptist 
Retirees, in care of Joe King at 
Interwest Savings in Dimmitt. 

great-grandmother, Mrs. Mar-
tina Reyes of Dimmitt; and 
numerous aunts and uncles. 

Pete Moreno 

Robbie Morgan 
Robbie Lennez Morgan, 61, 

of Dimmitt, died Wednesday. 
Services were Friday at First 

Baptist Church of Floydada 
with Dr. Floyd Bradley of 
Plainview and Rev. Joe Higgs 
of Dimmitt officiating. Burial 
followed in Floyd Co. Memorial 
Park under the direction of 
Moore-Rose Funeral Directors 
of Floydada. 

She was born Mar. 19, 1923 
at Glenrose, and married E. D. 
Morgan Sept. 7, 1940 in Clovis, 
N.M. She moved to Floyd 
County in 1949 from Lubbock, 
and worked for 24 years with 
the Plains Baptist Assembly. 
Since her retirement, she has 
served as a volunteer with 
Texas Baptist Retirees, and 
moved to Dimmitt several 
years ago. 
Survivors include her hus-
band; a daughter, Glenda Sims 
of Dimmitt; a son, Thumper 
Morgan of El Paso; one sister, 
Wilma Privitt of Carrollton; 
one brother, Denver Gravitt of 
Levelland; and five grand-
children. 

The family requests 

(The information contained 
in the Dorothy Chance 
obituary was correct to the 
best of the knowledge of the 
funeral directors, who obtained 
the information from the fami-
ly members present. We at-
tempted to verify this informa-
tion through the Castro Coun-
ty History Book, but there was 
no family history in the book. 

The family's wishes for 
memorials are always asked 
for by the funeral directors, 
and were included as a part of 
the obituary. As far as the 
funeral directors and the News 
knew, all information was cor-
rect. We hope we've straighten-
ed things out for you — jb.) 

Hattie Reed 
Hattie Lee Reed, 87, of Hart, 

died Thursday in Hale Center. 
Services were held Saturday 

at First Baptist Church in 
Hart with Rev. Jack Lee, 
pastor, officiating. Burial 
followed in Hart Cemetery 
under the direction of Lemons 
Funeral Home of Plainview. 

Mrs. Reed was born near 
Richmond, Va., and moved to 
Hart in 1932 from Amarillo. 
She was a member of North 
Side Church of Christ in Olton 
and Hart Extension 
Homemakers Club. 

She married W. R. (Bill) Reed 
in 1916 in Vernon. He passed 
away in 1978. 

Survivors include a 
daughter, Mrs. Wade Mills of 
Hart; a son, Glyn of Hart; two 
sisters, Flora Ashley of Hale 
Center arid Hazel Upham of 
Frazier Park, Calif.; five grand- 
children; 	10 	great- 
grandchildren; and one great-
great-grandson. 

The family suggests 
memorials to the Hart First 
Baptist Church or to the Hart 
Cemetery Fund. 

Funeral mass for Pete 
Moreno, 19, of Dimmitt, will be 
said at 3 p.m. today at Im-
maculate Conception Catholic 
Church with Rev. Norman 
Boyd, pastor, officiating. 

Burial will follow in 
Westlawn Memorial Park 
under the direction of Parsons-
Foskey Funeral Home of Dim-
mitt. 

Moreno was killed in an acci-
dent Tuesday morning north of 
Dimmitt. 

He was born in Lamar, Colo., 
and had lived in Dimmitt most 
of his life. 

Survivors include his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Louis 
Moreno of Dimmitt; two 
sisters, Lydia Davis of Fort 
Worth and Melissa Moreno of 
Dimmitt; one brother, Richard 
of Dimmitt; his paternal grand-
mother, Mrs. Filomena Moreno 
of Dalhart; his maternal grand-
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Jose 
Rodriguez of Dimmitt; his 

Funeral mass was said Dec. 3 
for Mary Elizabeth Wiedower 
Berkemeyer, 87, of Morrilton, 
Ark. She was the mother of 
two Nazareth women. 

Mrs. Berkemeyer died Nov. 
30. Burial was in St. Vincent, 
Ark. 

Born May 7, 1897 in 
Oklahoma, she married 
Clemens A. Berkemeyer. He 
preceded her in death in the 
late 1970's. 

Mrs. Berkemeyer was a 
member of Sacred Heart 
Church in Morrilton and a 
member of the Sacred Altar 
Society. 

Survivors include four sons, 
Carl and John, both of Atkins, 
Ark., Herman of Lake Village, 
Ark., and Raymond of Little 
Rock, Ark.; nine daughters, 
Sister Herman Joseph and 
Sister Anita, both of Nazareth, 
Marie Beck and Louise Sponer, 
both of St. Vincent, Ark., Rita 
Rehm and Helen Ward, both of 
Morrilton, Paula Patton of 
North Little Rock, Ark., Pat 
Stout of Hattiesburg, Miss., 
and Marilyn Riedmueller of 
Oppelo, Ark.; 36 grand- 
children; 	20 	great- 
grandchildren; and two great- 

Dear Editor: 

I do not know where you ob-
tained your information for my 
mother's obituary; however, 
there are many corrections 
that need to be made. I have 
had telephone conversations 
with friends of our family who 
were dismayed over the errors, 
and could not understand 
where the information was ob-
tained. I would also like to 
know where you obtained the 
incorrect information. 

My mother, Dorothy Chance, 
did not die after a brief illness. 
Friends of the family in both 
Earth and Dimmitt have advis-
ed me that she had been sever-
ly ill off and on for the past 
four years. They could not 
understand the article in the 
paper regarding a brief illness. 

She did not move to the "Old 
Flagg Community" when she 
was one year old. She was six 
years old. She had told me this 
many, many times. 

My mother was not a Baptist 
as stated in the article. She was 
a member of the Church of 
Christ; she was raised as a 
member of the Church of 
Christ. 

The article stated she is sur-
vived by two daughters. This is 
correct. However, the article 
stated one daughter's name is 
Julia Barnes; this is incorrect. 
The daughter's name is Dr. 
Julia Chance Sublett, Ph. D. 
(which is me and is on all my 
identifications, credit cards, 
and degrees). It also stated 
that I am from New Mexico. 
However, I am from 'Ruidoso 

ACCORDING to EPA's latest 
estimates, US industry generates more 
than 300 gallons of toxic waste for 
every person in the country each year, 
says the National Wildlife Federation. 
All told, that adds up to 71 billion 
gallons of toxic waste. This is 60% 
higher than EPA's figures released 
last year. 

AGAPE LOVE 
NEVER FAILS 

Love pleases God. 
Love will heal a broken heart. 
Love brings peace even in a storm. 

0011111111111111111/ 

Does God really require it? 
What does unfeigned love mean? 
Should we really have it above all things? 
Must we really forgive 70 times 7? 

A Crusade for God's Love is beginning in 
Dimmitt. May we plant seeds of Agape Love 
in the hearts of all the people and all the 
churches in Dimmitt and beyond. 
Prayerfully, let us embark on a non-
denominational effort to increase Godly love 
in all our churches. The word of God says 
there are many operations but under the 
same God. GOD IS LOVE. 

Please attend meetings to hear and learn: 
*More about Love 
*More about the protection Love brings 
*More about the joy of Love manifested 
*More about what Love is 
*More about what Love is not 

WHEN: Each Thursday evening at 
7:00. 

WHERE: Rhoads Memorial 
Library, Dimmitt 

All invited to come and take the zealousness of 
fervent Godly Love: 

Back to your own church 
Back to your home 
Back to your school 
Back to your job 
Back to your business 
Back to your customers 

Take it in your heart and share it with 
joy! 

REMEMBER: 
WITH LOVE, there is unity. 
WITHOUT LOVE, there is NO unity. 

Don't Forget to Attend 



(806) 647-5512 
NIGHT 647-2305 
201 E. ANDREWS 

aue W ttecket Smoke & Skop 
BODY SHOP & 24 HOUR WRECKER SERVICE 

ell\asar.sieN%,.../eaNar 
Don Elliott, Owner 	 "GET HOOKED ON US" 

Dr. Milton Adams 
OPTOMETRIST 

335 Miles 
Phone 364-2255 
Hereford, Texas 

OFFICE HOURS: 
Monday - Friday 

8:30 a.m. to 5 p.m. 

Saturday, December 15,1984 —Time: 10:00 A.M. . 
KIRBY PLUMBING CO. and BUSSEY ELECTRIC CO. 

214 East Bedford - Dimmitt, Texas 
Auctioneer Note? Mr. Kirby and Mr. Bussey are dissolving Partnership and have Commission us to Sell 
at Auction. They Are Not Quiting Business. 

PARTIAL LISTING 

TRUCKS, SNOWMOBILE. TRAILER, SATELLITE SYSTEM. 

1-1980 Ford 1/2  ton Custom Pickup 6-cylinder. 4-sp, Radio. 
Heater, F•100, P.B., P.S. White in color, 47352 Actual miles. 
Runs Good. 

1-1976 Ford 3/4  ton P U with Koenig Utility Bed and Rack, 390-
Engine Auto. Trans, A.C. P.S.. P.B., Radio, Heater. 16.5 Radial 
Tires, Utility Bed with Flip Top Lids. Pipe Vise, Extra Fuel Tank, 
Red in Color. Runs Good 

1-1978 Ford 1-ton Truck, 400 Engine, 4-sp, P.S., P.B., Radio 
Heater, 16" Tire-Radials, Utility Bed with Flip Top Lids, Extra 
Fuel Tank. Pipe-Vise, Runs Good. Utility Bed is a Koenig. White 
in Color. 

1-1971 Ford 1-ton Ladder Truck with 50' Scope Boom. 390 
Engine, 4-sp. P.B., Radio, Heater. Electric Brake Lock, Manual 
out Riggers, 4,Tools Boxes under Flat Bed. 89 000 Actual Miles. 
Good Running and Working Condition. 

1-1965 Chev. 1/2 ton Flat Bed P.0 292 Engine, Stan Trans, with 
Extra Gas Tank and Tool Box. 

1— 1974 Chrysler New Yorker. 440-Engine, Auto. Trans. AC.. P.S., 
4•DR. Sedan. 

1-400 Pontiac Engine with Auto Trans, on 3/4  ton Chev. Front 
End, Running when Dismantle 

1— 9'Paraclipse Satellite Television System, with Apollo Z70 
Receiver and All Wiring. 

1— Scorpion Whip Snowmobile, 440 C C.. 2 Cylinder. 759-Miles. 
1-3-Ramp Motorcycle Trailer with Single Axle. 
1—Double Axle Pipe Trailer. 
1— V W Dune Buggy Body No Engine 

MERCHANDISE: 

1—DeVilbiss 71/2  H.P. Portable Gas Compressor - Twin Cyl 
2-5)(8' Portable Flashing Signs with Arrow 1 • 4 Line, 1 - 5 Line. 
1— Senco Air Staple Gun. 120 P.S. 	Model M.W. with 2-Boxes of 

11/2" Staples. Work Good. 
1—Ridgid 535 Pipe Threader with 4 Die-Heads, 110 Volts with 

' 	Foot Operator, Less than 1•Yr. Old. 
1— Quijada Pipe Treader, Converted to Ridgid Threader 110 Volts 

- Manual Switch. 
1—Power Hacksaw with 1-3 Craftsman Motor on Stand 
1—Hammer Drill 110 Volts. 
2— Metal Work Tables - 1-8', 1•4'. 
1—Galaxy 6" Bench Vise. 
2—Ridgid Pipe Vises 1-3", 14". 

Inspection Date: Friday, Dec. 14 - 10:004:00 Storm Sate: Sat. Dec 22 

TERMS AND CONDITIONS: Cash or Personal Check Day of Sale, All Merchandise Sold AS-IS, WHERE-IS, 
with No Guarantee. 

Bring Your Checkbook. 	Auctioneer or Owner Not Responsible for Accidents. Lunch Will Be Available .  

SALE CONDUCTED BY 

MOGG'S AUCTION SERVICE 
Rex Mogg — Auctioneer 
TXS-111-0902 

(80d) 298.5787 or 293-9108 
Plainview, Texas 

Member Texas and National Auctioneer Associations 
Licensed & Bonded 

"WILL HANDLE ALL TYPES OF SALES" 

1—Ridgid Heavy Duty Cast Iron Cutter. Ratchet-Type. 

ynt Time Clock. 
11:AKceraorpnrei  

1—Oster Power Vise on Stand. 
1-11/2 " Water Pump with Gas Motor 
1—Scotman Ice Machine. 
1—Halsey-Taylor Drinking Fountain - Wall Type, 
1—Walk-in Cooler Evaporator built by Betz Model 260 HR Ser 

No. 712 
4—Under the Counter 24" Light Fixtures. 
1—Large Lot of Starter, Disconnect Boxes, Timers. Conduit Fit- 

tings, Breakers. Fuses, Capacitors, Relays, Starter Contact 
1—Box Fluorescent Light Bulbs, Mod-Li-Line Type. 
1—Large Lot of Outside Lampholders with Cover, Outside Light 

Fixtures, Vaportight Globe UN75, Vary Types of Light Bulbs. 
• Fluorescent Ballasts Vary Types, Weather Heads with Vary 

Type Conduit 
1—Large Lot of Conduit Boxes, Romex Boxes, Conduit Floor Type 

Boxes, Plugs, Switches, Covers, Vary Other Electric items 
1—Large Lot of Vary Type Hand Tools. 
1—Lot Appor. 30 Rolls of Upholstery Material. 

PLUMBING MATERIAL: 

3-2"Bronze Ball Valves 
1-2%' Bronze Ball Valves. 

• • 1-4" Bronze Gate Valve. 
1—Lot of Vary Size Dresser Coupling - Plastic. 
1—Large Lot of Black and Galv Pipe Fitting - 
1— Large Lot of New Faucets, P-Traps. Gate Valves, Flush Valves. 

Shower Valves, Flex Connectors, Sink Faucets, and Much More 
1—Large Lot of P.V C. Pipe Fittings, - Vary Siies, Washing Machine 

Wall Boxes. Plastic, Brass Fitting, P.V.C. Drain Fittings 
1—Lot of Metal Duct Material and Vent Pipe 
1—Lot of Butcher Block Counter Tops New. 

PIPE: 
315'-1/2  Galv. Pipe. 
126'-1/4  Galv Pipe 
483'-1/2  Black Pipe 
631-3/4  Black Pipe 
42'-1 Black Pipe. 
1—Lot 11/4 ". 1,/x", and 2" Pipe on Hand. 
1—Lot of Appr. 550' 4" Sewer Pipe. 
1—Lot of Apar. 440' Sch. 40 P.V.C. Pipe IA" thru 4". 

Much Much More to Numerous to Mention. Come Out and be With 
Us This Sale Will Be Held Inside 

vpNospRIME 
dituaoo  

FRESH 

Shrimp, Oysters, Crawfish, 

Fish and more. 
The finest selection ever of fresh seafood 

by air from Massachusetts, Oregon, 

Washington, Louisiana, Texas and elsewhere! 

LIMITED 

QUANTITIES 

THURSDAY 
DEC. 13 
2-6 p.m. 

CIRCLE K STORE 
PARKING LOT 

N. Broadway, Dimmitt 
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Senior 
Citizens 

Police Calls 

AUCTION 

Three weeks before 
Christmas, the burglars came 
and took: four frozen chickens, 
three men's watches, two full 
tool boxes, and a black and 
white 19-inch TV. 

Also, a record player with a 
wooden cabinet and a heavy 
duty battery charger was 
taken in the burglary of the 
Dick Thomas residence at 307 
NE 7th in Dimmitt. Police say 
the items were valued at a total 
of $992. Apparently entrance 
was gained through a 
bathroom window that had 
been pried open with a 
crowbar, which burglars left on 
the premises. Thomas reported 
the burglary Dec. 4. 

Dec. 5 at about noon, police 
received a report about a truck 
driver found dead in his truck, 
which had been making a 
'delivery to E. M. Jones Dit-
ching in Dimmitt. James A. 
Reese, 64, of Ulysses, Kan. had 
pulled up with a load of plastic 
irrigation pipe from the 
Ulysses Irrigation Pipe Co., 
but failed to get out to unload 
it. After 15 or 20 minutes, 

Bridge will be played today 
(Thursday), Friday, and 
Wednesday at 10 a.m. 
Duplicate bridge will be played 
on Monday evening. 

Ron Kolius, the Hi Plains 
hearing aid representative will 
be at the Center today from 10 
a.m. to noon. 

There will be a Bible study 
Monday at noon. 

The Beltone hearing aid 
representative will be at the 
Center Tuesday from 10 a.m. 
to noon. 

There will be a Christmas 
covered-dish supper Tuesday.  
at 6 p.m. Christmas carols will 
be sung. December birthday 
people will be honored. Each 
person attending is asked to br-
ing a Christmas gift for the 
Center. There will be an even-
ing of table games. 

We wish to all our Jewish 
friends a happy Hanukkah on 
Wednesday. 
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employees of the ditching firm 
went to investigate, and found 
Mr. Reese dead. Police 
reported that Mr. Reese had a 
history of heart problems. 

Investigation is continuing 
in the Dec. 1 burglary of the La 
Posta Liquor Store, located 10 
miles north of Dimmitt on US 
385. Beer, liquor and curios 
valued at a total of $1,042.82 
were taken in the incident. The 
front door of the establishment 
had been forced open. 

A "jam box" valued at $210 
was reported taken from the 
car of Nathan Nelson of 1103 
W. Bedford. Nelson told police 
that the tape player was most 
likely stolen between 6:30 p.m 
Friday and 6:30 p.m. Sunday. 

Dimmitt Fire Marshal Steve 
Jameson reported the theft 
Sunday of a five-gallon butane 
bottle valued at $150. Almost 
full, the bottle was removed 
from a trailer parked on the 
southwest side of the Dimmitt 
Fire Station. 

At 5:35 a.m. Sunday, the 
John Kovacs family was 
awakened by the sound of 
breaking glass at their home at 
404 SW 4th in Dimmitt. A 
19-year-old Dimmitt man was 
arrested in the incident and 
charged with public intoxica-
tion and criminal mischief. 
During booking at the jail, he 
was also charged with • using 
vulgar language. 

A Dimmitt man was arrested 
Saturday afternoon and charg-
ed with public intoxication and 
theft in the shoplifting of a 
package of salami valued at 
$1.35 from Taylor & Sons 
Grocery. 

Dec. 4, a 1981 Chevy pickup 
owned by Doug Schilling of 
Dimmitt was struck by an 
unknown vehicle, sustaining 
light damage. The pickup was 
legally parked in the 100 block 
of South Broadway. 

Two Dimmitt women, ages 
29 and 21, were charged Dec. 4 
with disorderly conduct —
fighting. 

Three men were charged with 
DWI, misdemeanor, and two 
were jailed to serve time on 
DWI charges. 
ots autogisAw4 a 	au% 	_ 
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Gift Her With 

711  GOWNS 
& ROBES 

GOWNS 
$599  to $1199  

ROBES 
$1399  to $2999  

* Campus * Walls 

Mens 
& Boys 
HANES 

BRIEFS & 
T-SHIRTS 

25% 
Off 

PANTIES 

$169  

to 
$249  

it 
Cute Doll Face 
Cuddle Mate 

HOUSE SHOES 
Hanes Too 

PANTY HOSE 

SLENDERALLS 

$1499  Pr.  

$325 
Pr. 

$q75 
Pr. LP 

DENIM JEANS 

Wrangler 
Boot & Straight Leg 

HARMAN'S Christmaslund-up Resistol 
hri  FELT 

HATS 
20% OFF 

20% Off '4' 

ALL JACKETS 
For Men & Boys 

	PR '1397  

Gift 
Him With 

Mens 
WESTERN 

SHIRTS 
$1399  to $2299  

CANTRECE HOSE Pr.$225  SLACKS ALWAYS 
FREE GIFT 
WRAPPING! THIGH HI HOSE '1799  

SPORT 
SHIRTS 

pr  $250  '15 to $35 "1099  to 

'3999  to '999  Gift Him With 
SWEATERS 

81599  to 82999  

Mens Texas Brand 
COWBOY BOOTS 	 
Mens Tony Lama 
COWBOY BOOTS 
Mens Cowtown 
COWBOY BOOTS . 
Boys & Kids 
COWBOY BOOTS 

$9999  to $15999 	ScN 
Values to '13999  NOW$9999  

$1899  to $5999 4 
Wrangler 

CORDUROY PANTS 
$1599  

MOON BOOTS 
Kids & Boys 

$1597 
40 SI-LAI 

Wrangler 
JOGGING SUITS 

Mens & Boys 

Nunn Bush 
SHOES 	As Low AsS2999  
Mens Velour 
ROBES . $1999  to '2999  
Gift Him With 
HOUSE SHOES $1399  
Casual 
SHOES 	OnlyS2199  '1697  

Heavy Duty Mens 

'1999  
SAVE AT HARMAN'S 



C&S EQUIPMENT CO. 
301 SE 2nd, Dimmitt 	 647-3324 
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SAWS 

Who's got the 
greatest toys 

around? 
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We do! 
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The Gift of Quality 

VHS 

VIDEO RECORDERS 

Call Us for Your 
HEATING NEEDS 

New Heaters — Service — Repair 

MeGUIRE 
REFRIGERATION 

647.5627 
'Industrial •Commercial *Residential *Electrical Contractor 

New Service! 
EXTENSION PHONES 

In-House Sales, Service, Installation 
Save on Price and Installation! 

.• • :2:30 —. 

BIG SAVINGS 
on Ingersoll•Rond's T-30 
S hp compressors. Get 
the pick of professionals 
at a solo price. Call 
McGUIRE 
REFRIGERATION 

.A 
e  

at 647.5627 
today 
Limited 
time 
offer. 

INGERSOLL-RAND. 
AIR COMPRESSORS 	 
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Cattle custody battle confounds commissioners DYF will meet 
Until a court orders the coun-

ty to dispose or sell, Castro 
County is the owner of 632 
head of cattle in a Hart feedlot, 
part of the dispute over the 
bankrupt Hereford Cattle 
Commission. 

County commissioners, 
meeting in their only session of 
December Monday, learned 
that a state district judge in 
Hereford had ordered the cat- 

. tle placed in the county's 
custody. The cattle have been 
in Bridges Feedyard near Hart 
since Nov. 8, and the county 
has been billed for over $15,000 
for the animals. However, the 
county will not be responsible 
for the bill, according to 
county-district attorney Jim-
my Davis. 

"We have a surety bond for 
$60,000," Davis said. The bond 
"should cover the county and 
the feedlot. We are trying to 
get a court order to sell these 
cattle as soon as possible. We 
just want to get them out of 
our hands." 

The Dimmitt Young 
Farmers will meet tonight 
(Thursday) at 8 in the Dimmitt 
High School ag shop. 

Jim Steiert of the Texas 
Waterfowl Association will 
present the program. 

All DYF members and the 
public are invited to attend. 

ahead for the increased expen-
ditures. 

Commissioners also agreed 
to hire Curtis Preston as the 
new assistant county extension 
agent, replacing Menzies 
McWilliams, and to advertise 
for bids on a new pickup for 
Ralston. The commissioners 
plan to provide the pickup cur-
rently used by Ralston to 
Preston. Classifieds get results! 

the existing doors on the barns, 
and construction of new door-
ways. 

"A lot of times, these sliding 
doors are just chained or wired 
shut," Standlee said. "We need 
to do something to provide 
easier access when it's needed, 
but we need more protection 
for these animals and the 
equipment." 

Commissioners gave the go 

According to the audit report 
the commissioners heard Mon-
day, the county is in good 
financial shape. 

The audit, prepared by 
Brown, Graham and Co., 
shows the county's receipts for 
the fiscal year ending Sept. 30, 
1984 at $1.52 million, down 
$255,000 from the 1983 fiscal 
year. At the same time, 
disbursements were chopped 
$169,000. With the "emergen-
cy" reserves built into the 
budget, plus $54,884 left over 
from Revenue Sharing funds, 
the county had an ending fund 
balance on Sept. 30 of $1.07 
million. 

The extra revenue sharing 
funds were left over as the 
result of two area projects, in-
cluding the Panhandle Alcohol 
Rehabilitation Center, that 
failed to get off the ground. 
The commissioners, according 
to federal guidelines, have 24 
months to reappropriate funds 
or refund them to the federal 
government. 

The commissioners accepted 
a bid for $4,851 from Audio-
Video Corp. of Amarillo for a 
new sound system for the Expo 
Building. The new system, in-
cluding new speakers, 
microphones, and other ac-
cessories, will be integrated 
with the existing system. The 
only other bid on the project 
was for $5,271.50 from Hender-
son TV & Appliance of Dim-
mitt. 

Dimmitt FFA instructor Ed 
Standlee and county extension 
agent Seth Ralston told com-
missioners that proposed im-
provements to the quonset 
barns south of the Expo 
building may cost more than 
the allotted $1,500. Standlee 
said the FFA, 4-H, Dimmitt 
Young Farmers and others will 
be working to improve the 
wash racks in the barns, in-
cluding the installation of new 
water lines for increased water 
pressure; new flourescent 
lights; more electrical lines and 
outlets; and improvements to 

More about  

School board... 
(Continued from Page 1) 

While the new courses will be 
offered, they may not 
necessarily be taught by 
DISD. They must be taught if 
10 or more students opt to sign 
up for the course. If less than 
10 sign up for the course, the 
school district may offer the 
course by correspondence, a co-
op arrangement with another 
school district, or some other 
means, including via satellite 
or other new technology. 

The board also created a 
vacancy for a new central staff 
member to assist with the 
teacher appraisal process. 

Even though the SBOE has 
• not adopted the procedures, 
strong evidence indicates the 
new staff member will assist 

• principals in the teacher ap-
praisal process, including 

career ladder placement, con-
tract renewal, and improve-
ment and remediation of 
teaching performance. 

The new member, as propos-
ed by Ryan, will be a person 
with a master's degree or a can-
didate for a master's degree, 
with five year's teaching ex-
perience in one or more of the 
basic skills and formal training 
in personnel management, 
supervision, and curriculum 
development. 

DIMMITT EQUIPMENT CO. 
Allis Chalmers 

Farm Equipment 
White Farm Equipment 

Irrigation Engine 
Sales and Service 

Phone 647-2573 

P. 0. Box 576 

The board voted 3-1 to create 
the vacancy and begin the 
search for the staffer. Board 
member Monty Boozer voted 
against the proposal. 

The board discussed the need 
for additional laboratory space 
at, DHS. Projections indicate a 
total of 18 sections of Physical 
Science, Biology, Physics and 
Chemistry will need to be 
taught next year. Current lab 
space will allow only for 14 sec-
tions. 

The board looked at a 
number of proposals, including 
construction of a new building 
for a lab, classroom and 
storage; building a lab in the 
rear of the existing metals and 

II 4,14 4444 
itn 

Oita
n
. flittif spectacular 

stereo sound  
t(":' 

,‘W 
Phone 647-3151 
Night 647-3155 

ZENITH VR2000. The value-packed 
Smart Deck for those on a budget 

power mechanics shop; 
eliminating the metals shop en-
tirely, combining those classes 
with the existng agri-
mechanics class; or converting 
an existing classroom into a 
lab. 

A new lab-classroom 
building would cost about 
$80,000 according to Ryan, 
while converting an existing 
classroom or the metals shop 
would cost about $50,000. 

The board opted to table the 
proposals until the Jan. 14 
meeting while several studies 
are done to further consider 
available options, and to 
survey students who may take 
Metals I or Power Mechanics 
next year. 

Curriculum director Corky 
Lockmiller outlined the 
changes that have already been 
made in his area in the Dim-
mitt schools, changes currently 
underway, and long-range 
plans. 

Lockmiller told the board, 
"The teachers and others who 
have worked with us have been 
outstanding in their work and 
'cooperation. We have 
developed a textbook-
independent curriculum, with 
areas outlined that must be 
taught. We will be using the 
textbook as an additional 
teaching tool, but the teacher 
will no longer be bound by the 
textbook in how or what is 
taught, or in what order. We 
have specified what must be 
taught in most subjects in 
most grade levels. 

"We have, for the first time, 
an outline of what each child is 
going to be taught from 
kindergarten through the 
senior year," Lockmiller con-
tinued. "It has not been fully 
coordinated in the past. We 
now know what is being taught 
in each classroom, and we 
know from semester-to-
semester what our students 
have and have not mastered." 

Lockmiller also explained the 
curriculum outline will help 
with in-class remediation, and 
with the new tutorial program 
for children having problems 
mastering any subject areas. 

The board decided to con-
tract with a Lubbock firm for 
repairs to the heating system 
at Dimmitt Middle School. 

Joe Miller, of Lubbock, told 
the board a new vacuum pump 
is needed for the boiler system, 
as well as replacements for 
radiator, gym and main line 
traps throughout the system. 
The project will cost $9,000, 
and will be completed during 
the Christmas break. 

Miller told the board the con-
densate return pipes need to be 
replaced thoughout the 
system. The work will be done 
by school maintenance people 
during the summer. Miller said 
most of the old pipe is rusting 
out. 

Garland Coleman, R.Ph. 
104 N.W. 2nd, Dimmitt 

"YOUR HEALTH 
IS A PERSONAL 
THING TO US" 

4-Head Scanning 

• 2-channel AFM stereo with auto-
matic noise reduction. 

• 2-channel longitudinal audio with 
Dolby* noise reduction. 

• 14 day/8 event programmable 
auto-record. 

Monday-Friday, 
8:30 a.m.-6:00 p.m. 

Saturday, 
8:30 a.m.-1:00 p.m. 

* Prescriptions 
* Computerized Records 
*24 Hour Service 
* Cosmetics 

ilgi  	 

!FAS:MR- 
VR4000 STEREO HI-Fl RECORDER. 

• Automatic front self-load. 
• 136-channel quartz electronic 

tuning. 
• 15-function Wireless Space 

Command -  Remote Control.  

ZENITH 
• 

Satellite Ty Systems 
Installed 

Receive over 100 channels for $42.43 
per month including movies, sports, 

religious, family and variety programs. 

*Automatic front self-load. 

• Space Commando  

Wireless Remote Control. 

OVIM 
$ 49900 

• 14-day programmable auto-
record 

• Electronic tuner 

0%0/41  0,0 

4°1  P-S  11  0 9.04-1 
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'Dolby is a registered trademark of Dolby Laboratories 

The quality goes in before the name goes on: 

Cash Price: $1,466.49. 
or $293.29 down payment 
and 36 monthly payments 
Total: 51.527.48. APR 18% 

2608-A Olton Road 
Plainview 
296-6755 

LEISURE 
WORLD 

INSTALLED, 
ONLY 

$42.43 
PER MONTH 

with approved credit 

KITTRELL ELECTRONICS 
103 E. Bedford, Dimmitt 

	
647-2197 
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Hey Dimmitt 

Take A Closer1-1001( 
You Now Have Our Very Ese8t, 

tad Re-Opettittg Come in and register for 

FREE DOOR PRIZES! 
FREE GIFT WRAPPING 

of all your purchases at Anthonys''? in Dimmitt OPEN 8 A.M. TO 8 P.M. UNTIL CHRISTMAS EVE 
(CLOSED SUNDAYS) 

Brighten your bedroom with 
savings on asorted comforters 

sale 2 1 .97 
Values to $55. Give your bedroom a whole 

new look and save. Choose from several 
designs and patterns. It's the easy way to 

redecorate! In sizes for full, queen and 
king size beds. 

Boys' 2 Piece 
Camouflage 
Fleece Sets 

sale 1297  
Reg. 16.99. Boys like the fun fashion of 
these 2 piece fleece sets, made of 100% 
acrylic in an action-packed camouflage 
print! The set includes a crewneck shirt 
and pull-on elastic waist pants. Available 
in boys' sizes 4-7. 

FREE Gift Wrapping 
with each purchase! 

k 

Satin Robes 
for Women 
Your Choice 

WRAP HER IN 
WARMTH FOR 
CHRISTMAS! 

sale 1497  
Reg. $22 to $25. A very special 

gift idea for her...beautiful 
satin robes in rich colors! 

Choose from 3 luxurious styles 
in a machine washable blend 

of 80% Arnel Triacetate® and 
20% nylon: the tone-on-tone 

lace trim wrap robe in cream, 
red, or blue; the solid satin 

eyelet trim wrap robe in blue, 
black, or purple; or the floral 

print zip front robe with quilted 
yoke in pink, blue, or orchid. All 

for women's sizes S,M,L. 

Save on moon boots for 
the family 

sale 15.97 
Values to 22.99. High tech warmth for your family These 
incredibly warm "moon" boots have an ultra lightweight 
nylon tricot and polyurethane upper with plush nylon 
fleece felt liners. In sizes for men, women and children. 

ENTIRE STOCK OF WOMEN'S 

FALL SHOES 

1/2  PRICE 

T 
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