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.s?ar Additional RainLites
By

Bill Ellis
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ANOTHER PIECE of Americana 
has bit the dust, and as usual, it was 
caused by a questionable law.

Next time you visit your favorite 
grocer, notice that there is no longer 
sawdust on the floor in the butcher’s 
area behind the meat counter.

A law passed soMetune earlier 
prohibits the use of sawdust In the 
meat area. The law argued thM If a 
butcher dropped a cut of meat, a 
consumer might be told meat with 
sawdust on It.

At least with the sawdust, the 
butchers had a way of keeping their 
floor clean, as the sawdust collected 
the meat grease. Now, our local 
butchers point out, they virtually 
have no way of doing this, and 
maintaining their floors will really 
be a problem.

Maybe the sawdust was a 
problem. If so, we bad managed to 
survive for a number of years with 
it. Problem or not, it still seems 
preferable to a greasy, dirty floor, 
which could be the alternative.

+ + +  +

SO FAR, WE HAVE met two of the 
candidates who are seeking Max 
Sherman's senate seat in the special 
election expected to be held in 
November. Sherman has resigned 
his position to become president of 
West Texas State University.

We are impressed by the calibre of 
those running for Sherm an's 
position, at least the two we have 
visited with. These are state 
representative Bob Simpson of 
Amarillo and Jim Brandon.

Simpson Is a young, well-thought 
of member of the legislature, and 
has apparently represented his 
district well. He says his main 
concern Is to get acquainted In the 
area outside Amarillo. He believes 
In holding the line on taxes, and In 
cutting down *he bureaucracy.

Brandon, an Amarillo attorney, is 
a member of the Amarillo College 
board of regents. He served as 
Ronald Reagan’s campaign chair­
man in 1976, and holds to all of 
Reagan's political leanings. This 
should gain him a built-in following.

Due to the special nature of the 
upcoming election, all candidates 
will run on one ballot whether 
Democrats or Republican. So far 
there are three Democrats and one 
Republican running, with Brandon 
being the only Republican.

Winner of the special election will 
be required to receive a majority of 
the votes cast in the election. If no 
candidate gets a majority, then the 
top two vote-getters, again regard­
less of party affiliation, will meet in 
a runoff.

In addition to those we have 
named, Mel Phillips and Jim 
Whittenburg are the announced 
candidates. Former congressman 
Bob Price has been rumored as a 
candidate for the position, but as of 
this writing, has not officially 
announced.

+ + + +
RECENT RAINS have boosted the 
agricultural outlook in the local 
area, but the main concern 
continues to be crop prices, rather 
than yield

Prices of corn and maize have 
been the biggest concern. The prices 
for these commodities continue to be 
on the low side, and it continues to be 
a major concern, as harvest time 
raws nearer.
Of course, lots of things can 

1 wippen before the harvest begins. 
ORe can only hope that something 
will come along to bolster these 
tagging markets. It’s sad for the 
farmers to have a good crop, and not 
have the prospects of having a 

Itable year. Farmers have 
lendous investments in their 
less They deserve a better 

OlltfOok
\ And as one of our visitors 
remarked this week, regardless of 

| the other reasons, I want to continue 
T o  eat That’s a major reason that 

the farmer should receive a profit 
for his labors.

If the farmer goes out of business, 
vho ts going to feed our nation0 

| Eating is a habit that’s hard to 
break Those of you who have tried 
dieting can attest to that.

+  +  + +
Don’t be too quick to criticize, 

lemember, even a clock that Isn't 
inning ts right twice a day

R eceived  In A rea
Substantial rain showers were 

received in the Friona area for the 
second week in a row, and in many 
cases, cropland has all of the 
moisture it needs, with irrigation 
stopped for the first time in a 
number of weeks.

Reports of up to two inches of
+  +  +  +

Date Hl-Low
Saturday, August IS 83-49
Sunday, August 14 91-15
Monday, August 15 92-11
Tuesday, August II 92-45
Wednesday, August 17 94-45
Thursday, August 18 87-44
Friday, August 19 88-41

Moisture: .81 Inch August 18; .24 
Inch August 19; I.9S for month.

Registration
Set Friday
Registration for the 1977-78 school 

year will be held for grades 6-12 next 
Friday, August 26. Superintendent 
Tom Jarboe reminded this week.

Sixth grade students will register 
at the junior high beginning at 9 a m. 
that day. Seventh and eighth grade 
students begin registering at 10 a m.

All high school student are to 
report at 9 a m. Friday.

Other grades, including kinder­
garten, will register on Monday, 
August 29, which is the first regular 
day of school Buses run for the first 
time on the 29th

Booster Club
Meets Monday%/
The Friona Booster Club will meet 

Monday night at 8 p m. in the High 
School cafeteria to watch the film on 
the Boy's Ranch scrimmage played 
Thursday evening.

Club president V.R. Wilcox said 
the Boosters are planning a 
watermelon feed for the boys after 
the scrimmage with Vega Thursday, 
August 25

Wilcox said the public is invited to 
the meeting to hear the coaches talk 
about their formations and explain 
some of their goals.

n "

CONTESTANT .. Sharia Benge, 
Frlona’i reigning Matte Queen, will 
represent the city In the list annual 
Wheartheart of the Nation pageant.

rainfall in the area were reported 
from the Wednesday night showers. 
Reports received by the Friona Star 
indicated that Cordie Potts received 
two inches at his place northwest of 
Friona; M.C. Osborn had the same 
amount, and the Ralph Wilson farm 
had 1.2 inches.

In Friona. the official measure­
ment was .81 inch on Wednesday 
evening, with another .24 inch falling

during the night Thursday.
Temperatures were on the mild 

side for the week, with a high of 92 
reached during the day Sunday, 
August 14 The low came out to 60 
degrees in the early morning hours 
of August 13.

Friona’s measurement of 1.05 
inches of rain for the week brought 
the total to 1.93 inches for the month 
of August.

Eleven Enter Event
Eleven girls have signed up for the 

Maize Days Queen Contest so far as 
planning for the city’s big event of 
the year draws closer.

The annual Maize Days celebra­
tion is set for September 13 through 
17 and will include a fire department 
raffle, Girl Scout bake sale, money 
doll give away, plus the parade and 
Little Miss Contest.

Deadline for entering the Maize 
Days Queen Contest is September 8. 
and entry blanks are available at the 
Chamber of Commerce office. 
Tickets for the contest are on sale 
now for $2.50

Entries in the contest so far are 
Debbie Menefee, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Dwain Menefee; Paige 
Osborn, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
M.C. Osborn; Priscilla Pruett, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Tom 
Pruett; Kathy Martin, daughter of 
Mr and Mrs. Clarence Martin; Julie 
O w en, d a u g h te r  of Bob O w en.

Also, Laura Ellis, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Ellis; Faith Mays, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Walter 
Harrell Mays; Charlene Seale, 
daughter of Mrs. Clara Seale; 
Rhonda Parsons, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Percy Parsons; Tracy 
Horton, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Hollis Horton, Jr.; and Donna 
Rector, daughter of Mr and Mrs. 
Floyd Rector.

Contestants entered in the Little 
Miss Contest are Heather Griffin, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. M C. 
Griffin, Teresa Mann, daughter of 
Mr and Mrs. Eddie Mann. Jr., 
Nicole Potts, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Jay Potts. Tonya Potts, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Larry 
Potts. Shay Shirley, daughter of Mr 
and Mrs Jess Shirley and Sherri 
Dickson, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Randy Dickson

Entry fee for the Little Miss 
Contest is 810

Sharia Benge Enters 
Wheatheart Contest

Sharia Benge. Friona’s 1976 Maize 
Queen, is a contestant in the 31st 
annual Wheatheart of the Nation 
Pageant scheduled at 3:30 p.m., 
Saturday. August 20, in the Perryton 
High School auditorium.

She is among 26 entrants in this

Saturday In Perryton. Sharia will be 
a senior this fall at Friona High 
School. She la the daughter of Mr. 
and Mra. Stanley Benge.

year’s contest. They come from 
three states and numerous Texas 
Panhandle communities 

Miss Benge will be a senior at 
Friona High School this fall. Her 
parents are Mr. and Mrs. W S. 
Benge.

The pageant is the highlight event 
of the annual Perryton Wheatheart 
of the Nation Celebration which 
features a week’s worth of activities 
These include a junior rodeo, tractor 
pull, old timer’s reunion, demolition 
derby, parade, motorcycle rodeo, 
free breakfast and barbecue, and old 
fashion threshing bee.

These activities will be held 
during the week of August 15-21 

Contestants in the beauty pageant 
are vying for the first place 
scholarship of $1,000 to the college or 
vocational school of the winner's 
choice. Other prizes awarded in the 
pageant are as follows: first
runner-up. $500 scholarship, second 
runner-up, $250 scholarship; third 
and fourth place runners-up, 
individual gifts. The pageant 
sponsor is the Ochiltree County 
Chamber of Commerce.

Judges selecting the 1977 Miss 
Wheatheart include Bill Nelson, 
executive vice president of the 
Texas Wheat Producers Association 
and Producers Board; Mrs. Rose­
mary Clements, model and former 
Miss New Mexico (1967); and Mrs. 
Janis Geddes. co-owner of Brier- 
croft Dance Academy in Lubbock 
The women have both participated 
in other beauty pageants as judges, 
contestants or directors 

Contestants begin their pageant 
experience with a rehearsal set for 
Friday afternoon, August 19 Judges 
will conduct interviews afterwards 
and continue them on the following 
Saturday. A dress rehearsal is 
scheduled at 8 p.m that Friday.

After a dinner and breakfast at the 
Perryton Cldb, the entrants will ride 
in the Wheatheart parade at 10 a m 
August 20

Change In 
Schedule

Friona High School band director 
Scott Houston announced this week 
that a change in the rehearsal time 
for the second week has become 
necessary, in order not to conflict 
with a revival meeting in the city 

The practice will be held from 6 to 
7:30 p m Monday through Friday, 
Houston said

16 PAGES PLUS SUPPLEMENT

RAIN GUAGE....CIty Manager Jake 
Outland made frequent trips to the 
city’s weather station this week to 
record rain amounts. Outland said

the city had received 1.9$ Inches this 
month and I 05 of that fell this week.

(Star Photo)

Phillips P leased  
With Scrimmage
Head coach Lonnie Phillips was 

well pleased with the performance 
of the Chiefs during the scrimmage 
against Boy’s Ranch Thursday and 
said if it had been a real game he has 
no doubt the Chieftains would have 
won

"From the fan's point of view the 
Chiefs scored one TD and Boy’s 
Ranch scored twice,” Phillips said 
“But the only thing which gave 
Boy’s Ranch its points was the 
automatic advancement of the 
ball.”

Boys Ranch did complete a pass 
which resulted in a 58-yard TD. but 
the Roughriders picked up only five 
first downs in the scrimmage and 
had 136 total yards, averaging just 
2.7 yards per carry.

The Chiefs picked up 12 first 
downs and ground out 240 total 
yards, completing one pass inside 
paydirt.

“We felt our defense did a lot 
better than we first thought,” 
Phillips said. "Boys Ranch had only 
<3 yards rushing In $9 carries. Our 
running backs are a lot further along 
than they were last year, also. They 
averaged over five yards per carry. 
We felt real good about the 
scrimmage.”

The coaching staff substituted 
players freely in order to get a look 
at all the boys. With all players 
seeing action the coaches were able 
to pick out strong points as well as 
weaknesses Fans will be able to tell 
more about the Chiefs game plan 
next Thursday in the Vega 
scrimmage, Phillips said.

Coaches were also pleased with 
the performance of the Junior 
Varsity. Although the JV didn’t 
reach the goal line they held Boys 
Ranch away from a score also. JV 
coaches were well pleased with the 
bright spots which showed up on the 
JV offensive squad

Roughriders coaches were also 
pleased with their team 's efforts and 
feel they will have a much better 
team than was first thought.

The Chiefs' first game will be 
against Floydada on September 1 
The Whirlwinds are not thought to be 
as fast as they were last year but 
still pose a threat for the 4-AA 
district crown. Floydada should be 
an explosive team this year but are 
also young and Inexperienced In 
several areas.

The JV will do battle at Morton 
with the Indian JV on September 1.

Child Abuse 
Is Charged
Ray Rando, Jr., 17, was arrested 

Tuesday of this week and taken to 
the court house in Farwell where he 
was charged with assault on a child. 
Rando was bound over to action by 
the Parmer County Grand Jury, 
which meets early next week He 
was being held on $1500 bond

The charges grew out of an 
incident in which Rando allegedly 
struck a two-month-old child and 
caused it to be dropped

QUARTERBACK KEEPER....Todd 
Bandy (1$) outruns Boys Ranch 
defenders and turns the corner for a 
good gain In the Thursday evening

scrimmage. The varsity offenst 
team picked up 12 first downs ai 
gained 244 total yards. (Star Phol
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F r io n a  F la sh b a c k s
from (be files of The Frioaa Star

45 YEARS AGO-AUGUST 29, 1932
Graduate students at Texas 

Technological College's summer 
session elected officers for the 
coming year at a meeting recently. 
George A. Heath of Friona was 
named president.

J.J. Horton is receiving the 
congratulations of his friends here 
on his appointment to the position of 
general manager of the Henneman 
Grain and Seed Company elevator in 
Friona

+  +  +  +
15 YEARS AGO-AUGUST 21,1942
Pfc. John W. Blackburn, son of 

Thomas E Blackburn of Friona, this 
week was accorded recognition on 
the Roll of Merit at this large school 
of the Army Air Forces Technical 
Training Command He is a student 
in the Advanced Mechanics Division 
Course at Chanute Field, III. Each 
week at this Army post, where 
technicians for the Army Air Forces 
are trained, men showing outstand­
ing achievement in academic work 
and soldiery bearing are chosen for 
the Roll of Merit.

Guests in the C W Dixon home in 
the Rhea Community during the 
past week were Mrs. Rose McLean 
of Dimmitt, mother of Mrs. Dixon,

Mrs. Emma Duncan of Assumption, 
111., and Mrs. Wesley Anthony of Big 
Square, sister of Mrs. Dixon.

+ + + +
30 YEARS AGO-

(Entire 1947 issue missing from 
Star files.)

+ + + +
25 YEARS AGO-AUGUST 21,1*52
One of the outstanding events of 

the summer social season was the 
recent stag shower given for Tim 
Magness, groom-elect of Miss 
Dorothy Guinn. Joe Osborn. G.B, 
Buske, Sloan Osborn, A.L. Black and 
Claude Osborn were hosts for the 
affair, given in the home of Sloan 
Osborn. A skit entitled “The 
Honeymoon is Over" was presented 
by A.L. Black as the bride, and G.B, 
Buske as the groom The honoree 
was presented with a violet corsage 
of gladioli and rainbow ribbon. 
Twenty-three guests enjoyed games 
and refreshments to round out a 
most stimulating evening

2® YEARS AGO-AUGUST 22, 1957
The formal opening of the 

Hi-Plains Savings & Loan Associa­
tion will be held from 1 to 5 pm . 
Saturday, August 24, in the 
Association's home office at 128 East

Lions To Sponsor 
Defensive Driving

A defensive driving course will be 
held September 27 29 for residents 
of Friona and the surrounding area 
who wish to receive a reduction in 
their car insurance.

The course, sponsored by the 
Friona Noon Lions Club, will be 
conducted in the high school 
cafeteria from 6 pm  to 10 pm ., and 
will be instructed by Department of

^ Bookmobile i
t Schedule i

The High Plains Bookmobile will 
be in our area on the following 
dates

Wednesday, August 24- Need- 
more. 9 30-11:00 a m ;  Stegall, 
11 30 a m.-12 30 p m ; and Three 
way. 1-2 p m.

Thursday, August 25-Oklahoma 
Lane. 9-10 a m ;  Rhea Community. 
10 45-11 45 a m ;  and Hub. 1:15-2 15 
pm

Friday, August 20-Wh'te's Eleva­
tor, 10-11 a m.. Lazbuddie. 12 noon-1 
p m.; ard Clay's Corner. 1:15-2:15 
p.m.

Saturday. August 27-Farwell, 8 55 
a m -11 50 a m ; and Friona. 1-3 45 
p m

Public Safety officer Tony Guess of 
Amarillo.

“Anyone taking the course will be 
entitled to a ten percent reduction in 
their collision and liability insu­
rance." Carrol Gatlin, chairman of 
the course, said. "This will be good 
for a three year period."

Gatlin said that on late model cars 
the reduction could amount to $20 
per year per car Couples who have 
an extra car in the family are urged 
to enroll as they will both get the 10 
per cent reduction if they are each 
the principle driver of their cars 

“ In other words," Gatlin said, 
“this it a per car-per driver course, 
and an opportunity for two car 
families to save on insurance."

Noon Lion president B K Buske 
said this course could be one of the 
best Lion projects in terms of time 
spent and money raised He stated 
that 100 participants would be a 
worthy minimum goal to shoot for.

Gatlin said a pre-registration 
location would be announced later, 
but tentative registration fee is $12 
per person He went on to say that 
the course would be worthwhile to 
drivers in that they will learn 
defensive driving procedures 

The course will be an all-class­
room type program with no actual 
time spent driving Persons in­
terested in the course are asked to 
contact Gatlin for details.

Third Street in Hereford. The open
house will officially open the firm for 
business.

Fred Mathis, district manager of 
General Telephone Company of the 
Southwest with offices in Littlefield, 
reports that local telephone service 
should be "much better in the near 
future." The current difficulty 
experiences in reaching the operator 
is due to the preparation for 
conversion to dial operation in 
Hereford, he says.

+  +  +  *+•
15 YEARS AGO-AUGUST 2S, 1M2
A total of 44 boys reported for the 

first football workout for the Friona 
Chiefs Monday morning. We’re 
extremely pleased with the number 
that has come out, as well as the 
spirit evidenced." said Coach 
Kenneth Miller, who jokingly added. 
“You might say that we showed an 
increase of 7.000 per cent over last 
year."

Bob Crozier. Work Unit Conserva­
tionist for Parmer County's Soil 
Conservation District for the past 
four years, has resigned his position 
with the Soil Conservation Service 
effective September 1.

+ +• + +
19 YEARS AGO-AUGUST 24,1M7
Mary Rando, Friona youngster 

who already made quite a name for 
herself with her recitation of "I Am 
The Nation," was informed this past 
week that she and her recitation had 
been made a part of the 
Congressional Record by Con­
gressman Bob Price.

Gary Murphree and Johnny Mars. 
Friona youngsters involved in an 
automobile wreck on August 13, 
continue to improve, a check with 
Northwest Texas Hospital revealed 
early Wednesday.

+  +  +  +
5 YEARS AGO-AUGUST 24.1172
A hearing on August 9 at the City 

Hall brought the Highway 214 
overpass and road widening project 
a step closer as two of the last three 
remaining parcels of right-of-way 
were disposed of. Only one parcel of 
land remains to be purchased, a 
parcel outside the city limits 
belonging to B G. Rule, and the 
project would be ready to be 
submitted to Austin by Resident 
Engineer Rhea Bradley for contract 
proceedings
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WELCOME TO FRIONA

The Allen Attaway family recently 
moved to Friona from Lubbock 
where they had lived for the past 
five years. Allen is the new market 
manager at Plggly Wiggly Super­
market. His wife, Shirley, and he 
have three children. Kristi, I, Scott.

4 and Michael, 18 months old. They 
are originally from Stamford and 
attend the Sixth Street Church of 
Christ. Kristi will be In the second 
grade at Friona Grade School this 
year.

BROCKMAN SALES
A utom otive  Parta Arsd 

Irr ig a tio n  Supplies

ROCKWELL BROS. 
AND CO.

“LUMBER MEN'

HOUSER
GROCERY & MARKET

REEVE CHEVROLET
New And lined Cara

FRIGIDA1RE APPLIANCES

Auction Sale
She was a tiny little pig 

when we got her but Dad told 
ua that if we would feed her 
and fatten her up we could 
sell her and keep all the 
money for ourselves

You could almost see her 
growing as we fed her table 
scraps, milk that was about 
to turn bad. com from the 
field, watermelons and 
anything else we thought she 
might like We scrubbed her 
and brushed her hair every 
day or two to make her 
pretty

Before long Dad said it 
was time to take her to the 
sale so we loaded her in a 
trailer and went into town

Lots of trailers were at the 
auction yards when we got 
there When our turn came 
we backed up to the chute 
and a man helped us get her 
unloaded She was tagged 
with a cardboard number 
stuck on her back with some 
sticky goo

We climbed up onto a 
platform that was above all 
the pens We walked around 
up there for awhile looking 
over all the livestock There 
were big. mean looking bulls 
and little scared calves, 
some horses and a few 
sheep

Dad said we'd better go 
inside, it was time for the 
sale to start The building 
was shaped like a half circle 
with bleachers around the 
outside wall. A high iron 
fence was between us and 
the auction ring The auc 
tioneer and his helpers were 
at a table behind and above 
the ring

C heerleaders 
Begin M oney 

M aking P ro jec t
Friona High School cheer­

leaders will begin a week 
long money making project 
Monday, August 22. as they 
go from house to house 
painting addresses on curbs.

The cost to Friona 
residents will be only S5 to 
have their address painted 
in red and white.

Proceeds will go to aid the 
cheerleaders in their many 
projects during the year.

•it'frs-

When the sale started 1 
couldn't understand a word 
the auctioneer said It was 
like some foreign language 
but most of the people 
seemed to know what was 
going on because one would 
holler "Yea!” Another 
would wave his hat, one 
would say “Here' another 
“Yo.“ Then the animal in the 
ring would be gone and 
another one brought in I 
never could figure out who 
was buying the stock or what 
they were paying until Dad 
explained the bidding and

told us certain things to 
watch for and listen for 

We got excited and jumped

up and down when our pig 
came in The auctioneer 
made some remark about 
the pig never missing any 
meals and everybody 
laughed The bidding started 
and went fast and before I 
knew it she was out of the 
ring and another was being 
brought in Dad was smiling, 
saying we got a lot more for 
her than he expected We 
were beside ourselves with 
happiness so I asked who had 
bought her Dad pointed to a 
man near us, so I went over 
and told him he had bought 
himself a fine pig and what 
did he plan to do with her 
“Why. Boy. I plan to make 
sausage out of her"

“Sausage? Sausage’ No! 
Don’t do that! She's a pet  ̂
She..."  He had walked off 

I was crying but my 
brother told me to cut it out 
“Daddy won't let us have 
another pig if he sees you're 
a blubbering cry baby "

I guess I had never stopped 
to think what people raised 
livestock for We met Dad 
out front by a window where 
a man was counting out 
money to him Dad, in turn, 
divided it in half and counted 
it out to us My eyes were 
still red but as I clinched 
what seemed like a fortune 
in my hand, a pretty good 
smile came across my 
freckled face,

Lois Norwood Says.

LEADERS IN 
INSURANCE!

Just becouse we ve issued more outo policies — 
paid more tosses to more satisfied people — for 
more yeors doesn't necessorily meon we ore 
the best . . but it's on indication! Come in ond get 
ocquointed with our Agency and you'll be satisfied 
too1

B J m c lg s - S p f t tg '

A q s n q j
I_____Inc.__

IT  PAYS TO  
KEEP U P  
T O  D A TE!

Many things change: stocks, income property value, status of mem­
bers of a family, tax and estate laws. It pays, therefore, for you to 
keep up to date where your Will is coi..erned. This institution does not 
draw Wills, but our Trust Officers will be glad to consult with you and 
your attorney on matters pertaining to the planning and management 
of your estate. Give serious thought to naming this institution as Execu­
tor of your estate. We have long, specialized experience in such work.

J
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FRIONA STATE BANK
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Results Are 
Given For
Net Tourney

Winners were announced this 
week in a local tennis tournament 
held the weekend of August 12*14. A 
total of 56 individuals entered the 
meet, some in as many as three 
divisions.

Winners included Paul Smith in 
men’s singles, Jo Luther In women’s 
tingles; Dale Houlette in men's open 
singles; Sunny Horton in women’s 
open singles; Leslie White in boys 16 
and under; and Kyle Barnett, boys 
16 and under, open.

Donating money for trophies and 
balls were the Country Store, 
Foster’s, Friona Star, Friona Wheat 
Growers, Houser’s, Kendrick Oil, 
Rick Luther Photography and 
Rockwell Bros. Lumber.

The complete tournament results 
as tabulated by Jo Luther was as 
follows:

RESULTS

MEN’S CHAMPIONSHIP SINGLES
First Round-*Paul Smith defeated 

Keith Martin 6-1, 6-3; Don Maynard 
defeated Mac Bush 6-4, 6-4; Jay 
Jarboe defeated Phillip Hand 6-2,
6- 4; Dave Hutson defeated Mickey 
Griffin 6-0, 6-3; Rick Luther 
defeated Roy Smith 8-7, 6-1; Wesley 
Barnett defeated Jayson Grimsley
7- 5. 6-2.

Quarter Finals-Paul Smith, bye; 
Don Maynard defeated Jay Jarboe 
6-2, 6-2; Dave Hutson defeated Rick 
Luther 6-1, 6-0; W. Barnett, bye.

Semi-Finals-Paul Smith defeated 
Don Maynard 6-4, 6-2; Wesley 
Barnett defeated Dave Hutson 6-2, 
6-1.

Finals--Paul Smith defeated Wes­
ley Barnett 6-4, 6-3.

WOMEN’S CHAMPIONSHIP 
SINGLES

Rhonda Parsons defeated Lydia 
Williams 6-2, 1-6, 6-3; Cindy Smiley 
defeated Teresa Buske 6-2, 6-0; 
Vicki Smiley, bye; Jo Luther 
defeated Joy Morton 6-4, 6-2.

Semi-Finals-Cindy Smiley de­
feated Rhonda Parsons 7-5, 6-4; Jo 
Luther defeated Vicki Smiley 7-6, 
6-2.

Finals-Jo Luther defeated Cindy 
Smiley 6-4, 6-3.

MEN’S OPEN SINGLES
Edward Castillo defeated Percy 

Parsons 6-2, 7-8, 6-0; Dale Houlette 
defeated Cliff McLellan 6-1, 8-6; 
Nick Hand defeated Travis Deering 
6-1, 6-1; Dave Buske defeated 
Dennis Anthony.

Semi-Finals--Dale Houlette de­
feated Edward Castillo 6-2, 6-4; Nick 
Hand defeated Dave Buske.

Finals--Dale Houlette defeated 
Nick Hand 6-2, 6-4.

WOMEN’S OPEN SINGLES
Teresa Loflin defeated Diane 

White 6-2,6-1; Sheri Martin defeated 
Dana Smith 6-2, 10-8; Sunny Horton 
defeated Rita Booe 7-5, 6-2.

Teresa Loflin, bye; Sunny Horton 
defeated Sheri Martin 6-0, 6-1.

Finals-Sunny Horton defeated 
Teresa Loflin.

WOMEN'S CHAMPIONSHIP 
DOUBLES

Jo Luther-Joy Morton defeated 
Teresa Buske-Sharon Jones 6-4, 6-3; 
Cindy Smiley-Vicki Smiley defeated 
Rhonda Parsons-Lydia Williams 5-7, 
6-3, 6-0.

Finals-Luther-Morton defeated 
Smiley-Smiley 7-5, 6-4.

MEN’S CHAMPIONSHIP 
DOUBLES

Don Maynard-Mark Neill, bye; 
Ted Proctor-Lenny Petree forfeit to 
Jimmy Norwood-Mark Zachary; 
Jerry Cass-Stephen Miller defeated 
Gary Wright-Jimbo Evans 6-2, 6-3; 
Mike Hutson-Leslie White defeated 
Dennis Anthony-Bill Loafman 6-2, 
6-3; Dave Hutson-Paul Smith 
defeated Rick Luther-Dave Buske 
6-2, 6-1; Keith Martin-Mike Martin 
defeated Rick White-Travis Deering 
6-1, 6-1; Mac Bush-Phillip Hand 
defeated Gary Jones-Micky Griffin 
6-4, 6-2.

Quarter Finals-Maynard-Neill 
defeated Norwood-Zachary 6-0, 6-0; 
Hutson-White defeated Cass-Miller 
6-3, 6-2; Hutson-Smith defeated
Martin-Martin 6-3, 6-3; Bush-Hand, 
bye.

Semi-Finals-Maynard-Neill de­
feated Hutson-White; Hutson-Smith 
defeated Bush-Hand 6-4. 6-2.

Finals-Maynard-Neill defeated 
Hutson-Smith.

MEN’S OPEN DOUBLES 
t Griffin-Jones defeated Wright 
•Evans 6 1, 6 4; Luther-Buske 
defeated Anthony-Loafman; Nor- 

I Zachary forfeited to Deering- 
»ite; Cass-Miller defeated Martin 

-Martin
I Griffin-Jones defeated Luther- 
Buske; Cass Miller defeated White- 
Deering

Finals-Griffin-Jones defeated 
Cass-Miller 6-2, 2-6. 6-4.

WOMEN’S OPEN DOUBLES
Martin White defeated Loflin 

Maurer 6-3, 6-8, 6-3; Janice
Richards-Janet Hand defeated Lof­
lin Maurer, 6-1, 6-1.

Finals-J. Richards-J Hand de­
feated Martin White 6 1. 6-1

BGYS-16-and-UNDER SINGLES 
CHAMPIONSHIP

Mike Hutson defeated Gary 
Wright 6-1. 6-0; Stephen Miller

(Cantlnued on Page 6)

QUARTER PORK LOIN OR 
FAMILY PACK

i ' \

f t

\V i *

9-11
:h o p s

LEAN CENTER CUT 
RIB

LEAN CENTER CUT 
LOIN

COUNTRY STYLE £  _  . g

Spare Ribs LB *  1 *  A ™ ° |CE beef
EXTRA LEAN ^  C n U C l f  BONELESS ^ ^ B ^ ^ B

B m I  Cubes » 9 9 *  Roast L,  I T

8_ 12
FRESH FROZEN YOUNG LB AVG .

C Hen JE  A
Turkeys LB 9 #

| ^  GOOCH S BLUE RIBBON SM OKED £  .

'  German Sausage p ° Gz 1

GOOCH^S Mexican O A c
_  Not Links JESS* lb 0 7
^  HORMEL S BEEF FINGERS OR

Patties W  V2k°gz  7 9 c
U S D A  CHOICE BEEF C ■  O o  U S D A  CHOICE ^  ^

Swiss Steak S1 29Chuck Steok 9 1
1 f tO TASTE WR,GHT PORK *  ■

I09 Sausage bag 1| S 9

B r o a s t e d  Ch k  K l$|
i i sarva chickan at its finast

B R O A S T E D
C h i c k e n

It 's  our specialty!

I t ’s cooked to order 
fresh to finished, in just 

minutes, especially 
for you.

A ls o ; CORN DOGS
for families, for friends. a n d  BURRIT0S

for all occasions PHONE 2 4 7 - 3 3 4 3 .

100% TEA

« Instant
Nested 3 OZ. 

JAR

Gkm^ uj S pec ia l

KRAFT SALAD DRESSING

Miracle
Miracle
Whip

KEN L RATION

Whip 32 OZ. 
JAR

PR IN G LE ’S 

RIPPLE

POT AT  
CHIPS

TW IN  PACK

“  c

Tender Chunks Ike51 59
DEL M ONTE TO M A TO

Sauce 5 BUFFET 5  \
C AN S ■

DEL MONTE

Pears 303 c a n  3%F
DEL MONTE _

Tomato Juice 46 oz. 5 9
SHURFINE / O f t
Fruit Cocktail 3 0 3  CAN 2 /  8 9

ZESTA

CRACKERS
c

LB. BOX

KING SIZE

DR.PEPPER
6 BOTTLE CARTON

C  PLUS 
DEPOSITP 6 BOTTL

7 9

TEXIZE

SPRAY
&

WASH
'  1 6  0Z .

$ J 0 4

■Daily Awl Fiojck Food

VAN  D E K A M P

Fish Fillet 12 OZ 
PKG

$129

FOOD KING CRINKLE CUT

Potatoes 2 l b . 39
BORDEN

Hi-Pro Milk Vi GAL. 7 9

Our Drawing This Week Will 
Be For 30,000 Stamps. 

Don’t Forget To Register! (

10.000 FR EE
GUHH BROS.

EACH BASIC PIECE 
W ITH EACH 
*3 00 PURCHASE

IMM Mil I -uw
FRUIT
DISH

N N =

50' OFF LABEL

D a s h

STAMPS
EACH WEEK

13 LB 2 OZ. 
BOX

Register each week while in our store. No purchase 
l e c e s s a r y .
The nm e of the winner w ill be drawn each week 
from  the lis t which has registered.
If there is no winner, an additional 10,000 Gunn Bros 
Stamps w ill be added to the total, until someone 
wins the stamps,
Shop Houser’ s fo r Double Gunn Bros' Stamps every 
Wednesday PRICES GOOD FOR WEEK OF AUGUST 2 0  TNRU AUGUST 2 6

CENTRAL AMERICAN
GOLDEN

RIPE

IMUITtD,

THOMPSON SEEDLESS

GRAPES CABBAGE
U  G^NN

j : HOUSER
VENTURI GROCERY

902 N. MAIN ST. PHONE 247-3343
FRIONA, TEXAS

LB. LB, oToTo
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PH .247-2211
Reader Ads-FIrst Insertion, per word 10 cents 
Addltonal Insertions (no copy change), per word

8 cents
IVInlmum charge $150
Classified display (boxed ads 8 pt. type under a 

specific heading, 1 column width only-no art or 
cuts. Per column Inch $1.50

Cards of Thanks-same as classified word rate, 
minimum charge $1.50

DE ADLINE for classified idvertlslng In Sunday's 
Isaue-Thursday noon.

Check advertisement and report any error 
immediately; The Star is not responsible for error 
after ad has already run once.

• FOR SALE....1974 Ford

ANNOUNCEMENTS ^ ^ “ PoCupc^
* 247-2205. 46-2tc

We Xre Now tfie (

X

Frlona Lodge No. 1532 
_  - 7th A Ashland 

Slated Meeting 
^ jn V  1st Tues. 8 P.M. 
< 5 *  J V* Fulks-W M. 

*A.L. Outland Sec.

I’m your Mary Kay Beauty 
Consultant. Call me for all 
your beauty needs Earlene 
Jordan, 247-2537. 45-tfnc

Authorized Dealers In
I riona For

MICHELIN TIRES * 
' The First Steel-Belted 

Tire”
WHITE’S ALTO

15-tfnc

« s.
WALL PAPER HANGING..
..No job too large or too 
small. Free estimates Call 
Jimmie Middleton (806) 
258-7715 or Pat Nelson (806) 
258-7337 Dawn. Texas

*5-tfnc

NOW....In Friona You 
can come direct to us 
and discuss a mortgage 
loan, or a home Im­
provement loan. Let us 
visit with you on any 
financial qWe%Uo« you- 
might have. Tri-County 
Savings A Loan. IM West 
Ninth, Frlona. IS tfnc

NOTICE....Little League
mothers, your pictures are 
in and may be picked up at 
715 Main These should be 
picked up as soon as 
possible 46 2tc

AUTOMOTIVE
FOR SALE....1974 Caprice 
Classic. Good condition Call 
265 3614 Roy Don Rector

45 tfnc

FOR SALE....1976 Chevette 
Hatchback. 4.000 miles. 
Excellent condition $2900 
Dr B<*b Alexander, Phone 
247 ? t 4 4- 3tc

FOR SALE....Morlang ma 
nure spreader. 14 ft. Like 
new Also 1972 Chevrolet 
truck, new engine with a 366 
HP motor Call Ray Gon 
tales. 238-1197 46 2tc

FOR SALE....Ranger XLT 
F-150 Ford pickup. 1976 
m odel, loaded Only 4.000
miles. 460 V8 engine with 
sun fighter 745 6888 46-tfnc

FOR SALE....Motorcycle, 
Triumph Bonneville 650 cc 
Chopper Good Call 806-247- 
3174 46-3tc

FOR SALE....Air compres­
sor. 8 5 cu. ft lVt horse 
motor, 10 gallon tank Used 
less than 30 hours. $200 00 
Call Bill Stephens. 247-3338 
after 6p m 46 ltc

FOR SALE....1970 Ford V* 
ton pickup Good shape See 
at 404 Jay Call 247 2039 or 
247-3392 46-2tp

ATTIC INSULATION
BLOWN-IN ADO ON TYPE

BORDER INSULATION CO.
FAR WELL. TEXAS PH. 481-9257

BUSINESS DIRECTORY

AMDS DRILLING CO. INC
NMEt WEU OMUMC

Uynt Pumpt lac Pump I  Gn r
1 immific Sprinkler! Mild Rlpair!

Salt! ft Strvic# All Makt!

TELEX
CLOVIS HEARING A ID  CENTER

HEARING AIDS
+ Batteries * Molds * Free Hearing Tost

SERVICE ALL MAKES
ft Phono 763 6900 9tfnc

PRO AUCTION SERVICE
1. ,  *A R y  And A ll Types O f Soles 1

AUCTIONEER CLERK >1
LARRY POTTS LELAND \

PHONE PHONE
2 9 5 -6 6 3 3 2 4 7 -2 1 4 6

FOR SALE....1963 Chevrolet 
tandem grain truck Drag 
axle, power steering, air 
brakes, good tires, new 
paint. Less than 2500 miles 
on rebuilt V6 Little Detroit 
motor. 10-speed 2-speed 
axle. Hoist, 20-foot bed. two 
40 gallon saddle tanks 
Diesel. Phone 265-3560. 
Eugene Boggess 46-3tc

Your
RADIO SHACK 

Dealer In Frlona 
!:• White's Auto 

We Have CB Radios
— II i i l fm

FOR SALE....Super Shark 
rims, 14s. for car or pickup. 
Brand new. plus two 
headers. Has lugs and caps 
Call 265-3382 45-2tc

Cards Of Thanks
CARD OF THANKS

How can we say thank you 
for responding to our needs 
in so many ways in a time of 
sorrow in the loss of our 
loved one Thanks for 
everything

The Jim Baxter Family 
46-ltc

FOR SALE
FOR SALE....8x40 Detroiter 
mobile home. Air condition­
ed. central heat, shower and 
bath Carpeted. Excellent
condition. $3200 Phone (806) 
965-2738. 45-2tc

FOR SALE....Frigidaire 
washer and dryer. Phone 
247-3882 after 6p.m. 44-4tc

FOR SALE....1975 Wayside 
3 bedroom mobile home. 
Used only 14 months, 
$7200 00. Call 265-3804

46-tfnc

GARAGESALE

GARAGE SALE....1104 
West 4th. August 26-27. 
Friday. 1-6 p.m. All day 
Saturday. Coffee table, 
round table, curtains, many 
other items. 46-ltc

RUMMAGE SALE....521 
Main (Formerly Wilhelm 
T V.) Friday and Saturday, 
August 26-27 and September 
2-3. Friona American Le­
gion Auxiliary. 46-2tc

SFAMILY GARAGE SALE.
..Friday and Saturday. 
August 19-20. 1111 Maple. 
9-6. 46-lip

HELP WANTED

WANTED....Reliable help 
for church nursery. Call 
247-3075 or 247-3045 46-ltc

FOR SALE....Seed Wheat. 
Tam and Tascosa. $3.25 per 
bushel. Joe Boeckman, 
24- 3357 46-4tc

L.V.N.
Immediate opening We
are expanding occupancy^ 
and need additional 
L.V.N. help Apply inf! 

person.

L Prairie Acres 
211 East 15th

_______ _______ 38-tfnc
FOR SALE....Gameinhardt
French flute Excellent 
condition. Also wooden 
clarinet. Call 247-3130 46-1 tp

FOR SALE....14 x 78 Lancer
mobile home 1970 model. 
Three bedroom. 2 bath 
Carpet and drapery, central 
air and heat. Kitchen 
built-ins, very nice By 
owner Call 247-2132 after 5 
pm. 45-tfnc

FOR SALE....Leblance cla­
rinet, with case and lyre 
Call 265-3802 46 2tc

HELP WANTED....Farm 
hand. Apply in person. 6 
north and 12 west of Friona 
Jim Dixon. 45-2tc

APARTMENTS

MODERN APARTMENTS
LOW rent starts at $147 mo. 
Carpeted, central air & 
heat, range & ref. furn 
NEW laundry facilities. 
SARATOGA GARDENS. 
1300 North Walnut, Friona. 
Texas 247 3666 33-tfnc

FOR SALE....Green Drecel 
sofa, four maple bar stools 
and a table lamp Call Marie 
Fleming. 247-3283. 46-ltc

FOR SALE.... Cook top and
wall oven Call 247 3640

46 ltc

FOR RENT....One bedroom 
furnished apartment. Bills 
paid. Quiet elderly or 
middle aged couple or single 
person No pets, drinking or 
parties No children. Call 
247-2284 45-ltc

FOR SALE....Electrolux 
vacuum cleaners. New and 
used. Sales and Service. 
Phone 247-3156 Mrs. L R 
White, 806 Ashland Avenue 

43-tfnc

PETS

R oberts  
A ppliance, In c.
IF rion i$ Newest i  Hereford's Oldest 

Applience Store)

61$ MAIN FRIONA PH.247-2122

WE PLEDGE TO GIVE THE VERY 

FINEST SERVICE ON EVERY ITEM  

WE SELL ...

* RCA *  WHIRLPOOL * ROPER

n LITTON *  ZENITH

Rem em ber The

1002 Main St..............F riona , Texan
BACK TO-SCHOOL SUPPLIES

FOR KIDS & TEACHERS
EVERYTHING YOU NEED AND  

SPECIALS ALL IN  ON E LOCA TION

BRICK HOME NEAR HIGH SCHOOL ; ■
1 bedroom, 2 bath, storm cellar, 
$32,000.00, 90 per cent loan available to 
qualified buyer. Will show you this house 
anytlme-day or night.

Call 247-3909 or 247-3274 
JOHN BINGHAM LAND COMPANY 

1821 W. 9th St., Frlona. Texas
46-2tc

LO ST AND 
F O J N I )

LOST....A dearly loved 
wedding present-a long 
haired black with white 
marking tom cat named 
Skeeter. If seen, please call 
us at 238-1243 or 247-2243.

45-2tc

REALESTATE
■ ■■

MUST SELL....Three bed­
room brick with storm 
cellar and garage. Location, 
406 Ave. G. Bovina. Gary 
McCormick, after 8 p.m. 
Call 806-797-9175. 39-tfnc

FOR SALE....New three 
bedroom house with two 
wood burning fireplaces. 
Large basement, 2^ baths 
and double garage. Call 
247-3236 after 7 p.m. 42-tfnc

FOR SALE....3 bedroom 
trick home. Fully carpeted. 
Refrigerated air. Corner lot 
with fenced yard. David 
Carson, 1606 W. 7th, 247- 
3222. 44-tfnc

FOR SALE....new three- 
bedroom house. Two baths. 
Refrigerated air. Forced-air 
heat, fireplace, fully car-’ 
peted. well insulated to save 
on heating Double garage. 
1621 W 9th. Phone 247-3290.

37-tfnc

I aTxrshallmTe u ) ^
I Representing 

Rushing Real Estate 
Phone 247-1907 
Res. 247-3266

Box 775, Friona, Texas 
31-tfnc

FOR SALE....Three bed 
room, two bath, refrige­
rated air, dishwasher, elec­
tric garage door, self-clean­
ing oven. Beautiful cabinets, 
carpet. 1127 Etta 95 per cent 
loan Call George C. Taylor. 
Phone 247-3896 30-tfnc

FOR SALE BY OWNER....3
bedroom home, fully car­
peted, plenty storage, lOOx 
140 corner lot, fenced back 
yard. Possession immedi­
ate. Ray White. 247-3082.

46-3tc

HOUSE FOR SALE BY 
OWNER....Large 2 bed­
room. brick. 30 ft. den and 
kitchen, 1408 sq. ft. floor 
space. 1205 Jackson Ave. 
Call 247-3074 45-tfnc

FOR SALE....Large 4 bed 
room, 2 bath home. Base­
ment, central heat and air. 
Glass enclosed porch. 
Shown by appointment. Call 
247-3105 45 3tc

FOR SALE BY OWNER....
Large 3 bedroom, 2 bath 
house. Double garage and 
double carport. Nice fenced 
yard, sprinkling system, 
extra nice. Call for ap­
pointment (505) 276-8461.

45-tfnc

PUPPIES TO GIVE AWAY.
Phone 247-3374 46-ltc

NOW RE-OPENED
Bargain Center has moved to 523 Main 

and Sixth Street.
Come by and see us. We buy and sell 

new and used merchandise.
If you have something to sell see us.

46-2tc

RICK LUTHER, PHOTOGRAPHER
Now you can have quality photos at 
reasonable prices. Phone 247-3419 or 
come by 715 Main, Friona, Texas. We 

specialize in Portraits. Weddings. 
Commercial-Industrial 

Copying and Restoration
Ask about our special student prices......

46-4tc

I
I
I
i
I
I
•

I

L‘

FARM SALES
★  FREE APPRAISALS  

it  GUARANTEE ALL CHECKS 
B & B  AUCTION SERVICE 

SEE A T  BIG NICK'S  
BIG NICK (8 0 6 1 2 3 8 -1 6 1 4  

HOUSTON BARTLETT 2 2 5 -6 6 9 9  $ 
FRIONA NIGHT PHONE •

JA

SHOP YOUR 
REAL ESTATE STORE

FOR ALL YOUR REAL ESTATE 
NEEDS!
HOMES

3 BR, \ \  baths, fireplace, ref. air A 
central heat, double garage, fenced 
yard, 2096 sq. ft.

$41,966.16

3 BR, 1A( baths, nearly new carpet, 
built-in appliances, double garage, 
fenced yard, 1442 sq. ft.

$34,000.66

4 BR, lty baths, paneled den, carpet, 
built-in appliances

$29,000.06

3 BR, 2 baths, living room, study, 
basement for storage, single garage, lVt 
stories, 2000 sq. ft.

$27,500.00

3 BR, 1 bath, built-in appliances, single 
carport, super neighborhood, 1222 sq. ft.

$20,000.00

3 BR, 1 bath, paneled rooms, corner lot, 
single garage, 1008 sq. ft.

$13,500.00

FARMS
200 acres, 2 wells, NE of Bovina 1350-acre

100 acres, 1 well, NE of Bovina $350-acre

320 acres, dryland, N of Frlona $200-acre

R  <‘ | > r e * e n t i i i £

H i - P l a i n *  S a v i n g s  &  L o a n

’’SERVICE is our only Business”

J

r

f'f Al TOR

Carrol Gatlin  
2 4 7 -3 6 4 1

CARROL GATLIN LAND CO.
“Your Real Estate Store”

102 E. 11th Office 806-247-2745 
FRIONA, TEXAS 79035

NOTICE
We are again In a position to build you a home with 
a minimum down payment.

We have plans for you to choose from.
See Ed Hicks If Interested

I Still Need Land Listings!
+ 4* 4* +

4 bedroom house, 2 bath, on South 
Virginia.

4  4  4  4
2 bedroom house on South Virginia.

4  4  4  4
ED HICKS REAL ESTATE 

Friona
Phone 247-3537 or 247-3181

FOR SALE....3 bedroom. 
1*4 baths, brick, on 2 lots. 
’900 sq. ft. 310 East 12th. 
Call 247-2214. 46-2tc

WANTED
WANTED....Guitar. good 
used amplifier Call 806-247- 
3174. 46-3tc

Legal Notice
LEGAL NOTICE

BRUEGEL & WHITE, a 
partnership doing business 
in Castro and Parm er 
Counties, Texas, hereby 
gives notice in accordance 
with Article 1302 2.02. 
V.A.T.S., of its intention to 
incorporate under the name 
of BRUEGEL & WHITE. 
INC., and to continue 
operation of such business 
under the corporate name.

46-4tc

WORK WANTED

WORK WANTED....Experi
enced heavy equipmei 
operator, veterinarian’s as 
sistant, landscaping, fari 
work. Guadalupe Trevirn 
Phone 295-6915 36-ltg

W M f

FEDERAL

FIRST FEOIRAI 
SAVINGS

AM“  juwean.

1 s t 801 Pile St.
i fNOfN 7 6 2 -4 4 1 7

C lovis, N ew  M e x ic o

■  I. t

P O ^ O Q O O B O O O O O O O O O O O O O O B Q d

PONTIAC

l

STAGNER-ORSBORN
BUICK-GMC-PONTIAC

30 YEARS IRRERFORO

SeeUsAndSAVE
142 Miles Ave. Hereford, Texes

Phone 364-0990

♦ A



Net Results • • •

(Continued from Page S)
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defeated Randy Corbell, forfeit; 
Kyle Barnett defeated Jimbo Evans 
2-6, 6-1, 7-5; Mark Zachary defeated 
Jimmy Norwood 2-6, 6-4, 7-5; Leslie 
White defeated Kenney Kennedy 6-0, 
6-2.

Hutson defeated Miller; Zachary 
defeated Barnett 7-5, 7-5; White, 
bye; Hutson, bye; White defeated 
Zachary 6 2, 6-0

Finals- Leslie White defeated 
Mike Hutson.

BOYS, II and-UNDER OPEN 
DIVISION

Evans defeated Wright 6-0, 6-1; 
Norwood defeated Kennedy 6-0, 6-1; 
Barnett defeated Miller 6-3, 6-1; 
Zachary, bye; Evans defeated 
Norwood 2-6, 7-5, 6-1; Barnett 
defeated Zachary 1-6, 6-1, 6-4. 

Finals- Barnett defeated Evans.

MIXED DOUBLES
Paul Smith-Marca Lynn Herring 

defeated Cindy Smiley-Mark Neill 
6-4, 6-3; Joy Morton-Mac Bush 
defeated Lydia Williams-Dave Bus 
ke 6-2, 6-2; Rhonda Parsons-Dale 
Parsons defeated Sunny Horton- 
Hollis Horton 6-1, 6-2; Jo Luther- 
Rick Luther defeated Leslie 
White-Vicki Smiley 7-5, 4-6, 6-4; 
Sharon Jones-Micky Griffin de­
feated Rita Booe-Mike Martin 6-0, 
6-1

Morton-Bush defeated Smith- 
Herring 6-4, 2-6, 7-5; Luther-Luther 
defeated Parsons-Parsons 6-3, 6-4; 
Griff in-Jones, bye.

Morton-Bush, bye; Luther-Luther 
defeated Griffin-Jones 6-4, 6-4.

Finals-Morton-Bush defeated Lu­
ther-Luther 4-6, 6-4, 6-3.

For all your personal, family and 
insurance needs 

call
BYRON D. HARDGROVE 

DISTRICT ASSISTANT 
715-B Main,Box 745 

FRIONA, TEXAS 7MS5 
TELEPHONE 247-3610

•Life Insurance •Health Insurance • Annuities 
• Group Insurance * Pension Plans

f* v

T H E ^  EQUITABLE
Th* C q u ita b l*  Lite Assurance Soc ■ sty o t the  U n ited  S tates. New YorW. N V

Piaseoki TWui'j
Of Clovis...Will Offer IN FRtONA

WEDNESDA Y DANC CLASSES
b a l l e t  & JAZZ
For Ages 4 Thru Teens

MORNING EXERCISE  
Classes For Ladies

Home Arts 
Club Meets

The Home Arts Hobby 
Club met Thursday, August 
18 in the Community Room 
of Friona State Bank to 
formulate plans for the new 
club year.

The first regular meeting 
for the new club year will be 
Thursday, September 15 at 
9.30 a m. in the Community 
Room of Friona State Bank. 
Each club member is to 
bring a covered dish for 
lunch.

Mrs. Eula Mae Madole of 
Clovis, New Mexico will 
give a demonstration on 
decorating styrofoam ice 
buckets. Anyone interested 
in becoming a member of 
the club is asked to attend 
the September meeting.

Starting August 31 
Register Now 
By Calling
247-3730

Teache
Ruth Piaseckt Jones 
Marianne Jones

CARDOF THANKS
Thank you for your 

expression of sympathy 
over the loss of our loved 
one, Catheryn Arnold. The 
love shown through prayers, 
words and deeds has been 
greatly appreciated and 
very much needed in this 
difficult time.

Husband, Sons, Parents, 
Sisters and Brothers

. _______ *-----—
Eagles mate for life and return 
to the same nest every year

>
l>

t

M eet 
\bur New 
Phone

Meet O.D. Hearn, your new tele­
phone company division manager 
with offices in Brownfield.

Your telephone service is O .D .’s 
primary concern. He along with 
the 287 employees in the Brown­
field Division have the respon­
sibility of serving you and the 
32.846 customers in the 29 ex­
changes making up the Brown­
field Division.

During the coming weeks, O.D. 
will be visiting each exchange to 
meet as many customers as pos­
sible. Only through one-to-one 
communications can he learn of 
your service needs, problems and 
ideas So plan to visit with O.D. 
when he comes to Friona.

GERERAL TELEPHORE

sn a c ttp a c K  e g TOP HAND

2 5 'OFF LABEL

TEXAS

GRAPEFRUIT 2 / 3 9

SPINACH

OUR AIM IS TO PLEASE IN EVERYWAY 
WE GIVE GUNN B R S T A M P S

WE ACCEPT USDA FOOD STAMPS PHONE 247-2250 WE
DOUBLE STAMPS ON WEDNESDAYS WITH PURCHASE OF »2.50 OR MORE
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USE FRIONA STAR CLASSIFIED ADS 
CALL THE FRIONA STAR AT 
247-2211 BY THURSDAY NOON

FRIONA CHICS....First place win­
ner In the Muleshoe Women’s 
Softball tournament were the Friona 
Chics. The Chics won five straight 
games. Pictured are front row (left 
to right), Lupe Brallllf, Yolanda 
Hernandei, Angle Guerra, Rosa 
Garza, Lupe Castillo, Martha 
Castillo. Back row: (left to right)

Coach Andy Hernandez, Margie 
Ramirez, Rachael Perez, Gloria 
Jones, Coach Glendel Jones, Susie 
Aldaco, Inez Montoya and Coach 
Angel Ramirez. The team Is 
currently searching for a sponsor, 
and plans to play In more 
tournaments this year. (Star Photo)

PIONEER
CA TTLE ORDER BUYERS, INC.

208 E. U th  S treet 
Friona, Texas 

Office (806)247-3911

STOCKERS FEEDER 
CATTLE

“ FRESH calves available a t a ll tim es"
Evenings Please Call

Bob Bradley 
Clovis, N.M. 
(505) 762-5663

Don Foster 
Hereford, Texas 
(804) 364 1645

Doug Stephenson 
Friona, Texas 
(806 ) 295-6546

Registered & Bonded

O C  WORTH OF £0  GROCERIES
TO BE GIVEN A W AY EACH WEEK.

PUT YOUR NAM E , ADDRESS &  PHONE
NUMBER ON YOUR GROCERY RECEIPT &
DEPOSIT IT  IN  BOX. DR A WING WILL BE
EACH SA TURDA Y AFTERNOON A T 3  P.M .

________ _____ _ REGISTER
aa  . n  < o t /  r \ i  n . EACH I I ME M ust Be 1 8  Years Of Age Or M arried . y ^ |
Winner W ill Be Posted A t The Store  | y *
OUR WINNER LAST WEEK WASJUNE~VILSON *

PRICES GOOD WEEK OF AUGUST 20 THRU AUGUST 26

SNACK PACK 7 0
4 CAN PACK R  &

ENFAMIL ~  c t c
BABY FORMULA 13 02. CAN A #  f  

VAN CAMP P O R K  £

BEANS S 3 0 i . a u  98
OLEO
53c

PARKAY

LB. PKG.

SAUSAGE
2LB. $  1 39
BAG J L

FRYERS
___S 3'

E "  WHITE SWAN CUT # _

W x 'Lo r e e n  b e a n s  3 / 8 9
'HITE SWAN m  0  / Q t k
PINACH CAN 3 / 8 9

303 CAN

FROZEN FOOD* 6 c o u n t  b o x
MRS. PAUL'S 14 07 4 ,4  70M0RT0N
FISH STICKS Vox $1 DONUTS 8 5

WHITE SWAN
CRACKERS LB.Box

MISS SALLY'S 1 0 n 7  A / ) C
SHRIMPBURGERPATTIES Sox 9 3

P R O

AVOCADOS 2 / 4 9 c 
ORANGES 2 3 c

02323668
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NEW TREES.....Ronnie McLellan
checking Austrian Pine on the Gary 
Snead farm at Hub. These trees 
were purchased through the Parmer 
County Soil and Water Conservation

District. After a year or two in this 
garden area and being protected 
from the southwest wind, these trees 
will be moved to form a windbreak.

Letters To 
The Editor

Plainview, Texas 
79072

Dear Editor,
The enclosed check is for a year’s 

subscription to Friona Star. We want 
to keep up with our friends in Friona 
since we have moved to Plainview.

It has been a real pleasure to be a 
part of friendly Friona for the past 
9*̂  years.

We have enjoyed working with the 
people of Friona with Little League, 
Chieftain Parents, P.T.O., Cancer 
Crusade and similar undertakings.

Friona is truly a wonderful 
community.

Sincerely, 
Jim & Evelyn Ball & Family

Courthouse
Notes

instrument Report Ending August 5, 
1177 In County Clerk Office, Bonnie 
Warren, County Clerk

WD. W James Charles, Vernon 
Estes, SW 80’ Lt. 12. Blk 91. Bovina 

WD. Leola D Williams. Harvey 
Eugene Griffin. Lts. 16.17, 18, 19 and 
20. Blk 77, Bovina 

WD. Veterans Land Board. 
Council Fogerson, SR 

WD. Council W Fogerson. Ricky 
Smith Bennett. WL£ of NW% Sec. 6. 
T15S, R2E

WD. Eugene C. Jenkins. First 
Federal Savings & Loan Assn., a 
tract of land out of Blk. 89 and closed 
Ave H. OT Bovina 

WD. Donald W. Gatlin. Carrol K 
Gatlin, Lt. 2. Blk 70, Friona 

WD. Shirley Ann and Billy Wayne 
Nazworth. Emilio and Raquel 
Degollado, Lts 1, 2, 3, 4, 5. 6. Blk 
100. Friona

MARRIAGE LICENSES

Martin James Govednik and Juliff 
Suzanne Teuksbury.

Arlin Leroy Hartzog. Jr. and 
Dianna Lynn Naegle 

Donald Ray Grissom and Doris 
Anne Sorley.

Jimmie Harold Southern and 
Donna Kay Newman.

D.L. Layman and Leona Adele 
Sevier.

FRIONA CONSUMERS

5T0REWIDE REDUCTIONS 
FROM 10% to 50% OFF
LAST 10 DAYS

l-PICKUP FUEL TANK & $ ionoo PURCHASED
A  ^ # 4 #  SEPARATELYTOOL BOX COMBINATION

ALL SNAPPER MOWERS 
CERESAN & PAN0GEN

2 0 % OFF

5 0 %  0PF
TWO . c . DC W ELDERS LEFT " • £ ! "  2 5 % . ff

I
ALL STRAW HATS 5 0 %
SUMMER COVERALLS 2 0 %
ALL FILTERS, TIRES & BATTERIES 1 5  %  o f f

MANY, MANY OTHER DISCOUNTS

FRIONA CONSUMERS [coojil
B t. J m

OFF

OFF

824 MAIN FRIONA, TEXAS PRONE 247-2771

R o b e r t s  A p p lia n c e, I n e ^ T i T t m

W h i r l p o o l
HOME A . APPLIANCES

It's  our birthday...but 
you get the Presents!

IVs Our First B irth day In  
Friona.... And Our 29th  

In H ereford.
tit)

9  w w  w  w  

S ta rt in g  M o n d a y ,
A u g u st 2 9 ,  W e Will B e  

G iving A w a y  H u n d re d s
O f S i lv e r  D o lla rs  i n

O ur Store•

I Wi

ZENITH
RCA

WHIRLPOOL
ROPER
LITTON

i
♦ ^ 1

You R eceive  S ilver D ollars With 
Each Purchase Made During 

Our Big B irthday
e

'10 -  '2 0 - *40- C/p To *60 
D ollars May Be Yours With The 
Purchase Of Certain Appliances.

W -

Lv vv

Roberts 
Appliance, Inc•

r m  cannt :r e n d  o n  i  s

F R I O N A ,  T E X A S P R .  2 4 7 - Z I I Z

u
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GOOD ^  ^
NEWS

FOR 

OUR

COLLEGE STUDENTS
You Can Subscribe To The Friona Star 
F o r Nine Months Fo r Only. . . .

$ 6.50
SPECIAL 9-MONTH RATE TO ANY COLLEGE CAMPUS

Don’t Miss Out On A ll The Hometown News 
While You Are Away At School!

CALL 247-2211 N O W  AND  

PLACE YOUR SUBSCRIPTION

T h e  F R I O N A  *  S T A R

Ed Robb Featured
In Local Revival £

Dr. Ed Robb, noted evangelist, 
will be the featured speaker at a 
revival meeting at the Friona United 
Methodist Church August 21 through 
25.

Tom and Debbie Mills of Amarillo 
will serve as music director and 
youth coordinators for the meeting

Services will be conducted three 
times daily, Monday through 
Thursday, and at the regular times 
on Sunday. Weekdays, Dr. Robb will 
speak at a breakfast meeting at 7 
a m., and at a pot luck luncheon, for 
members of the church and their 
guests. The evening worship hour 
will begin at 8 p.m.

Rev. and Mrs Mills will direct a 
youth fellowship hour each evening 
following services.

Dr. Robb’s preaching ministry has 
carried him to 4# states and St  
countries. He has preached In such 
countries as Brasil, Chile, India, 
Japan and Indonesia.

Since the beginning of his ministry 
in 1947, Dr. Robb has had keen 
interest in “the church beyond the 
local church." In 1966 he partici­
pated in the World Congress on 
Evangelism in Berlin, Germany. In 
1974 he was a participant in the

International Congress on 
Evangelism in Switzerland

Prior to going into evangelical 
work, Dr. Robb served for 20 years 
as a local pastor, including three 
years at the 2,200-member St. Luke's 
Church in Lubbock,

The Robbs are parents of five 
children, including a son and 
son-in-law in the ministry.

Dr. Robb has written three books, 
and publishes a quarterly religious 
magazine, "Challenge to Evange­
lism Today."

Tom and Debbie Mills have 
recently moved to Amarillo from 
Midland. They are serving as music 
and youth coordinators for the 
Forest Hills Methodist Church of 
Amarillo. He Is a native of Electra, 
and his wife Is from Fort Wayne, 
Indiana.

Mr. and Mrs Mills often team to 
sing duets for church services.

Mills has a degree in zoology, in 
addition to his master of divinity. 
Debbie has a BS degree in theater 
arts, with emphasis on directing.

farmer-to-farmer

OPEN 24 
HOURS

SAVE AT 
ALLSUPS

ALLSUPS
CO NVENIENCE STORES

O PEI24

*  “ My P-A-G 949
, yielded 11,760 lbs. 1 
\ per acre /
\a t  20.5% moisture.”

A u g u s t 2 3 V

~ t ^ . \  WE HAVE THE COLDEST 
ICE IH TOWS

E llis

VIENNA SAUSAGE 

so, 5 /$l°°

CRISCO
SHORTENING

3 L b .  C a n 9 9
SNIIIFIIE

FLOUR
3 9 L * .

Plastic T A B LE C LO TH S  44”  x 76”  Buy One, Get One FREE

B0R0EIS
TTAGE CHEESE

2 » 9 8 c
F I  b 0 m F T i
W  I  COOKIES
n t j  V  14 1/2 Oz.

ROOS |

I 6 9 c
PINCH ’ N SNIFF Buy One. Get One F REE

JYOUR CHOICE SHURFINE:
FRUIT C O C K TA IL, 

CORN IC reamed o r W.K.
SW EET PEAS 

SP IN A C H

7  BOMK IS PKMHM

ICE CREAM

Assortm ent Of
PAPER PLATES

Bama

STRAWBERRY JAM

32 Oz. 9 9

COFFEE
FILTERS 36 Count

ileeki

ACIAL TISSUES
C

mcr.
Shurfine 8 Roll Pkg.

TO ILET TISSUE
Shurfine Canned 13 Oz.

c Shurfine Sliced D ill 
PICKLES • 32 Oz. M

MILK 4 / » l
0 0

SHOP THE FMEIDIY. CORVEIIEIT 
IllSDP’S STORE HEAR TOU!

HOT COOKED FOODS

• BOO CHICKEN *0001101
• HOT LOUS • MHO IM IS
• BUMHTOS • COM D06S 

•6EMRAIS4USA8E *B U U  000 OOF
• 000 BEEF SANDWICHES

Shurfine Tomato
C A T S U P
shurfine
m i iA jp

32 Oz.

16 Oz. FRIONA, TEXAS

FLOYD REEVE
Friona, Texas

“ My P-A-G 949 yielded 11,760 lbs per acre 
at 20 5% moisture. Ear retention was ex­
ce llent—this corn is an excellent yie lder."

FOR MORE INFORMATION CONTACT

FRIONA WHEAT GROWERS
Friona, Texas

Ask your P-A-G Daalar about tha 1978 
REBATE PROGRAM.

It will save you monay on your P-A-G purchases

P-A-G SEEDS 
BOX 10303
LUBBOCK, TEXAS 79406

Parfor manca of thi* »u*c may m  advaraaty tffactad by 
anvifonmantai condition* mutant i f  ram* of intact* or 

o r otfter factor* hay on d tha control of P-A-0

Clean or replace dirty Air Filters 
on your furnace or air conditioning!

The purpose of a fille r on your a ir condition ing or healing air blower m> to keep the air inaide vour 
home clean The fille r catches dual and d irt before It can enter your home In time, the filte r w ill accu 
mulate du»t and d irt If if ge l* clogged, i l  can 't do fhe cleaning job if '*  supposed lo  Then If begin* 
to «hut off (he air flow and ha* the effect of m aking your a ir condition ing or heating un it u o rk  hardet 
When th f  unit w ork* harder. It u te* more e lec tric ity  and If It w ork* too hard bee a use of a d im  
filte r. It can be damaged

To avoid damage to your un it, to keep your hom e cleaner, and to *ave energy and money, be turn 
filte r* are clean Permanent type* can be cleaned accord ing lo  the m anufacturer'* instruction Non 
permanent type* are replac ed. kince they are inexpem lve It i t  wt»e to check filte r* every 30 days

Save energy vave money uve clean filte r*

Dance instructors for a new step? 
Let your fingers do the two step.

yellow pages
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r WHERE YOU BUY THE BEST FOR LESS

\  p i i c e u

BankAmemcaao

FRIONA, TEXAS
STORE HOURS... 9a.m. to 7:30p.m .

ADVERTISED SPECIALS GOOD AUGUST20 THRU 27

jgg/flgglfpmnrwmwrmmmmmmmjTA

4 9

SPIRAL THEME BOOK
120 SHEETS

l. 5 HOLE KEG. 89
THREE SUBJECT DIVIDERS

SAME AS ABOVE EXCEPT 
200 SHEETS

5 SUBJECT DIVIDERS REG. '1 .49

BOTANY-BIOLOGY FILLER
•UNRULED FILLER PAPER 

•SCIENCE GRAPH FILLER PAPER 
•QUA DRILLE FILLER PA PER

REG. 39

SPECIALS ON SCHOOL SUPPLIES GOOD 
WHILE SUPPLIES LAST O NLY... Shop Early  

While Selections A re  Good. M any M ore

Unadvertised Specials In  School Supplies. 

Shop For A ll Your School Needs  
A t Gibson’s W here Your 

D ollar Goes Futher.

dR,.point

r  CARBON
p a p e r
r “os»«TS

SCHOOL
BOXES

ALADDIN
NO. 2 1 5 7TABLET no i7

WHILE SUPPLY LASTS

REG.33‘

REG. 3 6 e

REG. 39

CRA YOLA 
CRAYONS

4 7 c 
4 2 c
7 6 c

UMiRS
O HO  OOTIFT
P A S T E

8 COUNT REG. S9‘ 

24 COUNT REG. 5 3 ‘ 

48 COUNT REG. 99 ‘

MEAD
PRACTICE TABLET FOR 
SECOND GRADERS O O C

WHILE SUPPLY LASTS REG. 29

, 0 . 2 5 9 9TABLET reg. 39
WHILE SUPPLY LASTS

INDEX
CARDS --------- ]---  P--

"l*  v-------- r
40 CARDS 1 11 1 1

TRANSPARENT DOCUMENT 
PAPER PROTECTORS

6 PER PNG.

~ cREG. 63

PAPERCLIPS
REG. 39 37

WIRE BOUND COORDINA TOR
3 STORAGE POCKETS 
64 SHEETS OPPAPER 
___________ REG. 8 9 ’

COMPASS &  
PROTRACTOR a a

SETREG. AT’  28
COMPASS "sr
PEDIGREE QUALITY

ERASER
BLUE CANVAS

-RING BINDER

j

PEDIGREE

COLORED 
PENCILS [ ■’

/RED)
2PERPKG.

REG. 24 *

C

| RULER

8C

STUARTHALL

ENVELOPES
4 ' / * "  * 9 ‘A "

3 * / * "  t6‘4 "

EACH
REG. 5 9 ’



LITTLE PROFESSOR

CALCULATOR
PLUS DEPOSIT

ZIPLOC STORAGE 
BAGS » CST
O  / S I  0 0

TEXAS
INSTRUMENTS

CALCULATOR
$ 0 0 4 9

TENNIS SH O ESfe
K 2 5 %  OFF

PARSON'S

AMMONIA
28 07.(S i■*a&

READYPENCILS

PANTS

TRUSTY
PENCILS

NO. 2 LEAD 
9 PER PNG.

PENCILS
NO. 2 LEAD

COKES
FRIONA STAR, SUNDAY, AUGUST,

WHERE YOU BUY THE BEST FOR LESS

6  PACK  

BOTTLES

G ibson’s
JlTU ,* < t'lturn

BankAmericaro
welcome

FRIONA, TEXAS * * * *
STORE HOURS.. . 9 a m . to 7.30p.m.

ADVERTISED SPECIALS GOOD AUGUST20 THRU 27

6 DIFFERENT PENCILS 
10 POINTS PER PENCIL 

INSTANTLY SHARP REG. 69

HI-LITERS
BLUE OR YELLOW REG.39C

BONANZA ASSORTMENT
•NO. 5 5 4 9  PENCILS 
•G IBSON PENCILS
•RED-W HITE-BLUEPENCIL  4 J  Q  0
•PEDIGREE CRAYONS

ALL MEN’S AND BOY’S

BELTS

ALL REG. 3 9

PKG.

FLASHCARDS *EG ’129
SUBTRACTION, Q Q C  

ADDITION, DIVISION W

THANK YOU NOTES 
WRITING PAPER

2 5 %

> s»

OFF

0 0
OFF

REGULAR
PRICES

■JJ.TEJTCWOK. 16sr,c, s
CHALK ,1027-
GLITTER ASSORT. COLORS

FOR DECORA TING REG. 2 7 _________

TYPEWRITER RIBBON

PRICE

I \ \ /  IS5J

REYNOLD’S WRAP
200 SQ. FEET

1 2 " x  2 0 0 ’ 

REG.*2.49

Reynolds Wap

J  •  ----- - (O) I

25 OZ

DOW p -3

BATHROOM V ^ j  
CLEANER I

cleaner H r y tREG. *1.63
-J f

REG. 99 
C

REG. 8 9 ‘ 
C

3-PRONG »™
fo l d e r s  s s1 0 /$I

ONIONSKIN
T A D t  C T  30 SHEETSTABLET REG. 5 3 '

START SCHOOL WITH 
A CLEAR COMPLEXION 
HELP FIGHT ACNE AND 

PIMPLES WITH....

PERNOX 
BAREFACE £3 
ULTI-SCRUB |

DRAWS-A LOT CRA YONS
WATER COLOR MARKS 

5 COLORS PER PKG. REG. 69

r f f
CLEARASIL

KS*a>M*•!»** 2 0 %  [ l
.1 Off
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Friona Woman Aids 
Crop Report Work
Wilda Millican of 608 Arrah, 

Friona, travels to cotton fields in her 
area to check on the progress of the
crop.

She’s not a cotton buyer; she is one 
of 54 field enumerators in Texas 
employed by the Texas Crop and 
Livestock Reporting Service to 
provide a detailed study of a 
“section ” of a cotton field, 10 feet x 2 
rows.

This work is part of the overall 
process of estimating cotton yields 
and harvesting losses in providing 
statistics on the state’s cotton 
production

Agriculture Commissioner Rea­
gan V Brown commended the work 
of the enumerators. “ We have found 
that these enumerators are trained 
well by the Texas Crop and 
Livestock Reporting Service and do 
a thorough job “

During the cotton growing season, 
special plant counts and measure­
ments are made to indicate yield as 
a guide to production. There are 710 
such sample units across the state.

The enumerator returns to the

same units each month to count the 
number of squares, blooms and 
bolls. This information along with 
the acreage data, and a continuing 
response to mail questionnaires sent 
to cotton farmers are important 
ingredients in accurate monthly 
production forecasts, issued begin­
ning August 1 through December

Near harvest time, the enumera­
tor, who started the season with an 
intensive training course, picks the 
cotton in the sample units and sends 
it to the laboratory in Austin for 
moisture checks and other exami­
nations to refine the estimate

After the farmer harvests the 
field, the enumerator makes one 
Anal visit to glean th'. cotton missed 
by the stripper or picker as an 
indication of harvesting loss.

The Texas Crop and Livestock 
Reporting Service is a cooperative 
effort of the Texas Department of 
Agriculture and the U S. Depart­
ment of Agriculture

Such field surveys are conducted 
for wheat and corn also

Cotton Varieties 
To Be Evaluated

More than 100 new and improved 
cotton varieties which are being 
evaluated by scientists of the Texas 
Agricultural Experiment Station 
will be among several featured 
attractions during the Experiment 
Stations annual field day at 
Lubbock. September 13.

The afternoon event each year 
attracts over 1200 visitors who tour 
the Experiment Station's numerous 
research plots and discuss new 
developments in agriculture with 
scientists and specialists.

Joining in the event will be the 
Texas Agricultural Extension Ser­
vice; Agricultural Research Ser­
vice, USDA; and agricultural 
meteorology office of the National 
Weather Service.

Drs Levon Pay, Jack Gipson and 
Earl Minton are cooperating in the 
cotton variety studies. Their 
discussions during field tour stops 
will include tests on disease 
resistance, short season and 
glandless varieties, and perfor­
mance records of about 50 
unreleased varieties.

in The .JournHl of the Ameri­
can Medical AMocifltion" more 
than two veam ago. recom­
mend that all Ainencann a g e  1 .'I 
and up learn ( ’PR Training 
murnen, which take only a 
handful of hours, are widely 
available through the Amen 
can Heart Association. Red 
Cross some YMC As, hos­
pitals. fire departments and 
others

Here s an example of how
CPH help* **ve live* Five
y ta r t ago Seattle, W a*h

i. «*mhiurkal on a pro
jfram ito im pi­ovr it* emergency

nt *erv ire* citiren ( ’PR
wan a major i•tanponent So far.
I1Mi(K)O Cltl/irn* have learned
CPH in that city Hrforr Seat
Ur • pn am brgan. 1 per
cent of wh.HHr heart*
ltd pprd <wf1 of h. .•pita 1 lr ved to
\*n i« i f long let m Ivor*.
To.rtn\ tlL A* figure i* ZT>perrent

i nforrnut ion hiiC P R  a* well
A* a frrr loin CPH motiva
tawna l film i “A Life In Your
Ha ureturnng Hin rt I.an
ra jit«r, in a v a il* ible frum the
ACT  Fo 4 a ti» r1 a tvon profit
'" I •ti<»n au pportrd by a
nuimbrr of Imdlin g  1Ph arm*
f-eutieal manufacturers dedi 
rated In establishing and im 
proving emergency medical 
systems Write In A (T. ISO 
(*mvr Street Rndgcwater. 
Mew Jersey iWUiT

“An ounce of work <t worth 
many pounds of words “

St Francis Dc Sales

limited so come in soon and get all the details 
on the Com Crop Lease and other exclusive leas­
ing programs available only through Lindsay 
Credit Corp

Take advantage of a program that has 
never been offered in the industry before . it s the 
lease we can do for you

Maybe it’s a trip to Europe or it could be Sally’s 

college education or maybe just for a rainy day . . . 

Whatever it is a person feels kind of lucky having a 

sum of money in a safety insured savings account. 

Let one of our financial specialists show you the many 

savings plans we offer.

Start a Lucky 

Ole Sum.

Services ConductedCorn (Growers Begin 
Membership Drive

The Texas Corn Growers Associa­
tion have begun a membership 
drive, according to Carl King of 
Dimmitt, Texas, president of the 
Texas Corn Growers Association.

A large membership in the Texas 
Corn Growers Association is 
essential, if corn growers hope to 
obtain favorable legislation, warns 
King,

Meetings with government offi­
cials are more effective if there is a 
larger membership to support your 
views.

Beside obtaining favorable legis­

lation. your membership fees are 
used for corn promotion and market 
development. Both promotion and 
market development are needed in 
order to keep the demand strong for 
corn. Of course, a strong demand 
helps keep corn prices up.

Your membership in the Tekas 
Corn Growers Association also 
makes you a member of the National 
Corn Growers Association.

To become a member of the Texas 
Corn Growers Association, call or 
write Carl King, 105 E. Bedford, 
Dimmitt, Texas. Phone 606-447-3510.

Funeral services were conducted 
here Monday, August 15 for 
Catheryn Lucille Anthony Arnold, 
51. who died August 12 in Santa Fe, 
New Mexico.

Services were held at the Friona 
United Methodist Church. Officiat­
ing were Rev. Bobby McMillan and 
Rev. C.H. Murphy. Burial was in 
Friona Cemetery, under the 
direction of Parsons-Ellis Funeral 
Home.

Mrs. Arnold was married to 
Howard Biggers of Hobart, Okla­
homa on August 17, 1945. Biggers 
passed away on April 8, 1976. Mrs. 
Arnold remarried in April of this 
year.

She had been employed as a nurse 
at Cordell Memorial Hospital, 
Cordell, Oklahoma.

Survivors include her husband, 
Sam, two sons, Gary G. Biggers and 
Richard A. Biggers, both of 
Amarillo, and two grandsons. Also 
surviving are her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. A.W. Anthony, Sr. of Friona. 
three brothers, A.W. Anthony, Jr., 
Ernest Anthony and Jean Anthony, 
all of Friona; two sisters, Mrs. Estes 
Bass of Friona and Mrs. Don Copley 
of Buffalo, Minnesota.

Pallbearers were Arthur Drake, 
Bruce Parr, Kenyth Cass, Eldred 
Brown, Baker Duggins and Bill 
Carthel.

ROCKY NICHOLS

Friona Campers 
Receive Honors

COUNTING STALKS AND EARS... 
Wilda Millican keeps crop statistics 
In Parmer Coui *y for the USDA 
headquarters in ^ustln by counting, 
and sometimes pulling and weighing 
corn and cotton In a field chosen by

Austin officials. They tell her how 
far to walk Into the field and how 
large an area she is to provide crop 
Information for. She also provides 
statistics on sugar beets, wheat and 
other crops. (Star Photo)

Three campers from Friona 
received honors recently during a 
session at Camp Longhorn, near 
Burnet.

Those honored were Shannel 
Woodard, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Clyde Woodard of Hub, and Rocky 
and Chuck Nichols, sons of Mr. and 
Mrs V.E. (Huck) Nichols.

Shannel, who will be a fifth grade 
student this fall, was chosen 
"Roughrider," which is the camp’s 
term for queen. There were over 100 
girls at the session, ages to 15 years 
old.

Rocky Nichols was named camp 
favorite in the Sea Hawk division of 
the boys’ camp. His brother Chuck 
was given similar honors in the 
Wrangler division.

__ To P re v e n t
Need le w  D ea th *

SHANNEL WOODARD

HEART ATTACKS

CHUCK NICHOLS

You can help increase the 
chances of a heart attack vic­
tim ’s survival

How’’ Ry learning a rela 
Uvely simple A BC procedure 
called cardiopulmonary resu*- 
cituUon (CPRi It consists of 
one or two people aiding a heart 
attack victim bv <Ai opening 
the airway. 'Hi m aintaining 
breathing, and (Cl m ain­
taining circulation The na­
tional standards, us published

C A R D IO P U LM O N A R Y  RE 
S U S C IT  A T IO N  has in ­
creased chances o f long 
term  survival for people 
whose hearts stop out o f 
hospita l from  11 percent to  
25 percent m one c ity

SAVINGS & LOAN ASSOCIATION OF CLOVIS
(DEPOSITS INSURED UP TO S40.000.00

HOME OFFICE 
801 Pil* $♦ 

CLOVIS, N. MEX

8RANCM OFFICE 
2nd ond Abdene St 
PORT ALES, N MEX

S P lIN K in
SERVICE

Dims* of IIC I  PUMf CO.
• fltte ts  Sm CsAmoi IM S})) 
MMMT1 to  I H  MMIfl
’ tWM 5 0 t m  w  m u

Here s another first from Lindsay . . .  
the Zimmatic Corn Crop Lease Instead of a fixed 
lease payment, you pay for your Zimmatic 
based on the once of corn If corn prices plunge, so 
does your lease payment

By offering this new lease. Lindsay is 
sharing some of the same risks that you face 
every year Corn prices fluctuate, which affects 
your profit picture That s why Lmdtay developed 
the exclusive Zimmatic Corn Crop Lease. a 
revolutionary program that tailors your lease 
payments to the changing price of corn, from one 
year to the next

The Zimmatic Corn Crop Lease is de­
signed so you can lease a Zimmatic without us*ng 
your normal operating credit sources..  your 
Zimmatic pays its own way by turning on 
your production

The number of Zimmatics available under 
this program and the time period of this otter are

a

Wow!
What you pay 

to lease 
a Zimmatic 
depends 

on the price
of com.

FSLFC

Lucky
-old  sum
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Carl Evans Enrolls 
In Medical School

STOCK YOUR FREEZER
)

Forty students began their 
medical schooling, Tuesday. August 
16, when they registered for the fall 
semester at Texas Tech University 
School of Medicine (TTUSM).

Included in the freshman class is a 
Friona High School graduate, Carl 
Evans, the son of Herb Evans. Carl 
is a 1973 graduate of Friona High 
School.

Freshman orientation preceded 
registration on August 15 and 16. 
Included in the orientation activities 
was an introduction to the 
university, the tutorial team 
program, the basic sciences 
chairpersons and a get-acquainted 
party.

The freshmxn class is selected out 
of approximately 1200 applicants to 
TTUSM, according to John Pelley, 
Ph D., assistant dean for admis­
sions. The applicants are evaluated 
by an Admissions Council comprised 
of approximately 20 members 
representing a cross-section of the 
medical school faculty and including 
medical students and community 
physicians.

The council presently screens all 
applications for overall merit. Each 
eligible application folder is person­
ally reviewed and evaluated.

Included in the evaluation are the 
curriculum, school attended, 
grades, quality of written com­
ments, outside interests, part-time 
employment and letter of recom­
mendation.

Approximately one-fourth of the 
applicants whose folders are 
reviewed are invited to an interview. 
On the day of the interviews, an 
orientation program is conducted to 
familiarize the students with 
admissions policies, curriculum, 
student life, and the history and 
operation of the school.

Each student is then interviewed 
in a one-half hour personal interview 
and a 45-minute group interview. 
Each individual and group interview 
procedure is structured in order to 
make the interview process consis­
tent for all applicants.

"Personal attention is the key 
word in admissions at TTUSM The 
faculty puts a great deal of personal 
effort into selection. We could select 
by a token interview and the use of a 
computer which would save a great 
deal of effort, but we have faculty 
that realizes academics should not 
be the only criterion for admis­
sions," Pelley said.

f

MR. and MRS. CHARLIE WISE

Lodge m em bers 
Tour Panhandle

........ .................................................................... .

HAPPY B IR TH D A Y  #
~  T O  FRIO NA FOLKS.....  1

WEEK OF AUGUST 21-27
Friona residents having birthdays 

next week are:
Raymond Schueler, August 21 
Dewayne Williams, August 21 
Justin Reed, August 21 
Mark Blankenship, August 22 
Jeanette Taylor, August 22 
June Cleveland, August 23 
Detricia Miller, August 23 
Shanna Renae Widner, August 24 
Lorna Schueler, August 24 
Byron Brewer, August 24 
Edwina Davenport. August 25 
Boyd A. Jones, August 25 
Opal Spring, August 25 
Rodney Ready, August 25 
Robert Garza, Jr., August 26 
Terry Lynn Widner, August 26 
John Scot Schlenker. August 26 
Beth Cranfill, August 26 
Gary Looper, August 26 
Martha Mae Pruitt, August 26 
Robert Schueler, Jr., August 27

Eugene Zlnser, August 27 
Holly Hudson. August 27

If you or someone in your family 
has a birthday coming up soon, call 
the Friona Star at 247-2211 by 
Wednesday of the previous week and 
let them know about it.

Sr. Citizens 
Set Meeting

A covered dish luncheon will be 
served at the regular monthly 
meeting of the Friona Senior 
Citizens on Friday, August 26.

The meeting will be held at the 
Union Congregational Church, and 
there will be a program "that folks 
won't want to miss."

The members will play games 
after the meeting. All senior citizens 
are invited to attend.

Mr. and Mrs. Charlie Wise, who 
are currently serving as Presidents 
of the Panhandle Association of 
Oddfellows and Rebekahs, have 
recently returned from a tour of 
visiting with members of 17 Lodges 
in the Panhandle area.

By combining the Lodges into 
three area meetings, Mr. and Mrs. 
Wise presented their goals and 
programs for the coming year to 
several hundred Oddfellow and 
Rebekah members.

The Dumas Rebekah Lodge No. 
186 and Oddfellow Lodge No. 118, on 
August 1, hosted a joint meeting and 
salad supper with the Dalhart 
Rebekah Lodge No. 336 and 
Oddfellow Lodge No. 118 Also 
present at this meeting were 
members of the Borger Rebekah 
Lodge No. 286 and Oddfellow Lodge 
No. 94

On August 2, members of the 
Canadian Rebekah Lodge No. 124 
and Oddfellow Lodge No. 164 hosted 
a joint meeting and ice cream 
supper with the Spearman Rebekahs 
Lodge No. 290 and Oddfellow Lodge 
No. 185. Also present at this meeting 
were members of the Perryton 
Oddfellows Lodge No. 225.

The Pampa Rebekah Lodge No. 
335 and Oddfellow Lodge No. 934 
hosted a meeting and salad supper 
on August 4th Present at this meet 
were members of Borger Rebekah 
Lodge No. 286 and Oddfellow Lodge 
No. 118; also Shamrock Rebekah 
Lodge No. 386 and Panhandle 
Rebekah Lodge No. 167. W E. Elms, 
Vice President of the Panhandle 
Association, was a special guest at 
this meeting, in addition to Mr and 
Mrs Wis

During their visits with the 
neighboring lodges, Mr. and Mrs. 
Wise urged lodge members to 
promote more publicity for their 
local groups. They also stressed 
contacting prospective members 
and their families, visiting the sick 
and needy, and having ‘Friendship 
Nights" with other neighboring 
Lodges. Mr. and Mrs. Wise urged 
the lodge members to work on their 
Degrees and Charges to be 
presented to the Panhandle Associa­
tion. They asked that each group 
plan to send a representative to the 
Association Meeting coming up in 
April -1978 and to plan to send as 
many members as possible to this 
annual event.

FREEZER PA
#1 Choice Cuts

I S.. $5850
10# S irlo in 
10# Round Steak 
10# Beef Roast 
5# T-Bone 
5# Charloin

CK SPECIALS
#2 B.B.O. Special

! Lbs. $7995
10# S irlo in  j 
10# Club Steak 
10# T-Bone 
10# Round Steak 
5# Charloin 
5# Patties

#3 Fam ily Pack

j Lbs. $5150
10# Round 
10# Chuck Steak 
10# Roast 
10# F ryers 
5# Patties 
5# Ground Chuck

#4 Butcher’s Special

! lL. *4395
10# Chuck Steak 
10# Beef Roast 
10# Beef Ribs 
10# F ryers 
10# Patties

#5 Economy Special

i! Lbs. $2195
5# Chuck Steak 
5# Pork Chops 
5# F ryers 
5# Beef Ribs 
5# Patties

#6 The Taylor Special

!°b.. *4995
10# Chuck Steak 
10# Round Steak 
10# Charloin 
10# F ryers
10# Beef Roast |

TAYLOR'S CUSTOM MEAT 
PROCESSORS, INC.

SO. HWY. 214
PHONE 247-3333 or 247-3563

FRESH
art to ort*

i M

TARA, INC.
Texas Agricultural Research Association

HOW MUCH LOSS 
CAN YOU AFFORD?

Doc W illiam s says that a ll indicators point to:

Low Grain Prices Could Mean Low Cattle Prices Next Year 

Wide Variations \rc  Expected In feeder Cattle Prices.

(iram Prices Will Be l nder Cost CM Production

rr •  Hedging will become a way of life and 
will be essential for survival!

X

\

L -

Open a Green Pastures Savings Account TARA

S £ « ct 5  '/i % -  6  '/2%  - 7  3/ j  %

P lanting  instructions: Sow in a small amount each 
-vs*i • k on a regular basis WV'II do th«* rest At The 
Money Grower* \s*m ation we niuture it. insure if 
and can* for it t ill \<>ui mone\ grows with interest

Join I he Association now. Money planted todav 
w ill liegin to blossom todav!

GROWERS
R S S O C IP T IO N

Friona Representative 
CARROL GATLIN LARD CO.

hi-plains savings & loan
HEREFORD &  D H IM IT T

We look to your tuture with interest________

Tne TARA Short Course in Marketing Commodities Cdn Help.

• Taught B\ Experienced Educators Who Are Nationally Known Eor Their Expertise In
The Commodities And Economics Of Agriculture

• Designer! To Help Anyone Interested In 1 fading Intelligently On The Com modi tie* Market

• Follow Up Support I rom The Leading Research And Advisory Enin In The Nation.

• Wives Are Invited.

DATES Thursday Night*-August 25. September 1.8 . I 5. 22. and 29, 1977 

TIME: 7:30 to 10 00 P M.

PI ACE1 VUTr SHCr  HTr-V ^CFCCT

You Max ( ontact iHOM 481-3288 or 481-9149. Earwell-Eor More Information.
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Linda Duke, Bobby Drake 
Exchange Wedding Vows

Linda Kay Duke and Robert 
(Bobby) Earl Drake, both Friona 
residents, exchanged wedding vows 
Monday, June 6 at 2:30 p.m

The wedding was performed in the 
chapel of the Southcrest Baptist 
Church, Lubbock. Rev. Charles 
Broadhurst, formerly of Friona. now 
pastor at Southcrest Baptist Church. 
Lubbock, performed the ceremony.

The bride is the daughter of Mr 
and Mrs R L. Duke of 1104 W 4th 
St., Friona The bridegroom is the 
son of Mr and Mrs. Earl Drake of
1210 Virginia. Friona

The church was decorated with 
spring flowers and a bouquet on a 
white pillar stand.

The wedding march was pre­
sented by Mrs. Owen Drake, 
sister-in-law of the groom, on the 
piano.

As the bride was presented in

marriage by her brother, CPO USN 
Robert Landon Duke, Jr. of Norfolk. 
Virginia, she wore a floor length 
organza gown with a full ruffle and a 
row of lace around the gathers. The 
gown featured long lace sleeves 
gathered onto cuffs of lace and a 
scooped neckline.

She wore a white hat. The bride 
carried a corsage of yellow 
carnations, white baby's breath and 
long white streamers.

For something old. the bride wore 
a wedding ring belonging to the 
groom’s great-grandmother. Her 
gown was something new She 
borrowed her hat from Linda Taylor 
and wore the traditional blue garter. 
She also wore a diamond necklace 
which was a gift from the groom

Catherine Duke of Friona. sister of 
the bride, was the maid of honor. She 
wore a floor length yellow satin

gown overlaid with white lace. The 
dress featured long sheer sleeves 
gathered at the wrists with lace, a 
high sheer neckline and a lace top.

Don Fortenberry of Odessa, 
Texas, was the best man.

Leslie Drake, niece of the groom, 
registered guests from a table 
decorated with yellow carnations 
and white baby's breath.

Out-of-town guests attending the 
ceremony were Mrs. Robert Duke, 
of Clarksville, Texas, grandmother 
of the bride; Mrs. Gilbert Sulsar of 
Bogart, Texas, aunt of the bride; 
Mrs. Frances Noward of Abernathy, 
Texas, aunt of the groom; Phyllis

Blau of Lubbock and Mr. and Mrs. 
Josh Howards of Abernathy, cousins 
of the groom; Mr. and Mrs. Larry 
Drake. Leslie and Todd of Stratford, 
Texas, brother of the groom; Beau 
Sterm of Midland, Texas.

For a wedding trip to Las Vegas, 
Nevada, the bride wore a 
three-piece yellow pants suit with 
white corsage and accessories.

The couple will reside on Route 2, 
Dalhart, Texas.

The bride is a 1977 graduate of 
Friona High School.

The bridegroom is a 1972 graduate 
of Friona High School. He is engaged 
in farming in the Stratford area.

Bridal Courtesies 
Fete Karen Head

Hello Central:
Our August birthday party 

Wednesday was hosted by ladies of 
First Baptist Church. Birthday 
people honored were A.£. Baize, 
Margie London. Bell Bandy and 
Julia Garrett.

+ + + +
One of the highlights during the 

summer has been the singing on 
fourth Wednesday afternoons Wo­
men of Sixth Street Church of Christ 
are responsible for this activity, but 
all women interested are invited to 
take part in it.

4- +  + +
Special thanks go to Lora Mae

McFarland for her unselfish
devotion to those of us who live here 
She gives a lot of her time, effort and 
energy aiding us in many different 
ways

Bouquets also go to Kitty G a llm a n

for the many hours she has spent 
assisting us with different types of 
handcrafts during the summer.

+  4  +  4
One of our residents, Lucy Welch, 

had a most enjoyable weekend It 
had been several years since she 
had been able to vacation at her 
mountain retreat. Create Del Monte, 
which is located near Cowles.

Last weekend she was accom­
panied to Create Del Monte by five of 
her seven children 

Those making the trip with her 
were Nelson and Lorraine Welch, 
Louis and Mamie Lou Welch, and 
Steve and Seva Struve, all of 
Friona; Jack and Myrna Miller of 
Dimmitt and Melba Brown of Tulsa 

Only two of her children, Estella 
Johnston and France Welch were 
unable to attend the family get 
to g e th e r

Mrs. Roger Head, the former 
Karen Young, was honored with a 
bridal shower on Saturday, June 25 
in the home of Mrs. Dale Smith.

Cookies, mints, nuts and punch 
were served by Vicki Smiley. The 
table was decorated with a blue lace 
table cloth and a potted plant which 
was a gift to the bride-elect from the

Girl Born To
D. Bauers

Mr. and Mrs. Dwayne Bauer of 
Everton, Missouri are the parents of 
a baby girl born Tuesday, August 16 
at 8 43 a m. in St. Vincent Hospital 
in Monett, Missouri.

Named Christie Marie, the new 
arrival weighed seven pounds, ten 
ounces and was 20 inches long She is 
the first child for the couple.

Grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Joe Mann of Friona and Franklin 
Bauer of Everton. Missouri.

G reat-grandparents are Mrs. 
Edna Bauer of Muleshoe and Mr. 
and Mrs. D P Mann of Friona.

R E V I V A L

Friona United Methodist Church
AUGUST 21 - 25

iUNDAY SCHEDULE:

3: A. M. - Church School
0:55 A. H. - C e le b ra tio n  and O ffe rin g  o f Worship 
5 30 P. M. - Youth Snack Supper and Fellow ship  Hour 

w ith  Tom and Debbie H il ls  
d:00 P. H. - Evening Worship

MONDAY THROUGH THURSDAY:

7:00 A. M. - B reakfast
w ith Horning M edita tion  
led by Ed Robb

12:00 Noon - Pot Luck Luncheon
fo r a l l  the Church and Guests 
Ed Robb. Speaker 

6 .3 0  P. H. - Youth Snack Supper 
and Fellow ship  Hour 
w ith  Tom and Debbie Hi l l s  

8 :00 P. H. - Evening Worship

WE l

ED ROBB  - S peaker 
Evangelist

United M ethodist Church 
Lubbock. Texas

TOM & DEBBIE M ILLS  
Music Director & Youth Coordinators 

Midland. Texas

A NURSt RY WILL BE PROVI DED FOR I N F A Ti b 1 0 D D L E R S

hostesses. The hostess gift was a 
blender.

Guests of honor, besides the 
bride-elect were Mrs. Troy Young, 
mother of the bride-elect, Mrs. 
Oscar Baxter, maternal grandmo­
ther of the honoree, and Jan 
Spencer, sister of the bride-elect. 
The guests of honor were presented 
with carnation corsages.

Hostesses were Mrs. Dale Smith. 
Mrs Leland Hutson, Mrs. Dave 
Hutson. Mrs Richard Perkins, Mrs. 
Harris Evans, Mrs. Gerall Wyly, 
Mrs Charles Rector, Mrs. Lloyd 
Rector, Mrs. Clarence Martin, Mrs. 
Lawrence M artin, Mrs. Floyd 
Wilkins, Mrs. Ronald Smiley and 
Mrs.Mike Chaney.

+ + + +
Karen Head was honored with a 

surprise bridal shower on Thursday, 
July 7 at Prairie Acres. The shower 
was hosted by the staff.

Cake, cookies, mints and punch 
were served.

The bride-elect was presented 
with a corsage of carnations. The 
table was covered with a blue lace 
table cloth. Mm. Bobby Drake

f-h. Save on Johnny Rutherford’s

CdR QUEST
K> GALLON 
MUFFLER

v

1974 & 1976 INDY 500 WINNER

10 gallons of 
gasoline FREE  
when you buy 
a W ALKER  
m uffler

CARQUEST
SUPPORTS

I TYPE ONLY)
Available at CARQUEST Auto Pans Store* Service 
Stations and Garages displaying the 10-gaMon muffler banner 
*0 Jfe 00 cath store or dea«' option

MUFFLER

You need a new muffler when
1. Motor noise level 

increases
2. Exhaust fume odor is 

noticeable.
Holes or rusted seams 
are detected on muffler. 
Soot deposits on the 
muffler are a clue to 
tiny leaks

CARQUEST is quality: 
Mama brands only. 
Thosa you know and 

trust CARQUEST is price 
Always right The lowest 
possible for top quality 
CARQUEST Is service From 
the aiparts in he business 
ALL the parte for all popular 
cars, plus professional ad 
vtco when you need it.

DUPUC0L0R 
SPRAY ENAMELS

Fist drying 
ant) rust
protection indoors 
or out
Sug List SI 99

NOW

$ 1 . 3 9

CAR WASH 
KIT

Bucket, polishing 
mitt, large 
with sponge 
quakty polishing 
doth, wtiitawal 
and teflon pot 
scrubber

NOW

$ 1 . 4 9

FREE
SCHOOL 
BOOK 
COVERS
Limit of two per 
family Additional 
covers are 251 
Available only at CARQUEST 
stores while supplies last.

CAL CUSTOM/HAWK ADJUSTABLE
DWELL H C H
Sal potnta 
timing Adjust 
cart accureefy
Jeweled Peering 
Handy compact 
eue
Sug Let
S30 79

n o w  $ 1 1 . 9 9

SAFETY 
JACK STANDS
Heevy duty
3 0001b # JS -15
capacity 
Ad/uits from 
12” to 17”
Tnpod base f t
ONLY $ 6 . P Q

CARQUEST 
MECHANICS’ 
FENDER COVER

Keepe
fender dean 

wttAe working 
on engine Drape 
over teat to 

protect upholstery

CARQUEST
MECHANICS’
CREEPER^

nylon 1 wtvei \ \  ' y V  
roNers. hard \  
wood frame
padded headrest \ \

ONLY $ 3 . 9 8  ! ONLY $ 9 . 4 9

Good at participating CARQUEST Auto Haris stores and dealers through September 4 1977

WELCH AUTO SUPPLY
W.HWY.60

WMAJ YOU MZAM WHCM rOU*Rf

Phone 247-2747

AT MOST 
W I

4



Hospital 

Report
ADMISSIONS-

Henry Graves, Jr., Friona; Stevan 
Smith, Friona; Margie Garcia, 
Friona. Eddie Braillif, Friona; E.L. 
Clark, Friona; Albert Bentley, 
Friona Frances Britt, Bovina; 
Letlee Upton, Friona; Susie Davis 
and baby girl, Friona; Regina 
Elliott, Friona; Ella Stormes, 
Lazbuddie; Phillip Chavez, Jr., 
Hereford; Fred White, Friona; and 
Sara Cervantez, Hereford.

DISMISSALS-
Rosa Cordova, Yolanda Montana, 

Irene Young, Richard Esquivel, 
Carl Fuqua, Mollie Teague, T.A. 
Williams, Ollie Duncan, Stevan 
Smith, Enedelia Levaro and baby 
boy, Henry Graves, Jr., Oralia 
Escalante, Eddie Braillif, Jennifer 
Smith, Mary Trevino and baby girl, 
Jerry Lee Galicia, Ella Stormes and 
Leslee Upton.

PATIENTS IN HOSPITAL-
E.L. Clark, Albert Bentley, Susie 

Davis and baby girl, Margie Garcia, 
Regina Elliott, Frances Britt, Fred 
White, Phillip Chavez and Sarah 
Cervantez.

THE FRIONA STAR, y ’NDAY, AUGUST 2 I. I * '

ROBERT LEON JACKSON, grad­
uated from West Texas State 
University, Canyon, on Saturday, 
August IS with a bachelor of science 
degree In health, physical education, 
with a history minor. He plans on 
teaching next year. He Is presently 
employed by Affiliated Foods, 
Incorporated and Is living In 
Amarillo, Texas. Robert Is the son of 
Mr. and Mrs. R.L. Jackson of 
Friona. A 1S73 graduate of Friona 
High School, he was among the 350 
West Texas State University 
students graduated In the summer 
commencement exercises. The 
ceremonies were held In the 
Amarillo Southwest Church of 
Christ.

SEPT. 8, 9, 10 
L U B B O C K

/ /

See the largest array of farm equipment, goods and services ever 
assembled on the High Plains.

Learn from nationally known experts on Marketing, Estate 
Planning, Energy and Water Development, plus "News in Cotton"

Homemakers attend a microwave cooking
demonstration, home decorating seminar, and a natural fiber fashion 
show. 1

September 8, 9 and 10 Lubbock Memorial Civic Center

Exhibits open 10-00 A M  to 7 00 P M  daily

Thursday. Saptambar 8 Friday. Saptambar 9

10 00AM MsrUatmj Symposium 1000AM Ensrjy Dsvatopmant
Symposium

2 00PM Microwava Cooking 1000AM 'N tw s «t Cotton*
Demonstration

2 30PM L ittle  Planning 2 00PM Homs Decorating
Symposium Seminar

Saturday. Saptambar 10

10 00AM Water Development 
Symposium

2 30PM Special appearance by
Senator John Tower 

4 30PM Natural Fiber Fashion 
Show

With the opening of school very 
close to us, Girl Scout leaders 
recognize the ever increasing need 
of workers. Volunteers are needed 
for every age level of Girl Scouting 
from beginning Brownies to Senior 
Scouts.

If you have time and talent to 
spare, it is urgently needed. All you 
need do is contact Mrs. Ralph Wilson 
or any Girl Scout for more 
information.

Another need of Girl Scouts right 
now is for Berry Crocker coupons. 
The Girl Scout House pantry needs 
more spoons, which may be obtained 
with these coupons.

If Mrs. Glen Herring isn’t the 
person you need to contact about 
donating coupons, she can tell you 
who is.

+ + + +
Anyone who ever gets on the 

highway notices the increasing 
number of cyclists going every 
direction every day. Seems like the 
“cycle bugs” bite more persons 
each year.

Two local people, who now live 
and teach in a public school down in 
the Houston area, are Larry Frank 
and Shirley White Truitt. This young 
couple stopped in Friona recently 
for a visit with their parents, Frank 
and Carmaleet Truitt and Ray and 
Wanda White; Larry’s grandmo­
ther, Mrs. Maggie Tims, and other 
local relatives and friends.

They were enroute to the 
mountains of Northern New Mexico 
and Colorado and were making the 
trip on a cycle.

Other visitors in the homes of the 
Truittts and Mrs. Tims have been 
H.C. Tims and daughter, Donna, of 
Calgary, Alberta, Canada.

These two had quite an experience 
due to the recent air strike. They 
stayed two days in Denver, then 
were able to get a flight to Salt Lake 
City and from there to Great Falls, 
Montana, where they were met by 
H.C.’s wife. Then the family drove to 
Calgary.

■f +  +  +
B.O. and Annie Elder of the Hub 

Community recently hosted e family 
fish fry in their back yard. They had 
all of their children, in-laws and 
grandchildren for guests.

Those present Included Mr and 
Mrs. Donnie McDonald, Farwell; 
Mr and Mrs. Don McDonald, Dana 
and Johnny, Clay’s Corner; Mr. and 
Mrs. Preston Carglle, Wade, 
Cassandra. Karen and Elaine and 
Mr. and Mrs. C.A. Watson, 
Lazbuddie; Mr. and Mrs. Jet 
Thomman, Levelland and Keith 
Rimpy. Muleshoe.

Also, Mr. and Mrs. Dwain

Menefee, Jody, Debbie and Jimmy 
and Mr. and Mrs. C.D. Dodson, 
Shae, Sherri, Stacie and Sunny and 
Becky Powell, Friona

Now, Otis probably has an excuse 
for him and Annie to take off on 
another fishing jaunt somewhere or 
other.

+  +  +  +
Visitors in the Friona area have 

been Mrs. WO. (Jack) Brown of 
Duncan, Oklahoma and Mrs. Ludie 
Quaid of Oklahoma City. These two 
ladies have visited in the homes of 
Mr and Mrs. Raymond Hughes, 
Mrs Carrie Shirley, Mrs. Robbia 
Hughes and other Friona friends.

Other guests in the Raymond 
Hughes home were Mr. and Mrs. 
Lee Smith of Odessa, who spent a 
couple of days here last week.

Sunday afternoon Mrs. Matt 
Brown of Wichita Falls and her 
father, Herman Brown of Byers, 
Texas, both former Friona resi­
dents, came to Muleshoe to visit in 
the home of Mr. and Mrs. Luther 
Hall

Betty came on to Friona Monday 
and spent two nights with Mrs. W R 
Riethmayer. Tuesday evening Mr 
and Mrs. Frankie Allen hosted an 
outdoor supper for Betty.

Then Thursday morning Betty, 
Flossie, Ludie and Herman left for 
their homes

+ + + +
We’ve been enjoying the company 

of two of our grandchildren this 
week. Joel and Heather Osborn, who 
live in Garland, are here Their 
parents, John and Geneva were here 
a couple of days last week then went 
home Sunday.

■f +  +  +
Judy Cummings is home again. 

She had surgery a few weeks ago, 
was dismissed from a Lubbock 
hospital within a week or so and then 
came home.

Later she had complications and 
had to return to Lubbock Now she 
hopes she’s "here to stay.”

+  +  +  +
Mrs. Ethie Woodard of Fort Worth 

spent a few days visiting her son, 
Clyde and his family In the Hub 
Community. Then, she accompanied 
Janet, Shea and Shannei to the 
Woodard cabin near Red River for a 
few days of relaxation and cooling 
off

By the way, my most sincere 
apologies go to Shannei and Shea for 
the mix-up reported last week. 
Shannei is a charming young lady 
and very graciously informed me 
that she and not her sister, Shea, 
was named Queen of the Ranch 
Branch at Camp Longhorn recently.

Sorry about the error girls. There

are many advantages to having a 
sister, but one of the disadvantages 
is having reporters get names mixed
up

+ + + +
If you’ve never lived in the 

Anton-Shallowater-Abernathy area, 
you may have never heard of a small
community in the northeast corner 
of Lubbock County and the 
southwest corner of Hale County 
called County Line.

Its only claim to fame may be the 
Anton-Irish oil field and the 
friendliness of its residents. This 
small community has a new 
Community Center Building and 
some enterprising residents of the 
community -mostly farmers and 
their wives-staged a reunion for 
ex-residents and old timers Sunday.

Festivities began with an old 
fashioned basket dinner at noon 
They must have been expecting a 
large crowd for someone had 
stretched a circus tent out in the 
yard that morning

Frionans attending the affair, 
besides the Glenn Floyds, were the 
Bill Turners and Rene and Jinx 
Snead. Reba Buske’s parents. Mr. 
and Mrs Neff Turner, were there, 
too Think they live in Abernathy.

No one would have ever guessed 
from looking at the food on the long 
tables that farmers are having 
financial problems. Congratulations 
to a fine group of people for a well 
planned, well executed function with 
all guests leaving feeling well fed.

+ + + +
Hardy and Mildred May attended

a school reunion in the Rush 
Springs Marlow. Oklahoma area 
last weekend Former students of
the College Mound Community
School were invited for an all school 
reunion.

The Mays also visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Edgie Graham of Rush 
Springs. Mrs. May and Mrs 
Graham are sisters.

+ + + +
Mr. and Mrs. H A Hyde have had 

several visitors recently. One of 
their daughters, Maxine Bolding of 
West Palm Beach. Florida, and her 
daughter, Jan, who lives in 
Louisville, Kentucky, stopped for a 
visit on their way to Glorieta, New 
Mexico.

Then two of Omer Hyde’s 
daughters. Mrs Warren Hall and 
Mrs Pete Price, both of Oklahoma 
City, and Mrs Price’s son, Ian.
came.

Later Mr and Mrs Truell Hyde 
and sons, Trean and Brad of Killeen. 
Texas, came and stayed a few days 
They were on their way to a church 
camp near Walsenburg. Colorado.

A few days later Mrs. Don 
Kimbrough of Othello, Washington, 
and one of her sons, Max, came. 
They were joined by Mrs. Thomas 
Cline and sons. Jay and Scott, of 
White Sands, New Mexico and Mrs. 
John Sandoval and daughter, 
Geneica, of Albuquerque.

5 ^ $ }  % ?

Higgins To Get 

Training At 

Dyess AFB
Cadet Michael R Kiggins, son of 

Mr and Mrs. James S. Kiggins of 88 
Eaton Road W. Fram ingham . 
Mass., is participating in a U.S. Air 
Force Reserve Officers Training 
Corps field training encampment at 
Dyess AFB. Texas.

During the encampment, cadets 
receive survival and small arms 
training and aircraft and aircrew 
indoctrination. They also have the 
opportunity to observe careers in 
which they might wish to serve as 
Air Force officers.

Cadet Kiggins, a student at Texas 
Tech University at Lubbock, is a 
1964 graduate of Boston (Mass.) 
Technical High School. His wife, 
Myra, is the daughter of Mr and 
Mrs. Valton Morris of Lazbuddie, 
Texas.

Kathy Horton

Makes l T
H o n o r  R o l l

The University of Texas has 
named 323 students to the College of
Pharmacy honor roll for the 1177 
spring semester

Students on the pharmacy honor 
roll maintained at least a B average 
(3 0) for 12 semester hours of 
academic work

The honor roll was released by 
Dean James T. Doluisio.

Making the pharmacy honor roll 
with high honors was Kathy Horton 
of Friona She is the daughter of Mr 
and Mrs. H.H Horton. Jr.

s h o p  . . . .
p e r r y ' s

1017 Main Friona, Taxas

■
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Double Ring Ceremony Unites 
Karen Young, Roger Head

Karen Denise Young of Friona and 
Roger Dale Head of Snyder, 
Oklahoma exchanged double ring 
wedding vows on Friday, July 8 at 7 
p.m.

The ceremony was performed by 
Jay Henderson of Plamview, Texas 
in the Tenth Street Church of Christ, 
Friona

The bride's parents are Mr. and 
Mrs Troy Young of Friona The 
bridegroom's parents are Mr. and 
Mrs Theren Head of Snyder, 
Oklahoma

The green archway was decorated 
with blue carnations and blue bows 
A bouquet of greenery and white 
satin roses decorated the center of 
the church. On each side of the 
archway were spiral candelabras 
with greenery and blue bows. A 
memory candle on the side was lit by 
the bride and groom. Family pews 
were marked with blue bows and 
white satin roses

The flowers were made by Mrs, 
Sterling Graham, cousin of the 
bride

“Theme From Love Story," 
“Theme From Romeo and Juliet" 
and "The Last Date" were wedding 
selections that had been taped and 
presented by Paul Wyly. He also 
taped the wedding march and 
recessional.

During the third song, the mothers 
and grandmothers of the couple 
were ushered into the church.

Special music was presented by 
Vickie Florez, soloist. She sang 
“Evergreen." A quartet consisting 
of J.D . Jr. and Jan Spencer and 
John and Debra Baxter, sang “ Let 
Me Be There "

The bride was escorted to the altar 
by her father. She wore a 
semi-cathedral floor length wedding 
gown of Chantilly type lace. The 
dress featured bouffant silhouette, 
long lace sleeves, a scooped neckline 
and the skirt and semi-cathedral 
train featured row after row of lace 
ruffles

Her three tiered fingertip veil of 
Chantilly lace had a crown cap 
trimmed with pearls.

She carried a hogarth arrange­
ment of spring flow er* and baby 's 
breath

The bride wore pennies minted in 
the years of the couple's birth in her 
shoe for good luck

Carrying out bridal tradition, she 
wore her maternal grandmother's 
wedding band for something old 
Something new were pearl stud 
earrings. She borrowed a peart 
strand necklace and wore the 
traditional blue garter

Jan Spencer of Friona. sister of

the bride, was the matron of honor. 
Bridesmaids were Sami Rector, 
Melodi Dixon and Vicki Florez.

Jay Head served his brother as 
best man. Groomsmen were Farron 
young, brother of the bride, J.D. 
Spencer, Jr., brother-in-law of the 
bride and John Baxter, uncle of the 
bride.

Candlelighters were Denny 
Young, brother of the bride, and 
Janet Head, sister of the groom

Flower girls were Janet Baxter 
and Tara Young, cousins of the 
bride.

Serving as ushers were Phillip 
Veazey and Boyd Pipes. Jr., cousins 
of the bride and Mitchell Smiley.

Feminine attendants wore floor 
length blue dotted swtss dresses with 
squared scoop necklines, fitted 
empire waistlines and short two-tier 
bell sleeves They wore picture hats 
with stiff lace ribbon around the hat 
falling slightly off the brim and blue 
carnation where ribbon crossed in 
the back. They carried bouquets of 
blue carnations and baby’s breath 
and blue satin streamers were 
carried by each attendant.

The bride's mother wore a pink 
floor length knit, a-line dress with

scooped neckline and matching 
sheer shawl.

The groom’s mother wore a long 
sleeved green knit floor length dress 
with fitted empire waistline.

The mothers wore corsages of 
white satin roses and pink ribbons.

A reception was held in the home 
of Mr and Mrs. Oscar Baxter, 
grandparents of the bride

The bride's table was covered with 
white satin swag over a floor length 
white lace skirt and tied with blue 
ribbons. The centerpiece was a 
basket of white satin roses and 
candelabras holding blue candles on 
each side.

Serving from the bride's table 
were Sue Rector. Ophelia Florez and 
Yvonna Jennings of Caddo, Okla­
homa. sister of the groom.

The groom's table was covered 
with a white satin table cloth The 
centerpiece was a long stemmed 
satin yellow rose in a silver tall vase 
with a blue bow. A silver coffee 
service completed the table setting

Donna Ruzicka of Lubbock and 
Sidney Stanfield served from the 
groom's table.

The punch was served from a 
crystal punch bowl.

Regina Elliot registered guests
For a wedding trip to Six Flags

Over Texas in Dallas, the bride wore 
a blue knit jumpsuit and matching 
jacket and a corsage of white 
carnations.

The couple will reside at 903 West 
Fourth Street. Friona.

The bride is a 1977 graduate of 
Friona High School and is presently 
employed as a nurses aide at Prairie 
Acres.

The bridegroom is a 1973 graduate 
of Snyder High School, Snyder, 
Oklahoma. He is employed at 
Kendrick Oil Co., Friona.

Out-of-town guests attending the 
wedding ceremony were Mr. and 
Mrs Theren Head. Jay and Janet of 
Snyder, Oklahoma; Mrs. Johnny 
Jennings and Jonetta of Caddo, 
Oklahoma; Mrs. James Head, Mr. 
and Mrs. Max Killian and Chipper, 
all of Snyder; Mary Mills of 
Barstow. California; and Mr. and 
Mrs. Jay Henderson and boys of 
Plainview, Texas.

REHEARSAL DINNER
The rehearsal dinner was hosted 

by the groom's parents at the 
Parmer House Restaurant on 
Thursday, July 7. Approximately 
twenty-five people attended and 
were served a roast beef dinner.

Jeanie Thompson
Mrs. Roger Head

oac. =**5

TAKE
Receives Diploma ainaktabe

Jeanie Thompson of 1609 W. 10th 
St. in Friona was among the 880 
students who filed for diplomas 
awarded in summer commence­
ment ceremonies Saturday. August 
13, at Southwest Texas State 
University.

Degree candidates included 197 
from the Graduate School, 172 from 
the School of Applied Arts, 124 from 
the School of Business, 36 from the 
School of Creative Arts, 182 from the 
School of E ducation . 28 from  the 
School of Health Professions, 94 
from the School of Liberal Arts and 
47 from the School of Science.

Texas Governor Dolph Briscoe 
delivered the commencement ad­
dress Degrees were conferred by 
Southwest Texas President Dr Lee 
H Smith

Ms. Thompson, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs Dave M Thompson, was a 
member of various honorary

OF THESE
PRICES GOOD WEEK OF AUGUST 22  THRU AUGUST 28

JEANIE THOMPSON
societies as well as the Dean's List 
and the President’s List.

Ms. Thompson graduated with a 
bachelor of arts degree with a 
double major in English and speech.

I hear Sponaora I  e lro m e  You To F riona 'a  C hurches

(?hurch Chuckles by CARTWRIC.HT

l & f l
H A V E  you 

S i g n e d
A N t w  P l f  DGC

" I f  I fa ll behind promt*# you won t tall this 
pledge to soma loan shark’ "

Rushing Insurance
The Friona ★ Star

Friona State BankL

Friona Consumers
Friona Motors

Wilhelm TV & Apj]►1.

Eth ridge-Spring
Anthony’s

Sugarland Mall Downtown Hereford

FIRST BAPTIST
SIXTH AND SUMMITT-REV. C. H MURPHY

CALVARY BAPTIST
IITH AND CLEVELANDJIFV RON TRUSLFR

ST. ESTHER'S BAPTIST CHURCH
STH AND MAIN-REV. I. S. ANSI FY. PASTOR

MEXICAN BAPTIST CHURCH
ITH AND WOODLAND-REV. DONNIE CARRASCO

6th ST. CHURCH OF CHRIST
Ml W. SIXTH--D L. HARGUFSS, MINISTER

LUTHERAN CHURCHES
RHEA AND FRIONA-REV. WILLIAM RUMPEL

FRIONA UNITED METHODIST
r i n i D l ' U  STH AND PIERCE- 
I . H t n U l  rorby McMillan

UNION CONGREGATIONAL 
CHURCH

EUCLID AT IITH-REV.

ASSEMBLY OF GOD
:W> *nd A,hl>nd- THOM AS BLEVINS

UNITED PENTECOSTAL 
CHURCH

STH AND ASHLAND-GAYLON CHAPMAN

ARRID EXTRA DRY

"iv D E O D O R A N T
REGULAR and NUETRALSCENTED 

NON-AEROSOL
X  3 Oz. Reg. *2.29 * 1  ®

---------------- « • »

- m ZEE
ARRID CREAM

D E O D O R A N T

.75 0z. A Q k  
Reg. 6 9 ' " W &

Reg. >1.65

29
n

LISTERINE Reg. 9 9 '

M O U T H W A S H  t o z .

MICRIN
4 9

. . .  WT i< i F S I4 A  r n K T n  TEMPLO LaHERMOSA SPANISH 6thST.IGLESIAdeCKISIO PENTECOSTAL CHURCH
m  W S IXTH - I H i  W ASHINGTON-TI R SO l.OPFZ,

__ _  PASTOR

10th ST. CHURCH OF CHRIST ST. TERESA'S CATHOLIC
r i f l f f t r  H  AND CLEVELAND-1,1 I*' I1FArHFR DFRMONT O'BRIENIfTH AND EUCLID

M O U T H W A S H  “Z
Reg. *1.98 l-aasi

M IC R IN
P L U S

$ 1 6 9
tot. A

COLGATE

T O O T H P A S T E
70z. R eg .’ l A l

1 EFFERDENT
e x t r a  s t r e n g t h  ' i j ,

'■ d e n t u r e  1
C L E A N E R

60 Tablets 
Reg. *2 35

9 9

REXALL

M E D I C A T E D  

S K I N C R E A M  i o o z

DRY and CLEAR

A C N E  M E D I C A T I O N

20z. $ 0 3 9
Reg. *2.95

PRELLL

S H A M P O O
Reg. ’2.00

$ 1 4 9
u  oz. A

LOREAL HERBAL

S H A M P O O  

$ 1 5 9
8 0 z . A  

Reg. *1.85

}

Reg.

«.\im  sHi nq lh

efferdent
M K 'iia i ' i • ans# m

jLL'S' ;

METH0LLATHER

B U R M A  S H A V E  n o z .

WELLA BALSAM Rtg. *2.98

H A I R  C O N D I T I O N E R  16 0z.

Bt-WIZE  ®  DREG
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MISS MARIANNE JONES

Clovis Director 
To Give Lessons

Mrs. Ruth Piasecki Jones and 
Miss Marianne Jones announced 
this week that they would be coming 
to Friona on Wednesdays to conduct 
dance classes.

Mrs. Jones began her dance 
training at the age of four and after 
receiving her formal training at the 
Badische Stadt Theater of The Arts 
in Kerlsruhe, Germany traveled 
throughout Germany and France as 
a professional dancer. Following her 
marriage and move to the United 
States she established the Piasecki 
School of Dance In Clovis, New 
Mexico in 1952 and has been a 
resident of that city since that time. 
Mrs. Jones returns to Koln, 
Germany by invitation each 
summer to participate in The 
Summer Dance Academy where a 
limited number of international 
choreographers and teachers are 
awarded the honor of being invited.

Miss Jones began her dance 
training at the age of four at the 
Piasecki School of Dance in Clovis. 
Beginning in Junior High School she 
attended Badische Stadt Theater Of 
The Arts in Karlsruhe, Germany 
during the summers as a guest 
performer where she was given top 
reviews by national critics.

Graduating from Clovis High 
School in 1967, she went to 
Hollywood, California to study 
dance with Eugene Loring, who has 
won wide acclaim for his choreo­
graphy of Billy the Kid. Included 
with her dance studies at the 
American School of Dance was 
drama study with Harrison Lewis at 
the Harrison Lewis School of Acting.

After two and a half years of study 
in Hollywood, she went to Badische 
Stadt Theater in Karlsruhe, Ger­
many to study under Ballet 
Meisterin Silberboard At the same 
time she studied at the Badische 
Stadt Theater, she also studied at 
the Academy of Drama under 
director Herr Wedekind and voice at

BALLET MEISTERIN 
RUTH PIASECKI JONES

the Academy of Music where she 
graduated. After graduating from 
the Badische Stadt Theater of The 
Arts, she continued her acting and 
entered the field of teaching and 
choreography. Proving her ability to 
teach and work with children 
awarded her an invitation to 
contract with Ballet Meisterin Ilse 
Borman Piaseckis’ Children’s Dan­
ce Academy of Karlsruhe.

During Miss Jones’ seven years of 
study and work in Germany she was 
invited to attend The Summer Dance 
Academy in Koln, Germany.

In 1976 Miss Jones decided to 
again make Clovis her home and has 
become a partner with her mother at 
the Piasecki School of Dance.

Classes available will include four 
year olds through adult ladies. 
Gasse will begin August 31 and 
conclude the latter part of May with 
a formal recital. Anyone wishing to 
register for classes may do so by 
calling Betsy Cook at 247-3730.

L o o k  y o u r  p r e t t i e s t  f o r  F a l l  a n d  f o r . . . .

M fo S t/m /
★  SPECIAL ON PERMANENTS 

*15#0to , 18s# Included

Special Runs Auguiit 22 T hru  September 3.

★  We Now Have A New Method 

Of Natural Highlighting For Your Hair 

★  Our Services Now Include Depilatory 

Wax Removal For Unwanted Hair
★  We Are Now Sponsoring A New 

Weight Loss Program To Lose 

10 to 29  Pounds In One Month
Nita Galyon, Tuesday-Friday  

Gail G rah am ,  Monday-Friday 
Wensie Gee, Wedne»day-Friday 

Recently Associated With Nemin-Marcus 
Salon of Fort  Worth

M A D E M O I S E L L E  
S A L O N
6th &  Euclid

Phone 247-3312  or 247-3851

Lazbuddie Sets 1978 I Library Report j
Meet Jesus Crusade

The 1978 Lazbuddie Meet Jesus 
Crusade has been set for July 16. 
1978 through July 23, 1978.

An organizational meeting will be 
called in January, 1978 to select a 
general chairman, evangelist and 
singer for the crusade. Ronald 
Elliott, 1977 General Chairman 
emphasized that any interested

layman or pastor is welcome to 
come to the organizational meeting 
in January.

"We would like to thank the many 
people who assisted us during the 
past crusade, especially the news­
paper and radio station personnel 
who helped us publicize the 
crusade,” said Elliott.

“Milton Berle," an autobiography 
with Haskel Frankel is available at 
Friona Public Library.

This startling autobiography by 
the man still known as Mister 
Television reveals the truth behind 
the public image, even when it is 
embarrassing and painful. Rich with 
anecdote and emotion. Berle’s book 
tells of his star-crossed love affair 
with a Hollywood glamour queen of 
the Thirties and the child they had 
out of wedlock, his surprising 
romantic liaisons with evangelist 
Aimee Semple McPherson and

Sex-goddess Marilyn Monroe, and 
his dominating stage mother who 
was still calling the plays in his life 
when he was 30 Berle pulls out all 
the stops and paints in intimate 
detail the life which ran ‘‘on guilt 
and adrenalin.”

America's madcap comic has 
written a book that spares nothing in 
re-creating all the excitement, 
pathos, comedy, and real tragedy of 
the brash, pushy clown who was 
determined to take off the funny 
man's mask and show the world his 
real face.

6fk Annual Special! Haurnt Auction
August 25-26-27, 1077
Thursday, Friday and Saturday —  10:00 a.m. Each Jay

Located PLAINVIEW, TEXAS, on Hwy. 87 — */? Mile South of Jimmy Dean Meat Co 
on West Side (Just South of Hwy 87 and Hwy 194 Intersection) 3 Day Auction

Thursday, August 25, 1977 -  Sale Time: 10:00 a.m.
Strippers, Trailers, Tractors, Implements -  Equipment will be sold on this Day -  This is a list of Equipment consigned 
up to press time. More consignments r t  eipected and will be accepted until 5:00 p.m Wednesday, August 24, 1977.

PLEASE CALL BEFORE BRINGING CONSIGNMENTS!

TRACTORS, LOADER, HI TRAC -
1-1970 Farmall 14S6 Ufesei IfKtor Cab OH Wf 

Wts
1-1968 John 0oe*e 4020 Dreset Tractor Cab WF 

SH Overhauled th»s Sprinf
1-1966 lohn Deere 4020 IPG Tractor M l P S DH 
1—1%7 L n e  1030 D*se< Tractor WF DH Duals
1 -  Vtchs Hr Trac with Massey Ferguson 35 Dactor Mtti 

150 |* i Propane Tank
2 -  1958 John Deer* 720 IPG Tractori w f PS 3 pts 
1-1952 Ford 8N Gas Tractor
1 -Farman M Gas Tractor 
I-Farmall H Gas Tractor 
1 International TOT Dies*1 Trac Loader 
1-International W9 Gas Wheatland Tractor Hyp Pump 

Remote C|H Cont

SELF PROPELLED STRIPPERS A 
TRACTORS WITH MTD. STRIPPERS, 
STRIPPERS -
1-1974 Allis Chalmers 860 Sell Propelled Stripper Cad 

Gas engine Burr Eitractor
14 Broadcast near* Stripped less than 500 hales 

1-1970 Allis Chalmers 760 XTB Sell Propelled Strippei

Cat ? Ron Units
1-1967 Messton Self Propelled 50 Cotton Stripper Cab 

Been Sheddec
1 -  long Sell Propelled Cation Stripper Cab Mtr 

Automatic Height Cont Burr Eitractor IPG
1-1966 Far mall 706 Dieset Tractor WF TA OH

16 9«34 Rubber «.tb 1972 Int 85 Brush Stripper and 
Basket with Basket ( i t

1 1963 lohn Deere 4010 Dies* Tractor All DH
19 9i34 Rubbei with lohn Deere 282 Brush Stripper 
with 70 Series Basket with Row Sensors

1 196? F*r mall 560 D*set Tract* WF IP  TO OH 
••th Int 30 Brush Stripper and Basket 

1 195) Farmal' M IPG Tractor Incvcie Front with Int 
21 Cotton Stripper

2 -  lohn Deere 28s Brush Strippers and Baskets with Ron
Sensors la * Acieage Shedded

3- lohn Deere 782 Brush Strippers and Baskets 
2 - International 85 Brush Strippers and Baskets
1- Messton ?4A Brush Shipper and Basket
I - AMC 3 pt ? Ron Cotton Stripper «nd Diangfe Basket 
? lohn Dee'e 782 Brush Strippers n th Trailer Del
4 iohn Deere 77 Cotton Strippers with Triable Baskets
2 -  lohn Dee*e 77 Cotton Strippers TO Been Shedded
2- John Deere 280 Cotton Steppers mth Triangle Baskets

2 -International Xo 30 Brush Strippers and Baskets 
3 - Inter national 30 Brush Stripper Trailer Dei 
4 international 22 Cotton Strippers ’ D

RICKERS. BOU SEPERRTOR -
1 ftowtod Conn- ItKhin
I loreen Richer
I Early Boi< Seperator on 4 whee chassis mth 

Basket Wisconvn (ngm

COTTON TRAILERS -
106150 Cotton Trailers Various Mahes and Sites Met* 

and Wood Some Combination Gram and Cotton 
Trailers Oittcrent Kinds ol Chassis and Bed Material 
We need more Cotton Trailer Consignments The 
Market Looks Good 'or Cotton Traders

WHEAT DRILLS -
1-Tye 8 Ron 3 pt Wheat Drill 10 spaced 
1-lye 6 Row 3 pt Wheat Drill 8 spaced tuied only 

on 30 acres)
1- lohn Deere ORB Wheat Dull
1 - John Deere ORA Wheat Drill
3 - John Deere 1610 Van Brunt Wheat Drills
I-Molme 1610 High Whcei Rubber Tire Wheat Drill

IMPLEMENTS -
I- John Deere 727 4 Row Shredder 
1 Stsnton 4 16 Spinner Mouldboard 
1 Hamby 3 Shank Stubble Mulch Plow 
1 lohn Deere DT 7 Row Shredder
I Sews 3 pt P I 0 Post Hole Digger 
I Massey Ferguson Side Deiwery Rake 3 pt 
1 - Schafer 14 Tandem Disc 
I Schjter 15 Oneway Cyf Cont 
1-International 4 Row 3 pt Cultivator 
I Big valley 3 pt Foggr
1 Gehi Silo Blow with 100 Silo Pipe and Distributor 
l farmall Gas Engine Mounted on Trailer (used to 

power silo brower)
1 Tan Gas Powered long Arm Bush Whacker or

Pruning Saw

BOAT, TANKS, AIR COMPRESSOR -
1 Glastron 15 Boat 70 h p Mercury Motor Drily

Tr*iie< (fish harvesting ng,
1 300 g*< Drese Tank on Tandem Ante Trailer with 

An Compressor Pressurized Tank 
1 750 gai Propane Tank on ? Whee* iiame 
I 40 ga< Saddle Tank (prior safety tank 
1 mgersotRand 4 hp Ifectnc An Compressor HD

LIVESTOCK EQUIPMENT -
I Chief 6 *2 0  Gooseneck Truler TA EMC Electrn 

Brakes 6 Saddle lompartments
30 5 i 10 Meta Stock Panels
1 OR) Scratch Cattle Drier
2 Whuiwind Mineral Feeders

C
Tim •  i  lot el cemigwrnenb as at August I. 1977 More consignment* are eipecled and will be accepted vntn 5 00 pm  WvdnmAay August 74 1977 -  It what ym need an t luted n may be her* Safe dee1

PLEASE CALL BEFORE BRINGING CONSIGNMENTS ____________________ 3
Friday, August 26, 1977 -  Sale Time: 10:00 a.m.

Combines, Cornfields, Combine Attachments and Related Items will be sold on this day -  WE WILL START THE NEWEST 
COMBINES FIRST -  DON’T BE LATE IF YOU ARE INTERESTED IN A LATE MODEL MACHINE! More Consignments are 
eipected and will be accepted until 5:00 p.m. Wednesday. August 24, 1977.

PLEASE CALL BEFORE BRINGING CONSIGNMENTS!
COMBINES -
1-1975 (new) lohn Deere 7700 Dtesei Combine CGS 

Machine 24 5i32 Rubber P/T D«>ve Turbo Bm 
( i t  24 Hdr HD Pickup Ree Header Float Springs 
Cab AC Heater Hew Bought m Fall o< 1975 
never used full Warranty Goes to Buyer

1-1976 lohn Deere 7700 D*esei Combine Turbo Hyd»o 
CGS Machine 224 Hdr Bm ( i t  Cab A C Heater 
Radio Wts Rock Guards 850 hours

1-1975 John Deere 7700 Diesel Combine Turbo P 'l 
Trans CGS Machine 224 Hdr Monitors Cab AC 
Heate* Chopper Bm ( i t  30 51 Rubber Pickup Reel 
750 hours Been Shedded

1-1977 lohn Deere 6600 Oresei Combme Mydrastat* 
Big (ngme Cab AC Heater Monitors 22 Hdi 
350 hours CGS Machine

1-1977 lohn Deere 6600 Oiesei Combine Pos Torque 
Trans Big (ngme Cab AC Heate* 20 Hdt CGS 
Machine Monitor Only 80 hours

1 -  1975 lohn Deere 6600 Diesel Combme 20 Hdi 
Ceb AC Heater Bm ( i t  CGS Machine

2 -  1972 lohn Deere 7?00 Combmes CGS Machines AC

Cabs Mtrs Bm ( it  1 has ?4 Hdr 1 has 20 Hd*
1 1971 John Deere 6600 Conbme Cab AC 15 Hdi 

Pickup Ree' 1078 hours Been Shedded
1-1976 international 915 Diesel Combme Hydrastat* 

Drive 24 Hdr Cab A C Heate* Bm ( i t  Monitors 
Only 113 hours

1 1974 International 915 Diesel Combine 24 Hd* Cab 
A C Mon .tors wheels spaced tor 120 1 Owne*
Low hour anti A t rage Machine

1 197? Moline 5297 Combine Cab A C Hyd'astatrc 
Drive Gas engine 2 Hdrs 1 20 Gram Mead with 
Pickup Reel 1 16 Hdr mth Sunflower Hd* Complete 
(This machine is the same combme as the Oliver 
5555 Just Pamted Red This is a good one owner 
low Acieage Machine

1 -  1967 International 403 Combine 14 Hdi Gas 
engine Cab AC Bm ( i t  Robot 18 4 Rubber One 
Season on Complete Overhaul

1 1976 Gfeaner Model L Combine Diesel 3500 engine 
Cab A C Heate- Hydrastatrc Drive Chopper Mon-tors 
Rock Guards Bm ( i t  24 Si3? Rubber ?4 Hd<

2 -  1976 Gfeanei Model l  Combines 3500 D>esei engine

Cab A C neater ?4 Hdr MBR Big Rubbe- Bm 
( i t  iitra  lights

1 1975 Cleaner Model l  Combme Diesel 3500 
engine Cab A C Heater Hydrostatic Drive Chopper 
Monitors Rock Guards Bm ( i t  24 5>3? Rubbe- 
?4 Hd*

1-196S Cleaner F Combme Cab 14 Hdi Butane engine 
Hyd Reei Lift V«* Spe*„ Ree and Cy'-ndr MB* 
(This combine is m mint condition been shedded 
(Probably the cleanest ot this make and model you 
have euei seen

1 -  1973 Gfeaner Mode M Drese* combine Cab A C 
Heatf Rock Guards Bm ( i t  20 Hdr

2 -  1969 John Deere 105 D«se< Combmes Cabs A C 
20 Hdrs

l 1963 John Deere 95 IPG Combme 14 Hd* Pickup 
Reel Cab A C Bm ( i t  Long Auge-

1-1963 lokn Deere 105 Combme Cab A C 14 Hdi 
Pickup Reel Bm ( i t  Hew Style Cor* Feeder House 
Gas engine

1 -1976 Massey Ferguson 750 Dtesei Combine Cab A C
24 Hd* ?4 5i3? Rubbe* MB Reei 37? Cu in

2 1974 Masse* Ferguson 760 Dreset Combines Cabs 
AC ?4 Hdrs MB Reels

1-1973 Massey Ferguson 760 D*esei Combme 20 Hdr 
Cab A C He* Tians hew Final Drwei 24 5*3? 
Rubbe* v B Ft

1-1971 Masse* Ferguson 510 Dtesei Combine Cab A/C 
Monitors 20 Hd> Pickup Ree* Big Rubbei Bern 
ShaddM

1 1968 Masse* Ferguson 510 Combine Cab A C 20 
Hdi Gas engine

1 1%: Massey Ferguson 510 Diesel Combine Cab
20 Hdr

CORNHEKOS. COMBINE ATTACHMENTS
1 -  lohn Deere 645 6 Row 40 Comhead
2 lohn Deere 444 Comhead 4 Row 40 

5aven
1 lohn Deere 643 6 Row 30 Comheac 
1 Masse* Ferguson C63 6 Row 30 Comhead 
1 Gfeanei tM 8 Row 30 Cornheac 
1 Case 4 Row 40 Comhead 1660
1 lohn Deere 435W Comhead
1-International 429 4 Row 40 Comhead 
i-Lynch 7 Row Hi Drum Row Hanreste*
1-lynch 6 Row Row Harvester
2 Lynch 4 Row Row Harvester
1 Set Sammann 4 Row Corn Savers 
I Wyi* 4 Row Sunflower Hdi Complete 
1-14 Pickup Reel 
1-Straw Choppe- tor Case 1660

r~

with Com *

LEASE PURCHASE PLAN -  We have available a firm that will help you purchase equipment on the leasepurchase plan, if interested let us know ]
Saturday, August 27, 1977 -  Sale Time: 10:00 a.m.

Trucks, Pickups, Tractors, Floats, Grain Trailers, Pups, Gram Carts will sell on This Day -  All Trucks will be sofa with 
OWNER Guarantee For Clear Merchantable Title -  More Consignments Are Eipected and will be Accepted until 
5:00 p.m. August 24, 1977 -  WE WILL START THE LATEST MODEL TRUCKS FIRST -  DON’T BE LATE!

PLEASE CALL BEFORE BRINGING CONSIGNMENTS!

TRUCKS -
1 -  1976 Chevrolet C 65 Tandem Aife Gram Truck 366 

engine 5 sp 2 tp ?? Bed Horit Clark Dans 
7 600 miles

2 -  1970 White Drew* Trucks Tandem tile  Twm Screw 
671 engine 10 ip Tram ?4 Gram Bed* T/C 
Horst 10 00 Rubber Straight An A C P/$

1-1976 international 1700 Tandem Aife Truck with
Henderson (hag with JJ M*b*< Bed 54 Sides 
T/C Hoist 1000 Rubbe* 5 tp 2 ip 8000 mrfes 

1-1970 CMC 6500 Sones ’ andem Aife Truck 5 so 
2 tp An Hag Drag 20 Bed with 5? Sides 30 Ton 
Hoist 10 00 Rubber Heart* Hew 4?7 engine

1 -  1975 Dodge D800 T*ndem Aife Gram Truck 413
engine ?? Bed 40 Ton Horst 5 tp T»*ns w«th 
Working 5th

2 -  1973 Chevrolet C-45 Tandem Aife G»em Trucks 366
engine 5 ip 2 sp 20 Beds T/C Horst 9 00
Rubber

1-1972 Chevrolet Tandem Aile G*am Truck 350 engine
4 tp 2 sp Hew 20 Gram Bed

1-1969 Chevrolet 650 Tandem Aife Cram Truck 350 
engme 20 Bed 50 Sides T/C Hertt 5 sp 2 sp

I 1975 1X600 leutwMe Ferd Truck $A 5 sp 2 sp 
20 Hmg Bed l/C Kent P S AC Saddle tanks
5 900 miles

I- I9 7 J  Ford 2 Tea Gram Truck 9 8 engine 4 sp 2 
ip 16 Bed T/C Horst

? ip

1-1968 Chevrolet 2 Ton Truck V8 engine 4 
sp Gram Bed and Hoist

1-197? Dodge 2 Ton Truck V8 engine 5 
sp Gram Bed and Hoist

1 1970 International 1600 2 Ion Truck 4 sp 
Gram Bed and Horst

1-1965 Ford F 600 truck Cab and Chassis 330 V8 
engine 4 sp ? sp

1 1966 Chevrolet 2 Ton Gram Truck V8 engme 4 sp 
2 sp 16 Bed and Most

I 1966 Chevrolet 2 Ton Trvcl Cab and Chassis 124 
CA V8 engine 5 sp 7 sp

1-1966 Chevrolet 2 Ton Van Truck 6 cyl 
4 sp Trans Xabrns Van

1 1964 Cheurofet 2 To* G'*m Truck 4 ip 
IS led

2 |%? CMC 4000 Senes G**m Trucks V6 
One has 5 sp ? sp One has 4 sp 
9 00 Rubber Gram Beds and Hosts

1 196? Chevrolet ? ton Truck V 8 engme 4 sp 
Gram Bed Horst

1 1%I l*t ?S Tot* Gram Duck 4 sp 2 sp I I  Bed
I I960 Dodge Ton Tmrk Cab and Chassis 111 engme 

4 sp 2 sp
I I960 international 2 Ton Gram Truck V l engine 

4 sp Gram Bed
I 1955 cheurofet 2 Ion Gram Truck 327 engme 4 sp 

? sp Bed and ''-SHt
1 1961 Chew vet 2 Ion Gram Truck v |  engme 16 

Bed 2nd ’«0*st

2 sp

engme
2 sp

• 2 sp

1-1957 Chevrolet 2 To* Gram Truck 261 engine 4 sp 
2 sp Bed and Horst

1 1%! Ford 2 Ton Gram Truck V8 engme 4 sp 
? sp 16 Bed

IMPLEMENT TRUCKS. TRAILERS -
I .964 international 2 To* Truck 4 sp 7 sp 2? T*tt 

implement Bed with Winch 9 00 Rubber 
1 196? Chevrolet 2 Ton Truck 4 sp 2 sp 6 cyl 

engine 20 TiN implement Bed with Wmch 44 000 
miles

I Gander ?4 Gooseneck Triple Aife Flatbed implement
Tra-fer Tilt Bed (fee Winch 

1 Donahue 21 low Boy Implement Trailer

GRAIN CARTS -
A Big I? Gram Karts 
I John Deem Gram Cart Xo 1210 
? Pharos Wither** Gram Cart*
3- John Deere Ko 68 Gram Carts

hCKUPS, SERVICE TRUCKS. SCOUT -
1 - 1974 Chevrolet Dual Wheel I Ton Pickup Xew engine

AT P/SP'B AC
1-1975 CMC W -a Claw S Ton Pickup P/S P'8 

A/C AT 454 engme
1-197) Fard F 100 Range* U1 Pickup P S P I  AC 

AT 390 engme
I - 1971 infernptmnal Scout M MB engme 4WD

L u n c h  Available P LU S  I ' l K  TOUR OWN CHECK k30K -TERMS Of SALE: CASH. A n w H  SWIM f e V I *
inks  lava (»«•««*•
HUB U. "**•' IMtCiuce and Long Auctioneer

Bo* 1921 — Plxinvtw, Texas 79072

1-1972 Chevrolet 1 Ton flatbed Pickup AT 350 
engine Xew Overhaul

I -  1970 Chevrolet 650 2 Ton Truck with 16 
Aluminum Sconce Bod* Xew 350 engine 4 sp —th 
2 200 gai international Fuel Tanks PT0 Pump 

1-1965 GMC H Ton Pickup V6 (ngme A sp Trans 
1-1964 Cheurofet X Ton Pickup S/T 6 cyl engine 

with Koenig Utility Bed
1-1964 Ford 1 Ton Truck Cib and Chassis V8 engine 

4 sp

BUILDINGS, HOUSE TRAILERS -
1 23 i 36 Metal Buiidmg 10 Walts Insulated 

Skylights Double Sliding Doors
I 30 i 40 Metal Building 1?- Walls 16 Sliding 

Doors Skylights
l-Highlander 30 5th Wheel Camping trailer Se« 

Contained Ret A C (fectnc »  Butane 
I -Concord Tandem Aife 2? Sell Contained House 

Tratfer Refrigerated AC

GOOSENECK GRKIN TRAILERS. 
COMBINE TRAILERS. HOPPER BOTTOM 
TRAILERS. TRUCK BEDS -
? Farm Hopper Gooseneck Hopper Bottom Darters 4 

Muhelrn lues 1*rp Complete with Plate and Biake
Hook up

I Demco Combination Gram and Combine Tiarfei
Hopper Bottom 'andem Aife Duals Mk helm Rubber 

I Fiuehuut 27 SA Hoppei Bottom Gram Irarte*
1 -  lutkm )4 Hooper Bottom landem Aife Darte*

10 2? Rubber
3-Gold Hugget i  Aife Combine Darters
2-  Donahue Combme Trailers
I - SM lowboy tandem Aife Dual Combme Darter 

(haul any combine)
I 3 Aile Combine trailer to haul ID 7 700 
I hnaphenfe 16 Gram Bed and fhust 
1-16 Manure Spreader Bed Fits Truck Chassis Xe* 

Beanngs and P T 0 Shaft

-LUNCH MILL K  AVAILABLE
.......... (M) m in t
n-aaar* ... (Ml) 29MMJ 
.................(Ml) ISM979

t
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A ux ilia ry  Sets Rummage Sale

The F riona American 
Legion Auxiliary will have a 
rummage sale two week­
ends, Friday and Saturday, 
August 26-27 and September 
2 3

Anyone having items that 
they will donate may bring

them by 521 Main (old 
Wilhelm TV building) on 
Thursday, August 25 at 2:30 
p.m. If you need these 
items picked up please call 
247-3206, 247 3013 or 247-3249 
as soon as possible.

PUUIC NOTICE
A pablk btiriM wiN U baM at 2 00 p.a. Wptaata
12. 1977 ia lit Con hi Coartrooa at FarvaN, Tails ta 
caasrOtr Ha proposal Cutty laOpat lar 1970, 
iacWma ill Itvaaaa SAartap M s prtptstV far isa
ia hblic Tnnsparlatim 1971 Mpat Saaaan
Mats:
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MDCITXC nrOLITUM B 
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THREETRUCK LOADS 
OF BINS ARRIVING 
NEXT WEEK! ! !

O i l *  n o i d s  up t o  5807 Qu. 
i l l  H o ld s  up t o  9959 Bu• 

7 * 1 "  O i a :  H o ld s  up t o  18656 Bu

CALL NOW TO HAVE 
YOUR SYSTEM READY 

BY HARVEST

e t c SS3SSSSSSS5SS
iEWENT SYSTEITIS 
IP I T MAKERS SS
mssssssssss

AUGERS ★  LEGS *  DRYERS 
STORAGE & DRYING BINS

COMPLETE DESIGN A INSTALLATION

WESTERN AG 
SALES co inc

F A R W E li, TEXAS
KEN COLE

OfficoPh. 481-3316 

Horn* Ph. 247-306S

Hr*

Shop

W--------------------------------------

USDA CHOICE BEEF

Your Clue 1b Sav in gs:M i MOVER*

„  LINKS » 89*
r l u u L Y  CORNNWS

W I G G L Y  MM .  *1M
EXTRA LEAN ammM

CHAR10IN STEAK *  *1M
no* rate
GROUND BEEF 
AMBURGER PATTIES .  89*

S M H K f t t

BONELESS
MAM
.  *2”

USPA CHOKE BEEF

„  * 1 ”

FRESHWATER

J \ "
mm WAFERS m  5 5 *  TEA BADS famhvsSze m m . * 1 * ’
CRUSHED PINEAPPLE 5 9 *  CAKE MIX BETTY CROCKER POX 5 5 *

ENJOY OUR DARLING
N /

GOLDEN
CORN

WHOIE KERNEL

303
CANS

10* OFF IABEL

GIANT
GNEER

MORTON FROZEN 

CHICKEN

"" PIESTURKEY ’  *

C fanny size RE0. *1.73 *189 DASH DETERGENT "reo'C oo *4”  
CSS HAND SOAP ° z e h  RES 50' 3 9 *  H A N  D I - W R A P  ZOO FT . ROU.

SANTA ROSA

PLUMS
TEXAS
0REEN

CABBAGE
TEXAS 

YEUOW SWEET

ONIONS
IP .

PETRITZ 
FROZEN

COBBLE
CHEERY PEACH 
APPU

14 0Z

l A I P S ^ S f *  a c r . l 1’  SAVER ASPIRIN save so* uoct.
INTENSIVE CARE LOTION 10 OZ. 

EXTRA STRENGTH SAVF SHAMPOO REVLON F IIX  BALSAM
1B0Z.



32HQS3
69*

Champion spark plugs.
Sizes to fit most U S. cars 

Resistor plugs slightly 
higher. 30 aoo 331

Prices effective through August 27,1977

R E D  H O T

White Power Custom 78 tires with fufl 4 ply construction and 
poiybutadiene tread compounds for excellent mileage potential. 

15.000 mile limited warranty against all road hazards and
wearout iss rs w

Free mounting
TIre F.E. • BW WW
Size Tax Sale Sale
A78x13 $1 72 4 for $71 52* 4 tor $79 52*
B78x13 1 82 4 lor 79 52* 4 lor 87 52*
C78x 14 201 4 for 87 52* —
E78x14 2 23 4 tor 95 52* 4 lor 107 52*
F78x14 2 37 4 tor 99 52* 4 lor 111 52*
078x14 2 53 4 tor 103 52* 4 lor 115 52*
G re * i5 2 59 4 tor 107 52* 4 for 1 19 52*
H78x15 2 79 4 for 11 1 52* 4 lor 12352*

* Plus F E tax each tire

2.57
Winchester shotgun shells.

Dove ft quail loads 2 V  
length Choose 12, .16 or 

20 gauge. ŝ 3A u n

2 9 .8 8
• track tape player with your choice 

of wedge or flush mount speakers. 
Includes mounting hardware, hookup 

wire ft instructions u m im m

j v / N i m s n *



t u r t l e
w a x

1.47
Tufl Stuff mufti

c lM n w  tor home or 
auto 22 ol  bpray

can. & i4r

AUTOMOTIVE S P E C IA L SFix-A-Flat seals 
small punctures and 

inflates tires to 25
lbs % 160

1 .1 7
Turtle Wax liqu id .

12 02 bottle » tb

^ 4 . 0 /  exch 
Reg 29 80 exch
W hite 's 36 month super battery
gives you fast, sure starts year after 
year Sizes to fit most cars 12 
volt (ft? 130 1 TV 18?
Free installation

feilSS

Your choice of sizes
Pickup too l and u tility  box has all

steel construction Sliding tray for extra 
convenience Waterproof locking lid. 

Sizes for both standard and compact 
pickups. io?5a?ftftI  U i  C / v /  ea

Window sunscreens in assorted designs 18 x
64 . 1 (310 13??

10.44
20'' x 22 window classic sun screen. M4 m

4 .9 9
Slip-on seat covers
of foam backed nylon. 
Solid or split back to fit 

most regular 2 or 4 
door cars. Red, 

brown, black or green.
S7-1OO-170

I  ■■■ 4 2 .9 9
3 pc chamois combination

includes a 2 sq ft chamois, 
scrub sponge & wash mitt »«i«

$37
Floor jack will hold up to 1 v* 

tons Roil about wheels 
45" heavy duty handle. iai40

Mo t o h  0l*>

Pennzoil motor o il.
20 or 30 wt 4« jo?. 304

* * £  T r r r
Fram o il filte rs in

sizes to fit most U S
cars 44 808 843



5.99
Tennis racket has tough 8 pty 

wood laminated frame 
construction with nylon strings 

Leather grip M «m«

2.57
Wilson tennis balls

Extra duty for long life 
and hard play Yellow 

wool & dacron 
cover M «44o

7.99
Tennis bag in men's and 

women s styles has a 
built-in racquet pocket and 
long zippered top Assorted 

colors 044S4S IS M

Charge it! Whites 
convenient credit plan 
Master Charge 
VISA (Bankamericard)

W hites h a s it I

46.88
CBC single barrel shotgun features button 

break action and automatic shell ejection 
Beavertail forend and pistol grip 

stock of Brazilian hardwood Box lock receiver 
Choose 12. 20 or 410 gauge model

13 411 000 SJO

139.88
WINCHESTER

Winchester model 1200 pump shotgun
in 12 or 20 gauge rustproof forged aluminum 

receiver and 28 " Wmchoke barrel Front 
locking bolt head Checkered walnut stock &

forend m  mo



36.77
Catalina stereo 

phonograph system
has a built in solid 

state amplifier and 2 
speakers Manual 

turntable with see-thru 
dust cover Sapphire 

Stylus < 23 fr? n

C A T A L IN A

$199
Catalina AM/FM/FM 

stereo component
system has a builtm  

8 track tape recorderf 
player plus a full size 
record changer with 
diamond stylus Two 
matching wide range 

speakers 8 track 
recorder has fast 

forward and pause 
Includes dust cover 

and two mikes 1230370

S y L V A N IA
$399

Sylvania 1 9 " diagonal 
measure color portable

TV has exclusive 
GT Matic color tuning 

and the exclusive 
Chromaltne picture 

tube 10 0 % solid state 
chassis Walnut grain 

finish cabinet with sturdy 
carrying handle 122 7020

S y L V A N I A
134.88

Sylvania 1 9 " diagonal 
84 W portable TV has

a 10 0 % solid state 
chassis Pulls n  crisp, 
sharp pictures even in 
fringe areas Memory 

VHF fine tuning Rugged 
beige plastic cabinet 
Telescoping antenna 

Sturdy carrying handle

Charge it! W hites 
conven ien t c red it p lan 
Master Charge 
VISA (B ankam erica rd )

Free delivery 
within W hites  
service area

16.77
Portable AM/ 
FM radio also

tunes m T V 
broadcasts 

Operates on 
battery 

(included) 
Compact size

S yLV A N IA

/  1 0 r n  A T T  TAT A

Sylvania 2 5 " diagonal measure color console combines Sylvania's 
dark life black matrix picture tube with the exclusive GT Matic II color tuning 

system for beautiful, natural colors 1 00% solid state circuitry Cabinet has 
handsome Mediterranean styling with a rich pecan grained finish 122 7000

$ 2 2 8
Catalina Mediterranean style stereo console. Features an A M /F M /F M  
stereo receiver with a built-in 8  track tape recorder/player with a full size 

record changer Complete unit is 42 ” long Includes 2 microphones,
diamond stylus and 45 adaptor. 123 MM

16.88
Catalina guitar with steel reinforced 
neck and steel strings Sunburst
finish. 1 <» 100

CATALINA

3 2 . 7 7
Catalina AM/FM digital dock radio 

has large easy to read numerals Wakes 
you to music or alarm 80 minute sleep 

timer. Walnut finish 120-0102

4
- I



69.88
9’ x 12’ rugs in your choice of colors Multi level 
sheared pattern in 100% nylon pile Serged on all 4
Sides ?38 1100 10 ?0 30 40 SO

Charge it! Whites convenient credit plan 
VISA (Bankamericard) Master Charge 
Free delivery within Whites trade area

Bassett
$388W w U  Sofa and chair

Early American styling by 
Bassett Features include 

attached pillow back, soft foam 
cushions and 100% Hercuk>n 

cover Solid wood trim in a golden 
pine finish ?3? 1010 io?o

Whites has It I
White's own Magic Sleep bedding is com fori 

designed Super supporting coil construction ir 
mattresses and foundations Quitted w itt 

polyester fiber and foam Fme bedding foi 
years of service

$268
Deluxe king size mattress and 

foundation. ??? t4oo
$198

Queen size mattress and 
foundation. 2 2 2 1410 

Your choice $78 
Full size mattress or foundation.

$ 8 8
Your choice
Fashionable sw ivel rockers.
Choose traditional design in 
luxurious royal gold velvet or Early 
American in rustic brick with 
reversible seat cushion »4 wo row.

727 1470 30
Your choice $68 

Twin size mattress or 
foundation. 22 2 1440 so

Your choice

59.88 each
Early American accent tables. Warm honey maple engraved finish 

and antiqued brass hardware Choose from square commode, 
hexagonal commode or cocktail table j m  *>03 mo*



brother $117
Brother free arm zig zag 

sewing machine with built-in 
true stretch stitch. Does 

everything without 
attachments! us 1060 

*17
Free arm sewing machine 

carrying case. 136 aoso

S199
Catalina super 18 lb 

capacity family dryer with 3 
temperature selections. 

Features large lint screen, 
safety door switch and end 

of cycle signal.
146 1310C A T A L IN A

s287
Catalina 15 cu ft chest freezer

features super insulating polyurethane 
foam cabinet Zero degree freezing 
with adjustable cold control 130 ssoo

s299
Catalina 18 lb family 

capacity automatic washer
with 8 cycle program. 2 

speeds. & 4  water 
temperature selections 

Cool down rinse White acrylic 
enamel finish 1*5 uoo

CATALINA t

Catalina 2 cu ft refrigerator with
freezer section Great for rec rooms, 

pool rooms, home bars, offices or 
dorms' 1 3d«aw

Eureka "P rin c e s s " canister
vacuum is compact, powerful & 

lightweight Deluxe attachments in 
handy lift out tool tray 1*0*19

KELVINATOR
$268

13 cu ft Kelvinator single 
door refrigerator has energy 

saving, space saving 
TRIMWALL foam construction 

Large 1 89 cu ft freezer 
Adjustable sliding shelves, 

door storage, egg rack, dairy 
keeper and kmg size slide-out 

crisper White acrylic finish

Charge it! 
Whites convenient 

credit plan 
Master Charge VISA 

(Bankamericard)
Free delivery 

w ith in  W hites 
service area

Whites h a s  I t  I

AT AI INA



15.97
5 pc cast alum inum  cookware set by Regal with 2 qt covered 
saucepan, 5 qt dutch oven with cover and 10" open fry pan Easy to 
clean "hard seal" cooking surfaces & cool Bakelite handles n «oo

12.97 *HAMILTON BEACH

Little  Mac cooks hamburgers or square sandwiches in minutes' Easy to 
clean Cover locks for spatter-free cooking'««

a 22.77
Catalina compact cassette
recorder with built-in condenser E 
mike Solid state Earphone 
included 1235300

7.99
AM/FM pocket radio. Telescoping 
antenna Earphone included p
120 2211

11.88
D igita l 24 hour alarm  c lock. M ; U

6.77
3 qt e lectric corn popper has
unique butter cup that dispenses 
melted butter evenly over popcorn 
Glass lid «• U3

5.97
Electric Insta-Pot quickly boils 
enough hot water for 2 to 5 servings 
of coffee, tea. bullion, etc *9?

7.77 g  3.77
20 pc dinnerware set. Complete B ig 16'^ oz. tum b le rs  made of
service for 4 includes 10" plates. break resistant, dishwasher safe
cups, saucers, bread butter plates acrylic plastic Set of 8 Gift 
& bowls Dishwasher safe Stain boxed Choose amber or green
resistant melamine T4 *oo w w ro r

W hites tins HJ

Ironing table is braced for extra 
sturdiness' Adjusts up to 36"
25 1 24

1.27
Ironing board pad & cover set.
22 509

9.88
G.E. steam or dry Iron with all 
fabric heat selector 59522

7.77



w a rn
10’ x 10' nominal size fu lly 

galvanized metal storage build ing
provides safe, weatherproof storage 

5 step hot dipped steel foundation 
system Lockable sliding door Interior 

dimensions 1 15 V  W x 1 1 1 3«"D x
75 V  H »s eo<

$249
10' x 14' nominal size metal 

bu ild ing  Interior dimensions 
1 16k. W x 1 54 V D  x 75J* H i  .

C harge it! W hites 
c o n v e n ie n t c re d it p lan  

M aster Charge 
VISA (B ankam erica rd ) 

Free delivery w ith in  
W hites trade  area

sale
price
less DuPont s 
cash back

$ 6 .8 8  £  

$ 1.00

Your cost
after DuPont s 
receiving cash back $5.88

C; l u o t s  f!  f  u ~ .u ^ * T L ~ » \l
\ Wall Paint J\|House P a r ty

sale
price
less DuPont s 
cash back

$8.88  5  
$ 1.00

Your cost
after DuPonts 
receiving cash back $7.88

* 1 1 .  .  11 .
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Dealer O pportun ity
W ant some Mrarght tacts about • great opportunity with 
White*'’ We car help you own yokm own thnvmg Whiles 
deAership Cal or v«rt the dealer who sent you this tabfcxl tor

W HITES APVERTISING POLICY
Our every in tention to  have a» adve rta ed  item s * i s tock and on 
our shelves M tor any unforeseen reason advertised item  
is not available W hites w i cheerfu lly  issue a RAIN CHECK on 
request to r the m erchandise at the sate p rice  when X becom es 
avaXable or W hites wA o tte r s com parable item  at a samdar 
reduction m price

1.33
Paint brush sal with 1 V*" 
and 4 " brushes with nylon 

bristles e t ro

99c
Pan & roller set with big 9 ’ 

roller and aluminum paint
pan s 20?

A uthorized Deafer S tores are independently ow ned and 
operated the re fo re  p rices and term s may vary A lso, due to  
Nmrted floo r space a* dealer operated stores may no t carry 
aM item s fea tu red  m th is tab lo id

SUPPLEMENT TO:
THE MULESHOE JOURNAL 
THE F RI ONA STA R 
THE P QRT AL E S  NEWS TRIBUNE

Home O wned l< O perated

*>y
David Edds 

1720 Tnplett 
Ownenaboro. Ky. 42301

HOME OWNED & OPERATED BY

Frank A M arlin Poynor 
4?0 S Avenue C 

Pot tales New M exico
L im its  do  not apply in N M

POYNOR'S WHITE STORES
located in

Portales. N M , C lovis. N M.. 
Muleshoe. T X ., L itt le f ie ld . TX  . 

H e rfo rd . TX  , F riona. TX

*4*. M l  a 4r*«£.4MM


