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IF THE YEAR 1981 passes as quickly 
as the year of 1980, then the next time 
we write our column, it may be dated 
1982, or at least well into 1981.

Everyone you talk to about the 
subject says the same thing: The year 
1980 just flew by, and was gone 
before they knew it. We might be 
mistaken, but this doesn't seem to be 
connected with the old theory that as 
you get older, the years pass by more 
quickly.

An article we read on the subject 
this week called the phenomenon “ a 
world wide conspiracy, probably 
Com munist-inspired, to shorten 
years.”

Associated Press writer Jo Haring 
even came up with the theory that the 
year 1980 never existed at all.

"Had a full 12 months elapsed 
since 1979, surely we could expect 
that our household mortgage 
principal to have dwindled, or to have 
made a dent in (he amount owed on 
our cars,” the Haring article said.

"A woman in Minneapolis insisted 
that 1980 could not have come and 
gone, since her husband had 
promised faithfully that he would get 
the house painted and the garage 
cleaned out during that year," it 
continued.

"A  number of other people 
observed that had 1980 actually 
happened they would now be at least 
30 pounds lighter, fluent in 
conversational French, capable of 
running the Boston marathon or 
debt-free, and considerably richer, 
depending on their personal 1980 
resolutions.

"Several people cited the fact that 
not only did they still have 1979 
Christmas lights up, but they are also 
still paying 1979 Christmas bills and 
getting 1979 Christmas cards in the 
mail.

"A significant number of people 
refused to believe that they had aged 
a year. And a woman in Pasadena 
insisted that she had not aged a day 
since 1957,"

So, if you had the feeling that the 
year 1980 just "swooshed right by," 
then apparently you are not by
yourself.

(H R FAVORITE FOOTBALL team 
did it again this past Sunday. Yep, the 
Dallas Cowboys looked like the 
miracle-workers of old as they came 
from behind for the playoff win at 
Atlanta

We’ll have to admit that more than 
once while watching the game we 
were ready to give up on the Cowboys 
and their chances of winning We had 
already decided that at least it would 
be nice that some new blood (Atlanta) 
might make it down the path to the 
Super Bowl.

But, lo and behold, here came the 
Cowboys with one of their patented 
finishes, to snatch victory from the 
jaws of defeat. In the process, they 
must ha.e left behind a bunch of 
shocked Atlanta Falcons and their 
fans.

This Dallas team has already 
achieved much more than its coaches, 
and the experts figured that they 
would With Roger Staubach, the old 
reliable field general retired, and with 
the Cowboys’ secondary in the hands 
of unproven players, it was figured 
that Dallas would be in a rebuilding 
year.

But the team surprised the experts 
and lied for the best record in their 
conference, missing the divisional 
title only by the complicated tie­
breaker system And such players as 
Danny White, the new quarterback, 
have stepped in to assume their places 
on the new Cowboy team.

If the team can get past 
Philadelphia this Sunday, they will 
find themselves in the Super Bowl for 
a record sixth time

And you'll have to admit: that isn't 
too bad for a ' ‘building year "

Cotton Count:
59,119

Bales of cotton had been ginned In 
farmer ( ounly ns of Thursday, 
Januarv I, 1981
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History Project

SWORN IN....County officials 
who were elected or re-elected 
during 1980 were sworn in 
during ceremonies at the Court 
House last Friday. County

Clerk Bonnie Warren is 
administering the oaths to (left 
to right) Judge Farter Roberts, 
County A ttorney Johnny 
Actkinson, Tax Assessor Hugh

Moseley, JP Albert Smith, 
Commissioners Archie Tarter 
and Ernest Anthony, and 
Sheriff Hill Morgan.

Wednesday Deadline 
For Chamber Tickets

The Parmer County Historical 
Commission has started back to work 
on the*History Book Project, after 
thE forced recess due to the death of 
Otho W hitefield, chairm an on 
November 7.

The group met with the County 
Commissioners and Judge Porter 
Roberts on December 8 to acquaint 
them of the progress.

The commissioners and judge went 
on record as favoring the book 
project and strongly urge all county 
citizens who have not written their 
personal family history to do so 
immediately. They agree with author 
Evets Haley that written local history 
is invaluable to our future 
generations and for the preservation 
of our past and present way of life 
and accomplishments.

“ We arc now stressing memorials 
to our deceased loved one and 
tributes to honor our Living Special 
Ones. Ask for prices on these pages 
There is no better way to hand down 
your respect and love to our 
grandchildren of the future than 
through these pages,”  says Grace 
Whitefield, co-chairman of the book 
project.

“ We are also stressing business 
history of the whole county. These 
record the progress and growth of our 
county since its beginning,” Mrs. 
Whitefield adds.

Anyone who has memories of past 
events and conditions that pertain to 
general community aad county 
history are urged to write! hem down 
and send to Parmer C o J 'y  History 
Book, P.O. Box 577, Fri»na, Texas 
79035.

"We want our book to include 
county progress in all phases of life.

First Baby 
Honors For 
Bovinian

The first baby born at Parmer 
County Community Hospital for 
1980 was Miss Sabrina Gonzales. She 
is the daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Jesse 
Gonzales of 200-9th Street, Bovina.

Sabrina was born at 3:39 p.m. 
Saturday, January 3. She has two 
older brothers and two older sisters. 
They are Edward, 17, Jesse, Jr., 15, 
Sandra Ann, 14, and Gena, 12.

Grandparents of the new baby are 
Ben Martinez of Clovis and Ramona 
Jiminez of Farwell, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Thomas Gonzales of Plainview.

Mrs Gonzales said that her oldest 
daughter, Sandra, was born on July 
4th, and that she has a sister who was 
born on Easter, so that “ special" 
births are not a rarity in their family.

F I R ST  BABY. . . . S a b r i n a  
Gonzales was the first baby 
born at Parmer County  
Community Hospital for 1981.

Ticket prices are $10 for tickets 
purchased in advance. Tickets at the 
door will cost SI2.50. Poor Boy’s 
Steak house of Clovis will cater the
banquet.

Speaker for the banquet will be Gil 
Stricklin, a humorist-motivational 
speaker and veteran of some 800 
banquets and conventions.

Stricklin is a native Texan, born in 
Grayson County. He has served as 
Associate for Direct Evangelism and 
Chaplain Ministerics for the Baptist 
General Convention of Texas, from 
1970 to the present.

Stricklin has spoken on three 
continents in 37 countries since he 
began his public speaking ministry in 
1953. He has been heard by more 
than 4,000 audiences.

He holds BA degrees from Baylor 
and Texas Christian University; as 
well as a BD from the Southwestern 
Baptist Theological Seminary.

An ordained minister, Stricklin has 
spoken in a number of prestigious 
pulpits, including the Melbourne 
Anglican Cathedral, Duke Street 
Church, London; Calvary Baptist 
Church, New York; and the First 
Baptist Church, Dallas

Stricklin also has contributed 
scores of articles to various 
publications on a variety of subjects. 
He was named the outstanding 
journalism graduate from TCU in 
1963

• A highlight of the annual banquet 
will be the naming of Friona's 
outstanding citizens for 1980

City Feather 
Entry Cops 
County Title

Winner of the Friona area 
“ Longest Tailfeather" contest during 
the pheasant season was Davis 
Bennett, whose winning entry 
measured 26-1/8 inch.

E l Fairchild and Lester W illiams 
tied for second and third in the local 
contest, each with entries measuring 
25 lA inches.

The Friona entry will apparently be 
the county champion for 1980, as 
Bovina's winner, by Dennis Willard, 
measured 24 V« inches, and Farwell's 
winner, Donald Lovelady, had a 25- 
3/8 inch feather

The contest is sponsored by the 
Parmer County Game Management 
Assn Top three entries in each 
community receive prizes of SI5, SI0 
and $5, and the county champion 
receives a plaque.

past and present. We also invite all 
interested persons to become active 
members in the Parmer County 
Historical Commission. Yearly dues 
are only $5.00 per person,” Mrs. 
Whitefield concluded.

Ex-Student 
Banquet Is
Big Success

A total of 664 people attended the 
Ex-Students Banquet held December 
27, 1980 at the Friona Community 
Center.

Former Friona High School 
students and teachers from all parts 
of the country, and even from outside 
the country, attended the banquet.

Clyde Goodwine, a member of the 
1916 graduating class at FHS, was 
honored as the oldest Friona 
graduate. J.T. Gee, who taught in the 
local school system for 41 years, was 
honored as the teacher with longest 
tenure.

Mary Ann Boggess, who lives in 
Belize, Central America, 2300 miles 
away, was the graduate coming the 
farthest for the reunion.

Former members of the 
Trebelaires, under the direction of 
Eva Miller, sang a medley of songs 
for the group.

Members of the ex-Trebs were 
Sherri Taylor, Jerre Benge, Lisa 
Edelmon, Sandy Awtrey, Phila May 
Weatherly, Lilah Gay Vars, Carolyn 
Wiseman, Jere Smith, Karen Blake, 
Carol Bavousett, LaVon Reeve, 
Laura Ellis, Sharon White, Sharia 
Benge, Karen Renner, Holly White 
and Tracy Horton.

Ted White served as master of 
ceremonies.

Elected to head the ex-student 
organization was Bessie Holt.

The group voted to hold a similar 
banquet and reunion during 1985

School Sets 
Dismissal

The Friona Schools will dismiss 
one hour early, at 2:45 p.m. on 
Wednesday and Thursday, January 
14 and 15 it was announced this week

There will be no school for students 
on Friday, January 16, which will be 
an in-service day for teachers.

Buses will run their regular route 
on Wednesday and Thursday, only 
one hour earlier for the afternoon 
run.

Regular classes will resume on 
Monday, January 20. The change of 
schedule is due to semester tests.

The time is rapidly approaching for 
the annual banquet for the Friona 
Chamber of Commerce and 
Agriculture.

The banquet date is Saturday, 
January 17 Deadline for purchasing 
advance tickets will be 5 p.m 
Wednesday, January 14.

County Purchases CDs

Area Gets 
Rain Shower

The first measurable moisture in 
several weeks was recorded in Friona 
on Thursday, although it fell 
considerably short of breaking the 
drought.

A total of .12 inch of rain fell, 
mostly during (he morning hours, as 
a light shower.

Farmers with wheat crops are 
hoping that the shower may start a 
trend, as moisture is badly needed for 
the winter wheat.

Temperatures stayed on the mild
side for the first week of 1981 

• 6 • 6

Temperatures
Dale Hi-low
Saturday, Januarv 3 62-31
Sunday, January 4 54-29
Monday, January 9 63-32
Tuesday, January 6 56-31
Wednesday, January 7 51-23
Thursday, January 8 58-26
Friday, January 9 45-28

MoMure: .12 or Januarv 9.

Her mother, Mrs. Jesse 
Gonzales holds her newborn, 
who was not particularly  
impressed by the occasion.

Parmer County Commissioners 
voteu to purchase certificate of 
deposits totalling $216,000, using tax 
money which was collected as of 
December 22.

County treasurer Benna Felts 
suggested that the bulk of this money 
would not be needed for awhile, and 
since tax money is coming in, that a 
total of $116,000 of Right of Way 
funds and $100,000 in general funds 
be invested in three-month CDs, 
which will mature on March 31, 1981.

A bid was accepted from Deckard 
Equipment Company, Amarillo, on 
supplying a trailer which had been 
advertised for Precinct 1. Deckard’s 
bid was $4,799.

A change in the method of paying 
for meals for prisoners in the county 
jail was approved. For years, the 
sheriff has received an allowance for 
each jail meal served Under the new 
setup, the county will buy the jail 
groceries on open account.

Judge Roberts read the court a 
letter telling of the clothing needs of 
two Parmer County foster children. 
A motion was passed to send $100 for 
use to buy clothing for the children.

Judge Roberts had been contacted 
about the possibility of the county 
purchasing radio crystals for the 
game warden for car to car contact 
with the New Mexico warden This 
item was tabled pending receipt of 
further information.

Approval was granted of boarding 
expenses in the amount of $180 for 
one of the county foster children

Susan Johnson appeared before the 
court expressing concern about the 
MX Missile system, and asking that a 
hearing be proposed for Parmer 
County, in order to clarify parts of 
the proposed system The hearing is 
to be requested.

Soil Conservation expenditures 
were approved for Richard 
Engelking, $37.50; Bobby Calloway, 
$37.50; Harry Sheets, $25; and 
Harold Jones, $25.

Members of the court attended the 
open house at the County Extension 
office, where Christmas goodies were 
served to all attending.

Seth Ralston reported that the 4 H 
barrows are ready for the stock 
shows, which will begin soon. 
Ralston said that 30 barrows from 
Parmer County are entered in the 
Denver Stock Show January 15

To Be Resumed

•  • v



r
PAGE 2, THE KRIONA STAR. SUNDAY. JANUARY 11,1981

50 YEARS AGO—JAN. 0, 1V31
'V M. Lee, formerly of Hereford, 

has purchased the Marvelettc Theatre 
from H.B. Eberling, former owner 
and announces that he will give the 
people of this area a worthwhile 
picture show as soon as he can install 
the proper equipment

• • • •
45 YEARS AGO-JAV 10. 1036
Almost every day (if it isn’t too 

cold to be out) 1 hear someone asking 
‘ Who is going to pay the taxes to 
repay all the money Uncle Sam has 
borrowed?” 1, of course, do not 
know , but it just occurs to me that a 
normal amount of reflection linked 
with experience will answer the 
question by saying that we, of this 
present generation and the several 
succeeding generations yet unborn 
will pay the debt through 
multitudious and ever increasing 
taxes.-J W W hite’s column.

consisting of Mayor Glenn Reeve and 
commissioners F.L. Spring and C arl 
Maurer, have changed the method of 
administering the city's business 
affairs by employing a city manager 
rather than having the city 
commission look after the details of 
the city’s business W right Williams, 
who recently received his discharge 
from the Armed Service, has been 
appointed to the position.

concern by school and health officials 
in the county this week. The disease 
hit Plainview in epidemic proportions 
the week before Christmas, and 
communities throughout the area 
have kept an uneasy check on the 
situation.

• • • •

• • • •
30 YEARS VGO--J.AN. II, 1951
Friona residents were excited 

Monday at a report which was 
circulated that one of the FBI’s most 
wanted men was seen in Friona 
driving a car with a Florida license 
plate The excitement built even more 
by a report by an Amarillo radio 
station that clues were being checked 
out in Friona. The rumors apparently 
were unfounded

15 YEARS AGO—JAN. 13. 1066
Open house for the new million- 

dollar Friona High School will be 
held Sunday afternoon between the 
hours of 2 and 5 p.m. The new 
complex, completed this fall, was 
part of a $1,250,000 bond issue 
passed by local voters in April of 
1%4.

• • • •

• • • •
• • • •

40 YEARS AGO—JAN. 10. 1941
The filling station on Main Street, 

known as “ Brookie’s Filling 
Station,” which was badly damaged 
by fire a few weeks ago. has been 
repaired and considerably 
enlarged, and is again open for 
business.' Wilbur Brookfield is in
charge of the business.

• • • •
35 YEARS AGO—JAN. 4. 1046

The Friona City Commission,

25 YEARS AGO-JAV 13. 1«#56
In a move to increase valuation of 

the Friona School District from its 
present $8,700,000 to $13,000,000. 
the school board recently voted to 
engage the services of an appraising 
firm from Stamford Only rural 
lands will be affected, as city property
was re-evaluated in 1948.

• • • •
20 Y EARS AGO—JAN. 6. I%1

Diphtheria cases reported as near 
as Dimmitt were being viewed with

J
\

WE TAILOR 
INSURANCE 

TO YOUR NEEDS . . .
As INWPENDfNT INSURANCE AGENTS we cor 
pick the best plan for your needs horn those 
offered by several insurance compomes You 
know you re getting the most tor your money 
from our AGENCY — coll us todoy!

E ih r i f e -S p r lw r
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10 YEARS AGO-JAV 14, 1971
They do things big in Texas. Like 

flying to Australia for a wedding. 
Miss Brenda Hawker’s Texas 
“ parents,"  Mr. and Mrs. E.G. 
Phipps, of Friona, arrived in 
Melbourne yesterday for her 
wedding Brenda, 24, of Kaniva, near 
Nhill, 240 miles west of Melbourne 
will be married at Wesley Church on 
Saturday. Mr. Phipps will give 
Brenda away. Her father died last 
year. In 1964, Brenda stayed with the 
Phipps family for a year as an 
American Field Service scholar.

t • • •
5 Y EARS AGO-JAV 11. 1976

The Friona area lost a pioneer 
citizen and businessman on December 
21, when Oscar F. (Os) Lange passed 
away in Houston after being ill for 
approximately two months. Services 
for Lange, longtime civic leader and 
manager of Friona's Rockwell 
Brothers Lumber outlet, were held 
Tuesday. December 23

T he  F rio n a  ★ S tar
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Friona. Texas 79035 
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Church Chuckles  bv CARTWRIGHT ♦

Welcome To 
Friona Churches

A
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♦ These Sponsors W elcome You
To Friona \  Churches

♦
♦
♦
I

Reeve Chevy-Olds
keep That (.real (.VI Feeling W ith 

Genuine GM Parts

Rockwell Bros.
Of Friona

♦ 
* 
♦

♦ 
♦ Friona State Bank

M apper to know O nward C hris tian  S o ld ie r* '? ’

• Horn-ClaytonIns.

< Friona Ford Sales

Ethridge-Spring
FIRST 1APT1S1

sixth A Summitl-Rev ( arrol Green

C ALVARY BAPTIST

T  UNITED PENTECOSTAL CHURCH
5th A Ashland-

I14th A < Ir»rland Murlr Rogers. Pastor .

TEMPI O BAUTISTA
4th A Woodland-

---- - 4 -
ST. ESTHER S BAPTIST CHURCH

5th A Main-Rev. |.s . Ansley. Pastor
♦

6th ST. IGLESIA de CRISTO
408 w sm h

6th ST. CHURCH OF CHRIST
502 W. Sixth- II I) Simmons, Jr.

10th ST. CHURCH OF CHRIST
10th A Euclid-

FRIONA UNITED METHODIST
CHURCH i

8rh A Pterce-Re». Archie Eeboto

FIRST ASSEMBLY OF GOD
10th A Ashland- 

Mrx. Frank Norred, Pastor

REDEEMER LUTHERAN CHURCH1 Jth A Virginia-11 am. 
i Reuben Haase, Pastor

TEMPLO “ MARANATHA” 
SPANISH ASSEMBLY OF GOD

301 Grand-Rafael Rodrigue/

UNION CONGREGATIONAL CHURCH
i Euclid At 16th-Rev Skip Sirnie

ST. TERESA’S CATHOLIC CHURCH
I6th A ( lev eland

Ronald Mc< overa, S.A. Administrator
r  IMMANUEL LUTHERAN CHURCH
i Rheu ( ommunity-9a.m. 
f Reuben Haase. Pastor Attend Church Regularly!

Services Held For 
Orville Houser

Funeral services for Orville 
Houser, 73, were held Wednesday, 
December 31, at 3 p.m. in the Sixth 
Street Church pf Christ with H.D. 
Simmons, officiating.

Burial was in Friona Cemetery 
under the direction of Parsons-Ellis 
Funeral Home.

Born December 18, 1907 in Collins 
County, Texas, Mr. Houser was 
married to Oleta Hartman January 7, 
1934 in Clovis, New Mexico.

He moved to Friona in 1946 and he 
and his brother, J.V. “ Cotton” 
Houser established Houser Grocery. 
He was a retired grocer, a member of 
the Sixth Street Church of Christ, 
and served in the Navy during WW11.

Houser died Monday, December 
29, in Desert Samaritan Hospital, 
Mesa, Arizona.

Survivors arc his wife Oleta of the 
home; his mother, Mrs. P.M Houser 
of Friona; two brothers, J.V. 
“ Cotton" Houser and Marc Houser,

ORVILLE HOUSER

both of Friona and one sister, Mrs. 
Ann Carroll of Dumas.

Pallbearers were Eugene Boggess, 
Rene Snead, David Carson, John 
Hays, Wendell Gresham and Burke 
Hand.

Rites Held In City 
For L.P. Davis

Funeral services for L.P. (Buster) 
Davis, 76, were held at 10:30 a.m. 
Saturday, January 3, 1981 in the First 
Baptist Church of Friona with Rev. 
Russell Pogue, pastor of the First 
Baptist Church of Spearman, and 
Rev. Carrol Green, pastor, 
officiating.

Graveside services were held at 4 
p.m. in the Lamesa Cemetery under 
the direction of Parsons-Ellis Funeral 
Home.

Born December 19, 1904 in 
Haskell, Texas, he was married to 
Nell Senter on December 19, 1925 in 
Lamesa. Davis moved to Friona in 
March of 1947 and was a retired 
farmer. He was a member of the First 
Baptist Church. Davis died 
Thursday, January 1, 1981 in Parmer 
County Community Hospital.

Survivors include his wife, Nell, of 
the home; one son. Bob Davis of

BUSTER DAVIS
Amarillo; two sisters, Mrs. Esther 
Smith of Lamesa and Mrs. Winnie 
Evans of Artesia, New Mexico, and 
four grandchildren.

Pallbearys were Jerry Cass, Dale 
Houlette, j  Frankie Allen, Jarrell 
Wright, JRck Moseley and Jimmy 
Maynard. I

BF.RTIE DOAK

Bertie Doak 
Rites Field

Funeral services for Bertie Pauline 
Doak, 86, were held Wednesday, 
December 31, at the First United 
Methodist Church in Friona, with 
Rev. Herschel L. Thurston and Rev. 
Murle Rogers officiating.

Burial was in Friona Cemetery, 
under the direction of Parsons-Ellis 
Funeral Home.

She was born June 10, 1894 in 
Waco, Texas and had lived in Parmer 
County since 1928

Mrs. Doak died December 29, at 12 
p.m. at Parmer County Community 
Hospital.

Pallbearers were Billy John Thorn, 
Ernest Anthony, Raymond Euler, 
Jerry Cass, Kenyth Cass and Jackie 
Stowers.

Survivors include two sisters, Mrs. 
Evelyn W'endt and Mrs. Lucille 
Collier, both of Friona; one brother, 
Clarence Ragan of Clarendon, Texas; 
two granddaughters; five great­
grandchildren; and two great-great­
grandchildren.

School Lunch 
Menu

W EEK OF JANUARY 12-15
MONDAY-Steak, carrots, green 

beans, hot rolls, cake and milk.
T U E SI) A Y - • S o u p , c h i l i ,

sandwiches, mixed vegetables, light 
bread, crackers, fruit and milk.

WEDNESDAY-Frito pie, pinto 
beans, mixed greens, cornbread, 
cookies and milk.

T H l'R S D A Y -H am , potatoes, 
peas, hot rolls, cake and milk.

FRIDAY-No school.

THEY'RE HERE!!

Interest -  Bearing 

Checking

Accounts.

CHECKING 
FRIONA STATE BANK S 

NEWEST
CHECKING PROGRAM

Ask Us For Details

Friona State Ba n k

L
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SHURFRESH QUALITY MEAT

Franks _____ ft
SHURFRESH QUALITY SLI MEAT

Bologna »
GLOVER S MEXICAN STYLE

Hot Links L
HORMEL LI L SIZZLERSpork link

Sausage
SHURFRESH

Meats
S H U R F R F S H  * * * * *  th in  s l ic io  s m o k id  o n u n rn c ^ n  voupcmoicf

cok\ m,d'.m . O  2Vj 3 OZ
C t" mv L  PKGS

COUNTRY PRIDE 
USDA GRADE A

Fryers
CERTIFIED

FINEST
QUALITY

SWIFT SSIZZLEAN
HAMM THAN BACON

Breakfast 
Strips 1

IM A  GRAM A
CERTIFIER FINEST OVALITY FRYERS

CUT UP WHOLE FRYERS

Pan Ready LB 7 5 *
SPLIT FRYER

Breasts LB
$  |  2 9

FRYER

Thighs LB
$  1 0 9

FRYER

Drumsticks LB
$ 1 0 9

KITCHEN TESTED FLOUR

Gold 
Medal

__ . ALL GRINDS COFFEE

' g a s * - '
N A B I S C O

Ritz

SHURFINE WHOLE
P f i l tO  IRISH

P o t a t o e s

HUNGRY JACK ASSORTE

Biscuits
KRAFT HLFMN COLBY

5 CT 
CANS

Cheddar Cheese PKG

$ 1 0 0

KRAFT

Velveeta

' J j  SCT $  1
W  CANS I

_ - e o z S j 3 9

$ 1 6 9

16 OZ 
CANS

POWEDERED CLEANSER
OFT

C o m e t
* O c14 OZ - %  W  

CAN 0 9  M

★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★

C A T A L I N A  , 1 0 0 0  I S L A N D  / % g\<
Dressing 6 9
KTAFT REAL A N J N

Mayonnaise 'jar 9 9
MARGARINE QUARTERS

Parkay

KRAFT DINNER

Macaroni 
& Cheese V h  O Z  

BOXES

ivoSL
9* OFF LABEL

I v o r y
S o a p

79*
m

20‘ OFF LABEL

Bix
$ 1 4 9

15‘ OFF LABEL

D o w n y  
L i q u i a  

$ 1 1 9

SHELF SPECIALS
mm H  £  AMERICAN BEAUTY

Spray Starch 150z. 7 5  Elbo-Roni
SUNSHINE

Fig Bars 8 9 *
DEL MONTE pineapple grapefruit

Fruit Drink I an

5 5

7 9

MARINA

S H U R F I N E

Grape Jam 59
HEALTH ft BEAUTY AIDS

Aqitv

aff»

CREME RINSE
ANOCONOlTlONfR ASSORT! O

A g r e e
$ 1 7 9

SHAM POO ASSORTED

'c A g r e e
$ 1 9 9

12 OZ I
BTL ■

f t l l TOOTHPASTE

IT 1 1 1 1 A t

1

SUNNYFRESH FARMS 
GRADE A

Jumbo Eggs
89cD O Z E N

Bathroom
Tissue 4 ROLL 

PKG.

Q§zm :
chggs-< X - v «

LOCALLY P t O O U C E D

WASHINGTON 
GOLDEN OR 

FANCY RED DELICIOUS

A p p l

PRODUCE SPECIALS
CALIFORNIA SUNKIST

Oranges
CALIFORNIA GREEN SKIN

Avocados
TEXAS GREEN

Cabbage

3

5

$100

1

COLORADO YELLOW

OnionsSWEET

LBS 1

$ 1 0 0
FOR

b 1 5 c
$ 1 0 0

LBS |

P R I C E S  G O O D  W E E K  O F  J A N U A R Y  1 0 1 6 .

VENTURE FOODS
902 M AIN S T R EET  FR IO N A , T EX A S
P H .2 4 7-3 3 4 3  O P E N 8 A .M .- 9 P .M . 

SATURDAY C LO S ED  SU N D AYSM O N D AY

DOUBLE GUNN BROS. STAMP DAYS
You Can Get Double Stamps on Tuesday &  Wednesday With A Purchase O f *2*° Or More
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PH . 247-2211
Reader Adv-Firvl insertion. per word................15 cents
Additional insertions (no cops change, per word)
............................................................................... 12 cents
Minimum ( (urge..................................................... $2.IK)
Classified display (boxed ads-10 pt. type under a 
specific heading, 1 column width oniv--no art or cuts. 
Per column inch........................................................ $2.00

Card of l hanks-same as classified word rale. 15 cents 
per word, minimum charge ....................................$2 00

DEADLINE for classified advertising in Sunday's issue- 
•Thursdav noon.

(  heck advertisement and report anv error immediately; 
I he Star is not responsible for error after ad has already 
run once.

PRO SI RVICT

SPECIALIZING IN FARM AUCTIONS
tor Anv Type Of Auction Or tree Appraisal 

(  all l)».
LARRY POTTS LELANDGUSTIN 
PH 295-6633 PH 247-2146
Mobile Phone: 265-3665 Mobile Phone: 265 3648 
Rt. 2. Box % Friona, Texas 76035

Khvmic Aerobic Classes 
January 12-February 20

Monday and Thursday 
Morning Classes 9:30-10:30 
t vening Classes 5:30-6:30 

6 week session $20.00 
Class limited to 20 students each 

To enroll call:
Susan Marnell Sylvia Ingram
289-5808 247-2010

Certified instructors 14-1 tc

$ $ (ASH $$
For sterling and 

10k 12k I4k-16k-18k 
Cold, Pre-1964 

Dimes, quarters, halves- 
Pre-1931 silver dollar 

806-364-6617

7-tfnc

WOMAN’S MORI I) 
BOUTIQUE 

features attractive 
women's clothing sizes 4- 
12 and I2G-50. Ilorcelle 
leather purses. Nnoopv 
dolls, karen's musical 
downs. I mated at 1005 
Park Plaia in Hereford. 
Call (806) 364-1350.

35-tfnc

We want to thank all of 
our friends and neighbors for 
all the flowers, food, cards 
and prayers.

Family of Bertie Doak 
14-1 tp

We would like to thank 
everyone for the cards, calls, 
flowers, food and prayers A 
special thank you to Dr l ee 
Spring and the nurses at the 
hospital during the illness 
and loss of our loved one. 
Buster Davis.

Nell Davis 
Bob Davis and Family 

14-ltp

O T S ii.ver
Paying Top Prices 
For Class Rings.
W edding Bands. 

Sterling Silver 
Jewelry, Coins 

Panhandle (.old A 
Silver Exchange

, w ^ ; ’ | ■ i 11nv
...........♦ ♦♦»♦»■» +

triona I odge No. 1332 
7th A Ashland 
Mated Meeting 

1st l ues. 8 p.m. 
W V  Buchanan-W .M. 

A.L. Outland--Sec.

KIRBY SALES 
& SERVICE
( ARI V illllt  
Phone 247-36III 

Of 247-3271

MONt \  lO L tN I) 
Refinancing

fa rm ..... Commercial
Residential 
CaU Or Sec 

il)av or Nighti 
• s l t \ t  II HANOI St I 

Phone 24' W»(M) 
triona. Texas

El ft  f ROI 1 \
A acuum ( leaners 

Sales A service. Phone 
247-3156 Mrs. I R  
While. 806 Ashland Avc.

44-ttnc

\ n m  a i > Ht if rt
By harlene Jordan
(all 247-2fJ7

2-lfnc

L.D.
Have A 
Happy 

Birthday!

tOR sAI E....I976 Monza 
Good condition, gets good 
gas mileage Phone 247- 
2106 35-tfnc

tO R  S A L E . . . .P ic k u p  
topper, good condition 
White fiberglass, with boot 
and lock on back. $400 Ph 
247-3566 14-tfnc

$ our 
RADIO SH ACk 
Dealer In triona 
Is W hile's Auto 

West Highwav r»0 
We Have( R Radios 

44-tfnc

tOR SALE....1972 l incoln 
Continental. In good 
condition Call Glen Stevick.
24"'-2858 I42tc

The family of Orville 
Houser is deeply grateful for 
the many acts of kindness 
shown us since his death The 
beautiful flowers, food, 
visits and words of kindness 
will always be remembered

Mrs Oleta Houser 
Mrs. Ada Houser 
Sirs. Ann Carroll 

Mr and Mrs J V Houser 
Mr and Mrs Marc Houser 

14-ltp

We Are Now The 
Authorized Dealers In 

t riona t or:
Ml( III I IN 1IRES 
I he I irst sieel-Belted 

lire"’
W hile's Auto 

West Highwav 60
( all 247-3977

TORGINAL
Gemini Seamless Floors and VA alls 

Bathroom and kitchen Remodelling 
Shower Stalls

•Free Estimates ‘ Guaranteed 
Raul Briones 

Phone 364-0419 t Nights) 
Phone 364-1272 (Days) 11 4tc

i
i
i
I
I
I
i

i
i

I
i

!
J
I

l
I
L

Stagner-Orsborn

Buick-Pontiac-GMC
}0 n t H S  I* HEREFORD

See Us And SAVE
142 RULES 4VE.HEREFORD TEXAS 

RHODE364-0990

K H P  TH U  
GRi AT (A ll  H U M .

WITH GIM  INI GVI PARTS

GM QUAUTY
SOMCf WU7TS

GENIBA1 MOTORS PARTS DTVTSWN

MckIBHf N ROOFING 
Roofing of all types, 
fence building. All work 
guaranteed. 17 years 
experience. Call 364-6578 
or 364-8095

28-tfnc

FOR RENT....Office space 
with utilities paid. See at 208 
East 11th. Call 247-2743 or 
nights, 247-3 398 6-lfnc

AIRLINES (REALESTATE

FOR SA IF  ...RCA tele
vision set. Color console 
model on swivel base Phone 
247-2769 from 9-5 or 24’ - 
3865 after 5 12-tfnc

tOR sA l.t.....Good maize
stubble SI 25 per bale 
Phone 247-3236 14-tfnc

FOR SALE....Maize stalk 
hay. Round hales. Call 247- 
3589 or 295 3657. I |-tfnc

K I R  s A I  t
can double as a bed Nancy 
Ray. call 247-3407. 247-3850 
or 247-3872. 14-tfnc

t O K  s At f
Prowl. Atra/ene, etc Save at 
W a tso n  C h e m ic a l ,  
Muleshoe Phone 272-47J7.

14-tfnc

H»K s \ l t  Vinyl COUCh. 
Excellent condition Call 
247-2257 after 5 p.m 14- He

FOR SALE....7 ft artificial 
green. Christmas tree Real 
pretty. Good condition. Call 
247-3848 14 21C

p  latS E T
tor cleaner brighter carpel 
call for Steri Steam. 

 ̂ Thomas Carpet ( leaning, 
* 238-1640
f 30-tfnc

STRAYED
From farm near Golf 
Course 4001b. heifer. Brand 

’ left shoulder. E G. 
Phipps. 24‘,-3888. 4 tine

LOST....Red, white, and 
blue rail fence patterned 
quilt 1 would really like to 
have it back Please call 
Marca L Herring, 247-3848

)4-2tc

1 o s  | __ W hue. hr.
spotted female short-haired 
pointer, bobbed tail Gone 
since first Monday of 
pheasant season. Last seen I-
2 miles east of our house, 
which is 8 miles west on 
1731. She is more important 
as a family pet than hunting 
dog. so please return or call 
with information: Danny 
Murphree, 295-6672 Reward 
offered, no questions asked.

14-2tc

I OsT...L onghaired Cocker- 
Poo, five months, apricot 
color. Answers to name of 
Prissy. Child's pet Reward 
offered Phone 247-3514 
after 4 p.m 14-tfnc

K) GIVI AW AY....Real 
cute blonde female puppy. 
Call 247-3848 l4-2tc

TO GIVE AW AY....Three 
puppies, '/i Australian 
Shepard, Vj St. Bernard. 
Also one female full 
Australian Shepard, k/2 
years old. Call 265-3840

14-ltc

Major airlines are now 
accepting applications for 
the following opportunities: 

FT IGHT ATTENDANTS 
K AMP A BAGG AGl 

PI KSONNEL 
TICKET AGI NTS 

RESERVATIONS AGENTS 
CLERK AI POSITIONS 
CUSTOMER SERVICE 

FOODSERVICE 
AIRCRAFT CLEANING 

B< >okkl I PING 
AIRCRAFT MAINTENANCE 
Individuals interested in 
applying with these airlines 
companies must be career 
oriented, have a public 
relations personality, be 
willing to travel if required, 
and be in good health. Major 
airlines will provide training 
for many of the positions 
listed above. For further 
inform ation on how to 
immediately apply directly 
with these major airlines 
companies, write to:

Travelex, Inc.
ATTEN:

Airlines Application 
Information

3865 South W asatch Blvd.
Suite 101

Salt Lake City, Utah 84109 
Please indicate briefly your 
background, what airlines 
position(s) you are interested 
in applying for and enclose a 
stam ped, self-addressed, 
letter size, envelope so that 
you may receive further 
information as to what steps 
to take so that possible 
interviews might be arranged 
by these airlines. All major 
airlines companies are 
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY 
1MPIOYLRS 14-2tc

HEI P W ANTED....Socre 
tarial-bookkceper opening at 
PACO Feed Yard. Please 
call for appointment, 265- 

14-lie

4(H) acifs, 2 small wells. $350 acre, 1/2 mineral, wilh
possession now.

173 acres, 2-6” wells, $800 acre, close lo town off 
pavement.

160 acrev, 2 small wells. $550 acre with possession 
now.

TLC has been given (o this 2 HR, I Bath home, 
knotty pine paneling enhance the dining and kitchen 
area, plus large living area and utility. Priced to be 
moved.......................................................... $18,000.00

With $3.<MK).IK) down for qualified FmllA buyer, 
you can purchase this super nice 3 BR, IV, bath Brick 
home wilh utililv, fenced vard and single car garage. 
.....................................................................$.30,000. (HI

FOR SALF.....2-bcdroom 
home with large utility, lots 
of closets, detached garage 
with 12x14 storage room. 
Completely remodeled, new 
plumbing and fixtures, new 
cabinets. Buy now and 
choose your carpet and 
formica tops or have our 
decorator choose them for 
you. Clark Flooring and 
Tile. 247-2156. 14-ltc

FOR SALE....Two-bedroom 
house with attached garage. 
221 West Sixth, Friona 
Lloyd Rector, Phone 265- 
3420. 14-tfnc

PROPERTY
ASSOCIATES

JANET BUSKK MARSHALL EI.DFR

m
BEALTORf

102 East 11th  
* 2  Call 2 4 7-2 74 5 ,

2-Bedroom brick with 
ad jo in ing  ap a rtm en t. 
Apartment rents for 
$125.00 per month.
Located 807 Prospect.

• • • •
2-Bedroom brick, located 
910 Jackson.

i D in t  U  
REAL ESTATE 
Phone 247-3537 

or 247-3189
4-tfnc

FOR SALE....3 bedroom 
house on 40 acres, 3 miles 
south on Hwy. 214, Call 265- 
3223 after 6 p.m. 50-tfnc

M)R SAI E....3 Bedroom 
brick, 1 bath, garage. 1308 
Columbia, $32,400. Any 
reasonable offer considered 
Call 1-293-7336 for 
information. 12-tfnc

Dealer Inquiries Welcome! 
10 per cent over cost. Pre- 
Fab ready to erect custom 
steel buildings for 
commercial, farm or homes! 
Matrex (24 hrs.) 512/231- 
2079. 14-4tc

FOR S A L E . . . .T h r e e  
bedroom house. One 
bathroom. Call 247-3702 
after 6 p.m. 12-tfnc

FOR R E N T . . . .T h r e e  
bedroom furnished mobile 
home. Call 247-3638 or 247- 
2584. 14-ltc

This UT clinic 
doesn't give shots

AUSTIN. Texas 'Spl i A 
new Children's Rights Clinic 
in The University of Texas 
Law School will give the 
voices ol children a chance to 
be heard in Texas courts 
through competent legal 
representation

Through the clinic i in which 
advanced law students gain 
practical case experiencei. a 
member of the law faculty 
will be available tor appoint­
ment by Stale district judges 
in Travis County to represent 
a child s interests in any case 
where the State intervenes to 
take custody ol a child or to 
terminate parental rights

Such a court-appointed at­
torney lor childrens rights 
was mandated w hen the Texas 
Family Code was amended in 
1979

WANTED....Coyotes, skin­
ned or unskinned (a ll Don 
Bandy. 238-1381 IO-6tp

NOW AVAILABLE
I. 2 and 3 Bedroom 

Apartments Modern wall to 
wall carpeting, heating and 
cooling, kitchen equipped, 
parking, laundry facility. 

Call 247-3666 
Saratoga Garden 

Apartments 
I riona, Texas

Listen 
to The Hum
B A A  B A A  B A A  B A A  B A Ammmmmmin in m in m in

28-tfnc

Did You know Friona Had A 
Home Decorating Center?

We Have 
A Large 
Selection

‘ Grass Carpets 
•Carpet
*V.A. Floor Tile 
•Vinyl Floor Covering 
Congoleum & GAF 
•Counter Tops 
•Wallpaper Supplies 
•Ceramic Tile

10 Per Cent O ff Of Your Total Purchase 
W ith This Ad.

Offer Good January 12 Thru January 16 
( lark Mooring A Tile 

Home Decorating Center 
701 Main 
247-2156 

Open
I P .M .-5 P.M . 

Monday-Eriday
If you need an after hour 
appointment, just call, we'll he glad 
to open.

It s the sound ot growth prosperity and progress in the 
Southwest It s the sound ot the Southwest making a 
bigger and bigger contribu tion  to our nation s economy 
It's the sound of e lectric ity E lectric ity that surrounds us 
w ith opportunities and |Obs pride and security And with 
proper use of our resources and new power plants using 
effic ient reliable tuels like coal that sound is going to 
keep right on humming
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ASCS Gives Tips To 
Protect Cotton Payments
Parmer County cotton farmers 

were given tips this week by Prentice 
L Mills, County Executive Director 
of the ASCS, concerning ways they 
can protect their payment yields.

"This message is for all cotton 
producers; and, especially the farm 
operators. The farm operator is the 
person who can do the most to 
maintain a farm’s cotton program 
yield,” Mills said.

As the yield for each farm is 
established on the basis of actual 
nr~tnction of cotton from the farm,

it behooves the farm operator to 
make certain that the yield records 
for the farm are correct. As the 
operator of a cotton farm, there are 
two very important things for you to 
remember to do. These are:

(1) When you take your cotton to 
your gin, make certain that the gmner 
knows which farm it came from. 
Look at your account sheet and make 
certain that it shows your name 
(operator), the name of owner of 
the farm and be certain that the 
ASCS Farm Number is shown on the

ginner’s account sheet for that farm.
DO NOT allow your ginner to list 

cotton for more than one farm on one 
account sheet. As soon as all the 
cotton from one of your farms has 
been ginned and marketed, bring 
your settlement sheets (or copies of 
them) to the ASCS office in order for 
us to record the necessary 
information. We will keep these 
documents in the farm file.

(2) If the cotton yield for your 
farm is below average due to adverse 
weather (wind, hail, rain, etc.) or 
other circumstances beyond your 
control, you (the farm operator) 
should report this to the ASCS office 
and also report fo us just what you 
did in attempting to produce a 
normal crop of cotton on the farm.

“ Your County Committee has the 
authority to adjust the cotton yield on 
your farm and they are eager to help 
you as much as they are permitted to 
by law; however, they cannot help 
you unless you furnish them with the 
information (facts) they need to work 
with,” Mills says.

"One thing m ore-lf the acreage of 
cotton you harvest from a farm is 
different from that you reported 
earlier, be sure and let us know about 
this. Any person having any question 
as to the procedure for protecting 
their cotton yield, should contact 
their local ASCS o ffice ,"  he 
concluded.

A W A RI)- WINNERS.... Clyde 
Goodwine, a member o f the 
Friona graduating class of 
1916, was the oldest grad: and 
J. T. Gee, the longest-term

teacher (41 years) at the Friona 
E x - S t u d e n t s  R a n q u e t  
December 27. A crowd of 664 
people attended the banquet.

CAME FARTHEST.. . .Mary  
Ann Roggess, who came the 
farthest for the ex-students 
banquet, is now living

Relize, Rritish 
which is 2300 
Friona.

1
Honduras, 

miles from

in

FOR SALE
320 Acres south of Friona. Two 
wells, all tile, pump-back system. 
Good water. Need to sell to settle 
estate.

JOHN BINGHAM  
LAND CO.

Phone 247-3909 or 247-3274
!4-2tc

UT ranks eighth 
in law teachers

At ST1Y Tt-xuv > Spl 
The l niversity uf Texas Law 
School has a prominent role in 
influencing the course ot legal 
education in the I' S

It rank' eighth among the 20 
law schools that produce the 
most graduates who become 
law teachers

Harvard leads the list with 
524 ot it' graduates in law 
teaching a figure that 
represents a 13 9 per cent ot 
all those teaching law I'T 
Austin with 81 law graduates 
who are law teach ers , 
provides 2 1 per cent ot the 
national total

Come on over!
We're ready to help you make one of your toughest farming decisions

That s right We saw a dramatic story untold in fields around here last tall 
And we re eager lo tell you about it From what we saw Pioneer brand hybrids 
and varieties were clear cut leaders across the board And it proved what 
we ve been saying all along In a good year they re as good as you II find, in a 
tough year, no one else even comes close

Come see us during Pioneer Decision Days We ll show you yield and 
performance records from this year and several years bach and help you 
select the right combination of Pioneer* brand seeds to be your money 
makers And during Pioneer Decision Days, we II give you a free while cap |ust 
for taking time to fhmk seriously about your seed needs

£ j g \ P I 0 N E E R
J  BRAND SEEDS

Kl Sf ARCH ... for thr Business of Farming

MIKE C H ANEY 
FER TILIZER

Office Ph. 2 9 5 - 3 4 4 4  Home Ph. 2 4 7 - 3 7 3 4
T*o limitattOA o* !*•"•**? •pp*e"»e on 1*4 §b0 % part o* 1*4 o» »»'*

1'4*4>*4f*  O* PWWW t f r t o * * * * * * *  UK

IDO N ’T  M I S S  T H E S E  J A N U A R Y ..

Squaws Fall 
In Contests 
At Abernathy

The Friona Squaws dropped a pair 
of games this week, and were playing 
in the Abernathy tournament th ir ' 
weekend, as action resumedr­
following the holiday break

The team was blitzed by ClassI; 
AAAAA power Ffercford on Friday 
64 18 The Flereford girls sport a 16 l! 
record following the win, and had! 
won something like 12 games in a! 
row.

The full-court press put on by the; 
Whitcface girls really baffled the; 
Squaws, who trailed 17-4 at th ^  
quarter and 31-6 at halftime

In fact, it wasn’t until 4:38 into the; 
third quarter that Friona’s score hiC 
the double-digit mark, and by then! 
Hereford had a 44-10lcad

It was the first time in several! 
decades that Friona and Hereford! 
had met in a varsity sports event, and! 
coach Al Stinson must have- 
wondered "why us?” before the; 
game was over.

On Tuesday, the Squaws fell to th^ 
Tulia girls, 61-49 in a game at Tulia. ;

The Hornettes outscored Friona.” 
23-10 in the second quarter lo break 
open an otherwise close game 
Theresa Bermea’s 17 points led the 
team in scoring Lynn Blackburn's six 
points were high in the Hereford 
game.

DINTY M O O R!

t H n t u M o * * ,
‘■VSiWaSf.:

D E I  M O N T E

FRUIT C O C K TAIL SI 6 9 c
D E L M O N T E  jm i h b  ^

CORN_________ c3?n 4 7
M I L E  HI GH C U T  M  ̂

GREEN BEANS 4 3
C U D A H Y B A R - S  4  7 Q

BACON________ lb.....................
L O N G H O R N  M A R K E T S L I C E D  * 4  C Q

B O LO GNA lb * 1
W A S H I N G T O N  D E L I C I O U S  A  " f  C

A P P LES  LB 4 7
d '» n *°

PEARS 6 9 1
v ____________________________________

Y E L L O W

W  f  ONIONS lb 2 9 c

With Super 
S ix  Card

STEW

9 9 «

Without Super 1 5 9  
Six Card

BAM A

PEANUT
BUTTER

18 01. JA R

Without Super 
Six  Card

Q 0 9

With Super 
Six  Card

|  4 9

J O H N S T O N

A P P LE  PIE 38 0 Z . $ 2 2 9

S U N B R I T E

O R AN G E JUICE 1 2  0 Z .  C A N 8 9

LUCKY LEAF

CHERRY

FILLING

Double Stamps 
On Wednesday

YOUR CHOICE OF GUNN BROS. OR ROSEBUD STAMPS

Without Super 1
Six Cord ^  "

With Super O  ^
t l «  r  rx r  #4 "  d r

With Super 
Six Card

W H ITE’S S U P ER M A R K ET
O U R  A IM  IS TO  P L E A S E  IN  E V E R Y  W A Y

WE ACCEPTUSDA FOOD STAMPS

as

•Tv
f t

a  t i t
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Study Club Held 
Christmas Party

A called meeting for Progressive 
Study Club members was held 
Thursday, December 5 in the home of 
club member, Roxanne Hurst

The program began with a roll call. 
The members answered the roll call 
with "Candy Making Tips.” Then 
M artha Schueler presented her 
program on candy making Lorna 
Schueler assisted Mrs. Schueler 
Members were shown and given 
various recipes made with chocolate 
For example, Mrs. Schueler made 
and painted chocolate Santa Claus 
suckers, made peanut butter cups, 
and the members were tempted by 
chocolate covered cherries. Mrs. 
Schucler's main suggestion to all was 
to be patient and never get in a hurry.

Mrs. Schueler has been making 
chocolate candy for three years but 
really got involved with the public 
about two years ago This happened

Hutson Rites 
Are Conducted

Funeral services for Bird Hutson, 
87, are scheduled for 2 p m. Saturday 
in the Bethel Baptist Church of 
Nocona, Texas. Hutson died 
Thursday at Parmer County 
Community Hospital.

Rev Wayne R. Williams, Baptist 
minister, Lubbock, will officiate, 
assisted by Rev Jerry Kirby, pastor 
Burial will be in the Starkey Cemetery 
of Nocona.

Hutson had lived in Fnona for the 
past seven years, moving here from 
Whituarral He was born January 22, 
1893, in Wise County. He was a 
retired farmer, was a member of the 
Baptist Church

Survivors include one son, Troy, of 
Friona; two sisters, Mrs. Elsie 
Doshier of Whitharral, Mrs. Effiedav 
Durham of Nocona; four brothers, 
Charles of Nocona, Hobtrt of 
Wichita Falls, O B of Gainesville 
and Leo Forrest of Bowie.

Also surviving are two 
grandchildren and three great­
grandchildren

when a lady suggested she order and 
buy her chocolate wholesale When 
she discovered she had 500 pounds 
she decided to share it with everyone

The business meeting was brought 
to order by President Gave Tannahill. 
Future plans for a district club 
convention were discussed as was the 
annual Christmas party.

Hostesses Maxine Loafman and 
Jeanette Maurer served a vegetable 
dip and a variety of cut vegetables 
along with bite size servings of Mrs. 
Schucler’s various candy. Eighteen 
club members were present along 
with four guests.

• • • •
M.C. and Ann Osborn’s country 

home was the scene of Progressive 
Study Club’s annual Christmas party 
on Tuesday. December 9. The 
members’ husbands were special 
guests for the evening

As members and husbands arrived 
they were served hot spiced punch. 
Not only was the house decorated for 
the Christmas season, the tables were 
decorated to resemble big packages 
Large bows with runners served as 
name place cards and each couple 
received a silver tree ornament.

Hostesses for the evening. Sue 
Beene. Lunell Horton and Lois 
Norwood, served dinner of prime 
roast beef, green bean bundles, 
potatoes on the half shell, tossed 
salad, bread and a variety of pies and 
cakes for dessert

The entertainment for the evening 
was an assortment of Christmas 
games Linda Gromowsky received 
the "Super Snoop" award for being 
the best guesser Lois Norwood and 
John Mars told of their best 
Christmas and Roxanne Hurst had to 
tell about her worst. A mad lib, which 
the members wrote themselves, was 
enjoyed by all

The husbands then held their gift 
exchange of homemade goodies and 
the ladies exchanged tree ornaments.

A good time was enjoyed by 
twenty-seven members and their 
husbands. All members can look 
forward to a program on dough art 
presented by Gaye Tannahill on 
Januarv 13.

The Happy 
Homemaker

PRESENTS ARTW ORK...Ar­
tist Ren Konis looks at one of 
the pieces of art which have 
been presented to Parmer 
County Community Hospital 
by Konis, Ray Landrum and

Joel l.andrum, in memory of 
Rosella Landrum. The pictures 
grace the hospital's new wing. 
Title o f the work shown is 
“ The Magnificent Seven," in 
the wing's sun room.

\  E W F A C E S . . . . D a r r e l l  
Oakley, left, will be working in 
the Friona Post Office for a 
six-week period, while 
Postmaster Richard Wilson 
fills in at Canyon. Harry

carrier fo r  City Route I, 
replacing longtime carrier 
Louise Rush, who is now 
working as a clerk.

This week’s column is being 
devoted to more "receipts" from "A 
Receipt Book of Pioneer Days- 
lngram, Texas 1879-1980.”

None of the receipts will produce 
anything for the table, but should 
provide the reader with some "food 
for thought," and other interesting 
tid bits.

Married Woman's ( ake
1 pound true love
1 pound perfect trust and confidence 
1 pound of cheerfulness 
A pinch of unselfishness 
A sprinkle of interest in all her 

husband does
Mix well with a gill of the oil of 

sympathy.
Put in a tin of contentment.
Flour with a bright fireside and a 

loving kiss.
Bake well all your life.

• • • •
For A flood Day

Take two parts unselfishness and 
one part patience and work together. 
Add plenty of industry. Lighten with 
good spirits and sweeten with 
kindness.

Put in smiles as thick as raisins in 
plum pudding and bake by the 
warmth which streams from a loving 
heart.

t • • *
When a man loses sight of his past, 

he loses his ability to look forward 
intelligently.

t • • •
Mud Cakes

Some water-about half a cup.
Add two full cups of earth.
Mix well and beat and beat 
For all you are worth;
Roll out and cut a half inch thick.
A dozen or so it will make.
Then arrange them on a board,
And set in the sun to bake!
Frosting:
A cup of sand, the white is best.
Add water drop by drop 
Until enough to mix and spread.
All over each cake top!
In center stick a big fat plum 
Or a berry or a cherry meat,
And then you’ll have some little cakes 
That look good enough to eat!

On Life
What seems to grow fairer 

To me as life goes by 
Is the love and the grace 

And tenderness of it;
Not its wit and cleverness 

And grandeur of knowlcdgc- 
Giand as knowledge is-—

But, just the laughter of children 
And the friendship of friends 

And the cozy talk by the fire 
And the sight of flowers and the 

sound of music.
# • • •

It’s (  oukie Time
A house should have a cookie jar.

For when it’s half past three,
And children hurry home from school.

As hungry as can be.
There’ nothing quite so splendid 

In filling children up,
As spicy, fluffy ginger cakes.

And sweet milk in a cup.

A house should have a mother, 
Waiting with a hug,

No matter what a boy brings home 
A puppy or a bug.

For children only loiter 
When the bell rings to dismiss.

If no one’s home to greet them 
With a cookie and a kiss!

Kitchen Hints
Buy a new powder puff and keep it 

in the shortening can for greasing 
pans, pots and cookie sheets.

• O • *
1 eat my peas with honey.

I've done it all my life.
It makes the peas taste funny,

But it keeps them on my knife.

The ends of candles should be kepi 
to add to the starch on washdays
They will add to the gloss.

• * • •
In the next Happy Homemaker 

column, we will learn something 
about the home remedies used by our 
ancestors. One entire section of the 
book was devoted to "Advice on 
Matters of Health.”

Watkins, right, is the new
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E very  W eek O ver 5.000 R eaders Find 
Out What H appened In The fr io n a  A rea  

B y  R ead ing  This N ew spaper. 
CALL 247-2211

To S ta r t Y our S u b scrip tio n , A ls On Sale
A t S evera l N ew sstands fr io n a .

INTEREST PLUS CHECKING
We have always offered you the highest interest

available and NOW we offer you checking in addition to

the highest interest rate.

Earn 5.25% interest compounded daily on all your 

funds with no minimum required.

FREE CHECKING if over 65.

FREE CHECKING if minimum balance of *400 is maintainedt
during month. ★

FREE CHECKING if average balance of (80G is maintained
during month, it

it Small service charge if account is below minimums.

Drop by one of our offices today and sign up to 

start earning interest on your idle funds.

4th & Sampson 
Hereford 
3643535

Mi Lim Mwflrtwi

FSLK 3rd & Bedford 
Dimmitt 
647-2189

i



THE FRIONA STAR, SUNDAY, JANUARY 11,1981, PAGE 7

Mrs. Wiley’s Services 
Are Held Friday

Funeral services for Irene 
Wiley, 69, of Shallowater, 
were held Friday, January 9, 
at 2:30 p.m. in ihe Calvary 
Baptist Church of Friona, 
with Rev Murle Rogers,

pastor, officiating.
Burial was in Friona 

C emetery under the direction 
of Parsons-F.llis Funeral 
Home.

Born August 6, 1911 in
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Cooper, Texas, Mrs. Wiley 
had lived in Friona from 
1935 to 1968, moving to 
Littlefield and had lived in 
Shallowater for the past 
three and one-half years. She 
was a member of the First 
Baptist Church. Mrs Wiley 
died Tuesday, January 6, at 
West Texas Hospital in 
I.ubbock.

Survivors include one son, 
James A. Wiley of 
Shallowater; two daughters, 
Jo Carol Rankin of 
Magnolia, Delaware and 
Jeaneen Wiley of Alvardo, 
Texas; six sisters, Mrs. Erma 
Rury and Mrs. Peggy 
Downing, both of Clovis. 
N.M., Mrs. Ruth Terry of

IRENE WILEY

Friona, Mrs. Margaret 
Dillard and Mrs. Kathryn 
Arnold, both of Lubbock, 
and Mrs. Lucille Livings of 
Temple; two brothers, 
Charles Robards of Lubbock 
and Winfred Robards of 
Clovis, N.M .; ten 
grandchildren and one great­
grandchild.

Pallbearers were H.E. 
Dillard, Zelbert Rury, Austin 
Downing, Leo Wiley, George 
Terry, Roger Dillard and 
William Gromowsky.

New SWPS 
Tolk Station
Construction on Tolk 
Station, Southwestern  
Public Service Com  
pany's new coal-fired 
power plant 12 mile' 
east o f  M uleshoe, 
Texas, is approaching 
the half-way point. The 
first o f two 543,00*' 
k i l o wa t t  g e ne r a t i n g  
units is scheduled for 
completion in 1982.

Mrs. Stevirk’s Rites 
Are Held In Hereford

Funeral services for Mrs. 
Corinne Elizabeth (Bobbie) 
sit-v ick. 'o . of Hereford 
were held Monday, January 
5 in the Wesley United 
Methodist Church of 
Hereford, with Rev, H.L. 
Thurston, officiating.

Burial was in West Park 
Cemetery.
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Come on over*
W e're ready to help you make one ot your toughest farming decisions

Thai s nght We saw a dramatic story unfold In fields around here last tall 
And we re eager to te you about it From what we saw Pioneer brand hybrids 
and varieties were dear cut leaders across the board And it proved what 
we ve been saying »u along In a good year they're as good as you'll (md. m a 
tough year no one else even comes close

Come see us during Pioneer Decision Days We II show you yield and 
performance records Irom this year and several years back and help you 
5P;f.ct me fight combination ot Pioneer' brand seeds to be your money 
rr,avers And during Pioneer Decision Days we ll give you a free white cap iust 
tor tav mg time to think seriously about your seed needs

PIONEER
BRAND SEEDS

Kl SI ARC H for the  Business of Farming

HUB GRAIN COM PANY
PH.265-3215

Mrs. Stevick died 
Saturday, January 3, in her 
home after a short illness.

Born June 20, 1910, she 
married O .E. Stevick 
December 15, 1951 in
Eunice, New Mexico. She 
moved to Hereford in 1951 
from Friona.

Survivors include her 
husband, O.E. of the home 
in Hereford; four daughters, 
Dell Hernandez of Globe, 
Arizona, Betty Roberts of 
Portales, N.M., Pat Star of 
Cliffton, Arizona and Peggy 
Ennis of Andrews; one son, 
Johnny Thomas of Boring, 
Oregon; two step-daughters, 
Jimmie Patterson of 
Hereford, and Betty 
Kuykendall of San Pablo, 
California; two step-sons, 
Glen Stevick of Friona and 
Larry Stevick of Dallas; two 
brothers; four sisters; 46 
grandchildren and 32 great­
grandchildren.

Letter To 
The Editor

Dear Bill,
I t’s ironic that the required 

Environmental Impact Statement 
(EIS) gives this area its best leg up in 
the fight against the MX missile 
system. This same bit of much-cussed 
"burdensom e regulation" and 
"excessive government red-tape" just 
might keep the MX out of our wheat 
fields. The required EIS assesses 
long-term environmental and social 
effects before a big project begins. It 
can prevent boondoggles like the 
Love Canal chemical dump in New 
York State or the destruction of the 
agricultural land and social fabric of 
the Texas Panhandle The EIS gives 
opportunity for local input to 
powerful decision makers thousands 
of miles away, and it should be 
spared by the Reagan-Bush boys 
when they wade into the regulatory 
thicket with their meat-axes. No 
doubt this area will be equally 
interested in the EIS of the nuclear 
waste disposal study now underway.

The next question is why do we 
need more nuclear madness at all 
when we have enough bombs to kill 
them 12 times over and they us 9 
times over? Or whatever those 
ridiculous overkill figures are

Byron Brewer

giant
about

sequoia tree 
2,600 years

“ B l o c k  g o e s  w it h  m e  t o  t h e  
I R S ?  F r e e ?  I s h o u l d a  
c o m e  h e r e  la s t  y e a r , v

We re trained to know every deduction and credit the law
allows And if the IRS calls you in well go with you. tree 

Not as a legal representative but to explain how your 
taxes were prepared

H&R BLOCK
THE INCOME TAX PEOPLE

511 Main Street. Friona 
Phone 147-3631

Open 9 A M.-4 P M Meekdny*
» A M.-l P M Saturday

f fta rra-o , •ppea'-'M) o *  % part o* t a *
,*#<•* ,P*kg'*»t't<i»'ada"'#r*at**or»aa'Mi§fadi«tarna*t

W r a n g l e r  J e a n s
Boy* & Student* 100% Cotton No Fault 

Bin Ke-ll Denim

B o y s .................... ♦ 7 9 8

S t u d e n t s ..........J 9 9 *

Special Group Menu

W e s t e r n  B o o t s

• 7 4 9 5Value* To 
•129.95

o rAll Men & Boyn Ixing 
Short Sleeve Dren*

W e s t e r n  S h i r t s  

Buv 2 Get Third 
FREE

^ ^ F x ju a Jo ^ L rn n ^ N a lu e ^

Student & Junior 
Overall* & Painter Pant*

m i B
Men*

Velour &  Knit

T o p s

3 0 %

L a m  Mahon

S h i r t u

* 5 ° °  Off

W rangler Perm* Prean

J e a n s
Boys I g U  Student** 1 0 * *

Men* Drea* Western
S u i t s

Grand Kntrv By Ko«r Mfg.(,o. 

Free Shirt With Each Sun

Pants
Keg.M8.95 •1591
H a u l  ill Not Be On Sale 

Beeaune Of Short Supply

Levi For Gab 
Bendover Pant*

10091 Woven Texturoed 
Dacron Polyeater

Reg.
*24.95

W rangier, Levi, Rumble Seat* &
Gtv Girl0

F a s h i o n  J e a n s  &  T o p s

30% Off

Men, Women & Boy* Denim. 
Polyester & Down

C o a t s  &  V e s t s  

2 0 %  o f f
One Group W all* Down

Jacket, R«.T5.UU •34’*
^  W rangier Kid* & Children f

4 0 %  off
V  r,Little Girl* Bloune*

°P*

W rangler 100% Cotton No Fault
Denim

J e a n s
Boou Flare
Reg. Fit & Slim Fit,.............. •14"
Cowboy Cut.................. •15"

Perma Pre** Bool Flare..... •12-
Group Ladle* 
Fashion Boot* 

Reg.
*89.95 *49"
All Gow bora Boot* 

Not On Sale 

10%  Off
Men, W omen & Bov*

Hat Acceworie*
pin* Feather* 

Hat Band*

2 0 %  o ff

All
W e*tem Belt* 

Name* Put ON 
FREE

^  Boy*, W omen & Men*

F l a n n e l  S h i r t *

3 0 %  Off
One Group Boy« Flannel Shin*

•7"
One Group Men* Flannel Shin*

x
Wall* Coverall*

Brown D uck............... * 4 4 "

Green Olive.................'43**

W rangier
Green (Hive.................  * 2 9 "

Children*

Coverall* *5** Off

W rangler & Levi 100% Polveater

Knit Pant*

•3 " o«
Boy*. Student* & Men*

Coduroy Pant*

25% off

All Item* 
Not On Sale

10% off

Heavy knit

W e*tem Sweater* 
Bv Miller

Rh 'so ,3 9 "

ees WESTERN W UE UK.

kiki>« ■ m m

t  n W T *  J * * * %V * * ' V '  * % 1 l i l t  I  | M  » M I I  I
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On Christmas Eve Mr and Mrs. 
Sam Williams and Mr and Mrs. Glen 
Williams drove to Olton, where they 
were dinner guests in the home of Mr 
and Mrs. Dale Williams and 
daughter, Shelley.

Other guests were Mr and Mrs 
David Adkins of Roswell Mrs.

Hearing Tests 
Set For Friona

FRIONA..Electronic hearing tests 
will be given at the Senior Citizens 
Building in Friona on Wednesday, 
January 14, from 10:00 to 12:00.

J. W ampler, factory trained 
Flearing Aid Specialist, will be at the 
Senior Citizens’ Building at 15th and 
Washington Street to perform the 
Tests

Anyone who has trouble hearing or 
understanding speech clearly is 
welcome to have a test using modern 
electronic equipment to determine if 
his loss is one which can be helped 
Some of the causes of hearing loss 
will be explained, and diagrams of 
how the ear works will be shown

Everyone should have a hearing 
test at least once a sear if there is anv 
trouble at all hearing clearly Even 
people now wearing a hearing aid or 
those who have been told nothing 
could be done for them should have a 
hearing test and find out if 
amplification can help them hear 
better

The free hearing tests will be given 
Wednesday, from 10 a m to 12 noon 
at the Senior Citizen’s Building If 
you can't get there on Wednesdav. 
call 247-}645 and arrange for an 
appointment at another time In 
home testing is also available

f f e t o n u '
\ A J
W ill FM f S

W Sen I 
A. U Wi l

J0I0 Olton Road 
Plainview, Texas

44 itc

Adkins is the former Tammy 
Williams.

• • • •
Mrs. L.D. Pope, who resides in the 

Black Community recently fell and 
was painfully injured She is currently 
at the home of her daughter, Glenna 
Mae Bainum, who lives in Dumas

latest reports indicate that Mrs. 
Pope w ill be confined to a w heel chair 
several months. Her mailing address 
is Apartment No. 10; Flarmony Rick 
No. 2, East First Street, Dumas, 
Texas, 7902W

$ t  # I
Christmas Day dinner guests in the 

home of Mr. and Mrs. E.l Fairchild 
were Mr and Mrs. Larry Fairchild 
and children, Tammy, Jeff and Vicky 
of Adrian; Kay Neel of Stinnett; and 
Mr. and Mrs. Otis Neel and Mr. and 
Mrs. Rex Blackburn and Brian of 
Friona.

Afternoon visitors were Mr and 
Mrs. David Blackburn; Mr. and Mrs 
Mike Blackburn and children, Shane 
and Jennifer; Lynn Blackburn and 
Mike Flutson, all of Friona 

* » • •
Barbara Bass of Lubbock, Charles 

and Pat Bass and daughters, Terri, 
Robbi and Conni, of Rogers, 
Arkansas; and Troy and Karene Bass 
and daughter, Melissa, of Friona, 
were holiday guests in the home of 
Mr and Mrs Estis Bass.

Charles, Pat, Terri, Robbi and 
Conni, also visited Pat's parents. Mr 
and Mrs Charles Meyers, and 
grandmother. Mrs. Vivian Mevers,
while they were here

• * • •
Mr and Mrs. Eugene Side. of 

Campo, Colorado, were weekend 
visitors in the home of Mr and Mrs 
Calvin Martin. Mrs. Nidey is 
Martin's daughter and the couple
lived here one time

• • • •
Mr and Mrs. James Waites and 

daughter, Debra, of Groves, Texas, 
spent Monday night in the home of 
Mr and Mrs. Rene Snead

Mrs. Waites, the former Joan 
Gray, is a former Friona resident She
and Mrs Snead are sisters.

• • • •
Mr and Mrs. Eugene Bandy 

hosted a Bandy family get together 
during the Christmas holidays.

Guests present were Mr and Mrs 
Bill Bands and children, W illiam and 
Alicia of Panhandle. Mr. and Mrs. 
Rusty Hinson and Walt of Quitaque; 
Mr and Mrs Wayne Maciolek and 
Mr and Mrs Jim Adams and Jamie, 
all of Amarillo. ^

Also VIr and Mrs Vernon Miller 
and children, Steven, Arnold, Fdwin 
and Filecn of Canyon, Johnny Bandy

and Carla Searcy of Lubbock; and 
Mr and Mrs. Clay Bandy and Mr. 
and Mrs. Todd Bandy, all of Friona

• • t •
Christmas Day dinner guests in the 

home of Sam and Geneva Williams 
were Russell Massey and Mr and 
Mrs. David Massey and daughter, 
Debbie, all of Amarillo and Frances 
Baize of Dallas

Mrs. Baize, who is the former 
Frances Massey, also visited in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. V.M 
Ferguson before returning home.

Russell Massey, Geneva Williams, 
Elizabeth Ferguson and Frances 
Baize are all children of the late Mr.
and Mrs. Otis Massey.

* • • •
Charles and Sue Rector had a nice 

surprise for Christmas. Their son, 
SGT 4 Chuck Rector and his friend. 
Jack Griffin of Cocoa Beach. 
Florida, came home for the holidays. 
Chuck and Jack are both stationed at 
Long Beach, California aboard the 
USS Jouett, and are serving in the 
Navy.

Also visiting with the Rectors were 
lawrence and Sammie Fithin and 
daughter kyndell of Lubbock and 
J.L. Armstrong of Alva, Oklahoma 
Sammie is the Rector’s daughter and 
Armstrong is Sue’s father.

0  0  0  0

Highlight of the holiday season for 
Myrl Buske was a six day stay at a 
Vars condominium in Breckenridge, 
Colorado. She was in the company of 
all four of her children with their 
vpouses and children.

There wasn’t any snow at 
Breckenridge, so the ski enthusiasts 
had to ski at Copper Mountain and 
Keystone

A Christmas tree and gift exchange 
and fun and games were the order of
every day.

Others present were Deann, Rick, 
Mike. Scott and Sheri Styles of 
Abilene; Don Max, Lila Gay, Mayla 
and Misty Vars of Canyon; and 
Phillip. Phila May, Park, Pepper and 
Penni Weatherly, and B k and Janet
Buske. all of Friona.

• • • *
On New Year’s Day thirty persons 

attended the annual reunion of the 
family of the late C.F. and Florence 
Buske It was held in the home of Mr 
and Mrs. J.F Buske at Abernathy.

Frionans attending were Myrl 
Buske. B k and Janet Buske; Goldie 
and Frank Griffith; Lucille and J B 
Buske. and Phillip, Phila May, Park,
Pepper and Penm Weatherly.

• • • •
In a very short span of time Aubrey 

and Flmina Carlton had Christmas, 
wedding anniversary and New Year’s 
Dav visitors.

ANNOUNCING
I NOW HAVE MY OWN OFFICE 
AND AM READ Y TO SERVE YOU

See Me For:
★ Bookkeeping 

it Payroll Reports

*  Income Tax Work

Have a " T A X I N G ' '
PROBLEM?

None too d ifficu lt for us' Helen Romo

H ELEN  ROMO
Custom Bookkeeping

JL222
N.  Main PH.  2 4 7 - 3 5 0 0

They included Bob and Anne Reece 
and children, Stephanie and Russ, of 
Kelso, Washington; Mr. and Mrs. 
Walter Carlton, Marty, Jodi and 
Casey of Arch, New Mexico; and 
LXmette and Jim Weatherly and sons, 
John and Craig of Conroe, Texas.

Also, Margie and Joe Rexrode and 
sons, W vman and Heath and Aubrey 
Jr. and Nell Carlton and children, 
Shannon, Tracy and Terry, all of 
l ockney.

Also. Sharon and Chris Christman, 
Canyon; Stephen and Krystal Jones 
of Alpine; Mr. and Mrs. Jerry

Carlton, J.D , lisa, Barry, Crystal
and Ricky of Clovis, New Mexico.

0 0 0 0

Holiday visitors in the home of 
Dean, Anna Jo and Hal Blackburn 
were Law Domasig, Chula Vista, 
California; Randy lvev, Tulare, 
California; Steve Mass, Hartshorn, 
Oklahoma; Steve Gale, Searcy, 
Arkansas; and Dick Davis, Joe 
Stratton and Dave Stratton, all of 
Fort Worth.

Also Leatha Morris of Tulare, 
California, who was honored with a 
get acquainted party in the Blackburn

home on Saturday, December 27.
Snacks, dips, chips, assorted 

candies, cakes, cookies and cold 
drinks were served by Dean, Anna 
Jo and Hal to the guest of honor and 
Mr. and Mrs. John Hays, Mr. and 
Mrs. Frankie Allen, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bobby Zctzsche and Mr and Mrs. 
Larry Broyles.

Also Rodney Allen, Teresa Wilcox, 
Jay Jarboe, Jan Mason, Davis 
Bennett, Eddie Allen and l arry Pat/, 
all of Friona; and Kay Amonette of 
Denver City, Texas.

(Continued on Page 9)

Large Eggs 
Medium Eggs

91
85

Dozen

Dozen

$ Red Rind 
* Longhorn Cheese:

J U S T  A R R I V E D :

Coca Cola, Dr. Pepper, Tab, &
* Diet Dr. Pepper

For 6-Pack

Dried Pineapple, * 
Peaches, Papaya * 
And Banana Chips, &

Prices Good January 1 0  - 1 6

I GALLMAN'S GARDEN GATE PRODUCE {
•  W.  Hwy.  60 Friona,  Tex as Ph.  2 4 7 - 3 3 7 3  *
t  -ac* -ac- ac- ac- -ac- at- at- ac- -ac- -ac- -ac. -ac- -as- at- a: -ac- -ac- -ac* at- -ae< -aes -at-. -ac* >ae< -ac- ae< I

REW ARD O FFE R E D !
FOR IN FO R M A TIO N  C O N C ER N IN G  T H E FO LLO W IN G  
P IEC ES  O F E Q U IP M EN T :

★  A W H IT E, 19 7 8  IN T E R N A T IO N A L  C A B 0 V ER  
T R U C K , WITH A SIGN “ F E L D  L E A S E  T R U C K ,”  
S E R IA L N U M B ER  E 2 3 2 7 H G A 10 4 4 4 .

★  1969 C A T E R P IL L A R  1 2 F  M O TO R G R A D E R . 
S E R IA L N O . 1 3 K 2 0 4 1 . H AS B 0 R S B ER R Y 
C O N S TR U C TIO N  C O . E M B L E M .

$1,000°° REW ARD O FFER ED
FO R IN FO R M A TIO N  LE A D IN G  T O  T H E  A R R ES T  

AN D  C ONVIC TIO N O F  PER SO N  OR P ER S O N S  TA K IN G  
THIS E Q U IP M E N T .

TR U C K  W AS L A S T  S EEN  A T  B O V IN A ; M OTOR 
G R A D ER  N E A R  FR IO N A .

IF YOU H A V E IN FO R M A TIO N , P LE A S E  C O N T A C T:

B0RSBERRY
CONSTRUCTION

_______  Ph. (806) 247-2 5 5 1 OR (915) 75 5 -76 2 5

t
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Ministerially 
Speaking

B> REV. RONALD McGOVKRN 
Pastor-Si. Ann’s, Bovina 

St. Teresa's, Krlona 
Ihe hpiphanv (What It Means To I s*

In the mystery of Our Lord’s 
incarnation there were clear signs of 
His Godhead. The events we 
celebrate in this season disclose the 
fact that God took a human body. 
Man must be able to see and not be 

■  left in ignorance of the things that are 
the proof of God’s love.

He reveals himself in such a 
fashion that his great sacrament may 
not be an occasion for us of great 
misunderstanding. The Magi find a 
child crying in a manger, the one they 
have followed as he shone in the sky. 
The Magi clearly see in swaddling 
clothes, the one they have long 
awaited as he lay hidden among the 
stars.

Today the Magi gaze in great 
wonder. One whom the whole 
universe cannot contain, here in this 
little body. Today Christ enters the 
Jordan to wash away the sin of the 
world. Today Scripture says: ‘‘This is 
my Beloved Son, in whom I am well 
pleased."

Guess Who Has 4o\  
Years Deposited In 
His Age Account.

Deann Styles Mamed
• /

Abilene 0 .(]. President

DEANN STYLES

Mrs. Richard M. Styles, who 
moved to Abilene from Richmond, 
Virginia in 1978, is the newly-elected 
president of Abilene Woman’s Club.

Mrs. Styles, whose husband 
became vice president of Hardin- 
Simmons University in 1978, was a 
kindergarten and elementary school 
teacher in Richmond. Earlier she 
taught high school home economics, 
was a university child development 
instructor, private school principal 
and taught adult education in Texas, 
New Mexico and Virginia

* * * > * * * &

Happy Birthday 
To FrionaFolks.... $

Happy 40th 
Birthday, 

Dale!!

WEEK OF JANUARY 10-16
Friona residents having birthdays 

next week arc:
Ben Ncelley, January 10 
Chris Houlette, January 10 
Buddy Wiseman, January 10

Town Talk....
(Continued from Page 8*

Recent visitors in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs Bud Elmore have been Mr. 
and Mrs. Dale Spivey and daughters, 
Regina and Dcena, of Comanche and 
Panny Spivey, also of Comanche.

Also Mr. and Mrs. Urschel Perkins 
and daughters, Teresa and Candace, 
of Tyrone, Oklahoma; and Mr. and 
Mrs. Larry Elmore and daughters. 
Andre and Renee, of Sundown, 
Texas.

• * • *
Christmas Day dinner guests in the 

home of Mrs. E.S. W'hite Sr. were 
Mr. and Mrs. Robert Holder, Fort 
Worth; Mr. and Mrs. John R 
Cannon and Mr. and Mrs. Lee Roy 
Oliver, all of Dumas; and Richard 
White, Dumas.

Also Raymond White and son, 
Pete, of Stratford and Mrs. Wayland 
Hinds and children, Pam and Kyle,
of Canyon.

L ater in the week Mr and Mrs. 
Dale Nolte and daughter, Stacey,
came up from Midland.

• * • •
The greatest reward of having a 

thing well done is to have it done.

Bill Neelley, January 10 
Harold Reed, January 11 
Sam Landrum, January 11 
Morris Hacker, January 11 
Jerry Taylor, January 11 
Susan Lillard, January 11

Gary Don Schueler, January 12 
Charles Hough, January 12 
Bonnie Lunday, January 12 
Carol A. Bavousett, January 13 
Sheri Louise Martin, January 13 
Martha Russell, January 14 
Lesa Jones, January 14 
Jacquelyn Hight, January 14 
David Hutson, January 14 
Marcia Blackwell, January 14 
Mabelle Hartwell, January 15 
Darran Procter, January 16 
Jill Hight, January 16 
Katy Osborn, January 16 
Rex Talley, January 16 
Christie Wiseman, January 16

If you or someone in your family 
has a birthday coming up soon, call 
(he Friona Star at 247-2211 by 
Thursday noon and report it.

The new Woman’s Club president 
has been active in civic, church and 
school affairs wherever she has lived

Since coming to Abilene she served 
as interim religious activities director 
at HSU, 1978-79, and as research 
assistant to the HSU president on 
gifted and talented student needs in 
Abilene, 1979-80

Mrs. Styles was a 1955 graduate of 
Friona High School and received her 
bachelor’s degree from Texas Tech 
University and has done graduate 
work at Texas Tech, the University of 
Virginia, University of Richmond 
and HSU. She is currently pursuing 
her master's degree in guidance and 
counseling at HSU.

She is director of the eighth grade 
department of First Baptist Church 
of which she is a member She is the 
daughter of Myrl Buske and the late 
Pete Buske of Friona.

City Man’s 
Brother Dies

Funeral services for Fred K Beaty, 
57, of Longview, Texas, were held 
Monday, December 29, at 10 p m. in 
the Welch Funeral Home in 
Longview.

Burial was in the Noonday 
Community Cemetery

Born June 18, 1923, he was a 
member of the Baptist Church in 
Greggton, Texas. Beaty died Friday, 
December 26.

Survivors are his wife Jean, of the 
home; one daughter, Mrs. Richard 
Berry of Longview; one grandson, 
John Keller of Longview; two sisters, 
Mrs. Fay Mays of Dallas and Mrs. 
Gladys Hopper of Longview; and one 
brother, Joe Beaty of Friona.

Attending the funeral from Friona 
were Joe Beaty, Mrs. Billy John 
Thorn and Mrs. Tommie Jones.

Prairie A cres 
Party Line l ~ j /

The residents and staff of Prairie 
Acres had a wonderful holiday 
season. We had Christmas 
decorations, parties, carols ^nd so 
many nice gifts from our relatives, 
friends and neighbors.

W e would like to express our most 
sincere appreciation to everyone who 
had a part in making the season such 
an enjoyable one. Your visits, 
candies, cookies, fruit and other 
goodies all made our days more 
meaningful.

• # • •
G A Bandy of Bovina, who is a 

former Prairie Acres resident, is back 
with us.

• t  • O

Bird Hutson is hospitalized at this 
time.

• O • O
Eleven of us are having January 

birthdays. They are Janie London,

January I; Ludic Neel, January 6; 
Pearl Hand, January 11; Ora Massie, 
January 12; Pearl Allen, January 14. 
Bobby Hix, January 18; and Bird 
Hutson, January 22.

Also, Steve Battenhorst, January 
23; Drucilla Paul, January 24, Buel 
Sanders, January 25; and Lucy 
Welch, January 27.

• 0 • O

Tentative plans are being made for 
the organization of an auxiliary for 
Prairie Acres. Dates of meetings will 
soon be announced by Debbie 
Shirley, activity director.

All interested parties are asked to 
keep these meetings in mind and
attend if at all possible

• • * *
Date of the 1981 Nursing Home 

Rock 'N Roll Jamboree has been set 
on Friday, February 13. Watch this 
column for more details

Hospital Report
ADMISSIONS-

Porfiri Yzaguirre, Hereford; Edna 
Estes, Bovina; Bessie Rea. Bovina; 
Ray Landrum, Friona; Martha 
Simmons, Hereford; Larry Potts, 
Friona, Lille Grisham, Hereford; 
Tom Whaley, Friona, Francis 
Arredondo, Hereford; Alicia 
Gonzales and baby girl, Farwell; 
Anna Morales, Hereford; Mariana 
Trejo and baby girl, Friona; Thelma 
Hutson, Friona; Cirilia Dennett, 
Hereford; Elba Estrada, Bovina;

Pablo Brito, Bovina; Rose Longoria, 
Lazbuddie; Lucy Brito and baby boy, 
Bovina; Eustalia l.egarreta and baby 
girl, Friona, Beulah Whaley, Friona, 
Jan Emerson, Friona; and George 
Douglas, Bovina.

DISMISSALS—
Inez Rule, Robbia Hughes, Todd 

Ware, Ella Dixon, P O. Dixon, Jack 
White, Reta Mimms, Irene 
McFarland, Edna Estes, Martha 
Simons, Anna Morales, Tom 
Whaley, Larry Potts, Porfiri 
Yzaguirre, Cirilia Dennett, Elba 
Estrada, Ricky Berkley. Bessie Rea. 
Mariana Trejo and baby girl.

PATIENTS IN HOSPITAL—
Nelson Welch, Ray Landrum. 

Thelma Hutson, Bird Hutson, Lillie 
Grisham, Frances Arredondo, Alicia 
Gonzales and baby girl, Beulah 
Whaley, Eustolia Legarreta and baby 
girl, Jan Emerson. Pablo Brito, Lucy 
Brito and baby boy, George Douglas 
and Rose Longoria

M r  SB- M -  M -  -SB- SB- -SB- M r  SB- -3B- -SB- -SB- X  M -  M - M -  -3B- M r M r
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ir Home Cooked !

Meals
I 
i 
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★  Homemade j 
Bread &  Pies !

★  Daily
Lunch S p e c ia l'*? +2?+ ^  i
With Vegetables.j g m i f r  )
Hours: 6 A.M. -10 P.M. 7 Days A Week] 

★ Eat Here Or Take Out.

FOR MID SIZE AMERICAH CARS

+■ *

X W W , 14  inch
FITS C ARS SUCH  AS Century (78 1 1 1 Malibu 
( 7 8 - l t ) .  Cutlass ( 7 1 8 1 ) .  Le Mans (78 81*.  
Concord ( 7 1 8 1 *  Regal (78  81)  Skylark 
( 7 7  80) Aspen (76 801 Granada (75 81 *. 
Omega (74- 79* .  Ptioenii (74 79* Versatile 
(7M9)

SIZE -  PRICE -  FET
185x14 57.42 2.33
205x14 70.42 2.24
215x14 85.42 2.57

FOR FULL-SIZE AMERICAH

X W W , 15 inch
FIT S CA RS SUCH AS leSabre (74 81) R ivi 
era (7 4 -8 1) .  Eldorado (74 81*.  Seville (75 
91) Cordoba 175 81* Thunderbird (74 79* 
Cougar (78-79* Continental (76 80) Mark VI 
( 1 0 - 1 1 * .  Corvette <74 8 1 ) .  Monte Carlo (74 
7 7 )

WE PUT AMERICA ON RADIALS

SIZE- -FET
205x15 78.42 2.72
215x15 82.42 2.91
225x15 86.42 2.98
235x15 92.42 3.29

Floyd And Anna Englant

E N G L A N T ’S 
BOVINA R E S T A U R A N T

Family Owned & Operated 

Ph. 238-1199

i
i
i
l
i
i

a

WHITES
Home and 

Auto
W. Hwy. 60

Friona, T exas Wl». 247-3977

Leland,
p .  J O

David
Hutson
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Lou Whaley,  John Sutton
United In Church Ceremony

» /

M r s . J o h n  S u t t r m

Miss Louise Whaley, daughter of 
Mr and Mrs. Watson Whaley,
Fnona, and John Sutton, son of Mr 
and Mrs Noel Sutton, Killeen,
Texas, exchanged wedding vows in a 
double ring ceremony at 9:30 a m 
Thursday, January 1, at Sixth Street 
Church of Christ.

S.W Pope. Amarillo, cousin of the 
bride, perform ed the ceremony 
before a setting of blue carnations 
and white shasta daisies in white
baskets, which were sitting on 
pedestals.

Given in marriage by her father, 
the bride wore a formal length
candlelight satin gown. It was 
designed with a sweetheart neckline, 
deep cuffed bishop sleeves and fitted 
cuffs, which were closed w*h tiny 
buttons The waistline ended in a v- 
point in the front and back The full 
skirt ended in a chapel length train 
Rows of lace entwined with blue 
ribbon and embroidered flowers 
running from shoulder to hem in both 
front and back enhanced the gown 
The fitted bodice was closed in the 
back with a row of tiny buttons.

The gown was designed by Mrs 
Dennis Slagle for her wedding

The bride's elbow length veil was 
fashioned of candlelight illusion 
gathered onto a band of satin and 
lace and was decorated with 
miniature seed pearls.

She carried a nosegay of white 
shasta daisies with blue ribbons and 
net Her only jewelry was a gold 
necklace, which was a gift from the 
groom.

Mrs Dennis Slagle was her sister's 
matron of honor She wore a blue 
satin formal designed with fitted 
bodice and gathered skirg with long 
sleeves The sleeves and neckhne were 
edged with ecru lace The lower edge 
of the sleeves and the hemline were 
circled with matching tucks She 
carried a spray of white daisies with 
blue ribbon, lace and tulle

Jesse Sutton of Killeen, Texas, 
brother of the groom, wav the best 
man.

Guests were seated by Dennis

Slagle, Friona, brother-in-law of the 
bride, and Dan Lisman of Amarillo.

Wedding music was performed by 
an acapella choir composed of Duane 
Ginn, Bob Welch, D.L Harguess, 
Carl White, Nelda Miller, Patsy 
Bandy, Libby Procter, Brenda 
Patterson and Glenda Procter

They sang "Wedding Song,” “ Let 
There Be Love,” and "Bridge Over 
Troubled Waters.”

Guests were registered by Cary Ion 
Wiley, San Antonio, cousin of the 
bride.

The serving table for the reception, 
which was in the foyer of the church, 
was covered with a white satin swag 
over a white lace cloth with blue 
ribbon bows It was centered with the 
bride's bowqucf in a silver compote 
with matching candelabra on either 
side.

Kay Gaines, Friona, cousin of the 
bride, and Tricia W hite of Amarillo, 
served the three tiered wedding cake, 
which was decorated with blue 
flowers and topped with wedding 
bells and a spray of lillies of the 
valley

Amanda Hewes of Amarillo served 
punch from a cut glass bowl

Reception hostesses were Mrs. 
Sterling Graham , Mrs. Doyle 
Cummings, Mrs Wayne Mills and 
Mrs W V Elmore, all of Friona, and 
Mrs S W Pope. Amarillo, cousin of 
the bride

For a wedding trip to Mexico City, 
Mrs Sutton wore a knit dress of blue 
and beige with a blue and white silk 
flower corsage, which was fashioned 
by Mrs Sterling Graham Upon their 
return from Mexico City they will be 
at home in Amarillo

The bride is a 1972 graduate of 
Friona High School and was the 
valedictorian of her class She holds a 
bachelor of science degree in 
mathematics education and a master 
of science degree in mathematics 
from West Texas State University, 
Canyon She is a former teacher in 
the Amarillo Christian School and is 
currently teaching in Amarillo High 
School.

The groom, a 1970 graduate of

Killeen High School, attended 
Abilene Christian University before 
transferring to Mary Baylor from 
which he holds a bachelor of science 
degree in mathematics. He also holds 
a master of science degree in the same 
field from West Texas State

University. He is employed as a 
mathematician by the U.S. 
Department of Interior in Amarillo.

Mr. and Mrs. Noel Sutton hosted a 
rehearsal dinner at Parmer House 
Restaurant W ednesday evening.

Com e on over!
We re ready to  help you make one of your toughes t fa rm ing  dec is ions

That s right We saw a dramatic story unfold in fields around here last fall 
And we re eager to tell you about it From what we saw. Pioneer brand hybrids 
and varieties were clear cut leaders across the board And it proved what 
we ve been saying an along "In a good year they re as good as you'll find, in a 
tough year, no one else even comes close

Come see us during Pioneer Decision Days We ll show you yield and 
performance records from this year and several years back, and help you 
select the right combination of Pioneer1 brand seeds to be your money 
makers And during Pioneer Decision Days, we II give you a free white cap lust 
fortakmg time to think seriously about your seed needs

PIONEER
BRAND SEEDS

RESEARCH . . .  for the Business of Farming.

WEST
FRIONA GRAIN

Ph. 247-3839
Th# Limitation o f Warranty an<j ' • rr,*dv appearing on th« ia t* i is part of th# tarm» of sal* 

p ee* •» a pranfl natm* numt>*fs tdffM'fy 'RaoisteradftadamarKof PtonearHi Bred international me

Earn 51/4% Interest 
on A ll Your Money.

Now you can ram  S' 
interest on all your money
and get Irtv checking with 
our new C het knui Hus 
Interest account So you gel 
a checking account just like 
vou re usxxl to and you cam 
interest besides

It vou save one place and 
hank at another, combine all 
your m oney into our new 
Checking Mus Interest 
account. Your money cams 
more And you never 
need another account 
am "where else

To ram  Interest on all 
your m oney and get free 
checking, just keep a $500 
balance in your Checking Plus 
Interest account If your 
balance falls below $500 
there is a monthly 
service charge

We re helping you build 
a better tomorrow With 
Cher king Mus Interest that s 
first for vour monev todav

- C o - u n k j
CALL OR COME BY

A N D  L O A N  A S S O C IA T IO N

EslK
iMM*

<9flC Tk*  SAv ^gs Covoo'i' o

Ml I.KSHOE 
ho*. 272 5527
LITTLtMtLD 
HO*. IMS 51 If

K 1= }fsl
JFNOtA

C ’fiC Th* Saving* M«rk*t.ng Cov notion

tKII l \  \ 
MO*. 217 I f  Ml

KARWH.L 
MOh (Ml ti.SI

A

AUCTION
Monday, January 12, 1981 -  Sale Time: 10:00 a.m.

LOCATED From La-iat. Texas 1 mile West on Highways 84-70 OR From Farwell, Texas, 8 miles 
East on Highways 84 70 OR From Muleshoe Texas 12 miles West on Highways 84 70.

JOE L. McWILLIAMS -  Owner
Telephone (806) 825 2571
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. i f1*- i t-».i«i mi

1 ITvX) ot h*
. .0* lo* .i* i 2 10 0*,iofi Cum Cwit
- l«r ''«  *v**' I lot 8*nr.fiu'V. *f»i 2 Soft 6.1#

. . »*j -
6lu*r*60 M •>. S* *«f.
u • . • 4 , ** 'o*

'.ii loo V ,■»*• ,i I

rifi..w HVi K'.iou Call I
a*nas (  C'v*tf 806 2% ■

tlMHiJUl
anxes V M ee lo n f 806 281$
tn S;||N'

8an.e 806 864 3

r

m m * t 'X l  I f l \ t 8  l 04 A I  3iP 
ft* •( rOU# tftuci 0C 'taul*

farm* t/f wj/p (rj>A lunch W \U ftp ,4fPii^6/f 
.4// 4' counts S* tilt <1 Day of Sul*

\OTt PUiU* /tnny K'nif dui ( ht'k H»«.k

Ctucc owi Itutq Audmwus
BOX 1921 PLAINVIEW TEXAS 79072



i i I 
I 

s
's

i
i

i
S

I
.

 1
*

3

I
THE FRIONA STAR, SUNDAY, JANUARY 11,1981, PAGE 11:* j .

1

♦ ♦

» • /

Lisa Buchanan9 Gary Wright
Exchange Vows In Friona

Felisa Ann Buchanan and Gary 
Wade Wright, both Friona residents, 
exchanged wedding vows Saturday, 
December 27 at 7 p.m.

The ceremony was performed in 
the C ongregational Church of Friona 
by Rev. Skip Sirnic.

The church altar was centered with 
a tall candle arch. The arch was 
decorated with a heart of candles and 
an arrangement of white mums, white 
roses and baby's breath. The arch 
was flanked on each side by a spiral 
candelabra, palm trees, seven branch 
candelabras and bouquets of white

spider mums and palms The pews 
were marked with arrangements of 
white flowers and greenery.

Sharon Eubanks of Farwell, 
vocalist, sang “ T oday" and 
"Longer." She was accompanied by 
Jeanette Maurer and Owaissa 
Fallwell of Dexter, New Mexico.

The bride is the daughter of Mrs. 
Billy G. Buchanan of Friona.

The bridegroom is the son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Wade Wright of Friona 

As the bride was presented in 
marriage by her brother, Chief 
Buchanan of Friona, she wore a

ANNOUNCING 
NEW  SHARE 

C ER TIFIC ATES 
C OM PARE OUR 
YIELD S

( (impounded 
Quarterly

7.25% 7.50 %
Annually Annually

Paid on Paid on
Six Month Six Month
Certificates Certificates
SI.(KM) Min. $5,WM) Min,

A Substantial Penally If Withdrawn 
Karly

ttNCUA
Federal Regulations prohibit payment 
of dividends in excess of available 

earnings.

FRIONA T EX A S  
F E D E R A L  CREDIT UNION
203 W. 6th Friona Ph. 247-2736

formal length white gown fashioned 
by Bil-Joy. The empire bodice 
featured a scalloped Queen Anne 
neckline and complete covering of 
heavy French alencon lace accented 
with clusters of pearls. The sheer 
bishop sleeves ended with wide cuffs 
of alencon lace. One wide strip of lace 
applique encircled each sleeve at the 
elbow. The slender miramist skirt was 
adorned with a large cameo of 
alencon lace directly above a wide 
border of alencon encircling the hem 
An apron type overlay attached at the 
bodice draped the back of the dress 
and three rows of alencon lace 
appliques gave the illusion of three 
tiers cascading down the back

She wore a fingertip length veil of 
miramis* net A border of French

Daughter Born 
To Local Couple

Mr and Mrs. Rick Jennings, 1402 
Columbia, became parents of a baby 
girl at 11:58 p.m. Friday, December 
26, at Deaf Smith General Hospital, 
Hereford

She was named Lindsey Nicole and 
weighed seven pounds, ten ounces.

Lindsey is the first child for the 
couple. Her grandparents are Mr 
and Mrs. Elvie Jennings, Friona, and 
Mr and Mrs. H.M. McPherson of 
Happy.

Mrs. O.M. Jennings of the 
Larbuddie Community is the paternal 
great-grandmother

Retired Teachers 
To Meet Jan. 13

There will be a meeting of retired 
teachers on Tuesday, January 13 at 7 
p.m in the Community Room of 
Friona State Bank.

Jeanie Moseley, president of 
District 16 of the Texas State 
Teachers Association, will be the 
speaker.

All members are urged to attend

PENN 30-W OR QUAKER STATE - 1 0  W - 40

M O TO R OIL QT.

SHURFINE a i i  
C OFFEE GRINDS ]

(T> CO
ay—1 
__
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P IN EAP P LE 2 / * J l ôo

H O R M EL OR SW IFT PREMIUM

VIENNA SAUSAGE 2 / $1
SHURFINE
PEACHES 2 / $l 00

LJ M HUBS

BORDEN S CHOCOLATE

1MILK
'71 J 't 
Tv^Noacwi
i a j U  ■*' o n e
m y

m QT
CTI o 9 °

BORDER S ASSORTED FLAVORS

ICE
CREAM

' i SAL. 
W CTI.

BURRIT0S 2/*l 
B BQSAN DW ICH  89e

FO U N TA IN  DRINKS
BUY O N E T D C r  
GET ONE r K t t

A N Y
S IZE

CRISC0 $ |9 9
3 LB . CAN 1

SH URFINE s i D
IFLOUR b a g

SHURFINE LB
CRACKERS b o x

SHURFINE QT.

SH URFINE OR SHOW BOAT

P O R K ’n B EAN S  3 / 1
SHURFINE

SALAD  DRESSING 6 9 C [CRANBERRY SAUCE 7 * 1
PRICES EFFECTIVE 

JANUARY 8-10.1981

SUPPLIES LIMITED

THERE S ONE NEAR YOU’

ALLSUPS
CONVENIENCE STORES

OPEN 24 HOURS A DAY 

OPEN 365 DAYS A YEAR 
WE ACCEPT FOOD STAMPS

alencon lace encircled the edge of the 
veil. A Juliet cap completely covered 
with alencon lace added the finishing 
touch.

The bride carried a cascade 
arrangement of stephanotis, white 
roses, baby's breath, yellow roses and 
pink roses. Pearls were scattered 
throughout the bouquet with satin 
streamers and love knots.

She also wore a diamond necklace
Mrs. Mitch Wilson of Plainview 

served as the matron of honor. 
Bridesmaids were Beverly Wright of 
Friona, sister of the groom, Norma 
Barlow and Janice Coffey, all of 
Friona

The feminine attendants wore blue 
quiana gowns fashioned with blouson 
tops and tiered handkerchief 
hemlines over the floor length skirt. 
They carried nosegay arrangements 
of yellow and white daisies in a cloud 
of baby’s breath tied with satin 
streamers

David Fleming of Friona was the 
best man. Serving as groomsmen 
were Kyle Barnett, John Ingram and 
Jerry Harrelson, all of Friona

Ushers were Milon Dixon and Scott 
Fangman, both of Friona

Jenifer Buchanan of Friona, niece 
of the bride, was the flower girl. She 
is the daughter of Mr and Mrs Chief 
Buchanan.

Cam and Dee Buchanan of Friona, 
nephews of the bride, were the ring 
bearers. They are the sons of Mr. and 
Mrs. Mike Buchanan

Lighting the candles were Karla 
Wright of Friona. sister of the 
groom, and Melanie Gallman of 
Friona.

The reception was held in the 
Fellowship Hall of the church.

Ken Rogers of Amarillo, cousin of 
the bride, registered the guests.

The three-tiered wedding cake was 
decorated with blue and white roses 
and was topped with two white doves

Mrs. W Y. Buchanan and Mrs. 
M.J Buchanan served from the 
bride’s table. Serving from the 
groom ’ table were Mrs. Frank 
Ncuberger of Garland and Mrs. Bill

Mrs. ( ,nr\  W right

Yoakum of Olton
Deana and Juli Buchanan handed 

out the rice bags.
For a wedding trip to Denver, 

Colorado, the bride chose an orchid 
pants suit with a purple catteleya 
orchid corsage backed by leaves and 
pearls.

After January 12, (he couple will 
reside at 4303-C 23rd Street, 
Lubbock.

The bride is a 1978 graduate of 
Friona High School and is attending 
Texas Tech University, Lubbock

The bridegroom is a 1980 graduate 
of Friona High School and is 
attending Texas Tech University.

Out-of-town guests attending the 
wedding and reception were Mrs 
David T McVey of El Paso. Texas, 
Mr. and Mrs Wayne Rogers, Mrs 
Preach Rogers, Mr. and Mrs. Mel 
Kruse, Phil Campbell and Randy 
Phillips, all of Amarillo; Mr and

Mrs. Troy Jones of Silverton; Ben ‘ 
Wright, Sheri and Valerie of 
Nacogdoches, Mrs Gene Broom a n d '’ 
Monte of West Port, Washington.

Also, Mr. and Mrs. Mitch Wilson 
of Plainview; Mr and Mrs Bill 
Yoakum and Terry of Olton. Mr and 
Mrs. George Serbamch, Mrs. Frank - 
Neuberger, David Serbanich and 
Michael Serbanich, all of Garland. 
Mr. and Mrs. Mike Fallwell of 
Dexter, New Mexico; Mr and Mrs 
Gale Warren, David and Laura of 
Stephen ville

Also, Mrs James Cox of Ralls; 
Mrs. Luther Locke of Gordonville;- 
Mrs. Ronnie W arshaw and David of 
Slaton; Mr and Mrs Bill Weatherly 
of Canyon; Mr. and Mrs. Jesse l anc 
and Lana of Dimmitt; Mr. and Mrs. 
Rusty Lindeman of Oahly, Kansas, 
Mr and Mrs. Max Eubanks of 
Farwell; /ane McVey and Melissa 
Pruett.

O B  w e s t

144-5041
HEREFORD, TEXAS

JANUARY CLEARANCE SALE
LARGE GROUP 

FELT HATS

2 0 %  off

1 .

MEN'S
WESTERN SHIRTS j

•99!-3-*28
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JACKETS Er VESTS

JUSTIN
ROPERS

*68
COWBOY CUT 
WRANGLERS

$ 1 4 9 5

ALL OFF
ONE GROUP 
KID'S BOOTS

*19

20%
ONE GROUP 

MEN'S BOOTS

20% off
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YOUR THRIFTWAY STORES SELL & FEATURE ONLY FINE QU ALITY AM ERICAN 
GROWN GRAIN FED BEEF FRESH PORK & QU ALITY POULTRY

HEAVY GRAIN FED BEEF BLADE CUT A l l  PURPOSE FLOUR

A l l  PURPOSE FLOUR

SCHILLING PURE

HUNGRY JACKruttir tastin,ha* y 
a #» BuntRMim hjlfyH IN I I I I  I s  Hi " I k V I . I

KRAFT DELUXE amlrican pimiinto
Bi b  a mb ̂  OiDINCHtSH
S L I C E S

HtAVY GRAIN FED BEEF BONELESS

CHUCK R O A S T MINUTE M AID  CHILLED ) 0 0 \

WRIGHT'S HICKORY SMOKED 
SLAB £ |  |  /TO M ATO ES

g r o u n d  b e e f
* AVY GAAlhHDBHKIHnROJ'

[CHUCK R O A S T
L aVY 0A A IN «0 »a tl* , ',A lU

STEW CUBES
lntAVY GRAIN HD BEEF

I CHUCK S T EA K
I hIAV* GRAIN HO N il

SWISS S T E A K

A  A  RUDY S FARM  WHOLE HOG REG HOT

9 9 c PORK SAUSAGE
c  _  - q  RUDY S EA R M  WHOLE HOG REG HOT

1 9 PORK SAUSAGE

WILSON S CERTIFIED

W ILSONS CERTIFIED SLICED MEA

WE RESERVE 
THE RIGHT
TO u V lT  . WASHINGTON DELICIOUSR̂IIIORNia

l f M O N S
°R LiMts K A l KAN ASSORTED

T O M A T O
/ R A M A y

wes$or
DISH LIQUID

all vegetable

WESSON
10' O ff LABEL FABRIC

P O P C O R N
$ 1  7 9

YELLOW CLING HALVES SLICES

H U N T 'S  P E A C H E S TEXAS GREEN

CALIFORNIA FRESH

H "N T  S PUDDINGS ASSTD
STllW Ell FROZEN

SHURFINE FROZENRIGINAL EASY TO WRING CREME SOAP ON  TAP

SOFTSOAP
$ 1 2 9 SNOW CROP ORIGINAL FRUIT PUNCH

MOUNTAIN WOOD COLLECTION 
BEAUTIFUL IMPORTED STONEWARE

D ES S ER T DISH
C L A R D Y  24 O Z .  C R T .
C O TTA G E C H EES E * 1

C L A R D Y  ■/, G A L .
B U TTER M ILK

DEL MONTE IN JUICE
G L E E M
TOOTHPASTE
SCOP!

MOUTHWASH
B O D Y O N T A P
SHAMPOO

p  CHUNK 
CRUSH

j SLICE/
A  1 5 %  O Z  
>  CAN WITH EACH SS 00 GROCERY PURCHASE

P R I C E S  E F F E C T I V E  
J A N . 1 0 * 1 6 , 1 9 8 1  
D O U B L E  S T A M P S  

E V E R Y W E D E N S D A Y

D O U B L E S A H  
G R E E N  S T A M P S  

S U N D A Y ,  J A N .  1 1 t h

T H R IFT Y  G R O C E R Y  B U YS
THRIFT KING CUT

FR E S H  D A I R Y  S P EC IA LS

ALL GRINDS COFFEE
^MARYLAND

tt H D

THRIFT KING

S H ELF SPEC IALS

F R O Z E N  FO O D  S P EC IA LS

L i



Save! Discount Coupons
Enjoy great meals at REAL SAVINGS 
on delicious ‘Texas Country Foods" 
and world famous Dairy Queen frozen 
treats with these VALUABLE 
COUPONS at specified TEXAS DAIRY 
QUEEN TRADE ASSOCIATION stores, 
now through February 28, 1981

There s something FEXAS TASTIN 
GOOi tor everyone, from the 
double met  beltbu ster  to the
countrified DUDE and Ountry  
FFASKE ' Top em off with a DO- 
SHAH and a delicious DQ BANANA

Bring the family and come on In!

.../o r ihr G ood  Unify.

Coupons good only at listed Dairy Queen locations, through February Zf, 1981

D a i r i i
Q u e e n

5*
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TH ES E COUPONS CANNOT BE C OM B INED  WITH A N Y O T H ER  O F F E R  TO E F F E C T  G R EA T E R  DISCOUNTS AT D AIRY Q U E E N .
L im it  o n e  c o u p o n  p e r  p e r s o n  e a c h  v i s i t  C o u p o n  m u s t  P e  s u r r e n d e r e d  a t  p u r c h a s e

FREE D Q S h a k e  j
•gu a' »>/• a  th Dury ̂ asa of a

H u n g r  b u s t e r  B e l t b u s t e r  j

Limit i pe» coupon
Limit 0^#  COUPON p#r p# rto n  ##Ch v *■! E«p<res r #r 2S ’ 901 I

SAVE 750 OFF
f#gu*#» prce * ih  purchaa# of a

CountiyUasket
Limit 1 p*r coupon 
Limit on* coupon p*r person Men v»il Expires Pot) 28 1981

•1
I
I
I
•
I
I

FREE FRIES
'#gui#f order with purchase of a

T e x a s  G i a n t

Cheeseburger
•g. cy e

L*mtt 1 p#' COuPOn
Limit on# COuPOn p#f p#'»on ##Ch » S't E«P‘f#S F#b 28 ^901 I

-J c

FREE Cm
im*plum a /# wlh purchase of

SAVE 500 OFF
regular sk*c#

The <Dude
Um,1 1 P#’ coupon
L.m.t pn# COUPON p#< p#dOn each v»#1 t ■?•'#* t# r  28 ’ 981

. J  L

3tb«h[i TACOS
'•gu'# ' pne#

Limit 1 p# ' coupon *  . _Q , Q(n
Limit on# coupon p#r person each vi»1 E *p 'f#S F#t) 28 90

SAVE 6 5 0  OFF 

T i s h  ffif T r i e s

FREE Ha-CkaNoikte!. 11
i f#Qu«#f o '0# f > w th  purchase o* •  I  Ilr#gu>a' order) win pu'enas# of a

C h i l i D o g
L m i 1 p#r coupon
Limit on# coupor p#r p#'Son each * s i E»P'res Feb 28 1901 I

j i < E >

Lim,t t p#f coupon .  h
L im l on# coupon p#r person each v i f l  E*P'r#S F#b <ro >90i

SAVE 500 OFF
regular pne#

D E E E E -
L I S H - U S ! L m,t 1 p#r coupon .  h

Lim it on# coupon p#f person each v'S't t«p<res heo /o  ’ VO'

<3>10
T U M M Y

VMM MY II u m m  I • tfTM' n# ;*»  i # ’ V Mrt *

Cone
E ■p*r#9 F#t> 28 ’ 981

" l  r  
I  I 
I  I 
•  I  
I  I 
I  I 
I  I 
I  I  
I  I 
I  I  
I  I  
I  I  
I I

• J  k .

FREE COFFEE
V  with this coupon

"O ut Th/utki to Y ou!"WELCOME
NEIGHBOR! No purchase required

Limit 1 p#r coupon
Lim it on# coupon p#r person each visit E .p .re sF e t) 28 i9 0 i

T H ES E 10 C O U P O N S  GOOD ONLY AT TH E FO LLO W IN G  T E X A S  D A IR Y  Q U E E N  T R A D E  ASS O C IATIO N  S T O R E LO C AT IO N S :

AMARILLO
2303 S Western 
150 ' Washington 
3333 Western 

ARCHER CITY 
South Hwy 79 

BONHAM
316 E Sam Rayburn 

BORDER 
415 North Cedar 
1500 N Wam 

BURKBURNETT
625 Sheppard Dr 

CANADIAN
301 N Second St 

CANYON
2300 23rd St

A d v e rtis in g  &upf>i#m«

N W
CHILDRESS

900 Avenue F 
CHILLICOTHE 

Hwy 287 E 
CLARENDON

Mary 287 
OALHART

Hwy 87 
DENISON

206 W Texas 
2900 S Woodlaw 
1900 W Wodon 

DIMMITT 
610 S Hwy 385 

DUMAS 
202 Dumas D '

rtr t # ■

r t  r*-

e l e c t r a
601 W Front 

FARWELL
FW 292 US 84 

FRIONA
West Hwy 60 

GAINESVILLE
E Hwy 82 
822 N Grand 
501 N interstate 35 

GRAHAM
1310 Hwy 16 S 
Hwy 380 Bypass 

GRUVER 
200 N Warn

HENRIETTA
H w y  82E Bus 287

HEREFORD
801 Pars Ave 

HOLLIDAY
Hwy 82 277

HONEY GROVE 
Hwy 82 East 

IOWA PARK
505 W Hwy 287 

& Pacdic 
KNOX CITY 

Hwy 222 E
LEONARD

Hwy 69 S 
McLEAN

I AO
MEMPHIS

Hwy 287 N Delaney

MUNDAY
Hwy 277 North

NOCONA
301 E Hwy 82 

OLNEY 
Hwy 114 W 

PAMPA
112 E Brown 

PANHANDLE 
Hwy 60 E 

PERRYTON 
1014 S Wain 

SAINT JO 
East Hwy 82 

SHAMROCK 
Hwy 83 & I *40

SHERMAN
103 Sunset 
2002 E Lamar 

SPEARMAN 
Hwy 207 S 

STRATFORO 
Hwy 54 — Wain 

TULIA
808 N W 6th St 

VAN ALSTYNE 
Hwy 75 N 

WHITESBORO 
Hwy 377 

WHITEWRIGHT 
Hwy 69 N

WICHITA FALLS
1200 Central Frwy E 
3500 Iowa Park Rd 
3901 Jacksboro Hwy 
3 '3 9  5th St 
2601 10th SI 
4705 Fairway 
1208 Holliday 
2400 Kemp St 
2005 Waurme 
1606 Enterprise 
3927 Ken
3100 Widwestern Pkwy

4 Dairy  
Queen *

X #  ?

J >  -  -  V  %■ /  a

i? * *  ,  -
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