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The silt deposited by the 
high water of two weela ago 
has been boiling up in the 
gusts of wind that have been 
so prevalent during the past 
few weeks. That plus the reg­
ular dust that blows in with 
the wind is causing some kind 
of unhappiness among people 
trying to keep things clean.

The brush and debris left by 
the high •/<ater ‘>rings on an­
other concern about cleaning 
up the town.

The election was not over 
with the tallying of votes on 
June 6. There are two local 
run-offs and some state-dis­
trict and federal-district rac­
es to he decided.

We heard a new one the 
other day about decisions in 
picking candidates: some vot­
ers do not realize their need 
of an official, and consequent­
ly use all kinds of criteria as 
a basis for their vote.

The two local offices in the 
run-off, for example! Who 
needs a county clerk or a 
precinct member of the Dem­
ocratic executive committee? 

Our answer: EVERYONE!
You may never have any 

personal contact with eidier 
of those officiak officially , 
but the duties of their office 
are such that they affect very 
much many things in oi» 
lives and they should be giv­
en as much thought and ser­
ious consideration as if we 
had official contact with 
them daily!

At least that is the way it
looks to us.

The clerk keeps records of 
action of the commissioners 
court, county and district 
court, files and keeps records 
of all kinds of legal transac­
tions such as the transfer of 
titles to property, deeds, e tc ., 
keejis records of births aixl 
deaths in the county, records 
and files for record all kinds 
of agreements, leases, ease- 
rnents, all indexed, properly 
filed, etc., for easy reference. 
The clerk also takes acknow­
ledgements of all kinds, 
sworn st.atements, duplicates 
filed records and transactions 
on demand, records all bills 
ol the county and issues war­
rants for their payment after 
•luthori/ed to do so by the 
commissioners, and a thou-
s. ind .ind one other little de-
t. iils th.it affect us all direc­
ts  or indirectly.

And the party precinct menr 
ber of the Democratic execu- 
ti\e names election iudges 
and clerks, niles on questions 
brought before the com m it­
tee about candidates, ■̂<̂ oced- 
'ires, canvasses votes, names 
Successors to the committee 
when v.acancies os'ciir bv a 
committeeman mox ing out of 
bis precinct, or .leatli, or res­
ignation, generally manages 
and controls the procedures of 
elections by primaries.

 ̂ou bet the job is important 
And people should be verx 

continued to second page

Louwi^n 2  net
In 220  R ace

Peggy Louwien placed 2nd 
in the CirU' State Track Uni­
versity Interscholastic League 
events for Class A schools.

P«SRy '■sin the event in 24.8 
and the winning mark was 
24.4.

Miss Judy Holubec was the 
coach of Miss Louwien and 
accompanied her to Austin.

The race was run Saturday.
Peggy is a senior in Sander­

son High School and the 
daughter of the late H.B. Lou­
wien and Mrs. H.B. Louwien.

Sptciol Educotion 
Avoiloble Her* For 
Coitoin Studonts

Sanderson schools will be­
gin a program for 3, 4, and 
5-year old children who may 
have problems later in schooL 
This may be a full day pro­
gram, a half-day program, or 
just an hour or two a day, de­
pending upon the help the 
child may need, according to 
Supt. C.B. Card. Screening or 
finding these children will be 
done this spring and summer. 
If a sufficient number of chil­
dren need this special help, 
classes will begin with the 
start of school August 19,
1974.

Was your child slow to be­
gin walking? Did he talk lat­
er than other children? Does 
your child have more acci­
dents than other children of 
his age? If the answer to any 
of these question is " y « ”, 
persons should contact Mr. 
Card, Mrs. C.A. Ha^mes, or 
come by the principal's office 
at the elementary school.

Anyone knowing some child 
that might need these classes 
is asked to talk to the parents 
or notify one of the school 
teachers.

Mr. Card stated that the 
characteristics to look for are: 
Overly active, inferior speech, 
jxjor language development, 
slow to toilet train, physically 
handicapped, low intelli­
gence, such things as mongol­
ism, epilepsy, cerebral palsy, 
etc.

63rd Judiciol Dist. 
Seeks Grant For 
DA Office Help

The board of directors of the 
Permian Basin Regional Plan­
ning Commission met Wed­
nesday of last week to consid­
er several grant applications 
and other business.

There was an application 
by counties in the 63rd Ju­
dicial District to the Texas 
Criminal Justice Division for 
assistance in providing the 
district attorney with office 
help with administrative 
tasks.

Terrell Count> is in the 
6Vd ludicial District and 
would benefit from the ,>ro- 
ject, if the application is ac­
cepted.

Mr. and .Mrs. F.J. Barrett left 
last Wednesday for Ruitloso, 
N.M., to spend the Mimmer.

Commissioners 
Have Extra Meal

The Terrell Count>' Cc n- 
missioners Court had a special 
meeting Saturday of last 
week at the courthouse. The 
meeting was to authorize 
County Attorney Jack Hayre 
and Sid Harkins to go to Cal­
ifornia for the securing of 
easements for the flood con­
trol project in Terrell County.

Following the explanation 
of the considered need for the 
trip, the authority was grant­
ed by the commissioners. The 
two men went to Midland and 
flew to California Sunday to 
accomplish their mission.

The regular meeting of the 
commissioners was Monday 
morning at the courthouse'. 
After the reading of the min­
utes and authorization of the 
bilk presented to the court 
for payment, it was decided 
to publish a request for bids 
on the pump jack and wind­
m ill tower behind the court­
house and sell the two items 
if the bids were sufficient to 
warrant the sale.

There was a review of the 
recent accomplishments of 
securing easements for the 
flood control project and it 
was pointed out ^ a t much in­
terest had been generated by 
the high water two weela ago. 
The number of easements se­
cured and the number remain* 
ing to be secured was review­
ed, and it was ako pointed 
out that the trip to California 
by Messrs. Hayre and Harkins 
would boost the total consid­
erably, and there was another 
trip authorized to tx>rth and 
central Texas for the securing 
of other easements, and a trip 
to Florida possibly would be 
necessary to wind up the out- 
of-state easements.

There was an organization of 
the board of equalization by 
the commissioners and initia­
tion of all procedures for ac­
tion by the commissioners in 
that ca lacity.

Class Favorites 
In SHS Named

Students in Sanderson High 
School named class favorites 
in balloting recently. They 
also selected all-school favor­
ites.

Senior favorites are Delma 
Montalvo, Wynne Massey, 
Darrell Cooke, and Serjio Gal­
van; junior favorites are Ja 
Chriesman, Carlos Munoz, 
Hanna Sullivan, and Linda 
Magelgans; sophomore favor­
ites are Mario Salazar, JoAnn 
Hagejgans, Kendall Billings, 
and Bryananne Stavley; fresh­
man favorites named were: 
Randy .Massey, .Marla Bell,
Lali Luevano, and Bcrnie Cas­
tro.

The all-school favorites are 
Peggy Louwien and .Mario Lo­
pez.

Mrs. John Whiting and Mrs. 
D.K. O'Keeffe were business 
visitors m Fort Stockton Satur­
day.

■Mrs. Louise Causey was an 
overnight patient in an Alpine 
hospital on Monday for tests, 
tecture and showing pictures 
to illustrate these types.

Run-Off Due In 
Two Locaf Races

There will be run-offs in the 
second Democratic Primary, 
according to rulings by the 
T en ell County Democratic 
Executive Committee and 
die Texas Democratic Execu­
tive Committee.

Locally, the committee rul­
ed that a run-off would be 
necessary in the race for 
county clerk as the leader in 
the race, incumbent Ruel 
Adams, received 396 votes 
and other candidates receiv­
ed 399. The run-off will be 
between Adams and Mn. 
Twanna Petty, who got 196 
votes in the first primary.

There will ako be a run-off 
between W.C. Baker of El 
Paso Natural Gas Plant north 
of Dryden and Mrs. George Es­
cobar, who resides in Sander­
son, for the post of Democrat­
ic committee-person from 
Precinct 4 in Terrell County. 
Both candidates received only 
write-in votes as there was no 
name printed on the ballot, as 
no candidate had filed for the 
post. Baker received 33 votes 
and Mrs. Escobar received 29 
votes and there were seven 
votes cast for as many differ­
ent people in write-ins.

The committee met Tues­
day morning of last week to 
canvass the returns of the pri­
mary and made the decision 
following the canvassing.

There will ako be a run-off 
in the race for 70th District 
State Representative between 
Mrs. Susan Gurley McBee of 
Del Rio, who received 322 
votes in Terrell County and 
led the race in the district, 
and Stanley C. Hausman of 
Eagle Pass, who received 117 
votes in Terrell County anJ 
was the second-high candi­
date in the race.

Write-in votes will not be 
counted in the run-off pri­
mary, according to informa­
tion from the committee^and 
voting will be June 1 from 
8:00 a.m. to 7:00 p.m. at the 
same locations as for the first 
primary.

Absentee voting for the se­
cond primary is for five days 
only, according to informa­
tion received - from May 22 
through May 28 -  at the of­
fice of County Clerk Ruel 
Adams during regular office 
hours. The above dates in­
clude a Saturday and Sunday.

YPCC NAMES OFFICERS 
FOR NEW YEAR

New officers were elected 
for the coming year by the 
Young People's Chamber of 
Commerce for the new year 
and include: Joe N. Brown, 
president; Skipper Harris, 
senior vice-president; F.D. 
Fisher, junior vice-president; 
Mrs. Bill Russ, recording sec­
retary; Mrs. Larry Choate, 
corresponding secretary; Bar­
ton Massey, treasurer.

Charles Stavley is the im­
mediate past-president of the 
organization.

Mr. and Mrs. T.O. Moore Jr. 
and daughter, Angela, left 
the first of the week for a fisk 
ing trip at Lake Amistad with 
an uncle and friends.

SCSSeb Losses 
in Recent Rood

Jerry Werunohs, local work 
unit supervisor for the Soil 
Conservation Service recently 
completed a survey of local 
and area residents to de­
termine the approximate loss­
es due to the April 29, 1974, 
flood in Sanderson. He gave 
the following report to The 
Times:

"As many people and busi­
nesses as possible were contao 
ted and asked to estimate 
their total damages. Losses 
were estimated at $105,200 
which does not include in­
direct damages such as inter­
ruption of travel, evacuation 
of premises and similar losses.

Besides replacing damaged 
or destroyed material, much 
livestock was lost, according 
to Wenmohs. Damage to 
transportation facilities in- > 
eluding the railroad and high­
way were extensive, he report­
ed,a'nd many miles of fences 
were damaged or destroyed.

Although losses were not as 
great as during the 1965 floocL 
Wenmohs said it represented 
a considerable monetary loss 
for Sanderson residents and 
residents of the area.

Band Conceit 
To Be Tonight

The Sanderson Eagle Band 
is having an outdoor concert 
Thursday evening on the 
courthouse lawn.

Dick Ramey, band director, 
stated that the concert would 
be free of charge and would 
honor the graduating class of 
Sanderson High School.

Patrons of the concert are 
asked to bring lawn chairs 
or blankets to sit on the lawn.

The band will have home­
made ice cream and cake for 
sale at the concert.

Time for the concert has 
been set at 7:30 p.m.

BACCALAUREATE SERVICE 
SUNDAY EVENING

The Baccalaureate service 
for the graduating seniors of 
Sanderson High School will 
be Sunday evening at 8:00 
o'clock in the high school 
auditorium. Rev. Paul Tatum, 
pastor of the First Baptist 
Church, will be the speaker 
for the occasion.

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Richard 
of Abbeville, La., are visiting 
Mr. and Mrs. H.H. Pipes.

The oldest picture of Sander­
son that we have received is 
On page 3 - taken in 1902. 
The two-story house at the 
right is the j.M . Jones home, 
the Methodist Church had not 
yet been built. The Kerr Ho­
tel cupola top is visible to 
the left of center and the rail­
road company house occupied 
by Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Couch 
and boys can be identified 
in the center. It is interesting 
to see that there were build­
ings on the south side of 
Downie St. and facing the 
railroad. The roundhouse is at 
the left. Mrs. W.H. Savage 
loaned us the pioture.
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interested in who is elected to 
the posts and vote according 
to qualification, ability, hon­
esty, integrity, e tc ., then lat­
er go down the list of popular­
ity items, such as color of 
pajamas, kind of detergent 
each uses, and favorite color 
of exterior house paint, etc.

The Times is not being evas­
ive in not publishing all the 
details of the number of ease­
ments received and not re­
ceived for the flood control 
project. There is no reason or 
effort to be evasive.

The fact is that numbers do 
not mean anything; what is 
important is that those re­
sponsible are really busy try­
ing to get things done! If the 
list lacked two to complete, 
the two might or might not 
be an important or meaning- 
ingful number, depending on 
who it was and what was in­
volved.

We do .ret want to be in a 
position for possible accusa­
tion as being somekind of a 
hang-up in the process of se­
curing easements. We want 
to cooperate with all persons 
who are involved in getting 
the work done, whether they 
are party of the first part, the 
second part, or any other part, 
as long as some real mean­
ingful effort is being accom ­
plished.

If anyone is interested in 
knowing what easements have 
been secured and which ones 
are lacking, this can be learn 
ed from the Soil Conserva­
tion Service office, from the 
county clerk, if the ease­
ments have been turned in 
for filing and recording, from 
the commissioners or county 
judge if the information has 
been passed on to them, or 
from County Attorney Jack 
May re, who is primarily in­
volved in the securing of the 
casements.

To point some kind of a 
finger at the property owners 
who have not signed ease­
ments might be unjustly 
pointing a finger accusingly 
at some one who has not had 
.in opportunity to sign an 
easement. Or to point an ac­
cusing finger at all who have 
had an opjxjrtunity to sign an 
easement a id have not signed 
it, is not a presentation of all 
of the facts, of which there 
could be circumstances far- 
reaching and very involved.

U’c are ix)t "copping out" or 
a responsibility, we are only 
realizing our responsibility, in 
our opinion! For example, 
one of the casements has to 
be obtained by court action, 
but it will be a "friendly" 
suit, so the full story is not 
e\en told with that statement.
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DENNIS PHILLIPS RECEIATS 
MASTER'S DECREE

Dennis Phillips received his 
Master's Degree in Social 
Work on May 11 at the gradu­
ation program at the Univers­
ity of Houston. He is the son 
of Mrs. Patty Phillips.

Mr. Phillips IS employed at 
the Texas Institute of Rehab­
ilitation G Research in Hous­
ton.

Rev. and Mrs. Amado Eli­
as were in Carlsbad, N M , foi 
several days last week to have 
medical check-ups.

Mr. and Mrs. R.S. Wilkinson 
attended funeral services in 
Fort Stockton Wednesday af­
ternoon for Mrs. Nell Shannon 
of that city who died Monday 
following a heart attack. Bob 
Wilkinson of San Antonio and 
Robert Lochausen of Seguin, 
who attended the funeral ser­
vices, also visited briefly 
with the Wilkinsons.

Locol Afhltfts 
Honortd Mondoy 
Night At Banqutf

The Lions Club's annual a ll­
sports banquet was Monday 
night in the St. Janies Parish 
Hall. The occasion honors the 
athletes of Sanderson High 
School.

Charles Stavley, |>re$ident 
of the I ions Club, was master 
of ceremonies. Janice Carter 
gave the invocation prior to 
the welcome by Stavley. Kev­
in Phillips respon led for the 
honored guests.

The coaches of the various 
athletic events were introduc­
ed by Athletic Director Willie 
Myers, and they in turn in­
troduced the athletes. The 
coaches are Tommy Gray, 
Steve Burleson, Larry DeVas- • 
to. Jack Cosby, and Miss Judy 
Holubec.

The most valuable players 
in each of the sports, by elec­
tion of the participants in the 
various events, included:

Darrell Cooke, boys' basket­
ball; Peggy Louwien, girls' 
basketball; Kevin Phillips, 
boys' trac’s; Janet Harrell, 
girls' tennis; Darrell Cooke, 
boys' tennis; Jimmy Davis, 
football.

Awards were given to all 
participants in all sports, in­
cluding the all-district awards 
in football to Robert Kline, 
Carlos Munoz, and Bobby 
Spence.

The benediction was given 
by Jimmy Davis.

The banquet was catered by 
societies of St. James Catho-

MRS. ROBINSON'S MOTHER 
DIES IN AUSTIN SATURDAY

Funeral services were in 
Bandera Monday afternoon for 
Mrs. Annie Dugosh James, 80, 
a life-long resident of that 
city. She had been in failing 
health and in an Austin nurs­
ing home for several months 
and died in a hospital in that 
cit> Saturday morning.

Her daughter, Mrs. K.K. 
Robinson, and husband had 
been at her bedside for sever­
al Jays and remained for the 
funeral services.

She is also survived by five 
sons, a brother, four sisters,
18 grandchildren, and 20 
great- grandchildren.

Joining the Robinsons for 
the funeral service were their 
daughters, Mrs. W.R. McDon­
ald with her husband and two 
sons. Rocky and Rusty, Mrs. 
B.A. Pendleton and daughter, 
Sharon, Mrs. J.D. Sandifer 
and Janie, Mn. Charles 
Hutchinson and son, Wade, of 
Del Rio, hks. Philip Vargas 
and daughter, Brandi, of 
Clarendon.

Mrs. F.D. Fisher and girls 
were in San Angelo Friday to 
reUim Miss Jane Fisher, who 
has finished her freshman 
year at Angelo State Univers- 
ity.

lie Church. The menu consist­
ed of roast beef, mashed po­
tatoes, green beans, congeal­
ed salad, iced tea, rolls, and 
cake with butterscotch top- 
ping.

NUSS BILLIE KAY COCKSY 
RECEIVES HS D IPLo^ ’̂  ̂

Miss Billie Kay Cooksey « 
among the graduates of 
an High School slated to J!"'*' 
ceive diplomas May 29 r!" 
laureate services are May >?** 

Miss Cooksey finished hef*" 
high school work at mid-ter 
and is employed in that citv"' 
She IS the daughter of M, 
NVi. B.ll C . C ook ,,,. 
Sanderson residents.

Mr. and Mrs. Gene MeSpar. 
ran went to El Paso Monday tc 
visit their sons, James McSpa» 
ran and Charles Holt, and 
family.

Mrs. WA. Baiuier is visitint 
in D*Hanis with her brother- 
in-law and sister, Mr. and 
Mrs. Charlie Koch.

Clayton Stubblefield retien- 
ed home Friday after a 1,000 
mile trip of sight-seeing and 
visiting with relatives and 
friends. He has recently re­
tired and stated that he en­
joyed the trip more than de­
livering gasoline.

9RAZOR CUTTINC 
♦SHAMPOOS 

♦FACIALS

CLOSED MONDAYS
YOUR BUSINESS 

APPRECUTED

"Call Station-to-Station
and Save.”

 ̂ operator and my job is handling your Long Distance
il? Long Distance, call

station to-station. t  s the most economical way, as you can see from  
this typical example. ’

Station-to- 
Station

Person-to-
Person Savings

U . 3 5  « 3 . 1 0  n . 7 5
By calling station-to-station, this is what you save on a three-minute call to Seattle 
made t^tween 8 a.m. and 5 p.m., Monday through Friday All non-coin station

Southwestern Bell
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Stacy Fi.her, daus?hter of 
Mr. and Mrs. F.D. Fisher, has 
her arm in a cast after it was 
fr.ichired in a fall about three 
weeks ai?o. Last week she 
cau ’ht her foot in a bicycle 
and the foot was badly lacer­
ated. She was taken to Alpine 
for medical attention.

Mr. and Mrs. H.P. Boy l, 
who have been at Kingsland 
in recent months, have none 
to the Vallecito Resort in 
Bayfield, Colo., for the sum­
mer.

Mrs. J.R. Blackwelder re­
turned home Wednesday after 
visitinn for a week in Midland 
with her nranddau^hter, Mrs. 
Ernie Ayers. She brought her 
great-grandson, Ricky Ayers, 
to Sanderson while he is re- 
Ciiperating from a recent ill­
ness.

Ernest Hernandez of Indio, 
Calif., visited here Friday 
with his uncle, Teodoro Gar­
cia, and family. He was with 
a troupe of 12 actors enroute 
to El Paso.

Miss Emma Silvas has com- 
,dieted her work at an Odessa 
secretarial school and is em­
ployed there. She is the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Syl- 
vestre Silvas.

Mrs. Ben Martin left Friday 
for Hot Springs, S.D., to visit 
her son, Ben Edward Martin, 
and family. She will attend 
the high school graduation of 
her grandson, Russell Martin.

Mr. and Mrs. Weldon Cox 
went on a trip to Chihuahua 
City, Mexico, which was 
sponsored by the Fort Stock- 
ton Chamber of Commerce. 
Eight cars were in the cara­
van leaving on Friday on the 
goodwill tour of Highway 67 
with 21 adults and two ch il­
dren in the party. The Coxes 
came by El Paso for him to 
have medical attention and 
returned home Tuesday night.

Mrs. Lee Eggleston of Sweet­
water visited here for several 
weeks with her sons, G.C. and 
Philip Eggleston, and their 
families and with her daugh­
ter, Mrs. Lewis James, and 
family on the ranch near Dry- 
den. Philip Eggleston took his 
mother home the first of the 
week. Mr. and Mrs. Carroll L. 
Eggleston and family of Wink 
joined his mother here for a 
weekend visit.

Mr. and Mrs. T.W. McKen­
zie returned home Friday af­
ter spending several days in El 
Paso, going to visit with a 
long-time friend, Mrs. E.H. 
Hines, whose husband's skele­
tal remains were found on the 
government firing range there 
after he had been missing for 
17 months.

Denis Foley, son of Mrs. Ed 
Foley of Alpine, has been 
named salutatorian of the 
graduating class of the Alpine 
High School. He had a 95.45 
average. He is a grandson of 
Mrs. A.D. Brown.

Bill Stavley left Wednesday 
for Juneau, Alaska, where he 
will engage in commercial 
fishing for several months.
His wife and children have 
remained here.

Mr. and Mrs. Cruz Marquez 
and son, Oscar Marquez, and 
his fiancee. Miss Vangie 
Hranga, of Marfa, were week­
end visitors in Odessa with tK. 
Marquez's other son, Cruz 
Marquez Jr. and family. Their 
daughters, Mrs. Domingo 
Aguilar of Sun Antonio and 
Mrs. Ramon Martinez and 
family of Monahans, joined 
ihem there for Mother's Dav.

fo rm er  RESICENT NAMED 
McCANiEY SALUTATORIAN 

Manuel Jesus Garcia has 
namcil salutatorian cl 

*he 1974 graduating class of 
High School.

' lanuel n^ainl.lined an aver­
age of *>6.52. He is the son of 
‘ If- and Mrs. Honornto F. 
Garcia, former residents of 

anderson, and the ne,9iew 
o Mr, and Mrs. Teoiloro Car- 
‘‘>•1 and Mr. and .Mrs. Leo- 
» irdo Pena, all of Sanderson.

^ Jih'
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Circle II of the Prcsb>ter- 
ian Women of the Church 
met in the home of Mrs. E.E. 
Harkins Tuesday of last week. 
Mrs. jolly Harkins presided 
and read a letter which she 
received from a Brazilian girl, 
sionaored by the circle , after 
she had sent her a gift of 
money for Easter.

The group voted to continue 
their circle meetings through 
the summer. The |une 11 
meeting will be at 3KX) p.m. 
in the ranch home of Mrs. 
Gilbert Bell.

After a "wish prayer" Mrs. 
David Marx gave the lesson 
on Mark 10.

Also present were Mmes. K.
B. Kothmann, Pinky Carruth- 
ers, Charles Stegall, John 
Whistler 111, Gilbert Bell, j.
A. Gilbreath, Larry DeVasto, 
and N.M. Mitdiell Jr.

Fresh strawberries, cheese-  
sausage balb, cinnamon rolb, 
and coffee were served for re­
freshments.

Circle 1 of the Presbyterian 
Women of the Church met 
Monday afternoon in the fel­
lowship halL Mrs. R.S. Wil­
kinson presided and opened 
the meeting with prayer. She 
gave a devotional from an ar­
ticle by Bishop Everett H. 
Jones, a former bishop of the 
Episcopal Diocese of West 
Texas, in which he admonish­
ed parents to make certain 
that their children are in 
church from early infancy.

After theDoxology had been 
sung, Mrs. David Mitchell 
moderated the lesson opening 
with prayer. "How To Use 
Money -  Emphasizing Total 
Committment of All Talent 
and Resources" was the sub­
ject of the lesion, based on 
Psalm 29 and Luke 18tl8-2S.

The meeting closed with a 
circle of prayer and then iced 
tea and cold drinks were serv­
ed.

Abo present were Mmes. W. 
H. Gri^by, E.E. Farley, G.K. 
Mitchell, J.D. Nichob, G.K. 
Mitchell Jr., Sid Harkins, C.
C. Mitchell, A.H. Zuber^el- 
er, N.M. Mitchell, and W.H. 
Savage.

Jbo/ncB  & C iA il

Q & i

"The Sweet Shop" was the 
tbeaie of the dance recital 
given Saturday evening for 
the pupib of Mrs. A.K. Brad­
ford Jr.

Appropriate decorations 
were on the backdrop of the 
high school auditorium stage 
with a capacity crowd in at­
tendance at the recital.

After 14 numbers by the pu­
pib, Miss Jana Marie London 
of Del Rio, Mrs. Bradford's 
suter, gave a solo dance,  ̂
"Devibfood Cake", and then 
all appeared on the stage for 
the finale.
I Tammy Fisher presented a 
w uquet of red carnations and 
.white daisies to Mrs. Bradford.

The 24 pupib include Laira 
O'Keeffe, Toni Andrews, 
Phyllb Eggleston, Lynn Whist­
ler, Susie Farley, Melanie 
Hall, Stacy Mitchell, Cindy 
Martinez, Amy Harrison, Mar­
cella Martinez, Rita R o ^ i- 
guez, Elizabeth Walton, Lisa 
Stavley, Mary Corbett, Cindy 
Brown, Eva Walton, Ward Eg­
gleston, Mike Stavley, Billy 
O'Rourke, Matt Stavley, 
Charlotte Marx, Shanna BlacH 
Tammy Fbher, and Cinda 
Hornsby.

'Buy a Bock at The Timea

Several mothers of junior 
pupib in Sanderson High 
School planned a dance Sat­
urday night of last week with 
a large crowd of the high 
school set invited.

An out-of-town orchestra 
provided the music for the 
dance which was in the V.F. 
W. HalL

"The Roaring 20s" was the 
theme noted in the decora­
tions. Red, white, and blue 
crepe paper framed the post­
ers and pictures on the walb, 
depicting scenes, movie char­
acters, etc. of that era.

Colorful red and white 
cloths were on die quartet 
tables arranged around the 
walb of the hall and centered 
with liquour bottles.

The refreshment table was 
against a backdrop in the 
south end of the hall. The 
backdrop was formed of twist­
ed crepe paper streamers in 
red, white, and blue. A red 
and white checked cloth was 
on the table widi trailing ivy 
vines and flowers forming the 
decoration and centerpiece. 
Sandwiches, cookies, and 
punch were served.

1 SINGER SEWING CENTER 
OF DEL RK)

[Sales, Service C Repairs 
Machines, Sweepen, Parts 

[Call The Times -  2442 
for Appointment

Ifhiu,

Miss Judy Holubec, who will 
be married to Eddie Jennings 
of San Angelo on June 8, was 
I onored at a party given in 
the home of Nlrs. C.B. Card 
Wednesday afternoon. Host­
esses were teachers of the 
junior high and Sanderson 
High Schoob.

Several gifts were presented 
to the honoree.

Chocolate cake, pound 
cake, punch, coffee, mints, 
and nuts were served for re­
freshments.

Mr. and Mrs. S.C. Harrell 
went to Pontotoc Sunday to 
visit Mr. and Mrs. Fount 
Sharp before going to Buchan­
an Dam to attend the annual 
reupion there.

WHSON-SANDERS TROTH 
ANNCXJNCED IN ALPINE

Mr. and Mrs. Chester W. 
Wilton of Alpine have anl . 
nounced the engagement of 
their daughter, Brenda Kay 
to Kenneth Sanders, who is’ 
the ton of Rev. and Mrs. Ray. 
mond Sanders of Alpine, form 
er Sanderson residents. The 
young couple graduated from 
Alpine High School and he it 
employed in Alpine; she is 
employed by the Big Bend 
Baptist Association. The wed- 
ding b planned for Friday 
June 14, at the First Baptist 
Church in Alpine.

Mr. and Mrs. Honorato Gar­
cia of M cCamey, former ret- 
identt, their daughter, Mrs. 
Pete Fuentes, and grand­
daughter, Lori Fuentes, vititec 
here Friday with relatives in­
cluding hb brother, Teodoro 
Garcia, and family and his 
sister, Mrs. Leonardo Pena, 
and family.

A U T O

iQ a /iy -J3 y n i4 t Intiirone# Agtncy
Phone 34S-2221 Phone 34S-2<M7

4
Tuesday 
Bridge Club

Mrs. James Caroline was 
hosten for the Tuesday Bridge 
Club last week, entertaining 
in the dining room at Admir­
al's Steak House. Pie, coffee, 
iced tea, and cold drinks w es  
served for refreshments.

High score in the card 
games went to hfrs. F.J. Bar­
rett who shared slam with 
Mrs. John Harrison and Mrs. 
Austin Nance was second 
high.

Also present were Mmes. R. 
S. Wilkinson, Tol Murrah,
Jim Kerr, Diane Andrews, 
Carlton White, W.D. O'Bry­
ant, David Marx, and Mark 
Duncan.

VONDA PAGITT HONORED 
WITH b ir t h d a y  p a r t y

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Pagitt hon­
ored their daughter, Vonda, 
with a party in the Memorial 
Park Wednesday afternoon for 
her 6th birthday, hfrs. Gra­
ham Childress assisted with 
the party.

After the 21 little guests 
had enjoyed playing games, 
refreshments of birthday cak^  
punch, and cold drinks were 
served.

IDr. Om *r D. Pric«
orroMimirr

NEW o m c E  HOimSt

Monday then Friday 
CLOSED 6 ^  SATURDAYS

A s  Nestfi Mate Sc.
Post Stockton, Texas

2 s ^
m a v e r i c k

Chfrck Our 
Discount Prices!
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The Ranch Home Demon­

stration Club met last Tues­
day morning in the Legion 
Hall with Mrs. L.J. Haroog, 
vice-presi^ *̂**** presiding.
Mitt Eva Billings led the 
group in reciting the THDA 
Creed to open the meeting 
and Mrs. K.H. Stutes gave the 
thought for the day.

Mrs. HartJOg reported on the 
spring THDA meeting in Stan­
ton on April 4.

Vfrs. H.E. Ezelle if a nom­
inee for THDA chairman of 
the Pecos County Council and 
is also a nominee from the 
Council to the state THDA 
meeting in Amarillo in Sep­
tember.

The group voted to give as­
sistance to the Home Econom­
ics department pupils in the 
Pyote Children's Home by 
bringing to the June meeting 
scraps of all kinds of m ater- 
iab and sewing accessories 
such as thread, zippers, poly­
ester 'or making pillows and 
cushions, e tc ., also Betty 
Crocker coupons to get serv­
ing pieces in stainless steel.
A later project for the home 
will be the making of table­
cloths.

Miss Ona Mae Lee, Home 
Demonstration Agent of Fort 
Stockton, gave an informa­
tive and inter'jsting program 
on "Let's Make A Deal" that 
concerned consumer responsi­
bilities. A game preceded her 
presentation.

Miss Eva Billings, who was 
co-hostess with Mrs. Ezelle, 
gave the invocation for the 
luncheon. They provided the 
dessert, bread, tea, and cof­
fee, and members brought 
covered dishes.

An arrangement of spring 
flowers was on the table and 
a bouquet of red amaryllis on 
the mantaL

Also present were Mmes. T . 
H. Eastman, Henry Moody,
Ray Clifford, and Mark Dun­
can.

PolMal
The Sanderson Times it au- 

authorized to publish the fol­
lowing list of names of candi­
dates for respective offices in 
the political parties shown.

Names are listed in the or­
der received.

One news story, subject to 
our editing, will be published 
with each announcement free 
of charge. Other statements 
of all candidates will be paid 
for at regular political adver­
tising rates.

Rates for announcements: 
District or State, $30.00  
County, $25.00  
Precinct, $15.00.

Political advertising must 
be completely prepared and 
signed by the person paying 
for the ad, and if by someone 
other than the candidate, the 
authority of the candidate in 
whose behalf the ad is being 
published, must accompany 
the copy.

All political advertising 
mu2L be j  jp odvancti.
d e m o c r a t ic  R U N ^ ff '
State Representative 

Mrs. Susan Curley McBee 
Stanley C. Hausman

Por County Clerk 
Ruel Adams 
Mrs. Twanna Petty 

Lutings above were paid 
for by the candidates named.

G c c s l i n
Funcro  I H o m e

y h d A L  z & i a Z t i .  K i/t h , 

'£& ct,r^ d/

Miss Rosalie Kerr, bride- 
elect of Ed Johnson, was hon­
ored at a gadget shower last 
Friday afternoon in the home 
of Mrs. N.M. Mitchell jr. 
with Mrs. David .Mitchell as 
CO-hostess.

A color scheme of yellow, 
white, and green was noted 
in the decoratioru and re­
freshments.

After the gifts had been 
opened and displayed, games 
were played with the prizes 
going to the honoree.

A floral arrangement of 
yellow and white flowers and 
greenery in a large basket 
centered the refreshment ta­
ble covered in a green and 
white checked cloth with yel­
low daisies imprinted on it. 
Yellow and white checked 
napkins were used.

A congealed salad, ham- 
wrapped asparagus, cheese 
puffs, party crackers, iced 
tea, and coffee were served 
with assorted fillings and dec- 
oratioru for the pastry tarts 
served for refreshments.

Thirty-five guests attended 
the shower including the 
bride-elect's grandmother, 
Mrs. W.C. Mitchell of San 
Angelo, her fiance's mother, 
Mrs. L.A. Johnson, of Hamlin, 
and her great-aunt, Mrs. Jim 
Kerr.

PICNIC TO HONOR 
PAST O.E.S. OFFICERS 

There will be a picnic at 
the home of Mr. and Mrs. A. 
J. Hahn on Friday evening at 
6:30 honoring all past patrons 
and past matrons of the Order 
of Eastern Star. All members 
of the chapter and their fam­
ilies are invited to attend the 
picnic.
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TO THE VOTERS OF TERRELL COUNTY”

I will appreciate your vote and 
support in the D em ocratic Run-off 
Primary on June 1, for the office 

of COUNTY CLERK 
Absentee voting May 2 2 -2 8  during 
regular hours of county clerk's  
of nee at the courthouse

MRS. TWANNA PETTY

(Pd. pol. ad. by Mrs. Twanna Petty, Sanderson, Texas)

I would like lo lliank the voters of Terroll County for
»

your support of my candidacy for 
Sfafo Roprosonfafivo.

STANLEY C. HAUSMAN

A Growing Community..
The Key to Opportunity For Your Children

When a new business or industry 
moves into your town . . . your family, 
especially the children, benefit greatly 
in many ways. For example, the taxes 
that are brought In with these busi­
nesses pay for more modern school 
facilities, libraries that are more com­
plete and up-to-date as well as parks 
and playgrounds with plenty of recrea­
tion eejuipment. And when your chil­
dren are ready for jobs . . . there

could be increased opportunities for 
careers . . . close to home. Com­
munity Public Service Company will 
work with interested citizens, Cham­
bers of Commerce or industrial foun­
dations to prepare information needed 
by companies who may be consider­
ing locating in your town. Contact our 
manager for further Information on 
helping your community progress.

COMMUNITY PUBLIC SERVICE
Your E lecfhc b g h f  Sr C om pan y

An Equal Opportunity Employor

F1N74
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Alpha Theta Alpha recently 
honored its two new members, 
Mrs. Kenneth Shurley, at the

left, and Mrs. Bill Russ, right, 
at a Preferential Tea in the 
home of Mrs. Larry Choate.

J& lack
^4, )Jd4ilU ^

The Baptist W.M.U. met 
Tuesday morning in the home 
of Mrs. Gene Black with Mrs. 
O.D. Cray presiding. Mrs. A. 
N. Farley read the Call to 
Prayer and the Prayer Calen­
dar and led in prayer.

Mrs. G.H. Carter presented 
the program on "Church Plans 
ers in Guatemala" and prayer 
by Mrs. H.C. Cates closed the 
meeting.

Refreshments served consist­
ed of tropical fruit cake, 
chocolate bundt cake, nuts, 
fruit punch, and coffee.

Also present were Mmes. R. 
F. Kuethe, Harvey Rogers, A.
D. Brown, a.id Paul Tatum.

GALVAN BOYS HONORED 
AT PARTY MONDAY NIGHT

Mr. and Mrs. Alex Escami­
lla Jr. and daughter, Rachael, 
entertained with a party in 
their new home Monday eve­
ning after the all-sports ban­
quet, honoring Serjio Galvan, 
a high school senior, and Car­
los Galvan who will be a 
junior high graduate.

Dips, chips, hors d'ouv'es, 
fruit salad, and punch were 
made available throughout 
the evening for the 50 youths 
who attended. Playing p»ool, 
music, and visiting provided 
diversion.

IJTU AUXILIARY MEETS 
The UTU Auxiliary met on 

Monday afternoon at 1:00 
o'clock in the Masonic Hall 
in regular monthly business 
session which proved to be 
brief. After adjoiunment, a 
cake made and decorated by 
Mrs. Joe Rouse and Mrs. Ken­
neth Shurley was served with 
tea and coffee to Mmes. F.G. 
Grigsby, Charles Hornsby, W. 
L. Babb, Raymond Fierro, 
Donald TulK, Sylvestre Silvas, 
Mike Fielding, J.M. Davis, 
and L.J Hartrog.

AOlA
The installation ot otticers 

for 1974-75 and the pledge 
ritual to induct Mrs. Kenneth 
Shurley, a new pledge, pre­
ceded the Alpha Theta A pha 
meeting Tuesday of last week.

It was announced that the 
May 21 meeting, which is the 
last meeting of the 1975-74 
sorority year, will be held at 
8KX) p.m. instead of 7:00 p. 
m. "Secret Sisters" will be re­
vealed and a talent show by 
the members will be held.

The program, "Architecture" 
was given by Mrs. M.E. Morris 
and Miss Linda Ball, both dis­
cussing various types of archi­
tecture and shcTwing pictures 
to illustrate these types.

Mrs. Stephen Young, hostess, 
served Boston cream pie, par­
ty mix, and iced tea to Mes- 
dames J.W. Rouse, Kenneth 
Shurley, B.A. Pendleton, W.O. 
O'Rourke, Burt Williams, A.
N. Farley, Jerry Wenmohs, 
Charles Stavley, Ronnie Min- 
ica, M.E. Morris, and L.M. 
Choate, and Miss Linda Ball.

The Bonhomie Club was en­
tertained in the home of Mrs. 
S.C. Harrell last Wednesday 
afternoon. An arrangement of 
sweet peas from Mrs. Ruel 
Adams' garden decorated the 
living room.

Upon arrival, guests were 
served candy, coffee, and 
cold drinks.

The refreshments consisted 
of Mandarin orange and pine­
apple salad, cheese crackers, 
and lemon pecan Tainties.

Members present were Mes- 
dames Ray Caldwell, Harvey 
Rogers, F.G. Grigsby, Carlton 
White, and Alfred Bendele.

Mr. and Mrs. Jolly Harkins 
were in Fort Stockton Monday 
for him to have dental work.

I appreciate your write-in vote for me 
in the Democrotic Primory for Choir- 
mon Precinct 4. Agoin I osk for your 
support in the coming run-off election 
June 1. '

If elected I will do my best to serve 
the people of Precinct 4 to the best of
my obility.

W . C. BAKER

(Pol. Ad. pxl. 1̂ ’ W.C. Baker, F.l Paso Natural G.is Plant) 
11 County  ̂ Texas_____ ______

t h r e e  local s t u d e n t s
GET SUL ROSS DEGREES

Three local students were 
among the 554 candidates lor 
graduation receiving degrees 
at Sul Ross State Universits '$ 
commencement exercises on 
Wednesday evening.

Miss Clclia Silvas received 
her Bachelor of Arts Degree ir 
mathematics. She did her 
practice teaching in Alpine 
and taught in Eagle Pass for 
the last semester.

Mrs. George Escobar, the 
former Elena Calrada, receiv­
ed her Bachelor of Business 
Administration Degree. She 
did her practice teaching in 
Sanderson High School last 
semester. She is employed in i 
the bookkeeping department 
at the Kerr Mercantile Co.

Mrs. Lois Deaton VXTiite of 
Midland, daus^ter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Jack Deaton, received 
her B.S. Degree in speech. She 
did her practice teaching in 
Alpine and finished her work 
at mid-term.

All of the ,'oung ladies are 
graduates of Sanderson High 
School.

HISTORICAL COMMITTEE 
TO MEET MONDAY 

There will be a meeting of 
the Texas Historical Survey 
Committee in the library on 
Monday evening at 7:50. Any­
one desiring to do so is invit­
ed to attend.

FRANK GREENS LEAVING
Frank Green, minister of the 

Sanderson Church of Christ foi 
the past two years, has reveal­
ed the information that he 
and his family will be leaving 
Sanderson about July 1 for 
Hale Center where he will 
serve as minister of the 
church there.

Mrs. Eddie Hanson was in 
an Odessa hospital last week 
for medical tests.

Now A rrivo lt. . .
To Mr. and Mrs. >rry Jones 

of Midwest City, Okla., was 
horn a son, their first child, 
on Sunday, May 12. His birth 
weight was seven pounds and 
14 ounces and his name is 
Jerry Jones Jr.

Mr. and .Mrs. J.M. Jones are 
the paternal grandparents of 
the new arrival.

To Mr. and Mrs. Eddie Poit- 
evint o f Odessa was born their 
second child and son on Mon­
day, May 6. His birth weight 
was eight (X)unds. Mr. and 
.Mrs. W.H. Poitevint are the 
paternal grandparents.

VFW TO HAVE MEETING 
SUNDAY AFTER1400N 

V.F W. Post 8912 will have 
a special meeting Sunday at 
5:00 p.m. to elect new post 
officers for 1974-75. All 
members are urged to make 
an extra effort to attend this 
meeting. Plans will also be 
made to attend the spring 
convention of District 27 
which will be in Marathon on 
May 25 and ?6.

Visitors with Mr. and M,. 
W.G. Shoemaker and famlv 
last week were her parenu 
Mr. and Mrs. W.A. Nunley’ 
and her cousin, Mn. Marie 
Dyer, all of Rockdale; also 
Miss Glenda Shoemaker's 
fiance, Kyle Walker, of Lub- 
bock.

L.C. Hartaog had orthopedic 
surgery in an El Paso holpjjji 
Wednesday and is rejxmedto 
be in satisfactory condition. 
His son, L.J. Hart/og, and 
wife spent several days at his 
bedside. Mr. Hart/og fractur- 
ed his hip in a fall here two* 
weeks ago and was taken to 
El Paso by ambulance.

Mrs. J.M. Jones and son, 
Donald, were business visiton 
in Fort Stockton Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. A.T. Freeman 
were in Del Rio last weekend 
to visit with relatives. They 
have bought a home there 
and will be moving the la« 
of the month. A1 Word has 
bought the Freeman property 
on Cargile Street

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Clifford 
went to San Antonio last 
weekend for him to have a 
medical check-up and then 
went to Kerrville to visit her 
parenu, Mr. and Mrs. H..VI 
Flcgg. TTiey were aUo in 
Odessa for her to have a med­
ical check-up.

FIN ISH ED STONE SET JEW ELRY
is now ovoiloblo for fho Groduotes

Rings, eoirrings pint, buckles, 
tie clips, bracelets

JOSEPHINE'S CA CTU S SHOP
412 East Oak St.

GE HI-EFFICIENCY 
5500 BTU-H ROOM 
AIR CONDITIONER
•  115 V., 5.5 Amp.,

625 Watts
•  8.8 Energy Efficiency 

Ratio— more cooling per
 ̂ watt than many models of 

comparable capacity
•  3-Speed cooling or 

ventilation
•  Easy-Mount Insulation
•  10-Posit ion thermostat—  

set lower to save energy

^ 9 5
Model AGAE 906LA

LOW SALE PRICE -  SAVE $30.00.
One Week Only -  May 16 Ihrough May 23 

NO MONEY DOWN (a ll 345-2464
Bcnd G a s  C o .
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/2r O/jfe / Service

Phone 3̂ 5-2551 KERR'S
M. ,
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Bloodmobil« Visit 
H*r« It Success

■Pie San Antjelo Blood Ser­
vice came to Sanderv>n last 
Tuesday for the second time 
in recent months and %) pints 
of blood were contributed, 
bringing the total to 67 pints 
for the two trips’ to Sanderson.

Arrangements for the com ­
ing of the bloodmobile were 
made by Mrs. Joe N. Brown, 
who is working with the pub­
lic affairs department of the 
Culture Club. The ladies of 
the Young People's Chamber 
of Commerce furnished the 
food for the meab for the 
workers.

"1 would like to express my 
thanks and appreciation to 
the local residents who sup­
ported and donated blood to 
the bloodmobile," Mrs.
Brown stated. "Without your 
cooperation, it would not 
have been a success. 1 would 
like to also thank the mem­
bers of the Masonic Lodge 
who gave blood and also 
helped to get others to do­
nate. A special thanks to my 
staff of workers, Mmes. V.E. 
Keyes, Irvin Robbins, F.D.

Fisher, Barr>' Pendleton, Lupe 
Daniel, N M. Mitchell |r., 
and the ladies who furnished 
the food for the meals."

Compc'.ing the blood ser­
vice staff were Terry Dun­
can, Sylvia Sarabia, June 
Walker, and Olga Rojas, whe 
expressed their appreciation 
for everything that was done 
to make the day a real suc­
cess and for the meals fur­
nished to them.

Texas Tech students arriving 
home last week were Hudson 
Kerr, son of Mr. and .Mrs. Ed­
ward Kerr, who completed his 
freshman year; James Druse, 
son of .Mr. and \trs. Troy W. 
Druse, completing his fresh­
man year; Ronnie Stewart ant 
Miss Sheryl Stewart, son and 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. T.J. 
Stewart, who completed their 
sophomore and freshman 
years; .Miss Jackie Bob Riggs, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Riggs, who will be a junior 
next year.

^SANDERSON CHAPTER 
No. 136 0 .e s .

3rd Tuesday, 7:30 pan. 
Mrs.J.W. Sanders  ̂WM.

V '

C1ASSI|IED 
ADVERTISING

We have been hoping that 
we would not have to send 
out statements for The Times, 
*ince EVERYBODY 'S subscrip­
tion expires June 1. If you 
live in Terrell County, the 
cost IS $3 per year, and out of 
Terrell County, the cost is 
S3.so. We would appreciate 
voiir sending in your renewal.

Studio Girl Cosmetics and 
Real Silk for talc at Galaxy 
TV. 309 W. Oak. 27-tfc

FOB SALE - Fire wood - Oak, 
tnesquite, and other wood. j .  
A. Mansfield, ca ll 2222. 51-tf

Wont To Buy
Horaaa, CatUt, Shaap, Ooata, 

Any Kind — Any Numbar 
Call 3D2-20M

Offitf Pridomoro
•ax «M Oaona, Tanas

FOR RFNT -  TV sets - at 
Galaxy TV Sales, call 2622

FOR SALE 12x60 mobile 
home, furnished or unfurnish­
ed. On comer of First and 
Richard. Phone 345-2681.

WANTED - Janitorial service 
contractor for Sanderson Bor­
der Patrol Station. Bids to be 
submitted in writing before 
.May 28, 1974. See Agent-in- 
Charge Pagitt for services re­
quired. 17-4tc

Classified Advertising Rates 
First insertion $1.50 minimuir 
for 5 lines or less. Each addi­
tional line 25i. Subsequent 
insertions $1 minimum, 20t 
a line for each line over 5.

Le£a 1 Notices
St per word for first insertion, 
and 4 t  per word for each in­
sertion thereafter.

FOR SALE - New Testament 
"Today's English Version", 
extra large clear type, soft 
back, $2.95. The Times.

NOTICE
MORRISON'S STORE is open 
every Thursday evening from 
7:00 to 9i00 p.m. adv

T ro ilr  Brokut 
T ro ilT t W ifd  
Bruokowoy Kifs 
Axlut and Parts

All Requirementi For New Law

Rio Troilar Shop
807 Ave. F - Rear 
DEL RIO, TEXAS 

|S12) 775-5533

FOR SALE -  Young laying 
hens...White Leghorn Hybrid 
...$1 .50  each. See at Big 
Bend Wool and Mohair in Al­
pine. 837-2241. 19-4c

T h a n k
You

I sinctraly oppraciofa tho •fforts of 
oil of you who supportod m« in my 
compoign for tfio Stoto Logisloturo. 
Evtn though tho rosults wort not oil 
wo hod hopod for, your friondship 
ond oncourogomont hovo modo tho 
compoign worthwhilo.

Grotofully,
LEE DAVENPORT

TH \NKS, VOTERS!
1 want to thank everyone 

who has ever voted for me to 
ser\e on the Deuiocratic Ex- 
ecutixe Committee of Terrell 
County. You know that 1 have 
never solicited your vote by 
advertising or word of mouth.
I want you to know that I ap­
preciate very' much the confi­
dence you have shown in the 
past for my ability to serve 
on the committee.

Even though Marshall fMr. 
Cooke) was inveigled into 
running for the office of Pre­
cinct *3  Chairman by false 
(iretenses, according to his 
own words by phone to me 
and offered to withdraw, af­
ter he read in The Times that 
he had filed against me, I 
have complete confidence 
that he will cooperate with 
the County Chairman, Edward 
Kerr, in upholding the Elec­
tion Laws of the State of Tex­
as.

I hope every voter will have 
the "good Conscience" that 
always encourages the Com­
mittee to abide by the elec­
tion laws and not to "bend" 
them as suggested in a letter 
to the Committee.

Bess Erelle (Mrs. H.E.)
Secretary to the Democratic 

Executive Committee until 
June 8, 1974.

TO THE VOTERS OF 
TERRELL COUNTY

Dear Frienib: Words canrot 
express my appreciation for 
your support in my bid for re- 
election. Your friendship 
means more to me than any 
office that any one could be 
elected to serve.

R.S. Wilkinson 
(Pol. Ad. psi by R.S. Wilkin­
son, Sanderson, Texas)

THANKS
My sincere thanks to all the 

good people who supported 
and voted for me in the May 
4 Primary. And best wishes 
to my opponents in their run­
off.

Mrs. Aubry Harrell 
(Pol. Adv. pd. by Mrs. Aubry 
Harrell, Sanderson, Texas)

CARD OF THANKS
We appreciated more than 

words can express the pres­
ence of so many friends in the 
community and from out of 
town who shared our dedica­
tion service. It was a joyous 
occasion for all.

The Congregation of El Buen 
Pastor Methodist Church

TO THE VOTERS OF 
PRECINCT 4:

I thank all my supporters 
in the Democratic Primary 
and will appreciate their vote 
and any others that might 
support me in the June 1 run­
off election.

Elena Escobar.
(Pol. Ad. pd by Elena Escobar, 
Sanderson, Texas)

Mrs. W.E. Riggs of Del Rio 
visited her son. Jack Riggs, 
and wife for sexeral days last 
week, leaving Friday for Ira- 
an to \ isit her son, Dan Riggs, 
and family. Mrs. Jack Riggs 
took her granddaughter, Johni 
Jack Robbins, who had visit­
ed here for several weeks, to 
her home in El Paso, Mrs. W.
E. Riggs accompanying her 
on the t'lree-day trip.

Mr. and Mrs. Arturo Men 
do/a and bab>' daughter of 
McCamey were weekend vis­
itors here with her parents,
Mr. and Mrs. Elijio Bustos, 
and family.

Mrs. Elirabeth Freeman and

TO THE VOTERS OF 
PRECINCT 3:

Thank you for >our vote in 
the Democratic Primary May 
4. I appreciate yoiu- confi­
dence and support.

Mrs. T.O. (Ruth) .Moore. 
(Pol. Ad. pd by Sirs. T.O. 
.Moore, Sanderson, Texas)

THANKS!
1 would like to thank all the 

people in precinct 4 for their 
WTite-in vote that got me in 
the run-off for Damocratic 
Chairman in Precinct 4.

W.C. Baker
(Pd. Pol. Adv. by W.C. Baker, 
El Paso Natural Gas Plant in 
Terrell County, Texas.)

boys, who have been re$id,„ 
in Houston, have moved ^ 
San .Antonio. Allen Freenu. 
one of her sons, has been viil 
iting here with his grandpa, 
ents, Mr. and Mrs. A.T. 
man and Mr. and Mrs. G.Vi’ 
Kyle, for sever.M weeks.

Dr. and Mrs. Fred*\VilUrd 
and sons. Will and Benton of 
New Braunfels were weeketd 
visitors with her mother N4, 
E.F. Pierson. ’

Mrs. G. W. Kyle, took her 
mother, Mrs. W.A. Banner, to 
Alpine Wednesday afternoon 
for a medical check-up.

Mrs. Herman Couch return- 
ed to Sanderson Nbnday aftn 
visiting with her son-in-law 
and daughter, Mr. and Mrs. 
Richard Hild, and family in 
Quincy, III. Mrs. David Man 
went to the Midland Air 
Terminal to meet her.

Mrs. Bur Herron is employed' 
at Admiral's Steak House.

Mr. and Mrs. Juan Ramirei 
and five children, who have 
been residing in El Paso, have 
moved back to Sanderson. Hr 
is employed on the S.P. Rail­
road.

Mr. and Mrs. W.C. Mitchell 
of San Angelo are visiting 
with their daughter, Mrs. Ed­
ward Kerr, and family and on 
the ranch with their son and 
daughter-in-law, Mr. and 
Mrs. W.C. Mitchell Jr. north 
of Sanderson.

TO TH E VOTERS OF 
TERRELL C O U N TY :

During my compoign for Stofo Rep- 
rotontofivo I bocomo woll ocquointed 
with tho two condidotoo in tho run-off.

Thoro it no quottion in my mind that

SUSAN G U RLEY McBEE

will moko o hottor Rfprotontotive 
Hion would hor opponont. I suggest 
thot thoso who no longor hovo o fav- 
orito condidoto in Hio rpco, transfer 
their loyalty ond voto to hor.

LEE DAVENPORT

(Pol. Ad. pd. by Lee Davenport. Del Rio, Texas)

Mcknight motor co.
will close M aij l(>

THANKS -  to loyal friends who supported us 

during the past 32 years.

We are having lo dose (or ftnandal reasons— 

some people refuse to pay their hills.


