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We were told the other day 
diet there would be some- 
ditag happen aoon that would 
be a surffiie to many people! 

This is not put out juat as a 
"teaser” by ua; not by any 
meaM. We suppose that the 
only reason we're putting otst 
this information is that we 
can't stand to be held in sus­
pense all by ourselves!
There comes a time when 

we could all use some good 
news now and then, and this 
is one of those times!

The tropical storm that 
wrecked Hondivas left so 
much misery in its wake 
that it is difficult to think of 
the plight of those poor peo­
ple and come up with a hap­
py thought. Every news cast 
iM week about them indi­
cated a really serious situa­
tion concerning food, medi­
cine, disease, homes, dead, 
water. The really good thing 
about their circumstance' is 
that they don't have too 
much worry about the need 
for warm clothes.

The Eagles lost by a feetty 
whopping score to Iraan last 
week - and that's not good 
news for local fans or players. 
And with a tough and report­
edly stronger team coming 
up, there's not a lot of real 
expectation that Sanderson 
will walk away with a lop­
sided win Friday night, 
either!

The work that was expected 
to begin several days ago on 
topping the streets was delay­
ed because of the weather 
and that was not good news 
for many people who were 
anticipating the beginning of 
the work. It turned out well, 
though, in that it may have 
been damaging to the seal- 
coat to be standing in water 
»  long! So that's bad news 
and good news!
One things seems for sure! 

The way the wet weather re­
cently affected the present 
turfacing on streets of Sander­
son, we are lucky that tfie 
seal-coating was planned for 
immediately, otherwise we 
might have a tremendous loss 
0- investment.

are happy to be joined 
m Our pleas for clean-up of 
Sanderson by Mrs. W.H. Sav- 
*ge and her committee of 
‘he Culture Club. Their rea­
soning makes sense in more 
♦vays than one.

!' 1$ something that has to 
^  ilone on an individual 
ham, since there is no law 
or enforcing agency to get 
'ach [Tojwrty owner to clean 
“P his r»0(wrty.

!n watching a |>articular 
Program on "the tube" last 
^eek, there was a stressing 
O' 'he need of some kind of 
'vipsUtive controls on the 

o certain drugs that 
would conic under the "harnv 

‘'orignation of «m e | w  
P e ami agencies.

*te«t enigmas of 
••■•blued to second pagt

Tumbkw««dt Art 
Torgtf of Piojtct

Ai chairman of the Com­
munity Improvement Com­
mittee of the Culture Club 
this year, Mrs. W.H. Savage 
is making a plea to the entire 
community to go to work at 
once on a project she feels 
a ll will agree will do much 
toward improvement of our 
town.

"It's  Fall Clean-up Time 
again! W ill all join in this 
bracing activity? Right now 
let's begin by eradicating all 
noxious weeds, particularly 
the Russian Thistle or Tuiiw 
bleweed, which as you know 
will very soon ''beat you to 
the draw' If you don't watch 
out! If you wait only a few 
more days, they'll mature 
milliom of seed and with fall 
winda soon to arrive, scatter 
the seed far and wide. Then, 
next spring, we can only ex­
pect a greater crop of these 
pests," Mrs. Savage urged.

She continued: "Let's all 
join in tumbleweed destruc­
tion at once. Larry Seymore 
at the Soil Conservation Ser­
vice says tbay are in favor of 
this move lOOK, and offer 
their support to the import­
ant cause of beautifying San­
derson. Please, won't you do 
your part?", Mrs. Savage 
pleaded.

PECOS COUNTY PLANS 
NEW HOSPITAL FACILITY

Plans are for construction 
to begin in about V) days cm 
a new hospital in Fext Stock- 
ton to be built at a cost of 
S2,056,7W  after action by 
the Pecos County Commis­
sioners at their meeting last 
week. Approval of the voters 
of the county was given in a 
December 1$>72 bond issue 
election. The hospital bonds 
were issued and sold early in 
197^. The balance of $580,- 
000 needed for the project 
will be provided in certifi­
cates of obligation issued by 
the commissioners' court.

Charlie Rogers of Fort 
Stockton visited here the 
first of the week with his 
son and daughter-in-law,

.Mr. and Mrs. Harvey Rog­
ers.

Presbytery To Heef 
Here Odober S-9

About 75 delegates of Tres 
Rios Presbytery are expected 
in Sanderson October 8 and 9 
to conduct busines of that 
organization. The Presbyteri­
an sectional organization in­
cludes representatives from 
Presbyterian Church of the 
United States from El Paso to 
San Saba and Sanderson to 
Seagraves.

This it the first time that 
the Presbytery has met here 
since about 19S0.

Business will get under way 
at 10:00 a.m. Tuesday morn­
ing, according to Rev. David 
C. Marx, pastor of the First 
Presbyterian Church of San­
derson, host congregation for 
the Presbytery meeting.
There will be a worship ser­
vice at 8:30 Tuesday night 
to which all members and 
friends of the church are cor­
dially invited. The moderat­
or retiring at this meeting of 
the Presbytery will be the 
guest minister and Holy Com­
munion will be observed.

The final session of the 
Presbytery will be on Wed­
nesday morning.

O n « Dead After 
Accident Fridoy

Mrs. Arturo Urquidez, 24, of 
Alpine was pronounced dead 
on arrival at Big Bend Memo^ 
ial Hospital at 7:30 p.m. Fri­
day of last week after being 
involved in an auto accident 
east of Dryden.

She was a dietician at the 
Big Bend Memorial Hospital.

She is survived by her hus­
band, two daughters, and a 
son, all of Alpine; her p.ir- 
ents, four sisters, four bro­
thers^ _

Texas Highway Patrolman 
Ben Lockhart, who investi­
gated the accident, stated 
that the small foreign-made 
automobile apparently went 
off the shoulder of the road 
on the right and when the 
driver pulled suddenly back 
to the left, the car overturn­
ed. Locldiart stated that the 
driver of the car was not ser­
iously injured. Mrs. Urquidez 
was the only other occupant.

Braves Baal Eagles 
AI Homecoffllng 
Friday In Iraan

The Class A Iraan Braves 
used their homecoming Fri­
day night as the spur to their 
34-0 victory over the ClatsB 
Sanderson EAgles. Their ex­
tra strength and critical twn- 
overs aided their cause. It 
was the first win of the season 
for the Braves.

Iraan scored a touchdown 
in each of the first three peri­
ods, tacking on the ex^rc 
point on place-kicks follow­
ing each. In the fourth peri­
od the Braves added two 
touchdowns widi an extra 
point added after the first, 
but failing on the last.

The Eagles pxit together a 
good piassing game against 
Iraan and were able to earn 
156 yards from aerials, but 
were unable to score. Mar­
vin Davis, freshman quarter­
back, hit five of 13 passes.
He also had two interceptions, 
and this coupled with three 
lost fumbles, helpied the 
Braves' efforts considerably.

Iraan led in first downs 23- 
9; they had 265 yards rushing 
to only 60 for Sanderson.
The Braves' passing game was 
two-for-two and 43 yards to 
boost their total yardage to 
308 over 216 for Sanderson.

Sanderson was forced to 
pxint five times and they av­
eraged 35 yards. Iraan's to­
tal tivnovers were four punts 
which averaged 36 yarch.

The Eagles will host the 
Rankin Red Devils Friday 
night in a non-conference 
game. Rankin is expected 
to have plenty of opposition 
on hand for the Eagles here 
Friday night as they are peg­
ged as one of the strong teams 
of their district.

AMONG OUR SUBSCRIBERS
New sobscribers to TTie 

Times include William A.
Ford and Sam Hollmig of 
Sanderson; Jimmy R. Nuncio, 
San Antonio; Elizabeth Pena 
of Del Rio.

Renewals have come from 
joe Kerr Jr., Del Rio; Mrs.
Don Wilson, San Angelo, Miss 
Judy Miller, Midland.

New Wildcat Hole 
ToBe Drilled

Belco Petroleum Corp.,Mid- 
land, will drill the No. 1 PaW 
enham Ranch Co. Ltd., and 
11,500-foot wildcat in Ter­
rell County, 12 miles south­
west of Sheffield, 2 1/2 miles 
iKMthwest of the depleted Uni­
versity Block 34 (Atoka gas) 
field, oixe mile south of the 
depleted one-well Blackstone 
(Wichita-Albany) field and 1 
1/4 miles east aoid slightly 
south of an undesignated 
Strawn discovery.

Location it 1,320 feet from 
the south and west lines of 
S7-B2-CCSDCRGNG. Ground 
elevation is 2,300 feet.

StofamanH Sant 
Proporty Ownars 
For 1974 Taxos

Terrell County property 
owning taxpayers were m ail­
ed statements for 1974 prop­
erty this week.

The statements were mail­
ed by the Terrell County In­
dependent School District 
and by Terrell County.

A comparison of the two 
statements will reveal a dif­
ference in the total amount 
due to each of the taxing 
units on the same property.

Any questions concerning 
the statement for taxes 
should be directed to the 
taxing organization.

Mr. and Mrs. Dean Farmer 
of Ganado, Ar., were week­
end visitors with her mo­
ther, Mrs. Ruth Geaslin.

Another picture of the 7th 
Cavalry at Dryden showing 
some personnel, horse-drawn 
vehicles, and tents. Ernest 
Miller, who loaned us the 
picture, stated: "We kids a l­
ways had a fine time when 
the troops came through. 
They always asked us to sup>- 
p>er or chow, and we always 
accepted. By daylight the 
next morning, the grounds 
would be vacant and clean, 
hardly any signs of anyone 
having been there." Notice 
white stockpens in center 
background.
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Ntw Deputy Sheriff J. E. 'Slim' Hotty 
Hired To Reploce Interred Here
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continued from front pu(*

life is why people have to be 
legislated into taking care of 
themselves.

But maybe the reason is that 
we have different ideas about 
taking care of ourselves and 
what all IS involved.

One of the sayings that it 
of tome benefit to us -  taken 
in a different way than that 
originally used: "After all, 
you only go around on ce!"

But there are many differed 
opinions about the appLca* 
tion of that statement in life.

1 guess it depends on how 
you look at it!

There is a lot of persuasion 
from several sources within 
the state for persons to be 
sure they are registered to 
vote in the next general elec­
tion - November 5.

This urgency is being hand­
ed down to those who were 
not registered, and to those 
who may have moved since 
the last election and are not 
now registered in the proper 
precinct

It has been pointed out that 
it IS necessary to change your 
residence registration when 
moving from one precinct to 
another.

N«w Aivfvok

Church of Christ 
Slotos 4-Doys Of 
Spociol Services
Dr. Edward E. Coates, inter­

im minister of the Highland 
Church of Christ in Abilene, 
will hold a 4-day gospel 
meeting here October 6-9 , 
according to Charles Draper, 
minister of the local Church 
of Christ.

The services will be at the 
regular time Sunday -  10:90 
a.m. and 6K)0 pi.m., and on 
Monday through Wednesday 
at 7:00 a.m. and 7:90 p.m.

Dr. Coates was a revival 
speaker here in 1955 while 
he was teaching school in 
Balmorhea.

Dr. Coates has been at Ab­
ilene Christian College for 
two years as associate profes­
sor of education.

All members and friends of 
the church are extended a 
sincere and warm welcome 
to attend the series of sp«ciai

To Mr.and Mrs. Tommy J. 
Couch was bom a son weigh­
ing eight pounds, 14 1/2 > 
ounces in an Alpine hospital 
on Saturday, Sept. 21. His 
name is Tommy J. Couch 111.

Mrs. Ignacia Benavides is 
the maternal grandmother.

BOB KRUEGER VISITS
Democratic nominee for U. 

S.Congress, Bob Krueger of 
New Braunfels, was in Sander­
son Wednesday of last week 
to visit supporters and meet 
new friends. Kfr.and Mrs. 
Charles Stavley hosted a cam 
paign reception for the candi­
date at Admiral's Steak 
House.

Krueger spoke to the group 
on national issues and there 
was a short question-answer 
session.

PAP TEST CORRECTION
The information received 

by the local unit of the 
American Cancer Society in 
regard to the results of the 
Pap Smear C linic" here May 
4 was erroneous, according to 
later information. The local 
unit was recently informed 
that there were four of those 
tested who required further 
testing, but each woman was 
contacted b>' her pihysician.

Opjen
Monday Thru Saturda> 

8KK) a.m. - 6:90 p.m.

Your P.ifron.ne Appreciated

services.

Tony Robinson
Terrell County Sheriff Dal­

ton Hogg told The Times 
Monday night that he had 
hired Harvey Glenn, 52, as 
depnity sheriff. His duties will 
begin as soon as he arrives 
from Dimmit, and cxpiected 
to be within the next week, 

Hogg stated that Glenn had 
been in pwace officer work 
for a long number of years 
and came here with high 
recommendations.

Hogg also stated that Tony 
Robinson, who has been dep>- 
uty sheriff for several months 
and given his resignation ef­
fective Cctober 15. Robinson 
planned to continue his edu­
cation at Angelo State Uni­
versity, according to Hogg. 
Mr. and Mrs. Robinson and 
their children will return to 
San Angelo within the next 
two weelo to make their 
home.

Mr. Robinson stated that he 
had made several close 
friendship's while in Sander­
son and had many nice and 
complimentary things to say 
about the citizens of the coui> 
ty, classifying them as the 
best bunch of people he had 
been privileged to know. He 
said that he was grateful for 
the friends that he had here 
and would always remember 
the kind favors shown him 
and his family.

Sepd The Times to someone

f

John E. (Slim) Hasty, 57, 
died in a San Antonio hospnt- 
al last Thursday morning fol­
lowing surgery there several 
days previously. He was a 
victim of cancer.

Funeral services were in 
Sanderson in the First Baptist 
Church Satur.lay afternoon 
with Rev. Paul Tatum, p«s- 
tor, officiating and burial 
was in Cedar Grove C em e­
tery. Doran Funeral Home of 
Del Rio was in charge of ar­
rangements.

He was born in San Angelo 
on October 2, 1916. He had 
resided in Sanderson for many 
years before moving to Del 
Rio a year ago. He was a 
machine opierator on the S.P. 
Railroad having been employ-' 
edonthe railroad for 92 years.

His survivors include his 
wife, Mrs. Zada VanCleave 
Frazier Hasty; two sons, John 
E. Hasty |r., and Fred Hasty 
of San Antonio; also two 
grandchildren.

Pallbearers were Ray C lif­
ford of Sanderson, F.A. Lang 
o f San Antonio; W.L. Kessler, 
R.B. Calderson, C.E. Tetford, 
Joe Castillo, and G.O. Gon­
zales, all of Del Rio.

Among out-of-town rela­
tives here for the funeral 
were Mr. and Mrs. J.E. Hasty 
Jr., Mr. and hfrs. Fred Hasty, 
and Mr. and Mrs. Cory Chil- 
dreu, all of San Antonio;
Mrs. Alta Scott and Mr. and 
Mrs. Johnny Scott of San An­
gelo; Mrs. T.L. Colston of

Thr«« Atttnd SCS 
Ar«o MMting
The Rio Gramle-Pecos Riy. 

er Soil and Water Conserva­
tion District directors joe N. 
Brown and Roger Rose, and 
District Conservationist Lairy 
Seymore, of the Soil Conserv 
ation*Service, attended the ' 
Far West Texas Association 
meeting in Van Horn Sep­
tember 24.

Those on the program were 
Dee Brune, president of the 
State Association of SWCDs; 
Texas Congressmen Richard 
Slack of Odessa and Jim Ras­
ter of El Paso; Joe Antilley, 
State Soil and Water Board 
Member; and L.F. Stewart, 
field representative of the 
State Soil and Water Board.

New officers were elected 
for 1974-75. Cne of the main 
issues discussed at the meet­
ing was "Land Use Planning". 
The subject was discussed 
through a letter from Ken­
neth Kuykendall, vice-presi­
dent, Association of Texas 
SWCD.

Mr. and Mrs. Barton Massey 
were weekend visitors in Fort 
Worth with their daughter. 
Miss Wynne Massey, who is 
attending Tarrant County 
Junior College.

Tyler; Mr. and Mrs. Ray 
Barnes, Fort Worth; Mrs. Nena 
Dickey, Hobhs, N.M.; Mr.’ 
and Mrs. Sam Jeffers, Texas 
City; Mr. and Mrs. E.P. San­
ders, Lubbock.
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tracU will total nearly |20 
million.

Texana cut aasoline con-
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lexana cut gasoline con-
aurnption sharply, but e lec  «  S n f l# * P a ia v « a r
tncity consumption increased *  I I I I I  AH It  ^ | Jitt./ t7H itV t?r

AUSTIN—Texaa foeemmen-
S .  need »<> ^ 6 2

rnillion over the next five 
years to improve tiwapoita- 
tion systems, according to • 
Texas Mass Transportation 
CominiMion staff estimate.

A TMTC preliminary de­
velopment plan propoaea $666 
million worth of rail system 
improvements and construc­
tion and $286 million for bus 
systems.

The sute, the report con- 
eluiM, must come up with 
i4f«i for moving an increas­
ing number of travelers 
tmong major cities by rail, 
new expressways parallelling 
existing ones or other means.

If travel increases as fast 
u  expected, according to 
one authority, traffic on In­
terstate 35 between San An­
tonio and Dallas may be as 
congested by the year 2,000 
u  it is on tlie Gulf FYeeway 
in the Houston area.

Coat of developing mail 
passenger facilities presents 
a generally unhimpy picture. 
Riulroads, according to TM­
TC Director Russell Cum- 
minp, are not enthusiastic 
about starting up new pas­
senger service or turning 
their tracks over to any 
agency for paasenmr haul­
ing in conflict with their 
freight business.

Only 18 cities in the state 
still maintain transit sys­
tems, as compared with 87 
such systems 20 years ago, 
TMTC was in form ^  But use 
of transit systems Is ex­
pected to increase three-fold 
by 1990. Buses are projected 
to handle 75 per cent of the 
future load, i^ l systems 18 
per cent and “specialised 
systems” seven per cent. 
LEASES TAKE UP—Cash 
bonus payments totalling 
more than $7.8 million 
reached the state Permanent 
University Fund from a re­
cent oil and gas lease auc­
tion on University of Texas- 
owned lands.

More than 123,640 acres 
were leased for oil and gas 
exploration. With deposits 
of the cash bonus payments 
the Permanent University 
Fund increased to $678,- 
332,143.

Biggest areas of interest
were Loving and Ward coun­
ties.

Superior Oil Company paid 
the largest cash bonus— 
^10,000 for a 640-acre tract 
in Ward County. Chalfant, 
Magee and Hansen were suc­
cessful bidders on a 320-acre 
tract in Ward and Loving 
counties with a |435,000 cash 
bonus.

Land Commissioner Bob 
Armstrong, chairman of the 
Board for Lease of Univer­
sity Lands, said increased 
demands for energy are be­
ing reflected in all public 
l»nd lease sales. 
INDUSTRIES INCREASE— 
Thirty - one new industries 
with a combined annual out- 
put of over $8 million located 
*"r/^*** touring August. 
.Total economic impact of 

the 31 firms was estimated 
by Texas Industrial Commis- 
»ion and the University of 
texas Bureau of Business 
Kewarch at more than |129 
million a year.

The 31 new industries are 
exacted to generate |7.7 
million a year in federal 
. ’‘f*! >550,943 in local taxes 
•nd 1502,943 in state taxes, 
•nd to create 1,743 new jobs 
2 2̂ 1̂ ■ *pinoff of another

industries located in 
n Amarillo, Athens, Aus-

« Port Arthur, Brownsville, 
Tenter, Coleto Creek, Chan- 
nelview, Del R|o, Diboll, 
'Report, Houston, La Porte, 

•oi’A'iew, Lufkin, 
JJadisonville. .Mineral Wells.

Rocksprings, 
Texarkana. Wharton. Weath-

•"L^'<-hita Falls.
> '^9 k k d  o v e r  — a

itm u "^''-committee began 
on rights to rer- 

Depart-
.. ill* of Public .Safety sur- 

•‘■tivities involving 
private citixens.

colleges and universities is 
up about five and a half per

DPS Chief Col. Wilson 
Speir agreed the legislature 
should furnish guidelines, 
but he warned against re­
straints so strict as to inter­
fere with law enforcement 
efforts.
ENROLLMENT UP—SUte- 
wide enrollment at Texas 

leges I 
about

cent above 1975, far above 
the national projection of a 
1.3 per cent nationwide in­
crease.

P re lim in a ry  tabulation 
shows total enrollment of 
549330 students at Texas 
public, private, junior and 
senior institutions. This is 
28,300 more than the fall 
semester of 1973. Two hun­
dred and seventy five thou­
sand of the students are at­
tending public senior col­
leges, 201,400 at public com­
munity colleges.

Even the private institu­
tions in Texas are growing. 
Their total enrollment of 70,- 
800 represents a 1.4 per cent 
increase over the 1973 head- 
count. About 10 of the 37 
may experience some decline 
in enrollments.
AG OPINIONS—Voters who 
participate in party primary 
elections are not eligible to 
sign applications of indepen­
dent candidates where nomi­
nations for the office sought 
are made in primaries, Atty. 
Gen. John Hill held.

In other recent opinions. 
Hill concluded:

• State employees who 
leave their jobs before com­
pleting six months’ service 
are eligible for no accrued 
vacation time.

• State licensing of pri­
vate child care facilities does 
not sufficiently implicate the 
state in' the policies of the 
institutions to make their 
discriminatory practices a 
“state action” for constitu­
tional protection purposes.

• Receipt of guaranteed 
annual wage payments does 
not render an individual out 
of work ineligible for state 
unemployment compensation.

• When an employee given 
a merit pay raise is pro­
moted, funds become avail­
able for merit raises to 
others in the agency.

• Director of the Division 
of Parole Supervision is not 
the executive head of a state 
agency, and the Board of 
Pardons and Paroles is legal­
ly responsible for his conduct.

• Co’inty clerks have no 
authority to issue certified 
copies of letters testamentary. 
APPOINTMENTS—Dr. Lor- 
ene Rogers was named acting 
president of The University 
of 'Texas, Austin, after Dr. 
Stephen Spurr was fired.

Gov. Dolph Briscoe ap­
pointed Ronald Lee Wilson 
of Texas City to be 212th 
district attorney for Galves­
ton County, succeeding Jules 
Damiani who became mstrict 
judge.
COURTS SPEAK — Texas 
Court of Criminal Appeals 
unanimously upheld 1972 
convictions of former House 
Speaker Gus Mutscher, for­
mer State Rep. Tommy 
Shannon and Rush McGinty 
for conspiring to accept a 
bribe in the famous Sharps- 
town case. All received five- 
year probated sentences.

The State Supreme Court 
ordered Secretary of State 
Mark White Jr . to certify 
Socialist Workers Party can­
didates for the November 
general election ballot unless 
he could prove their petitions 
insufficient with a name-by­
name check of 65,000 signa­
tures. White, changing his 
September 11 decision, certi­
fied the candidates.

SHORT SNORTS
A new Calendar of Texas 

Events for October - March 
lists 20 sUte, county and re­
gional fairs.

The Start! Textbook Com­
mittee meets here Tuesday 
(Oct. 1) to hear protests 
against textbooks being sub­
mitted for adoption. Con-

tricity consumption increased 
8.1 per cent from last year 
(based on a May figure), 
according to a govemoPs of­
fice energy report.

Governor Briscoe approved 
more than $1.9 million in 
criminal justice grants for 41 
projects.

Way has been cleared for 
final application to transfer 
12 old ships to four deep­
water sites where they will 
be sunk to enhance the fish 
harvest.

Texas Water Rights Com­
mission adopted a new policy 
requiring water district de­
velopers to contribute up to 
30 per cent of cost of water, 
sewer and drainage facilities.

A $438,100 federal grant 
was forwarded to Texas for 
reimbursement of energy 
management programs ^ is  
fiscal year.

Rasa Unida party at its 
state convention in Houston 
elected Lupe Youngblood of 
Robstown its state chairman, 
succeeding Mario Compean 
of San Antonio.

Notable Quote
“We are reaching the point 

that every time a businessman 
tries to make a move to hire a 
new employee, develop a new 
product, market a new prod­
uct, expand his plant, move 
into a new city, merge with 
another company, negotiate a 
labor contract, ship his goods, 
or raise new capital, he is con­
fronted by a regulation that 
says he cannot do it unless a 
federal agency approves.”

— Rep. James M. CoBliis 
(D>Tcx.)

85 percent of the world's 
energy resources arc in either 
coal or uranium. The United 
States has sufficient resources 
of both. Oi ly eight percent of 
the world’s energy resources 
are in oil and natural gas. 
However, 75 percent of all 
energy used in the U.S. comes 
from petroleum or natural gas.

Need any office supplies/ 
Try The Times FIRST!

Do you know what microfiche is? It's best described as mini- 
microhlm. The heart of the system is the hchc itself, a 4''x6‘' 
film miniature that can hold information contained on 270 sheets 
of I l ' 'x l4 ‘’ computer printout paper. A single 24-square inch 
hche contains the same amount of information normally recorded 
on 288 square feet of paper.

Lise U/einl Acts'-Theu ^ei fpesu lisl

MOBILE
HEARING TES T LAB
DON PENDERGRASS

Certified Hearing Aid 
Audiologist

Hearing Aid Specialist
from Odessa

(Dcic&et̂  Sfh
S'.oOmrIZtum

for the purpose of oondttccfng 
hearing tests and hearing aid

consultations.

All hearing aids fitted with medical 
approval by a Doctor of Otolaryngology

Hearing Aid Repoir and Batteries alto 
ovalloblc.

When a man says in public 
what he says in private, 
he is all that he says he is.

Open, honest communication is at the 
foundation of good government And 
credibility

Doug Harlan, a lawyer and former 
government teacher, is saying in this 
campaign the things he believes 

Privately and publicly he's speaking 
out (or a lower cost of living and a bal­
anced Federal budget For a Man's Right 
to Work And for dealing with our water 
problem before it becomes a crisis 

If you re for continued conservative 
and enlightened representation in 
Washington then you're lor 
Doug Harlan 

He's all that he says he is

P.4Hic.lM)wfi>«>«« e*idta<bTfri»ndtorOoutH.«<an W C Conwa. Chairman Ona Remana Ha«a San Xn«onia Ta.at XI70S
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C«nn*d vegetable

by G E O R C iE  M A C iE lX )R N
Chief Economist. National Association oi Manufacturers

The real economic danger 
ahead is not that see Mill have 
some kind ol eci'nomic setback 
in 1974 and 1975 We have al­
ready had It. and while there 
may be some improvement in 
the next year and a half, hardly 
anybody expects that 1974 or 
1975 will be a great year or 
even a very gvHKJ year

The real danger is that, in 
this atmosphere ol economte 
performance widely regarded as 
sub-par. policymakers will turn 
again to hscal and monetary 
stimulation as the needed tonic. 
That kind of move might in­
deed succeed for a while in 
pepping up the economy. But 
It would alsiv give one more 
turn to the inflationary screw 
W'e would very likely wind up 
(if not immediately, after an 
interval of a couple of years) 
with a rate of price climb even 
worse than the horrendous rate 
of the past year.

The reason for this fear is 
that, during the past 10 years, 
we have twice before faced the 
same general economic situa­
tion wc face now. Tw ice before 
national economic policy was 
reversed— from fiscal and mon­
etary restraint to curb inflation, 
to fiscal and monetary stimu­
lation to restore full employ­
ment Twice before we wound 
up. two to three years later, 
with prices rising faster than 
at the start of the process, and 
the whole job of restraining 
inflation to be done over aga»n.

At this point the economic 
situation again resembles the 
conditions of early 1967 and
m id -1971 The economic slow­
down again is worrying gov­
ernment officials. Again there 
IS impatience with the appar­
ent fact that the slowdown has

QUEEN OF FESTIVAL 
IS KNOWN LOCALLY 

M iss Elsa Valles, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Pablo Valles 
of Monahans, was named 
Queen of the Catholic Men's 
Club Festival in that city on 
Saturday, September 14. She 
IS a 16-year-old sophomore 
in Monahans High School.
She collected 51,080 votes in 
her campaign which was 
sponsored by a service station 
there. Miss Valles is a grand­
daughter of Mrs. San Juana 
Borrego of Monahans and Mrs. 
Maria Marquez of Fort Stock- 
ton.

Mrs. Dimas Lopez is employ­
ed at the C.G. Morrison Co. 
store.

Yo u r CoRfresunen aod Sea- 
•*o r\ arc voliug often these 
days on porkethook iasues and 
«»thrr priiftranix n h k h  may be 
of dirrcl inlerrsi to you. \5alrh 
their votes and y«Hi will hr 
able to iudge better how N» 
vote in the fall. > our vote may 
make a big diflrrencr. In C>eor> 
gin's fourth i ongressionsil dK- 
trirt in l9bA. KepuM kan Hen 
Rlm kburn won by onlv .4*tt 
votes out of I Itl,l.'ltt votes cast.

not helped to contri'l inflation 
Again we hear calls lor resiim- 
ul.iiing ihe ecimomy.

USDA
AgrtcuBurai Markoting Sorvica 

As of mid-September, the supply situation in October is expect­

ed to look like this . .  .

RED MEATS —

to be 'moderately la,
a big ,n c ,„ ^

of tometo nrcvti.r*. ... .tometo product, due ,0 a

plentiful «'**tob*

I he (  hairman ol ihe I ed- 
eral Reserve System has indi­
cated his firm delerminalion to 
resist any shill lo a more liberal 
money and credit policy Hut 
he IS under heavy pressure. It 
IS a question whether he will 
he able to maintain his position 
if a serious credit shortage re­
sults and if the recovery of the 
housing industry is retarded by 
a lack of funds for financing 
mortgages

In C'ongress there are advo­
cates of a hroad-gaugc tax cut. 
amounting to a S6 billion loss 
in federal revenue. This, it is 
argued, would restore purchas­
ing power and bring us out of 
the present recession, slowdown 
or whatever you want to call it.

If we listen to these siren 
songs, and once again under­
take to stimulate the economy 
to a higher level of output and 
employment, we will establish 
the base for a fourth wave of 
inflation. It will surely he worse 
than any of the preceding three 
waves including the present sit­
uation.

The alternative is to endure 
a pericHl of sluggish economic 
conditions, lasting for perhaps 
two to three years. This will be 
our penance for past inflation­
ary sins. The only thing you 
can say in favor of that course 
of action is that the penance 
gets worse the longer you dc- 
lay it.______________

Bnnf to continue plentiful, 
with production record large 
for the month. This mostly re­
flects larger supplies of lower 
grade beef.

Hork supplies to be ade 
quate. Output, nearing the sea­
sonal peak, will exceed the 
year-ago level. Production, 
however, will be below the Oc­
tober 1970-72 average.

POULTRY & EGGS —
Eggs to be adequate, with 

output about 2 -3 %  below the 
relatively low level of October 
1973 and about 6 -7 %  below 
the 1971-73 average.

Broiler-fryers to be limited, 
with production 1 0%  less than 
a year ago and 2 %  under the 
1971-73 average.

Turkeys to be plentiful, with 
marketings 1 0 %  under Octo­
ber 1973, and 8 %  below the 
1971-73 average. Cold storage 
stocks remain at record, one- 
third more than the 1971-73 
average.
MILK R DAIRY PRODUCTS —

Fluid milk, butter, chMse. 
and ruMifat dry milk to be ade­
quate. though production will 
decline seasonally. Commer­
cial stocks of cheese to be at 
record levels, and stocks of 
butter and nonfat dry milk well 
above the 1971-73 average.
FRUITS, VEGETABLES. NUTS

Fresh cranberries and cran­
berry products to be plentiful, 
with total output at near rec­
ord level —  6 %  above last 
year and 4 %  above the 1971- 
73 average.

Pears to ba plantiful. Pro­
duction IS estimated to be close 
to last year's and 4 %  above 
the 1971-73 average. Bartletts 
will still be availabie, and rec­
ord Pacific Coast crop of main­
ly Bose and An|ou vanetias is 
being harvested.

Apple supplies to be ade 
quate. The commercial crop 
ils slightly below last year's, 
but equal to the 1971-73 av­
erage.

Fresh grepes to be adequate. 
Production in California, whara 
most fresh grapes originate, 
is down 3 %  from 1973, but 
1 7 %  above the 1971-73 av­
erage.

Canned non-ettrus fruits to 
be adequate with larger pro­
duction rebuilding inventories.

Citrus juices, particularty 
frozen concentrated orange 
juice, to be plentiful. Stocks of 
Florida frozen orange juice at 
the end of August were 9 %  
above last year’s large supply.

Raisin supplies to be larg­
er than the big 1973 crop. 
Dried prunes to be plentiful 
despite output down 2 9 %  
from last year, but larger than 
the 1971-73 average.

Onions to be plentiful, based 
on a 1974 storage crop 17- 
1 8 %  above last year and the 
1971-73 average.

Potetoee to be hitting their 
seasonal peak. The fall crop will 
likely be larger than the lim­
ited 1973 supply. Frozen po­
tato stocks on August 1 were 
up 1 7 %  from last year, but 
1 8 %  less than the 1971-73 
average. Supplies of both to

Peanut, to be plentiful. End 
of-July ,tock, Mere 27A£. 
e ^ v e  a year earl.er, and the 
1974 crop I, nearly a, largl 
as racord 1973 one. ‘

Walnuts to be plentiful Cur­
rant crop I ,  down about 19«/ 
from 1973', record crop t j  
about equal to the 1971.73 
average.

Almonds to be plentiful 
with production at record lev­
els. 3 4 %  larger than previou, 
record crops in 1971 and '73

GRAINS & L E G U M E S -
Rice to be plentiful, with 

record production 22%  above
the 1973 cro p  —  up 6%  from 
the August forecast Crop i, 
expected to be 29%  above 
the 1971-73 average.

Dry beans to be plentiful, 
with record output 30% above 
a year ago and 26% above 
1971-73 average. Dry pea pro­
duction to be more than dou­
ble last year's, and 36% above 
the 1971-73 average.

Whnat supplies to be ade­
quate for U S. needs Produc 
tion is expected to be at 1 
record high —  5%  above last 
year and 1 0%  above the 1971- 
73 average.

Com  supplies for food use 
to be adequate, with produc­
tion 1 1 %  below 1973’s record 
crop and the 1971-73 average.

Rice Supply Record-Large
USDA’s Agricultural Market­

ing Service has issued a spe­
cial Food Marketing Alert to 
rem ind consumers of this 
year's rscord-large rice crop. 
It's estimated at 113.5 million 
hundred-pound bags.be adequate.

Terminology used: PLENTIFUL —  More than enough for requirements. ADEQUATE —  Enough to 
meet needs. LIMITED —  Less than adequate; not enough for normal needs.

Cook Meals
in Minutes...

w l l h  a  M I c r o w a v o  O v o n

usu a U im p ^^'th  delicious meals . . . prepared in a fraction of the

foods can h ' pa^s to wash because

and food*; rpt cooking time is reduced so you save electricity
to worrv ahr^ flavor and vitamins. W hat’s m ore, you no longer have

L T u r  d .a ^  spills and splatters w o n ’t bake on
bee your dealer soon for a modern microwave oven.

COMMUNITY PUBLIC SERVICE
Krv/r /  l ,H r K ' U jh f  / U v r r  C iH iifV im j

An Equal Opportunity Employer
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aturJav evening l̂OO 
• lock in St.

, ,nd David Clvera were 
•ted in marriage, Rev. 

hn Pierce officiating at the 
uble-ring wedding r*tes. 

lArrangements of pink and 
carnations and white 

adiolus decorated the altar. 
Mrs. J.M Davis was organ-

The bride was given in 
irriage by her fsarents, Mr. 
id Mrs. Siivestre Silvas, the 
idegroom and his parents,
. and Mrs. Rodolfo Olvera 
Carriio Springs, meeting 

icm at the altar.
The bride's gown of pearl 

,hite satin with self-trim 
[nd fashioned by her mother, 
d a fitted bodice with V- 
ckline, short puffed sleev- 
and flared skirt and was 

immed m pearl white lace, 
er waist-length veil of il- 
isjon was attached to a 
own of tiny forget-me-nots 
shioned from pearls. She 

amed a bouquet of white 
arls.

I Mrs. Manuel Parada Jr., 
cusin of the bride, was the 
atron of honor and the 
aid of honor was her sister, 
iss Emma Silvas, of Cdes- 
. The bridesmaids were 
issClelia Silvas of Odessa, 
ster of the bride. Miss Irene 
Ivera of C.irriro Springs, 
ster of the bridegroom. Miss 
ene Garcia of Carrizo 
pings, Miss Melinda Maldo- 
ado of Odessa, cousin of the 
ide. M iss Rosa Mancha of 

agle Pass, and Miss Hope 
ortez of Odessa.
The matron of honor's floor* 

ength gown was identical to 
e bride's; the maid of hon- 

r wore a gown of small pink 
oral print on white crepe; 
le bridesmaids' gowns were 
f beige crepe with small 
ink floral ;rint.
The junior bridesmaids, 
ilda Rocha, cousin of the 
idegroom, and Sonya Mu­
ir, both of Carrizo Springs, 
ore gowns of pink crepe 
ith dark pink floral print. 
Manuel Parada Jr., cousin 
It the bride, served as best 
an. The groomsmen were 
eresmo Garcia and Ismael 
Ivera, cousin of the bride- 

;room, both of Carrizo 
pings; also Onesimo Martin- 
r of Asherton, Lupe Martinez 
f Eagle Pass, Domingo Rod- 
iguez of Sweetwater, Alfred 
f̂crales of Midland, and Ro- 

and Valles, Tony Calzada, 
md Sandy Silvas, brother of 
he bride, of Sandersotu 
berapio Picaso Jr. was the 

mg bearer and Bebi Silvas 
'f San Antonio was the flow- 
r girl. Both are cousins of 
he bride.
A reception in St. James 
all followed the wedding 
nd later an out-of-town or- 
hestra povided the music 
ot dancing.
The bride, a life-long resi- 
«nt of Sanderson, is a gradu- 

late of Sanderson High School 
and after receiving her de- 
Pee from Sul Ross State Uni-

iMUdeaf?
khicago, liu A free offer of 
special interest to those who 

not understand 
I r. u * announced byI  ̂nnn-operating
ai^* smallest Bcltone

will be given
» to anyone re-<lwting It.

T^isis not a real hearing 
tin’ . show you how

fuaT'i ^

and it's all
w,r« / 'V  ’ “" ‘t- No

tl ffom body to bead.
w.r,: 7 'o

DeJ tod.iy to
iesVor^’ a*?''*®" fTciiron- 

•. Chicago, III.,

Al|4ia Theta Al(4ia met the 
evening of Sepemher 24 at 
Mrs. Bill McDonald's home.

The next two meetings will 
be held at 6:30 p.m. instead 
of llie usual 7:00. The Octo­
ber 8 meeting will be at the 
courthouse; the October 22 
meeting at the home of Mrs. 
Bill Russ after which will be 
the "rush iiarty".

The program "Self-Analy­
sis" was conducted by Mrs. 
W.O. O'Rourke and l^s. L.
M. Clioate. An analysis 
chart was given to each men> 
ber and the resulting average: 
were told. An informal dis­
cussion followed.

The hostess served apple 
dumplings, cheese and wheat 
bits, mints, and chocolate 
coffee to B ^ e s . B.A. Pendle­
ton, A.N. Farley, Burt Willi­
ams, Kenneth Shurley, M.E, 
Morris, C.H. Stavley, Ronnie 
Minica, L.J. Hartzog, W.O. 
O'Rourke, and L.M. Choate; 
Miss Linda Ball^and Miss Judy 
Justus who was a guest.

Mr. and Mrs. F.J. Barrett re­
turned home last week after 
spending the summer in Rui- 
doso, N.M. Enroute home, 
they visited for several days 
with their son-in-law and 
daughter, Mr. and Mrs. James 
Kenney, of Carlsbad, N.M.

District Judge George M- 
Thurmond and Court Report­
er Frederick Casado of Del 
Rio were here on business on 
Monday.

versity is on the faculty of 
the Carrizo Springs High 
School.

The bridegroom, a gradu­
ate of Carrizo Springs High 
School, received his degree 
from Texas A&l University in 
Kingsville, and is a junior 
high teacher in Carrizo 
Springs where the couple is 
making their home.

Out-of-town guests here for 
the wedding included: Mr. an 
and Mrs. Euoligio Gonzales 
and Mrs. Jesse Garcia and 
family of Andrews; Mr. and 
Mrs. Guadalupe Olivas and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Jose 
Bravo and family of Odessa; 
Mr. and Mrs. David Maitinez 
Sr., Monahans; Mr. and Mrs. 
Pascasio Gonzales and family, 
Mr. and Mrs. Juan Cordova, 
Mrs. Florencio Galvan and 
daughter, and Joe Garcia, of 
Fort Stockton; Mr. and Mrs. 
Rocha and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Reyes, and Miss Janie 
Garcia, of Carrizo Springs;
Mr. and Mrs. Steven Reyma, 
an uncle and aunt of the 
bride, and their family of 
San Antonio; Mr. and Mrs. 
Jessie Estrada, Mr. and Mrs. 
Thomas Pallanez, Marathon; 
Jose Gomez, uncle of the 
bride, Jessie Gomez and son, 
cousins of the bride, all of 
San Antonio; Larry Flores, A1 
Torrez, Richard Cortines, Al­
pine; Miss Camila Viscaino, 
Marfa.

M iss Melva Montalvo, b ru l- 
rlect of Domingo Picaso, was 
honored at a miscellaneous 
bridal shower Sunday evening 
in the Legion Hall with about 
60 guests attending.

WI ite and yellow wedding 
hells and floral decorations 
in the honoree's chosen col­
ors, lime and yellow, decor­
ated the hall.

Welcoming the guests along 
with M iss Montalvo were her 
mother, Mrs. Juanita Alvarez, 
and the groom-to-be's sister. 
Miss Vicki Picaso. Miss Mon­
talvo was presented with a 
bridal corsage and the others 
with white carnation corsages 
tied with yellow and green 
ribbons.

Miss Lali Luevano was at 
the bride's book to register 
the guests.

Several games provided di­
version with prizes going to 
Mrs. Eleno Marquez, Mary 
Corbett, and Mrs. Manuel 
Maldonado. The guests then 
viewed the gifts which had 
been dispUayed on tables.

Refreshments were served 
from a table covered in a 
yellow cloth. Green and gold 
candelabra flanked the cen­
terpiece of large white wed­
ding bells and greenery tied 
with white ribbons. Favors in 
silver baskets were silver 
wedding rings, wedding bells, 
and rice bags of yellow net 
tied with white ribbons on 
which was inscribed "Melva 
and Domingo".

Chicken salad, fruit salad, 
piarty crackers, cheese speead, 
dips, chips, and evergreen 
pninch were served with the 
cake which was iced in white, 
yellow, and lime, and deco­
rated with silver wedding 
rings, bells, hearts, and love 
birds.

The hostesses were femin­
ine members of the wedding 
party including Mmes. Vi­
cente Picaso, S.M. Chalam- 
baga, and Roman Gonzalez; 
Misses Lali Luevano, Sandra 
Villarreal, Linda Hagelgans, 
Imelda Escamilla, Susan Cor­
bett, Rosalinda Lopiez, Mari- 
cila and Rosemary Martinez, 
Delma Montalvo, Aurelia Pi­
caso, and Mrs. Pete Salas Jr., 
of Marathon.

RODRIGU EZ-EUBANKS 
TROTH IS REVEJM.ED

Mr. and Mrs. Daniel Rodri­
guez Jr. have announced the 
engagement of his sisr**-, 
Maniiela Rodriguez, and Paul 
Eubanks of Fort Stockton.

The wedding will be in St. 
James Catholic Chiu-ch on 
Saturday, October 5.

Miss Rodriguez has been 
employed at the C.G. Mom- 
son Co. store. Mr. Eubanks is 
owner of Paul's Shoe Shop in 
Fort Stockton where the 
couple will reside.
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4 Tuesday 
Bridge Club

Mrs. Herbert Brown was 
hostess last week to the mem 
hers of the Tuesday Bridge 
Club, entertaining with a 
dessert-bridge in her home. 
An arrangement of roses was 
on the dining table.

High score in the card 
games was held by Mrs. R.S. 
Wilkinson, who shared slam 
with Mrs. J.A. Gilbreath, who 
was second high.

Also present were Mmes. 
James Caroline, Carlton 
White, C.H. Stavley, Jim 
Kerr, and Diane Anebews.

Nine members attended 
the meeting of the Friends of 
the Terrell County Public Li­
brary in the library building 
Tuesday evening.

The group voted to purchase 
a new memorial book and to 
pxiy for the gasoline for Mrs. 
Robbins' trip to Fabens for 
the inter-lilvary loans work­
shops She is the librarian 
and gave a report of the work­
shops

The report of the librarian 
for July and August showed 
499 adult visitors and 774 
children; S14 non-fiction 
hooks checked out, 1875 fic­
tion, 615 paperbacks, 89 
magazines, and 4S Spanish 
books and puzzles.

Mrs. W.H. Savage, memori­
als chairman, reported cash 
contributions of $85.00 and 
two books.

Mrs. N.M. Mitchell Jr. 
sougiit p>ermission to hang in 
the library, the plaque which 
had been presented to the 
Culture Club recently for 
their work in soil conserva­
tion.

Mrs. E.E. Harkins Jr. was 
appointed to write a history 
of "Friends" for the Terrell 
County Historical Society.
. After adjournment, Mrs. 
Robbins served pumpkin cake, 
tea, and coffee.

Also present were Mmes. 
E.E. Farley, LF. Pierson, L.
H. Gilbrea^, A.C. Garner; 
also Jack Hayre.

Cross Pens at The Tima*

TO SUB-DISTRICT MEET
The Big Bend sub-district of 

the Rio Grande Conference 
met last Sunday afternoon in 
Alpine. Attending from the 
United Methodist Women of 
El Buen Pastor Church were 
Mr. and Mrs. Richard Mon- 
dragon and Mmes. Gus Flores 
Manuela de la Cerda, Maria 
Jiminez, lesiis Marquez Jr., 
Francisco Moreno, and Man­
uel Garcia, also Miss Olga 
Villarreal. Mrs. Garcia was 
elected president of the sub­
district.

YOUMSnRS SID  IS...SIKHI TOUR rO O TM U SKILLS

S K n  UP rOR TIU  1974 
rORD PURT PASS & KICK 
COfllPSTITlOR

D «T ft

TMMx4  o'clock
FieldHurry! Th e re ’s only 

a few days left to sign 
up to compete in the 
1974 Ford Punt. Pass 
& Kick Competition.
Test your football skills in 
competition with youngsters 
your own age. It's free. Just 
bring your parent or guardian 
to register, get your free PP&K 
Tip s  Book and start practicing!

Rfcisnurnoii ia m
O<T0 B iR 4

loomoAt

1TU 4 . C l. K . Q iA aeU o fcL

A layette shower in the 
home of Mrs. J.L. Whistler 
111 Wednesday morning honor­
ed Mrs. A.K. (Zeke) Bradford 
Jr. Mrs. Ronnie Hall was co­
hostess.

A panda-bear cake, butter­
ed mints, mixed nuts, coffee, 
and spiced tea were served 
from a lace-covered table 
when the guests arrived.
Play p>en decorations were on 
the table and an arrangement 
of pink and white carnations 
and yellow daisies on the 
coffee table.

After Mrs. Bradford had 
op̂ ened her gifts, they were 
passed for display.

The guests included Mmes. 
Bill Rose, Karlos Kothmann, 
Charles Hornsby, G.C. Eggle» 
ton, W.H. Savage, Burt Wil­
liams, Ross Stavley, Sam 
Hollmig, Charles Stavley,
Van Mund, and Bruce Talley

Ray Robison visited rela­
tives in San Angelo last week.

Mr. and Mrs. Ed Johnson vis­
ited her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Edward Kerr, and family last 
weekend. The Johnsons now 
reside in Midland where he 
has been employed by a firm 
of accountants.

James Kerr, attorney of 
Fort Stockton, was here on 
business Monday and visited 
his brother, Edward Kerr, 
and family. He was accom­
panied by Rev. Sam Hornsey, 
pxriest of the Catholic Church 
of that city.

Mr. and Mrs. George Esco­
bar visited in Alpiine Sunday 
with her n.other, Mrs. Jesus 
Calzada, who is a medical 
patient in the hospital there, 
and with her sister, Mrs. Oliv­
ia Salinas, who is with her 
mother. They reported Mrs. 
Calzada's condition to be im-

JA N E S  
F U N E R A L  

H O M E

"DEDICATED TO SERVICE" 

(915) 392-3202

OZONA, TEXAS 76943

Y O U  M EY 
YH IS M A N ?

Ysabel Duarte
SelM Repw i i taCha

loot Mortfi Kmism 
f t  StocMon. Tomb T97St 
But. 33S 5311 Pm . JM-MS4 
You should moot him, (o t to 
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Y omHi 's lnf«r«sts 
$••11 in Survey

Cynical, af\ithetic,0|<imis- 
tic, rebellious, thou(?hifiil, co- 
0 ('erative, serious; what is the 
niood of youth in the Ameri­
ca of the Seventies?

As students return to school 
this fall, high school jrinci- 
pals, teachers, and jurents 
are looking eagerly for an­
swers. Many of them are re­
vealed in The Mood of Amer­
ican Youth, a recent study by 
the National Association of 
Secondary School Principals 
and the Gilbert Youth Re­
search Corp. of New York.

"Education is important to 
young people today - they 
have a positive attitude to­
ward school The {srincipals 
asociation survey shows that 
most students feel their 
schoob are doing a good 
job ," said James I Payne, 
(rincipal of Sanderson High 
School.

Interviews with high school 
students throughout the na­
tion probed their attitudes on 
education, work, school actiw 
ities, parents and family, 
marriage, politics, religion, 
the use of leisure time, and 
the future of American soci­
ety. The survey shows that 
students today are cautiously 
optimistic about their life as 
adults of the Eighties. Young 
people feel:

- -  that their schools are jro  
viding them with a satisfac­
tory education (77H, 99^ 
plan to finish high school).

- -  that high school students 
should have the opportunity 
to work part-time during the 
school year(849^).

- -  that happiness at home 
(92%) is more important than 
fame (less than 2%); a good 
family life attracts far more 
high school students (74%) 
than a lifetime of interesting 
experiences (25%),

- -  that particiivition in jo l- 
itics IS distasteful, but that 
voting IS a civic resjwnsibili- 
t>; 78% plan to vote in every 
election for which they're el­
igible, but onle one in ten 
would be willing to run for 
public office.

- -  that social reform should 
be accomplished jieacefully 
through community service 
rather than radical ujheaval;

are already involved in 
communit>’ service; 5̂ *% 
would like to be more involv­
ed, and over 40% plan to ex­
pand or continue their in­
volvement after high school.

- -  that goals are important 
and that hard work will be 
necessary to achieve them 
(95^).

— that those goals will cen­
ter around completing an ed­
ucation (35%), finding a job 
(52%), and settling into mar­
riage and a family (46%).

- -  that most difficulties 
with their jorents are a result 
of communication problems, 
rather than deep philosophi­
cal divisions. Less than 5% of 
the students expressed strong 
disagreement with their jvar- 
ents' ideas on pobtics, cloth­
ing styles, choice of friends, 
religion, education, drugs, 
and work, but 16% said they 
could not accept their par­
ents' ideas on sex.

— that overpopulation 
(23%) and ecology (36%) are 
today's two most important 
global issues; poverty (20%) 
and the threat of a third 
world war (71%) were also 
much on students' minds.

- -  that political change 
can be accomplished working 
within the government. Over 
50% feel that the present con­
stitutional government serves 
U S. citizens well; less than 
6% said it should be abolish­
ed in favor of another form.

The full report on the Mood 
of American Youth will be

released by NASSl’ in Octob- 
er. The National Asociation 
of Secondary School Princi- 
I 'a ls  IS a non-profit associa­
tion serving 35,000 secondary 
school administrators, head­
quartered in the Washington, 
D.C., area.

R^gistrofion O f 
Voters Is Urged

Texas Secretary of State M. 
W. White Jr. this week issued 
a reminder to any qualified 
piersons wishing to p'articipate 
in the November 5th General 
Election that they must be 
registered by October 5, 1974. 
A voter registration applica­
tion may be obtained at the 
County Tax Assessor-Collec­
tor's office in the applicant's 
county of residence. The apv 
plication may be filed either 
in person or by mail.

Secretary White noted that 
a registration is valid for 
three years and is automati­
cally extended for the suc­
ceeding three-year pveriod by 
voting in a primary or gener­
al election. Consequently, 
many voters who have pwtic- 
ipxited in prior elections need 
not make application K> re­
new their registration.

White also announced that 
all voters wishing to cast an 
absentee ballot for the No­
vember 5th General Election 
may do so beginning October 
16 and the absentee voting 
period will continue through 
Friday, November 5.

According to Secretary 
White, the proper absentee 
voting procedure will depend 
upon each individual voter's 
situation.

Mr. and Mrs. Thomas Earle 
and children have moved to 
the Savage rent house at 508 
N. Second St., formerly occu­
pied by Mr. and Mrs. A.K. 
Bradford Jr. He it trainmaster 
here on the Southern Pacific.

JHIIIIIIIIIIIIIHIIillMHMIMHHHil

I P«rtoiMlt. .  •
Mr. and Mrs. Roger Rose 

went to Del Rio Friday after­
noon to spnid the weekend 
with Mr. and Mrs. Doug 
Smith. The Smiths were 
guests of the Rotes at the 
annual Rio Grande Electric 
Co-op meeting and barbecue 
Saturday.

Larry Wight of San Antonio 
visited here Saturday with his 
mother, Mrs. W.H. Goldwire, 
Mr. Goldwire, and with his 
brother, Ronnie Wight, and 
family.

Mr. and Mrs. Pete POstell 
of Houston visited here last 
week with her sister, Mrs. 
Andres Falcon, and family. 
They returned home soon af­
ter the expilotion and fire on 
the S.P. Railroad there and 
were unable to go to their 
home for 24 hours. Tfie win-t 
dows in the house were all 
shattered by the explosion.

Mr. and Mrs. Alfred Bende- 
le were in San Angelo last 
Wednesday for her to have a 
post-surgical check-upx They 
visited with Mr. and h^s. J. 
Garner. Enioute home they 
visited in Uvalde with Mr. 
and Mrs. Jimmy M ilb and 
Mr. and Mrs. Robert Burger

and in Del Rio with hii,,,
ters, Mrs. Oliver Calk aJ, ,  
Mrs. Alton WeIty, and jfamilies. «h«ir 1

R*cent visitors with yv, 
Elma Riley and family 
her sister, Mrs. Virginia . 
ler, of Austin and her „.,c, 
Mrs. Jimmy MilU. ofUvai.

Steve Litton attendin,
Angeto State University, Sa,
Angelo, for his junior yea!
He was employed on th, Lp 
Railroad this summer andii 
ter being "cut o ff . enmll,d’ 
lor thu semester.

Mrs. Don Wilson, who «. 
tended the summer sessionol 
Texas Tech University, Lub. 
bock, has enrolled in Anetk 
State University and will hn. 
irfi her freshman year at mid. 
term. She is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. W.H. Coldw»,.

Mrs. W. A. Banner returned 
home Thursday from Houston 
where she had visited with 
her grandson. Buddy 
and wife while she had a 
medical check-upx.

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Gooch 
are moving to San Antonio 
this week. They have been 
residing here for several 
months and in Alpine unce 
he has a travelling job with 
the S.P. Railroad and he will 
be working on the Houston 
and Lafayette Division.

S A LE PRICES O N  
S IN G E R  S E W IN G  M ACH IN ES 

W I T H  OR W I T H O U T  CABINETS 
SA LE EN D S O C TO B E R  12

Don't F o rg e t-----------Christmos is just
Ground tho comor.

For o domonttrotion of machines or 
sorvico -  coll T lio  T im o i — 345-2442.

PRINTED AS A PUBLIC INTEREST BY THE TIMES BECAUSE WE CARE!

GUP AND SAVE
Identification Chort of Potentiolly-Dangerous Drugs ond Narcotics

Prevention it the only relioble euro for drug obwM. Evory utuol changot from nontiol b«liovler. Whon ebt«rving tent 
parent thould bo rotpontiblo for watching for the telltole er dowghtert, poronft mutt be cowtiout and mutt net cen- 
tymptemt ef drug ute. Obtervo yeur children fer ony un- elude that ene tymptem it cenduehre proof of drug ute. |

DRUG USED PHYSICAL SYMPTOMS LOOK FOR
1

DANGERS !
GLUE SNIFfING Violence, Drunk Appearance, 

Dreamy or Blank expression
Tubes of glue, Glue smears. 
Large paper bags or handker­
chiefs

L u n g /B ra in /L iv er damage, j 
Death through suffocation | 
choking. Anemia |

NEROIN (H o rtc . H, Junk. 
Snow, Stuff, Harry)
MORfHINE (White Stuff, Miss 
Emma, Dreamy)
CODEINE (Schoolboy)

Stupor/D row siness, Needle 
marits on bod^. Watery, eyes. 
Loss of appeutc. Blood stain 
on shirt sleeve. Running nose

Needle or hypodermic syringe. 
C o tto n , Tourniquet-string, 
Rope, Belt burnt bottle caps or 
sptwns, Glassine envelopes

Death from overdose. Mental j 
deterioration. Destruction of j 
brain and liver |

1
1
1

COUGH MEDICINE CONTAIN­
ING CODEINE AND OflUM

Drunk appearance. Lack of co­
ordination, Confusion, Exces- 

-tive itching

Empty bottles of cough medi­
cine

—  1

Causes addiction |
1
1

_______________________ _____________

MARIJUANA (Pot,Grass. Loco- 
weed, Marv Jane, Hashish, Tea, 
Gage, Reeters)

Sleepiness, Pandering mind, 
Enlarged eye pupils. Lack of 
coordination, Craving for 
sweets. Increased appetite

Strong odor of burnt leaves. 
Small seeds in pocket lining. 
Cigarette paper, Discolored  
fingers

Inducement to take strong mr- I 
cotics. Recent medical findings 
Marijuana does injure organs 1

1

LSD (A cid , Sugar, Big D. 
1 Cubes, Trips)
j DMT (Businessman’s High)
1 STR
1

Severe hallucinations. Feelings 
of detachment, Incoherent 
speech. Cold hands and feet, 
V'omiting. Laughing and crying

Cube sugar with discoloration 
in center, Strong body odor. 
Small tube of liquid

Suicidal tendencies. Unpredic­
table behavior, Chronic expo­
sure causes brain damage

1 AMPHETAMINES (Bennies, 
I Denies, Co-Pilots, Wake-Ups, 
1 Lid Poppers, Hearts, Pep Pills, 
1 Speed)

1

behavior. Giggling, 
Silliness. Rapid speech. Con­
fused thinking. No appetite, 
Extreme fatigue. Dry mouth, 
shakiness

Jar of pills of varying colon. 
Chain smoking

................
Death from overdose, Hallu- i 
cinations

1

j BARBITUtATES (Barbs. Blue 
1 Devils, Candy. Yellow Jackets, 
i Pbeeniea, Peanuts, Blue Heav- 
i ens. Goof Balls, Dtowns)

__________________ -

Drowsiness, Stupor, Dullness, 
Slurred speech. Drunk appear­
ance, Vomiting

Pills of varying colon

------------------------------- ----------- --

Death from overdose, Uncoo 
sciout

________________- --------------------- r r i

‘ S.
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ASC CommiffMmtn 
Nominofiont Are 
Being Received

Jr. High Eoglet 
Lose To Morfo

Ptftitiotu lo nominate can- 
Jiilates for Terrell County 
Agricultural Stabilization and 
Conservation committeeman 
are being acce|Xed in the AS- 
CS Office in Alpine until 
October The mail ballot­
ing to choose one committeot 
man and two alternates will 
close December 2.

Petitions must be limited to 
one nominee and must include 
a written certification that 
the nominee is willing to 
serve if elected. The j^eti- 
tions must be signed by at 
least three eligible voters, 
but voters can sign as many 
petitions as they wish. The 
lietitions may be mailed to 
Box 397, Alpine, Texas79830 
or left at the SCS Office in 
Sanderson.

To be eligible a nominee 
must be eligible to vote in 
the county ASC election, 
must reside in the county, 
and shall not have passed 
his 70th birthday. The candi­
date may not have served 
three consecutive terms as 
ASC Committeeman.

To be eligible to vote a 
person must be of legal vot> 
ing age, and have an interest 
in a farm, or ranch as owner, 
tenant, or sharecropper.
Minors who supervise whole 
ranching operations are eligi­
ble to vote.

Because Texas is a com- 
-munity property state, spouses 
of eligible voters may also 
vote and hold office of com­
mitteeman.

Herbert Brown is the com­
mitteeman with the expiring 
term. He is not eligible to 
succeed himself because he 
will have completed three 
consecutive terms.

Monty Harkins, chairman, 
has two years remaining in 
his term, and Lee Dudley has 
one more year to serve.

If less than three persons 
are nominated by petition, 
the incumbent committee

Tho M-irfa Junior High 
School Shorthorns were here 
Thursday of last week to play 
the Sanderson Junior High 
Eagles. Marfa won 6-0, mak­
ing their touchdown in the 
third I'eriod. Sanderson did 
not have a serious threat of 
scoring during the game.

Following the regular game, 
the 7th graders of each team 
of the two schools played one 
quarter and Marfa was able 
to score and converted the 
extra points on a running 
play to give them an 8-0  vic­
tory.

The roster of 8th graders in­
cludes Hector Galvan, Craig 
Cooke, Abel Marquez, Gib 
Bell, Lloyd Coots, Xavier Lo- 
|iei, Russel McDonald, Wade 
Sumrall, Julian Martinez, Ma­
lone Mitchell Jr., Indalecio 
Salazar, Marvin Sanchez,
Paul Muit, Gary Allen, and 
Joe Eckert.

The 7th grade roster includ­
es: Jose Daniel, Aubby Black, 
Rudy Licon, Robert Nevarez, 
David Arredondo, Ben Carri­
llo, Ty Haynes, Rex Hol­
combe, Donnie Allison, Scott 
McDonald, Cody Carruthers, 
Kade Kothman, Richard Mon­
talvo, Charlie Brown, Hector 
Salazar, and Milby Winn, 
some of whom played during 
the regular game.

Bill Ford is junior high 
school coach.

T.W. McKenzie returned 
home Thursday from El Pa» 
where he and his wife had 
been visiting for several days 
with relatives including her 
brother. Bud Krauss, who had 
surgery over a week ago and 
is recovering satisfactorily. 
She came home Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Owens 
returned home last Tuesday 
from Odessa where she had 
major surgery. She is making 
satisfactory recovery.

will fill out the slate at their 
regular meeting to be held 
November 6.

V / /  . »  ■ I

CLASSIFIED 1̂ # r.(

a d v e r t is in g ; ^
Classified Advertising Rates 
First insertion $1.50 minimum 
for S lines or less. Each addi­
tional line 2Sg. Subsequent 
insertions $1 minimum, 
a line for each line over 5.

Le^a 1 Notices
5g per word for i'irst insertion, 
and 4g per word for each in­
sertion thereafter.

FALL BARGAIN RATES - The 
San Angelo Standard-Times 
by mail went into effect on 
September 1, effective until 
January 1. Daily C Sunday, 
morning paper $30.84; Daily 
only, no Sunday papier, $22.86. 
See Mrs. L.H. Gilbreath, local 
representative for subscrip­
tions by mail at The Times.

FOR SALE - 12x60-foot mo­
bile home, '69 Manatee, fur­
nished, also portable dish­
washer, 2 refrigerated air 
ccxiditioners, $4,000 or best 
offer. At Ben's Trailer Park, 
call ^45-264 \  41-tfc

FCR SALE - Electric stove in 
good condition and Hotpxjint 
refrigerator with freezer, $45 
each. Mrs. W.A. Banner, 400 
Cargile. Call 2293. 41-tfc

NOTICE
MORRISON'S STORE is opx-n 
every Thursday evening from 
7 :(XJ to 9;(X) pi.m. adv

Troiltr Broket 
Troiltrf Wired

FOR SALE- 1969 Mustang in 
excellent running condition. 
Good economy car, 302 en­
gine, 4-sp'eed, tapie deck, 
$h<X). Tommy McDonald345- 
2969. 40-3tc.

Brtokoway Kits 
A x l«t  ond Ports

All Requirements for New Law

FOR SALE - Large selection 
of religious hooks, puper- 
b.icks. At The Times. adv.

Rio Troilor Shop
807 Ave. F - Rear 
DEL RIO, TEXAS 

(512) 775-5533

PROTECT YOUR CAR - Add 
\llas or Dowgard Anti-Freeze 
to cooling system now. Check 
all belts anil radiator hoses. 
Word Auto Supi !y. 37-tf

FOR RENT - TV sets - at 
Galaxy TV Sales, call 2622.

FOR SALE - Fin- wood - O ik, 
m e s q i i i t e ,  and other wooil. J. 
A. Mansfield, call 2222. 51-tf

W o n t T o  Buy
HoTMt. Cattle, Sheep, Ooets, 

Any Kind — Any Number 
Call 3K-20M

Ottist Pridomort
CAI  VFS  7 to 14 . lays o M ,  
he I It by anti sfartc i l  on  l o t  t i e .
I ree ilt-livery on 10 or more. 
(214) 223-5171 after 7:(K)|.iu

•e« $J$ Oaena. Teeat

Studio Girl Cosmetics and 
Real Silk for sale at Galaxy 
TV. 309 W. Oak. 27-tfc

C a /y u p r  J& C d stu  

7 }k d i. T ifiik y
Twelve members of the 

board of directors of the Ter­
rell County Unit of the Amer 
lean Cancer Society met lust 
Thursday evening in the fel­
lowship hall of the First Pres­
byterian Church with Mrs.
Web Townsend, president, 
presiding.

Chris Torn of Midland, ex­
ecutive district director, at­
tended the meeting and pre­
sented the certificate of au­
thorization to the unit for the 
coming year. He announced 
changes made in the by-laws 
at the division meeting in 
Dallas in August. After he 
had read the suggested chang­
es, they were adopted by the 
local hoard. It was decided 
to keep the unit's name: 
"Terrell County Unit".

Mr. Torti also gave the ' 
staff report on the annual 
meeting of the division in 
Dallas in August at which 
time Dr. Edwin Franks of Ira- 
an gave a program on '\Jter- 
ine Detection - Sanderson 
Plan". Terrell County pilaced 
eighth in the state in public 
education. The local unit 
was also commended for win­
ning the Golden Achievement 
Award for collecting more 
money each year in the an­
nual drive for funds for 13 
consecutive years.

As a result of the work done 
for the Pap Smear Clinic, on 
behalf of her committee and 
everyone who helped to make 
the clinic a success, Mrs. Da­
vid Mitchell, public educa­
tion chairman, received a 
certificate at the meeting in 
Midland. The local unit re­
ceived the award for "Total 
Adult Audiences".

The report of the treasurer 
showed a total of $2,306.14 
for the fiscal year ending on 
August 31, 1974. Of this 
amount, $2,288.64 was trans-

TO THE VOTERS OF 
TERRELL COUNTY:

It has been called to my 
attention on several occa­
sions during the pest few 
weeks, that there was to be a 
write-in campaippn for the of­
fice of County Judge on be­
half of Judge Wilkinson. 1 
spoke piersonally with Judge 
Wilkinson on September 30, 
1974, and was told that there 
is no truth in this rumor and 
that he is looking forward to 
retirement. This is written 
with the hop>e that this rumor 
will be put to rest and also 
with the hopie that we may 
all work together for the bet­
terment of our communit" 
and county.

Sincerely,
Charles Stavley.

FOR SALE -  15 - foot Frigid- 
aire refrigerator, frost-free,
7 years old, excellent condi­
tion, $125. Call 345-2642 
after 5:00 pvm. Ic

Sanderson Lodge 
#988, AFGAM 

>2nd Tuesdays 
_ R.S. Wilkinsen, Secy. 
Ben Lockhart, W M.

Legion Auxiliary 
I Tuesday 7:30 p. m. 
Legion Hall
Mrs. Dalton Hogg, pires.

V.F.W. meetings 
every 1st Sunday 
11 a.m. at hall.

CARD OF THANKS 
We are thankful beyond 

measure to all of our good 
friends who helpu-d us so 
nnich and in so many way's 
;'t the time of the death of 
our loved one. Mas wc offer 
our humble thanks for the 
many lOurtesies and thought­
fulness that comlorted us.

The family of 
J.F. (Slim) Hasty

IXJUTs' BOY - All 1 have to 
*lo IS nothing. Saved this for 
Last. Left an inveMig.iior 
llivre. Knows where X-rays 
Miivrvised by me are. This 
will NOT Bf like that Amen. 
I ail thing in A/. 4i)-|.

milted to the division office 
in Austin, leaving a cash bal­
ance of $17.50.

After a discussion of pTO- 
grams and pvlans for the com­
ing year, the group voted to 
have the annual "hunters' 
food sale" again and it will 
be at Dudley's on Friday, ?slo- 
vember 29, with Mrs. Her­
man Couch as chairma ». The 
president has called a meet­
ing for Thursday, October 17, 
at 7:00 pxm. in the fellow* 
ship hall for the purpose of 
planning the food sale.

Mrs. W.J. Ferguson Jr., ser­
vice and rehabilitation chair­
man, announced that Dr. Mi­
chael P. Longley had accep>- 
ted an invitation to serve at 
medical advisor for the local 
unit and, with the presence 
of a doctor in the community, 
this program will be expsand- 
able.

Mrs. Towiuend reported on 
the annual Area 1 and Dis­
trict II meetings in Midland 
on June 4, attended also by 
Mrs. J.W. Hapxple and Mrs. K. 
H. Stutes.

Abo present were Mmes. H. 
E. Ezelle, W.H. Savage, H.A. 
Mullings, E.E. Farley, Char­
les Hornsby, Julian Martinez 
Jr., E.E. Harkins, Ray Hernan­
dez, Cruz Marquez, and A.H. 
Zuberbueler.

lit . . .

Word from Austin Nance is 
that he continues to make 
satisfactory recovery from 
surgery in a Houston hospital 
over a week ago. He was 
moved from intensive care 
last Thursday and hu daugh­
ter, Mrs. David Kleinbeck, 
of Midland, returned home. 
Mrs. Nance has remained in 
Houston with her husband.

Visitors with Mrs. Lizzie 
Billings and family Thursday 
were Mr. and hks. Hollis Ha­
ley of Marathon and their 
daughter, Mrs. Pat Leary, and 
son, Jeff, of Alpine.

T.O. Moore was a business 
visitor in San Angelo last 
week.
* James Early and George 
Rodgers of San Angelo are 
visiting their daughter and 
niece, Mrs. T.O. Moore Jr., 
and family and doing some 
work of remodeling the 
Moores' home.

Mrs. Gene Black is substi­
tuting for Mrs. Arturo Men­
doza, who is on maternity 
leave, and will continue un­
til a replacement can be se­
cured. Mrs. Mendoza taught 
kindergarten in the elemen­
tary school.

Mr. and Mrs. Ben Lockhart 
and daughter are moving to 
Big Spring where he is being 
transferred by the Depart-, 
ment of Public Safety. He is

NOTICE TO BIDDERS 
Sealed bids will be received 

by the State Parks and Wild­
life Department,JohnH. Rea­
gan Building, Austin, Texas 
78701, until 2:00 p>.m. Octo­
ber 16, 1974, for Project No. 
354-586, Seminole Canyon 
State Park, Val Verde Coun­
ty, Comstock, Texas, for coi> 
struction of piark boundary 
fencing (sheep fence - ap>- 
proximately 2.3 miles). Plans 
and specifications can be ob­
tained from the Engineering 
Division of the Texas Parks 
and Wildlife Department, 
John H. Reagan Building, 
Austin, Texas 78701. Tel. 
512*475-2561. 40-2tc.

a mcmlHTof theTexa.U^ 
way Patrol and u to J  
for duty on November T

Howard Dishman called k 
fro n ts . Mr. and Mrs. W r 
Dishman, from Amarilln
Monday night .orep:::^':,;;
he had passed hi, ,*,y, , 
examination and had been 
sworn into the U.S. Army H. 
IS reporting to Fort Polk L 
fw his basic training and ' 
plans to later go to a hel,co„ 
ter school. He visited in Wm 
minster, Colorado, Friday,^
Saturday m the home of Mr 
and Mrs. Jack Savage and 
children, making the tripbv 
plane from the Midland Ab 
Term inal.

REV. PHIL BAKER TC 
PREACH HERE SUNDAY 

Rev. Phil Baker of Alpnne 
campus minister at Sul Ro,i 
State University, will be the 
pyacher at the First United 
Methodist Church Sunday fo, 
•ho-elev
the 11:00 o'clock service 
Sunday is World-Wide Com­
munion Sunday and Holy 
Communion will be observed 
at the service. All memben 
and friends of the church are 
invited to attend the service 
and to bring a covered-dish 
for the dinner which will fol. 
low, the United Methodig 
Women furnishing the bread 
coffee, and tea.

Dr. O m «r D. Prici
OrrOMETRIST

OFFICE HOURS:
9i00 a.m. to 5:30 pi.m. 

Monday thru Friday 
Closed Saturdays

603 North Main Su 
Fort Stocktoi

O ur Gos Friers 

Butane 35c gol. 

Propane 26c gd.
Delivered in Your Tank

BIG  BEND
G AS CO.

Weetem Mattress 
G u n  pony

SAN ANGELO, TEXAS
Save SCFr on having your 

mattress renovated
All Work Guarantied

In Sanderson twice a month

Call 34S-2211 for 
Pick Up and Deliviiy

Geeslin 

Funeral Home

IX5N GEESLIN

AI pine

(;il5) 837-2222

H E
A I - T H  ‘ L I F E

Phone 34 5-2 2 21

'jG y r u s t  Insurance Agê V̂
Phone 345-24#^

me

CO


