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ACCORDING TO an item we saw 
recently, we at the Star are right in 
step in our advertising department. 
Here are the ten most popular words 
for advertising purposes;

1. NEWl 2. NATURAL! 3. 
LIGHTl 4. SAVE! 5. FREE! 6. 
REAL! 7. RICH! 8. FRESH! 9. 
EXTRA! and 10. DISCOVER, or 
DISCOVERY.

Now, we hope that you will 
discover the all-new Friona Star, with 
a natural freshness. You can save a 
bundle of real money by taking 
advantage of the various specials and 
free offers by Star advertisers. These 
are designed to make you feel extra 
rich, and not suffer from a light 
wallet!

*  *  *  *

SPEAKING OF WORDS, it is a
proven fact that you should say what 
you mean, and mean what you say. 
However, in the case of the following 
excerpts from published news items, 
i t’s hard to tell if the writers were 
paying attention to what they were 
saying:

♦Firemen today received 28 letters 
thanking them for their efforts which 
destroyed three houses last 
Wednesday night.

•A man was shot as he tried to foil 
an armed raider. Police have not 
named the man who was shot at his 
request.

♦The scales vanished from a locked 
office and police are weighing up the 
possibilities that they have been 
stolen.

♦The doctor said that after the 
accident the defendant told him he 
had been to a very good dinner and 
had a good deal to drink. He was 
certain that his car had touched 
nothing.

« « « «
MOST YEARS, if your team was in 
the same district with the team which 
went to the state finals a year earlier 
and had a good percentage of its 
material coming back, you wouldn’t 
be overly optimistic about the 
upcoming season.

Such, however, is not the case with 
Tommy Moss and his staff in regard 
to the 1983 Friona Chieftains.

True, the team is in the district 
once again with Littlefield, and true, 
the Wildcats should be loaded. But 
the fact of the matter is: The 
Chieftains aren’t going to be a 
“ slouch” of a team, themselves.

With about half of his starters 
returning, plus another seven or eight 
players who saw a lot of playing time 
last season. Coach Moss is viewing 
the upcoming season with optimism. 
And, unlike most coaches, he doesn’t 
mind showing his optimism.

The nice thing about the new 
playoff system is the fact that there 
are two playoff spots available in 
every district. That way, when there 
are at least two outstanding teams 
(and in our district’s case, maybe 
three--or more), you’re not out of the 
running when you lose a game.

And, having had a taste of the 
playoffs for the first time, the 
returning members of the Chieftains 
are chomping at the bit to get back to 
a game situation and prove what they 
can do.

On the two-team playoff rule, we 
don’t mean to imply that the 
Chieftains have conceded first place 
to Littlefield, just because of their 
record and repu tation-no t in the 
least. In fact, they remember last 
season, when although hobbled by 
injuries the Chieftains were still able 
to hold a lead over the Wildcats for a 
time.

And this time around, the 
Chieftains will get to play the 
Wildcats here at Chieftain Field. It 
seems like we’ve been playing 
Littlefield on their turf for the past 
ten years, but th a t’s changed for 
1983.

So, maybe you could look at things 
this way, kids: The bad news is that 
the summer is almost over. The good 
news is that it will soon be football 
time.
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Grid Workouts Start 
For Chieftains Monday
Some 70 candidates for the 1983 

Friona High School Chieftain 
football team will begin two-a-day 
workouts on Monday, August 11, 
according to head coach Tommy 
Moss.

The varsity level (sophomore- 
junior-senior) group will be joined by 
some 38 freshmen gridders, which 
will push the number expected to take 
part in the workouts to 108. Players 
need to report to the field house at 9 
a.m. Monday. Daily workouts will be 
from 8-10 a.m. and 4-6 p.m.

“ Since we only have about 150 
boys in high school, this is a pretty 
good percentage. I t’s the biggest 
group of freshmen we’ve had in 
awhile, to come out before school 
starts,” Moss said.

Optimism is running high in the 
Chieftain pre-season camp, after the 
team gained the playoffs last year for 
the first time in a generation.

Back from the team which 
captured the District 2-AAA runner- 
up position to state finalist Littlefield 
are 16 lettermen and ten starters.

The Chieftains have returning 
virtually their entire backfield, 
including three running backs who 
gained over 1,600 yards rushing last 
season. They are Charlie Morgan, the 
rushing leader on the team last year 
with 1185 yards; Alfredo Mata, and 
fullback Reese Fleming.

Fleming gained 257 yards as a 
junior in 1982, and Mata, seeing only 
limited action due to injuries to 
upperclassmen, added 163 yards. He 
caused Friona fans and coaches to 
take notice by ripping off 93 yards 
against the state finalist Littlefield 
team in just 12 tries.

Other returning offensive starters 
returning are split ends Johnny 
McLellan and Eloy Caballero and 
tight end Kevin Brogden and 
offensive tackle Tim Kirk.

Defensive starters returning include 
Charlie Veazey, who played amost 
every secondary position; linebacker

Reese Fleming and defensive tackle 
Tim Kirk.

Other returning lettermen include 
Shayne W oodard, Doug Carthel, 
Rudy Bermea, Jessie Gonzales, Mitch 
Reeve, Troy Crutchfield, Bob 
Behrendsen and Robert Escalante.

“ A number of the returning 
lettermen saw a good deal of action 
last year, due to injuries, and they 
will almost be like having returning 
starters,” Moss pointed out.

Veazey saw some action at 
quarterback, and is the leading 
candidate heading into pre-season. 
However, Veazey has Doug Carthel 
and Rickey Barnett pushing him for 
the spot.

“ It’s the first time in about three 
years we can face the opening of the 
season knowing we should have a 
quarterback with some experience,” 
Moss said.

Back to the offensive statistics.

returning starter Caballero was the 
team ’s leading pass receiver last 
season, averaging 31.5 yards per 
catch on four receptions. Two of 
Caballero’s catches went for 
touchdowns.

The Chieftain mentor said that the 
attitude of the team members is 
“ tremendous.”  This is a close-knit 
group, and they have been all the way 
through school. Moss pointed out.

The team will host Bovina in a 
scrimmage game on August 19, and 
will visit Springlake-Earth for a 
second scrimmage August 26.
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The schedule to be faced by the 
1983 Chieftains is once again 
extremely tough. Last year’s district 
runners-up compiled a 6-5 won-lost 
record, considered good in light of 
the teams Friona played. This year’s 
schedule is exactly the same; only the 

(Continued on Page 8) .
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Five Firemen Attend 
Firefighting School
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Five members of the Friona 
Volunteer Fire Department attended 
the Texas Firemen’s and Fire 
Marshall’s school at Texas A&M last 
week. The school was attended by 
some 2,500 municipal firefighters, 
instructors and sales representatives, 
present to sharpen their firefighting 
skills.

Attending from the Friona Fire 
Department were Chief Ralph 
Shirley, Roger Fields, Joe Mann, 
Steve Jones and Bobby Jordan. 
Shirley, who has served as an 
instructor at the school for a number 
of years, instructed a ladder class at 
the 1983 school.

Fields took a course in “ Fire 
Prevention II ,” Mann took “ pump 
maintenance,” Jones was enrolled in

Hereford Woman Is 
Killed In Car Accident

One woman was killed and seven 
people were injured in a two-vehicle 
accident Monday afternoon in 
Parmer County.

Maria Erlinda Reyes, 19, of 
Hereford, was dead on arrival 
Monday afternoon at Parmer County 
Community Hospital in Friona.

Services are pending with Rix 
Funeral Home in Hereford.

Two other passengers in the 1980 
Buick Miss Reyes was driving were 
injured.

David Garcia, 14, was in critical 
condition at Parmer County Com­
munity Hospital with chest injuries. 
Delia Barrinetez, 47, was reported in 
good condition with minor bruises at 
the Parmer County Community 
Hospital.

All are from Hereford.

The Reyes’ vehicle was attempting 
to make a u-turn from a barrow ditch 
on FM 2397 east of Friona at about 
4:25 p.m. Monday when the 1965 
Plymouth, driven by Ostolia Sanchez 
Ramos, 47, of Dimmitt, slammed 
into the passenger side of the 1980 
Buick.

Ramos was in fair condition at the 
Parmer County Community 
Hospital. Passengers in the Ramos’ 
vehicle were Irene Ramos, 25; Tina 
Ramos, 14; and Jesse Ramos, 12-all 
reported in good condition at Parmer 
County Community Hospital; and 
Billy Ray Aleman, 9, who was 
transferred to Deaf Smith General 
Hospital in Hereford, where he was 
in good condition. All are from 
Dimmitt.

TOP CLOWN..,.Mary DiaZf right, won the clown dress-up 
contest at Jack and Jill on Tuesday o f this week. She is shown 
being congratulated by store manager Darrell Alexander. All o f 
the store employees dressed as clowns twice during the 
promotional week.

“ Fire Fighting III’’ and Jordan’s 
class was “ Fire Fighting II.”

Those attending called the annual 
event a “ very productive school.” By 
having this number attend the school, 
Friona residents will be due a three 
per cent reduction in their “ key rate” 
fire insurance.

The school is designed to 
encourage training and better fire 
protection techniques for Texas 
firefighters.

The firemen had both classroom 
and field training last week. They 
attended six hours of instruction a 
day plus a night class on Monday. 
They then took a final examination 
Friday. The examination covered 
theory from classroom and practical 
application from field training.

Basic field training includes how to 
properly hold a fire hose, prevent 
smoke inhalation and forcibly enter a 
structure without causing damages. 
The more advanced classes dealt with 
electrical and structural fires and the 
chemicals used to prevent them.

The program is one of the best in 
the nation with visitors coming from 
all over the United States and abroad 
to observe the teaching methods and 
the efficiency with which the program 
is run. Volunteer instructors came 
from all over the nation to teach the 
newest firefighting techniques. Some 
of the men stayed in college dorms 
and about 1,0(X) stayed in motels.

The Fire Protection Training 
Division of Texas A&M conducts the 
firefighting school. It is one of 16 
separate training divisions of the 
Texas Engineering Extension Service.

The fire protection division 
sponsors three firefighting programs: 
municipal firefighting, industrial 
firefighting, and a special program 
for Spanish, speaking firefighters.

Friona JH

JUNIOR TW IRLERS....The Friona Junior High twirlers 
attended the Cara van o f Camps Summer Clinic at West Texas 
State University recently. Shown from the left are Lori Fulks, 
Rena Burnett and Julie Brown. Unable to attend the camp was 
the fourth twirler, Dara Wells.

Maize Days Set
As Meeting Topic

Twirlers

The Friona Chamber of Commerce 
and Agriculture Board of Directors 
will have its monthly meeting 
Wednesday, May 10 at the Chamber 
of Commerce office. The public is 
invited to attend. Items on the agenda 
include preparations for Maize Days 
and approval by the'board of the 
1983-84 program of work.

Larry Knowles will represent the 
Chamber of Commerce and 
Agriculture’s Industrial Committee at 
the Texas Industrial Commission’s 
Conference on Economic 
Development in Austin, August 17 
and 18. The conference will feature 
the latest financing tools and 
techniques available for industrial 
and business development in Texas 
communities.

The Chamber reminds all area 
young ladies that entry forms are 
available at the Chamber office for 
the Little Miss Friona and Miss 
Friona Maize Queen pageants. Entry 
fee for the Little Miss Contest is $15. 
Entry fee for Miss Friona Maize 
Queen will be $30. Deadline for entry 
submission is September 7. The Little 
Miss Pageant will be September 20. 
Miss Friona Maize will be chosen 
September 17 in the High School 
Auditorium.

The Friona Chamber of Commerce 
and Agriculture has nominated The

Workshop
Win Honors Kicks Off

Three of the four Friona Junior 
High School twirlers recently 
attended the Caravan of Camps 
summer clinic for twirlers on the 
West Texas State University campus.

Attending were Lori Fulks, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Bobby 
Fulks; Rena Burnett, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Leroy Burnett and Julie 
Brown, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Gary Brown. A fourth twirler, Dara 
Wells, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Roy Wells, was unable to attend the 
camp.

In competition. Miss Burnett, who 
is head twirler, placed second in 
majorette strut, and second in solo. 
Miss Fulks placed first in solo, third 
in modeling, and fifth in majorette 
strut. Miss Brown placed second in 
solo, third in modeling and fifth in 
majorette strut.

The group also received the “ deli” 
award.

Summer Drama W orkshop, a 
special event sponsored each year for 
Friona youngsters by the Friona Fine 
Arts Council, will begin on Monday, 
August 8.

Registration will be held on 
Sunday, August 7 at Friona High 
School, between the hours of 3 and 5 
p.m. Registration fee of $25.00 per 
student will be taken at the time of 
enrollment.

Del Lewis, Friona native and 
longtime participant-coach in the 
drama world, is once again the 
workshop conductor.

Minimum age for the younger 
division will be ten, and enrollment 
for this group will be limited to 
around 20, and will be on a “ first 
come, first served” basis.

Those wishing further information 
may call Gay Tannahill, 247-3144 or 
Roxanne Hurst at 295-3580.

Friona Star for the West Texas 
Chamber of Commerce’s Community 
Service Award, in recognition of the 
coverage the paper provided for the 
Library Fund Drive last year and the 
Prairie Acres Van Drive this spring. 
This award will be presented at the 
West Texas Press Association Annual 
Convention in Fort Worth, August 
19-20. An anonymous committee 
including journalists will select the 
winner from among the nominees.

The Chamber has received 
application forms for the Tri State 
Fair Parade to be held September 3 at 
10 a.m. in Amarillo. Any party 
interested in participating in the 
parade may come by the office and 
pick up one of the entry forms. 
Deadline for ¿ntry is August 19. This 
year’s theme is “ America’s Decade of 
Water.”

School To 
Begin Here 
August 22

The 1983-84 school term begins in 
Friona on Monday, August 22, and 
some special pre-registration 
information has been released by 
Superintendent of Schools Tom 
Jarboe.

Students who did not attend school 
here last year are asked to report to 
their respective principal’s office: 
high school students, Hal Ratcliff, 
between August 11 and August 17.

Grades six through eight, to Cecil 
Maddox at the junior high, between 
August 15 and 19; and kindergarten 
through fifth grade, to Freeman 
Melton at the grade school, August 
15-19.

This pre-registration process for 
new students is to enable them to be 
on an equal basis with the district’s 
returning students.

Teachers in the school system will 
have in-service days August 18 and 
19, prior to the first day of school.

All high school students are to 
report on Friday, August 19, for 
registration. Grades eleven and 12 
will register beginning at 9 a.m., and 
grades nine and ten are to report at 
10:30 a.m.

School hours will once again be the 
same as in the past, 8:45 a.m. to 3:45 
p.m.
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Winners Announced 
In Playnight Events

The results of the third Playnight 
held at the Riding Club arena Friday 
night, July 29, are as follows:

Pee-wee barrels: 1. Michael Jeter, 
20.33; 2. Michelle Highsmith, 26.46; 
3. B.J. Parvin, 20; 4. Lana Allemand, 
40.93.

Junior barrels: 1. Tiffany Osborn, 
18.62; 2. Paul Trimmell, 19.17; 3. 
Glen Trimmell, 19.42; 4. Beth 
Johnson, 19.72; S. Randal 
Highsmith, 20.29; 6. Reese Hand, 
20.33.

Senior barrels: 1. Ashlee Gee, 
19.51; 2. Shain Rhodes, 26.57.

Adult barrels: 1. Lisa Nash, 17.38;
2. Toni Mitchell, 19.93; 3. Roy 
Trimmell, 20.70; 4. Robert Zetzsche, 
22.55; 5. J.C . Parvin, 22.98; 6. 
Randy Highsmith, 36.52.

Pee-wee flags: 1. B .J. Parvin, 
22.09; 2. Michelle Highsmith, 34.38;
3. Lana Allemand, 41.66.

Junior flags: 1. Beth Johnson, 
12.52; 2. Lacye Osborn, 14.27; 3. 
Randal Highsmith, 16.14; 4. John 
Clark, 40.26.

Senior flags: 1. Shain Rhodes, 
17.12.

Adult flags: 1. Roy Trimmell, 
13.47; 2. J.C . Parvin, 14.99; 3. 
Randy Highsmith, 19.03.

Pee-wee poles: 1. Michelle High­
smith, 30.49; 2. B.J. Parvin, 34; 3. 
Lana Allemand, 51.33.

Junior poles: 1. Tiffany Osborn, 
23.07; 2. Paul Trimmell, 23.39; 3. 
Randal Highsmith, 25.26; 4. Reese

Hand, 25.38; 5. Lacye Osborn, 26.47; 
6. Glen Trimmell, 30.63.

Senior poles: 1. Shain Rhodes, 
25.09; 2. Ashlee Gee, 34.33.

Adult poles: 1. Lisa Nash, 21.47; 2. 
Gina Sandberg, 25.89; 3. J.C . 
Parvin, 25.92; 4. Robert Zetzsche, 
26.84; 5. Roy Trimmell, 29.01; 6. 
Randy Highsmith, 32.54.

Pee-wee stakes: 1. B.J. Parvin, 
14.96; 2. Michelle Highsmith, 15.68; 
3. Michael Jeter, 18.10; 4. Lana 
Allemand, 20.02.

Junior stakes: 1. Beth Johnson, 
9.57; 2. Tiffany Osborn, 9.98; 3. 
Dustee Gee, 10.11; 4. Reese Hand, 
10.49; 5. Randal Highsmith, 10.93; 6. 
Lacye Osborn, 11.17.

Senior stakes: 1. Shain Rhodes, 
9.85; 2. Ashlee Gee, 10.96.

Adult stakes: 1. Lisa Nash, 9.28; 2. 
J.C . Parvin, 10.22; 3. Robert 
Zetzsche, 11.18; 4. Gina Sandberg, 
11.28; 5. Randy Highsmith, 13.20; 6. 
Roy Trimmell, 13.78.

Pee-wee rings: 1. B.J. Parvin, 
26.75; 2. Michelle Highsmith, 38.37; 
3. Michael Jeter, 41.82; 4. Lana 
Allemand, 1:13.88.

Junior rings: 1. Lacye Osborn, 
14.45; 2. Glen Trimmell, 14.94; 3. 
Paul Trimmell, 17.51; 4. John Clark, 
21.07; 5. Reese Hand, 22.64; 6. 
Randal Highsmith, 24.81.

Senior rings: 1. Kevin Trimmell, 
17.98; 2. Shain Rhodes, 22.09.

Adult rings: 1. Randy Highsmith, 
15.15; 2. J.C. Parvin, 17.93; 3. Roy

LET US SHOW YOU 
HOW TO RELAX!

If your insurance problems have got you 
"worried", it's time to talk it over with the 
INDEPENDENT INSURANCE EXPERTS ot our 
AGENCY. You'll quit worrying ond stort 
relaxing . . . most people do when we solve 
their insurance problems and probably sove 
money too! So stop worrying ond start 
relaxing, see or call us todoy.

Ethridge-Spring 
Agency, Inc.

603 MAIN STREET - FRIONA
'hone: (806) 247-2766

Trimmell, 19.13; 4. Robert Zetzsche,
19.81; 5. Gina Sandberg, 30.34; 6.
Lisa Nash, 27.73.

Recordbook
Winners Are 
Announced

Each summer, 4-H ’ers are busy 
compiling recordbooks of their 
projects to submit for judging. These 
books show all aspects of 4-H work 
that the youth have been involved 
during the year. Parmer County had 
ten books in the South Plains District 
competition July 25,1983.

Mindy Neal of Bovina placed 
second in the senior dairy goat 
division. Charles Johnson of Bovina 
placed third in the senior swine 
division. Maureen Jesko of 
Lazbuddie received a participation 
ribbon with her senior fashion revue 
book.

In the junior division Parmer 
County received the following 
awards:

Blue aw ard-Sharlet Johnson of 
Bovina, swine; Elaine White of 
Friona, food and nutrition; Chad 
Rhodes of Friona, sheep; and Cain 
Neal of Bovina, dairy goat.

Red award"Casey Wayne Brad­
shaw of Lazbuddie, achievement; 
Jennifer Cass of Friona, clothing; 
and Kara Camp of Oklahoma Lane, 
horse.

The Friona ★  Star
(PublicaUon Number-USPS-210-800) 

Published Every Sunday 
Weekly, Except Christmas Week 

At 916 Main Street 
Friona, Texas 79035 

Second class postage paid at 
Friona, Texas 79035

SUBSCRIPTION RATES 
Parmer County, adjoining counties, 
$10.00 per year. Elsewhere, $12.00 
per year.

Bill Ellis, Editor & PubUsher 
Vickie Copley, Production Supt.
Lisa McLellan, Advertising 
Laura Nell Coffey, Bookkeeper

w w w w w w

Church Chuckles b y  C A R T W R I O H ' I '

© ̂  H A$. <A nTw R IS07

" D i d  y o u  e v o r  h e a r  o f a n y o n e  e ls e  w h o s e  f a it h  w a s  
t ie d  to  th e  u p s  a n d  d o w n s  o f  th e  s to c k  m a r k e t ? "

w w ^ w w

Welcqme To 
Friona Churches

These Sponsors W elcome 

You To Friona's Churches

Reeve Chevy -  Olds
Ui« muiy'II!I!I mPtRATOBlAT iCiee nA « J  QII niUNQ fflTH ,
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Rockwell Bros.
Of Friona
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Friona State Bank
Mem her F.D.LC.

AAA

Ethridge-Spring
Insurance Agency. Inc.^ ^  ^ ~ A  A A A

D.L. ŝ Thriftway

FIRST MEXICAN BAPTIST CHURCH J 
r 904 Wasbington-Martln Mercado, Pastor 4

nR ST BAPTIST j 
Sixth & Summitt-Cecil Golden, Interim Pastor jJ

1

* <
<

*

SIXTH ST. IGLESIA de CRISTO 
408 W. Sixth

CALVARY BAPTIST |  
14th & Cleveland-Andy HoUlnger, Pastor |

SIXTH ST. CHURCH OF CHRIST 
502 W. Slxth-T. Leon Talley

TEMPLO BAUTISTA j 
4th & Woodland-Rev. Glenn Smith 1

TENTH ST. CHURCH OF CHRIST 
10th A Euclid

►

ST. ESTHER’S BAPTIST CHURCH j  
5th : Main-Rev. I.S. Ansley, Pastor.................. j

FIRST ASSEMBLY OF GOD 
10th & Ashland-Mrs. Frank Norred, Pastor

•
FRIONA UNITED METHODIST CHURCH 

8th A Plerce-Rev. Archie Echols <
>

TEMPLO “ MARANATHA” 
SPANISH ASSEMBLY OF GOD 

301 Grand-
■

REDEEMER LUTHERAN CHURCH ] 
13th A Virginia j 

Sunday School 9:30 Church 8:30 J

ST. TERESA’S CATHOLIC CHURCH 
16th A Cleveland-Ronald McGovern,

S.A. Administrator

UNION CONGREGATIONAL CHURCH 
Euclid At 16th-Rev. Skip Simic

UNITED PENTECOSTAL CHURCH 
5th & Asbiand-George Green

A A
»

>

IMMANUEL LUTHERAN CHURCH 
Rhea Community-9 a.m . Attend Church Regularly

FAIONil FLASHBACÜS
from the Friona

55 YEARS AGO-JULY 20,1928
Word was received here Tuesday to 

the effect that Morris Edwin, small 
son of Sheriff and Mrs. J.H. Martin, 
was stricken suddenly ill Tuesday 
morning and was rushed to the 
hospital at Clovis where at about six 
o'clock that evening he was operated 
on for appendicitis.

Mr. and Mrs. C.C. Maurer drove 
to Amarillo last Saturday and spent 
the day there on business and 
pleasure, returning home on Sunday.

Wednesday evening a birthday 
party was given at the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. A.O. Drake in honor of 
their daughter, Miss Pearl Drake.

Mr. and Mrs. V.E. Hart and 
children, John and Thelma, drove to 
Floydada last Friday for a two day 
visit.

*  *  *  *

45 YEARS AGO-JULY 22,1938
O.D. McLelland, Jr. was shocked 

and knocked unconscious by 
lightning, last Saturday about 6:30 
p.m. He was milking a cow at the 
farm of G.H. Brock, where he is 
employed, when the accident 
occurred. He was seated on a zinc 
bucket milking, he said, when the 
next thing he knew water was being 
poured on him and rain was falling in 
his face. First aid was rendered by 
Mrs. Reece and Mrs. Brock, and Mr. 
Brock returned from town by that 
time and rushed him to a local 
doctor, who pronounced his 
condition as shock, and not of serious 
nature. He was able to be up the day 
following, and complained only of 
nervousness and headache.

Miss Floy Goodwine, who has been
attending Texas Tech College at
Lubbock during the past six weeks,
returned home early Sunday morning
and will spend the remainder of the
summer vacation period at home with
her mother, Mrs. Minnie Goodwine.

« •  « «
35 YEARS AGO-JULY 23,1948
Mr. and Mrs. George McLean had 

as their guests Tuesday and Tuesday 
night, Mr. and Mrs. Willard 
Whittaker of Lawrenceville, Illinois.

Mr. and Mrs. F.H. Hadley

returned Sunday from Childress, 
where they had spent the week 
visiting relatives, friends and former 
neighbors.

Dr. and Mrs. R.C. Stokes and son. 
Walker, departed on Friday of last 
week for a trip to Denver, Colorado. '  
Their plan was to return to Friona on 
Wednesday.

0 0 0 0
30 YEARS AGO-JULY 23,1953
The childhood game of turning 

cartwheels resulted in a broken left 
arm this week for Patricia Barker, 
eight year old daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Fred Barker Jr.

Mrs. Joe Fallwell and children and 
Jimmy Sue Fallwell left last week for 
Kansas to visit Mrs. Fallwell’s 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Tom Rardin.

Thomas Giles Cobb, Jr. arrived 
home Saturday from Germany where 
he has spent the past eighteen 
months.

Mr. and Mrs. Louis Welch, Mr. 
and Mrs. Ralph Wilson, Dr. and Mrs. 
Paul Spring and Mr. and Mrs. 
Herschel Johnson spent the weekend 
in the mountains at Cowles, New 
Mexico.

* * * *
25 YEARS AGO-JULY 17,1958
Ronald Dean Smiley, 20, of Friona 

was treated for cuts and abrasions 
Sunday afternoon after a pickup tire 
exploded in his face at Londan 
Brothers Magnolia Station.

Three Friona youths were injured 
in a wreck when their pickup truck 
ran into a culvert at Euler’s corner 
two miles east of Friona at 12:30 a.m. 
Sunday. The boys, J.W . Baxter, 
Darrell Buske and Robbie Osborn, 
were taken to the Parmer County 
Community Hospital where they were 
treated for various injuries.

Four Friona farm workers died in a 
scattering mass of wreckage Sunday 
about 3:30 a.m. when their 1950 Ford 
rammed the side of a Santa Fe
passenger train.

*  *  *  *

15 YEARS AGO-JULY 18,1968
The condition of Mrs. Hop Lewis 

is reported to be improving. She had 
surgery in Houston last month and is

convalescing at home.
The Friona Women’s interde­

nominational meeting will be held at 
2:30 p.m. July 26.

Airman First Class Charles A.
Shamblin III, son of Mr. and Mrs.
Charles A. Shamblin, Jr. of 1310
Vernon St., Plainview, Texas, has
helped his unit win the 438th Military
Airlift Wing PRIDE (professional
results in daily efforts) Award at
McGuire AFB, N. J.

« *  •  •
10 YEARS AGO-JULY 15,1973
Friona’s Dairy Queen Restaurant 

opened this week, and already has 
been tried out by many Friona 
residents.

E.R. New, 92, of Roby, a former 
Friona resident, ^ed at 8:40 p.m. last 
Friday in a Rotan hospital.

0 0 0 0

5 YEARS AGO-JULY 30,1978
Friona’s Major League All-Stars 

won the district championship with a 
pair of sparkling wins at Borger early 
this week and had their sights set on 
the sectional title in a game to be 
played this Friday, July 28 at 
Plainview. Team members are 
Michael Granado, Eloy Caballero, 
Rudy Bermea, Charlie Veazey, Ross 
Roden, Cody Scott, Mitchell Reeve, 
Paul Melton, Reese Fleming, Charlie 
Morgan, Rene Bermea, Scott Straw, 
Matt Lohis, Jeff Lundy and coaches, 
Larry Fallwell and Larry Johnston.

Muleshoe Sets 
Tournament

The Jack and Jill invitational 
softball tournament will be held in 
Muleshoe August 12, 13 and 14 and 
the entry fee is $65.

The deadline for entering is August 
8. Trophies will be given for first and 
second place and the team trophies 
will be given for first, second and 
third individual.

Each team must furnish their Blue 
Dot ball.

For further information, call 
Evelyn Pope, 272-3976 or 272-4023.

REMEMBER
WHEN? a

V  *>' «

Q

a

b Although it later claimed the title of **Longest Country 
Elevator in the W orld,” the Friona Wheat Growers* 
elevator was just average-sized prior to its expansion 
program in 1950-51. The above photo, taken in May of 
1950, shows construction underway on several bins at the 
elevator. Friona State Bank salutes our business neighbor, 
and is anxious to serve the banking needs of area residents.

FRIONA STATE BANK
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ai
T e n d e r  L e a n ®

PORK STEAK

T e n d e r  T a s te ®

SIRLOIN
STEAK

T e n d e r  T a s te ®  
B o n e le s s

ROUND
STEAK

B o tto m  C u t

Ten^der Taste® $ 0 8 9  Tender Taste® Boneless $ 0 7 Q  Great fo r Tacos

T-BONE STEAK M  BARON OF BEEF LONGHORN CHEESE
Tender Taste® Boneless ( O Q Q  Tenderized

EYE OF ROUNO S1EAK„
LB.

Tenderized t 0 7 Q  C h ef’s Pantry

BEEF CORE STEAK . .  V  ”  BREABEO FRITTERS LB.

Great fo r Cookouts! Country S t y le C 4  Q Q

PORK RIBS «
Tenderized 7 Q

PORK CUBE STEAK „
Rodeo t i R Q

SlICEB BACON '£
Rodeo Thick or Thin 1 4

MEAT BOLOGNA IS
Hormel Cheese or t  A 9 Q

MEAT WRANGLERS IS 7
Hormel A f i r

COOKEO HAM S “ “
Hereford p

CORN TORTILLAS ."L
DON’T MISS THESE SHOPPER’S CASH SAVINGS

K R A n PARKAY

MARGA­
RINE

GENERIC

SODA
WITH ONE 
FILLED
SHOPPERSCASHCARD

Pillsbury Microwave

POPCORN

DEWEY FRESH

ORANGE
JUICE

PLEASMOR

SUGAR
5 LB. BAG

Kraft Sm oke-Plain-Onion

BARBEOME
SAUCE

18 OZ. B T l

6 4 0 Z . ^  0
WITH ONE ■  I  WITH ONE 
FILLED I  § j |Q p p £ p §

SHOPPERS CASH CARD I  CASH CARD
Dewy Fresh

WHIPPED TOPPING
Vlasic Kosher

DILL HALVES
^ ____________________

New  Item !
K ellog g ’s Strawberry

RICE

PLEASMOR LARGE

EGGS
DOZEN

DARI MAID

MILK
V2 GALLON

80L
cm

WITH ONE 
FILLED
SHOPPMSCASHCAR&

Our Fam ily W hole

GREEN BEANS
Keebler

CLOB CRACKERS

WITH ONE 
FILLED
SHOPPERS C A S H C ^

D ú r k é e  O & C

WITH ONE 
FILLED
SHOPPERSCASHCARD

16 OZ. 
. CAN

16 OZ. 
BOX

POTATO STICKS 70Z.
CAN

Toddler-D aytim e

BUGGIES
BIAPERS

RICE
KRiSPtES

KRISPIES
14 OZ. BOX V

Purina-
Hi'Pro

Purina 
High Protein

DOG
FOOD 5 LBS. 50Z.

CAN

PK6.0F 
33 OR 48

Ellis

VIENNA SAUSAGE
Dish D etergent

CINCH
Our Lady

FABRIC S O E M R

50Z. 
. CAN

3 2 0 1
BR .

64 OZ. 
lUG

For C lothes Whiter 
Than W hite!

Red & Green 
Seedless

GRAPES
Ita lia n  P u rp le

PLUMS

84 0 1  BOX

$359

C a lifo rn ia

PEACHES
C a lifo rn ia

CUCUMBERS
C a lifo rn ia

AVOCADOS
C a lifo rn ia

CELERY HEARTS

LB.

BAG

FRUIT FRESH
Regular Size

KERR LIDS
Presto Snap & Seal Gallon Size

FREEZER BAGS PKG. 
OF 15

Presto Tow elettes

WET WIPES
Ritz Printed

PAPER TOWELS
PKG. 

OF 160

lUMBO
ROLL

Vaseline Lotion

INTENSIVE CARE
Deodorant

SECRET SPR
10 OZ. 
BTL.

Oxy-10

SKIN CLEANSER
The S ofter Swab

TIPS PKG. 
Of 170

S A LE 'S A LE !
E K C O ~ T E R N A

STAINLESS STEEL

CUTLERY
Featured 
this week

For
P a r t ic ipa t in g  
Stores Only

3Vi" CoitMr 
PviRt Kiilt

Ekeo trre rno sM a m o u sn d m e in th e in d u S try lo rk itC ^e n M n ivP S  -s 
p rou d  to  o ffe r C LA S S IC  C UTLERY a new  com p le te  CuHcrv 
assod m en i d es igned  for the  p ro fess iona l Out pneed e*c ius ive iY  
for you Twelve kn ives  to  choose  fro m ' Each km ie  has its ow n 
unique design -  o r ^  for every  possible need Add to ihts co llection  
five d iS tifK tive  cuttir>g boards a rx i tw o conven ient storage holsters 
and you can have the  u ltim a te  assortm ent o f k itch e n  km ves and 
accessories  w h ich  w ill last and last fo r years to  com e An item s 
ca rry  ou r fam ous E K C O E T E R N A ’ five  year w arran ty

No Ouai>r>»ng Purct'ase Reov-red

jeWAFT̂
16 AMBUCAN SLICES

V̂iA V 1

v > T " - .

Kraft
Swiss

Pim ento
Americani

IPLY
BATHROOM

TISSUES
Our

Lady
I

' «

Kraft Mini or Jet

r'

SINGLES
12 0 1  PKG.

TISSUES I M ’MALLOWS
4 ROLL PKG. 10 OZ. PKG.

H u n t’s

TDMATO 
KETCHUP

32 OZ. BTl.

Super Good 
Quality

ICE CREAM
V2 GAL. cm.

Easy 
W ay  

9 Inch

PAPER
PLATES

PKG. OF 100

PRICES EFFECTIVE THRU AUG 1 2 ,1983
Q u a n tity  R ig h ts  R eserved

ir..
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FAST!
PH. 247-2211

Reader Ads-First insertion, per word................. 20 cents
Additional insertions (no copy change, per word)
...............................................................................15 cents
Minimum Charge...................................................... $2.50
Classified display (boxed ads-10 pt. type under a specific 
heading, 1 column width only—no art or cuts. Per column 
in ch ........................................................................... $2.50

Card of Thanks—same as classified word rate, 20 cents 
per word, minimum charge...................................... $2.50

DEADLINE for classified advertising in Sunday’s issue- 
Thursday noon.

Check advertisement and report any error immediately. 
The Star is not responsible for error after ad bas already 
run once.

All classified ads are CASH in ADVANCE. Only legal 
notices or continuous running ads will be billed. All other 
ads must be paid in full before they will be published.

f . . . ------------- ---------- 1
I ANNOUNCEMENTS I

ELECTROLUX 
Vacuum Cleaners 

Sales & Service. Phone 
247-3156. Mrs. L.R. 
White, 806 Ashland Ave.

44-tfnc

^  AUTOMOTIVE

FOR SALE.... 1975 Ford 4- 
wheel drive pickup. Call 247- 
2169 for more information.

34-tfnc

COME IN AND SEE 
Our Honda Lawn Mowers.

NATIONAL FARMERS 
UNION INSURANCE

9th & Main 
Life-Home-Farm- 
Auto-Commercial 
Jim Tucker, Agt. 
Phone 247-3335

51-tfnc

Wheels & Things 
518 Main 

Call 247-8093
32-tfnc

CALL 
247-8811

FOR TAKE-OUT 
ORDERS 

MRS. ABALOS
32-tfnc

FOR SALE....1981 Mercury 
Capri, power steering, 4- 
speed, 40,0(X) miles, AM-FM 
cassette. Call David Tipps, 
247-3963-work or 247-2810- 
home. 31-tfnc

FOR S A L E ....1 9 7 1
C h ev ro le t C o n v e rtib le , 
au tom atic  transm ission . 
Good condition. Call 295- 
3016. 44-ltp

I Friona Lodge No. 1332 è 
â 7th & Ashland !
f Slated Meeting f

IstTues. 8 p.m. É 
J.G. Mars-W.M. ’

A.L. Outiand-Sec.

REPORT 
CHILD ABUSE 

CALL 1-800-252-5400
22-lfn

FOR S A L E ....1978 Ford 
Thunderbird, one owner, air, 
power steering, power 
brakes, cruise, tilt, AM-FM 
8-track, runs good, excellent 
condition, below wholesale 
only $3000.00 or best offer. 
Call 247-2387. 44-tfnc

MARY KAY 
BEAUTY

By Earlene Jordan 
Call 247-2537

2-tfnc

COME IN AND SEE
Our Snapper Law Mowers 

Complete Parts and 
Service.

Wheels & Things 
518 Main 

Call 247-8093
41-tfnc

CHINESE AUCTION....On
Friona Cable, Channel 6. To 
be auctioned off-25  inch 
RCA EXL 100 console, 
colored T.V., on casters, 
slightly damaged, $610.00.

44-ltc

FOR SALE

FOR SALE....50-inch RCA 
television. $1599 plus 
trade. Originally sold for 
$2498.00. Wilhelm TV & 
Appliance. 43-tfnc

! S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S

 ̂ Friona Students |
I Class Ring Selections |I _  _ - iCowan Jewelers iI217 N. Main

sssssssssssssssssssssssssssssssssssssss

Hereford
29-tfnc I

S S S S 2

8

ANNOUNCING....
Drs. Ervin And Larry Bussanmas, 
Optometrists, Have Purchased Dr. 
Beene’s Equipment And Have 
Opened A Practice In Friona At

901 Main Street

The Office Will Be Open On 
Tuesday, Wednesday & Thursday. 

Dr. Beene’s Previous Records Are 
Available At Dr. Bussanmas’ 
Office At 901 Main Street In Friona 

Call For An Appointment 
Clovis Ph.(505) 763-7012 

Friona 247-3061

FOR SALE....Large group 
video discs. Half price- 
Wilhelm TV & Appliance.

43-tfnc

FOR SALE....Disc players. 
$150 each. Wilhelm TV & 
Appliance, Friona. 43-tfnc

GARAGE SALE....August 
12-13. 8:30 a.m .-7 p.m. 901 
Arrah. Jogger, stereo system 
and lots of bargains. 44-ltc

r  FOR RENT I

FOR SALE....Down draft 
air conditioner, $125.00. 
Good condition. Brad Lloyd, 
247-3860. 41-tfnc

RENT TO OWN....TV and
appliances at Wilhelm TV 
and Appliance. 31-tfnc

FOR S A L E ....L o n g h o rn  
4du11. Call 295-3097. M.C. 
Osborn. 44-ltc

Video-tape movies. Buy, rent 
or swap. VCR format only. 
Bill Ellis, phone 247-3053 or 
247-2211. 25-tfnc

FOR S A L E .. . .A n tiq u e  
upright piano. Call 247-2537.

44-2tc

FOR RENT....Office space. 
Single office or suite. Call 
247-3961 or 247-3335.

8-tfnc

WE HAVE 
Bug Eaters 

Weed Eaters 
Wheels & Things 

518 Main 
Call 247-8093

41-tfnc

FOR RENT....Office space 
with utilities paid. See at 208 
East 11th. Call 247-2743 or 
nights, 247-3398. 6-tfnc

SATELLITE ANTENNAS...
$1,995.00. Financing avail­
able. Call Wilhelm T.V., 601 
Main, Friona, 247-3035.

34-tfnc

See Us For All Your 
Cosmetic Needs 

Cover Girl 
Maybelline 

Revlon 
Max Factor 

Cody 
Aziza

Bi-Wize 
Health Mart 

619 Main 
Call 247-3010

26-tfnc

SARATOGA GARDENS 
1300 N. Walnut Ave., Friona 

Now, 2 Weeks Free Rent 
1, 2 or 3 BR apartments. 
Modern all utilities paid. 
Kitchen equipped, carpeted, 
laundry facilities, cable TV, 
parking. Low rent for needy 
families. Children welcomed. 

Phone 247-3666
23-tfnc

MOVIE RENT....$1.00 per 
day. 200 movies to choose 
from including The Toy, 
First Blood, An Officer And 
A Gentleman, and Best Little 
Whore House In Texas. We 
will' also rent the movie 
player. Wilhelm T.V. and 
Appliance, 601 Main, call 
247-3035. 42-2tc

I  CARD OF THANKS ■
VIDEO 

MOVIE
We would like to express 

our appreciation for the 
cards, calls, flowers, visits 
and prayers during Ray’s 
stay in the hospital at St. 
Anthony’s.

Ray and Nancy Jackson
44-ltc

RENT OR SWAP
^Current titles: 
*Golden Oldies 

VHS Format Only

r  GARAGE SALE I 
. - . . . « • - . I

Phone 247-3053 
For Details

GARAGE SA LE....Satur­
day, August 6, 9 a.m.-12 
noon. Lots of toys, kids 
clothes, many bargains to 
choose from. 910 East 11th, 
at Radiator Shop. 44-ltc

BILL ELLIS

Call 247-2211 By 
Thursday Noon For 

Classified Ads.
PERMANENT PART-TIME 

FIELD INTERVIEWER 
NEEDED BY 

U.S. CENSUS BUREAU 
$5.12 PER HOUR

20.5* PER MILE CAR ALLOWANCE
Contact selected households in person to conduct social 
and economic surveys in Parmer County. Selected person 
will work full time during survey period, 60-70 hours per 
month. To qualify you must:
Be available days, evenings, and Saturdays 9 to 9 during
survey period
Be a U.S. citizen
Be a resident of Parmer County
Be 18 years old, or 16 years old with a high school
diploma or equivalent
Pass a 30-minute written test
Have full time use of an automobile
Be able to attend a 3 Vi day paid training in Dallas, Texas
Qualified applicants will be tested and interviewed by a
Census representative in Friona. If interested report for
test and interview to the Friona City Hall, 623 Main, on
Friday, August 12, 1983, at 9:30 a.m.

U.S. DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 
BUREAU OF THE CENSUS 

EQUAL OPPORTUNITY EMPLOYER

IMPROVE THE MARKET 
VALUE OF YOUR CORN

♦Economically clean your 
corn, wheat, sorghum & 
soybeans
♦Guaranteed to effectively 
remove chafs, cobs, d irt, 
insects, husks, weed seed 
♦Up to ISOCTbu. per hour 
removing as little or as 
much as you like

♦Simple low cost design makes the Eagle 
Cyclonik Grain Cleaner affordable to the 
individual farmer-

For more information contact:
CLAYTON ROBERTS
Manufacturer's Representative 

P.O. Box 295 Lubbock, Texas 79408
Phone: 806-799-8078

RAINBOW CARPET CLEANING
Cleaning, Tinting & Dyeing 
Residential and Commercial 

Eldon and Nelda Fortenberry, Owners 
Terry Huffaker, certified operator

Phone 364-4190 Hereford

I HELP WANTED Î
I______________ I

REAL ESTATE I

THERE'S A CAREER IN 
YOUR FUTURE!

Sales Expert W anted....to  
sell Avon. Good earnings. 
Call 247-3246. 44-ltc

FOR SALE BY OWNER....
3-bedroom, 2 bath brick 
home, 2 living areas close to 
high school. Call 265-3502 or 
247-3817. 43-tfnc

Need to hire LVN and 
CMA’s for 11 p .m .-7 a.m. 
shift and some for 3-11 ¡shift. 
Apply in person to Jo 
Blackwell, adm inistrator. 
Prairie Acres, 201 E. 15th, 
Friona. Phone 806-247-3922.

43-2tc

WANTED
Pro Shop attendant. 
Friona Country Club. 
Salary open. Retired 
couple preferred, but will 
take applications from 
ev ery o n e  ( re fe re n c e s  
required) phone (8 a.m.-5 
p.m.) 247-3839. After 6 
p.m. 247-2215.

41-tfnc

HOUSE FOR SALE....3
bedroom, 2 bath, double 
garage, brick, with fireplace, 
landscaped yard with 
sprinkler system, newly 
painted exterior, lots of
extras. For appointment call 
247-2447 days and 247-2352 
nights. 43-tfnc

SERVICES

GENTLEMEN, seven days a 
week dead stock removal. 
Call your Local Used Cow 
Dealer, 1-800-692-4043.

38-tfnc

I LOST & FOUND !

FOUND....Steer, call for 
more information, 295-6327.

44-4tp

PETS

LIGHTNING
WEEDER....

Kills weeds electrically. 
For overhead weed 
control in cotton, beets, 
etc. call Scott Fangman, 
247-3510 for Lightning 
Weeder application. 30” 
or 40” rows.

44-ltc

TO GIVE AW AY....two
puppies. Call 265-3459.

43-2tc

WANT TO BABYSIT in my
home Monday-Friday. Call 
247-2091. 43-tfnc

FOR SALE....AKC Brit­
tany’s. For hunting, show, or 
pleasure. Great champions in 
blood lines. Both parents 
proven hunters. From 
experienced kennel. Call 247- 
3431. 44-ltc

r >aec:9Bcgfic>w>Kc:9Cc^ 
LADIES I

For cleaner brighter carpet k 
^  call for Steri Steam, a 
y Thomas Carpet Cleaning, I  
i  238-1640. • 30-tfnc 0

LEGAL
NOTICE

AUTO SALVAGE ^  
Free removal. |  

Mike’s Automotive i

LEGAL NOTICE OF 
BUDGET HEARING OF 

FRIONA INDEPENDENT 
SCHOOL DISTRICT

The President of the Board 
of Trustees of the above 
named School District, 
pursuant to Section 23.45 of 
the Texas Education Code, 
has called a meeting of the 
Board of Trustees for 
the purpose of adopting a 
budget for the 1983-84 fiscal 
year of the district, which 
budget shall cover all 
expenditures for the Friona 
Independent School District 
for such fiscal year.

Phone 247-3596 »
17-tfnc I

ROOFING AND 
REMODELING....

Bob’s Roofing and Car­
pentry since 1949. Call 
247-8055 after 5 p.m.

40-tfnc
5SSSSSSSSSSSSS5

The meeting will be held on 
Thursday, August 18, 1983 
at 7:00 P.M. in the Board 
Room at Friona High 
School, 7th & Etta, Friona, 
Texas.

Any tax payer of the District 
may be present and 
participate in the hearing.

44-ltc

Courthouse
Notes

Instrument Report Ending 
July 27, 1983

WD, Ruth Rushing, Eric 
Vance Rushing, Lot 1, Blk. 
9, Drake Rev., Friona; part 
of NE part Sec. 2, T3S;R3E 

WD, Shirley L. and 
Homer Garrison, Roy Don 
Rector, 2 ac. out of SVi Sec. 
2, T6S;R3E

WD, T.L. Kent, Bobbie 
Lou Foster, SE 160 ac. Sec. 
18, T4S;R3E, 155.65 ac. Sec. 
18,T14S;R3E 

WD, T.L. Kent, Doris Lee 
Christian, W'/i and all S'/i 
ofSE'/4 Sec. 34,T6S;R3E.

GMC

mucKi
^0

Stagner-Orsborn

Buick-Pontiac-GMC
30 YEARS IN HEREFORD

See Us And SA VE
142MILESAVE.. HEREFORD, TEXAS

PHONE 364-0990

KELP TH AT 
GRE AT CM FEELING 

WITHGENUNE GM PARTS

G M Q U A Ü T Y  
S E R V IC E  PAR TS GM

GiENERAL MOTORS (ARTS DIVISION

^  We found another custom built brick home in choice 
Staley. Mom will love the beautiful kitchen and storage 
space. Dad will like the large fenced yard with Bar-B-Q, 
3 Baths and no fix up needed. $74,500.00

Super starter....3 BR, IVi Bath Brick home with fenced 
yard, single garage, central heat and choice location.

$32,000.00

Yesteryear charm with today’s conveniences...this 3 
BR, IV2 Bath bas it with spacious rooms, country 
kitchen, luscious knotty pine paneling and 2 living 
areas. $34,000.00

Looking for a brick home with potential. Call us about 
this 2 bedroom home with attached apartment.

PROPERTY
ASSOCIATES
R E A L T O R  S-----

JANET BUSKE 
AUBREY CARLTON 
GARY SCHUELER

102 East 11th 
Call 247-2745

Sales and Service on an 
brands of sewing 
machines and vacuum 
cleaners. We make service 
calls.
McKnight Sewing Center 

226 North Main 
Hereford, Texas 
(806) 364-4051

18-tfnc

HAVE JOHNSON GRASS?
Will help make it scarce for a 

slight fee.

Using a VERSA Hi-Boy 
Pipe Wick Applicator.

ROUND-UP
APPLICATION

Cotton Milo
Soybeans Layout

Call or see Ray Landrum 
295-3567

Or Box 911, Friona
42-tfnc

I WANTED Ì

30” or 40” Rows

Pipe Wick Mounted 
On Hi-Boy

Call Roy O’Brian 
265-3247

39-9tc

WANT TO BUY....House 
with 2 or 3 lots. Write to: 
T.L. Berry, 1213 Oak Street, 
Bonham, Texas 75418.

44-ltc

I WANT TO RENT OR 
LEASE....A pasture for 
three horses. Call 247-2156.

44-2tc

S-P-E-C-I-A-L
A-N-N-O-U-N-C-E-M-E-N-T

In order to give our employees extra time to be 
with their families, we will be CLOSED ALL 
DAY ON SATURDAYS during the summer 
months only. Evening appointments may be 
arranged in advance.
Beginning in September, we will again be open 
on Saturday mornings on the 1st and 3rd 
Saturdays of each month. Thank you for your 
coopertion.

Drs. Armistead & Smith 
Optometrists 

406 LFD Drive-385-5147 
Littlefield, Texas

The nations STuOlO

One 11x14  Color Portrait
$60.00 Value for only $1.50

Your choice of family nroup or individual 
One special offer per family, one per person

B-3

BUDGET MOTEL 
Wednesday Aug. 10th 

Photo Hours: 1:00 - 9:00 pm 
FRIONA. TX

M inors must be accom panied
by an adult

. I
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Happy
Birthday 

Friona Folks

LIBRARY CORNER
By DARLA BRACKEN

WEEK OF AUGUST 7-12
Friona residents having birthdays 

next week are:
August 7-C ordie  Potts, Earl 

Drake, Carol Dement, Charlcie 
Clark, Mike Fabela, Jud Simms, 
Debbie Wilcox.

August 8—Richard Ellis, Oscar 
Eastep, Jason Vaughn, Jeffery De La 
Paz, Julia Warren, T.G. White.

August 9-K athrine Cortese, 
Cheryl Weatherly, Odie Claborn, 
Ricky Rector, Ricky Roden, Patsy 
Talley.

August 10“ Kathryn Goddard, J.T. 
Gee.

August 11-Leland Hutson, Cliff 
McLellan.

August 12—George Jones, Ann 
Schueler, Mindy Beth Johnson, 
Denae Vera, Kathy Rutherford, Mary 
Johnston, Charles Caudill, Lisa 
Weatherly, Jimmy Putnam, Bill 
Wood.

If you or someone in your family 
has a birthday coming up soon, call 
the Friona Star at 247-2211 by 
Thursday noon and report it.

Hospital
Report

ADMISSIONS--
David Phelps, Muleshoe; Laura 

Tafoya and baby boy, Friona; Shain 
Rhodes, Friona; Jesse Ramos, 
Dimmitt; Maria Flores, Hereford; 
Vivian Myers, Friona; William Wells, 
Friona; and Linda Taylor, Layton, 
Utah.

DISMISSALS--
Mark Asher, Frank Abalos, Celia 

Alonzo, Lisa Vasquez, George 
Kellum, David Phelps, Bernardo 
Trevino, Laura Tafoya and baby 
boy, Maria Flores, Shain Rhodes, 
Jesse Ramos and Effie Jennings.

PATIENTS IN HOSPITAL-
Mary Anne Ruther, Carl Rea, Arlin 

Hartzog, William Wells, Vivian 
Myers and Linda Taylor.

“ I go into my library, and all 
history rolls before me. 1 breathe the 
morning air of the world while the 
scent of Eden’s roses yet lingered in 
it...I see the pyramids building; I hear 
the shouts of the armies of 
Alexander...! sit as in a theater-the 
stage is time, the play is the play of 
the world. ’’ Alexander Smith

“ Dreamthorp: Books & Gardens”
"L ibrary”  comes from the Latin 

word liber which means book. Down 
through some 6,000 years of existence 
the purpose of libraries, i.e. 
'collections of books,’ has been to 
communicate and educate the masses 
through both pictorial and written 
forms of communication. These have 
been on a wide variety of materials 
including: bone, clay, metal, wax, 
wood, papyrus, silk, leather, 
parchment, paper, film, plastic and 
magnetic tape.

The oldest library in the United 
States is Harvard University Library 
founded in 1638 just 31 years after 
the establishment of Jamestown, the 
first permanent settlement in the 
United States. A Massachusetts 
clergyman, John Harvard, donated 
money and 400 books for the library 
which was promptly named in his 
honor so valuable was the gift 
considered.

The first successful method to 
make books available to the general 
public was called ‘subscription 
libraries.’ Members paid their dues 
and the money raised was used to buy 
books which the members were then 
allowed to borrow free of charge. 
Benjamin Franklin founded the first 
subscription library in America in 
Philadelphia in 1731. Comparative 
dates include: the establishment of 
Library of Congress in 1802; first 
public libraries, as we know them, in 
the early 1830’s; and the Smithsonian 
Institution in 1846. Libraries have 
certainly come a long way--not only 
in methods of operation and 
quantities of materials, but also in the 
types of services offered. Enjoy 
making use of your library!

Almost 5,000 (4,823) items have 
been circulated during the months of 
June and July to 1,808 patrons with 
83 new readers registered. 224 
children have attended the weekly 
film programs for the summer

reading club in seven sessions.
New at the library: we have 

purchased subscriptions to Friona 
Star and Amarillo Daily News 
(Sunday and weekly) beginning 
August 1. All newspapers will be ‘in 
library use only’; we will keep back 
issues of the Star but the Amarillo 
papers will be discarded after one 
week.

Also a reminder of the ongoing art 
show with several of our local young 
people exhibiting. They are: Kenda 
Atwell, J ’mai Cash, Katherine 
Cortese, Daylen Gallman, Edward 
Garcia, Ricky Marquez, Alisa 
Perkins, Yolanda Renteria, Kenneth 
Smith and Shannel Woodard. We do 
invite young people to share their art 
work with us if they wish to do so.

Also available at the library on a 
rotation packet basis are: Large print 
books-30 books, fiction and non­
fiction and Spanish language book 
packet-20 books-adult, junior and 
children-rotated every four months; 
I6mm film  packet-i films-rotated 
once a month-usually primary, junior 
and adult; cassette tapes-60 tapes- 
different types of music, junior 
books, children’s books-rotated every 
6 months; and filmstrips-S-chWiren's- 
rotated every 4 months.

New on the bookshelf:
1. Color Me Beautiful by Carol 

Jackson is an exciting, new book on 
how to choose colors in make-up and 
dress which best compliment your 
personal coloring type. The authors 
identify these four basic types as

Bridal Showers
summer, winter, autumn and spring.

2. yVhere The Sidewalk Ends by 
Shel Silverstein is a collection of 
zany, contemporary poetry for 
juniors and definitely a book that will 
make you laugh.

3. Masquerade by Kit Williams for 
those of you who love an intriguing 
puzzle is a highly unusual, yet 
fascinating book with all types of 
both visual and written clues. The 
author says that it can be solved as 
easily by both a ten year old and a 
college professor.

4. College Survival Kit by Irv 
Brechner is just that a timely, helpful 
little book jammed with ideas on how 
to survive all aspects of college life.

5. Keeping The Faith "b y  Simmy 
Carter tells of both the exhilaration 
and solitude he experienced while 
serving as President of the United 
States.

6. Gavels, Grit and Glory by 
Jimmy Banks is the life story of local 
politician. Bill Clayton of Springlake. 
Plenty of pictures enhance his 
colorful story.

Book donations have been made 
by: Bobby Wied, S.S. Pritchards, 
Roxie Phipps, Bill Gibsons, Anita 
Guest, John Southall, Robin 
Houlette, Paul Springs and Wana 
Brewer.

Memorial donations have been 
made by:

William J. Mercers to Casey 
Adams.

Fete L . Surratt
Linda Surratt, the former Linda 

Anthony, was honored with two 
showers in Wink, Texas where she 
teaches school.

On May 17, a group of friends 
hosted a lingerie shower. Hostesses 
were Debbie Littlejohn and Paula 
Stark of Wink. They served punch, 
chips, dip, sandwiches and cookies.

Then on May 22, a miscellaneous 
bridal shower was h.dd at the Wink 
Methodist Church for the couple. 
Hostesses were members of the 
church.

Refreshments of cookies and 
punch were served to friends from the 
Wink community. Special guests were 
Mr. and Mrs A.W. Anthony, Jr. and 
Mrs. H.L. Surratt.

A Blue Stamp shower was given by 
the Young Homemakers of Texas 
group in Amherst, Texas on June 4. 
Friends from Amherst and the 
surrounding community came to the 
shower and brought books of stamps 
the bride can redeem.

Refreshments of cheese, crackers^ 
sausage balls, sandwiches, and 
cookies were served.

A special guest was the mother of 
the bride.

A bridal shower was held on June 
25 in the home of Mrs. Ernest Osborn 
here.

Hostesses were Jane Dixon, Melodi 
Woosley, Ann Carthel, Peggy

Monroe, Anna Jo Blackburn, Valoris 
Osborn, Nellie Pearl Shelton, Maxine 
Brown, Dorothy Ingram, Lois 
Weatherly, Tommie Boeckman, 
Ophelia Bennett, Diane White, 
Louise Widner, Tommie Mercer, 
Joyce Broyles and Ada Beth Smith.

Receiving guests with the honoree 
were her mother, Irene Anthony, and 
the groom’s mother, Selette Surratt. 
Honored guests were Mrs. Anna 
Anthony, grandmother of the bride, 
and Mrs. Ruby Anthony of Elida, 
New Mexico.

The serving table was covered with 
a white lace cloth. A crystal vase 
filled with pink roses and baby’s 
breath served as the centerpiece. 
Silver and crystal serving 
appointments were used to serve 
fruit, strawberry punch and assorted 
cookies and mints.

On July 9, a bridal luncheon was 
held at the Friendship House in 
Friona.

The luncheon was hosted by Mrs. 
Tom Woosley and Mrs. Jane Dixon.

Tables were decorated with bud 
vases with pink carnations and baby’s 
breath with little sachet baskets filled 
with silk flowers at each place setting. 
Arrangements and baskets were 
prepared by Mrs. Woosley.

A buffet meal of beef tips, fresh 
vegetables, fresh fruit, rolls, iced tea 
and strawberry tarts was served.

DON’T  BUYA THING UNTILYOU
HAVE CHECKED OUR FOOD BUYS!

DEL MONTE

FRUIT COCKTAIL 303 CAN 79

Long-term  c re d it 
to  buy
o r im prove ian d .

Use Friona Star 
Classified A ds- 
Call 247-2211 By 
Thursday Noon.

Del monte
DEL MONTE

PEACHES 303
CAN

C Q C  2 ^ l m o n t e

0 9  PEAS 303
CAN 59

DEL MONTE

PEARS 303 CAN 77
DEL MONTE

CORN »5 57
DEL MONTE CUT

GREEN BEANS 303 CAN 49
DEL MONTE

SPINACH 303 CAN 59
When you make the land your life . . .  you 
need to look for a specialist when selecting a 
lender. At your Federal Land Bank 
Association our specialty is long-term credit 
to agriculture. At the Land Bank we
have funds to help T K  a  
you finance 1 1 1 C

L a n d  
B a n k

DEL MONTE

CATSUP 24 OZ. BTL. n 09 DEL MONTE MIXED

VEGETABLES 303 CAN 53
9»)

a sound project.

Close to the land
and the people who work It
Federal Land Bank 

Association Of Muleshoe 
316 Main Street 

272-^010 or 272-5388

WHITE CLOUD

BATHROOM
RUSSET

POTATOES
10 LB.BAG

TISSUE 4R 0U P K G

CALIF.Plums
WITH SUPER 
SIX CARD . 59c

SWANSON
TURKEY 
DINNERS Boi » 1 5 9

CHEF PIERRE

S U LG EA P H O B tA
BANANAS

WITHOUT SUPER 
SIX CARD » 1 19 CHERRY

4 0 0 Z .
$ 3 7 9

SUNBRIGHT

fl:i
' S

BORDEN’S
MILK

LEMON AID ca°n'  B T

M£NUMflK£RS
BAR-S
BACON

UPTON FAMILY SIZE

Unfortunattly, very few people can wear a swim suit without anxiety. 
Bulgeaphobia afflicts us all at one time or another, so take a bit o f comfort 
in the fact that you're not alone.
I f  you're tired o f beach and poolside fears and really would like to get an all- 
over tan without a hint o f  embarrassment, there is a way to so/ve the 
problem . . . permonent/y. Join the hundreds o f thousands o f men and 
women who hove successfully lost pounds and inches the Pat Walker's way.
Our guaranteed method o f helping you lose weight, firm  up and (eel good 
about the shadow you cast invblves no fad diets, drugs or gimmicks, ft's a 
proven system we've used since 1952 which combines passive exercise on 
our patented Symmetricon, nutritional counseling and continuing figure 
onofysis.
I f  you're tired o f sitting on the sidelines, call today for an oppo/ntment. Tour 
initio! visit is obsofutefy FREE. We guorontee youll lose the bu/ges . . . and 
the anxieties ... os we work together to bring the rcof you out into the 
open!

BRAND 14 OZ. 
CAN

WITH SUPER 
SIX CARD 59c

J
WITHOUT SUPER 
SIX CARD

19

TEA
i z ^

24 CT.

WITH SUPER 
SIX CARD » 1 29

ROUND
STEAK

WITHOUT SUPER
l s ix  c a r d » 1

MGUM M8MCTION SALONS INTERNATIONAL
407 N. Main Som ep lace  S p e c ia l 364.8713 Danny Campbell, Agent 

247-3166 
Friona, Texas

DOUBLE ROSEBUD 
STAMPS ON
WEDNESDAY. 

REDEEM AT OUR STORE

WHITE’S SUPERMARKET r  t

OUR AIM IS TO PLEASE IN EVERY WAY
WE ACCEPT USDA FOOD STAMPS PH .247-2250

fS
r\;N7\x/\X/.\xn'x:
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Linda Anthony, Clinton Surratt
Exchange Wedding Vows Here

Linda Darlene Anthony and 
Clinton Scott Surratt exchanged 
wedding vows at 6 p.m. Saturday, 
July 9 in the First United Methodist 
Church of Friona.

Reverend Phil McClendon, pastor 
of First United Methodist Church, 
Amherst, and Reverend Tom Mills, 
assistant pastor of First Methodist 
Church, Alpine, officiated at the 
ceremony.

Parents of the couple aie Mr. and 
Mrs. A.W. Anthony, Jr. of Friona 
and Mr. and Mrs. H.L. Surratt of El 
Paso.

As the couple exchanged vows, 
they stood before an altar flanked by 
two seven branch candelabras and 
three-fifteen branch candelabras 
stood at the back of the altar. A large 
floral bouquet of white gladiolas, 
pink carnations, pink roses, baby’s 
breath and greenery was placed on 
each side of the altar railings. The 
arrangements, candelabras and unity 
candle were adorned with greenery, 
bows and pink ribbons. Floral 
arrangements with votive candles in 
the windows, pew bows, bride’s 
bouquet and bridesmaids’ flowers 
were all arranged by Melodi Woosley.

Mrs. Margie Harmon of Amherst, 
organist, and Mrs. Phil McClendon 
of Amherst, pianist, presented a 
variety of prelude music with Mrs. 
McClendon accompanying the 
vocalists. Donna Swaringen of 
Lubbock sang “ My Treasure’’ and 
“ He Has Chosen You For Me’’ as 
candles were lit by Mrs. Mike Fickey 
of Lubbock and Mrs. Curtis Bailey of 
Aztec, New Mexico. Mrs. Tom Mills 
sang “ The Wedding Song’’ as 
grandmothers were ushered in and 
the mothers were ushered in by the 
groom.

As the bride was escorted to the

altar and presented in marriage by her 
father, she wore a formal length 
gown of white chantilly lace designed 
along Victorian lines and featuring a 
Queen Anne neckline, long full 
sleeves and a wide flounce of crystal 
pleated chiffon at the hemline 
extending around a full chapel length 
train. Crystal pleated ruffles finished 
the edges of the sleeves and cuffs. The 
bodice of the gown was covered with 
scattered seed pearls and re­
embroidered lace.

To complete the ensemble, a tiered 
waltz length veil'of bridal illusion was 
bordered with matching lace and a 
crystal pleated headpiece.

The bride carried a heart shaped 
bouquet of American Romance and 
pink roses, wild roses, lillies and pink 
pixie carnations. The bouquet was 
made of silk flowers and was 
accented with shades of pink ribbon.

Carrying out bridal tradition, she 
wore a six pence minted in the year of 
the couple’s births, a blue garter, 
borrowed diamond earrings from 
Melodi Woosley, an old wedding 
band belonging to the bride’s mother 
and something new was her wedding 
gown. She also carried a handmade 
lace handkerchief from Venice, Italy.

During the ceremony, a special 
message to the parents, which the 
bride and groom had written, was 
read by Rev. McClendon. A song was 
then sung by Rev. Tom Mills and his 
wife, Debbie. The song was entitled 
“ Author of Love.’’ After vows. 
Congregational Lord’s Prayer and 
exchanging of rings, the bride sang 
“ With This Ring’’ to the groom. 
After the unity candle and 
p ronouncem en t, “ H arm o n ee”  
composed of Mrs. Jackie Howell, 
Mrs. Stan Miller and Mrs. Brad

by

B. W.
Armistead, O.D.

Drs. Armistead & Smith 
O P T O M E T R IS T S

406 LFD Drive • Phone 385-5147 
Littlefield, Texas 79339 Steven D. 

Smith. O.D,

YOUR CHILD’S PRECIOUS EYES
Because an individual’s well-being, personality, posture, 

social adjustment, school and work achievement is so closely 
related to vision, your child’s first visit to an optometrist 
should not be delayed or postponed. T h a t’s the 
recommendation of the American Optometrie Association to 
parents.

The AOA suggests that parents encourage a child’s 
interest in educational programs on TV and stimulate his 
interest in reading at an early age by reading to him and 
letting him SEE what you are reading from illustrations. It’s 
important to impress upon every youngster the importance 
of protecting his eyes and those of others from sharp objects 
and irritants such as sprays and sand, etc.

We recommend that your child see an optometrist for the 
first visual examination at the age of three and again before 
entering kindergarten.

This message brought to you in the interest of better vision 
by Drs. Armistead and Smith, Optometrists, Littlefield, 
Texas.

Isn’t it
great to be

part of
a family

44 million
strong? V •

\
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FRIONA TEXAS
FEDERAL CREDIT UNION
6TH& EUCLID PH .247-2736

Enloe, all of Amherst, sang “ This Is 
The Day.’’

Traditional processional and 
recessional music was played. The 
bride presented roses to mothers and 
grandmothers as she left the 
sanctuary.

Mrs. Tom Woosley of Amarillo 
was the matron of honor. She wore a 
tea length light pink chiffon dress 
with a handkerchief hem. The bodice 
featured off-the-shoulders with tiny 
spaghetti straps. The dress had large 
puff sleeves and a ruffle around the 
shoulders and top of the bodice. 
Matching light pink sandles were 
worn with the dresses.

She carried three long stemmed 
roses in shades of pink tied together 
with pink satin ribbon and she wore a 
small cluster of pink flowers in her 
hair.

The maid of honor, Cheryl Scott of 
Lubbock, and the bridesmaids, Mrs. 
Randy Roberts of Azle, Sherrie 
Baumgardner of Lubbock and Ellen 
Dixon of Odessa, wore gowns, 
shoes and roses identical to the 
matron of honor.

The flower girls were Kim Surratt 
of Grants, New Mexico, niece of the 
groom. Pi Pa McCollister of 
Cleburne, niece of the groom, and 
Tiffany Anthony of Arlington, niece 
of the bride. They wore formal length 
dresses of white chantilly and rachelle 
lace over a satinette matt taffeta 
fabric bodice that featured a high 
Victorian neckline and a scooped 
yoke. Satin ribbon accented the 
waistline of the a-line pink taffeta 
skirt.

The flower girls carried white lace 
baskets filled with pink carnations 
and trimmed with pink ribbon bows.

Travis Surratt of Grants, New 
Mexico, nephew of the groom, and 
Trent Anthony of Arlington, nephew 
of the bride, were ring bearers for the 
ceremony. They wore silver gray 
tuxedoes with white pink tucked 
shirts and gray bow ties. Trent carried 
a ring pillow hand made by the 
bride’s sister-in-law, Mrs. Larry 
Anthony.

Jack Dorris of Odessa served as 
best man. Groomsmen were Steve 
Brownlee of Corpus Christi, Mike 
Surratt of Grants, New Mexico, 
brother of the groom, Alex 
McCollister of Cleburne, brother-in- 
law of the groom, and Dennis 
Anthony of Friona, brother of the 
bride. They wore silver gray tuxedoes 
with white pin tuck shirts and gray 
ascots.

The groom wore a gray and black 
pin striped tuxedo with white pin tuck 
shirt and black, gray and white ascot.

Guests were registered by Mrs. 
Larry Anthony of Arlington and 
Mrs. Alex McColliser of Cleburne, 
sister of the groom.

Ushers were Larry Anthony of 
Arlington, brother of the bride, and 
Cole Perkins of Odessa.

Club Has
Business
Meeting

The Modern Study Club met 
Tuesday, July 26 at the Club House 
for a called meeting.

The 1983-84 budget was discussed 
and approved.

The Country Store and Maize 
Queen candidate were among the 
topics discussed.

Cookbooks have been purchased 
from the Caprock District to sell at 
the Country Store. These cookbooks 
have recipes from club members in 
the Caprock District and include 
several from Friona. These 
cookbooks can also be purchased 
from club members.

Refreshments were served to 
seventeen members and one guest.

“Good st̂ rvice. 
good coverage. 
gO (xi p a c e '
That's State Farm 

insurance."
Call:

JERRY SHIPMAN 
lAuto-Life-HcaKh-Homc and Businessl 

801 N. Main Sirecl- 
Post Office Box 1230 

Hereford, Texas 79045 
Phone: 364-3161

STATI lARM

INSUIANCI

lilt» a good r)«<ghbOf 
Stal» Farm la th#r»
SIjI» f Aifrn
insu'ak:» ConwntHS 
>4ome O I k rs

iihnois

Special guests from out-of-town 
were Mrs. Don Copley of Minnesota; 
Ruby Anthony of Elida, New 
Mexico; Mr. and Mrs. Clayton W. 
Barron of Arkansas; Wessolee 
Barron of Albuquerque; Mr. and 
Mrs. Clay Barron of Truth or 
Consequences, New Mexico; Mr. and 
Mrs. Clarence Mills of Arizona; Mr. 
and Mrs. Howard Meadows of 
Abilene; Mr. and Mrs. Richard 
Biggers and Dustin of Abilene; 
Jeanette Thompson of El Paso; Gail 
Cade of Sonora, Texas; Shirley 
Cunningham of Yuma, Arizona; Mr. 
and Mrs. Travis Howard of Odessa; 
Barbara Stephens of El Paso; Mr. 
and Mrs. H.L. Porter of Petersburg; 
Freeda Barron of Alpine and 
grandmother of the groom; Mr. and 
Mrs. M.M. McLarty of El Paso; and 
Mrs. Anna Anthony, grandmother of 
the bride.

A reception immediately followed 
in the Fellowship Hall of the church.

A wedding cake decorated with 
white roses and accented with 
greenery and reai flowers featured a 
pink flowing fountain. It was topped 
with two white satin wedding bells.

Cake was served by Barbara Bass 
of Lubbock,*cousin of the bride, and 
Linda Weaver of Muleshoe. Punch 
was served by Rene Colwell of 
Lubbock. Mints and nuts were also 
served.

The centerpiece, made by Mrs. 
Woosley, was romance roses and 
light pink tweedia with willow stems. 
The arrangement was in a crystal 
bowl and was flanked by silver 
candelabras.

Some of the silver appointments 
were furnished by the bride’s 
grandmother, Mrs. Anna Anthony.

The groom ’s cake was chocolate 
and was decorated with the couple’s

Mrs, Clinton Surratt
wedding date and an oil well. The 
groom’s table centerpiece, also done 
by Mrs. Woosley, was made up of 
shades of brown flowers and a 
wooden oil derrick. The cake was 
served by Mrs. Mike Surratt of 
Grants, New Mexico, sister-in-law of 
the groom, and Mrs. Ricky White of 
Friona. Coffee, nuts and mints were 
also served from the groom’s table.

The couple will reside in Wink, 
Texas.

For a wedding trip to Orlando, 
Florida and Disney World, the bride 
chose a white linen tailored two piece 
suit with a bright pink blouse to

complete the ensemble. Her corsage 
was pink roses, pink carnations and 
baby’s breath.

The bride is a 1977 graduate of 
Friona High School and a 1980 
graduate of Texas Tech University.

The bridegroom graduated from 
Eastwood High School, El Paso, in 
1977 and from the University of 
Texas of the Permian Basin, Odessa, 
in May, 1982.

REHEARSAL DINNER
The rehearsal dinner was hosted by 

the groom’s parents on Friday, July 8 
at K-Bob’s in Hereford, Texas.
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I f  A ir Conditioning 
doesn't have it  here

it  prohahiy doesn '1 have it.
Gas Air Conditioning Has It!
No other air conditioner has a warranty 
like a gas air conditioner because no 
other air conditioner is built like a gas 
air conditioner.
Gas air conditioning has fewer moving 
parts and no compressor to wear out 
or break down. This means less wear 
and tear and lower maintenance costs.
That’s why gas air conditioning is so 
dependable and why it has a warranty 
that’s tw ic e  as long as other types of 
units . . .  a full 10 years!
Find out more about the air 
conditioning that’s backed by the best 
warranty available. Call Energas today 
for a free cooling survey and cost 
estimate. There’s no obligation.

Remember, all air conditioning  
was not created equal. And we 
have the paper to prove it!

M a n u fa c tu re r's  lim ite d  w arran ty  covers  a ll d e fe c ts  in m a te ria ls  and 
w o rkm a nsh ip  o n  th e  sealed re fr ig e ra tio n  u n it fo r  ten  years fro m  the  
date  o f in s ta lla t io n  o f th e  a ir c o n d it io n e r w hen  it is  in s ta lle d  in  a 
s in g le  fa m ily  res idence . A ll o th e r pa rts  are w arran ted  fo r one  year 
from  da te  o f  in s ta lla t io n .
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Town Talk
By June Floyd

Call 247-3681 With Your News Item
How long has it been since you’ve 

seen “ Texas”  or visited the 
Panhandle-Plains Historical Museum 
at Canyon? If your answer is “ more 
than a year,’’ it has been too long.

Friday afternoon, along with our 
Oklahoma kids, John, Geneva, Joel 
and Heather Osborn, we left here 
about 2:30 or so with a picnic supper. 
Our first stop was the Museum, 
which we hadn’t visited for a long 
time. There are so many interesting 
things to see there that we ran out of 
time. It was closing time before we 
had viewed nearly all the exhibits we 
wanted to see.

The weather cooperated beau­
tifully, so our picnic supper in the 
park was fun. At a table nearby we 
saw Charlene Shaffer and children, 
Tracy and Cully, and her mother, Vi 
Lindsey, who lives in Muleshoe, also 
having a picnic. As we ate we saw 
horsemen, covered wagons and other

such things moving around here and 
there and watching them was fun.

We and other picnicers had some 
uninvited guests, too. One large 
tarantula made his way across the 
grounds and several wasps and bees 
wanted to be too close to us for 
comfort.

The production, which is in its 
eighteenth year, was super. Many of 
the costumes were new as were many 
of the performers.

One thing that hadn’t changed 
since we last attended was Tucker 
Yelldell. The same fellow has played 
that part for several years and as 
usual did an outstanding job.

If you want to see this year’s 
production, you need to include it in 
your list of things to do pretty soon. 
The final production date will be here 
before very long.

Some time in the not too far distant 
future we plan to go to Canyon early

You Are Invited To A 
Bridal Shower Honoring

JANE DOE 
Bride-Elect Of 
JOHN SMITH

Saturday, December 10,1983 
3:00 to 4:30 P.M.

In The Home of Mr. and Mrs. Doe

^  Now you can invite friends and relatives to X 
\  special occasions right here in the Friona Star,  ̂
I  Callus at 247-2211,

some weekday morning and spend the 
entire day.

* * A A

After being out of the classroom 
more than 20 years Paula O’Brian has 
enrolled at West Texas State 
University, Canyon. She has attended 
both summer sessions and plans to 
take a full load this fall. Her 
husband, Roy, and children, Celia, 
Shelia and Edward, have all agreed to 
assist her in qualifying herself for a 
bachelor’s degree in business.

She said, “ Right now I’m just 
trying to get in the groove and learn 
my way around. When the time 
comes. I ’m hoping to be ready to 
select the field I will best fit into.’’

•  * A A

Visitors in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. B.W. Turner last week were 
Gary and Becky Turner Hardcastle 
and children, Mindy and Marcus. 
The Hardcastles live in Wheeler and 
are on their way to San Antonio.

Mindy, age 13 and an eighth grade 
student, has qualified for the TAAF 
in high jump. They plan to make the 
track meet a part of their summer 
vacation.

Gary is a farmer and rancher and 
Becky teaches Junior High speech, 
drama and English in the Wheeler 
school system.

A  A  A  A

Newcomers in Friona, who really 
aren’t strangers at all, are Terry, 
Varla, V’Lynda and V’Laura Wilcox. 
Terry and Varla are both former 
residents and graduates of Friona 
High School.

The Wilcox family moved from 
Lubbock to 1108 Etta, former home 
of Joy Lindeman Trimble who now 
lives in Bovina, one day last week and 
Terry is employed at Friona Ford 
Sales.

Granddad Gene and Grandmother 
Mildred Welch are very fortunate to 
have five granddaughters living near 
them. The other three are Vacresia, 
LaTawn and Vanette White, who live 
in the Black Community. They’re the 
daughters of Troy and Veca Welch 
White.

A  A A A

■ V S

USED CARS
USED CAR CLEARANCE

1976 FORD LTD 1-OWNER
|l982  MERCURY m a r q u is  b r o u g h a m  4DR.(SLICK)
1981 FOsÓV-OTD CROWN v ic t o r ia  4DR. (SUCK)
1982 FORD EXP 2 DR. (NICE)
1981 ESCORT 4 DR.
1 9 8 1 ESCORD WAGON (BLUE)
1981 MUSTANG (NICE)
1981 ESCORT WAGON (WHITE, NICE)
1978 CHRYSLER LeBARON (NICE)
1977 OLsOtoUTLASS (WHITE, SHARP)
1977 OLDS CUTLASS (BLUE)
1978 TOYOTA COROLLA ( CHEAP TRANS)
|l9 7 6  POI^Sl^C GRAN PRIX

PICKUPS
1982 FORD FISO 

981 FORD FIDO (NICE)
98soT5RD FISO  
979 FORD COURIER

|l97sQyv^EV. SILVERADO
1979 CHEV. SUBURBAN

97%óS^EV. SUBURBAN 
11976 FORD FISO  
1976 FORD FIDO
|l980F 0R D  F-ISO(NICE)
1 9 8 1 GMC SHORT WHEEL BASE PICKUP (NICE)

FORD FRIONA
FORD-MER

WAS NOW 1
*2,495»“ *2,150»»l
»10,400»» *9,895»»!

*8,995»» *8,450»»!
*5,950»» *5,400»»}
*5,850»» *5,300»»!
*5,850»» *5,300»» 1
*6,950»» *6,450»»!
*5,355»» *4,995»»!
*4,395»» *3,995»»!
*4,250»» *3 ,850»»!
*2,950»» *2,400»» 1
*1,950»» *1,495»»!
*2,595»» *1,950»» 1

WAS NOW 1
*8,995»» *8,200»»}
*6,950»» *6,495»»!
*7,695»» *6,495»»!
*5,495»» *4,995»»}
*3,450»» *2,995»»}
*6,750»» *5,695»»}
*7,495»» *6,850»»}
*2,995»» *2,265»»}
*2,950»» *2,450»»}
»5(895'"’ *5,494'"’ }
»8,995'"’ >8,450'’'’ }

'I

CUR Y

Bryan Barton of Amarillo has been 
visiting in the home of his maternal 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. W. Odell 
Holley. His mother, Madeleaine, and 
sister, Berkett, arrived in Friona 
Tuesday afternoon for a visit.

« « # t
Odell and Etoille returned home 

recently following an extensive visit in 
California with stops several places to 
and from the West Coast.

They made the trip by bus, so 
maybe you could call it a bus man’s 
vacation. Odell retired from the bus 
driving business several years ago.

After being picked up at their own 
mail box by a Continental Trailways 
bus, the couple travelled to Clayton, 
California by way of Clovis, 
Albuquerque and Flagstaff, a 
distance of 1300 miles.

In Clayton they were guests in the 
home of Stan and Mary Holley. Stan 
is the couple’s son.

While they were there the Holleys 
observed their 45th wedding 
anniversary and were special guests at 
a French restaurant in Clayton. 
Etoille is of French descent, so Stan 
and Mary planned the party 
especially for her.

They did a lot of sightseeing in the 
Berkeley and San Francisco area. . 
They spent some time at the 
California Academy of Science in San 
Francisco and visited Golden Gate 
Park.

Other places of interest visited by 
the couple included the Crossroads of 
the Ancient World and the 
Aquarium, which are located in the 
park.

Perhaps the highlight of their stay 
was a visit to a fabulous Holland 
garden, which was established about 
1850 complete with a Dutch 
windmill, which has been pumping 
fresh water in large quantities for 
more than 100 years to water a large 
garden filled with tulips, grown from 
imported bulbs.

In the Napa Valley they visited 
several wineries and attended a wine 
sipping at the-Beringer Winery at St.

Helena. They were also guests at the 
French Wine Embassy, which is 
directed by Mr. and Mrs. Jean 
Jacques Vitrac, who have two sons, 
Emmanuel and Francois, and a 
daughter, Catherine.

Enroute home the Holleys stopped
in Fontana, California, for a visit in
the home of Rick and Koreen Phillips
and sons, Dustin and Chad. Koreen is
the couple’s granddaughter.

* « • «
Randy and Wessie Weatherly and 

children, Ashlee, Aaron, Dustee and 
Kassie, returned home Thursday after 
a four day vacation in the mountains 
of cool cool Colorado.

« «
Dave and Vivian Myers spent a 

couple of weeks visiting in the home 
of Mrs. Ina Coker. The couple, who 
live in California, accompanied Mrs. 
Coker and her daughter, Mrs. Billy 
Turner, to Beaver, Oklahoma, for a 
cousins reunion before returning to 
their home.

son, answered the phone and 
straightway went out to find his 
brother.

“ You’re pulling my leg,” Gerald 
replied. Then told his dad, “ I’m not 
going to fall for something like that.’’

Even after Laurie and Marsha 
returned home and re-enforced 
Ernest’s report, it took some 
persuading and maybe a phone call or 
two before the lucky ticket holder was 
convinced that he had really won a 
new pickup.

Gerald and Laurie lived here before 
their marriage and their first son, 
Gerald, was born here. She was 
employed by the Friona Star and 
Plains Publishers in the late fifties 
and early sixties and assisted Gerald 
in operating the Mobil Wholesale 
plant until they sold it to Dale and 
Jane Houlette.

9 * 9 9
David Carson, who had heart 

surgery at St. Mary’s Hospital in 
Lubbock Thursday morning, is 
making satisfactory recovery.

♦ ♦ « ♦
Gerald and Laurie Wright of 

Clovis visited in the Floyd home 
Monday evening. Their oldest son, 
whose name is Gerald, too, held the 
lucky ticket for a drawing at the 
Farwell-Texico Border Town Days 
celebration last weekend.

The Twin Cities Fire Department-I 
think that’s the official name of the 
organization-had sold a large 
number of chances on a new pickup 
and Laurie’s brother, Lewis Cooper 
of Texico, had sold his nephew a 
ticket.

As soon as the name Gerald Wright 
was announced over the loud speaker 
as the owner of the winning ticket, 
Laurie and her daughter, Marsha, 
who were in the crowd, called home 
to report the good news.

Ernest, Laurie’s and Gerald’s other

Ross, the 2*/2 year old son of Kent 
and Amanda Miller of Duncan, 
Oklahoma, had emergency surgery at 
the Children’s Hospital in Oklahoma 
City Thursday evening.

Mildred May, Amy Mason and 
Nelda Miller went to Duncan 
Thursday evening and returned home 
Sunday evening. They report his 
condition as very good and expect 
him to be dismissed in a few days.

The Kent Millers recently moved 
from Bovina to Duncan.

« • # *
A twentieth year reunion of the 

Friona High School class of 1963 is 
being planned for September 24.

Sharon Reeve White, spokesman 
for the group, asks that anyone 
knowing the whereabouts of the 
former Andrea Milligan or Angel 
Aleman contact her.

Her mailing address is Route 3, 
Box 138 and her phone number is 
265-3874. She would like for all class 
members to check picture albums and 
loan whatever suitable pictures they 
can find to the decorating committee 
for the reception.

Tr
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(fS BORDEN'S HOMOGENIZED

MILK
$959

GALLON

(rS

COOKED FDDD SPECIAL OF THE WEEK

BURRITOS 2 / 99 '
SAUSAGE V . C  
ON A STICK 99 EACH

K  KRAFTn n H T i  H

BBQ SAUCE 18 oz. 59
SHURFINE 1 0 L B .S 1  1 9
CHARCOAL ba g
VLASIC HAMBURGER a  A
DILL CHIPS 3 2  OZ. 89
ALPO BEEF FLAVORED « , g Q Q
DOG FOOD 5LB.BAG 1

BORDEN'S ASST. FLAVORS

ICE CREAM
ICE

CREAN

■J

Vz GAL. CTN.

Sherbet

BORDEN'S ASST. FLAVORS

SHERBET

Vz GAL. CTN

HUNT’S

CATSUP

PEPSI 
COLA
12 OZ. CANS

w \
SHURFINE

MUSTARD
32 OZ. 99c

PINTJAR

[f3

(rS
AILSOP

CONVENIENCE STORES

PRICES EFFECTIVE 
AUG. 5-7.19B3

WHILE SUPPLIES LASTI 
OPEN 24 HOURS

FOR YOUR COHVEHIENCEI 
SELF SERVE GAS
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Commissioners Pay 
Quarterly Tax Bill

Ü *  Ü

i t j i '
ill

_____________________________ - - _ _  * -----

4-H Members Compete
In Dist. Fashion Show

1

Payment of the county’s 
W orkmen’s Compensation fund 
payment for the quarter ending 
September 30, 1983 was one of the 
main topics at the Commissioner’s 
Court meeting July 25.

The county had voted recently to 
change their Workmen’s Comp to the 
Texas Association of Counties, and 
had received a bill from this 
organization for the fee of $2,687 for 
the quarter ending September 30.

At the suggestion ^ f  County 
Treasurer Benna Felts, a motion was 
passed to reinvest money from a 
Farm to Market CertiHcate of 
Deposit which had matured, in a 14- 
day CD, maturing August 9,1983.

A motion was passed to have Mack 
Heald spray the Courthouse trees for 
bagworms and elm leaf beetles, at a 
cost of $280.

Steve Lindsey of West Texas 
Equipment Company, Amarillo, met 
with the court to explain his 
company’s lease-purchase agreement 
for heavy equipment for possible 
future reference.

Motion was passed to allow the use 
of the Courthouse lawn for the 
Border Town Days Celebration.

A request by a citizen for help on a 
large hospital bill was denied, as the 
court did not feel obligated to become 
involved.

Soil conservation work was 
approved for several farms, when 
county equipment is not in demand 
otherwise, such work to be 
reimbursed to the county. Those 
approved were: Ricky Rector, 
Donald Dale, Larry Hodnett, Leslie 
McCain, Ricky Bennett, James 
Haseloff, Joe Bradburn, Billy 
Sudderth, Jerry Herrington and Bert 
Williams.

S. Stephenses 
Have Baby Girl

Mr. and Mrs. Steve Stephens, Jr. 
of Grants, New Mexico, are the 
parents of a baby girl born Monday, 
August 1, at 2:30 a.m. in Grants.

Named Hanna Beth, the new 
arrival weighed six pounds, ten 
ounces and was twenty-one inches 
long. Hanna is the first child for the 
couple.

Grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Joe Mercer of Friona and Mrs. 
Charlie Stephens of Abilene.

Great-grandparents are C.L. 
Mercer of Friona, Mrs. Thomas 
Martin of Paris, and Mrs. Mamie 
Stephens of Lubbock.

Mrs. Stephens is the former Leesa 
Mercer.

iSSt
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SAFE....Sam Morgan o f Bovina^ a member o f the Friona 
''White'' All-StarSi takes a throw from the catcher in an attempt 
to get the Muleshoe player out. The runner was safe and 
Muleshoe won the game. Mike Bermea is on second base. The 
action was in the recent Bronco all-star tourney.

Penni Weatherly Is 
Counselor At WTSU

F. Bates’ Rites Held
Frank Bates, 54, of San Antonio 

passed away July 10 and services were 
held July 12 at the Sunset Church of 
Christ in San Antonio. Bates was 
born near Bovina and attended 
school in Bovina. Survivors include 
his wife, Barbara and nine children, 
all from San Antonio.

He was known for his success and 
described by his brother Wayne, as a 
“ self-made man who, like other 
businessmen figured out that the key 
to real success was to ‘build a better 
mousetrap’.’’

In 1955, Frank opened a small 
restaurant that was to become the 
first of 21 Whopper Burger 
restaurants. His “ mousetrap” was 
the six-inch hamburger patty that 
soon ' became known as the 
“ Whopper” Burger. The concept was 
so popular that Burger King, a 
Florida firm that has grown into one 
of the top three hamburger outlets in 
the country, copied the concept and 
purchased the rights to use the

“ Whopper” as the name of its deluxe 
hamburger.

Burger King agreed not to build 
any restaurants in the San Antonio 
area where the Whopper Burger 
restaurants are located, according to 
Wayne Bates.

Frank Bates spent his early years 
oh a farm near Bovina. He spent time 
in the service and returned from 
Korea to start the fast-food chain 
with little more than “ an idea, $500, 
hard work and imagination.” Besides 
being in this business he was also 
active in numerous community 
organizations.

Frank Bates was preceded in death 
by his brother, Earl E. Bates, in 
January of 1983. Earl was survived 
by his wife, Ann, two sons, four 
brothers and one sister. Earl attended 
Oklahoma Lane, Bovina, and Friona 
schools, and taught school at Rhea, 
Hollene and Clovis. He received his 
degree from West Texas State 
University in Canyon.

Penni Weatherly, a freshman at 
West Texas State University from 
Friona, has been chosen as one of 41 
students to serve as counselors for 
Buffalo Branding ’83, a unique four 
days for beginning freshman 
students.

During Buffalo Branding ’83 on 
Saturday, August 20 through 
Tuesday, August 23, beginning 
freshman students will move to their 
residence hall rooms for four days 
featuring a preview of college life at 
WTSU.

Buffalo Branding was begun last 
year by personnel in the Office of 
Student Affairs to acquaint beginning 
freshman students with campus and 
to build class unity by teaching 
students history and traditions of 
WTSU, said Cindy Pearce, director 
of residential living and Buffalo 
Branding coordinator.

More than 400 freshmen 
participated last year.

“ We really just want to make the 
freshmen feel more comfortable 
about adjusting to college life,” said 
Pearce.

While meeting other students, 
faculty and staff members, 
participants will learn about WTSU 
history, student organizations and 
activities, and take campus tours. 
Workshops will be available 
concerning career decisions, money

Tri state
Fair ParadeCommunity Benefits

From Special Program Set Sept, 3
This community, as many others, 

receives the services of the Rural 
Infant Education Program. This 
program is an infant education and 
stimulation program sponsored by 
Central Plains Mental Health/Mental 
Retardation Center in Plainview.

The program is also partially 
funded through a grant from the 
Early Childhood Intervention of 
Texas. The program offers services to 
the residents of Bailey, Briscoe, 
Castro, Floyd, Hale, Lamb, Motley, 
Parmer and Swisher counties and the 
children referred to the program must 
have a physical or mental handicap or 
a developmental delay or be classified 
as developmentally disabled or as a 
high risk infant.

The child must reside in the nine- 
county area and parents must be 
willing to cooperate. Services offered 
in this program are a 
transdisciplinary assessment which is 
provided for each child. This includes 
psychological, educational, medical, 
sociological evaluation with physical 
therapy, occupational therapy and 
speech therapy assessmerjts given as 
needed.

When the child is enrolled in the 
program, he/she will have an 
individual treatment plan for his 
special needs in the following areas: 
daily living skills such as feeding, 
dressing, toileting, etc., gross motor 
skills such as physical skills like 
sitting alone, crawling, walking, 
jumping, etc., fine motor skills such 
as grasping and releasing objects, use 
of small objects to manipulate

Write Your 
Congressmen

Here are the addresses of your 
elected officials:

Congressman Kent Hance, House 
of Representatives, Washington, 
D.C. 20515.

Senator John Tower, 142 Russell 
Office Bldg., Washington, D.C. 
20510.

Senator Lloyd Bentsen, Senate 
Bldg., Washington, D.C. 20510.

objects, language beginning with the 
development of cooing and babbling 
and leading to speaking in sentences, 
cognitive skills developing thinking 
skills and problem solving skills, 
sensory training skills, training in 
developing abilities in the five senses-- 
hearing, seeing, feeling, smelling and 
tasting.

Other training will be provided 
according to the child’s needs such as 
physical therapy, occupational 
therapy and speech therapy. Services 
for this program are free of charge. If 
you know a child that is old enough 
to walk but is not walking, a child 
who is old enough to talk but is not 
talking, or a child that was born 
under conditions that might be risky 
to that child, you can refer this child 
by calling 647-2409 or writing to 
RIEP, 710 Quincy, Plainview, Texas, 
79072.

Workouts...
(Continued from Page 1) 

game sites have been reversed.
The Chiefs open up by hosting 

River Road, the team Friona met in 
the playoffs last November in 
Hereford. The Wildcats are 
defending champs in District 1-AAA, 
and are once again favored to be a 
contender this season.

Friona’s home schedule is really 
power-packed. The Chiefs will host 
Dalhart, always a District 1-AAA 
contender, on September 23; host 
district opponent Abernathy on 
October 14, and close out their 
schedule against rivals Muleshoe here 
October 28 and Littlefield here on 
November 4.

1983 Varsity Football Schedule 
Date School, Site, Time
Sept. 2 River Road, here, 8 p.m. 
Sept. 9 Boys Ranch, there, 8 p.m. 
Sept. 16 Shallowater, there, 8 p.m. 
Sept. 23 Dalhart, here, 8 p.m.
Sept. 30 Farwell, there, 8 p.m.
Oct. 7 Tulia, there, 7:30 p.m.
Oct. 14 Abernathy, here, 7:30 p.m. 
Oct. 21 Dimmitt, there, 7:30 p.m. 
Oct. 28 Muleshoe, here, 7:30 p.m. 
Nov. 4 Littlefield,here, 7:30 p.m.

Everyone loves a parade, and the 
Amarillo Tri State Fair Parade 
always draws a big crowd. This year 
will be no exception as the parade 
kicks off the 1983 Tri State Fair op 
Saturday, September 3.

The parade will begin at 10 a.m. on 
Polk Street in downtown Amarillo, 
according to John Kuhn, chairman of 
the parade committee, and will 
feature marching bands, military 
units, floats, horses, clow ns- 
everything you love about a parade.

The theme of this year’s parade is 
“America’s Decade of Water.” Cash 
awards of $250, $100 and $50 plus 
trophies will be given to the top three 
floats which best follow the theme of 
the parade. Trophies will be awarded 
for the best overall entry and for the 
best entry in the following categories: 
military, equestrian, band (four 
trophies to best bands from junior 
high through high school), junior 
ROTC, civic, youth and religious 
organization.

Awards will be presented at the 
outdoor stage on the fairgrounds at 
6:45 p.m. Saturday, September 3.

Entries must be in the fair office by 
August 19. For entry forms or 
additional information you may call 
the Fair office at 806/376-7767 or 
write-Tri State Fair, P.O. Box 31087, 
Amarillo, Texas 79120.

Club Sets 
Photo Event

Modern Study Club has announced 
that there will again be a photography 
exhibit and contest held during Maize 
Days.

Area photographers are being 
urged to sort through their photos 
now and have them enlarged. 
Pictures must be 5x7 or larger and 
must be matted or framed in order to 
be eligible. Snapshot-size pictures 
which are matted to a 5x7 size are not 
acceptable.

Pictures may be in color or black 
and white. There will be categories 
for almost every type of picture.

management, decorating residence 
hall rooms, dating, and diet and 
fitness in college.

Counselors, who are upperclass 
students, will share experiences and 
answer questions. Students chosen as 
counselors are selected on the basis of 
their involvement at WTSU and their 
wish to assist freshman students. 
They must maintain a 2.0 grade point 
average on a 4.0 scale.

Faculty members also host Buffalo 
Branding students in their homes one 
evening and the students are hosted at 
a barbecue at nearby Palo Duro 
Canyon.

At a cost of $25, participants will 
receive meals at the WTSU East 
Dining Hall, entertainment and a t- 
shirt.

Weatherly participated in last 
year’s Buffalo Branding. She has 
received the Campus Services 
scholarship and Don and Sybil 
Harrington Honor Scholarship. She 
is a member of Baptist Student 
Union, Recreation Club, First Baptist 
Church and participates in 
intramurals.

Her parents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Philip Weatherly of Friona.

Six 4-H champions from Parmer 
County will model apparel they have 
created in the annual South Plains 
District Fashion Show, Friday, 
August 5, at the Lubbock Civic 
Center.

Members from 4-H Clubs in 20 
counties will compete for honors and 
the right to represent their district in 
state competition next September in 
San Antonio.

The theme of this year’s show will 
be “ Happy Birthday 4-H,” saluting 
the youth organization’s 75th 
anniversary in Texas. Contestants in 
the district event already have won in 
county competition.

Representing Parmer County will 
be Maureen Jesko, Lazbuddie, senior 
daytime tailored; Devera Rhodes, 
Friona, senior daytime non-tailored; 
Shelly Salyer, Friona, junior daytime 
tailored; Sharlet Johnson, Bovina, 
daytime non-tailored; Danna 
Ralston, Farwell, junior active 
sportswear and Jennifer Cass, 
Friona, evening and specialty.

Each contestant will compete in 
one of four categories of clothing: 
tailored daywear, non-tailored 
daywear, active sportswear, or 
evening and specialty wear. There are 
two age divisions: senior, aged 14-19; 
and junior, aged 9-13. Only the senior 
winners advance to the state 
competition.
 ̂ Special awards will be presented to 
the senior and junior displaying the 
best cotton fashion.

The 4-H’ers will model their

Baby Girl Born 
To John Millers

John J. and Brenda Miller of 
Friona are the parents of a baby girl 
born Monday, July 25 at 1:32 a.m. in 
Deaf Smith General Hospital in 
Hereford.

Named Brandy Nichole, the new 
arrival weighed five pounds, ten 
ounces and was 18'/2 inches long.

Brandy has four brothers and four 
sisters.

Grandmothers are Roxie Farmer of 
Fort Worth and Delpha Vinson of 
Bovina.

creations in a public revue at 2:30 
p.m. in the Civic Center theater. 
Judging will begin at 10 a.m.

The 75th birthday of 4-H Club in 
Texas was the theme for the 1983 
Parmer County 4-H Fashion Show 
held July 7 in Friona. The First 
Baptist Church Fellowship Hall was 
decorated for a birthday party with 
balloons, party hats and streamers.

Eleven 4-H’ers from all clubs in the 
county participated in the Fashion 
Show. Each girl selected pattern and 
fabric to construct their outfits for 
judging on fashion, construction and 
fit. All 4-H’ers received a blue ribbon 
for a total score of 90 or better.

Other contestants in the county 
Fashion Show were: daytime non- 
tailored, Brandy Ray and Leigh 
Neelley, Friona; active sportswear. 
Lucretia Foster, Oklahoma Lane ana 
Nicole Potts and Elaine White, 
Friona.

Muleshoe 
Sets Mule 
Day Events

On August 13, Muleshoe will host 
her neighbors for a Mule Day 
Festival. Beginning at 6 a.m., events 
are scheduled throughout the entire 
day, with something of interest for 
everyone. All proceeds benefit 
Girlstown, U.S.A., Whiteface, 
Texas.

The Jennyslippers, women’s 
division of the Chamber of 
Commerce, will sponsor a parade 
through downtown Muleshoe at 12 
noon. Cash prizes of $100, $75 and 
$50 will be offered in three categories: 
junior riding clubs, senior riding . 
clubs and antique vehicles. All other 
entries will be eligible for a $100 
“ People’s Choice” award. The entry 
deadline is August 9.

For information or entry forms 
contact Dianne Nieman, 806/272- 
5285 or Roselee Powell, 806/965- 
2652. All clubs and organizations are 
urged to enter. _

UCTION
àNO

rioHtî

Tuesday, August 16, 1983 Sale Time: 10:00 a.m.
(T e xa s  T im e )

LOCATED: From Bovina, Texas, 8 miles West on F.M. Highway 2290 then 2 miles North, OR 
From Texico, New Mexico, 9 miles North on New Mexico Highway 108 then 2Va miles East on 
New Mexico Highway 77 and Texas F.M. Highway 2290 then 2 miles North (same being from 
Pleasant Hill, New Mexico, miles East on New Mexico Highway 77 and Texas F.M. Highway 
2290 then 2 miles North).

A. L. NUTTALL Owner
Telephone: (505) 762-7851

am moving from the State and the following will be sold at Public Auction:

TRACTORS -
1 - 1978 Farmall 1486 Diesel Traclor. Cab, A/C. HU.. W.F., 

3-pt., Weights. T.A., D.H., 18.4X38 Rubber, Duals.
2888 Hours

2 -  1974 Farmall 1066 Diesel Tractors, Cab, A/C, Htr., 
Radio, 3-pt.. Weights. W.F.. T.A., D.P.T.O.. 1-With 18.4X38 
Rubber. 1-With 16.9X38 R^ubber

1 -1 9 5 3  Farmall Super M LPfe Tractor, With I.H.C. 30 
Stripper & Triangle Basket Mounted

COMBINE, CORNHEAD, AHACHMENTS, 
GRAIN CARTS -
1 -1 9 8 0  International 1460 Axial-Flow Diesel Combine. 

Cab, A/C. H tr„ Radio. Hydrostat. 20’ Header. Monitors. 
28LX26 Rubber. 1025 Hours 

1 -ln te rna tiona l 864. 6 Row Cornhead, With Kickers 
1-I.H .C . 20' Pickup Reel 
1 -S und Pickup Attachment 
l - 6ig 12 Gram Kart 
1-Phares-Wilkins Gram Cart

TRUCK TRACTORS, GRAIN TRUCKS, 
GRAIN TRAILERS, PICKUPS -
1-1967  International 4000 Cabover T.A. Diesel Truck 

Tractor. Twin Screw. 5 Sp.-2 Sp.
1 -1 9 6 4  Mack B-61 T A Diesel Truck Tractor. Tti-Plex 

Transmission. 10 00X22 Rubber 
1 -19 59  Chevrolet S A  Grain Truck, 6 Cylinder, 4 Sp - 2 S p , 

16' Gram Box
1 -1 9 5 8  Chevrolet S.A. Gram Truck. 292 Engine. 4 Sp - 

2 S p „ 16' Gram Bed. Hoist
1 -19 54  Ford S.A Gram Truck, V-8 Engine. 4 Sp.-2 Sp.. 

Gram Box
1 -1954  I H.C. R-160 S A Flatbed Truck, With A-Frame 

Hoist Rack. 4 Sp.-2 Sp.. New Short Block 
1 -1 9 7 0  Tiifipte 38' Hopper Bottom Gram Trailer. T.A. Tarp 
1 -1 9 7 0  Fruehauf 38' Hopper Bottom Gram Trailer. T A 
1 -1978  Chevrolet Custom Deluxe 10. 4 Wheel Drive Pickup.

350 Engine. On Butane. A/T. L W B 
1 -1 9 7 6  GMC Sierra 15, ^  Ton Pickup. A/T. 350 Engine, 

On Butane. L W B  Crossover Toolbox

EQUIPMENT -
l-S c h a le r 20' Tandem Disc
1-John  Deere 400. 6 Row Rotary Hoe
1-ln te rna tiona l 155. 5-16" Spinner Mouldboard Plow

-Roll-A-Cone D.S.B.. 6 Row, 21' Lister & Fertilizer Rig. 
With D G.W.

-6  Row T.D.B. Toolbar, With Big 12 Hydraulic Drive 
Rodweeder. G.W.. Cleanouts 

-In te rna tiona l 6 Row Rolling Cultivator 
-In te rna tiona l 500. 6 Row. Cycio Air Planter 
-S erv is  1310. 4 Row Shredder 
-Jo h n  Deere DR-A 16-10 Gram Drill 
-Jo h n  Deere DR-A 20-8 Gram Drill 
-S u pe r Rhino 3-pt.. 8' Blade 
-S erv is  2 Row, D.T Shredder 
-S cha fe r 12' Offset Disc 
-Massey Ferguson 12' Offset Disc 
-In te rna tiona l 8' Tandem Disc 
- A l l is  Chalmers 3-14", 3-pt. Spinner Mouldboard Plow 
-W m kels 20' Land Float
-Hoem e 3 -p t, Box Beam. 9 Shank. Chisel-Sweep Plow 
-B ig  12. 6 Row. 3-pt Cultipacker 
- B ig  12. 4 Row Cultipacker
1-  6 Row. 3 -p t. O.T.B Cultivator

2 -  Eversman 6'. D.T V-Oitchers 
1-H am by 3-pl. Disc Ditch Filler 
-O itch -R ite  5'. D.T Blade
-J o h n  Deere 4 Row, D.T Rotary Hoe 
-W inpower 3 -p t. 4 Row Rotary Hoe 
-B u rc h  4 Row, D.T Rotary Hoe 
- 9  Row. D.T: Sandfighter 
-M -M  3-pt.. 4 Row Cultivator 
-Massey Harris 8' Single Gang Disc 
-Johnson 4 Row. 3-pt. Crustmaster 
- 4  Row Rubber Tire Seed Packer 
- 5  Row. 3-pt. Knifing Rig 

1 -4  Row, 3-pt. Scratcher Rig

IRRIGATION -
l-M o lm e  H.D. 800 Irrigation Engine. (1 Year Since 0 /H ) 
-Chevrolet 292 Irrigation Engine. (Rebuildable) 
-Waukesha Irrigation Engine. (Needs Overhaul)
1-G M C  478 Irrigation Engine

3 -  Molme H.D. 800 Irrigation Engines. (Need OverhauD
1 -  Moline 800 Irrigation Engine. (Salvage)
3 -  Roadmaster Turbo Chargers For Molme Engines
2 -  Molme 800 Crank Shafts
4 -  Molme 800 Heads
3 -  Molme 800 Clutches
20-Joints 7 "X20' Gated Pipe 
10-Jomts 8 X20' Gated Pipe 
8 - 7  & 8 " Hydrants

1 -L o t Irrigation Tubes. Various Sizes

TANKS -
1 -2 0 0  Gallon Poly F M, Spray Tank. With 
Booms & Pump

1 -2 0 0  Gallon 250 P.S.I.. A A Tank 
1 -2 5 0  Gallon Propane Tank, On 2 Wheel Trailer 
1 -1 4 0  Gallon Diesel Tank. With 12 Volt Pump 
1 -1 1 0  Gallon Aux Fuel Tank. With Hand Pump

WELDER -
l-F o rn e y  Portable Weldanator Welder-Generator. Air 

Cooled Engine. Electric Start

TRACTOR & TOOL MAKEUPS >
l - S e t  16 9X38 Axle Duals. For 1066 
1 -2 1 ' Double Reinforceo Tool Carrier 
3 -15 'X 2»4" Toolbars 
1 -3 -p t Hitch 
1 -L o t Toolbar Spacers
5 -M  M Lister Beams 
1 -L o t 2 **" Toolbar Clamps 
1 -S e t Byrd R OC. Hydraulic Row Markers 
1 -S e t Mills Hydraulic Folding Row Markers 
1 -S e t Byrd R O C Gauge Wheels

NON CLASSIFIED, ANTIQUES -
3 -S tee l Culverts 14 & 16" X 16'
1 - lm c o  125 Propane Carburetor & Centrey Propane 

Vaporizer (For Small Pickup)
1 -2 0  Gallon Pickup Propane Tank
1 -  Lot Electric Fence Wire. Posts. Insulators
2 -  Electric Fence Chargers 
l-A n tiq u e  Vise 
1 -A ntique  Drill Press
1-A ntique  Oak Buffet. With Beveled Minor 
1 -2 0 ' Overland Trailer House 
1 -L o t Barrels & Stands 
l-B u ta n e  Filler Hose 
1 -L o t Scrap Iron

James u I'uce 
iTXSQlWiJj

James M MiKe' Long
fTKMlWISr)

Jim Sumners 
(TUAOSJStU)

Jimmy Reeves
. - f t r

(8Ü6)

(806) 293-8883 

(806) 864-3611 

(806) 864-3362

Ovm Olid £(wg AucUmm
BOX 1921 -  PLAINVIEW, TEXAS 79072

m  UE «CEKTS MO «GEVn 0*11


