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Editor's Note: The following 
poem was submitted by Warren 
Parson, who is enlisted in the U.S. 
Air Force, last year but was too late 
to be published at that time. How 
appropriate it is for this years 
Christmas edition since there arc so 
many military loved ones helping 
defend our country overseas in Iraq. 
Our hearts and prayers arc with the 
military personnel and their families 
who wil I be apart this year during the 
Christmas Season. Thank you 
Warren for the beautiful Christmas 
card and such a touching poem. May 
God bless you and yours. Vanda 
Anderson Creech

Come To Christmas 
Carols, Candlelight & 
Communion Thurs.

Please bring your entire family and 
share in an hour of Christmas carols, 
candlelight and communion at the 
First United Methodist Church on 
Christmas Eve at 6:00 p.m.

Who doesn't like to sing the fa­
miliar Christmas carols? Watch the 
beauty of the sanctuary being illu­
minated by candles! Be reminded of 
the reason Jesus came by partici­
pating in the Lord's Supper. (Any­
one who is a follower of Christ is 
welcome to take part in the com­
munion service!)

The lighting of the candles sym­
bolize the light that we, as Chris­
tians, are to reflect upon a dark and 
sometimes dreary world. This 
heartwarming and special event will 
add a new dimension to your 
Christmas Eve celebration. Be a part 
of the "real meaning" of Christmas!

ITie Night Before Christmas 
'Twas the night before Christmas, 

he lived all alone 
In a one bedroom house made of 

plaster and stone.
I had come down the chimney with 

presents to give.
And to sec just whom in this home 

did live.
I looked all abouL a strange sight 

did I see.
No tinsel, no presents, not even a 

tree.
No stocking by the mantle, just 

boots filled with sand.
On the Wî |l hung pictures of far 

distant lands.
With medals and badges, awards 

of all kinds,
A sober thought came through my 

mind.
For this house was different, it was 

dark and dreary,
1 found the house of a soldier, once 

I could see clearly.
The soldier lay sleeping, silent, 

alone.
Curled upon the floor in this one 

bedroom home.
The face was so gentle, the room in 

such di.sordcr.
Not how 1 pictured a United States 

soldier.
Was this the hero of whom I just 

read?
Curled up on a poncho, the floor 

for a bed?
1 realized the families 1 saw on this 

night.
Owed their lives to these soldiers, 

who were willing to fight.
Soon round the world the children 

would play.
And grown-ups would celebrate a 

bright Christmas day.
They all enjoyed freedom each 

month of the year.
Because of the .soldiers, like the 

one lying here.
I couldn't help wonder how many 

lay alone.
On a cold Christmas Eve, in a land 

far from home.
The very thought brought a tear to 

my eye,
I dropped to my knees and started 

to cry.
The soldier awakened and I heard a 

rough voice,
"Santa, don't cry, this life is my 

choice.;
1 fight for freedom, 1 don't ask for 

more.
My life is my God, my country, my 

Air Forcc/my Army/my Corp/my 
Navy."

The soldier rolled over and drifted 
to sleep,

I couldn't control it I started to 
weep.

I kept watch for hours, .so silent and 
still

And wc both shivered from the 
cold night's chill.
See DOWN HOME pg. 2

Chamber of 
Commerce 
Business 
Spotlight

I f Thanks” 
from the 
Kiwanis

LOVELY NEW FURNISHINGS DECORATE THE VISITING 
AREA AT COLONIAL OAKS NURSING HOME

Nursing Home Gets 
Fresh New Look

By DEBORAH GRISWOLD

The Cross Plains Chamber of 
Commerce will begin a series of 
articles spodighting Chamber busi­
ness members. Plans are for each 
business member to submit to the 
Chamber office information re­
garding their business. A Chamber 
member will then contact the busi­
ness folk for taking a picture to ac­
company the news article. If you are 
a business member and have not yet 
submitted your information to the 
Chamber office, please do so as soon 
as possible. For further information, 
you may contact Susan Schaefer, 
Chamber manager at 725-7251.

On Thursday, December 17 Colo­
nial Oaks Nursing Home proudly 
presented their newly renovated fa­
cility to approximately 75 family, 
friends and residents of Cross 
Plains during their open house. 
Linda Merritt and Ruby Cassle re­
ally did a great job getting every­
thing ready and in place for the fes­
tivities.

Upon arrival you will automati­
cally notice the fresh coat of gray 
paint and teal green shutters on the 
windows. The entire home had 
some kind of renovation take place.

Vinyl flooring was laid throughout 
the home to begin with, and the walls 
.saw a coat or two of white paint. A 
border consisting of blue, mauve 
and beige flowers around the ceiling 
make for a bright airy feeling. 
Various pictures adorn the walls in 
each hall.

A much needed face-lift is noticed 
especially in the lobby area. The old 
rocking chairs and sofas were retired 
and Queen Anne styled chairs, rock­
ers and a sofa carrying out the color 
scheme of blue and mauve replaced 
them. Matching end tables with 
beautiful lamps compliment the de­
cor. A sofa size mirror with an 
antique gold tri m hangs over the sofa 
while on the opposite wall over the 
piano, a beautiful painting of a piano 
with sheet music, candelabra and a 
kitten sitting on the piano bench

hangs.
Ruby Cassle head dietician was 

especially proud of her new kitchen 
and each week she would show me a 
litde more of what had been ac­
complished. New cabinets replaced 
the old ones, new sinks and two 
refrigerators were also added.

Colonial Oaks Nursing Home was 
built in 1963 by Col. Ray Lee who 
owned and operated the home until 
his death in September, 1981. Mrs 
Ray Lee continued to operate the 
home by the same high standard 
until her death at which time her 
daughter took on the responsibility 
until she sold the home to current 
owner Mike Mayo.

The nursing home was initially 
open for business in November, 
1963. The care and well-being of the 
resident has always been the pri­
mary concern. Good food, good 
care, cleanliness and a loving, 
friendly atmosphere are the things 
the staff strive for and work hard to 
guarantee the residents and their 
families.

An open door policy, inviting 
visits from the families and the en­
tire community has been the wish of 
the management in years past and 
Continues to be true under the 
present management.

If you find you have time on your 
hands, go by Colraiial Oaks Nursing 
Home and visit with the residents. 
You will not only make the residents 
day but you will be richly blessed.

The Kiwanis Club of Cross Plains 
takes this opportunity to thank all 
who helped make our Christmas 
program, in conjunc tion with Cross 
Plain’s Christmas 'v'illage 1998, a 
great success and enjoyable time.

They especially thank all the 
m erchan ts  and b u sin ess  
establishments for your donations 
for the drawings -  cash, articles and 
services (see advertisement for 
listing).

A big "Thank You” to Mr. Mickey 
M ichaels o f B irchw ood 
Construction (the construction 
company working on the sidewalks) 
for donating $500 that made twenty 
recipients $25 richer each -  and 
happier!

Also a special 'Thank You" to 
Lowe's of Abilene for donating the 
Christmas tree in front of City Hall. 
It not only enhanced the program 
that night, it is providing an addition 
to the lighting along Main Street for 
the entire Christmas season.

Another special "Thank You" to 
Mr. Felty and the band members for 
providing the excellent Chrisunas 
music for the night.

The Kiwanis Club appreciates the 
kiAipciuuuii 01 so many wtio helped 
make the armual Christmas program 
its usual meaningful event.

Commissioners approve 
vehicie purchase - other 
items discussed in meeting

By BILLY HARRIS 
Special Writer

BAIRD—Callahan County Com­
missioners met in regular session 
Monday, December 14 and ap-. 
proved a new vehicle for the sheriffs 
department.

Judge Bill Johnson presided over 
his last Commissioners Court Mon­
day and called the meeting to order 
with all four commissioners in at­
tendance.

Johnson has headed the county 
government for eight years (two 
terms) and chose not to seek re- 
election in the last election. He an­
nounced his intentions at the June 22 
meeting last year and said, "I'vcbcen 
working since I was eleven years old 
and I'll be 67 at the end of this term, 
and I'm tired." A small reception 
was held for him after the meeting.

Hanner Chrysler was the only 
bidder, at $21,000 for a sheriff} 
uepartment vehicle and was 
awarded the bid by commissioners. 
A 1999 Dodge 1/2 ton pickup will be 
added to the sheriffs fleet A 1994

Ford Crown Victoria car, with ap­
proximately 200,000 miles on it, 
will be tradeil in on the pickup. 
Motion by Bryan Farmer and sec­
onded by Tommy Holland.

Other items on Monday's agenda:
Bruce Clark spoke to the court 

concerning access to some property 
in Precinct 4 that had been closed by 
landowner Raymond Franke.

Clark said he had an affidavit from 
a long time resident who stated he 
has personally used the road for 
forty-four years and observed Cal­
lahan County road equipment 
maintaining the road over that pe­
riod of time.

Judge Johnson said, "I’ve searched 
through commissioners court min­
utes back as far as you can go and I 
can't find anywhere that the road was 
requested to be taken in for county 
maintenance or that the county ap­
proved such maintenance."

"The only way wc'rc going to get 
tnis resotved, to everybody's sitis- 
faction, is to take it before a district 
court and whatever the district court 
Sec COUNTY pg. 5
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RETIRING FROM COI.ONIAL OAKS NURSINi; IlOME- 
W oil was honored with a reception.

F ranees

Colonial Oaks Honored Frances 
Wolf With a Retirement Celebration

By VANDA ANDERSON 
CREECH

Colonial Oaks Nursing Home held 
a surprise retirement celebration for 
Frances W olf, adm inistrator, 
Thursday, December 17. Members 
of the staff prepared a beautiful table 
with cake, punch and all the 
trimmings in her honor.

A host of friends, her family, staff 
and residents were in attendance. 
Everyone was able to wish Frances 
well, as she officially retires 
December 31st.

She has been employed by 
Colonial Oaks Nursing Home for 
the past 29 1/2 years. Beginning as a 
nurses aidcinJuly, 1969, a year later 
she attended administrator school at 
Cisco Junior College for two years. 
She was em ployed  as an 
administrative trainee under the 
direction of the late Raymond 
(Colonel) Lee, who owned the 
nursing home at that time, for one 
year. Her o ffic ia l duties as 
administrator began June 1972.

Frances remarked, "I wouldn't take 
anything in the world for all the 
experiences. The memories over the 
years arc so special to me."

With 29 plus years in one position 
she has made friends with so many 
employees, residents and their 
family members -- life-tim e 
acquaintances which she treasures. 
F rances fe lt th a t she had 
accomplished good relationships 
with every family she had dealt with.

"I just love people, especially the 
older residents," Frances said. She 
expressed how much she would 
miss everyone. She complemented 
her staff, suting that they were 
precious to her and they had spoiled 
her.

Frances related the main objective 
she held foremost during her career. 
She wanted people who met her to 
know that she was a Christian. .She 
shared her daily morning prayer: 
Lord, let me do and say the things 
that will make people realize that I 
am a Christian. What better goal?

Frances' husband, James, will be 
retiring from employment with 
Kenneth Moiidordon Detcml it 31 
as well. The couple have three 
children, Trudi Long, Mack Wolf 
aiKl Dale Wolf, nine grandchildren 
and seven great-grandchildren 

Last September they moved Irom 
north of Pioneer to a home in Cross 
Plains. T'hcy hope to enjoy their 
retirement while they arc still able 
to, as Frances says.

They haven't planned their 
retirement out in details, but James 
told Frances they were going to do 
what they wanted, when they 
wanted, and where they wantetl. 
"Tve been planning all my life. I 
don’t want to plan any more," 
Frances noU'd.

The two hope to be a part of the 
community and may travel a little.

It you have loved ones who reside 
at Colonial Oaks Nursing Home 
now or in the past, or if you just visit 
friends there, you can’* overlook the 
family-type atmosphere. It is a great 
comfort to know that they arc well 
cared for. Frances can be proud of 
her accomplishments. She will be 
missed, too!
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Presents:
“What’s Inside”

COLONIAL OAKS 
SERVICES
Cornerstone Church will conduct 
worship services at Colonial Oaks 
Nursing Home on .Sunday, Decem­
ber 27, commencing at 3:30 p.m.
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COUNTY COURT 
Bill Johnson presiding

Misdemeanor Filings
Aaron Lane Everea, possession of 

marijuana.
Andres Martinez, Jr., DWI.
Joe W. Cleveland. DWI.

Johnson, James Duane Gotcher, 
Todd Francis Glasgow, Richard 
Styles, Jr.

In the matter of Clark J. Ward, SOS 
Bail Bond is allowed to withdraw as 
surety.

Fidel Poppy Carrillo, criminal 
mischief, $229.25 court costs. 60 
days in jail.

Misdemeanor Minutes
Motions filed to revoke probations: 

Michael Ray Johnson, Michelle 
Baldock, Curtis Sean Dugan.

Motions dismissed to revoke pro­
bations: Robert Lee Young, Jr., 
Stephen Ronald Willis, Howard 
Thomas Williams, Jesse Andgel 
Vega, Guadalupe Herrera Trevino, 
Jody Lynn Thomas, Antonio 
Soriano, VirginiaSueSmith, John C. 
Smith, Daniel Clifton Riggs, George 
Michelle Raiola, Utah Alton 
Presley, Bill»Wayland O'Donald, 
Jeffrey Lee Lovelace. Ricardo 
Leroy, Barney Johnson, Alonzo 
Lee, Mark J. Holbert, Helen Qara

MARRIAGE LICENSE 
Ava Joyce Tolled & Ray Scott 

Dodd of Cross Plains.
Toni Michelle Stephenson & 

Charles Jefferson Carr IV of Clyde.

42ND DISTRICT COURT 
John Weeks, presiding

Civil Filings
Rigid Building Systems vs GMC 

Project Services, Mai Enterprises & 
Lawrence Management Service, 
damages; breach of contact.
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Civil Minutes
Dale E. Davis, found to be $39,708 

in arrears on child support; new 
schedule of payments to begin 2-1- 
99.

Leland Dean Wansley, found to be 
$4,025 in arrears on child support; 
new schedule of payments began 12- 
15-98.
John C. Wooten, found to be 

$5,080 in arrears in child support; 
new schedule of payments to begin 
1-1-99.

Divorce granted:
King, Kimberly & Robert.

Raymond 'Cobby' 
Strickland

BAIRD—Raymond L. "Cobby" 
Strickland. 81, lifelong local resi­
dent, passed away Thursday, De­
cember 17, 1998, in an Abilene 
hospital.

Services were held at 10:30 a.m. 
Saturday in Parker Funeral Home 
Chapel with Alfred Gadberry and 
Lyle Ancell officiating. Burial was 
in Ross Cemetery.

Mr. Strickland was bom in Burkett 
and served with the U.S. Army 
during World War II. He married 
Ruth Hardwick in 1953 in Abilene 
and retired as head of maintenance 
of the Baird Housing Authority. He 
was a member of the Church of 
Christ.

Survivors include his wife, of 
Baird; two sons, David Strickland of 
Abilene and Paul Strickland of 
Denton; one daughter, Martha 
Strickland of Abilene; five grand­
children and three great-grandchil­
dren.

Decenlber 14-18

(USPS 138-660) is published 
weekly on Thursday, for $15.00 
per year w ith in  Callahan 
County; $18.00 per year else­
where in Texas; $20.00 per 
year out of state. (No foreign 
copies except APO or like ad­
dress); by Review Publishing 
Co., 116 E. 8th St., Cross 
Plains, Texas 76443.

Periodical postage paid at 
Cross Plains, Texas 76443.

POSTMASTER: Send address 
changes to Cross Plains Re­
view, P.O. Box 519, Cross 
Plains, T^xas 76443. 
Telephone : 1 (254) 725-6111 
FAX: 1 (254) 725-7225

Felony Indictments 
Randal R. Whitaker, theft & un­

lawful use of a motor vehicle. 
Joseph Ray Maxwell, arson.
Joe E. Taylor, possession of a 

controlled substance.
Oscar Lewis King, DWI.

Felony Minutes
Ronnie Scott Claxton, probation 

discharged.
Tommy Davy Patterson, motion 

dismissed to revoke probation.

8 1 /2 x 1 1 ,8 1 /2 x 1 4 ,  
or 11 x17 
C O P IE S  
AT T H E

C R O S S  P L A IN S  
R E V IE W

Santa Claus visited the children of 
LAP last week and brought Christ­
mas treats. Thank You Santa!

Statistics
Cross Plains Books: 54 
Abilene Books: 6 
Audio Cassettes: 17 
Memorials: I/MNovilia Barton by 

O.B. & Bobbie Edmonson and 
Hollis and Cherry Shults 

I/M Elton Weaver by Hollis & 
Cherry Shults

I/M Dale Gary by Harley & Linda 
Gary

I/M of Silas & Ross Havens by S.L. 
& Evelyn Havens 

Gifts: In HonorofBillie Loving by 
Ross Hemphill

Donations: Burl McCowen, Doris 
N. Jones. M/M H.R. Stambaugh, M/ 
M Dick Thrasher, M/M John Adams 
and Kent Davis of Camp Springs, 
Missouri

Sdected
Scriptures

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH
10TH & M A IN  CROSS PLAINS (254)725-7629
Sunday School.............................................................. 9:45 a.m.

Evening Worship..................................................... 6:00 p.m.
Wed. Prayer Service.......................................................................7:00 p.m.

Wayne Lenz • Pastor 725-4577 • Jason Kampf • Youth & Music Minister

/  entreated your fa vo r  ufith 
my zuhoCe Heart; “Be mercifid 
to me according to  your  
zvord. Tsedms 119:58 
Paid Advertising — Irma Miller

O F nC E  SUPPLIES

U N IT E D  P R E S B Y T E R IA N  C H U R C H
9TH & AVE. D CROSS PLAINS
WORSHIP SER V IC E...................9:30 A.M.
BIBLE C L A S S ..... ........................  lOiS^'A.M.

Rev. Henry G rubbs, Pastor /
Everyone Welcome

LAMINATING MACHINE

COPIER -Enlargements/ 
Reductions

PUBLIC FAX MACHINE

Cross Plains Review 
(254)725-6111

Billie Jo Richards
Billie Jo Richards, 75. of Clyde 

passed away Saturday at a local 
hospital.

The body was cremated. Services 
were held December 19,1998 at 11 
a.m. Tuesday at Allen-Korzenewski 
Funeral Home Chapel, 1443 N. 2nd, 
with the Rev. Vic Meyer officiating.

Mrs. Richards was bom in Gorman 
and graduated from Hawley High 
School. She was a homemaker and. 
a member of the Church of Christ. 
She manied Wes Richards in 1968.

Survivors include her husband, of 
Clyde; three stepsons, Steven Lee 
Richards of Wennemuca, Nevada, 
Monty Don Richards of Cross Plains 
and Gary Lynn Richards of 
Beeville; 11 grandchildren and sev­
eral great-grandchildren.

Memorials may be made to the 
American Cancer Society, P.O. Box 
41. Abilene 79604.

CROSS I  
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Cross Plains 
Cemetery 
Assoc. Report

Month of September 1998 
DONATIONS & EARNINGS: 

Leota & Wayne Howser $25; Ida 
Belle Duncan $100; Annoymous 
Donation $100; I/M of Larry Bishop 
& M/M Lee Bishop by M/M Dale 
Bishop $50; Vic Shackelford $100; 
CD Earn #8190 $213.62; CD Earn 
#7719 $994.01 Earnings added to 
acct$5.17 TOTALS $1,587.80 

GRAVE OPENING PERMITS:
Bassett - 2 plots $ 150 TOTAL $ 150 

Month of October 1998 
DONATIONS & EARNINGS:

FredLandolt$60; Mel Strength $25; 
S.O. & Elvis Montgomery Estate 
$1,384.22; Clara Nell Spencer $10; 
Frances Prothro & John Earnest 
$50; Earnings added to acet. $7.89 
TOTALS $1,537.11 

GRAVE OPENING PERMITS:
Tommie Harris $750; GOP Burl 
Lusk $75; GOP Wayne Dennis $75 
TOTALS $900

Month of November 1998 
DONATIONS & EARNINGS: 1/

DOWN HOME

D eadlines
Articles Noon Mon.- 

Advertising Noon Tues

Living W ater Ministries J^eUozusfivp
Full G ospel —  N o n-D on om lnation a l 

 ̂ Apoatollc
Restonng And Equipping The Saints 

Colleen Anderson Sunday Morning 10:00 a m.
Maxey Evans Thursday Evening 6:30 p.m

For In fo rm atio n  C a ll (25 4 ) 725 -6 8 0 0  
1 -B 00 -2 5 2 -3 6 2 S

C O T T O N W O O D  B A P T IS T  C H U R C H
Sunday School....................... u..................... ...................9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship............... / . ....................... ............... . 11:(X) a.m
Evening Service............. u!........................... ...................6:00 p.m.
Wednesday Bible Study & Prayer Time..... .....................7:00 p.m.
Joe Coppinger, Pastor (254) 725-7730 Church 725-6266

Friendly Church • Bible Teaching

ROMAN CATHOLIC FOUR-CITY PARISH
Sitnrday V lfn  M aa : 5:00pudi. St. Francii (Hnglith) 806S. Halbiyan Raidind, Texas 

&MMl»|i4Aaaai
8:30 a.m. Holy R o s a r y ............ F St. at I2 th ............................................Cisco, Texas
10:00 a.m. Sl R iu  (Rectory)........... 1109 Blackwell Rd............................... Ran|cr, Texas
10:00 a.m.* St. Francis (Spanish).... 806 S. Halbryan................................ Eastland, Texas
11:30 a.m. St. John.......................... Hickory Street..................................... Strawn, Texas

PaaSor: Pr. Vlnctnl 8 . InasnHtI (154) 447-3UT 
• Dmcmi Jm ii  lls li (254) 453-1534

Your one source for family health care^

O ffice  Hours: M -F  Sam to 5pm

• Medicare & Medicaid accepted
• Walk-ins & Appts. welcome

109 E. Ninth • Cross Plains

254-725-7106
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M of Sterling Odom by Joyce Odom 
$25; I/M of M/M B.H. Brown & M/ 
M Silas Havens by M/M Wm. D. 
Brown $100; Earnings added to 
accL$8.74 TOTAL $133.74 

NO GOP TO REPORT

December 1,1998

1 didn't want to leave on that cold, 
dark night

This Guardian of Honor so willing 
to fight.

The soldier rolled over, with a 
voice soft and pure.

Whispered, "Carry on, Santa,
It's Christmas Day, All is secure."
One look at my watch and I knew he 

was right
Merry Christmas, my friend, and to 

all a Good Night!
-Author Unknown

This was a regular meeting of the 
Cross Plains City Council. All 
members of the council were present 
except for W.C. Pringle who was out 
due to illness.

Minutes of the last meeting were 
approved as read.

Don Gosnell met with the council 
to present his police report. Edwin 
Weiss moved to accept the police 
report as presented. Ray Womack 
seconded and motion carried.

Bob Hill met with the council to 
discuss the judge's report. Jerry 
Casslc moved to accept the report as 
presented. Edwin Weiss seconded 
and motion carried.

Bids were opened on the removal 
of the old house located on the 
property next to city hall. Ray 
Womack moved to allow Rusty 
Reed to remove the house at a cost of 
$350.00. James Nichols seconded 
and motion carried.

By general consent the council 
agreed to change to rates to use the 
community center to include an 
hourly rate of $7.50 Other rates for 
use of the center were left as is, 
which are presently set at $45.00 up 
to six hours and $75.00 for all day 
use of the building. A $100.00 
deposit will still be required on all 
reservations.

No one was present to speak with 
the council concern ing  the 
permanent Christmas tree.

Discussion was held concerning 
the replacement of the sidewalks on 
West 8th Street and East 9th Street. 
Thc.se sidewalks were not included 
in the replacement of sidewalks in 
the state contract. Ray Womack 
moved to approve the replacement 
of the sidewalks up to S14,365.(X). 
Jerry Casslc seconded and motion

carried.
Discussion was held concemiig 

the replacement of street signijj 
Discussion concerning making th^  ̂
street names correspond with tht^ 
house numbers were also discussed.
Edwin Weiss moved to change th^
numbered street, 1st through 16tli tO;-
correspond with the numbers. Jamejq 
Nichols seconded and m otioi^
carried. ob

Jerry Casslc moved to amend ih ^  
budget in the amount of S14,365.(K) ,̂ 
for the sidewalk project to be taken 
out of general fund. Edwin Weiss,, 
seconded and motion carried. ,g

James Nichols moved to purchase.,-̂  
street signs at each intersection o( ĵ 
Main Street and 4ih Street. Jerry,- 
Cassle seconded and motion carried,^

James Nichols moved to pay thi;;̂  
bills. Edwin Weiss seconded and„ 
motion carried.

Jerry Casslc moved to go 
executive session. Edwin Wcisjij, 
seconded and motion carried.

Discussion was held with ih^' 
Econom ic D evelopm ent
Corporation concerning a new 
business possible relocating icyy 
Cross Plains. ;

Edwin Weiss movctl to go iniv̂ i 
open session at 9:25 p.m. Ra»c 
Womack seconded and motiopyi 
carried.

Jerry Casslc moved to meet in ijr-i 
special meeting on December 29i?, 
1998, at 5:30 p.m. for the purpose oj** 
holding a public hearing conccrningi. : 
the application to the Texas Capiial;S 
Fund. Ray Womack seconded and"'£ 
motion carried.

Ray Womack moval to adjourn. 
James Nichols seconded and motion 
carried.

Ray Purvis, Mayoj: J 
Debbie Gosnell, Secretary'*^

COLEMAN LIVESTOCK AUCTION 
COMMISSION CO., INC.

Coleman, Texas 76834 
915/625 4191

Cattle Sale Every Wed., 11:00 a.m.
IB

" J a m ^  O um ed &  Operated Since 1961" 
Hwy. 84 Nortn P.O. Box 875

BOBBIE EDINGTON 
915/625-2091

BOB EDINGTON 
915/625-5026

DAN EDINGTON 
915/625-2829

Christmas Carols 
Candlelight &/Communion

Christmas Eve beginning at 6:00 p.m.

First United Methodist Church
Bring your entire family and be a part of the 

"real meaning" of Christm as
(A nyone w ho is a fo llow er o f  C hrist is welcom e to take 

part in the com m union service)

The Kiwanis Club of Cross Plains
Thanks The Following M erchants &  Businesses

For Donations To O pr'C hristm as Drawings

A Taste of Texas Jones Real Estate
Bryan's Variety Judy's Hair Place
C & C Service Center KLH Ojl & Gas
Charlie's Truck & Trailer Repair Lakeway Grocery
Citizens State Bank Lawrence Farm & Ranch
Collum's Restaurant Mack's Trading Post
Columbia One Source Health Center Neal Drug
Connie's Cuts & Curls Pioneer Farmers Co-Op
Country Kin Pizza Pro
Cross Plains Frozen Foods . R & R Production
Cross Plains Grain & Peanut ^Aay's Barber Shop
Cross Plains Petroleum Rose Butane
Cross Plains Review Strength's Paint & Body
Dairy Queen Subway
Dal Mar Energy, Inc. Susan Schaefer, CPA
First Med of Cross Plains Sweet Stuff 'i  ’
Greenwood Insurance Agency Sylvia's Hair Shack
Hair Country Salon T & K Tire
Higginbothams T & T Fina Station
Hutton Construction The Backroom
Hwy 36 Motel The Movie Store
J Of. L Sates itm srio ra i & uiits
Jack's Place Village Market
Jean's Feed Barn West Texas Utilities
Jerry 's Tropical Fish Wild Texas Taxidermy
Johnson's Dry Goods Wilson Well Service

( I



colonial OAKS NURSING HOME

NEWS
 ̂ LINDA MERRITT 
Activity Director

Our Annual Christmas Upen 
House Party for the residents turned 
out really well. Everyone seemed to 
enjoy themselves while hearing the 
Christmas Story told by Bro. Wayne 
Lenz, pastor of First Baptist Church, 
singing of carols by members of 
First Baptist. The refreshments 
made by the Garden Club ladies was 
delicious as always. Santa Claus, 
Ray Dodd, really made a big hit with 
the young and young at heart.

'Appreciation to the United Meth­
odist Church for the Kleenex, to 
Beverly Brown, Terry and Gilbert 
for the cute Christmas table center 
pieces, to First Baptist Church Kids 
Praise for the sacks of gifts and to the 
7th and 8th grade girls for the pretty 
cards, to Sharon Pickett for the cin­
namon rolls, to Merrilyn Golson for 
the biscuits, to Bobby Golson for the 
fmit and munchies. We appreciate 
each and everyone who helped in 
making our residents have a very 
Merry Christmas.

Nash Tucker was our winner for a 
free meal at Jack's Place. Thanks 
Wanda and Jack.

Betty Montgomery from Midland, 
Dorothy Welch from Fort Worth 
and Betty Beggs visited with Leila 
Montgomery. ^

Susan Andis from Coleman and 
Frances McAnally and Frankie 
Smith visited with Ed McAnally.

Pete Golson visited with Nora 
Golson.

Bob Wallace, Deborah Griswold, 
David Clark, Sharon and Bob Hill, 
Rolan Jones, Mark Nwris, Debbie 
Gosnell, Charlie Grider, Misty Cal­
laway and Amanda Kitchens visited 
with everyone.

Yuna V. Burkett from Burkett, 
Evelyn Adams from Coleman, and 
Patrick Adams came and told a 
story.

Kenneth Brooks from Pioneer 
visited Blanche Brooks.

Activities during the week were:
Monday: Bingo winners were 

Falba Shofner, Nash Tucker, Ruby 
Harrell, Vera Belyeu (2), Alpha 
Wilson and Louise Richardson. 
Exercise class.

Tuesday: Sing-a-long with Bob 
Wallace. Popcorn social.

Wednesday: Art class. Exercise 
class. Skip-Bo games.

Thursday: Bingo winners were 
Vera Belyeu, Louise Richardson, 
Alpha Wilson (2) and Nash Tucker 
(2). Bean Bag Toss.

Friday: Singing with Bob 
Wallace. Sit-down-basketball.

Sunday: Cornerstone Church.
May the beauty of the season 

bring you happiness and joy.
Merry Christmas!!

NtiWLY REMODELED KITCHEN AT COLONIAL OAKS 
NURSING HOME

P P H '

Myth Of The Mayo Clinic Diet Still Persists
According to Jennifer Nelson, a registered dietician at 
Mayo Clinic. "There is no Mavo CUnic diet." Ver­
sions of the diet promise weight loss over a short 
period of time by eating lots of eggs or grapefruit and 
limiting carbohydrates such as cereal and grains. 
According to Ms. Nelson, These kinds of recom­
mendations can be downright dangerous for some 
people. We tailor plans to include eating and exercise 
tips as well as suggestions for overall good eating 
habits."

Your better health is our concern.

1) NEAL DRUG
PH. (254) 725-6424 

CROSS PLAINS, TEXAS

BREAKTHRU
By Bob Pipes, preacher. 

Cross Plains Church of Christ 
433 N. Main At 12th 

(254)725-6117
Have you ever noticed that the inspired apostle John used one sentence in 

mentioning Jesus' b irth ; 'A nd the Word became flesh and dwelt among us.. (John 
1 4) John actually began the account of Jesus by going all the way back to -  well, 
he said that in the beginning, Jesus already was! He was with God (the Father) in 
the beginning; '...th e  W ord was w ith God, and the Word was God." Inotherw ords, 
like the Father, Jesus is eternal, w ithout beginning or end.
; A little  over half way through John's account, chapter 12, he begins telling of 

Jesus' last week leading up to His crucifixion. The rest of John's gospel account is 
devoted to the ’ passion week,’  then Jesus' death, burial and resurrection -  and a 

days following His resurrection.
John's inspired account, added to Matthew, Mark and Luke's, was written to 

DUikl faith in the reader or hearer of the story of Jesus. Almost as an apology, it 
would seem, John says that there is a lot more of the story of Jesus, a lot more of 
tHe signs that He did, that he was not commissioned to write, ’ but these are written 
that you may believe that Jesus is the Christ, the Son of God, and that believing, 
y6u may have Nfe in His name,’  John 20 ;30-31. He added, 21 ;25, that if all the things 
that Jesus did were to be w ritten in detail, ’ even the world itself could not contain 
the books that would be w ritten.’

: My appeal to you is to reread the story of Jesus -  from the cradle, to the cross, 
td His ascension. D on i m iss a word, espeaally those ’words in red* -  like ’ And you

trjtf*., Orid irXiC I ^ m” ma'no MOV, oul Xt O.OC.

^nday Morning Bibl« Class... 9:45 a m. Sunday Evening Worship........600 p.m.
^nday Morning Worship 10:45 a m. Wed. Evening Bi}le Study....... 700 p m.

; Friends A Neighbors Caring In Jesus

Clips, Quips & Comments
By KAY DENNIS MOSLEY •

c3 —  C ross Plains Review December 24 ,19 98)

"Reflections"
What is a reflection? A reflection 

is what looks back at you when you 
gaze into the mirror.

By the same token, everything that 
a person does reflects back on 
someone else.

When I was a teenager growing up 
in Baird, a group from our church 
went to Clyde to a group meeting at 
the church there. There were also 
some people there from Cross Plains 
who had known my parents when 
they were young newlyweds. This 
couple from Cross Plains had al­
ready spotted my parents and talked 
with them. Mother had told them 
their two daughters were there also, 
with a group of young people form 
our church in Baird. So this man and 
his wife were trying to figure out 
which two girls were mother and 
daddy's daughters. They thought 
they had found one because she had 
red hair. My mother had red hair 
also but neither daughter did.

Someone said something funny 
and we all laughed. That man told 
my parents that as soon as he saw me 
laugh, he knew who my mother was. 
He could see a reflection of my 
mothers laugh in my laugh. Many of 
you know that couple from Cross 
Plains. The lady was still living here 
when I moved back here in 1992. 
She has since gone on to glory. My 
parents Ervin and Iris (Meador)

Dennis, when they first married in 
1936; lived neighbors to this couple. 
The couple was Merritt and Suma 
Dill. My mother said they were the 
best people and the best neighbors 
they'd ever had. I think their son and 
his wife, Mr. and Mrs. Fred Dill still 
reside in this area.

Now that was a good reflectipn.
We just want to make sure that we 

never reflect badly on our parents, 
friends, neighbors, teachers, chil­
dren, churches, etc.

You know if you commit an of­
fense, or offend someone, folks 
don't just say, that was John James 
Whippersnapper did that The story 
grows as it is passed along. That was 
old Bodey Whippersnapper's son (or 
daughter) did that. You know his 
grandfather was Beauregard 
Kitzeljimmet, a better man never 
lived.

Reflections!! Somehow we all get 
caught up in them. The things that 
each of us do; not only reflects on our 
forebears or ancestors but also on 
our descendents.

Let's set a goal; to make our re­
flection, "A Proud One!"

Sitting here reflecting on the fact 
that yesterday was my birthday and 
tomorrow — tomorrow — have a 
Merry Christmas day to refiect back

CHRISTMAS DINNER AT SENIOR CITIZENS CENTER WELL 
ATTENDED — A large crowd ejoyed the entertainment, fellowship and 
meal.

TRIAD
News

By KAY MOSLEY, Sec.

on.

The Callahan County TRIAD/ 
S.A.L.T. Advisory Council met 
Wednesday, December 9 at the 
Cross Plains Multi-Purpose Center 
for a toef discussion and a Christ­
mas Buffet.

A round table discussion of items 
on the agenda began at 11:30 a.m. 
The council set new goals for the 
coming year. A more detailed report 
on subjects of discussion will be in 
the December minutes soon to ap­
pear in the Review.

Be sure to notice the new Neigh­
borhood Watch signs in town, do­
nated by Rolan Jones Real Estate, 
they can currently be seen at the

W "
Multi-Purpose Center, Joe Howsers 
Home Sweet Home Enterprises on 
Hwy. 36E and at West Texas Utili­
ties.

A buffet was held following the 
meeting with members providing 
the tantalizingly tasty menu items. 
The decorating theme was Christ­
mas Holidays which the well ap­
pointed buffet table carried out, 
charmingly and beautifully. Three 
guests were present, joining mem­
bers in a holiday fcas( of roast tur­
key, cranberry sauce, hors dc 
ouvres, canapes, salad, finger sand­
wiches, coffee and desserts galore.

The council wishes everyone 
Happy Holidays and a bright and 
festive New Year.

On the fifth Christmas of my 
young life, my brother Larry 
introduced me to the famed "Red 
Ryder" B-B Rifle. This was like 
giving me the ultimate, super 
colossal weapon of desutiction.

With my "Red Ryder" (which I had 
to stand barrel first on top of my shoe 
and use both hands to cock) I stood 
among the likes of The Cisco Kid, 
The Lone Ranger and Zorro. I 
pledged to right all wrongs and wage 
war on all evil doers. But a five-year-

old has different ideas of evil doers 
than most people.

My big sister Sheila and those 
giggly girls she ran around with 
were the evilcst of all evil doer. 
When the mighty warrior and tighter 
of all wrongs appeared with his rifle 
in hand and cape flapping in the 
wind, those girls would take off like 
a great herd of buffaloes. You would 
think they had targets on their 
rumps!

AARP Christmas Festivities
By KAY MOSLEY 
Publicity Chairman

The Cross Plains Multi-Purpose 
Center was enlivened by the music 
of Mr. Lunas' Senior Band on 
Monday, December 7. The band 
which calls Cisco home, played for 
the entertainment and enjoyment of 
the local AARP Chapters' annual 
Christmas Party. Golden-Oldie vo­
cals, accompanied by the band cn-

■ First
■  ^ ^ - I - ' ,  ■
I  We wUid<)se$tU:OObooAoiiTbut!)^tI)e<:!.24afid2 _________
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I  will be closed o« # 11 ; i;  reb|$l!ii i
f r e ^ l a r  b o a r s ' i

hanced the atmosphere to the great 
delight of members and guesLs alike. 
The entertainment began at 10 a.m.

A holiday brunch followed the 
music program. The gaily dccoralal 
brunch table in a Christmas theme 
set the mood for the delicious 
brunch, and the spirit of the season 
was enjoyed by one and all.

The chapter greatly missed long­
time members. Chuck and Elva 
Woody and hope they can be back 
soon.

♦

Family^
Dentistry

1 B a ir d  ̂
Orthodontics j  I Family

D ental
J O E  K. R E E D , D D S

in Baird (915) 854-1173

*Medicaid and Most Insurance

Allen Weizer surprised his wife 
Brenda with her Chrisunas present - 
- tickets to the Gary Morris concert 
last Friday at the Abilene Civic 
Center.

She thought they were going out to 
eat and then to a movie. Tjiey drove 
up to the Civic Center and she saw 
Gary Morris on the billboard and 
burst out in tears -  he's one of her all 
time favorites.

This was a special concert, 
including his 19-ycar-old son Malt. 
Their blend of voices created a truly 
memorable concert and a fantastic 
evening, leaving the couple with a 
warm glow for the entire weekend.

30
Color

Photos

12 9 9

1 10x13
(W.dl Phtiml

1 8x10
2 5x7
2 3x5 ..

16 King Si/e Wallets 
8 Regular Si/e Wallets

99C Deposit 
$12.00 D ue at 

Pick up
(plus tax)

You are invited to 
attend a Retirement 

Celebration honoring 
Dora Hounshell 

and Darlene Walker 
Monday, December 28,1998 

2:00 to 4:00 pm 
At the

lallahan County Courthom 
Room 102 - Baird, Texas 

Dora has worked for Callahan 
County for 48 years.

Darlene has worked for 
CallahcuA County for-24 years.-

COME JOIN THE 
CELBIRATIONI

Garden Club
Celebrates
Holiday

AT

By BARBARA POWELL 
Reporter

Members of the Cross Plains Gar­
den Club attended the Coggins Av­
enue First Baptist Church's Fourth 
Annual Cantata. This was the first 
time to sec the presentation for most 
of the group. Everyone agreed that 
the life of Christ was wonderfully 
portrayed. The production was very 
professional.

We enjoyed dinner together at the 
Golden Corral in Brownwood.

Our next meeting will be our Arbor 
Day Program to be held on January 
8.

Higginbotham Bros. 
&

General Merchandise 
too N. Main 

F rid ay , J a n . 8
'9a.m . -12 noon 

1-5 p.m.

Group charge 
99C per person

O u rtn R  th is  p m m o tlo n  

v o u  w i l l  re c e iv e

*  F R E E  .3 X 5 ’s
A

w ith  e a c h  H ISJ.O ft 

p a c k a R c  p u rc h a s e d .

SUnsCRIBE tcT 
THE CROSS PLAINS 

REVIEW TODAY 
(254) 725-6111

J
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( ADVERTISE
IN THE CROSS PLAINS REVIEW )

190 ACRES —3 bedroom frame 
house, irrigation wells, approximately 
120 acres Coastal; on Sabanno River/ 
Stephens Real Estate (915) S p  
0748, (915) 597-2681.

FOR RENT—Trailer space (254) 
725-7545.

Subscribe To 
The Cross 

Plains Review
AVON

REPRESENTATIVE
Call Dee Harrell 

For All Your Avoiv Needs 
(254) 725-7120

RISING STAR 
NURSING CENTER
Has Vacancies Available For 

Both Male and Female 
Residents

Private Or Semi-Private Rooms 
Are Available

CaU (254) 643-2691 Or Come By 
And Visit At 411 South MUIcr 

In Rising Star

V V S CREATIONS—Now dis­
played at COYOTE FLAT GEN­
ERAL STORE on East Hwy. 36. 
Custom orders available - wall hang­
ings, wreaths, final baskets,/nore! 
Call Vandaat(254)725-6111or725- 
7796 or Vicki at (254) 725-7650 or 
(254)725-4033. »uc ^
1982 CHEVROLET CAPRICE— 
2-dr., 110,(X)0 actual miles; excellent 
condition; all new belts, seals, gas­
kets; good tires; Blanche Moore'sear; 
$2,000 O.B.O. Can be seen at Cliffs 
Texaco (254) 725-6800. 37<fc
LOVEBIRDS—Just in time for 
Christmas, $35.00 each. Rising Star 
(254)643-2027. vu«
MUST SELL— 1995 Pontiac Grand 
Am, 2-dr.. excellent condi tion, $5,500
O.B.O. (254)725-7558.
----------------------------------------------------------1—
B & R FIREWORKS—wiU be open 
Christmas & New Year holiday's on 
Hwy. 206 South.

LAST MINUTE 
SHOPPING 

Try Sweet Stuff for 
handmade caiKlies and baked 
goods,silver jewelry and more 

(254) 725-4663. \
Next door to Subway.

CARPET CLEANED 
AND SOLD

Commercial/Residential. Free esti­
mates. Scotch Guarding Available. 
Carpet sold, repaired, installed. New 
or used. DUB MEADOR (254) 725- 
7720. iMc

WATER SYSTEMS 
/  Construction and Maintenance 

call
Roger Crawford 

(254) 725-4061 or (915) 647-3544.

Shoes on the Run
60% off G irls/B oys 
Shorts & Shirts by Levis, 
Bongo, Calvin Klein, 
more. Summer Sale on 
Shoes, also. 521 West 
Access Rd. Clyde (915) 
893-5156. rvNc

[JOHN DEERE TRACrrORS
NEW  AND USED 

PEANUT EQUIPMENT 
LILLISTON-KMC

PLANTERS4)I8K»D(ULI.8 
ROLLING CULTIVATORS 

CH8EL8

SELL OR TRADE  
CLARK TRACTOR & SUPPLY, INC.

DELEON — (254) 893-2061 
COMANCHE — (915) 356-2593 

WHERE YOUR BUSINESS 
IS APPRECIATED

, im«.
961
-2593 I

L I1C •  1 /2x11 ,81 /3x14 , or 11 x17 
COPIES AT THE CROSS PLAINS REVigW

EXPERT BODY WORK AND PAINTING

BARRETT COLLISION CENTER
CLAUD CHAMPION 

(915) 677-2924 
(FAX) 677-4601

ROCKY CHAMPION 
214 North Leggett 

Abilene Texas 79603

BI-RITE AUTO
PH O N E  (254) 725-7361 4 B LO C K S E. O F L IG H T

C R O S S  P LA IN S , TEX A S  76443

AUTOS
1991 MERCURY SABLE 4-DR., 63.000TOTAL MILES, RUNS. LOOKS AMO DRIVES
LIKE NEW...............................................................................................................14,500
1990 CADILLAC SEVILLE, 4-DR , SUPER NCE. SPECIAL......................  14,280
1989 LINCOLN CONTINENTAL, 4-DR., LEATHER SEATS. 7.000 MILES ON NEW
ENGINE, VERY GOODCOND............................................................................... t3 ,3S 0
1988 CADILLAC FLEETWOOD, RUNS, DRIVES SUPER.................|S 00  DOWN
1977 OLDS 98, 4-DR , RUNS GOOD.................................................... $280 DOWN
1988 CHRYSLER 8TH AVE, RUNS GOOD....................................... $328 DOWN

PICKUPS
1987 FORD F-280 7.3 DIESEL, AUTO., RUNS VERY GOOD................... S3,900
1992 FORD F-3S0 CREW C A I  DIESEL DUALLY, SSPD., NEW 4 COLOR PAINT,
VERY GOOD COND................................................................................................$8,800
1990 FORD F-380 XLT LARIAT CREW CAB, 7.3 DIESEL DUALLY. CUSTOMIZED
INTERIOR. EXTERIOR. LOTSA CHROME A ALUM., A SHOW TRUCK........... $$,800
1991 3800 CHEV. 1-TON CREW CAB DIESEL, FLATBED. AUTO . VERY CLEAN A
GOOD..................................................................................................................... $4,280
1t$S FORD F-280 SUPER CAB DIEBEL, AUTO........................................S2.480
1984 FORD F-280, 7aO€SEL.AUTO............................................................ $2,180
1988 FORD F-380 DIESEL, DUAL REARS. FLATBED................................ $1,780
1981 FORD 1/2 TON, V-8, RUNS GOOD............................................$380 DOWN

IVflSC.
1901 LINCOLN 302 V-8 ENGINE LOW MILES ONLY COMPLETE........ 3780
7.3 DIESEL ENGINE $1,300; $ .•  DIESEL ENGINE $1,280; LOTS OF FORD 

. LPiCKUPA mtcoinaatMTOABTa^—  — ■■4. — ......  ..........*

SOME HNANCING AVAILABLE
NO TICE - O PEN MION., TUES., THURS. 9 A.M. TO 2 P.M. 
OPEN W ED. A SAT. 9 A.M. TO  4 P.M. - CLO SED FRIDAY 38-iic

W ILL DO TYPING OF ANY 
KIND—Resumes, Term Papers, 
Business Letters, etc. Contact 
Deborah at The Cross Plains Review 
or call 254-725-6111 before 5 p.m'.

ELECTRICAL & PLUM BING- 
35 years master plumber, commer­
cial; plumbing repair; new construc­
tion; water pump repair; caU (254) 
725-6731 or (254) 643-7003, Leave 
Message. *ottc

WANT YOUR HOUSE 
CLEANED?—One, two or three 
rooms or more, call Janette Turner 
(254) 725-7273. >j-»v

NURSES AIDES—Colonial Oak^ 
Nursing Home, will consider Uain- 
ing, call (254) 725-6175. i4-.tc

WANTED—Netha's Day C!are1ias 3 
openings; full-time only 7 a.m. - 5:30 
p.m. Mon.-Fri. (254)725-6267. 3*.

Card Of Thanks 
I would like to take this opportu­

nity to say thank you to all the em­
ployees and patients at the Nursing 
Home for the wonderful love and 
support that they have given me thru 
the years.

Especially to the girls for the 
lovely retirement party and all the 
gifts - to a wonderful employer, who 
has supported me in every way.',

To the the great people of Cross 
Plains who have been my friends and 
supporters for this 29 l/2years. James 
and I plan to continue to be a part of 
this community and will continue to 
treasure your friendship.

God bless each of you, 
Frances Wolf

PAYING $20 TO $30 ANNU­
ALLY—per useable acre for Coastal 
hay and pasture in Cross Plains area. 
I need 100 to 30Qi- acres with lease for 
7 to 10 years. Let's talk. My lease 
arrangement not only pays you well 
but is better than CRP since it also 
provides local work and products for 
sale plus rewards both local repair 
servicemen and equipment salesmen. 
Call (254) 725-7141.

)

Effective 11-27-98,1 will no longer 
be responsible for any debts other 
than my own. James R. Carter. 3441,

NOTICE OF APPLICATION 
FOR OIL AND GAS WASTE 
DISPOSAL WELL PERMIT 

R £ . Greene, P.O. Box 906, Baird, 
TX 79504 is applying to the Railroad 
Commission of Texas for a permit to 
dispose ofproduced saltwater or other 
oil and gas waste by well injection 
into a porous formation not produc­
tive of oil or gas.
The applicant proposes to disclose of 
oil and gas waste into the Cisco For­
mation Cal Ramsey -B- Well Num­
ber 10. The proposed disposal well is 
located 5 miles East of Putnam in the 
Callahan County Regular, in Calla­
han County. The waste water will be 
injected into strata in the subsurface 
depth interval from 820 to 869 feet. 
LEGAL AUTHORITY: Chapter 27 
of the Texas Water Code, as amended. 
Title 3 of the Texas Natural Resources 
Code, as amended, and the Statewide 
Rules of the Oil and Gas Division of 
the Railroad Commission of Texas. 
Requests for a public hcaritig from 
persons who can show they are ad­
versely affected, or requests for fur­
ther information concerning any as­
pect of the application should be 
submitted in writing, within fiflecn 
days of publication, to the Environ­
ment Services Section, Oil and Gas 
Division, Railroad Commission of 
Texas, P.O. Box 12967, Capitol Sta­
tion, Ausiin,Texas 7871 1 (Telephone 
512/463-6792).

LOST—Two heifers, approximately 
800 pounds each, Brahma cross, one 
red, one grey, west of Cottonwood 
area. Call David Jones (254) 725- 
4016, REWARD OFFERED! imct

WE LAMINATE
Small Item 
5 1/2 X 8 1/2 Item 
8 1/2 X 11 Item 
11 X 17 Item

Prices may vary due to 
thickness of laminate & quantity

Cross Plains Review
116 East 8th 
C}ross Plains

(254) 725-6111

Want to go
SURFING??
Why not SURF the 
INTERNET with us

For In ternet Service 
Contact

Vanda or Deborah 
at

(254) 725-6111
Not happy with current 

provider? We can help! 
Call us for details

DORA SMITH

\;

Real Estate Broker 
(254) 725-6489

NORA ODOM
(254) 725-6840

COUNTRY DREAM
* NEW LISTING—Great 

investment, triplex, 1 bdrm., I 
bth. each, on 5 city lots.

* NEW LISTING— 4 city 
lots - commercial or residen­
tial.

* NEW LISTIN G — 1 
bdrm., 1 bth. house, $6,500.

149 h o n ^ i^n e  new 
brick andlom ilM iltcountry

culuvation, cross fences.
* 2 bdr., 1 bath, fenced, car­

port. storage, trees, $11 ,000.
* COUNTRY LIVING—3 

br., 1 3/4 bath, brick, 5.31 ac. 
total elect, fenced yard, water 
Pioneer Area. REDUCED!!

* 3 city lots, cleared, city 
utilites available.

Lotsforres.,bldg.siteorig. 
com. yard, 145 feet E. Hwy 36 
frontage, 24x36 office, exda 
storage bldg.

* BUSINESS OPPORTU­
NITY, former Buy-Rite, in­
cludes equp., N. Main..

OFFICE SUPPLIES 
AT THE CROSS PLAINS REVIEW

CROSS PLAINS 
3 BEDROOM BRICK HOME on 

1 ac. w /beautiful oak trees, work-i 
shop, carport.. City water, 2 w elia 
& paved road. Call now to sea 
this great property. All For Only 
$79,900

CROSS PLAINS 
Sm all house and duplex. G rea| 

location. O o n lle t th is investm ent 
property go by.

'A I KADITION OF 
.SI RN K K...

A KF.Pin ATION FOR 
RF.Sl I/r.S!

CALL: JACK CORN

D d i z e l l ,

Realtors-
LET US MARKET 

YOUR REAL ESTATE!!
BAiRD-CLYOE ABILENI 
854-2501 677-2241

BUSINESS & PROFESSIONAL
DIRECTORY

Cox Electrical & 
Plumbing

New Water Heaters, Water 
Pum ps S Water System s 

Comm Brclal, 
Construction  & Repairs

(254) 725-6731 
(254) 643-7003

Leave Message

AUTOWIRE
’ Get those troublesorhh ’ ' 

wiring problems fbced on 
your pickup, trailer, RV, 

car, tractor or accessories. 
Fix  It O n ce !
F ix  It R ight!

A U TO W IR E  com es to you!
(254) 725-6255 
1-888-FIX-WIRE

 ̂JIN TAX iERVICE
INCOME TAX 

AND
ACCOUNTING SERVICE

Al TypM Fonni I R«pont

ZE LLA  ERW IN
140 Ave A - Cross Plains

(254) 725-6156

Susan J. Schaefer 
C.P.A. \

Accounting & 
Tax

Service
9th & Main  

Cross Plains  
Phone: 725-6747

RUSSELL-SURLES 
TITLE, INC.

Phone
(915) 854-1115

BUGBUSTER
Pest

' Control

(254) 725 6740 
1-800 605 PEST

TERRY HARRIS 
HC 86, BOX 65 

BAIRD. TX. 79504

NeWTires Used Tires

& K TIRE 
& ALIGNMENT

300 W. 4th
Cross Plains, Texas 76443
(254) 725-6223
Tractor or Truck Tires 
Front-End Alignment 

Brakes

Carpenter
Chiropractic

Medicare & Medicaid I 
_____Accepted

Dr. Jim C arpenter  
M on., F rI., & S at. 
(254) 643-3101

S I2 College_________ Rising Star

Home Improvement 
Service 

• Ronnie Scott 
Building

Framing-Cab inetry*Trim 
Panaling*N«w Construction/ 

Ramodeling
-Too Much Exparienca To List Here' 
Put Twenty-Taro Years ol Experience 

To Work Todayll

(254) 725-6419

T o  P l a c e  
Y o u r  A d  in  

T h is  
S e c t io n  

Call The Cross 
Plains Review  
(254) 725-6Ul

New Storage 
Units Available

In

Rising Star
$40 per month

L & R Storage
(254) 643-3275

3»4lp

T o  P la c e  
Y o u r  A d  in  

' T h is  
S e c t io n  

Call The Cross  
Plains Review  
(254) 725-6111

New Home Construction 
Additions - Remodeling 

Tape & Bedding
Concrete Work

Keed Construction 
Rusty Reed 

(254) 725-7363

Rose Butane
Home Deliveries 

R .V ., Bottle Fillingy

Call:

1-800-821-8807
W0 Appreciate You Business

2e-ttc

CISCO FAMILY 
CHIROPRACTIC

Dr. Devin Koenig, D.C. 
1619 W. Hwy. 206

(254) 442-4878
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JONES
REAL ESTATE
R o la n  J o n e s ,  B roker^

This month we are a d v e i t i a ln ^  Hiih 
Plaiiu Journal. ^ ' /

E -m ail r isfta te^cnxap la in t.oan i 
Webpage hup://ww«.cnHplaiaa.cont/ 

Jonoa.ReaLEiUia/
• NEW LISTING—Lovely 4 

bdrm., 2 blh. home on 21/2 lots 
w/corrals & pens on 2 lots.

NEW LISTING—27 acs. 
all wooded; stock tank. Lots of 
tuiicey & deer. Brown Co.

• 54 acs. w^ouse and shop, 2 
mi. from Cross Plains. Water 
well, stock tank, some woods.

Like New- 2 bdrm. w/study 
or could be extra bdrm., 2 bth. 
brick home on 2.7 acs. Beautiful 
landscaping w/oak and pecan 
trees, shop and storage bid.

Cottonwood Area - 571/2 
acs., all woods, good water, has 
a 3-bdrm., 2 bth. house w/2 
storage bldgs.

70 acs. Eastland Co., GOOD
H U N B R R iG D M m A C ^
ergy efficient home.

264 acs.. Eastland Co. just 
outside of Cross Plains. Scmic 
with hills, thick pasture, grazing 
for cattle, and SO acs. of Coastal. 
6 stock tanks, some spring fed & 
good fishing. Deer, wild turkey, 
pecan trees, and oak trees, and 
good water. Rock house, 2 bd./ 
ba., livingroom, dining, kitchen 
&. den, w/2 car carport, and 2 
bams. Creek runs across back of 
property.

• *2 Large
stock p J ild ^ le K ^ L L E N T  
FIS
acs.

• 187 AC-Brown Co. w/2 bdr., 
2 ba. mobile home, S stock tanks 
- EXCELLENT native grasses - 
80 acs. in cultivation • GREAT 
HUNTING!

• REDUCED—2 bdr., 2 bth., 
on 2 1/2 lots. CH/A, peach or̂  
chard, carport

Beautiful comer lots. Very 
nice 2 bdr., 2 bth., w/CH/A. 
LOTS OF EXTRAS.

• 485 AC. Callahan Co., IS ac. 
Lake, irrigation systems, cattle
pens, water well, stock tank. 
Partin cultivation, part Coastal, 
part brush. EXCELLENT 
HUNTING!

• 570 AC. ColemaiVC^Iahan 
Counties. Lake on Little Pecan 
Bayou 44 stock tanks, metal 
bam and battle pens. Part in 
cultivation, part oaks and mes- 
quites. Coleman Water System. 
GREAT HUNTING!

• 218 AC. , Eastland Co., 
Good Hunting Place.

• 4.5 ACS. IN COTTON­
WOOD—^Very good view for 
building a home.

JOHNNIE BLAND 
(254) 725-6293

SANDRA JONES 
. (254) 725-7640
< o r

DIANNE HAIL 
(254) 725-7317

Cross Plains, Tx.»*-TFC

SUBSCRIBE TO 
THE CROSS PLAINS 

REVIEW TODAY 
(254) 725-6111

GE

6IFT8

Give The Gift That 
Keeps On Giving 

All Year
A SulMCrlptiiin lb  The 

Cross Floins Review

. m u I n- • 6M* i m 
Oiatwif-Sfte Addftnea 
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says u  what well do,” said Johnson. 
Clark said he had discussed the 

matter with the county atomey and 
agreed with the Judge about the 
district court making the decision.

Callahan County Historical Com­
mission President Allen Wright 
spoke to the court about a reprinting 
of the ”I Remember Callahan 
County” history book that was first 
published in 1986 and has been sold 
out for over a year.

Wright said the Mike Konezak was 
negotiating with publishers for the 
reprinting of the book and was un­
able to attend the meeting with a 
final decision on figures. SOO books 
were planned in the reprinting.

The item will be p lac^  on the next 
commissioners agenda.

A holiday schedule, for county 
employees, was approved with a 
motion by Farmer and seconded by 
Holland.

Terry Ellis, Bob Robinson, and 
Gary Harger met with the commis­
sioners about the Callahan County 
shooting.

A request was made of the county 
leaders to sign a resolution over 
operation of the shooting range, lo­
cated west of Baird, to the nonprofit 
corporation of the Callahan County 
Shooting Sports Association Incor­
porated.

It was explained that, according to 
the requirement of the Texas Parks 
and Wildlife Grant that funded the 
building of the facility, the range is 
to be opened up to the general pub­
lic. All of the requirements of the 
grant have been met except public 
accessibility.

The land is leased from the City of 
Baird.

A range master would be on pre­
mises anytime the range is open to 
public use and memberships would 
be sold for citizens to use the fa­
cilities. The memberships will pro­
vide funds for all upkeep and im­
provements to the facility.

All schedules would also have to 
work around the4-H shooting sports 
events because that is what the fa­
cility was built for to begin with.

Judge Johnson suggested that 
more research be conducted before 
signing the resolution because a 
previous agreement had been 
signed, but could not be found, with 
the grant paper.

Charlie Grider made a motion to 
table the resolution, seconded by 
Harold Hicks, to table the resolution 
and place on the January 11 agenda.

Hubert and Darlene Donaway 
were approved to join the Callahan 
County Historical Commission at 
the request of Commission Presi­
dent Allen Wright. Motion by Ha­
rold Hkks and seconded by Tommy 
Holland.

A split vote decided that the county 
employees would still not be able to 
”cash in” their vacation time and 
must take the time allowed or lose 
the days off. j

Bryan Farmer said he had em- 
, ployees wanting to cash in their va­
cation time instead of taking the time 
off from work. "Fve had to let em­
ployees off the last week of the year, 
the past two years,” said Farmer, 
"and rd just as soon pay them and 
have them at work.”

There was discussion concerning 
budget problems if this was allowed 
because the budget was set for em­
ployees taking off their vacation 
time. Personnel and bookkeeping 
problems were also discussed.

"The county couldn't afford it," 
said Judge Johnson," and I think you 
would be opening up a can of 
worms."

Commissioner Hicks agreed by 
saying, "I've worked for several 
companies and they said lake the 
time or lose it"

Johnson said the last action taken 
on the matter in 1976 when it was 
decided that county employees must 
take their vacation within the allot­
ted year or lose the time.

The item had come up several 
times since 1976 but no action had 
ever been taken said Johnson.

A vote of four to one allowed the 
rule to stay in effect Precinct 2 
Commissioner Bryan Farmer cast 
the only no vole.

Four applications were reviewed 
and the court expressed concern that 
none of the applicants were certiHed

have to foot the bill for certifying 
anyone appointed (an estimated 
$900). If dected, the new constable 
would be responsible for getting his 
own certification within two years of

AFGHANISTAN PINE 
SEEDLING

AFGHANISTAN PINE 
NEWLY PLANTED

AFGHANISTAN PINE 
TWO YEARS OLD

AFGHANISTAN PINE 
NINE YEARS OLD

Windbreak Tree Orders 
Being Taken Thru Feb.
"The Callahan Divide Soil and 

Water Conservation has started 
taking orders for windbreak trees,” 
say Jack Farmer, Chairman ftu' the 
Callahan Divide SWCD in Baird. 
"Each year the District offers these 
windbreak seedlings to the general 
public on a first come, first serve 
basis at a very inexpensive cost.” 
Evergreens which are available in­
clude the Afghanistan Pine, Pinyon 
Pine, Austrian Pine, Ponderosa Kne 
and the Eastern Redcedar. In addi­
tion to the Evergreens, several vari­
eties of barerooted hardwoods are 
also available. These hardwoods 
include Green Ash, Mulberry, 
Hackberry, Russian Olive, Red Oak, 
Sand Cherry, Catalpa, Lacebark 
Elm, WalnuL Nanking Cherry, and 
Honeysuckle. Tree orders will be 
taken from now until February or till 
the supply runs out which ever

accepting the position.
The opening, left when Kevin 

Weiss resigned last month, will be 
placed on the first available ballot.

Commissioners tabled the selec­
tion of a Precinct 4 Constable with a 
split vote.

Precinct 4 Commissioner Charlie 
Grider cast the dissenting vote say­
ing he hated for the Precinct 4 Justice 
of the Peace Court to go that long 
without a Constable to serve papers 
and it also added an officer to the 
Cross Plains area that has just one 
city policeman.

Sheriff Curtis told the court that he 
and his deputies would try to fill in as 
much as possible.

Rolanda Fullham was approved as 
a member of the MHMR Public Re­
sponsibility Committee with a mo­
tion by Tommy Holland and sec­
onded by Charlie Grider.

Bills were paid with a motion by 
Harold Hicks and seconded by 
Charlie Grider.

comes first The expected date of 
delivery is guaranteed. These trees 
are delivered fresh from the Texas 
Forest Service nursery located at 
Lubbock. The pickup location for 
the trees will be at the Natural Re­
sources Conservation Service office 
in Baird. For more information on 
planting, planning, and maintcnaiKe 
of a windbreak tree, or how to pur­
chase low cost seedlings, contact the 
Natural Resource Conservation 
Service office in Baird at 1-915- 
854-1349.

DECEMBER 25 
Leanne Gibson 
Jimmy Van Story 
Mrs. Jack Rector 
Donald Stover 
Mrs. R. L. Moon 
Leslie Reed 
Karin Sabaitis 
Wesley Webb 
Brent Hutchins 
Blanche Thrasher 
Charlotte (Brown) Biggs 
Roger Crawford 
Joseph Jackson 
Mrs. Cal Long 
Daniel Bushnell

DECEMBER 26 
W. F. Kilgore 
Jay RinghofTer 
Mrs. Joe Bryson 
Bill Slate
Richard Keith Illingworth 
Tom Robinson 
Loy Thompson 
Lisa Sims 
Brandon Jones

DECEMBER 27 
Mrs. Jack Little 
Mrs. Elmer Wilson 
Dickie Nowell 
Bobby Lawrence 
Dr. Mickey Bush 
Barry Miles 
Norma Proctor 
John Ross McCaghren 
Hannah Brown 
Patricia (Lee) Higgins

DECEMBER 28 
Tami Gwen Woody 
Brian Sibley 
Mrs. Katherine Swindle 
Marion Perry 
Mrs. Glen Vaughn 
Michael Ingram 
Mrs. Billy Paul Golson 
C. A. Walker 
Mrs. Pauline Regian 
Karen Flecher 
Mose Green 
Sheila Bell

B & R FIREWORKS 
Fireworks Dollar

Good For $1 Worth of Fireworks 
limit one coupon ner customer

South Hwy. 206 Cross Plains. Texas

DECEMBER 29 
Dianne (John.son) Hail 
Mrs. Earl Allen 
Johnnie Strickland 
Kenneth D. Brown 
Frances Knott 
Vicky (Moore) Worley 
Michael Blake Foster 
Glenda Chandler 
D. J. Roe 
Jacob Strickland

DECEMBER 30 
Kenneth Hopson 
Billy Gene Spoon 
Keith Hopson 
Carol Bates 
Eric Lovell 
Oddie Dawkins 
Mrs. Bob Dean 
Christopher Hamer 
Getrude Johnson 
Royce Lawrence 
Wanda Jennnings 
Milton Baty 
Billy King 
Lawrence S. Lee 
Joseph L. Hopkins 
Nancy Sheppard 
Don Edington 
Sambo Fleming

DECEMBER 31 
Kathy Denny 
Johnny Combs 
Eldon Gregg 
Shirley Emmons 
Mrs. Norman Farr 
Danielle Webster 
George Randall Dickey 
Vicki (Hickman) Walker 
Billy Spoon 
Jesse Norris 
Kimberly Ratliff 
Royce Lawrence 
Austin Walker

We Like Small Town Business!
☆ AUTO^

☆  Small Business & Commercial 
☆  Rural Property 

☆  Mobile Homes 
☆  Farm & Ranch 

☆  Home &
Fire

M outray------------  &
A ssociates
Insurance Agency, Inc. 

786 S. Leggett • Abilene

TEXAS STATEWIDE CEASSII lED ADM RTISINf; NET WORK

PUBLIC FAX 
AT THE 
CROSS . 
PLAINS 
REVIEW

TexSCAN Week of Dec. 20,1998 
BUSINESS OPPORTUNITIES 

AVON PRODUCTS • START your own buii- 
ncu  Work flexible hours. Enjoy unlimited eam- 
ings. Cill loll free 1-888 942-40S3. t 20st«r1-up 
LOCAL CANDY ROUTE. 30 vending mx- 
chines. Earn approximiiely $800/diy. All for 
S9.99S. Call I -600-998-VEND Mulli-Vend, Inc 
WE’LL SHOW YOU the money! (Call any of 
our clients) Shre/week •Talking" Phone Card Ma­
chines. SIO.SSOrequired. Free sample! CardMait 
of America, Inc. 1-800-876-3326.____________

DRIVERS WANTED
CONTINENTAL EXPRESS NEEDS OTR A 
Regional drivers Voted among the lop 10 small 
carriers. Paid benerns 90-93% no-iouch freight 
1-800-727-4374 EOF.. 1-800-695-4473. 
DRIVER COVENANT TRANSPORT •Coast 
to coist runs* Teams start 3S/C-37A. * SI.(XX) 
sign-on bonus for experienced company drivers. 
For experienced drivers and owner operiiors. 
1-800441-4394. Gradusse students 1-800-338-6428
DRIVERA3TR - A NEW approach to OW/OP 
Program! S700 lign-on. Paid: tolls, permits, cargo 
A liab.. Worker's Comp., payroll taxes, holidays, 
vacation! Health insurance available. Sillon Mo-
lor Unes I-80D5334765.__________________
DRIVER.S • O /O 'S  SMITHWAY Motor Ex­
press. New Pay package, weekly pay Great home

DRIVERS • START AT 34c/mile! •2.500-3.000 
milesAveek •l(X)% conventional sleepers. •Ben- 
ePits A Bonus program *Mosily no louch/Drop 
A Hook Call OTRX today! 1-800 423-6939

OWNER-OPERATORS: MEMPHIS regional 
runs. Mid south. Oklahoma. East T exu Home 
most weekends • Top earnings • steady refnger- 
aied runs - low cost complete insurance - life 
model truck. Sunco Carriers. Inc I-800-816-.3775
Mike____________________________________
RAPID FREIGHT O F Texas is seeking OTK 
drivers. Minimum I year experience Class A 
(TDL with HazMsl required (Ull recruiting I- 
800 299-7274. ext 21 or ext 41____________

EDUCATIONAL/ TRAINING
COM PANY SPO N SO RED  TRA IN IN G  A 
First year income S30K • Stevens Transpon - 
(7TR truck drivers wanted! Non-expenenced or
experienced. 1-800-333-8595 EOE ________
FREE TRUCK DRIVER Training w k  no con­
tracts or paybacks Call now I-800-86W 284. 
O PPO R T U N ITIES  AVAILABLE: INTER 
NATIONAL Orginizaiion seeking represenli- 
lives to usisl/iupervise high school exchange 
sludenls and Iheir host families. Represenittivci 
receive free training, reimbursement for expenses, 
and the opportunity to make friendships of a life- 
lime. Cill 903-%3 8889 or l■g00-473■0696

_______ EMPLOYMENT_______
H b a k R T  CORPORATION; SERVICE Tech­
nicians. immediate openings for cindidalcs with 
experience repairing food service equipment Ex­
cellent compensation and benern package with 
whicle L800-35^.394J_______

TKi

-800-317-9971.
NEED CASH? IMMEDIATE cash paid for fu­
ture seillcmenl payments, lottery winnings, and 
insurance. Call Singer Asset l-800-605-5(X)7
WWW singerissel com _____________  ___
OVER YOUR HEAD in debt ! Credit cards/bills'' 
'•Cut payments up to 60%!!! *Mainlain good 
credit *Free consultation  1-800-556-1548 
WWW ancwhoriion org Licensed, bonded, non- 
profii. National C o . ___________________

__________FOR SALE_________
STEEL BUILDINGS SALE: 5.000+ sizes 
40x60x14. $7 ,821, 50x75x14, $10,324. 
50x100x16. $13,663. 60x100x16. $13,236 
M ini-slorage bu ild ings. 40s 180. 36 units. 
$17,818 Free brochures Sentinel Buildings. 
www teniitielbuildings.com. I-800-327-0790. ext 79 
W ORLD'S BEST PURPLF. Martin bird houses 
$29.95 + S H. Tektcopic poles/ accessories avail­
able Great gift idea!! Free catalog. Order today! 
Call I -8(X)-764-8688 www purplemaitin.nei 
WOLFF' TANNING BFT)S. Tan al home Buy 
direct end save! Commercial/Home units from 
$199 (X). Low monthly payments' Free color cala- 
log Call loday, I 800-842-1310 _________ __

HEALTH

A DF.BT-FREE LIFE! Confidential help Cut 
monthly payments Reduce interest Siopcollec- 
lion calls Avoid bankruptcy. Nation's largest 
nonprofit: Genus Credit Management. 24 hours.

MEDIC A RE FOLKS! TIRED of paying for ei- 
pentive inhalers for asthma/emphytema? Save 
your money today by calling Alliance Medical. 
■Toll Free. | gOD854 9223 No HMO't acxcptod

VACAI
PALM SPRINGS, CAI.IFORNIa 200 vaca 
tion rentals, weekly, monthly I -4 bedrooms, golf, 
tennis, poolt. cjm ios Call now. I -8(X)-248 2529

NOTICE. While most advertisers are reputable, we canntH guarantee their products or services advertised We urge our readers to use 
caution and when in doubt contact vour local Better Business Bureau for inform ation about the comnaiiY befo re  te n d in t  m oitet.

Call this N ew spaper to Advertise Statewide and Regionally or Call 512-477-6755.
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CPISD School Board 
Minutes

LIBRARY STAFF AND VOLUNTEERS RECEIVE TRAINING ON 
NEW COMPUTERS — Cherry Shulls( from left), librarian, Joan 
McCowen, board vice-presidenL Bobbye Hinkle, Green Thumb worker, 
watch as L ibrary  Resource Management Systerm 's personnel 
demonstrates how the retrospective conversion of all the library's 
records will be done.

Automation Progressing 
at Locai Library

By BILLIE LOVING

A "Caring Community?" Yes -- as 
can be seen in the cooperation that is 
evident in the sidewalk project. 
Taking place quietly is another 
important project ~  the automation 
of the Cross Plains Public Library.

In the past week a crew from 
"Library Resource Management 
Systems, Inc. (LRMS) of Plano have 
been installing new computers for 
both staff and patrons.

The system, computer^, will take 
the place of the card catalogue and of 
the checking in/out books by hand.

Automation of the library did not 
simply happen. It is the product of 
much work by the Library Board 
over a long period of time — 
applying for grants and raising funds 
in other ways to make sure that Cross 
Plains folks are not left "in the Dark 
Ages." Funds from interested 
individuals and The Tocker

Foundation of Austin have made the 
automation project possible.

But the work to keep the library a 
source of pride for the community is 
not finished. At this point, months of 
hard work lie ahead. Over 10,000 
books have to be bar-coded and 
entered into computers. The people 
from LMMC will continue to work 
with the library as needed until 
everything is in place and working.

In the meantime, the Library 
Board's search for funding for other 
projects is on-going, with the 
president, Mary Ann Chaffin, 
leading the way.

An up-to-date library is an 
es^ntial in a town that intends to 
survive. There will be loud noises to 
let the community know when the 
current project is completed, 
because the community has been 
involved. But until then, be patient 
and visit the library to see how 
improvements are progressing.

3i£iin* Station
Putnam, Texas

Liquor ~ Beer ~ Wine ~ Gasoline ~ Diesel

Prinw SdcctkMH -  Weekly Speriab ~ CdeknitM i Priret

Open 1 0 -9  
Monday -  Saturday (915)662-3328

Pioneer Farmer’s Co-Op
Will be Closing at Noon 

Thursday, Dec. 24 '
Re-open Monday, Dec. 28 

Thanks For Your Patronage 
Throughout The Year
Happy Holidays!

One Source 
Health Center

Holiday Office Hours
Dec. 24'" Sam to Noon 
Dec. 25‘" Closed 
Jan. 1*' Closed

Happy Holidays 
From Our Family To Yours

109 E. Ninth • Cross Plains 
2 5 4 - 7 X S . 7 1 0 £ ^  1

INTERESTING GUEST SPEAKER — Denise Coulter (left), executive 
director of the Cross Plains Economic Development Corporation, was 
the featured speaker at a recent meeting of the Cross Plains Kiwanis 
Club. She gave an informative talk on the Texas Capitol Fund Project, 
which could benefit our local businesses. Kiwanis meets on Tuesdays at 
noon at Jean's Feed Bam.

Junior High Giris Leash 
the Ranger Buildogs
The 8th grade team played very 

"well" on Monday night December 
14. Everyone on the team had a 
chance to play some basketball.

Final score was Cross Plains 31 
and Ranger 9. Team scorers were: 
Kitchens 15, Winfrey 8, Hartman 3, 
Dillard 3, Rivard 2. Team fouls 13, 
Record 3-4.

The 7th grade team lost 26 to 12. At 
the end of the first quarter the girls 
were ahead by 2 points. At the end of 
the second quarter they were tied

7th Big Country Farm 
& Ranch Show to 
Take Place in Feb.
The 7th Annual Big Country Farm 

& Ranch Show is scheduled for 
February 23 and 24 at the Taylor 
County Fairgrounds in Abilene. The 
show will feature the latest in 
agricultural equipment and offer 
a rea  p ro d u cers  a tw o day 
educational conference. The show 
will take place two weeks later than 
it has been in previous years.

The exhibit floor will showcase 
over 300 booths of national 
m an u fac tu rers , dealers  and 
suppliers. Exhibits will range from 
large hp tractors to seed and 
chemical companies. Educational 
seminars are organized by the 
T aylor County A gricu ltural 
Extension Service and offer CEU’s 
for Pesticide Applicators during 
several meetings. The Rolling 
Plains Cotton Growers will hold 
their annual meeting at the event 

Sponsors for this years event 
include the Abilene Reporter-News, 
KTAB-TV, VSA Radio Networks, 
Taylor County Ag Extension 
Service and the Rolling Plains 
Cotton Growers. Admission is free. 
For more information, please call 
800-827-8007.

W ant To W rite Your
Elected Officials?

Here are their addresses: 
Austin

George W. Bush, Gover­
nor, Room 200, State Capitol, 
Austin, TX 78711.

Jim  Keffer, District 60 State 
R epresentative. P.O. Box 
2910 Office #E2.802, Austin, 
TX 78768-2910 or call (512) 
463-0656.

Washington
Bill Clinton, President of 

the United States, The White 
House, W ashington, D.C. 
20000.

C harles  S tenholm , Con­
gressman, 17th Texas Dis­
trict, 1211 Longworth House 
Office Building, Washington, 
D.C. 20515.

Phil G ram m , U.S. Senator, 
Room 370, Rus.scll Building, 
W ashington, D.C. 20510- 
4302.

K ay B ailey H u tch iso n , 
U.S. Senator, Room 703, Hart 
Building, Washington, D.C 
20510-4301.

LOOK TO THE
c l a ssio t d V

SOME GREAT
BARGAINS

with the Bulldogs.
In the third and fourth quarters the 

Bulldogs came alive. The Bulldogs 
set traps on Cross Plains and the girls 
had trouble getting the ball into the 
rigĥ t hands. Ranger’s #45 Robinson 
scored 18 points.

Cross Plains team scorers were 
Rivard 10 and Young 2. Team fouls 
were 10, with Rivard fouling out 

The next games will be Thursday, 
January 7 at Gorman.

"Hoop It Up!"

Boys Basketball 
Update with Zephyr

By COACH LARRY BARTER

Cross Plains Junior Varsity playa! 
Zephyr resulting in a 43-28 victory 
for Zephyr.

Scoring for the Buffs were Peters 
5; Ross 5; Hopkins 4; Norris 4; 
Beauchamp 3; Butler 2; Hill 2; 
Mauricio 2; and Wilson 1.

The Cross Plains I.S.D. Board of 
Trustees met in a regular meeting 
with the following members 
present: Leon Nixon, Rex Beggs, 
Rickey Carey, Donnie Dillard, 
Charles Chesshir, Monty Richards 
and Tony Wyatt.

The following administrators and 
guest were also in attendance: 
Superintendent Jackie Tennison, 
High School Principal Rondall 
Sanders, Elementary Principal 
Margie Sowell, and guests, Ron 
Bagley and Todd Fclty.

Prayer was led by Jackie Tennison.
Minutes were approved as read.
Motion was made by Carey and 

seconded by Beggs to pay bills for 
the month of November. For 7/ 
Against 0

Motion was made by Chesshir and 
seconded by Beggs that we approve 
band trip, provided written and 
specific rules and regulations with 
corresponding discipline arc in 
place and'that adequate sponsors be 
approved and committed to go by 
March 1, 1999. For 7/Against 0

Motion was made by Carey and 
seconded by Beggs that we accept 
insurance bid from Greenwood 
Insurance for 1999 to be paid in one 
installment. This includes E &0, 
General Liability, School Vehicle 
Liability and Property Insurance. 
For 7/Against 0

Motion was made by Wyatt and 
seconded by Nixon that we approve 
TASB policy for appeal of an 
expulsion order - FOD (Local). For 
7/Against 0

Motion was made by Richards and 
seconded by Nixon that we approve 
the textbook committees consistinu

of Lynda Edington, Julia Wheeler, 
Beckic Thompson, Cam Morgan, 
Margie Sowell, Cord Woerner, 
Larry Bartce, Ricky Sparks, 
Charlene Fleming, Darlene Webb, 
Tom Barclay and Rondall Sanders. 
For 7/Against 0

Motion was made by Beggs ami 
seconded by Wyatt that we appros c 
a Shared Services Agreement with 
Abilene Regional Day School 
Program for the Deaf. For 7/Againsi 
0

Motion was made by Carey and 
seconded by Wyatt that wc approve 
purchase of a slock trailer for the 
vocational ag dcparuncni. For 7/ 
Against 0

Motion was made by Beggs ami 
seconded by Nixon that wc acceiti 
bids on delinquent property and that 
wc advertise for bids at a later date. 
For 7/AgainsiO

No action was taken lor nev 
shelving for the high .school.

Motion was made by Beggs and^ 
seconded by Wyatt that wc approve 
a plan to transport drop-out students

"I'

to Cisco for alternative. For 
Against 0

Possible changes with .Callahar^^ 
County Central Appraisal District^ 
was discussed.

Motion was niailc by Wyatt ami 
seconded by Beggs that wc accept 
the resignation of Heather Bomaras 
an aide. For 7/Againsl 0

At 9:40 executive session was 
declared by President Donnie 
Dillard.

At 9:43 executive session ended.
Motion was made by Carey ami 

seconded by Wyatt that wc adjourn.
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BAYER MOTOR CO., INC
218 EAST GRAND • COMANCHE, TX

'98 Chevrolet 1 ton Ext. Cab Dually................................... $22,000

'97 Chevrolet 1/2 ton ext. cab.............................................. $17,500
V-6, auto, Silverado, GM Warranty

'97 Chevrolet Cavalier............................................................$11,000
4-dr., 28,000 miles, Factory Warranty

^  '97 Chevrolet 1 to n ..................................................................$23,500
4-dr., V-8, automatic, Silverado, 21,0(X) miles, factory warranty

^  '97 Pontiac Grand Prix G T .................................................... $19,000
2-dr. loaded, 22,000 miles, factory warranty

'97 Chevrolet 1/2 ton Reg. C a b ........................................... $13,500
V-6. automatic, 56,000 miles, tilt, auise

*97 Pontiac Grand A M ............................................................ $13,000
4 dr.. Auto, loaded, 22,000 miles. Factory Warranty I

'97 Toyota Pickup....................................................................$10,500

"97 Chevrolet Tahoe (4x4).................................................... $28,000
LS Pkg., 350, Auto., Loaded, 23,000 miles, Factory Warranty

m i l ^  '97 Oldsmobile Delta 88 ........................................................ $15,500
24,000 miles. Factory Wananty

'96 Chevrolet 1/2 ton Reg. Cab 4 x 4 ....................................$14,000
V-6, Auto

*96 Pontiac Grand A M ............................................................ $10,500
2-dr., auto., loaded, 29,000 miles. Factory Warranty

H F f e * '96 Chev. 3/4 ton, Ex .̂ Cab (4x4).........................................$18,500
Silverado, 350 V-8, Auto , Loaded, 51 ,000 miles

'98  O ld s m o b ile  A ch ieva  (2 In s tock)
V-6, Auto., Loaded, Warranty 
6.9% with approved credit 
$1,000 D n .-$235.40 mo.

'96 GEO Tracker Convertible...............................................$10,750
m M ia ^  Auto, A/C, NEW Vehicle. 36/36 GM Warranty

— ' 96 Pontiac Sunfire..................................................................$10,750
■ i l i V . f i 4-dr . automatic, 26,0(X3 miles, factory wananty ,

'96 Chevrolet S-10 B lazer......................................................$20,000
2-dr . v-6, auto , NEW, 36/36 Warranty

'95 Chevrolet 1/2 ton Conversion Van............................... $18,950
^  loaded, NEW VEHICLE, 36/36 GM warranty

'94 Chevrolet 1/2 Ton Ext. Cab............................................ $13,500

■ m t fc. '94 Chevrolet 3/4 ton Reg. C a b ............................ \ ........... $ i 2,500
^  Auto, Silverado, 64,000 miles V

'94 Chevrolet Corsica......................................................... .....$7,000
-p- automatic, 49,000 miles

'93 Chevrolet 1/2 ton Ext. Cab........................................ .'....$12,000
350, Auto., Silverado, Clean ’

IV '93 Chevrolet Caprice 4-dr. LT Z .......................................... $11 500
350, auto.. 56,000 mitM ’  ’

^  '92 Jeep Cherokee 4-dr. Laredo (4 x 4 ).......................................... $9 000

'91 Chevrolet Lumina Euro............................................................. $5 500
4-dr., V-6, Auto, Loaded, 63,000 miles ’
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1- 800- 968-1877
1- 800- 843-5230



1 «■- | wi

Santa letters are printed as is, 
no corrections have been made. 
This gives the letters a unique 
appearance and sound as it is 
written in the child’s own 
words.
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Dear Santa,
How are you. I am fine. 1 tried to 

be a good boy but it did not always 
work. I am sorry. 1 will try harder 
next year. I want a C.D. robot And 
I would like a microscope. I want a 
toy plant and a big ball with a clown 
on it. For my baby brother 1 love you 
Santa. Thank you and Merry 
Christmas.

Love.,
Dillon Whiteley

Dear Santa,
I would like a Butterfiy Kisses doll. 

Could you also bring a truck for my 
brother, some animals for my sister, 
tools for daddy and a lamp for mom. 
Maybe you could also bring some­
thing nice for nana and papa.

Please be careful on your trip. 
Love,
Delany

Dear Santa.
I want a Pooh sleeping bag, rabbits 

hioeuut and a Pooh tent.
Please bring my brothers a com­

puter, a ring for my mom, a tool set 
for my dad, and a ring for my granny.

I have been good this year.
Love,

Cristy Beauchamp - 7

Dear Santa,
I want a Potato Head game, and a 

Godzilla, a Lite Brite, a megazord, 
and Scooby Doo video game. I will 
leave you some cookies and milk. I 
have been a good boy this year and 
you can also bring my dad some 
stuff.

Hayden Wyatt

Dear Santa,
I would like a race tract with cars, 

a truck with big wheels. Power 
Ranger doll the blue one, and Hot 
Wheels for Christmas.

Thank You,
Tyler Story

*

Dear Santa,
I would like a red Teletubbie, a 

Barbie doll with clothes, a Big Bird 
doll, and a Winnie the Pooh doll for 
Christmas.

Thank You,
Summer Story

Dear Santa Claus 
I would like a Blue Clue doll, some 

new close and a McDonald doll and 
some coloring books.

P.S. I will leave some cookie and 
milk on the table for you.

Love,
Misty Simons

Many nice gift 
items for last 

minute shopping. 
R.V. spaces 

available and 
antiques on ' '  

consignment.

Dear Santa,
1 would like a truck with big 

wheels, soccer ball, basketball, a 
bike and a new baby sissy.

Thank You,
Chad Sasser

Cross Plains 
Frozen Food

(254)  725-7571 
\ ^ i n  and Vondean H u tc h in g

HOME SWEET 
HOME

ENTERPRISES
Antiques & Collectibles

East Highway 36 
(254) 725-7351 

Joe Howscr

Dear Santa Claus,
I would like to have for Christmas 

is a green bikie, a pair of roller 
blades, a Little Mermaid movie,'a 
Pipi Longstocking movie and a real 
puppy. I will have you some cookies 
and milk waiting for you. I have 
been a real good girl.

1 Love You Santa,
Renee Robertson

Dear Santa,
I have been a very good boy. I want 

a new pair of shoos, a bee bee gun 
that looks like a 30-30, a socket set, a 
tool set, a hand held bee bee gun that 
coums with a holster and a tool box. 

Thank You 
Clay Koenig

P.S. Would you please bring my 
brother a Play Station.

Merry Christmas To All 
And To All A Good Night!

V

Thunk You For Your Unfailing Support.
From eastside to weslside 
And all aroumi the toum 
May peace and happiness 
Blanket the toum.
Arid to all our goodfri.ends 
Doth far and near—
A oery good Christmas 
Ami a happy New Year.

Connie’s C & C
Cuts & Curls ^ • r  i

Connie Kirkhani, tmner/operator i ^ e P V I C c  V ^ c r l l C l  
Lillie Dillard

(254) 725-6318 725- 7445

r

ALWAYS HAPPY TO BE OF SERVICE. SEASON'S GREE'nNGS TO ALL!

i
BUQBUSTER PEST CONTKOL

(254) 725-6740 or 1-800-605-PEST
Terry & Jean Harris and Family J

Amelia’s 
House 

of Beauty
(254) 725-7247

Happy
have an Holidays 

ol' fashittned 
Christm as and 

a grand ol' time!
I'hanks for your 

support, pardners!

Johnson's 
Dry Goods

( 254) 725-6211 
Noah and Bobbie


