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Kitty^s K orner
by

Kitty Montgomery

Computers may take over 
the world as predicted for the 
next century, but as of now 
they have a heck of a long 
way to go in my opinion. I 
have two new things that are 
computerized, and both have 
gone haywire. My new tele­
vision goes on and off on it’s 
own and there is no way to 
stop it and my new car stops 
and starts on its own and 
there is no way to correct it 
manually, that is.

Both are under warranty 
and hopefully the television 
has been fixed. The car is 
another matter. The first me­
chanic said there was noth­
ing wrong with it and sure 
enough when 1 got it back, it 
an like a top for at least a 
lay and a half. Then I was 

>.oming down the hill and all 
the red lights came on. 
Fortunately, I was able to get 
It to the curb at Doris 
Moore’s house. If it had not 
been for the lights, I would 
not have known the motor 
had died and there would 
have been no earthly way to 
stop at the intersection be­
low. When it dies, every­
thing dies, the steering, the 
brakes, even the horn. Some­
times you can start it again 
and sometimes you can’t. If 
you’ve seen my car parked 
around town at some of the 
strangest places, you may be 
sure that’s one of the times I 
couldn’t re-start it.

In exasperation I called 
Detroit. When I explained 
how it was missing, stopp­
ing, starting, with black 
smoke pouring out of the 
exhaust, the nice man asked 
if the “check engine’’ light 
came on during this time. I 
answered in the affirmative. 
He said I had no problem, 
the computer was just send­
ing wrong signals to the 
engine and as the car was 
under warranty it could easi­
ly be replaced. Well, they 
don’t do warranty work here 
unless the car was purchas­
ed here, so I was out of luck. 
Can you imagine stopping 
and starting and belching 
black smoke all the way to 
San Angelo?

Tom was off on a hunting 
trip, so I decided to try to get 
it to the house and let him 
decide what to do. After it 
stopped right in front of a 
moving truck as 1 was cross­
ing Hwy 290, 1 decided I 
would not drive it again 
under any circumstances. 
Walking is safer than driv­
ing a fancy new car with the 
omputer messed up. It was 

.ny trip from the office to the 
house that really broke the 
camel’s back.

It just started up as nice as 
you please, purred through 
town and died on the bridge 
across the draw. Other driv­
ers managed to dodge me as 
I wrestled it down by the 
Silver Spur. I knew what it 
meant to be in a “ cold 
sweat.“ but I managed to 
pull myself together and get 
the darned thing started 
again. 1 sputtered up the hill 
and it died just as I was 
turning on my street. Well, 
of course, there was no way 
to turn, so I ended up with 
the front end in the bottom of 
our yard and the back end 
sticking out in the street. I 
tried again. After I got it 
started I had to go straight 
up over the hill and back 
around to the house. Every 
time I turned or stopped at a 
stop sign, the computer sent 
the wrong signal to the 
engine, but I managed to 
creep into our driveway after 
what seemed hours and 
when I got out of that car I 
knew I’d never get in it 
again.

Tom came home and took 
it to San Angelo where we 
had an “ appointment’’ to 
have it looked at. As of this
CONTINUED ON PAGE 9

12 b a s k e tb a ll team s e n te re d -

PtC.A.N NA IN NEKS-These were ihe winners at the
conclusion oi the annual Crockett County Pecan Show held 
here .Monday. Jack Baggett, center, had the Grand 
Champion pecan, i^u Deaton, reserve Champion, and June 
Henderson, champion native. Tom Cameron, right, ac­

cepted Mrs. Henderson’s plaque and prize money. Louise 
Ledoux won the prize for the smallest pecan entered and 
Buster Deaton had the most entries. John Parks, back 
center, presented the prize money.

County Pecan Show 
most successful to date
The Crockett County Pe­

can Show held Monday at the 
Civic Center was the most 
successful show yet. Entries 
were more than double those 
of last year with 143 of 
various varieties.

Jack Baggett had the 
Grand Champion pecan with 
a Success variety. He re­
ceived the $50 top prize and a 
plaque furnished by the Pe­
can Growers Association. Re­
serve champion went to Lou 
Deaton with a Tejas which 
was also champion in the 
shelling division. She receiv­
ed the second place $25 and a 
plaque. June Henderson had 
the champion native again 
this year. Louise Ledoux won 
the prize for entering the 
smallest pecan and Buster 
Deaton had the most entries.

Winners will be entered in 
the regional show and state 
show, where Crockett County 
entries have done well in the 
past. Last year Troy Wil­
liams captured a first place at 
the State Show and Larry 
Bailey received a third.

Winners in the food divi­
sion were, cakes-Lorelei Mc- 
Mullan, first and Tina Mor­
an, second. Pies-Janet Hill, 
first; Joyce Young, second. 
Cookies, Alice Poage, first 
and Janet Hill, second. 
Breads, Dennis Young, first; 
Janet Hill, second. Martha 
Henderson' won the miscel­
laneous division and Janet 
Hill was second.

Winning the arts and 
crafts division were Patsy 
Hester, first, with a large 
hollow log filled with pecans 
with a ceramic squirrel 
perched on top. Virginia 
Cotton was second with a 
Christmas broom door decor­
ation.

The winning recipes were 
a pecan pie, cranberry bread, 
Texas pecan bars, Italian 
Cream Cake and chicken 
salad. They are printed in 
another part of this week’s 
edition of the paper.

Judges for the pecan divi­
sion were Dr. Austin Stock- 
ton and Charles Neeb of Fort 
Stockton. The food and crafts

4-H Food Show 
is Saturday

were judged by Evea Huff- 
aker and Novella Dehnel of 
McCamey.

Buster Deaton was chair­
man of processing with his 
committee of Billy Carson, 
Bill Cooper, Bill Lindsey, 
Tom Stokes, Cotton Good­
man, Pete Jacoby, Larry 
Bailey and Bill Baggett.

Janet Hill was chairman of 
the food and craft division. 
Assisting her were Liz Mary 
Pipes, Queta Fierro, John­
nie Johnson and Patsy Hes­
ter.

T h o rn to n 's  
has n e w  
m a n a g e r

John Whitworth recently 
moved to Ozona from New 
Braunfels, to become the 
new manager at Thornton’s 
Supermarket.

The Crockett County 4-H 
Food Show will be Saturday, 
December 12, at the Civic 
Center. Approximately 65 
4-H members are making 
plans to enter the show-

The 4-H members select a 
recipe, and enter it in one of 
four groups. (Breads and 
Cereals, Main Dish, Fruits 
and Vegetables, and Nutri­
tious Snacks and Desserts). 
Glenda Winkley and Marlene 
Clay are serving as chair­
men of this year’s show.

Members need to bring 
their food to the Civic Cen­
ter between 9:30 and 10:00. 
Judging will start promptly 
at 10:00. Parents and guests 
are invited to view the food 
entries at 11:00 and awards 
will be presented at 11:30.

Serving as 4-H food lead­
ers this year were: Amelia 
Alveraz, Virginia Baggett, 
Roberta Bailey, June Camer­
on, Alice Couch, Michelle

Couch, Marlene Clay, Cry- 
stelle Childress. Lou Deaton. 
Carolyn Dunn, Mary Louise 
Hayes, Sherrie Lloyd, Sharon 
Hartnett, Alena Faye Hokit, 
Mary Lou Knox, May Lay, 
Jari Lee, Doris Hood, Debbie 
Massey, Tina Moran, Ethel 
McCrohan, Brenda Newton, 
Agnes Payne, Peggy Phil­
lips, Carman Ramos, Cynthia 
Reina, Jane Richardson, Ro­
berta Schoenhals, Jackline 
Shacklette, Glenda Winkley, 
Beverly Watson, Sharman 
West, and Mary Ann Ely.

Each 4-H member receives 
a ribbon and first place con­
testants from each food cate­
gory will receive a trophy. 
Sponsors for this year’s tro­
phies are Maxine’s Flowers, 
Brown Furniture, Baker 
Jewelers, Thornton’s Gro­
cery, Ozona Television Sys­
tem, Jim’s Foodway Gro­
cery, Clayton’s Village Drug 
and Baker Oil Treating Com­
pany.

JOHN WHITWORTH

He was store manager for 
Wuest Super Markets in New 
Braunfels for the past fif­
teen years. Whitworth is a 
native of South Carolina, but 
has lived in Texas since 1954, 
and feels he is a “ quali­
fied Texan’’ at this time. 
He is 46 years old and has 
been in the grocery business 
36 years, as manager for the 
past 23 years.

Whitworth has a wife, 
Kathy, who plans to join him 
here shortly after the Christ­
mas holidays. Their daugh­
ter, Nannette, is in law 
school and their son, Wayne, 
is a college student.

Complete results of the 
pecan division follow:

Placings in the In-Shell 
Division were as follows:

Burkett-W. T. Stokes, 
first; Pat Aiguier, second; 
Carmen Sutton, third.

Choctaw-Bill Watson, first 
and Bud Cox, second.

Mahan-Lou Deaton, first; 
Troy Williams, second; Bus­
ter Deaton, third.

Stuart-Lou Deaton, first; 
Buster Deaton, second; Don 
Sessom, third.

Success-Jack Baggett, 
first; Demp Jones, second; 
Sandy Stokes, third.

Wichita-7-U Ranch, first; 
Billy Reagor, second; Buster 
Deaton, third.

Variety Seedling In-Shell- 
Bill Lindsey, first; Bill Lind­
sey, second.

Other In-Shell-Gary Van- 
noy, Delmas, first; 7-U 
Ranch, Shoshoni, second.

Shelling Division places 
were:

Kincaid-Buster Deaton, 
first; June Henderson, sec­
ond; Louise Bunger, third.

San Saba-Billy Carson, 
first; C. O. Spencer, second; 
Herb Kunkel, third.

Schley-George Bunger, 
first; Wanda Bunger, sec­
ond.

Tejas-Lou Deaton, first; 
Buster Deaton, second.

W estern-S am  P ern e r, 
first; Larry Bailey, second; 
Tommy Stokes, third.

Variety Seedling-Shelling- 
W.T. Stokes, first; Tommy 
Stokes, second; Roger Dud­
ley, third.

Van Deman-Jeffrey Sut­
ton, first; June Henderson, 
second; Louise Bunger, 
third.

Harper-Pat Aiguier, first; 
Lou Deaton, second.

Other Shelling-June Hen­
derson, first, Conley; Gran­
ville Flanagan, second; Lou­
ise Bunger, third. Barton.

Other Indian varieties-i 
Buster Deaton, first, Sioux; 
Buster Deaton, second, 
Cherokee; Buster Deaton, 
Comanche, third.

Native-June Henderson, 
first; Louise Bunger, second; 
Mrs. Russell’s Kindergar­
ten, third.

Smallest Pecan-Louise Le­
doux, first; Roger Dudley, 
second; Virginia Cotton, 
third.

Annual tourney 
starts Thursday

Ozona’s 51st Annual Bas­
ketball Tournament will get 
under way here Thursday 
with the first game schedul­
ed for 11:00 a.m. Thursday. 
The tournament has drawn 
12 teams this year, taking the 
Ozona and Sonora junior 
varsity teams to take up the 
slack. Other teams entered 
are Big Lake, Stanton, 
Crane, Iraan, Eden, Eldora­
do, Wall, Junction and the 
Ozona and Sonora varsity 
teams.

Stanton won the tourna- . 
menMast year and will be a 
heavy favorite this year. 
Wall, who took home the 
runner-up trophy last year, 
also has a strong team and 
will be among the favorites. 
Sonora took home the conso­
lation trophy last year.

The tournament will get 
under way Thursday morn­
ing at 11:00 with the Big 
Lake Owls and Stanton Buf­
faloes meeting for the open­
ing game. Crane and Iraan 
will square off for the sec­
ond game, scheduled for 
12:45. The Sonora J.V. and 
Eden will open the after­
noon session at 2:30. Sonora 
will play the Ozona J.V. at 
4:45. Eldorado and Wall are 
scheduled for 6:30 and the 
Lions will play Junction in 
the final game of the day at 
8:15.

Games are scheduled all 
day Friday at the same times 
with losers playing losers for 
the consolation and winners 
playing winners toward the 
championship. Finals will be 
held Saturday with consola­
tion games in the morning 
and championship games in 
the afternoon and evening. 
Presentation of trophies will 
take place after the champ­
ionship game and all tourna­
ment players will be named.

The Ozona tournament is 
one of the oldest in West

Texas, but the Lions have 
only won the championship 
five times in the 50 years the 
tournament has been held. 
Big Lake holds the record for 
winning the top spot the 
most times, taking home the 
championship 15 times. The 
Owls won the tournament 
seven years in a row from 
1964 through 1970.

Tournament records have 
not been broken in the past 
ten years. Bobby Cottle of 
Rocksprings holds the record 
for the most points for an 
individual with 54, in 1967. 
He also holds the record for 
the most field goals, 23, also 
set in 1967. David Gentry of 
Mertzon set the record for 
the most free throws with 14 
in 1969. However, Billy 
Hubble of Eldorado tied that 
record in 1971. Webb Wil­
liams of Comstock still holds 
the record for the highest 
individual score in the tour­
nament with 155, set in 1970.

Tournament directors are 
Ozona basketball coaches 
Tommy Wilson and Johnny 
Bradshaw.

Time keepers are Don 
Sessom, Winston Koerth, 
Steve Poage, Rip Sewell, 
Gene Hood and Frank Rea­
vis. Score keepers will be 
Bob Wallace, H. O. Hoover, 
Rip Sewell, A. J. Gholson, 
David McWilliams, Don 
Payne and Thomas Hanson.

Chick Womack and Pete 
Maldonado are in charge of 
ticket sales. Referees include 
former Ozona basketball 
coach Charles Spieker, Nolan 
Fontenot, Mike Wooley and 
Howard Nance.

Tickets may be purchas­
ed at the door for each 
session. Price of tickets will 
be 75c for students and $1.50 
for adults for all sessions 
except the championship ses­
sion Saturday evening when 
tickets will be $1 for stu­

dents \n d  $1.50 for adults.
The sophomore class will 

have the concession stand 
and will be open for eacl 
session.

Members of the host team 
are Jon Adams, Varlyn Al­
dridge, Zeke Martinez, Da­
vid Badillo, Robert Massey, 
Jack Thompson, Harvey 
Huereca, Ernie Borrego and 
Dan Bean.

O H S  class  
A A A  n e w  
s c h e d u le
Due to UIL changes, Ozo­

na High School will be in 
District 6AAA with the be­
ginning of the 1982 school 
term.

The football schedule for 
next fall ha< been released. 
The first game will be here 
with Junction, Sept. 3. Sept, 
10, the Lions will play Wall, 
there and Sept. 17 Big Lake, 
there. They will host McCa­
mey Sept. 24, and be in 
Eldorado for the last pre­
district game Oct. 1.

District play begins Oct. 8 
when the Lions host Ballin­
ger. Oct. 15, the Lions will 
play Colorado City, there. 
The district tilt with Crane 
will take place Oct. 22, 
here and the Lions will be in 
Coahoma Oct. 29. The final 
game will be with Sonora, 
here, Nov. 5.
Day care  c e n te r 
n u m b e r change

The Ozona Day Care Cen­
ter, located at the Metho­
dist Church, has a new tele­
phone number, 392-3641.

The center is open Monday 
through Friday from 7:30 
a.m. until 6:00 p.m. and is a 
service to the entire com­
munity.

POOL COMPANY DEDICATES SOOTH RIG-The new rig will operate out of the Ozona yard, 
A dedication ceremony was held recently in the Westchase area of Houston to celebrate the 
addition of the 500th rig to the fleet. C. V. Helm, president of Pool Company, dedicated the 
rig to the more than 8,300 employees of Pool Company around the world.
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FEEDING INFLATION’S FIRE
By;Edwin Feulner

■While Democratic partisans in Congress have 
denounced the Department of Labor’s decision to
revi.se the Consumer Price Index (CPI) as a *‘gimmick,” 
the move stands out as a good one, and will save American 
taxpayers billions of dollars in the years ahead.

‘ By definition, the CPI measures the change in the price 
of>a uniform “ market basket” of goods and .services over 
time. Unfortunately, it is often confused with and used 
as a cost-of-living index which attempts to measure a 
constant standard of living. Its three principal functions 
have become quite fuzzy, and in fact, inaccurate.

First, the CPI attempts to measure how successful the 
government has been in maintaining economic stability -  
wHich means it plays a key role in Wall Street's economic 
del'ision-making. Also used as part of a formula to compare 
p ^ e s  over lengthy periods of time, the CPI is essential 
ift;calculating the Gross National Product (GNP). Finally, 
t ^  ( ’PI is used as an index for automatic cost-of-living 
v^ge increases to guard incomes against a decline in 
f^chasing power.
j: Unfortunately, says economic analyst Peter Germanis 

a j^  others who have studied the subject, the CPI is anything 
b]^ accurate, and because it overstates actual increases in 
haling costs. 11 adds billions of dollars in costs to 
gtlvernment and business each year In fa< t, says Germanis. 
e^;ry time the CPI creeps upward one percentage point. 
tl§ cost of government goes up S2 billion

For example, because the retirement pension of former 
.Speaker of the House John W. McCormack was tied to 
thf CPI, his pension of $.50.(KK) (or eighty percent of his 
si^ary' at retirement) had risen to $92,(X)() at the time of 
hfs death in I9K0. In contrast, current .Speaker of the House 
Tip O ’Neill’s salary is “ only” $79.125 per year.

Not only are the pensions of retired Congressmen tied 
to the CPI, but so are the retirement incomes of other 
federal employees. Social Security recipients, retired 
military personnel, and trade union members, retired as 
well as tho.se still in the workforce (whose contracts often 
contain Cost of Living Adjustment -  COLA - clauses).

Since the CPI is based on changes in prices over time, 
we’re talking about the same items over time. But the 
American people don’t necessarily u.se the same items over 
the years -  as our lifestyles and standards of living change, 
so do the things we buy. For example, since world oil 
prices have escalated, and we are aware that our supply 
is not unlimited, perscmal consumption has dropped. 
Nevertheless, the CPI uses an outdated base measure, which 
clearly raises the heat of inflation’s fire.

Moreover, durable goods such as housing, cars, and 
appliances are purchased in one period, but generally 
p^^)vide services over a number of years, Germanis points 
lAjt. Treating the purchase of a house as simply another 
o’rie-time expense gives it much greater weight than it 
should. A true cost-of-living index, he says, should indicate 
t^e price one would pay to rent similar shelter. Moreover, 
a house represents both a “ consumption” and an 
investment. Yet the CPI ignores housing as an investment.
- The bottom line is that the CPI overstates inflation, 

afid by doing so pumps up the federal budget. By one 
estimate, according to Germanis, the federal budget would 
b? $11 billion smaller today had changes in the way we 
compute the CPI been made in 1974.

With fiscal responsibility the issue of the 1980s, and 
vtith billions of dollars in cost-of-living adjustments hinging 
i^on each percentage point change in the CPI, no time 
sfiould be wasted in correcting the CPI's flaws -  before 
the fires of inflation leave us with nothing but ashes.

Together. ^
You and your neighbors 

can help. 
Write to; Crime Prevention 

Coalition, Box 6600, 
ckville, Maryland 20850
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AUSTIN — Gov. Bill 
Clements last Thursday gave 
up his fight to avoid testify­
ing in the Congressional re­
districting case after the 5th 
U.S. Circuit Couit of .Ap­
peals said he must respond 
to the plaintiffs subpoena.

The governor considered 
an appeal to the U.S. Su­
preme Court on the grounds 
of executive privilege before 
deciding to testify on Friday. 
The appeals court did not 
express an opinion as to 
Clements’ right to claim 
executive privilege to avoid 
answering questions.

Both House Speaker Billy 
C'layton and Sen. John Wil­
son—author ot the contro­
versial bill—testified that 
Clements had no effect on 
the redistricting plan. He 
had threatened to veto any 
plan which did not provide 
a minority district in Dallas.

The three-judge panel set 
a Dec. 17 deadline for sub­
mitting post-trial briefs and 
insisted they would rule on 
the case before the Feb. 4 
filing deadline for congres­
sional candidates. Before the 
throe judges rule, however, 
the plan must be reviewed 
by the Justice Department 
for compliance with the \  ot- 
ing Rights Act.
Press Barred from Hearing

In a Texas Courtroom of 
another sort. The Lufkin 
News has gone to federal 
court over a state district 
judge’s barring the press 
from a pre-trial hearing.

The hearing involves a 
lawsuit filed by minority 
stockholders of the Texas 
National Bank in Lufkin 
against the bank's majority

stockholders. When the 
judge barred a Lufkin News 
reporter, Publisher Joe Mur­
ray committed his efforts to 
“■going all the way”, pre­
sumably to the U.S. Supreme 
"Court, to open the delayed 
pre-trial hearing.

The judge uphold the 
press ban on the motion the 
hearing involves sensitive 
and confidential bank mat­
ters.

O 1979 The A dvertising  Council, Inc.

Q: i was thinking of starting 
my own business. If I would sell 
ice cream, soda pop or cookies at 
my home, would i need to obtain 
a license? If so, how much is it 
and where would I go to get a 
license?

A: Most cities and towns have 
zoning ordinances which pro­
hibit doing business in a resi­
dence. If your home is in a resi­
dential neighborhood, you may 
not be able to obtain a license for 
selling refreshments. City of­
ficials have the zoning and licens­
ing information you need.

Q: i didn’t think it would hap­
pen to me but it has. My husband 
of 30 years has walked out on 
me. I have two daughters still in 
need of some financial support. 
My husband has a good Job and 
receives a VA check, but he says 
the only money I’m entitled to is 
one-half of what we gel when we 
sell the house. I hope this is not 
true. Please tell me what may 
happen on divorce.

A: V.A. disability benefits are 
not community property and will 
not be available to you on di­
vorce. You will, of course, seek 
child support if your daughters 
are still minors. You may not 
need to sell the house. In addi­
tion to the equity, you also have 
a claim to half the family’s in­
vestments, .savings and insurance 
and to half your husband’s job 
benefits, including retirement.

Q: If you are being chased by a 
city police officer and you cross 
the city limit line, does the police 
officer still have jurisdiction and 
can he continue the chase? Can 
he still arrest you?

A: A city police officer who 
sees you commit an offense, or 
who is attempting to arrest you 
or question you, may pursue you 
across the city limit lines. His 
Jurisdiction does not end at the 
line, and yes, he may arrest you 
outside of the city.

Q: The Warranty Deed on our 
home shows only my husband’s 
name. If he should die before I 
do, would I automatically receive 
our hottfO and land?

A: A home bougli; durina 
marriag^is presumed to be com­
munity property, it belongs 
equally to you both, even though 
your name is not on record.

At his death, your husband’s 
one-half will pass to his children 
equally. You would retain your 
one-half and would have the 
widow’s right to occupy the 
home for your lifetime.

Your husband can leave you 
his half^ln his Will. Also, if he 
has no children, you would in­
herit allTiis community property, 
even without a Will.

Q: Must a father continue to 
pay child support when his 
former wife remarries?

A: A father is under court 
order to support his children un­
til a new, or modified, order is 
entered by the court with juris­
diction over the child. Unless the 
divorce decree specifies that sup­
port changes on the mother’s 
remarriage, a formal hearing 
must be had to accomplish this. 
At that time, the father can in­
troduce his earnings and the 
mother’s earnings to support his 
petition that changed c ir­
cumstances call for a revised 
order.

tanking party officials have 
been traveling around the 
state encouraging better 
known GOP faithfuls to en­
ter congressional races. The 
message has been that Re­
publicans have had few
losses recently and to assure 
those eyeing races that there 
will be ample money to help 
candidates.

Computer Tracking
(jov. Clements told a U.S. 

Senate subcommittee early 
last week that a joint Mexi- 
can-U.S. computer operation 
designed to keep track of 
border crossings would help 
stop the flow of Mexican 
nationals entering the Unit­
ed States illegally.

The governor told the 
immigration panel that he 
will meet Mexican President 
Jose Portillo after the first 
of the year for more talks 
about the immigration prob­
lem.

During his brief testimony 
before the subcommittee. 
Clements repeated his sup­
port for President Reagan’s 
immigration proposals, espe­
cially the 5().0()0-pcrson 
■guest worker" program. 
Reagan’s plan also provides 
for penalties for employers 
who knowingly hire illegal 
aliens. However, the Presi­
dent’s proposal would grant 
temporary resident status to 
most of the persons now in 
this country illegally.

Meanwhile, U.S. Rep. 
Phil Gramm, the College 
Station Democrat, indicated 
he would consider switching 
to the GOP if he is removed 
from the House Budget 
Committee. Congressman 
Jack Hightower of Vernon 
is reported to have received 
an invitation to make a 
switch to the Republican 
party.

Republicans Busy
F-or the past two weeks 

Republican State Chairman 
Chet Upham and other

Layoffs Will Total 400
Approximately 400 em­

ployees of the Texas Em­
ployment Commission will 
be laid off early next year 
because of reductions in 
federal funding, agency of­
ficials announced last week.

The employee reduction is 
in addition to 300 positions 
the state agency lost through 
attrition since a hiring freeze 
began in March. The Dec. 
31 layoffs will be based on 
seniority.

Ernie Tullis, commission 
administrator, said affected 
employees will be notified of 
their termination by letter no 
later than Dec. 10. Tullis 
said the state headquarters 
in Austin will lose about 60 
employees, while the largest 
reduction will come in Cor­
pus Christi, which will lose 
79 positions.

Interest Rates Lowered
As the prime rate of in­

terest continues to slide 
downward, the State De­
pository Board has lowered 
the rate of interest charged 
banks on state funds from 
14.5 per cent to 11 per cent. 
The Board also instructed 
the State Treasurer’s staff to 
consider a “floating” rate 
formula system for making 
such adjustments automat­
ically.

Short Takes
Frances (Sissy) Farcn- 

thold, a former Texas guber­
natorial candidate, told a 
Houston workshop spon­
sored by the Women’s Lob­
by Alliance that women are 
an “expendable constituen­
cy” under the Reagan ad­
ministration.

Secretary of State David 
Dean ruled the Libertarian 
Party of Texas is not en­
titled to place nominees on 
the 1982 general election 
ballot Without filing lists of 
precinct convention partici­
pants or petitions.

The Texas Public Utility 
Commission has set Dec. 9 
to consider staff recommen­
dations that a $4 million 
service penalty against Gen­
eral Telephone Co. be lifted.

Comptroller Bob Bul­
lock’s office reports Texas’ 
gross sales totaled $77.3 bil­
lion in the second quarter, 
an increase of $12.6 billion 
from the same quarter in 
1980.

Travis County officials 
did not contest the moving 
of Rep. Mike Martin’s ag­
gravated perjury trial to 
Fredericksburg. Martin, a 
Longview Republican is to 
be tried Feb. 8. Another 
change of venue could be 
sought when the pre-trial 
hearing is held on Jan. 14.

Public Notice

1962 graduates ot U.H.S. 
interested in a 20-year class 
reunion the summer of 1982 
please contact Jan Kenley, 
392-2439, Box 659, or John­
ny Childress, 392-3634, Box 
1066. If enough interest is 
shown, a reunion will be 
planned. Respond before 
Dec. 15 please.

38-4tc

T h e  N e w s re e l
A re-run of “ The Ozona Story” as gleaned from 
the files of the “The Ozona Stockman”

ENERGY AWARENESS 
REDUCES MONTHLY 
BILLS

Turning off the lights 
when you leave a room for 
more than three minutes 
saves money, say experts at 
the Center for Energy and 
Mineral Resources at Texas- 
A&M University.

That is one of the tips 
offered in “Texas Energy,” 
the center’s monthly con­
sumer publication. Among 
the suggestions to help rent­
ers save energy and reduce 
utility bills:

Major appliances account 
for 20 to 30 percent of all 
energy used in the home. 
Energy can be saved by 
lowering the thermostat on 
the hot water heater, as well 
as by insulating the heater 
tank and the hot water pipes, 
the publication says.

When washing dishes in 
the sink, fill the sink and 
plug it instead of letting 
water run constantly. If using 
a dishwasher, stop the .ma­
chine before it gets to the dry 
cycle and let dishes dry in the 
air. Run the dishwasher only 
when full.

A four-minute shower uses 
less water than a bath. A 
flow restrictor attached to the 
shower head can cut water 
flow from eight gallons a 
minute to two.

When cooking, preheat the 
oven for only five minutes or 
not at all, says the energy 
publication. For oven-cooked 
meals,, turn heat off for the 
last 10 minutes. Boil or heat 
on the range with a cover on 
the food to save a third of the 
energy normally used.

on the 
School

Thursday, Dec. 11, 1952
An election to choose three 

directors of the Crockett 
County Water Control and 
Improvement District No. 1 
will be held in the district 
area on Tuesday, January 13.

29 Yrs. Ago
Members of the Ozona 

Literary Club wrote “ finis” 
to one of their projects last 
Saturday when volunteer 
workers completed the in­
stallation of swings 
North Elementary 
ground.

29 Yrs. Ago
An electric eye has re­

placed the human element 
formerly required to turn on 
Ozona street lighting system 
each evening and turn them 
off in the morning.

29 Yrs. Ago
Members of the Ozona 

Literary Club met Monday 
afternoon in the home of 
Mrs. Lem Bray for their 
annual Christmas party.

29 Yrs. Ago
Santa Claus is coming to 

Ozona next Thursday to pay 
his annual pre-Christmas vis­
it to Ozona kids.

29 Yrs. Ago
Mrs. Bland Tandy and 

Cathy of Abilene are guests 
this week in the home of 
Dr. and Mrs. H. B. Tandy.

29 Yrs. Ago

A Christmas Pageant will 
be held at the Ozona Com­
munity House, Friday, Dec­
ember 19, 7:30 p.m. All 
members and friends are 
cordially invited,

29 Yrs. Ago
Lowell Littleton, active 

vice president of the Ozona 
National Bank, is able to be 
out again after a recent 
attack of pneumonia.

29 Yrs. ago

Billy Ray Graves, son of 
Mrs. Robert Graves of 0- 
zona, is spending a 30-day 
leave from the navy with his 
mother here.

PU B L IC  N O TIC E
In compliance with Sec . 43(a) of

Art. 1446c, V.A.C.S., West Texas
Utilities Company hereby publishes
NOTICE that it has filed, on November
25, 1981, its statement of intent to make
changes in its rates charged for electric-
ity and services sold and rendered inside
and outside municipal jurisdictions,
such proposed changes to be effective
January 1, 1982. Such Statement of In-
tent includes the proposed revisions,
tariffs and schedules, and a statement
specifying in detail each proposed
change, the effect the proposed change
is expected to have on the revenues of
the Company, and the classes and num-
hers of utility customers affected. Gross
revenues are expected to be increased
15.4 per cent over adjusted test year rev-
enuesby the new rates.Statements of in-
tent were filed with the Public Utility
Commission of Texas and with the fol-
lowing municipalities:

Abilene Hawley Quitaque
Alpine Hedley Rankin
Anson Impact Rising Star
Aspennont Iraan Roaring Springs
Baird Jay ton Rochester
Balmorhea Junction Rule
Ballinger Knox City San Angelo
Benjamin Lawn Santa Anna
Big Lake Lueders Shamrock
Blackwell Marfa Sonora
Bronte McCamey Spur
Buffalo Gap Melvin Stamford
Childress Memphis Sterling City
Cisco Menard Talpa
Clarendon Merkel Throckmorton
Clyde Mertzon Trent
Cross Plains Miles Turkey
Crowell Moran Tuscola
Dodson Munday Tye
Eden O’Brien Valentine
Eldorado Paducah Weinert
Estelline Paint Rock Wellington
Goree Presidio Winters
Hamlin Putnam Woodson
Haskell Quanah

Areas affected by the filing with the
Public Utility Commission of Texas are
in the following:

Cities
Albany Lakeview Roby
Chillicothe Matador Rotan
Dickens Robert Lee

Counties
Baylor Foard Pecos
Brewster Gillespie Presidio
Briscoe Hall Reagan
Brown Hardeman Reeves
Callahan Haskell Runnels
Childress Irion Schleicher
Coke Jeff Davis Shackelford
Coleman Jones Stephens
Collingsworth Kent Sterling
Concho Kimble Stonewall
Cottle King Sutton
Crane Knox Taylor
Crockett Mason Throckmorton
Dickens McCulloch Tom Green
Donley Menard Upton
Eastland Motley Wheeler
Edwards Nolan Wilbarger
Fisher

29 Yrs. ago (Sum.
A group of young people

enjoyed a box supper party at
the First Baptist Church
Monday evening. s

Ozona 

Business

And  

Professional 

Guide
OZONA SATELLITE T-V 
Have your own earth sta­

tion, receiving up to 40 
television channels.

Call
Oscar Kost 

392-3257 or 392-3323
OZONA DAY 

CARE CENTER 
Methodist Church 
PHONE 392-3641 
18-mos and older 

fulltime or drop-in 
7:30 to 6 p.m.

WELDING 
General & Oilfield 

24 Hr. Service 
Ph. 392-3029

VILLAGE BARBER SHOP 
Regular Haircuts 

Razor Cuts-Layer Cuts 
and Men’s Hair Styling 

Jim Caldwell

MAXINE’S" 
FLOWER SHOP 

Fresh Cut-Pot Plants 
Artificial Arrangements 
Gifts For All Occasions 

Ph. 392-2648

THE CAMERAS TWO 
PHOTOGRAPHY STUDIO 

Sandra Childress 
Chris Weant 

Call for Appointment 
392-2256

VFW POST 6109 
Regular Meetings 

Third Tuesday 
In Each Month 

8 P.M.

OZONA BUTANE CO. 
Propane Gas 

Sales and Service 
1108Ave. E 
Ph. 392-3013

THE LINE 
Party Merchant 
14Mi.EoffI-10 

Beer-Liquor-Wine 
Ph. 387-2956

THE BAGGETT AGENCY 
Insurance 

Your Protection 
is our Profession 

1114 Ave. E-392-2606

‘Everything for the Home’ 
at

BROWN FURNITURE CO. 
906 Ave. E 

Ph. 392-2341

J.W. MOTOR PARTS

Auto Parts & Supplies 
60611th St. 

392-2343

B&C AUTOMOTIVE 
Complete Auto Repair 

& Auto Needs 
Ph. 392-2016 

Cor. of 11th & Ave. C

SPORT SHACK 
T-Shirts-Transfers 

Deer Leases 
1102 Ave. 1392-3382

ALCOHOLICS 
ANONYMOUS MEETING 

Tuesday Nights 
8:00 o’clock 

Conference Room 
Lilly Welding & Cons. 
603 Ave. H 392-2669

MARY KAYE 
COSMETICS 
Ruth Hester 
Ph. 392-2051 
205 Ave. G

38-tfc

SKAIN’S GARAGE 
Welding & General Repair 

24 Hr. Wrecker Service 
392-3110 392-3505

38-12td
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J IM S  -
f o o d w a y

A N O TH ER  TR E M E N D O U S VALUE  
FROM  TH E  VALUE LEADER. . .

TIMEX TH E  BASIC WATCH
DURABILITY, DEPEN D A B ILITY  

A N D  VALUE!

• Available in 
Ladies or Mehs

• Assorted Styles 
& Movements

• Buy One for 
Yourself & One 
for a Gift

• Values to $59.95

NOW
ONLY

$1699

ON EVERYTHING YOVU NEED
tJea*9o// f^et f/ ie a i/i/  G am /ij, Goo/ne^Sya/u/ <5̂

PRICES 600P MONDAY, DEC. 14 ' LIMIT *’

USD! CHOICE "P.S.” BEEF

ROUND STEAK9189
BONELESS 

LB H I  2̂̂  ̂ LB.

L IM IT
R IG H T S
R E S E R V E D

SLICED
S U B BACON

USDA CHOICE BEEF

T-BONE STEAK
USDA CHOICE PS BEEF 

BONELESS PIKE'S PEAK R O A S T
WHOLE HOG - HOT OR MILD

GOOD VALUE SAUSAGE
USDA CHOICE 'T .S /' BEEF

BONELESS RUMP ROAST

HICKORY
SMOKED

Ever wonder what Qscar lAayer 
has in store for you...

GOOD VALUE WAFER THIN

SLICED 
MEATS

DIM

DEL MONTC

VEGETABLES
•  W h o le  K ernel C o m  17-Oz
•  C ream  S ty le  C orn 17-Oz
•  C u t G reen  B eans 16-Oz
•  F ren ch  S ty le

G reen  B eans 16-Oz
•  S w e e t P ea s  17-Oz

CAN.39

LEAN & TENDER

CUBE
STEAK

USDA CHOICE PS BEEF

LOIN TIP  
STEAKS

m z n m r
DECORATED OR DESIONER

VIVA TOWELS

JUMBO
ROLL .79

*1 ri “ I »3 Itfi rsFlYST i® I j y u i i r l l  u  L r l i i l L S L s ®
ALL PURPOSE

PILLSBURT FLOUR

5-LB
BAG .89

IP  ^ 4 0

■ uG iaP irif I H I M 1 8
SNASTA - ASSCRTED

SOFT DRINKS

j t j

VI!

12-OZ
CANSV*

CREAMY OR CHUNKY THICK & RICH'

J IF  PEANUT B U n E R
ASSORTED COLORS

W HITE CLOUD BATHROOM TISSUE
SLICED, CHUNKS, or CRUSHED - IN JUICE

DEL MONTE PINEAPPLE

18-OZ
JAR

4-ROLL
PKG

*1 * *  DEL MONTE TOMATO CATSUP 
M * ' GLADIOLA POUCH MIXES_____

32-OZ
BTL *1 0 9

5 6-OZ $

15%-OZ
CAN

1 DIXIE 100 CT.

PAPER PLATES $ ]  oo
LUCKY LEAF 2 ' OZ. CAN

M I ' f il l in g  9 5 ^
CHRISTMAS

CANDY CANES q o ,
12 PKG. 0  #

LUCKY LEAF
CHERRY *̂9*
PIE FILLING 9 ]  59

PUREX

LIQUID BLEACH
1/2 GAL.

SPECIAL

59
ASSORTED

SUNBEAM COOKIES
4 / $ ]  00

PKG.

COCO-COLA 
SUNKIST ORANGE 

7-UP
$]59

6 PKG.

TEXAS - RUBY RED GRAPEFRUT

BROCCOLI
TEXAS
GREEN ONION
FARM FRESH

RED POTATOES

TEXAS

EACH

5 9 ’
.39
.19

Lemons IO forM Apples lb.79
Ocean Spray - Fresh Crisp Pascal

Cranberries>1k§%89 CelerysŜ XLK%39

G reat F o r the H olidays G ranny S m ith

D ID

FROZEN ASSORTED

BMQUET POT PIES

8-OZ
CTNS .89

IjKEEFuV
GOLDEN QUARTERS

■MPfRiALMARGARINE

1-LB
CTNS 99

FROZEN ASSORTED

EL CHARRITO DINNERS 
BISCUITS 0

^1 5-Aiive Juice

12 to 14-OZ 
PACKAGE

Frozen Breaded

Mushrooms 1 ^

8 O Z.CANS
Snow  C rop  - C h illed

16-O Z
C T N

.8 9
5  /  $ 1 0 0

$ 1 4 96 4 -O Z
C T N

Corn on the C ob P ^ G o f^

Green G ian t - Frozen

Nibblers
W eight W atchers - Frozer^
1 ^  j m | 0 | | l ^  C h id te n  Parm igiana - 9  O z V O U R  ^

W ispride - Assorted C heddar

Dover Farm s
PerdY; Luncheon - 8% O z C H O IC E

■89 Soft Cheese Spread
M erico - Assorted

rV^ Deluxe Biscuits 3 ca°n\ T
T .V . - C o lb y  or Cheddar

Whipped “Topping rû ŝ iBB Longhorn Cheese 10 -O Z
PKG

40

9 1 6  ir^STR EET O Z O N A ,T E X -
. . .  HOME OWNED ^ OPERATED

>ii>TORE flO U R 'S  
7 3 0  AM - O OO M0N-i>Ar 

Cl_'03CU SUNIWY

UNITED
SUPERS
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Tips Fo r Gardeners Womans Forum has
From The Ozona Garden 
Club by Mrs. Bailey Post program on China

Of the many traditions 
brought to this country from 
foreign lands, those of 
Christmas have survived 
best. They live today across 
the South in the celebrations 
of communities settled long 
ago. The one custom that I 
remember so well was the 
community Christmas tree in 
a church or school building 
usually. As of now, most of 
you will be having your own 
family tree and gathering.

The preparation for all of 
this is well underway I’m 
sure. Simple aromatic 
boughs of greenery from 
\our own garden to fancy 
arrangements, holiday de­
corations have never been 
more attractive. Find some­
thing that appeals to you and 
r̂y it in your own home. Pine 

;ones, seed pods, of many 
plants, such as redbud, will 
add a natural touch to the 
i^litter of commercial Christ- 
nas decorations.

Perhaps you are planning 
to give plants for gifts. 
Match the plant to the reci- 
oient when purchasing them. 
Don’t give a beginning in- 
ioor gardener a tempera- 
tiental plant, such as a 
’aidenhair fern, and don’t 
ive an expert a rubber 
I ant. For the inexperienced, 
jnsider Chinese wergreen, 

seart-leaf philodendron, san- 
scvieria, corn plant, or others 
easy to grow. Good choices

for the expert include African 
Violets, fuchsias, cacti, fid­
dle-leaf fig, and false aralia.

A delightful plant to give 
or receive is the Christmas 
cactus. Unlike poinsettias, 
which should be discarded 
once blossoms fade, the 
Christmas cactus can be 
enjoyed year-round for its 
colorful flowers during the 
holiday season, then as a 
handsome foliage plant. If 
properly cared for you may 
be rewarded again next year. 
Provided Christmas cactus 
receives bright light (not 
direct sunlight), only mini­
mum care is required to keep 
it attractive and healthy year- 
round. In fact, the plant is 
best left alone except for 
>ccasional watering and 
feeding. Water only when 
the soil becomes dry and 
fertilize monthly.

Mrs. Williams
is bridge 
club hostess

Bridal
R egistry

WILDA MARTINEZ 

DANiTA McCa rtn ey

Have Made Selections 
In Housewares 

At

South Texas 
Lum ber Co.

Mrs. Byron Williams was 
hostess for bridge at the 
Country Club Thursday.

High score went to Mrs. 
Clay Adams and second high 
to Mrs. J. B. Parker. The 
hostess won the bingo.

Others playing were Mrs. 
Bob Bailey, Mrs. Joe Bean, 
Mrs. Larry Braden, Mrs. 
John Childress, Mrs. James 
Dockery, Mrs. Jake Short, 
Mrs. Sherman Taylor, Mrs. 
C. 0 . Walker, Mrs. Evart 
White, Mrs. Charles Wil­
liams, Mrs. Jack Williams 
and Mrs. Byron Stuart.

The Ozona Womans For­
um met last week at the Civic 
Center for an interesting and 
informative program on Chi­
na, given by some Forum 
members who visited the 
country recently.

Hostesses were Mrs. Roy 
Pearson and Mrs. Allie Lock. 
They set the scene for the 
program with a refreshment 
plate of fruit compote, al­
mond cookies, China tea and 
a fortune cookie. Plate fav­
ors were miniature paper 
umbrellas with rice paper 
napkins.

Mrs. Jam es Childress, 
president, welcomed guests 
and postponed the regular 
business meeting for the pro­
gram. She introduced Mrs. 
Bill Clegg, Mrs. Bill Car- 
son, her traveling compan­
ions on the trip to China, also 
Mrs. Pleas Childress, who 
traveled with another group 
at the same time.

They made a beautiful and 
interesting exhibit with items 
they had collected on the 
trip.

Mrs. Carson gave a brief 
history of each dynasty that 
lUled the country from 
around 2000 B.C. to 1912 
A.D., then the establishment 
of the Republic of China 
through the civil war be­
tween the nationalists and 
communists, and finally the 
lifting of the Bamboo Cur­
tain.

Mrs. Clegg showed some

beautiful slides she took on 
the trip and gave an infor­
mative commentary.

Mrs. Pleas Childress 
showed some pictures which 
highlighted a side trip she 
made into one of the most 
scenic and fertile regions of 
China. After talking to some 
native Chinese people, she 
reminded the audience that 
tourists saw only what the 
government wanted them to 
see. The vast majority of the 
people are very poor and live 
frugally, she said.

The following members 
answered roll call with a 
saying from Confucious: 
Mrs. Worth Allen, Mrs. T. J. 
Bailey, Mrs. Charlie Black, 
Mrs. J. D. Brown, Mrs. Bill 
Carson, Mrs. James Chil­
dress, Mrs. Pleas Childress, 
Mrs. Hugh Childress Jr., 
Mrs. Bill Clegg, Mrs. Fred 
Hagelstein, Mrs. Brock 
Jones, Mrs. Dempster 
Jones, and Mrs. Huey In­
gram.

Also Mrs. L. D. Kirby, 
Mrs. Lowell Littleton, Mrs. 
Allie Lock, Mrs. Jess Mar- 
ley, Mrs. J. McCartney, 
Mrs. J. B. Miller, Mrs. 
Marshall Montgomery, Mrs. 
Kirby Moore, Mrs. Roy Pear­
son, Mrs. Gene Perry, Mrs. 
Arthur Phillips, Mrs. George 
Russell Jr., Mrs. C. O. 
Spencer, Mrs. W. T. Stokes, 
Mrs. C. O. Walker, Mrs. 
Rufus Ward, and a guest, 
Mrs. R. A. Harrell.

Select childrens'

O u tle ts
toys with care

h a v e
b a rg a in s

Looking for wardrobe bar­
gains?

Consider shopping at out­
let stores to save money on 
items that are close-outs, 
seconds or irregulars, advis­
es Becky Saunders, a cloth­
ing specialist.

Most are priced 25-50 per­
cent below retail price, she 
says.

Buying children’s toys for 
the upcoming holiday season 
is fun and important--but it 
may not be as easy as you 
might think, cautions Cindy 
Wilson.

“ As a guide in shopping, 
ask yourself if the toy is 
appropriate, safe and worth 
the cost,’’ she says.

“ Know the child, what 
he’s able to do and what he 
likes to do,” Wilson says. 
“This is the start to wise toy 
selection.”

Choose toys that suit the 
child’s size, age and devel­
opmental level, she contin­
ues.

“ A toy must fit the child’s

interests and abilities-not 
your own--to be a good buy,” 
she says.

Toys are poor buys if they 
are inappropriate and don’t 
interest the child, she adds.

“ In other cases, many toys 
are poor buys for other rea­
sons. Poorly made toys and 
dangerous toys are not good 
buys at any cost,” Wilson 
warns.

“ Examine each toy care­
fully for safety before you 
buy. Avoid broken or damag­
ed toys.

“ Know what toys the child 
already owns and try to know 
what other relatives plan to 
give to avoid duplications.”

r i i l i i j 'A i i  iiiiA iK ir 111
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M E N S WATER-EIESISTANT ANALOG  
QUARTZ EAY/CATE

KP109
$125

lA D IES’ QUARTZ ANALOG

^  $125
W  KC A87 

#  $95

Baker Jewelers
1 01 Ave. E J

Debra Says
By Debra Price

With the Pecan Show 
Monday and the 4-H Food 
Show Saturday, things are 
staying busy. Let me remind 
you of the Cookie Magic 
Christmas Program, Wed­
nesday, December 9, 12:00 
p.m. at the Civic Center. 
Dian Calley, Home Econo­
mist with Energas will pre­
sent the program.

In November, Crystelle 
Childress, Jackline Shack- 
lette, Marlene Clay, and I 
judged the Eldorado Food 
Show. I am including some of 
the recipes that were entered 
in the show.

PEACH BARS 
By Cody McCravey 

2 cups flour 
1 cup sugar
Vi teaspoon baking soda 
Vt teaspoon salt 
V* cup margarine 
1 cup chopped nuts
1 cup coconut
Peach jam or preserves 
Mix the flour, sugar, bak­

ing soda, salt and margarine 
until crumbly. Mix in the 
chopped nuts and coconut. 
Press half of crumb mixture 

jin the bottom of 9” xl3” pan. 
Spread with a layer of peach 
jam or preserves. Cover with 
remaining crumbs and press 
down firmly with hand or 
fork. Bake 30 minutes at 350 
degrees. Yield: 2 dozen. 
MEXICAN CASSEROLE DIP 

By Kimberly D. Williams
2 large cans Bean Dip 
Mix together: 3 avacados

&  3 tablespoons lemon juice 
Chop: Fresh green onions, 

ripe olives, tomatoes 
Mix together: 1 cup sour 

cream, ‘/j cup mayonnaise,
1 pkg. dry Taco Seasoning 

1 cup grated Longhorn 
Cheese

Spread bean dip in bottom 
of casserole dish (13’9"). In a 
separate bowl mix avacados 
and lemon juice together, 
salt and pepper to taste.

Spread avacados on top of 
bean dip. In a separate bowl 
mix sour cream, mayonnaise 
and taco seasoning. Spread 
on top of avacados. Top with 
chopped olives, green onions 
and tomatoes. Top with 
cheese. Serve with chips. 

HOTTAMALEDIP ‘ 
By-Siummi Edmlston 

3 tamales
Vi can (15 oz.) chili (no 

beans)
Vi lb. Velveeta cheese 
I  Vi tablespoons Worces­

tershire Sauce 
Mash tamales with fork, 

add chili and Worcestershire 
Sauce. Heat on low until hot. 
Add cheese. When melted 
mix well. Serve with tortil­
las.

Mix in beans, egg and green 
chilies. In 9” round cake dish 
layer 1 tortilla, scant % cup 
bean mixture and about V* 
cup Cheddar cheese. Repeat 
3 times ending with cheese. 
Microwave at 50% (Medium) 
10 to 15 minutes, or until 
heated, rotating every 3 min­
utes.

Stockman
classifieds
get results

OZONA
CHURCH OF CHRIST 

1002-11th Ozona

Sunday Morning Class 
9:45

Sunday Morning Worship 
' 10:50

Sunday Evening Worship 
6:30

Wednesday Evening Class 
7:00

KRCT Radio Every 
3rd Month

RALPH ANDERSON 
Minister

Serving Christ By 
Serving You

PINEAPPLE CHEESE BALL 
By Lindsay Johnson

16 oz. cream cheese, sof­
tened

SVi oz. can crushed pine­
apple

Vi cup finely chopped 
green pepper

2 tablespoons minced on­
ion

1 tablespoon seasoned salt
Vi cup finely chopped pe­

cans
Mix all ingredients toget­

her, reserving half of pecans. 
Shape into a ball and roll in 
remaining pecans. It should 
be made a day or two in 
advance of serving.

Calling All 
Homemakers
Brought To You By Brown Furniture

BURRITOPIE
1 package (3 oz.) cream 

cheese
1 can (17 oz.) refried beans
1 egg, slightly beaten
2 tablespoons chopped 

green chilies
4 flour tortillas, 9” diam­

eter
3 cups shredded Cheddar 

cheese
Place cream cheese in 

medium bowl. Microwave at 
50% (medium) 30 to 60 
seconds, or until softened.

Many people forget to consider a center of 
interest in other rooms besides the living room. 
It’s usually a good idea to decorate with a center 
of interest in each room.

Keep balance in your rooms by distributing the 
weight of the various elements throughout the 
room.

Be sure to provide space for movement and 
traffic.

Review locations of lamps and their uses, and 
be sure that study and close work areas have 
particularly good lighting.

Are your furnishings arranged in such a way 
that the pieces compliment each other? And, is 
the furniture in scale to the size of the room?

Don’t forget comfort, especially in chairs and 
sofas.

Look to the future. Will your children be 
entertaining in a few years, or will you have many 
overnight and out-of-town guests? If so, think of 
furnishing for these needs as well as for the 
immediate situations.

We are anxious, willing and able to help you 
with all your room planning in every possible 
way, and we have a wonderful display of 
furniture. Stop in for complete help at Brown 
Furniture.

M

Sunday
Psalms
84:1-12

Monday
Psalms
86: 1-10

Tuesday
Isaiah
61:1-4

Wednesday
Mark

10:17-27

Thursday
Matthew
25:31-46

Friday
Matthew

9:9-13

Saturday
Leviticus
25:8-17

Maggie and June worked all morning 
making their snowman. He got so big that 
they had to fetch a stool and stand on tiptoe 
to make his arms and to cinder-buttpn him. 
The mailman helped put on his head.

Sometimes life is like that snowman — 
grand and glittering with all the things we 
have. Then the hot winds of disaster blow, 
and their importance vanishes and we are 
left with emptiness.

When they napped that afternoon, the 
sun shone hot and bright, and the south 
wind blew. When they woke, their snowy 
pal had dwindled and his cinder face cried 
dirty streaks. Sadly they turned away.

What makes life meaningful? If posses­
sions can’t make us happy, what can?

Our churches have the answer. 
Through worship and prayer they teach us 
to find the joys of spirit.

Copyright 1981 Keister Advertising Service 
P.O. Box 8024. Charlottesville. Virginia 22906 Scriptures se lected by T he  A m erican  B ible Society

This series o f ads is being published and sponsored  by the Ozona  
business firms in the interest o f a stronger com m unity.

Brown Furniture 

L-B  Motor Co., Inc. 

Ozona Butane Co. 

Jim ’s Foodw ay

Ozona TV  System  

Ozona National Bank  

South Texas Lm br. Co. 

White’s Auto

Ozona Stockman
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THORNTON’S SUPERMARKET

l i l b V e  p r o u d
to  g ive  y o u  mcMre!

S H U R F R E S H

LARGE EGGS
c

L I M I T  4  D O Z .  m  M  D O Z .79

DEL MONTE
CRUSH, CHUNK, SLICED

PINEAPPLE
IN J U I C E __________

15V4 0Z.
CAN

THRIFT KING

TOMATOES 4 9 *
SKINNERS MEDIUM OR WIDE EGG m  A  .

NOODLES 6 9 *
s o w  M O T O R  O IL  ,

Q U A K E R  S T A T E  C A N  7 9 ^
BAMAREO

PLUM JAM r j-  8 9 *
BAMA APPLE JELLY OR GRAPE m  j | _  _

JAM OR JELLY 7 9 *
S U G A R Y  S A M  A A < f

Y A M S  3 0  o z .  8 9 ‘ ^

V A S E L I N E  D E R M A T O L O G Y

C R E A M  3  o z .

4'/i OZ. DEVILED HAM/CORNEO BEEF R o ast B e e f, _ _  _ _

U N D E R W O O D '" " : ”̂’ " « n ”
ARM&HAA/IMER

BAKING SODA
CARPET FRESH
7 ' OFF UBEL-BEAUTY BAR

CARESS

8 9
U B . 4 0  C
BOX ^  W

^  1

BATH 5 5 *  
BAR N # N #

F R E S H  D A I R Y  S P E C I A L S

G O L D  N  S W E E T

M A R G A R I N E  ^  ’
SHURFRESH BUnERMILK/SWEETMILK m

BISCUITS 6
H U N G R Y  J A C K

B I S C U I T S  1 0  C T .

3 / $ ^  0 0

,Z 5 1 0 0
iNS I

2 / » l “

C R Y S T A L  W H IT E

D E T E R G E N T 1
D E L  M O N T E

D« mcntc',̂ 1̂ _
F R U I T  

C O C K T A I L
2 0  3 / 4  O Z . 99

[ l i j i i l lM li l i iH H IH fH Itiliil

REAL
 ̂ KRAFT

MAYONNAISE

32 OZ. 
JAR

139
5 LB. BAG TEXAS RUBY RED

GRAPEFRUIT
5 LB. BAG TEXAS

ORANUESl
3 LB. BAG RED DELICIOUSi

APPLESj
YOUR CHOICE

H E A L T H  &  B E A U T Y  A I D  S A V I N G S

CENTRAL AMERICAN

BANANAS
TEXAS GREEN

CABBAGE
TEXAS

BELL PEPPERS
LONG GREEN

CUCUMBERS
CALIFORNIA GREEN SKIN

AVOCADOS

30' OFF LABEL-TOOTHPASTE

GLEEM T̂
5 OZ. CONCENTRATE, 11 OZ. LIQUID

PRELL 4 0 'OFF LABEL.................... ^TU
20' OFF REGULAR OR CONDITIONING SHAMPOO

H e a d  &  S h o u l d e r s  B1
20' OFF-SHAMPOO

H e a d  &  S h o u l d e r s  TL
V A S E L I N E  D E R M A T O L O G Y

L O T I O N  1 1  o z .

W jVe p ro u d  to  
give you m ore!

MINUTE MAID FROZEN

ORANGE
JUICE

S P E C I A L S

89
V A N  C A M P S

P O R K  N  B E A N S

S H U R F IN E

C A L I F L O W E R  i o  o z .
SWANSON DINNERS ( MEAT LOAF 99') A  A  (

S a l i s b u r y  S t e a k  . °pkg° ' 8 9
SWANSON WESTERN STYLE/CHOPPFD SIRLOIN «  ■  1 i

^  T IM E X
B a t c h e s

$ 1 H 8 8
O N L Y  I

AT PARTICIPATING STORES 
T A K E S  K EEPS

A  L IC K IN ' O N  T IC K IN ’

MASA $  
MARINA us

EKCOETERNA' ghoKWAw 
FRY PANS
10” OPEN SKILLET

$ A 9 9
REG. $11.99

WITH $5 PURCHASE
PRICES EFFECTIVE 

DEC. 7-12,1981

W E ACCEPT F A D  STAJNPS WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT PRICES EFFECTIVE DEC. 10-16 ^

T E □ F □ d
$ 0 0 $
0 0 0 0
0 0 0 0
0 0 0 ’C‘‘
0 0 0 0

îBIÎ FFILIATED FCX)DSINC.
MEMBER STORE
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Ozona High School

1982
DATE VARSITY BOYS VARSITY GIRLS JV GERLS JV BOYS

Tues., Nov. 17 
Mon., Nov. 23

Rankin Here 8:00 Rankin Here 6:30 Rankin Here 5:00 Rankin Here 5:00

Tues., Nov. 24 
Mon., Nov. 30

Rankin There 8:00 Rankin There 6:30 Rankin There 5:00 Rankin There 5:00

Tues., Dec. 1 Sonora Here 8:00 Sonora Here 6:30 Sonora Here 5:00 Sonora Here 5:00
Dec. 3-5 
Tues., Dec. 8

[Dec. 4] McCamey Here 8:00 Sonora Tournament 
Mason Here* 8:00

Sonora Tournament 
Mason Here 6:30

[Dec. 4] McCamey Here 6:30

Dec. 10-12 
Mon., Dec. 14

OZONA TOURNAMENT Iraan Tournament Iraan Tournament OZONA TOURNAMENT

Tues., Dec. 15 
Dec. 17-19

Iraan There 8:00 
Rankin Tournament

Big Lake* There 8:00 Big Lake There 6:30 Iraan There 5:00

Sat., Jan. 2 Sonora There 8:00 Sonora There 6:30 Sonora There 5:00 Sonora There 5:00
Tues., Jan. 5 Eldorado Here* 8:00 Eldorado Here 6:30* Eldorado Here 5:00 Eldorado Here 5:00
Jan. 7-9 
Mon., Jan. 11

Big Lake Tournament Eldorado Tournament Junction Tournament Junction Tourney

Tues., Jan 12 
Fri., Jan. 15 
Mon., Jan. 18

WaU Here* 8:00 Wall Here* 6:30 
Iraan There 6:30

Wall Here 5:00 
Iraan There 5:00

Wall Here 5:00

Tues., Jan. 19 Junction Here* 8:00 Junction Here 6:30* Junction Here 5:00 Junction Here 5:00
Fri., Jan. 22 
Mon., Jan. 25

Menard There* 8:00 Menard There 6:30* Menard There 5:00

Tues., Jan. 26 Mason There 8:00 * Mason There 6:30* Mason There 4:00 Mason There 5:15
Fri., Jan. 29 
Mon., Feb. 1

Big Lake Here 8:00* Big Lake Here 6:30* Big Lake Here 5:00 Big Lake Here 5:00

Tues., Feb. 2 Eldorado There 8:00* Eldorado There 6:30* Eldorado There 4:00 Eldorado There 5:15
Fri., Feb. 5 
Mon., Feb. 8 
Tues., Feb. 9

Wall There 8:00* 

McCamey There 8:00

Wall There 6:30* Wall There 4:00 Wall There 5:00 

McCamey There 6:30
Fri., Feb. 12 
Mon., Feb. 15

Junction There 8:00* Junction There 6:30* Junction There 4:00 Junction There 5:15

Tues., Feb. 16 
Tburs., Feb. 18 
Fri., Feb. 19 
Tues., Feb. 23

Menard Here 8:00*

Mason Here 8:00* 
Big Lake There 8:00*

Menard Here 6:30* Menard Here 5:00

Mason Here 6:30 
Big Lake There 6:30

FRESH. BOYS

Ft. Stockton There 5:30

[Dec. 4-5 only] Ft. Stockton Tourney

Big Lake Here 5:30

Ft. Stockton Here 5:30

Big Lake There 5:30

Ft. Stockton There 5:30

McCamey Here 6:30

Stockton Here 5:30 
McCamey There 5:00

Big Lake Here 5:30/

Big Lake There 5:30

J
*  DISTRICT GAMES

OZONA JUNIOR HIGH BASKETBALL 4-
♦

DATE OPPONENT TEAM -t ~ H ♦
Nov. 18 Mertzon, There 7G, 8G, 4:30

■ , ■ 4-
Nov. 23 Mertzon, Here 7G, 8G, 7B, 8B, 4:30 ♦
Nov. 30 Eldorado, Here 7G, 7G, 8G, 8B, 4:30 ♦
Dec. 3, 4, 5 7th Grade Tournament, Here 7G, 7B 4-
Dec. 7 Big Lake, There 7G, 7B, 8G, 8B, 4:30 4-
Dec. 14 WaU, Here 7G, 7B, 8G, 8B, 4:00 4
Dec. 17 Big Lake, Here 7G, 7B, 8G, 8B A
Jan. 4 Open
Jan. 8, 9 Sonora 8th Grade Tournament 8G, 8B W
Jan. 11 Junction, Here 7G, 7B, 8G, 8B, 4:30 4-

.  Jan. 14, 15, 16 Big Lake Tournament 7G, 7B, 8G, 8B Tk
Jan. 18 Eldorado, There 7G, 7B, 8G, 8B, 4:30 4-
Jan. 21 Sonora, Here 7G. 7B, 8G, 8B, 4
*Jan. 25 Sonora, There 7G, 7B, 8G, 8B 4
Jan. 28, 29, 30 Iraan 8th Grade Tournament 4
Feb. 1 WaU, There 7G, 7B, 8G, 8B, 4:00 4
Feb. 4, 5, 6 Dist. 9-AA Tournament in Ozona 4

★  ★ ♦ ♦ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ♦ ★ • a  ★

feekly Pick'em Sheet *
, Pick the Winner,  ̂ *

$15 .00  Jackpot I
4

OKLAHOMA STATE VS TEXAS A&M  ̂ **
PHILADELPHIA VS DALLAS ?
HOUSTON 
MIAMI 
N.Y. GIANTS 
CINCINNATI 
SAN DIEGO 
MINNESOTA 
N.Y. JETS 
SEATTLE

VS SAN FRANCISCO 
VS KANSAS CITY 
VS ST. LOUIS 
VS PITTSBURGH 
VS TAMPA BAY 
VS DETROIT 
VS CLEVELAND 
VS DENVER

n

Sponsored By These Ozona Businesses:
TIE BREAKER-PICK A SCORE

-ATLANTA VS. L.A.-

RANCH FEED & SUPPLY 
OZONA STEAK HOUSE 

BLUE RIDGE OIL & GAS 
THE BAGGETT AGENCY 
TITE BISHOP WELDING 
ELMA'S ROADSIDE GRO. 
OZONA INN OF THE WEST 

CLAYTON'S VILLAGE DRUG 
OZONA NATIONAL BANK 
EL CHATO'S RESTAURANT 
VILLAGE BARBER SHOP 
DINA'S POCO TACO 
BROWN FURNITURE 

BALL'S DAIRY KING

SOUTH TEXAS LUMBER CO. 
MAYFIELD CONSTRUCTION 
JAY MILLER CONSTRUCTION 

THORNTON'S SUPERMARKET 
JERRY'S APPLIANCE SER.
DE LA ROSA PLUMBING SER.

*t ©

CIRCLE BAR TRUCK CORRAL 
OZONA TELEVISION SYSTEM
UNITED DEPARTMENT STORE

!

NORMA'S KOUNTRY KITCHEN 
LEO CERVANTEZ EXXON

a

SIZEMORE FUNERAL HOME 
FENTON'S WATER STATION 
I 10 GULF SERVICE

Send Football Contest To: 
OZONA STOCKMAN 

BOX 370
OZONA, TEXAS 76943 

Deadline for contest is Friday
HIWAY CAFE 

MOORE OIL 
THE LINE 
B&C AUTOMOTIVE

^ 'NAME:- 
^  ADDRESS:- 
4. PHONE NO.:- 
♦

C.C. WATER DIST. 
V.F.W. POST 6109  
THORP'S LAUNDRY 
WESTERMAN DRUG 
COOKE'S MARKET 

WATSON'S 
OZONA QUICK STOP 
WHITES AUTO 
MANESS TEXACO 
L-B MOTOR

HORSE'S INN 
HAPPY HOLLOW 
KYLE KLEANERS 

7U RANCH CO. 
LILLY WELDING 
OZONA BUTANE 
SMALL FASHIONS 
SKAINS GARAGE 
NICK'S CHEVRON 
JIM'S FOODWAY
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G o v e rn o r
to  o p e n  
o il s h o w

Texas Governor William P. 
Clements, Jr., will “ throw 
the switch” to start a five 
story high oil well pumping 
unit with Christmas lights at 
the opening ceremony for the 
World Oil & Gas Show and 
Conference, to be held in 
Dallas, December 14-17, 
1981.

This was announced today 
by Martin C. Dwyer of 
Martin C. Dwyer Interna­
tional, a Division of Clapp & 
Poliak, who is General Man­
ager for the event.

“ Governor Clements, who 
is on the show’s advisory 
committee, was at one time 
an oil country salesman and 
sold pumping units. He will 
be well qualifled to start up 
the Lufkin Mark II unit, 
dubbed “ Rudolph” , at the 
entrance of the Dallas Con­
vention Center, site of the 
show and conference,” said 
Dwyer,

“The sell-out show cover­
ing space equivalent to five 
regulation size football 
fields, will feature new tech­
nology and new and improv­
ed equipment to help the 
booming petroleum industry 
cut costs, increase efficien­
cy and thus find and pro­
duce more oil.”

D an  B ean  
q u a lif ie s  
fo r  s ta te
An Ozona youth qualified 

for the Slate High School 
Rodeo Finals to be held in 
Sequin next June, when Re­
gion 11 of the Texas High 
•School Rodeo Assn, held its 
first qualifying rodeo for 
1981 at Alpine last week.

Dan Bean qualified for 
team roping by winning first 
in that event. Dan. son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Bean, is a 
student at Ozona High 
School.
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Cattle picture bullish 
despite weak prices

H M  ( i l l  l O  H h .A l t  K K W '  w h i i h  ^ i l l  w p cru U  P o o l C o m p a n x ’s SOOIh rig  «iul o f the  P im iI 
vard in  U /o n a . Cre't^ «h ie t  .lohn (  astro is h o ld in g  O ld lo u l  P usher, the  com pany m ascot. 
O th e r m em b ers  o f the crew  a re . (. lo r . .  Rav W heeK -r. V lario  M a rt in e z  and R ichard  O rti/..

Things still point to a bull­
ish outlook for cattle prices 
even though the market re­
mains weak.

“The next few weeks may 
hold the key to what cat­
tlemen can expect after the 
start of the new year,” points 
out Dr. Ed Uvacek, livestock 
marketing economist with 
the Texas Agricultural Ex­
tension Service.

Uvacek believes fed cattle 
prices will move slightly 
higher toward the end of this 
year and expects definite 
overall improvement for the 
cattle industry going into the 
new year.

His optimism for a long- 
awaited upturn in cattle pri­
ces stems from the fact that 
the number of cattle and 
calves on feed remains down 
sharply from a year ago. This 
means that supplies of fed 
beef should be quite low in 
early 1982.

Also, lower interest rates, 
some increase in disposable 
income for consumers due to 
the tax cut, and the like­
lihood of improved economic 
conditions should all help 
beef demand and conse­
quently strengthen beef pri­
ces, believes Uvacek.

Regarding cattle and 
calves in the nation’s feed- 
lots, the economist notes that 
November 1, 1981 totals
were 9 percent below year-

America to face reduced ag. 
capacity and increased costs

America will face reduced 
agricultural productive capa­
city and increased production 
costs unless the critical soil 
and water resource conser­
vation problems of the nation 
are addressed. This is the 
conclusion of a three-year 
study by the U.S. Depart­
ment of Agriculture.

The study was required by 
congress in the Soil and 
Water Resources Conserva-

Estate Settlem ent
INCLUDING THE FOLLOWING MUSEUM. 
QUALITY PERIOD PIECES;

EARLY 19TH CENTURY FRENCH “ EM­
PIRE”  SIDEBOARD WITH WALNUT 
BURLWOOD AND INLAY. BEVELED 
GLASS AND MIRRORS. MARBLE TOP 
AND ORMOLU.

FRENCH “ BUHLE” CABINET-CIRCA 1820. 
SOLID EBONY WITH INTRICATE BRONZE 
INLAY AND ORMOLU. ROSE CARRATA 
MARBLE TOP.

SOLID WALNUT AND SATINWOOD 
EARLY 19TH CENTURY FRENCH 3-PIECE 
BEDROOM SUITE INCLUDING SV2 ’ HIGH 
ARMOIRE. BEVELED MIRRORS, INTRI- 
CATE ORMOLU AND BEADING.

MID-19TH CENTURY COUNTRY FRENCH 
OAK 9-PIECE DINING ROOM SUITE.

18TH CENTURY DUTCH MARQUETRY 6- 
PIECE BEDROOM SUITE. EXQUISITE 
HAND-CUT INLAY AND VENEER. ORI­
GINAL MARBLE.

MANY OTHER BEAUTIFUL PERIOD 
PIECES.

CALL 694-0138 COLLECT [MIDLAND] 
FOR APPOINTMENT

tion Act of 1977 (RCA), 
according to Clitis Sinclair, 
Soil Conservation Service 
(SCS) district conservation­
ist for Crockett District.

Specifically, the RCA stu­
dy showed that:

One-third of America’s 
cropland is eroding faster 
than the soil can rebuild 
itself through natural proces­
ses. Unless corrective actions 
are taken, the acreage of this 
excessively eroding land will 
increase further.

Floods threaten human

life, cropland and other pro­
perty, livestock and crops in 
upstream watersheds. Great­
er damage is likely in the 
future.

Depletion of groundwater 
threatens the continuation of 
irrigated agriculture in ex­
tensive areas of the West,

Deterioration of water 
quality may limit the use of 
water for irrigation, munici­
pal and industrial supply, 
fish and wildlife habitat, and 
other purposes.

These RCA findings are

Christmas bonuses 
taxable income

Taxpayers should include 
as income on their 1981 
federal income tax returns 
rewards and bonuses paid to 
them for outstanding work, 
the Internal Revenue Service 
says.

Rewards and bonuses in­
clude prizes such as a paid 
vacation trip awarded for 
attaining sales goals. If the 
prize or award is in the form 
of goods or services, its fair 
market value is the amount 
the taxpayer must include as 
income.

If the employer chooses to 
pay the bonus or award at a 
future time, it is not taxa­
ble until made available to 
the taxpayer, the IRS says.

If an employer distributes 
at Christmas or other holi­
day times turkeys, hams, or 
other items of nominal 
worth, the value of these 
gifts is not taxable. Howev­
er, if the employer distri­
butes cash, gift certificates 
or similar items that may be 
easily exchanged for cash, 
the value of the gifts is 
taxable.

Further information is de­

tailed in Publication 525. 
“Taxable and Nontaxable In­
come.” It is obtainable free 
by calling the IRS Tax 
Forms' Information number.

based on the most intensive 
and accurate appraisal of the 
country’s nonfederal natural 
resources ever conducted, 
Sinclair reports. “ Much of 
the data came from on-site 
examination at about 200,000 
sample points across the 
United States. In Texas, 
some 14,550 sample points 
provided information for the 
national summary.”

The information gathered 
include data on land uses, 
soils, erosion, prime farm­
land, cropping sequences, 
and crop residue treatment.

Besides the SCS inventor­
ies and other USD A studies 
and evaluations, the RCA 
process drew on studies 
made by the Department of 
Commerce, Bureau of the 
Census, Fish and Wildlife 
Service, Environmental Pro­
tection Agency, Water Re­
sources Council, Bureau of 
Outdoor Recreation and ot­
hers.

© 0 © k

¥ o u p

Aero Vac Charter Service

Aero Vac Charter Service lets you set your own 
schedule. You leave when you want to leave. 
With AeroVac there are no parking or baggage 
pick-up hassles-no layovers or transfers. You 
save time and money.

For business or pleasure, fly AeroVac.

LUBBOCK-l Hr. 15 Min, EL PASO-1 Hr. 55 Min, 

SAN ANTONIO-1 Hr. 10 Min. MIDLAND-42 Min. 

DALLAS-1 Hr. 50  Min. HOUSTON-2 Hrs. 15 Min. 
RUIDOSA, N.M.-2 Hrs. 5 Min.

Call eariy to insure your reservations

392-3243 392-3619 392-3300

a
llTour Walls, your windows, 

your table, your trees, 
and your doors with 
exciting Christmas 
decorations from 

South Texas Lumber Co.
We have a limitiess assortment of 

tee decorations, table arrangementSf 
door wreaths, garlands, swags, andj 

many more.

New! Self-assembling 
Christmas Trees I

IWsif our delightful Candle Sh^p 
where a bountiful collection of 
candles awaits your selection.

South Texas 
Lumber Co.

ago levels and the lowest 
since 1974. October place­
ments also were down sub­
stantially from a year ago, 
but the decrease was not 
quite as sharp as the 17 
percent drop recorded during 
the July-September period.

“This continued decline in 
numbers of cattle placed on

High b lood
p re s s u re
in c u ra b le
In most cases high blood 

pressure is a lifelong disease 
and is usually incurable, re­
ports Dr. Mary Ann Shirer, a 
health education specialist.

“ If your doctor tells you 
your high blood pressure is 
down to normal, you aren’t 
cured. It merely means that 
since you’re taking your 
medication and have done 
the things your doctor ad­
vised, you are controlling-- 
not curing-your high blood 
pressure,” she explains.

In order to enjoy a full and 
healthy life, continue to fol­
low the doctor’s treatment 
plan, she encourages.

Shirer is with the home 
economics staff of the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Ser­
vice, The Texas A&M Uni­
versity System.

feed reflects the fact that 
feedlots are still experienc­
ing heavy losses,” says Uva­
cek. “ October breakeven 
feedlot costs for Choice fed 
steers in the Plains states 
were $74 to $75 while mar­
ket prices ranged ft-om $62 to 
$64. Feedlots have difficul­
ty operating when they’re 
losing that kind of money.” 

Fed cattle marketings for 
the first quarter of 1982 are 
projected to be 5 to 8 percent 
below the January-March 
1980 level. That means con­
tinued downward pressure 
on fed beef supplies which 
should eventually bolster the 
cattle market if the general 
economy cooperates at all.

A
SPECIAL 

CHRISTMAS 
GIFT IDEA

the personal promise ring

For a special person express­
ing special feelings with a 

special personal touch. Your 
name on one side and . . .  

that special someone's on the 
other.

Set with a sparkling diamond. 
Available in VALADIUM or 
lOK yellow gold. Order early 

to insure delivery by 
Christmas Eve.

Baker Jewelers
1008 A ve. E

Growing Communications Firm!
Now Hiring j

Full Time Mobile O perator I
Busy C on so le--E xp erien ce  H elpful ^

E xcellen t P osition  for  Right Person |
P leasant W orking C ond itions--G ood  Pay |

R otating Shift Work |
ONLY THOSE SEEKING PERMANENT POSITION NEED APPLY |

South Perm ian, Inc. I
303  Ave. E. O zona j

Interview By Appointment Only! |
Call Marie or M aryan at 392-3566 i

4̂  ' Htf.

Back
Sleep in true luxury on the most 
comfortable mattress ever made 
by Morning Glory! Back Relief 
is downy soft as a pillow on top 
because of the double foam lay­
ers and deep-puff quilting of the 
rich designer cover. Underneath 
is just the firmness your body 
needs for a good night’s rest.

And, of course, Back Relief has 
the famous Morning Glory edge 
support system that allows you 
to sleep all the way to the edge, 
giving you an estimated 25% 
more sleeping area. Come try 
this supremely comfortable mat­
tress—and get an edge on to­
morrow . . . tonight!

Brown Furniture
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The Lion^s R o a r
By the Journalism  Department O f Ozona High School

EDITOR-Erika Lee 
STAFF MEMBERSWendy 
Hood, Mel Spiller, Sue Ellen 
Black, Vicky Vargas, Gail 
Hunnicutt, Leanna Kramer, 
Jana Harris, Stacy Chapman, 
Marilyn Wester

CUBS BASKETBALL 
By-Marilyn Wester

Monday night the Ozona 
Cubs played Eldorado here. 
The seventh grade boys 
team was defeated 24 to 18. 
Coach Payne stated that 
Eldorado had a much taller 
team and the boys had 
(rouble getting rebounds. He 
said they were pretty even up 
until the last few minutes of 
the game. The highpoint 
scorer for the Cubs was 
Roger Flores with 12 points. 
Coach Hanson thought the 
boys did a good job on the 
game, but still made too 
magy errors.

"^e eighth grade boys 
ils$ played Eldorado Mon- 
viay night. They took the 
icjory with a score of 53to 

iO.l High point scorer for the 
ighth grade was Steve San- 
hqz with 18 points followed 
\v jChuy Hernandez with 12 
,)oi|its. Coach Payne said 

just about everybody on 
he; team scored. He stated 

the boys looked really 
gO||d for their first game. 
Ihdy shot 50% from the 
:lo0r. Mark Marshall and 
Chicly Hernandez controlled 
he- board all night. Coach 
Pa<ne believes the boys 
shduld show a lot of promise 
ind do fairly well the rest of 
th^ season.

The 3rd. 4th. and 5th, 
(h<lre will be a seventh grade 
tournament here in Ozona. 
Th^ eighth grade’s next 
ga^e will be December 7 in 
Big Lake. Come on out and 
support the Cubs. 
rttE BEST IN THE WEST 
By^Gail Hunnicutt

^fhe 9-AA All-district 
t e ^ s  have been announced 
!)>' aCoach Don Sessom. The 
tea^s are nominated and 
voti|d on by the coaches in 
il^^istrict.

^zona Lions on the 1st 
‘till 1 were Will Mason, a 
ji^Jor. as kicker. Also, Ernie 
B^ifrego, a senior, made the 
(c ^ i as a linebacker. Junior 
K ^ert Massey was a unani- 
r r ^ s  choice of the coaches 
a ^ h e ir  1st team choice as 
s t^ n d a r y .

i
f a o  is not slacki 
(^nccrning His prom- 
i^ s . Gen. 9:13-17

^ a n  contributes to his 
^ n  shortcomings.

■

1 Clayton's 
§ Village Drug

Lions making the 2nd team 
were Varlyn Aldridge, a sen­
ior, as quarterback, Ernie 
Borrego, again as a back. 
Santiago Lopez, a senior, as 
lineman. For defense, Tho­
mas Gries, and Mike Vellejo, 
both seniors, made the team 
as linemen. David Badillo, a 
junior, made the team as 
secondary.

Lions making Honorable 
Mention were Hector Leal, a 
senior, as a back. Honorable 
mention wide receivers were 
Robert Massey, a junior, 
Ernest Badillo, a senior, and 
r’eliz Flores, a senior. David 
i ijerina, a junior, as center. 
Ruben Perez, and Cater Vil- 
lereal, both seniors, as hon­
orable mention linemen. For 
lefense. Cater Villereal as 
iineman. Ruben Perez and 
Kelly Buckner, both seniors, 
is linebackers, and Ernest 
Badillo, a senior, as secon­
dary.

We are very proud of these 
)oys and are proud of their 
ecognition in district foot- 
mil play.
J HE NEW STUDENT 
By-Stacy Chapman

We have a new student in 
IHS named Gary Wayne 
Vhitehead. He is the son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Tom White- 
head. Gary’s dad has been 
itving and working here for 
quite a while now but the 
family has just recently 
moved here from Fredericks­
burg. Gary’s favorite color is 
ed, his favorite TV show is
Monday Night Football” . 

Mis favorite foods are pizzas 
.ind hamburgers. Like most 
teenagers, Gary’s favorite 
. ar is a Trans-Am. His 
favorite kind of music is rock 
md he really likes the group 
'Iron Maiden” . Gary’s hob­

bies are basketball, listening 
U) music, and watching TV. 
After graduating Gary wants 
to attend college in San 
Angelo at ASU.
To the Ozona Lions:

I wish to thank everyone of 
you for all of your support 
when 1 went to the National 
meet in Idaho. Although I 
really ran for North Texas 
State in my green and white 
uniform, in my heart, I was 
still running for the mighty 
Ozona Lions with my purple 
and gold uniform. The four 
pages of names wishing me 
luck made me feel great and 
sure gave me a lot of drive. 
Tears came to my eyes when 
1 read it. It made me feel so 
good. Thanks again for all of 
your support. Ya’ll are the 
greatest!

Take care and remember 
“ All things are possible 
through Christ which stren­
gthens me.”

Love you,
Kaye Thompson 

NEWS FROM THE NORTH 
By-Leanna Kramer

Janice White was born 
lune 12, 1955, in Monahans, 
lexas. She attended high 
-chool at Lompoc High 
School in California. Jan has 
Mved in three different states 
ncluding Texas, California, 

,ind Florida for 6 months. 
She graduated from North
l exas State and landed her 
i r̂st job in Ozona 2% years 
(go.

On May 8, 1980, Janice 
White was married to David 
North. Over the summer Jan 
worked on making their new

SPECIAL 
WEST TEXAS 
BARBECUE

*4.95
Every Friday

Begin serving at 6:00 p.m. 
lAJL the trimming and all you can eat

OZONA
STEAK HOUSE

OZONA INN OF THE WEST

house a home. She spent alot 
of time making new things to 
furnish their home.

Some of Jan’s hobbies are 
cooking, sewing, reading, 
and hunting. When asked 
about her future plans she 
stated, “ This summer I 
would like to start on my 
masters degree and when I 
get everything else out of the 
way I want to start a family.”

The last question asked to 
Jan was; What have you 
enjoyed most about teach­
ing? Her answer was, 
“ Working with teenagers.”

JR HIGH ACTION 
By Vicky Vargas

The seventh grade girls 
played against Eldorado for 
their first game of the year. 
Ozona was defeated by El­
dorado with a score of 22-16. 
Coach Sessom felt that the 
girls played very well for 
their first game. She stated 
that the game was a good 
learning experience.

The seventh grade girls 
also had a tournament last 
weekend. The team had to be 
divided into two groups so 
everyone would have a 
chance to play. Team A con­
sisted of: Shauna McCary, 
Peggy Knox, Kathleen Jus- 
tiss, Vicky Flores, Missy 
Ybarra, Cathy Bailey, Jenni­
fer Parks, Lisa Colen, and 
Bernice Ybarra. These girls 
played against Iraan and 
were defeated with a score of 
34-iO. Vicky Flores was high 
rebounder and high point. 
She scored 5 points. Cathy 
Bailey and Kathleen Justiss 
each made 2 points. The girls 
played Big Lake for their 
second game. Big Lake won 
with the score of 37-6. Vic­
ky Flores was again high 
point scorer with 5 points, 
she was also high rebounder. 
Peggy Knox scored 1 point.

The second group of sev­
enth grade girls played So­
nora for their first game of 
the tournament. Ozona won 
with a .score of 38-10. This 
team consisted of Diana San­
chez, Alma Gutierrez, Vicky 
Reagor, Teresa Hudler, Ca­
mille Davidson, Jena Allen, 
and Janet Diaz. Diana San­
chez was high point scorer 
with 21 points. Teresa Hud­
ler scored 7, Vicky Reagor 5, 
Alma Gutierrez 3, and Ca­
mille Davidson scored 2 po­
ints. Alma Gutierrez was 
high rebounder. This group 
played Eldorado for their 
second game. Eldorado beat 
Ozona with a score of 27-17. 
Diana Sanchez was high 
point with 9 points; Alma 
Gutierrez scored 8 points.

Eldorado won the tourna­
ment by defeating Irran. 
Coach Sessom stated, “The 
kids learned a lot and gained 
a lot of experience in these 
games.” The girls’ next 
game will be held in Big 
Lake.

The eighth grade girls 
played Eldorado last week. 
Ozona lost the game with a

score of 29-22. Coach Kemp 
stated, “ Eldorado is unde­
feated so the girls did a good 
job. Everybody did a good 
job at pressing.” Donna 
Sanchez was high point with 
10 points, Zelda Munoz 
scored 8 points, while Vanes­
sa Miller and Julie Reagor 
played a really good game. 
These girls will play Big Lake 
this week. Good Luck!

ROUNDBALL ACTION 
By-Erika Lee

The boys Varsity Basket­
ball team played on Nov. 24, 
in Rankin. The boys lost with 
a score of 68-50. High point 
scorers for the game were 
Jack Thompson with a total 
of 13 points, David Badillo 
had a total of 9 points, and 
Robert Massey and Dan 
Bean each had 7 points.

The team played against 
the Sonora Broncos on Tues­
day, Dec. 1, with a loss of 
55-46. Jack Thompson had 15 
points, Zeke Martinez, 9, 
and Dan Bean, 6.

Coach Wilson stated that 
the guys just aren’t able to 
hit their shots yet, but it will 
get better. He also said that 
they are playing pretty well 
and the hustle and attitudes 
are really good.

Last Friday night the Var­
sity also played the McCa- 
mey Badgers. High scorers 
for this game were David 
Badillo with 12 points. Jack 
Thompson with 11, Varlyn 
Aldridge with 10 and Jon 
Adams with 8. The game was 
a close one until the fourth 
quarter when the Badgers 
pushed ahead with a final 
score of 70-58.

The 51st Annual Ozona 
Tournament will be taking 
place this weekend, Decem­
ber 10-12. Teams entered are

Monday
Mixed Vegetables & Beef 
Buttered Corn 
Vegetable Salad 
Fruit Cup '
Cornbread 

Tuesday 
Pinto Beans 
Weiners 
Cabbage Salad 
Cookies 
Cornbread 

Wednesday
Beef & Noodles 
Buttered Carrots 
Vegetable Salad 
Fruit Cup 
Cornbread 

Thursday
Barbecue Beef on Bun 
Ranch Style Beans 
Vegetable Salad 
Fruit Cup 

Friday
Turkey, Dressing & Gravy 
Cranberry Sauce 
Buttered Peas 
Fruit Salad 
Applesauce Cake 
Hot Rolls

Big Lake, Stanton, Crane, 
Iraan, Sonora, Sonora JV, 
Eden, Eldorado, Wall, Junc­
tion, Ozona, and Ozona JV. 
The. Ozona JV will play 
Sonora, Thursday, at 4:45. 
The Varsity will play Junc­
tion Thursday at 8:15.

Ozonans will be furnish­
ing housing for the Eden 
players and coaches. We 
would like to remind all 
Ozona fans to be courteous 
and friendly to all teams, 
coaches, and officials.

GOOD LUCK OZONA!
^ IR L S  VARSITY 

BASKETBALL 
By-Wendy Hood

Last week the Girls J.V. 
and Varsity basketball teams 
played Sonora and won with 
a score of 48-45. The So­
nora Tournament was this 
weekend. The Varsity girls 
played the Sonora J.V. team 
Thursday night. Ozona won 
with a score of 62-39. The 
J.V. played and beat the 
Sonora Freshmen.

Friday, the Varsity girls 
played Kerrville Tivy and 
lost with a score of 32-63. 
The J.V. played Eldorado 
J.V. and lost 54-24.

Saturday the Varsity girls 
played Del Rio for third place 
in the tournament and lost 
61-40. The J.V. played Ft. 
Stockton and lost 54-29.

Eldorado beat Kerrville 
44-42 to win the tourna­
ment.

Next week the girls will be 
in the Iraan tournament 
Thursday, Friday, and Satur­
day.
GOSSIP

Hey, Wilma, the camera 
works better with the lens 
open!

How old are you Alma 
Kay?

Marina T., what happened 
in 3rd period biology?

Ricky T., found any new 
loves lately?

Santiago L., who’s the new 
girl?

Will H. and Russell W., 
have you written your book 
yet?

Hey Coach McWilliams do 
we call you “ Mr.” Coach 
Mac now?

Kissing isn’t allovved in 
third period study hall 
Deena.

Is Marla W. falling in 
love?

Hey Larry P., what’s your 
new saying?

Who is good looking, |?ril- 
liant, charming, gracious, 
lovable, honest, and well- 
mannered? You guessed it,

he "Twelve D ays 
Christmas" 

Bells

On the tenth day of Christmas. . r^our newest pair
[ 'be sparkling on

J roi
be

your tree or mantle. Reed & Bartqbs charming two- 
by-two series, inspired by the f^ e d  Christmas 

carol, now includes the 19^edition — 
"Ladies Dancing" and "Lords a-Leaping." Also 

available: the four previous annual editions, freshly 
minted and gift-boxed in pairs. 2*/2 to 3" high, 

$18.50 pr. Two more bells will be issued next year, 
completing the collection.

Baker Jewelers

an OHS senior.
Who’s Bubba?
What’s wrong with the 

freshmen class?
Rita D.L.R., who do you 

really like?
The sophomore class 

would like to wish our boys 
and girls good luck in their 
tournaments.

NICKNAMES
“ Uncle Chad”
Olivia G. and Marina T.- 

“ Living Cantu”
Teresa Lee-Diana Diction­

ary
Richard Garza-“ Goofus” 
Lydia M.-Two tall toes 
Peggy Skains-Rocky? 

THOUGHT OF THE WEEK: 
Those who gossip with you, 
gossip about you.
FISH BB
By Sue Ellen Black

The players on the Fresh­
man boys basketball team 
this year are A1 Ramirez, 
Andel Wagoner, Mike San­
chez, Mat Gutierrez, Lionel 
Munoz, Joe Marshall, John­
ny Villereal, Mario Arre­
dondo, David Ledbetter, Da­
vid Delgado and Ed Borrego. 
Their first game was in Ft. 
Stockton on November 30, 
the score was 27-46, Ft. 
Stockton.

Last Friday the Freshman 
played again in Ft. Stockton, 
but this time it was in a 
tournament. Their first game 
was against Ft. Stockton and 
Ozona won 43-34. They play­
ed Monahans in their second 
game and lost 63-48. They 
played for third place against 
Big Lake and lost 68-33.

Coach Bradshaw said that 
the boys got off to a slow 
start, but they have a good 
prospective team. Their 
schedule for the rest of the 
season is as follows:

Monday, December 14, 
Big Lake, here at 5:30.

Monday, January 11, Ft. 
Stockton, here at 5:30.

Monday, January 18, Big 
Lake, there at 5:30.

Monday, January 25, Ft. 
Stockton, there at 5:30.

Monday, February 1, Mc- 
Camey, here at 6:30.

Monday, February 8, Ft. 
Stockton, here at 5:30.

Tuesday, February 9, Mc- 
Camey, tihere at 5:00.

Monday, February 15, Big 
Lake, here at 5:30.

Thursday, February 18, 
Big Lake, there at 5:30.

It is never too late to 
start driving carefully--as 
long as you are able to 
drive, anyway.

Be 
YOUR
PHARMACIST 

PH 392-2608

The Colonel’s Pipe Shop
in San Angelo

% Southwest Plaza
W PIPES!
Accessories, Lighters 

Custom Blended Tobaccos 
Walk-in Cigar Humidor

Not Sherman Premium Cigarettes 
Imported Cigarettes 

Phone 944-3322 Mail Order Service

Hunters Ice
Resident and Non-resident

Hunting Licenses
Federal Ammunition Public Telephone

Exxon Gasoline and Oil

Ozona Quick Stop
MO at Hwy 163 South

Open
6:30 a.m. • 11:00 p.m.

7 Days a Week

This year, say Merry Christmas with a phone from GTE.
We’ve got phones that say it the old-fashioned way, phones that take the modern approach, 

and phones that stand on their own two feet (and come with their own two ears). 
What's more, you can actually take these phones home, wrap them up and put them 

under the tree. So call your local General Telephone business office.
For a gift that really communicates.

General Telephone ( H B
Mo$( aty(es: avatiabte (Ft most ar0a$: ® MAii- - jisNfv
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( RAl-1 WINNERS IN EEC \N SHOW -Pals> Hester won first place in the eral'l division in the 
annual Pecan Show , nith her squirrel atop a hollow log filled with pecans. Virginia Cotton, 
right, won second place with her pecan-decorated door broom.

Balance livestock and 
vy/ildlife on range

One of the basic princi­
ples in managing rangeland 
is to balance the number of 
animals, both livestock and 
wildlife, with the amount of 
available forage.

Balancing the number of 
ammals with forage pro­
duced calls for flexibility, 
points out Billy Reagor. 
county agent with the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Ser­
vice. Texas A&M University 
System.

In a livestock operation, 
fiexibility can be built into 
the program to help over­
come drouth situations 
where forage availability 
drops below the number of 
animals which are being 
grazed on a range area. A 
rancher can buy feed or sell 
some animals during times 
w'hen grazing is poor.

But what can be done 
about the wildlife situation? 
Law regulates the number of 
animals that can be harvest­
ed. and tradition has result­
ed in a predominant harvest

0  JE S S E  #  
. Tire Repair 

Shop
corner of Ave. 

H & 5th St. 
FULLTIMF 

ROAD SERVICE
7 a.m. to 12 p.m. 

Ph. 392-3473

of male animals, or bucks, in 
the case of white-tailed deer. 
Basically, deer and other 
large wildlife feed on vege­
tation. especially native 
plants, notes Reagor. As 
deer numbers have increased 
competition for available pre­
ferred vegetation has caused 
food supplies to deteriorate. 
This has resulted in low 
quality deer.

T a x  rig h ts  
e x p la in e d
Two free publications is­

sued by the Internal Reve­
nue Service explain federal 
tax rights and responsibil­
ities for small business own­
ers.

Publication 334, “ Tax 
Guide for Small business 
owners.

Publication 334, “ Tax 
Guide for Small Business,’’ 
goes into detail on such 
subjects as setting up a tax 
records system, determina­
tion of net income, tax cred­
its and business assets. Pub­
lication 583, “ Recordkeep­
ing for a Small Business,’’ 
explains what a small busi­
ness person needs to know to 
meet tax obligations, such as 
how to file forms and com­
pute the tax.

Taxpayers can obtain 
these free publications by 
mail, using the order form in 
the tax package.

H o o v e r
w in s
c o n te s t

Tony Hoover was the foot­
ball contest winner this 
week. This is the second time 
this season for Hoover.

He won out of a field of 65 
entries, and won without the 
tie-breaker being the decid­
ing factor.

Contest blank may be 
found on the sports page 
sponsored by Ozona mer­
chants. Everyone is invited 
to enter weekly through the 
playoffs. The jackpot pays 
$15 weekly to the winner.

G o n z a le s  
n a m e d  to  
W ho's W ho

Lit^e Gonzales of Ozona 
has been named to “ Who’s 
Who Among Students in 
American Junior Colleges,’’ 
according to an announce­
ment by John Muller, Dean 
of Student Life at Cisco 
Junior College.

Both landowners and hunt­
ers have a vital role in 
improving the food supply 
and complying with the prin­
ciple of balancing the num­
ber of grazing animals with 
forage production. Only 
through the manipulation of 
wildlife populations through 
harvest can the number of 
wildlife animals be brought 
back into balance with forage 
production. The other alter­
native of reducing numbers 
is through starvation.

During the 1981 hunting 
season, the agent advises 
landowners to consider har­
vesting surplus deer. A land- 
owner can work with hunt­
ers who have leased his 
ranch for hunting to insure 
that does are harvested. This 
will move the buck-doe ratio 
closer to the desired one- 
to-one and will reduce over­
all numbers.

As surplus deer are har­
vested. more forage will be 
available for remaining ani­
mals. I'his will improve their 
quality, there will be less 
pressure on forage plants, 
and rangeland and wildlife 
habitats will improve, con­
tends the Agent.

If the divorce and remar­
riage rate continues, there 
may be ,a generation of step­
children that may raise anot­
her generation of step-chil­
dren with very little educa­
tional help in doing so.

LUPE GONZALES
Mr. Muller commented 

that “ the thirty-seven stu­
dents of Cisco Junior Col­
lege who have been named to 
“ Who’s Who’’ represent 
some of our very finest on the 
campus.

B ook G.C. 
ro o m s in 
a d v a n c e

Members of the Civic Cen­
ter board remind residents of 
Crockett County that al­
though they encourage use of 
the center, room bookings 
must be made in advance.

Rules state that bookings 
must be made at least one 
day in advance. Due to the 
large number of bookings, 
especially during the holiday 
period, conflicts may arise 
unless advance bookings are 
made.

Rot)ms may be booked by 
calling the Civic Center at 
392-3266.

Kitty^s K orner
[Cont’d From Pg. 1]
writing 1 know not what the: 
future will bring, but I’m 
looking for a used car with no 
electrical equipment, no 
power steering and by all 
means, no computer. The 
television was just irritating, 
but the car was downright 
dangerous. The warranty 
man said the computerized 
cars are the wave of the 
future and will be fine when 
they get the bugs worked 
out. But will this happen in 
my lifetime?

Cam era 
I Accessories

I  35 MM CAMERAS 
KODAK & POLAROID 

CAMERAS 
FILM 

TRIPODS 
LENSES

CABLE RELEASES 
BULKFILMAND 

LOADERS
EMPTY CANISTERS 

CLEANING KITS 
CAMERA CASES, ETC.

Clayton’s 

iVillage Drug

Crockett County 

Care Center News

BY ANN McCa rtn ey  
DIRECTOR OF ACTIVITIES & SOCIAL CARE

Fifth Sunday services, con­
ducted by the Calvary Bap­
tist Church, was enjoyed by 
our residents at four o’clock 
on Sunday afternoon.

Dominoes on Monday 
were played by Paul Cav- 
in and Ola Mills, Maude 
Pettit, Gertrude Daniels, 
Juana Hernandez, and Ber­
tha Mills helped Grace Dor­
sey and Doris Hoffman make 
Christmas balls from medi­
cine cups, glue, and glitter. 
You will be impressed with 
the results.

Tuesday and Friday bingo 
was won by Ola Mills. Her 
gift certificate was from 
Clayton’s Village Drug. A 
dinner for two at El Chato’s 
was won this week by Maude 
Pettit and Virginia Russell 
won the monthly certificate 
from Baker Jewelers. A red 
and white throw pillow was 
this week’s second place gift 
and was won by Maggie 
Crawford.

We really missed Dorothy 
Doll this week. We told her 
not to be sick but she was 
anyway! Doris Hoffman fill­
ed in for her with the reading 
group on Wednesday.

Doris and Maria Vitela 
have asked me to remind 
everyone that we still need 
more volunteers on Thursday 
mornings in the beauty shop.

The month of December 
promises to be a busy time. 
Our first Christmas party will 
be next Friday night, Dec. 
11. with three the next week 
and two the next on our 
schedule. Our big family 
Christmas party, complete 
with Santa Claus, will be on 
the night of Dec. 17, start­
ing at 6:30. Jamie Knox and 
his band will be here to 
entertain. Cameras Two,

with Sandra Childress and 
Chris Weant will be taking 
pictures for a nominal fee 
and we may even have some 
gift itejns for sale. Every­
one is invited so we want all 
of you to come and help make 
it the biggest Christmas par­
ty ever!

Fall is one of nature’s 
greatest shows; you can 
enjoy the next few weeks 
im m ensely  if you take 
time to observe what is all 
around you.

Notice!
We now have a 

complete supply of
Impco

Carburation Systems
in stock

Plus several sixes of motor fuel tanks 
Plus, a modern, fully etiuipped garage

where we do the conversions 
All inquiries welcome

Ozona Butane Co.
Hwy. 163 S. n .  392-3013

C&S Charter Service
Now Offers

Aero Roundup
Let Us do the Job Better, Faster & Cheaper

Less than the Cost of Helicopter Service 
3 Years Experience

Call or Write C&S Charter Service
For Full Informatioa and Rates 

Concerning Charter S  Roundup Service
Box 915 Oxona, Texas 76943 392-3798

i‘.i:
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:r

'
5*:'

;r.

iv

Interest Rates Are Falling
BOTHNA TiONALL YANDLOCALL Y...
SO  NO W 'S  A  GOOD TIME FOR YOU TO

EASE 1HE SQUEEZE.:

WUH A HOME IMPROieiDIT UMN
Come in and discuss your needs with 
us today. Growing families have a way 
of outgrowing their homes.
We recognize this problem, and WE'RE 
HERETO HELP!

EQUAL HOUSING
LENDER

FIRST SAVING
c ^ n d  J lo a n  < ^ /fssocia tio ii

OF FORT STOCKTON

OZONA BRANCH-
VILLAGE SHOPPING CENTER- PH. 392-3776
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MR. AND MRS. TOMMY WILSON

iss F a to u t a n d  M r .  
l/V ilson a re  m a rr ie d
Z *
JjMiss Leslie Fatout became 
fte  bride of Mr. Tommy 
ifilson in a 4:00 p.m. cere- 
cjony November 28, in Ozona 
{United Methodist Church 
ivfith Rev. Larry Bailey, pas- 
(<Jr, officiating.
••Parents of the couple are 
j^r. and Mrs. Jerry Fatout of 
Pzona and Aubrey L. Wilson 
^  Florida.
;;The bride, given in mar- 
rjage by her father, wore a 
jtireet length dress of ivory 
panne’ velour with lace in­
e r ts .  She carried a bou- 
^ e t  of blue and white dais- 
les.

Matron of honor was Mar- 
Williams, sister of the 

fide, of Odessa. Ring-bear- 
was Chad Johnson of 

lessa.
^fDon Payne was best man,

p h o o s e  e le c tro n ic  
Ig a m e s  w ith  c a re
^  Have your child’s “ once 
^ c it in g ’’ electronic “ Mer- 

or computer football 
S^>me down with the “ no-

t'" 'o r e - a m u s e m e n t  syn - 
_ome?’’
p  Before letting more recre- 
j^ional devices end up on the 
^oset floor never to be seen 
gjr heard from again, learn to 
^ ak e  an intelligent choice as 

which games your children 
Still enjoy the longest, says 
Sinda McCormack, a family

S l k l i s t v a  
S> Since electronic ganies are 
jisually more expensive than 
J|thers, money can be wasted 
»
SEWING MACHINE 

REPAIRMAN
iW ill be in Ozona 

a t the
Inn of the West

Thurs., Dec. 10 
and

Fri., Dec. 11,
doing in home 
repairs .

All brands so call 
392-2663  now for 
appointm ent.

if games become boring to 
the child, the specialist 
notes.

Weigh the good and bad 
points, McCormack sug­
gests.

Purchasers should try out 
the game themselves to de­
termine how difficult it is and 
if the child is capable of 
beating the computer, she 
adds.

On the other hand, the 
game may be too easy, she 
warns. An electronic game 
should require skillful appli- 
caitiori for a child’s age and 
ability-otherwise very little 
challenge exists and he may 
put the toy aside.

Another point to consi­
der is if the toy is battery 
operated. If so, are these 
batteries easily changed, and 
how expensive are they? You 
may want to consider using 
an adapter, McCormack sug­
gests.

Other questions to consi­
der include: Does the game 
require one or two people?

Are the instructions easy 
to follow?

How long does the game 
last?

Are the buttons or move- 
able parts easy to operate?

Grin And Share It 
It’s not your position 

that determ ines your hap­
piness or lack of it. It’s 
your disposition.

PHONE NEWS TO THE 
OZONA STOCKMAN

Create Your Own 
Bead Necklace

Start with one, three 
or five beads on 

^ a dainty 18" 14 Kt. t 
\ Gold rope chain and add & 
\  , more at any time. i

Actual Size

3 m m  4 m m  5 m m  6 m m  7 m m

3mm 4mm 5mm 6mm 7mm
] 25 2*® 3“  4’* 5’®

14K gold chain as shown 
4 7 5 0

B o k e r Jew elers

Deer quality measured 
by age of the animal

and Perry Williams of Odes­
sa was usher.

The church was decorated 
with fall flowers and green­
ery.

Mrs. John Hignight, orga­
nist, furnished traditional 
nuptial music.

A reception followed the 
wedding at the Ozona Inn of 
the West, hosted by the 
bride’s parents and Mr. and 
Mrs. A. C. Stone. Cham­
pagne and wedding cake 
was served by the bride’s 
aunt. Ginger Johnson of 
Odessa. Around 40 guests 
attended.

The couple is at home in 
Ozona where the bridegroom 
is a teacher and coach in the 
Ozona school system and the 
bride is employed at the 
water district office.

The age of a deer is of 
interest to both the land- 
owner and the hunter. This 
interest is more than simple 
curiosity. Many things which 
measure deer quality and 
welfare are related to age.

On nearly all deer ranges 
in Texas, the food supply is 
the most critical element in 
the habitat. When deer num­
bers are not in balance with 
available food, inadequate 
nutrition is reflected in the 
herd by poor body condition, 
reduced reproductive effi­
ciency and undesirable antler 
characteristics.

The massiveness of the 
antlers, rather than the num­
ber of points usually is 
related to age but,is more 
strongly influenced by nutri­
tion. A well-fed yearling 
could be an eight-point buck, 
but a poorly fed 7-year-old 
could be a four-point. Large 
antlers at an early age reflect 
good food conditions.

The age pf a deer cannot 
be determined by replace­
ment of the front teeth 
(incisors) as it can in sheep, 
goats and cows, but age can 
be determined by replace­
ment of, and wear on, the 
jaw teeth. As a deer grows 
older, certain portions of its 
teeth, particularly the crests 
*n the jaw teeth next to the 

tongue, wear and expose 
increasing amounts of the 
lark dentine. Description of 
most age classes is based on 
the relative amount of expos­
ed dentine on the crests next 
to the tongue.

Deer have only six jaw 
teeth, although they appear 
to have many more. The 
teeth are in two distinct 
categories-the premolars, 
and the molars.

Deer are aged in fractions 
because they are born a- 
round June or July and 
usually are examined during 
the fall hunting season.

Deer managers should 
keep accurate records on all 
deer harvested to manage­
ment and levels of deer 
harvest. Without such re­
cords, any change in man­
agement cannot be evaluated 
accurately with respect to the 
impact on deer quality.

Records need not be ela­
borate. On males, antler 
characteristics can be mea­
sured using a small steel 
measuring tape. These mea­
surements should include the 
circumference of the antler at 
the base, above the burr; the 
inside spread at the widest 
point of the main beam; and 
the length of the main beam 
measured on the outside of 
the antler from base to tip.

The number of points on 
each antler should be noted.

Body weights, usually 
from field dressed (internal 
organs removed) animals, 
should be kept. Also, the sex 
should be recorded.

General body conditions 
can be recorded as good, fair 
or poor based on predeter­
mined criteria.

Finally, all animals should 
be aged. This will allow the 
deer manager to categorize 
the information by age and 
sex. The records then will 
show at a glance, for exam­
ple, what the average 
weights and antler charac­

teristics are for all bucks in 
any given age class. Even if 
some error is made in aging 
individual deer, the combin­
ed records will reflect the 
quality of young growing 
deer, mature animals that 
should be prime and older 
animals that may be declin­
ing in some quality charac­
teristic. Such accuracy is suf­
ficient for management pur­
poses.

By maintaining these and 
other records (deer density 
figures, range condition, 
livestock stocking rates, etc.) 
the deer manager can best 
determine the results of herd 
management.

Drugs and o lder Texans  
n e e d  s p e c ia l s a fe ty

Drugs and older Texans 
are a “ combination” with a 
special need for safety, re­
minds Judith Warren, a fam­
ily life education specialist­
aging.

Warren, on the home ec­
onomics staff of the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Ser­
vice, The Texas A&M Un­
iversity System, says older 
adults take 25 percent of the 
prescribed drugs sold in the 
United States, yet they make 
up only 11 percent of the 
population.

They’re at a special risk in 
the use of medicines because 
they take a higher percen­
tage of drugs than other age 
groups and because of other 
reasons, Warren notes.

Older adults take more 
drugs than other age groups 
for two reasons, Warren 
says; Partly because they 
tend to have more and longer 
illnesses and partly because 
drug therapy is the help 
usually offered by doctors- 
to physical and even social- 
pychological concerns in­
stead of other alternatives.

Other reasons older adults 
face special risk with drugs 
include possibilities of drug 
interactions and harmful re­
action, the specialist says.

Some illnesses and disor­
ders may affect the action of 
a particular drug just as 
some drugs may interact 
with each other when taken 
together.

Also, various foods and 
beverages can interact with 
drugs.

Results can include failure 
of the body to absorb vita­
mins and other nutrients 
from the food and in some 
cases failure to absorb the 
drug itself.

For example, the calcium 
in milk interferes with the 
body’s ability to absorb the 
antibiotic tetracycline.

Alcohol seems to affect 
many drugs--from aspirin to 
antihistamines.

Medications can have dif­
ferent effects on older per­
sons than they would on 
younger persons because of 
normal changes that occur in 
body weight and composi­
tion as a person gets older.

With age, the ratio of body 
fat to muscle tissue and body 
water increases. This change 
affects how much and how 
fast or slowly drugs are taken 
into the body.

Studies show that drugs 
remain four or five times 
longer in an older person’s 
body than they do in a 
younger person’s body.

Because of the special 
risks that older adults face 
with drugs, special attention 
in taking drugs is neces­
sary, Warren says.

Following the physician’s 
instructions is the first im­
portant step among many 
others, she adds.

W o rk  a n d  
re c e iv e
S.S. to o

Do you receive Social Se­
curity and want to work too?

You can earn up to $5,500 
and still draw benefits be­
fore paying taxes, says Jud­
ith L. Warren, a family life 
education specialist-aging.

That decision has been ef­
fective since Jan. 1, 1981, 
she reminds.

IT S

TAXPAYING TIME 
AGAIN

County, State and School taxes
Became Due October 1 
They May Be Paid Through

January
Before Becoming Delinquent 

2%  Discount In November 
1% Discount in December

Discount applies to County anti 

State Taxes only.

No Discount on School Taxes

TOM STOKES
Tax Assessor & Collector Crockett County

Patients receiving treat­
ment in the Crockett County 
Hospital last week were: 

Vonnie Womack*
Robert Sterling*
Michael Meyers*
Lupe Fierro*
Samuel Smith*
Artura Lara Jr.*
Stephen Calahan*
Elbert Watkins*
Grady Davis*
Louise Bunger*
Sharon Hartnett*
Marie Sherman*
Eunice Graham 
Liz Fierro 
Everett Davis 
Angelita Fierro 
Irma Galindo 
Johnny Henderson 
Walter Alexander 
Rufus Ross 
Samuel Martinez 
Althea O’Bryant 

* denotes dismissal

C h e e s e  is 
g o o d  to  
have handy

Cheese is a “ good” item 
to have on hand for a 
nutritious snack, says Dr. 
Cass Ryan-Crowe, a food and 
nutrition specialist.

Soft cheese keeps up to 
two weeks after opening if 
tightly wrapped, she says. 
Hard cheese will keep sever­
al months. Tightly wrap it, 
too.

If cheese becomes too 
hard, grate it or shred it and 
use in sauces, she adds. 
Ryan-Crowe is on the home 
economics staff of the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Ser­
vice, The Texas A&M Uni­
versity System.
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Tambunga & Sons Grocery
Open Daily

6:00 a.m. ■ 10:30 p.m.
Full line groceries, plus homemade 
burritos and tortillas.

Comer of Bisente & Santa Rosa

IVe Appreciate Your Business.

Diamond and 
14K Gold Pendant 
and Earring Set

Full Cut Diamonds 
in 14 Karat Gold Settings 

With Gift Box
Chain Included

INTRODUaNG ADVANCED
Space Phone
IN NEW 1982 r g M i n L

19” TABLE T V
D IA G O N A L

With COMPUTER SPACE COMMAND* 
4000 REMOTE CONTROL

ADVANCED SPACE PHONE Lets  you  m ake  and re c e iv e  
ca lls  th ro u g h  th is  TV w ith o u t leav ing  y o u r  easy cha ir. (N o t fo r  
c o n n e c tio n  to  pa rty  lines). S C 4000  a lso  fe a tu re s  U P /D O W N  
ch an ne l scann ing , o n -sc re en  ch a n n e l n u m b e r and tim e  
d isp lay . B u tto n s  to  a c tiva te  new  T im e  C o n tro l P ro g ram m e r 
and th e  usual Z e n ith  q u a lity  re m o te  c o n tro l fu n c tio n s .

S25 Instant 
Rebate

GENUINE
PECAN

VENEERS

MAKE & l i  
RECEIVE 
PHONE 
CALLS 
THROUGH 
THIS TV!

$25 Instant Rebates 
on most 19” System 

3 Models.
$50 on most 25’

The VAN GOGH • SN1973P ^
G e n u in e  Pecan veneers . B rushed  
N icke l-G o ld  c o lo r accen ts. C on tro l 

area dark  B ro w n  and B la ck  w ith  
b rig h t A lu m in u m  c o lo r  tr im . A u d io  
O u tp u t/E a rp h o n e  Jack. E arphone.

E le c tro n ic  P ow er S en try .

Models.

7 2 9 9 5

112 CHANNEL CAPABILITY
ALL VHF/UHF P L U S  4 2  CABLE 
CHANNELS, w ithout converter 
(except scramble(d programs).

■ PRP CIRCUIT
■ TRI-FOCUS PICTURE TUBE
■ TRIPLE-PLUS CHASSIS
■ COLOR SENTRY SYSTEM

QUARTZ-CONTROLLED 
ELECTRONIC TUNING
TIME CONTROL 
PROGRAMMER

Come in  fo ra  dem onstration! 

Ozona TV  System
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G e t  a  T e x a s  g ro w n  
Christmas tre e  this y ea r

The human race has 
its problem s, including  
you and me.

ORDER RUBBER 
FROM THE 
STOCKMAN.

STAMPS
OZONA

FOOD DIVISION WINNERS in Monday's pecan show \vere, 
left to right, lyoreiet McMullan, Janet Hill, Alice Poage,

Dennis Young and Martha Henderson. Ihe winning recipes 
mav be found in today's edition of the paper.

Winning pecan show recipes-
There were five categor­

ies in the food division of the 
Annual Crockett County Pe­
can Show held Monday at the 
Civic Center. The winning 
recipes in each category fol­
low:

PECAN PIE 
By-Janet Hill

Mix and pour into a 9” pie 
crust:

cup butter 
1 cup sugar
3 eggs, slightly beaten 
% cup white syrup 
1 cup pecans, broken
1 teaspoon vanilla 
'■'4 teaspoon salt
Bake at 350 degrees for 1 

hour.
CRANBERRY BREAD 

By-Dennis Young
2 cups fresh cranberries 

(sliced in half)
Va cup pecans (chopped) 
2 tablespoons oleo melted 

and cooled
Sift together: 2 cups flour,

1 teaspoon salt, Vi teaspoon 
soda. 1 cup plus 2 table­
spoons sugar, 1 V4 teaspoons 
baking powder.

Pour flour mixture into 
bowl. Combine 1 well beaten 
egg, 'A cup water, '/s cup 
orange juice, and oleo. Pour 
this mixture into flour mix­
ture and mix only enough to 
moisten. Add nuts and cran­
berries and stir only enough 
to barely mix all ingred­
ients together.

Grease and flour a 9x5x3” 
pan and also line bottom with 
waxed paper. Bake at 350 
degrees for 70 minutes. Cool 
10 minutes in pan on rack. 
Loosen with spatula, remove 
from pan, peel off waxed 
paper and cool.

TEXAS PECAN BARS 
By-Alice Poage 

Vi cup margarine 
Vi cup packed brown sugar
1 cup flour
Vi teaspoon baking pow­

der
V4 cup chopped pecans
2 eggs
V4 cup dark corn syrup 
'A cup brown sugar 
2 tablespoons flour 
‘/2 teaspoon salt 
1 teaspoon vanilla 
V4 cup chopped pecans 
Cream margarine and 

brown sugar, add flour, bak­
ing powder and Va cup 
i:hopped pecans, Pat mixture 
into bottom of a well greased 
9x9” pan. Bake at 350 de­
grees for 10 minutes. While 
this is baking, beat eggs until 
foamy. Add corn syrup, 
brown sugar, flour, salt and 
vanilla. Mix and pour over

crust. Sprinkle chopped pe­
cans over top. Bake at 350 
degrees for 15 minutes for 
chewy bars or 25 minutes for 
crunchier bars. Cut when 
cool. Yield: 30-35 bars.

ITALIAN CREAM CAKE 
By-Lorelei McMullan

V2 cup Crisco
1 stick oleo
2 cups sugar
1 teaspoon coconut extract
1 teaspoon butter extract
1 teaspoon soda
.1 cup buttermilk
2 cups flour
‘/2 teaspoon salt
2 cups coconut
1 cup pecans

5 eggs, separated 
Cream Crisco, oleo, sugar, 

and extracts. Add egg yolks, 
alternate dry ingredients 
with milk. Stir in coconut and 
pecans. Fold in stiffly beat­
en egg whites. Bake in 3 
layer pans at 350 degrees 25 
to 30 minutes.

Icing
1 stick oleo 
1-8 oz. cream cheese 
1 box powdered sugar (3 V2 

cups)
1 teaspoon butter extract 
1 teaspoon coconut extract 
1 cup chopped pecans 
Cream oleo and cream 

cheese, add sugar, extracts.

and pecans.
CHICKEN SALAD 

EXOTIQUE 
By-Martha Henderson

3 cups diced cooked chick­
en

1 cup halved seedless 
grapes

2 cups chopped pecans 
1 cup diced celery
1 cup diced green pepper 
V2 cup sour cream 
Add fresh lemon juice and 

a pinch of tarragon, nutmeg, 
and Beau Monde seasoning. 
Add 1 cup home-made may­
onnaise. Combine and chill. 
(1 like to use roasted pecans).

Most of the good buys 
are in the dairy dept.

For a real Texas Christ­
mas this year, be sure your 
Christmas tree is a genuine 
Texas product.

What could be more fitting 
than to find that longed-for 
western belt or pair of boots 
underneath a Texas-grown 
Christmas tree? Those gifts 
plus thousands of others will 
find their way under some 
75,000 Texas-grown Christ­
mas trees this year.

“Texas-grown Christmas 
trees offer a number of ad­
vantages,” says Dr. Mike 
Walterscheidt, forestry spec­
ialist with the Texas Agri­
cultural Extension Service, 
Texas A&M University Sys­
tem. “They are fresher, 
more fragrant and usually 
less expensive than those 
shipped in from other 
states.”

More than five million 
Christmas trees are sold in 
Texas each year, imported 
mainly from northern and 
western statds. So the 
growth potential of the Texas 
Christmas tree industry looks 
good, notes the specialist. 
Growers have planted about 
a million seedlings each of 
the past several years.

While the availability of 
Texas-grown trees continues 
to increase, most shoppers 
will likely have to go to the 
larger cities in Texas or to 
smaller communities in eas­
tern areas where most of 
them are grown, says Wal­
terscheidt.

Many Christmas tree 
farms operate on a “ choose- 
and-cut” basis in which the 
shopper selects the tree he 
wants, cuts it himself and 
takes it home. Walterscheidt 
says that this restores the

S iK "
CLOGGED PIPES, 
DRAINS, SEWERS
NOdigging NO damagi

old-fashioned idea of making 
the selection of a Christ­
mas tree an outing the entire 
family can enjoy.

Anyone interested in a 
Texas-grown Christmas tree 
can contact their county Ex­
tension agent for a listing of 
tree farms, adds the specia­
list.

“ Texas-grown trees are 
mainly Virginia pines which 
are native to the Appala­
chian area of the southeas­
tern United States,” explains 
Walterscheidt. “ These do 
best in the acid, sandy soils 
of East Texas. Another spe­
cies, the Afghan pine, is now 
being grown in central and 
western areas of Texas 
where alkaline soils and drier 
climates prevail.”

Christmas tree production 
has a lot of potential in 
Texas, but it also requires a 
lot of hard work, says Wal­
terscheidt. There are such 
regular operations as plant­
ing, weed and insect con­
trol, and twice-a-year shap­
ing during the trees’ third 
and fourth years. If all goes 
well, a grower may harvest 
up to 1,000  trees per acre in 
four years.

BROWN FURNITURE will 
be open all day Saturday 
during the month of Decem­
ber, before Christmas. 39-5tc

HEfR-Mbr

Phone 392-2344

h

iounce BOCK to 
H ea lth  ond Vigor 

the  Modern S c ien tific  Woy

TOOL VALUE BARGAIN
OrTBEHONTH OFTHEMONTH

Consumers with an eye for 
good buys won’t want to pass 
up the dairy section of their 
favorite supermarket this 
fall.

“ Most supermarkets are 
currently featuring attractive 
prices on dairy products,” 
says Dr. Bud Schwart, dairy 
marketing economist with 
the Texas Agricultural Ex­
tension Service.

Why?
Because production of dai­

ry products during the first 
half of this year is 6 per­
cent higher than during the 
same period in 1980, notes 
Schwart. Furthermore, raw 
milk production is expected 
to hit record levels this year, 
so wholesale milk prices 
should remain stable or even 
drop slightly--a benefit for 
consumers.

“ That’s not to say that 
prices of dairy products hav­
en’t gone up, because they 
have. But they have not 
increased as much as the 
average prices for all food

items,” says Schwart.
Dairy products really be­

come attractive buys when 
consumers compare their 
purchasing power over the 
past three decades, contends 
the economist.

An American worked 16 
minutes to buy a half gallon 
of milk in 1950, but today 
that same amount of work 
buys a whole gallon. Work 
time to buy a pound of 
cheese has dropped from 23 
minutes to 19 minutes dur­
ing the past 30 years, and the 
same work time now buys 
more than twice the amount 
of ice cream that it did in 
1950.

As far as consumption of 
dairy \ odpets is concerned, 
the pattern has changed 
drastically over the past 30 
years as Americans have be­
come more health and weight 
conscious, says Schwart.

Annual per capita con­
sumption of whole milk has 
dropped from 31 gallons to 
half that amount while use of 
low-fat milk has jumped from 
a glass to nine gallons. 
Americans are now eating 
yogurt at the rate of three 
pounds a year compared to 
just over an ounce 30 years 
ago. Per capita cheese con­
sumption has doubled to 18 
pounds a year.

C a U
Raul DeLaRosa  

Plumbing & Serv.

P h .  3 9 2 - 2 7 2 6  

1 2 0 6  A ve. F

QUANTITIES LIMITED

P o lle n e x

SuppKts Last

Dial
Massage
J u s t tu rn  d ia l to  ch o o se  fro m  
c o arse , f in e , w id e  a n g le  o r  
p u ls a tin g  sp ray . V a ry  in te n ­
s ity  fro m  g e n tle  to  v ig o ro u s . 
W a ll m o u n tin g . D M 1 0 9

Master
MECHANIC

While Supplies Last

n o w,M,cH 8.98
HIP-ROOF TOOL BOX
E n a m e le d -s te e l  to o l  b o x  
w /r e m o v a b le  to te  t r a y .  
P ia n o - ty p e  h in g e , s in g le  
d r a w b o l t  w /p a d lo c k  e y e .  
IS x S V ix ?  inches . M M 8 1 9  

Quantities Limited

CORNING WARE
HMk
SuppKes Last

3-PC. ■ ■ f
FRENCH WHITE I .  
COOK/SERVING SET
E le g a n t 8t fu n c tio n a l. G o e s  
fro m  fre e z e r  to  o v e n  to  ta b le . 
A ls o  id e a l  f o r  m ic r o w a v e  
o v en s . In c lu d e s  2 V4-qt. ro u n d  
c a ss ero le , co ver, 10 -in . p ie / 
q u ic h e  p la te . F l /3

Quantities Limited

South Texas Lumber Co. !

'Safety  
boots

B -966

If you don’t like safety  
shoes, it’s probably be­
cause you haven’t tried Red 
Wings. We can fit you in the 
style you like, and with com­
fort that lasts from A.M. to 
P.M. Stop in.
You’ve earned 
your Wings!

^ d W i i g l
DEALER

Putyour 
family 
in a 
perfect^ 
setting.

a custom  
made 

family 
ring.

t)artof T h P
B irthstdne
( ^ L E C T I O N

bv Iknchwork®

Frigidaire
Electri-Saver Dishwasher,The 

Perfect Gift For Mom & The Family!
TRULY A PERFECT CHRISTMAS 

GIFT FOR MOM AND THE FAMILY 

IS THE FRIGIDAIRE 
BUILT-IN OR PORTABLE 

ELECTRI-SAVER DISHWASHER. 
STOP BY YOUR WTU LOCAL 

OFFICE AND CHOOSE 
ONE FOR MOM____

Let us hand set the birth- 
stones representing each 
member of your family in a 
choice of the beautiful lOK 
or 14K gold designs shown 
here or others from our com­
plete collection.

B aker Jewelers  
1008 Ave. E

The Classic American Silver
Reed & Barton’s famous “ Holiday” giftware is now on sale at 20% off 

regular prices. Handsomely fluted in lavish silverplate, all pieces in this 
collection make memorable gifts.

The classic styling accents contemporary or traditional tablesettings . . . 
always fashionable for entertaining, and now at sparkling “ Holiday” savings!

hem Reg. Price Sale Price hem Reg. Price Sale Price
A-Epergne. 5" high $75.00 $60.00 F-Sandwich Dish, lO'A"
B-SaladDish. 15" long 60.00 48.00 long .35.00 28.00 '
C-Epergne. 5" high. G-Candy Dish, 6'h." long 25.00 20.00

with gla.ss bowl 75.00 60.00 H-Bread Tray, 11 ’/i" long .35.00 28.00
D-Water Lily Centerpiece 40.00 32.00 I-Water Lily
E-Salad Dish. 13"diam. $60.00 $48.00 Candlesticks, pr. 40.00 32.00

S 9 '

It

Baker Jewelers

Dishes come sparkling clean 
with Super-Surge Wash 
Action.

Cut up to 30% of the 
electricity used in the 
Normal Soil cycle just by 
pushing "No” on the Heated 
Dry Energy Option.

Detergent is dispensed 
automatically at the proper 
time in wash cycle thanks to 
easy-to-fill detergent 
dispensers.

WEST TEXAS UTILITIES COMPANY

A Member of The Central and South West System

Qualified Factory-Trained Servicemen Offer You The Finest In Appliance Service

i
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Card of Thanks
CARD OF THANKS

Our family would like to 
thank the G. I. Forum and 
everyone involved for the 
help and support extended 
us in our time of need. Our 
sincere thanks.

The family of
Jose R. Flores

41-ltp

THE OZONA STOCKMAN WEDNESDAY, DECEMBER 9, 1981

25 ACRES GREAT HUNT-
ING-$595 per acre. Deer, 
turkey and javelina hunting. 
5% down payment. 15 years 
financing at \2V*% simple 
interest available. Call 
734-0301 or 1-800-292-7420.

39-3tp

OLDER MODEL Straight 
stitch Singer sewing ma­
chines, cabinet and button- 
holer. Call Corner Drug 
Store, Iraan, 915/639-2221.

40-2tp

CARD OF THANKS
The family of 0. R. Blan­

ton wishes to express its 
heartfelt thanks to its many 
friends and neighbors. We 
truly appreciate all the kind­
ness and love shown upon 
the loss of our loved one. 
Thank you for the many 
beautiful flowers, cards and 
the food brought to our 
home. May God Bless each 
of you always.

Malava and Doug Blanton 
Mr. and Mrs. I. R. Blanton 
Mr. and Mrs. Tom Dav­

idson, Dree and Brittnae

REMODELING HOUSE-
Have windows, doors, storm 
doors, and fence gate for 
sale. Call 392-3679 after 5 
p.m. 41-tfc

ONL OF SANTA’S ELVES
will be available to help 
Santa’s helpers in Ozona by 
putting toys, bicycles, etc. 
together. Reasonable rates. 
Contact Jerrilyn at 392-2060. 
If no, answer, call 392-2533.

38-5tp

MAIDS WANTED Apply at 
Flying W Lodge. 19-tfc

HELP NEEDED at Hillcrest 
Motel. 2 maids needed. Good 
pay, vacation pay & Christ­
mas bonus. Contact J. B. 
Miller at 392-2641. 41-tfc

For Rent

FOR SALE "'arn . h 
business and hom«. iiorage, 
7X8 to 14X48 stock buildings 
and larger custom. Heavy 
duty steel. We deliver. 
Morgan, 3220 Sherwood 
Way, 944-8696. 34-tfc

4V AILABLE-trailer spaces, 
, 2-20 24-tfc

TRAILER SPACE FOR
RENT-204 Bias St. Call after 
3:00,392-2725. 36-tfc

USED ROYAL MANUAL 
TYPEWRITER for sale, $35. 
Phone 392-3232. 41-ltp

RESERVATIONS now being 
accepted for trailer spaces. 
Contact Tom Montgomery.

19-nc

Used Cars --------------------

NOW HIRING Nursing Aides 
and LVN’s. Apply at the 
Crockett County Care Cen­
ter. 37-tfc

FOR SALE-1980 Z28. Call 
39T-3998. 40-2tp

FOR SALE

FOR SALE-ADBA regist­
ered, American Pit Bull 
pups. Call 392-2962. 41-ltp

FOR SALE-New 14 ft. Howie 
flatbed utility trailer, with 
ramps and new spare. $1550. 
Call 392-3747. 41-ltc

FOR SALE-Matching set 
G.E. washer and dryer and 
an electric range. Phone 
392-2084. 41-ltc

FOR SALE-Christmas trees. 
All sizes. Baker Trailer Park 
#16. Ph. 392-2956. 40-2tp

PECANS FOR SALE $1.00 
Ib..̂  Phone 392-3634 or 1102 
Ave. E. 39-tfc

APPROXIMATELY 300 ft. of
Cedar, 2x4” , 8 ft. and 10 ft. 
long, 75c a foot. One 4’x6" 

.beam, 16 ft. long, 90c a foot. 
Call Mike Clayton at 
392-2737. 36-tfc

FOR SALE-Girls bicycle 
^$35,00, baby walker, $10.00; 
.Kodak Colorburst Instant 
■Camera, new. $30.00. Call 
.392-2585. 41-ltp

I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
♦

♦

I

Sporti fans
I BET 
YOU g 
DIDN’T !  
KNOW

By Jerry Lay

Of all the college foot-1 
ball teams in America,I 
which are the Top 3 inf 
going to the most post-i 
season bowl games ini 
history? They are Ala-f 
bama which has gone toi 
bowl games 34 times,! 
Texas which has played^ 
in 27 bowls, and Southern , 
Cal which has gone toi 
bowls 25 times. I

Amazingly, no runningi 
back over 30 years oldl 
has ever won the rushing| 
title in the entire history j 
of the National Footballl 
League. The oldest mani 
ever to win the NFL. 
rushing title was Marionj 
Motley of the Browns,! 
who was just 30, in 1950. ’

Of all the heavyweight! 
boxing champions of the! 
world in history, which 
one was the heaviest?! 
The heaviest heavy-! 
weight champ of them all' 
was Primo Camera whoJ 
weighed 267 pounds! 
when he won the title in’ 
1933.

1 bet you didn’t know! 
L-B Motor does car in-| 
spections when your ve­
hicle needs it. L-B Motors! 
also has parts for the! 
do-it-yourself mechanic i 
or has mechanics on duty; 
when your car needs! 
worked on. Also come by' 
and pick out a new or 
used automobile or pick-j 
up. Choose from our line' 
of new Oldsmobiles, Pon- 
tiacs, Cadillacs, Chevro-, 
lets, or Buicks. '

L-B M otor Co.

Business Services Help Wanted
For Sole

DECORATED CAKES and
cookies for special occasions. 
Call PoUy at 392-3129. 39-tfc

FOR YOUR Rinsenvac 
Cleaner come to South Texas 
Lumber Co. 30-tfc

ART WORK & SIGN
PAINTING-Lowest prices in 
town. Kevin Johnson. 
301 Rugged Road. 38-4tp

Miscellaneous
WILL TRADE

Will Trade for used Jeeps, 
Trailers or Pickups. Call or 
come by Ranch Feed & 
Supply. 804 W. llth -P h . 
392-3747. 38-tfc

EARN $4.87 HR.
We need assistance in 

evaluating and responding to 
daily work reports submitted 
by our field agents through­
out the state. No experience 
necessary. Paid training pro­
gram, work full or part- 
time at home. For informa­
tion send self-addressed, 
stamped envelope 9 ‘/2 inches 
long to AWGA. Dept. E, Box 
49204, Atlanta, GA 30359 

41-ltp

BROWN FURNITURE will 
be open all day Saturday 
during the month of Decem­
ber, before Christmas. 39-5tc

Desks, chairs, flies, safes, 
large selection. Save 20%- 
50%. Cash and carry. 9:00 to 
5:30. Monday - Friday. 
VALUE CITY. 121 W. 
Twohig-Ph. 658-5502, San 
Angelo. 15-tfc

GREAT CHRISTMAS GIFTS
Boy’s Schwinn 10-speed, Hip 
Pocket stereo cassette, 5 mm 
Benjamin pellet rifle, pellet 
pistol and BB gun. Call 
392-2434 after 5 p.m. 41-4tc

A V AILABLE- Professional 
bartender for your holiday 
parties, Dec. 18 through Jan. 
3. Call 392-2296. 41-4tc

NEEDED-at Crockett County 
Hospital, dependable nur­
ses’ aides, call Director of 
Nurses, 392-2671, or apply in 
person. 36-tfc

Long-term 
credit 
with no 
prepaym ent 
penalty.
The

Land
Bank
C/ose to the land 
and the people whd work it

y A.E. PRUGEI^ Manager 
Box 397

Sonora, Texas 769StF

HOMES
Neat, Clean, 2-br. home 
with den, covered patio & 
carport.

rfssic
Nice 3 br., 2 bath with 

central heat on large lot.
**

Large rock home with 3 
br.. 3 bath, double gar­
age and attic as extra 
rc'om.

* *
VERY NICE den and 
fireplace in this 3 br. 
home with central heat 
and air.

* *
OUT OF TOWN 
PROPERTY Barnhart- 
Two large brick buildings 
with these 7 plus acres 
and all the minerals- 
perfeet for home, yard, or 
you name it.

LOTS
Look! 5 Crazy, Cali­

che Lols-Approximately 
60,000 sq. ft. If you can 
think (U a purpose for 
them. ut>'ll reduce the 
price

ACREAGE
Want to really get 

awa\ '̂  Then buy these 42 
acres in scenic Big Bend

If you have any Real 
Estate need [buying or 
selling, large or^small], 
please contact me. 1 may 
not have all the answers, 
but 1 will certainly try to 
help you.

Thank you,
JOHNNY CHILDRESS 

1102 Ave. E 
392-3634

Steve Stewart Realtor

e

'th L

'7 '^

Loans for [very Occasion

Let Us help Complete 
your Christmas Plans!

The Full Service Bank 
in Crockett County

\

Ozona National Bank
Member of FDie

FtOCIAl Ofrosir INSUIANCf COt^ATlON

WAITRESSES NEEDED
Apply at El Chato’s or Ph. 
392-3622. 35-tfc

NEEDED-Front help. Cook 
and Dishwasher for Red Ap­
ple. Good benefits and added 
bonuses. Apply to J.B. Mil­
ler at Firestone store. 27-tfc

PART TIME HELP needed 
for front and back in the 
afternoons at Norma’s Koun- 
try Kitchen. 41-tfc

NEEDED-Mature depend­
able adult to fill dental 
assisting position. Experi­
ence considered however not 
necessary. Salary open. 
Please inquire at 1104 Ave. 1. 
Ph. 392-2575. Dr. Steve Ses- 
som. 39-tfc

JANITORS NEEDED at 
Circle Bar. Call Jack Lewis at 
392-2637. 25-tfc

GARAGE SALE

GARAGE SALE-1303 Ave.
G. Saturday 9:30 a.m. Sheets 
Curtains, Nice children’s 
clothes. Toys. 41-ltp

FOR SALE-2 bedroom house 
on large corner lot with 
trailer hook-up. Ave. I & 3rd 
St. Ph. 392-3808 27-tfc

Lost & Found
LOST-3 mo. female coon 
hound, Bluetick. Lost around 
303-13th and B or C Ave. 
Call 392-2450 or 392-2461. 
Reward. 41-ltp

I JAY MILLER I
tCONSTRUCTION COjj

General Dirt Contractor 
Oil Field Contracting

R oads, Locations, Pits 
D ozers, D um ptrucks, M ainta iners

♦

I

GARAGE SALE-King Size 
Bed, Furniture, Barbie doll­
house, toys, clothes, misc. 
702-3rd St. Wed. afternoon 
and all day Thursday. 41-ltp

Real Estate
100 ACRES ROUGH HUNT-
ING-$169 per acre. 5% down 
payment. 15 year owner fi­
nancing at 12%% simple 
interest. Call 734-0301.

39-3tp

FOR SALE-recently remod­
eled 3-br. or 2 br. with office 
or den. 2 baths, sun room, 
kitchen, living, dining and 
laundry room. Storage ga­
lore. Central heat and air. 
Established neighborhood, 
Ph. 392-2850, 608 Ave. I 

40-tfc

SEW!NG MACHINE 
SAVE

^120®® to ^200®® 
On new Necchi 

Sewing Mochine. 

Thurs., Dec. 10 
and

Fri., Dec. 11 
a t the

Inn of the West. 
Used Sewing 

Machine 
$40®® & up.

39-3tp

I •I  Airplane Service Available |  

^392-3243 Phone 392-2489^

ALL TYPES OF flfCTRICAL WORK 
DITCHING

DALE'S ELECTRIC A PLUMBING
FREE ESTIMATES 
f U l i r  IMSURID 

DAU HOBSON
Box 1464 Ph- 392-2801

JOHNNY CHILDRESS,
392-3634

HAYES
AUTO

REPAIR
Mechanic On Duty 

8 a.m.-6 p.m. 

1311 Ave. AA 

Phone 392-3224

Notice of 
REWARD

1 am offering

*500 Reward
for apprehension and convic­
tion of guilty parties to every 
theft of livestock in Crockett 
County - except that no 
officer of Crockett County 
may claim the reward.

Sheriff, Crockett Co.

Billy Mills
— ................n il..

REAL ESTATE
Homes 
Ranches 
Commercial 
Lots 
Loke Prooerties 
Appraisals

Tree Dozing, 
Raking & Tanking,

Levon Parker
Call 392-2206

TRAPPERS
Buying Pur every Tuesday in 

Oiona at the 
Quick Stop Exxon IH 10

3:30 p.m. ■ 4:00 p.m.
So. Austin Fur Co.

Steve Stewort-Reoitor

Pete W. Jacoby
Real Estate

K ay Braden-Agent
H om es-L ots-C om m ercial 

R anch Properties 
P hone 3 9 2 -3 7 4 9  or 3 9 2 -3 0 5 9  

8 0 4  W. 11th St.

Jerry's
Appliance Service

Call for Service
on All Makes and Models 

of Appliances.
Also Heating and Air Conditioning 

Repair!
We Buy Used Appliances

606 10th Ph. 392-3887
Behind Westerman Drug

JO H N STO KES
Certified

Public Accountant
P.O. BOX 1739 
OZONA, TEXAS 76943

PHONE 
915/392-3711

Fierro Brothers
M AINTAINERW O RK- DOZER WORK 

DUMP TRUCK SERVICE 
n ^ ^ 4 ^ ® ’ ACK DIRT.CALICHE 

r  RIGHT-OF-WAYS
Call

OZONA 392-2226 or 392-2597 TEXAS

Serviag Croekett County Since 1905.

Building - Remodeling - Painting 

Plumbing Repair - Electrical Repair

Cement Work - patios - Floors - Stem

Walls - Basements - Sidewalks 

Commercial or Residential 

20 Years Eiqierience

Qyde “Red” Myatt

392-2602 Ozona, Texas

John R. Jones
Real Estate

3 9 2 -2 0 2 1  3 9 2 -2 1 1 3

Elizabeth U pham -Agent

3 9 2 -2 3 3 4

(Lots-Houses-Com m ercial)

4 BEDROOM, 3 BATH HOME 
CENTRAL HEAT AND AIR.


