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Cross Plains Loses
Outstanding Citizen
Billie Ruth Loving, 83, of 

Cross Plains, entered into rest 
Saturday, April 10, 2004, at 
Hendrick Medical Center in 
Abilene after a series of illnesses.

Funeral services were held at 
2:00 p.m. Tuesday, April 13, 
2004, at Higginbotham Funeral 
Chapel with Bob Pipes 
officiating. Burial was in the 
Cross Plains Cemetery in Cross 
Plains with Higginbotham 
Funeral Home in charge of 
arrangements.

Billie Ruth was bom May 4, 
1920 in Cross Plains, Texas to Ira 
B. and Mittie Gains Loving. She 
was employed in several cities 
during her life. During World 
War II, she worked as a 
cryptographer for the War 
Department. After the war, she 
returned to Texas where she 
taught English for 35 years in 
various schools. She enjoyed 
theater and designed costumes 
for many plays during her 
teaching career. She was a 
member of Cross Plains Church 
of Christ.

After her retirement, she 
returned to Cross Plains where 
she served as librarian 
instituting a children's reading 
program. One of her proudest 
accomplishments was working 
with Project Pride in the

BILLIE RUTH LOVING

establishment of Howard Days 
honoring hometown author 
Robert E. Howard. She served as 
docent of the Howard House 
from its establishment until her 
health failed.

Survivors include two nephews, 
Ira Evers of San Antonio and 
Billy Dale Strickland of Glen 
Rose; as well as many cousins 
and a host of friends.

Pallbearers were James 
Lawrence, James Alexander, 
Larry Crockett, Keith Lawrence, 
Charles Chesshir and Terry 
Pollard. Honorary pallbearers 
were Bob Childress and Scott 
Childress.

In lieu of flowers, memorials 
may be made to the Cross Plains 
Public Library, P.O. Box 333, 
Cross Plains, Texas 76443, or 
Project Pride, P.O. Box 699, 
Cross Plains, Texas 76443.

DANA HALL TAKES 1ST & 3RD PLACE IN COOKOFF—  
Dana Hall, of Cross Plains, was a double winner in the cookoff. 
Dana was awarded a check by Fearless Fernandez.

Local Lady Wins 
Big at County Cookoff
The Callahan County Cowboy 

Roundup drew a great crowd, 
according to Baird Chamber of 
C om m erce m em bers who 
hosted the all-day event last 
Saturday.

More than 350 people a t­
tended the Deryl Dodd Con- 
cert/Dance on Market Street 
Saturday night, and there were 
16 teams with 53 entries in the 
chili/beans/brisket cookoff.

Dana Hall (Dana's Famous 
Brisket and Ribs) of Cross 
Plains was a double winner in 
the cookoff. She took first 
place in the beans category and 
third for her chili. Other winners 
in the bean cookoff included 
Lilly Barron (B&W Towing) of 
Clyde, second; and Kevin 
Hines, (KEAN 105), third 
place.

Jimmy Williams, (Double J 
Ranch) of Abilene, received the 
first place award in the chili 
cookoff. Scott Farmer, (Doh 
Boys) of Abilene, second place. 
Randy Scarborough, (R&R 
BBQ) of Abilene had the first 
place brisket. Second place 
went to G.T. Ward, (Eagle Eye 
Cookers) of Abilene; third place 
winner was Charles Alexander, 
(Alexander the Great) of Abi­
lene. Other teams were from 
Abilene, Hawley, Cisco and 
Buffalo Gap.

The Cowboy Roundup was 
sponsored by Texas Chevy 
Dealers, KEAN 105 FM Radio, 
The Baggage House Restau­
rant and Baird Motor Inn and RV 
Campground.
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WORK 
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Saturday, April 17th

&
Saturday, M ay 1st

At
B aseball F ields

We would like to ask 
EVERYONE  
to come lend 

a helping hand! I

Controlled Evening with Dennis Gaines
Joyfully Anticipated by AllBurns in 

Callahan to 
be Reported
Callahan County Commission­

ers are requesting any controlled 
burning in the county be re­
ported to proper authorities be­
fore beginning such controlled 
burns.

During the commissioners' 
court meeting held Monday, 
April 12 at the County Court­
house in Baird, Callahan County 
Judge Roger Corn reported the 
commissioners' court received 
a request from a county fire 
department chief the county 
consider placing a fine upon 
anyone who makes a controlled 
burn in Callahan County with­
out first notifying the proper 
authorities.

Judge Corn said the fire chief 
stated his department has re­
ceived several reports of grass 
fires, only to find out the call was 
a controlled burning in the 
county. The fire chief stated the 
department is wasting time and 
money answering the call, only 
to find out it was a controlled 
burn.

The fire chief asked the com­
missioners to approve a resolu­
tion making the fine a Class C 
misdemeanor if anyone has a 
controlled burn without first no­
tifying authorities. However, 
Judge Corn said the commis­
sioners' court has no authority 
to make such a fine.

Instead, the commissioners' 
court agreed to notify residents 
in the county to first call your 
local fire department before any 
controlled bum to let them know.

Other agenda items brought 
before the commissioners' court 
included;

See Controlled Burns Page 6

Local Art 
Club to Meet 
Tbesday, 
April 20tb
The Cross Plains Paint and 

Palette Club will meet at 3 p.m. 
Tuesday, April 20, at the 
Multi-Purpose Center located at 
the comer of N.E. 1st Street and 
Beech Street.

Donna Lewis, an established 
artist from the Brownwood Art 
Association, will demonstrate a 
painting in acrylic or watercolor.

Everyone is asked to bring their 
favorite snack.

Visitors are always welcome. 
For additional information call 

(254) 725-7235.

The Key Club
To Host

Powder Puff 
Football Game

Saturday 
April 17th

5:00 p.m.
At Football Field

Admission:
$3 per Adult 

$2 per student

Come & Enjoy the 
FUN!!

Big entertainment is coming 
to our little community this 
week. Friday, April 16 in fact. 
Award winning Cowboy Poet/ 
Storyteller Dennis Gaines will be 
performing at 7:30 p.m. in the 
Family Life Center of the First 
Baptist Church. Gaines is being 
sponsored by the Public Library 
as a major fund-raiser event.

Home-made chili will be avail­
able starting at 6:00 p.m. until 
show-time. Cost for the supper is 
whatever you feel led to donate; 
the show cost is $7.00 for adults 
and $4.00 for ages 12 and under. 
Cake and coffee will be 
available for purchase during 
the intermission.

Other "attractions" throughout 
the evening will be a raffle for 
various western items and the 
funny fund-raising antics of the 
likes of Coach Atchley, Rolan 
Jones, Greg Turner or Tony 
Wyatt. You REALLY MUST 
SEE what part these community 
minded guys play in one of 
Gaines' poems.

Gaines has led an eventful life to 
say the least. From the oilfields of 
the world to ranches of the West, 
he absorbed the experiences 
and treasured the memories. 
Encouraged by friends to enter 
the entertainment business, he 
soon found himself "throwin" a 
big loop around this writin' and 
recitin' business". Through it all, 
he has tried to preserve some of 
what is good about cowboy 
culture and its heritage, with an 
emphasis on humor, tradition and 
perhaps even a little bit of nostal­
gia.

DENNIS GAINES
None can dispute the feelings he 

evokes in "The Centaur's Better 
H alf when he writes, "What man 
of heart and soul could see a horse 
and then deny/The existence of a 
God who gave us birth/Atheists 
and skeptics may declare it all a 
line/ But I've found a piece of 
Heaven here on Earth."

The Friends of the Library are 
extremely grateful for the follow­
ing businesses who have helped 
sponsor Gaines' appearance: 
Lawrence Farm and Ranch, Jones 
Real Estate, Conway's Bitter

Creek Ranch, Texas Heritage 
Bank, Cross Plains Review, 
Cross Plains Veterinary Clinic, 
Cross Plains Frozen Food 
Locker, Jean's Feed Barn, 
'Tween Peaks, C&C Handyman 
Services, Tim's Roral and Gifts, 
Greenwood Insurance Agency, 
Village Market and Sam's, as well 
as the First Baptist Church.

So ya'll come on out for an 
evenin' of entertainment and 
laughter while supporting the 
efforts of the Cross Plains Public 
Library.

Trail R ide 
Postponed  
Club to Meet 
April 26th

The Cross Plains Roping Club 
has postponed plans for a trail 
ride until further notice.

The club will be meeting 
Monday, April 26, at 7 p.m. at the 
local arena. All members and 
perspective members are 
encouraged to attend.

Texas 
Heritage 

Bank
^ H e r i

P p | l
"We're Proud of Ouf Local Heritage"
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M ake Your M other’s Day Gift Very Special

Mother’s Day 
Cancellation

Presents:
" What's Inside"

Are you looking for something 
that is extra special for your mom 
on Mother’s Day? The U.S. Post 
Office at Cross Plains may have 
just what you are looking for.

On Friday, April 30th, they will 
be having a special cancellation 
just for Mother’s Day. Stop by 
on Friday the 30th and have your 
M other’s Day card, letter, or 
present cancelled with this special 
cancellation. Not only will your 
mom be getting a card from you, 
she will also be getting a

wonderful collectors item. Cross 
Plains is one of a very few select 
offices that will be having this 
special cancellation.

Come by the Post Office and 
take a look at the many gift items 
available (each item is a collec­
tors item) including key chains, 
lapel pins (just for mom) and 
some really cute “I Love You” 
bears. Go by and see what they 
have to offer.
They don’t just sell stamps!
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Concerned Christians 
for America to Meet 
Thursday, April 15th

Concerned C hristians For 
America will be meeting Thurs­
day evening, April 15th at 7 p.m. 
in the new sanctuary of New 
Beginnings Church, at the comer 
of Belle Plain and Cordell. Use 
the Cordell Street entrance. This 
is non-denominational and non­
political.

If you would be interested in 
participating in "The God and 
Country March", April 24th at 6 
p.m. You can go buy the Word

FREE (3) Band Concert 
Set for Coleman April 17
This Saturday night, April 17, at 

6:00 p.m. and Open Air Concert 
will be staged at 200 Liveoak, just 
west of the Courthouse. In case of 
rain, the concert will be moved to 
the building next door.

The Three Band Concert will 
feature Kevin Max of DC Talk 
and the entire band is coming to 
Coleman for another FREE con­
cert. That's right! Over nine 
million records sold and a four

time Grammy Award winner.
Kevin Max will be in Coleman 

on Saturday, April 17th. Can you 
believe it

Opening bands include This 
Holiday Life out of San Diego 
and Avenue out of San Angelo.

No charge! Bring your friends 
and lawn chairs. For information 
to make reservations, all today 
(325) 625-2223.

Cross Plains Review April 15 ,200^

O bituaries

Shoppe at 901 CC Woodson in 
Living Word Church, Early 
Blooms and More at 401 Early 
Blvd. in Early, or the Bible Book 
Store at 410 Center, downtown 
Brownwood.

The March will gather for line 
up in front of the Coliseum at 5 
p.m. on Saturday, April 24,2004. 
For more information, please call 
Jim or Pauline Holloway at 641- 
1301.

William Todd Patton
Todd Patton, age 51, of San 

Francisco, California, passed 
away Monday, December 29, 
2003, at the Los Angelos VA 
Medical Center. A memorial was 
held April 7,2004 at Pioneer Bap­
tist Church with Dwaine Clower 
officiating. His final resting 
place is in Riverside National 
Cemetery, Los Angeles, 
California.

Bom August 5, 1952 to Mat­
thew R. Patton and Virginia 
Nadine Patton. Todd lost his par­
ents young and was raised by his 
grandparents, George and Eunice 
Pointer, in Corpus Christi.

Growing up he loved Little 
League Baseball, archery and 
surfing at Port Aransas. He joined 
the Cub Scouts and earned the 
coveted Eagle Scout badge. Todd 
graduated from King High 
School in Corpus and then joined 
the U.S. Marines. He made Ser­
geant and was honorably dis­
charged in 1976.

Much of his working days were 
in the field of oil engineering and 
production. He also loved the 
mountains of Montana and the 
vastness of Wyoming. He was 
employed as a hunting guide, 
ranch hand and fur trapper. 
Living in the mountains and off 
the land brought him peace.

Survivors include his two 
daughters, Brandi Burks of 
Arkansas and Allison Erwin of 
Austin; two grandsons; his 
grandmother, Eunice Pointer of 
Cross Plains; a sister, Kandy 
Jones of Cross Plains; great 
uncles, Wesley Horton and 
Albert Horton; and several 
cousins.

In Todd's journal he wrote:

Stop Christian passerby.
Child of God,
Beneath this ground a soul 
does fly

Patton Todd

For 30 years I felt no grace 
Suffering life, this earthly face 
Mercy praised, forgiven death 
Rest in peace, silent breath.

Pet Clinic 
at Lake 
Brownwood 
Fire Station
There will be a Pet Clinic at the 

Fire Station at Harbor Point at 
North Lake Brownwood Satur­
day, April 17th from 2-4 p.m. 
This is sponsored by the 
Sparkettes.

At

Carbon Christ Center
7u[[ §osjf)e[

Hwy 6 at blinking light Carbon, Texas

S ing ing  E van g list 
Group Tfossie

‘“ifands ofTaitd” %o(JiQers

Friday, April 16th - 18th 
7:00 p.m.

C ourthouse  N ew s

Billy Glen Whitehead
Billy Qlen Whitehead, 74, of 

Cisco, passed away Friday, April 
9, 2004, in Eastland Healthcare 
Center. Funeral services were 
held at 2 p.m. Monday at Bible 
Baptist Church, officiated by the 
Reverend George Malis. Burial 
was in Cottonwood Cemetery, 
directed by Kimbrough Funeral 
Home.

Mr. Whitehead was bom in 
Amarillo to Sterling Glen and 
Frances (Coats) Whitehead on 
October 3,1929. He served in the 
U.S. Army and married Charlsie 
Ingram on September 23,1950 in 
Cottonwood. He worked for 
Bankers Life and Casualty and 
was a member of Bible Baptist 
Church.

Survivors include his wife, 
Charlsie Whitehead of Cisco; 
daughter, Brenda Robinson and 
husband John, of Fort Worth; 
son, Buford Glen Whitehead of 
Fort Stockton; brothers, George 
Whitehead and wife, Flo Jean, of 
Oklahoma, Benny Whitehead 
and wife. Ginger, of Palestine, 
Jerry W hitehead and wife, 
Shirley, of Fort Worth; sisters, 
June Retcher and husband, 
Robert, of Lubbock, Ada Smith 
of Irving, Janie Smith and 
husband, David, of Plano, Susie 
Adams and husband. Sonny, of 
Hobbs, New Mexico; ten 
grandchildren; and seven great­
grandchildren.

He was preceded in death by his 
son, Bryan Lee Whitehead, and 
daughter-in-law, Debra White- 
head.

Gerald D. Bailey
Gerald D. Bailey, 74, of Rising 

Star, passes away Monday, April 
12, 2004, in Eastland.
Funeral services were held at 2 

p.m. Wednesday, April 14,2004, 
at the Higginbotham Funeral 
Chapel with Terry Simmons 
officiating. Burial was in the 
Blake Cemetery in Brown 
County, Texas with 
Higginbotham Funeral of 
Rising Star in charge.

Gerald was bom November 1, 
1929 in Brown County, Texas to 
James Allison Bailey and Eura 
Dee (Suddereth) Bailey. He 
married Martha Jo Guynes in 
June 30, 1951 in Union Grove 
Baptist Church.

Survivors include his wife, 
Martha Jo Bailey of Rising Star; 
his three sons, Richard Bailey of 
Oracle, Arizona, Russell Bailey 
and his wife, Cindy of Carrollton, 
and Jerry Don Bailey of Rising 
Star; a daughter, Jackie Holden 
of Abilene; a brother, Travis 
Bailey and his wife, VonDell 
Bailey of Cross Plains; five 
grandchildren, Chris Bailey, 
Leanna Bailey, Randy Strain, 
Jeremy Bailey, and Latisha 
Nguyen; five great-grandchil­
dren, Phillip Bailey, Isaac Bailey, 
Abby Bailey, Lexi Strain, and 
Kendell Strain.

He was preceded in death by his 
parents and a brother, Wayne 
Bailey.

Pallbearers were Josh Strain, 
Jeremy Bailey, Robby Bailey, 
Larry Bates and Nathan Edwards.
_________■ » > •

Subscribe To The 
Cross Plains Review

COUNTY COURT 
Roger Corn, presiding

Misdemeanor Minutes

Adam V. Foix, motion to re­
voke probation granted.

Mickey Ivey, plea of guilty to 
theft by check, $50 fine, $215 
court costs, $76.59 restitution.

Billy Joe Jones, plea of guilty 
to assault, 1 year probation, 
$400 fine, $293 court costs.

Mandy Jo  Kidd, plea of guilty 
to driving while intoxicated 
(DWI) - 1st, 10 days in jail, 
$100 fine, $243 court costs.

Vickie John, plea of guilty to 
theft by check, $50 fine, $215 
court costs, $100.57 restitu­
tion.

Shamar Hawkins, motion to 
withdraw as counsel granted.

Marriage Licenses

Rodney Wray Offield and An­
gela Marie Walsh, both of Clyde.

Matthew Harold Deel and Ali­
cia Michele Hafner, both of 
Clyde.

42nd DISTRICT COURT 
John Weeks, presiding

Civil Filings

Jeremy Scott McGhee and 
Kendra Mishea McGhee, di­
vorce.

Civil Minutes

Martin Clay Dilno and Rebecca

Denton Valley 
School
Reunion set in 
Clyde April 24
The Annual Denton Valley 

School Reunion will be held Sat­
urday, April 24, 2004 at the 
Clyde Intermediate School in 
Clyde. The school is located on 
Farm Road 1707 (Hays Road), 
take the #299 exit pffjnterstate 
20.

The business meeting will be 
held at 11:00 a.m., with lunch 
being served at 12:00 noon. 
Please come and enjoy tall tales 
and good memories.

For more information call 
Frances (Gibson) Mabb at 325- 
893-5992  or Louise 
(McCormick) Jones at 325-839- 
5906.

Lee Dilno, divorce granted.
Tiffany Mae Soliz and Jason 

Michael Soliz, divorce granted.
Shayne Fomby and Melanie 

Fomby, divorce granted.
Fred Childers and Jessie  

Childers, divorce granted.
Deborah Kirsten Phillips and 

David Wayne Phillips, divorce 
granted.

The State of Texas vs. 1995 
Eagle Vision, 4 dr, 

Texas LP# W60-PFB, 
VIN #2E3HD56F2SH619269, 
default judgment granted.

Thomas Charles Bearden, or­
der of dismissal with prejudice 
granted.

Anetta Lambert and Robert 
Mac Lambert, divorce granted.

Criminal Minutes

Robert R. Floyd, plea of guilty 
to forgery, 1 year in prison, 
$266 court costs.
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He Is Risen!
FIRST UNITED M ETHODIST CHURCH

Van Service Available - Call (254) 725-7694^
N. Main (Hwy. 206)
Cross Plains, Texas 
Sunday School - 9:30 a.m. 
Worship -10:45 a.m.
Rev. C. Michael Redd, Pastor

Sunday’s Sermon

“Don’t Doubt But Believe”
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P i o n e e r  N e w s

! Our quilting went well this 
week. We did get Lou's quilt out. 
It is so beautiful. Maybe you will 
be able to see it at our next quilt 
show. We are working on Lessie's 
"Wedding Ring"—it is coming 
along. May's top, that belongs to 
Karen Richey, is in the frame. 

, This week we will put in Sandy's 
top. One out, then one in. There 
wasn't as many present to quilt 
and we missed those who couldn't 
come. We still had a great day!

Last Tuesday night Cowan and 
Laverne attended the Gospel 
meeting in De Leon. David Har- 

. ris, minister at 4th and Stewart 
congregation in Brownwood, 
was preaching. He brought a 
great lesson on the Kingdom. 
Cowan and Laveme's daughter, 
Wanetta, visited with them Fri­
day afternoon. Glenda Phillips 
and Laverne took in some garage 
sales in Cross Plains, had lunch at 
Jean's Feed Bam, and then did a

• little shopping last Saturday 
; before going home.

Logan Phillips visited Glenda
- last Thursday afternoon. Krista
- had a track meet at Cross Plains. 

She ran the 400 m and 800 m
• races. When Laverne and Glenda 
' got in from Cross Plains last Sat­

urday, Krista and Emily Harris

were at her house jumping on the 
trampoline. They really have a lot 
of energy and fun. We are so 
thankful for all the rain we have 
had lately. Everything is so pretty 
and green.

There should be a "domino 
party" at the Community Center 
this Thursday evening. Come on 
out for some fun and food. Every­
one always has a good time.

We have had our April cool 
spell. Hopefully frost will stay 
away. The wheat is beginning to 
head, the peaches have formed 
and some have their gardens 
growing; therefore, we do not 
need the frost. We always like the 
rain we get. The side of the roads 
are so pretty! The roads around 
Pioneer have an abundance of 
paint bmshes with a few bluebon­
nets. The road from Cross Plains 
to Rising Star has a lot of 
bluebonnets with some paint 
bmshes. Take a ride around the 
countryside. You will think it is 
worth it.

Word of Wisdom: For God so 
loved the world that He gave 
His one and only Son, that who 
ever believes in Him shall not 
perish but have eternal life. 
John 3:16

L ib r a r y  N o t e s
Check It Out!

.  ̂ From The Bookworm (April 12)
This is such a sad time for me as 

‘ my dear, dear friend, Billie Ruth, 
will no longer play h(de 'n seek 

' with me among the books. But I 
will still feel her presence when 
the LAP kids come in to giggle 

; and learn, when the older kids 
' /  come in to search for knowledge 

and when adults come in to do all 
the things adults do in our library. 
If I had a hat, it would be 
doffed to her dedication and 
love.

: Apri l  5-9 
Statistics 

Circulation:
f  Books ' 63
 ̂ " Lap 44

, Internet Users 25
Total 132

Memorials:
Frances Galloway - In Memory 

of Maurine Barr Russell 
Donations:
Mr. and Mrs. H.R. Stambaugh 
Donations - Books:
Bobby Hinkle

Library Activity Report 
April 5-9

Patrons: 92
A.M. (Lap +  11 children) 39 
P.M. 51

92
After 5 p.m. 3
Programs: 34
Copies: 68
Reference: 28
Check In/Out 59

Includes Lap - 44 
Calls In: 6
Internet Users: 25

D I A B E T I C S
Tired of jumping 
through hoops to 
get your diabetic 
supplies?

Have your diabetic 
supplies delivered to 
your door at little or 
NO COSTI

Call P riority  M edical Supply, LLC
“Y our com plete satisfaction is our priority!”

1-866-660-1718
Medicare and private insurance welcome. Sorry, HMO’s not accepted.
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Located inside Skinny’s |

(254) 725-7161 J

2 Medium 
2 Toppings 
$12.99 +  tax

BREAKIHRU
By Bob Pipes

Cross Plains Church of Christ
433 N. Main

(254) 725-6117

Somewhere today, someone is having great difficulty — many 
are! A loved one has just died, a child is very sick, a disaster has 
stmek, a soul is dying without hope — and the list goes on. We 
are not aware of who it is necessarily. We have not met most of 
them since they are far removed from us. We hear, read or see the 
news, and though we might not know them, we can hurt with 
them. That’s compassion; that’s sympathy. Sometimes we can even 
empathize.

Jesus said that to help those in need is to help Him, and that in 
judgement, a lot is going to depend upon what we did or did not 
do for others, Matthew 25:31-46. Let’s be more aware of those 
who are around us who are lonely, hurting, undergoing 
difficulties.

We encourage you to share with us in all the times of Bible 
study and worship as we meet together. We really do care about 
you!

Sunday Morning Bible Class..9:45a.m. Sunday Evening Worship....6:00p.m.
Sunday Morning. Worship....10:45a.m. Wed. Evening Bible Study...7:00p.m.

Friends & Neighbors Caring In Jesus
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B y W allace B ennett

Annual Historical Associa­
tion Meeting May 1st

The annual Cottonwood 
Historical Association meeting 
is scheduled for Saturday, May 
1st. This meeting provides 
former and current residents an 
opportunity to enjoy 
Cottonwood's past and present 
together. All former residents, 
their children, grandchildren and 
friends are invited and urged to 
attend the meeting.

Herman Weaver will preside 
over the annual business meeting 
that will take place at 10 a.m. Matt 
McGowen, pastor of Cotton­
wood Baptist Church, will give 
the invocation; Richard Purvis, of 
Abilene and former Cottonwood 
resident, will deliver the main 
speech, and Wallace Bennett will 
give the benediction and bless the 
food for the noon meal.

The Historical Association 
Board of Directors will provide 
the meat, bread and drinks and 
participants are requested to 
bring a covered dish appropriate 
to the occasion (vegetable, salad, 
or dessert).

The Historical Association 
Board of Directors has set 
Saturday, April 24, at 9 a.m. as 
clean-up day for the cemetery.

Quilting Club Re-schedules 
April Activities

The Cottonwood Quilting 
Club has re-scheduled quilt 
day for the last week in April to be 
Tuesday, April 27. Please don't 
forget.

The Cottonwood Quilting Club 
also has scheduled this coming 
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Friday, April 16, for spring 
cleaning at the Community 
Center. Volunteers are needed, 
wanted and admired. Volunteers 
are requested to report to the 
center this Friday morning with 
gloves, tools, implements and a 
happy attitude to help them get all 
gussied up for a new season of 
activities.

Fire Department to Meet 
this Thursday

The Cottonwood Fire 
Volunteers will meet Thursday, 
April 15, at 7 p.m. at the fire 
station. Members of the board are 
reminded that a board meeting 
will be held after the training 
meeting.

Strawberries Revisited
When I made remarks a couple 

weeks ago about genetic 
engineers, I meant no offense, 
if indeed, there are any. I like 
engineers, even the would-be 
kind like myself, and I love straw­
berries.

I am reminded of what a former 
Englishman of literary distinc­
tion wrote about the strawberry. 
He wrote, "Doubtless God could 
have made a better berry than the 
strawberry, but doubtless he did 
not." I have a sneaking suspicion 
it was Lord Byron, but I am not 
sure.

(Please contact W allace 
Bennett about news or personal 
items for this column at (254) 
725-7474; e-mail
csb5@airmail.net : snail mail, 
11093 Country Road 440, Cross 
Plains, Texas 76443.)
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GET ON Y O UR M ARK -G ET SET-GO!— That 
was all it took, the race was on.

1  
I 
I 
I

Coupon expires 8-31-04

1 Large, 2 Topping! 
with Bread Sticks I 

$7.99 -I- tax j
Coupon expires 8-31-04

KIDS IN ACTION—The Easter Egg Hunt hosted by The 
Rising Star Nursing Center was a blast for all who attended.

We had a huge success with a 
great turnout of parents and chil­
dren at our Easter Egg Hunt. We 
want to say a big "Thank You" to 
everyone who came. Our resi­
dents really enjoyed watching the 
kids run around picking up eggs. 
Some of our top prize winners 
were: Kalie Hamlett, Lane 
McGinn, Shayla Clay, Sierrra 
Fraley, Connor Riley and Sarah 
Osborn.

Thoughts and prayers for 
several of our residents who are in 
the hospital—J.W. Starkey,
Clara Schlittler, Eddie Petty and 
Pansy Read.

New Program!
0/0 Leasing Program

With purchase option 

Now Hiring:
Company •  0/0 • iinglei^Teami 

ôo-Cri-ORIVE www.cfidrive.com
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Q u ips , C lips &  C om m ents

B y K ay M osley

Note: Fiction or non-fiction
Judge Roy Bean was non-fiction

"The Life and Time of..."

Just who was Judge Roy Bean, 
commonly referred to as "the 
Law West of the Pecos"? And 
where did he disappear to after 
leaving his apparently self-ap­
pointed post and judgeship West 
of the Pecos?

Many people smarter in the lit­
erary field and better educated in 
the ways and secrets of the Old 
West, have speculated, guessed 
and pondered this mystery for 
centuries!

Perhaps he just sorta melted into 
the landscape there along with the 
scorpions, snakes and he was 
known to have a large crush on 
the actress Lily Langtree, perhaps 
he even named his saloon (where 
he held court) for Lily Langtree.

According to recorded history, 
he voraciously dispensed frontier 
justice with a vengeance. He 
seemingly did a great job, too. 
Nothing seems to be known about 
his past nor his future under the 
name Roy Bean. Ii has been sug­
gested that Roy Bean might not 
be his correct name. Perhaps it 
was a part of his name. I have 
come up with from which the 
name Roy Bean may have been 
contrived.

1. Beanaird or Benard
2. Beanco

3. Benad
4. McBean
5. O'Beanion
6. Naeb-Ni'
7. Bean Chovey
8. Van Beanzo'
9. Roy Be-Anderson
10. Beanvides
11. Be-Angelo or Be Angelos 

or O Beanvelos
12. Roy Van BeWildon.
There are many other names

both feasible as well as probable.
In those days it was much easier 

than now to change your name 
than in today's society of red tape.

Mayhap his name really was 
Roy Bean. He many have 
changed it to a derivative when he 
left his Lily Langtree past and 
rode away into the legendary 
western sunset to blend in with 
other into the Old West.

Maybe, a Judge Roy Bean 
would be Apa-po in Iraq right 
now— one would think his 
judgeship could be well used in 
that troubled area, in this troubled 
era.

I can imagine it now, he takes 
out his six gun, gangs on the 
counter with it and says, "Hear- 
ye, Hear-ye, this session of the 
court with Judge Roy Bean pre­
siding is now open."

After all, in his court Roy Bean 
was The Judge, The Jury and The 
Executioner. Come to think of it, 
I don't ever recall seeing him 
"What's My Line". Have you?
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Raised beds are popular be­
cause they are relatively easy to 
build, plant, weed and maintain 
since the soil can drain sooner and 
warm up faster in the spring. They 
enable you to plant earlier in the 
season. You can have a garden in 
permanent or temporary beds.

Use rot-resistant materials. 
Beds need to be at least one foot 
deep, no more than three to four 
feet wide, and as long as you

would like. If the beds are wider 
its harder to reach the center to 
weed, water and fertilize.

If building the beds on soil, 
improve drainage by spading the 
soil in the bottom of the bed. 
Then fill the bed to the top with a 
mixture of compost and topsoil. 
Plant your favorite vegetables at 
the proper time for your area, and 
try not to compact the soil by 
Walking on it.

SENIOR CITIZENS 
MENU

APRIL 19-23
MONDAY - Spagetti w/Meat 
Sauce, Tossed Salad, Italian 
Blend Vegetables, Pears, Garlic 
Bread, Milk
TUESDAY - Smothered 
Chicken, Buttered Carrots, 
Mashed Potatoes, Peanut Butter 
Chews, Bread, Milk 
WEDNESDAY - Meatloaf, Lima

Beans, Beets w/Orange Suace, 
Cherry Gelatin, Combread, Milk 
THURSDAY - Teriyaki 
Chicken, Stir fry Vegetables, 
Rice, Brownie, Bread, Milk 
FRIDAY - Beef Stew, Tossed 
Salad, Mixed Fruit, Vanilla 
Pudding, Crackers, Milk

V I A G R A ®  D I E T  P I U S

Everyone enjoyed Thursdays 
sing-a-long with our regular sing­
ers, Jacque Childress, Marguerite 
Ransdell, Gail Ransdell, Frank 
O'Banion and Frankie Smith. We 
had a special guest, Jerry Walker, 
who came and played his guitar. 
Thanks Jerry, do come back.

Appreciation to First Baptist 
Church of Cross Plains for the 
cute Easter cards given to the 
residents.

Coke floats were an added treat 
Tuesday afternoon and enjoyed 
by all.

Jesus — The Key to the 
Kingdom.

Prescription Strength Alternative 
without Prescription!

(30 tabs)- 100mg $79.95 
(60 tabs)-100mg $129.95

Order Online with Credit Card 
or Call now toll free!

1.888-527-0870
or Send Check or M.O. to: 

p  P.E. Labs 
1025 SW 59th 8t

tradenuric of m«r Co. OKC OK 73109

FREE
SHIPPING

Prescription Strength Alternatives 
without Prescription!

Phentrazine®
(60  ta b s )-3 7 .5 m g  $79 .95

Xenicai®
(120  cap s )-1 2 0 m g  $99.95  

Call now toll free!
1-888-527-0870
or Send Check or M.O. to: 

P.E. Labs 
1025 SW 59th St

sexpillusa.com dietnillusa.com

R olling  O aks G olf C lub 
I n R ising  S tar, TX

Is O ffemng T he Following To

SENIORS!!
(50 YEARS &  O l d e r )

Monday - Friday 
Play 18 Holes w/Cart 

for just

$ 1 6 . 5 0 ! !

mailto:csb5@airmail.net
http://www.cfidrive.com


C.P. Student Review

H.S. Track Results
The High School track teams 

competed last week at the Pioneer 
relays. Dayna Bennett placed 2nd 
in the shot put. Kelsee Richards 
placed 2nd in the discus. Kim 

 ̂ Mosier finished 5th in the high 
jump. Christin Hyles, Richards, 
Naomi Isbell, and Mosier fm- 

 ̂ ished 3rd in the 400 m relay. C. 
Hyles, Richards, Rainey Bacon, 
Isbell finished 6th in the 600 m 

" relay. Shanna Hyles came in 6th 
' in the 800 m run. Mosier won the 
 ̂ 400 m dash. C. Hyles, Mosier, 

Isbell and S. Hyles ran their best 
time of the year to finish 3rd in the 
mile relay.

The Varsity boys ended the 
meet in 2nd place as a team. 
Dusty Dickson placed 2nd in the 
high jump. Roy Smith finished 
4th in the long jump. Brandon 
Horton won the pole vault. Tho­
mas Dimitri placed 2nd in the 
pole vault. The team of Smith, 
Jason Goains, Dickson and 
Michael came in 2nd in the 400 m 
relay. Andy Bennett came in 2nd 
in the 800 m run. Smith, Dickson, 
Dimitri and Goains finished 6th 
in the 800 m relay. Bennett came 
in 5th in the mile. Smith, Goains, 
Bennett and Allen won the mile

C.P.H.S. Trackster 
Competions Told

The Cross Plains tracksters had 
an impressive showing last week 
at the district track meet. The JV 
boys placed 3rd overall.

The relay team of Chance 
Watkins, Thomas Estes, Russell 
Thomas and River Dillard place 
2nd in the 400 m relay and 1st in 
both the 800 m relay and the; 1600 
m relay.

Jordan Dillard place 2nd in the 
800 m run, won the 1600 m run, 
3rd in the pole vault and 6th in the 
long jump. Justin Dickson placed 
6th in the 300 m hurdles. Thomas 
Estes finished 3rd in the triple 
jump. River Dillard placed 4th in 
the long jump and 5th in the high 
jump. Randy Duncan placed 1st 
in the long jump and 3rd in the 
high jump. Chance Watkins 
placed 4th in the high jump. 
Others competing were Travis 
Black, Chris Beaty,-Raymond 
Sifuentes and Chris McBride.

The girls placed 6th overall in 
the meet. Shanna Hyles placed 
5th in the 800 m run. Kim Mosier 
finished 2nd in the 400 m dash. 
The relay team Mosier, Christin

Hyles, Naomi Isbell and S. Hyles 
finished 4th in the mile relay. 
Kelsee Richards finished 2nd in 
the shotput and the discus. Dayna 
Bennett placed 4th in the shotput. 
Others competing were Rainey 
Bacon and Mykea Douglass.

The boys placed 3rd in the meet 
and every competitor .will be 
advancing to area in an event. 
Cesar Rameriz started off the day 
finishing 2nd in the 3200 m run. 
Dusty Dickson tied for 3rd in the 
high jump while Roy Smith 
placed 5th. Brandon Horton 
placed 2nd in the pole vault and 
Thomas Dimitri placed 4th. The 
team Smith, Jason Goains, 
Dickson and Michael Allen fin­
ished 2nd in the 400 m relay. 
Andy Bennett came in 3rd in the 
800 m run and 2nd in the 1600 m 
run. Allen came in 2nd in the 400 
m run. Smith, Dickson, Dimitri 
and Goains finished 3rd in the 
800 m relay. Smith, Goains, 
Bennett and Allen ran a 3:28.65 
in the mile relay to finish 2nd.

Submitted by 
Coach Jay Wilcoxen

S c h o o l  b o a r d  m e e t in g

A regular meeting of the Board 
of Trustees of the Cross Plains
I.S.D. will be held on April 14, 
beginning at 7 p.m. in the high 
school adm inistrative board 
room. The subjects to be 
discussed or considered or upon 
which any formal action may be 
taken are as follows:

Prayer
1. Minutes
2. Open Forum
3. Review 2004-05 Student 

Transfers
4. Discuss and Take Action on 

2004-05 School Calendar
5. Discuss and Take Action on 

Date to Canvass School 
Board Election

6. Executive Session

7. Personnel for 2004-05
School Year
A. Resignations
B. Act on Letter of 

Assurance for Secretaries 
and Aides

C. Act on Letter of 
Assurance for Auxiliary 
Personnel

D. Other Personnel Matters, 
as necessary

8. Review/Pay Bills
9. Adjourn
Notice of the meeting was 

posted in compliance with the 
Open Meetings Act on April 14, 
2004, at 3:00 p.m. by Jackie 
Tennison for the Board of 
Trustees.

Spring Picture Packet Orders
Proofs were sent home last Friday. 

DEADLINE for ordering the packets 
APRIL 16,2004

Return orders and payments to 
Elementary Office or Lurene in High School.

Cross Plains Athletic 
Booster Club needs pictures

relay.
The JV boys also came in 2nd in 

the meet as a team. Travis Black 
placed 5th in the discus and 4th in 
the shot put. Chris Beaty placed 
6th in the discus. Chance Watkins 
won the high jump and Randy 
Duncan came in 3rd. Duncan won 
the long jump and River Dillard 
placed 3rd. Thomas Estes placed 
2nd in the triple jump and Russell 
Thomas finished 3rd. Watkins, 
Thomas, Estes and R. Dillard fin­
ished 2nd in each of the 3 relays.
J. Dillard came in 2nd in the 800 
m run and won the mile. Duncan 
finished 2nd in the 400 m dash, 
while Black came in 3rd.

We would like to thank all of 
those that helped make the Pio­
neer Relays successful. The 
Booster Club, the parents that 
volunteered, the kids that helped 
out, Karen Robinson and her 
class for preparing the coaches/ 
workers meal, Russell Robinson 
for cooking the meal, the 
coaches, other school employees 
that helped, the press box workers 
and the countless others that 
helped out that are not purposely 
being left out. We appreciate all 
the work that you put in for us.

The Cross Plains Athletic 
Booster Club needs pictures of 
athletes participating in any 
athletic event. These pictures will 
be used for posters for the 
All-Sports Banquet. If you have

any pictures please bring them to 
G&G Sporting Goods 240 N. 
Main. Please put your name on 
the back of the pictures if you 
want them back. Deadline is May 
1st.

PIP FESTIVAL WINNERS — Morgan Thomas (from left), Seth 
Wyatt, Sammie Tollett, Brody Thomas, and Savana Wyatt.

PIP Group Travels to 
Dallas for Competition

On March 12-13 five of the 
Cross Plains PIP (PLAYER IN 
PROGRESS) group traveled to 
Dallas to compete in the annual 
National PIP Festival.

This year the competition was 
held at SMU. In the past the 
Festival was held at ACU in 
Abilene, but due to scheduling 
conflicts the Festival had to be 
moved.

The kids that competed in their 
four individual events were

Sammie Tollett, Savana Wyatt, 
Seth Wyatt, Brody Thomas, and 
Morgan Thomas. There are kids 
from all across the United States 
that compete in the Festival. Each 
kid competes against his/her own 
age and gender. This year there 
were over 700 kids competing. 
This is the first year that 
Cross Plains had every kid place 
in at least one event. What a 
great way to end a great year. 
CONGRATULATIONS PIPS!

C.P. Little League 
Fund-raiser Told

The Cross Plains Little League 
is having a raffle to raise money 
for the 2004 baseball season. The 
money raised will help the league 
buy equipment and work on the 
playing fields.

The players are selling raffle 
tickets for $1.00 each or 6 for 
$5.00 for a variety of gifts. The 
player selling the most tickets 
will receive a $25 gift certificate 
to Academy. The team selling the 
most tickets will receive a pizza 
party.

They will draw for the prizes on 
the opening day of the season. 
May 8th, following the opening 
ceremonies and between each of 
the ball games. The league.

coaches and players would like 
to thank these businesses for 
donating prizes : Big Mack's 
Automotive; Bitter Creek Ranch; 
Connie's Cuts & Curls; Cross 
Plains Review; Cross Plains Parts 
Plus; G&G Sporting Goods; 
Higginbotham's; Jean's Feed 
Barn; Johnson's Dry Goods; 
Lawrence Farm and Ranch; T&K 
Tire and Alignment; Tim's 
Floral; The Movie Store; and 
KOXE Radio.

If you would like to donate 
som ething, please contact 
Deanna Golson or Kim Thomas. 
Your donations would be greatly 
appreciated.

Junior High Track 
Results Reported

March 23 May Tiger Relays 
Girls Team Place 3rd 

(14 teams entered)
2400 M Run - 1st 10:56.56 

Mandy Rose; 400 M Relay - 3rd 
60.25 Terrah Augustine, Beth 
Saveli, Starla Schaefer, Christi 
Burrhus; 100 M Hurdles 1st 
20.10 - Emily Harris; 100 M 
Hurdles 3rd 20.78 - Macayla 
Cook; 800 M Run 4th 3:15.93 - 
Krista Phillips; 400 M Dash 6th 
81.66 - E. Harris; 300 M Hurdles 
1st 58.72 M. Cook; 1600 M Run 
3rd 7:10.68 M. Rose; 1600 M 
Run 6th 8:11.06 K. Phillips; 800 
M Relay 5th 2:14.97 - T. 
Augustine, B. Saveli, S. 
Schaefer, C. Burrhus; 1600 M 
Relay 2nd 5:22.12 - T. August­
ine, E. Harris, S. Schaefer, C. 
Burrhus; Shotput 2nd 31' 7 1/2" 
Betty Mathews; Discus 5th 56'8" 
Ashleigh Gallaway; Long Jump 
2nd 13' 3 1/2" C. Burrhus; High 
Jump 15th 4' C. Burrhus; other 
runners - Lela Bills, Hailey Biggs 
and Tiffany Walker.

April 1st Cross Plains Relay 
Girls Tied 6th/7th 
(15 teams entered)

400 Relay 4th 59:41 T. August­
ine, S. Schaefer, L. Bills, C. 
Burrhus; 100 Hurdles 6th 19.65 
M. Cook; 300 Hurdles 4th 57.81 
M. Cook; 800 Relay 5th 2:07.10 
T. Augustine, S. Schaefer, E. 
Harris, C. Burrhus; Shotput 5th 
27' 10" A. Gallaway; High jump 
6th 4' 2" M. Cook; other runners
K. Phillips, M. Rose and Tiffany

Walker
Junior High Girls 

3rd Place in District April 6 
Teams: Gorman, Albany, 

Baird, Ranger and Cross Plains 
2400 M Run 2nd 10:25.62 - 

Mandy Rose; 400 M Relay 4th 
60.36 - Terrah Augustine, Starla 
Schaefer, Lela Bill Christi 
Burrhus; 100 M Hurdles 3rd 
19.57 Macayla Cook, 4th 20.03
E. Harris, 6th 22.37 B. Saveli, 
800 M Run 3rd 3:19.87 Saveli, 
6th 3:28.94 Krista Phillips; 100 
M Dash 6th 15.11 M. Cook; 400 
M Dash 4th 75.37 M. Rose, 6th 
76.54 B. Saveli; 300 M Hurdles 
3rd 56.94 - M. Cook, 6th 69.68 
Betty Mathews; 1600 M Run 4th 
6:53.50 M. Rose; 800 M Relay 
2nd 2:05.90 - L. Bills, S. 
Schaefer, E. Harris, C. Burrhus; 
1600 M Relay 3rd 5:07.62 L. 
Bills, S. Schaefer, E. Harris, C. 
Burrhus; Shot 2nd 28' 5 1/4" B. 
Mathews, 4th 25' 10' Ashleigh 
Gallaway; Discus 3rd 54' 3" 
Hailey Biggs; Pole Vault 2nd 5' 
4" L. Bills; Long Jump 3rd 13' 3" 
C. Burrhus, 4th 12' 9 1/4" E. 
Harris; High Jump 2nd 4' 2" M. 
Cook, 3rd 4' E. Harris, 4th 3' 10" 
C. Burrhus; other runners. 
Tiffany Walker.

The Junior High girls had a 
small group of 13 girls that did a 
great job this track season (6 - 
seventh graders and 7 eighth 
graders). Submitted by

Coach Becky Dillard
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April is Child Abuse 
Prevention Month

Helping to Strengthen Texas 
Families

Child Abuse and Neglect: 
Protection and Prevention

Child abuse and neglect affect 
the lives of nearly 50,000 Texas 
children each year.

Childhood should be a time of 
happiness and security, but for 
too many children, it is a time of 
tragedy and suffering. Unfortu­
nately, home is not always the 
safe place it should be.

The Texas Department of 
Family and Protective Services 
encourages you to advocate for 
children and help us make 
communities safe for all children.

If You Suspect Child Abuse or 
Neglect:

Do believe the child—Don't 
walk away.

Don't try to investigate.
Do report reasonable suspi­

cions by calling the 24-hour 
Abuse Hotline, 1-800-252-5400, 
or your local law enforcement 
agency—Don't walk away.

What is Child Abuse:
There are four major types of 

child maltreatment: Neglect, 
physical abuse, sexual abuse 
and emotional abuse.

Neglect is failure to provide for 
a child's basic needs.

Suspect Neglect When You 
See:

♦Obvious malnourishment
♦Lack of personal cleanliness
♦Tom or dirty clothing
♦Stealing or begging for food
♦Child unattended for long 

periods of time
♦Need for glasses, dental care, 

or other medical attention

♦Frequent tardiness or absence 
from school.

Physical Abuse is physical in­
jury (ranging from minor bmises 
to severe fractures or death) as a 
result of punching, beating, shak­
ing, kicking, biting, throwing, 
stabbing, hitting, burning, chok­
ing, or otherwise harming a child. 
Such injury is considered abuse 
regardless of whether the 
caregiver intended to hurt the 
child.

Suspect Physical Abuse When 
You See:

♦Frequent injuries such as 
bmises, cuts, black eyes, or 
bums without adequate 
explanations

♦Frequent complaints of pain 
without obvious injury 

♦Bums or bmises in unusual 
patterns that may indicate the 
use of an instmment or human 
bite; cigarette bums on any 
part of the body 

♦Lack of reaction to pain 
♦Aggressive, dismptive and 

destmctive behavior 
♦Passive, withdrawn, and 

emotionless behavior 
♦Fear of going home or seeing 

parents; injuries that appear 
after a child has not been 
seen for several days 

♦Unreasonable clothing that 
may hide injuries to arms or 
legs

Source: 2004 Child Abuse 
Prevention Kit 

Tx. Dept, of Family &
Protective Services

Submitted by Callahan County Child 
Welfare Board — Call for More 
Information (254) 725-4290 or
(254) 725-4284

2004 Cross Plains Elementary
Come join the fun and 

learn your multiplication facts. 
Students in grades three, four, 
five, and six are invited to 
participate in the Multiplication 
Madness Contest. Each student 
must know the multiplication 
facts.

The third and fourth graders 
must know the facts 0-10 and the 
fifth and sixth graders must know 
the facts 0-12.

Students will given timed tests 
during homeroom at 3:15. The

test will be graded and all students 
scoring 100% will receive a 
Multiplication Madness T-Shirt 
plus their names will go into a 
drawing for $10.00 and $5.00. 
There will be a tutorial on 
Wednesday for anyone who wants 
to practice; also students may take 
home an Oral Fact Practices. 
Students may take the test as 
many times as needed.

Submitted by
Pat Stephens

[ SCHOOL MENU
APRIL 1 9 -2 3

BREAKFAST 
MONDAY - Eggs, Bacon, 
Biscuit, Assorted Juice 
TUESDAY - Pancakes, Sausage, 
Assorted Juice
WEDNESDAY - Breakfast Taco, 
Assorted Juice
THURSDAY - Hot or Cold 
Cereal, Toast, Assorted Juice 
FRIDAY - Cinnamon Toast, 
Assorted Juice

LUNCH
MONDAY- Corn D ogs, Potato 
Wedges, Baked Beans, Spice Cake 
TUESDAY- Salisbury Steak w/ 
Brown Gravy, Mashed Potatoes, Peas 
& Carrots, Rolls, Peaches 
WEDNESDAY- Beef-Vegy Soup, 
Grilled Cheese, Crackers, Fresh Fruit 
THURSDAY- Spaghetti w/Meat 
Sauce, Cheese Stick, Garlic Toast, 
Broccoli, Pears
FRIDAY- Hamburger, Lettuce, 
Tomato, Pickles, Fries, Cookie

G e n t le  F a m ily

DENTISTRY

K. Seed, J . •
in Baird accepts

M E D IC A ID
'"‘cnce

& most dental insurance. 
Accepting New Patients!
1-866-854-1173 • (325) 854-1173



County Government Week 
proclaimed April 18-24

3RD PLACE W INNERS IN THE 9/11 FLIGHT CREW  
M EM O RIAL G OLF TO URNAM ENT —  Charlie Ross 
(from left), Scott Childress, James Ross, and David Ross.

Local G olfers Compete 
in  9/11 M em o ria l 
Tournament in Euless

Resolution
Whereas, county government 

is the oldest form of local gov­
ernment in the United States; 
and

Whereas, county government 
in Texas has been a major pro­
vider of services to Texas citi­
zens since the early days of the 
Republic, and today, all 254 
counties supply services to their 
citizens; and

Whereas, counties are on the 
front line of addressing many of 
the nation's most critical issues 
including environmental protec­
tion, indigent health care, spe­
cial assistance for elderly, job 
training, and public safety, and

Whereas, the mission of Texas 
county government is to meet 
the needs of all our citizens with­
out placing an undue hardship

on local taxpayers.
Mow, therefore, be it resolved, 

that the Commissioners' Court 
of Callahan County of the State 
of Texas, hereby proclaims April 
18-April 24, 2004 as County 
Government Week, and encour­
ages all its citizens to become 
more aware of the history and 
more involved in the future of 
Callahan County.

(s) Roger Corn 
County Judge 

(s) Harold Hicks 
Commissioner Precinct # 1 

(s) Bryan Farmer 
Commissioner Precinct #2 

(s) Tommy Holland 
Commissioner Precinct #3 

(s) Charlie Grider 
Commissioner Precinct #4 

(s) Jeanie Bohannon 
County Clerk
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CJC Bands and Belles 
Presenting a Concert 
’’Spring Celebration”

[P aB L lC F A X  ,( 2 5 4 )7 2 5 - 7 2 2 5 |

The Cisco Junior College Bands 
and Belles will present a concert 
called "Spring Celebration" 
Thursday and Friday evenings on 
April 15-16. The program will be 
at the Hilton Hotel, beginning at 7 
p.m. Coffee, tea and strawberry 
dessert will be served. The cost is 
$5.00.

The music will be light, ranging 
from the nostalgic to the modem. 
From the swing era, the Jazz Band 
will perform "It Don't Mean a 
Thing If It Ain't Got That Swing". 
The Wrangler Belles will dance 
to a medley of Elvis Presley

tunes. Many other enjoyable 
melodies will also be on the pro­
gram.

Reservations are necessary. 
Call (254) 442-2567, ext. 0. After 
hours and weekends dial exten­
sion 5129 to make your reserva­
tion on voice mail. Be sure to 
include your name, number in 
party and a telephone number. 
Reservations can also be made 
online at www.cisco.cc.tx.us. 
click on "News 8l Events", click 
on "Band & Belles Spring 
Celebration" link.

Charlie Ross, James Ross and 
Scott Childress, all of Cross 
Plains, along with David Ross of 
Comanche, recently competed in 
the 9/11 Flight Crew Memorial 
Golf Tournament held at the 
Texas Golf Club in Euless.

The foursome played well and 
finished in 3rd place in the 3rd 
flight. They received tropnies for 
their efforts.

The tournament was held to

raise funds for a memorial to be 
placed in the city of Grapevine to 
honor the memory of the flight 
crews of American and United 
Airlines who were killed on 
September 11, 2001 when
terrorist hijackers seized four 
jetliners and crashed them into 
the World Trade Center in New 
York City, The Pentagon and a 
Pennsylvania field.

A thletic B ooster Club  
M eeting

April 19th at 7:00 p.m. 
in Gym  Foyer
Will be discussing 

decorations & meal for

A ll-Sports Banquet!
I If you are interested in helping with the banquet please I 
I attend otherwise please don’t complain! I

P a B L I C F A X i ^ > 7  
AT THE CROSS PLAINS REVIEWl 

FJKm 1 -254-725-7225

EVERYONE IS INVITED TO THE
3 3 r d  ANNIVERSARY o f

 ̂ BOB WILLS DAY
in  T U R K E Y , T E X A S  

Saturday, A p ril 24, 2004
Featuring many former Texas Playboys/Playgirls 

www.turkeytexas.com Phone (806) 423-1253

BEST
Ju f f  eo f

B B m it
[ / i 4  announces fndushy 
leading pay Increase!

Company Prfverfi earn

u|» fo 4E  ̂pet mile

Company Teams earn

Up to SS  ̂pet tnfle

Owner Operators earn

u|> Id 9 ^  pet mile

Urgent news for people who have used

WELDING RODS
S cien tists  report that e lev a ted  m an gan ese  exp osu re from  
welding rod fum es has been  associa ted  with Parkinsonism (like 
Parkinson’s  d ise a se ) and m anganlsm . Sym ptom s include  
sh ak iness, d istorted facial exp ression , lo s s  o f equilibrium, 
d ecreased  hand agility, difficulty w alking. Joint pain, lo s s  
o f short term  m em ory, slu rred /slow  spt^ech, stiffn ess  In 
m u scles and tremors, if you have experienced any of these  
problem s, call us today toll free at l-SOO-THE-EAGLE for a free 
consultation to evaluate your potential claim. We practice law  
only in Arizona, but a ssoc ia te  with law yers throughout the U.S.

G O LD B E R G  & O SB O R N E  
1-800-THE-EAGLE 

OfTIccd In (1 -800-843-3245)
wwWjTSOOtheeagle^^

If

R e e d  C o n s t r u c t i o n
"Wketv ipu Need — caLt Reed"

No Job Too Big o r Too Sm all
C-oiA/crctc - Barovs - T*alv>J:Û

New H-oMd.es - Adollti.oiA.s - ■Rem.odLlkv̂
Tape § ■&eol § Tzyctucre - MetaL § sbliA^Le Roofs

We've Been a Local Business Since 1980
L ^ c a l  ’R jt f tY t \A y C ts >  -

"Bring Me a Legitim ate Estim ate Ana I  W ill Beat It!"

vve'LL Be Here After Worte is Dopve
W ork Is G uaranteea

Hom e 254-725-7363 Pager 325-734-0932 
, Texas Contractors License 4047

Take a Load Off...

and work easy

with
C E N T U R Y ™

CENTURY’S compact tractor line offers 5 models to choose from, 
with horsepower range from 30 to 48. Matched “easy-on” loaders available for each.

% ith one of the heaviest chassis on the market, CENTURY’S weight lets you make 
full use of your engine horsepower.

CENTURY is exceptionally comfortable, smooth and easy to operate and simple in maintenance.

All models feature Synchro-shuttle transmission, with 3- and 4-cylinder diesel engines.

Take a good look at CENTURY today.

1635 South Access Rd.
1-20 E at Clyde, TX 79510

325-893-4242 
Toll Free 1-888-216-4311FARM EQUIPMENT

THE BEST INVESTMENT 
YOU’LL EVER MAKE

( 5

Z e to r  tr a c to r s  a r e  m a d e  t o  la s t .  
A n d  w h e n  s o m e th in g  is m a d e  to  last 
y o u r  co st o f  o p e ra t io n s  stays low . 
T h a t's  w h y  S m ith  a n d  S o n  
carries  Z e to r.

H eck, S m ith  a n d  S on  has b e e n  in  
b u sin ess  fo r  30  p lu s ye a rs  so  w e  c a n 't  
a ffo rd  to  sell a n y th in g  less.

1635 South Access Rd.
1-20 E at Clyde, TX 79510

325-893-4242 
Toll Free 1-888-216-4311FARM EQ U IP M EN T

http://www.cisco.cc.tx.us
http://www.turkeytexas.com


rngh school students can learn about military 
service opportunities at 'Academy Day'

Washington, D.C.—Congress­
man Charlie Stenholm (TX-17) 
invites area high school students 
who are interested in attending 
a military service academy to 
“Academy Day” events on Sat­
urday, April 17th, and Sunday, 
April 18th.

Representatives of the CI.S. 
Naval, Military, Air Force, Coast 
Guard and Merchant Marine 
Academies will be on"hand at 
each event to share information 
about their schools with pro­
spective students and parents. 
The Reserve Officers Training 
Corps also will be represented.

In addition, the Academy Day 
program will feature informa­
tion about the Congressional 
nomination process that is nec­
essary to secure appointments 
to the military academies.

Academic achievement, extra­
curricular activities, leadership 
potential and motivation are all 
considered in the selection pro­
cess.

“1 strongly encourage inter­
ested students to attend Acad­
emy Day so they can learn about 
the academies and determine if 
an academy education might be 
right for them,” Stenholm said. 
“The academies provide excel­
lent educations to outstanding 
young people in exchange for 
their service to our country.”

“The Academy Day is a great 
way for students and parents to 
get answers to questions they 
may have about the academies

and the selection process,” Sten­
holm said. “Each year I take 
great pride in nominating eli­
gible students from West Texas 
to our nation’s academies, and 
each year a few of our best 
students are selected to join 
these elite institutions.”

On Saturday, April 17th, Acad­
emy Day will be at two locations 
in Stenholm’s 17th Congres­
sional District: The Stephenville 
location is on the Tarleton State 
University campus from 9 to 11 
a.m. Events will be in the Sci­
ence Building, Room 109, lo­
cated at 1333 West Washington 
Street. The Abilene location is 
on the Abilene Christian Univer­
sity campus from 3 to 5 p.m. 
Events will be in the Bible Build­
ing, Room 112, located at 1850 
Teague Blvd.

On Sunday, April 18th, Acad­
emy Day will be in San Angelo 
on the Angelo State University 
campus from 2 to 4 p.m. Events 
will be in the Math-Computer 
Science Building, Room 100, 
located at 2200 Dena Drive.

Academy applications for high 
school students from the 17th 
Congressional District of Texas 
are available from Chandra 
Eggemeyer in Stenholm’s San 
A ngelo office at 2121-A  
K nickerbocker Road,  San 
Angelo, Texas 76904. For more 
information, students and par­
ents may call Eggemeyer at 
(325) 9428881 or e-mail her at 
chandia.eggemeyei@mafl.house.gov.
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M onth for Awareness .—.............
Brownwood Mayor, Bert V. 

Massey II, has declared the 
month of April as Parkinson's 
Disease Awareness Month. 
This declaration joins the 
approximately one and one half 
m illion Americans with 
Parkinson's Disease in putting 
forth awareness.

To date, proclamations have 
been accepted by the Brownwood 
Parkinson Group from 
Brownwood, Abilene,
Stephenville, Coleman,
Comanche, San Angelo, Early

and Brady.
The Brownwood group will 

host a free brunch and seminar 
dealing with movement disorders 
on Saturday, April 24th, at the 
Adams Street Community 
Center.

For more information or to 
register for this event, please 
call Linda Duncan at (325) 
641-0020 or Nancy Smythe at 
(325)646-6757. The title of the 
upcoming program is Over­
coming Obstacles—Learning to 
Live with Movement Disorders.

Rep. Stenholm's Ag Talk

First positive rabies 
case reported in county

The first positive case of rabies in Callahan County in 2004 
has been diagnosed in a skunk recently found dead within the 
city limits of Baird.

While this is the first case in Callahan County this year, 
Taylor County has already had 10 positive rabies case, 
Coleman County has had four, Eastland County has had two, 
and Runnels County has had nine rabies case so far this year.

Callahan County had seven positive rabies case reported in 
2003.

Although rabies vaccinations are good for three years, most 
veterinarians in this area recommend yearly vaccination due 
to this high incidence of this disease. Consult your local 
veterinarian with any questions concerning vaccination or 
epidemiology of this important disease.

By Charlie Stenholm 
April 8, 2004 

Sheep and Goats
Shearing season is in full swing 

again as sheep and goat ranch­
ers across Texas and the Ci.S. 
sharpen their shears and get to 
work.

In the last couple of years we 
have been fortunate to see wool 
and mohair prices continue to 
improve.

Currently prices are up from 
last year with the posted wool 
price at $2.75 per pound and 
the posted mohair price at $2.67 
per pound.

The CI.S. produced approxi­
mately 38 million pounds of wool 
last year valued around $27 mil­
lion. Mohair production for 
Texas, Arizona, and New Mexico 
was about 2 million pounds val­
ued near $3 million. This repre­
sents 99% of all mohair pro­
duced in the G. S. last year.

The Wool and Mohair Market­
ing Loan Program contained in 
the 2002 Farm Bill has helped to 
provide producers a marketing 
tool that has been beneficial and 
provided a safety net for low 
prices.

Last year in San Angelo, 1 met 
with representatives of the sheep 
industry from the G. S., Austra­
lia and New Zealand to discuss 
issues that impact the lamb in­
dustry worldwide.

The meeting’s focus centered 
on a cooperative relationship

E X m M D E il FO R  YOU!

NEW ‘04 CHEVY AVALANCHE
* 54165.0 oiS

$ 3 2 ,9 8 0 .0 0
TRUCK FEST REBATE - 1 , 0 0 0 . 0 0

FACTORY REBATE -3 ,500 .00  
HAMMER DISCOUNT -3 ,528 .00

Only <24,952 + TT&L

NEW '0 4  CHEVY CANYON m. m  zj\
« 54579.0

MSRP $ 2 1 ,9 4 0 .0 0  
DISCOUNT -1 ,875 .00  

TRUCK FEST REBATE - 1 ,000.00  
FACTORY REBATE -1 ,500

Onh
TRUCKS • TRUCKS

^ 1 7 ^5 6 5  + TT & L

STK« 7 4 0 8 3 .0  '0 3  PONTIAC MONTANA 24K  n7.800°°
STK« 7 4 0 6 5 .0  03 CHEVY t$00  X -C A 6 IS  37K ONLY n0,450°°  

STK# 7 4 0 5 8 .0  "Oa CHEVY 1500 X-CAB Z71 37K O N LY « 1 .8 5 0 “  
S T K * 74052.1 '0 0  FORP RANGER SUPER CA8 4 X 4  EXTRAS! ONLY n2.995°° 

STK« 7 4 0 4 9 .0  '02  CHEVY SURBUR8AN HURRY* ONLY 123,995"  
STK * 7 4 0 4 7 .1  '99  DOOGE CONVERSION VAN 19,250"  

S IX *  7 40 20 .0  '01 CHEVY REG CA8 4 X 4  ONLY 31K 117,500" 
S T K * 74016.1 '9 5  CHEVY 3500  F U T  8EP 0 0 0 0  MILES «7,995"  

S T K * 73117.0 '0 0  CHEVY 1500 REG CAB V 6 , AUTO, ONLY H 1,500"  
STK *5 4 4 5 1 .1  00  G M C R E 01500 X-CAB <16,995" 

STK * 5 4 4 0 2 .1  '02  CHEVY 1500 X-CAB Z71 3 8 K 0 N L Y  <20,995" 
STK *54316.1 00  CHEVY VENTURE VAN <9,995"

CARS • CARS CARS • CARS
S T K * 5 4 2 4 8 .1  '02  CHEVY CAVALIER HURRYI <7,995"  

S T K * 7 4 0 3 9 .0  '0 2  CHEVY TAN IM PALA ONLY <11,650" 
S T K * 7 4 0 6 3 .0  '03  BUKK CENTURY ONLY <11,995" 

S T K * 7 4 0 6 4 .0  '0 4  PONTIAC GRANP A M  9 ,0 0 0  MILES! ONLY <15,800" 
a n *  S T K * 7 4 0 6 6 .0  '0 3  OLPS ALERO ONLY <11,900"

STK *  7 4 0 7 3 .0  '0 3  CHEVY IM PALA 22K <14,300" 
S T K * '7 4 0 8 0 .0 '0 3  CHEVY MALIBU 30K <11,600" 

S T K * 74081 .0  '0 3  OLPS ALERO <12,500" 
______________________________S T K * 7 4 0 8 4 .0  '0 4  CHEVY IMPALA ONLY <15,500"

Come See Johnny Crazell, Ron English, Vernon Willingham, Don Darr, 
Joe M orrison, Kelly Com Or Randy Tollett. “The Hanner Team ."

1-20 AT BAIRD -  854-1133

Callahan County  
DPS Report

Calls received by the Callahan 
County Department of Public 
Safety from April 4, 2004 
through April 10, 2004 include: 

Cases Investigated 
Warnings—138 
Complaints—184 
Possession of Marijuana—1 
Driving While License Sus­

pended—1
Felony Warrant- Possession of 

Cocaine—1
Driving While License Sus­

pended Warrant—1 
Driving While Intoxicated—1 

Vehicle Accidents 
There were two vehicle acci­

dents investigated during this 
time span.

Barb Cues
By Barbara Holmes Worcester

between our three countries in 
order to enhance the profitabil­
ity and susceptibility of the G.S. 
lamb market.

It is positive to see American 
producers working with Austra­
lian and New Zealand producers 
to share a goal of a more suc­
cessful, stable, profitable indus­
try worldwide.

GSDA Livestock Heat
Stress Research 

Although it is only April, the 
heat of summer will soon be an 
issue we once again will have to 
face.

On that note, agricultural en­
gineers with the G.S. Depart­
ment of Agriculture (GSDA) are 
trying to pinpoint what makes 
cattle susceptible to heat stress, 
which can kill livestock or re­
duce productivity, causing losses 

for producers.
The system Is fairly simple and 

inexpensive but still gives good 
results. It consists of a tempera­
ture sensor, battery and trans­
mitter and a data recorder.

For short-term measurements, 
a capsule can be swallowed. For 
longer-term measurements, a 
three-inch capsule is inserted 
into the animal’s abdominal cav­
ity. The results of stress are in­
putted into the data recorder, 
and then conclusions can be 
made.

This kind of research is impor­
tant in bettering our livestock 
industry in general. If we can 
find a way to prevent heat stress 
in livestock, we will improve G.S. 
livestock production and cut 
losses.

Oasis Gin Record
Timely rains this last cotton 

season produced above-aver­
age yields for dryland and irri­
gated cotton land, which resulted 
in an unofficial state record at a 
small Texas gin. The Oasis Gin, 
southwest of Seminole, Texas, 
ginned 84,637 bales of cotton 
last year.

The gin is a single plant with 
one bale press. The 2003 gin 
record beat the previous gin 
record of a little more than 
68,000 bales and the Gaines 
County record 6f 70,000 bales.

One more thing to note. Oasis 
Gin was 99 percent finished by 
December31,2003. That is quite 
an accomplishment, men. Keep 
up the good work.

OSDA Acreage Predictions 
Now looking ahead, the GSDA 

has released its annual planting 
intentions report, and their pre­
dictions include increases In both 
soybean and cotton acreage.

Projected Texas soybean acre­
age will be up from last year, 
and Texas cotton acreage is pro­
jected to jump up half a million 
acres.

It will be interesting to see how. 
In fact, we can increase both 
cotton and soybean acreage at 
the same time, it seems one’s 
got to give.

Congressman Stenholm repre­
sents the 1 7th District of Texas in 
the CI.S. House of Representatives 
and is the Ranking Member of the 
House Committee on Agriculture.

New Beginnings

We are continuing our theme 
of new beginnings. Easter was 
this past Sunday and of course 
the first Easter was the ultimate 
in new beginnings. Christ, who 
people thought was dead, arose 
from the grave and went into 
Heaven. Because of that we all 
have a chance to have a new 
beginning.

One can just look outside and 
see new beginnings in all direc­
tions. The new vegetation and 
all of the new colors just make 
me happy. Aren’t you glad that 
God didn’t make everything 
gray?

My hibiscus garden is coming 
up. They are tiny shoots of green 
now but I know that in June, 
they will provide the glorious 
plate-sized red blossoms that 
people drive by just to see.

One neat thing in nature is how 
things fit together and provide 
for each other. We have just 
come through winter when the 
ground received preparation for 
spring. The freezes destroy pests 
and many things happen which 
are beneficial to new growth at 
the proper time.

Let us think of our physical 
and mental new beginnings. 
Many of us may have become 
sort of lazy both in body and 
mind during the “stay in the 
house time.” 1 personally am 
eager to get put and dig and 
ready the ground. Do we need

to dig mentally and “work our 
ground”. We may find some 
“pests which the freeze didn’t 
get. We may need to trim some 
of the dead leaves from winter 
and make room for new growth 
on our plants and in our hearts."

Larry has promised to come 
this week and “out the plants 
go”. I think we may make it this 
year. I get nervous when the fruit 
trees bud out because so often 
we have an unexpected expected 
April freeze that gets the baby 
fruit. I hope we do not have a 
freeze that kills our new begin­
nings, either mentally or physi­
cally.

Join me in preparation for new 
growth and let us make some 
new beginnings.

New Growth
1 love to see the earth’s new 

growth.
I hope that I have grown and 

have shoots of new.
Off come the junk and old 

dead leaves.
Shall we prune our attitudes 

too?

1 exult and rejoice and feel like
a dance. _

I’m color happy and growth 
happy too.

With love for the world, and 
Creator, creation,

1 ESPECIALLY LOVE ALL OF 
YOG!

BHW

Risk management conference offers 
strategies for cattle producers

AGSTIN—Agriculture Com­
missioner Susan Combs an­
nounced that the Texas Depart­
ment of Agriculture is partnering 
with Texas Cooperative Exten­
sion, the G.S. Department of 
Agriculture’s Risk Management 
Agency and the Texas and 
Southwestern Cattle Raisers 
Association to offer conferences 
in April and May to help produc­
ers manage challenges and risks 
in the beef industry.

The next conference will take 
place at the Abilene Civic Cen­
ter, 1100 N. Sixth St. in Abilene 
on April 28. Registration is $20, 
and participants may register at 
the door. The event is from 8 
a.m to 5 p.m

The conferences, called “Got 
Risk?” will also be held in other 
major beef production areas of 
the state including Sulfur Springs 
on May 11, Waco on May 18, 
Palestine on May 19 and Alpine 
on May 26.

“These workshops are a great 
way to inform cattle produc­
ers—the ultimate leaders in our 
agricultural business commu­
nity,” Combs said. “Our cattle

industry is widely known for its 
quality and high levels of pro­
duction, and there are a number 
of programs and strategies avail­
able to help cattle producers 
keep their operations moving 
forward.”

The workshops will highlight 
various tools available to pro­
ducers. Sessions will include In­
formation on prices, strategic 
planning, state and federal pro­
grams, country-of-origin label­
ing, drought management and 
value-added marketing, to name 
a few.

“Providing tools for our cattle 
producers is more important than 
ever,” Combs said. “Risk man­
agement involves being proac­
tive and prepared for shifts in the 
industry, severe weather, price 
volatility and many other situa­
tions that can be challenging.”

For more information, please 
call the Texas Department of 
Agriculture’s Rural Economic 
Development Division at 1 -800- 
TELL-TDA or visit 
m as te rm a rk e te r .ta m u .e d u / 
tbrm.

Controlled Burns-
—Commissioners voted to ap­

prove the March 22 and March 
29 minutes of the commission­
ers' court meetings.

—During a time set aside for 
public comment, no one ad­
dressed the commissioners' 
court.

—Commissioners voted to re­
new the interlocal cooperation 
contract between the Texas 
Department of Public Safety and 
Callahan County.

The purpose of the contract is 
to implement the provisions of 
Texas Transportation Code 
Chapter 706. A local political 
subdivision may contract with 
the Department of Public Safety 
to provide information neces­
sary to deny renewal of the driver 
license of a person who fails to 
appear for a complaint or cita­
tion or fails to pay or satisfy a 
judgement ordering payment of 
a fine or cost in the manner 
ordered by the court in a matter 
involving any offense within the 
jurisdiction of the justice or 
municipal court.

The Departm ent of Public 
Safety has authority to contract 
with a private vendor pursuant 
to Texas Transportation Code 
j 706.008. The vendor will pro­
vide the necessary goods or ser­
vices to establish an automated 
system (FTA system) whereby 
information regarding violators 
subject to the provisions of Texas

Transportation Code Chapter 
706 may be accurately stored 
and accessed by the DPS. Gtlliz- 
ing the FTA system as a source 
of information, the DPS may 
deny renewal of a driver license 
to a person who is the subject of 
an FTA system entry.

Each local political subdivision 
contracting with the DPS will 
pay monies to the vendor based 
on a fee certain established by 
the contract. The DPS will make 
no direct or indirect payments to 
the vendor. The vendor will en­
sure that accurate information 
is available to the DF^, political 
subdivision, and persons seek­
ing to clear their licenses at all 
reasonable times.

—Six county residents attended 
the commissioners' court meet­
ing to discuss roadway mainte­
nance on County Road 460 and 
County Road 479 in Commis­
sioner Charlie Grider's Precinct 
#4.

Commissioner Grider told those 
in attendance that his precinct 
has a limited amount of money, 
however he would do what he 
could.

—Commissioners voted to ap­
prove a resolution proclaiming 
April 18-24 as County Govern-y  
ment Week In Callahan County.

—Commissioners voted to pay 
all approved bills and voted to 
adjourn the commissioners' 
court meeting.

O FF IC E S U P P U E S A T
T H E C R O S S P L A IN S R E V IE W
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ACCORDING TO A SITE FURNISHED BY THE TEXAS PARKS AND WILDUFE DEPT.- This is the 
legitimate picture of the record-setting catfish,

LETTER TO THE EDITOR
RECORD CATFISH WAS BIG, BUT NOT AS BIG AS IN THE PICTURE!

Dear Editor:
Enclosed please find the pic­

ture you printed on March 11.1 
was disapointed to find you 
printed something without it first 
being checked. I do hope this 
doesn't happen again.

Sincerely,
Dorothy Schroeder 
Issaquah, WA

The following was furnished 
by Ms. Schroeder;

Summary of the eRumor
A picture of a giant catfish 

being held by two men. The text 
says it is a 140-pound giant 
caught in Lake Texoma and is a 
Texas state record.

The Truth
The truth is that there is a giant

blue catfish that was pulled frpm 
Lake Texoma, but it's not the 
one in the picture.

The real fish was 121 1/2 
pounds and was pulled out of 
the lake on January 16, 2004 by 
27-year-old Cody Mullennix. 
According to ESPN he was fish­
ing on the Texas side of the 
.'■eservoir, which is on the Texas- 
Oklahoma line, when he pulled 
out the 60-inch beauty.

The fish set several world 
records as well as some Texas 
state records.

He kept the hardy fish alive 
and donated it to the Texas 
Freshwater Fisheries Center in 
Athens, Texas where it is swim­
ming happi ly in a huge 
aquarium.

Authorities there say they in­
tend to return it someday to the 
waters of Lake Texoma.

What about the picture that is 
circulating with the eRumor? It is 
from a foreign catfish angler's 
website at www.xvella.free.fr 
where a man named Lucan Van 
Der Geest claims to have caught 
a 6 1/2 foot catfish weighing 
187.4 pounds.

It was allegedly caught in the 
Po River in Italy, although we've 
not found any substantiation for 
that.

The picture has also circulated 
with claims that the fish was 
caught in Lake Norman in North 
Carolina, Lake Leon in Texas 
and in Georgia.

Letter to the Editor
Dear Editor:

The community of Cross Plains 
lost, what I consider, an 
important part of itself over the 
Easter weekend. Billie Ruth 
Loving was my first physical 
introduction to your quief little 
town and she became a friend. It 
is rare to see someone who has 
been through so much maintain 
the courage and the love of life 
that Billie had.

I visited Billie just a few weeks 
ago. Despite how bad she was 
feeling and worried about how

her hair looked since she had been 
taking a nap, she was just as 
talkative and full of humor as 
always. She was thrilled that she 
could make it down the street to 
the post office in her chair since 
she wasn't able to drive anymore. 
She was excited about her 
column for the library in the 
Cross Plains Review. She was 
hoping to continue helping 
Project Pride in some small way 
for this year's REH Days. Most 
of all, she was happy to have 
company and to be alive. 
Everyone knew that you were 
always welcome to come and

say "hi".
Citizens of Cross Plains knew 

Billie. I don't claim to be a part 
of your community, although I 
enjoy coming there every year. I 
do know that during my visits 
and my interviews with Billie 
she loved Cross Plains and its 
people. She wouldn’t have 
traded it for the world. I'm sure 
some of the people she worked 
with knew how Billie felt, while 
others may be unaware. From an 
outsider's point of view. Cross 
Plains was her world,

Ethan Nahte' 
Producer/Director

(iCOPIES MADE AT THE CROSS PLAINS REVIEW)
Mama’s Oldsmobile
When I was very young, yearly my grandfather drove my grandmother 

and I north to the arid, blistering, thorny land upon which Papa was raised.
The summer of my eighth year, we crossed the old cattleguard in the new, 

shining, air conditioned ‘58 Oldsmobile Papa bought Mama. My grand­
father was a quiet, humble man who left Breckenridge and family at the 
beginning of the Second World War. Many years later I remember clearly 
the Who-wees of admiration as he pulled that shiny car up to the well and 
shut her down.
Each time Papa returned home, he arrived successfully. I wasn’t alive when 

he brought my grandmother home, or my mother, and I wasn’t around to 
see him lumber up the road in his ribbons and Eisenhower jacket. I expect it 
was similar to that day he brought home the big Olds.

When Papa came home, aunts and uncles and cousins I barely knew, but 
missed terribly all year, gathered at the pioneer wooden house of great-grand­
father. There was fried chicken and pickled eggs, and potato salad and grape 
koolaid, and big clear pitchers of iced tea with an inch of unmelted sugar on 
the bottoms.

Summers in Breckenridge were heated ordeals. The sun washed the color 
from the earth, the buildings, the chaparral, cactus, and even the cows paled 
under August. When Papa came that year, he brought color enough for the 
entire county in that chrome-weighted Olds and my grandmother. Her 
lipstick was brighter than the reddest prickly pear, and as proud he was of 
that car, he was prouder of my grandmother. I was a little kid, and didn’t 
know what a looker my grandma was when she dolled up. She still is.

My life’s greatest disappointment is my failure to appreciate the small, 
consistent splashes of color with which God decorates our existence.

If I am very fortunate and Forgiven, possibly my grandchildren might 
drive to visit me.

Written by 
William Todd Patton 

August 5,1952 — December 29,2003

2004 Joy 
Reunion
Yes family and friends, it's that 

time again! Reunion Time!! The 
reunion will be held on April 23, 
24, and 25th at the Old Cotton­
wood Schoolhouse in Cotton­
wood, TX.

Friday, April 23 is our arrival 
date. Come join us as everyone 
begins to arrive and visit! You 
will have to furnish you own 
meals today.

Saturday, April 24th will be the 
fun day!! Join us for fun and 
games for all ages! We will have 
some organized games and com­
petitions as well as the usual 
horseshoes, dominos, cards, soft- 
ball, etc! So bring your game 
equipment. And of course, we 
will do our usual auction of items 
brought by you. So get creative or 
go to the store, but try to bring 
three items to put in the auction to 
help pay for food and building 
costs! A BBQ lunch will be pro­
vided on this day. We ask that you 
please bring a dessert and side 
dish of your choice if possible.

Sunday will be clean up day and 
good-bye day! It is always hard to 
leave once we get together. Come 
help us finish the leftovers, clean 
up and visit some more before 
everyone has to go.

There are overnight sleeping 
accommodations. Camping is al­
lowed on the schoolhouse 
grounds. So bring the campers, 
RV, tents, sleeping bags, etc.! 
Electrical hookups at the school- 
house for RV's, campers, etc. is 
$5.00 per day. You can pay 
PeeWee when you get there. 
There are also several motels you 
can stay at, 36 West Motel in 
Cross Plains (All rooms here are 
booked) or Baird Motor Inn in 
Baird, TX, 5001-20 E, 325-854-' 
2527. You will have to call them 
direct to reserve a room!

If you have any questions, call 
Creshia Bailey 432-530-2501, 
Pat Jones 432-333-6036, or 
PeeWee Joy 431-381-0847. 
We'll see you there!!

APRIL 17
Sandra Terrel
Tracy Michelle Dillard
Brad Calhoun
O.P. Mercer
Glenn Champion, Jr.
Mrs. Ressie Browning 
Richard Ogden 
Donna Lynn (King) Irby 
Shannon Steele 
Linda Fortune 
Claudia Clayton

APRIL 18
Darvel Hutchins 
Marilyn Robinson 
Linda Havener 
Billie Jo (Reed) Fulcher 
William Emery Daniels 
Brett Wheeler 
Joe Coppinger

APRIL 19
Raymond Lynn Tatom 
Dianne (Petty) Alexander 
Ollie Allmond 
Leigh Ann Belew 
Clara Tong 
Gary Self 
Kevin Cheshier 
Earlene Burge 
Justin Whitsitt 
J.W. Newton

APRIL 20
Alan Givins 
Robert Johnson

Rex Archer 
Mrs. Joe Ingram 
Joshua W. Hopkins

APRIL 21
Caroline Wilson
Sheri (Anderson) Johnston
Mrs. Carol Drennan
Richard Sowell
Judy Albrecht Shugart '
Johnny Wooten
Melanie Chesshir
Bobby Perry
Royce Young
W.E. Nowell
Michelle (Richardson) Rudloff 
Khristina Rene Horan

APRIL 22
Marbra Ingram Thompson 
Marcella Martin 
Melanie Bull 
Jan Garrett 
Mrs. Carl Bludworth 
Mrs. Nellie Holmans 
Jessie D. Whiteley 
Jackie Lynn Thomas 
Payton Porter

APRIL 23
Tommie Beryle Conlee 
Carrie (Rogers) Hutton 
Ronnie Purvis 
Bill Driskill 
Mrs. Randall Segura 
Robert Eugene Lee 
Angela Peacock

N O  C D L P  N O  P R O B L E M I
C o m p a n y  S p o n s o r e d  C .P i T r a i n i n g

We are constantly looking for talented 
and motivated people who want to learn 
from & work for the best in the business!

• No experience 
needed

•  No money down
• $35K+1stYear 

earnings
•  New classes wkly

• Med/Dent/Vision, 
401k, Rxcard & 
$50K life insurance

• Owner/Operators 
and experienced 
drivers welcome!

Cross Plains 
Review

A

7
April 15, 2004

w w w . s t e v e n s t r a n s p o r t . c o  m

Diseases may occur 30 to 50 years 
after exposure to asbestos. Many 
workers were exposed from the 1940s 
through the 1970s. Industrial workers 
and spouses (washing clothes) are 
among those at risk for mesothelioma, 
throat cancer, or lung cancer.
Call us for professional insight.

Cappouno CEunnED as above and Others Not Certified 
By The Texas Board Of Legal Specialeation

NO FEE 
FOR

FIRST VISIT
Ryan A. Krebs, MD, JD

(D octor-Lawyer in full time Law Practice)

Richard A. Dodd, L.C. 
Timothy R. Cappolino, P.C.

Board Certifled Personal Injury Trial Law & 
Civil Trial Law, Texas Board of Legal Specialization 

Cameron, Texas

1 -8 0 0 -4 6 0 -0 6 0 6
www.asbestoslaw.com

Memories of Billie Loving
I Brst met Ms. Billie Loving when I won a poetry contest sponsored by the 

Cross Plains Library. She called me up to give me the good news and to chat. 
Over the phone, we shared our love of poetry and writing, an she recited to 
me several poems she had written. We both liked the same kind of literature. 
She invited me to her house where she showed me the many lovely mementos 
and antiques she had acquired during her travels abroad. She gave me to 
understand that she disliked being called “Billie Ruth”, though that’s what 
most folks called her.

Over time, we continued our friendly visits by phone and had many 
hilarious conversations. She got me involved in projects for the library and 
acting as a docent at the Howard House. When I wrote my first magazine 
article, I asked Billie to “vet” it for me. She read it and called me back with 
several good suggestions. When a nationally published travel magazine called 
me to say they wanted to publish it as their featured piece and offered me a 
startling amount of cash for it, I called Billie Loving to share the excitement. 
She literally whooped when I told her. I don’t know who was more elated, 
she or I.
Since then, I have published other articles in magazines and major market 

newspapers. I’ve had my share of “rejection letters”, too, but those don’t 
matter very much to me. Ms. Loving thought that if you could write 
something good and of interest to people, you could eventually find the right 
“niche” for it in publication. She really gave me the encouragement I needed 
to try my hand at writing and to keep at it for the sheer joy of it whether I’m 
published or not.

I’ve just finished my first book of fiction. It’s a book of short stories about 
the people and events in a small West Texas town. Some tales are funny, some 
are sad. I was looking forward to giving her a copy of the manuscript Whether 
the book is any good or not, I don’t know. I think Billie would have liked it 
anyway.

Billie Loving taught and inspired several generations of students. I’m very 
glad that, late in my life, I got to be one of them.

Carol Walt 
Cross Texas Ranch

http://www.xvella.free.fr
http://www.stevenstransport.co
http://www.asbestoslaw.com


CROSS PLAINS REVIEW CLASSIFIED ADS
' 116 S.E, 1st Street - RO. Box 519 - Cross Plains, Texas 76443-(254) 725-6111

Cross Plains Review Only - $3.00 for up to 20 words. 20f̂  each additional word. 
Card of Thanks - $3.00 & up.

Classifieds must be received in the review office by noon Ihesday to be published in 
the current week’s edition.

The Cross Plains Review reserves the rights to reject any and all Classified Ads considered 
by the publisher to be subject objectional in matter, phraseology, or opposed to the interest or 
the policy of the newspaper. No fraudulent, dishonest, or misleading ads will be knowingly 
published in the Cross Plains Review for any cost, injury or liability upon it because of the 
content of any ad so submitted._________

HELP WANTED FOR SALE
SINGERS WANTED - Win a
recording contract Gospel music 
talent competition August 14th, 
Abilene Civic Center. For entry 
form call 1-866-773-4254,3-2tp. 

CARPENTER/CARPENTER 
HELPER WANTED - Lots of 
Work to do! Must have 
transportation. Call Rusty Reed at
254-725-7363. 4-2tc.______________________

HELP NEEDED - Rising Star 
Nursing Center is now accepting 
applications for a Full-Time LVN, 
call 254-643-2681 and ask for 
Rachel or Lori. 3-2tc.

GARAGE SALE

MARY KAY PRODUCTS 
5otfc FOR SALE

Have Stock in Hand! 
FREE Facials

Pam  Croom
Independent Beauty 

Consultant
325-643-4619 or 325-642-1767 

You can also visit 
pcroom @ marykay.com 

www.marykay.com/pcroom
GARAGE SALE - Baby stuff, 
clothes, furniture, lots of misc. 
Saturday and Sunday beginning 
at 8 AM at 733 North Ave E. 4-up. 
GARAGE SALE - Saturday, 
April 17th, 8a.m. to 3p.m., at 308
NE 7th Street. 4-np.___________
MOVING SALE - Saturday, 
April 17th, 8 AM til ? at the home 
of Joe & Delma Coppinger (117 
NE 6th St, 1 block South of gym). 
Dropleaf DR Table, 2 living room 
chairs, Ryobi Gasoline Powered 
Trimmer, compost tumbler, scroll 
saw, lots of good books, some old 
tools, framed paintings, puzzles,
etc, etc. 4 -itc ._________________________________

BIG INSIDE GARAGE SALE 
- Sat. April 17, Old Odom’s Res­
taurant, 124 W. 5th St. (Hwy 36), 
Cross Plains. Lots of Items! Plus 
some antiques! 4-itc.

AUTO FOR SALE
1994 CHEVY PICKUP FOR 
SALE - Will make a good Farm 
Truck, 5 speed, call 254-725- 
4922.4 -itp

M OBILE HOM ES
TARLETON BOUND? 
MOBILE HOME FOR SALE
- 3BD/2B, 14 X 76 single wide in 
Stephenville, $6,000 OBO. Call 
254-968-8959.4tfc

REAL ESTATE

REPAIRS

FO R  SALE IN CROSS 
PLAINS- Restruant building and 
Warehouse, 124 W. 5th Street 
Hwy 36.; Also the Ratliff Supply 
Building 116 W 5th Street Hwy 
36, call 254-725-4267.2tfc

LAWN MOWER REPAIRS -
Will pick-up and deliver. Call 
Danny at 254-725-4450.2-etp

PETS FOR SALE

M USIC LESSONS
FIDDLE LESSONS - Call 
Daley at 254-725-6654. 4-itp 
CADDO PEA K  PIANO 
LESSONS - Prefer beginners, 
call 254-725-6569 leave name 
and number. iMp

AKC GERMAN SHEPHERD 
PUPPIES - Parents of premises, 
2 males,$175 each,254-725-6654.
45tfc

FOR RENT
3BD/2BATH, $325/mo.,$150/ 
dep. Call 254-725-6654.4-i,p

More than 200 Garage Sales
Bosque Countywide Garage Sales

F r id a y  &  S a t u r d a y ,  A p r i l  2 3 - 2 4 ,  2 0 0 4

Ind iv idu als , B u s in esses  and O rg an iza tio n s  
are  having  sa les  o f a ll kinds!

For information, call (254) 435-2331 or (254) 675-3720

UPCOMING MIKE JONES AUCTIONS 'k
K-FABRICATION &  WELDING K. HILL ESTATE

TUES • APRIL 20 • 10 A.M. 
2702-B N. NICHOLS • FT. WORTH, TX 

W elders • Tank Rolls • Shear

SAT* APRIL2 4 *  10A .M .
ERA, TX > 65± ACRES W/3 BR BRICK 

Antiques 'G o ld  Coins • Oil P aintings
Forklift • Hyster C arry Crane R ED  R IV E R  C LA SSIC  C A R  A U C T IO N

KROGER SUPERMARKET SAT < MAY 22 • 10 A.M.
1 THUR • APRIL 22 • 10 A.M. GAINESVILLE FACTORY OUTLET

SE CORNER OF 1-35 & LOOP 288 R EN T A L  G A LA X Y  • LEW ISV ILLE TX

1 DENTON, TX • Complete Liquidation | SUN • MAY 23 *1 P.M. • 1297 FM 407

LEARN AUCTIONEERING * 972*387*4200 • Dallas, TX
GO TO MJAUCT10NS.COM k  972'387<1110 tx67s6

B A R R E T T  C O L L ISIO N  C EN TER
CLAUD CHAMPION 

(915) 677-2924 
(FAX)'677-4601

ROCKY CHAMPION 
214 North Leggett 

Abilene, Texas 79603

I I I HESSTON
I AOCSI

"Come Our M̂ ay & Trade Your Way" 
PARKER IMPLEMENT COMPANY

3542 S. Treadaway 
Abilene, Texas 79602 

(915) 695-0000 or 1-800-588-7100

aOSHBOG*
v v

MASSEY FERGUSON

BUSINESS SERVICES

M EN ’S DRESS W ESTERN 
SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS -
Pearl Snaps, 2 pockets, 14 1/2 to 
20, Tall Men sizes, $17.99; 
Johnson’s Dry Goods, Cross 
Plains (254) 725-6211.4-iu.

WATERWELL DRILLING 
Pump Sales & Service 

TX Lie 1864PKW 
Jimmy D. Wilson 

(254) 725-6120

COX CONSTRUCTION
Remodeling & New 

Construction S2tfc. 

We Do T'fie ComjjCete JoS 
‘PCumSing St (ECectric 

Ceramic T'iCe St T a in ting  
(254)725-6731 (254)643-7003

Cell - 254-433-7248 
SUN RAYZ  

Tanning & Gifts
Circle E Candles 

The Faith Collection 
(Wind Chimes & More) 

Willow Tree Angels 
Greeting Cards

Silver Jewelry, Designer Purses 
(254) 725-4578 24tfc.

M ODERN  
HOUSE LEVELING

THE PROFESSIONAL 
LEVELING CO.

(915) 643-4767
________ Brownwood

C & C Handyman 
Service

Contact Cliff Kirkham 
Call 254-725-6500

Cattle Processing and Hauling, 
Carpentry, Lawn Care, 

Plumbing and Etc. 32tfc

" Will Do
Light H ousekeeping  

& Light Cooking  
CaU

254-725-6863

CARD OF THANKS

A special thank you to all those 
who have assisted during and 
following my fall and subsequent 
period of recuperation.
A number of you called, came 

by, visited me in the hospital, 
nursing home, as well as at home. 
Some brought food, many offered 
up prayers, helped monetarily, 
held my hand, offered comforting 
thoughts and words, offered 
prayers, expressed concern, 
provided rides, and helped in any 
other way our hearts go out to you 
in gratitude and Christian Love. 
For the rides provided which 
enabled Marvin to visit me both 
in the hospital and then in the 
nursing home, our deepest thanks.
A particularly LARGE NOTE 

OF THANKS to Pastor Ronnie B. 
White, Deacon Tom Dunn, First 
Baptist Church, John Swift, the 
Cross Plains Garden Club, and 
also to the Cross Plains EMS 
Personnel.

Kay Mosley

CARD OF THANKS
Perhaps you sent a lovely card, 

or sat quietly in a chair. Perhaps 
you sent a floral piece, if so we 
saw it there. Perhaps you spoke 
the kindest words, as any friend 
could say, perhaps you were not 
there at all, just thought of us that 
day. Whatever you did to console 
our hearts, we thank you so much 
whatever the part.
A special thanks to the ladies of 

the Cottonwood Quilting Club 
and the folks of the Cottonwood 
Community for all the food and 
support.

The Family of 
Ray Nell Duncan

QassifiedAds 
Get Results 
Place One 

254-725-6111

JOHN DEERE TRACTORS
NEW AND USED 

PEANUT EQUIPMENf 
LILlilSTON-KMC

PLANTERS-DISKS-DRILLS 
ROLLING CULTIVATORS 

CHISELS

SELL OR TRADE 
CLARK TRACTOR & SUPPLY, 

INC.
DELEON -  (254)893-2061 

COMANCHE -  (915) 356-2593 
WHERE YOUR BUSINESS 

IS APPRECIATED

Cross Plains Review April 1 5 ,2 0 (^

RUSSELL - SURLES TITLE, INC.
TITLE INSURANCE - ABSTRACTS

Cly d e -b a ir d
Representing; Alanlo Title, First American Title and United General 

Clyde, Texas Baird, T exas
120 Oak Street 337 Market St.
P.O.Box 499 P.O.Box 938

Clyde, TX 79510 ' Baird, TX 79504
Ph: (915) 893-4227 Ph: (915) 854-1115
Fax: (915) 893-4229 ' Fax: (915) 854-1459

PredIdent: Andrew Ladyman, Attorney

Joe Tharne^—RPh 1 ^
Palace Drug | i

P rescrip tion s
D cli\cr - Friday

Major Insurance
Medicaid - Tricare for Life 

Gifts - .99t Cards
254-643-3231

100 N. Main, Rising Starj4t ^

Sprinkler Systems
Installation & Service

L I 7119
TURNER LANDSCAPE 

IRRIGATION 
(254)725-7755 
(915)669-5553 

WATERWHEELS
Sales & Service 

5 4 5 7 0 P  42-6tp.

Buffalo Game 
Room

341 W. 4th Street

OPEN:
Mon.- Sat. 10am-8pm 

Sun. lpm-8pm  
(254) 725-4602

No Alcoholic Beverages

CISCO FAMILY  
CH IRO PRACTIC

Mcdicarc/Medicaid
Accepted

Dr. Devin Koenig, D.C. 
1510 State Hwy 206 

(254) 442-4878

i
I

Big Mack’s Auto
254-725-6186 

Hours: M-F 8-5
Foreign & Domestic 

Cars, Pickups & Diesels
ASE Certified Mechanic

Will Work On Check Engine Lights, 
CV Joints & Axles, AC Work & 

Power Steering

Owned By: Mack McConal

CARPET & 
CARPET CLEANING

10 Samples of in Stock 
Carpet Installed with 1/2" 
Pad for Under $13 sq. yd. 

Cleaning Resident or
Commercial.

FREE ESTIMATES 
ALL SERVICES.

DUB MEADOR
(2541725-7720

BUGBUSTER
Pest 

Control 
(254) 725-6740 
1-866-725-6740 
(254) 725-4490 

Professional Service
at Small Town Prices

Cross Plains, Texas

C r o s s  P l a i n s
B u s in e ss  S e r v ic e

Income Tax Preparation 
E-File Available 
Accounting

Julene Franke 
(254) 725-7712 
(254) 725-7434

I
C A R O U T H

CONSTRUCTION
Metal buildings. 
Custom Homes, 

and Cabinets

Rickey Carouth 
(254) 725-7515 

MobUe (915) 660-3207 
Cross Plains, Texas

I
A U T O W IR E
G et those troublesom e  

wiring problems fixed on 
your pickup, trailer, RV, 

Car, tractor, or accessories  
Fix It O n ce!
Fix it Right!

105 W. College Rising Star
(254) 643-6255 

1-888-FIX-WIRE

I
I

FARMERS MUTUAL p  
Protective Association p  

Lodge 198 i

Home Insurance p
Steve Propest p

Local Agent 
(254) 725-4747 

Fax (254) 725-6617

S t r e n g t h ’s
P a i n t  & b o d y
I I filock Soiiih of Rcil I .iulii)

All Work Garanteed!

(254) 725-6514
|I3-4tc.

UNIERBUILDINO& 
CONCRETE CONSTffUCTION
Remodeling Add-ons 
Cabinets

J

50-tfc

I

II
FORTUNE

CONSTRUCTION

licensed Septic System Installer 
Dozer, Backlioe, Truck - 

T ren rh in g a n i] D irt Construction
Trey Home 254-725-4569 

Cell 325-665-5725 
Steve Home 254-725-7307 

Cell 325-669-6984

f

Need Your H om e or  
B usiness Spiffy 

in a Jiffy?

CALL ME! 
Honest, Dependable 

Reliable, Experienced 
Cleaning Service 
Shannon Nichols 

254-725-4667

f
i

i

Gary Lanier
Home: 254-725-4992 
Cell: 325-642-3160

6750 CR 411 West 
Cross Plains, TX 76443

< ///// / / / // / / // / / / // / / / // / / // / / / ,

New Tires Used Tires

T & K TIRE  
& ALIGNM ENT

300 W. 4th
Cross Plains, TX 76443
(254) 725-6223

Tractor or Truck Tires 
Front-End Alignment 

Brakes

I
HART LAND & 

CATTLE
Registered Brangus

Rodger Hart, CiRl 
Real Estate Broker

254-725-4398 
PLobiie 325-669-3335
W  il3-4TC

I

Rick Carouth
Backhoe

&
Forklift Service

Sand & Gravel Hauling 
Rickey Carouth 
(254) 725-7515 

Mobile (915) 660-3207 
Cross Plains, Texas

W ATER W E I.L  
D R IL L IN G

Drilled & Completed to 
State Specifications 

Test Holes 
Pump Installation 

TX Licensp#1864PKW 
35 years drilling experience
' Jimmy D. Wilson

To  A dvertise

IN THIS Space i

iiG u it h e

Gloss P l a in s  %

R E E D
C O N S T R IC T IO N
When In Need Call Reed

Concrete - Painting 
Tape & Bed & Texture

Home (254) 725-7363
Pager (325) 734-0932

License # 4047

The Vine
Matting & 
Framing

By
Tom & Mary Dunn

(254) 725-7136

G & G
SPORTING t;0 ( ) l)S  

240 N. Miiin St. 
(254) 725-4671

Custom Screen Printing, 
Embroidery, & Heat Press. 
T-shirts,Caps,Windsuits, 

Towels, etc.
2otfcCome See Us!

http://www.marykay.com/pcroom
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(254)
JONES REAL ESTATE 

725-6163
ROLAN JONES, BROKER

Email: rlestate@crossplains.com - Webpage: www.crossplains.com
ACREAGE:
* 11.41/A, waterwell, fenced, native grass, good home site. $1,500/A
* 20/A, on pavement, 5 miles from town unimproved, $20,000 Callahan Co.
* 22.895/A out of Eula, storm cellar, shop building, septic system, fenced, water meter, good home site, ready to 
go. $65,000
* 30/A, Denton Valley area, 1 pond, good hunting of Deer, Turkey, Quail, Dove. $1,500/A.
NEW LISTING--32.79/A, close to Cross Plains, 2 ponds, 1 spring fed. Fish, Deer, Turkey, Wild Hogs, Dove, 
Equipment shed on pavement. Oak, Live oak and Mesquite. Goat fenced. Rural water available. $38,000 
*130/A, central Callahan Co., G w d J w i^ g , 3 stock ponds, approx .8/A in food plots, good cover, fair fences. 
Deer, Turkey, Quail, Dove, H og ir> 8^ m
* 171.80/A, Excellent farm land, good fences, 1 tank, some brush. $550/A. Call Mike
* 190/A, 2 ponds, Mesquite, Live Oak, good grass, excellent hunting. Rural water line. South West of 
Cross Plains. $1,200/A
* 380/A, Excellent hunting, fishing, 3 ponds, small lake, good fences. Quail, Deer, Turkey, Dove. Southwest of 
Cross Plains. $1,200/A.
* 384.91/A, Stephens Co., 1,400 Sq. Ft. Farm House, 8 miles N. of Cisco, 4 ponds, water well, out buildings. 
Good hunting. $343,680
* 485/A - 15/A, lake, 240/A, Coastal, 2 center pivot irrigation systems, springs, well, hunting and fishing, very 
productive. West of Cross Plains. $1,000/A
ACREAGE WITH HOME:
NEW LISTING— Approx. 1.5/A, Beautifully landscaped, 2,400 sq. ft. 3bd/3bth, 2 story home, 2 car garage, 
sun room, deck, central H/A, gas fire place, detached office building and storage/garage, many large trees. City 
water and water well. Out of City limits. Cross Plains. $179,000.
* 1/A with 1,880 sq. ft. 3 bd/1 3/4 Bath, nice, close to town, metal roof, city water and water well.
Cross Plains. $55,000
* 29/A with 3/2 Nice Mobile Home, 2 large decks, stock pond, approx 8/A in coastal. Good hunting, 2 miles out 
of town on pavement. $75,000
* 93.85/A with 2,624 sq. ft. Brick home. Central H/A, fireplace, wood stove, glassed in sun porch, large trees, 
on pavement, guest house, 3 bams, creek, new fences, pond, some Coastal, good hunting. Western Eastland Co. 
$280,000.
* 106/A, older 2 bd/ 1 bath farm home, p o le ^ ^ b a ^  cross fenced. Approx 60/A. Coastal Bermuda, and 46/A 
brush, good hunting, water well, on pavememf^lilmian Co. $115,000.
* 113/A in Brown Co., 2/1 bath farm hom^ fi^dwspndition, bam, pens, good fences, 3 ponds, water well. Large 
hill,, 1/2 Coastal and 1/2 Native pasture. T raW W
* 341/A Paradise, super hunting, secluded,.heavy wildlife cover, spring, ponds, excellent underground water, 
new 1,344 sq. ft. 2/2 1/2 bath house, large fireplace. 32’ X 30 ft. bam with 30’ X 12’ shed, new storm cellar, 
Eastland County. $1,400 Firm.

FOR MORE LISTINGS GO TO: wwvt^.crossplains.com 
MIKE WINFREY (325) 669-9651 STACI WINFREY (325) 669-9658

CALLAHAN REALTY
Rodger Hart - GRI, Broker 254/725-4398 home 325/669-3335, mobile

Tom Ames, Agent 254/725-6375 home 325/668-4157, mobile
ACREAGE:
* 80/A Near Hico. Bosque River frontage. Big trees, very pretty. $1,995/A.
* 208/A Brown Co., Good hunting and grass. 4 stock tanks. $900/A. Owner finance.
* 49/A Mix of good coastal, some pasture, and about 6/A of oak woods. Fenced and cross fenced 
with one stock tank. Good building site with FM 374 frontage and good strong underground water. 
$1,350/A
ACREAGE WITH HOME:
* Very attractive Victorian style home on 3.3/A (+/-), 3BR/2B downstairs one large room upstairs 
could be 4thBR or game room etc. Large pens, bam presently being used for pre-conditioning 
cattle. Could be used for cattle or horses. $120,000.
* Nice 3/2/2 Brick w/ CHA and woodbuming fireplace. 22/A  coastal. Pretty house site with 2 tanks
(one spring fed), good water well. New metal 20’ X 40’ bam/shop has concrete floor in shop. 
Fronts on Hwy 36 7 mi E. of Cross Plains. (CPISD). Deer, Turkey, and Dove, water aLtank on 
back of property.-$140,000. «
* Farm House and 10/A 3 miles east of Cross Plains. Big trees & water well. $50,000.
* Older house on 2 1/2 acres. At Pioneer. Will have a Westbound water meter. $10,000. 
BUSINESS:
* Brick home, 3BR/2B, CH/A, privacy fence, comer lot, metal shop building, vehicle storage, 
fenced, other outbuilding, presently used for wrecking yard and classic car restoration. Adaptable 
for many uses. Price reduced due to health problems. $115,000.
* 48 unit apartment complex near Lake Hubbard. Good investment opportunity. $1,2(X),000.
* 49 unit self-storage complex in San Angelo. Good cash flow. $130,000.
* 5(XX) sq. ft. Brick bldg. On Hwy 36 in Rising Star. Motel/Retirement Home with 3/2 home in 
west end. $70,000. Owner finance with 25% down.

Need Listings— Call to Discuss Com m ission Rates

IT PAYS 
*  TO

ADVERTISE
C A L L  (254 )72 5 -6 1 1 1  

116 S. E. 1st Street, Cross Plains, TX

WHEN RENEWING 
YOUR

SUBSCRIPTION TO 
THE

CROSS PLAINS 
REVIEW 

PLEASE BRING 
THE

RENEWALCARD 
SENT TO YOU 
IN THE MAIL 
THANK YOU

BI-RITE AUTO
4 B LO C K S E. O F L K iH T-C R O SS PLAINS 

PH O N E 254-725-7361 
Closed F riday  & Siiiidav

CASH SPECIALS GOOD THRU APRIL 25 ,2004
Finance Cash

90 Pontiac Bonneville, 4DR, Runs good ... $1,295.................... $895
86 OLDS Cutlas, 4DR, Runs,Looks good.... $995 ........................$750
88 Lincoln Cont,V6,Runs good, Nice Car ....$995......................... $795
91 Ford Probe,Runs good (White)...............$1 ,450 ................... $1,250
87Dodge Dakota L.W.B.,V6,Very Clean..... $1 ,650 ................ $1,450

TRUCKS-VANS-ETC.
82 Ford F250 Super Cab,V8, Auto, Runs good, H.D. Towing Package..$l,450 
82 Chev. 1 Ton Dually W recker.................................................. $2,100
92 Ford F250 Diesel Super Cab,Cold Air, Runs,Drives,good......$3,250
85 Ford F250 Diesel Super Cab, Very clean & good...................$2,850
84 Ford F350 Diesel Dually, Steel Flat Bed, good condition........ $1,950
88 Ford F150 4X4 Super Cab, 300,6 cyl, good condition.......... $1,975
86 G.M.C. Jimmy, 2.8,4cyl., Automatic, Runs good.......................$1,195
81 Ford F150 Super Cab,V8, Auto, Cold Air, Nice interior. Towing Package$l,495

AUTOMOBILES
7  T. Bird, 3.8 V6, A good clean car & cheap at............................... $3,595
5 Lincoln Town Car, Go First Class For ONLY.............................$3,250

95 Mazda Protgee, 4 cyl. In Good Condition..................................$2,250
93 Taurus, 3.8 V6, Runs good........................................................... $1,950
94 Mercury Sable, 3.8 V6, It’s a good car for................................. $2,295
94 Pontiac Grand Am, A nice, clean good car.................................$1,995
87 Buick Park Ave, In Good Condition ....WAS $1,095...... NOW $995
91 Lincoln Cont, Clean inside & out.......WAS $1,250...... NOW $1,150
90 Lincoln Town Car, V8, Leather, Looks,Runs Good.......  ............$1,575
88 Lincoln Town Car, A Good One For ONLY.................................$950
IN BUSINESS IN CROSS PLAINS OVER 50 YEARS

WE BUY-SELL-TRADE & FINANCE

DORA SMITH
Real Estate Broker

NORA ODOM
Agent

(254) 725-6840

* 2BD/11/2B, carport, fenced. 
Detached Apt. IBD, 3/4B,
garage/shop, 740 S. Main 
*3BD/1B, 3 plus lots, .530 
acres. Corner of E. 2nd and 
Apple.
* COUNTRY U V IN G --5  
ac., h eav ilw -^ b ^ ed , ideal 
h o m e s ite ,^ fr  Hwy 206, 8 
miles north.REDUCED
* FO R M E R  BUY-RITE 
READY FO R  S A L E - 
Qualifies for Interim Reim­
bursement Program, equip, 
inclii^lfed. N. Main CALL 
T O D A t!
* QUADRAPLEX- Each unit 
2BD/1B, utility room, CH/A, 
GREAT INVESTMENT
* CITY BLOCK plus 2 lots, 
commercial or res. $600 per lot, 
behind Charlies, SW 4th.
* E. HWY 36 FRONTAGE- 
Lots for res., bldg., site or Ig. 
com. yard, 145 feet, 24 X 36 
office, extra storage bldg.
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LAND & REAL ESTATE

Toll Free: (877) 805-5550
Coleman, Texas 76834 

www.liveoak-realtors.com

CHARLES CHESSHIR
BROKER/OWNER

(325)625-4181
R ESIDENTIAL

CR 421 - 4BR-1 3/4B modular home, CH/A, shade trees, shrubs, flowers, edge of town___________
Lake Coleman - 3 lots ready to build your dream home on, 1 has lake frontage___________________
100 X 140 lot in Cross Plains - Large shade trees, beautiful building site, near school & downtown_ 
152 Mountain St. - 3BR-1B, w / i4 i iN O E R  i C O N ^ R A O T t t .  great potential,_______
159 Lakeview - 5BR-3B brick and cedar home, completely redone, boat dock and storage, 
260 Edgewood - 3BR-2B home, new paint in & out, new carpet, linoleum, cabinets, etc.__
301 N. Ave. E - Great 2BR-1B home on huge corner lot with plenty of oak trees & large porch,
517 NE 5th - 2BR-1B, fireplace, shade trees, large fenced pen w/coastal, barns_____________
2.5 Ac. - 3BR-2B, fire place, covered deck, pretty yard, good location, 1 tank.
2.6 Ac. - 2 or3BR-2 1/2B, fireplace, nice kitchen, lots of cabinets, prop, to center of rive___
5 Ac. - 3BR-1B, large oaks, pine t itW 4 B W E I^ n 0 O N v F R A '© T o n ta g e ______________
7.953 Ac. - Nice 3BR-2B home secluded in oak trees, oak cabinets, oak floors, water well, 
10 Ac. & Home - Red barn, 4 iN 'E )E f% > I ^ O W T R A O ^ k ,  hwy frontage, Co. water_
10 Ac. - Highway frontage, water well, electricity, good home site, mostly open__________
17.124 Ac. - Nice 1/1 week-end cabin, live oak & mesquite, 1 tank_____________________

,45,000  
. 26,500 
_  6,000 
.21,500 
. 90,000
46.500 

,34,900
27.500 

. 78,000
67.500 

.58,000 

.95,000
79.500 

. 20,000 

.67,500

HUNTING  & RECREATIO NAL PR O P ER TY

20 Ac. - Scattered brush, 2 water draws, good deer, quail, & dove hunting.
40 Ac. - 4BR/3B brick home, 2566 sq.ft., beautiful covered patio.mesquite.oak, deer & dove
42.69 Ac. - Very pretty home site, live oaks, 1 tank, paved road, deer, turkey and dove_______
43.95 Ac. Beautiful hills, lots of oak & cedar cover, good deer & turkey population___________
50 +/- Ac. - Pretty building site with coastal & large oaks, good water well
66.5 Ac. - 2BR/2B, nice k itc y f^ ® R D u @ O N ^ T R A l® T s .  very good hunting____________
75 Ac. -1  tank, rural water, electricity, oak trees, good hunting, Stephens County____________
164 Ac. - 2 tanks, beautiful place, remote, rolling hills, great hunting.
168 Ac. - Rolling hills, with great deer hunting, pecan, live oak, & post oak, N of Eastland, 
720 Ac. - Rolling hills, good elect. & hunter’s cabin___

— 40.000 
-195,000  
— 59,766 
— 87,500 
-1,500/Ac 
-155,000 
-123,000 
. 288,900 
-275,000 

468,295

Buying or Selling

Let Our Team “PUT YO U R  NEEDS F IR S T”

Your FIRST Call fo r Personal Professional Service
Erlene Barker 325-625-2876 Phil Schaefer 254-725-7140 Doug Dallas 254-631-6870
Karen Lenz 254-725-4023 Andy Needham 325-636-7750 Charles Chesshir 254-725-7119

We Can Help You Get Connected to the 
INTERNET Today!
Call Vanda or Amber at the 

Cross Plains Review (254) 725-6111

Mike's 
Tire & lube

209 So. Access Rd. West
Oil Change, Batteries,
Flats Fixed, New Tires,

Windshield Wipers
Mon. Fri. 8am-6pm 

Sat. 8 am-Noon
Mike Nigar - Owner

Cross Plains
Masonic Lodge 

No. 627

Stated Meeting 
1st Thursday, 7:30 p.m.

www.cross-plains.tx-mm-org 
www.gltexas.org 

Sec. (254) 725-7530

To Guarantee 
Publishing In The 
Current Week's 
Paper, PLEASE 

Have Articles in Bv 
2p.m. Monday and 

Ads bv Noon on 
Tuesday of that 

vreek

TEXAS STATEWIDE CLASSIFIED ADVERTISING NETWORK
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t
I
f
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COMPANY DRIVERS, GREAT YOU CAN DO it all with the FREE 4-ROOM DIRECTV
opportunities if you live in TX, OK, Texas Army N ational Guard. SYSTEM including installation! 
LA, AR! Regional-10 states (70%), Get paid for training, earn a 125+channels, including locals, from 
home weekly. $600-$800 OTR, great sk ill and go to school $29.99/month.Digitalpicture/sound. 
start .32 cents. Excellent benehts to earn your degree. D on’t let Limitedoffer. Plus shipping. Restric- 

Note: It is illegal to be paid for include 401k, 6 months plus T/T th is o p p o rtu n ity  pass. C a ll tion£^££l^^^2;80^26^45^ 
anything beyond medical and legal experience with A/CDL. Bob or 1-800-GO-GUARD today! 
expenses in Texas adoption. Rick, 1-800-666-0380, National
.......................... ......... .......^  Freight, Inc. www.natlfreight.com
ADOPTION. LOVING COUPLE _ ;  HEALTHCARE FOR ENTIRE
promises baby secure future. Full- d r iv e r s  - $$MO MONEY, MO Iy $9 9 95  monthly No
time mom, grandparents, pets, out- P/’’ ANNOUNCEMENT: NOW restrictions, includes dental,
door sports, educational o p p o r t u n i - H I R I N G  2004 postal positions, vision, pre-existing conditions 
ties. Expenses paid. Call Stacey/ S r n ' l T w e k o L ^ ’^^^^^^ $14.80-$38.00+/hr. No experi- accepted. unlimited usage,
Carlos, 1-800-201-9842 or attorney, ! w S n c  com^gonwen^ n ecessary . E ntry  level 500.000 doctors. 1-800-807-9769,

TexSCAN Week of 
April 11, 2004
ADOPTION

HEALTH
INSURANCE

1-800-242-8770. DRIVER COVENANT
with full benefits. Paid training, lim itedtim eoffer
Call 7 days for inform ation . 
1-888-826-2513, Ext. 966.

REAL ESTATE
A F IR S T  T IM E  O F F E R .

PREGNANT? CONSIDERING TRANSPORT. Teams and Solos 
ADOPTION? We can help. We check out our new pay plan, 
specialize in matching families with Owner/Operators, Experienced ANNOUNCEMENT; NOW iq o  a c res  - $ 4 4 ,900 .
birthmothers nationwide. Toll Free D i'v e rs , Solos, Teams and HIRING for 2004 postal j r ^ p h y  w h ite ta ils  and mule
24 hours a dav 1-866-921-0565 Federal h ire .^ g g r . R o l l in g  h i l l s  and
24 hours a day. MORE PAY (1-888-667-3729). $ 1 6 .00 -$ 4 8 .0 0 + /h r. Full g^^g, g ^ .^ s s . Abun-

DRIVER TRAINEES NEEDED. benefits/Paid training and vaca-jjgnf tu rk e y , q u a i l ,  sm a llOne True Gift Adoptions.

BUSINESS
OPPORTUNITY

Learn to drive for Covenant! Local tions. No experience necessary, ggj^g M ore a v a ila b le . E-Z 
15 day CDL training now available! F- Success, 1-866-317-0558, Texas Land &

1.800. VENDING,90MACHINES- 1-800-336-2669.___________ ___ ------------------------- R a n ch es , 1 -8 6 6 -8 9 9 -5 2 6 3 .
$9,120. The best locations, jjr jy e r s  t r u c k s  § £ 7  [q ^5 * * F E D E R A L ^S T A L  JOBS*'* AREA NEW
1.800. «36.3464.24hou„.--------mphi $2500 experienced drive, 40 . c r e r  o n , ,
ARE YOU MAKING $1000 per New tr.inee pa,I w L ,  pnirBeoefirt D&LMarke,.
week? A!) cash vending routes With Yg|^j^g([jgj^ ^g(Qf,ggl QQL j^gjj,. 1 800-842-1622 Ext 448 N a tio n a l F o re s t. S tu n n in g

^ -----------------  land  o u ts id e  R u id o so
vending

oriine locations available now! . ___------------------------------------------------ —  lauu  u u i&iug inuiuu^u m
Under $9,000 investment required. ing available. Swift Transportation. jq b s  FOR 2004. be a u t i f uV and" 6 5*00 f U 7 l e v'a

/OA I 1 ‘ 8 6 6 - 3 3 3 - O O U  i , nn/hr PaiH frainina FullCall Toll Free, (24-7), Liberty
Routes, 1-800-963-2654 www.swifttnickingjobs.com

EMPLOYMENT
OPPORTUNITY

$16.20-$39.00/hr. Paid training. Full tion L inco ln  County. A dja- 
benefits. No experience necessary, cent to N ational forest abut- 
Green card OK. Call Exam Prepara-ting co n serv a tio n  p reserve. 
tion, 1-866-895-3696, Ext. 5656. G reat elk and deer area.

Remote and private but with 
year round road access and 
s till an EZ drive to exciting

FINANCIAL
SERVICES

HOME INSPECTION TRAIN­
ING 5 day hands -on course. TREC 
approved for forty hours. Spon­
sorships available. ASHI MRC’s CALI BOUND. NOW hiring 

-NAHI CEU’s-CREIACEC’s. Build-sharp outgoing people to travel
ing Specs, Inc. 1-800-217-7979, enti're US representing top sport, ^ ^ ^ A ™  NOW for stnic-Ruidoso. B est f inancing  in

u ij- .-o V , . /  t , -  turedsettlements, annuities andmsur-years 1-866-350-5263.www.buildingspecs.com------------- fashion and news publications. 1-800-794-7310. J.G. ^
Expense paid training with Wentworth.... J.G. Wentworth means 
base guarantee. Daily-weekly-cash now for structured settlements.

DRIVERS
WANTED

Run Your Ad in TexSCAN!

monthly bonuses. T r a n s p o r t a - S T R U C T U R E D  
A/CDL DRIVERS: MINIMUM tion and hotel provided with settlement/annuity payments. It’s 
6 months OTR. Team runs to return trip guaranteed. Call Elite your money! Get cash now when 
West Coast-Late model equipment-g gjgj  ̂ 1-800-282-0381. Call you need it most. Oldest/best in the 
Great pay, miles and benefits. Call (Q^ay-start tomorrow. business. Settlement Purchasers.
Steve Mox Trucking. Ask for Marci------------------------------------------- - i 077 Mnncv-Mi*
1-800-253-5148. GET PAID FOR EATING! Post- ^

FOR SALEATTENTION D RIV ERS/ menopausal women needed for -rAM Mivr
TEAM S, E .,n  mow per mile “  week line-in nulrition , led,.
with us! Generous hometime and Fly to North Dakota at pgy^g^^^ 529/month.
great benefits. Mesilla Valley expense! 1-800-562-4032, FREE color catalog. Call today.
Transportation, 1-888-562-4342. www.gfhnrc.ars.usda.gov 1-888-839-5160.
NOTICE: While most advertisers are reputable, we cannot guarantee products or services advertised. We urge readers to use caution and when in doubt, contact 
the Texas Attorney General at 1-800-621-0508 or the Federal Trade Commission at 1-877-FTC-HELP. The FTC web site is www.ftc.gov/bizop________

Statewide Ad. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .$400
307 Newspapers, 1.1 Million Circulation

North Region Only.. . . . . . . $175
102 Newspapers, 377,000 Circulation

South Region Only.. . . . . . . $175
102 Newspapers, 465,000 Circulation

West Region Only..... . . . . $175
103 Newspapers, ̂ / ) 0 0  Circulation

To Order: Call This Newspaper 
direct, or call Texas Press Service 

at 1-800-749-4793 Today!

Extend your advertising reach with TexSCAN, your Statewide Classified Ad Network.

mailto:rlestate@crossplains.com
http://www.crossplains.com
http://www.liveoak-realtors.com
http://www.cross-plains.tx-mm-org
http://www.gltexas.org
http://www.natlfreight.com
http://www.swifttnickingjobs.com
http://www.buildingspecs.com
http://www.gfhnrc.ars.usda.gov
http://www.ftc.gov/bizop


JOYCE ODOM CELEBRATES HER “90TH” BIRTHDAY—  
Mrs. Odom’s children honored her with a 90th birthday 
celebration. Pictured are Virginia Trevey (back, from left), and 
Ivon Jr.; Nancy Palmer (front, from left) and Joyce Odom.

Joyce Odom Honored 
on Her 90th Birthday

ZACH EDINGTON AND MANDI CAUTHEN

Joyce Odom’s daughters and 
sons-in-law, Virginia and Ralph 
Trevey and Nancy and Charles 
Palmer, and son, Ivon Odom, 
hosted a “90th” Birthday 
Celebration at the Family Life 
Center, First Baptist Church, 
Cross Plains, on April 4, from 2 
to 4 p.m.

Guests were from Abilene, 
Baird, Clyde, Tuscola, Potosi, 
Rowden, May, Snyder, Paint 
Rock, the state of Colorado and 
Cross Plains.

The serving table was centered 
by a fresh spring bouquet of 
flowers, flanked by a cake that 
was inscribed “Happy Birthday— 
Mama Joyce” with rainbow 
colored napkins. Pam and Evelyn 
Harris, nieces, served cake and 
punch, nuts and mints. The 
registry table had a handmade 
registry book created by Nancy.

The table for guests to enjoy 
refreshments was centered with 
cloth covered flower pots filled 
with petunias. They were

prepared by Virginia.
Cherished old and new friends 

and kin were registered by 
Jennifer Stewart, Joyce’s grand­
daughter of Snyder. Michal 
Palmer, grandson of Paint Rock, 
took pictures and also made a 
video throughout the event.

Kin who attended were: Nicky, 
Evelyn, Chris, T.J. and Emily 
Harris, Jimmy and Pam Harris, 
Becky Odom, Gary and Patty 
Odom, Mariam Odom Scott, 
Tom and Phyllis Harris, John 
Stewart, grandson, and Ryleigh 
Stewart, great-granddaughter. 
Scott Trevey of Lubbock sent his 
grandmother a letter and David 
Trevey, grandson of Snyder, 
called on his way home.

Ryleigh, 2-year old great grand­
daughter, added innocence and 
beauty all dressed up in a Jumper 
with pantalettes.

“It was and will be a memorable 
occasion for me. The well wishes 
and beautiful cards will be 
cherished,” Joyce remarked.

CaTt^7.Thurm ^ Cauthen-Edington 
to be Wed May 15th Engagement Told

June Wedding PlannedRon and Sherrian Conway of 
Cross Plains would like to 
announce the engagement and 
approaching marriage of their son 
David Allen Carter to Miss 
Tammy Lynn Thurman, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Doyle Thurman 
of Mt. Selman.

Mr. Carter graduated from 
Midway High School in Waco, 
and Tarleton State University in 
Stephenville. He is currently 
employed as Parts Manager for 
M ilk Transport Services in

Stephenville. Miss Thurman 
graduated from Jacksonville High 
School in Jacksonville. She is a 
licensed Massage Therapist, and 
is currently employed at the 
Jacksonville Hospital. Mr. Carter 
is the grandson of Mrs. Wilma 
Tarlton, formerly of Brownwood, 
and the late Dr. A.L. Tarlton.

The wedding will take place on 
May 15, 2004 in Frankston. 
Following a honeymoon in 
Hawaii, the couple will reside in 
Stephenville.

t r o s s  Plains Review^ National
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April 15, 2004

Join us for a

Downright Hilarious Evening
featuring

Award winning
Cowboy poet / humorist / storyteller

Dennis Gaines
&

Chili Supper
Benefiting the

Cross Plains Public Library 
Friday, April 16, 2004

Family Life Building of
1st Baptist Church 

3rd & Main
Cross Plains, Texas

Free Chili Dinner 6:00 pm 
(donations accepted) 

Performance at 7:30 pm 
$7. adult / $4. for 12 & under

For more information call the Cross Plains Public Library at 725-7722 

T hanks to  o u r S p o n so rs:

Lawrence Farm & Ranch - Jones Real Estate - Conway's Bitter Creek Ranch 
Texas Heritage Bank - Cross Plains Review - Cross Plains Veterinary Clinic 

Cross Plains Frozen Food Locker -Jean's Feedbarn 
'Tween Peaks - C&C Handyman Services - Tim's Floral 
Greenwood Insurance Agency - Village Market - Sam's

Library
Week
April 18-24

National Library Week is April 
18 through April 24, 2004, so 
boys and girls mark your 
calendar for April 24th, from 
10:00 a.m. until 2:00 p.m. and 
com e to the Clyde Public 
Library. The Friends of the 
Library have invited a guest 
author for you to meet. Her 
name is Jacqueline Stem. She 
w rites m ystery  books for 
students in elementary and 
middle schools. Mrs. Stem will 
be talking about her books and 
will have a book signing.

I read one of her books, and it 
has a local connection. The 
MYSTERY TAKES PLACE ON 
THE PRUDE RANCH. Elizabeth 
Prude Longbotham grew up on 
th e  Prude  Ranch .  Mrs.  
Longbotham was a teacher 
many years at Clyde Junior 
High. She and Dr. Jack are to 
be the special guest of the 
Friends of the library on April 
24. They also write books for 
children.

Thanks to Mrs. Watkins and 
her High School Art Students, 
they have created all the posters 
for the authors visit, and are also 
displaying a sample of their own 
art.

So boys and girls you don't 
want to miss this event. SO 
COME TO THE CLYDE 
LIBRARY ON APRIL 24 AND 
JOIN THE FUN!!!!

Submitted by Jayne Carter, 
Friends of the Library

Burkett
Volunteer Fire 
Department

Will Be Holding a
G arage Sale

at the Old Gym in
B urkett

Saturday, April 24

Need Donations 
&

Your Help 
M ore Details Later

Larry and Brenda Cauthen of 
Baird are pleased to announce the 
engagement of their daughter, 
Mandi Cauthen, to Zach 
Edington, son of Howard and 
Debbie Edington of Burkett.

The bride-elect is a 2002 gradu­
ate of Baird High School and is 
currently attending Cisco Junior 
College and plans to pursue her

career in Elementary Education.
The prospective bridegroom is 

a 1999 graduate of Cross Plains 
High School and is currently 
attending Howard Payne 
University and will graduate in 
May with a degree in Exercise 
and Sports Science.

A June 5, 2004 wedding is 
planned in Clyde at the First Bap­
tist Church.

Set Your Cattle Herd Ready 
For Breeding Season

$5 O ff Bull Breeding Soundness Exom
(Expires 4/30/2004)

Eliminate Fleas & Ticks This Season!
Buy a 6-Month Supply of K9 Advantix''̂  and 
Set 1 Monthly Tube Free - Sove up to $15

Dr. Curtis Creach, J r . .  DVM 
Cross Plains Veterinary Clinic 

(254)-725-4359

Cross Plains 
G rain & Peanut

254-725-7345 or 800-996-9693 
— It’s Fertilizer Time Again —

That means it is time to make your money

invested count. You need the most fertilizer

you can get for your money and someone that

you can trust to apply it correctly. We have

over 50 years combined experience.

With our GPS Mapping System and excellent

machinery we can guarantee that it is put

down correctly. We handle anhydrous, liquid

and all types of dry blends. We can customize |

fertilizer to fit your needs. Don’t get over

charged by estimating your acreage.

We will give you an exact map of each

individual field with precise measurements,

leaving the guess work out.

Come by or 
Call

Mike or Terry at
1254-725-7345 or 800-996-96931


