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Zelda Munoz named Homecoming Queen
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Beautiful girls, a winning 
football team and crisp fall 
weather combined to form the 
perfect Homecoming Friday 
night in Lion Stadium.

Miss Zelda Munoz was named 
Homecoming Queen in pre-game 
ceremonies. The OHS senior was 
escorted by Jesus “ Chuy” Her­
nandez.

Zelda is president of V.I.C.A 
this year and treasurer of the 
Senior Class, a cheerleader and 
basketball captain. She is the 
daughter of Stella Munoz.

Chuy is a Lion captain and 
senior student at OHS. He is the 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Marcelo

Hernandez.
Homecoming dutchesses were 

Bonnie Cameron, Julie Reagor 
and Vickie Reagor.

Bonnie is a senior at OHS and a 
cheerleader. She is secretary of 
the Student Council this year, a 
member of the Honor Society and 
plays tennis. She is active in MYF 
at the Methodist Church. Her 
parents are Mr. and Mrs. Tom 
Cameron.

Bonnie was escorted by Harvey 
Fierro, son of Mr. and Mrs. Jesse 
Fierro. Harvey is a Lion captain, 
plays basketball and is Student 
Council treasurer.

Julie Reagor is also a senior at

OHS and a cheerleader. She is 
Senior Class representative on 
the Student council and president 
of the 4-H. She has been in 4-H 
for nine years and was named 
Gold Star award winner this year. 
She is also FFA Sweetheart and 
Rodeo Sweetheart. She is active 
in MYF and a basketball captain. 
Julie is the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Billy Reagor.

Escorting Julie was Bias Var­
gas. Bias is a Lion captain and 
center for the team. He is an 
officer in both V.I.C.A. and FFA 
this year. The senior student is 
the son of Mr. and Mrs. Bias 
Vargas.

Vickie is head cheerleader this 
year and Junior Class Student 
Council representative. She is a 
member of the National Honor 
Society, on the varsity basketball 
team and secretary of the 4-H 
Club. She has been in 4-H eight 
years. Vickie is also active in 
MYF. She is the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Billy Reagor.

Vickie was escorted by David 
Adams, son of Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Adams. The Lion captain is 
president of the Senior Class and 
a member of National Honor 
Society.

The Lion Band provided mu­
sical accompaniment for the 
coronation ceremony.

4-H awards program honors 66
The annual 4-H awards pro­

gram and hamburger supper 
honored 66 4-H members Mon­
day night at the Civic Center. 200 
members, parents, leaders and 
guests attended the event.

ship. She has competed at State 
4-H Roundup in “ Share the Fun” 
and a method demonstration on 
“ Recycling Clothing” . She is the 
17-year-old daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Augustine Martinez.

Jerri Lynn, Julie and their 
parents will be honored at the 
District 6 Gold Star banquet in 
Alpine on November 23.

Julie was also named recipient 
of the $1,000 Dan Bean 4-H

Julie Reagor, Gold Star winner: Trebie 
West, Mother Davidson winner: and Jerri

Lynn Martinez, Gold Star winner, were 
honored at the 4-H banquet Monday night.

Trebie West received the 
Mother Davidson Award pre­
sented by Jim Bob Bailey. This 
award has been presented an­
nually to an outstanding Senior 
High 4-H member in Crockett 
County since 1951. It includes 
achievement, leadership, citizen­
ship and project work. Trebie has 
been in 4-H for six years and has 
excelled in foods and nutrition, 
lamb, range and grass, shooting 
sports and leadership. Major ac­
tivities for Trebie include: State 
4-H Roundup, State 4-H Record- 
book competition. Champion 
Heavy Weight Finewool in Hous­
ton (1982), participation in nu­
merous district 4-H Food Shows 
and teaching a foods and nu­
trition project group. Trebie is 
the 15-year-old daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Wesley West.

Jerri Lynn Martinez and Julie 
Reagor were named Gold Star 
winners and presented gold pins 
by Dr. Gary Vannoy. The Gold 
Star Award is the highest state 
award given on the county level.

Jerri Lynn has been an active 
4-H member for seven years. Her 
project areas have included: 
lambs, clothing, foods and nu­
trition, babysitting, and leader-

the Weather

Julie has been an active 4-H 
member for eight years and 
excelled in several project areas. 
Her projects have included: 
lambs, horse, goats, steers, horse 
judging, foods and nutrition, 
clothing and leadership. She has 
competed at State 4-H Round-up 
in “ Share the Fun” and horse 
judging and shown top placing 
lambs in major livestock shows. 
She received the Mother David­
son Award last year. She is the 
17-year-old daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Billy Reagor. (Cont on pg. 4)

Lions select sweetheart

by James Pagan

HI LO
Oct. 1 62 48
Oct. 2 76 46
Oct. 3 83 50
Oct. 4 71 35
Oct. 5 . 73 35
Oct. 6 78 50
Oct. 7 80 61

Lion Club President Dorris Haire introduced Sweetheart candidates 
Vickie Reagor [/], Amy Jones and Julie Reagor. Not present was 
Bonnie Cameron.

Amy Jones, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Johnny Jones, was 
elected Lions Club Sweetheart by 
a vote of the members last week.

Candidates Julie and Vickie 
Reagor were also present at the 
Lions’ Club luncheon at Inn of the 
West when the sweetheart an­
nouncement was made. Bonnie 
Cameron, a fourth candidate for 
the honor. Was unable to attend 
due to illness.

Lion Lane Scott outlined theI
I

Library shelving 
arrives
All the shelving for Crockett 

County Public Library has arrived 
says Librarian Louise Ledoux. 
The oak shelving was the first to 
come in and is “ beautiful” says 
Mrs. Ledoux.

Moving day for the library will 
be October 26.

“ We plan to be open in two or 
three weeks and have our grand 
opening on Sunday afternoon in 
November.”

NEW S photo by Scotty M oore

Lions clip the wings of the Eagles
By Cynthia Harrell Hodges

Jubilation erupted among 
fans, players and coaches follow­
ing the 16-13 homecoming victory 
of the Ozona Lions over the

Eldorado Eagles Friday night.
The victory, which broke a four 

game losing streak this season, 
“ was very important,” said Head 
Lion Coach Jim Green. “ When 
you don’t win. you begin to feel

Absentee begins October 16th

Memorial Scholarship. This was 
the second annual presentation of 
this award to the outstanding 
senior 4-H member in the 
Crockett County 4-H Agricultural 
Program.

Vickie Reagor and Sharon 
McCrohan received the Danforth 
“ I Dare You” citizenship award.

Brock Jones III and Julie 
Reagor were M.C.’s for the 
awards program with awards 
being presented by a number of

Voters will have the oppor­
tunity to express their preference 
on 14 proposed amendments to 
the Texas Constitution in a 
November 5 election. Absentee 
voting begins October 16 at the 
office of County Clerk Debbi 
Puckett and will end November 1.

In a nutshell, the proposed 
amendments are:

Proposition No. 1 - To au­
thorize issuance of an additional 
$980 million of Texas Water 
Development Bonds to create 
special water funds for water 
conservation, water develop­
ment, water quality enhance­
ment, flood control and other 
purposes.

Proposition No. 2 - To au­
thorize the issuance and sale of 
$200 million Texas agricultural 
water conservation bonds.

Proposition No. 3 - To au­
thorize the Legislature to pass 
laws permitting a city or town to 
make assessments for relocation 
or replacement of water lines on 
private property.

Proposition No. 4 - To au­
thorize the use of proceeds from 
sale of permanent school fund 
land to acquire other land for the 
permanent school fund.

Proposition No. 5 - To au­
thorize the Legislature to regu­
late the providing of health care 
by hospital districts.

Proposition No. 6 - To permit 
state prisoners to be placed in 
prison facilities in other states 
subject to an interstate agree­

ment.
Proposition No. 7 - To au­

thorize Chambers County to be 
divided into two to six pre­
cincts.

Proposition No. 8 - Providing 
$500 million in additional bond­
ing authority for the state vete­
rans housing assistance program 
and allowing the Legislature to 
define an eligible veteran for the 
program.

Proposition No. 9 - To protect 
public funds by authorizing prior 
approval of the expenditure or 
emergency transfer of state ap­
propriations.

Proposition No. 10 - Authoriz­
ing the issuance of general 
obligation bonds to provide fi­
nancing assistance for purchase 
of farm and ranch land.

Proposition No. 11 - Changing 
the manner in which a person is 
charged with a criminal offense.

Proposition No. 12 - Granting 
the Texas Supreme Court and 
Court of Criminal Appeals juris­
diction to answer questions of 
state law certified from a federal 
appellate court.

Proposition No. 13 - Providing 
for reapportionment of judicial 
districts of the state by the 
Judicial Districts Board or by the 
Legislative Redistricting Board.

Proposition No. 14 - To provide 
for the abolition of the office of 
county treasurer in Andrews and 
El Paso Counties and abolition of 
the office of county surveyor in 
Collin, Dallas, Denton, El Paso, 
Henderson and Randall Counties.

you are snakebit. This was a 
great morale booster. The com­
munity has really backed the 
team, and this win rewarded the 
community.”

The excitement of the victory 
has given away to preparing for 
the district opener Friday night 
against Ballinger. Ballinger, the 
number one team in the district, 
has gone to the playoffs the last 
two years, and has lost only one 
game -  Coleman defeated Bal-

(Cont. on pg. 8)

P i e r s o n  n e w  

P e r r y s  m a n a g e r

Halloween carnival October 31

James Pierson has been named 
manager of the Perry Brother’s 
variety store here.

Pierson, who started working 
for the 168 store chain six months 
ago, moves here from Perry 
Brother’s company headquarters 
in Lufkin. His first day at the 
store was Thursday afternoon. 
Interim managers, Ray Hollings-

(Cont. on pg. 4)

duties of the sweetheart as a 
representative of the club before 
members balloted.

Miss Jones is a senior at Ozona 
High School. She is a member of 
the Front Line, National Honor 
Society where she serves as 
secretary and is president of 
Teen Council and a member of 
MYF at the Methodist Church.

The candidates were intro­
duced by Lions’ Club president 
Dorris Haire.

Spooks and gobblins of all ages 
are busy planning costumes for 
the annual Halloween parade and 
carnival planned for October 31. 
The parade will be at 5:00 p.m. 
followed by the carnival in City 
Park.

Booth space for the carnival is 
still available says Chamber of 
Commerce Secretary Beth Boyd. 
Booths are $25.00. A refund of 
$10.00 will be given to those who 
clean their areas after the carni­

val.
Booth space which had been 

reserved with Mrs. Boyd by 
mid-week included: Lion Boost­
ers, fajitas; Care Center, funnel 
bread; Girl Scouts, fish pond; 
FFA, bucking barrel, greased 
pole, needle in hay stack; Alpha 
Alpha Mu, cotton candy; Wo­
man’s Forum, food booth; 4-H, 
dunking tank, pony rides, rat 
race, basketball toss; Catholic 
women, tamales;

Also Arts and Crafts Guild, 
cake walk; KRCT, record toss; 
EMS, ring toss; Beta Sigma Phi, 
cakes and pencils; V.I.C.A. Club, 
grab bag; C.C.D., sweet sale; 
Band Boosters, face painting, 
balloons; Rebecca , Martinez, 
tamales and burritos; Girl Scouts 
#91, duck pond, nickel pitch; Girl 
Scouts #53, bean bag toss; 
Helping Hands for the Elderly 
and Knights of Columbus.
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Miss Vickie Gonzales and puppet Mr. 
Pazzoo, pose with members o f her pre­
kind,ergarten class. Class members are: 
Randall Borrego, Phil Castro, Gina Castro, 
Leah De La Garza, R. J. Elizondo, Eric

NEW S photo by Scotty M oore

Garza, Nancy Gutierrez, Alma Longoria, 
Mark Martinez, Myra Onofre, Lori Sanchez, 
Maggie Sanchez, Margo Sanchez, Tania 
Sanchez and Kimberly Galan [not in order].

Pre-kindergarten students team in many areas
By Cynthia Harrell Hodges

Teaching four year olds to 
socialize, to share and to be 
civilized is the primary goal of 
prekindergarten first year 
teacher Vickie Gonzales.

“ Most of the students aren’t 
proficient in English,,’’ Miss 
Gonzales, a 1984 graduate of 
Angelo State University, said 
recently. The class is structured 
for economically and educational­
ly deprived students and is one of 

' the programs set forth in House 
Bill 72. “ Some of my students 
understand English completely, 
but don’t speak it well.

“ There are very fast learners 
in my classes. Those that know 
English well help the others. The 
program helps get children used 
to going to school.

“ These students would be left 
behind if they did not attend. By 
the end of the year, they will have 
caught up with others that will be 
entering kindergarten next 
year,’’ Gonzales said.

Miss Gonzales strongly en-

courages parental involvement. 
“ I strongly recommend reading 
to young children, and simply 
taking time with them. Take them 
for walks, and show them a frog, 
a tree, the grass. You can tell 
which parents work with their 
children.’’

Many different activities are 
scheduled for the short five to ten 
minute attention spans of the 
children. There are 15 children in 
both the morning and afternoon 
classes. The three hour classes 
are from 8:30 a.m. to 11:30 a.m. 
and from 12:30 to 3:30 p.m.

“ They are four year olds. Some 
are not yet ready for school. This 
makes the job very challenging.’’

The children will learn to 
identify objects, follow simple 
directions, recognize familiar 
sounds, listen to music and 
stories, art, music, hand and eye 
coordination, count, self aware­
ness, safety, and how to write 
their nameSi

Miss Gonzales teaches bi- 
lingually now, but hopes even­

tually to just teach in English. 
One feature of the class includes 
Mr. Pazoo, a puppet. “ When it is 
time for Mr. Pazoo, everyone 
stops what they are doing and 
listens to him. Everyday he has 
something new in his pouch.’’

“The children have some free 
time each day, and they can go to 
the reading corner, play with the 
toys or do whatever they wish. 
Early childhood education is 
becoming very important,’’ Miss 
Gonzales, a 1980 graduate of 
Ozona High School, said.

Miss Gonzales is the daughter 
of Lupe Gonzales, longtime em­
ployee of the Texas Highway 
Department, and Irene Gonzales, 
mother of six children. She is an 
active member of Templo Bau­
tista. “ It is nice to be inde­
pendent. I want to become 
involved in other community 
activities.’’

In high school. Miss Gonzales 
was president of her Senior 
Class, band sweetheart and band 
member.

Alpha Alpha Mu has party G,E,D, registration
The Alpha Alpha Mu chapter 

of Beta Sigma Phi met for a 
Women’s Rush party Monday 
evening, September 30, at 
Granny Miller Hall. Hostesses 
were Tina Bean, Jeannine Hen­
derson, Roylan Sullivan and 
Leslie Wilson.

Honored guests were Lisa 
Branch, Sharon Forehand, Bar­
bara Glosson, Roxanne Hailey, 
Patti May, Suzzane Renfro, 
Becky Sizemore and Kay Stewart.

The women enjoyed a Mexican 
fiesta followed by several get 
acquainted games. Prizes were 
awarded to game winners.

Care Center Auxiliary 
elects officers

Officers for the Crockett 
County Hospital and Care Center 
Auxiliary were elected at the 
October meeting held in the day 
room of the Care Center. Head­
ing the organization will be Jo 
Davidson who was re-elected 
president, Glenda Henderson, 
secretary, and Marie Pierson, 
treasurer.

Members voted to purchase a 
whirl-pool tub with a patient lift 
to be available for use by the 
spring of 1986. Starting the 
organization off on this drive will 
be a style show November 16 at 
the Circle Bar Solarium at 11:00 
a.m. The Teacher’s Store and 
Small Fashion will provide cloth­
ing to show holiday attire. Tickets 
are on sale by Auxiliary members 
or can be purchased at the 
Teacher’s Store and Small Fash­
ions.

Refreshments and door prizes 
will be included in the price of 
admission.

Ramona Turnley reported on 
the hospital telephone life-line 
project. More interest is needed 
if the program is to be installed. 
Persons interested in a 24 hour
telephone system that is available 
to help in a case of emergency 
are asked to call Don Hop­
kins at the hospital.

Interest has also been expres­
sed for a junior auxiliary organi­
zation or Candy Stripers. If you 
are between 12 and 18 years of 
age and interested in helping 
others, call Billie Kiser at 
392-3638 or call the hospital.

“ Our van is en route, and we 
hope to have it for the Halloween 
Parade,’’ says Jo Davidson. 
“ Thank you, Crockett County.’’

The candle was passed, and 
Secret Sister gifts were ex­
changed.

Members present were Tina 
Bean, Tammy Bunger, Nesa 
Chandler, Becky Dillard, Debbie 
Glasscock, Laurie Hale, Jeannine 
Henderson, Karen Huffman, 
Connie Jennings, Ellen Lipsey, 
Susan McMullan, Barbie Myers, 
Renee Pearl, Dena Porter, Leslie 
Reeves, Billie Renfro, Rita Sig- 
wing, Roylan Sullivan, Lisa Wag­
oner, Marcy Williams and Leslie 
Wilson.

Connie Jennings reporting

Ozona Public Schools have 
announced that the district will 
offer a free G.E.D. class for 
Ozona adults who would like to 
prepare for their Graduate Equi­
valency Diploma Certificate. 
Registration will be Thursday, 
October 10, from 6:30 p.m. until 
9:00 p.m. in the Ozona Junior 
High School Cafeteria, and the 
class will meet each Tuesday and 
Thursday at that time.

All instructional material will 
be provided free of charge, and 
anyone at least seventeen years 
old and out of school is eligible to 
attend. Interested participants 
may call Ms. Kathy Grendahl, 
program instructor, at 392-2843 if 
more information is needed.

20% OFF
on Jackets 
and Coats

S m a l l  T a s i j io n ^

Cubs down 
Eagles

By T. C. Tucker '

Both Cubs teams made their 
way to Eldorado last Thursday to 
try to extend their victory 
records.

On their first possession, the 
seventh grade Cubs, who would 
end the night with 375 yards total 
offense, rambled to within 23 
yards of a touchdown, but failed 
to score. However, on their first 
play of their second possession, 
Ruben Borrego went 41 vards off 
a dive up the middle for the Cubs’ 
first touchdown. Borrego, who 
had 63 yards rushing, drove his 
way in for the two-point con­
version.

The only time Mingo Perez 
carried the ball, he shot 36 yards 
for the Cubs’ next touchdown. 
The attempt for the extra two 
points failed, but the Cubs were 
still the only one on the score- 
board.

On a third and one, Lonnie 
Martinez, who led all rushers 
with 92 yards, crossed the goal 
line as the buzzer ended the first 
half for a 59 yard touchdown. The 
Cubs led 20-0 after the two-point 
conversion failed.

The first score of the second 
half came when Duan O’Neal 
scrambled 17 yards off a wing- 
back trap.

The Cubs’ defense picked up in 
the second half and continued to 
drop the Eagles for a loss. The 
Cubs held Eldorado to only 34 
yards total offense. Brad Bollier 
led all the tacklers with five. He 
was followed by Ruben Borrego 
with four, Lonnie Martinez, Ur- 
bino and Lee Galan each with 
three.

The Eldorado quarterbaek was 
pressured into throwing an inter­
ception that Anthony Vasquez 
returned thirty yards for a 
touchdown to give the Cubs a 
32-0 lead.

On the next play from the line 
of scrimmage, the Eldorado 
quarterback threw another inter­
ception, This time, Mingo Perez 
returned it for a 45 yard touch­
down.

Brad Bollier, who replaced 
Oscar Gutirrez as a quarterback 
and went three for six on the 
night, connected with Shane 
Pridemore for the two point 
conversion.

The eighth grade Cubs ran into 
some trouble in the first quarter 
when the Eagles recovered a 
fumble on the Cubs 36 yard line. 
This set up their first score of the 
game, and the Cubs found them­
selves behind 6-0.

The Cubs responded with a 
touchdown of their own on their 
first possession. Roger Martinez, 
who had an outstanding night 
with 107 yards rushing and two 
touchdowns, dropped the ball on 
a left sweep, picked it up and 
went eleven yards to the right for
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Ybarra service in Robert Lee
Mrs. Rosa Ybarra, 95, of 

Robert Lee, died Friday morning 
in an Abilene hospitaj following 
an illness.

Mrs. Ybarra was an active 
member of a Baptist Church in 
Abilene.

Survivors include Ozona rela­
tives: a son, Inez Ybarra; eight 
grandchildren, George San­
tiago Ybarra, Pete Ybarra, An­
gela Pena, Rosa Leal, Nane 
Guitierrez and Joe Ybarra; nu­
merous great-grandchildren.

the Cubs’ first touchdown. The 
PAT attempt failed and the score 
was tied at 6-6.

George Ybarra returned an 
Eagles’ punt 55 yards for his first 
touchdown, early in the second 
quarter.

Immediately following the at­
tempt of the two-point conver­
sion, which failed, the Cubs 
recovered a fumble on the 
kickoff. Ybarra, who had 139 
yards total offense and two touch­
downs, sped 29 yards on a screen 
pass for the Cubs’ third touch­
down. Chris Denman hit Phillip 
Munoz for the two-point con­
version.

Lalo Rodriquez, who was held 
to only 66 yards offense, ex­
tended the lead to 27-6 after he 
plunged up the middle for a six 
yard touchdown and then added 
the extra-point.

With 23 seconds left in the 
third quarter, Chris Denman, 
who only completed three of eight 
passes but two of the three were 
for touchdowns, connected with 
Luis De La Garza for a 46 yard 
touchdown pass. The PAT failed, 
and the Cubs led 33-6.

The Eagles added their second 
touchdown on a 86 yard pass 
play. The two-point conversion 
was successful, but Eldorado still 
trailed.

Roger Martinez, who started 
the Cubs’ scoring, motored 47 
yards for the last touchdown of 
the game. Lalo Rodriquez’s kick 
was good, and the Cubs finished 
the game with a 40-14 victory.

Lalo Rodriquez led all tacklers 
with eight. Roger Martinez had 
seven, followed by Moe Cruz and 
George Ybarra, each with six.

The Cubs’ next game will be 
here at 6:00 on October 17 
against Colorado City.

Bloom tennis shoes by 
Connie’s
Rose print fabric

$19^

The Footnote

SPECIAL
C o n s u m e r  S t e e l  R a d ia l  T i r e s

1 9 5 /7 5 R 1 4  

2 0 5 /7 5 R14  

2 0 5 /7 5 R 1 5  

2 1 5 /7 5 R 1 5  

2 2 5 /7 5 R 1 5  

2 3 5 /7 5 R 1 5

$33.50

36.50
36.50

38.50 

40.00

43.50

Check our 
prices on 

Michelin Tires

Free 50% Replacement 
Workmanship & Material Warranty

P r i c e  d o e s  n o t  i n c l u d e  m o u n t i n g  a n d  b a l a n c i n g

Wool Growers Central Storage Co.
607 Ave H Ozona, Texas 392-3731
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24% FULL 
LEAD CRYSTAL

C H A M P A G N E
NOW ON SALE! G L A S S

THIS WTEK S 
FEATURE ITEM

$ 1 9 9
J L e a c h

Wilh Kach (K) Puix'hasc 
Regular Retail S í  99

M atch ing  A ccesso ries  
A lso Available.

See Store Display For Complete Details

TROPICANA FROZEN ORANGE

JUICE
12 OZ. 

CAN

TV SPECIAL
PET RITZ FROZEN FRUIT

COBBLERS 
$ 1 4 9

26 OZ. 
PKG.

Cf Super Select Lean

PORK
ROASr LB.

24 OZ.
wesson.! b t l .

TV SPECIAL

20* OFF LABEL

WESSON OIL 
$ 1 1 9

Ground Fresh Daily - 73% Lean

Ground Beef
Lb. 99

Oscar Meyer 6 oz. pkg.

PEANUT BUTTER 
CRUNCHY OR SMOOTH

PETER P A N  
$ 1 5 9

■  18 OZ.
■  JAR

1 Wilsons Sliced Meat Variety Pak Luncheon Meat $ F
i Bologna LB. 99c Oscar Meyer 6 oz. pkg.(
 ̂ Beef Skirt LB. Smoked Turkey Breast $ 1 *’
j Fajitas LB. $1” Oscar Meyer 9 oz. pkg.

Hormel 12 oz. pkg. Smoked Chicken Breast $ 1 “’
Little Sizzlers Limited supply Shurfresh Brand-Young

) Oscar Meyer Square 12 oz. pkg. Turkeys LB. 79*
\ Ham Variety Pak $ 1 »’ 16 lb. — 18 lb. avg. lb.

TV SPECIAL

CAMPBELL'S

6 9 ^1 IB. 
BOX $

i
10% oz.

CANS

CROCIRY SPEOALS
BREAKFAST CEREAL

CRAPE NUTS
FRANCO AMERICAN

SPAGHETTI
5 LBS. FREE-30 LB. TOTAL

PURINA
24 N EW BRN/18 D A Y /12 TODDLER

HUCOIESUpton
Tea Bags
Chicken of teh Sea
TUNA 6% oz. Can Oil or W/Pack

LIPTON FAMILY SIZE

TEA 
BAGS

towê
'.-■It runs in tn*

$
JUMBO

ROLLS

M IX  OR MATCH 
RED OR GOLDEN DELICIOUS

APPUS 59
U.S. NO. 1 RUSSET“

POTATOESc
5 LB. 
BAG

3 ^ c

59‘ 
8 9 «  

39«
AO

CALIFORNIA RUBY RED

GRAPEFRUIT
WASHINGTON U.S. NO. 1

BARTLEn PEARS
OCEAN SPRAY

CRANBERRIES
CALIFORNIA GREEN PASCAL

CELERY
JALAPENO OR BELL

PEPPERS

LB.

LB.

12 OZ. 
Q N .

LB.

n s nunr rea aacs

HEALTH A BEAUTY AIDS
CHILDREN'S CHEWABLE TABLETS

— ^  TYLENOL
V '  ' .wait» »»ttrŝ : }  $  

48 CT. ^  
PKG.

24 a.
PKG.

$ 1 » 9

EXTRA THICK

VELVEETA  
SLICES
^ 1 7 9

WIN^'$ 1 , 0 0 0
EVERY
WEEK

$136,370 IN PRIZE MONEY 
IN 13 WEEKS

12 OZ. 
PKG.

NESTEA 3 oz. $199
Here are this week's 
Tele-BINGO numbers:

FABRIC SOFTENER

FINAL
TOUCH 64  OZ. 

BTL.

W atch the exciting  
TELE-BINGO TV Show

Wediwsdov 
6:57 P.M.

4* OFF LABEL- PINK OR WHITE

DOVE 
BAR

B 1 N G 0
4 20 34 47 61
7 25 39 49 67

10 28 41 51 69
14 30 43 55 75

BATH
BAR

4 .5  OZ. 
PUMP

5 OZ. 
CAN

2 0 ‘ OFF LABEL-GEL OR PASTE

COLGATE
AQUA NET EXTRA BODY STYLING

MOUSSE
AQUA NET ^

h a ir sp r a y _ ^ ^ £ 9 9 «

Dr. Pepper or 
Pepsi Cola

$ 1 '^

¡Miracle Whip
32 oz. iPY 59

FROZEN FOOD t DAIRY
PILLSBURY ASSORTED MICROWAVE

PIZZA
SHURFRESH BTRMLK/ COUNTRY STYLE

Shurnne Sugar biscuits
SHURFRESH HAIFMOON COLBY OR

Shurfine 5 LB. CHEDDAR CHEESE

7 OZ. 
PKG.

8 OZ. 
CANS

10 OZ. 
PKG.

$139

WEEK 2 BLUE CARDS
GOOD o a . 10-16, 1985 

BONUS NUMBERS FOR BLUE CARD WILL 
BE ANNOUNCED ON TV OaOBER 16, 1985

KVIl-TV OMmiel 7 - Aniarillo, Texos 
KLBK-TY Qiaiiiiel 13 - Lubbock, Texos 

KOSA-TV Chonnei 7 - Odesso/Midloiid, Texas 
KAUZ-TY Chamiel 6 - Wichito Foils, Texos/ 

Lawton, Oklolionio
KTXS-TV dioiinel 12 - Abilene, Texos 

KBIM-TV Chonnei 10 - Roswell, Niew MexicoTHORNTON'S
WE RESERVE INE RWin ID LURir DNANTinS

12 oz. 6 pk. cans fiTimiiFTWAY
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Watson Department Store marks 23 years
By Cynthia Harrell Hodges

Watson’s Department Store 
quietly celebrated 23 years in 
business Tuesday says founder 
and owner of the store. Bill 
Watson.

Though the store has never 
done the volune of business 
anticipated, it has afforded both 
Watson and his wife, Julie, the 
opportunity to feed, clothe and 
educate their two daughters, 
Janell Watson Ramsey of Arling­
ton, and Doreen Watson Turner 
of Plano.

Watson was a young man on 
the move in the corporate world 
of Sears & Roebuck. The Texas 
Tech business administration 
graduate worked for Sears, the 
greatest department store mer­
chandisers, for eight years. “ I 
wasn’t the corporate type -- I just 
wasn’t tough enough. I didn’t 
enjoy the big cities,” Watson 
explained.

The Watsons had moved to 
Clovis, New Mexico in 1960 so 
that he could move up in the 
corporate structure. “ When we 
moved to Clovis, we weren’t told 
what house to buy -- just what 
type home we should have. My 
boss’ wife helped Julie pick our
home out. I worked 18-19 hours a 
dav, trying to straighten up a 
mess that I inherited. We lived in 
Clovis two years. I realized that I 
had no time with my family, and 
there had to be something better 
someplace else.”

After he quit working for Sears 
in 1962, Watson started looking 
for a business to buy in Stanton. 
A friend of his parents recognized 
Watson from a picture and 
offered him a partnership in a 
business in Ozona. Watson was 
not interested in having a part­
ner, but was intrigued about 
Ozona. Watson, who had not 
been in Ozona since playing in 
the 1947 Ozona Invitational Bas­
ketball Tournament, decided to 
investigate. “ I came to Ozona on 
September 14, 1962, stood on the 
sidewalk and visited with people.

“ I called Stephen Perner at 4 
p.m. about leasing this building. 
At 4:30 p.m., the lease agree­
ment was finalized. I opened the 
store about one month later on 
October 8, 1962. I’ve never beCn 
sorry I came here, despite the 
lack of growth in the business.

“ Fortunately, I have the most 
ideal mate. Julie was willing to do 
whatever I wanted to do. We did 
not enjoy the mandatory society 
structure being a Sears executive 
requires. We were excited to 
come to a small town and live a 
quiet life and work in the 
church.” he said.

When the business first 
opened, Mrs. Watson worked at 
the store full time. “ We soon 
realized that the girls needed her 
more than I did. You can hire 
help for a store, but you can’t hire 
a mother.”

At times, the store has been 
kept open “because of my bull- 
headedness, not because of its 
success,” Watson said.

!‘It is so disheartening to hear 
customers say they shopped in 
San Angelo first. I recall one 
Sunday, three ladies at the Ozona 
Church of Christ all appeared in 
the same dress. My wife was one 
of the ladies. A lady froth 
the church approached me and 
said that fear of imitiation and 
lack of choice were some reasons 
the ladies did not shop in Ozona. I 
proudly informed him that none 
of the dresses had been bought in 
Ozona. The dresses had been 
purchased in San-Angelo, Odessa 
and Iraan.

“ The demand at our store 
limits our selection. We sit at the 
same market tables as do the 
larger stores. The quantity of 
things bought is determined by 
the sales of the previous year.” 
Sue Borrego has been doing some 
of the buying for Watson the last 
one and one-half years. “ She is 
younger and is more in tune with 
the times,” Watson said of his 
valued employee.

One of Watson’s biggest dis­
appointments was opening day. 
Circulars were placed in all the 
area newspapers announcing the 
store’s grand opening. “ We did 
$26.00 worth of business opening 
day. I had coriie from Sears, 
where that kind of advertising 
would have netted $700,000 in 
sales. It has been uphill since that 
time.”

Watson inherited some of his 
interest in the business world 
from his parents. His mother and 
father owned a grocery store for 
many years in Iraan. “ At my 
insistance, they bought a piece 
goods store in 1959 in Iraan.”

Community involvement are 
not just idle words to Watson. 
“ For my personal satisfaction, 
this involvement is necessary. I 
want this community to be my 
home. I am interested in the 
future of Ozona. I look at other 
businessmen who are not in­
volved in civic work. Some are 
more successful than I. I guess 
I’m just not very bright.”

Though he has lessened his 
involvement recently, Watson 
has served as president of the 
Ozona Lions’ Club and the 
Chamber of Commerce. He 
helped with the Fort Lancaster 
project of the Crockett County 
Historical Commission. Watson 
once traveled with Mrs. Brownie 
Harvick representing the Texas 
Wool and Mohair Auxiliary. He 
has also been active in the 
Scouting programs and Lions 
Booster Club.

“ I have solicited funds for 
every organization in town and 
have been involved with the 
Ozona Youth Rodeo for 20 years. 
I served as a deacon in the 
Church of Christ for many 
years.” Watson still serves on 
the maintenance committee at 
the Church of Christ and also 
enjoys woodworking in his 
limited spare time.

Future businessmen must be

Brown Furniture Company
Open Monday through Friday 

Closed on Saturday

very definite about the need for 
their type of business in a 
particular locale. “They should 
buy an existing business if 
possible. The ready made store 
traffic is worth more than one can 
imagine. Most new businesses 
take a minimum of five years 
before there is enough profit to 
support oneself. Above all. don’t 
enter a business underfinanced,” 
Watson advises.

When the store opened, Wat­
son set his retirement date as 
October, 1992. “ We have no 
retirement plans now.”

Watson’s success in the busi­
ness world has continued into 
another field. He announces, 
with R. B. Babbitt, the play-by- 
play of Lions’ games on KRCT. 
The games enable Watson to 
keep in touch with the youth of 
Ozona and help keep this Ozona 
Lions’ booster young at heart 
forever.

★  Pierson
(Cont. from  pg. 1}
worth, manager of the Sonora 
store, and Chuck Weaver, as­
sistant manager of Perry’s in 
Brady, have been here for two 
weeks. The new position of 
assistant manager will be filled 
by Betty Koerth, former owner 
and manager of the Montgomery 
Ward outlet here.

“ I want this store to be the best 
in the Chain. I want people to be 
able to buy what they want when 
they want it,” Pierson said.

“ I enjoy this kind of work, this 
kind of business, working with 
people,” he continued. “ Em­
ployees determine the entire 
success of the store.” Pierson 
anticipates no immediate 
changes in personnel.

Pierson will be joined in Ozona 
by his wife,- Iiia, and their 
children, Robin, a nine:year-old 
fourth grader; Ollie, a five-year- 
old kindergartener; and four- 
month-old Raven. They also have 
a 22 year-old son, James, who 
lives in Henderson.

Pierson worked in the grocery 
business all over Texas for 19 
years. While in Lufkin, he and 
his wife were active in the 
Special Olympics organization. In 
his limited spare time, the Hen­
derson native enjoys working 
with his children.

“ I want to make Ozona my 
home and raise my children 
here.” Pierson Said he would like 
to organize a Special Olympics 
program for this area.

★  4H
(Cont. from  page 1)
4-H members and leaders. Guest 
speaker for the evening was Ted 
White who concluded his remarks 
with the advice that young people 
should not worry as much as their 
parents do.

Club officers and 4-H organi­
zational leaders for Senior High, 
Junior High and Elementary 
clubs were recognized. The 
Senior High Club was responsible 
for the program and assisted 
leaders with the awards presen­
tations. Junior High 4-H mem­
bers were responsible for clean- 
iin and the Intermediate Club was 
in charge of decorations. The 4-H 
Parent and Leaders Association 
coordinated the hamburger sup­
per.

Award recipients included: 
Food and Nutrition - Randi 

Thompson. Monica Mundell, 
Staci Sessom, Ami Sewell. Ve­
ronica Vasquez, Terrie Willmon, 
Card Chandler, Mindy Coates, 
Elena Dominquez, Misty Fowler, 
Tracy Harris, Joe Jurado, Ma- 
randy Keith, Jennifer Davidson 

Clothing - Heather Kemp Mac­
kenzie Hopkins, Cassie Mont­
gomery, Tiffany Vargas, Summer 
Shacklette

Babysitting - Tammy Davee 
Sheep - Bret Hood, George 

Wall, Leroy Martinez, Jim Mc- 
Cary, Andy Stokes, Julie Chil­
dress, Leigh Ann Coates, Jay 
Haire, Leesa Haire

Horse - Shane Cooper, Bonnie 
Martin, Tess Worthington, 
Sharon McCrohan

Horse Judging - Missy Bishop. 
Chad Upham, Julie Reagdr, 
Brock Jones

Range Judging - Stephanie 
Saunders, Gary Thompson. John 
Williams, Keith Fowler

Flower Arranging - Crista 
Chalmers, Dottie Gonzales, Lisa 
Herring, Martha Mayfield, Julie 
Carson

Shooting - Justin Southern, 
Martin Childress, Jason Coates, 
William Dean Fierro, Randel 
Wilson

Agriculture - Stefny Sutton, 
Margaret Jones, Haley Carson, 
Fleet Worthington, Jena Allen, 
Jason Montgomery 

Jr. Achievement - Tammy 
Arrott, Jeanie Cooper, Terry 
House, Tamie Reagor, Cody 
Sutton, Whitney-Vannoy, Tamel 
West

Sr. Achievement - Brock Jones, 
Keith Fowler

Leadership - Randi Thompson, 
Trebie West, Vickie Reagor 

Citizenship - Jerri Lynn Mar­
tinez, Jena Allen, George Wall, 
Andy Dews

Childress attends 
photo seminar

ceremony.

Charlie’s Place

Saturday Special
S irlo in  S teak

B aked P ota to  or French F ries  
Salad Bar Coffiee or Iced Tea

Snips, quips 
&

lifts
A rich man with two jobs is 

diversified. A poor man with two 
jobs is moonlighting. By Lottie Lee Baker

Failing memory is what makes 
them the “ good old days” .

If we had a better organized 
society, we would have less 
organized crime.

A little bit of concern is a good 
thing, but constant worry will 
wear out a good heart.

It is better to give than it is to 
lend, and it doesn’t cost much 
more.

Public relations is the art of not 
treating the public like they were 
relations.

Any man who guesses a 
woman’s age correctly is dumb.

A mudpack helped his wife’s 
appearance; then it began to 
flake off.

When we are busy borrowing 
customs from older cultures, who 
was the dumb-dumb who passed 
up the siestas?

No matter how much a person 
fear the future, he usually wants 
to be here to see it.

Beautiful young people are 
accidents of nature; beautiful old 
people are works of art.

* * * *

Liberty is being free from thé 
things we don’t like to be slaves 
to things we do like.

A LIFT FOR THE WEEK

You are young at any age if you 
are planning for tomorrow.

Sandra Childress, owner ot 
Cameras Two Photography, re­
cently attended one of the Texas 
Professional Photographers’ fall 
seminars in Midland. Thèse 
serhiriars are designed to help 
professional photographers im­
prove photographic and business 
skills.

Featured speaker for the two 
day event was Glenn Dressen, 
master photographer from Home- 
wood, Illinois. Dressen has con­
sistently won awards for photo­
graphic excellence, including 
Best Wedding -Album and Best 
Wedding Portrait awards.

Dressen photographs all of his 
wedding couples and families 
before the wedding ceremony so 
that there is a smoother flow from 
the ceremony to the reception. 
Dressen stressed that the “ tra­
dition” of the bride and bride­
groom not seeing each other 
before the ceremony evolved 
from Hollywood, and not for any 
valid reason. In Biblical times, 
the bridegroom was encouraged 
to visit with the bride before the

Junction tramples Ozona
By Copie Davis

Thursday night the Ozona J.V. 
took on the Junctiori J.V. in a 
game that many die-hard Ozona 
football fans would love to forget.

Ozona had a hapless and 
hopeless first half. The Lions 
gave up 169 yards offense in the 
first half alone, while Junction 
rolled to a 30-0 halftime lead, 
Ozona just couldn’t get it to­
gether in the first half, making 
only 49 yards offense and no 
points.

The first Junction score came 
on a 52 yard halfback pass on the 
first play of the game that 
stunned the Lions and proved as 
an accurate omen for things to 
come. Junction came storming 
back in the second quarter, 
scoring thrice more. One on a 
nine yard run, the second on a 19 
yard pass, and the third on a 
reverse with 0:07 left in the half, 
leaving Ozona gasping for air, 
trying to evade the proverbial 
“ going under for the third time” .

In the second half, things got 
better for the Lions as they held 
Junction to 121 yards and no 
touchdowns. Although Ozona 
played a good defensive second 
half, the offense still couldn’t find 
their groove. The Lions could, 
muster only 67 yards offense in 
the second half with no score.

Harvey Dominquez, Ozona’s 
workhorse on offense, pounded 
out 63 yards rushing on 15 carries 
for a 4.2 yard rushing average; 
Oscar Galindo and Paul Galan 
teamed up for 18 yards apiece 
with Brandon Morgan and Ed­
ward Cervantez gaining seven 
and six yards respectively.

Quarterback Copie Davis had a 
horrendous night passing, ending 
up one for 11 for five yards and 
one interception. Davis was also 
sacked six times for minus 14 
yards. Tight end Robbie Tam- 
bunga was the receiver of Davis’ 
sole completion.

The next J.V. contest will be 
October 10 as Ozona takes oh the 
Irion County J.V.

In the wake of the Ozona 
varsity’s thrilling 16-13 home­
coming victory, the Ozona J.V, 
traveled to Eldorado last Satur­
day and crushed the Eagles 26-0.

Ozona simply overpowered El­
dorado with 329 yards total 
offense.

Sub Fierro had a superb day 
running the ball as he gained 38 
yards on four carries and had a 
9.5 yard rushing average. Oscar 
Payne powered out 37 yards on 10

carries, and fullback Bret Hood 
had 22 yards on nine carries.

Quarterback Derold Vargas 
smoked the Eagle’s secondary for 
seven cornpletions on 16 attempts 
and 206 yards passing. Vargas 
also passed for two touchdowns.

Danny Sanchez, who had 61 
yards receiving at Water Valley 
last week, compiled 157 yards 
receiving on Saturday and hauled 
in both of Vargas’ two touch­
down passes.

Ozona was also excellent on 
defense as they forced eight 
Eldorado turnovers and held 
them to only three first downs in 
the entire contest. Sub Fierro 
snagged two interceptions, while 
Oscar Payne got one. Eldorado 
fumbled the football five times on 
the day, and Ozona was there to 
recover. Richard Galvan, Luis 
Perez, Renee De La Rosa, Danny 
Sanchez and Ed Calvert each had 
one fumble recovery.

Wolv Rutherford led all tack- 
lers with five, while Bret Hood, 
Ben Rios and Landon Duncan 
followed up with four each.

The scoring in the game did not 
start until early in the second 
quarter when Derold Vargas hit 
Danny Sanchez with a pass, and 
Sanchez took it 70 yards for a 
touchdown. Oscar Payne put the 
extra point through the uprights, 
putting the Lions on top 7-0.

Ozona crossed the goal line 
twice in the third quarter, once on 
a six yard rumble by Ruther­
ford, and the second on a two 
yard blast by Hood. Payne con- ; 
verted on one of these, and the 
score increased to 20-0, Ozona.

In the fourth quarter, Vargas 
and Sanchez teamed up again on 
a seven yard touchdown comple­
tion to end the game, Ozona 26, 
Eldorado 0.

Deer census 
workshop

A deer census workshop will 
be held Thursday, October 17, at 
7:00 p.m. in the Civic Center 
Small Meeting Room. Dr. Dwight 
Guynn, Extension Wildlife 
Specialist from Uvalde, will pre- - 
sent the program. Following the 
program, participants will load 
vehicles and actually go out and 
lay out a survey line and make 
initial counts.

Census work is an important 
part of deer management. Deer " 
census gives ranchers some good *• 
base line data to begin a pro­
gram.

S I h i L .
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Care Center 
News
By Ann McCartney 

Director of Activities 
and Social Care

Firemen stress fire prevention

October brings to mind Ok- 
tober Fcsts, and that is just what 
we had last Wednesday. Pietures 
of Germany along with some 
facts about the country were 
given. A large table of food 
reminded us of all the good eooks 
that eome from Germany. Ger­
man sausage, sweet breads 
donated by Donuts,. Etc. and 
candy donated by Westerman 
Drug \Vere all served by volun­
teers Jo Davidson and Dorothy 
Doll. We thought this was a great 
way to begin the month.

Earlier in the week we wel- 
eomed baek Marilyn Chalmers, a 
very aeeomplished piano player. 
We are pleased to have her agree 
to come and play for us a couple 
of times each month.

Marilyn was also instrumental 
in getting her husband. Rod, to 
come and show us a movie and 
give us some information about 
deer in Texas. He gave his 
program on Friday afternoon.

The Hospital and Care Center 
Auxiliary held their quarterly 
meeting last week. New officers 
elected are: Jo Davidson, presi­
dent; Glenda Henderson, sec­
retary; and Marie Pierson, 
treasurer.

Club members receiving recog­
nition for a hundred or more 
hours of service included: Do­
rothy Doll, Beth Boyd, Marie 
Pierson, Clara Byrd, Maudie 
Couch, Vivian Hughes, Mary Lee 
Jones, Earline Jones, Anna Bell 
Patrick, Lola Rios, Glenda Hen­
derson, Bonnie Warth, Alice 
Ross and Jo Davidson. We really 
appreciate all that these volun­
teers do for both the hospital and 
the Care Center.

Thursday morning’s beauty 
shop was manned by Clara Byrd, 
Clara Babb and Vivian Hughes.

Bible study was directed by 
Ted Turnley. This was followed 
by Spanish Hour of Praise 
conducted by Maria Vitela, Pau- 
lita Leal, Carmen Vargas, Norma 
Flores and Victoria De La Garza.

Sunday afternoon church ser­
vices were brought by Rev. Ken 
Harrison, pastor of the United 
Methodist Church, Bernice Jones 
played the piano. Four fellow 
church members assisted with 
the singing.
. Tuesday and Friday morning’s 
bingo was played by some sixteen 
residents. Ola Mills won thé first 
place gift certificate from Clay­
ton’s Village Drug. Hilda Dysart 
received the second place prize, 
and Minnie Karr won the certifi­
cate from El Chato’s for a dinner 
for two. Volunteers included 
Sophia Tijerina, Dorothy Doll, 
Mattie Cooper, Teresa Sanchez, 
Elodia Zapata, Anna Bell Patrick, 
Gwen Nelson, Minnie Karr and 
Alice Ross.

Wednesday morning’s ceramic 
class was managed by volunteers 
Janet Wilson and Marie Pierson, 
Doris Karr came that afternoon to 
clean some pieces to be painted 
by our residents next week. 
Residents Juana Hernandez, To­
masa Ramoz, Pauline Clinton, 
Hilda Dysart, Ola Mills, Moriama 
Perez, and Emma Taylor all 
participated in this activity.

It shouldn’t be long now until 
our van arrives. We are really 
looking forward to that special 
fed letter day.

Think Volunteer!

Ladies golf 
results

Lady golfers at Ozona Country 
Club had their weekly golf day 
last Wednesday. Winning low 
gross was Ella Clegg, Low net 
was won by Sherry Holt, and 
winning low putts was Katy 
Jones.

The winners in the point 
system were Sherry Holt, Jimmie 
Jacoby and Ella Clegg,

Other golfers were Wanda 
Stuart, Bobbie Fatout, Dorothy 
Montgomery, Donna Sanders and 
Jonesy Williams.

By Cynthia Harrell Hodges

Ozona firemen will com­
memorate Fire Prevention 
Week by presenting programs at 
the Crockett County Primary and 
Intermediate Schools Thursday 
afternoon. Students will partici­
pate in fire drills and see fire 
department equipment. Some 
individual classes at the schools 
will make posters, and write 
stories and poems about fire 
prevention,

“ The United States has the 
highest record of fire in the 
industrialized world,’’ Fire Mar­
shal Steve Kenley said recently. 
“ Overseas, fire prevention is a 
vital part of regular school curri­
culum.’’

Since the Ozona Fire Depart- 
mènt was established in 1947, 
there have been no major in­
juries. “ This is due to the good 
training, eudeation and luck,’’ 
Fire Chief Dorris Haire said 
recently, “ There is no way to 
fight fires without danger and 
risk. Firemen often get careless 
on little fires. With little fires, 
there is a greater qhance of injury 
to the fireman.”

There has been little change in 
the firemen’s equipment since 
the 1800’s. “ The first radical 
invention was a leather fire hose 
in the early 1800’s,’’ Kenley said. 
Before this hose, a nozzle was 
attached to a pump cart. Men 
formed bucket brigades. Firemen 
really fought this change. The 
next innovation was the steam 
engine. Steamers could pump for 
up to 36 hours. “ Firemen used to 
have contests to see who could 
pump the longest. These steam­
ers were pulled by horses. When 
the gasoline engine was in­
vented, the firemen resisted 
using it. They liked their horses. 
The newest modern advancement 
has been the citizen’s band two 
way radio and the additional 
protective equipment that is now 
available,’’ Kenley explained.

Fires have threè phases: 
smoldering, open flaming and 
smoldering. If a fire gets no air, it 
will use up its available oxygen 
supply and eventually return to 
the smoldering phase, Haire 
said. Each fire must have an

I

Billy Reagor, Rachel Hall and Nancy Hale
on ajob well done!

W e support the 4-H program 

in our community

We will be closed Mondayfor Columbus Day

Crockett County 
National Bank
Your Bank of Personal Service

BANKINGHOURS 
Lobby 9:00 a.m. - 3:00 p.m. 

Drive-in 8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. 
Monday - Friday

Ozona, Texas 
392-3745 / 392-5829

FDIC

ignition source. Some com­
bustible materials will ignite on 
their own.

Haire said that many injuries 
are caused by flashovers. This 
flashover or explosion has been 
known to blow entire buildings 
down.

The key to keeping fires from 
starting is to keep ignition and 
combusion sources separated, 
“ Homes sometimes have, a lot of 
dangerous fire hazards, but this 
is the land of the free, and each 
man can live as he chooses. Each 
man’s home is his castle,’’ 
Assistant Fire Chief Bob Faulk­
ner said.

Most fires are extinguished 
with water. Certain chemicals 
and flammable liquids are ex- 
tinquished with foams and other 
fire fighting chemicals. The most 
fires ever responded to by the 
Ozona Fire Department was 165 
fires in 1977.

Crockett County Commis­
sioners have given us whatever 
we need in the department, Haire 
said. “ We never ask for some­
thing unless we really need it.’’

Sirens signal fires during the 
daytime hours, but home radio 
alerts signal a night time alarm. 
One former member of the fire 
department once had a funny 
thing happen. His wife would get 
up and start his pickup so he 
could go to the fire. One night, 
she started the pickup and waited 
for á long time for the fireman to 
come fight the fire. She did not 
realize that the alarm had been 
cancelled. Kenley said. She never 
did start his pickup for him again.

McCalebs man station
Lowell and Minnie McCaleb 

were just looking for a job when 
he retired 12 years ago from 
Ozona Butane Company. By 
living at the fire station and 
dispatching Ozona firemen, they 
found more than a job - they 
found a sense of never ending 
responsibility.

Having driven a butane truck 
for many years, McCaleb knew 
“ every road in the county” . This 
job was a natural for. him. Mrs. 
McCaleb really mothers the 
firemen. Coffee is always piping 
hot for the volunteers, and 
sometimes there is a tasty desert. 
She stays up, no matter what the 
hour, until the last man has come 
in the firehouse after a call. Fire 
Marshal Steve Kenley said.

The 48 year residents of Ozona 
make sure that the trucks and 
pumpers are dusted each morn­
ing. McCaleb starts each of the 
trucks daily to ensure that it is in 
good running condition. “The 
firemen wash the trucks and we 
just try to keep them clean,’’ 
Mrs. McCaleb explained.

There are more chemical fires, 
and the building material in the 
newer buildings is more hazard­
ous than when we started 12 
years ago, McCaleb observed.

The county commissioners pro-

vide maintance for the equipment 
and see that the firemen get 
updated equipment when it is 
needed. This year, 50 percent of 
the fires have been oil field 
related according to the 
McCalebs.

A fireman can be “ almost any 
kind of person. They don’t mind 
getting up and going and are 
dedicated to fighting fires and 
helping persons,” Mrs. McCaleb 
observed.

There are three pumpers, three 
grass trucks, one van, which 
contains a “jaws of life” , five fire 
trucks, which are continuously 
dusted and pampered by the 
McCalebs, so that they are ready 
to use on a moment’s notice.

The emergency fire number is 
392-2626 or 392-3751. The non­
emergency number at the fire­
house is 392-2544.

Fire department 
organized

As Ozona increased in size, the 
need for fire protection became 
apparent. A group of volunteers 
met in May 1947 and organized 
the Ozona Volunteer Fire Depart­
ment.

Nineteen men became charter 
members of the fire department. 
Bill Cooper, then manager of the 
water and power department, 
was elected president; Alan 
Saunders, a local nurseryman 
who had considerable experience 
with the Sonora Fire Department, 
was chosen fire chief. Roy 
Thompson served as secretary- 
treasurer, and Frank James and 
Ben . Williams were elected sub 
chiefs. Other charter members 
included Gene Williams, Charles 
Ratliff, Oscar Kost, Bill Berg- 
feld. Miller Robison, Dick Hen­
derson, Arthur Kyle, Eddie 
Bower, Ted Doggett, Gene Ra­
mirez, Ed Cranfill, V. 0. Ear­
nest, Beecher Montgomery, Bill 
Hannah, James Semmler, Jim 
Dudley, D. F. Brownrigg and 
Herbert Kunkel.

The first fire station was com­
pleted in May of 1950. Some 
years after the initial organiza­
tion, a fire department band, 
under the direction of Ozona 
High School Band Director 
Corbett Smith performed at 
various civic functions for two qr 
three years. Members of the 
band included: Doug Green,
piano; Hartley Johnigan, bass 
fiddle; Aaron Bledsoe, Jr., 
drums; James Semmler, trom­
bone; Oscar Kost, Jim Dudley 
and A1 Fields, trumpet; Bill 
Carson, baritone; Arthur Kyle 
and W. L. Harrison, saxophone; 
and Bill Cooper, clarinet.

A Model T Ford fire truck 
served as the first equipment for 
the department. A vintage 1935 
model fire pumper still remains 
at the fire station. Due to the 
inaccessability of parts, this old 
pumper is no longer in use. One 
fireman stayed at the firehouse at 
all times. A second metal build­
ing was constructed behind the

PREVENTIVE MAINTENANCE SERVICES

TONY’S
^  QUICK LUBE AND TIDY CAR
-----  1*06 AVE D-

OZONA, TEXAS 76943 
o il  change-lube job-car w a sh  

39*'3S57 F rank  T am bunga

I f you save as much 
in the next five years as the 

last five, will you be satisfied?

Chances are you won’t. Saving isn’t easy, and 
increasing your savings is even more difficult. 
But with Farmers Interest Sensitive Whole Life, it’s 
attainable.

You get a built-in cash value savings feature 
that pays current, competitive interest. Right 
now it’s 12% (4'/2% of which is guaranteed). The 
guarantee remains constant. The high interest 
rate fluctuates with the money market.

This new Farmers Interest Sensitive Whole Life has 
a very competitive prem ium . Also, it provides 
guaranteed life insurance, and cash Values which 
compound annually.

There are other advantages, which I, your fast, 
fair, and friendly Farmers Agent, can tell you.

FARMERS

Farmers New World Life Insurance Cc 
Mercer Island, WA

ELIZABETH UPHAM  
A gent
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primary fire station in 1979. A 
Ladies’ Auxiliary of the Ozona 
Fire Department met briefly 
during part of the 1970’s, but 
disbanded because of the decline 
in membership.

The fire department has been 
called to respond to major fires 
many times during its existence. 
A fire at the Ozona Primary 
School caused over one million 
dollars in damage.

The radio home alert system 
was installed in July, 1973. Sirens 
no longer would waken Ozonans 
during the night, once this 
systerri was installed.

Membership in the present 
department cannot exceed 30! 
Those presently in the depart­
ment include: Dorris Haire,, fire 
chief; Bob Faulkner, assistant 
fire chief; Dick Kirby, assistant 
fire chief and 26 year veteran of 
the department; Steve Kenley, 
fire marshal and arson investiga­
tor; Dee Keilers, training officer; 
Bob Harris, president; Elliott 
Barrera, vice-president; David 
Cooke, secretary-treasurer; and 
Mr, and Mrs. Lowell McCaleb, 
dispatchers; Raymond Borrego, 
newest member of the depart­
ment (April 10, 1984); Randy 
Branch, Al Galindo, Fernando 
Garza, John L. Henderson, a 26 
year veteran of the department; 
Steve Hubbard, Larry McMann, 
Jam es Montgomery, Doug 
Meador, Dub O’Bryant, Max 
Schroeder, Felix Trujillo, Billy 
Wagoner, Tony Wheeler and 
Vance Worthington.

The department provides pro­
tection to Ozona and to those who 
live in the 2600 square miles of 
the county. .Sonora, Eldorado, 
Mertzon, Barnhart, Big Lake, 
Iraan, Sheffield and Del Rio all 
provide mutual aid for Ozona.

Bob Faulkner, à long time 
Ozona fire fighter, said he is 
uncomfortable with the word 
volunteer in the title of the 
department. “ We are trained and

(Cont. on pg. 10)

EARN
10%

4 YEARS

9.5%
2V̂2 years

9.375%
1 YEAR

9.25%
6.MONTHS

9.00%
90 DAY

8.75%
30 DAYS

FSLIC insured to $100,000 for 
each account. Rates subject 
to change without notice and 
substantial interest penalties 
required for early with­
drawal.

STOCKTON
SAVINGS

ASSOCIATION

“Since 1957” 
Ozona, Texas 

CALL 
COLLECT 

392-3776

Kimball Saddlery
H w y 2 9 0 W

Fort Stockton f ■
W Local information, Call 392-3158 ■!

»Custom Built Saddles

«Repair Saddles and ^
All Riding and ^  ’
Working Tack 
•Tack W -' :' J j
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Lion Fever...
CATCH

O zom  Lions w Ballinger Bearcats
There 8:00 p.m.

Introducing the Ozona Lions

KENNETH SESSOM

Kenneth is an avid swimmer and diver and 
served as lifeguard and swimming instruc- 

r - tor at the North Pool last summer. He enjoys
^  listening to music and riding around with his
^  friends.
^  Kenneth is the son of Mr. and Mrs. Tommy

Sessom.

M  

¥

¥

t  J. B. MiUer and Co.
¥

BRAD THOMPSON
Brad Thompson, #80, has set the goal of 

all-district in football and basketball for 
himself this year. He enjoys the competitive­
ness and team concept of sports and has been 
playing football for four years.

Brad also has high scholastic and career 
goals. He hopes to finish in the top of his class 
and then attend college in Florida. He wants 
to be the best that he can be in whatever task 
he takes on.

Brad is a member of the Ozona varsity 
basketball squad and a member of the Ozona 
High School Student Council.

He is the son of Mr. and Mrs. William 
David Thompson.

The following businesses and individuals arc
100% behind you!

¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥

^ B & C Automotive
Clayton’s Village Drug
Happy Hollow

Pepe’s
¥  W ester man Drug
¥  W atson’s 
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥

Small Fashions 

Buttery M otors 

W hite’s Auto 

Mayfield Construction 
House of Rowers 

Donuts Etc.
Brock and CamiUe Jones 

M oore Oil Company 
The Teacher Store 

De La Rosa Plumbing 

The Footnote 
South Texas Lumber Co,

Ozona National Bank 
Circle Bar Truck Corral 
El Chato’s

Leo Cervantez Exxon 
Chem-Solv Corporation 

Baggett Insurance Agency 
Ozona Butane 

Sizemore Funeral Home 

M aness Texaco 
South Permian, Inc.

Tite Bishop Welding Service 

M onica’s Hair and Nails 
Double C. Enterprises 

Gary Vannoy 

Sonny’s Drive In 
Perry’s
Jessie’s Tire Shop 

Crockett County News

ISAIS FLORES
Sports are “ fun, interesting and I am 

learning more about them. Also they help 
me keep up my grades,” said Isais Flores, a 
five year veteran of the football program.

1 want to finish up the year with the 
varsity and keep up my grades. I want to 
make all state in basketball and football,” 
said the grandson of Mr. and Mrs. Alfonso 
Ramirez Jr.

The Ozona Lion band member enjoys 
fishing, swimming and riding around with 
his friends in his spare time.

The Aycock Family 

The Red Apple 
Seven-U Ranch Company 

Perry M otors, Inc.
W ool Growers 

Upham insurance Agency 
Kyle Kleaners 

J. W . M otor Co.
Dairy King

Crockett County Water Dept. 
Stockton Savings 

KWIK-Marc
Crockett County National Bank 

Dina’s Poco Taco 
Thornton’s Supermarket 
Western Auto 
La Cocina

Danny’s Texaco 
Charlie’s Place

¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
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Rachel’s
reviews

By Rachel 0. Hall

One hundred and thirty youth 
were fingerprinted Saturday, Oc­
tober 5, at the Community 
Center. Identification cards were 
provided to all participants and 
included spaces for fingerprints, 
personal identification informa­
tion and current photos.

The Crockett County Sheriffs 
Department and Crockett 
Heights Extension Homemaker 
Club sponsored the fingerprint­
ing clinic. Families who missed 
this clinic and wish to receive an 
identification card should contact 
the Sheriffs Department.

To be commended for their 
assistance Saturday are: Goldia 
Kilgore. Sandra Childress, Doris 
Karr. Rod and Marilyn Chal­
mers. Crista and Martha Chal­
mers. Charlotte Trull, Roberta 
and Larisa Schoenhals, Polly 
Mayes. Victor De La Garza, Bob 
Rodriquez. Danny Simmons, 
.lohn Crockford. Hector De La 
Gar/a. Louis Hall. Fred Fierro 
and Raymond “ Bear” Borrega.

The “ Families Working To­
gether” series held September 23 
and 30 was one of numerous 
aetiNities which ha\e occured in 
the Extension program over the 
past tew weeks. The series was 
sponsored by the Extension 
Home Economics Committee and 
included such topics as strangers, 
first aid and fire safety, leisure 
time and after school activities.

Ì

nutritious snacks and meals, and 
household  re sp o n s ib ilitie s . 
Presentations during the series 
by Dee Keilers, Doris Haire, 
Doug Meadors, Kathryn Russell, 
Jan North and Ken Harrison were 
appreciated.

A newsletter for parents and 
children titled “3-6 Club” is 
available upon request to anyone 
who missed the “ Families Work­
ing Together” series. The news­
letter addresses safety, food, 
study and fun topics. Call 
392-2721 if you are interested in 
receiving this four week news­
letter series.

Five ladies completed the 
Beginners Sewing Course which 
was held on consecutive Thurs­
day nights in September and 
early October. Participants in­
cluded: Judy Paris, Mary Hucka- 
bee, Jody Barton, Jeanie Thomp­
son and Reba Houston. Addition­
al sewing classes for adults will 
be coordinated based upon re­
quests.

UPCOMING EVENTS:
Oct. 10 - Progressive Exten­

sion Homemaker Club meets at 
12:00 noon. Civic Center, for a 
program on “ Stress” by Ann 
McCartney

Oct. 15 - Program Building 
Committee Meeting, 7:30 p.m.. 
County Extension Offiee Meeting 
Room.

Connie Mae Fielder, age 8, was one of the children who 
participated in the fingerprinting clinic Saturday. Assisting are Victor 
De La Garza and Danny Simmons [seated].

★  Football
tC ontfrom  pg. 1)

linger 20-12 earlier this season -  
in the last two and one half 
seasons. The Bearcats defeated 
Brady 21-6 this week, to improve 
their reeord to 4-1.

“ The Bearcats are a very well 
coached team. They have an 
excellent junior quarterback, Eric 
Lugo. Terry Strambler, a 186 
pound running back, (he scored a 
22 yard touchdown during the 
Brady game) has tremendous 
speed. Wide receiver Bobby 
Gomez is an excellent pass 
receiver. The defense Bearcat is 
anchored by all district offensive 
tackle Tommy Sauceda and line­
backers Scotty Zutuche and 
Timmy Kozelsky,” Green said.

Ozona continues to be plagued 
by nagging injuries. Lion de­
fensive guard Brad Thompson 
suffered a shoulder separation 
and will not play this week. 
Running back David Adams sat 
out the last three quarters of the 
Eldorado game after ex­
periencing dizziness. It is not 
known if Adams, who suffered a 
head injury earlier in the season

School
Cafeteria
MENU'

WEEK OF OCT. 14-18 

MONDAY
Corny Dogs, Vegetable Salad, 

Macaroni and Cheese, Sliced 
Peaches

TUESDAY
Enchilados, Spanish Rice, 

Ranch Style Beans, Tossed Green 
Salad, Pineapple Tidbits

WEDNESDAY
Western Chili Beans, Fresh 

Garden Salad, Sunny Fruit, Pea­
nut Butter Cookie, Cornbread

THURSDAY
Hamburger on Bun, Tater 

Tots, Lettuce and Tomatoes, 
Banana Pudding

FRIDAY
Southern Fried Chicken, Sea­

soned Green Beans, Creamed 
Potatoes, Dixie Chilled Fruit, Hot 
Rolls

S92-2726

1206 c;4i/e.
Ogona. 0°e)i:as

THE CAMERAS TW O  
PHOTOGRAPHY

portfalts<ommercial-weckJHigs-quick passport photos

Sandra Childress
hometown professional photographer

392-2256404 AVE J

against Big Lake, will play 
against the Bearcats. Roger 
Flores, a junior tight end, re­
ceived a neck sprain, and may be 
out of the Ballinger game.

The large, enthusiastic home­
coming crowd saw Ozona receive 
the opening kickoff on their own 
22 yard line. Adams, who gained 
41 yards in the game, scam­
pered to the 36 yard line on the 
first play from the line of 
scrimmage. The drive was 
stopped on the 43 yard line by a 
quarterback sack.

The Eagles could not move the 
ball on their first possession 
because of a penalty. Both the

School
Bulletin Board

ALL SCHOOLS
Oct. 16 - Report cards issued

HIGH SCHOOL

SIX WEEKS TESTS 
Oct. 9 - Periods 1, 3, 7 
Oct. 10 - Periods 4, 6 
Oct. 11 - Periods 2, 5 
Oct. 10 - 9th Grade vs. 

Mertzon, there, 6:30 p.m. Bus 
leaves at 4 p.m.

Oct. 11 - Pep rally, 3 p.m.; 
Ozona vs. Ballinger, there, 8 
p.m.; School dismissed 3:20 p.m.

JUNIOR HIGH

SIX WEEKS TESTS 
Oct. 9 - English, Reading 
Oct. 10 - History, Band, Special 

Classes
Oct. 11 - Science^ Math

Oct. 10 - 7th grade vs. Iraan, 
here, 5:30

INTERMEDIA TE SCHOOL

Oct. 10 - Fire drill and program 
by firemen in observance of 
National Fire Prevention Week

Six weeks tests all week

PRIMARY SCHOOL

Oct. 10 - Fire prevention
program, fire drill, 12:30; pos­
ters, poems

'T e o

CERVANTEZ

901 Sheffield Road 
, 392-5082 .

wheel balancing
A full service station 
with tires and batteries

^usG oi

904 Ave. H
392-5883 

Come in and get
FREE NFL  

AFL Schedules

J Norma’s M
{  Country ^
■k Kitchen -k
£  OPEN 10 to 10 J
^  closed on Monday ^

•k SPECIALS

i  7’i/£‘5Z).4K-Hamburgers^ 
w and fries $2.25 ^ ̂lPEDNESDAy-\0 p ie c e s^

^  of chicken $4.65 ^
^  THURSDA F-Steak finger-i^

Sutton and
Crockett
Counties

Hablamos Español

LIFE AUTO FIRE 
HOMEOWNERS 

GENERAL LIABILITY 
FARM/RANCH 

ESTATE PLANNING 
WORKERS COMP.

Sutton County Farm Bureau
Serving you to Serve Again

Bill Saveli - home 392-2062 
Sonora answering service 387-5231

N otice o f  
REW ARD

I am offering

$500 R ew ard
for apprehension and con­
viction of guilty parties to 
every theft of livestock in 
Crockett County-except that no 
officer of Crockett County may 
claim the reward.

SHERIFF, CROCKETT CO.
SnhMUs

Eagles and the Lions had their 
next few possessions stopped by 
interceptions, fumbles and penal­
ties.

A second quarter drive by the 
Eagles started on their own 35 
yard line. A 55 yard pass from 
Eldorado quarterback Jimmy 
Turbeville to wide receiver Jesus 
Martinez moved the ball to the 
Ozona 10 yard line. The Eagles 
attempted a field goal, but it was 
no good.

The next Lion possession 
ended with a fumble on their own 
27 yard line. The Eagles lost no 
time getting on the score board. 
Turbeville connected with Mar­
tinez on a 27 yard touchdown 
pass at the 8:26 mark of the 
second quarter. The PAT by Mike 
Moore was good, and left the 
score at halftime 7-0 in favor of 
the Eagles.

The second half started with 
fumbleitis by both teams. Ozona 
Lion Brad Thompson recovered 
an Eagle fumble on the Eagle 20. 
Clutch runs by Chuy Hernandez 
and Harvey Fierro set up a two 
yard touchdown dash by quarter­
back Steve Sanchez at the 5:35 
mark of the third quarter. The 
two point conversion pass from 
Sanchez to Fierro gave Ozona an 
8-7 lead -  their first lead of the 
season.

The Eagles struck back im­
mediately. A 34-yard pass from 
Turbeville to junior tail back Russ 
Dacy moved the ball to the Lion 
26 yard line. Senior Eagle tail 
back Jay O’Harrow scampered up 
the middle for a 26 yard touch­
down romp, giving Eldorado a 
13-8 lead. The PAT two point 
conversion was no good.

Ozona capped its scoring with a 
late fourth quarter 46-yard drive. 
Runs by Fierro and Sanchez 
sustained the drive to the Eagle 
five yard line. The score came on 
a fourth down, five yard pass 
from Sanchez to Fierro. The 
Sanchez-Fierro combination also 
connected on a two point con­
version pass, to make the score 
16-13, Lions over the Eagles.

Both the offense and defense 
played well. The offensive line 
did a “ super job blocking.

Harvey Fierro, Butch Gonzales 
and James Sanchez did out­
standing jobs,”  said Coach 
Green.

Steve Sanchez had 11 passes 
for 121 yards. Chuy Hernandez 
had 12 carries for 31 yards, and 
Butch Gonzales gained nine 
yards on five carries.

“ Hit of the Week” honors 
went to Andy Dews, Abel Lara, 
Art Gonzales and John T, Stokes. 
“ Maldonado (Coach Pete’s) 
stinging bees, Brian Morrow, 
Butch Gonzales, Brad Thompson 
and Bias Vargas made the big 
plays when necessary. We had 
one quarterback sack and few
penalties that killed 
Green said.

drives,”

OZONA ELDORADO
13 First Downs 11
36-44 Rushes-Yds, 30-87
12-121 Pass-Yds. 8-171
165 Total Yds 258
24-12-2 Pass-Comp.-Int 14-8-0
6-29 Punts-Av. 5-34.6
2-1 Fumbles-Lost 7-3
2-18 Penalties-Yds. 10-57.5

Ozona youths 
win trophies

Marshall Hubbard, Shane 
Cooper and Jeanie Cooper all 
received trophies for second 
place wins in the Christoval High 
School Rodeo Club’s rodeo at 
Eldorado September 28,

Hubbard was second in calf 
roping, Shane second in goat 
tying and break-away calf roping 
and Jeanie second in goat tying.

Other Crockett County partici­
pants in the rodeo were Greg 
Underwood, Kevin Miller and 
Ronnie Pratt.

CECIL WESTERMAN 
Would 
Like
To Be 
Your
Pharmacist 

392-2608

DONUTS ETC. 
392-5800

SPECIAL ORDERS
Open  

6 days
6 a.m. to 1 p.m.

pies
dinner rolls 

cobblers 
cheesecakes

breads and hamburger buns 
hot sandwiches and fountain drinks

*5% o£f ®“ «M
Shotgun and Rifle Shells 
by the case or by the box

Ozona Wool 
& Mohair

La Cocina

basket $2.99
^  FR/D^F-Fish and fries ^  
^  with slaw $2.99 ^
^  we also sell ice cream 
jw cones and shakes . C

M 4
BRUCE MAYFIELD
General Dirt Contractors 

P . O . B ox 1736 
Ozona, Texas 7^943

Home Telephone 
392-2149 '

SPECIAL
M an ess i  J.W . MOTOR PARTS CO

I-IO T exaco 1  ^ 5 1 J W . JOHNIGAN -OWNER
1  C A Q l ^

* GAS * GROCERIES * ICE 1  OZONA TEXAS 76943
I-lO & H wy. 163 

Full and self service 11  CARQUESTrthe right place to but buy auto parts 
1  Over 1700 CAROUEST Auto Parts Stores Coast to Coast.

Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday
Mexican Dinner Beef Soup Chicken Fried Steak Monterrey All Burritos

Came Guisada Dinner 
Steak Ranchero 
Fajita Dinner

New Item added to menu 
El Sombrero

Opened 6-2 and 5-10
Orders to go welcomed! 392-2810 Monday - Sunday
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Comings and Goings
By Cynthia Harrell Hodges

Shane and Drake McKinney 
and family have moved here from 
Menard and are making their 
home in the Webster house 
across from Flying W Lodge. 
McKinney is the new president at 
Crockett County National Bank.

Kellye Prosise of Bastrop, 
Rikki Green of Bastrop and Lonni 
Green of Angelo State University 
were here to attend the home­
coming game Friday night and 
visit their father, Coach Jim 
Green, and Mrs. Green.

Mr. and Mrs. 0. D. West will 
celebrate their 64th wedding 
anniversary October 15 with a 
quiet dinner with their daughter 
and son-in-law, Beth and Leonard 
Boyd.

Mr. and Mrs. R. A. Harrell left 
Sunday morning for a regular 
checkup at the Mayo Clinic in 
Rochester, Minn. They will be 
returning home Friday or Satur­
day.

LuAnn Perner Pierce is in 
Community Hospital in San An­
gelo awaiting the birth of her 
second child. Her husband, Joey, 
accompanied her to the hospital 
from their ranch near Ozona,

Lowell Littleton returned home 
Saturday from a Houston hos­
pital. He is reported to be doing 
well.

Mr. and Mrs. Mark Worthing­
ton and Katie have moved into 
their new home, the former 
Lowell Littleton house.

Diana and Jimmy Trevino of 
Odessa visited their parents, Mr, 
and Mrs. Andres Trevino, last 
weekend. They both attend 
Odessa College.

Mary and Santiago Ybarra will 
celebrate their first wedding 
anniversary Sunday.

Kay and David Cooke and 
family have returned recently 
from Walla Springs, 90 miles 
from Dallas, where they visited 
her parents.

Kristie Thurman Cushman and 
her children, David, a seventh 
grader; Sarah, a fifth grader; and 
Beth, a kindergartener have 
moved here from Tuscon. Mrs. 
Cushman is the daughter of Carl 
and Marlys Thurman.

Congratulations to Betty and 
Tom Martin on their 17th anni­
versary Saturday.

Rachel and Louis Hall attended 
a county Extension agents’ meet­
ing in Midland Monday.

Mrs. Frances Flannigan cele­
brated her birthday with her 
family Monday.

On Saturday, October 5, Mrs. 
Denis Moran was honored with a 
surprise birthday party. This very 
special event was made possible 
by her five sons and their 
families, Joe and Tina, Frank and 
Gloria, Rudy and Margie, Eleno 
and Esmie, Florencio and Norma. 
Also attending were fifteen 
grandchildren and six great- 
grand children, A barbecue din­
ner and birthday cake were 
enjoyed by alt.

Ralph and Kay Anderson left 
Friday for their new home in 
Bartletsville, OK after spending 
the night with Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Watson.

Mrs. Lottie Lee Baker and her 
daughter, Mrs. Priscilla Pakkila 
of Buchannan Dam, have re­
turned from a three week trip to 
the Green Mountain, state of 
Vermont. They visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Bob Bixby and son J. J. of 
Ludlow, located at the foot of 
Okemo, a famous New England 
ski resort. Bixby is a supervisor 
for the General Electric plants in

Rutland, 20 miles from Ludlow.
While there, they attended the 

harness races in Saratoga, N.Y. 
The 10 races were run on “ the 
fastest one-half mile track in the 
world,” Mrs, Baker said.

Mrs. Baker saw J. J. play in his 
first soccer game of the season, 
and Bixby compete in a Fox Run 
Country Club golf tournament.

“ We had a wonderful time and 
a wonderful trip,” she said.

Mrs. J. W. Johnson of Bastrop, 
mother of Judy Reagor, and Mrs, 
Blanch Reagor of Llano, mother 
of Billy Reagor, visited here over 
the weekend.

Sue Littleton, daughter of 
former Ozonan Eleanor Ingham 
Littleton, has received a full 
scholarship to St. Edwards Uni­
versity in Austin. Mrs. Littleton, 
who works for an Austin law firm, 
will attend special classes on 
Saturday. She plans to earn her 
degree with a major in Spanish 
and a minor in English.

Mrs. Morgan Singleton of 
Kerrville has been a recent visitor 
in the home of Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Probst.

Mr. and Mrs. Terry Racher 
have returned from Carrizoso, 
N.M. where they visited his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Gordon 
Racher. The elder Racher rode on 
a motorcycle for the first time and 
had a ball.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Williams 
were in Del Rio Saturday to 
attend an art show.

J. D. and Doris Norton and 
daughter Dolores, Paul and Bea 
McLemore of Lake Palestine are 
here for the duration of deer 
season to patrol the Hudspeth 
Miller Ranch where they have 
been coming for several years.

Dean Phillips was in Colorado 
Springs, Colorado last week to 
attend the second reunion of the 
54th Fighter Group.

A recent story about Mrs. Vera 
Baker inadvertently omitted the 
name of her younger grand- 
granddaughter, Miss Joanie 
Martin. Joanie is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Martin. 
She is a senior at Highland 
Park High School in Dallas where 
she has just been named captain 
of the tennis team.

Mrs. Maness’s fifth grade class panned 
for gold last v^eek in front of the 
Intermediate School.

Pictured above are L-R Eric Sanchez,

Bobby Grado, Cipriano Perez, J. J. Coy and 
Angel Cervantez. Good luck kids. We hope 
you Jind that pot of gold at the end o f the 
rainbow! n e w s  photo by Scotty M oore

Arrests reported
More than $3,000 in construc­

tion supplies were reported 
stolen from a construction site 
near the Circle Bar Motel and 
Truck Stop this week. Crockett 
County Sheriffs Department was 
notified of the theft Monday, and 
the case is under investigation.

Four out of state residents 
were arrested in Crockett County 
during the past week. THP 
Trooper R. B. Babbitt arrested 
two brothers from Arizona Mon­
day after a routine license check 
indicated that the car they were 
in had been stolen in Arizona. 
The men, ages 40 and 41, were 
arrested on I-IO near Circle Bar, 
They remained in jail Tuesday 
awaiting pickup by Arizona au­
thorities.

A Florida man was arrested 
October 3 by Richard Barton 
assisted by THP officers Neil 
Lovern and R. B. Babbitt. The 
man was stopped on a routine 
speeding charge and found to be 
wanted on theft warrants out of 
Key West. He was released the 
next day after Florida refused to 
come pick him up.

A 54 year old New Mexico man 
was arrested October 4 as a

parole violator from the New 
Mexico State Prison. He came to 
the Sheriffs Office seeking wel­
fare assistance, and it was 
discovered that he was wanted. 
He was still in jail Tuesday 
awaiting arrival of New Mexico 
authorities.

Three Ozona men were ar­
rested for public intoxication 
October 6, One was fined $100 
and released the next day. The 
other two were fined $150 and 
released October 7.

The Sheriffs Department re­
ceived a report from a citizen 
whose horse had been shot in the 
leg with a pellet gun while the 
horse grazed in Johnson Draw.

Square dance 
sign up

This is the last week to enroll in 
square dance classes. If you are 
ready for fun and friends, join the 
group of dancers which meets 
each Thursday at 7:30 p.m. at the 
Methodist Church.

To enroll or for further infor­
mation, call 392-3060, 392-3451 
or 392-3082.

Stiidy Qub meets 
at Pandale

Pandale Study Club met Oc­
tober 3 at the Pandale Com­
munity Center with Ginger Per­
ner, secretary-treasurer, presid­
ing in the absence of the 
president and vice-president.

Josephine Mills, chairman for 
the November meeting, assigned 
tasks for the Thanksgiving dinner 
and for the Val Verde County 
Centennial observance to be held 
at the old Pandale Store and Post 
Office.

Sandwiches, punch and Oreo 
ice cream dessert were served by 
hostesses Sarah Hargraves and 
Myrtle Malone to members Sue 
Arledge, Lara Sue and Leana 
Baggett, Lela Bunger, Opal 
Everett, Josephine Mills, Judy 
Norsworthy, Ginger Perner and 
Jessie White.

Sue Arledge for Lou Deaton, 
reporter

BE KIND.
Remember, everyone you 

meet is fighting a hard battle.

The Circle Bar Restaurant
and

Jose Tobar 
are now ready to serve you with those

very important
parties, banquets, weddings, etc.

Come join us for our daily Specials
Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

Spanish steak Bar-b-que plate Chicken fry Catfish special

Refried beans & rice Potato salad 

Pinto beans
French fries French fries

Two flour tortillas
Onions Pickles

Salad bar Salad bar

Dessert 
Coffee or tea

Coffee or tea Coffee or tea

$4 '̂ $4“ $4'̂ $4“

Monday
Hamburger Steak 

French fries 

Salad bar 

Coffee or tea

$425
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Buy, Sell, Trade, Save! 
in the Classifieds
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392-5230

For Sale
For Sale: Reg. Rambouillet 

bucks. Ex. quality. Tony Allen. 
392-3414.________________2pl5

Small Catalina deep freeze for 
sale. 392-2920 7 a.m. - 3 p.m.; 
392-2853 after 3 p.m.______ lp l6

For Sale: Snare drum ir
excellent condition. Call 392-3278 
after 5.___________________ ^

Ink cartridges for caligraphy 
pens for sale at The News.

For Sale: TRS 80 Model 4 with 
cassette and programs. $450. 
392-5888._______ 4c9

PREVIOUSLY 0  WNED GUNS 
Cash or Trade 

No Tax 
392-2490

Ruger Security Six stainless, 
.357 mag. - $250.

Ruger Speed Six stainless, .357 
mag. - $250.

For Sale: structural pipes and 
sucker rods. 392-5020. tf8

Real Estate

MAKE OFFER!

MUST SELL NOW!
3 bedroom, 2 bath, 4 yrs. old. 
Site-built home. Owner may 
carry part of equity. Closing 
costs, fees pd., will buy 
points; See'305-Rugged Rd;' 
behind high school. Call 
392-3634 or 303-824-7442.

APARTMENT FOR RENT 
2 bedroom, 1 bath, living room 
w/fireplace located at 901 Ave. J; 
$300.00 monthly. Contact: Don 
A. Patrick - 512-774-4555. 2cl6

Mobile Homes

1970 Celebrity mobile home. 
14x70. Excellent condition. Ap­
pliances included. 392-2334. 9 
a.m. to 5 p.m. tf/1

Building, remodeling, paint­
ing, cement work, roofing. Clyde 
“ Red” Myatt. Call after 5 p.m. 
392-2602. tf3

Miscellaneous

POLLY'S CAKES

Decorated cakes, cookies and 
cupcakes for all occasions. Re­
member Halloween parties. 
Wedding cakes large and small. 
392-3129. 211 Mesquite. 3cl2

Part-time job needed. Call 
392-3985.________________2pl4

Fire guards and righ-of-ways 
maintainer or dozer cut. 392-5020 
________________________ tJ8

Garage Sale: metal shelves ana 
gondola. 501 Ave. I. Thurs.-Fri. 
9-6 lcl5

PERRY’S

Daily and Weekly VCR Rentals

Open on Sunday 
12:30 - 5:30 p.m.

Notices

Card o f Thanks

A big thank you goes to all who 
helped with the Poor Man’s 
Supper. Special thanks go to 
Crockett County National Bank, 
Ozona Nationa Bank and Joe 
Tobar for their donations.

Band Boosters

★  Fire .
(Cont. from  pg. 4)

attend schools; the only dif­
ference between us and the mem­
bers of a paid fire department is 
the salary issue. We are both 
professionals, trained and 
schooled in saving lives and 
property.”

The fire department meets on 
the second and fourth Tuesdays 
of the month. Each prospective 
new member is evaluated during 
a six month probationary period. 
The prospective member is then 
voted into full membership at one 
of the bi-monthly business meet­
ings of the organization.

As fire chief, Haire, who has 
served in that capacity for the last 
12 years on and off, has the final 
responsibility for the personnel 
and equipment. Bob Harris, as 
president, presides at the busi­
ness end of the department.

The department averages 120 
runs per year. All fires are 
investigated by Kenley, the fire 
marshal, who is also an identifi­
cation officer of the Sheriffs 
Department. Kenley has training 
in the origin and cause of fires, is 
a certified peace officer and 
"serves on various state arson 
boards.

The Crockett 
County News

392-5230

Pandale Pannings
by Jonny Johnson

Last Monday afternoon a 1964 
Piper Com. 250 plane belonging 
to the Young Mobile Home 
Company of Hobbs, N.M. made a 
landing near the Gries 
Ranch with the landing gear up. 
Some damage was done to the 
plane, but no one was hurt.

Mae Tinney of San Angelo

spent the weekend with Gene and 
Pickle Finch.

The bow hunters were out last 
weekend and were having some 
good luck. There were a lot of 
hunters and fishermen in the 
Pandale area.

Kerry Bradshaw of Del Rio is 
visiting with the Calvin Johnsons.

Border Patrol apprehensions 
up 20% for year
Border Patrol agents of the 

Ozona Station apprehended a 
total of 1,802 persons for the year 
ending September 30. This re­
flects a 20 percent increase in 
overall apprehensions over the 
previous year.

By far the Ozona Station’s 
greatest increase was in the 
apprehension of persons trans­
porting aliens into the United 
States. Thirty persons were ar­
rested transporting aliens to 
various points in Texas and 
beyond. This is a 500 percent 
increase in these felony appre­
hensions over last year.

A total of ten vehicles were

Couples golf winners
October 1 winners at Couples 

Golf included: 1 Joyce and
Weldon Maness with Bob and 
Barbara Wallace; 2 S. L. and 
Marie White with Mike and 
Debbie Vordick; 3 Bill and Ella 
Clegg with Wanda and B. W. 
Stuart.

Taking the honors of closest to 
the pin were Charles Williams 
and Wanda Stuart.

OZONA
BUTANE

Propane 
Sales and 
Services 
392-37^

Jesse’s
Tire Repair 

Shop

Corner Ave. H & 5th St. 
Phone 392-3473

ROUSTABOUT AND PAINT SERVICE 
BRUSH CONTROL ROAD REPAIR 

BACKHOE SERVICE

Double C Enterprises
P O BOX 332 OZONA, TEXAS 76943 

FULLY INSURED

BLACK DIR 
CALICHE

fill

Day or Night
915-392-2858 915-392-5020

CLEAR RIGHT OF WAYS 
MOVE MOBILE HOMES 
LOCATION CLEAN UP

MOORE on. COMPANY
101 Ave. E.

Local distributor of
^  Compressor OU0 ^  Diesel

Motor oil A* Gasolines
^  Methanol

Phone 392-3010

NOTICE TO BIDDERS

THE COMMI S S I ONERS  
COURT OF CROCKETT 
COUNTY, TEXAS will receive
sealed bids until 11:00 AM 
Monday October 14, 1985 for the 
purchase of One New Gooseneck 
Low Boy Trailer.

Bidding instructions and spe­
cifications may be obtained by 
contacting the County Auditor 
Office, Courthouse Annex, Ozona 
Texas.

Dick Kirby
County Auditor
Crockett Countv 2cl5

®  / 4 1 / IO M ia S

Crockett Automotive
1202 Ave. E., Box 518 
Ozona, Texas 76943 

(915)392—3159

Good Supply Parts 
Overnight Service

6 f i s

seized by Ozona Border Patrol. 
These vehicles, used in the trans­
portation and movement of 
aliens, had a combined total 
value of $24,000.00. The vehicles 
are auctioned in Del Rio, and 
anyone interested in bidding may 
contact the vehicle seizure officer 
in Del Rio at 512-774-4681.

The Border Patrol wishes to 
thank Sheriff Billy Mills and the 
Crockett County Sheriffs Office, 
Rod Chalmers, State Game War­
den, and the officers and dis­
patchers of the Texas Highway 
Patrol for their cooperation and 
assistance to the Border Patrol in 
Ozona.

J o h n n y  C h ild r e s s  
R E A L  E S T A T E

RESIDENTIAL - RANCHES 
LOTS - ACREAGE 

COMMERCIAL
CHANDLERDALE WEST LOTS 

Owner financing available

392-3634 392-5051
1102 Ave E OZONA

W- JACOBY  
REAL ESTATE

Homes-Lots-Commercial 
Ranch Properties 

392-3059 401 Hillcrest

South Texas 
Lumber Co.

M ^ O W A R E  STO R E S ,

Of Osona 
3 9 2 -2 6 3 4

ROC kiT ioTies ~ wind miir& ” 
Pump Service

Ranching Background 
New Equipment 
Fair Rates 
Sales & Service

I

P.O. Box 914 Sonora, Texas 76950
Phone 

(915) 387-3711

Prevention is protection

Fiire
p rev en tio n
week
O ct. 6-12

O N B  proudly salutes 
Ozona Volunteer Firemen

a group of community minded men working 
to keep our homes and families safe!

Ozona
National Bank

Since 1905 Ozona, Texas 76943 Member FDIC 

Phone 392-2676,392-2694, 392-3787
For timely weather reports, call 392-3751


