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Commissioners hear hospital proposal
Commissioners listened to i 

proposal by Dr. Bill Bass of San 
Angelo regarding operation of a 
medical facility here when they 
met Monday. In short order, Bass 
told the court that Shannon 
Hospital would send a doctor to 
Ozona on a part-time basis when 
needed, still wanted to operate a 
facility here as previously pro­
posed, and that Shannon is 
looking at a heliocopter evacua­
tion set-up which would benefit 
area communities. Bass com­
mented that Crockett County has 
the “ highest fatality rate after 
accidents in the state” .

Ozona was recently without a 
doctor for 10Vi hours while Dr. 
Don Carlilse was hospitalized in 
Shannon and Dr. R. M. Owens- 
by was away. Medical coverage 
which had been arranged did not 
materialize, and alternatives had 
to be found without notice. Dr. 
Carlilse’s concern over the situa­
tion was expressed to Bass, 
prompting his comments to the 
court. Bass also told his listeners 
that Carlilse is now out of the 
hospital following skin graft on 
his leg and is expecting to be 
back at work November 1.

Later in the morning, the court 
invited Bass to outline the 
Shannon proposal for operating a 
medical facility in Ozona, in­
formation which has been pre­
sented before in the community 
and The Crockett County News.

Shannon Hospital would es­
tablish a family practice clinic

here for routine, non-emergency 
care and put in an emergency 
room comparable to the one at 
Shannon. Management of the 
clinic would be through Shannon- 
Shamrock with contract doctors 
available at the clinic 10-12 hours 
a day and on call the remainder of 
the time, Bass said.

The Shannon proposal would 
upgrade the Crockett County 
Care Center to a skilled nursing 
facility which would have to be 
Medicare approved. Skilled nurs­
ing facilities can be reimbursed 
by Medicare for recuperative care 
of patients brought in after being 
hospitalized elsewhere for thre or 
more days.

Bass told the court the ad­
ministration of the Care Center is 
alright, but Shannon would su­
pervise if desired. Shannon 
would also operate the am­
bulance service if the county 
wished. Bass praised the local 
EMS for the number of highly 
trained personnedl.

Shannon would operate an 
emergency room - family practice 
clinic out of the present hospital 
building and take care of all 
in-county treatment of indigents 
for $250,000 per year. Crockett 
County would be responsible for 
maintenance of the building and 
insurance with Shannon to main­
tain and upgrade medical equip­
ment as needed.

A cancellation clause could be 
put into the contract, Bass said, 
after being asked by com­

missioners.
County population should 

generate 40 sick people a day 
needing medical treatment ac­
cording to Bass.

Hospital Administrator Don 
Hopkins told the court that use of 
the hospital had dropped 80 
percent in the past two years 
compared to two percent else­
where. Total patient days during 
the past month were 47 with 30 
attributed to one individual. 
Percentage of occupancy was 
7.83. Total cash deposits for the 
hospital were $49,485.03 and 
total cash disbursements were 
$85,474.17.

The situation comes down to 
“ what does the community want, 
and what are they willing to pay 
for,” said Hopkins.

J. W. Johnigan and Dee 
Keilers presented plans for the 
new wastewater plant and re­
quested a letter of approval from 
Judge A. O. Fields. The official 
sanction is part of the process of 
state approval.

Johnigan also asked about the 
status of $20,000 in Revenue 
Sharing funds allotted for new 
sanitation equipment. Instruc­
tions were given to issue the 
check to be used toward a later 
purchase of a trash truck.

County Road Supervisor Eddie 
Moore reported that the main­
tenance crew is back on caliche 
roads which have “ taken a 
beating from rains” .

Moore was instructed to put a

The home o f Bob and Carolyn Harris at 201 Avenue K  has received 
the Garden o f the Month award from Ozona Garden Club.

Moving day at the Library
The long-awaited shelving has 

finally arrived at the Crockett 
County Public Library. Frank 
Vargas with Central Freight 
delivered 32 boxes containing the 
book shelves last week. They 
were a welcome sight to Librarian 
Louise Ledoux.

The opening of the library had 
been delayed due to a manu-

tìte Weather
by James Pagan

Rain Hi Lo
Oct. 8 .02 74 67
Oct. 9 .64 79 69
Oct. 10 83 67
Oct. 11 84 61
Oct. 12 84 61
Oct. 13 83 60
Oct. 14 .37 74 50

facturer’s delay in shipping the 
metal shelving. They were manu­
factured by a firm in Montreal, 
Canada. J. C. Schroeder and his 
side-kick Gary are now in the 
process of assembling the book 
shelves and placing them in the 
book rooms. A big thank you goes 
out to J. C. and Gary from the 
Library Board and the Library 
staff.

Plans can now go ahead for the 
move into the new building. 
Moving day has been scheduled 
for Saturday, October 26. All 
Friends of the Library are urged 
to be there and lend their 
support. There aré many more 
ways to help out than just by 
physically moving the books. 
Refreshments and lunch for the 
movers need to be supplied,^ 
drivers, packers and un-packers 
are needed. It’s going to be a fun 
day of work and community 
fellowship.

Anyone interested in joining in 
to help can call the library at 
392-2185 or 392-3563 to pledge 
your support. Moving will start 
^bout eight o’clock Saturday

water tank truck out with other 
equipment which is to be auc­
tioned.

A request by Onecimo Ortiz for 
motor replacement or repair to a 
1979 GMC pickup was granted. 
The court agreed to a new Target 
engine for the truck. Ortiz also 
told commissioners that the 
street sweeper is giving trouble. 
Bryon Stuart was instructed to 
make inquiries regarding over­
haul of the machine.

Youth Center Director Garland 
Young told the court that there

were 28 bookings last month at 
the Civic Center. The Youth 
Center has the highest member­
ship ever with 176 high school 
students, said Young. Pool tables 
at the Center will be covered this 
week, and card tables are 
scheduled for repair and replace­
ment.

Beth Boyd appeared on behalf 
of the Chamber of Commerce to 
request funds for replacement of 
holiday decorations. An order

(Cont on pg. 2)

Ozona official
Sesquicentennial
community
Ozona has been designated as 

an official Sesquicentennial com­
munity announces Sandy Stokes. 
Stokes is co-chairman of the 
Crockett County committee along 
with Mrs. Geneice Childress.

Lee Storie of Austin v/ill be 
here October 22 to make the 
recognition official at a 7:00 p.m. 
meeting at the Civic Center.

Mrs. Sara Hignight’s students 
will present a patriotic program 
at that time, and the public is 
invited to attend.

S O  U T :

Bennett rites
Zelda Atchison Bennett of 

Ozona died in Fort Stockton at the 
home of her daughter October 8, 
1985. She was 82. Mrs. Bennet 
had been ill for about a year and 
one-half.

Funeral services were Thurs­
day, October 10, at 2:00 p.m. in 
the Ozona church of Christ with 
burial in Cedar Hill Cemetery 
under direction of Sizemore Fu­
neral Home.

Mrs. Bennett was born April 4, 
1903 at Sagerton in Haskell 
County. Her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. John Atchison, and family 
moved to Stanton in 1907. She 
was the next to the youngest of 
eleven children of which five still 
survive.

She married Raymond A. Ben­
nett of Fort Stockton and Ozona. 
He preceded her in death in 
August of 1962. Their children 
are Ellis Ray Bennett of Houston, 
Betty Carroll Hickman of Fort 
Stockton and Dr. John Terry 
Bennett of Richardson.

Mrs. Bennett lived in Midland 
for a time and returned to Ozona 
in 1964 to make her home there. 
She retired as manager of the 
Crockett Hotel in 1980 at the age 
of 77. She was a bright spot in the 
lives of many friends and rela­
tives and a faithful member of the 
church of Christ from the age of 
twelve. Her philosophy of living 
is summed up in her own words, 
“ The true end of life is to prepare 
so at the end of life we are ready 
for the life that never ends.”

Survivors include her three 
children, 10 grandchildren and 2 
great-grandchildren; four sisters, 
Alta Henson, Elvie Henson, 
Stella Kelly, Noma Blocker; one 
brother, Foreson Atchison of 
Stanton; numerous nieces and 
nephews.

Pallbearers were grandsons, 
Terry and Grant Hickman, Chris, 
Michale, Hiram and Eric Ben­
nett.

morning. A lunch break is 
scheduled for noon at the new 
library, and lunch will be pro­
vided bv the Friends for all 
movers.

Music, progress reports and 
encouragement will be 'provided 
by KRCT Radio.

“ Come join in the fun Saturday 
October 26, at the library,” says 
Mrs. Ledoux.

B /
This giant tumbleweed is a signal o f Fall 

weather. The tumbleweed blew in ahead o f a front
last week.

Bearcats defeat the Lions 56-(L
Ballinger simply out per- 

sonneled and out manned the 
Ozona Lions during a 56-0 rout in 
Ballinger Friday night. Ballinger 
has a winning tradition, especial­
ly at homecoming games, and 
“ once they get you down, they 
won’t let you back in the game,” 
Head Lion Coach Jim Green said. 
“The team was even better than 
on film.”

Ballinger was up for this home­
coming game, and defeated the 
Lions on all fronts -  running, 
passing, defense and kicking.

Preparation after a game, 
whether it is a win or loss, starts 
the next day. “ When you win, 
you celebrate one night. When 
you lose, you put it behind 
you.” Green explained. ,

Colorado City journeys here to

attempt to extend its district 
record to 2-0 Friday night. The 
Colorado City Wolves will not 
overwhelm Ozona size wise. 
There will be a 10-15 pound per 
man advantage to the Wolves, 
but this should not be much of a 
factor. Colorado City defeated 
Coahoma last Friday, and has a 
3-3 season record. Though picked 
to finish fourth or fifth in the 
district, the Wolves currently 
share the district lead with 
Crane and Ballinger (all have 1-0 
records).

“ The Wolves are a passing 
team. They try to spread you out 
defensively with passing, so they 
can run. The Lions try to run, so 
we can pass.” The Colorado City 
quarterback, Mike Ligón, throws 
well, and he had good receivers.

Board has short meeting
The Ozona Board of Trustees 

completed agenda items in record 
time during their regular monthly 
meeting on Tuesday, October 8.

After approving the minutes 
and the accounts payable, the 
members accepted insurance pro­
posals from the Baggett Agency 
for school property and casualty 
insurance, automobile liability 
and physical damage insurance 
and worker’s compensation in­
surance.

Superintendent Garland Davis 
presented a proposed local school 
policy which allows school prin­
cipals, subject to the approval of 
the superintendent and within 
State Board of Education guide­
lines, to shorten class periods for 
the purpose of conducting an 
abbreviated school day. The pro­
cedure would be used no more 
than six times per year and would 
allow principals more flexibility 
in planning staff development 
sessions, faculty meetings and 
school activities. The policy was 
approved as presented on a 
motion by Van Miller secondéd 
by Gary Buck Mitchell.

The trustees approved the 
d istric t’s participation in a 
m ath/science cooperative co­
operative program sponsored by

the Region XV Education Service 
Center in San Angelo on a motion 
by Cecil Buckner seconded by 
George Ybarra. They also ap­
proved additions to the sub­
stitute teacher list for the district 
on a Mitchell motion seconded by 
Buckner.

The second reading of guide­
lines for removal of problem 
students from the classroom was 
given by Assistant Superinten­
dent Ted Cotton. Acceptance of 
the guidelines was approved by 
the board on a motion by Van 
Miller seconded by Hank Sellers.

Board members acknowledged 
a philosophy position paper on 
the girls’ athletic program from 
Coach Ronda Yarborough and 
discussed repairs needed for 
school housing.

Trustees went into executive 
session to discuss personnel.

The meeting was adjourned 
after President Jeffrey Sutton 
gave members a report on the 
Texas Association of School Ad­
ministrators - Texas Association 
of School Boards Fall Conference 
which was attended by board 
members Gary Buck Mitchell, 
Joe Couch, Jeffrey Sutton and 
administrators Ted Cotton and 
Garland Davis.

Senior rushing back Sammy 
Rivera provides the Wolves’ 
rushing threat.

“ There will be no wholesale 
changes in the lineup. Two junior 
varsity members. Sub Fierro, 
wearing #23, and playing wing- 
back, and Ben Rios, an offensive 
lineman and defensive guard, 
have been elevated to the varsity 
•squad permanently.” Nine junior 
varsity players saw action in the 
Ballinger game. All nine, George 
Wall, Fierro, Rios, Bret Hood, 
Oscar Payne, Danny Sanchez, 
Rene DeLa Rosa and Jimmy 
Etheridge, played well and 
helped provide replacements to a 
tired defensive unit.

During the first quarter, the 
game seemed to be a defensive 
struggle, with neither team 
moving the ball consistently.

In the second quarter, the 
Bearcats got untracked, and Stan 
Neff capped a scoring drive with 
a six yard touchdown dash. Brad 
Matschek kicked the PAT at the 
6:59 mark of the second quarter, 
to give Ballinger a 7-0 lead in the 
game. Ballinger got its second 
score less than a minute later, 
when all district 186-pound

(Cont on pg. 3)

Courtney
service

Mrs. Wilma S. Courtney of 
New Boston, sister of Mrs. 
Arthur Phillips of Ozona, died 
October 9, 1985 in a New Boston 
hospital. She was 69.

Mrs. Courtney was a frequent 
visitor in Ozona through many 
years. She was born in Asherton. 
Her husband died in 1978.

Services were held in New 
Boston Baptist Church on Friday, 
October 11, and interment was in 
Carrizo Springs with a graveside 
service on Saturday, October 12.

She is survived by one son, 
Robert E. Courtney of New 
Boston; one brother, William W. 
Collins of Chesapeake, VA; and 
one sister, Bernice C. Phillips of 
Ozona.
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Pandale Pannings
by Jonny Johnson

Vite/a to Eldorado store

We have had cloudy, nice 
weather temperature wise all 
week, and the bow hunters are 
having a heyday, I understand 
the best kill in several years.

The Pandale Trailer Park was 
opened by Mr. and Mrs. Okey 
Grimm this week with eight R.V. 
hookups at present.

Four people in two canoes left 
from the crossing Saturday with 
the Texas High Bridge as their 
destination.

The fishermen and campers 
were out again this weekend 
taking advantage of the re­
maining fall weather.

We have been busy shipping 
and receiving cattle this week.

SUPPER TO BENEFIT MEALS 
ON WHEELS PROGRAM

Everyone is invited to eat at the 
Civic Center October 18 from 5:30 
to 7:30 p.m. Sausage/hot dogs, 
beans, slaw and cornbread with 
spiced cake, tea or coffee will be 
served. Price is $4.00 for adults 
and $2.00 for children.

Funds will benefit the Meals on 
Wheels program.

Kathy Reavis is chairman of 
the organization with Rachel Hall 
as secretary and Beth Boyd is 
treasurer. Other members are 
Louis Hall, Jerry Hill, Blanch 
Castro, Elma Buckner and Sa­
vannah Wright. The group meets 
the first Monday of each month.

Anyone 60 years of age or older 
is eligible for the hot lunches 
which are delivered five days a 
week.

YOUTH BIBLE CLASSES

Youth Bible classes are being 
held at Temple Jerusalem Bap­
tist Church on Saturday at 7:00 
p.ih. All young people are 
welcome to attend the sessions 
which last for one hour.

In addition to Bible study, the 
young people plan to visit the 
Care Center and have occasional 
trips as part of their activities.

EMS TO SPONSOR 
PROGRAM

SAFETY

Crockett County EMS invites 
the community at be at the Civic 
Center October 28 for the film 
“ Room to Live” . The film and a 
program will be presented at 7:00 
p.m. by Safety Education Instruc­
tor Charlie Ramirez.

Refreshments will be served 
following the program.

DEER CENSUS WORKSHOP

A deer census workshop will be 
held Thursday, October 17, at 
7:00 p.m. at the Ozona Civic 
Center in the small meeting 
room.

Dr. Dwight Guynn will present 
a short program on census work 
and the value of it in a deer 
management program. He will 
also cover methods and pro­
cedures of laying out lines and 
counting.

Following his presentation, the 
group will load into vehicles and 
actually go out and lay out a 
census line and make the count.

Ranchers who are interested in 
doing a better job of managing 
their deer and in turn increasing 
income from hunting are en­
couraged to take advantage of 
this workshop.

By Cynthia Harrell Hodges

The closing of the Foxworth- 
Galbraith Lumber Company end­
ed 46 years of service to Crockett 
County and the surrounding area.

“ The economy in Ozona had 
been on the decline for the last 
two year,” 22-year bookkeeper 
and manager of the yard, Nip 
Vitela, said. Vitela, who lacks 
three years until retirement, 
plans to commute to Eldorado 
and work at the Foxworth- 
Galbraith yard there. “We have 
no plans to move away from our 
friends and home.’’

The closing of the store did not 
surprise Vitela. “ I had been a 
bookkeeper most of my years 
with the company. When Larry 
Petron, former manager of the 
store here, left and I was elevated 
to manager, I knew what was 
going on.’’

The closing of this store is 
“just an isolated incident’’. The

company, which operates 58 
stores, has bought nine other 
yards this year.

The unsold merchandise is 
being distributed to other stores 
in the chain. The company is also 
attempting to sell a company 
house.

Economic predictions by the 
company for this area forecast a 
downward trend for several more 
years, Vitela said. The company 
normally only closes those stores 
which were very old and dilapi­
dated.

The closing of the store means 
the end of competition between 
yards. “ It was just not viable to 
keep the store open any longer, ’ ’ 
said Vitela.

He enjoys being with his wife, 
Maria, and their daughter, 
Sylvia and her family, as well as 
fishing. “ We have not been too 
happy about all this, but at least I 
still have a job. The company has 
taken care of me.’’

O’Bryant resigns from EM S
Crockett County EMS held the 

regular monthly business meet­
ing Monday, October 14, at 8:00 
p.m. in the Care Center dining 
room. Members present were 
David Cooke, Zoe Green, John L. 
Henderson, Carol Hunnicutt, Dee 
Keilers, Doug Meador and Tina 
Moran.

Vice-president, Carol Hunnicutt 
announced the resignation of 
organization president Dub 
O’Bryant who is also ambulance 
co-ordinator, and read a letter of 
appreciation from him to all those 
present. Dub is being transferred 
by his company to another 
location.

More touches were put on the 
plans for a booth at this year’s 
Halloween Carnival. All those

present volunteered to help in 
some way, but still more volun­
teers are needed.

It was also announced that on 
October 28 at 7:00 p.m.. Safety 
Education Instructor Charlie Ra­
mirez will present a special 
program at the Ozona Civic 
Center. A movie titled “ Room to 
Live’’ will be shown by Trooper 
Ramirez, and he and members of 
the EMS will be present after­
ward to answer questions that 
may arise.

The film was recently show to 
second and third graders in 
Ozona schools.

Everyone is invited to come out 
a see this move and visit and 
enjoy refreshments afterward.

Hoover awarded contracts
★  Hospital

(Cont, from  pg. 1)
placed by Wednesday is guaran­
teed delivery in time for this 
holiday season said Mrs. Boyd. 
She commented that her many 
pleas for donations from the 
community had, for the most 
part, gone unanswered. A total of 
55 decorations are needed, but 40 
will suffice for this year accord­
ing to Mrs. Boyd.

Commissioners guaranteed a 
minimum purchase of 25 deco­
rations at $4,530.50. Mrs. Boyd 
was asked to seek donations for 
the other 15. She said that the 
only money the Chamber had on 
hand for decorations was a 
donation of $100.00 received 
three years ago from the late 
Doris Moore.

The decorations have not been 
replaced since 1963.

Bids were opened at 11:00 for 
purchase of two one ton trucks 
and a half-ton pickup and 25 ton 
lowboy trailer. Jim Bass Ford was 
low bidder for the vehicles. Aztec 
trailer sales was awarded the bid 
on the trailer.

Judge Fields announced that 
the Meals on Wheels program in 
Crockett County will be termi­
nated October 31 unless another 
place is located for preparation. 
The program is 90 percent funded 
by the Department of Human 
resources and Concho Council of 
Governments with the reamining 
10 percent provided locally.

The hospital kitchen and Civic 
Center were discussed as al­
ternative locations with commis­
sioners favoring a trial period at 
the Civic Center.

Ken Boling of American Bene­
fit Hospital Corporation pre­
sented an insurance plan to the 
court Monday afternoon designed 
to provide the same benefits for 
health, dental and life as the 
current carrier. Blue Cross. Bo­
ling said his plan would guaran­
tee a $66,000 savings to the 
county this year.

Approval was given for im­
provements to a road department 
building to increase storage area 
for tires and equipment.

County Extension agents 
Rachel Hall and Billy Reagor 
provided a special report to the 
court requesting that the Exten­
sion budget be amended to take 
care of increased travel require­
ment expenses. The amendment 
was approved with no increase in 
funds to the Extension oroeram.

Special antlerle^s 
deer tags to be issued

Texas Parks and Wildlife De­
partment will issue special antler­
less deer tags for Crockett County 
on October 30, 1985 from 8:00 
a.m. until noon and from 1:00 - 
5:00 p.m. in the County Court­
house. The special tags are 
required for any antlerless deer 
harvested in this county during 
the upcoming hunting season. To 
qualify for tags, a landowner 
must own or control acreage in 
Crockett County.

After the opening of hunting 
season, tags will only be available 
through the State Office in Austin 
and through regional offices 
located in Rockport, San Angelo, 
Tyler and Waco. Tags will not be 
issued by local department per­
sonnel.

Landowners or their agents are 
urged to pick up tags on the 
scheduled issuance dates.

J^hil Tciliplc v y .V iiv i'

Educational Recording Service of 
Ozona, received state and na­
tional contracts last week. Educa­
tional Tour Consultants of Win­
chester, VA awarded exclusive 
recording rights for the following 
music festivals: Mid-America M. 
F. - St. Louis, Mo., Greater 
America M. F. - Chicago, 111., Six 
Flags Over Georgia M. F. - 
Atlanta, GA, Six Flags Over

lexas M. jb. - Dallas, TX, and 
Astro World M.F. - Houston.

The state contract was awarded 
by the Texas Music Educators 
Association Board of Directors. 
The contract includes recording 
all the all-state organizations, 
guest university groups, honor 
groups, and all clinics. Events 
will take place throughout the 
1985-86 school year.

The heaviest dog so far on record 
was a St. Bernard that weighed 295 
pounds.

SPECIAL
Consumer Steel Radial Tires

1 9 5 /7 5 R 1 4 $ 3 3 .5 0

2 0 5 /7 5 R 1 4 3 6 .5 0

2 0 5 /7 5 R 1 5 3 6 .5 0

2 1 5 /7 5 R 1 5 3 8 .5 0

2 2 5 /7 5 R 1 5 4 0 .0 0

2 3 5 /7 5 R 1 5 4 3 .5 0

Check our 
prices on 

Michelin Tires

Free 50%  Replacement 
W orkmanship & M aterial W arranty

Price does not include mounting and balancing

Wool Growers Central Storage Co.
607 Ave H Ozona, Texas 392-3731
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McCartney honored 
on retirement from Shell

J. McCartney was honored 
with a retirement party by fellow 
Shell employees and retirees last 
Saturday night, October 12, at 
Inn of the West. The group 
presented him with a gold pocket 
watch.

J. went to work for Shell on 
June 15, 1951. He worked first at 
the gas plant at Notrees near 
Odessa. In 1962, he transferred 
to McCamey, then in 1970, he 
transferred to Quanah. Here he 
worked as a combination man

with both the gas plant and with 
production. In 1978 he moved to 
Ozona as a lease operator.

All of J .’s immediate family 
were present for his retirement 
party. He and his wife, Ann, were 
joined by Mr. and Mrs. Ken 
McCartney and Kendra Ann from 
Amarillo, Mr. and Mrs. Greg 
McCartney and Regina Gayle 
from DeSoto, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Mike Bounds (Danita) and their 
daughter, Katherine Brooke, 
from Abilene.
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free tumbler 
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Brent Scott - art teacher and more Tta« t“ P«Pare for Pecan Show.

By Cynthia Harrell Hodges

“ Everyone needs to open their 
eyes and see how things are 
made -- see things they have 
never seen before,” art teacher 
Brent Scott said recently.

“ Art is everywhere, in every­
thing we touch, feel or see. All 
man-made objects are some type 
of art. A student can use art his 
entire life by becoming more 
aware of everything around him” 
said the former Brownfield 
carpenter.

Scott taught in Brownfield for 
11 years before entering carpen­
try for six years. “ I missed 
teaching and am glad to return to 
it.”

Carpentry and art are inter­
related. “ Persons often asked 
how something would look when 
it was finished. I could draw a 
picture of what a kitchen nook or 
a remodeled bath would look like. 
Art can be used in any field,” 
said the versatile Scott.

“ The hardest thing to give 
students is self-confidence. 
Everyone can go to his own 
height in art. I have to dig each 
student’s height out. We are our 
own worst critics. If a student will 
quit criticising his own work, if 
they will stop trying so hard for 
perfection, they can develop their 
own style.”

Learning under different art 
instructors is advantageous. A 
person can learn each instructor’s 
techniques, but eventually return 
to his own particular style. 
“ Everyone has a particular style. 
New techniques merely enhance 
a person’s own style.”

Scott admits that it is difficult 
to grade art. At an art show, for 
example, three different judges 
will judge each piece, based on 
their own likes and dislikes.

“ I try to grade not only on how 
nice the drawing is, but also how 
much time and effort the student 
puts in the work, as well as how 
involved he was in the project. If 
students try, they will receive a 
B. It is hard to get an A plus - 
there is always room for improve­
ment.

“ I am not trying to make 
everyone who takes the course an 
artist. I just want to push a 
student as far as he wants to go. 
It is entirely up to the student. 
Sometimes, you can push a 
student further than he wants to 
go. We are often so busy we 
never see things,” he explained.

The state has not set curri­
culum for teaching art. There are 
just some guidelines. “ House Bill 
72 has made teachers more 
aware. We must teach essential 
elements. We must cover more 
areas of art, have more variety in

the course. Instructors can no 
longer just teach in their parti­
cular field of interest.”

The course is divided into two 
levels, but most of his students 
are enrolled in the beginning Art 
I level. The course will include 
various craft areas, such as 
ceramics, leather crafting and 
latch hooking. Crafts widen the 
teaching scope. Many students 
are more craft oriented. A new 
kiln, bought last year by former 
art teacher, Mary Helen Parks, 
has just arrived this year. “ We 
hope to do slab coil work, where 
we build and design our own 
work, as well as some green ware 
work with molds.”

Since this is his first year here, 
Scott said he is learning about the 
students and how to develop the 
course. “ We hope to work toward 
one or two art shows each year, 
and have some competition 
among the students.

“ There is no cost to the 
students except for a 10 cent 
pencil. If a student really wants to 
explore a particular phase of art, 
then the school will not provide 
expensive materials. The student 
must, for example, buy his own 
set, if he wishes, of watercolors.” 

Scott entered the world of art in 
a round about way. Lacking

(Uont on pg. 4)

The annual Crockett County 
Pecan Show will be held De­
cember 9 and 10 according to 
County Extension Agents Rachel 
Hall and Billy Reagor. The show 
is sponsored by the Crockett 
County Extension Program Build­
ing Committee. Beth Boyd is 
chairman of this year’s show. 
Buster Deaton, Chairman of 
Processing, and Janet Hill, 
Chairman of the Food Division.

The pecans will be processed at 
the Chamber of Commerce on 
December 9 and judged in Ozona 
National Bank on December 10. 
The food will be judged in the 
Chamber of Commerce. The 
pecans and winning food entries 
will be displayed in Ozona 
National Bank on December 10.

Annually some of the winners 
from the County Show place at 
the regional and state shows. 
Last year, June Henderson’s 
Kincaid was first at regional and 
state. Lou Deaton’s Stuart was 
second at regional. Her Mahan 
was first at regional and state.

This year homeowners have a 
good crop of pecans, so there 
should be a good pecan show. 
Now is the time to start planning

for the show. The early maturing 
and heavy nuts are beginning to 
fall. They are usually superior to 
the ones that fall off the tree 
later.

Rules are much the same as in 
the past. Those entering should 
select 45 nuts of the same variety, 
large, uniform, free from cracks 
and blemishes, and put in a bag 
labeled with their name. Only one 
entry per variety per exhibitor 
will be appreciated.

In order for a variety categor to 
be judged, there must be two or 
more entries in the same variety. 
All varieties with less than two
entries will be classed as 
“ others” . Pecans must be ex­
hibited in their natural state with 
no artificial alterations. Pecan 
entries may be left at the 
Chamber of Commerce or County 
Extension Office. The deadline 
for entering is Monday, Decem­
ber 9, at 3:00 p.m. the processing 
will begin at 5:00 p.m. on 
Monday in the Chamber of 
Commerce. The pecans will be 
judged Tuesday, December 10.

In the Food Division, rosettes 
and ribbons will be distributed in 
all food categories. The cham­

pion adult food entry will receive 
a pecan plaque. Three age 
divisions include: adult, 13-19 
(school student), and 12 and 
under. Categories include cake, 
pie, candy, cookies, bread and 
miscellaneous. Pecans must be in 
all recipes with the entire recipe 
submitted, or in case of cookies, 
three dozen. Food should be 
wrapped in clear plastic wrap 
with name and food category on 
each entry. Recipes must be 
submitted with food. Foods will 
be judged on appearance, flavor 
and texture. There is no limit to 
the number of entries. All food 
entries should be submitted' De-‘ 
cember 10, 7:30-10:00 a.m. at the 
Chamber of Commerce and 
picked up by 6:30 p.m.

Any primary or intermediate 
student is encouraged to partici­
pate in the poster contest pro­
moting the use of pecans. Posters 
will be judged on originality, 
appearance and promotion of 
pecans. Ribbons will be pre­
sented. Posters should be regis­
tered Tuesday, December 10, 
7:30-10:00 a.m. at the Chamber 
of Commerce.

Everyone in the community is 
encouraged to participate in this 
year’s pecan show.

New books at library^
New books at Crockett County 

Library include:
Art o f the Maya by Henri 

Stierlin
Art o f the Aztecs by Henri 

Stierlin
North American Indian Art by 

Peter T. Furst
Step-by-Step Bookkeeping by 

Robert C. Ragan
The Guinness Book o f Golf

Facts and Feats by Donald Steel 
The Guinness Book o f As­

tronomy by Patrick Moore 
Asimov's Guide to Halley's 

Comet by Isaac Asimov 
Edmond Halley: The Man and 

His Comet by Barbara H. Hec- 
bart

Electricity and Electronics by 
Gerald E. Williams

Pascal for Beginners by Chris­

topher Lampton
Texas Politics by Wilbourn E. 

Benton
The Texas Governor's Mansion 

by Jean Houston Daniel 
Hold the Dream by Barbara 

Taylor Bradford
Walk in my Soul by Lucia St. 

Clair Robson 
Mindbend by Robin Cook 
Son o f the Morning Star by 

Evan S. Connell

Students attend UIL conference.
Odessa College was the scene 

of a University Interscholastic 
League pre-activities conference 
Saturday, October 12.

Several Ozona High School 
students accompanied by journa­
lism coach Jacquelyn Shacklette 
attended.

The purpose of the conference 
was to prepare students for

spring UIL competition in all 
events which included speaking, 
writing, math and science.

Other similiar conferences are 
being staged throughout the state 
at various times during the fall.

T. C. Tucker, Isabel Benitez, 
Linda Villarreal, Virginia Al­
varez, Patsy Vasquez, Summer 
Shacklette, Amy Beth Scoggins 
and Dottie Gonzalez were the 
students attending.

'Education is teaching a child how to talk—and then howto keep quiet."
Anonymous

★ Football
(Cont from  pg, 1)

running back Terry Strambler 
rushed 23 yards to make the score 
13-0 Ballinger over the Lions. 
Cory Lee kicked the PAT.

A Bearcat interception thwar­
ted the Lions’ next offensive 
effort. The Bearcats promptly 
moved the ball from their own 45 
yard line to the Lion 45 with a 
pass reception from Lugo to 
Jason Sedco. Strambler gained 
much yardage, including a 15 
yard rush during this third 
scoring drive. Lugo passed to 
Grant Teplichek for the third 
Ballinger score with 1:52 left in 
the first half. Lee kicked thie PAT 
to make the score 21-0.

The Lions gained their only 
first down of the first half on their 
next possession, but were unable 
to sustain the drive. The Bearcats 
ended the first half scoring attack 
with a 12-yard run by Timmy 
Kozelsky. The two point con-

version was not good and left the 
halftime score at 27-0, Ballinger.

“ It took a lot of heart and 
courage to play in the second 
half as hard as we did,” Green 
said. “ We never did quit scrapp­
ing until the end.”

The second half started omin­
ously for the Lions. Strambler 
returned the second half kickoff 
60 yards for a touchdown. The 
PAT by Lee was no good, and the 
score stood at 33-0.

The Lions then mounted their 
only offensive drive of the night. 
Starting on their own 33 yard 
line, Ozona moved to the 49 yard 
line of the Bearcats. An inter­
ception stopped this drive on the 
Bearcat 37 yard line.

Ballinger promptly took ad­
vantage of the Ozona error. An 18 
yard pass to Lee and a 20 yard 
dash by Strambler set up a 15 
yard touchdown run by Neff. The 
PAT by Lee pushed the score to 
40-0.

The next Ballinger drive was 
stopped on the 37 yard line of the 
Lions. Bearcat Cory Lee showed
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how strong his foot was with the 
first of three field goals. This 43 
yarder made the score 43-0.

An interception stopped the 
next Lion drive and set up a 46 
yard field goal by Lee early in the 
fourth quarter.

The last Bearcat touchdown 
three yard run by 

Kozelsky, with 2:55 left in the 
game. The PAT by Lee was good, 

and made the score 53-0.
Ballinger had evernthing 

bounce its way. The next Lion 
possession ended with a Bearcat 
fumble recovery of a mishandled 
Lion ball. The Bearcats marched 
down the field to the Lion 37. 
After a penalty, Lee kicked a 56 
yard field goal with 2:39 left in 
the game to end the night’s 
scoring and make the final score 
56-0.

During the tough game, the 
Lions suffered two injuries. Bret 
Thompson sustained a shoulder 
injury and may not p'̂ ay in the 
Colorado City game. B/ian Mor­
row received an ankle -injury and 
probably will not play Friday 
night against the Wolves.

76943
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Maria and Adolfo Rodriguez were witnesses for vows spoken by Fortunato and Elena Tambunga.

0°ambangGs cefcb/iatc goMcn onniiie/isa/ty
Fortunato and Elena Tam­

bunga were honored with a 
golden wedding anniversary cele­
bration Saturday, October 12, 
1985. The renewal of vows was 
heard at three o’clock in the 
afternoon at Our Lady of Per­
petual Help Catholic Church. 
Present as witnesses were Adolfo

and Maria Rodriguez.
A reception was held for all 

invited guests following the 
ceremony. The sons and daugh­
ters and their children were all 
presented at the dance.

The couple was married Oc­
tober 16, 1935. They have 11 
children, 36 grandchildren and 32

great-grandchildren.
The children are Nato Jr., 

Cruz, Ernest, Sam, Neo and 
Alejos who lives in Ft. Worth, 
Lina De Hoyos, Mela Flores, 
Irene Gomez of Sonora, Lupe 
Cervantez and Vicky Longoria. 
Another son, Armando, is de­
ceased.

M rs. Hopkins attends 4-H seminar
Mrs. Nelda Hopkins has re­

turned home from Eatonton, GA 
where she attended the 1985 
Southern Regional 4-H volunteer 
Leader Forum at the Rock Eagle 
4-H Training Center. Mrs. Hop­
kins was among 16 leaders from 
Texas participating in the Sep­
tember 30 - October 4 conference 
designed to help volunteers build 
specific leadership skills and to 
facilitate the exchange of ideas.

skills and knowledge. The five- 
day event attracted some 300 
adult volunteer leaders from 13 
southern states, the Virgin Is­
lands and Puerto Rico.

In keeping with its theme “ 4-H 
Volunteers: For Youth for Ameri­
ca’’, the forum included work-

1'shop sessions, educational visits 
to the Uncle Remus Museum in 
Eatonton and historic homes in 
Madison, and an Idea Fair at

I'

Nordilakc
INSULATED 

water buck leather 
w ith  a

Wcrterproof Guarantee

The competition 

NORTNLAKE

$77 95

All leather 
Ranch Shoe

$39”

'i t  CARIBOU
SNOW FACS 

Removable Shearling 
top

w ith wool felt liner

Long sleeve chambray work 
shirts • • • • $13*' '̂

All leather insulated gloves 
$ 1 8 ““

Hooded sweatshirts $ 8 8 ““ 
A ainsuits...............  $ 6 ““
Ozona Boot & Saddlery

'which each state exhibited suc- 
cessful ideas, projects or ac­
tivities from their local 4-H clubs.

Ybarra chosen 
Knight of Month

Edward Ybarra has been 
chosen Knight of the Month by 
the Ozona Chapter of Knights of 
Columbus.

Criteria for the selection in­
cludes the Knight and his family 
being active in the church. The 
Knight must also be of help in the 
activities of the council.

★  Art class
(Cont. from  pg. 4)

one-half credit in junior English 
literature from graduating from 
high school, he laid out of college 
for one and one half years. Scott 
then entered Sul Ross as a 
business major, transferred to 
the industrial arts division, and 
finally settled in the art de­
partment. “ It is so very hard to 
make a living as an artist, I didn’t 
want to teach because I was too 
introverted. Two girl cousins 
convinced me to try teaching, so I 
received my teaching certificate, 
along with my art degree.’’

Scott’s wife, Joy, is a native of 
Alpine, so they both were fa­
miliar with this part of Texas. The 
Scotts both enjoy the outdoors, 
rock hunting, hiking and just 
watching the wonders of nature. 
They have two sons, Ronnie, a 
junior, and K. C., a freshman, in 
Ozona High School.

Scrapbook 
award received

The Alpha Alpha Mu chapter 
of Beta Sigma Phi took honors 
last weekend at the Beta Sigma 
Phi West Texas Area Convention 
with their scrapbook entry.

Approximately 350 organiza­
tion members from various West 
Texas chapters met in San 
Angelo October 11 through 13 for 
seminars and social activities. 
Among members present was 
Alpha Alpha Mu President Leslie 
Wilson. Judges awarded the local 
chapter with third place for their 
scrapbook entry. Convention Par- 
ticijpants gave the book first place 
honors in the “ convention fa­
vorites’’ election. Each category 
had six winners.

“ Jeannine Henderson, Connie 
Jennings and I put the scrapbook 
together. Now that it did well on 
the area level, we’ll be making 
plans to enter it in state and 
internation competition,’’ Wilson 
said.

Charlie’s Place

1 1 :0 0  a .it i.
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if  MethantJ
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&

l i f t s
There is more to life than 

increasing its speed.

A pessimist is a guy who holds 
a seashell to his ear and hears a 
faucet dripping.

A woman’s Lib slogan is - “ A 
miss is as good as a male.’’

Most of us can keep a secret, 
but the people we tell it to can’t.

When looking for “ secret 
faults” , remember you can begin 
at either end of the word “ SIN” 
and find “ I” right in the middle 
of it.

****
Almost anyone can steer the 

ship if the sea is calm.

About the only thing that is 
free of charge today is a 
run-down battery.

To bear fruit, most grapevines, 
trees, and speeches need

By Lottie Lee Baker

pruning.

andThinkers don’t drink 
drinkers don’t think.

Work hard and save your 
money and when you are old you 
can have the things that only 
young people enjoy.

If you are going in circles, 
maybe you are cutting too many 
corners.

Usually after truth changes 
hands a few times it becomes 
fiction,

A LIFT FOR THE WEEK

You must have long-range 
goals to keep you from being 
frustrated by short-range fail­
ures.

EM S personnel to Lubbock
Five Crockett County Emer­

gency Medical Technicians - 
Special Skills will be participating 
in a continuing medical education 
conference October 26 in Lub­
bock. Planning to attend are 
Belinda Henry, Bryan Henry, 
Carol Hunnicutt, Doug Meador 
and John L. Henderson.

The purpose of the conference 
is to review current thinking and 
innovations in pre-hospital care, 
increase knowledge and pro­
ficiency in new techniques and 
keep emergency medical service 
providers abreast of political 
developments at the state level 
which will influence the progress 
of EMS growth in Texas.

Upon completion of the con­
ference, the participants will be 
able to:

•evaluate proper on-site care

for various emergency situations 
•discuss patterns of emergency 

response times in the West Texas 
region

•assess the political and legis­
lative developments at the state 
level which influence EMS 
growth

•describe innovations in air 
evacuation on the South Plains 

•demonstrate proper technique 
in EMS radio communications 

•describe correct pre-hospital 
management of emergency child­
birth

Television personality Dr. 
James H. “ Red” Duke, Jr. will 
be keynote speaker at the con­
ference. He is a professor at the 
Department of Surgery of the 
University of Texas Medical 
School at Houston.

VCR Rentals
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C a re  C e n te r  
N e w s
By Ann McCartney 

Director o f Activities 
and Social Care

The Mflis of God

It seems to me that we might 
still be in the “ dog days of 
summer” even if fall has already 
arrived. The weather keeps 
changing back and forth. I 
believe the lucky ones are those 
who are working outside.

We began a new program this 
week. We are going to try our 
reading and “ Down Memory 
Lane” program at 11:00 on 
Monday mornings. Residents 
Bertha Miller, Hilda Dysart, Ola 
Mills, Juana Hernandez, Pauline 
Clinton and Moriama Perez all 
enjoyed our first session. Elvira 
Martinez assisted with this pro­
gram.

Vivian Hughes, Dorothy Doll, 
Mattie Cooper, Earline Jones and 
Janet Wilson all conducted our 
birthday honorées, Virginia Hoo­
ver and Phil Schneemann, with 
their birthday celebration this 
week. Polly Mayes donated the 
cake and Maxine’s Flowers sent 
both ladies a corsage.

A big congratulations is in 
order to our own Stella Munoz 
whose daughter Zelda was 
named Homecoming Queen for 
Ozona High School.

Many thanks to Maudie Couch 
for making six dozen new bibs for 
our residents, to Louise Taliafer­
ro for sending a big dish of 
cookies, and to the Senior High 
School Class of the Catholic 
Church for bringing our residents 
a basket of fruit.

Tuesday and Friday bingo 
game winners included: Ventura 
Sanchez, winner of the gift cer­
tificate for two dinners from El 
Chato’s, Tomasa Ramoz, winner 
of the gift certificate from The 
Teacher Store, Jesus Hernandez, 
second place winner. We wel­
comed back Bonnie Warth as our 
Tuesday caller and Lelia Tam- 
bunga as our Friday caller. Other 
volunteers included Mattie Coop­
er, Dorothy Doll, Teresa San­
chez, Elodia Zapata, Anna Bell 
Patrick, Gwen Nelson, Sophia

Tijerina, Alice Ross and Minnie 
Karr.

Tuesday afternoon we were 
host to a van load of residents 
from Reagan County Care Cen­
ter. As soon as our van arrives, 
we plan to return their visit. In 
fact we expect this to be an 
ongoing event since we both have 
vans. Big Lake residents visiting 
included Tom Workman, Odessa 
Edwards, Mae Donham, Letha 
Chesnut, Maude Pettit and Paul 
Cavin. Staff members Viola Gate- 
wood and Nancy Leifeste ac­
companied the group. Some 
played dominoes while some 
visited with old friends. All were 
served ice cream and cookies by 
volunteers. Dorothy Doll, Mattie 
Cooper, Vivian Hughes and Clara 
Byrd.

Marie Pierson and Ruth Hester 
(welcome back, Ruth!) assisted 
residents Juana Hernandez, To­
masa Ramoz, Hilda Dysart, Ola 
Mills, Moriama Perez, Emma 
Taylor, and Virginia Hoover with 
ceramics on Wednesday.

Clara Byrd and Vivian Hughes 
conducted our musical program 
Wednesday afternoon. One can­
not help but have a good time 
with these two.

Clara played the piano again on 
Thursday morning after the la­
dies all had their hair fixed. 
Helping Clara fix hair were 
volunteers Vivian Hughes and 
Alena Faye Hokit.

Bible study was brought this 
week by Charles Huffman and 
three fellow church members of 
the Faith Lutheran Church.

This was followed by Spanish 
Hour of Praise brought by Maria 
Vitela, Carmen Vargas, Felipa 
Munoz, Mariana Hernandez, 
Norma Flores, Victoria De La 
Garza, Isabel Molina, Heriberto 
Gutierrez and Lorenza Gutierrez 
of the ladies’ group of Our Lady 
of Perpetual Help Catholic 
Church.

Eleven church members from

Read: Luke 20:9-18

Charles Huffman, pastor 
Faith Lutheran Church, Ozona 

' Hope Lutheran Church, Sonora 
' Edward Gibbon, who lived in 

the 18th century, knew more 
about human history than anyone 
else at that time. You may not 
recognize the name, but have 
probably heard of his most 
famous work: The Rise and Fall 
of the Roman Empire. Once he 
was asked if he could sum up the 
wisdom man had learned on earth 
in one book. His answer was this: 
“ I think I can sum up the lessons 
of history in one sentence, and 
here it is - “The mills of God 
grind slowly, but they grind 
exceedingly fin e“\“ What does 
that mean? Here we are handed 
the accumulated wisdom of the 
human race, and we can’t under­
stand it. Maybe it’s because 
you’ve never been to a flour mill. 
First, the wheat is sifted, and 
then forced air blows most of the 
chaff away. Next, it goes through 
large tumbling drums lined with 
sandpaper. Then it is sent 
through a half-dozen rollers of 
stone or stainless steel, which 
look like the wringers of an old 
fashioned washing machine. 
Next, the wheat is sifted again, 
which is now like powder and 
looks like flour. But, it is still not 
ready! It must be “ bolted” . It’s 
called bolting because it is sifted 
with bolts of cloth, each piece 
finer than the one above. After 
shaking and sifting the wheat, all 
that’s left at the very bottom is 
like talcum powder, which a 
slight breeze would blow away. 
The point of the history professor 
is that “The Mills of God” 
produce only the finest grade of 
flour, that is to say, what goes 
through the Mills of God gets 
pulverized completely.

But this is not just some history 
professor’s opinion. The Bible 
shows us it’s God’s own truth. In 
the reading above, Jesus tells a 
parable the point of which is that 
God doesn’t leave sin unpunished

----------------------------- j------------
this same Catholic church ac­
companied Father Richard Alten- 
baugh for our Sunday afternoon 
services. This group brought an 
enjoyable program.
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forever. Jesus tells the Jews that 
God would take His Church away 
from them and give it to others. 
Those who heard this said “ That 
must never happen!” In answer 
to that statement, we read that 
Jesus looked directly at them and 
said: “ The Stone the builders 
rejected has become the Corner­
stone. Everyone who falls on that 
Stone will be broken into pieces, 
and if that Stone falls on anyone, 
it will scatter him like dust.”

The Mills of God are the 
long-term consequences of our 
actions. What does the grinding 
is life. What goes through the 
rollers and crushers and gets 
“ sifted like wheat” , are those 
who ignore the warnings of God. 
There are many things which 
remind us of God’s power and 
His displeasure with sin. For 
example, any sickness or disease 
can remind us of the curse of 
disease and death that followed 
upon Adam’s sin. So, in this age 
of so-called free sex we see the 
breakdown of family and various 
diseases. Other things that show 
us God is still the One who 
decides what is right or wrong in 
this world are alcoholism and 
cirrohsis of the liver, drug 
addiction and suicide, fornication 
and herpes disease, abortion on 
demand; and of course, homo­
sexuality and the latest disease of 
AIDS. Of course, ANY sin should 
cause us to think of God’s will for 
our lives as put forth in His 
Word.

Again, Jesus says: “The Stone 
the builders rejected has become 
the Cornerstone. Everyone who 
falls on that Stone will be broken 
into pieces, and if that Stone falls 
on anyone, it will scatter him like 
dust” . Rejection of Jesus, open 
disobedience and defiance of God 
will put you through the mill, 
alright, and that mill grinds men 
and nations to finest powder and 
scatters them like dust. Going 
through a literal flour mill 
couldn’t be more unpleasant. 
But, thank God, there is another 
alternative! In His unspeakable 
grace God sent His Son into the 
world to “break” things. By His 
life of perfect obedience to the 
Word and will of the Father, 
Jesus Christ broke the curse and 
condemnation of the law that was 
against us. By His innocent 
suffering and death on the Cross, 
He broke the power of sin and the 
devil that held us captive. And, 
by His glorious resurrection from 
the dead, our Lord broke the 
bonds and fear of death. The 
benefits of Christ’s redeeming 
work are ours by grace, through 
faith. In his first letter, chapter 2, 
the apostle Peter says that if we

Debbie Phillips hosts 
Xi Sigma Omega

The Xi Sigma Omega chapter 
of Beta Sigma Phi' met Monday, 
October 14, at 7:30 p.m. in the 
home of Debbie Phillips. A 
business meeting was held. 
Members who attended the West 
Texas area convention in San 
Angelo reported on activities and 
events at the convention. The 
program was presented by Mrs. 
Phillips, who led discussion on

happiness and what makes indi­
viduals happy.

Members present included Ar­
lene Clayton, Bobbie Fatout, 
Brenda Newton, Donna Sanders, 
Jeanne Wellman, Donna Snyder, 
Diane Myers, Sherry York, 
Janice Graham, Marsha Cannon, 
Dana McAllister, Betty Koerth 
and the hostess.

believe in this Cornerstone, Jesus 
Christ, we will never be disap­
pointed.

Everyone who falls on that 
Stone will be broken in pieces. If 
you turn to him, Jesus will break 
you - but that’s GOOD! If a bone 
is crooked in the first place, the 
Doctor has to break it so he can 
heal it. As people are sinful in the 
first place, the Son of God has to 
break you so He can heal you. We 
are all sinners, there are places 
where we are not perfectly 
straight and there are places 
where we have sinful rough 
edges which need to be ground 
off. In 1 John 1:8-9 we read: “ If 
we say we have no sin we deceive 
ourselves, and the truth isn’t in 
us. If we confess our sins, we can 
depend on Him to do what is right 
- He will forgive our sins and 
wash away every wrong.” . Fall 
on Jesus and He will do that for 
you. The process may not be the 
most pleasant in the world - but it 
beats going through the mill! In 
His grace, God calls us to daily 
repent, to fall on Jesus, so He can 
continue to break us and remake 
us in the image of His Son. When 
the sinner comes to the point 
where he prefers being broken by 
Jesus to that of being crushed by 
the Mills of God, he’s in for a 
pleasant surprise! The surprise is 
that Jesus is totally different than 
anyone else. Everyone else says: 
“ First you chanee. then we’ll 
love you” . But Jesus says: “ First 
I’ll love you, then you’ll change” . 
And the Lord tells you and me to

be the same way. We should 
never give the impression we 
approve of sin - we hate it - but it 
is equally important that Chris­
tians express God’s love for the 
sinner. How else will they know 
Christ’s love, except through us? 
How else will they ever be able to 
change, except through His love? 
We are to express the love of 
Jesus, even for the most un­
lovable people.

We, who have fallen on Jesus, 
who have experienced His chang­
ing love and found forgiveness 
have come to know that He never 
gives up on the sinner and that 
He never writes us off as a “bad 
job” . We are never hopeless! 
The Mills of God not only remind 
us of His power and displeasure 
with sin; they also provide us 
with opportunities to share the 
Good News of the other alterna­
tive - that often rejected Stone 
who has become the Cornerstone, 
Jesus Christ.

‘ÎJJouSG o | 9?0IA/G/(S

904 Ave. H

392-5883 
Come in and get 
Dallas Cowboy

Schedules

PR EVENTIVE M A IN T E N A N C E  SERVICES

T O N Y ’S
QUICK LUBE A N D  TIDY CAR  

1206  A VE- D- 
OZONA, T E X A S 76943  

o i l  ch a n g e -lu b e  job -car w a s h  
392-3857 F r a n k  T a m b u n g a

Î ^  è fa  Q o sa

S92-2726 
1206

4  O g o n a , 9 ° G m

Notice of 
REWARD

I am offering ,

$500 Reward
for apprehension and con­
viction of guilty parties to 
every theft of livestock in 
Crockett County-except that no 
officer of Crockett County may 
claim the reward.

SHERIFF. C R O C K S  CO.
BUty Mills

CECIL WESTERMAN 
Would 
Like

•To Be 
Your
Pharmacist 

392^2608

LEO 
CER VANTEZ

901 ^effíeld Rojid®\ ■

' ^ h ë e f î Œ i S Ï
 ̂ A  full service statioiii: 

.j^ th  tires and batterieS'

-S ’i
f u n e r a l  ..J^c

izem ore
unerai 

SERVING THE LOWER PERMIAN 
BASIN

HIGH PROFESSIONAL STANDARDS 
offering

BURIAL INSURANCE • MONUMENTS
Becky and Charles Sizemore — i Owners

S  O Z O NA

I

p
p

Ip
p
f e

Jesse’s
T ire  R ep air 

Shop

Corner Ave. H & 5th St. 
Phone 392-3473

OZONA 
BUTANE

Prqipane 
. Si^es and 

S e r v i c i ^  

3 9 ^ -3 7 2 4

ROUSTABOUT AND PAINT SERVICE 
BRUSH CONTROL - ROAD REPAIR 

BACKHOE SERVICE

Double C Enterprises
P.O. BOX 332 - OZONA, TEXAS 76943 

FULLY INSURED

bee
BLACK DIRT 

CALICHE Day or Night
FILL 915 -39 2 -28 58  915 -39 2 -50 20

CLEAR RIGHT OF WAYS 
MOVE MOBILE HOMES 
LOCATION CLEAN UP
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Lion Fever...

Ozona Lions «
Colorado City Wolves

¥
¥
¥

here Friday night in Lions Stadium

¥
¥

Introducing the Ozona Lions
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
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¥ CHUY HERNANDEZ HARVEY FIERRO DAVID ADAMS

¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥

Senior running baek Chuy Hernandez has partici­
pated in the football program “ Because I like the 
sport. Football will help me to do better in my 
classes.”

The son of Marcelo and Maria Hernandez serves as 
president of the VICA club and plans to attend UTI in 
Houston and become an automotive technician.

Hernandez also participates in track and hopes to 
win the 300 meter hurdles in district and go to 
regional and “ have the best time there. I also w'ant 
the Lions football and basketball teams to win district.

Academically, Hernandez plans “To do the best 
possible in every class.” He enjoys listening to music, 
being with friends and riding around in his spare 
moments.

Senior wingback Harvey Fierro excels not only on 
the football field, but also in the classroom.

The National Honor Society member and football 
captain plays football because “ I enjoy it, and it helps 
me become a better person physically and mentally. I 
want to lead the team to the playoffs.”

The gifted athlete has played football for six years 
and also participates in baseball, basketball and track.

The son of Mr. and Mrs. Jesse Fierro hopes to 
graduate with honors from high school. “ I then plan 
to go to college and study law.”

Working with computers, spending time with 
friends and riding around fill Fierro’s idle moments. 
He also serves as vice president of the Student 
Council.

“ I just love sports,” is the simple reason senior 
running back David Adams has participated in the 
football program for the past seven years.

The football captain wants to “ become the best 
possible athlete I can be. I believe that if you want 
something great (like a great team), everyone should 
participate.”

Going to college and eventually studying law are 
the long range career plans of Adams, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Jack Adams. The future lawyer enjoys hunting, 
traveling and lifting weights in his spare time.

The extroverted Adams also enjoys helping his 
family and others when ever possible.

¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥

The follow ing bu sin esses and Individuals are
100% behind you!

^ J. B . M iller and Co. 
5  B & C Automotive
i  Clayton’s VUlage Drug

Ozona National Bank 
Circle Bar TruclH^orral 
El Chato’s

Happy Hollow¥
¥ Pepe’s
^  Wester man Drug 

W atson’s¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
He
¥
¥
¥
¥

t
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥

Small Fashions 

Buttery M otors 
W hite’s Auto 
Mayfield Construction 
House of Flowers 

Donuts Etc.
Brock and Camille Jones 

M oore Oil Company 
The Teacher Store 

De La Rosa Plumbing 

The Footnote 
South Texas Lumber Co.

Leo Cervantez Exxon 
Chem-Solv Corporation 
Baggett Insurance Agency 
Ozona Butane 

Sizemore Funeral Home 
M aness Texaco 
South Permian, Inc.

Tite Bishop Welding Service 

M onica’s Hair and Nails 
Double C. Enterprises 

Gary Vannoy 

Sonny’s Drive In 
Perry’s
Jessie’s Tire Shop

Crockett County News 
I-IO Exxon

The Aycock Family 

The Red Apple 
Seven-U Ranch Company 

Perry M otors, Inc.
W ool Growers 

Upham Insurance Agency 
Kyle Kleaners 

J. W . M otor Co.
Dairy King

Crockett County Water Dept. 
Stockton Savings 

KWIK-Marc
Crockett County National Bank 

Dina’s Poco Taco 
Thornton’s Supermarket 
Western Auto 
La Codna 

Danny’s Texaco 
Charlie’s Place
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Goliath tramps Ozona 30-0 Hotneniaking clubs meet
By Copie Davis

The Ozona J. V. traveled to 
Mertzon last Thursday to take on 
the Irion County Hornets. Irion 
County, armed with their version 
of Goliath (6’4” , 240 pound Jason 
Burleson), embarrassed the Lions 
30-0.

Burleson, who scored two of 
the Hornets’ four touchdowns, 
took a pitchout on Irion’s first 
possession and rumbled 55 yards 
for the first score of the game.

On Ozona’s ensuing drive, 
quarterback Copie Davis threw 
the first of three interceptions, 
giving the Hornets the ball. Davis 
went one for seven, two yards 
passing and three interceptions.

The second Hornet score came 
on a 30 yard scoring pass early in 
the second quarter. The two point 
conversion was successful, 
making the score 14-0. With a 
little over 2:00 minutes left in the 
first half, Irion County scored 
again to close first half scoring 
and to give Irion County a 22-0 
lead.

Ozona rose up and bit back in 
the second half as they held the 
Hornets to one score but could 
not cross the goal line them­
selves. The Hornet defense held 
Ozona to 104 yards total offense 
in the game and took advantage 
of the absence of leading Lion 
rusher Harvey Dominguez. Do­
minguez was injured against 
Junction last week and will be out 
for two to three weeks. Picking up 
that slack for the Lions was 
Landon Duncan, who churned out 
70 yards rushing on 13 carries for 
a 5^2 yard rushing average. 
Davis ran for 14 yards on six 
carries, and Johnny Lumbrana 
had 10 yards on four carries.

Defensively, Duncan and Lum­
brana teamed up for seven 
tackles apiece. Richard Gray had 
six tackles, five of which were in 
the fourth quarter. Wolv Ruther­
ford and Oscar Galindo both 
came up with a turnover and 
seven tackles between them.

Next week the Ozona fresh­
men will play Colorado City, and 
the remaining J.V. will take on 
the Colorado City J.V.

Cubs pound Iraan 46-0
By T. C. Tucker

Oscar Gutirrez returned the 
opening kick off for a 58 yard 
touchdown in Thursday’s seventh 
grade game against Iraan. The 
Cubs led 8-0 after Lonnie Mar­
tinez rambled in for the two-point 
conversion.

“ I feel that we played our best 
game of the season Thursday 
night,” said Coach Don Payne. 
“ I’m extremely proud of them.”

The outstanding hitting of the 
Cubs’ defense intimidated Iraan 
on their first possession. Led by 
Ruben Borrego with eight tack­
les, Jason Vitella and Albert 
Talamantez each with six, the 
Cubs’ defense would go on to 
hold Iraan to only 54 yards total 
offense.

‘‘Albert Talamantez had an 
outstanding night defensively,” 
said Coach Payne. He also said 
that Talamantez will begin to play 
fullback some in the upcoming 
games.

With Iraan unable to move the 
ball, the Cubs usually started 
each of their offensive drives in 
Iraan territory.

The Cubs’ next score came 
when L. Martinez shot 42 yards to 
help him end the night with 55 
yards rushing.

On the Cubs’ next possession, 
starting at the Iraan forty yard 
line, Gutirrez hit Mingo Perez for 
a 40 yard touchdown. The Cubs 
led 20-0 after the two-point con­
version failed.

The Cubs, who would end the 
night with 335 yards total of­
fense, took control of the ball with 
1:09 left in the first half. They

DONUTS ETC. 
392-5800

SPECIAL ORDERS
Open 
6 dayspies

dinner rolls 
cobblers 6 a.m. to 1 p.m.

cheesecakes
breads and hamburger buns 
hot sandwiches and fountain drini«

Progressive Qub
The Progressive Extension 

Homemaker Club met October 10 
at the Civic Center for a salad 
luncheon. Ann McCartney pre­
sented a program on stress and 
how to handle it.

Hostess for the meeting was 
Joyce Youth. Others attending 
included Rachel Hall, Jean Con­
ners, Laurie Hale, Nancy Hale, 
Becky Fleniing, Evelyn Keith, 
Lois Lock, Connie Jennings, 
Michelle Wharton, Janet Wilson,

Alpha Alpha Mu meeting at 
Community Center

started at the Iraan 45, but were 
forced back to the 50 after a 
penalty.

Then R. Borrego sped 50 yards 
off left sweep. However, the 
Cubs were offsides, and the play 
was called back. Now the Cubs 
faced a first and twenty, but 
Borrego took the ball and scored 
off the same play. None of the 
Iraan players came close to him 
as he racked up his only yardage 
of the night.

Brad Bollier, who came in as 
quarterback late in the second 
quarter, completed only one of 
his six passes. However, the one 
pass that was completed was the 
first score of the second half. 
Bollier hit Shane Pridemore for a 
25 yard touchdown.

The next Cub score was early 
in the third quarter, when Danny 
DeHoyos bulled his way in from 
one yard out.

Martin Urbino, who had 56 
yards rushing, was second only to 
Gutirrez who had 59 yards. 
Urbino scored with two minutes 
left in the game. Bollier funbled 
the ball on the two-point con­
version attempt, but fell on it in 
the end zone.

Other defensive leaders in­
cluded Gutirrez, Cody Morris, 
and M. Urbino with three tackles 
apiece.

Both Cub teams will play 
Colorado City here this coming 
Thursday beginning at six p.m.

Coach Payne is optimistic 
about the upcoming district 
games. ‘‘They will be tougher,” 
he said. ‘‘But we will prepare for 
them each week and be ready by 
game time.”

The Alpha Alpha Mu chapter 
of Beta Sigma Phi met at the 
Ozona Community Center on 
Monday, October 14, at 6:00 p.m. 
Presenting the program and 
serving as hostesses were exe­
cutive board members Jeannine 
Henderson, Karen Huffman, El­
len Lipsey, Dena Porter, Marcy 
Williams and Leslie Wilson.

Organization officers pre­
sented ‘‘The Wizard of Beta 
Sigma Phi” . The play illustrated 
to guests the responsibilities of 
each officer and her role in the 
organization.

President Leslie Wilson pre­
sented the group the 1984-85 
award winning scrapbook. A 
panel of judges awarded the local 
chapter with third place honors at

the recent West Texas Area 
Convention. The book took top 
honors as it was voted ‘‘con­
vention favorite” by Beta Sigma 
Phi members from all over West 
Texas. The committee compiling 
the scrapbook included Jeannine 
Henderson, Connie Jennings and 
Leslie Wilson.

Members and guests enjoyed 
finger foods, and Secret Sister 
gifts were exchanged.

Guests in attendance were 
Debbie Bachman, Lisa Branch, 
Sharon Forehand, Barbara Glos­
sen, Patti May, Karrie Myers, 
Suzanne Renfro, Becky Sizemore, 
Kay Stewart and Carla Worthing­
ton.

Members present were Tina 
Bean, Tammy Bunger, Nesa

Margaret Tabb and Georgia 
Kirby.

Crockett Qub
The Crockett County Extension 

Homemakers Club met October 8 
at the Saveli Ranch where 
Barbara Saveli shared some ideas 
for Christmas decorations. She 
also displayed her lovely quilts.

Those attending were: Hazel 
Storms, Marilyn Chalmers, Doris 
Karr, Goldia Kilgore, Roberta 
Schoenhals, Charlotte Trull.

Chandler, Becky Dillard, Debbie 
Glasscock, Kim Hager, Laurie 
Hale, Connie Jennings, Barbie 
Myers, Renee Pearl, Billie Ren­
fro, Rhonda Shaw, Rita Sigwing, 
Roylan Sullivan, Leslie Wilson, 
Jeannine Henderson, Marcy Wil­
liams, Karen Huffman, Ellen 
Lipsey and Dena Porter.
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Skiles addresses 
Woman's League
Tuesday, October 8, the Ozona 

Woman’s League met at the Civic 
Center. Mrs. Jim Bob Bailey, 
Mrs. Fred Chandler, Mrs. Dennis 
Clark and Mrs. Bill Mason served 
as hostess for the guest day.

After a short business meeting, 
Mrs. Buster Deaton introduced 
the speaker, whom she had 
known from childhood. Mr. Jack 
Skiles, curator of the Judge Roy 
Bean museum in Langtry, gave a 
slide presentation of a trip down 
the Rio Grande. The trip began in 
Presidio and made its way to 
Langtry, the final destination. 
Members present enjoyed Mr. 
Skiles narration of the slides, 
which were from several different 
float trips down the river.

Following a question and an­
swer session, the meeting was 
dismissed.

A manned rocket can reach the moon today in less time than it took to 
travel the length of England in a stagecoach.

REPORT OF CONDITION
Consolidating domestic and foreign subsidiaries of the

OZONA NATIONAL BANK
In the state of

Name of Bank

Texas
of Ozona

City

, at the close of business on September_2.Q_ 1985
published in response to call made by Comptroller of the Currency, under title 12, United States Code, Section 161. 
Charter Number 77 4 8___________Comptroller of the Currency_________ Eleventh_________________ District

Statement of Resources and Liabilities

Cash and balances due from depository institutions:
Noninterest-bearing balances and currency and coin
Interest-bearing balances................................................

Securities................................................................................
Federal funds sold and securities purchased under agreements to resell in domestic offices

Thousands of dollars
1,801
T > 1 QQ

2 S L JÚ 1 .

2 0 , 9 6 9

-z íL l

2 Q .U 7,g.

of the bank and of its Edge and Agreement subsidiaries, and in IBFs................................ ...................1 4 . 9 0 0  I
Loans and lease financing receivables:

Loans and leases, net of unearned income...........................................—
LESS: Allowance for loan and lease losses................................................
LESS: Allocated transfer risk reserve...........................................................
Loans and leases, net of unearned income,
allowance, and reserve.....................................................................................

Assets held in trading accounts.................................................... ......................
Premises and fixed assets (including capitalized leases).............................
Other real estate ow ned.......................................................................................
Investments in unconsolidated subsidiaries and associated companies ..
Customers’ liability to this bank on acceptances outstanding......................
Intangible assets ....................................................................................................
Other assets ................................................................. .........................................
Total assets...................................................................................................... —

- 0 -

2,x^S.Q..
1 Â ±
-Q-
- n -

- 0 -

9 5 4
5 2 . 5 2 5

Deposits:
In domestic offices...................................................................................

Noninterest-bearing.............................................................................
Interest-bearing.............................................................................. .......

In foreign offices. Edge and Agreement subsidiaries, and IBFs

9 . 0 1 7
36.450

J 45.467 ~1

Noninterest-bearing.................................................................................
Interest-bearing............................................ ...........................................

Federal funds purchased and securities sold under agreements to repurchase in domestic
offices of the bank and of its Edge and Agreement subsidiaries, and in IBFs......................
Demand notes issued to the U.S. Treasury.......................................... ........ ..................  ..... .
Other borrowed money.......................................... ............................... ...................................
Mortgage indebtedness and obligations under capitalized leases.....  ................. ............
Bank's liability on acceptances executed and outstanding....................................................
Notes and debentures subordinated to deposits.......................................................................
Other liabilities.............................................................................................................................
Total liabilities.......—  ..............................................................................................................
Limited-life preferred stock.................................. ........................................................................

Perpetual preferred stock..................................................................................................... ......
Common stock.............................................................................................................................
Surplus................................................. ........................................................................................
Undivided profits and capital reser\-es........................................................................................
Cumulative foreign currency translation adjustments........................................................... ...
Total equity capita!.......................................................................................... ........................ _
Total liabilities, limited-life preferred stock, and equity capital......................... .......................

- D t .
- 0 -

0 -

- 0 -

- 0 -

- 0 -

440
45,907

- 0 -

- 0 -

400
m o .

^ . , 6 1 8

6,618
-52.525

We, the undersigned directors, attest to the correctness of 
this statement of resources and liabilities. We declare that it 
has been examined by us, and to the best of our knowledge 
and belief has been orepared in conforrnahce with the 
instructions and iS/iolp and cprrect

I Lou C. Haire
Name

Cashier
/

d^prrèc^ Title

A

of the above-named bank do hereby declare that this Report 
of Condition is true and correct to the best of my knowledge 
and belief.

Directors

^ i f : I —

V
Sgnature

October 10, 1985
Date
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R a c h e l’s  
r e v ie w s

By Rachel O. Hall

Crockett County has long been 
known as one of the major sheep 
producing counties. However, 
lamb in the local meat market has 
been limited. Many consumers 
feel confident in preparing poul­
try, pork and beef, but feel 
somewhat limited in preparing 
lamb.

In order to prepare a variety of 
tasty lamb dishes, it is important 
to understand the many cuts of 
lamb and preparation methods. 
On Monday, October 21, 7:00 
p.m. at the Civic Center, there 
will be a lamb seminar concen­
trating on cutting, preparation, 
cooking and serving of lamb. 
Anyone may attend this seminar. 
Orlando Vargas, meat manager 
at Thornton’s Supermarket, and 
Charlie Frazier, chef at Inn of the 
West, will be presenting this 
seminar. Lamb cuts will be 
available at both Thornton’s and 
T & T’s meat markets for a 
limited time.

There are six basic methods of 
cooking lamb and two basic 
classifications of these methods. 
Dry heat methods of preparing 
lamb include: roasting, broiling, 
panbroiling and panfrying. As 
the name implies, the meat is 
cooked by dry heat, which means 
using open pans. Dry heat 
methods are best for tender cuts 
of lamb such as loin chops, 
steaks, leg or sirloin roasts.

1

Moist heat methods rely on 
moist heat to cook the meat.
Moisture can result from sealing 
the pan with a lid or cooking the j .  j  ,
meat covered with a liquid. Less Xi S 3. §11*1
tender cuts of lamb such as 
shanks, breast, and neck slices 
are tenderized through moist 
heat methods. When cooking 
lamb, regardless of the method 
used, remember that low heat 
produces the best results. Slow 
cooking is more uniform and 
keeps in juices.

Vi cup grated Parmesan cheese 
2 tablespoons butter or mar­

garine, softened 
V2 teaspoon salt 
1/8 teaspoon pepper 
Broil chops 3 to 4” from the 

source of heat for eight minutes 
or until lightly browned. Turn; 
broil five more minutes or to 
desired degree of doneness. 
Meanwhile, combine remaining 
ingredients and blend well. After 
broiling second side, spread 
cheese mixture on chops; broil 
two to three minutes longer or 
until cheese is lightly browned.

HONEY-MUSTARD GLAZED 
LAMB

1 leg of lamb
V2 cup prepared mustard
Vi cup honey 
1 teaspoon salt 
Vi teaspoon pepper 
Place lamb fat side up on rack 

in open roasting pan. Roast in 325 
degree oven for 30 to 35 minutes 
per pound or until meat ther- 
momether registers 175 degrees 
to 180 degrees, depending upon 
desired degree of doneness. 
Combine remaining ingredients 
and blend. About 1 hour before 
end of roasting time, pour honey- 
mustard mixture over lamb.

PARMESAN BROILED LAMB

4 shoulder or loin chops (about 
1” thick)

Luann and Joey Pierce are the 
parents of a girl, Laura Gladys, 
born October 8, 1985 in Com­
munity Hospital in San Angelo. 
The baby weighed seven pounds 
11 ounces and was 21 inches long 
at birth.

She has a sister, Marie, age 
two.

Grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. Sam Pemer and Mr. and 
Mrs. J. S. Pierce IV. Great- 
grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. J. 
S. Pierce III, Mr. and Mrs. Roy 
Pearson of Ozona and Mrs. Nora 
Hardin of Johnson City.

The first American student to work 
his way through college was Zech- 
ariah Brigden, 14, who graduated 
from Harvard in 1657. He earned 
money by "ringing the bell and 
waytinge."

La Cocina
7

SPECIALS
Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday
Mexican Dinner Beef Soup ' Chicken Fried Steak Monterrey All Burritos

Came Guisada Dinner 
Steak Ranchero 
Fajita Dinner

- New item added to menu 
El Sombrero

Opened 6-2 and 5-10
Orders to go welcomed! 392-2810 Monday - Sunday

Independent 
Beauty Consultant 

Sara H ignight 
392-2471

COSMETICS

J  Norma’ s J
{  Country {
i  Kitchen ¥
Z  OPEN 10 to 10 J
^  closed on Monday ^

¥  SPECIALS

^  r i/fS /M  K-Hamburgers 
^  and fries $2.25 i
J  WEDNESDAX-IO
^  of chicken $4.65 ^
^  THURSDA r-Steak finger^  
^  basket $2.99 
^  FRIDAY-¥ish and fries 
^  with slaw $2.99 ^
♦c

Ozona Wool 
& Mohair

Feed &
Livestock Supplies 

Deer Feeders
N o w  b o o k in g  w in t e r  Seed  

W h ole  c o t to n  seed
C o tto n  S eed  C ake  
C orn
G rain  C ubes

wum m/KM msunAnct co s

Sutton and
Crockett
Counties

Hablamos Español

LIFE AUTO FIRE 
HOME OWNERS 

GENERAL LIABILITY 
FARM/RANCH 

ESTATE PLANNING 
WORKERS COMP.

Sutton County Farm Bureau
Serving you to Serve Again

Bill Saveli - home 392-2062  
Sonora answering service 387-5231

Maness 
I-IO Texaco

* GAS • GROCERIES ‘  ICE 
I-lO&Hwy. 163

Full and self service

...............

CONSTfijy,

Bulletin Board
ALL SCHOOLS

Monday: Oct. 14 - Second six 
weeks begins

HIGH SCHOOL

Tuesday, Oct. 15 - All grades 
except “ incomplètes” are to be 
in computer by 3:30 p.m.

Thursday, Oct. 17 - Report 
cards passed out second period.

Ozona 9th vs. Colorado City, 
there, 5:00. Team leaves at 1:30.

Ozona J.V. vs. Colorado City, 
there, 6:30

Friday, Oct. 18, Pep rally, 
boys’ gym, 3:35 p.m.

School
Cafeteria

Monday, Oct. 21
Meat Loaf, Mashed Potatoes, 

Green Beans, Peach Halves, Hot 
Rolls

Tuesday, Oct. 22
Polish Sausage, Pinto Beans, 

Cabbage Patch Salad, Cookies, 
Cornbread

Wednesday, Oct. 23 
Chicken Spaghetti, Buttered 

Peas, Lettuce Chunks, Sliced 
Pineapple, Hot Rolls

Thursday, Oct. 24 
Chili Dogs, Tater Tots, 

Crunchy Vegetablé Sticks, Peach 
Cobbler

Friday, Oct. 25
Fish Sticks, Macaroni and 

Cheese, Buttered Peas, Orange 
Half, Hot Rolls

diet consultation and other areas. 
Each participant will receive an 
individual stress test and consul­
tation with the doctor and diet­
itian.

The families of the participants 
are also invited to a support and 
motivation session on the final 
day of the program.

LaMesa, a new concept in 
fitness, offers maximum benefits 
for a minimum price. Contact 
your county Extension agent, 
Rachel Hall, for more information 
and registration details.

Ozona Varsity vs. Colorado 
City, here, 8:00 p.m.

JUNIOR HIGH
Thursday, Oct. 17 - Ozona 7th 

vs. Colorado City, here, 6:00; 
Ozona 8th vs. Colorado City, 
here, 7:30

Teen Council 
Officers elected

Ozona Youth Center Teen 
Council members met with the 
Board of Directors October 2 to 
discuss use of the Center this fall.

The Council has officers this 
year for the first time according 
to Patti Jones, board president. 
Officers of the organization are: 
Amy Jones, president; Andy 
Dews, vice-president; Annalu 
Lopez, secretary; and Sharon 
McCrohan, treasurer.

Class representatives on the 
Council are: Seniors - Amy Jones, 
Andy Dews, Annalu Lopez; Ju­
niors - Peggy Knox, James 
Sanchez, Jennifer Probst; Sopho­
mores - Jim Ethridge, Sharon 
McCrohan, Scott Denman; Fresh­
men - Billy Aycock, Summer 
Shacklette, Gina McCollum.

Ozona’s youth have a newly 
decorated gathering place this 
fall. Summer fix up of the facility 
included a new paint job and 
attractive wall decorations. Mrs. 
Jones and Gary Davis, assisted 
by members of the Council, 
painted the word “ Ozona” in 
multi-colors in the pool room and 
decorated with car posters. The 
game room has the words “ The 
Lion’s Den” on one wall, a large 
lion on another, and colorful rock 
star posters. In the television 
area, a lion cub welcomes every­
one to Crockett County Youth 
Center.

Director Garland Young says 
that the Center has the largest 
membership ever with 176 this 
fall.

Members of the Youth Center 
Board are: Patti Jones, president; 
Cliff McMullan, vice-president; 
Rosie Davis, secretary; Jann 
Miller, Alice Lopez, Felice Gu- 
tirrez, Jim McCrohan, Carmen 
Sutton and Ann Childress.

Director Garland Young is 
assisted by his wife, Joyce. Also 
helping at the Center are Mrs.
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Katie Maney and Mrs. Mary 
Capps.

10%
4 YEARS

9.5%
2V2 years

9.375%
1 YEAR

9.25%
6 MONTHS

9.00%
90 DAY

8.75%
30 DAYS

FSLIC insured to $100,000 for 
each account. Rates subject 
to change without notice and 
substantial interest penalties 
required for early with­
drawal.

STOCKTON
SAVINGS

ASSOCIATION

“Since 1957” 
Ozona, Texas 

CALL 
COLLECT 

392-3776

BRUCE MAYFIELD
General Dirt Contractors 

P.O. Box 1736 
Ozona, Texas 76943

Office Telephone
392-2601 Radio Equipped

4 ^
Home Telephone 

392-2149

Cars are in and we would like 
to introduce you to them

Come by for a 
test drive today!

I .. .

1986 SOMERSET LIMITED COUPE

For the best buys going!

BUTTERY MOTOR CO

Ozona, Texas Phone 392-2691
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C o m in g s  a n d  G o in g s
By Cynthia Harrell Hodges

Bohannons haye visitors 
from Germany

Ozonans participate in tourney

Mrs. Mary Bess Augustine is 
recovering from a fall suffered at 
her home.

Wanda and George Bunger 
enjoyed a recent two week trip 
through southern New Mexico 
and over into Utah. They re­
turned through Nevada.

Jim and Zoe Green were 
visited last weekend by their 
daughter and her family, Kim 
and Ron Keck of Midland and son 
Raydean.

Mildred and A1 Fields have 
returned from a recent trip to San 
Antonio and Kerrville. While in 
Kerrville, they visited Mr. and 
Mrs. C. H. Baccus. Mrs. Baccus 
is a former Ozona resident.

Helen Tamplen of Whitesboro 
is here visiting her family, Doris 
and Gene Hood, and her grand­
sons, Bret and Eugene. She will 
also visit her granddaughter and 
family, Wendy and Robert Tam- 
bunga and their children. Mrs. 
Tamplen plans to stay in Ozona 
about a month.

Ruth and George Hester have 
returned from Wimberly where 
they met and visited friends for 
several days.

Mrs. David Sewell’s father is a 
patient in the Coleman hospital.

Mrs. John Bohannon is in San 
Angelo this week to puppy sit at 
the home of her son-in-law and 
daughter, Mr. and Mrs. Howard 
Gill.

Robilyn Miller has returned to 
the ranch south of Ozona from a 
recent business trip to Sonora.

Mr. and Mrs. R. A. Harrell 
returned this week from their 
regular checkup at the Mayo 
Clinic in Rochester, MN.

Dick and Shirley Kirby were in 
Christoval Sunday to visit his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Chelsea 
Kirby.

Geneice Childress is in Penn­
sylvania to see her daughter and 
son-in-law, Lucille and Joel Huff, 
and their children, Melissa, Abi­
gail and Phillip Joel.

Kiddie Klub and Tinyville 
students at Ozona Community 
Center and Ozona Day Care 
toddlers are enjoying red metal 
seesaws donated by the Ozona 
Primary School.

Dub and T. K. O’Bryant will be 
in Bangs Saturday to attend the 
wedding of his father, W. D. 
O’Bryant, to Bertha Macey at 
First Methodist Church. Im­
mediate family will be attending 
the wedding. “ I’m tickled about 
it,’’ says Dub.

Mrs. Bill Cross (the former 
Kathy Lynn Russell) and her sons 
were here last weekend visiting 
her mother, Mrs. Katharine 
Russell, and her sister and 
family, Susie and Johnny Chil­
dress and their children.

Mr. and Mrs. John Childress, 
Mr. and Mrs. Dwight Childress, 
Mr. and Mrs. Duane Childress 
and Mr. and Mrs. David Chil­
dress were in Dallas Saturday 
attending the Texas-Oklahoma 
game.

Please
Community groups are en­

couraged to submit news items to 
this newspaper.

Our deadline is Monday at 1:00 
p.m. for publication in Wed­
nesday’s Crockett County News. 
News releases should be mailed 
to P. 0. Box 1963, Ozona, Texas 
76943 or brought by our ojßce in 
the Village.

Berry cobbler proved to be a hit 
with both a German and an 
American this last week.

Visiting in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. John Bohannon were their 
grandson, Ernest Gill of Ham­
burg, West Germany, and his 
friend, Ulrich Klein, 27, of 
Cologne, West Germany.

Gill, the son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Howard Gill of San Angelo, and 
Klein, a modern dance and ballet 
teacher, enjoyed “ many helpings 
of my special cobbler,’’ Mrs. 
Bohannon reported.

Gill, a 1972 graduate of Angelo 
State University with a major in 
journalism and a minor in Ger­
man, worked for the San Angelo 
Standard-Times from 1969-1972 
reporting on high school and 
college activities. He had been 
editor of the Rebellaire at Lee 
Junior High School and a mem- 
ber of the Campus Corral staff at 
Central High School. The 35- 
year-old Gill also worked for the 
Corpus Christ! Caller-Times, the 
Middlesex News in Framinham, 
Mass., and the Boston Patriot 
Ledger.

He presently works as a trans­
lator and rewrite editor for thei// 
German Press Agency, DPA, the 
equivalent of the Associated 
Press or UPI, and as the Ham­
burg correspondent for Deutsche 
Welle - a short wave radio 
service.

Gill recently wrote a guest 
column for the nationally syndi­
cated New York Times columnist

William Safire.
Klein, who is on his first visit to 

America following his certifica­
tion as a dance instructor, 
graduated from a Hamburg 
dance academy.

“ They are used to walking 
great distances,’’ Mrs. Bohannon 
said. One afternoon in San 
Angelo, Klein disappeared and 
was gone for many hours. “ Our 
grandson finally called the police 
who found Klein taking pictures 
and enjoying the West Texas 
scenery. I guess we just don’t 
take time to walk a lot.’’

Six Ozona couples were repre­
sented at the West Texas - New 
Mexico Senior Golf Association 
Tournament October 7-10 at 
Lakeway Resort near Austin.

The local couples attending the 
tournament included: Pete and 
Jimmie Jacoby, Demp and Katy 
Jones, Charles and Jonsey Wil­
liams, Pleas and Geneice Chil­
dress, Bill and Ella Clegg, and 
Bud and Marilyn Cox.

The 400 participants played 
golf on three courses - Liveoak, 
Yaupon and The Hills of Lake­
way which was designed by Jack 
Nicklaus.

Mrs. Jacoby was a member of a 
second place scramble, composed 
of three men and one woman.

Marilyn Cox and Charles Wil­
liams also were members of a 
second place scramble team. 
Their team tied with four other 
teams for second place.

“ We all did well and had a 
wonderful time,” Mrs. Jacoby 
said. While at the banquet the 
last night, the Ozonans were 
joined by former residents Dr. 
and Mrs. Ralph Simon. They 
were able to see the former 
Martha Simon and her family. 
Dr. Simon presently practices in 
El Paso. Martha Simon and her 
family live in Austin.

"Courage is knowing what not to 
fear." Plato

Party for Amanda
Amanda Joy Hignight, 

daughter of Sara and John Hig­
night, celebrated her fourth 
birthday Monday evening with a 
party.

Joining her for the festivities 
were her parents; grandparents, 
J. B. and Mary Stringer of Mans­
field; Jamie, Ty and Kelley 
Porter, brother Jason, and Har­
rell, Christine and Cynthia 
Hodges. A special guest at the 
party was her new Cabbage Patch 
Preemie, Fayette Mindy.

Guests were served Cabbage 
Patch cake and punch.

Tbe 
C o H a g e
Collee'tion. joi mh st<-

Halloween Speciality Items
Our imported candies are in:

Delux Halloween Mix>~ Fall Festrival 
Mix-Gummi Pumpkins'- ■ Candy Corn and moreS 
Halloween Gifts- Ceramic Jack-o-Lanterns 

Pumpkin Face Hangings — Handpainted 
wreaths and decorator items • Halloween tins, 
crates,and jars —  Special Heavy duty Trick 
or Treat Bags — Treat Baskets made to order.

Unique gifts for children, grandchildren. 
Secret Sisters and pals • Friends surprise 
for and any Special Spook on your list

Í

The Circle Bar Restaurant
and

Jose Tobar 
are now ready to serve you with those

very important
parties, banquets, weddings, etc.

I

Come join us for our daily Specials

Monday
Hamburger Steak 

French fries 

Salad bar 

Coffee or tea

$425

Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday
Spanish steak Bar-b-que plate Chicken fry Catfish special

Refried beans & rice Potato salad 

Pinto beans
French fries French fries

Two flour tortillas Om’ons Pickles
Salad bar Salad bar

Dessert 
Coffee or tea

Coffee or tea Coffee or tea

$ 4“ $ 4“ $ 4”
'iti
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For Sale Real Estate
Homemade tamales. Order 

anytime. Call 392-3139. 2pl7

For sale: pop-up camper trail­
er. Venture model. Good con­
dition. $1,500.00. Call evenings 
392-5204. Icl7

Ink cartridges for caligraphy 
pens for sale at The News.

For Sale: structural pipes and 
sucker rods. 392-5020.; tfS

MAKE OFFER!

MUST SELL NOW!
3 bedroom, 2 bath, 4 yrs. old. 
Site-built home. Owner may 
carry part of equity. Closing 
costs, fees pd., will buy 
points. See 305 Rugged Rd. 
behind high school. Call 
392-3634 or 303-824-7442.

Garage Sale 613 Ave. J Satur­
day, 10-19, 8:00 to ? - vacuum 
cleaners, golf clubs, clothing all 
sizes, mise. Texas Lone Star 
Branch #8006 matching funds 
with Faith Lutheran Women.Ipl7

Indoor garage sale: 108 Ave. 
M. Fri.-Sat., 8-5 p.m. Mrs. 
Weant. “ Some of everything.”

Ipl7

POLLY’S CAKES

Bill Davis Custom P.P.C. .357 
Mag. Aristocrat Rib on heavy 
barrel - S&W nickel frame. 
Excellent cond. $600 or best 
offer. 392-2490.

Mobile Homes
Decorated cakes, cookies and 

cupcakes for all occasions. Re­
member Halloween parties. 
Wedding cakes large and small. 
392-3129. 211 Mesquite. 3cl2

1970 Celebrity mobile home. 
14x70. Excellent condition. Ap­
pliances included. 392-2334. 9 
a.m. to5p.m . tf/1

AMT Hardballer Longslide .45 
Cal. Auto Combat Features. $500 
or best offer. 392-2490.

Fire guards and righ-of-ways 
maintainer or dozer cut. 392-5020

tfS

For Sale: couch and loveseat. 
$150.00. Good condition. 
392-2051. Icl7

Priced to sell - 1982 Melody 
Mobile Home. 12x50, 2 bedroom, 
1 bath, $7,500. Contact Don A. 
Patrick. 512-774-4555 or 512-774- 
3449 after 5 p.m. Icl7

Building, remodeling, paint­
ing, cement work, roofing. Clyde 
“ Red” Myatt. Call after 5 p.m. 
392-2602. tf3

For sale at The Crockett 
County News: Liquid Paper:
Ledger Buff, Ledger Green, 
Canary, Stock Green, Stock 
Goldenrod, Stock Blue, Stock 
Pink and White. Also Liquid 
Paper for Pen and Ink and Just 
For Copies.

For Rent
APARTMENT FOR RENT 

2 bedroom, 1 bath, living room 
w/fireplace located at 901 Ave. J; 
$300.00 monthly. Contact: Don 
A. Patrick - 512-774-4555. 2cl6

Lost: Tues. a.m. red cocker 
spaniel and black/gray large dog. 
5 miles north of El Paso Gas Plant 
at Midway Lane. 392-3282 or 392- 
2145. 2pl7

Card of Thanks
For Sale: 1984 Scirocco, mint 

condition. Low miles, garage 
kept, 5 speed, A/C, AM/FM 
cassette. Sun roof, fuel inj., nice 
sports car! $9,995 or best offer. 
Call Michael. 392-3783 (work), 
392-5235 (home). tfl7

Miscellaneous
PERRY’S

Daily and Weekly VCR Rentals

TEX SUN INSULATION of 
Edlorado has free estimates for 
cellulose insulation of ceilings 
and walls for residential and 
commercial buildings. Farris 
Nixon, 915-853-2996. tfl7

Open on Sunday 
12:30 - 5:30 p.m.

Clayton’s Village Drug. Ham­
burger, chips and soft drink. 
$1.90. Icl7

We would like to take this 
opportunity to thank all the many 
people that helped us and shared 
with us the celebration of our 
50th anniversary. Special thanks 
to Father Richard.

Thanks to all our sons and 
daughters and their families and 
to all the many relatives and 
friends for the gifts and prayers.

Thank you all so much for 
everything from the bottom of our 
hearts. God bless you all.

Nato and Elena Tambunga
lpl7

$2990

Regularly $38®®

Qáecied '^ o ’s
tliey lost

9 ’aupe

Footnote

Letter to the 
Editor

Dear Editor:
Saying “Thank You” has al­

ways been easy for me, but in a 
few days I’ll also be saying the 
hardest two words in the world 
for me to say. I will be saying 
“ Good-bye” to two very special 
people. They have not only been 
fellow workers, but very close 
friends. Whether it was a prob­
lem on the job or at home, I knew 
who I could look up to. These two 
people have served this com­
munity in more ways than one. 
They have touched many lives 
besides ours. They came into our 
lives when we were weakly trying 
to recover from a very tragic loss. 
They have been with Crockett 
County Ambulance Service for 
many years, sometimes being the 
only ones on call because there 
was no one else.

Dub andT. K. O’Bryant, thank 
you for coming into my life when 
you did. We’ll miss you very 
much. Good-bye and good luck in 
your new home and on your new 
job.

Love,
Tina Moran

Johnny Childress 
REAL ESTATE

RESIDENTIAL - RANCHES 
LOTS - A CR EA G E

CO M M ERC IA L
CHANDLERDALE WEST LOTS 

Owner financing available

392-3634 392-5051
1102 Ave E O Z O N A

The Crockett 

County News

392-5230

W JAGOBY  
REAL ESTATEHomes-Lots-Commercicil 
Ranch Properties

392-3059 401 Hillcrest

South Texas 
Lumber Co.

HAROWASC STORES

O f Ozona 
3 9 2 -2 6 3 4

I

I

Rocky Jones Windmill & 
Pump Service

Ranching Background 
New Equipment 
Fair Rates 
Sales & Service

( 915) 387-3711

— I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I

P.O. Box 914 Sonora  ̂Texas 76950 I

Your prospects for financial 
security Increase when you 

use the many services at ONB.

Ozona
National Bank

Since 1905 Ozona, Texas 76943 Member FDIC

Phone 392-2676,392-2694, 392-3787
For timely weather reports, call 392-3751
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