
i f

I  t

o e  J o u r n a l
kThe Community of Opportunity-W here Water Makes the Difference’

Volume 57, No. 47 12 Pages Published Every Thursday at Muleshoe, Bailey County, Texas 79347 Thursday, November 20, 1980

First
Convicted Female 
Escapee Nabbed

Janice Bates Holmes, 
25, who escaped from the 
Bailey County jail in Mule- 

shoe on Monday, Septem­
ber 1, was recaptured in

During a shuffle in office 
space last week, the Mule- 
shoe Chamber of Com­
merce and Agriculture 
moved back to the Mule- 
shoe City Hall.

The Bailey County Tax 
Apprai* 1 Office, which 
had been housed in the 
Muleshoe City Hall, moved 
across the street to occupy 
the offices formerly held by 
the C of C.

Their address is 100 East 
Avenue C, across the 
street south of the city hall 
and the telephone number 
is 272-5501.

Mr. and Mrs. Darrell 
Turner became victims of 
the weekend storm when 
they were snowed in south 
of Sweetwater last week­
end. The Turners were 
moving a load of furniture 
to Brady for John Crow, 
when their truck became 
stuck in a snowbanj^ a- 
round 4:30 p.m. Sunday.

After three hours trying 
to dig out the truck, the 
Turners caught a ride to 
Roscoe with a student from 
Texas Tech University. Af­
ter spending the night with 
friends in Roscoe, Turner 
dug the truck out on Mon­
day afternoon.

Crow returned from 
Brady to retrieve his snow­
bound Furniture, said 
Turner.

*****
Bob Finney fared better 

returning from the Dallas 
Cowboy-St. Louis Cardinal 
football game Sunday. Al­
though he made it home 
from Dallas, he spent some 
16 hours on the highway in 
the snow and icestorm.

*****
Curtis Smith, of the

nominating committee for 
the Muleshoe Chamber of 
Commerce and Agriculture 
announced the following 
officers and directors for 
the 1981 year.

Tommy Gunstream, 
president; Dave Cavitt, 
vice president; Curtis 
Smith, secretary; and di­
rectors, Kerry Moore,
Bruce Woods, Robert
Montgomery, Robert Hoo- 
ten and Herman Morrison.

*****
As a fund raiser for a 

„ 'r'p to Six Flags, Brownie 
Troop 288 is currently sel­
ling light bulbs.

A package of six bulbs is 
S2 per package. For further 
information contact Mrs.
H-E. Reeder.

*****
Members of the FFA 

presented a program «n 
Parliamentary Procedure 
°̂r the Muleshoe Rotary 

^ 'uh at noon on Tuesday. 
Alex Williams was in 
charge 0f the program and 
'Produced the following
^  Page h. Col. 2

Los Angeles, Calif, last 
Friday, according to Los 
Angeles law enforcement 
officials.

Bailey County Deputy 
Sheriff Bob Henderson 
said a teletype was receiv­
ed from Los Angeles 
around 8 a.m. Friday, noti­
fying local officers of Ms. 
Holmes apprehension.

According to the Calif­
ornia officers, Ms. Holmes 
was using the name Bren­
da Jones when she was 
captured. Also, the tele­
type said she was being 
held on local charges 
there, as well as a possible 
hearing for parole violation 
from Los Angeles County.

Shortly before her es­
cape from the jail in Mule­
shoe. Ms. Holmes had 
been sentenced to serve 60 
years in the Texas Depart­
ment of Corrections follow­
ing conviction by a jury for 
her role in the April 28 
armed robbery of Lindsey 
Jewelry in Muleshoe.

Before Ms. Holmes 
was sentenced, her two 
accomplices in the robbery. 
Jimmy Jordan and R.C. 
Willard received sentences 
for their part in the 
robbery.

Morgan was assessed 
a sentence of 90 years, and 
Willard received a 50 year 
sentence.
Cont. Page 6, Col.3

Mo-Ped Law 
May Affect 
Purchases

With Christmas approa­
ching, and the possibility 
of several parents tenta­
tively planning to purchase 
Mo Peds for their child’s 
major gift for the year, the 
Muleshoe City Police have 
issued a reminder that new 
laws go into effect on 
January 1.

Police Lt. Jerry Hicks 
has reminded that accor­
ding to the new laws, a 
special operator’s license 
wj|| be required to operate 
the motor assisted bi­
cycles*

The law states that 
youths between the ages of 
15-18 |will be required to 
comp!ete a special 20-hour 
cours^ approved by the 
Department of Public 
Safety! before they can be 
licensed. The license will 
jnC|ude motor assisted bi­
cycles! 
motor _

no one will be 
below the age of 

perate the Mo-Peds 
j*eds must be 

and must be in- 
according to an- 

provision of the new 
Ihe Mo-Peds must 

the license plate 
pection sticker, 

a youth, 15, has 
his or her 16th 

, the restrictions 
cc on motor as- 

|v bicycles, motor-
■Icsiand motor scooters

jH bft removed from the 
liccnsf-

persons over the age of 

(),nt. <>. Col. 2

* motorcycles, and 
icooters to 125 cc.

iO

raffic
Snowdrifts Forced 
Holiday For School

FIT FOR A CHRISTMAS CARD..... Monday morning, following a weekend of snow in this area, many homes wore
white decorations, including huge snodrifts, such as this one to the right of the large tree in front yard of the J.K. 
Adams home on Avenue J. Many homes were also festooned with icicles, hanging two to four feet from roof edges. By 
Tuesday afternoon, much of the eight to ten inch snow had melted in warm sunshine. The snow forced closing of 
schools in Muleshoe and other places in the area for Monday.

Major Recording Artist 
To Perform Concert Here

Maynard Ferguson, 
Columbia Records record­
ing star, will bring his 
energetic, high - powered 
music to Muleshoe High 
School tonight, Thursday.

Advanced ticket sales 
indicate he will be perfor­
ming for an audience more 
from ihe area than from 
Muleshoe itself, reported 
Charles Faulkner, band di­
rector from Muleshoe High

Monte Horne 
In Competition
For Tennis Slot

Monte Horne, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Harold Horne, 
and a seventh grade stu­
dent at Muleshoe Junior 
High School, qualified as 
one of the championship 
tennis players in the State 
of Texas.

In competition last Fri­
day and Saturday, he was 
one of approximately 20 
players in the 14-year old 
division. He entered the 
TAP Tournament in Lub­
bock and was the only 
13-14 year old to remain 
undefeated for the entire 
two days of competition.

Monte started his way to 
the top by downing Darryl 
Barnes of Midland, 6-2; 
6-2. Next, he met Jay 
Ciacio of Midland, and 
came out on top. 6-2; 6-1. 
Gregory Akin of Abilene 
was the next opponent. 
This match ended for 
Monte, 6-2; 6-0.

In the finals, Monte 
faced the strongest oppo­
nent of the tourney, Fred 
Kennedy of Midland. After 
splitting sets, Monte won 
the match. 6-3; 3-6; 6-0.

This tournament victory 
will allow Horne to enter 
the championship bracket 
of major designated tour­
naments throughout Texas. 
He said he will be striving 
for state-ranking in the 
tournaments to come.

School. Early Tuesday 
morning, ticket sales had 
exceeded four hundred in 
surrounding communities, 
including from Seagraves, 
Plainview, Friona, Clovis,

Roddam Duo 

In Top Spots 

For Contest
All right! All you faithful

entrants in the annual
Muleshoe Merchants'
Football Contest, it’s right
down to the wire again,
and with just one week left
in the contest, one of » , 
several persons could win.

Leading the pack right 
now, and not by leaps and 
bounds, but by a mere two 
points, is Doyle Weir, a 
Lazbuddie resident and 
one of the faithful weekly 
entrants.

Doyle has 22 points, and 
guesses close each week. 
His wife, Debbie, has four 
points on the year, but the 
points of a husband and 
wife, or of anyone cannot 
be combined.

Currently in second 
place with 20 points is 
Elaine Roddam. Showing 
up with sixteen points now 
arc Shane Smith. Randall 
Stevens, and Jerry 
Roddam. Both Wade 
Cargile and C.O. LaRue 
have 14 points at this time.

First place winners with 
10 points each are Bob 
Copeland. Jr.. Weldon 
Dennis, L.C. Roddam, and 
Kathleen Hayes.

This week, the first place 
winner was Elaine Roddam 
who missed only one game 
the Tennessce-Mississippi 
upset. However, she cor­
rectly predicted both up­
sets in the tiebreaker 
games.

Her husband. Jerry, had 
smaller faith. He missed 
both tiebreakers to take 

Cont. Fagc 6, Col.3

Portales, Hereford and 
many other locations. Be­
fore Tuesday ended. Di­
rector Faulkner expected 
the out of town ticket sales 
to exceed 500. In Muleshoe 
two day before the concert, 
he added that ticket sales 
were very slow.

“ It’s somewhat of a let 
down,’’ said Faulkner. “ I 
was hoping this could be 
something our community 
could get involved in. It 
seems that other commu­
nities are more apprecia­
tive of what we have here 
than our own."

"Nevertheless, those 
who do not attend are 
going to be royally enter­
tained by one of the pre­
mier musicians of all time. 
Many feel that Ferguson is 
the greatest trumpet player 
in the world. He has en­
joyed great success with 
his recordings of the past 
ten years and has enjoyed 
a career that has spanned 
three decades,” added

Club Planning 
Annual Dinner 
At Needmore

Good food, and plenty 
of it, is promised for the 
annual Needmore Commu­
nity Club Dinner Saturday 
night.

With serving getting un­
derway at 5:30 p.m. and 
will continue until all per­
sons arc fed.

Again this year, turkey 
and dressing with all the 
trimmings. including 
homemade cakes and pies 
will be served.

Tickets for the dinner at 
the Community Building at 
Needmore arc 54.50 for 
adults and S3 for children 
under the age of 10.

Proceeds w ill be used for 
utilities and upkeep of the 
Needmore Community 
Building.

Faulkner.
"One should always 

keep one step ahead of the 
young,” said Ferguson, on 
the occasion of being nom­
inated for a ’Best Pop 
Instrumental' Grammy a- 
ward for his version of 
"Gonna Fly Now", the 
theme of the Oscar-win­
ning movie "Rocky” . If 
you respond to their de­
sires successfully, he ad­
ded. you become what

Cont. Page 6, Col.3

A weekend snowstorm, 
although unpredicted by 
National Weather Service, 
deposited eight to ten in­
ches of moisture-laden 
snow in Bailey County and 
the surrounding area, 
snarling traffic and forcing 
closing of numerous farm - 
to-market roads and high­
ways. Both Cochran Coun­
ty, to the south of Bailey 
County and Parmer County 
to the north closed several 
roads late Sunday evening.

Snow started falling near 
night on Saturday, and by 
Sunday morning, an ac­
cumulation estimated at six 
to seven inches was on the 
ground, and light snow 
was still falling. By night­
fall Sunday, icy conditions 
and snowpacked highways 
and roadways were slowing 
traffic to a crawl.

Bailey County fared bet­
ter than neighboring coun­
ties, who had to close 
many highways due to 
snow drifts. As the icy 
wind whipped snow into 
drifts, in some instances, 
abandoned cars were al­
most completely covered 
by snow.

Shortly after 6 p.m. 
Sunday,. DPS officers from 
Parmer County were sent 
to the Clay’s Corner area 
where several vehicles had 
entirely blocked the high­
way. The officers found up 
to seven vehicles had spun 
out of control, for nearly 
two hours, the officers 
worked to clear the entire 
intersection.

Although the Texas 
Highway Department 
crews worked throughout 
Saturday night, all day 
Sunday and Sunday night, 
wind whipped the snow 
back into deep drifts be­
hind them. Crews of high­
way department workers 
were also sent from Lub­

bock to assist the crews in 
Bailey County who spent 
long hours trying to keep 
roads clear for travelers.

The National Weather 
Service and the Texas De­
partment of Public Safety 
issued numerous weather 
advisories and travel war­
nings. Despite all the war­
nings, large numbers of 
‘overdue motorists’ notifi­
cations were sent out, as 
all travel was slowed.

Around 8 p.m. Sunday, 
Highway 86 just east of 
Hub was packed with stuck 
and abandoned vehicles, 
whose drivers found the 
snowpacked highway im­
passable. Some eight ve­
hicles had skidded around 
on the highway and in 
some instances into the 
ditches.

Icy conditions prevailed 
as the snow continued late 
Sunday, and little to no 
traffic was moving on city

Cont. Page 6, Col. 1

MHS Fine Arts 

Boosters Plan 

For Bake Sale
_,Mulcshoe Fine Arts 
Boosters have scheduled 
their annual Thanksgiving 
bake sale for this Saturday 
at both Shoprite Grocery 
and Pay and Save Grocery.

The bake sale will get 
underway at 9:30 a.m. and 
each member of high 
school band, art or speech 
and Muleshoe Junior High 
School band, art or speech 
are asked to bring home 
baked items including pie, 
cake, cookies, brownies, or 
candy to the stores prior to 
9:30 a.m.

Further information may 
be obtained by calling 
Sandra Martin at 272-3670 
after 5:30 p.m.

SHF'S SNOW LADY..... Miss Janie, very tall, and wearing her hat and gloves, along with
a shawl, scarf and >>urse, is ready to go shopping. Taking advantage of no school on 
Monday. Rosemary Quiroz, left, and Rene Garcia, constructed their snow lady at 508 East 
Third Street. They ate among the many youngsters who created their own snow creatures 
on Monday following the weekend snow.
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CRUNCHY

CELERY
Closed Thursday, Nov. 27,1980. Have an enjoyable Thanksgiving.

HONEYSUCKLE

Cri»p
For
S a la d s  or 
D re ss in g s

Stalks T f 0

Sweet Potatoes i C Q
Bake or Candy For Tradition lbs.

Fresh Broccoli 49°icy Crisp. lb.

taking Bunch
Potatoes

No. 1 Russets I b s . ^  ^

Rod Bunch
Grapes r q o  Radishes 2 7Q o

Salad Favorite lb. w w  Colorful. Bunch I  W

Loaf Acorn
Lottuco o q c  Squash 9Qc

U  9  Bake Up Fresh, lb. ■  W

s QQc Onions 2 QQo
No. 1 Russets lbs. w  w  Green. Bunch w W

U.S.D .A . G rad e  A. Se lf 
Basting. 12 lbs. & larger

■ I  1

7 9
ButterbaH Turkeys
Swift’s Self
Basting. 12 lbs. & Up. lb.

Honeysuckle Turkeys
U.S.D.A. Grade A. Self 
Basting 12 lbs. and smaller lb.

Other Traditional Meat Features
Stuffed Turkey# - Turkey Breasts - Turkey Hindqtrs. - Duckling - 
Geese - Swift's White Turkey Roasts - Swift's Mixad Turksy Roasts - 
Rich’s Turkey Ham Chunks - Smoked Turksys —  And Don’t Forget 
Fryer Livers A Gizzards for Gravy.

089|
850

Red. Bunch

• Ml IIINOKSf'dl. ■

STOVE TOP 
STUFFING MIX

stu ffing mi*

Chicken 
Corn Bread 
Pork

6-oz, pkg.

Red Label
32-oz. btl.

Angel Flake 
25c Off Label 

14-oz. pkg.

Karo Syrup 
Baker’ s Coconut 
Cut Yams 
Pumpkin Pie Spice 
Deep Dish Pie Shells 
Niger's Coffee

Sugary Sam 
30-oz. can

Schilling’s 
11A-oz. can

Pet Ritz 
2-ct. 
pkg

All Grinds 
1-lb. can

$y49 
S j  29

6 9 '
7 9 '
7 9 '

sos®

Have aljappy
Thanksgiving

\ ______________________________________ ______ ______________________________
Each of these advertised items ia required to b« raadily available for aala at or bolow lha advertised price in each store except 
aa apecificall’ noted in thia ad. Wa raaarva the right to limit quantities. None told to dealers.

Longhorn Cheese
Kraft Half Moon

Cream Cheese
Philadelphia

Mandarin Oranges 
Fruit Cocktail 
Mini Marshmallows 
Marshmallow Creme

Boneless Sirloin 
Tip Roast
Select Tender Beef lb.

9 9

16-oz. pkg.

8-oz. pkg.

$ 9 9 9

8 9

Rodeo’s Buckboard 
Whole or Half

Sliced Free ! 1
0

Del Monte 
11-oz. can

Hy-Top 
17-oz. can

Kraft 
10Va-oz. pkg.

Kraft 
7-oz. jar

6 6 '
5 7 '
3 9 '
4 9 '

Boneless Pork Roast s1 39
Sliced Bacon “  .  - » s1 59 
Ground Beef . s1 69
All Meat 
Franks
Rodeo. 12-oz. pkg.

All Meat 
Bologna
Rodeo. 12-oz. pkg.

09
Baking 
Hens
Grade A. I

Fantail Shrimp 
$ 1 1 9  Briaded

$1

Booth 16-oz.

7 9 c
$499

Thanksgiving Menu Go-Together Food Favorites At Vslus Prices!

CRANBERRY
SAUCE

O cean  Spray. W hole or Jellied

16-oz. can

4 9

LIBBY
PUMPKIN

B ake  Up  P ie s Fresh!

16-oz. can

EVAPORATED
MILK \

Carnation  

2 13-oz. can s

COOL
WHIP
B irdseye  Frozen

8-oz. bowl

Chips
Chocolate Flavored. 12-oz. pkg.

Potato Buds
Betty C ro cke r 13 % -oz. pkg.

GOLO MEOAL 
FLOUR

4 9
9 9
7 7

Poultry Seasoning 7 0 c Diced Pimentos
Schilling s %-oz. can f  Or Sliced. Dromedary 4

Ground Sage
Sehilling’a ,86-oz. can

Folger’s Coffee
“* ‘ 13-oz. can

}
PUMPKIN

PIE
Mrs. Smiths Frozen.

26-oz. pkg.

rurnifi'1
r +  <iWi‘ntj y 19

u m°mnr'4" “r ^  Cresent RollsMe Manzimlla Olives Q Q e
Durkee, Green, Stuffed 5%-oz. jar. . . Stuffed 5%-oz. jar

$ 9 3 9  Sweet Pickles
£  Vlasic 1

Merico Refrigerated. 8-oz. tube.------  O  w .  « « ■  w  w a a  y  w — -

13-oz. can £  Vlasic 16-oz. jar $i 19 Rrown Serve
Asparagus Spears $159 Ripe Pitted Olives 7 Q c  9
Del Monte. Mary Waehing»on14V*-oz. | Early California, Select.#300can f  g  £ ,  J-Ct. pkgs.
■ ■ aa A MS B a ■ ■Green Beans
Del Monte, Whole 16-oz. can

Whole Beets
Hy Top 16-oz. can

60-ct.

PREMIUM
8ALTINES

A Q c  Dinner Napkins
Chiffon

Q Q c  Aluminum Foil
U  V  • Diamond Heavy Duty 37Va’ roll

79c Chicken Broth
9 9 ' Sw an so n

5 lb. bag 4 1-lb. pkg. 19
scon
TOWEL

CRISCO
SHORTENING

2
13 3 /4-oz. can s

CAKE
MIXES

6 9
9 9
5 9

Big roll

With One Filled SAH 
Bonus Special Booklst

, m jg jrv j  With 0ne Filled SAH 
Bonus Special Booklst

19
With Ons Fillsd SAH 

Bonus Special Booklsl

31 Betty Crocket 
Super Moist 

1816-oz. pkg-

3 lb. can

With On# Fillsd SAH 
Bonus Special Booklet

wjtft0re Filled SAH 
Bonv*Sp®cial Booklet
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Nursing Home 
News

By Joy Stancell

Friday morning Ora 
Roberts, Russ Duncan, 
Marie Patton, Rosemary 
Pool went out to the Mini 
Mall, here in Muleshoe to 
see the new shops. Some 
of them also went to 
Perry’s and to the new 
antique shop. They all en­
joyed seeing the changes 
that were taking place in 
Muleshoe.

*****
Thursday afternoon Doc 

Goucher, C. W. Wilhite, 
Wayne Marlow, Maud 
Kersey came to play domi­
noes with Ora Roberts, 
Bertie Hendrix, Russ Dun­
can, Grace Kemp, Edith 
Bruns, Charlie Garth, Al­
ma Henley, Betta Lancas­
ter and Rosemary Pool.

*****
Sunday morning E. B. 

Wilson came to have Bible 
study with Alma Shofner, 
Marie Engram, Alma Hen­
ley, Marie Patton, Grace 
Kemp, Maggie London, 
Russ Duncan, Dottie Wil- 
terding, Charlie Garth, Ar­
chie Scarlett, and Jose 
Garcia.

Marie Patton was visited 
by June Gore.

*****
Dr. McDaniel is visited 

daily by Mrs. Whatley. 
*****

Bertie Hendrix was visi­
ted by Jerry Hutton, Mr. 
and Mrs. Bobby Gable, 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Embry, 
Veta Self, and Mrs.
Chambless.

*****
Clara Weaver’s visitors 

this week were Jimmy and 
Johnnie, Jerry Hutton, 
Maud Kersey, Cordelia 
Cochran and Ruby Garner. 

*****

Lula Embry was visited 
by her family members, 
Frank Hawkins, and Bob 
Beller from California.

*****

Ora Roberts was visited 
by Melba and Mona Clark 
from Sterling City, Russ 
Duncan and Ora Roberts 
played a game Thursday, 
Mary Roberts from Roswell 
visited Freda McOfee from 
Portales. Ruby Clark took 
her mother, Ora Roberts to 
Clovis Saturday. They did 
some shoping and ate din­
ner at the Pizza Hut. Ruby 
Ward, Cordelia Cochran, 
Jerry Hutton, Lorna Mora- 
vec, Eileen and Olivia 
Martha, a long time friend 
of Ora’s, Mr. and Mrs. 
Frank Hawkins also visi­
ted.

*****
The St. John’s Lutheran 

Church of Lariat brought 
issues of large print Portals 
of Prayer to the nursing 
home Tuesday.

*****
Our new resident is 

Ruby McCamish. She was 
born in Texas February 17, 
1905. She is a Baptist. She 
was in a nursing home in 
Morton before coming to 
Muleshoe. She likes to 
listen to records and to the 
radio. We welcome her to 
the nursing home.

BLACKLANDS

AUSTIN -  Blacklands 
cotton production dropped 56 
percent in October, Agricul­
ture Commissioner Reagan 
V. Brown has reported. The 
decrease was the biggest drop 
statew ide and probably 
reflected the effects of the 
drought more than any other 
region. Brown noted.

Texas Crop and Livestock 
Reporting Service estimates 
the harvest at 140,000 bales, 
doen 180.000 bales from last 
year.

Statewide production is. 
projected at 3.6 million bales,
down 34 percent from 1979.

* * * *
Very few participants 

in marriage ceremonies 
recall the "for poorer” 
phrase.

Cats Claw 
Mules

The 7th grade Mules 
met the Littlefield Wildcats 
Thursday Nov. 13. The 
Wildcats came out on top 
by a score of 20 to 0. The 
Mules kicked off and a 
Littlefield back ran in for a 
touchdown. The Mules had 
a drive going but were 
stopped when they had to 
punt. Littlefield second TD 
came on a quick pitch to a 
Littlefield back. With one 
minute before the final 
buzzer, Littlefield scored 
on a short pass. With 
seconds to go the ,Mules 
had the ball, but time ran 
out, with the final score 20 
to 0 in favor of Littlefield.

Coach Jones comment­
ed, "At times the 7th 
grade played well. Hope­
fully with a year’s growth 
and maturity, these boys 
will develop into a good 
team.”

Player of the Week was

Mules Upset 
For District 
Championship

The 8th grade mules met 
the Littlefield Wildcats last 
Thursday night, November 
13, at Littlefield. The final 
score, with Littlefield winn­
ing the district champion­
ship, was 12-0.

Jerry Gleason was sele­
cted player of the week for 
doing a real good job on 
defense and he also receiv­
ed the "Big Lick" award.

Coach Jones comment­
ed, "The eighth graders 
put out great effort, unfort­
unately we fell short by 12 
points to win the district 
championship in the eighth 
grade.” The coaches 
appreciate the efforts and 
attitudes of the players and 
are pleased with a 6-2-1 
record.

given to David Vela for 
playing a very good game 
both offensively and defen­
sively. Players receiving 
stars were David Vela, 
"Player of the Week” and 
Mike Holt, “ Big Lick.”

MJHS Feelings 

About The Mules
An original poem by a 

sixth grade boy, Stacy 
Springfield, expresses 
MJHS feelings about <5uf 
Mules.

WE ARE THE MULES 
We are the Mules
We have power,
Who is the next 

team we will devour?

We are the Mules 
We’re not nuts 

We’ll hit-’em hard 
Right in their guts.

We’re the Mules 
We’re pretty slick,
Next team we play 

Gets a good hard kick.

We’re the Mules 
We’re not sinners,
Next game we play 

1 bet we’re the winners.

We’re the Mules 
We will win,

We’ll hit them hard 
In the end.

West Texas D evelopm ent

Y j ?  f T

MRS. M ARY SCOGGIN
There’s quite a dif­

ference between being 
present and doing the 
work.

J. Fred Bucy, president 
of Texas Instruments Inc. 
and chairman of the Texas 
Tech Board of Regents, 
predicted that West Texas 
will have "explosive de-

Teacher 
of The Week

Coach Jerry Robinson 
was selected as teacher of 
the week Nov. 4. This is 
Coach Robinsons' first year 
to teach. He graduated 
from Crosbyton High 
School, then he attended 
North Texas State Univer­
sity and graduated with a 
B.S. degree. At MJHS he 
coaches 7th and 8th grade 
athletics, 6th grade P.E., 
8th grade History, and 8th 
grade Science.

He is married to Nonette 
Robinson and they have 
one son, Taylor who is 2 
1/2 years old. The Journal­
ism Staff would like to 
congratulate him for this 
honor.

Mrs. Mary Scoggin >vas 
chosen as teacher of the 
week by the Student Coun­
cil.

She graduated from high 
school at Field, New Mexi­
co, and went to Eastern 
New Mexico University, 
where she graduated from 
college, she majored in 
Home Econmics and mino- 
red in Science.

She has taught for 24 
years, 21 of those years at 
Muleshoe, where she curr­
ently teaches 7th grade 
science.

Her hobbies include 
reading, sewing, and yard 
work. She and her husband 
Lewis, have three sons, 
Kearney, Verylon and 
Jerry.

Congratulations Mrs. 
Scoggin!!!!

velopment between now 
and the year 2000.”

Bucy spoke before the 
first Regents Reunion, ad­
dressing present and for­
mer members of the 
boards who have governed 
Texas Tech University and 
the Texas Tech University 
Health Sciences Center.

The former regents were 
invited to return to the 
institutions -- and will be 
invited in succeeding years 
-  to help develop a con­
tinuity of policy and to 
counsel with present board 
members.

Bucy told his audience 
that Texas Tech should 
“ play a primary role in 
being the intellectual lea­
ders for what, I guarantee 
you. will be the explosive 
development of this region 
between now and the year 
2000.”

He spoke about national 
and international problems 
and areas in which Texas 
Tech could work to solve 
some of these.

"Inflation is a tough 
one,” the chairman said. 
"Government is a tough 
one. I have strong beliefs 
in the self reliance of 
people and that is why I 

i personally am a conserv­
ative.

“ I think the temper and 
the mood of the people of 
this region are conserva­
tive, too. We don’t want a
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big government either tel­
ling us what to do or doing 
it for us. But we also don’t 
want government preven­
ting us from doing what is 
necessary,” he said.

The basic answer to in­
flation, Bucy contended, is 
to find the right balance in 
the relationship between a 
free people and their gov­
ernment.

“ I believe that balance 
can be found in basically 
conservative principles.”

As he continued his re­
marks, Bucy made it clear 
he was “ in no way pre­
scribing for the young 
people who come to Texas 
Tech what they should 
think, and what they 
should learn.

“ I do mean that we need 
to teach all points of view, 
he said, “ not just what 
Fabian Socialists have 
preached in England for 
the last 100 years, not just 
what the Keynesian eco­
nomists say. t

“ I think we should also 
discuss classical economics 
and the role of government 
as the source of inflation,” 
said Bucy. “ I think there is 
no better place to do this

than this region where the 
spirit, the temper, and the 
heritage of the people are 
still rooted in deep and 
self - confident conser­
vatism.”

RECIPE
By Sank Anne Sheridan

Chop* with Fruit

6 pork chops, 1-inch 
thick

2 T salad oil
1 t salt

V* t pepper
V* c chili sauce
3 T lemon juice
1 16-oz. can cling-peach 

slices, undrained or 
other fruit

In large skilled over 
medium-high heat, brown 
chops on both sides in hot oil; 
sprinkle with salt and 
pepper. Add chili sauce, 
lemon juice and Vi cup syrup 
from peaches. Cover; cook 
over low heat 50 minutes or 
until chops are fork-tender. 
During last 5 minutes of 
cooking, add peach slices; 
heat. Makes 6 servings.

Pork with Apples: Pre­
pare as above but omit chili 
sauce, lemon juice, peaches 
and syrup. Add 'A cup apple 
juice or cider. During last 5 
minutes, add 3 thick apple 
slices, halved.

• cAlou/ A  Stock
^ o o / td  
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ENGAGEMENT ANNOUNCED..... Mr. and Mrs. Jimmie
Pitcock wish to announce the engagement and 
approaching marriage of their daughter, Nina Marie, to 
Joe Avory Adams, son of Mr. and Mrs. Ray Adams of 
Tulia. The tenative wedding date is set for January 2 at 7 
p.m. in the Trinity Baptist Church in Muleshoe. She is a 
1979 graduate of Muleshoe High School, and is attending 
South Plains College and plans to continue her education 
at W.T.S.U. Adams is a 1978 graduate of Tulia High 
School, and a 1980 graduate of South Plains College and is 
currently employed in Tulia.

D o Y ou Look Like The Last 
Faded Rose O f Summer

The last rose of summer 
has long since faded. So 
has the flattering suntan 
that brightened summer 
faces. But winter’s drab 
pallor need not cast itself 
upon your face.

“ Winter makeup should 
be as flattering and natural 
looking as summer’s casual 
healthy look,” says Monica 
Hollister. “ Winter war­
drobes, even in mild cli­
mates, tend to be more 
structured and ‘serious’ 
and less colorful than 
summer outfits. Con­
sequently, some women 
tend to apply makeup in a 
more heavy-handed and 
structure way.”

“ Your winter makeup 
should not make you look 
winter weary,” says Hol­
lister. “ First you may want 
to re-evaluate your skin 
care program to counteract 
the drying effects of wind, 
cold and overheated homes 
and offices. A foundation 
product that adds a subtle 
tinge of healthy color to 
your skin is another es­
sential.”

“ The biggest boost can 
come from color en­
hancers.” she says. “ Flat­
tering copper and deep 
rose blushers can brighten 
the skin and coordinate 
beautifully with the 
copper, bronze, loder 
green, purply blue and 
rose-colored fabrics in your 
winter wardrobe. Select a 
soft deep blue, gray, green 
or brown eyeshadow to

reflect the color of your 
blouse or dress. Choose a 
highlighter of a lighter 
color and then smudge a 
little navy, brown, green or 
gray eyeliner pencil just 
above your lashline to 
bring eyes into more dra­
matic focus. For lips and 
fingernails, rich copper 
and deep rose colors are 
appealing but never 
garnish.”

Christian
Women’s
Fellowship

The Christian Women’s 
Fellowship of the First 
Christian Church met 
Tuesday, November 11 at 4 
p.m. in the church study 
with Mrs. Walter Bartholf, 
Sr. as hostess.

The president, Mrs. 
Wesley Glover, presided 
over the meeting. She led 
the saying of the C.W.F. 
Prayer. After the business 
meeting. Mrs. Joe Costen 
presented the program on 
the Women of the Bible, 
by discussing the life of 
Rizpah. The devotion was 
the reading of the "One 
Hundredth Psalm” , the 
Thanksgiving Psalm.

The next meeting will be 
Tuesday, December 9.

Members attending were 
Mrs. S.E. Goucher, Mrs. 
Wesley Glover, Mrs. Wal­
ter Bartholf, Sr. and Mrs.
Joe Costen.• * * *

A fanatic is one who 
lets one idea dominate his 
life and befog his reason.

Joyce Walker, president 
of the New Mexico 
Teachers Association has 
been selected as one of 
thirty musicians to tour 
China with the 1981 United 
States Professional Musi­
cians People - to - People 
Delegation.

Leaving on May 30, she 
will tour Peking, Tientsin, 
Canton, Shanghai, and 
Hong Kong.

Owner of the Hobbs 
World of Piano, Mrs. 
Walker is currently vice 
president of the Southwest 
Division of the National 
Music Teachers Associa­
tion. She will serve as the 
hospitality chairman for 
the 1981 national conven­
tion slated for Phoenix.

In the recent state con­
vention for the New Mexi­
co Music Teachers Associ­
ation, The Student Foun­
dation was established in 
honor of Joyce Walker of 
Hobbs, who has promoted 
student activities in New 
Mexico Music Teachers 
Association for many 
years.

The student programs 
for NMMTA have been an 
interest of hers for many 
years. She has also served 
as secretary, district vice 
president, vice president, 
student affiliate chairman 
and at present is the Presi­
dent for the State Associa­
tion.

The student honors 
auditions are two programs 
which have been es­
tablished under her lea­
dership.

Joyce Walker is the 
daughter of Byron and 
Velma Gwyn of Muleshoe. 
She is a graduate of Mule­
shoe High School and of 
West Texas State Univer­
sity. She is married to Joe 
Walker who is a professor 
at New Mexico Junior Col­
lege. They have two chil­
dren, John of Dalhart and 
Cindy, who is a student at 
Texas Tech.

JOYCE WALKER

Muleshoe 

Singing Group 

Meets
m M W  ■ * * “

The Muleshoe Study 
Club met Thursday, No­
vember 13 at 4 p.m. at the 
Art Loft. Refreshments of 
cake and coffee were 
served to the following; 
Mrs. John Agee, Mrs. 
Rufus Gilbreath. Mis. T.R. 
White, Mrs. Wi|son 
Witherspoon, Mrs. jTG. 
Arnn, Mrs. Charles Shain, 
Mrs. Wilma Thompson, 
Mrs. Joe Costen, Mrs. 
Betty Carpenter, Mrs. A. 
C. Neely, and Mrs. Wesley 

' Glover.
A tour of the Art Loft 

was made, seeing many 
antiques, and old fashion 
Christmas decorations and
toys.

Afterwards, the mem­
bers adjourned on to Mrs. 
Wilma Thompson’s home, 
where a short business 
meeting was held and dis­
cussion of the booth the 
club will have at the bazaar 
the 22 and 23.

Also the plans for the 
menu for the Christmas 
dinner were made and 
Mrs. Gilbreath will be the 
hostess for this occasion in 
her home on December 10.

The Christmas dinner 
will be the only meeting in 
December.

Mr. and Mrs. Hal And­
erson are the proud par­
ents of a new daughter 
born at 5:21 p.m., Novem­
ber 8, in the Iubbock 
Methodist Hospital.

The young lady weighed 
7 lbs., 8 1/2 oz. and was 20 
1/4 inches long. She has 
been named Krista Eliza­
beth. She is the first child 
for the couple.

Grandparents are Roy 
and Hazel Dyer, of Mule­
shoe, Mrs. Jewel Anderson 
of Lubbock and the late 
David S. Anderson.

joni Gail Sneed
Mr. and Mrs. Frank 

Sneed are the proud 
parents of a new daughter 
born November 6 in the 
Clovis High Plains 
Hospital. She weighed 8 
lbs. and 11 oz. and was 22 
inches long. She has been 
named Joni Gail Sneed.

Grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. Fletcher Sneed ot 
Idalou and Clarence Mason 
formerly of Muleshoe.

Great grandparents are 
Lola Brunson of Idalou and 
Mr. and Mrs. Vance 
Wagnon of Muleshoe.

Criss&ndra Marie Cotham 
Kristina Adeline Cotham

Mr. and Mrs. Robert 
B. Cotham HI. of Clovis, 
are the proud parents of 
twin daughters born No­
vember 14 in the West 
Plains Medical Center. 
They have been named 
Crissandra Marie and 
Kristina Adeline.

Crissandra was bom at 
12:32 p.m. and weighed 5 
lbs. Kristina was born at 
12:34 p.m. and weighed 4 
lbs. and 12 oz. They are 
the first children for the 
couple.

Grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. William Thomas 
and Bob and Durley 
Cotham. all of Clovis.

i p w w w w w w w w w w w *

West Plains 
Medical Center 

Report

There were 13 present at 
the Muleshoe Singing 
Group meeting Saturday 
evening. The meeting was 
opened with J.C. Shanks 
presiding, he led the first 
two hymns.

Invocation was given by 
Mrs. Minnie Kelly. There 
were several specials given 
by the local group, also 
congregational singing.

The group meets each 
Saturday at 6:30 p.m. in 
the fellowship hall of the 
Trinity Baptist Church.

Omer Kelton gave the 
benediction.
BLACKLANDS

AUSTIN ■— Blacklands 
cattle and calves numbers 
totaled 2,000,000 head on 
July I, 1980. a 6.38 percent in­
crease over 1979, Agriculture 
Commissioner Reagn V. 
Brown has reported.

In the July I inventory by 
the Texas Crop and l ivestock 
Reporting Service, the biggest 
increase came in beef cows at
910.000 head, up 10.97 per­
cent. Milk cows stood at
50.000 head.

Although feeder cattlt; 
increase was small at .61 per­
cent, Brown said Blacklands 
led the state for the second 
consecutive year with the 
highest feeder total at 837.000 
head. Brown attributed the 
high count to the summer 
drought as ranchers brought 
more cattle into feedlots for 
rdief from dry and barren 

tjpis(pastures.

f  - A A

ADMITTED
November 13, John Reed, 
Ted Millsap, Amanda 
Claybrook, Guadalupe 
Garcia
November 14, Renee Coth­
am, Cotton Burlison, Tu- 
entan Ellis, Barberett Sikes 
Louise Garcia, Thomas 
Kirvin
November 15, Weldon 
Timms, Pilar Lopez, Hattie 
Gray
November 16, David Clay- 
brook, Sallie Schuster, 
Pamela Clingenpul, Pat 
Angeley
November 17, Allan Guinn, 
Lee Kimbrough, ' Maria 
Murrefo

DISMISSED
November 14. Thurman 
Bartlett, Seferona Agurre 
November 15, Rojelio Me­
jia. Jr., Guadalupe Mendez 
Cotton Burlison, Inez Rios 
and baby girl, Barberatte 
Sikes, Jo Rempe, Kerry 
Wagnon
November 1 /, Tuintez 
Ellis, Louise Garcia

ALL GRINDS

FOLGER'S 
COFFEE c«

8 loin pork chops, 
thick (about 2 lb.)
1 tablespoon unsalted but­
ter or margarine 
Vi cup chopped onion 
l-'/j cups packaged en­
riched pre-cooked rice 
l-'/j cups water 
1 cup diced peeled tart 
apple
1 cup diced orange 
sections*
l-Vt teaspoons grated
orange rind
1/8 teaspoon pepper
1/8 teaspoon poultry
seasoning

♦Or use */i cup chopped 
dried prunes

PEPSI LIBHT/M OUNTAIN D EN / 
DIET PEPSI OR

iP E P S I
OPEN THANKSGIVING

GREAT FOR BAKING

1 2 9GLADIOLA
S I .  . S '
BAGFLOUR

M ORTON'S HONEY

BUNS 9 OZ. 
PK8. 6 9 c

SCHILLING'S GROUND

9 9 cSAGE 7/8 OZ.
BORDEN'S f t  4 09BUTTERMILK o f f 1 S 1
REGULAR SUPER A  +

KOTEX Kfi- 5 I1 79

COTTAGE CHEESE

FRITO 111#6-1109 P*Si
TOSIIIO’S 
OR FIIIO'S

PRICES EFFECTIVE 
NOVEMBER 20-22.1980 
WHIU SUPPLY LASTS

ALLSUPS
c o n v e r g e STORES 

There SONE NEAR YOU'
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Shopping Mortgage Options 
Can Save Home Buyer Thousands

/

By Robert L. Haney 
TAES Science Writer

T o d ay 's  house buyer 
should shop for a mortgage as 
carefully as the house itself; 
it can am ount to many 
thousands of dollars differ­
ence in cost, according to Dr.
D. A. Klinefelter, research 
economist at Texas A&M 
University.

“ Because of volatile and 
increasing cost of funds to 
mortgage lenders, the tradi­
tional fixed-rate mortgage is 
hard to g e t,’’ K linefelter 
says.

“ Increasing use is being 
made of variable rate and roll­
over mortgages. The interest 
rate on the variable-rate mort­
gage is not fixed, but is tied to 
an index of money-market 
rates.

“ Under a typical plan, the 
interest rate can change at 
predetermined intervals with 
the rate changes usually 
limited to not more than 2.5 
to 3 percent over the life of 
the mortgage.

“ It is my own opinion that 
without a fundamental change 
in government economic 
policies towards longer term, 
less politically motivated 
strategies, mortgage rates are 
not likely to drop below 10 
percent during the 1980’s.

“ Therefore, given current 
rates the adjustments are 
more likely to be up than 
down. Because of this, buy­
ers need to consider the po­
tential effect of changes in in­
terest rates on the size of their 
monthly payments.

“ For example, principal 
and interest payments on a 
25-year, $50,000 mortgage 
will run $490.06 at 11 per­
cent, but if the interest rate 
were increased to 14 percent, 
w ould  run $ 6 0 1 .8 9  a 
month.”

Rollover mortgages are 
written as a series of 3-to 5- 
year fixed-rate, guaranteed 
renewable notes, but with the 
interest rate renegotiated at 
the market rate existing at the 
time of renewal. The borrow­
er has the option of accepting

the new rate or paying off the 
loan.

If a rate increase is neces­
sary, in some instances the 
payments may be kept nearly 
the same by extending the 
maturity of the loan although 
the total interest cost obvious­
ly increases. Rollovers are 
usually favored by people 
who plan to own a home only 
a few years before selling, ac­
cording to Klinefelter.

Although these mortgage 
instruments do force buyers 
to accept at least part of the 
interest-rate risk,” Klinefel­
ter says, “ they tend to in­
crease the availability of 
locked into a fixed-rate in­
vestment when their cost of 
funds increases.

“ A second matter related 
to interest rates has had a sig­
nificant impact on the availa­
bility of mortgage funds in 
the past. These are usury laws 
or legal ceilings on interest 
rates which lenders can 
ch a rg e  on ce rta in  loan 
categories.

“ Because interest rates 
have such a significant impact 
on home buyers, many well 
meaning consumer groups 
lobbied for ceilings on mort­
gage rates to ‘protect’ bor­
rowers.

“ The result of such laws 
was that when rates on alter­
native investments rose above 
the ceilings on mortgage rates 
and when their cost of loan­
able funds increased, lenders 
were forced to cut back on 
mortgage lending and divert 
their funds elsewhere.

“ The end result was that 
the borrowers these laws were 
designed to help were unable 
to get financing or else the 
government was forced to 
create its own loan programs 
at subsidized rates.

“ During this past year, 
however, the federal govem- 
mortgage money because 
lenders face less risk of being 
ment has acted to set aside 
state usury limits on mort­
gages made by federally in­
sured lending institutions and 
on loans from other sources 
which are insured or guaran­
teed by the federal govern­
ment.

“ Hopefully, we will see 
less artificial tightening in the 
real estate funds market. The 
decision will rest more with 
the buyer regarding whether 
or not to pay the going market 
price for mortgage money.

“ With variable rate loans, 
buyers should also have less 
reason to delay purchasing a 
home during temporary rate 
upswings since their cost will 
fall when rates decline be­
cause like the lender they are 
no longer locked into a fixed 
rate for the duration of the 
mortgage.

“ I hope this brief discus­
sion of the complex area of 
mortgage funding will help 
prospective home buyers to 
realize the importance of 
shopping the funding market 
as diligently as the house 
market.

“ Careful consideration of 
options by a homebuyer can 
sometimes save thousands of 
dollars,”  Klinefelter con­
cluded.

Editor's Note: Any questions 
regarding this column should 
be addressed to Science Writ­
er, Department o f Agricultur­
al Communications, Texas 
A&M University, College Sta­
tion. Texas 77843.

Program ranks 

No. 1 in nation

AUSTIN, Texas (Spl.)-A 
panel of experts in the com­
munity college field has pick­
ed the program in Community 
College Education at The 
University of Texas as the No. 
1 graduate program of its kind 
in the country.

The UT Austin program 
prepares administrators for 
com m unity  co lleg es  
througnout the nation.

In the same study that rank­
ed the UT Austin program, 
Dr John E Roueche, 
professor of educational ad­
ministration, was cited as the 
outstanding living author in
community college education 
since 1960 Two of his books 
were singled out among those 
making national impact on the 
community college move­
ment

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Dood 

Haragan were in Shamrock 
during the weekend to at­
tend the art show-sale held 
there.

*****
Damon Provence has 

been in Lubbock several 
days recently to undergo 
tests.

*****

Pam Kent, Carol Wil­
liams, John Chester, Gary 
Brownd, Diana Gardner 
were among college stu­
dents home for the week­
end.
Your Six-Minute Thanksgiving Turkey

While America has adopted 
many traditional holidays from 
various countries, Thanksgiv­
ing is trully an all-American 
feast day . and what is 
Thanksgiving without a tur­

key? In fact. Benjamin frank­
lin thought so much of the 
noble turkey—"a true, original 
native of America." that he 
wanted to use it on our coun­
try's Great Seal instead of the 
bald eagle.

It might be a comforting 
thought as you approach the 
busy holiday season, whether 
this is your first try at a 
Thanksgiving dinner or you 
are an accomplished veteran 
with a time problem, to know 
that it need only take about 
six minutes of your time to 
prepare the bird for the oven.

In planning for holiday ap­
petites, it is wise to allow one 
pound of turkey per person 
This allows for generous serv­
ings plus some extra, always 
welcome for a favorite left­
over treat.

. If turkey is frozen, leave in 
original bag and thaw in 
refrigerator for 3 to 4 days 
>24 hours for each 5 pounds 
of turkey i or cover with cold 
water, changing water fre­
quently i ' j hour per pound 
of turkey i. Refrigerate or cook 
turkey as soon as thawed.

For your six-minute turkey, 
simply follow these easy steps. 
Remove plastic wrap from 
thawed turkey, remove giblets 
and neck from body cavities, 
rinse turkey inside and out. 
pai dry with paper towel, re­
turn legs to hock lock or band 
of skin, tuck tips of wings
akimbo" back of turkey and 

skewer neck skin to back.
Place turkey breast side up 

on rack in shallow roasting 
plan. Place a tent of aluminum

$1 MILLION PAINTING
NEW YORK ~ The Whit­

ney Museum of American 
Art has paid $1 million for a 
painting by Jasper Johns, 
believed to be the highest 
price ever for the work of a 
living artist. The 1958 
painting, a famous precursor 
of the Pop Art movement, is 
Three Flags.

Mr. and Mrs. Walter 
Sorensen visited last week 
end in Dallas with friends
and relatives.

*****
Wayne George of Lub­

bock visited last Thursday 
with Mr. and Mrs. Martin 
Maxwell.

*****
Mrs. Doris May was in 

Montague last week to

attend funeral services for 
a relative.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Alan 

Beale were in Lockney last 
week to attend funeral ser­
vices for their cousin, Mrs. 
Tempest Phillips.

*****
Butch Hall was 

Wednesday to the 
shoe Hospital.

taken
Mule-

*****

foil loosely over turkey to prevent over-browning. Place in oven 
and roast according to chart. Foil tent may be removed last hall 
hour for final browning.

APPROXIMATE ROASTING TIME IN 325 F. OVEN*
Weight I'n stuffed Stuffed
8 to 12 lbs. 3 - 4  hrs. 4 - 5 hrs.

12 to 16 lbs. 3 'a - 5 hrs. 4 '*  - 6 hrs.
16 to 20 lbs. 4 'a - 6 hrs. S '-  - 7 hrs.
20 to 24 lbs. 5 'a - « '*  hrs. 6'.. - 7 'a hrs.

•Factors affecting roasting times are variations in oven, shape 
of turkeys and degree of thawing. These variations make it 
important to begin checking for doneness about one hour before 
the end of the recommended roasting time.

The turkey is done when meat thermometer registers 180 F. 
to 185 F.. thick part of drumstick feels soft when pressed with 
thumb and forefinger or drumstick moves easily. Stuffing in a 
turkey needs to reach 165 F. to be sufficiently cooked.

Let turkey stand at room temperature for 15 to 20 minutes 
for easier carving.

Joe Wood was guest 
speaker at the Circleback 
Baptist Church last Sunday 
morning and evening.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Jack 

Engram were in Plainview 
Saturday to attend the art 
show and sale.

*****
Josh Chester was re­

leased from the Methodist 
Hospital on Friday of last 
week. He is the infant son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Curtis 
Chester and underwent 
surgery two weeks ago. 

*****
Mrs. Mary Baker and 

Kristen of Lubbock were in 
Sudan Saturday afternoon 
to attend the baby shower 
for Mrs. Cindy Legg.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Halbert 

Harvey returned home 
Saturday night from visit­
ing in Lufkin and in Dallas 
with relatives. Her mother, 
Mrs. Luella Kendricks re­
turned home with them 
following an extended 
visit.

*****
Mrs. Norma Poe is a 

surgical patient in the St. 
Mary's Hospital in Lub­

bock this week following 
surgery there on Wednes­
day.

*****
Mrs. Velma Reasoner 

and children of Brownfield 
visited during the weekend 
with her parents, Mr, arid 
Mrs. Pal Legg and at­
tended the baby shower for 
her sister-in-law, Mrs. 
Cindy Legg.

*****
Jodi Vernon and Pam 

Kent were among college 
students home for the 
weekend.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Tom 

Whitis of Stephenville vis­
ited during the weekend 
with her sister, Mr. and 
Mrs. Early Bartley. Also 
visiting with them for a 
family get together were 
the Bartley’s children, Mr. 
and Mrs. J.C. Williams of 
Hereford and Mr. and 
Mrs. Gene Bartley and 
children of Sudan.

*****
Weekend visitors in the 

home of Rev. and Mrs. 
Truman Johnson and fam­
ily were her parents, Mr. 

j and Mrs. Lester Lockett of 
Meadow.

*****
It was reported that Ray 

Wood was to be released 
this week from the Meth­
odist Hospital.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Tom Ford 

of Lockney and Mr. and 
Mrs. John Kropp and 
children visited during 
weekend with Mr. and 
Mrs. Claud Kropp.

*****

St. Clairs Would Like To
4

C o n g / t a t u f t a t e
T he Following W inners O f Their Drawing 

Held Saturday Nov. 1 5 ,1 9 8 0

Mrs. Dirk Green - Mr. Beau Pant Suit 
Mark Leak - Sewell Suit

Phyllis Angley - Men’s Jamar Slacks 
Mrs. Terry Sowder - Rob Roy Shirt 
Floyd Rymer - Robert Prince Sweater 
Rudolph Kube - Panty Hose 
Anita Foster - Bedspread 
Inez Flores - Arrow Shirt 
Mrs. O.M. Lackey - Men’s Shoes 
Debbie Kittrell - Rob Roy Shirt 
Debbie Glover - Dickie Jeans 
Jan Crawford - Rob Roy Shirt 
LaVayne Williams - Underwear 
Linda Lowe • Dickie Jeans 
Connie Morris - Underwear 
Linda Vinson - Hose 
Donna Glover - 2 Pillows 
f^ary Mardis - Blanket 
Sylvia Guevara - Rob Roy Shirt 

rna Lopez - Bib Overalls 
bbie Dunham - Men’s Sweater 
uise Sullivan - Hose 

Jackie Brown - Jockey Underwear 
ary Anna Bryant - Underwear 
rtis Buhrman - Dickie Jeans 
leron Eubanks - Ladies Panty Hose 
anda Shafer - Arrow Shirt

Think Ahead
Start Now and Enjoy The Holidays

U llM T B r  P i c k e d  U

fly H i

St. 4
( A U P r i z ?  u 4 u m ) SINCE 1930

“When 1 bought these size 18 jeans, 1 weighed 202 pounds” says 
5’4” Sandy Camp of Dangerfield, Texas. “I managed to take off 
20 or so on my own, but then I was stuck. That's 
when 1 went to Pat Walker’s.”

No-sweat exercise is the secret
After her introductory treatment on Pat 
Walker’s Symmetricon passive exercise 
unit, Sandy knew that she’d come to the 
right place. She felt rested and relaxed— 
not sweaty and exhausted. She didn’t 
even have to change into exercise 
clothes. And before many weeks went 
by, she could see how her figure was 
being toned and firmed up. Sandy 
eventually lost 13 inches from her waist,
12 inches from her tummy, 11 x/i from her 
hips, and several inches in other areas.

Complete privacy 
is your privilege
If wearing a leotard embarrasses you .. .if 
you don’t like revealing your figure prob­
lems to a roomful of strangers, then Pat

Walker’s is your 
kind of place.I  W f %

v i l  m

r
K -  1

Every aspect of 
your weight loss 
program - from 
counseling ses­
sions about 
sensible eating 
habits, to Sym­
metricon treatments—is 
totally private. We think you deserve that.

Free figure analysis
Today, even Sandy Camp’s husband loves to buy her new things to wear, now that she’s down 
to 124 pounds and size 8. Sandy's success story could be yours. Make an appointment for a 
free, no-obligation consultation at Pat Walker’s. Well tell you how much you need 
to lose, how long it will take and the total cost of your com­
plete figure correction, based on four dollars 
per tjiirty-minutc treatment.

CALL FOR FREE T R U  FIGURE 
ANALYSIS

- 4
•1980 Pol WolliFr i 

Owner* Aitociotion Inc 119AVEC  MULESHOE 272-45

•> ■ vjjjijj e salffli
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A PREVIEW?.— As a preiew of the Christmas season, 
this large ‘outdoor Christmas’ is wearing natural decora­
tions this year. The dusting of snow is real, and the tree 
already has a beginning for the Christmas season to come.

held enoughWeather—
Con’t from page 1

streets in Muleshoe. As 
nigh; approached on Sun­
day, ice started forming on 
slushy streets, creating an 
additional driving
condition.

Only one accident was 
reported on Sunday on city 
streets and one accident 
-vas investigated a short 
distance north of Muleshoe 
on Highway 214.

Monday morning, with 
snowpackcd roads and 
snowdrifts from one to four 
feet on country roads, and 
vome intersections in the 
city, school was dismissed 
for the day.

Monday night, Muleshoe 
City Police investigated an 
accident involving two ve­
hicles at the intersection of 
American Boulevard and 
West Twelvth Street. The 
intersection was rebuilt 
during the summer to help 
drain water front the inter­
section, but the intersec-

r ~ ------------------------------
A Land Bank 

Loan
Long-term 

credit 
for buying, 
building, 

or remodeling

L A N D  B A N K
C /itfoouuim

Bill Liles

K L JR .A . o f  iVluleglioe 

3 1 6  M a in  

Ph.272-3;; 0

tion held enough water 
Monday to cause freezing 
conditions on the highway 
and another accident. No 
injuries were reported.

Again on Tuesday mor­
ning. at the height of early 
morning traffic, another 
minor accident was 
checked by the Muleshoe 
City Police, again with no 
injuries.

Roads were expected to 
be thawed and almost 
cleared in the area by 
nightfall on Tuesday, with 
warmer conditions prevail­
ing. School resumed in 
Muleshoe, and almost all 
activities were back to 
normal.

Mo-Ped—
Con’t from page 1 
18 who wish to operate a 
motor assisted bicycle 
(Mo-Ped) will be required 
to take a test at the De­
partment of Public Safety 
Driver’s License office at 
the Bailey County Law En­
forcement Center. Interes­
ted persons may check 
with the driver’s license 
office for additional infor­
mation.

Muleshoe—
Con’t from page 1 
Muleshoe High School 
FFA students who partici­
pated: Curtis Wheeler, 
Scott Campbell, Tamara 
Gilliland, Kim Farmer. 
Todd Holt. Lincoln Snell 
and Eddie Flowers.

Guests at the Rotary 
meeting included Willard 
Pittman, Delbert Barry and 
Earl Cook.

*****

It is su»nge how other 
people can tell you how to 
run your business, and 
why.

Give
Them A New 

Pair Of 
Boots? &

A A f n

P u  0  W E S T E R N  W E A R  I n c :

1910 W. Amcr. Blvd. 272-4663

mmnvMmmmmmmmmmmM

Concert —
Con’t from page I

might be called a trend­
setter.

With only 850 tickets on 
sale, if tickets are left, they 
will be available at the 
door for S5.50. The doors 
will open at 7:30 p.m. and 
the two hour concert be­
gins at 8 p.m. Seating is on 
a first-come, first-served 
basis.

Several businesses pro­
vided ‘up-front’ money so 
the concert could be 
scheduled. Faulkner said,
“ I would like to thank the 
civic-minded businesses 
for their interest. They are 
the First National Bank, 
Tri County Savings and 
Loan, Leal’s Restaurant,

Contest —
Con’t from page 1 
second place in the contest 
for the week.

Third place winner for 
the week was Debbie Weir, 
who missed three games, 
including both tiebreakers. 
But, her score was only 43 
points off on the tiebreaker 
scores.

Others missing only 
three games, but being in 
excess of 50 points away on 
the tiebreaker scores in­
cluded Frank Jesko, 
Richard Engleking, Cliff 
Buckner, Morris Douglass, 
and Gig Pierce.

Escapee—
Con’t from page 1

Deputy Henderson 
said the Los Angeles I.aw 
enforcement officers said 
they would notify Bailey 
County officers of future 
hearings for Ms. Holmes. 
At this time, it is unknown 
as to when she will be 
returned to Bailey County 
to begin serving her sent­
ence at the Texas Depart­
ment of Corrections at 
Huntsville.

Following her convic­
tion here, she was still 
jailed locally as the convict­
ed woman had appealed 
her sentence.

Cable Channel Six TV and 
White’s Cashway
Grocery."

Faulkner also thanked 
local and area news media 
for boosting the upcoming 
appearance of the na­
tionally known musician in 
Muleshoe. He said special 
appreciation went to the 
Muleshoe newspaper, 
KMUL Radio, KKQC Ra­
dio in Clovis, Channel Six 
Cable TV, the Amarillo 
Globe News, the Lubbock 
Avalanche Journal. KMCC 
TV Lubbock, and the 
Clovis News Tribune.

In other appearances in 
Texas, tickets have been 
sold for up to $10 for the 
Maynard Ferguson show. 
"We are very fortunate to 
have obtained a recording 
star of this magnitude to 
agree to a performance in 
Muleshoe,” concluded 
Faulkner.

G asses Slated 

For Handicapped
There is still time late 

this week to enroll your 
child in the Early Child­
hood Class for three and 
four year old handicapped 
children, according to the 
Muleshoe Independent 
School Superintendent 
Harold Horne.

For appointment to dis­
cuss your handicapped 
child’s needs, please call 
272 5230 for appointment.

The special class is 
scheduled to begin on Jan­
uary 5 at Richland Hills 
Primary.

To be eligible for this 
class, the child must be 
tested to determine the 
handicapping condition. 
Mrs. Harold Horne said 
the most common handicap 
for children this age is 
speech.

Other handicaps include 
deaf, blind, physically 
handicapped, mentally re­
tarded, emotionally handi­
capped and development 
delay.

Eligibility will be deter­
mined by the Muleshoe 
Diagnostician and Speech 
Therapist.

New Textbooks To Be Chosen
Harold Horne, superin­

tendent of the Muleshoe 
Schools, announced the 
selection of the local text­
book committee, approved 
by the Muleshoe School 
Board. This committee will 
evaluate and recommend 
books to be adopted for use 
in the local schools for the 
1981-82 school year.

Subject areas for which 
textbooks will be selected 
are Reading 1-8; Bilingual, 
K-3; Earth Science, eight; 
Business Management, 
Business Communication, 
Business Law, Drafting 
Trades, scociology and 
psychology, high school.

Members of the commit­
tee include Ruby Lambert, 
Jan King, Mary Helen 
Gutierrez, Milton Oyler, 
Richland Hills; Peggy Bur­
nett, Wilma Smith, Ethel 
Allison, Bill Taylor, Mary 
DeShazo School; Pat Wat­
son, Barbara Milburn, 
Fred Mardis, junior high; 
Tom Smith, Keith Taylor, 
Wayland Ethridge, high 
school; Elizabeth Watson 
and Harold Home, chair­
men.

Horne explained that all 
teachers are involved in 
making these selections 
and are encouraged to 
study and evaluate the 
books carefully.

Coin Show Set 

At Clovis Soon
Area persons interseted 

in coins are asked to attend 
a coin show to be presen­
ted Saturday and Sunday, 
November 22-23, in the 
cafeteria at Marshall 
Junior High School in 
Clovis.

The school is located at 
Main Street and Commerce 
Way and the show will be 
held in the cafeteria. Hours 
on Saturday at 9 a.m.-7 
p.m. and the Sunday hours 
are 9 a.m.-5 p.m.

Christie Durben said the 
admission is free and the 
Clovis Coin Club would like 
to extend an invitation to 
all interested persons.
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Muleshoe Co-op Gins Clays Corner Gin &
Mulenhuf 272*4794 Garwell Gin 96/5-2/76

t  rank Brothers Gene Paul Jarman
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Sample copies will be 
available for examination 
by interested parents and /  
or lay citizens. After Janu­
ary, these sample copies 
will be on display in the 
curriculum office and each 
principal’s office.

The selection process 
will be completed by 
March 1, 1981.

Drought Brings 
Crop Harvest 
Estimates Down

A l.'S I IN-1 he vegetable 
harvest lor the last quarter ol 
19X0 is expected to drop, one 
more lingering effect of the 
drought that in some areas ol 
the state made it “too dry to 
plant," reports Agrieulture 
Commissioner Reagan V 
Brown.

Harvest of carrots, hell 
peppers, spinach, lettuce and 
cabbage will all he down, 
according to the lexas Crop 
and Livestock Reporting 
Service. Only cucumbers and 
tomatoes arc expected to in­
crease over the 1979 fall 
harvest.

“It wasn’t disease or insects 
that got these crops.” said 
Agriculture Commissioner 
Reagan V. Broun. "It was the 
hot. drs weather. In some 
areas it was too drs to plant.”

Prospective harvest figures 
for the October-Deccmbcr 
quarter are 3.400 acres of 
carrots, down 11 percent from 
1979; 4.XOO acres of bell 
peppers, down 17 percent: 
4.000 acres of cabbage, down 
33 percent: 1.700 acres of 
spinach.down 37 percent.and 
900 acres of lettuce, down 47 
percent

Around 4.600 acres of 
cucumbers, a 35 percent in­
crease over last year, are 
ex pected  fo r h a r v e s t . 
Tomatoes will increase from 
500 acres in 1979 to X00 this 
fall.

Nationwide, harvest for 14 
fresh market vegetables is 
estimated at 249.000 acres, 
down one percent from a year 
ago. Yields are projected at 
2.06 metric tons, down four 
percent.

ON REFUGEES
The Carter Administra­

tion announced a reduction 
in the number of refugees 
who may legally enter the 
United States next year, 
largely because of the recent 
heavy influx of Cuban and 
Haitian refugees. The new 
refugee quota would be 217.- 
000. 14.700 fewer than this 
year.

MAYNARD FERGUSON

Credit Vs Creditors 
Running into debt 

isn’t so bad. It’s running 
into creditors that hurts. 

•Gosport, Pensacola.

Seldom
Standing offers are 

seldom made by men 
seated in crowded buses. 

-Wall Street Journal.

ClnMstn/ias
©pen ^ o u s e

S unday

oAJouembe/i 23,1980
1:30 - 5p.m.

^Pdease Come ^ y f  

^Unique 8  Cofo/ifaQ Q ij ts  

'zfestive 8  imaginative TJeoo/tations

Ctoishe, -Qa^o.

0! litis. Johtnie £ ̂ Un.tqotcf 
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When

want
results.

. . . give our 

classified department 

a call! If you

want to turn your unwanted Items Into tn k  w # H ^e/p you 

write an ad that will get fast results. Wlifl,fver X00 want to 

buy ot sell, you'll get action with a W A / d ^ ^

C a l l :  2 7 2 - 4 5 3 6  

Muleshoe & Bailey 
County Journals
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DISCOUNT CENTERS

NOTICE To All Of Our Customers!
In the past we have had trouble getting to our customer quick enough 

to give good service. To help correct this problem we have installed 

TV camera's in our store so that we can better serve our customers.
Prices Effective 

Nov. 20-22
Thank-You for your patronage

Bath TissueSt. M ary 's Daybreak

Bedspread
\  Reg. *15”

Dress Boots35 Days 
Left For 

Christmas 
ShoppingDeluxe Travel Kit

Includes After Shave, Stick 
Deodorant, Shave Cream Boot Socks

3-pc. Mixing
Bowl Set

M en 's Nylon Quilted

Jackets

Hoover Convertible 

No. U4119

Vacuum
Cleaner

HEALTH & BEAUTY AID SAVINGS
F k i

Shampoo or 
Conditioner

Aspergum
S S < A  16 Tablet!

B A LSA M
tptoH>N

Lawn & Leaf

Rakes
Soft Back Insulated

Hunting

Vest
Polyester Belted

Dress Slacks
Sizes 4-8

Regalia 5-pc

Touch 'n Foam Instant

Insulation 14 oz. Can
West Bond 

Electric Buttermatic

Corn Popper
Devilbiss

Vaporizer

Model No. 1280

Camp Fuel

HOUSE CLEANING BUYSSHOP OUR TOY DEPT

Dawn
Dishwashing Liquid 

32 FI. oz.

Childrens
SJveritone Com injwiir.

Cookware or Dish Sets

WHERE YOU ALWAYS BUY THE BEST FOR LESS

U J fT js -

EVERY DAY LOW PRICES
Gal. Homo Milk *219
Vi Gal. Homo Milk *F
Gal. Lowfat Milk $l»
Vi Gal. Lowfat Milk $103

»• • R 1

Vi Gal. Buttermilk $J03
2 lb. Cottage Cheese*!93 
1 lb. Cottage Cheese*!03
Sour Cream .53<

48“ Fluorescent Prestone

Shop Light Anti- L
fa

2 Lamp Freeze ?
Gallon

$ 1 ] 8 8 $ 4 2 5 «



Page 8, Muleshoe Journal, Muleshoe, Texas, Thursday, November 20, 1980

Back The Mules

1st
Place

2nd
Place

3rd
Place

Grand Prize $50 and 2 Tickets To Cotton Bowl January 1.
There Will Also Be A Contest and Prises For The Bowl Games

NAM E THE W INNING TEAM EACH WEEK... __________
R U LES  OF T H E  GAME...

1. The contestant must be 12 years or older.
2. Only one entry per person may be made for any one 
contest.
3. Weekly contests are open to everyone except employees 
and families of this newspaper; bring or mail your entries to 
the Journal office.
4. Mailed entries must be postmarked not later than 5:30 
p.m. Friday; winners names will be published in this 
newspaper each Thursday following the close of the weekly 
contest.
5. Check the team you think will win; 10 points for 1st place,
6 points for 2nd place and 4 points for 3rd place determines 
the Grand Prize winner.
6. The tiebreakers will count as one of the games picked, 
the predicted scores will be used to determine the top three 
places in that week’s contest, if necessary, and cash prizes 
and points will be divided between winners in event of ties.
Please write FOOTBALL CONTEST on the envelope of the 
mailed entry. Decision of the Journal’s scoring judges will 
be final.

You Have Until 5:30p.m . Friday To Enter
Please Write FOOTBALL CONTEST , Box 449, 
Muleshoe,, Texas on envelope o f mailed entry.

OFFICIAL ENTRY FORM
NAME.
ADDRESS 
CITY____ .PHONE

1. Southern Cal....
2. Tulane...............
3. Oklahoma. State
4 .  Bayior.....
5. Princeton ..........
6.S.M.U...... .
7. Mississippi ....
8. San Jose State

1. U.C.L.A...............
2. L.S.U...................
3. Iowa State...........
4. Texas ..................
5. Dartmouth..........
6. Arkansas.............
7. Mississippi State

n

J 8. Utah State............
Tiebreaker

1. Texas Tech ........ .............. VS Houston.......................

2..Nebraska ............................ VS .Oklahoma................... .

You Must Put Score On Tiebreaker!!

Congratulations Mules!!!!
On A Great Season !!!!!

We Love You!!!!!!
Larry Norman, Jr.

Larry Beene, Sr.

Ronnie Angeley, Jr.

Felix Norman, Sr.

Bobby Perez, Sr.

Johnny Puckett, Sr.

Jimmy Gleason, Sr.

Clifford Watson. Sr.

Brad Poynor, Sr.

Monty Hysinger, Jr.

Charles Walker, Sr.

Benny Pena, Sr.

Scott Denny, Sr.

Carroll Precure, Sr.

Curby Brantley, Sr.

Greg Harrison. Sr.

Benton Glaze, Sr.

Jeff Meeks, Jr.

Wesley Rasco. Sr.

Bryce Holmes, Sr.

Marvin Lewis, Sr.

Gary Cox, Sr.

Mickey Long, Sr.

Kelly Harrison, Sr.

George Vela, Jr.

Managers: Scott Saylor, Kevin Dudley

Coaches: Mike Wartes, Roger Morris. Robert Brandon,
Alan Cornclius, Jim Leach, Ronnie Jones, Steve Taylor,
Tom Duncan. Jerrv Robinson

M U LESH O E
STATE BA N K

101 AMERICAN BLVD 2724561 MEMBER FOtC

BAILEY COUNTY 
ELECTRIC COOPERATIVE 

ASSOCIATION
305 E. Aw. B 272-1504

MAIN STREET 

BEAUTY SALON
115 Main 272-3440

H a tr e U  s &aslihions
PHONE 806 272-3459 

1519 WEST AMERICAN BLVD

mERiE noRmfin cosmETics

FIRST NATIONAL 
BANK

224 S. J«. 272-4515
Member FJDJ.C.

Terry Field Ins.
213 E. Ave.B

272-5551

SPUDNUT

SHOP
328 S. Main 272-3542

M l  WESTERN 
DRUG

114 Main St 272-3106

ee’s WESTERN WEAR

1910 W. Amer. Bhd. 272-4663

ROBERT GREEN INC
“Your OJdsmobile, Buick, Pontiac 

St. CMC Dealer”

Govie Hwy. 272-4588

WILSON
DRILLING

W. Hwy. 84 272-5521

r sT>ci J
A

312 W. 2nd.

Brian Pohlmier 
Mgr.

272-4229

SAMS SPORTING 

©  GOODS

226 Main 272-4414

EARL LADD 
& SONS INC.

602 W. Amer. Blvd. 272-3306

MULESHOE 
[COOPERATIVE GINS

272-4794

Nix$ Dept. Store

218 Main 

272-5511

Muleshoe Home 
Center

105 E. Ave.B. 272-5105

Shipman & Sons 
Body Shop

410 N. lit .  272-4408

Watson Alfalfa Inc.

272-4038

McCormick Seed & 
Grain Inc.

400 LAshAve. 272-3156

Western "6 6 " Co.

272-4556

Wooley
International Inc.

272-5514

Irrigation Pump 
Service
272-5182

I I I  W. A*'

M M xanct c ^ c jtn c y

272-4581

A&U Farm Store

dovtt-Portales
Muleshoe



d .°St S f Fe ass’stance provided through the Great Plains Conservation
rogram an t e gricu tura Conservation Program helped several Bailey County farmers 

to insta over 6 ml cs 0 parallel terraces this past year. Contact the Soil Conservation 
Service at 111 East Avenue D in Muleshoe for information on Parellel Terraces. (Photo 
Courtesy of SCS)

The 
Sandhills 

Philosopher
Editor’s note: The Sand­

hills Philosopher on his 
Johnson grass farm on 
Sandy Creek has a few 
post-election thoughts this 
week.

- 0 -

Dear editor:
A lot of experts were 

surprised at the outcome of 
the election. I wasn’t. I’m 
never surprised at the out­
come of any election. I hold 
my surprise back for a 
couple of years and then 
see if I’m surprised at how 
the winner’s doing in the 
job.

The reason the experts 
were surprised this time is

that they believed their 
own polls. By interviewing 
a scientifically selected 
cross-section of the nation 
the polsters set out to tell 
us how people are going to 
vote. This time they re­
ported the voters were a- 
bout evenly divided and 
the election was too close 
to call, preparing every­
body to stay up late elec­
tion night, when actually 
we found out the results by 
— ; 00.

Sometimes polsters and 
their scientific methods are 
like volcano experts.

Volcano experts have a 
perfect record on telling us 
when a volcano has erup­
ted, but a mighty poor 
record on letting us know 
ahead of time.

Volcano experts, earth­
quake experts, economic 
experts, weather forecas-

Tradition May Rule 
Outcome For Games
Tra-di-shun .. tra-di-shun 

..this can be a big factor in 
deciding who might be the 
winners in some of the 
season’s final football 
games. Just for example. 
Harvard and Yale are 
meeting for the 97th time..

• for Wisconsin and Minne­
sota, this is their 90th 
game., for Richmond and 
William and Mary, #90.. 
and then there are Lehigh 
and Lafayette who are 
playing each other for the 
116th time! College foot­
ball has been around for a 
while.

Nebraska and Oklahoma 
are only on their 61st 
go-round, but it’s difficult 
to remember when their 
game didn’t have some­
thing to do with either 
national championship 
at least the title in the Big 
Eight Conference. The 
corn huskers were upset 
early in the season 
Florida State, and 
Sooners have been beaten 
outside the conference 
Stanford and Texas, 
braska will be at home, 
and the Huskers are rather
big 17 point favorites.__
In “ honor” of the 50th

a
or

by
the

by
Ne-

meeting between Southern 
California and U.C.L.A., 
both are on the Pac-10 
ineligible list. So the out­
come will have no bearing 
on either conference stan­
dings or the Rose Bowl. 
National ranking, yes. The 
Bruins, beaten by Arizona 
and Oregon on succesive 
Saturdays, will have their 
problems with the Trojans. 
Southern Cal, tied earlier 
by Oregon, is coming off a 
tussle with Washington. 
The difference will be nine 
points, Trojans.

Michigan and Ohio meet 
for the 77th time, this one 
in Columbus. The Buck­
eyes lead the series by 13 
games, and in this Big Ten 
finale for both, Michigan is 
the underdog by four 
points.
Powerful Florida State, 

our #1 college football 
team, will close out its 
season with a 17 point win 
over Florida.
And good friend John 

Whitehead's Lehigh
Engineers, leaders in Divi­
sion I-AA, will win meeting 
1̂16 over Lafayette by 33 

points.

. 9

ouf'h

Need Insurance
Call Barbara

or
Elmer Scarf

A t  2 7 2 - "

For YourHom4Farmor 
Farm Implement ( .̂overage.

They Are H enU For:

Hochheim Farm
Mutual jftfii

AssocitflPIL

ters, network commen­
tators, newspaper colum­
nists and scientific polsters 
do not live in a city on a 
shining hill, or however the 
phrase goes.

Sometimes, taking a 
survey ahead of time on 
how people are going to 
vote is like taking one on 
which football team is go­
ing to win next week.

However, public opinion 
polls like volcanoes and 
football upsets will con­
tinue.

Yours faithfully,
J.A.

BIBLE VERSE
"All we like sheep 

have gone astray; we have 
turned everyone to his 
own way; and the Lord 
hath laid on him the 
iniquity o f us all.''
1. To whom do the above 
words apply?
2. Who is the author of 
these words?
3. Who is the sin-bearer 
to whom the writer refers? 
Answers to Bible Vorso
1. To all mankind.
2. Isaiah, the great 
prophet.
3. Jesus Christ.

Enochs News
By

Mrs J.D. Bayless

Cold Wind Hurts 
Older Citizens
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Mr. and Mrs. PR- 
Pierce were dinner guests 
in the home of their 
daughter, Mr. and Mrs. 
Jim Carpenter at Muleshoe 
Sunday.

*****
W.L. Key, father of Bill 

Key, has been a patient in 
the Amherst Hospital for
some time.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Harold 

Layton of Dell City came 
Wednesday night and 
spent until Sunday after­
noon with his parents, the 
J.W. Laytons. Harold was 
helping with the harvest. 

*****
Mrs. Buford Peterson 

spent several days in the 
Methodist Hospital in Lub­
bock for tests. She was 
dismissed Thursday.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Tom 

Bogard attended the 
funeral service of a son in 
law, Glenn Gaston, at 
Junction 9 a.m. Friday. We 
wish to express our 
sympathy to the Bogards 
and their family.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Dennis 

Turney visited her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Trueman Nix 
at Littlefield Sunday.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Erwin 

Neiman of Muleshoe visi­
ted her sister, Mr. and 
Mrs. P.R. Pierce Friday 
afternoon.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth 

Turney have moved to 
Morton.

*****
Visitors at the Baptist 

Church Sunday were Mr. 
and Mrs. Harold Layton 
and Robert, Mrs. Jerry 
Nichols and Kristen of Dell 
City, Donnie Nichols of 
Canyon and Brandi Shad— 
Wick of Odessa.

*****
A man of fifty is respon­

sible for his face.
-Edwin M. Stanton.

The next time a cold 
wind slices through your 
clothes, you may wish you 
could not feel the cold at 
all. But as many as one in 
10 older people are in real 
danger because they are 
not sensitive enough to 
cold.

Sometimes older people, 
especially those over the 
age of 65, have bodily 
malfunctions that keep 
them from noticing cold 
and regulating body tem­
perature well. So when 
they stay in a consistently 
nippy atmosphere (some­
times no colder than 65 
degrees fahrenheit) for a 
long time, body tempera­
ture can drop low enough 
to be fatal from a condition 
called “ accidental hypo­
thermia.”

Since hypothermia’s 
symptoms may be similiar 
to those of some other 
diseases, no knows posi­
tively how many people die 
from it yearly. But the risk 
is very obvious because 
thermostats are going low-

V asquez Services 

Held Monday

Funeral services for 
Francisco Vasquez, 36, 
were held at 3 p.m. Mon­
day in Singleton Ellis 
Chapel of the Chimes, with 
Silbinana Rangel of Little­
field and Rev. Rocky 
Puente of Muleshoe, offi­
ciating. Burial was in the 
Amherst Cemetary, under 
the direction of Singleton 
Ellis Funeral Home.

Survivors include his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Francisco Vasquez, Sr. of 
Jaurez, Mexico; two sisters 
Mrs. Francisca Urvina and 
Mrs. Saleda Casarez, both 
of Juarez, Mexico; three 
brothers, Jorge Vasquez of 
Juarez; Esidoro Vasquez 
and Armondo Vasquez, 
both of Delicias Chihuaha, 
Mexico.
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RESEARCH ... /or the Business of Farming.

Farmers Cooperative Elevator Muleshoe 272-4666
Texas Sesame Division of Paris Milling Inc.

Muleghoe 272-4231
Frank Brothers Gene Paul Jarman

Muleshoe 923-6454 Muleshoe 965-2340

Don Bryant Muleshoe 965-2464f w

er as heating bills go up.
Instead of the often ob­

vious symptoms (such as 
hard, white, numb areas) 
that can indicate frostbite, 
hypothermia symptoms can 
mimic other diseases and 
be less obvious. Mean­
while, the victim’s body 
can slow down until un­
consciousness occurs and 
ultimately the heart stops.

Once the core of the 
body has gotten cold 
enough to be hypothermic, 
several days can pass be­
fore unconsciousness oc­
curs. In the meantime, 
symptoms may include 
bloated face, pale and 
waxy or occasionally oddly 
pink skin, trembling in one 
part of the body, slurred 
speech, dulled awareness 
and slow response. (The 
victim probably will feel 
cold only before acute hy­
pothermia occurs and not 
afterward.) Most hypo- 
themia symptoms are signs 
of other diseases so a 
physician should be con­
tacted to make an accurate 
diagnosis.

Protection against hypo­
thermia includes wearing 
warm, multi-layered cloth­
ing, especially protecting 
the head, hands and feet, 
drinking warm liquids (ex­
cept alcohol because it 
causes heat loss), proper 
nutrition, keeping the 
thermostat reasonably high 
and checking a room ther­
mometer regularly. These 
are good ideas for anyone 
but are especially impor­
tant for those older people 
whose natural warming 
methods are weakened.

Sometimes the body 
loses the ability to shiver 
and blood vessels may not 
distribute body heat prop­
erly. Losing these two nat­
ural warming methods may

be especially serious for 
the aged who often have 
less muscle mass and 
slower chemical processes, 
which are two other heat­
ing producers. To make 
matters worse, sometimes 
the aged cannot move a-

round very much to get 
warm and they do not eat 
properly so there is less 
fuel for the bodily chemical 
processes to use to make
h e a t . -------------
The face is often only a 

smooth imposter.
•Pierre Corneille.

COTTON TALKS
tkom piaiais conow o><towm iwc.

W ith the addition of three new counties in 1981, the 
Federal Crop Insurance Corporation (FCIC) for the 
first time will be offering all-risk coverage on major 
crops in all of the 25 High Plains counties represented 
by Plains Cotton Growers, Inc., Lubbock.

The three new counties, Borden, Midland and 
Motley, were added to FCIC program along with 42 
others in Texas as a part of the FCIC expansion man­
dated by the Federal Crop Insurance Act of 1980. 
Midland County has been opened for loss coverage on 
cotton only, Borden coverage will extend to cotton and 
grain sorghum, and Motley producers will be offered 
policies on cotton, grain sorghum and peanuts, accord­
ing to a local FCIC spokesman.

In other changes soybean coverage will be added in 
Lamb and Lubbock Counties in 1981, and 1982 policies 
on wheat will be available in Lamb, Lubbock, and 
Motley Counties. Also, FCIC insurance will be 
available for the first time in 1981 on dryland cotton in 
Gaines and Hale Counties. Dryland insurance is 
scheduled for six other PCG counties in 1982 and FCIC 
eventually plans to offer coverage on all dryland crops.

Premium costs for 1981 have not been released but 
the general expectation is that there will be few if any 
changes from those in effect for 1980. Premium rates 
and other actuarial details of the program as it will 
operate in “old” counties, officials say, will be released 
by December 15 of this year, but no deadline has been 
set for those counties where crops are being insured for 
the first time in 1981.

Producers, as previously reported, have three op­
tions in 1981. They can (1) insure crops against yield 
loss of 50 percent, 65 percent or 75 percent and accept 
a 30 percent premium subsidy on coverage up to the 65 
percent level, in which case they will not be eligible for 
Agricultural Stabilization and Conservation Service 
(ASCS) disaster program payments, (2) take FCIC in­
surance against loss a t any of the three levels, pay the 
entire FCIC premium and retain eligibility for disaster 
program payments, or (3) participate in the ASCS 
disaster program and take no Federal crop insurance.

There is also provision for producers to carry hail 
and fire insurance with a private company along with 
FCIC coverage of other risks, thereby earning a reduc­
tion of not less than 15 percent nor more than 30 per­

cent of the FCIC premium.
These are the general provisions of the new FCIC 

Act as now understood, all of which should be checked 
closely with area FCIC and ASCS officials before any 
producer makes final decisions.

Pioneer The Limitation of Warranty and remwjy appearing on the tobe* * P*,f ,he tef™* of sale 
is a brand name; numbers identify varieties * Regwtered trademark of Pioneer Hi Bred IntematM

The Harmon Forecast

Saturday, Nov. 22 —  Major Colleges

Arizona 28 Oregon State 7
Austin Peay 28 Arkansas State 20
Ball State 22 Indiana State 17
Baylor 23 Texas 17
Boston College 27 Massachusetts 10
Brigham Young 33 Utah 13
Brown 31 Columbia 6
Citadel 20 Furman 17
Cornell 21 Pennsylvania 7
Dartmouth 22 Princeton 20
Drake 27 Long Beach State 21
East Tennessee 21 Marshall 19
Florida State 24 Florida 7
Fullerton 21 Pacific 20
Houston 21 Texas Tech 10
Kansas State 24 Colorado 14
L.S.U. 23 Tulane 21
Maryland 24 Virginia 16
McNeese 23 SW Louisiana 13
Miami, Fla. 27 North Texas 14
Miami (Ohio) 28 Cincinnati 13
Michigan State 20 Iowa 10
Minnesota 24 Wisconsin 17
Mississippi State 24 Mississippi 20
Missouri 23 Kansas 10
Nebraska 31 Oklahoma 14
No. Carolina State 25 East Carolina 17
North Carolina 24 Duke 13
NE Louisiana 22 Louisiana Tech 21
Notre Dame 38 Air Force 7
Ohio State 21 Michigan 17
Ohio 23 Bowling Green 20
Oklahoma State 20 Iowa State 16
Oregon 17 Arizona State 13
Purdue 24 Indiana 10
Richmond 25 William & Mary 20
Rutgers 28 Colgate 10
San Diego State 23 New Mexico 22
San Jose State 24 Utah State 23
South Carolina 30 Clemson 13
South’n California 24 U.C.L.A. 15
S.M.U. 27 Arkansas 17
So. Mississippi 23 Louisville 14
Stanford 30 California 12
Syracuse 17 West Virginia 14
Temple 24 Villanova 22
Tenn.-Chattanooga 21 Vanderbilt 16
Tennessee State 37 Kentucky State 7
Tennessee 26 Kentucky 17
Texas A & M 24 T.C.U. 21
Texas-Arlington 25 Lamar 24
Toledo 22 Kent Stats 7
Tulsa 27 New Mexico State 13
Wake Forest 28 Appalachian State 17

Washington 28 Washington State 14 
West Texas 27 Southern Illinois 24
Wichita 21 Memphis State 14
Wyoming 31 Texas-EI Paso 10
Yale 22 Harvard 20

Other Games— East

Boston U.
C. W. Post
Delaware
Iona
Lehigh
R.P.I.
Wagner

33 Northeastern 
25 Kings Point 
29 Youngstown 
31 Brooklyn College 
33 Lafayette 
20 Ursinus 
27 Kean

6
7
7
0
0

16
7

Other Games— Midwest

Fort Hays 24 East’n New Mexico 23
Northern Iowa 41 Evansville 0

Other Games— South and Southwest

Abilene Christian 
Alabama A & M

22 
28

Angelo State 17
Catawba 24
Central Arkansas 34 
Eastern Kentucky 33

Howard Payne 13 
Arkansas-Pine Bluff 6
East Texas 
Lenoir-Rhyne 
Harding 
Morehead

8
15
6
8

Eton 22 Carson-Newman 14
Florida A & M 40 Delaware State 0
Fort Valley 17 Albany State 14
Henderson 22 Ouachita 20
Howard 21 Morgan State 12
J. C. Smith 26 Virginia State 13
Jackson State 23 Alcorn State 7
Jacksonville State 24 North Alabama 20
No. Carolina A & T 21 No. Carolina Cent'l 17
S. F. Austin 31 Sam Houston 12
Savannah State 24 Knoxville 6
SE Louisiana 23 NW Louisiana 10
Southern Arkansas 23 Ark.-Monticello 20
Southwest Texas 24 Texas A & 1 17
Tennessee Tech 24 Middle Tennessee 21
Texas Southern 23 Prairie View 6
Virginia Union 37 Hampton 6
Western Kentucky 23 Murray State 21
Wofford 30 Gardner-Webb 7

Other Games— Far West

Boise State 31 Idaho State 14
Cal Poly (Pomona) 21 Northridge 20
Cal Poly (S.L.O.) 33 Sacramento State 7
Hayward State 20 St. Mary's 17
Nevada-Reno 22 Idaho 21
Portland State 27 Weber State 17
Simon Fraser 28 West’n Washington 7

Presented By:

Texas Sesame



Gwu) Special

Brown & Serve Soft N' Lite

1 lb. Can Tin 

Maxwell House

Double Gunn Bros. 
Stamp* Every 

Wedno*,Uly
And Saturday.

%/

WE WELCOME
USDA

foodstamp
E O l t O N s

^  CASHWA Y
' .. We Reserve The Right To Limit Quantitips

7:30 a.m. til 9 :00  p.m. 

MONDAY - SATURDAY

Open On StffTclay 
12:00 p.m. to 8:00 p.m.

COSt TO 
CASHWAY 
FOR YOUR 
WKCAR» 

PURCHASE

Page 10, Muleshoe Journal, Muleshoe, Texas, Thursday, November 20, 1980

wo.300 Lan ocean spray nnoie Berry A “f<t

Cranberry Sauce..........
No. 303 Can Del Monte *

Pumpkin... ...........
12 oz. Pkg. Baker's C m O o

Chocolate Chips........ *129
16 ox. Pka. Dromedary c < o g

Pitted Dates ”
No. 303 Can PHncelb a  / A Q 4
Yams ? /9 8
2 lb. Bag Imperial *r%

Powdered Sugar...... *149
7 oz. Box Kellogg's ,

Croutettes 69*
14 oz. Pkg. Shari Almond *  .

Bark Chips *169
1 5%  Can White Swan
Chunks-Sliced or Crushed i| A  (t

Pineapple 9 "
No. 303 Can White Swan

Peach Halves 59*
14 oz. Can Swansons

Beef Broth 29*
No. 303 Can White Swan All

Green Asparagus......... 79
No. 303 Can White Swan

Sliced Beets............... .39*
No. 303 Can White Swan -

Fruit Cocktail.............. 59
lOoz.Pkg. Pecos Valley

Shelled Pecans............$1 "
7 oz. Jar Krafts

Marshmallow Creme...55*

Family Pride Grade "A ” Self Basting

Turkeys Pwuce Specials

Have A Happy Thanksgiving Day To You & Your 
Family From The T.R. White Family &  Employees

W e a l  S p e c i a l

Cash way Has A Good
Selections Of Swift Grade 

“A ”Butterball Deep
Basted Turkeys -Norbest 

And Honeysuckle 
White Turkeys

Hams *  1 °

Hormel's Super Select Family Pack ±

Porit C h o p s *139.
Hormel's Super Select - (Center Cut) £  «  /  q

Pork Chops *169»
Peyton's Hickory Smoked Whole a .  a a

Hams *129 *
Peyton's Hickory Smoked (Butt End) ^

Hams $129 e
Peyton's Hickory Smoked Sliced m  A Q

Breakfast Hams 1
________________

f c

1

Washington Golden Delecious

Apples
California Green Pascal-Stalk

Celery
Colorado All Purpose (10 lb. Bag) ^  _

Potatoes......... *1
Eastern New Mexico Golden

Sweet Potatoes..37 ib.
Texas Yellow Sweet

Onions 19* a.

No. 303 Can White Swan Golden

Kernel Com

«

Dnmj And Ftejew Fo

Pet Ritz's (Pkg of 2)

8 oz.. Ctn. Birdseye f

Cool Whip 69*
20 oz. Pkg. Banquet _  _

Pumpkin Pie........79*
20 oz. Pkg. Banquet Mince

Meat Pin 79*
Vi Gal Ctn. Borden's t  <i 1 o

Buttermilk 1
8 oz. Ctn. Borden's

Whipping Cream..... 2 /98 *
8 oz. Ctn. Borden's

Sour Cream........... ? /9 8
8 oz. Ctn Borden's

Dips..CTpurChoke).............. 2/98*

8 oz. Pkg. Philadelphia

Cream Cheese........ 89*
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Dtadliae for Classified Ads Is 
Tuesdays And

M

CLASSIFIED RATES 
1st Insertion,

Per Word-S. 15 
Minimum Charge- 

$2.00
2nd Insertion,
Per word-S. 13 
3rd Insertion.

Per W ords. 10 
Minimum Charge 

-SI .  80
1/3 Cheaper to run

Classifieds 3 times or more 
CARD OF THANKS 

25 words-$3 
Over 25 words 

charged at regular 
classified rates 

Classified Display- 
Si. 55 per column inch 

Double Rate for 
Blind Ads 

DEADLINE FOR 
INSERTION 

11a.m. Tues. forThurs. 
11 a. m. Fri. for Sun. 
WE RESERVE THE 

RIGHT TO CLASSIFY 
REVISE OR REJECT 

A N Y AD.
NOT RESPONSIBLE 
FOR AN Y ERROR 

AFTER AD HAS RUN 
ONCE.

**********************

1. PERSONALS

Have Brush - Will Paint 
Call Charles Harvey 

272-4059 
l-47t-8tc

NOTICE: Needmore Cafe 
is now open for business. 
l-46s-2tc

$$ TOP DOLLAR SS 
Cash paid for GOLD Rings, 
Sterling Silver, diamonds, 
Coins, Stereo Equipment, 
CB’s, TV’s, Tapes. Knives, 
Ski Equipment, anything of 
value. BENBROOK DIS­
COUNT TRADING CO. in 
VILLAGE behind VILLAGE 
BARBER SHOP, 7th and 
Main 505-762-0111, Clovis,- 
New Mexico. 
l-38s-tfc

WE BUY
USED FURNITURE AND 

APPLIANCES 
CALL 272-3030 

« HARVEY BASS 
APPLIANCE

i J S H fc ----------------------- -

Watch This Space

December 3

For Announcement

Concerning 39

Public Notice
CONTRACTORS’ NOTICE 

OF TEXAS HIGHWAY 
CONSTRUCTION 

Sealed proposals for con­
structing 121.181 miles of 
Seal Coat

Locations throughout 
District 5 on Highway No. 
US 84, US 87, US 70, US 
b2, US 180. SH 194, FM 
54, SH 83, & FM 378, 
covered by CSB 52-5-24, 
CSB 53-4-30, CSB 53-5-36, 
CSB 68-1-29. CSB 451-1-18 
CSB 294-1-21, CSB 294- 
2-13, CSB 439-4-13, CSB 
439-5-13, CSB 563-4-9, 
CSB 563-5-7, CSB 583-1-7 
and CSB 970-2-11 
in Lamb, Garza, Lubbock, 
Bailey, Gaines, Hale, 
Yoakum and Floyd County, 
will be received at the 
State Department of High­
ways and Public Transpor­
tation, Austin, until 9:00 
a.m. December 4, 1980 and 
then publicly opened and 
read.
Plans and specifications 
including minimum wage 
rates as provided by Law 
are available at the office 
of William M. Pope, Resi­
dent Engineer, Lubbock, 
Texas, and State Depart­
ment of Highways and 
Public Transportation, 
Austin.
Usual rights reserved. 
l-47t-2ttc

**••*••*••«*******••**
3. HELP WANTED 

* • * •«**•*• * **•**•„«**■**
HELP WANTED: Waitress 
Muleshoe Country Club. 
3-46t-tfc

Distributor needed for Clo­
vis News Journal in Mule­
shoe. Home delivery and 
racks. Excellent job for 
retired person or young 
adult. Ir interested, call 
circulation department col­
lect 505-763-3431.
3-44s-tfc

The Texas Migrant Council 
is accepting applications for 
Center-Director.
Call 272-3992
3-35s-tfc

NEEDED: Police Radio 
Dispatcher. Must be neat 
in appearance with ability 
to meet the public. Must 
be able to type 40 wpm, 
accurately. Must be high 
school graduate or equiv­
alent. Must be at least 19 
years of age. Past back­
ground will be investigated 
to determine moral 
character. Some knowledge 
of office procedure neces­
sary. Must be willing to 
work shifts 8-4; 4-12 and 
12-8. Must have the ability 
to handle stress situations 
as they arise. Must have 
clear and concise voice 
when operating telephone 
and police radio. Good 
fringe benefits and retire­
ment. Applications will be 
accepted until December 
15. We are an equal 
opportunity employer. Ap­
plications will be accepted 
from both male and female 
applicants. Contact Mule­
shoe City Police Chief 
Johnny Richards at 
272-4304.
3-47t-7tc

SMALLWOOD 
REAL ESTATE 

232 Main 272-4838 
Joe and Ricky 

Smallwood
96 acres, 3 miles north­
west of Muleshoe, elec­
tric circular sprinkler. 
Will take house in trade.

160 acre farm, 7 miles 
northwest of Muleshoe, 
2 wells, house, hay 
barn. $30,000.00 down 
payment.

160 acre farm, 5 miles 
from Muleshoe on 1760. 
2 wells, water drive 
Valley Sprinkler.

2 bedroom, 1 bath, 1 car 
garage, west of Rich­
land Hills School.

If you want to sell, see 
or call Joe or Ricky. 
8-43s-tfc

I4 7t-5tc

Public Notice
PUBLIC NOTICE 

Public Notice is hereby 
given that a copy of RE­
PORT RC-9C as filed with 
■he of of Revenue Sharing, 
which reports details the 
budgeting and expenditure 
°f Revenue Sharing monies 
for 1979. together with 
other information regard­
ing expenditures of County 
monies, is on file in the 
County Judge’s Office, and 
may be examined at any- 
time by any interested
Person.

Signed November 12. 
1980.

(St Glen Williams 
Glen Williams 
County Judge

Bailey, County, Texas 
1 47<-ltc

Make Money At Home 
Creating clothes, needle­
work, toys for boys and 
girls.
SB ADR A S CREATIONS 

965-2622
3-43t-tfc

Unlimited opportunity, sal- 
arv negotiable for shop 
foreman, parts person and

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom 
brick home, double garage, 
2 baths, fireplace, lots of 
built-ins on 5 acres, well 
and sprinkler system. 2'/i 
miles north of Muleshoe 
272-5195.
8-44s-tfc

FOR SALE: Lot #6 Block #8 
Pool Addition, replat. 125 X 
75, 600 block facing Ave. K 
Call 272-4536.

allto machinist. Truck and 
tractor shop in West Texas 
tovin.Reply to Box 449, 
Muleshoe. Texas 79347. 
3.40t-l5tc

KREBBS 
REAL ESTATE 
122 W. Ave. C 
Ph. 272-3191

Seaffltrcss needed. Good 
positions for qualified
ladies-! Ful1 or Part ,ime‘ 
Contact Charlie's Originals
2 7 7-5180 for more informa­

tion 1 
3-4l'-fc

Nice 3 bedroom home 
in country for rent or 
lease.
Good 80 acre irrigated 
farm, close in.
160 acre farm, new 
circle sprinkler.

H tlp \ WANTED: 2 Way 
rJ '°  a f  Muleshoe Inc. has 
job tippings now for two 
Jjns(a|lJtion and general 
H^jntwance personnel. 
App|y In person at 319 E. 
A#(ridun Blvd.
3^ . 4 c

Have grazing ready fot 
calves.
3 bedroom house with 
10 acres.

Good 150 acres irriga 
led, new circle sprinklei 

Your Listings 
Are Appreciated 

8-47t-lfc

.......
Stm1** P  bedroom ,railers 
, r rent Ranch House 
0 e tf2 -4 2 b l.
4.4 f c W _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _

.bsence sharpens love; 
pyesence strengthens

5 -Scottish Proverb.

Need to lease wheat pas­
ture for 500 calves. Call 
Benny Splawn 272-4327 af­
ter 5:00.
7-43s-8tc

* * * *
Optimism is more im­

portant to business than 
cash is to buyers.

TOWN and 
COUNTRY

REAL ESTATE

3 bedroom brick, double 
garage, 2 bath. 1916 W. 
Ave. H. $55,000.

3 bedroom, brick, single 
garage, 2 bath, new 
paint and carpet. 1920 
W. Ave. E. $38,500.

3 or 4 bedroom. Car 
port, 2 bath, stucco. 518 
W. 7th St. $35,000.

Richland Hills lot. 103 
foot, front on West Ave. 
H.

8-35t-tfc

FARMI RANCHES HOME!
JO H N W . S M ITH , Broker

106 272-4671

Quiet country living, but 
still close to town. 3 bed­
room house on one acre. 
Call 965-2488 after 7 p.m. 
8-40s-tfc

FOR SALE: Americana 14 
x 72 mobile home. 2 bed­
room, 2 bath - low equity. 
Take up payments. Call 
272-4406.
8-46s-4tp
----------------------------------------------------------------- 4.

FOR SALE: 80 acres, irri­
gated. 2 '/ j  miles northwest 
of Muleshoe. Phone 
272-3658 or 272-5578. 
8-42s-tfc

We want your business.
REMEMBER 

REID REAL ESTATE 
THURSIE REID 

272-3142
OR **

George Nieman 
965-2488 

OR
Dianne Nieman 

965-2488 
OR

Lucille Harp 
272-4693 

8-19s-ttfc

SUDDERTH 
REALTY INC.

Box 627 
109 Fifth St. 

Farwell. Texas 79325 
Phone [806] 481-3288 

or 481-9149

160 acres northwest of 
Muleshoe, 2 wells, lays 
good on FM highway.

320 acres irrigated with 
2 electric wells and. 
circles all wheat, fenced 
excellent water area. 
Near Bovina Feeders.

160 acres irrigated, cir­
cle sprink'^. 2 wells, 
200 ft. plus 3
bedre louse, new 
steel barn, on highway 
northwest of Muleshoe.

320 acres Bailey County-1 
2 circle sprinklers. Four 
8” and one 6” wells. 12 
miles west of Muleshoe 
on FM highway 1760. 
Lay excellent.

1285 acres, circle 
sprinklers, 7-8 inch 
wells, corrals and feed 
pens, trailer house. 
Priced to sell. Owner 
will finance. 29 percent 
down or will take cash.

60acres east of Mule­
shoe. One 8” well Mile 
row sprinkler, 3 small 
barns, all irrigation e- 
quipment goes. Priced 
to sell.

320 acres near Lazbud- 
die, excellent water 
area, 2 ■ veils and 
one 6‘ i d *  without 
pump. *Tne leased cir­
cular sprinkler. Priced 
for immediate sale. 
8-38t-tfc

For all your real estate 
needs call:

GLAZE A GOFORTH 
112 Ave. C 
272-4208

...................

9. AUTOMOBI LES 
FOR SALE

********»*********A**4 .
1979 Chevrolet van, 13,000 
miles. Take up payments. 
Call 272-3159 or 272-4818. 
9-45s-tfc

FOR SALE: Good clean 
1977 Chev. Bonanza pickup 
Big 10 pack, loaded, 47,000 
miles, ready to go. Cal! Bill 
Darnell 272-4825.
9-46s-tfc

FOR SALE: 1979 Rock- 
wood fold out camper, like 
new condition - includes 
heater, 2 propane tanks, 
battery, 1800 watts porta­
ble generator. 272-3881. 
9-45s-tfc

F01 Sale: 1980 MGB 
Sports Car, 11,300 miles, 
Good Shape. Will Sell for 
Pay off, $64,00.00 
272-4321 8-6 Tues-Sat. 
9-45t-6tp

11. FOR SALE 
OR TRADE

•AM .*.*1**.* ********* *f *
FOR SALE: Full blooded 
cocker spaniel. Call Jama 
Brown 272-4006 ' or
272-5487.
1 l-46t-2tc

FOR SALE BY OWNER 
Used 14X75 Astro Mobile 
Home to be moved. 2 
bedroom, 1 3/4 bath and 
fireplace. Call 806-825-26 [8 

. llJ8s-tfc

FOR SALE 1978 Yamaha 
Enduro 100, good condition 
Call 272-4759 after 5 p.m.
1 l-45s-tfc
**********************

12. HOUSEHOLD GOODS

BURROWS 
UPHOLSTERY AND 
FURNI TURE REPAIR 

118 W.  Ave.  C 
In the re a r  

Phone  272-4255 
12-39s-tfc

FOR SALE: Kirby vacuum 
cleaner and attachments. 
Call 272-3881.
12-46s-tfc

Recliner chair - good con­
dition - $95.00 272-5289. 
12-46s-4tc

FOR SALE: Twin bedroom 
suit with new box springs 
and mattress. Call
965-2496.
12-47t-4tc

Surplus Jeep value $3196.. 
sold for $44. Call 312- 
742-1142 ext. 794 for in­
formation on how to pur­
chase bargains like this. 
12-47t-4tp

**********************

15. MISCELLANEOUS

FRANKS
REFRIGERATION

AND
APPLIANCE SERVICE 
315 W. 3rd. Muleshoe 

Phone 272-3822 
15-4lt-l6tp

FRESH HONEY FOR SALE 
Nick Landers 

334 W. Ave. J  
Muleshoe, Texas 

272-3096 
l5-33s-tfc

GREYHOUNDS FOR SALE 
Coyotes and rabbit dogs. 
Phone Delton nr Richard 
Finney in Tulia 995-2100 or 
995-3854. 
l5-43s-8tc

Everyone is a fool at 
some stage of life

Three Way 
N e w s

By Mrs. H.W. Garvin

Mrs. Perry Lynskey un­
derwent major surgery in 
West Plains Medical Cen­
ter Monday.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Marvin 

Long from Amarillo spent 
the weekend with the S.G. 
Longs.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. H. C. 

Toombs and Mrs. Janie 
Self and girls were in 
Lubbock Saturday shop­
ping.

*****
Naomi Julian underwent 

surgery in the Methodist 
Hospital in Lubbock

------------. . . . . . . . . --------
Own your own jean shop; 

go direct - no middle man. 
no salesman’s fee. of­
fering all the nationally 
known brands such as Jor- 
dache, Vanderbilt. Calvin 
Klein, Sedgefield, Levi and 
over 70 other brands. 
$14,500.00 includes begin­
ning inventory, airfare for 
one to our national ware­
house, training, fixtures 
and Grand Opening Pro­
motions. Call Mr. Loughlin 
at Mademoiselle Fashions 
612-835-1304.
!5-46t-ltc

Want a propane system? 
Check with SMITH LP-GAS 
MULESHOE.
15-30s-tfc
................................. ........

WANT YOUR OLD 
BRICKS HAULED OFF?, 
Youth activities needs 
bricks for the miniature golf 
course, will pick up 1 to 100 
or more. To donate, call 
272-4051 or 272-4536. 
15-26t-tfc

Wednesday.
*****

The Three Way High 
School football team played 
Texline at Texline Friday 
night, with Three Way 
winning the game.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. W. H. 

Eubanks from Lubbock 
were at Maple Tuesday 
visiting.

*****
Several farmers in the 

Three Way Community are 
finished with the grain and 
cotton harvest. Crops were 
very poor here.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Clarence 

Benton from Stamford 
spent part of last week 
visiting his daughter, the 
Rayford Mastens.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. George 

Tyson visited their daugh­

ter, the Tommy Durhams, 
in Lubbock Thursday
afternoon.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. S. G. 

Long visited Mrs. H.W.
Garvin Sunday evening. 

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Pete 

Tarlton, Mr. and Mrs. 
Adolph Witther, Mr. and 
Mrs. Bill Dolle and Mr. 
and Mrs. J.W.Tyson at­
tended the Co-op mana­
gers and board members 
monthly dinner in Lubbock 
Thursday evening. The 
dinner and meeting was 
sponsored by Lubbock 
Co-ops.

*****

Mr. and Mrs. Larry 
Flowers and daughter from 
Missouri spent the past 
week visiting her parents, 
the Adolph Wittners.

HEEDED:
BODY TECHNICIAN

EXPERIENCED IN ALL PIUSES
XUTO BODY A PAINT WORK. 

EXCELLENT WORKINR CONDITIONS. 
INSURANCE RENEFITS. PAID 

VACATION

DOG STEWART
CHEVROLET BURR

2500 MABRY DR.
CLOVIS, N .M .
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RESEARCH ... for the Business of Farming.

Texas Sesame Division Of Paris Milling Inc.
Muleshoe 272-12M

Frank Brothers
Muleshoe 925-6454

(rptie Paul Jarman Don Bryan t
Muleshoe 965-2540 Muleshoe 965-2464
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The Speaker

by BUI Clayton
AUSTIN— In continuing

with its review of our state 
agencies, the Sunset Ad­
visory Commission has con­
sidered proposed legislation 
on ten of the 28 agencies 
under review this biennium. 
Legislation adopted by the 
commission will be brought 
before the 67th session of 
the Legislature for final dis­
cussion and votes beginning 
in January.

Of the ten agencies con­
sidered, the commission de­
ferred action on three. 
These agencies included the 
Board of Polygraph Exam­
iners, the Veterans Affairs 
Commission and the Water 
Well Drillers Board. The 
Sunset Commission tenta­
tively approved proposed 
action on the remaining 
seven agencies.

With regaro to the first of 
these, the Board of Tuber­
culosis Nurses Examiners, 
the Commission recom ­
mended the abolition of this 
agency and its functions. 
The board has not m et in 
four years and the small 
number of tuberculosis 
nurses who continue to work 
in Texas today will not lose 
their jobs or their clas­
sifications if the agency is 
indeed abolished.

Legislation accepted  by 
the Sunset Commission re­
garding the Civil Air Patrol 
calls for an abolition of the 
agency and the transfer of 
its sta tu to ry  function of 
providing assistance to pri­
vate aviators flying search 
and rescue operations to the 
Governor's Division o f Dis­
a s te r  Emergency Services. 
While the s ta te  has not pro­
vided funds in the past to 
reimburse the cost of such 
ac tiv ities, this approach

would give the Governor's 
Division of Emergency 
Services the authority to re­
ceive and disburse state ap­
propriations for this purpose 
should the Legislature 
decide to provide funds in 
the future.

Another agency recom­
mended for abolishment is 
the Fleet Admiral Chester 
W. Nimitz Museum Com­
mission. Created in 1969, 
this agency was designed to 
foster and commemorate 
the era of supreme United 
States naval power. To con 
tinue with this effort, the 
functions of the commission 
would be transferred to the 
Texas Parks and Wildlife 
Department upon approval 
of the Legislature.

The Texas Aeronautics 
Commission is one agency 
which the Sunset Com­
mission recommended be 
maintained. In addition, 
nine modifying points were 
recommended regarding the 
functions of the agency. 
Such a plan calls for the 
continuation of this in­
dependent commission in its 
present capacity to perform 
regulatory, advisory and air­
port development functions.

Also accepted in its 
present form but with 
certain modifications being 
numerated is the State 
Board of Registration for 
Professional Engineers. The 
need for such an agency was 
made quite evident by the 
explosion and collapse of 
the New London School in 
1937. Today the board 
regulates over 34,000 
licensees from across the 
state.

The State Board of Lib­
rary Examiners is another
agency recommended for 
abolishment by the Sunset 
Commission. Under the 
recommended provisions, 
the administrative functions 
of this agency would be 
transferred to the Library 
and Archives Commission.

The Texas State Board of 
Plumbing Examiners was 
recommended to be main­
tained with certain mod­
ifications. These modifying 
points include placing the 
agency funds in the State 
Treasury and amending the 
statute to accept licenses

form other states on an en­
dorsement basis.

While these recom­
mendations represent only a 
snail portion of the massive 
arfiount of work currently 
being done by the Sunset 
Commission, they do point 
up two important aspects of 
the development of the Sun­
set process in Texas. First, 
the Legislature is being of­
fered a positive approach 
for changing state opera­
tions that is much wider 
than the limiting alterna­
tives to either abolish or 
continue. Through the Sun­
set process, needed changes 
can be made to improve 
both the way services are 
offered and the organi­
zational structure through 
which they are offered. 
Second, the Legislature has 
a means by wnich in­
formative operating stand­
ards can be developed and 
required of all agencies, 
thus increasing agency ef­
ficiency and effectiveness 
which will ultimately bene­
fit the entire citizenry of 
the State of Texas.

Elementary schools 
could use more men, 
educator believes

COLLEGE STATION — 
The lack of male teachers in 
elementary grades may be 
causing developmental prob­
lems for young boys, believes a 
Texas A&M University educa­
tional specialist.

Tom Savage, associate pro­
fessor of curriculum and in­
struction, said educational ex­
perts are becoming alarmed 
about the small number of men 
becoming elementary teachers.

Savage worries that boys see 
teaching, and possibly school, 
as a female task.

Savage said elem entary 
teaching always has been 
dominated by women teachers, 
but the dominance is becoming 
more pronounced.

In 1975, he said, the national 
norm of male teachers in 
elementary education was 12 
percent. In Texas, he said, of 
71,000 elementary teachers on­
ly 6,800 — or less than 10 
percent — are men.

G. William Miller, Treas­
ury Secretary, on ris­
ing interest rates:
"If it continues for 

very long, it would tend to 
discourage the recovery.”

Winter Driving 
Creates Problems

Winter driving problems 
can slip up on you even in 
a Sunbelt state such as 
Texas.

One of the most dan­
gerous conditions is glaze 
ice, the Texas Medical As­
sociation warns. This 
glass-slick ice layer is al­
most undetectable until 
sliding starts.

One way to get a feel for 
the road is to tap the 
brakes or gas pedal and 
see what minor response 
occurs. This technique has 
its own hazards so it 
should be done only when 
slickness is not obvious 
and there are not other

vehicles or other hazards 
around. Watching other 
vehicles’ response to the 
road is another good indi­
cator of conditions, 
especially if you allow e- 
nough space to adjust your 
driving for their errors.

Once slick conditions do 
occur, pumping the brakes 
is better than jamming 
them on to avoid chains 
and snow tires also can 
help handle slick condi­
tions but not many people 
have such equipment so 
they must depend on good 
tread on ordinary tires 
(which is very important in 
slick conditions). Texans

[CALENDAR OF EVENTS
MONDAY

12 p.m. Jaycees, XIT Restaurant (every)
3:45 p.m. P.T.A. Mary DeShazo or Richland Hills School 
Cafeteria (second)
7:30 p.m. Rainbows, Masonic Hall (second & fourth)
8 p.m. Fine Arts Boosters, Band Hall

TUESDAY
12 p.m. Rotary, Civic Center (every)
2 p.m. Art Association, Muleshoe State Bank (second)
7:30 p.m. O.E.S., Masonic Hall (first)
7:30 p.m. Progress 4-H, West Camp Community Center 
(third) ,
7:30 p.m. llano Estacado (second)
8 p.m. Athletic Boosters, Muleshoe High School Cafeteria 

WEDNESDAY 
12 p.m. Lions, Civic Center (every)

THURSDAY
'11:30 a.m. W.O.T.S. (every)
, 12 p.m. Optimist, Corral Restaurant (every)
'2 p.m. Hobby Club, Mulqshoe State Bank (first & third) 
[6:30 p.m. T.O.P.S.. Bai|ey County Electric Community 
Room (every)
7:30 p.m. Odd Fellows, Odd Fellows Hall (every) 

JSRIDAY
11:30 a.m. A.A.R.P., Civic Center (fourth)
6:30 p.m. Kiwanis. Corral Restaurant (every)

SATURDAY
7 p.m. Muleshoe Singing Group. Trinity Baptist Church 
(every)

If you would like your club or organization listed on the 
| calendar of events, please furnish the information in with 

your report.

also rely heavily on caution 
slow speeds and possibly 
hazardous ideas such as 
putting extra weight in the 
trunk of cars ihat need it.

Some authorities say this 
traction-gaining technique 
is dangerous because a 
collision could throw the 
weight forward wiih dan­
gerous force. Others say 
putting some weight such 
as sand or salt is safe when 
place over the rear axle 
and tied so containers will 
rip open quickly in a col­
lision.

If the car rear end does 
start to slide despite all 
precautions, turn the front 
wheels to adjust. For in­
stance, if the rear slides to 
the right, turn the front 
wheels to the right and

resist the temptation to 
lock the brakes. In a crisis 
seat belts are more impor­
tant than ever because 
they hold you in place so 
you caii control the car 
better and protect you in a 
collision.

If a mishap does occur, it 
is a good idea to have some 
warm clothes in the car, 
TMA says. Even if you are 
just driving in town, 
having t.t least a coat and 
good shoes can come in 
handy while handling 
problems ranging from 
collisions to flat tires.

Helmut Schmidt, Chan­
cellor, West Germany, 
after defeating Franz 
Josef Strauss:
"I will still have a 

place in West German 
politics."
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We can all beat 

inflation ifwe just use our 
dolars and sense.
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- Come Early 
For

Best Selections & Good Savings

Wooley 
; International, Inc.
I W.Hwy.84 272-5514

I
if

f

*•

#

Shop Rite Puts Magic In Your Holiday Shopping

f
EXTRA S & H 
GREEN STAMPS

M

/
Vs*
A

V  V

A  »

! /

Holiday Magic - 2 Big Weeks OF BONUS COUPONS LEFT
Redoom These Coupons During The Next 2 Weeks!

Coupons Below May Be Redeemed Between Nov. 28 &  Dec. 3 . 1 9 8 0

•A>J-M
A \

t i

10 0
EXTRA

STAMPS

I

I
I

II 
II 
II

With This Coupon And 
$10 Purchase or Moro 

(excluding item* prohibited by low). I I  
Limit ono coupon por family

i i  
i i  
i i  
ii

Coupon Good 
Thru Doc 3. 1M0

100 
EXTRA 

STAMPS
With Thla Coupon 
and Purchase of

1-gal. jug

HOMO
M ILK

Coupon Qood 
Thru Doc ]. 1PM

100
EXTRA

STAMPS
With This Coupon 
and Purchase of

25-lb. bag Gravy Train

DOG
FOOD

Coupon Good 
Thru Doc. 3. 1190

II
II
II
II
II
II
II
II
II
II

100
EXTRA

STAMPS
With This Coupon 
and Purchase of

32-oz. jar

H E LLM A N N ’S
M AYO N N AIS E

Coupon Good 
Thru Doc. 3, 1980

I
I
I

II 
II 
II 
II 
II 
II 
II 
II 
II 
II 
II 
II

50
EXTRA

STAMPS
With This Coupon 
and Purchase ot

16-oz. Mini or Jata

K R AFT
M ARSHM ALLOW S

Coupon Good 
Thru Doc. 3. 1990

50
EXTRA

STAMPS

jJv7|
■ . m p s J

V

With This Coupon 
and Purchase of

32-oz. pkg. Banc‘J' t

FRIED
CHICKEN

CpuepeOtad
Thru Due. *, 1M0

N L -  

v t - .
4 ^ *

Coupons Below May Be Redeemed Between Nov. 20 & Nov. 26* 1980

*5 «
• O

# /
• s \

\ V .

r  / \  *
9 •9 9
'*■r-y, v*

4 • f 0

9 4 O 
8 *

r  1

10 0
EXTfeA 

STAMPS

With This Coupon And 
t10 Purchase or Moro

I Items prohibited hy law). || 
Limit one coupon por family. ||

II
II
II

Coupon Oppd j j

. - I I .
Thru Her. M  <*M

10 0  
EXTRA 

STAMPS
With This Coupon 
and Purchase of

12-oz.can

LUNC H EON
SPAM
Coupon Quod 

Thru He* M , IM S

I
I
I

II 
II 
II 
II 
II 
II 
II 
II 
II 
II 
II 
II

10 0
EXTRA

STAMPS
With This Coupon 
and Purchase ot

5-lb. bag

6 0 L D M E D A L  
FLO U R
CcupcnOeod 

Thru Nov. 29.1990

I
I
I

II 
II 
II 
II 
II 
II 
II 
II 
II 
II 
II 
I I

10 0
EXTRA 

STAMPS
With This Coupon 
and Purchase of

200-ct. Kleenex 
White A Aaat.

FACIAL
TIS SU E

Coupon Qood 
Thru No. J#, IS M

50
EXTRA 

STAMPS
With This Coupon 
and Purchase ol

1-doz.

LA R G E
EGGS

Coupon Oood 
Thru Nor. M, «M

I
II  
II 
II 
II 
II 
II 
II 
II 
II 
II 
II 
II

50
EXTRA 

STAMPS
With This Coupon 
and Purchase ol

2-lb. pkg. Kraft

V ELV EE T A
C H EES E

Coupon Qpod 
Thru Mo.. M, 1SS0

Extra Stamps Fill Books & Booklets Faster. . .  Redeem for Food or Gifts!
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