
Farm Leaders 
Take Action 
On Problems

At the regular meeting of the 
Sherman County Farm Bureau 
Tuesday, eighteen farm leaders re­
presenting the various communi­
ties expressed much concern about 
current agricultural problems in 
the county.

R. C. Buckles reported that at 
the national spring wheat confer­
ence held at Omaha, Nebraska, re­
cently, recommenda^iions were 
made for a wheat program based 
on a two price system and acreage 
control. The national leaders at­
tending the meeting represented 
all major wheat producing states. 
They expressed a desire for each 
state to be given an opportunity 
to work out their own program as 
the different wheat areas produce 
various types of wheat which are 
not sold under the same market­
ing classes. The northwestern 
states for example produce wheat 
with low food qualities used pri­
marily for feeding livestock and 
have to import wheat from other 
areas to mix with the local grain 

'in  order to sell for food consumj)- 
tion. To protect the northwest­
ern wheat producers, any basic 
price for wheat loan would require 
a two price system; one for feed 
wheat and another for milling and 
baking wheat. Mr. Buckles point­
ed to the research work being done 
on using grains for the production 
of commercial alcohol to be used 
in the making of rubber and fuel 
for tractors and automobiles, in 
addition to the many feed products 
as having great possibilities for de­
velopment of future markets with 
better prices for farm products.

Otis Bryant, E. W. Carter, and W. 
T. Crabtree were selected to head 
the weed control program in this 
county. This committee will also 
represent Sherman County at the 
Amarillo meeting April 15 when a 
Panhandle wide noxious weed con­
trol program will be completed.

The Sherman County Farm Bu­
reau "will sponsor one 4-H club boy 
to attend the state 4-H Club 
Round-Up to be held in College 
Station this fall.

Sam Wohlford presented the 
problem of re-evaluation of land 
for taxation in Sherman County to 
the group which produced some 
very interesting discussion on the 
problem of taxation in general in 
the county.
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P-TA Box Supper 
Announced For 
April 18th

A box supper sponsored by the 
Parent-Teacher Association will be 
given in the school gymnasium 
Friday night, April 18, at 7:30 P. M.

A third of the proceeds will be 
used to defray expenses of the high 
school band on its trips to Guymon 
and Pampa.

Ladies, grade school and high 
school girls are invited to bring 
boxes. The boxes will be segre­
gated in order that grade school 
boys, high school boys, and adults 
will buy boxes pepared by ladies 
and girls of their own age.

Lloyd Johnson and Van B. Bos­
ton will auction the boxes.

P-TA Met 
In Regular 
Session Monday

“Food is most important in 
building better bodies,” said Mrs. 
Earl Bond, at the regular meeting 
o f the Stratford P-TA in the school 
auditorium Monday afternoon. 
“ Health, mental and physical, is a 
means to an end, to happier and 
more efficient living” continued 
Mrs. Bond.

Mrs. A. L. King presided.
Mrs. A. H. Dawson presented 13 

o f her pupils in four dance num­
bers.

Mrs. Wendell Flores reported 
purchase of sheets and spreads for 
day bed used by children who be­
come ill in the gracfe building, and 
also a first aid kit. v

Mrs. Ben Biddy ann6unced a Box 
Supper to be held in the school 
gymnasium, Friday, April 18 to 
raise funds for the P-TA and the 
band.

Mrs. Glen Reed, Mrs. A. L. King, 
and Mrs. H. Folsom were elected as 
a  nominating committee.

Room count was won by the fifth 
grade.
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Let Contract 
For Construction 
Of Legion Building

Contacts have been let for the 
constuction of the American Le­
gion and Masonic Lodge two-story 
steel and brick 40x120 foot building 
to be erected across the street 
northwest of the City Hall.

Actual work is expected to start 
within a few days, as the only de­
lay anticipated is the arrival of a 
ditching machine for excavation 
work necessary for the concrete 
foundation.

40 Attended 
Lions Meeting 
Monday Night

Twenty members of the Lions 
club, 16 ladies and four guests at­
tended the club banquet at the 
Palace Cafe Monday night.

Misses Dixie Lea Lasley, Billye 
Joyce Baskin, Ruby Dell Harding 
and Shela Duby furnished enter­
tainment for the evening consist­
ing of vocal and clarinet numbers.

Dumas Lions have extended an 
invitation to Stratford, Dalhart 
and Sunray clubs to attend their 
ladies night banquet to be held in 
the Dumas High School Cafeteria 
April 24.

A meeting of the zone advisory 
(Committee will be held at thiiS time.

Members from each club attend­
ing the meeting in Dumas will be 
expected to furnish a 20 minute 
entertainment program. Those 
from the local club planning to at­
tend will be asked to make reserva­
tions at the meeting of the club 
Monday night. Plates will be 
$1.50.

Mrs. Bud Coffman 
Wins Honors At 
El Paso Rodeo

Mrs. Bud Coffman, a represen­
tative of the Stratford Lions Club 
in the rodeo held at El Paso March 
25-30, has returned home with 
boots and money prize awards for 
first, second and third places dur­
ing the rodeo.

Mrs. Coffman made a leaping 
straddle for the final chair to win 
a first place prize.

Points which she won in the 
contests entitle her to the title of 
hostess, which role she will prob­
ably accept at the Amarillo rodeo.

Mrs. Mullican’s 
Grandmother Dies 
At Hereford

Mr. and Mrs. Grady Mullican 
were called to Hereford Sunday 
night by the death of Mrs. Mulli­
can’s grandmother.

Sherrod Expected 
Home This Week

H. C. Sherrod, who has re­
presented Lovelace Motor & Equip­
ment at Minneapolis-Moline meet­
ings in Kansas City, Missouri, Chi­
cago and Moline, Illinois, is expect­
ed home this week.

CARD OF THANKS
I wish to take this means of 

thanking my friends for their re­
membrances of flowers, cards and 
letters during my recent illness.

Mrs. Mynola Ross.

James Cameron 
Returned To 
Hospital

James Cameron was taken to 
Scott and White Hospital in Tem­
ple, Texas Sunday by Eugene Wil­
son and Bill Ross. Mrs. Cameron 
and Mrs. Raymond McWhirter ac­
companied the patient to Temple.

According to reports, Cameron 
underwent an operation Wednes­
day. Friends state he is suffering 
from the after effects of an at­
tack of poliomyelitis.

Baseball 
Season Opens 
May 4th

Stratford’s opening game in the 
16-team league will be played May 
4, it was announced this week. 
Stratford, Texhoma, Keyes, Four- 
Corners, Boise City, Dalhart, Du­
mas and Sunray compose the west 
half of the league.

The team has most of its equip­
ment. A dozen baseballs were 
presented to the club by the Yates 
Drug. Eighteen suits have been 
ordered.

Club strength is gaining with 
each practice. To be eligible to 
play in the league games, players 
must either make practice before 
May 1 or sit on the bench for at 
least two weeks before they will be 
eligible to play.

Seven league games will be play­
ed at home and seven games away.

Chick Raising 
To Flourish 
In County

Present purchase rate of baby 
chicks indicates Sherman County 
farms wî l produce a large number 
of chickens this year. M. H. Har­
rison reports the sale of 2,000 baby 
chicks Monday.

Improved Farm 
Practices Prevent 
Soil Blowing

The winds blow just as hard now 
as they ever did, but they don’t 
pick up so much of the topsoil 
from the land that has a sorghum 
cover crop according to R. C. 
Buckles, Chaiman of Sherman 
County’s Agricultural < Conserva­
tion Association Committee. Pro­
tected summer fallow is another 
good way to help hold the soil as 
well as to conserve a large part of 
the moisture that falls.

Both of these practices are a 
part of the 1947 Agricultural Con­
servation Program in Sherman 
County and the government is of­
fering to pay part of the cost of 
putting them into operation. Far­
mers who intend to carry out these 
practices under program provi­
sions should be sure they have 
prior approval before the practice 
is begun. This is required in or­
der that funds available in the 
county can be properly budgeted. 
The first operation on the sum­
mer fallow practice must be com­
pleted by May 2, 1947.

City Prohibits 
Parking Trucks 
On Main Street

Parking of truck with a wheel 
base exceeding 122 inches, and the 
parking of machinery on Main 
Street between the intersections of 
the Rock Island Railroad and Col­
lins Avenue, was prohibited in an 
ordinance passed by the City Coun­
cil Thursday night.

This ordinance in the interest of 
public safety is one which has been 
discussed for several years as the 
parking of large trucks on Main 
Street during harvest season has 
created a dangerous hazard.

Cars backing into the street from 
the side of a parked truck have 
been blinded from traffic until 
they were out in the driving lane, 
causing a continuous hazard to 
safety.

The safety measure taken con­
forms with regulations practiced 
in nearby towns.

Councilmen "and City Marshals 
working in cooperation with the 
Sheriff’s Office will appreciate the 
public’s cooperation in the observ­
ing of this new ordinance for the 
safety of the public in general.

Patroling officers will enforce 
the order of the council.

Stratford’s Juniqr 
Baseball Club 
Is Organized

Stratford boys between the ages 
of 10 and 15 have organized a Jun­
ior baseball club composed of 24 
boys with new enthusiasts joining 
each week.

The club will soon be in a posi­
tion to challenge the junior clubs 
in any nearby town.

Real Estate Auction 
Announced For 
April 22

W. N. Price is announcing the 
auction sale of real estate and 
mineral interests to be held on a 
yacant lot south of the courthouse 
in Stratford April 22.

Church Of Christ
M. R. Norman and A. C. Huff, 

Ministers.
Bible Classes 10:00 A. M.
Morning Services 11:00 A. M. 
Evening Services 7:30 P. M. 
Wednesday EJvening Services 

8:00 P. M.

Baptist Church
Sunday School 10:00 A. M. 
Morning Worship 11:00 A. M. 
Training Union 7:00 P. M. 
Evening Service 8:00 P. M. 

Wednesday 
W. M. S. 2:30 P. M.
Bible Study and Prayer Meeting 

7:30 P. M.
Choir Practice 8:00 P. M.

Friendship Club Met 
In Home Of Mrs. 
Raymond Borth

The Friendship Club met in the 
home of Mrs. Raymond Borth 
April 3.

The election of new officers was 
held at this time. ’The following 
officers were elected: President, 
Mrs. Robert Bolster; Vice-Presi­
dent, Mrs. Earl Smith; Secretary 
and Treasurer, Mrs. Elstel Pleyer; 
and Reporter, Mrs. Kenneth Borth. 
It was voted that the member at- 
tendng the most meetings for six 
months would receive a prize.

One new member, Mrs. Jim 
Thompson, was added to the club.

The afternoon was spent working 
for the hostess on tea towels.

Refreshments were served to the 
following members: Mesdames P. J. 
Pronger,* Jr., H. C. Borth, Robert 
Bolster, Earl Smith, Guy Campbell, 
Kenneth Borth, Estel Player, Jim 
Thompson and the hostess, Mrs. 
Raymond Borth. The club ad­
journed to meet with Mrs. Donald 
Borth April 17.

Richard’s Cash Grocery 
Will Open Business 
Saturday Morning

Mr. and Mrs. Richard Albert will 
open the doors of their new gro­
cery store located on Main Street 
at the intersection of U. S. High­
way 54 Saturday morning. The 
new firm will be known as Rich­
ard’s Cash Grocery.

McIntosh Dry Goods 
Opens Anniversary 
Sale Today

Mr. and Mrs. H. F. McIntosh are 
staging a ten day sale at the Mc­
Intosh Dry Goods in observance of 
the first anniversary of the firm 
in Stratford. The sale opens to­
day.

Ralph Salesman 
Attends Frigidaire 
Service School

Ralph Salesman is attending the 
Frigidaire service school in Fort 
Worth this week. He is preparing 
himself to service frigidaires for 
Duby Plumbing & Electric.

Inter Se Club 
Entertained By 
Mrs. Arthur Ross

The Inter Se Club members were 
entertained Thursday afternoon in 
the home of Mrs. Arthur Ross.

An enjoyable time was spent 
playing “42” , Mrs. S. J. Calvird 
receiving high score.

Visitors were Mrs. Richardson 
and Mrs. Royal Pendleton. Mem­
bers present were Mesdames Joe 
Brown, R. C. Buckles, D. L. Buckles, 
Calvird, Duby, O’Brien, Shirk, Wig- 
inton and Taylor.

Lovely refreshments were serv­
ed. Easter rabbits were given as 
favors.

Bammes Garage 
Installs Air * 
Pressure Riveter

Alfred Bammes has installed a 
hew air compression riveter in the 
Bammes Garage this week. The 
machine is especially designed for 
replacing brake linings.

* Assembly of God 
Church

Sunday School 10:00 A. M. 
Morning Worship 11:00 A. M. 
Evangelistic Service 8:00 P. M. 
Bible study and prayer meeting 

Thursday evening at 8:00 P. M.
Everyone is invited to attend 

these services.*

1J48^ License 
Tags Issued 
For County

Records at the Sheriff’s office 
reveal that 1,148 1947 license tags 
have been issued for vehicles op­
erating in Sherman County. Tags 
were issued for 610 passenger cars, 
434 farm trucks 79 commercial car­
riers, 5 truck tractors, and for 20 
truck trailers.

Erecting Church 
At Site Of Old 
Spurlock School

Excavation work has been com^ 
pleted for a basement and con­
crete walls completed for the base­
ment of a 50x32 foot 
church building to be 
erected in the Spurlock Community 
at the location of the old Spurlock 
School house. Work is being do­
nated by men of the community.

Two Fined For  ̂
Selling Liquor 
In Dry Territory

Virgil Hambleton and J. E. Walk­
er, Texhoma, arrainged before 
County Judge L. P. Hunter Sunday, 
charged with possesison of liquor 
for the purpose of sale in a dry 
area, plead guilty and were each 
fined $100.00 and costs.

Stratford Motor Co. 
Closed In Respect 
For Henry Ford

O. L. McMinn and Charles Wis­
dom are cooperating with other 
Ford dealers in closing their place 
of business today as a tribute of 
respect for the late Henry Ford.

In case of an emergency the 
firm will open its doors to be of 
service to the public.

Mrs. Pronger 
Entertains Golden 
Cross Society

The Golden Cross Society of the 
Methodist Church met all day 
Tuesday with Mrs. P. J. Pronger, 
Jr. Each guest and member 
brought a covered dish, and all en­
joyed the noon day luncheon. The 
time was spent quilting and visit­
ing, with a short program in the 
afternoon. Those present were 
Mesdames Arthur Ross, Tim Flores, 
Elliott, H. M. Brown, A. L. Harrison, 
A. E. Pronger, Dyess, McIntyre, 
Richardson, Foster and the hos­
tess, Mrs. P. J. Pronger, Jr.

Counterfeit Money; 
Forgery Increase 
Is Expected

Leo Williams, one of Texas best 
known Secret Service agents, 
stopped here for a short visit with 
old ftiends, Mr.’ and Mrs. Brown 
Ross, Monday morning.

Williams, who is chairman of the 
Texas Police Association member­
ship committee, called on local of­
ficers in his membership drive, 
and warned that counterfeit mon­
ey and forgery was on the increase.

While in the Panhandle Williams 
disposed of forgery cases in Moore 
and Hansford Counties.

First Christian Church
Sunday School 10:00 A. M. 
Morning Worship 11:00 A. M. 
Christian Endeavor 6:30 P. M. 
Evening Services 7:30 P. M.
Choir practice 8:00 P. M. Wed­

nesday.
You are always welcome at any 

and all these services.
G. M. Eastman, Pastor.

Mrs. Whatley Is 
Recovering From 
Major Operation

Mrs. Howard Whatley, wife of 
the Baptist pastor, who underwent 
a major operation at Scott and 
White Hospital in Temple, Texas 
last week, is reported to be getting 
along nicely, according to a tele­
gram received by L. P. Hunter from 
Rev. Whatley.

Boy Preacher To 
Speak Sunday Af 
Church Of Christ

Don Willingham, 13-year old 
Amarillo evangelist, will conduct 
services Sunday at the Church of 
Christ in Stratford.

The church invites the public to 
attend these services.

Tile Wall Of 
Brown’s Food Store 
Is Stuccoed

The tile wall on the southeast 
side of Brown’s Food Store building 
was stuccoed this week.

Trustees
Elected
Saturday

O. H. Ingham, Herbert Folsom, 
R. L. Baskin, and John Steel were 
elected for a term of two years as 
trustees for the Stratford Rural 
High School District in the elec­
tion Saturday.

At the meeting of the board Mon­
day night A. L. King was elected 
president and John Steel, secre­
tary.
County 'Trustees

G. L. Taylor was elected Coun­
ty Trustee-at-Large.

A. E. Pronger was elected County 
Trustee for Precinct 1.

Arthur Cartrite was elected 
County Trustee for Precinct 2.

Arthur Ross was elected County 
Trustee for Precinct 4.

Reports from the Lone Star 
Consolidated school district elec­
tion are not available.

March Of Dimes 
Helps Increase 
Polio Scientists

Floyd Keener, chairman of the 
Sherman County Chapter of the 
National Foundation for Infantile 
Paralysis, said that local contribu­
tions to the March of Dimes had 
helped make possible a huge new 
program aimed at expanding the re­
servoir of scientists trained to car­
ry on the fight against poFio.

He said the program had'just been, 
announced by national headquar­
ters of the Foundation and the Na­
tional Research Council, of Wash­
ington, D. C. It will be financed 
with $200,000 in March of Dimes 
funds and will be administered by 
the Research Council.

The Foundation grant. Keener 
said, continues support of fellow­
ships for young physicians of ex­
ceptional promise in virology, or­
thopedics and pediatrics, and will 
make possible new senior fellow­
ships in neurology and epidemio­
logy.

Asserting the new grant supple­
ments $170,000 previously allocat­
ed by the Foundation for similar 
Research Council fellowships. Mr. 
Keener said the funds were derived 
from the 50 per cent of March of 
Dimes sent to national headquar­
ters by local chapters.

The fellowships provide up to 
$6,000 annually per Fellow and up 
to $1,000 annually for labaroatory 
expenses. Most Fellows will study 
for three years at various universi­
ties throughout the country and 
some will have the opportunity to 
continue for another three years.

The local chairman said the 
Fellows would devote much of their 
time to work in the field and in 
laboratories, and would be avail­
able during polio epidemics for 
special- assignments on behalf of 
chapters of the National Founda­
tion.

The end of the war, he said, had 
released many promising young 
scientists to civil pursuits, and the 
Foundation is expanding its sup­
port of the fellowship program so 
as to harness their talents in 
fighting disease.

Best Yet Club 
Meets Friday

The Best Yet Club will meet 
Friday, April 11, at 11:30 A. M. in 
the home of Mrs. Charles Wisdom.

Mrs. Hose Flores 
To Present Pupils 
In Recital

Mrs. Hose Fiores will present her 
pupils in a piano recital at the 
school auditorium Tuesday, April 
15, at 8:00 P. M.

Those appearing on the program 
are: Donna Jeanne Bryan, Rheta 
Evelyn Cameron, Bernadeen Car­
ter, Judy Cleavinger, Dixie Lea 
Lasley, Maxine Palmer, Lelah 
Price, Cynthia Reed, Beverley 
Smith, Dolores Smith, Linda Riffe, 
Sue Ellen Flores, Timmie Lu Wil­
liams, Sherrydon Keener, Jerry 
Bob Walden and Gregg Whatley.

Mrs. Homer Smith 
To Entertain

The La Ciencia Club will meet 
in the home of Mrs. Homer Smith, 
April 17, for an all day meeting.

Methodist Church
(Rev. H. A. Nichols, Pastor) 

Sunday School 10:00 A. M. 
Sunday morning services 10:55 A. 

M.
Evening worship at 7:30 P. M. 
Junior League 6:30 P. M. 
Intermediate MYF 6:30 P. M. 
Senior MYF 6:30 P. M.
Young People’s choir practice 

Monday evening at 7:30.
W. S. C. S. Wednesday at 2:30 P. 

M.
Choir practice Wednesday night 

at 7:30.
Thursday night Intermediate 

play night 7:30 to 8:30 P. M.
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W SCS Met Wednesday/®*"'" ^opened by roll call, followed by the 
The WSCS met Wednesday in i reading of the minutes. The pres-

Wilson Funeral Directors
AM BULANCE SERVICE  

FUNERAL SERVICE

Boise City, Okla. 
Phone 31

V Stratford, Texas 
Phone 60

i

Stratford Laundry
Your Helpy Selfy Laundry

Everyone Is Welcome — And We Appreciate Your Business
W e Do, Finish Work — Wet Wash and 

Rough Dry with Flat Work Finished 
A t No Extra Charge

We do each laundry separately with the same gentle 
care that you would give your own laundry.

Give Us A Ring and We Will Pick-Up and Deliver FREE 
Mr. and Mrs. C. E. Hawkins ------------------ Phone 8

Stratford Abstract Co.
Minnie Laura Jackson, President

Incorporated 1907.-;---- 39 years of Satisfactory Service to
Sherman County Land Owners

Let Us Make Your Abstracts
WE SHOW THE RECORDS

Office on Corner of Main Street and Grand Avenue

EMERSON AND CLARION TABLE MODEL

R A D I O S
AND

QUICK W A T C H  REPAIR SERVICE
ALL WORK GUARANTEED

Burns Gem Shop
Two Doors South of Post Office

How Long Has It Been Since YouVe 
Had Your

Portrait Made?
Don’t delay any longer. Let us make 

a portrait of you that expresses your true 
personality.

Bond Studio
In Cactus Tuesday and Friday After­

noon.

IT ’S A  GOOD YE A R  TO

Start Chicks
Yes, eggs may sell for a dollar a dozen next fall, but 

you’ll have to start chicks this spring — to cash in on this 
golden opportunity.

Our advice is buy good chicks and start them right. 
Feed them------- •

PURINA CHICK STARTENA
to get them off to a flying stars ft’s America’s Favorite 
Chick Starter for Life and Growth and this year it’s the 
best Purina ever made. We have a good supply in stock. 
Come in and see us for chicks and all your chick raising 
needs.

Harrison Poultry & Feed

Used CARS
1—’42 Model 4-Door Dodge Sedan.
1—’42 Model 2-Door Dodge Sedan
These Cars are in A-1 Condition, 

fully equipped with Radios and Heaters.

Seat Covers
And

Batteries
FOR ALL TYPES OF CARS, TRUCKS  

AN D  PICK-UPS

M AGN O LIA
Wholesale and Retail Products

Garrison Motor Co.\
Y our Chrysler-Plymouth Dealer

ABSTRACTS
W E H A V E  A  COMPLETE  

ABSTR ACT PLANT
Covering All Real Estate In Sherman 

County
W e Furnish Quick, Efficient Service 

On Short Notice

Sherman County Abstract Co.
Roy«l Pendleton, Manager Stratford, Texas

Regular Session, 1937, Chapter 125, 
Page 229, by adding a new section 
of a geenral pension fund for city 
employees shall be set aside and

made a part of the Firemen’s Relief 
and Retirement Fund; and declar­
ing an emergency.”

(To be continued).

Combine Motors
And

Combines
REPAIRED

Bring your motors or machinery 
to us as early as possible and give 
us an opportunity to have it in 
good operating condition for an 
early harvest.

Marquette Home 
Freezers

8 and 16 Foot Sizes

BAMMES GARAGE
ident, Mrs. Blanck, was unable to 
be present, so Mrs. Richardson pre­
sided over the business meeting. 
Mrs. Harrison had the devotional, 
and Mrs. King led the lesson on al­
cohol. Members present were 
Mesdames Foster, Harrison, A. L. 
King, Richardson, Riffe, Ralph 
Harding, P. J. Pronger, Jr., Mc- 
Minn, and Nichols.............................

HOTEL STRATFORD
“Once a Guest—Always a Booster” 

Mrs. Areace LeBleu, Prop. 
Phone No. 7

dams, so as to save the water 
their farms and ranches.

on

On many ranches of the county 
rains are being made to grow grass 
instead of washing away the 
rangeland as they once did. Wa­
ter-saving dams that are built un­
der the AGP program store water 
in many of the natural draws and 
help to prevent it making great 
gullies.

When the construction of these 
dams is a part of the conservation 
plan for a farm or ranch, the Gov­
ernment helps pay part of the 
construction cost. Buckles added. 
Ranchers or farmers who are in­
terested in building dams this year 
are urged to contact the county 
office at an early date, and to se 
cure prior approval of this conser­
vation measure before the con­
struction work is started.

Stockwater Ponds And 
Erosion Control Dams

Waterholes have been the center 
of many a fight, both in story 
books and in real life. Many ranch­
ers in this country can remember 
some of the stories. Many of them 
can remember too, when water 
didn’t cause gun-fights but was 
nevertheless precious beyond price 
when drouth struck. These con­
ditions are passing fast, R. C. 
Buckles, Chaiman of the Sherman 
County ACA Committee says, be­
cause more farmers and ranchers 
are buildng stockwater ponds and
DAB Auto Paint

The new wonder paint for auto­
mobiles. Just wipe it on. Leaves 
factory-like paint job, guaranteed 
two years. $5.95 paints car. Free 
literature. Dealers wanted in Pan­
handle. Whsle-retail distributors. 
Cover Co., 1911-N, Lubbock, Tex.

W A N T  ADS
FOR SALE: Double bed and nat 

ural gas heater.— Mrs. M. E. Cleav 
inger, Jr. 26-ltc

FOR SALE: 2 practically new 
cotton mattresses for single beds.— 
Mrs. Joe Duby.______________ 24-tfc

FOR SALE: 1 Frigidaire Pop Box 
in good condition.—Stratford Froz 
en Food Lockers. 25-tfc

Mr. Renter and Investor, we have 
a good farm or ranch in Western 
Kansas or Eastern Colorado to fit 
your needs, priced from $15 to $75 
per acre, write us now.— G. W 
Jesse, Arnold, Kansas. 25-8tp

FOR SALE: 4-room house with 
unfinished bath.— See Harold 
Leonard at Mid-Way Cafe. 25tfc

WATER WELL DRILLING.— Ro­
bertson Bros., Box 148, Dalhart, 
Texas, Phone 671-W. 25-6tp

FOR SALE: 1931 Baldwin 12 foot 
combine.— Ed Honeman, Hooker, 
Okla. - • 27-3tp

WANTED: Dead livestock. We re­
move them from your place free 
of charge. Call Stratford Frozen 
Food Lockers or Dalhart Render­
ing Co. We pay phone call. 24 4tc

FOR SALE: Model A 1930 Ford 
4-door sedan on good rubber, in 
fair condition.— L. J. Fitzgerald, 
Texhoma, Okla. 26-2tp

FOR SALE: Good used Plymouth 
4-door sedan, priced reasonable. — 
Chester Guthrie. 24-3tc

Bills Introduced—
(Continued from Page 3)

“motor carrier” to include the 
transportation of motor vehicles on 
their own power or by the tow-bar, 
saddle mount, full mount or other 
similar method; to grant “grand­
father” certificates of convenience 
and necessity or permits to persons 
engaged in such type of transpor 
tation on the 1st day of January, 
1946, and who have been contin­
uously engaged in good faith in 
such business since said date; pro­
viding for the filing of applications 
therefor within 30 days from the 
effective date of this Act; provid­
ing for the payment of annual fees 
by such carriers; making it un­
lawful for motor carriers to oper­
ate certain vehicles without there 
being attached to and displayed on 
such vehicles identification plates 
furnished by the Commission and 
excepting certain vehicles from 
such requirements; fixing the fee 
for such plates; and declaring an 
emergency.”

Senate Bill No. 82, A bill to be 
entitled “An Act to amend the 
statutes of the State of Texas re­
lating to the computation of the 
reserves on policies and contracts 
issued by Ijfe insurance companies 
organized under the laws of this 
State or authorized to transact 
business in this State by amending 
Article 4688 and 4748 of the Revised 
Civil Statutes of Texas, 1925, and 
Section 5 of Chapter 101, Page 172 
of the Acts of the Forty-second 
Legislature (Article 4764a, Section 
5, Vernon’s Civil Statutes of Texas 
Annotated); and declaring an em­
ergency.”

Senate Bill No. 83, A bill to be 
entitled “An Act to amend the 
statutes of the State of Texas re­
lating to what a policy of life in­
surance shall contain by amend­
ing Sections 6, 7 and 8 of Article 
4732 of the Revised Statutes of 
Texas, 1925, and Subsection e, Sec­
tion 2, Chapter 89 of the ^.cts of 
the Forty-seventh Legislature, (Ar­
ticle 4764b, Section 2, e, Vernon’s 
Civil Statutes of Texas Annotat­
ed); and providing that this Act 
shall take effect January 1, 1948; 
and declaring an emergency.” 

Senate Bill No. 84, A bill to be 
entitled “An Act amending General 
and Special Laws, 45th Legislature,

Discontinue
. Buying Cream

There being an insufficient amount 
of cream sold in this territory to justify 
the operation of a local cream station, 
we will discontinue buying cream after 
this week.

Harrison Poultry & Feed

Customers contemplating the need of new truck beds 
for the Harvest Season will find it advisable to place their 
orders early while we have sufficient ------

Steel for Truck Beds
, TRACTOR TIRES O f A ll Sizes 

AUTOM OBILE PAINTING
A smooth finished paint job not only increases the 

value of your car through its appearance but gives a pro­
tective coating rust resistance protection to the body of the 
car.

Davis Brothers
Wright Davis, Mgr.

© DEPOSITS INSURED
BY

The Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation
 ̂ WASHINGTON. D. C.

c c n n n  m axim u m  in su r a n c e  c c f i n n
^ U U U U  FOR EACH DEPOSITOR

SSS I >

Old Friends
Or

New Friends
It doesn’t matter which you are, you 

will fincji that this bank is equipped and 
ready to meet your financial require­
ments.

Y O U  ARE W ELCOM E  
HERE

Fird State Bank
OF STRATFORD

Closed
Today

TH U R SD AY «

In cooperating with other Ford 
Dealers over the nation we will be closed 
today (Thursday) as a Tribute of Re­
spect for

Henry Ford
A  GREAT INDUSTRIALIST

In Case of An Emergency Do Not 
Hesitate To Call On Us To Open Our 
Doors To Render Service.

W e Have Just Received A  Large 

Shipment Of

Gleaner-Baldwin
Combine

Parts
COME IN AN D  GET TH EM  N O W  

SEE US FOR
■ •

Used Cars and Trucks

Stratford Motor Co.
YO U R  FORD DEALER
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Harrison Poultry 
Discontimiies 
Buying Cream

Harrison Poultry & Peed will dis­

continue l)uying cream after this 
weeh, the firm announces. An in­
sufficient amount of cream is offer­
ed for sale from this territory to 
make possible immediate shipment

of cream to prevent deterioration.

Specials! Specials!
The American Pubfic are always looking for special 

bargains. WE HAVE THEM.

GARDEN HOSE 
50 Feet of A-1

$ C . 5 0

FRAM  OIL FILTER UNIT  
List $1.49 $J.OO
Special

CAR FUEL PUMPS
List $5.00  
Special

$ ^ . 5 0

Special Price On Tires
AUT© ACCESSORIES ALL KINDS

Walden Service Station
PHONE 111

Scarce Items
N O W  IN STOCK

Window TJnffes 
Doors 

Siding 
Oak Flooring 

2xr« i:o 2xl2’s
lk6 Rough Fencing Lumber 

1 Inch Sheathing Lumber 
5x5 Rough Windmill Towers 

Small Stock Watering Tanks 
Shingles, Cedar or Composition 

Roll Roofings
Cement — Lime — Plaster 

White House Paint and Enamel ,
Red Picket Fence 

Screen Wire 
Screen Doors 

Window Screens

m.

Bills Introduced In 
The Texas Legislature

Senate Bill No. 77, A bill to be 
entitled “An Act amending Section 
1 and Section 6 of Chapter 35, Acts 
of the Regular Session of the
Thirty-ninth Legislature of the
State of Texas, relating to the re­
mission of certain taxes to the
Counties of Willacy and Cameron 
for flood protection by changing 
the period in said Act from twenty- 
five years to forty years; and de­
claring an emergency.”

Senate ill No. 78, A bill to be en­
titled “An Act authorizing the
Board of Directors of the Agricul­
tural and Mechanical College to 
establish and maintain a vegetable 
breeding laboratory at Winter Hav­
en, Texas, defining the purpose of 
said laboratory, making an appro­
priation for the purposes of said 
laboratory, and declaring an em­
ergency.”

Senate Bill No, 79, A bill to be 
entitled “An Act to define and reg­
ulate the practice of Chiropractic; 
to create the Texas Board of 
Chiropractic Examiners, prescrib­
ing its qualifications, powers and 
duties; to provide for the registra­
tion, examination and re-examina- 
tion of applicants and the issuance 
of licenses and certificates; to pro­
vide the qualifications of appli­
cants; to provide for the granting

R o x y  Theatre
STRATFORD, TEXAS 

April 10 and 11
‘Heartbeat”

Ginger Rogers - Jean Aumont 
Also MARCH OF TIME

We have numerous other supplies which will be 
of interest to those who wish to build or repair — Give Us 
A Visit.

Foxworth-Galbraith' Lumber Co.

April 12
“West of Dodge City”

Smiley Burnette 

April 13 and 14
“ Sister Kenny”

Rosalind Russell - Alexander 
Knox

April 15 and 16
“ Home in Oklahoma”

Roy Rogers - Dale Evans 
In TECHNICOLOR

Two Piece Maroon and Gray 
Mohair By

Hausske-Harlen Furniture Mfg. Co.
M ANUFACTURERS AND DESIGNERS

Since 1880 The Most Individual Line of Living Room Suites In
America

Pay Us A  Visit And See This Wonderful Suit. t

Also we have in stock the

Thor Gladiron
the Ironer with a roll small en­
ough to Iron Shirt sleeves. Iron a 
shirt in 4 minutes.

Eureka
The Only Complete Home Cleaning System.

20 and 30-Gallon
Hot Water Heaters

Tracy Stainless Steel Cabinet 
Top and Sinks

At Wholesale Cost — Use Our Easy Pay Plan

9 New Bed Room Suites

Slay’s Furniture 
& Appliances

M A Y T A G KELVINATOR RCA EUREKA

The Stratford Star
Published Weekly By 

Brown Ross
Entered as second class matter 

at the Post Office in Stratford, 
Texas, under the act of March 3, 
1879.

Subscription Rates
$2.00 per year in Sherman and 

adjoining counties. $2.50 per year 
outside first zone.

Clarified and Legals
10 cents per line per insertion; 

71/2 cents per line subsequent; in­
sertions. Display rates on appli­
cation.
of licenses by reciprocity; to pro­
vide that the District Clerk of 
each county shall keep a record, to 
make it unlawful to practice with­
out annual registration; to 
exempt chiropractors by amending 
Article 740 of the Penal Code and 
Aritcle 4504, Revised Civil Statues, 
Texas; to amend Article 741 of the 
Penal Code and Article 4510 of the 
Revised Civil States of Texas; to 
provide fees for the payment of 
expenses of the Board and for the 
disbursement thereof; to provide 
for the revocation or supervision 
of license to pratice Chiropractic 
and for the enforcement of this 
Act; to fix penalties for the viola­
tion of this act; to provide for a 
seal to be used by the Board; to re­
peal all laws in conflict; to provide 
that any part, if held unconsti- 
titutional it shall not invalidate 
any other part; and to declare an 
emergency,”

Senate Bill No. 80, A bill to be 
entitled “An Act to amend Sub­
section (b) of Section 3, Acts 1931, 
Chapter 282, Acts Regular Session, 
Forty-second Legislature, regulat­
ing the maximum height of vehi­
cles unlade or with load; and de-

been very busy for the past 
few weeks, doing my Spring sew­
ing. And this year, I’ve discovered 
an attachment called the Stitch 
Master that has certainly made my 
work look professional. It’s at­
tached right to my machine — and 
with it I can make invisible hems 
and smooth edges, not only for 
dresses, and clothes —  but for new 
Spring house furnishings.

So far. I ’ve made two new suits 
for my young daughter . . . which 
she tells me the girls call “ dreamy” 
. . .  a new dress for Babs and one 
for myself, as well as a host of 
things ioT my home. And my new 
miracle attachment has certainly 
been a help! On necklines, for in­
stance, I’ve learned how to make a 
smooth, perfect edge . . .  a skirt 
hem is no problem at all, anymore 
— I stitch them right on the ma­
chine and with the new Stitch Mas­
ter the stitches are actually invis­
ible!

It’s certainly easy to sew with 
today’s modem equipment, isn’t it? 
My two sons were thrilled with the 
curtains I made for their bedroom. 
I found some regular saikicth . . . 
dyed it navy blue—and applicqued 
bright ships and anchors on it. 
Then I made spreads to match for 
their bunk beds. Now the entire 
room has a nautical look and the 
boys are proud as punch! New 
draperies for the living room are 
next on my list. I’ve always been 
afraid to tackle them before— for 
the fear they’d look home - made. 
But with my new sewing machine 
attachment I have no fears at all 
—for every garment I’ve made with 
it, has really looked professional, 
and I’m making plans for dozens of 
new furnishings which I can make 
easily and quickb/ now!

Sweeten tin Ikcs^ion
wUh

C h oco la tes
fo r

turnerican Queens
The Swe^est way to say 

*th<wik you" to your hosted. 
Take her a box of King's, 
the chocolates with o r o ^  
flavor.

Bonar Pharmacy

daring an emergency.”
Senate Bill No. 81, A bill to be 

entitled “An Act to amend Sec­
tion Kb), Sec,tion 3, Section 7, Sec­
tion 17 and Section of Article 911b,
r - ..

Revised Civil Statutes of Texas, 
1925, Acts 1931, Forty-second Legis­
lature, Chapter 277, as amended, to 
enlarge the definition of the term 

(Continued on Page 2)

P.T,A. Box Supper 
Friday Night

APRIL 18 7 :30  P. M.

SCHOOL G YM N ASIU M

Ladies, Grade School and High 
School Girls are Invited to Bring Boxes.

Stratford’s High School Band W ill 
Receive 1 /3  of the Proceeds.

Y O U  ARE INVITED TO ATTEN D
SPONSORED BY

Stratford Parent Teacher Association

*8* if ♦I* *1* *1* *$* *1'*  ̂ ^ ^ »X*  ̂̂"4*

Automotive Repairs
Have your A U TO M O TIV E  REPAIR  

Work done in a shop equipped with all 
new tools.

There is no more opportune time to 
have your repair work completed to 
place your Cars, Pick-Ups and Trucks in 
proper running condition for the inevi­
table rush of the harvest season.

REMEMBER Our guaranteed repair 
service costs no more than ordinary re­
pair service and drive in for your needed 
repairs.

4*

TOC Motor Co.
t Studebaker Sales and Service

PAINTS
Our current stock of Paints include:

White Outside 
Paint

Linseed Oil /
r  ' FLOOR FINISHES

Varnish
TURPENTINES

[Paint Thinner
■ KEM -TONE

Piicote.
You will find our line of paint re­

presents one of the most complete offer­
ings in this territory. Regardless of your 
needs, we believe that we either have the 
proper paint in stock or will be able to 
secure it for you with a few days notice.

Van B. Boston
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RHVniES OFREHSOn ^otdU andllfY|iuic0y A 4 c ln to s h

^  PEAL AT

m m sm

C O M t , W | F E . y ,  , 
D H A R - n̂  a n d

H U R R > J  P R a / '

W ^ A T  D O ^ S T M t  
i - i T T L t  R a s c a l  
s A y ^

McIntosh dry« goods

holidays in Carter, Oklahoma visit­
ing her mother and father, Mr. 
and Mrs. W. W. Biscoe. She was 
returned to her home Tuesday by 
her brother, Louis Biscoe and fam­

ily, of Long Beach, California.
Miss Ineva Headrick, Amarillo, 

and Elizabeth Bradshaw were 
visitors in the home of Mrs. Agnes 
Foster over the week-end.

LOCAL NEW S
'Mr. and Mrs. Cone Donelson 

.were Amarillo visitors Monday.
Mr. and Mrs. Tom Gibbons ana 

Children of Texhoma visited rela­
tives here Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Lee were in

Amarillo Monday on business.
Miss Louise Wall was a visitor in 

Fort Worth over the week-end.
Mr. and Mrs. J. C. O’Brien and 

Mr. and Mrs. Meritt Green and 
family were i^narillo visitors 
Tuesday.

Miss Jeneanne Huggins returned 
Monday to Austin where she is at­
tending school.

Mrs. Arthur Ross and Gene visit­
ed in the L. B. Steel home m Dal-

hart Monday.
Mr. and Mrs. H. C. Borth, Ama­

rillo, visited in the Kenneth Borth 
home over the week-end.

Mrs. Jim Faris spent the Easter

Carload Of Select And Certified

SEED
To Arrive Next Week 

Including
M ARTIN MILO, PLAINSM AN MILO, 

HEGARI And 
Other Field Seeds

Phones 40 and 86

Stratford Grain Co.

FATS AND Oils FORECAST FOR
‘ - FIRST SIX MONTHS '

 ̂ 194-6
NET EXPORTS

^FIDST 6 M ONTHS

216 MILLION POUNDS

1947
NET IMPORTS
FLPftT 6  M O N T H S  i  S

150 MILLION P O U N D S ^

1 9 4 6

1 veSRTARLt 
1 OIL CROPS

V  4,317 M I L L I O N  P O U N D S

1 ^  ■* / f W

1 9 4 7 ^ l|i^^ CATTLE

VESETAEL6 
0«U CAOPS

4 -.I6 0  M I L L I O N  P O U N D S

----------------------  T A K E N  F R O M  R E S E R V E S  )---------
K  A l l  F I R S T  SIX M O N T H S  — -  1 ^

n o ’ r k e r v k a v ^ ^

jH if  |T

3S5*M 1 dT T n 1946

THE AMERICAN HOUSEWIFE 
CAN M AKE UP TH IS  ' 

y  150,000,000 POONP 
-  DEFICIT -  B Y  SAVINS 

EVERY DROP OF USED 
COOK1N6 FAT.'

PLEASANT 
EVENINGS 
AT HOME with

Better lighting adds livability to your home. Prop­
erly placed lamps and lights will add to the attrac­
tiveness o f  your home. Y ou ’ll avoid eyestrain.

Fill in and mail the coupon, or call your nearest 
Southwestern Public Service office now^for a light­
ing survey o f your home. A  specialist w ill come to 
your home, and measure the lighting in every 
room. Y ou ’ll be given recommendations that will 
lead to  better l ig h t in g . . .  better living. And 
remember, it’s another service o f  your Public 
Service Company, furnished without extra charge.

............ .......................... — .............-
SOUTHWEST PUBLIC SERVICE CO.

(Please M ail to Y ou r  Nearest P ublic Service Co. OflSce)

Please send a representative to advise me on better lighting and 
adequate w iring.

Name-

Street Address- 

City__________ ..State..

We have nothing to sell but good electric service. 
We are acting only in an advisory capacity.

S O U T H W E S T E R N

PUBLIC SEPVICB
COMPANY

2 2  Y E A K S  OF COOO C I T I Z E N S H I P  A N D  P U B L I C  S E R V IC E

The following described tracts of Real Estate and Mineral will be sold at

Public Auction
on vacant lot south of courthouse in the City of Stratford, Texas, on the

22nd Day oS April 1947
beginning at 2 :00  P. M. for Cash to the highest bidder, one-fourth to be paid on sale 
date, balance on approval of title.

TRACT ONE: Lots 4 and 5, Block 9, 
Stratford.

TR ACT T W O : Lots 4 and 5, Block 49, 
Stratford.

TR ACT THREE: Lots 1 to 4, Block 2, 
Stratford, Stokes Addition.

TR AC T FOUR: Lots 1 and 2, Block 6, 
Stratford.

TR ACT FIVE: Being 186.8 acres out of 
the N .W . Corner of Section 229, 
Block 1-T, Sherman County, 
Texas, subject to an oil and gas 
lease, all valid easements of re­
cord, and a farm lease which ex­
pires August 1, 1947. Purchaser 
gets 1/4th  of 1947 wheat crop 
delivered to elevator.

TR ACT SIX : Section 231, Block 1-T, 
Sherman County, Texas, subject 
to an oil and gas lease, all valid 
easements of record, and a farm 
lease which expires August 1, 
1947. Purchaser gets l /4 th  of 
1947 wheat crop delivered to 

 ̂ elevator.
TR ACT SEVEN: South i  of Section 

146, Block 1-T, Sherman Coun­
ty, Texas, subject to an oil and 
gas lease, all valid easements of 
record, and a farm lease which 
expires August 1, 1947. Purchas­
er gets 2 of 1947 wheat crop de­
livered to elevator.

TRACT EIGHT: Easi i  of Easi of
Section 12, Block M-27, Mrs. C. 
Barclay Survey; and Section 5, 
J. C. Patton Survey, Dallam 
County, Texas, and that part of 
Section 1, Block 1, P.S.L., Sher­
man County, Texas, lying west 
of County road, containing ap­
proximately 1950 acres, subject 
to all valid easements of record, 
and a farm lease on about 730 
acres of growing wheat which 
expires August 1, 1947. Pur­
chaser gets 4 th of 1947 wheat 
crop delivered to elevator. Up­

on delivery of Deed, purchaser 
can have possession of grass.

TR ACT NINE: North J of Section 10, 
and Section 11, Block M-2, 
Moore County, Texas, except 
fths of minerals, subject to valid 
oil and gas lease on fths of min­
erals, all valid easements of re­
cord, and a farm lease which ex­
pires August 1, 1947. Purchaser 
gets 4 th of 1947 wheat crop de­
livered to elevator.

TR ACT TEN: NE4 of Section 11, Block 
3-B, Sherman County, Texas, 
subject to an oil and gas lease, 
all valid easements of record, and 
a farm lease which expires Aug­
ust 1, 1947. Purchaser gets 4 th of 
1947 wheat crop delivered to 
elevator.

TR ACT ELEVEN: East |ths of N.E. i  
of Section 220, Block 1-T, Dal­
lam County, Texas, subject to all 
valid easements of record, and a 

 ̂ farm lease which expires August
1, 1947. Cash rent, no crop rent 
to go with this tract.

TR AC T TW E LV E : South J of Section
2, Township 1, Range 8, Cimar­
ron County, Oklahoma, subject 
to all valid easements of record, 
and a farm lease which expires 
August 1, 1947. Purchaser gets 
4 of 1947 wheat crop delivered 
to elevator.

TR AC T THIRTEEN: One-Half undi­
vided interest in 300 acres of

' mineral in Section 180, Block
1-T, Sherman County, Texas, de­
scribed as follows: Lot 3, 4, 5, 
and 6 in Block 11, all of Blocks
3, 4, 5, 6, 12, 13, and 14, all in 
Neals Addition, Section 180, 
Block 1-T, T& N O  Ry. Co. sur­
vey, Sherman County, Texas, 
containing approximately 300 
acres, subject to a valid oil and 
gas lease thereon.

All the above described property is owned by co-tenants, and each co-tenant re­
serves for himself the right to bid at the sale. For further information concerning the de­
scription, location, and terms of sale, contract of the above described property contact

W . N. PRICE
STRATFORD, T E X A S
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ffSe can te// t/iat 
nowJsi/ie t/me ̂  cAdn̂ e to

^ niiiips66
tMor Oil!

PROVED BY 6 6  BILUON MILES OF SATISFACTORY SERVICE

Ralph Harding
Phillips 66 Wholesale and Retail Products

Blackwells Return 
T o  Stratford

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Blackwell and

Meals
SHORT ORDERS 

COFFEE

Ŝerved to Please your desire 
and Appetite

When We Please You— 
Tell Others

'When You Are Dissatisfied 
Tell Us

Pdace Cafe
(RUSSEhL BEALL, Proprietor

■children returned to Stratford Fri­
day after a few months visit in 
Shirley, Arkansas. They plan to 
make Stratford their home.

LOCAL NEW S
Mr. and Mrs. Walt Strother are 

in Hot Springs, New Mexico on a 
fishing trip.

Tom Pugh visited in the Dick 
Diehl home Saturday.

Imperial Barber & 
Beauty Shop

Whiskers Died Here

STEVENS AND BRECK 
SCALP TREATMENTS 

For Men, Ladies and Babies 
J. L. TURNER & SONS

Imperial Barber &  
Beauty Shop

Phone 33 For Appointments With 
Beauty Operator________

Stratford Lodge 874
A. F. & A. M.

stated
Communication

SECOND FRIDAY NIGHT OF 
EACH MONTH

MELVIN PHILLIPS, W. M.
W. O. BRYANT, Secretary.

Little Princess 
Kitchen 
BROOMS
Each

Househol^Bfeach 
CLOROX 
Quart

Texas Seedless 
GRAPEFRUIT 
8 Pounds 39

Speed Clean With 
BAB-0 
2 For 23
For Clogged Drains
DEANO
Each 23
20 Mule Team 
BORAX 
1 Pound Box 19
Toilet Soap
REGULAR PALMOLIVE 
2 For 25
Flood O’Snds 
SUPER SUDS 
Large 39
Window Cleaner
SHINEX
EaSkCh 23
Pargon’s AMMONIA 
10 Ounce Bottle 10
Peets Crystal White
CLEANSER
Can 5
Wright’s Silver Cream
POLISH
Each 25
CHORE GIRL 
3 For 25
Tavern
PAINT CLEANER 
Quart 49
For Furniture and Woodwork 
JOHNSON’S WAX gO  
Each
NIL
Kills Odors Each 79
Argo CORN STARCH 
Each 10
Heavy Syrup Demand
PEACHES
No. ZV2 Can 29
Prepared PRUNES 
15 Ounce Glass 23

Best Quality
RED 
POTA­
TOES
10 Lbs.
California
Navel
Oranges
8 Lb. Bag

Good Onion 
PLANTS
2 For
Washington
Winesap
Apples
2 Pounds
Fresh Frosted 
Green PEAS 3 5  
12 Oz. Box

Fresh Frosted

Cauliflower
10 Ounce Box

W e Sell Plains Grade A  
MILK  
Only

Assorted Cold

Meats
Pound

h ifu itr
M A K E S  TME 

IVIEAL^

Armour’s Star 
BACON

SLAB
Found 63

Pinkney Small
WEINERS
Pound

37
Fancy
beef roast

.  37Found

BAKING
HENS
Pound 57

-  U

Nancy Lee Cut 
GREEN BEANS 
No. 2 Can; 2 for

Boneless Catfish
STEAKS 49
Pound

25

Brownes Food Store

that. Why didn’t you laugh? 
Jimmy—I-I-I did.

know
Hired and Fired

Boss—Do you think you 
enough to work here?

New Boy—Why sure! The last 
place I worked, the manager said I 
knew too much.

And How!
Daisie—I’ve lost quite a lot of 

weight recently.
Maisie—I can’t see it.
Daisie—Of course not. I’ve lost it.

Human Bulldozer
Joe—With his big feet, I don’t see 

how the Seabees ever took him.
Jeff—I understand they use him 

to stamp out new airfields.

This is Corny
Sarge— Ĥave you heard the. story 

about the ear of corn?
Rookie—No, I haven’t.
Sarge—Then ask the kernel.

Sea Sick, Too
Harry—Of what does the Atlantic 

ocean remind you?
Jerry—You, it’s so seldom quiet!

Speaking Frankly
He—Do you mind if I smoke? 
She (coldly)—I don’t care if you 

bum!

Money Talks
Passerby—I say, young fellow, 

I’ll give you three dollars for that 
I pup.
1 Boy—I’m sorry, it can’t be done,
j sir. That dog belongs to my sister, 
I and she’d cry her heart out if I sold 
j it. But I’ll tell you what I’ll do 
for you: raise the price to five dol­
lars and we’ll let her cry!

Mother—Why are you crying, 
Jimmy?

Jimmy—P-p-pop hit his finger 
with the ha-hammer.

Mother—Don’t cry at a thing like

Pass the Old Salt
Retired Sailor — Well son, are you 

going to become a sailor?
Young Boy — Yes, sir.
Retired Sailor — I guess it’s the 

same as in my time. They send the 
fool of the family to sea.

Young Boy — No, sir. That’s all 
changed since your time.

[ Real Trouble
; Auntie — What are you crying 
about. Tommy?

Tom—Because my brother has s 
holiday and I haven’t.

I Auntie—But why don’t you have 
a holiday, too?

Tom — Because I’m not old 
enough to go to school.

LOCAL NEW S
J. R. Alexander and W. G. 

Brien were business visitors 
Dalhart Tuesday.

O’-
in

Mrs. Frank Duby and baby, 
Claude, Texas, are here for a visit 
in the home of Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
Duby. She plans soon to join her 
husband, Lt. Frank Duby, station­
ed near Honolulu, Hawaii.

Mr. and Mrs. Everett Toomey, 
Sunray, Mr. and Mrs. Dick Booth-

by, Texhoma, Harold Turner, Am­
arillo, Mr. and Mrs. John Kimbrel, 
Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Keener, and 
Lester Turner, Alva, Oklahoma, 
spent Easter Sunday with Mr. and 
Mrs. J. L. Turner.

Mr. and Mrs. H. C. Bennett and 
son, Hal, and Mrs. David Lacey, 
San Fernando, California, axe on a 
fishing trip at Parker, Kansas.

Mrs. Fate Morris, employed with

Van B. Boston’s implement store 
for several years, is complying with 
her doctor’s orders to take a much 
needed rest before returning to her 
work.

Mr. and Mrs. F. L. Yates were 
visitors in Texhoma Sunday after­
noon.

Bob Townsend arrived by plane 
Monday to return to his work with 
the Bonar Pharmacy.

It’s Still a Still

Powerful enough to “distil” 
solids and liquids never before va*̂  
porized is this molecular still, an 
atomic age descendant of the old 
liquor distillery. By creating an 
“effectively perfect” vacuum, the 
still evaporates materials into their 
molecular components. Developed 
by Gulf research to explore the 
true nature of 'petroleum, it can 
divide waxes, greases and oils into 
several hundred distinct parts for 
study, a degree of separation never 
before approached. Dr. John. R. 
Bowman, who pioneered in the de« 
velopment, is shown giving opera* 
ting data to an assistant.

Pioneer Beauty 
Shop

Is Ready To Serve You 
For That Well Groomed 

Look

Featuring

HELEN CURTIS 
Permanent Waves

Mable McKee - Mrs. J. L. Faris 
Beauticians

Radios
1— Motorola Table Model FARM RADIO.
2— Electric Table Model RADIOS. (White and Brown Cases) 
1—Olympic Table Model Brown Case RADIO.
1—Motoralo Table Model Brown Case RADIO.
1—Portable Battery & Electric Sonora RADIO.
1—Small Portable Battery and Electric Motorola Playboy 

RADIO.
1—RCA Battery RADIO.
1— Used Aerline Table Model RADIO.
2— Used Battery RADIOS. Cheap.
1—Used Cabinet Model RADIO, Very Cheap.

CAR AERIALS — RADIO TUBES 

Place Your Orders For Car Radios

Raymond’s Radio Service
“Where Radio Is a Business and Not Just A Sideline”

Special This Week 
Ladies Bags

Coal Black, Brown 
And Cherry 

Cake Plastics 
Rich Black and 

Brown Kids 
Hand Tooled 
Leather Bags 

1 /4  OFF!

Costume Jewelry
Chatelaines

Pin and Earscrew 
Sets

Pins, Earscrews 
Necklaces 
Bracelets 

OFF!

Lovelace Dept. Store

SAVIOR OF THE 
W H EAT CROP

O  WARMS o f passenger pigeons ravaged early 
Wisconsin wheat crops by devouring the 

newly-sown grain. Moved by the farmers’ plight, 
the Van Brunt brothers o f Horicon, in 1861, 
built a seeder, incorporating their newly-pat­
ented cylinder feed. Seed grain was worked into 
the ground and covered with a protective blanket 
o f  soil.

The success o f  the Van Brunt seeder exceeded 
its builders’ fondest dreams. It not only over­
came the pigeon menace, but revolutionized ex- 
isting seeding practices. Within a few years the 
fame o f the Van Brunt machine spread across 
the^nation.

M odem  John D eere-Van Brunt grain drills are 
still the outstanding buy. Stop in today Jor Jull de­
tails,

Bennett Implement Co.
Jp tfii;Q H C n iE  Q U A LITY  FARIVf E Q U IP M E N T
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Miss Ermalee Bonar who is at­

tending the University of Wichita,

Kansas, was home for the Easter 
holdays. Kathryn Bonar return­
ed with her for a short visit and

Made to Measure Suits
W IT H  E X T R A  PANTS  

FOR MEN

Ladies Tailored Suits
New Selection of Samples on Display for your appro­

val.

Order Your Made To Measure 
SPRING PANTS  

Now
Replace Worn Out Zippers With New 

Ones
We have a large stock of assorted colors on hand.

Stratford Cleaners

TO USE FROZEN FOODS 
M E A T S

Frozen meats can be put in the oven 
or skillet immediately upon removing 
from your locker, and cooked in the us­
ual manner. Good results are also ob­
tained by thawing at room temperature 
without unwrapping. When thawed, re­
move Wrapping and cook. If poultry or 
game birds are to be stuffed they should 
be thawed before stuffing.

Stratford Frozen Food Lockers

Thermos Bottles 
Thermos Jugs

Take Cold Drinking Water with you on your trips 
this summer. Your outings may take you to many spots 
where this convenience is not available.

Medicine and First 
Aid Supplies

Your First Aid Kit is the most valuable piece of lug­
gage you can carry on an outing. See us for a supply of

DISINFECTANTS  
APPLICATORS  

G AU ZE  
COTTON  

EMOLIENTS  
ADHESIVE TAPE

An ounce of prevention is often worth a pound of cure.

YATES DRUG

.22 Automatic
Pumps and Rifles
These new .ZZ Guns are the type the average boy has 

been wanting for his hunting trips and represent the fin­
est in workmanship.

FISHING TACKLE BOXES

FISHING TACKLE  
O f A ll Kinds

LINES —  RODS —  REELS 

PLUGS - SPOONS 

SPINNERS 

TROT LINES

■̂1

Get Your Fishing supplies hOW and be ready to take 
advantage of the entire fishing season when the sport is at 

its best.

Cowdrey H w d . & Im p l.
J. I. CASE SALES AND SERVICE

Miss Jan Mueller, a former room­
mate of C. W. C.

Mrs. L. L. Grimes, Miss Arlene 
Grimes and Robert Steel were visit­
ors in Amarillo Monday.

G. D. Rime and son, Quanah, 
were visitors here Tuesday.

J. W. Pigman, Dalhart, tran­
sacted business here Tuesday.

C. Holt, Amarillo, was a business 
visitor here Tuesday.

V. O. Martin of the Stanolind Oil 
Company was here Tuesday and 
Wednesday looking after company 
interests.

Those enjoying an Easter picnic 
Sunday afternoon were: Mr. and 
Mrs. Earl Bond, Mr. and Mrs. 
Charles Wisdom and family, Jim 
Faris and Charlotte, Mr. and Mrs. 
Wayne Harding and family, T. L. 
Wakefield, Mr. and Mrs. Ben Bid­
dy and family, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Jack Golladay. The afternoon 
was spent playing baseball, hunt­
ing Easter eggs and eating.

A. L. King, Jim Taylor, L. M. 
Fedric, Herbert Folsom, and John 
Steel were business visitors in 
Friona and Canyon Tuesday.

Miss Vida Bachman has acepted 
a position with Albert’s Grocery.

J. W. Scott, Kiowa, Kansas, was 
a visitor in Stratford Friday.

Mrs. Joe Gibbins and Arthur 
Gibbins were Amarillo visitors 
Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. Dick Diehl were in 
Plain view and Amarillo Sunday 
and Monday on business.

Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Taylor and 
Mrs. G. L. Taylor were in Amarillo 
on business Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. L. M. Price return­
ed home Saturday after spending 
two weeks at Mineral Wells, Texas.

Rev. McMahen, Amarillo, preach­
ed Sunday at the Baptist Church 
in the absence of Rev. Whatley.

Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Ross and 
Gene, were visitors in Dumas and 
Sunray Sunday.

Roy Denney and Bob Walters, 
who are attending school at Den­
ton, were home over the week-end 
visiting relatives.

Visitors in the Kenneth Borth 
home are Mrs. Borth’s father, How­
ard Kimball and her brother, Mar­

vin Kimball, of Ceiling, Oklahoma.
Mrs. C. H. Wisdom is visiting for 

a few days in the home of her son, 
Charles Wisdom and family.

Mr. and Mrs. E. R. Kelp spent 
the Easter holidays in El Paso with 
thei daughter and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Gene Wills. They also visit­
ed a few days in Hot Springs, New 
Mexico with Mr. and Mrs. Bill Lol- 
lis and family.

Rev. H. A. Nichols went to Robert 
Lee, Texas Monday to bring Mrs. 
Nichols home. Mrs. Nichols has 
been with her father, who has 
been seriously ill, but is reported 
to have recovered from his illness.

Little Arthur Gibbins, Jr., is ill 
with the measles this week.

Mrs. Sam Lasley took her 
daughter, Sammie to Amarillo Mon­
day. Miss Lasley was enroute to 
Shawnee, Oklahoma, where she is 
attending Oklahoma Baptist Uni­
versity.

Howard Gibbons, Mrs. E. R. Kelp 
and Mrs. Dick Diehl visited in the 
Torn Gibbons home at Texhoma 
Tuesday.

REGULAR M EALS  
SHORT ORDERS

C. E. Leonard 
Harold Leonard

M ID -W A Y  CAFE

CITATION BY PUBLICATION
THE STATE OF TEXAS:
TO: Mary V. Waldo, widow, J. D. 

Rawlings, Bert E. Nash, Carrie B. 
Nash, wife, J. M. Cole, Harry H. 
Cole, H. H. Cole, Fred T. Cole, Lot­
tie M. Cole, female, if married, her 
husband, whose name is unknown, 
Josephine E. Cole, female, if mar­
ried, her husband, whose name is 
unknown, C. P. Scrinener, Chas. P. 
Scrinener, Charles Percy Scrinen­
er, J. W. Aylor, whose places of 
residence, if living are each ' un­
known, and if any be deceased, the 
heirs, their heirs and legal repre­
sentatives, respectively of such as 
are deceased, names and places of 
residence, being unknown, GREET­
ING:

You are hereby commanded to 
appear before the Honorable Dis- 
of this citation, same being the 
19th day of May, 1947, then and 
there to answer Plaintiff’s Petition 
filed in said Court, on the 4th day 
of April, 1947, in this cause, num­
bered 1109 on the docket of said 
court the names of the parties be­
ing: H. B. Naugle, Plaintiff, Mary 
V. Waldo, J. D. Rawlings, Bert B. 
trict Court of Sherman County at 
the Court House thereof, in Strat­
ford, Texas, at or before 10 o’clock 
A. M. of the first Monday next af­
ter the expiration of forty-two 
days from the date of the issuance 
Nash, his wife, Carrie B. Nash, J. 
M. Cole, Harry H. Cole, H. H. Cole, 
Fred T. Cole, Lottie M. Cole, fe­
male, if maried, he husband, whose 
name in unkown, Josephine E. 
Cole, female, if married, her hus­
band, whose name is unknown, C. 
P. Scrinener, Chas. P. Scrinener, 
Charles Percy Scrinener, J. W. Ay­
lor, and the unknown heirs, their 
heirs and legal representatives of 
each and all of said persons who 
may be deceased, if any, DEPEN­
DANTS;

A brief statement of the nature 
of this suit is a follows, to wit:

A suit in trespass to try title, to

Opening For
Business

Saturday, April 12
W e welcome you to visit our store on its open­

ing day. Check these prices for an introduction 
to our low cost merchandising. Our filling sta­
tion will be open soon.-
BEEF ROAST  
Pound SS
CLUB STEAKS  
Pound 37
M ARSH M ALLO W  
CREME 
8 Ounce Jar 22
POST TOASTIES
8 Ounce
Box

GRAPEFRUIT JUICE 
Del Haven ^  A
No. 2 Can

PEACHES  
Hearts Delight 
No. 2 2 Can 29
COFFEE 
Del Monte 
Pound Jar 34

Dromedary 
COCONUT  
i  Pound Bag

%22
SPINACH
Harges A 
No. 2 Can ^
MUSTARD GREENS 
Good Brand 
No. 2 Can 
3 For
CATSUP  
Del Monte 25
APPLE JELLY  
Pint Jar 3S
H O M IN Y  
White Swan 
No. 2 Can B
COCOA  
Hersheys 
2 Pound 12
DREFT
O XYD O L
DUZ 36

Richard’s Cash Grocery
Located on Main Street at intersection of U.S. 54

recover rents, damages, costs of 
suit, writ of restitution and remove 
cloud, plaintiff pleading statutory 
tespass to try title and also title by 
ten years statute of limitation, and 
seeking general and special relief, 
in law and equity, of, for and con­
cerning the Southwest quarter of 
Section 127, Block 1-T, Cert. 30/64; 
T&NO R. R. Co., Sherman County, 
Texas, containing 160 acres, as is 
more fully shown by Plaintiff’s Pe­
tition on file in this suit.

The officer executing this pro-

cess shall promptly execute the 
same according to law, and make 
due return as the law directs. If 
this citation is not served within 
90 days after the date of its issu­
ance, it shall be returned unserved.

Issued and given under my hand 
and the Seal of said Court, at of­
fice in Stratford, Texas, this the 
4th day of April, 1947.
Attest: LBLAH BONEY, Clerk,

District Court, Sherman County, 
Texas.

4—10 17 24 5—1

Bargains!
Bargains!

FARM
RADIOS

$2e>oQ

KITCHEN
SINKS

$ 0 .9 5

STAINLESS STEEL 
SINKS

$^e.oo

USED GAS  
RANGE

$25.00

W A LL
HEATERS

$25.00

54 Inch DOUBLE DRAIN  
SINK

$5 0 .0 5

Duby Plumbing &  Electric
‘ ‘Your Frigidaire Dealer”

Inner Spring - -

Mattresses 
Box Springs

Trade In Your Old Mattresses and 
Springs On A  Beautiful New 

“ Supreme”
M ATTRESS And BO X SPRING 

COM BINATION
You will average spending 1-3 of your life in bed. 

You are entitled to good sleeping.

NcNahen Furniture
Your Complete Home Furnisher Phone 137

Shop In South Stratford

Grease
Sale

Closes April 12
W e Have Our Allotment O f ^

Bailing Wire
for 1947 in stock. Get your supply now.

[Do You Need Wheel Weights 
On Your Plow?

Let lis put water in your plow tires 
for this needed weight.

Consumers Co., Inc.
“ W e are Open 24 Hours a Day 99
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Mr. and Mrs. A. E. Bums spent 

Easter with Tetatives in Thomas, 
Oklahoma.

Mrs. Wayne Harding, Mrs. 
Charles Wisdom, and Albert Arm­
strong were Amarillo visitors Tues­
day.

Graydon Gamble left Wednesday 
on a business trip to Arizona.

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Lee took Mr. 
Lewis Lee to Xtelhart Monday to 
be with Mrs. Lee, who has been

very ill.
Mr. and Mrs. W. C. Martin left 

for Phoenix, Arizona, Tuesday on 
business.

Mr. and Mrs. J. R. Alexander and 
son, Bobby, visited Mr. and Mrs. W. 
G. OBrien Tuesday. Bobby was 
returning to Canon City, Colorado, 
where he is attending school.

Mrs. J. T. Gibbons is visiting her 
son, Tom and family of Texhoma 
this week,

Mr. and Mrs. R. C. Buckles and

STUDEBAKER SALES &  SERVICE
COMPLETE PARTS STOCJK ------ ACCESSORIES

Fully equipped Body and Paint Shop 
Complete Mechanical Service «ti all Makes of Cars. 

AUTO GLASS
Phone or write for appointment.

KOEHLER M OTOR C O M P A N Y
P h o n e  123

302 Rock Island Ave.
P. O. Box 1072 

Dalhart, Texas

The Car Situation Is 
Tough!

But You Don’t Have To 
Drive Them In This

A
Condition

Drive in and let us check your motor troubles — you 
may be jjleasingly surprised to find that we have the parts $ 
needed to place Your Chevrolet in perfect condition.

Davis Motor Co.
“ YO U R  CHEVROLET DEALER”

Buy the Best for Less
Special Friday and Saturday

STE AK  
Good Loin Or 
T-Bone 
Pound 47
CLUB STEAK  
Pound 39
BEEF ROAST  
Choice Chuck 
Pound 36
K R A F T CHEESE 
Velveeta.
2 Pound Box 89
SARDINES 
Tall Can 
2 For 29
TAM ALES  
152 Ounce Can 
2 For 3S
M USTARD GREENS 
Good Brand 
No. 2 Can 
3 For
PINTO BEANS
Divens
Large
30 Ounce Can 19
PORK & BEANS 
Sugar Loaf Brand 
No. 2 Can 19
Mexican Style 
BEANS  
Pecan Valley 
Tall Can, 2 for 21
G.^APEFRUIT JUICE 
Del Haven
No. 2 Can U Q  
2 For
T O M A T O  JUICE 
Wood Cross 
46 Ounce Can 25
SOAP
Magic Washer 
Regular Size 
F X 34
H Y-LO  
Regular Size 25

FLOUR
Purasnow 
25 Pound Sack
50 Pound 
Sack

$ 2 ^ .0 5

$ J .9 9

COFFEE 
Fire Side 
Pound 39
COFFEE
Admiration
Pound 42
PRESERVES 
Pure Fig 
Pound Jar 29
PEACHES  
Del Monte . 
No. 22 Can 33
PEARS 
Nile Brand 
No. 22 Can 35
SPINACH  
Brimfull 
No. 2 Can 
2 For 29
CORN
White Creme Style 
No. 2 Can 
2 For 29
JUNE PEAS  
No. 2 Can 
2 For 29
PIMENTOES  
Costal Brand 
4 Ounce Can 19
GREEN ONIONS  
2 Bunches 15
PREPARED  
M USTARD  
Pure Schilling O  
6 Ounce Jar ®
SALAD DRESSING  
Blue Bonnet U ^  
8 Ounce Jar  ̂"

ALBERT’S
Grocery & Market

Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Milton and 
daughter, Jeneanne Huggins, were 
Sunday dinner guests of Mrs. D. 
L. Buckles.

Mr. and Mrs. E, W. Butler left 
Sunday to take Mrs. Vande Dowda 
to her home in Helena, Arkansas. 
Mrs. Dowda was a guest of her par­
ents during the pre-Easter holi­
days.

H. L. McMahen returned Ihiesday 
from the furniture convention in 
Galveston.

Mrs. E. D. Lavake, Mr. and Mrs. 
Tom Lavake and children spent 
Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. Ed La­
vake at Goodwell, Oklahoma.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Cameron 
spent the Easter holidays with rel­
atives and friends in Oklahoma 
City.

Mr. and Mrs. T. D. Chisum had 
as Sunday dinner guests Mr. and 
Mrs. Jack Parker, and Miss Louise 
Deitz, Amarillo, Virgil Chisum, Dim- 
mitt, Mr. and Mrs. T. N. Beard, and 
Mr. and Mrs. Homer Blake. This 
was the first time the family had 
all been together on Easter Sun­
day since the war.

Mr. and Mrs. L. F. Denney, Roy 
Denney, and Mrs. McIntyre visited 
friends in Goodwell Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Brown Ross 
brought Mrs. Mynola Ross home 
from Dallas Sunday where she has 
been under the care of specialists 
for two months.

Spurlock News
Mr. and Mrs. Olen Branham of 

Sunray spent Easter Sunday with 
Mr. and Mrs. Alvin Spurlock and 
family.

Mr. and Mrs. Meritt Sweny, Mrs. 
N. W. Hudson and sons, Gary and 
Jimmie were visitors in Dumas 
Saturday,

Jim Sweny came home Thursday. 
He will receive a medical discharge 
at the end of his terminal leave. 
Jim says “The Panhandle is the 
grandest place on earth, and no 
fooling.”

Mr. and Mrs. Owen Hudson and 
daughters, and Mr. and Mrs. N. W. 
Hudson and sons spent Sunday 
with Mr. and Mrs. Eugene Hudson 
of Stratford.

Mr. and Mrs. Guy R. Sweny, Bill, 
Jim and Carol Mae went to Canyon 
Saturday and brought Bob home

with them to spend Easter. Bob 
is a student in the college at Can­
yon.

Dwayne Carter who attends 
West Texas State College at Can­
yon came home Saturday to spend 
Easter with home folks.

ina Fay Sweny spent the week­
end in ‘Amarillo visiting in the T. 
R. Lowery home.

The children of the neighbor­
hood enjoyed an Easter egg hunt 
last Simday.

The basement walls for the new 
Spurlock Church have been run. 
The men of the neighborhood have 
each helped in tearing down the 
old building and in hauling sand 
and gravel and building the base­
ment.

Mrs. Luther Browder spent last 
week in Gray, Oklahoma visiting 
her mother.

Travis Spurlock expects to move 
into their new modern home this 
week.

ORDINANCE NO. 116
AN ORDINANCE PROHIBITING 

THE PARKING OF LARGE 
TRUCKS AJJD MACHINERY ON 
MAIN STREET.

Whereas, by ordinance passed on 
the 3rd day of April 1947, the City 
Council of the City of Stratford, 
Texas, ordered that parking of ma­
chinery and trucks exceeding 122- 
inch wheel base will be prohibited 
on Main Street from the intersec­
tion of the Rock Island Railroad 
northwest to the intersection of 
Collins Avenue.

Persons failing, resisting or re­
fusing to comply with any of the 
conditions of the requirements of 
this ordinance, shall foe deemed 
guilty of a misdemeanor and upon 
conviction thereof shall be fined 
the sum of not less than $1.00 nor 
more than $100.00, for each of­
fense; and each failure to comply 
with the conditions of this ordin­
ance shall be deemed as a separ-

BUTANE - PROPANE

TANKS - BOTTIES 

Thermostats - Regulators' 

BOTTLE EXCHANGE

Slay’s Furniture

ate offense, and shall be fined as in 
other cases.

This ordinance shall take effect 
and be in force after four publica­
tions in the Stratford Star.

Passed and approved this 3rd

day of April, A. D. 1947.
G. R. GARRISON, Mayor, 

(Seal) The City of Stratford,
Texas.

Attest: Brown Ross, Secretary. 
4—10 17 24 5—1

Hand Painted Clothes Hampers, 
Kleenex Boxes and Waste Baskets
Tuscan Fine Bone China Coffee Cups and Saucers 

Stafford’s Bone China In Coffee Services And After 
Dinner Cups and Saucers

Ladies Plastic and Kid Bags
ON SALE AT 1-3 OFF

Robbie’s Gift Shop

Yes, W e Have Some More Beautiful

LADIES  

SPRING

Coats
And

Suits
These new spring 

creations are offer­

ed in 100%  Wool 

Gaberdines and 

Crepes.

We also have an attrac­

tive display of —

Spring Blouses

Ross Bros. Dry Goods

INTERNATIONAL
HARVESTER

We second the motion 
We’ll ^  our part!

Infemdlionul Harvester has reduced prices to save users of 
its products $20,000,000 a year. The reductions apply to r 
selected list of various products made by the Company.

In making its annoimcement to the general public last weel^ 
International Harvester said:

**We believe there is nothing more important to ihis country 
than to lower the prices of goods people buy.

**The American people have insisted that the government 
withdraw from its attempts to control prices in peacetime. 
That places the responsibility where it heUmgs-'in the hands 
of business and industry.

^ "Because we believe price reduction is irital, we,ere wfOktg 
io assume the risks involved.*^

[As International Dealers we will do our part We will pav 
XntCTnational Harvester’s price reduetienw Io our eustomeaa

And now a word of gratitude fo our friends who have 
patiently waited for the new machines they need. As most of 
our customers are aware. International Harvester has done 
evmything possible—and some things that seemed impossible 
—to maintain and increase production.

The outlook is somewhat better. Soon we hope to supply 
equipment to all of those who have cooperated so faithfully 
with us.

Meanwhile, the same top-quality International Service and 
Parts diat have kept equipment operating for our customers 
during die difficult years are available from us. We urge out? 
friends io  continue to use these facilities to obtain TYinyimimn \ 
operating economy.

Iniemational Harvester is doing its part witb qualify, Iz^  ̂
eicased production and reduced prices. ^
Wa will do our part in this territory *

W. T. MARTIN
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CROSS
T O W N

Bv
Roland Coe

‘Pop, how about increasing my allowance to a point 
where it’s worth complaining about?” “ It’s in celebration of Dad’s new raise!’*

NANCY By Ernie Bushmiller

REG’LAR FELLERS By Gene B3rni^

SILENT SAM

SEWING CIRCLE PATTERNS

f liM , C o o t.,L g ^ n ig ^ o w n  S u m m e r  \ ^ o o l n e 6 A

•Slilrtwalster' f^ eren n la i ^^auorite

8134
12-42

Cool Nightdress

An e x q u is it e  nightdress to 
keep you cool on summer 

nights. And it’s so easy to make, 
so easy to launder. The tiny 
sleeves are just right, narrow rib­
bon adds a pretty finish. You’ll 
want to run up several in differ­
ent fabrics.

Pattern No. 8134 comes in sizes 12, 14, 
16, 18, 20; 40 and 42. Size 14, yards 
of 36 or 39-inch; 5 yards ribbon.

O— O- f'— <v» fVw

I ASK Me ]
\ ANOTHen • ’
\ A General Quii
fw (v« o - t

The Questions

1. How can a new state be cre­
ated?

2. What is the difference be­
tween ingenious and ingenuous?

3. To the ancient Hebrews Pal­
estine was known as what?

4. What was the first newspaper 
published?

5. Which is the only state in the 
Union to give a condemned man 
his choice of death by hanging or 
in front of a firing squad?

6. Is a woman member of con­
gress referred to as “ congress­
man” or “ congresswoman” ?

7. Prince Otto von Bismarck led 
Germany into how many wars?

8. Buffalo Bill’s real name was 
what?

The Answers

1. Only by congress.
2. Ingenious, having an aptitude 

for invention; ingenuous, open, 
frank,

3. The “ Land of Canaan.”
4. The earliest known newspaper 

was the Acta Diurna, published 
Rome several centuries B. C.

5. Utah.
6. She is referred to as “ the con­

gresswoman from (her state).”
7. Three (with Denmark, Aus­

tria and with France).
8. William Frederick Cody.

1617
14-46

Tailored Shirtwaist Frock 
'^H IS  crisply tailored shirtwaist 

frock has that casual, clean-cut 
look all women admire. It be­
comes every figure, is suitable to 
any occasion. Wear it now through 
summer with assurance.

Pattern No. 1617 Is for sizes 14, 16, 18, 
20; 40, 42, 44 and 46. Size 16, STi yards 
of 35 or 39-inch.

SEWING CIRCLE PATTERN DEPT. 
530 South Wells St. Chicago 7, 111.

Enclose 25 cents in coins for each 
pattern desired.
Pattern
Name-
Address.

HARSH LAXATIVES 
UNNECESSARY?

Millions Find Healthful Fresh 
Fruit Drink Gives Them AH 
the Laxative Aid They Need

Don’t form the habit of depending 
on harsh, griping laxatives until 
you’ve tried this easy, healthful way 
millions now use to keep reĝ ular.

It’s fresh lemon juice and water 
taken first thing in the morning—just 
as soon as you get up, the juice of 
one Sunkist Lemon in a glass of water. 
Taken thus, on an empty stomach, it 
stimulates normal bowel action, day 
after day, for most people.

And lemons are actively good for 
you. They’re among the richest 
sources of vitamin C, which com­
bats fatigue, helps resist colds and 
infections. They supply vitamins B| 
and P, aid digestion and help alka- 
linize the system.

Try this grand wake-up drink 10 
mornings, ^ e  if it doesn’t help youl 
Use California Sunkist Lemons.

J U N G L E  H A M M O C K S
New W ar Surplus

For the home, yard, farm, campittg.

Made of grade Poplin for'gti _
Arm y. Complete with ropes ond canopy for 
protection against mosquitoes and other in­
sects. Comes individually packed. e  M Q C  
Ready for immediate shipment, O n  

Add 10%  for Postage. *4‘
ROKO COMPANY

7 2 9  BALTIMORB KA N SA S CITY, M O .

FlGlschmann's Dry Yeast
is right there when you need it

•  G et it to d a y ! Fleischm ann’s Fast 
R ising D ry  Yeast, the m odern baking 
discovery that keeps fresh in the cup­
board  for  w eeks—always "on  the spot”  
for  extra-quick baking, extra delicious 
results. IF Y O U  BAKE A T  H O M E - 
lay in a g o o d  supply o f  speedy acting 
Fleischm ann’s Fast R ising D ry Y ea st- 
use it as you  need it. A t your grocer's.

î eps in the cupboard
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Still a Bargain
“ What do you think of the high 

cost of living?”
“ It’s worth it,”

Forgery, Begorryt
Casey and Murphy were asked to 

witness the signing of a will. Casey duly 
signed, but, being unable to write, put 
an X.

*'Begorra, Casey,”  Murphy exclaimed, 
seeing this, ''you’ve gone and signed my 
name!”

Finding Out
Friend—Well, how is married 

life?
Bride—Lovely, but what do you 

think? My husband really does 
stutter and I always thought it was 
emotion.

Fresh Then
Diner—I wish I haci come to this 

restaurant last year when I was in 
town.

Proprietor—It’s very kind of you 
to say that, sir.

Diner—Yes, this fish would have 
been about right then.

Out of Sight
**I know I’m not really much to 

look at,”  admitted the fiance.
“ Oh, well,”  philosophized his 

bride-to-be, “ you’ll be at the office 
most of the time.”

CLASSIFIED
D E P A R T M E N T

AUTOS, TRUCKS & ACCESS.
NEW & USED TIRES and Tubes. large 
selection. Mail orders. Sun. noon. EAGLE 
TIRE CO., 3463 Larimer, Denver, Colo.

BUSINESS & INVEST. OPPOR.
FOR SALE—Laundry, helpy-self and fin­
ish work. It’s only laundry in Gunnison, 
Colo.. Box 666, Tele. 374.

FOR SALE
Garage, stock and equipment includi&g 
arc and acetylene welders. Liv. quarters 
In shop. Price $3,500. Leaving for Calif. 
ERNEST E. ANDERSON, Rexford, Kans.

FARM MACHINERY & EQUIP.
WESTERN RED CEDAR FENCE POSTS 

Sale by Carloads.
BONNER CEDAR CO., Sandpoint, Idaho

28-46 OLIVER Red River Special thresh­
ing machine, 14-ft. feeder, all roller bear­
ings. In good condition. JOHN D. M EYER, 
Seward, Nebraska, Fh. 8335.

FARMS AND RANCHES
200 ACRES, 6 S., 3 E. of Peabody, Kansas. 
Excellent land. Large barn, new granary, 
good house. 35 in pasture, 16 alfalfa. Bal­
ance cultivation. $20,000.
NEWTON FINANCE*INVESTM ENT CO. 
Newton . . . .  Kansas
A  SOUND INVESTMENT, 992 acres. 732 
A. wheat, near Groom, in Gray Co., on 
U. S. 66, S.W. of Pampa, half oil produc­
tion reserved, all wheat goes, 30 bu. pros­
pect; this farm has heavy production rec­
ord. Price $85 A. Purchaser leases for oil, 
acquire a loan, market big wheat crop; no 
large amount of cash. Immed. poss. S. K. 
Roach, Groom, Tex., P.O. Bx. 148, Ph. 13.

_______MISCELLANEOUS______
ROLL Developed — Overnight Service. 
2 High Gloss Prints each negative. All 
■sizes, 25c. Re-prints, 3c each.
FOX STUDIOS - - Billings, Montana

TREE GROWS IN BROOKLYN
502 pages; Life On Mississippi, David 
Harum, One More Spring, 4 books. Send$l. 
CURTIS, 630 North Grand, St. Louis, Mo.

POULTRY, CHICKS & EQUIP.
U. S. APPROVED Pullorum Tested Chicks 
In all popular breeds culled for quick 
maturing; straight run chicks as low as 
$9 .50 per 100; send for our prices and guar­
antee. GIBBS HATCHERY, Laddonia, Mo.

SEEDS, PLANTS, ETC.
FOR SALE—Sand lovegrass seed, $3 per 
pound; shipment prepaid.
MARK W. CULLEN, Guymon, Oklahoma

Gas on Stomach
IMieved in 5 minutes or double your money back

When excess stomach acid caases painfol. suffocat- 
laggas. sour stomach and heartburn, doctors usually 
prescribe the fastest-acting medicines known for 
symptomatic relief — medicines like those i n Bell-ana 
Tablets. No laxative. Bell-ans brings comfort in a 
jiffy  • ■to OG. or double your money back on return o f  bottle 

08. 25e at all druggists.

New Hampshires
U. S. Approved—^Pullorum Tested. 
Our New Hampshires are out­
standing for fast, uniform growth, 
imusual hardiness, and layers of 
large eggs. We also hatch all lead­
ing breeds and Austra-Whites. Write 
for  folder and Special Discounts.
Wells Hatchery, Lyons, Kan.

Wichita’s Greatest Values In

S E E  N E W  T R A V E L IT E S — U N IV E R S A L S
Used Trailers Bought and Sold. ‘

Bring this ad for free trailer dishes with 
new trailer purchase. We also pay for 
gas on trip to Wichita.

General Sales Company
1108 E . C en tra l, W ich ita . T e l. 2-8977

WNU—H 15—47

Help Them Cleanse the Blood 
of Harmful Body Waste

Your kidneys are constantly fil-.erlnt 
waste matter from the blood stream. But 
kidneys sometimes lag in their work—-dc 
not act as Nature intended—fail to re­
move impurities that, if retained, ma} 
poison the system and upset the whoh 
body machinery.

Symptoms may be nagging backucbe 
persistent headache, attacks of dizziness 
getting up uights, swelling, puffinest 
under the eyes—a feeling of nervoui 
anxiety and loss of pep and strength

Other signs of kidney or bladder dis­
order are sometimes'burning, scGUity oi 
too frequent urination.

There should be no doubt chat prompt 
treatment is wiser than neglect. Us« 
Doan’s Pills, Doan’s have been winning 
new friends for more than forty years 
They have a nation-wide reputation. 
Are recommended by grateful people thi 
country over. Ask yout neighbor!

Grantland Rice

'T'HIS is supposed to be the season 
when baseballs are thudding into 

gloves and bats are thudding against 
bhseballs. But, apparently, football 
now covers the entire 12 months.

It might surprise you to know how 
many football coaches, scouts and 

players are seeking 
the sun, or holding 
s p r i n g  - training 
south of the Mason 
and Dixon line, as 
well as above. And 
they already have 
started t a l k i n g  
about next fall, in­
cluding the 12 or 15 
bowl games that 
will open the cam­
paign of 1948.

There will be one 
of the wildest shifts 

of coaches this season that football 
has ever known. There are new 
men at California, Alabama, North­
western, Cornell, Mississippi, San 
Francisco university, Ohio State, 
Pittsburgh, Maryland—too many to 
mention. But a big part of the old 
guard is still standing pat.

We have been taking a vote of 
these sun-seeking wanderers, here in 
Florida, to get an early line on 
what might happen from September 
to November. We first ran into a 
well-known eastern coach, one of the 
best, who had this prophecy to offer;
Navy vs. Pennsylvania

“ The college battle in the East 
should be between Navy and Penn­
sylvania. They have the two strong­
est squads coming up. Columbia 
and Yale can be close. Yale espe­
cially so, if Howie Odell can dig up 
another line. Both Yale and Colum­
bia will have fine backs. Cornell 
can be strong—and probably will be. 
The eastern race will be a good one, 
one of the best in many years. 
Army? A guess. No team can lose 
nine of its best starting team, espe­
cially such men as Blanchard, Da­
vis, Tucker, Foldberg and Poole, and 
have too much left. This should be 
Navy’s year, as far as West Point 
and Annapolis go. Army won’t be 
bad, but none too good. It may 
lose four games.

“ South—Georgia loses Trippi and 
others. Look out for Alabama, Tn- 
lane and Tennessee. Tulane can be 
extra good. So can LSU. And 
don’t overlook North Carolina with 
Charlie Justice. Duke is still a 
guess.”

“ Just a minute,”  another scout 
cut in. “ If you leave out Georgia 
Tech you are crazy. This will be 
the team to beat in the South.”

On the early evidence, it seems 
that the South again will face one 
of its big seasons, with at least 8 or 
10 strong teams.

Moving to the Midwest, the vote 
went to Michigan in the Biĝ  Nine 
roundup, with Notre Dame heading 
the country’s list, East, West, North 
or South.

“ Frank Leahy's Notre Dame 
squad should be even stronger than 
it was last season,”  one traveling 
scout reported. “ Notre Dame has 
most of her veterans back, most of 
her stars, plus some young backs who 
will be brilliant. The squad again 
wiU be two or three deep. As Leahy 
happens to be one of the game’s 
ablest coaches, you can see what this 
means. A South Bend gall(^ all 
fall.”

Michigan is rated highly in the 
Big Nine, without an early Army- 
game pressure to set her back this 
time. Ohio State and Minnesota 
both will be dangerous. Illinois loses 
several of her best men, including 
Agase and Buddy Young. Missouri, 
Nebraska and Oklahoma are rated 
well.

In the ever-hustling Southwestern 
conference, Jess Neeley’s team t̂ 
Rice is given a good chance to re­
peat. The battle for conference 
leadership is so fiercely fought in 
this section that early predictions 
are useless.
UCLA Leads in West

“ What about the West coast?”  I 
asked a wayfarer from California.

“ UCLA should still be the strong­
est squad,” he said. “ I know 
how terrible they looked against 
Illinois, but 'they are a far better 
team than that game showed. When 
the Army game was called off, 
the spirit of the squad took a heavy 
drop. UCLA still has a strong nu­
cleus left, a bunch that will be keen 
to wipe out that Rose Bowl showing.

“ Stanford will be improved. So 
will California and Southern Califor­
nia. I don’t know so much about 
the Northwest.”

I have a feeling that the pressure 
will be lightened, this next fall, in 
the way of salaries and recruiting. 
This doesn’t mean perfection. It 
means that the effort, on the side 
of amateur play, will begin showing 
early effects. 'The game was un­
doubtedly getting out of hand.

Tiger Pitching Best
The Tigers may miss lank Hank 

Greenberg’s busy bat, but they still 
expect to beat out the Yankees for 
second place. They also expect to 
crowd in much closer on the fâ  
vored Red Sox, and perhaps movo 
into the front spot.

The answer to this is pitching. Tho 
Tigers have the best pitching staff 
in both leagues. The one team that 
might argue this point is the Cardi­
nals.

Gems of Thought
'^W O  necessities in doing a 
-*■ great and important work: 

a definite plan and a limited 
time.—Hubbard.

A man should never be ashamed 
to own he has been in the wrong, 
which is hut saying in other words, 
that he is wiser today than he was 
yesterday.

Hypocrisy is the homage 
which vice renders to virtue.— 
La Rochefoucauld.

Beauty and Health
By Simple Exercise

Y ^ H A T  type of exercise is help- 
’  ful in slimming the waist and 

midriff? The main thing is to get 
those lazy muscles working again, 
BO concentrate on brisk stretching 
or twisting exercises.

Try this one: Stand with arms out to 
the sides, and kick your right leg across 
your body, trying to touch the left hand. 
Feel that stretch? Return leg to position, 
and kick the left leg. Do 12 times, alter­
nating legs

Whatever your figure problem, our 
Reader Service Booklet No. 90 can help 
you. Exercises for slimming hips, waist, 
bust, legs, ■ neck, back. Send 25 cents 
(coin) for “ Beauty and Health Through 
Simple Exercises”  to Weekly Newspaper 
Service, 243 W. 17th St., New York 11, 
N. . Print name, address, booklet title 
and No. 90.

J ju iw u L  p h m n in g ..

I An elderly couple had been sit­
ting in front of the evening fire a 
long time without speaking. At 
last the husband inquired, “ What 
are you thinking about?”

To which the wife replied: “ I 
was just thinking how long we 
have lived together and that it 
couldn’t go on forever like this and 
that the time will soon come when 
one of us will have to go,”

“ Yes,”  assented the old man, 
“ but it is no use to worry about 
that now. Mother.”

“ No,”  was the calm reply, “ but 
I was just thinking that when it 
does happen, I would like to go to 
California to live.”

PuH the Trigger on
\ a z y " \ n n a r d s

WHEN CONSTIPATION makes you fed  
punk as the dickens, brings on stomach 
upset, sour taste, gassy discomfort, 
t ^ e  Dr. Caldwell’ s famous medicine 
to quickly pull the trigger on lazy “ in­
nards”  and help you feel bright a&d 
chipper again.
DR. CALDWELL’S is the wonderful sen­
na laxative contained in good old Syrup 
Pepsin to make it so easy to take. 
MANY DOCTORS use pepsin prepara­
tions in prescriptions to make the medi­
cine more palatable and agreeable to 
take. So be sure your laxative is con­
tained in Syrup Pepsin.
INSIST ON DR. CALDWELL’S— the fa­
vorite of millions for 50 years, and feel 
that wholesome relief from constipa­
tion. Even finicky children love i t  
CAUTION: Use only as directed.

DR.GUMLL’S
SENNA LAXATIVE

co»u,«o.» syrup pepsin

OUR 
•CAP-BRUSH’ 
APPLICATOR 

MAKES BLACK 
LEAF 40 GO

MUCH FARTHER package.
B u y  o n ly  in  fa cto ry  sestod p a c k - «  
ages to  in su re  
f u ll  s tre n g th .

tliack Leal 40 spread on the 
roosts gives off fumes as chickens 
perch. Lice and feather-mites are 
killed. Full directions m every

itid

t-M H p  M ij

”“ pno?iT

Saving surplus and con­
verting drought stricken 
crops to proiliable feed is 
the fob for your Dodson 
Silo. Order now for early 
installation. Free litera­
ture — silos, grain bins, 
form buildings.

IMPROVED 
UNIFORM INTERNATIONAL

SUNDAY I
CHOOL Lesson

By HAROLD L. LUNDQUIST. D. D.
Of The Moody Bible Institute of Chicago. 

Released by Western Newspaper Union.

Lesson for April 13
Lesson subjects and Scripture texts se- 

lec.»-u and copyrighted by International 
Council of Religious Education; used by 
permission.

THE KINGDOM ESTABLISHED

LESSON TEXT—I Samuel 8:1, 2; 11:12,

^^MEMORY SELECTION—Blessed Is the 
nation whose God is the Lord.—Psalm 33:12.

A major crisis had come in the 
history of Israel when we left them 
in our study of January-March, 
1946. They were ready to change 
their form of government. They no 
longer wanted God to rule them 
directly through his representa­
tives, but wanted a king like other 
nations round about them.

God acceded to their request and 
instructed his servant Samuel to 
anoint Saul as king, and they began 
that period in their history which 
led to their ultimate captivity and 
disgrace. We shall study together 
during the next three months the 
facts and factors involved in the 
rise and fall of the nation of Israel.

Our lesson concerns their first 
king, Saul, the son of Kish, who 
promised to be a great and good 
king, but who failed through dis­
obedience.

I. Saul—a Choice Man and God- 
Chosen King (9:1, 2; 15:1).

To begin well is to be far on the 
road to success. Here was a man of 
excellent quality, “ a choice young 
man and a goodly” —in fact, there 
was not among his people one who 
surpassed him. What a splendid rec­
ommendation for the prospective 
ruler!

His physical appearance was also 
attractive. That is not as great a 
factor in success as some think, but 
it does have a bearing on a man’s 
influence over others.

Most important of all, this man 
Saul was the one whom not only 
the people but also the Lord had 

' chosen. The Lord sent Samuel 
(15:1) to anoint Saul as king, and 
to give him the key to success as 
ruler—obedience to the voice of 
God.

II. Saul—an Obedient and God- 
Blessed King (11:12, 13).

The attitude of a man toward his 
enemies is often the test of his 
character. Bitterness, hatred, re­
venge, or veiled hostility with a 
purpose of ultimate destruction— 
these are the common reactions of 
men toward them who oppose 
them.

Saul, who was not essentially dif­
ferent in his own spirit (as we shall 
see later), was a man after God’s 
own heart in his early reign, for he 
was obedient to the Lord.

Some “ worthless fellows” de­
spised Saul and refused to recognise 
him as king. The urge of the flesh 
to destroy them was aggravated by 
their own unworthiness. Some 
wanted to put them to death for 
their disloyalty to the king, but Saul 
in true kingly spirit, and recogniz­
ing that he reigned by the good 
grace of the Lord, decreed that 
there was to be no revenge, but 
rejoicing.

*1110 story which we touch on so 
briefly here is one that teaches the 
eternal truth that the way of bless­
ing and power is the way of obedi­
ence to the laws and the will of 
God.

Saul began well, but before long 
his pride and self-will began to as­
sert itself and he thus brought to 
ruin and personal disaster that 
which had begun with such promise 
and blessing. There were many 
such incidents, but we consider only 
one.

III. Saul—a Disobedient and God- 
Rejected King (15:22-26, 34, 35).

God had commanded that there 
must be utter destruction of the 
Amalekites and their possessions— 
something like the burning of a dis­
ease-infested house—a wiping out 
of a king and people who were con­
demned of God. We may not fully 
understand this act of God, but if 
we know him we will not doubt that 
it was in accordance with his infi­
nite wisdom and love.

Saul chose to disobey, later con­
tending that it was done because of 
the people, that sheep and oxen had 
been spared for a sacrifice to the 
Lord. Samuel cut through his hy­
pocrisy and declared that (Jod 
wants obedience rather than sac­
rifice. This is a lesson that many 
who profess to follow the Lord have 
not learned.

The church or the individual who 
denies or disregards the teaching of 
God’s Word and attempts to make 
up for it by sacrifices and cere­
monies declares to the world that 
there has been a departure from 
true faith in God. Obedience is a 
virtue all too rare.

Too late! What sad words—and 
never sadder than when they speak 
of spiritual failure. Saul talked of 
repentance and prayer, but the 
Lord had already rejected him as 
king.

There comes a time when God’s 
patience with man’s disobedience is 
exhausted, and the door to further 
service is closed. It is a long, long 
way to the boundary line of God’s 
patience; but mark it well, there is 
a boundary line!

NEEDLEWORK PATTERNS

Lovely Veacock Chair Covering

Embroidered Chair Set
"Y^OUR fine upholstered furniture 

needs a protective covering like 
this exquisite chair set. The pea­
cock is embroidered, the fascinat-

OUSEHOLD
lliTSI

ing pineapple crochet is designed 
to form the tail of the peacock.

To obtain complete crocheting instnie* 
tions, transfers for the Peacock Chair Sat 
(Pattern No. 5092), color chart for em­
broidering, send 20 cents in coin, your 
name, address and the pattern number.

Due to an unusually large demand and 
current conditions, slightly more time la 
required in filling orders for a few of Ow 
most popular patterns.

Send your order to:

SEWING CIRCLE NEEDLEWORK 
530 South Wells St. Chicago 7, 111.

Enclose 20 cents for Pattern.
No________________
N am i»

Address-

Old engine$ 
made young

, "l.’fr .. I •}, •'./ragain!

Obtain a piece of window pane
the size of your cookbook. Bind 
the edges by gluing a half-inch 
strip of thick cloth around it. Then, 
when following a recipe, open your 
cookbook and place the glass over 
it. Recipe can plainly be read 
through the glass, and the glass 
also prevents the book from clos­
ing while it’s being used.
1 —

Use precaution when selecting a
lining for your jacket or coat. It 
should last as long as the garment. 

— •—
Knives and other kitchen gadgets

with painted handles should not be 
allowed to stand in water. The 
wood under the enamel will absorb 
water and cause the paint to chip 
off.

— • —

Cut off the buttons before throw­
ing an old garment away. Slip a 
fork under the button and cut 
thread with scissors or razor 
blade.

— • —

Iron rayon jerseys lightly and
don’t pull the garment. Avoid hav­
ing the iron too hot or the result 
may be disastrous.

— • —

To prevent rust marks on bath­
room or kitchen fixtures where 
scouring powder can rests, dip the 
bottom of the can in hot paraffin.

Restore O riginal Power; 
Save Gas, Save Oil With New 
Sealed Power Piston Rings

There’s a Sealed Power Indi­
vidually Engineered Ring Set 
specially made for y o u r  en­
gine. These sets are made up 
from  tw enty-six  (2 6 ) basic 
designs o f Sealed Power Piston 
Rings. "Whatever the make; 
model, or cylinder wear con-* 
dition, there’s a Sealed Power 
R ing Set specifica lly  engir 
neered to do the best 
possible job. See 
your Sealed Power 
Franchise Dealer.

INDIVIDUALLY 
ENGINEERED

SEALED POWER 
P I S T O N  RINGS

BEST IN NEW ENGINES!
BEST IN OLD ENGINES! *

WAR SURPLUS— Cost Gov’ t  Approx. $ 1M

NEW r r  BOATS

Used for fishing, hunting, swimming, etc. 
Guaranteed. Can be inflate in less than 5 
minutes. Ponable. folds up in case. Can bo 
carried under arm. When so sS q  |g 
inflated it is ft* long 9  ■ JW  9  9
by 3 ft. w id e ................ .. ^  ,
Immediate Shipment- Sent postpaid. Write foc 
prices on 4 man. 3 man, and 7 man boatt.

ROKO COMPANY
TMBaltlmor* - Kansas City, NMh

^AMF! CRACKLE! AND TOP! SAY^**
fiEAf-

pop!

mGE KBISPIES/^«||
Be sure you get A m erica’s favorite rice cereal, 
the one and only K ellogg’s  R ice Krispies!

Time on lour Hands!?

Would you like to have more spare time— to 
spend with your children, attend meetings or 
for your hobbies?

Well, just try using Red Star Active Dry 
Yeast the next time you bake. Y ou ’ll find that 
this new, different yeast reduces rising time, 
makes kneading easier and saves precious min­
utes. Y ou ’ll be delighted, too, at the improved 
flavor, texture and crust color.

Ask your grocer for Red Star, the dry yeast 
that needs no refrigeration, that keeps fresh 
and active on your pantry shelf for weeks.

KAY ROGERS SAYSi
“ Try Red Star Yeast with yomr 
old recipes and be assured of 
good results. It, however, you’d 
like me to send you my new 
recipes, simply write 
me In care of Red 
Star Yeast A Prod­
ucts Co., Dept.
WN-4, Milwaukee I.
Wisconsin.’’

DRY
YEAST
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10 Big Days

All Ladies

Coats and 
Suits
1 /3  OFF

One Rack Ladies Dresses 

Greatly Reduced 

For This Sale

Our First 
Anniversary

On this occasion we wish to express our appreciation to all 
of you for the splendid reception we received in Stratford on our 
opening one year ago. Most of you realized the handicap un­
der which we opened during a period of acute shortages of many 
items. However, we have made every effort to secure the mer­
chandise you desired and feel that we now have an excellent 
stock of merchandise to offer you. We have secured such Na­
tionally advertised lines as Nelly-Don, Jerri, Doris Dodson, Gor- 
don-Togs, Hobbies, Don-a-Togs and Prima Dona Dresses for 
Women and Misses; Sandra Sharon Dresses for Girls; Style- 
Mart, Finlay Hall, and Marx Made Clothes for Men; Hickok Belts 
and Billfolds; E & W Dress and Sport Shirts; Dickie Work 
Clothes; Levis; Simplicity Patterns; Quadriga Print and Many 
Others.

Our first year has far exceeded our anticipations and we 
hope it is the first of many years of pleasant associations with 
our friends and customers.

We gratefully acknowledge and express our thanks to our 
customers, our wholesale houses, and the friends without whose 
help and wonderful cooperation we could not have opened our 
store during such a trying period.

As one means of expressing our thanks to our many custo­
mers we are having this ten day sale and we think we have some 
real bargains to offer each and everyone of you.

Mr. and Mrs. H.<F. McIntosh

KNIT SLIPS 
Reg. $3.50 $ ^ .9 5
Now “

Lydia Grey
Scented
TISSUES

Ladies Black 
PANTIES

Reg. $1.76 $ ^  .49
Now •

On

Ladies Rayon 
PANTIES

Reg. $2.00 $H .75 
Now ^
Regular $1.56 $ ^  .25 
Now
Regular $1.38 $|| .00 
Now *
Regular $1.25 $ ^  .00
Now ^
Regular .92 
Now
Regular .78 Pffic
Now

^ H %  Discount 
All Costume 
JEWELRY

Purchased During This Sale

RECEIVING
BLANKETS  

Reg. .68 $1
Now 2 For ^

.00

REAL SILK HOSE
Size 9 Only

Regular $3.25 
Now

79
59

Seamless Rayon 
HOSE

Were 59c $
Now 2 Pair for 1

Cotton SNUGGIES 
Regular .99 
Now_____________ /  J

P A N T Y  GIRDLE 
Regular $1.95 $ ^  .50 
Now "

GIRDLE
Regular $5.00 $ ^ .2 5  
Now

W e will have One 
Table of Other Items 
Greatly Reduced and 
New Items will be 
added to this table 
Each Day.

LADIES PLAY  
SHOES

Regular $2.95 $ ^ .2 5  
Now ®

W e have secured 
an account with GOS- 
SARD and our first 
shipment of Brassiers 
and light weight Gir­
dles will arrive soon.

GIRLS DRESSES 
And

PLA Y SUITS 
1 /2  PRICE

ONE LOT LADIES  
BLOUSES 
1 /2  PRICE

Men’s OVERALLS
8-Ounce Sanforized, Graduated 

Rise — Red Ball
Regular $3.95 $ ^ .9 5  
Now ^

Entire Stock of Fine 
LUGGAGE  
2 0 %  OFF

M EN’S SO X
Reg. 50c Value $ f  
Now 3 Pairs for ^

April 10-19

R A YO N  FABRIC

MEN’S SPORT COATS
Latest Spring Shades 1.00

Values To S24.95 Now
B O Y ’S SPRING DRESS SUITS

Sizes 7 to 18
Values To $19.35

MEN’S DRESS TROUSERS
In Tropical Worsted ^pm.95 To ^ .95

______1 ______14_
$27.50 to $42.50

Part Wool and Rayon
Men’s Suits
B U Y YO U R ALL W OOL SLACKS  

For Your Vacation Now 
1 /2  PRICE

* 2
Every Slack Suit Purchased 
Will Be Reduced

o

K iLL A R N EY

SPOETSWEAS

tailored by
M A R X  M A D E

Handsome jackets m 
cashmeres, tweeds and 

cheviots Free-and-easy 
slacks in gabardines, 

flannels, tropicals, 
worsteds and the 

popular "Bur-Mil" 
Rayon Fabric Fine 

sportswear tailored 
by the skilled crafts­

men of Marx Made.

3
COTTON PRINT

AU New Spring Shades. Guaranteed Fast 
Colors; Regular 42c Value; Now 3 Yards for

Quadriga Cloth Yard 49c

OUTING FLANNEL
36 Inches Wide, White, Pink, Blue,
Regular 49c Value; Now 3 Yards for ' &

Limited Quantity Of BLUE $ 4  
C H A M B R A Y 5 Yards for * o

MflTDSH DRY GOODS
We Give S. & H. Green Stamps


