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JIM AND JODY PEARSON

Jim and Jody Pearson of 
Stamford. Nebraska, will 
present singin^t Gospel 
Music Country Style at the 
first Chnstian Church. 303 
West 8th. Friday. February 
2. at 7 p m.

I he public is invited to 
attend.

The Pearsons are in a full 
time ministry of praising the 
Lord and encouraging people 
in the Lord through concerts, 
revivals, working in 
Christian Service Camps and 
other ways. They have 
worked with B.J. Vernon, 
Howard Davis. Riley Donica 
and many others.

OIL NEWS
Louisiana Crude Oil &  Gas 

Co. Inc. o f New Orleans will 
drill No. 2 Raymond Beck in 
the Pat Kahan (Mississip- 
pian) Field in Eastland 
County.
The planned 4,100-foot 

venture is located on a 
114-acrc lease five miles 
north of Eastland.

It spots 2,230 feet from the 
south and 2.107 feet from the 
east lines of Section 21. Block 
4, HAiTC Survey.

ScTS Oil & Gas Co., Brown- 
wiM>d. will drill No. I Clausen 
in the regular field two miles 
northeast of Williams.
The planned 3.200-foot ven­

ture is located on a 100-acre 
lease.
It spots b.OOO feet from the 

north and 6.800 feet from the 
east lines o f H.P. Brewster 
Survey 700.

F.J. Saddler. Abilene, will 
drill two regular field 
projects in the county.
No. IS E.P. Kilgore is a 

planned 1.250-foot venture 
for the area four miles north­
east of Cross Cut.
Drillsite is 450 feet from the 

north and 660 feet from the 
west lines of N.B. Mitchell 
Survey 153.
The lease is composed of 75 

acres.

Other venture is No. 1 Reba 
L. Keeler, located on a 
200-acre lease two miles east 
of Cross Cut.
Site is 4,027 feet from the 

north and 150 feet from the 
west lines o f Patrick Curlong 
Survey 151.
Permit depth'applied for is 

1,350 feet.

New Hope Exploration dt 
Development o f Abilene 
completed No. 1 Monroe 
Walker in the Pat Kahan 
(Mississippian) Field five 
miles northwest of Eastland 
in Eastland County.
Location is 467 feet from the 

south and 547 feet from the 
east lines of Section 34, Block 
4. H&TC Survey.
Daily potential was 13 

barrels o f 42 navHy oil, plus 
one barrel o f water.

Flow was through a 16-64 
inch choke wMi AM) pounds 
casing and 142 pounds 
tubing pressures.
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f Nostolgia Night' 
jTo Be Presented 
By G C  Stoge Bond

1 StCliOR Oko, Ttm

Comanche Trail Council 
To Honor 30 Scoutmasters

“ Nostalgia Night," will be 
presented by the Cisco 
Junior College Stagehand 
Tuesday, Feb. 6, in the Roof 
Garden of the Victor Hotel at 
7:00 p.m. This dinner theatre 
production will reminisce the 
old “ ballroom and big 
bands" era.

“ Stardust," and “ Senti­

mental Journey" are just two 
of some 30 great songs that 
the CJC Stage Band will 
play. The Wrangler Belles 
will also perform during the 
program.
Reservations may be made 

by calling Pat Dill at the CJC 
Switchboard, at 817-442- 
2567. Tickets are $6 each.

The thirty Scoutmasters of 
the Comanche Trail Council, 
Boy Scouts of America, will 
be honored for their out­
standing leadership as the 
council marks the introduc­
tion o f the ninth edition of 
the OfRcial Boy Scout Hand­
book.
Bill Pardue, Council 

Commissioner, said that 
each Scoutmaster will 
receive a copy o f the new

book, which was released in 
conjunction with Scouting's 
69th anniversary, at a Scout­
master's meeting, at Adams 
Street Community Center, in 
Brownwood, at 6:15 p.m. on 
February 17th.
The new Boy Scout Hand­

book is being presented 
through the generousity of 
the Brownwood Elks Lodge.
The Scoutmasters will then 

give leadership to their 
troops in preparing for the

Jim & Jody Pearson 
To Present Gospel 
Music Country Style
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Bob Lindsey Makes Appraisal 
Of Right-To-Read Program

With the first half of the 
1978-79 school year for Cisco 
Public Schools being 
completed and the second 
half of the year three weeks 
on its way, coordinator Bob 
Lindsey o f the Texas Right- 
To-Read Program in the 
Cisco Public Schools has 
made a timely appraisal of 
what is being accomplished 
in that area in grades three 
th ro u g h  s ix .
Classes for student partici­

pation in the Right-To-Read 
Program began September 
25th o f the current school 
year. However, it should be 
recalled that preparation for 
these classes begun during 
last school year. Each child 
who was scheduled to be in 
Intermediate School was 
given a Prescriptive company 
for computer greading which 
tabulated the level o f each 
child's reading ability and 
the skills each had or had not 
mastered. With this informa­
tion each o f the 272 students 
n grades three through six

plus three from Primary 
School has been placed in 
reading levels of his ability 
and in various skills classes 
that he needs to master.

Since September 2Sth 
seventy-five skill classes on 
four levels have been 
completed with the testing 
program showing the 
following results:
Grade three-83 percent 

mastery; Grade four-84.S 
percent mastery; Grade five- 
80 percent mastery; Grade 
six-82 percent mastery; and 
O ve ra ll-8 2 .375 percen t 
mastery.
In addition to the skills 

classes, enrichment partici­
pation is provided m  the 
students who have mastered 
all the prescribed skills. An 
example of an enrichment 
project is one done under the 
direction o f Mrs. Joyce 
Schaefer in which each pupil 
wrote and illustrated a b e ^  
on pre-school level. These 
books were permanently 
bound. Five enrichment

Pnnluction is from perfor­
ations at 3,753-61 feet, 
treated with 2.500 gallons of 
acid. The pay was fractured 
with 18,000 gallons of gel 
and 160 sacks of sand. 
Operator set the 4‘/i inch- 

rasing at 4,005 feet, and the 
hole is bottomed at 4,012 
feet.
Gas-oil ratio was 13,558-1.

Completed in the same field 
was Texfcl Petroleum Corp. 
No. 1-4-21-B Fee.
Unration is 2.371 feet from 

the south and 853 feet from 
the west lines of Section 21, 
BliKk 4. H&TC Survey.
Daily potential was 10 

barrels of 44 gravity oil, 
flowing through a 16-64 inch 
choke with packer set on the 
casing and 250 pounds tub­
ing pressure.
Ifroduction is from perfor­

ations at 3,807-18 feet, 
treated with 1,500 gallons of 
acid.
Operator set the 4'/a-inch 

casing at 3.900 feet, two feet 
off bottom.
Gas-oil ratio was 18,900-1.

A project was recompleted 
in the Bluff Branch (Ellen- 
burger) Field four miles 
northeast of Putnam.
It is Safari Drilling Corp. of 

Abilene No. 1 Mitcham- 
Agnew Unit, spttong 1,500 
feet from the north and 330 
feet from the west lines of 
Section 3175. TE&L Survey. 
Daily potential was 1 ^  

barrels of 48 gravity oil. Flow 
was through a 13-64 inch 
choke with packer set on the 
casing and 875 pounds tub­
ing pressure.
It is producing from perfor­

ations at 4,025-44 feet. The 
4‘/i-inch casing is set at 
4,047 feet, three feet off 
bottom.
Gas-oil ratio was 1,612-1. 
Operator had plugged off 

the Ellenburger in 1973 to 
produce the Conglomerate, 
^ e  plug was removed to 
again produce the Ellen­
burger.

Santex Oil Co. of Arlington 
No. t  Rogers Is a plannod 
800-foot wildcat for Eastknd 
County.

It will be drilled three 
miles west of Gorman on a 
700 acre lease.

Drillsite is &1S feet from 
the south and 1,649 feet from 
the east lines of george 
Miller Survey., A-S7B.

Same firm will drill N a  1 
Self as a proposed 3,400 foot 
w ildcat in the Carbon 
(Caddo) Field three miles 
west of Gorman.

Site is 660 feet from the 
south and 1,650 feet from the 
west 1 lines of Section 26; 
Block 1, HATC Survey.

The lease is composed of 80 
acres.

CapiUl Equity Transfer 
Co. of Abilene will drill No. 1 
Irene Landreth et al, in the 
regular field three miles east 
of Rising Star.

The planned 1,350 foot 
venture is located on a 180 
acre lease.

It spots 305 feet from the 
south and 1,323 feet from the 
west lines of Section 8, Block 
2, ETRR Survey.

Dallas Production Inc. No.
1 Smith was completed six 
miles northwest of Cisco in 
the Tee Jay (3,750) Field.

Location is 1,830 feet from 
the south and 467 feet from 
the east lines of Section 2055, 
TEAL Survey A-1095.

Absolute, open flow was 
800,000 cubic feet of gas 
daily. It had a gas liquid 
hyrocarbon ratio of 165,5^-1 
of 60 gravity.

Promotion is from per- 
foraUom at 3,673 to 3,710 
feet, treated with 1,000 
gallons of acid.

The 43k inch casing is set 
at 4,199 feet, one foot off 
bottom.

Enre Corp. of San Antonio 
completed No. 3 Roy Adams 
in tlw regular field 12 miles 
west of Cisco.

Location is 2,100 feet from 
the north and 2,100 feet from 
the west lines of Section 3169, 
TEAL Survey.

Dailey potential was 12 
barrels of 43 gravity oil, plus 
five barrels cf water.

It is pumping from per­
forations at 3,142,62 feet, 
treated with 16000 gallons of 
acid.

The 4Vk inch casing is set 
at 3,979 feat, one foot off 
bottom.

Southeastern Resources 
Corp. of Rising Star will 
raontar to 3,000 feat, the old 
total depth at a wildcat on»- 
half ■¿la  southwest of 
Groavanor.

It la No. 1 Jundl, located

on a 73 acre lease.
Drillsite is 2,044 feet from 

the noilh and 467 feet from 
the east lines of SecUon 43, 
HTAB Survey.

The project was ̂ g g e d  in 
1974 as John R. Thompson 
No. 1 Junnell-Kyser Unit 

A Texas Agricu ltural 
Experiment Station engineer 
has developed a “ heat pump 
concept" for drying peanuts 
when the cost of natural gas 
now supplying heat becomes 
too costly.

"The peanut industry wiU, 
sooner or later, be forced to 
change its system of drying 
its crop,”  said Nat K. Per­
son, “ as cost of energy in­
creases, or as supplies now 
used play out, or are 
diverted away from use in 
agriculture.

The heat pump concept 
wad described away from us 
in agriculture.

The heat pump concept 
was d described by Person 
as basically, and simply put, 
capture of heat from an 
exhaust, and recycling and 
rerouting it to enhance the 
heating of air flowing from 
the outside into drying bins.

This “ added heat" shor­
tens the time ( and reduces 
the total amount of energy 
which would otherwise be 
required) to dry peanuU, 
tlmwby cutting total coat of 
energy.

“ The heat pump is mors 
expensive than present) 
system in use, but looking 
down the road it won’ t be," 
Person said. “ And, the heat 
pump system for drying 
peanuts w ill become a 
reality," he added.

The research agricultural 
engineer cited two major 
problems he said the peanut 
industry will face in the 
fu tu re -- (l) high and in­
creasing costs of fossil fuel 
and ( 2) possible curtailment 
of natural gas to agriculture, 
as homes and industry are 
granted priority.

The ob jective o f the 
research and development of 
the heat pump system is to 
enable a switch from gas to 
electricity when nscesaary. 

Heat pumps have bacome 
a widely used method ef 
hasting reaidenoos, to taka 
advantage of thermal units 
in the hea air to move Into 
rssldanoes, lowering coat ef 
heating.

classes have been offered 
with four others scheduled. 
This complete program 

functions during the time 
period from 8:25 to 8:55 and 
ui no way infringes on 
regular class schedules as 
required by state regulation. 

Mr. Lindsey reports that he 
and his entire staff are 
encouraged with the tangible 
progress being made in 
endeavors to give children 
the Right-To-Read.

L a tlitra n  Youtli 
Spontoring Ground 
Nog's Doy Suppor

The Lutheran Youth Fellow­
ship of Redeemer Lutheran 
Church is sponsoring a 
Ground Hog's Day .Supper at 
iu  Parish Hall on Saturday, 
February 3. They will be 
aeivkig Waffles, Pancakes 
and Sausages and Bacon 
from S-8 p.m. The tickets 
cost $2.00 for adults and 
$1.75 for children.
The public is cordially 

invited.

Jon And D onnf 
A H U i o u g o  n u m w  

To Honor RoR
A toul of 1163 under­

graduate students have been 
named to the President's 
Honor Roll and Dean’s Lists 
for the 1978 fall semester at 
East Texas State University 
in Commerce.
Janice A lldredge was 

named to the President’ s 
Honor Roll. Denmund 
Alldredge was named to the 
Dean’s List.
The President’s Honor Roll 

includes students who 
compiled a 4.0 (a) grade 
point average for the 
semester. The Dean’s List 
include students who had at 
least a 3.25 grade point 
average. ETSU uses the 4.0 
grading system.
Students listed on the Pre­

sident’s Honor Roll also are 
considered part of the Dean’ s 
List in their particular 
college.

Chari W oH 
Nomad A t 
Sority Plodga

GEORGETOWN-Cheri 
Ward o f Cisco has been 
named as a pledge to Zeta 
Tau Alpha Sorority for 
women at Southwestern 
University at Georgetown. 
The announcement came 

following rush activities last 
week at the state’s oldest 
university.
Cheri is the daughter of Mr. 

and Mrs. Richard E. Ward of 
1400 Ave. M.

/ P E C IA L  
11 ^ 1 1  n O T IC E J
Jim Arron. June and 2^ch 

Darr of Abilene and Mr. and 
Mrs. W.L. Darr o f CIk o  
visited Theron Darr in 
Arlington and went to the 
Pompeii A.D. Exhibit in 
Dallas Museum of Fine Arts 
Sunday.

]

Sponsor
Auction Fab. 17
Cisco Booster Oub will 

sponsor an Auction Feb. 17,
1979 at CJC Ag. Building 
starting at 9 a.m. Food and 
drink will be available. We 
need donations for the 
auction. Business or indivi­
dual donations will be 
accepted. Please call 442- 
1655 to arrange for your 
donations to be picked up.
We will accept any 
donations. Proceeds will go 
to Cisco High School Athlete 
Department. We need your 
help.
The following are a list of 

contributors for the auction.
We wish to thank them for 
their generosity.

Motts, Thriftmart, Cisco 
Lumber A  Supply, Lefty 
Young Priemier Station, B&J 
Fina, Thorton Feed Mill, 
Hightower Welding, Lopez 
Gulf, JRB, Man's Short Stop, 
P o s e y 's  S ta t io n ,
Gardenhire’ s, Lois Caris 
America Handicraft, J.T. 
Richardson Station, W.W. 
Smith's Gulf Station and 
Reich's Texaco.

Stonholm Elocted 
Socratory-Traaturar

Congreeaman Charles W. 
Stenholm has been elected 
Secretary-Treasurer of the 
Freshman Class in the House 
of Representatives. This post 
is an important position of 
leadership for a new 
member.

Mr. Stenholm plans to 
remain in close contact with 
his freshman colleagues in 
the House in order to assure 
that the interest if the 17th 
District of Texas are made 
known to Members of 
Congress from other areas of 
the Nation.

council's See 'N Do. to be 
held on April 28, in each 
community in the council 
area, which will use the new 
handbook as the basis for 
troop demonstrations of 
Scouting's outdoor skills.
"The See ‘N Do is planned 

to make the pages of the new 
handbook come alive-both 
for boys who are already 
Scouts and for all those who 
come to see the event.”  
Pardue said.
The new handbook, 576 

pages of reference material 
for Scouts, outdoorsmen, 
camping fa illes, hunters 
hikers, and others, was 
written by William “ Green 
Bar B ill" Hillcourt, well- 
known Scouting author, as a 
one-year voluntary contribu­
tion to the Boy Scouts of 
America. Over the years. 
Pardue said, there have been 
more than 29 million copies 
printed of the handbook; the 
first printing of the ninth 
edition is 600,000 copies. 
“ Although the handbook is 

written for boys." Pardue 
said, “ people interested in 
the outdoors who want to 
learn the skills that are part 
of the educational program of 
Boy Scouting will find it 
useful too.”  There are more 
than 1,000 full-color 
drawings in its seven 
sections, which include 
“ What Swuting Is,”  "What 
Scouts Do.”  “ Where Scouts 
Roam,”  “ You and Other 
People." "You-American 
C itizen .”  “ Upward to 
Eagle,”  and “ From Boy to 
Man."
In addition to Scout skills.

C.W. GuHiria 
And David GM 
A ttend Som biar.

C.W. Guthrie, fire chief, 
and David Gill of the Cisco 
Fire Department, attended a 
Hazardous Material seminar 
Monday, January 22, in 
Abilene. The seminar was 
sponsored by the Big 
Country Safety Association 
and Dow Chemical.
Bill Webb and Royce Darr, 

volunteer firemen o f the 
Cisco Fire Department, 
attended a regional fire 
meeting Saturday, January 
27, hosted by the Rising Star 
Fire Department.
There were 23 fire alarms 

calls during the month of 
January and three of those 
false alarms.

163 Professional RreRghters 
Lost Lives In Accidents

the new handbook 
emphasizes the methods of 
Boy Scout program, 
including Scouting ideals, 
the patrol method, outdoor 
p rogram , advan cem en t, 
personal growth, adult male 
association, and leadership 
opportunities.

Plans for the Scoutmaster's 
recognition meeting are 
being developed by Bill 
Pardue, Commissioner and 
W alter Walske. Dinner 
Chairman. The See ‘N Do 
will be under the direction of 
each Troop and its Scout­
master.
The new Official Boy Scout 

Handbook is now available at 
the Comanche Trail Council 
Service Center, 807C Center. 
Brownwood, and at the 
following official Scouting 
distributors: Heidenheimer's 
in Cisco; The Hub in Breck- 
enridge; T.G. A Y. Family 
Center in Brownwood; and 
J.C. Penny Co. in Stephen- 
ville and Lampasas.

Lodfoi Country 
Oub Lunchaon 
To Ba Fob. 7
The Ladies Country Gub 

Luncheon will be February 
7th. Call any of the hostesses 
for reservations by noon 
Monday. February 5th. The 

■ hostesses are Hein Surles, 
Mary Austin. Ethel Harrell. 
C atherin e Cunningham , 
licne Cotton, Rora Robinson 
and Ruth Pugliese.

nuMin uimior 
to  Bo Sorvod 
By Country Oub
On Saturday, February 10. 

at the Lake Cisco Country 
Gub, an Italian dinner will 
be served from 6:00 to 8:30 
p.m.
Members o f the Cisco Civic 

League are preparing and 
serving the meal. The menu 
will be lasagna, salad, hot 
bread, cake, coffee or tea.
Adults may eat for $2.75 

and children ten and under 
can get a plate for $2.00.

Proceeds from this supper 
will be used for a community 
improvement project; such 
as more equipment for the 
city park.
Tickets may be purchased 

from any Civic League 
member until Friday, 
February 9th.
Everyone is invited to come 

and try a taste of “ Italy” .

A total o f 163 professional 
firefighters lost their lives in 
on -the-job accidents or from 
occupational diseases in 
1977, according to figures 
compiled by the International 
Association of Fire Fighters.
Seventy-nine professional 

firefighters died in the line of 
duty last year. When 
averaged to job deaths per 
100,000 firefigh ters, this 
constitues an 11 percent 
increase over 1976. The fire­
fighter death rate remains 
far ahead o f all other 
occupational death rates, 
again making firefighting the 
most hazardous occupation 
in North America.
Information computed from 

the Public Safety Officers'

Benefits Program -  Law 
Enforcement Assistance 
Administration, and fire ­
fighters statistics as reported 
to the lA FF  by fire 
administrators, show that 
over the last 10 years fire­
fighters have sufi^ered an 
average of 86 deaths per 
100,000, compared to 56 
deaths per 100,000 for 
policemen.
This type of comparison 

clearly shows that, contrary 
to public opinion, the life 
hazard attached to firefight­
ing is greater than that 
attached to police work.

from the FlotMa Stale Fire 
Marahal's 

ALARM ALERT

Recalled Smoke Detectors 
Still To Be Located

A  savanth o f  earth's land 
s u r fa c e  is d r y  d e s e r t .

As many as 8,636 BRK 
SS749 series smoke detectors 
that may overheat and cause 
a fire inside the detector may 
still be in operation in Texas 
homes, says the 
manufacturer, currently 
conducting a voluntary recall 
of the defective units in 
cooperation with the 
Consumer Product Safety 
Commission.

represents 76 percent o f the 
11,306 units originally distri­
buted in Texas.

"T h e  nationwide return 
rate is more than 50 percent, 
so efforts in Texas have been

10 a.m. B.J.’ a 12 p.m. 
Pizzas and sandwiches 
710 Avenue E 442-2231 

Monday through Saturday 
Every Wednesday night 
special spaghetti S3.00.

xîsco^iÇ ^^
WASH

3rd St. and Ave, E.
Where Most People 

Wash. Wash your 
Venetian blinds throw 
rugs, motor._______ _

THE LOBO 
Heads and Threads 

Shop
. 709 Ave. D. Cisco

Custom T-ShkU 
Transfers and Letters 
Men’s and _ W omen’s 
Presciolen Hair Design 

Call 442-9979 
tie ■*4

increased to find a greater 
percentage of the remaining 
AC-powered units,”  said 
Ernest Emerson, State Fire 
Marshal, who emphasized no 
battery powered units are 
involved. "T h ere fo re , in 
addition to organizing 
factor-supervised replace­
ment programs with distri­
butors who purchased the 
detectors and contractors 
who installed them, BRK la 
working with state fl;a  
marshal’s offices such as 
Texas’ to track down 
additional detoctors." The 
company will replace the 
defective detectors.
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Shocks installed

I Used Cart and Trucks

^  Guns- -Ammo, n

NOTICE: Repair all makes 
Sewing Machines and 
vacuum cleaners Free pick 
up and delivers City Sewing 
Center. 308 E. Main Cast- 
land 629-1481. tf 
UIIUMIIIIIMIMMIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIII#

CARD OF THANKS
We would like to thank 

everyone for the clothes, 
furniture, the fire depart­
ment. friends and neighbors 
fur helping out during the 
burning of our house.

Joe, Mablo, BUI and 
Buddv Nunn

I.NSIDC SALE : Starts 
February 2-3 from 10 a m. to 
S;30 p.m. Odds and ends, 
buffet, miac, furniture and 
some antiquea. ISD8 Avenue 
A. 442-2363. 9

Commercial PrinUng- Hale Dun&on

t I S ( t> - E A S T 1. A M )  - KA.NGKK 
Sl'BSCRIPTION RATl':S;By carrier in city, 30 cents a 

1 week or 90 cents a month $10 60 a year, one year by mail in 
county, $7 00, City P O  Boxs $7 00, one year elsewhere in 

I Slate, $10 00 out cf sute $12 year

K ISIN t, STAR SI RS« K IPT IO N  RATES; By 
mail in Eastland and Adjoing Counties $400 per
year m Tfv;,s. *5 « )  perjyear elsewhere is U S  
and foreign counties, $« 00 p^r★ MEMSE» 1979 A S S O C IA T IO N

IMPORTANT 
Check your ad the First 

Day It appears. In event of 
errors, please raU 
immediately to have it 
com-cted. No claims wfll be 
allowed for more than one 
Incorrect Insertion.
The pnbUahers Uabllliy 

shall be Urn ited te only the 
amount of apace consumed 
by theae errors.

KIDNEY DANGER SIGNS- 
BACKACH E, Getting up 
nights, smarting, leg paings 
may show need for a gentle 
aid to kidney function. 
FLUSH kidneys 3-tabs-a-day 
trcainicni. Feel GOOD again 
in 12 hours or your 69 cents 
back at any drug counter. 
NOW at City Drug. 13

iU flc c space fo r  r*-'it
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NOTICE: If you have a 
problem arising where you 
need lo sell your property 
now and. cannot wail, wc will 
huY it. GARL D. GORR 
REAL ESTATE BROKER­
AGE 442 .1642. Night 
442 1642. 59|fc

CARPENTRY A 
CONSTRUCTION 

[ w o r k  R es idetitta l tt 
icommerriaJ. Remodeling, 
|add-ana, new homes,] 
I custom cabinets, concrete 
[electrical work, etc. 

HOI.US WILIJAMS
442-1933 a-tfcl

MORGAN'S CAUNkT SHOP 
Star Roote 

Carboa, Texas 
Phone643-*SI7 

CUSTOM BUILT CABINETS
W W W .

uc . Û i

FURNITURE
Strip, Repair,

Reflnlsb

riPPFN PAINTING A 
DECORATION 

Blown acoustic Sprav 
palming Tape and iM-d 

lilt. Decorating 
Wall cov erings

Free estimates 442-1585.

DOZER SERVICE 
Tanking, brush pushing 

and all Ivprs of dirt work 
S25 per hour. Call Bob 
H allm ark , 442-2127.

> • • • — a a a a a ta a a a a a a a

 ̂water damaged Hems. 
We have lewered our

Attention housewives and 
students wanted for light 
delivery work! For more 
information call 629-2655. 
extension 134. (Call Thurs. 
or Fri. 9 a.m. to 8 p m. or 
after 2 p.m. Monday »he 
29*h).

SCHAEFER TV 
Sales & Sers ice 

315 E. 22nd
442.1070, Cisco p97-lfc

■ m f

and Bmall Upbolslery. We 
ako do trunks, burnt and

 ̂prices from last yenr» 
^SaUsfsclion guaranteed) 
 ̂Buy, selL and trade ako. 

^ C all817-442-2363 t ills  p.m. 
p-tfc

aim lam.

TA^iu^lfsTER
Painting, residential or \ 

[commercial. Complete 
! mobile home service all 
I type« of concrete work. 

Free Estimates 
call

Leroy Steinman 
62»- M34

Taylor Laundry 
f  Ave. A and I4th St.
^  40 Washers, 13 dryers 
" Clean, no waiting 

Francis Rains, Mgr.
T t 5

‘ ' 'v n ^ D ff fR S T S R E M E r^

Cle;::: «Hir i xirpcls t.i-ipr
;:nd lioll« t vMlh .VTK.VMK.X
HonI :bi' iiu:cl:im' tur Ktll's

>tl Supplv. • S O I
Aw'iiur 1). 112 .1111;) I' tfc

l a  Colon Gd. *4«

JUtO W M E
Allcn't Heating- 
Air Conditioning 
Sale« and Serv ice 
«54-1795. BalH.
p-tfc

AND
BRIDES MAID DRESSES 

25 percent off 
See sample«

Cactus & Calico 
Ranger

NOT'
|- r \ iiOr >*i,

w Iik I - w n . .»
wimlii.tN .. ,•!
ciirpoi'is. I'.ili tltis t'..tc,iiaii
63<i- tu t.

HUE lu n tE  liR T "  
SHAMPOO 

Boctifc Sh— pooor

COUNtt NMDWARE

Cox
Concrete 

Conlraclors
For a quality «olid foun­

dation or float work of any 
kind give us a call. 

629-2583
After SiOO p.m. TIO

NOTICE
Insubtc vour home with 

Mastic Solid vinyl siding 
and Reynolds storm 
windows. For free 
estimates call SiVM 
Suppiv Co.. Cisco. 
442-2077. _________ p-ifc

O iftt for d l

^COLLMS HAIDWARE

6 d l  A W 
TV Sdof A Sordco

Cdor TV ^  
f7H  Abo. P. 442-3A I
NOTICE” See me for the Fort 
Worth Star Telegram and 
Dallas Morning News. 
Maggie Ingram. 442-1500, 
home delivery, ptfc

in ONE FAMILY 
5, MOTHER Get« A JOB 
To Help PAY For 'a 
CH ILD ’ S UNIVERSITY 
EDUCATION. LIFE INS­
URANCE Can Help AVOID

jC R iC K E t’S DAY CÀBE  
[C EN TER  fe r c h ild re n . 
Open Menday tbrengh 
Friday. W iU be Ucenand to 
keep 13 chlldron. Loested 
Old Highway M  betwaaa 
Ctoea aad Eaetlaad. Far 
farther laleraM itlaa caM 
A'MJUaa

Cleco Radiator Service 
Clean-rod-
rcpalr-rcrorc radiators 
aad healers. Clean and 
repair gas tanks. Call 
442-1547. p-ifc

Rend the claMifieds

i
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CARD OF THANKS
It is with grateful heans 

that we say thank you for the 
concern and love shown 
Andy and the family during 
the illness and death of our 
loved one.

The famUy of Andrew 
Stanford

GAMAGE SALE-February 2- 
3. 504 West 7th. 2 dining 
room suites, refrigerator, 
apartment cook stove. 2 
space heaters and other 
items. 9

FLEAMK = 
S WIU be open February 3.S 
= P-9 =

nMiMiiiMimiiiiim iiiiitiim iir
Freeman Drapery Custom 
Drpacs for unc window or for 
the whole house. For more 
information call 725-6684. 
44 4TP
♦ * e * * * * * e * » * * * * * * * * e
:  1
^O T IC E -O d d  jobs and $ 
«phtmblag repnir. Cali Tes *  
«L'nderwood,442-21M. p-lS a

:  I
* * e * * e * * * * e * * * * * * * * g

tNOnCEs See me for the 
Abilene Reporter News. 
Ho:iic delivery or mail 
subscriptions. Morgan 
Fleming 442-3031. u

CARD OF THANKS
Wc wish to express our 

gratitude to Dr. Addy and 
nurses; the staff of Cisco 
Nursing Center; and the 
many friends of our beloved 
aunt. Una Jackie Young for 
their faithful devotion during 
her long illness. Every kind­
ness will be remembered.

Maxine Stiles and famUy

CARD OF THANKS
In appreciation of the many 

thoughts, prayers, cards, 
flowers and gifts during 
Murl’s illness and at her 
death, we want to express 
our gratitude.

Roy Speegle aad fansHy

FOR RENT

CARO OF THANKS
We extend our gratitude to 

the ladies of the Presbyterian 
Church and Baptist Church 
for the food, to Rev. Dow for 
his words o f comfort, to the 
nurses. Dr. Cermin and Dr. 
Addy, and to friends for the 
flowers and food at the 
illness and loss of our loved 
one.

The Bert Waters FamUy

O f l.nTEREST J
TO UJOfTlEn

Pattern«
w ith a

WESTERN Flair

< : V

SIZES 
14 TO 17

$2.00

MAN'S RUFFLED  
W ESTERN SHIRT
Y oked , long s le ev e  

s h irt, b u tto n  or sn ap  
fro n t. Lace  ru ffle  fro n t 
w ith  no  pockets , w in g  
co lla r an d  c u ffs  c losed  
w ith  sn ap s  or b u tto n s .

P r i n t e d  p a t t e r n  
# 1 2 2 2  in s izes  1 4  to  1 7  
S e n d  $ 2 ,0 0  for th is  
p a tte rn  . add  7«« 
h a n d lin g  an d  po stag e  
S e n d  to:

Belle’s Patterns 
P O Box B41 -  Dept 416 

Hurst. Texas 76063

GETTING READY...KCB- 
aeth B. WalUa, acting chief 
exncative e fflcer and DIaac 
D uerr Levine, vice presi­
dent, United State« C riilte«, 
la c ., ditenss m edem lintlon  
of the 8.S. Unitnd B ute«, 
■chednled to opem ta  
tw een Lna Angeles  
H e a e ln la  beginning  
apring, 1M9.

be-
aad
late

FOR RENT: Trailer space. 
309 Avenue L. $40 month with 
water. Call 442-3363. Stfc

Fer Rent- Storage 
924 mealh. See at 

Taylor Center r iM  Ave.
D. p- tfc

W ANT 'TO RENT-Garage or 
bam to store pick up truck, 
tools, etc. Call 442-3927. 9

HELP W A N TE D -E xper- 
ienced secretary for oilfteid
supply and weU service. CaU 
442-2008. 10

W ANT TO BUY 
Pregaaal cews. 

CaU 817-442-3381.
p-11

VVanu tl- liilnrui.<auiT 
on any unsigned lapesiry 
puiniings done around 
1915- 1920 oil boom 
period. 629- 2413. TF

FOR SALE-Terrier puppies.
................. . -353«.Call 442-1286 or 442
10

M OBILE HOME FOR 
SALE; 12 x «0. $5,000. 1011 
East 18th or call 442-3117, 9

NAYFORSAU
442-3031

p -ii

FOR SALEi New Victor 
Electronic Calculator. $129. 
See at Cisco Press. tfc

SPINET-CONSOLE PIANO .
Available to responsible, 

local party on small payment 
balance. Write before we 
send truck, Joplin Piano, 
P.O. Box 8241. Waco. Texas 
76710. 10

12' oO‘ 2 bedroom ..:i!i..iie 
home, washer-dryer, dish­
washer. regrigerator-ice 
maker. 3 ton central air-heat, 
blocks, porch, all hookups, 
service pole. Call 629-1588. 
Tf

Estala

FOR SALE : 1973
Chevrolet LUV. Camper, 
air coadlUonlng, AM-FM 
and tape. Recently 
overhauled. E xcellca l 
condition. Need moaey 
for acbooi. 442-2191 or 442- 
im ..p - l l_____

All the property liated here la on a paved street or road 
regardleaa, in town or in the country.

Three bedroom, two bath frame dwelling. 

Three bedroom, two hath brick raaidence.

A wonderful frame houae that will fit aqy peraon or 
family.

IN S ID E  S A L E -S ia r t s  
February 2-3 from 10 a.m. to 
5:30 p.m. Odds and ends, 
buffet, misc. furniture and 
some antiques. 1508 Avenue 
A. Cisco. 442-2363. If bad 
weather sale will be held 
February 9-10. 9

PAMPERS 
30 Count 

Reg. S3.00 
Now S2.25 

Cactus ft CaUco 
Ranger

M! A very nice three bedroom frame that will fit your 
I pocketbook.

Check with us for a good dwelling in the country or land 
I without a house.

We have business and commercial building for sala.

FOR SALE: 1973 Gehl </5- 
ponable feed mill. Also Holl­
ingsworth • 4 ton commercial 
fertilizer spreader ground 
drive excellent condition. 
Also 9' blade with 3 point 
hook-up. heavy duty Call 
Jerry Lowrance 629-1941 
Don Lowrance 629-1181.. tf

"F o r  your benefit", we do get every penny a place is 
worth but, we appraise all property before wc list it to sell, 
and will not lake up your time showii^ you anythii« that 
is priced out of the nnariieU! !

TO GIVE AW AY: 3 puppiea, 
half poodle and hnlf Benji 
dog. CaU 442-1291. 9

For Sale - Hogs. 
I Regkiered Duror. Gilt 
and biNir. CaU H.T. Button 

I after i  p.m. at «47- 1S24.

ALSO. WE WANT TO TAKE THIS OPPOR1VN1TY Tt) 
THANK ALL THE PEOPLE WHO HAVE MADE IT  
POSSIBLE FOR US TO HAVE HAD ONE OP THE MOgT 
SUCCE88F I  L  YEARS THIS PAST YEAR. IN ALL  OT 
OUR THIRTY FIVE YEARS OF DOING BUSINE88 IN  
CISCO, TEXAS. YOU PEOPLE HAVE BEEN GOOD TO 
US AND WE ARE TH ANKFU L!! BURNICE AND GARL.

Fo r  SALE: By u k  
dividual; Heavy duty 
Whirlpool washer with 
big tub, and five- cycle, 
three temperature 
electric dÌ7 er. Both like 
brand new. Both in 
beautiful harvest gold. 
First come, first sold • • 
both for $450. CaU to see 
at 91V 676- 2008. tf

TT53room Tricir
besnr with fireplacr and 
bulll-lat, central alr-hcal. 
BuUt by Cisco Junior 
College BuUding Trades 
Deportment. Not listed 
w M  any realtor. Call 
442^228lforaj^^

FOB SALEi 3 bedroom house 
in Cisco, vacant. $1500.00 
equity. Phone 629-1530. 
T-10

f o r  S A L E - O f f ic e  
bulldiag. Prime loralioa 
la dowatxmrn Ckeo. Large 
CBoagh to occupy part 
and 1 lease rest. Call 9i$- 
•73-1142. ^14

FOR SALE BY OWNER:
15 acres, all electric two 
bedroom, utility. 2 carports, 
2  wells, tank, net fence, bam 
over 500’ . Located on High­
way 36-3/10 mile west of 
Rising Star. Come Look. 
33-ltp

FOR SALE
Nice 3 bedroom bonac, 

weU located real buy 
Immediate poaaeaaion. 
Commei'i is| building 

5000 sq. feet, S10,000. 
1150 acres whh good 

improvemenU on Inter- 
Mate 20, 5 mUcs, Cisco. 
Nice 3 bedroom house, 

woU located, a roal buy. 
^foo 3 bodioom house, 

iocated on paved straot, a 
real buy.

Lake cabin Cisco south 
side. A real buy.
353 acre ranch, well 

located, west Cisco.
164 acres on Highway 

183, south Cisco.
House at 602 West 4th. 

Complelely remodeled. A 
real buy.
3 bedroom, well located, 

reasonable down pay­
ment, monthly payments 
on balance. Immediate 
possession.
4 bedroom house, buy 

equity, assume loan or for 
loue for one vear. WeU 
located on paved street.

Tom B. Stark 
Realtor

Archie Cbaoineaa 
Realtor 

Call 443-3148 
or 443-1144 

Wa ara vary active 
realtors la Claca.

W osM  U ka  To Buy O lto  H onw  
^ H o a w s , W M  P ay < M .
C al

HERITAGE HOMB
IS « n w s s t

Hkttosa»
t i c o

When you seU the property you cannot keep a h i^e UaUi« 
I so, please be sure and check with us, as it cornea, and it 
[goes.

107 Avt. D.,CIbco

GorlD.Gorr 
Red Estate Brokerage

tftiMWOril
442-3642 or bMAI 442-1642

FOR SALE BY OWNER: 
lake home and lot caU collect 
(214) 296-3181. U1

m r

BEST COUNTRY LIVING
U)vely bedroom, three bath, brick home. 

AH elec^c, large den with adjoining trffice 
space, with own heating and cooling system two 
watw wells, swimming pool and landscaped 
yard, plus 32.86 acres. Twdve miles from Cisco 
on highway 206. Highway 206.

A R o d B u o u ty
Pickrell Real Estate

___________ ««7-t««l SoiiBer

FOR SALE OR RENT
2 lots and building on Wost 8th in 

Cisco. Call 915-762-2535 oHar 5 p.m.

P -1 4

M o ig K M E m R n
COM.MERCIAL

GREKNIfOU.SE A LE R T -redu ced  to sell- New 
greenhouse in Eastland on almost 4 acres, may buy 
mobil home on site or not. Wholesale buainesa existing, 
retail potential.

RESIDENTIAL

Beautiful country home with 10 acres, call for details.

CISCO RARITY S'»««! 2 bed
room, single bath, carport and storage sheds. $16,000.

W ANT TO BUILD NEW HOME? I have a pretty location 2 
lots, existing garage. One o f best neighborhoods. $6,500_.

IMMEDIATE OCCUPANCY on closing. New FHA loan 
available. 2 bedrooms, living room, dining room, utility 
area single bath. $22,960.

NOTHINGS WRONG with this home, preaent owners 
moving. 2 bedroom, built ins in kitchen, living room, 
dining room, den, fenced yard has neat efficiency 
apartment in it. $32,500.

ROOM FOR ALL Y ()U R  KIDS and then some, 4 
bedrooms, IVk baths on 2 lots, woodburning fireplace, 
storage everywhere in house, storage house behind 
nouse. $31,900 00

S acres with home that needs loving care, tank, water to 
property line. $15,000

HEY 'THERE if you are a small famUy, we have a small 
home for you, 2 bedrooms, uitlity area, carport, central 
air and heat $ i7,100. FHA Available.
CENTRAL AIR-heat 2 bedroom home. Asaunw loan, 
call for details.

105 acres In the Cook area, off Rising Star High­
way. $52,500.

2 bedrooms, 1 bath rock houaa with garaga and 
workshop. 3 lota. Good building aits. $13,000.

KAie%AiUia$^
& Î94U  S ò4p^

ê m U  m -  4 4 r ^ S i €  ^ Ù nb*
Anlts Webb, Associate. 442- 3545'’
Elizabeth P. Ward-Broker <42^24 
Ray_M oody-^ker 725-7279

¥



OBITUARY
n n d  RHet For 
Jomes Perry

Services For 
Andrew Stonford

To Be Thursdoy Meld Friday
Funeral services for James 

Wilson Perry, 8h, of Cisco, 
will be at 2 p.m. Thursday in 
the Cisco Funeral Home 
Chapel The Rev Jesse 
Cassle, Baptist minister, will 
officiate, assisted by the Rev.
Buddy Sipe, pastor of the 
First Baptist Church. Burial 
will be in Clyde Cemetery.

Mr. Perry died at 4; 10 a m.
Tuesday in F..L. Graham 
Memorial Hospital after a 
lengthy illness.

He was born October 8,
1892, in Callahan County. He 
married Mattie Elizabeth 
Denton on September 5,
192(), in Lockney He was an 
Army veteran of World War I 
and a member of the Ameri­
can Legion. Mr. Perry was a 
member of First Baptist 
Church and retired rural mail 
carrier serving in Clyde, Tye 
and Rotan, before retiring 
and moving to Cisco in 19hl.

Survivors include his wife; 
two sons. Rex H. of Shiprock.
N.M and T.Ray of Dallas;, 
one brother, Frank W. of 
Clyde and five grand­
children

Lelo Swart 
Buried !?i Rites 
Held Wednesday
Services for Lela M. Swart,

67. of Cisco, who died Mon­
day. were at 2 p.m. Wednes­
day in First United Metho­
dist Church.
The Rev. Jerden Davis, 

pastor, officiated, assisted by 
the Rev. Art Anderson of 
First United Methodist 
Church in Eastland. Burial 
was in OakwiHid Cemetery, 
directed by Ci^'o Funeral 
Home.
Born Feb. 14, 1911, in

Scranton, near Cisco, she 
was an operator for Bell 
Telephone for 3b years until 
retiring in 1973. She married 
R.O. Swart in July 1950 in 
Ranger and had lived in 
Eastland County all her life.
Mrs. Swart was a member of 
First United Methodist 
Church.

Survivors include her 
husband; a stepdaughter. 
Peggv Ouiett of Fort Worth; 
three brothers. '  Durett 
Slatton of Lamesa. H.S. 
Slatton of Dallas and Stewart 
Slatton of Holiday; four 
sisters, Eunice Penn. Agnes 
M iller and Catherine 
McCrary, all of Cisco, and 
Mary Sneed of Eastland; two 
grandchildren; and a great­
grandchild.

Gronvell Agnew 
Buriud In RHet 
Held Wednesday
Funeral services for Lt. 

Granvell Agnew, 47, of 
Abilene, were at 10 a.m. 
Wednesday in Elliott-Hamil 
Chapel of Faith. U.S. High­
way 277in Abilene. The Rev. 
Gary Coble. assiKiate pastor 
of Trinity Baptist Church, 
officiated. Burial was in Elm­
wood Memorial Park in 
Abilene.
Mr. Agnew died Sunday 

evening in Hendrick Medical 
Center in Abilene.

He was born October 26. 
1931. in Cisco, and attended 
Cisco Public Schools and 
Hardin-Simmons University 
in Abilene. He joined the 
Abilene police force 17 years 
ago after graduating in the 
Abilene Police Department's 
first police academy.

He married Claudia Roberta 
Taylor on December 25. 
1949. in Hysham. Montana. 
The couple moved to Abilene 
in 1962 from Hysham. He 
joined the Police Department 
shortly afterward. He was a 
patrolman until September 
1966. when he moved to the 
records division.
Promoted to sergeant in 

March 1968. he worked 
patrol for one year before 
returning to the records 
section. In 1971. he again 
joined patrol. In 1975. he was 
named coordinator of the 
Selective Traffic Enforce­
ment Program (STEP), a 
pilot program in which off- 
duty policemen monitored 
areas considered high traffic 
risks. At the time of his death 
he was a shift lieutenant.

Survivors include hit wife; 
four sons, Gary of Billings, 
Montana. Darryl, a police­
man in Nashville, Tenn., 
Bert, stationed in California 
with the U.S. Navy and Dale 
of Denton; three brothers. 
L.C. of Abilene; Ray of Lake 
Cisco and Ben of Billings, 
Montana; two sisters. 
Margie Green o f Lake Cisco 
and Martha Sue Day of 
Midland; his mother. Mrs. 
Zilla Agnew o f Abilene and 
his father. WUliam Letter 
Agnew of Cisco; and five 
grandchildren.

Funeral services for 
Andrew (Andy) Stanford, 72, 
lifelong resident of Cisco, 
were at 2 p.m. Friday, 
January 26, in the Cisco 
Funeral Home Chapel. The 
Rev. W .E. Hallenbeck. 
Church of God minister in 
Eastland, officiated. Burial 
was in Oakwood Cemetery.
Mr. Stanford died at 2 a.m. 

Thursday in the Veteran’s 
Administration Hospital in 
Big Spring after a lengthy 
illness.
He was born September 7, 

1906, in Eastland County. He 
was a retired truck driver. He 
was a Methodist.
Survivors include a sister, 

Fannie Stewart of Abilene 
and several nieces and 
nephews.

Pallbearers were Charlie 
Pence, Herschell Penn, 
Clarence Penn, Charlie 
Moad and Bud Turnbow.

Thursday, 

February 1, 1979

Funeral Sarvkua 
Held Monday For 
B u tio y CMkiron

Funeral services for 
Gretchen Michelle Bussy. 6. 
and Heather Lynn Bussey. 3. 
of Athens, were held at 2 
p.m. Monday. January 29. 
in the Carroll and Lehr 
Funeral Home Chapel with 
the Rev. Irvin Mills.
The two children were 

found dead Friday. January 
26. in their home at the 
Shady Oaks community near 
Athens.
Gretchen was born June 20. 

1972. in Athens, and Heather 
was born October 6. 1975, in 
Athens. Gretchen attended 
the Cross Roads School in 
Athens.
They are survived by their 

parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Richard Bussey of Shady 
Oaks; their grandparents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Robert Ford of 
Athens, Mrs. Sandra Agnew 
of Cisco and C.O. (Cub) 
Bussey of Haynesville. La.; 
and their great-grand­
parents, Mr. and Mrs. R.B. 
Thames of Cisco. 

Pallbearers were Randy 
Brown, Larry Cobb, Eddie 
Cade, Ben Thompson, Jonny 
Eaton, Jackie Gibbs, Harold 
Brooks and Keith Knight.

Read the classifieds

fu in u u i nuws
•y Mrs. R.i. Toylof

»
Old man winter still stays 

around. I don't think we have 
had one pretty day this week. 
We had a nice rain one day 
which adds up to more than 
three inches in January. 'Hie 
grain fields are really looking 
good again, and we missed 
the snow and ice predicted 
for this week for which we 
are thankful. I talked to my 
daughter at Farmington, 
N.M., yesterday (Monday) 
and they had six inches of 
new snow Friday.

Mrs. George Weeks still 
has not come home after 
surgery some time ago. She 
and Mr. Weeks are staying 
with a son at Abilene.
Mrs. Burette Ramsey is still 

a patient at Hendrick 
Hospital at Abilene. She.is 
doing very well.

David Park Clinton o f 
Dallas, son of Mrs. Bob 
Ginton of Cisco, formerly of 
Putnam, had major surgery 
at Dallas this week. He is 
doing fine.
The country musical which 

has been on the second 
Friday night of each month at 
the school house will be on 
Saturday nights from now 
on.

Mr. nnd Mrs. John Petty 
visited their daughter and 
husband. Mr. and Mrs. Jerry 
Toland at Breckenridge 
Tuesday. They also visited 
their aunt, Mrs. Virginia 
Beck at Coleman Wednes­
day.
Mrs. Dovie Pruet spent 

Monday night with her 
sister-in-law, Mrs. Opal 
Jones at Ranger.

Mr. and Mrs. George Lee 
Ramsey and Tim left Friday 
for their home at Glenwood 
Springs. Colo., after a weeks 
visit with her mother. Mrs. 
Annie Mae Donaway and his 
father. Jack Ramsey.

Maxie Solomon spent Wed­
nesday through Friday with 
her daughter and family. Mr. 
and Mrs. Bud Taylor at 
Mineral Wells.
Mrs. Ida Mac Waddell, our 

local justice of the peace, is 
attending school at San 
Antonio for a few days.
Mrs. Bonnie McCleskey of 

Cisco visited Mrs. Annie 
Mae Donaway and the 
Clinton Ivies Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Byron Yeager 
of Brownwood visited Mrs. 
Dovie Pruet last Sunday. 
They went to Moraqn and 
visited Mrs. May Delle Jones 
in the afternoon.
Mr. and Mrs. John Doyle 

Isenhower gave a birthday 
party Sunday for Steve 
Reynolds, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Roddy Reynolds of 
Elmdale. It is his third

birthday. Attending were 
Mr. and Mrs. John D. 
Isenhower, Mr. and Mrs. 
Butch Petty and family of 
Eastland and Darrel and 
Donna Green.
Mr. and Mrs. l.G. Mobley 

of Baird visited the Ray 
Green family Sunday.

Mrs. R.B. Taylor had lunch 
Sunday with Mrs. Fred 
Heyser, Mrs. Maggie Cook 
of Baird and Mrs. Annie 
Merle Simms of Pecos. They 
reported that Howard 
Farmer of Baird who has 
been patient at Hendrick 
Hospital at Abilene for three 
weeks will probably come 
home Monday.
Visiting Mrs. R.C. Speegle 

Sunday were Mrs. Lou 
Speegle, Mrs. Burl Reed and 
Mrs. Wanda Blackwell, all of 
Cisco.

Thurtday, Fobruary 1979

Hanry W. Block

“We can 
help save 

you money 
on taxes?

We are income tax specialists. We ask the 
right questions. We dig for every honest 
deduction and credit because we want to 
be sure you pay the smallest legitimate tax. 
That’s another reason why we should do 
your taxes... whichever form you use short 
or long.

H>R BLOCK
THE IN C O M E TA X PEOPLE

1405Ave.D.
Op«n 9 A.M. - 6 PJM. WBukdoya. 9-5 Saturday. 

Phong 442-7794

sr
e.
a

AITENnON 
MR. PEANUT FARMER

There wUI be a peanut grower meeting on ThnrMiay, Febmary| 

8, at 7 P J*. in the gymnarium at Riling Star. Thii Meeting u

bang held lor the purpoie rf diicniiing the contracting of above

qaata peanuts lor the coming crip yeii. Mr. Roii Wilson from 

Soathwestem Peanut Grower Association in Gorman will be 

present to answer questions and make coments about the peanut 

program.

Everyone who prodncei peannb ii incouraged to attend

NO F E S i i / MB S a V IC E  CHARGES

y

OUR N E w T r a n s A c t io n  a c c o u n t  c a n
RING UP DIVIOENOS ON YOUR CHECKING ACCOUNT MONEY

■  NEW CONVENIENCE! You can have funds transferred from your 
checking account at any bank to your TransAction Account or from 
vour TransAction Account to your bank all by phone the sam e day 
you call Our TransAction Line is open 24 hours a day. 7 days a week

■  NEW DIVIDENDS! Your TransAction Account deposits earn  
dividends at 5 ’ 4 ®o. from the day of deposit to the day of withdrawal 
And It s insured to S40 000  W e II even send you an itemized  
statement each month showing you just how much your excess cash 
IS earning! Absolutely free No fees. No service charges 
For inlormotion. call or visit one of our offices.
The TransAction account, only at

United Savii^ O F
T E X A S

ABILENE DIVISION

'̂ -1 OUlcA' _■ WMIBBWi
CEDAR STREET • 67S-5171 iT t 8 PIONEER 0 « • S73-5171

□
SOU N 1ETH • 073-5171 
nWiMrOoli.
330S a 14TH. 073-5171

(

i 10 commercial ■ U5-sk40 
Q CMOOl
701 AVENUE D • 442-1006

¿  S S a T main • 7M-2252

101 E COURT PLAZA • M3-2401□

301 EDWARDS AVE • 92S-4TM

ESJC

We have taken the month o f January 
to  get our new ito re  ready to  open 
February 1 ft. Our new locotion i t  1100 
W est 8 th , O tco . We wW be next to  the 
new Quick Way.

We wM hove new spring clothing ond
hnprintablef arriving weekly. We hope 
you w ill come tee  us a t our Grand 
Opening February 1st.

Thonk you fo r your patience 
throughout Jonuory. We hope we wM be  ̂
oUe to  serve you be tte r a t our new.
ku^er store In 1979.

THE SHIRT SHOP
Owntrt - Jwitt Mid Wfc««t

1100 Wtst till

NEW SPRING FASHIONS 
ARE ARRIVING D A IIY

Lovely Clothes and Accessories 
The Finest Populor Price Fashions.

BooutHul Ornsags-Mony prgtty stylga In Long Drgsagt 
ond Rggolor longtha. On# 0 « Thg Lorggs» Sgigctlons 
In Wgst Tgxas.
ggtly Roag ond Lonaon Coata-Drgat Coots ond All 
Woathgr Coots Most Stylo* *2V*‘ To *69**

Pont Sulta-from R ond K Orlglnols, Jo Lostgr, Groff 
of California ond Mony Othor*. *29** To *69**

SALE
FAU AHD WINTER FASHIONS

• PANT COATS-DRESS COATS 
■ DRESSES AND SPORTSWEAR
• REDUCTIONS TO AND

SHOE SALE
Dims aid Sent ShoM NiHosd ' 
PwMMllT4n tram . OM lfr S

StyW* Mum

ALTMA
AMUNE CISCO



'4, *

FOK SALE) 3 bedroom 
houie in Olden, complete­
ly ctrpeted, screened in 
porch, cellar, fruit trees, 
grape arber and carport, 
>14,500.00 also 2 lots. 
Call 653-2350 after 6:00 
p m. or 642-1241 daytime 

TI4

Mr» Fred Brown’ i  S-D Shop 
now has a new telephone 
number 62»438a. Cal* for 
birthday, Wedding cakes and 
complete catering ser­
vice. T9

Hay for sale sudan fertilired 
Hay gra/er $1.25 per bale- 
20d or more $1.65. 629-2.344 
or 442-2600, T9

FOR SALE -1977 Chev, 
SIKerado, 3.‘'4 ton, double 
cab, camper special -  
loadt'd, AM-FM radio/ 
tape deck, air cond., 
power steering and 
brakes, cruise control, 
automatic. 33,IN)fl miles. 
Call 442-1319 or 442-3962.
p-12

FOR SALE: 1976 Ford Coo­
ler Pickup, 24 ft Travel 
Trailer, live traps 16 * 16 » 
48 Call 629 1907. tIO

FOR SALF:; 1974 Dodge 
Mat! Van, loaded for 
tamping, captains chairs, 
must sot- to appreciate. 
S4.$00.00. (  all 629-8109. 
TI2

FOR SAI F
2 registered Hereford 
bulls. Call after 5 p.m. 

442-1238. p-11

COINS 
We carry a complete sUKk 
of coins. Coin jewelry and 
supplies.

Gold, Silver, U.S. 
and Foreign.

Lav away plan available 
Pratt's Coin Shop 

Abilene 
2155 So. 1st 

672-6991

STONE ETERNAL 
MEMORIALS:

Seal and i-crtlflcaic see 
Mr. and Mrs. L.C. Free­
man representing Cole­
man Mtinumcnt Works, 
Cok-man, Texas.

Phone 817-629-1631 
or s*t 305 N. Dixie, 

F^slland, Texas 764̂ 18

76 YAM AHA. 80 Trail Bike; 
Ktiiis gotid and ip nearly now 
amdition-S 175.00. 
SEVERAL SHETLAND 

PONIES. Mostly Sorrells 
with markings. $25--$75. 
PH. 8I7-259-.3453, CI RTIS 

CHAMBERS. R miles Sxiulh- 
wcsl of Rising Star on 
Williams Pavement. 51-ITP

l .Hig BraiU'li Polled Horclivrd 
Polled Hereford Breeding 
Bulls for Sole. I implightcrs 
and Victor Domino bliMHlIiiie. 
Fev* heifers for sale. Call 
643 443:’ . t28

Deyir F:. Squires Con­
tractor Huill up roofs and 
shingles all nexx work 
guaranteed. Ph. aS3- 2212 
alter K p.m. ttWIen. Tex.
;kim  U

HAY FOR SALE: 200 
bak‘s, fertilixed coastal. 
S2.S0 per bale. 647-3277 
after 5 647-1536. T-16

FOR SALE: 1971 DotMin 
pick-up 60,000 miles, 
1600 model, 4 cylinder, 4 
speed in floor, 4 new 
tiro , 25 miles per gallon 
Call 629 2232. T14-

FOR 8ALFI; by owner lake 
home and lot call collect 
(214) 296-3181. til

Outaide sale. Olden. Texas 
one mile east of Post office 
on nghl, every F'ri and Sat. 
Savings on lota of new items, 
Jew lery, tools, buckles, 
knives, books, toys, paint, 
hammer handles, wrought 
iron and plaster from Mexico 
and furniture. We buy old 
coins, furniture and ap­
pliances Call 653-22S9 TlOS

FOi TSALE: Rabbits; Bucks; 
Bred Does; Cages; Buy one 
or all.

Fresh Jersey Milk Cow; 
Gentle; Price-$450. Also two 
bred Jerseys; Gentle; broke 
to milk.

Ph. 643-4174 ’
5-2TC

TRAPPERS Creager Gun
Sales will buy furs daily at 
905 S. Bassett 5:00 p.m.-6:00 
p.m. posted price list, fair 
prices. T9

RealdcnUdl and 
Commercial- Remodeling, 
•ddons, concrete work, 
new hornet, electrical 
work, etc. Mickey 
WlllUms 629-8285. TF

MEN ONLY
On Saturday afternoon 
Hair cuts and styling 
MY FAIR LADY BEAUTY 

SHOP 
647-1411

Ask for Peggy Ferrell or 
Pam Collins
Manicures on Weilnesday 

For men and women 
T-I3

Sullivenl Income Taa 
Service Simple or 
C o m p lex  r e ta m a  
welcomed. Call 629-1205. 
T34

PATSY’S PLACE 
Washer and dryer and 

refrigerator repair, chain 
aawa and acceaaorica.. 
Anllquea. 1600 Liggett 
Ciacf*, 442-2407. p-9

INTRODUCING 
Bobby Brummell and 

Johnny Frago for State 
Wiiie consultants in crime 
prt-v cnilon/delection 
sylems for resemicntlal, 
vximmcrclal, schools, etc. 
Stale Llixnsc No. B-2076 
FInam-ing Av allabic For 
Your Proleclion Infomta- 
liim Contact Ineallv 
MRS. ORA BRUMMETT 

647-1402
Hrs: 7:.30a.m.-6:00p.m.

Ifc

Williams «  Cagle 
Conalruction 

Residential and 
commercial. Remodeling, 
adxions, concrete work, 
new homes, electrical 
work, also floor covering, 
629-8285 or 629-8203. TF

Iinsemination. tl8- 1679

I  Residential and 
icommerical. Remodeling, I

¡1 addons, concrete worfc, | 
new homes, electricalj 
work, etc. Mickey 

.Williams 629-8285. TF

TESCO
ItM W iU M T m

NOTICE-Doke Johnson 
Contractor Remodeling, 
Concrete, Electrical, 
Plumbing, Fencing, Boat 
Dock, Houae Leveling ca ll! 

1647-3682 or 442-1330. TF

Notice; Would you like to 
cull your herd through 
pregnancy teating? Call u 

icertlfied A.I. and Palpation 
technician with seven years 
experience 639- 2272. The 
(op bulla of the nation are 
available through artlfkial

MWe »SM M M M M Æ ILM m m m M .
♦ / OUlCK FILMQUICK FILM 
i  PROCESSING
*  Film-Cameraa-Suppliea «
*  GIBSON «
a Camera Center X
X Eaalland t

THE
(POODLE PALACE

Jf#
(Kay Lomb
onn« Rains

t
anqnRIscra need 
attama and kwada 
lay Ihnngh Saturday 
689 ar 442-3406 
sl ralaa far

M  Waat Mat ta 
: Carl Reanty

____________ Z L .

I E. Sgnlraa Can­

iles aH MW wark 
«teed, P k  4M- «18 
4 pak OMap Taa. 

. If

NOTICI

TRAVEL SERVICE 
Airline TIcVets-Tonrs 

nndCmIses 
HELEN CRAWFORD, 

Rep.
Supertravel, Inc.

1 442-226S
S02 Avc. D. 

Cisco

WANTED

DAVID FENTER 
.U C E N S E D  PLUMBER. 

AND REMODELING 
CONTRACTOR 

647-1970
Spedaliilng In 

residential plumbing 
If

SCOTTY’S EARN 
MISCELLANEOUS. 

PAINTING AND 
METALCRAFT 

1315 S. Lanmr, Eastland. 
I paint lawn farnitara 
a p p l la a c e s  m e ta l
awaings-Bictal 
gales-cmral paads-alaa 
polish and wax- 
automobiles. Come by, or 
call L.A. Scott. tf

Golf cluba. Do yoo bave | 
I aay old golf dubs 
I putlers In yoor garage or | 
alile? If yan do and waat 
to soli ihcm for cask CaU | 
442 1264. p-lS

HELP WANTED: Secretary
needed-some typing, apply 
in person at Morgan's Bldg. 
T9

HELP WA.NTED: Builders 
and Builders Helpers will 
train-apply at Morgan’ s 
Bldg, in Eastland. 116

»CLEANING LADY ONE* 
|DAY WEEK. REUABLE, 
•STRONG. —  
¡REFERENCES. 629-2413.

MORGANS CABINET 
SHOP

STAR ROUTE 
CARBON TEXAS 
PhoM643-6S17 

CUSTOM BUILT 
CABINETS

WANTED: Growing Grocery 
Company looking for hard 
working applicants. A ll 
company benefits-starts 
$12.000 yearly. Send resume 
to P. 0 . Box 1246 
Breckenridgc-all replies will 
be kept strictly 
cunndential. tl2.

HELP WANTED: Aides, pait 
time laundry and kitchen.

Â m person. Leisure 
Ostrom. Tf 
WANTED! Construction 

work. Will do sidewalks, 
patios, driveways, chain link 
and cedar fence also work. 
Call 442-2514. Manuel 
Marquez, tf

Wb

LOW COST WSURANa
We are eaay to reach and easy 

to talk to. We can anawer your 
questions on coverages, 
protection, values and rates 
We'll give you plain Ulk and 
straight facU.

m t f  iB  h u f t  B a ty  tB

« 4  bB̂ B tB 88VB yOB RMBBy.
INSURANCi AG ENa

OffkB Hmm  «47-1U1 
•%bt *29-1447 

ObbIB talÉltBB OffiCB

for Christmas-Time & After

A’’* *  Hobby Supplia*
Paintings 4 Fromos 
Art Classas

Morren's Gift Shop
1013 W. Main In Eastland

WANnD
loefc Hoe stork, Dozor w ork, a ll 
kinds o f sn ttor Ones, Septic tonka. 
Got lin e s , D k t Hooliiig R.V.S. 
Contracting.

629-2401 o r 629-2446.
_______  TF

UIIIHMIMIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIMMII:
I  We buy aluminum cane,S 
i  crushed or uneruahed. 17 s  
Scent! a lb. Call 647-1236. ^ 
:T12 3
SlIHIIIIimiHIIIMMIlIHUHIUlF

Lbbb Star THIb 4 Ahttraet Co. 
Job I . KBoacB, Mgr.

• • r  
*  
*  
*

,104 Wfft ComiBBrcB St. 
Iu ltakl, Tbxbs 76441

417-429-2649

au u u M im a satstactioii guaiantiío

EATON'S INSUUTION
4lnvB hi Attic Or WbI í

CLINTON lATON 
lBR|Br, Tbib i 74470 
417/447I19S

W.T. UTON 
Ok b , Tf BBC 74417

417/442-9204

r c i i iü s
A. & D. 

Plumbort
Phom *29aOS1

107 I, Cot B OiBB
Tommy A lford

AR1S MOBILE HOMES 
Granbnry 573-4551 

Seloction-Savlngs-Scrvlca
p-61tfc

629- 17C7 
Ihot's All 
You Need 
To Know 
About 

Job
Printing

M cM urry Poof
COMpMoPOBt 

FrooTorwItB
Coll Mnivin

Saloamon *  Extnrmlnolq^
Talaphona 672-3N17

Ablisfis TmmoO' ^
Or Caro Mon WoDon Talaphonad 647^60*9

Abilona. Toxos
Termitn, Finos, Deks. Mise. A »  KInè» Of fniiK ll

R B O B O O O O B a O C X a O O

KING IN S U R A N a  
REAL ESTAIS

207 Main 647 -1171 
RIRSALE

LAKE LEON
BEAU'HFUL LAKE LOT on Lake Lkon. 

two-story log cabin, metal storage hotiaa, p ^ 
terraced lawn, bar-b-que oven, picnic labkBpRMdNi 
area, $20,000.00. x'

RANGER
Six room dwelling, one bath, pgrtly 

fL lot, clooe to town, I6.500.0P ' ' '*

Seven room dwelling, two batfaa, paneUag. ses iifll 
trees, four lots, $14,500.00.

Nice two bedroom, den or bedBDom,*lafRi|:' 
living room, carpet, garage and atoragp, stadU 
nice yard. $21,000.00. r ..

Two bedroom dw 
garden space, fenc

BRICK VENEER, three bedrooms, f b « g  
fire place, nice kitchen, one bath, 
plete^ inside decorating, paneled, 
neighborhood, 100 ft comer lot, $ ^ iio a $ .

SMALL ACREAGE: For good coiuitryRviniLBiit 
outside city limits, four bed-rooms, 2>6 bOtha, i M p  t^n 
with fire place, central heat and air, ghew.MMiug, 
small barn, two car garage, coastal herngiuda-field 
$30,000.00. < ' .

NICE THREE bed-room, one bath, pice kikhaa, 
panelled, butane tank, water depoeit far41 misR-Vallqr. 
Water District, on highway, close tos(orei^oa2^acreat/ 
$19,500.00. ^

Three bed-room dwe<" g room, diatBRiftMaiK
kitchen,carport, ge, baraandaereral
small buildings, t near aeheol oR h i ^
way. . I

IVk story dwelling, three bed-rooms, two bath, utility 
room, some carpet, garage, fenced back yard 116’ x 215’ 
fL lot, good neighborhood, $20,000.00. , ‘

Two bed-room, living-dining room, kitchen w if i  
utility area, all large rooms, could convert to tl*ua 
bed-rooms, lots of storage space, nice carpet' cafpogt, 
storage, nice patio, $16,500.00

Two bed-room house, living room, nice kHchab.-; 
garage and storage building, newly painted i ig i# ,  i 
carpel, good neighborhood, $12,500.00,v v

«
Nice two bed-room, living room «rilh 

or dining room, nice kitchen with all 
central heat and air, lots of storage/,- 
storage room and office, comer lot,

Nice three bed-room, two-bath, lacglp 'li 
room, nice kitchen, garage, IVx lots, nkifr 
$18,000.00.

COMMERCIAL
Large commo-cial building, two atoiy, 

two streets, on Hwy. 80, $40,000.00,

EASTLAND
Beautiful w o o d s ' l o w  EdWon. B W  m afa  

nice homesite. Ca

tioa. you can see plana, 
These homes will  ̂

1.400 to 1300 sq.ft.

building sites, ’

hetne. This place ' 
Iota ar develop.

anabath, nice kitchen ’ 
nearly all ui r 

Cloae in.

bedroom house one 
neled carpeted, two 

one takn, city

A a b a th , laundry room, 
hay bam, grain 

Hak fence in front.

two and one half 
. kitchen, all large / 

fk|B window refrigeration {! 
back yard, garage, and

, very nice kitchen 
paneled, all new

, one bath, new 
this year.

Rkdroonu, one bath, new

rttiee bedroom, one bath 
,-m odm  kitchen, spiral 
B i. Total electric.

"" RB*k*(R4  paneled, fenced
LjapBK B B W  lot. very good neigb

paneled. Completely

bedrooms, very very 
wet bar, two car 

, this place ia
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. ill«  Ughi Touch, Tuahts From 
^ The C hristio ii W orld
^  Bv Josephine Cleveland

lyCIntIrty
The ideal committee 

consists of two, four, or six 
people who haven't time, 
and one person who likes to 
run things his own way.
Busy people have a strong 

will; lazy people, a strong 
won't.
Teenager on phone: " I  can 

go out anytime I want to--just 
hold on while I find out if I 
want to ."
Why didn't Noah just swat 

both flies?
Wing your way over to 

Bray's in Eastland and' 
Ranger for shoes that feel so 
giH)d you'll think you're fly­
ing.

Read the classifieds

Roy Johnson, President of the Eastland 
County Farm Bureau, is presenting Gilbert 
Garces of Eastland, with Texas Farm Bureau 
windbreakers.

Mr. Garces is the Safemark Tire Dealer in 
Eastland, Texas for Texas Farm Bureau and 
signed up 16 new members in 1978.

Eastland County finished out with 1439 family 
members and 221 new members.

Cdl Ut For hstdhrtkw Of Yoor 

NowWotorSyitoo*

Eltctrk El For Qooning Sowor Linos 
Ropoir And Now Construction

GREGORY PLUMBING CO.

I first met Farzah Safadel 
when he came to the United 
States, September 25, 1978. I 
couldn't miss noticing this 
young man as he stands out 
distirtctly from the crowd 
with his slight build, black 
hair and soft, but sparkling 
brown eyes.

His home is in Shirez, Iran, 
located in the southwestern 
part of Iran, near the Per­
sian Gulf.

Farzah is the fifth child in 
a family of eight children. 
His father works in a rice 
factory and a brick factory 
to support his family.

“ Why did you come to the 
States and especia lly to 
Cisco. Texas?”  I inquired of 
Farzah. He shared with me 
that he enrolled as a Senior 
student at Cisco H i^  School 
because his brother had 
attended Cisco Junior 
College fiv e  years 
previously. Later his brother 
earned an Engineering 
degree at a higher school of 
learning and returned to 
Iran. His brother urged him 
to study in the States. He

6294301 Ret. 639-2340

Whatever happens 
w ell make it 

together.
This year’s a real puzzler. Anything could happen. But no matter 

what, you can count on us to hang in there with you. Just like we 
have for 51 years.

And when you save with us you’ll earn the highest rates allowed 
by law.

You Deposit 
This Lump Sum

For
This

Compounded 
Dally At

Your 
Actual 
Yield IsiMiniinuin;

$  5

Long

Osamatic
Prestige
Account

A ZMB64S

5 % % 5 . 3 9 %

$  1 , 0 0 0 6 m o s . 5 % % 5 . 9 2 %

$  1 , 0 0 0 l y r . 6H% 6 . 7 2 %

$  1 , 0 0 0 3 0 m o s . m% 6 . 9 8 %

$  1 , 0 0 0 4 y r s , 7 H % 7 . 7 9 %

$  1 , 0 0 0 O y r s . 7 % % ao6%
$  1 , 0 0 0 S y r s . 8 % a33%
M o n e y B r n o s . [able
$10,000

Call us collect for 
the weekly rate.

F or quotes on deposits over $100,000, just give us a call.
Early  w ithdrawal on savings certificates is subject to reduction to passbook rate 
plus 90 days interest penalty.

EASTLAND SAVINGS
Both divisions of Olnsy Savings

Tb us, people are w orth a lot m ore than m oney

RANGERSAVINGS

overcame his first hurdle 
when Winston Heidenheimer 
of Cisco was willing to 
sponsor him as a student in 
our c country.

Frazah could nut speak or 
write Engliah when he 
arrived. With a great deal of 
perservance and discipline 
he mastered both speaking 
and writing English in the 
four m montha he has lived 
in Cisco.

Iran was ruled by Reze 
Shah Pahlavi, the father of 
the present Shah, from 1925 
to 1941. Riza Shah was 
educated in the military and 
became a military officer. At 
that time Iran was an old- 
fashioned monarachy. Riza 
Shah rose to power and 
began to force a policy of 
nationalism. He organized 
the troops s so well that he 
soon had the entire country 
under his control. The 
Iranians deposed the last 
Kajsr Shah and Riza Shah 
begin the Pahlavi dynasty. 
The other Shah, Kajarieei 
was forced to flee from the 
country. Riza Shah took 
steps to modernize the 
country.

There w ere extrem e 
nationalist groups, including 
the Communists which 
provoked hoatilities against 
the Western powers. They

committed various acts of 
violence, and even 
threatened the life of R iia  
Shah. In 1941 the present 
Shah, Reza’s son became the 
Iranian leader. He conUnued 
to modernize the country. 
This arounsed the ire of the 
Moalenu and other groups 
each having their own 
reasons for being in discord 
with the Shah Mohammed 
Reze Pahlavi’s policies.

Questions came quickly to 
my mind. "Farzah, what is 
your opinion of the 
revolution in your country? 
Did you favor the Shah 
Mohammad leaving Iran 
and possibly the Moalem’a 
religous leader, Islam  
Khomeini becoming the 
guiding leader of Iran?”

F a rza h  thou gh tfu lly  
commented, “ As a Jewish 
Iranian boy, I can say that 
the Shah Mohammed was 
not exactly good for the 
people of Iran. Maybe you 
would ask why? The Shah 
took a great deal of money 
from the people and used it 
for his own pleasure. He was 
not an effective leader of my 
country because he seldom 
stayed in Iran. Every few 
months he left the country to 
visit in outer countries and 
visited much of the time in 
the United States. He left the 
government affairs in the 
hands of his ministers.

Farzah continued, “ The oil 
of Iran should have been 
very cheap for the Iranian 
people. Instead the price was 
higlwr for them than it wai

for those in foreign nurkets.
Then Farzah’a expression 

became more serious and 
the tone of his voice reflected 
more concern as he said,”  
But you have to know that as 
a Jewish boy, I can say that 
nobody can be like the Shah 
Mohammad because he gave 
the Iranians religious 
freedom...

Changes need to be made 
in our country. However, if 
the religious leader of Islam, 
A y a tu a l la h  R u h o lla h  
Khomeini, leades our 
country 1 do not think that 
our country will progress 
and develop as the western 
nations have. Iran needs one 
man chosen by the people 
like Reza Shaz who ruled the 
country well and was not 
influenced by the United 
States or the Soviet Union.”

What e ffec t has the 
revolution had upon your 
family,”  I asked.

“ I received word that my

parents can no longer 
worship in their Synagogue 
They have been told that 
they, along with other Jews, 
must leave the country.”

“ W here w ill they go, 
Farazh,”  I questioned, “ and 
will they Im  able to take 
money and some of their 
possessions?”

“ No, they must leave 
everything. Somewhere they 
will find a way in some other 
country." he replied. Then 
with a gleam born of hopt' 
and faith, he said, “ My 
parents are preparing to go 
to the Holy Land and build a 
new life  for themselves 
there.”

Our visit ended. Thoughts 
lingered with me— -I 
recalled t that many cen­
turies ago another family, 
the family of Abraham, left 
his homeland and journeyed 
with faith and hope to a far 
country not knowing wh<it 
awaited them.

O r d e r X i c k e t s N o w !

817/335-8777

b a l c o n y
| t u o e m t ;4|-

“You’ll like him. He's not one of those 
‘Whatever you had, you've got it again,’ types.”

M. L  Terrell Real Estate
HigbwaySO EaM

HOMES
In Eastland:
2 bedroom, 1 bath home with new carpet, covered 
pa do, garage with storage building in back. Extra lot 
goes with house.
3 bedroom, 1 bath home that it  carpeted and paneled. 
Owner will sell furnished for tSl.S00.00.
2 bedroom, 1 bath home on comer lot, close to Jr. 
High and High School. $13,900,00.
2 bedroom, 1 bath home that is carpeted, located on a 
large lot with fenced back yard  $17,000.00 
Largo, nice older home on a comer lo t 3 bedrooms, 2 
baths, den with fireplace, study and formal dining 
area. $35,000.00.
A very nice 3 bedroom, 2 bath home with den and 
fireplace. This approximately 2100 square foot home 
has built-ina and is fully carpeted. It hat a large 
workahop, paUo and nice trees; on approximately 4 
acres. $M,000.00. ^
A large 3 b ^ ro )^ ,''i-tk  bkdi older bode that la close 
to dbwhtoAra T M i hoilie N 'ca fpeM d aae^lMnelsd. 
$18,500.00
2 bedroom, 1 bath home that is partially paneled and 
carpeted. Located at Morton Valley on ap­
proximately 3 acres. $19,500.00 
2 bedroom, 1 bath older home that has a large living 
room with a fireplace. TWa home la fully carpeted 
and paneled. Priced at only $15,500.00 
Other Locations:
2 bedroom, 1 bath home on approximately 1 acre, 
close to Olden. It is carpeted and really nice inside. 
There is a good water well but city water is available. 
$22,500.00
Small 2 bedroom, 1 bath home in East part of Ciaco, 
with carpet, and (xi comer lot. $12,000.00
1 bedroom lake cabin at Lake Leon, with city water, 
electricity and telephone. This is on a deeded lot. 
$15,000.00
Like new, this 3 bedroom, 2 bath two-story home has 
Iwrdly been lived in. This is really a show place. It 
l « a  a fireplace and many other extras inside and out. 
This 2350 square foot home is in a good location at 
Lake Leon and priced at $72,000.00 
A real nice 2 bedroom, 2 bath home that ia toUl 
electric and one of the best locations at Lake L«on. 
$65,000.00
2 bedroom frame home on large deeded lot at Lake 
Leon that is carpeted and has a fireplace. $55,00.00
2 bedroom frame home on large deeded lot at Lake 
Leon that is carpet, pecan mx:hard and is on 
pavement
3 bedroom, 1 bath home on two lots. This home ia 
fully carpeted and has central heat There is an extra 
house in back that ia 2 rooms and bath. Very large 
double garage that would be ideal for a shop. Located 
in Cisco. $23,500.00
2 bedroom, 1 bath dder home that has new siding but 
does need repair on the inside. Located in Ranger. 
$10,000.00
3 homes close to downtown Ranger. All are fully 
carpeted and have been completely remodeled. 
$36,000.00 for all three or will tell separately.

COMMERCIAL PROPERTY

Rental property! We have 2 large brick duplexes for 
sale. All are 2 bedroom, m  bath that are fully car­
peted, stove included. No problem staying rented. 
Only m  years old and have 110 square feet in each 
side.
One 2 bedroom duplex, fully carpeted, with stove, 
storage room, disposal and carport. Approximately 2 
years dd. Stays rented, has 900 square feet in each 
side. Only $45,000.00

4 houses do te  to school, in good condition. They are 
rented now. There is one 1 bedroom, two 2 bedroom, 
and one3 bedroom. They have new all-weather siding 
and chain link fences.
A grocery store and station with fixtures and stock 
that is doing a good business. A 3 bedroom home goes 
with tMa buaineM on approximately 1 acre a t land at 
Lake Leon. $45,000.00
Near Ranger on 1-20 8 acres that would make a good 
site for a buaineaa. $25,000.00 
A 25 X too building with four Iota that would make a 
good site for a buaineaa. There is an older home on 
one of the four lota that could be remodeled. 
$22,000.00

LOTS AND SMALL ACREAGE
41 acres near Lake Leon with city water, on 

pavement No improvements.
ApproKimatdy 31 acres with house and barns. This 

,,plaqe Jn intersects fwo highways. City water and 
‘wtMer well. $35,006.00
7 acres in good location in Cisco with city water, road 
frontage on four sides. Ideal building site. $15,000.00 
2 to 5 acre tracts at lake Leon with city water, 
electricty and telephone. Ideal building sites.
1 to 5 acre tracts on Hiway 80 East or I-2U. Ideal for 
commercial or residential. $5,000.00 and up.
5 lots located on South Bassett in Eastland. A real 
good buy at only $4,000.00
A very large corner lot located on South Bassett, 
approximately Vk acre. $10,000.00 
Gcnd size lots located in Olden. Mobil home or 
buihling sites. Only $2,800.00 each.
31 acres on pavement near Lake Leon with city 
water, electricty and telephone. Good building site. 
$21,000.00

FARMS AND RANCHES
650 acres on Sabanna River with pecan trees and 
some cultivation. Terms can be arranged $325 per 
acre.
612 acres located near lake Leon with large 2 
bedroom home, on pavement, with 174 acres 
cultivation, good fences, good pens and barn. One- 
half minerals. $350 per acre
546 acres Northwest of Eastland with mile high­
way frontage, 9 tanks, water well, city water, 180 
acres cultivation and a 5 room house with fireplace. 
$325 per acre
415 acres located Southwest of Ranger with deer and 
turkey. On Colony Creek. $300 per acre.
395 acres located on Ranger-Morton Valley highway 
with good fences, some coastal and love grass.
326 acres Northwest a t Ranger, approximately 80 
acres cultivation, house, good barns, and set of pens. 
One-half minerals. $375 per acre.
161 acres Northwest of Ranger with 60 acres coastal, 
20 acres love grass, and balance in KR bluestem and 
side oats, 2 good tanks, and good fences. No minerals. 
$375 per acre
154 acres Southwest of Carbon with 4 tanks, 100 acres 
coastal, good barn, and older house. Will take 20 
percent d ^ n  and carry 10 years. $450 per acre.
152 acres near 1-20 and Olden with city water, elec­
tricity and telephone available.
143 acres locatCKd Northwest of Ranger with 55 acres 
peanuts, 6 irrigation wells, and some minerals. 
$55,000.00
125 acres 5 miles Northwest of Gorman with 53 acres 
cultivation, S3 acres peanuts, and balance in pasture 
that hsa been cleared and reseeded in Blusestem. 
$600 per acre
210 acres North a t Eastland on pavement, with ap­
proximately 60 acres cultivadoa Good building site. 
$296 per acre. $14,000.00 down, owner will finance.

Office Phone 619-1725 
Nlwny M Enct 
tocNend, Texes 76441
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Nenie 647-1923



C o u rth o u M
News

lenry Rots Hedges & wife 
To Geo. E. Norris Wsrrenty 
Deed
Homestesd Const. Co. To 

Cram Mort. Ser. Inc. Deed of 
trust
Homestead Const. Co. To 

Ronald E. Owings & wife 
Warranty Deed 
Millard C. Humphrey Sc 

wife To Cram Mortg. Co. 
Deed o f trust 
Homestead Const. Co. 

Millard C. Humphrey Sc wife 
Warranty Deed 
Letha Lavelle Horn, dec'd 

To The Public Proof of Hem- 
ship Will attached 
Homestead Const. Co. To 

Jerry lee Langley Sc wife 
Warranty Deed 
Mrs. J.T. (Loula) Henry 

To Opal Nell Smith Sc others 
Warramy Deed 
Wayne Huff To Geo. 

Prestridge Deed of trust 
Roy Leon Johnson To The 

Public Affd
Frank A. Jones Sc wife To 

Nettie Rushing Warranty 
Deed
James E. Russell Pet To 

Jim R. Wright Sc wife Rel 
OGL

Joe Dennis Jarvis Sc wife 
To 1st Natl Bk-Cisco Deed of 
trust

Floyd Johnson To Viola 
Thomspon Rel. V-L

Crandall D. Jones To R.P. 
Wilson OGML 

Gail D. Jones To R.P. 
Wilson OGML 

Mary Kent To Pitts Oil Co. 
OGML

Truman P. Kirk Sc wife To 
Alton T. Maples Sc wife 
Warranty Deed 
Christine King Sc others To 

Ralph C. Hart Sc others OGL 
Walter Kurklin Sc wife To 

Joe D. Jarvis Sc w ife 
Warranty Deed 
Lazy T. Ranch To The 

Public Assumed name 
Mary E. Lane To Lonnie R. 

Holotik OGL
Lewis Foley Sc Assoc. To 

Michael J. Collins Rel. Lis 
Pendens
Tommy Lucas To Bill Smith 

Par Rel MML 
Jack E. Mergle To Doug 

Bevoni Asgn OGL 
Calvin Michelson To 

Weldon Isenhower Asgn 
0/R Roy.

MJM Oil Co. To Olen L. 
Scott Well Ser. MML Affd 
Harmon Paul Monts & wife 

To Edward G. Bagwell Sc 
wife Warranty Deed 

Horace L. Martin Sc wife To 
Homestead Const. Co. 
Warranty Deed 
Curtis W. Murphey To 

Lonnie R. Holotik C)GL 
Doyle L. Maynard Sc wife 

To Eastland Natl Bk Asgn 
D-T V-L
Eva K. Nichols vs Johnie H. 

Nichols To The Public 
Certified Copy divorce

decree
OIney Sav. Assn To Fred 

Barrett & wife Rel MML 
OIney Sav. Assn o Fred 

Barrett Sc wife Rel D-T Sc V-L 
OIney Sav. Assn. To Dolly 

V. Reid Rel D-T Sc V-L 
Pierce Mtr. Co. To 1st Natl 

Bk-Baird Deed of trust 
Norman L. Park Sc wife To 

Sanford Fagsdau OGL 
Stanley J. Pirtle To Ft. 

Worth Oil Sc Gas Asgn OGL 
Lee Roy Pearson Jr. To 

R.P. Wilton Asgn OGL 
A.G. Parrack To R.P. 

Wilson Asgn OGL 
Pearl Parrack To R.P. 

Wilson OGML 
Geo Prestridge To Wayne 

Huff Warranty Deed 
City of Ranger To Bob R. 

Harris Warranty Deed 
Timothy E. Reich Sc wife To 

The Public Design, of Home­
stead
Timothy E. Reich Sc wife To 

1st St Bk-Rising Star Deed of 
trust
Connie Robinson To R.P. 

Wilson OGML 
C.R. Richardson, dec’d To 

The Public Proof of Heinshtp 
Isadore Roosth. Indv. Sc 

others To R.P. Wilson OGML 
Howard D. Roper Sc wife To 

Danny Dyson Sc others Deed 
of trust

Skinny’s Inc. To L.R. Pierce 
dba Sc others Warranty Deed 

Southeastern Resources 
Corp. To Dynamic Industries 
Par Asgn OGL

Stephenville Prod. Cred.

Assn. ToC.B. Dill Sc wife Par 
Rel Deed of trust 
Robert Lowry Shults Sc 

others To Tra-C Oil Sc Ga» 
OGL

Homer King Shahan To 
Rodman Pet. Corp. OGML 

James L. Simpson To 
Lonnie R. Holotik OGL 

St. of Tea.-Gen. Ld. office 
To Woodrow Hallmark Graz­
ing Lse.
nalda Steagall Sc others To 

Stanely J. Pirtle OGML 
O.B. Slone To R.P. Wilson 

OGL
Ernest Simpson To Lonnie 

R. Holotik OGL 
Iona Day Sikes To R.P. 

Wilson OGML 
Tideway Energy Ltd Part. 

1976-3 To Deposit Guaranty 
Natl Bk Deed of trust 
Dorothy Turner Sc others To 

Paul J. Pendley Ogl 
Tra-C Oil 4c Gas to Robert 

L. Shults Asgn OGL 
C.L. Tyra Jr. To Tea-Enex. 

Incorp. Asgn OGL 
Tea. Enea Inc. To Harry 

Espenscheid Asgn OGL 
Tea-Enea Inc. To Ralph F. 

Anderson Asgn OGL 
Tea-Enea Inc. To A.C. 

Parks Asgn OGL 
Richard V. Troutman Sc 

wife To Ryan Mortgage Co. 
Deed of trust 
C.L. Tyra Sc others To 

Thomas M. Dick Asgn Int. 
Jerry W. Trice Sc wife To 

OIney Sav. Assn Deed of 
trust
Tideway Energy Ltd

OPENING FEBRUARY 6,1979

EASTLAND GLASS
House Of Reasonable Rates'

Window GIom R qilacem ^

Auto Glass
Table Tops 
Tab Endosares

Shower Doors 
Mirrors

•'*
k UÌI .H I f  ’»— 629-2973 

Serving EastliEuid G>unty
I 200 W. Commer̂  

G>mplete Glass Service

Partnership 176-3 To Deposit 
Guaranty Natl Bk F/S 
Randall Thorton 4c wife To 

Roy Edwards Sc wife Deed of 
trust
Tea Colada Oil Co. To 

Farmers 1st Natl Bk-Steph- 
enville Deed of trust 
Viola Thompson To Sandra 

Burkett Warranty Deed 
Olive E. Underwood To 

Marion S. Clayton Sc wife 
Warranty Deed 
Rozelle M. Uffelman To 

Charles E. Lansdale 4: wife 
Rel. DT V I
Veteran’ s Land Board To 

Harvey E. Franklin Deed 
Veteran’ s Land Board To 

Billie Frank Dudley Deed 
Opal Jo Warford 4; others 

To La. Crude Oil 4c Gas OGL 
Verda Harlow Wilson To 

J.E. Gardner OGML
Marilyn Wallach To 1st St 

Bk-Rising Star Deed of trust 
Everett Wilcoaen 4c wife To 

OIney Sav. Assn. Deed of 
trust
Wayne Webb 4: wife To 

Robert Lamb Const. To 
OIney Sav. MML 4c Asgn 
Gary Wilson Sc wife To J.R. 

Rector to 1st Natl Bk, Brown- 
wood MML 4c Asgn 
Gary Wilson 4c wife To 1st 

Natl Bk. Brownwood Deed of 
trust
Jim L. Webb To G. Gerald 

Winnett Rel D-T V-L 
Dollie V. Wells Sc husband 

To Equitable Life Ins. Soc. 
Warranty Deed 
James W. Young Sc wife To 

An Jennings Warranty Deed

Marriage Licenses — 
Roben Charles Bowles and 

Mary Louise Bowles 
lastniments FUed-Co. 

Clerk’ s Office — 
Albany Energy Company To 

H.R. Stasney &  others Asgn 
OGL

Phillip Arther Sc Wife To 
Eastland Natl Bk Deed of 
trust
A-1 Plumbing To The Public 

Assumed name 
Charles Arnett Sc wife To 

William S. Smith 4c wife 
Deed of trust
Della Clement Brown To 

Rube Cozart Special 
Warranty Deed 
B.G. Brown Construction 

To Samuel L. Starnes Sc wife 
Warranty Deed 
Bobbie G. Brown Sc wife To 

Saul A. Pullman Warranty 
Deed
J.B. Bryant To TESCO R/W 
Louis Barclay To The Public 

A ffd  of Non Production 
Arlin Bint To West Artesia 

Transmission OGL

H.C. Brown 4c others To 
West Artesia Transmission 
OGL

H.C. Brown 4c others To 
Cal Michelson OGML 

Joy Bowers 4c husband To 
Palo Petroleum Inc. OGL 

Virginia Bennett To Palo 
Petroleum Inc. OGL 

Mabel Clement To Pat 
Clement Power of atty. 

William H. Condry 4c wife 
To William E. Cltft 4c wife 
Warranty Deed 
Richard L. Criswell To 

Joyce Ray Criswell Warranty 
Deed
Coleman Production Credit 

Assn. To Sidney L. Waynick 
Sc w ife Part Rel Deed of trust 
Bob Carroll 4c wife To 

TESCO Esmt 4c R-W 
Robert Carroll To TESCO 

Esmt 4c R-W
Billy F. Claborn To TESCO 

Esmt R-W
O.D. Cunningham Sc wife 

To TESCO Esmt R-W 
Timithoy J. Creed Sc wife To 

Southern Savings 4c Loan 
Deed of trust
Dora Craddock To Clifton 

Ben Craddock 4c wife M/D 
Conn. Life Ins. Co. To B.E. 

Hanson Sc others Par Rel D-T 
Fred A. Chapman To Tea. 

Pacific Oil Co. OGL 
Carbon Farm Supply To 

The Public Assumed name 
C.G. Connell, Indv. To E.P. 

thomas Ratif.
C.G. Connell, Indv. To E.P. 

Thomas OGML
Frazier Clark To The 

Christi Co. Inc. Asgn OGL 
Citizens State Bank-Cross 

Plains To Douglas Campbell 
Sc wife Rel Deed of trust 
Cisco Jr. College To R.O. 

Duncan Warranty Deed 
E.E. Donelson 4c wife To 

Sidney L. Waynick 4c wife 
Rel Deed of trust 
Bevcriv S. Dudley, Jr. To 

TESCO Esmt 4c R W 
Travis Doggett 4c wife To 

TESCO Fsml 4c R W 
R.T. Ezzell To Odessa Natl 

Corp. R-W Easment 
Eastland Natl Bank To Jerry 

C. Squires 4c wife Rel. Deed 
of trust
Opal Edwards To Shirley 

Stuart P/A
Opal Edwards To Jo Ann 

Daniel P/A
Bonnie Faye Evans To 

Tea-Enea. Inc. OGML 
Mattie B. Evans A  others 

To W .K. Livingston OGML 
Jimmy E. Fickling 4c wife 

To Paul E. Wallen 4c wife 
Warranty Deed 
Jimmy E. Fickling 4i wife 

To Paul E. Wallen 4c wife 
Contract
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Hospital Potientt «
Patients in the E. L. 

Graham Memorial Hoapitai 
were Uatsd aa (oUows;
Ruby Compton 
Sylvia Switxer 
Charlea Collina 
Maude Hill 
Elsie Rogers 
Earl Neely 
Rosa Hart 
Roland Owings 
Houston Wink 
Floyd Honeycutt 
Sarah Barker 
Jcaephine Brawley 
Vivian McMiUan 
Viola Swindle 
Oscar McNecly 
Charlea Miller 
Serafina Lopez 
Lanall Anderson

Opal Blackstock 
Myrtle Parker 
Flora Loudder

PatienU in the Eastland 
Memorial Hospital are as 
listed:
Jamie Smith 
Thelma Lewis 
Della Hagar 
Linda Sadler 
Royce Parsley 
Lloyd Almire 

. Donald Rhyme 
Neely Earl 
Dicy Spink 
Charles Chesnut 
Leo Atkinson 
Con Brinkley 
James Smith 
Velma Fleming

Patricia Haley 
Betty Keith 
Effie Sharp 
Bertrice Murphy 
Cindy Brown 
Laura Nell Ridens 
George Region 
Fannie Turner 
R iU  Mann 
Leonard Alvey 
James Petsick 
Tracy Hardin 
Patricia Boner 
Kim Cole

Benny David Bronson 
Fred Coker 
Truman Teague 
Ralph Wood 
Baby Girl Cole 
Baby Girl Boner 
Baby Boy Hardin 
Wesley Nabers 
John Curtis Koen 
Kathryn Simpson 
Effie Forehand

• • •

May we wopest:
Young Edwardian Jumpsuits 
Herfc A Poo Slouses 
Esprit do Corp. Separates

Mony Items Still On Sole. CHARLIE'S ANGELS 
JEANS

800 North Seaman 

Eastland. Texas 
Telephone 629-8141

Bernice Copprock 
Anna Stephenson 
Bradley Arrington 
Justin Wilks 
Joyce Forrest 
JeretU Kay Tedford 
May Harbin 
Willie WyUe 
Myrtle Norris 
Pebble Chaney 
Ruth Morgan 
Lela Rasberry 
Judson Lemmons 
Emmet Morren 
Lawanta Livingston 
Mary Anderson 
Calvin Griffin 
Edward Clyde Rogers 
Shawna Oabom 
Tania Beggs 
Emma Boyd 
Letha Rogers 
Rube Callaway 
Virgil Wagley 
Gladys Fraley 
Gloria Tucker 
WiUiam Frank Taylor 
Frank Tucker 
Edward Anderson 
Glen Hamilton 
Fannie James 
Fay Overstreet 
Josephine Boatright 
Clara Mahurin 
Roy Lee Smith 
Leo Bailey 
Melvin Maynard 
Joe Vem Garrett 
Pamela Gray 
Darlene Fox 
Eula Brown

Patients in Ranger 
General Hospital:
0|Me Jones
Susie Sledge
Bessie Rose
Carlos Swarfford
Claude Vinson
Zola Neeley
Elizabeth Lenzini
Odessa Johnson
Mary Eley
Mary Hale
Nora Lemley
George Rhyne
Louis Harvey
Winnie Sparger
Judith Harlin
Robert Edwards
A. C. Thompson
J. D. Rogers
Della Jones
Hattie Wright
O. L. Justice
Ernest Dempsey
Clyde Campbell
Louise Stocktell
Donna McDonald and Baby
boy

T* Givt TtsIhMiiy
John Hogan, em ployee 

with West Texas Produce, 
w ill g iv e  his personal 
testimony this Sunday, Feb." 
4, 19?« at 5:00 p.m., at (he 
church of Nazarene, 1008 W. 
10th in Cisco, everyone is 
welcome. •

C O L L E G E  S T A T IO N , 
Public comment, especially 
from farmers and others in 
the peanut industry, is 
invited regarding price 
support levels and other 
provisions of the 1979 crop 
peanut program by Feb. S.

R ecom m endations are 
being sought for a number of 
items on the program includ­
ing the national support level 
for quota peanuts, national 
support level for additional 
peanuts, and the sales policy 
for additional peanuts 
acquired by the government 
under the 1979 program and 
sold for export edible use. 
Legislation requires price 

support of not less than 5420 
per ton be made available on 
1979 crop peanuts produced 
within a farm's poundage 
quota, points out Johnny 
Feagan, economist with the 
Texas Agricultural Extension 
Service. It also requires price 
support on peanuts produced 
within a farm’s acreage allot­
ment but in excess of the—  
poundage quota. However, 
this support level is deter­
mined by the Secretary of 
Agriculture.
In determining the price 

support level for those 
additional peanuts, the 
Secretary will be looking at 
current demand for peanut 
oil and meal, expected prices 
of other vegetable oils and

firotein meals, and demand 
or peanuts in foreign 
markets, notes Feagan.
In 1978 price support was 

available on quota peanuts at 
5429 per ton. Additional 
peanuts were supported at 
5250 per ton. The 1978 
Commodity Credit Corpora­
tion minimum sales price for 
edible grades of additional 
peanuts for export was 5400 
per ton.
Feagan encourages peanut

Courthouse Squares

producers and producer 
groups to take advantage of 
this opportunity to, 
recommend changes in t h e »  
1979 peanut program. Send 
comments to Ray Fitzgerald, 
Agricultural Stabilization

Regortling Peanut Price Leveb
Washington, D.C,and

U.S.
Conservation Service,
Department of Agricul-

E AS^ii^DTrELEGEXM  C ÌÌS ^ M Ìe SS

ture,
20250.

RANGER TIMES 
Raager, Tezee Eastlead, Texea

Thuredoy, February 1.

W E HONOR

MnkM ieiiicmb

Start N ut f  - S Tilts

As a doctor, I've found 
you can cure lots of 

things by telling folks 
their ailment is a sign of

MAALOX
12 01. U90M

4 |« 7

Ub
PANH HOSE

Only 5 7

ELECTRIC BLANKETSDbbMb M Sho 
SiRgIt CoMtroli Qniy

’tiir’ *17“
SUPER SAVING'S 

2 0 %
ALL BUSTER BROW N  

IN S T O C K

SPRING
FLOWER BUSHES 

0riy$157

20 Gal. BUCK 
TRASH CANw/iM $̂ 841 10 01. lox

CHERRIES

•“ 93*
SLEEP W UR FLEECÊ

■h - ' i *’ tc

99*
1 T iM tO f

DOUBLE KNITMSoHi 0̂
v e« M  To *3- $ 2 7 7

J IR T A M m O  
HAND n n iN ID

ROSE BUSHES 
$ 2 9 6

ju n M u n v D

GLADIOLA BULBS
1 0  n i  9 | M

1 DAHLIAS

JUST ARRIVED
d w a r f  $ 1 3 9
CANNAS Pk. 1 
IL iP H A N T ^
iA R S  ta . /y

KINCAID
OPEN MON-SAT

WHY HAVEN'T YOU CALLED U8-on this beeutifrU 
brick hbme located in Eastlonds finest neighborhood-3 
br., 2 baths-Large family room with fireplace, unique 
kitchen with buUtrins, Double garage with excellent 
storage and a handy shop with 220 wirlng-Owners 
waiting to-Don't you wait to call-Reduced price
948,900.00

LARGE G RAaO U S FAM ILY  HOME-3 bedrooma, 2 
baths, fireplace, large kitchen with built-ina, comer 
lot, custom drapes. Immediate possession, A Nice 
Home for 942,800.00.

ARE YOU WAITING TO MOVE TO THE COUN- 
TRY-There will never be a better time than now with 
this attractive home available to you-4 acres, rough 
cedar exterior, central heat and air in addition to the 
cosy fireplace, shop, water well and city water. Ideal 
location-Appraiaed at 948,000.00.

MAKE US AN OFFER-3 br., 1 bath home situated on 
5 acres. Well kept-Stay comfortable with central heat 
and air. Plenty of storage and a shop-Call Today- 
Asking 38,900.00.

COMFORTABLE AND INV lTlNG -3 bedroom and 
m  baths-comer lot, red brick, formal dining, break­
fast room, service porch, 4 ton central heat and air- 
new shop building-Handy to schools-See Today- 
9^800.00^
B E AU TIFU L-O AK  TREES-Surround attractive 
3 bedroom, 1 bath home. Situated on two lots, chain- 
link fence, double garage, warm pine paneling and 
cablnets-AvaUable for 91000.00 cash down-Asking 
933,500.00.

ARE YOU READY TO MOVE YOUR BUSINESS 
CLOSER TO HOME-Then we have what you are 
looking for in this newly listed 3 bedroom home in 
Cisco-Beauty Shop and storage, 3W lots, covered patio, 
central heat and oir-CaU Us Today-929,S00.00.

COUNTRY BAROAIN-3 acres, loU of potential, 
carpet, seperate dining, paneling, good fences-Call 
For An A|^intment-919,m.00 SELL YOUR WIFE- 
On tUs cosy 2 br. home in Gorman-2 blocks from 
hospital and rmt home, W acre, water weU-Call for 
Mors lBformattoo-919,500.00.

ARB YOU LOOKING FOR AN OUTSTANDING  
BUY-Then look now mora-We have a comfortable 2 
bedroom home that sounds Uks you^^oay dining room 
with fireplace, fsneed back yard, garags and storage. 
What a Buy-Whet a PrleeSlOOO.OO caslnlown paynent 
919JOO.OO.

We have oioay other listings
Loe rm es 817-629-1575 

Joy Staggs 517429-1396

REAl ESTATE
FNA-VA-CONVENTIONAL FINANCING

THIS 18 THE PERFECT CHANCE FOR YOU-To 
buy a good house at a good price-Neat 3 bedroom 
home-new siding, excellent neighborhood. Roomy 
kitchen, nice yard, even a garden spot-Check this out 
before look ii« elswhere4lS.500.00.

MAKE A TRADE FOR THIS 2 BEDROOM HOUSE 
IN CISCO-Good neighboriiood, paneled, carpet, large 
living room, fenced, lota of fruit treea, excellent 
gardm  apace-Owner would conaider mobile borne or 
lake property in tmde41?400.00.

KNOW A BARGAIN WHEN YOU SEE ONE-You 
will in this 3 bedroom frame with 1 acre in Ciaca In 
good repair, freah paint, ready to move into. Carpet, 
roomy kitchen with pretty wood cabioeta. Fenced with 
bam -R ea^ for you and your borae-Priced for quick 
sale417,000.00.

EXTRA INCOME I>OTENTIAL-3 or 4 bedroom 
houae on comer lot with 8 mobile home spacea, 
comfortable house, good neighboihood, all carpet 
except utility room, fruit troea-A Woiklng man’s Home 
at A Thinking Man’s Pric*417,000.00.

LOOKING FOR A W AY TO BEAT HIGH RENTAL 
PRlCES-’Than check out this large 3 bedroom home in 
EasUand-Convenient to acbooia, nice size rooms, 
wonderful potential-Pay equity and aasumc low 
monthly paymonta of 9101.00.

REMODELING EX PE R T NEEDED-For tUa 10 
room, 2 story houae in Gormaa Great potential with 3 
bedrooma, 2 hatha downataira-3 rooms upstairs. 
Priced right at 910.000.00.

M EET THE DEMAND FOR RENT PROPERTY- 
with this duplex in Eaatland-’Three bedrooms on one 
side, 2 on the other-needs some repair, but rentable- 
Asking 97900.00.

START THE NEW YE AR  OFF RlGHT-ln our newly 
listad 2 bedroom honw panoUng-Don’t Let Thia Pass 
You By419J00.00.

ECONOMY MINDED-Small 2 bodroom bouse in 
Eaetland. Lota of kitchen cnbinota, fenced back ynrd- 
912.980.00.

COME SEE THlS-spacioua older home in Ranger, 
completely laoovnted, 8 bedrooms, 2 baths, new built 
ins, new bath ftxturaa, cantral boat A air. Inaulation, 
2200 aq. fL You’ ll lova tba naw look and tha old charm, 
ownor financing. Ba sura to aoa thta for 940,000.

DON’T  WORRY ABOUT FINANCING on this 3 
bedroom house, 1300 sq. ft., 5 lots, nice remote location 
for a garden or orchard Owner financing. 20 percent 
dowa 915,500.

E F F ia E N T  IS THE WORD for this small house in 
Ranger near downtown. Stove, refrigerator, ft 
evaportlve cooler included watber-dryer hookup. 
Greet atarter at this price 97,500.

IT ’S A BEAUTY of a mobile home with 2 large lota in 
Ranger. 14 x 80,3 bedroom 1V6 baths, 2 yaara old, rock 
underpining, furniture included. Beautiful tocation, 
chain liiA  fence, get Into this for a low down payment, 
ft take up payments. 915,000.

629-1781
LAKE PROPERTY

BUY NOW-FOR LATER4ind enjoy a good wata- 
front in this one bedroom cabin on Lake Leon. Large 
family room, seperate dining room, leased lot, fenced 
yard422,000.00.

ENJOY EASY U V IN G  A t  THE LAKE-in this one 
oedroom cabin, large screcned-in porch, pertielly 
furnished, BBQ. pit, large deeded lot4ie,000.00

LAKE CABIN-Located on a fishing nook at Lake 
Leon Small house completly furnished, boat dock-Not 
far from Country Club-a good Weekender for 
910.000.00.

LOTS AND SMALL ACREAGE
JUST WHAT YOU ARE LOOKING FOR 5 acres 

near Cdony, lovely rural homeaite, close to both 
Eastland ft Ranger, pecan trees, natural gas on site, 
water welL ideal location for home. Owner finance, 20 
percent down, 98,500.

CORNER LOT IN EASTLAND on paved streets, 
large trees, close to schools, Nice business or 
homesite. 91,800.

2 FENCED LOTS with scattered oak trees. Small 
ahed with horse pen, Nice building site or ready fw  *  
horse.

18 LOTS IN CISCO, close to 1-20. Good investment or 
development property, needs tome leveling. Owner 
finaincing availabie. 94,500.

S ACRES ON EDGE OF EASTLAND 2 tracts to 
choose from. Large mature pecan treea, coastal 
bermuda, creek bottom, city water. Pretty place to 
live 97,500.

12 ACRES IN CISCO Street frontage on Leke^w n ie  
road, ready to be improved, city water, V4 minerals, 
will divide, make us an offer. Asking 91,000 acre.

14 ACRES ON 1-28 Large pecan treaa, Leon River 
bottom, great potential, ownar financing with 10 
percent down. Asking 9900. acre.

29 ACRES SOUTH OP CISCO, ^ ^ c ,  scettwad 
treea, west-bound wat«r. Ideal for biiilding or mobile 
home, flexible terms or nnancing. Asking 9900 acre.

48 ACRES-B08QUE COUNTY-Soma cultivation, 
‘nmber, native graaaaa, paean orchard, 1 tank, aoma

minerals, Bosque K iver runs thru property Owner will 
consider financing-Call for Details.

58.1 CARES-LEON RIVER RUNS THRU-2 taidis. 
water welL 1 bam, small one bcdroom-partly tar- 
niahed hoase, 4W mllea south of Clsca 5888.89 per acre.

68 ACRE PEANUT FARM-1 mile off highway, 25 
acre peanut allotment, water well. Will sell all or sub- 
divide4820.00 per acre.

85 ACRES PR IM E GRASSLAND-3 miles N. E. of 
Eastland-Good fences. Old houae, 2 small bams, 2 
tanks, Poasible owner finance-9565.00 per acre.

188 ACRES-AU improved graasland-Carbon area- 
bem, good fences, atock tanka, all coastal and love 
grau. Asking 9495.00 an acre.

119 TREE-COVERED ACRES-Located approx. 7 
miles aoutheaat cf Eastland, W minerals, fenced, good 
Deer hunting, owner financing avaitable-affet^ at
9375.00 an acre.

138 ACRE84TRAW N AREA-Ideal hunting-amaU 
houM-roUlng hills. Perfect Hideway-Owner finance-
9388.00 an acre.

388 ACRE8-S. of Ciaco-ExceUant hunting, lota of 
trees, some open land, 3 stock tanka, good fences, 
owner would consider splllting. Sorpe minerals. 
Asking 9325.00 an acre. '

888 ACRE8-EA8TLAND COUNTY-ExceUent hun­
ting, good water walla, stock tanks, Ultra4tanic-Invest 
or tanna with ownar financing. Priced well below 
average land prices. Ideal combination Ranch, 
Racraatlon, Invaatment property.

lanches, oiotels, and apartments. We want to SELL your liftings.
NMn N rsoos 817429-2754 S try l M dOm M iM y 8 1 7 rtf9 4 4 2 9
d im s  I o w w s  217447-3127 IM s  Kincaid l l l ^ i m
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ARE YOU SICK AND T lliD 7
Aro you tick and tirod o t  faeling aick and tired???? If we 
remove the cauae the aymptoms will diaap- 
pear...Diaordered nerves and bad digestion are a common 
cause. of most illness. We specialise in disorders related to 
the spine and nervous system. There’s a place for 
Chiropractic in your health program. Free Con­
sultation...X-Rays not required. Please call for an ap­
pointment

DR. GEO. G. MePHAUL 
-chirepractor- 

647-M2I
S t p Im bo  Cut and Save Rangar. Tciaa

GyMiMftict Q n ttt In Frogrngg In Enstlaid

CACTUS A auco
120 A Mnin Rnngtr 647-1414 

W1  tn  Oostd For bivMitory 
Jonimry 29, 30 A 31.

WM Rt-Opnn Fghrnnry 1.
Com« In And Sm  Onr Nnw Spring Linng.

m i .  n a t a l .

1 There's lots of flipping an 1 
balancing going on at thi 
brick gym  on Tuesda 
nights.

Instuctors from Abiler3 
Christian University con • 
over and for an hour an a

half teach children gyn - 
nastics.

They learn tip-ilps, for­
ward roll, backward roll, 
ca rtw h ee l, headstand, 
handstand, front, hano- 
spring, step-out, backwalV- 
over, front walkover, aerials 
and back somi-tuck. Each 
step i is a different level and 
some are on each level.

Those involved are Joci 
A lexander, K im  Arnold, 
Ashley Ball, Angela Begg», 
Craig and Lisa Chick, Am / 
Davis, Phyllis Gevara, Leigh 
Callerman, Janna, Tonn.a 
and Bubba Adair, Lori 
Lasater, Sandra Lye rle , 
Shonda Martin, Jennifer 
Maynard, Tracy Maynan , 
Nan Mitchell, Josefa Oroaco. 
Rebecca and Tom m y 
Treadw ell, Ingrid  Valik, 
Vicki W right, NataLa 
Stevens, Laurie Cagle and 
Julie Dennis.

These students are ages V 
12 and are from Eastland, 
Ranger and Cisco.

If you are interested in th s 
program  fo r your child, 
contact Mildred Adair after 
5:00 at 629-2848

DAVID'S &  Q U enA 'S
1 - »  iosl Nairt fa  I

DAVID'S QUETTA'S
AIL SWEATERS

1 Grou|i O f Long SloovoSHins
PIKE

«  ’

AN Remoiniiig

MERCHANDISE
OH

60%O
On AH

FAIL SPORfSWUR

On AH New

SPRING
MERCHANDISE

Arriving Doily

Sbtryl N « tt i7t -79RMg«r J«ycM Rodoo Gu«tn
Sheryl Harbin will represent Ranger Jaycees 

at the Fort Worth Fat Stock Show and Rodeo on 
Friday, February 2, 1979 at the 2:00 p.m, per­
formances.

P e tit Jury 
Advised Not To 
Return Feb. 5

TheOlst District Court petit 
jury which was recessed 
recently and instructed to 
return on Monday, Feb. 5, is 
being advised not to report 
on that date at the direction 
of the court. District Court 
Clerk Roy Lane has 
announced.

President Elected 
For Shrine Oub

C.C. Window of Albany has 
been elected president of the 
Croaa Timbers Shrine Club

Other new officers are 
Phillip Osborn of Gorman, 
vice president: and W. E of 
Cisco, screlary-treasurer.

tNiRiEpliMcMi
All IntoTMtad Parsons. Cali 647-3297 or Fill Our M ow Form and 
Moil to Mrs. Froddi« H. Johnson, 117 Mosquito, Rongor, TX 7547

REdSTRATION FOiM 
EoaSond Country Spinnora 

Square Oonoo Chib

NAME

FHONE-

‘  A  / /  \

‘  r t <  s
/

--

1 \ ' H | i  i N  \ H I  1 

I N  1 1 U l i i H '
For Distinctive Draperies Call

» Pearltne JSeil
1706 W. C o m m e r ç a  a  EASTLAND, TEXAS 7 6 4 4 8  a  PHONE 6 2 9 - 1 3 1 9

Goylene Stephens 
Voted Sweetheort
Julie Gaylene Stephens of 

Huffman, Texas. Daughter 
of Danna Hamm, grand­
daughter of Mrs. Irene Over- 
and. Gaylene is a senior at 
Huffman High Schind, she 
has been voted the Sweet­
heart of the Huffman CVAE 
Chapter, she is President of 
the Huffman Chapter, an has 
been elected as Secretary of 
the State of Texas CVAF.. 
Gaylene, has a brother Larry 
D. Stephens a Sophmore and 
sister Laurie Hamm a first 
grader, fH>th here in F.astland 
public school.

CITIZEN REALTY
RANGER EASTLAND

''W e Sell Eastland County
CISCO

a

COMMERCIAL BUILDING Good investment on Main 
Street in Ranger-leased to four going buaineaa-Call for 
more informatioa
RECENTLY REMODELED, 2 bedroom home. Small 
down with low monthly payments. A very good buy, call 
for complete details.
3M ACRES Northwest of Ranger, highway frontage. 
CoasUl and love grass with three stock tanks makes this 
a real nice place. Priced toaell, call for details.
JUST REMODELED-Nice 3 bedroom home redone 
inaidc and out. Vacant and ready for you. See today 
$30,960. Small down FHA-financing avaiabie.
SEE TO APPRECIATE Nice 3 bedroom home on comer 
lot-beautiful paneling-amall down payment on FHA 
Loan.
GOOD LOCATION ON LAMAR Nice 3 bedroom home on 
comer lot-beautiful paneling-amall down payment on 
FHA Loan.
GOOD LOCATION ON LAMAR Nice 3 bedroom. 
bath, brick home. Lota of extras-Vacant and ready for 
you. Call today for detaila.
LARGE BRICK brick, 3 bedroom,
2 bath on wooded tion. Storage building-
barbecue, fenced y w 3 S t»  storage Good financing. 
RECENTLY R ^ M C ' V k « t  2 bedroom home with 
fresh paint inside at roof, only $15,900, amall
down FHA or no d c ^ ^  Vets.
PRICED TO BELL 3 bedroom home in good location, 
remodeled a year ago. Good financing, call for detaila 
today-won’t last
BAROAIN-REOUCED^xoody buy on this 2 bedroom 
frame home-reduced to $5,000 for quick sale.
IDEAL EBTABUBHED BUSINESS for retired couple In 
Ranfa r . Miniture Golf course with all squipment and 
cooceasioo stand. Priced for quick aak ^,000.00.

tn  NAVI o rm i u stm o s  m  U N ea -C A U  
TM  NUMBD B aow  FOB MOM  
m f o r m a h o n i

J07 A M akiSangar
647-1302

M S r iH I* i4F-1U S

OWNER SAYS SELL! ! ! We have two new brick homes, in 
Eastland’s finest neighborhooa both are 3 bedroom, 2 bath 2 
car garages, wood burning fireplaces, central air and heat, 
loaded with extras. Excellent financing available Trade-ins 
considered-Call today for more information.
TWO STORY HOUSE 4 bedroom, 2 bath, frame carpet, A 
good buy $22,340. Call today for details on financing. 
REMODELED 2 bedroom-Good condition neat, small 
frame house, range and refrigerator goes with it a real good 
buy at $6500.
LOVELY COUNTRY HOME 5 miles Northwest of town. 
Three bedroom 2 bath all built-ins, living-room, dining 
room, den with wooden fireplace. Very attractive home, 
dining room, den with wooden fireplace. Very attractive 
home, call for appointment to see 
MOBILE HOME14 x 80 ̂  mobile home built-
ins central air and het C j| \ Y . lJ  ndition, owner bought 
new, needs to sell-call v ^ ^ i a i l s .
REAL NICE2 bedroom frame home in nice neighborhood 
priced to sell. Call for detaila.
611 acres with 4  minerals near Lake Leon with an older 3 
bedroom brick home.
COMANCHE COUNTY 292 acres-72 acres peanut allotment 
110 coastal 110 cultivation with a real nice 3 bedroom 2 bath 
home, irrigation wells, 2 stock tanks plus 1 irrigation tank 
call for details.
47 acres South of I-w' .  interchange, ideal for 
building site, highwa rized to sell 4  minerals
goes with property,
LAKE LEON ROAD 4*  ̂acres good building site $4,500 
FRESH ON M ARKET Apartment rental and established 
buaincas. Call for details.
GROCERY STORE AND STATION bait house, with a 3 
bedroom home on l acre at Lake Leon-call for détails. 
BROWNWOOD Thunderbird-Bay 2 lota-water and elec­
tricity.

161 ACRES 14 miles Northwest of Ranger 40 acres coastal 
bermuda 20 love grass 101. range land-improved. Fenced 
and crossed fenced, two tanks and corrals. 
WEEKENDERS W ILL A PPR E O A TE  this one bedroom 
lake home with deep water boat dock large lot, all for 
$22000.
COME SEE THIS MOBILE HOME 3 lots, bost dock, 
storage house, furniture, located on ideal part of the lake. 
Priced to sell $31500.
CUSTOM BUILT LAKE HOME on beautiful deed lake front 
lot, 2 large bedroom 2 full baths, 2 car garage. Custome 
cabinets and built-ins, big kitchen, fireplace, boat house, 
basement, many other amentities. Call for appointment. 
W ATER FRON’T BEAUTY 3 bedroom home with fireplace, 
have covered patio landscaped back yard to water. Boat 
dock and ramp $53,200.
LARGE LOTS and deep water frontage, 2 bedroom 
screened sleeping porch, are features of this lake home, 
city water and priced to sell in the upper 30’s.
ANOTHER ONE 1 bedroom lake cabin m ly $18000 lake 
front, boat dock. Call today for detzils!!
FRESH ON MARKET See to appreciate thii 3 bedroom, 2 
bath central air and heat, all built-ins, den, large boat dock, 
wooded lot, storage house, pump house, 2 septic tanks also 
city water-Call for more information.
BEAUTIFUL LAKE HOME This luxury home is 
everything you’ve dreamed about Custom drapaa, 
Austin stove, big kitchen w-lots of cabinets and storage. 
Large covered porch, 2 boat house, beautifully land­
scaped lot, basement 2 car garage. Come sec this 
honey.

FOK MORE INFORMATKNI ON EASTUND'S LISTINGS CAUt
820 W. M oiii-E attio iid

629-1769
W«7M OvriMM 629-A212 SonIm I 629-1269 H a iti Utëerwted 629-11M

Ltvt 647-1914 RMNiy Cofbtni 629-2341

EQUAL NOUtlllG 
OFfOKTUNITIEt

C. ANGY FOWLIR, OWNIR-BROKER
o p e n d a Il y s t o s

WE 
T U D l-

LARGE 3 BEDROOM HOME on 3 lots Buy equity and 
assume loan of only $11,400. A good solid home priced for  ̂
quick sale.
RECENTLY REMODELED G«K)d K)cation on 13th Street 2 , 
nice 2 bedroom with study. G(x>d Financing low down 
payment-immediate occupancy. Call for details.
EQUITY BUY Real nice 3 bedroom home. 2 car carport with 
storage room Shady corner lot with fenced back yad. 
Excellent condition. Buy equity and assume loan. Immedi­
ate position.

COME SEE TO APPRECIATE-Very roomy 3 bedroom 1 and 2 i  
half baths, glass enclosed sun porch, built-in dishwasher and' 
garbage disposal, refrigerator and cook stove, fireplace, | 
Borage apartment. Financing available, call today for detaila 
won’t last long!! ’ |

INVESTMENT PROPERTY Combination residental and 
business in good location. Too many extras to list. Call us 
today for details.
SUPER HOME on  ̂bedroom with beautiful
carpet. With built-i shwasher. 2 car garage on
a landscaped corn« —  .  in the mid-teens.
FRESH ON MARKET-COMMERCIAL BUILDING with 
inventory for fast foods. Excellent opportunity for interested 
party. Owner ftnancing available. Call for details.
SOUTH OF CISCO -80 acres improved $500. per acre.

MORAN-ROOMY 2 or 3 bedroom, 2 bath, home, 2 car 
garage with work shop. This large house has IVk lots- 
Come see us about the caay financing available.

NEW LISTING, recently remodeled, 3 bedroom, living 
room and den, new carpet, priced to sell in mid teens, 
call for detaila.

WE NAVE OTHER CISCO LISTINGS CALL THE 
NUMRER lELOW FOR MORE MFORMATKHIt

707 Avo* D-Q fco O ffko
442-3568

Tm m  McMwry 442-2459 
D «m  Gb m m  442-39SI

442-1933

r e a l t o r *
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Ces-Tex Reiij-|tiate
JOHNNIE WATSON

m-tm.
L Y U A  M B H A rrS Y
C irS M l3 »> as l

1«  A C U  tUNCM
witfas tMdKMM. S hsMi, hMM. AU iourovMi
p u iu r«  with gsoi f«aow a id  eriM  faocM wo to «00 
P ^ n  Irooo, M iH i  lu d  oa bM EoklM  of m n ilt  rivor, 
oioo t  Uiaks. (¡hTMt iof tiowc« QUAil, door ond
turkey.
1146,000

U  A C V V
with beoutlfui t  jrr. old brick S.OSO HI- ft. home, very 
•podoue with S bodroomo, X bolbo. Control hooting and 
AC with fifotJoco ia huga <lv> SMi room, ad­
joining oeparata fo ino room. A il improvod paaUire with 
good metal oorrak. 3 stock pHglfc X water walk. |ii«,uuo

4« ACHES
with small but aice 3 bedroom. l.UM sq. f t  home. Has 
new carpet, X car onclosod gscago- W o o M  and pasture 
land in EasUaad county, good fences and boms, 3 stock 
tanks, deer and turkey. Only Xis miles from Lake Leon. 
143,900

SSS N. Kent, German, 4 bedroom, 3 bath brick. Two. 
firepkces, beamed ceiling in dan. New Carpet 
throughout Lets of storage, large utility area, dish 
washer. Water well, c o v e ^  patio. «31,SCO.

Excellent building site-TS foot by 310 feet on Pershing 
streeM^orman 11,900.

2 bedroom rook house on S. Fisher Street in Gormaa 
Separate duang room, pecan trees, large lot 319,000.

Busintss oppurtunity-2Vk acres on Interstate 20. 
Restaurant six courts, station with living quarters.

2 bedroom mobile home on 110 x 
fumuhed. 16,900.

300 lot. Partially

314 S. Third, Gorman. 3 Bedroom, m  baths, brick, 1 
car garage 1100 square fea t total elactric, oeoual 
heating and air, carpat Ctoae to schoda. |X6,000.

310 N. Kant S t GorinanX bedroom k rge  older home. 
Newly remodeled bathroom. Separate dining room, 
paneled throughout Good location on comer k>t large 
oak trees, metal storage building 311,000.

Real Cutc!-1 bedroom bouse in Gorman Paneled pink 
siding exterior. Ideal for young couple 37,00U.

210 E. Lexington, Gorman-3 bedroom, m  baths, brick, 2 
car garage, central heating and air, carpet 4 years old. 
329,000.

WE NEED LISTINGS 
Jerry Mekaffey, Broker 

CEN-TEX 
REAL ESTATE

Call anytime je rry  Mehaffey
Jokaay Watsee Broker
817.734-2777 P.O. Box 727

■PglPf Pi TTMB 7 « «

B ankm  To DiscyM 
Now AG MMioting

Keeping sbresst of 
changing marketing alterna­
tives is important to any 
banker who dealt with 
producers of food and fiber 
products. Texas bankers will 
learn more about some new 
concepts in marketing 
agricultural products at the 
2/th Texas Farm and Ranch 
Credit School for 
Commercial Bankers Feb. 
12-13 at Texas AAM  Univer­
sity.
A special panel discussion 

on marketing to improve 
producer profitability will be 
chaired by Dr. Bob Branson, 
coordinator of Texas AAM 's 
A g r ic u l tu r a l  M a rk e t  
Research and Development 
Center. Panel members 
include Ralph Newman, exe­
cutive vice president, 
American Rice, Inc., 
Houston; Ed miller, Texas- 
sweet Citrus Advertising, 
Inc., M ission; and Don 
A n d erson , A g  ricu ltu ra l 
Investments Consultants, 
Inc., Lubbock.
Leading off the school will 

be Ernest Baughman, presi­
dent, Federal Reserve Bank 
of Dallas, who will discuss 
the economic and monetary 
outlook.
Other sessmns will cover 

outlook information for 
v a r io u s  a g r ic u ltu r a l  
commodities, sources o f 
funds for small agricultural 
banks, coorespondent bank­
ing. and current policy issues 
in agricuture, points out Dr. 
Dick Trimble, economist with 
the Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service and 
program chairman of the 
school.

Subscription DeadKno Extended Thni Febi

Immediately following the 
school will be an Agricultural 
Credit Analysis Workshop 
which will begin the morning 
of Feb. 14 and end the 
morning of Feb. 16. This 
W orkshop will provide an 
in-depth treatment o f  prepar 
ing and analysing financial 
statements, reconciling farm 
records, and preparing cash 
flow projections. Case 
problems will be solved to 
provide realistic experience 
for attending bankers.
A special three-day 

Commodity Hedging Session 
will also be conducted during 
the same period as the credit 
workshop. This session will 
provide an in-depth look at 
the mechanics *o f hedging, 
hedging as a forward pricing 
fool, hedging decision
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Because o f icing and 
generally had weather dur­
ing most of January, the 
deadline for extension o f  
subscriptions to the local 
newspapers has been 
extended through the month 
of February.
The local newspaper in an 

effort to be able to hold 
subscriptbn prices without 
increases, has gone to Jan. 1 
to Jan. I subscription period 
so that individual notices will 
not have to be sent out, due 
to the ever increasing cost of 
postage.
However, subscriber are 

being urged to subscribe 
from Jan. 1 to Jan. I in

advance, sod all subscribers 
who are not paid up by Feb. 
28, will be removed from the 
mailing list.
The response to the system 

has been overshelm ingly 
good and local newspaper 
subscribers generally report 
that they prefer the new 
syatem. in as much as it 
helps them to remember that 
their subscriptions are due 
each Jan. 1, rather than at

scattered times •throughout 
the year.
The newspsptir record 

keeping system«, will be 
im imved with tlMt yesr-loog 
subscriptions, aatl the sav­
ings in postsgs Is s great 
help in keeping tlie cost o f 
subscriptbns d ^ i i .  
Production costs ointinue to 

increase and the cost of 
newsprint has just gons to 
3320 a ton.

2 Bedroom,

Country
Largo

Living In

*55o"^««r
A vt. I ,  Qn 9

p

f a t 100 X 120, Carport, Orchard, 

Tt Um, FHA 3'A Percont Loon 

Akonlhly, Tolol Frico *I«,X90.M«CUndor

*100 Omen Payment \PUis Closing Cost, 

CoN CoNoct: '
N iM T âW  HOMES

É Â  1 -11Û0

H & W DevelopeiiMiit
216 S.

CourfhouM
N t w s

Bob Simpson A wife To 
Larrv Simpson Corrective 
W-D
Larry Simpson &  wife To 

.lohn K. Epperson A wife 
Warranty Deed 
Mary Lou Taylor To Lonnie 

R Holotik OGL 
The Diet Workshop To The 

Public Assumed Name 
H.R. Tibbels & wife To O.J. 

Caraway MML 
Weldon Tankersley A wife 

To Stanley N. Staples OGML 
TV Cable of Rising Star To 

The Public Assumed Name 
United Savings o f Assn, of 

Texas To Sec't o f Housing 
and Urban Dev. of Wash. 
D.C. Warranty Deed 
United Savings Assn of Tex. 

To Robert M. Newman Appt. 
of Sub trustee 
Veteran's Land Board To 

James H. Krabill Jr. 
Contract o f S/P 
Veteran's Land Board To 

Lloyd L. Durham Contract of 
S/P
Veteran's Land Board To 

William E. Taylor Contract of 
S/P
Veteran's Land Board To 

William D. Rainey Contract 
of S/P
Perry C. Vines A wife To 

Stanley N. Staples Paid up 
OGL
W.A. Hill A  Sons. Inc. To 

Eu^aj^d Natl. Bk. F/S

guides, and living with a 
hedged loan.
For further information on 

the bankers school, contact 
Trimble at I08A Ag. Bldg., 
Texas A A M  University, 
College Station, Texas, 
77843 (713/845-80113.mmtmmmmmrn

Eastland

3 bedroom, 1 t>ath, living uroa, kitchen and dining com- 
binaUun. Woodbuming fireplace. Central heat and ahr. 
Paneled and new carpet. Nice location with double ffarage 
and storage. Fenced back yard and shade treea.

Here ia that country home you have wanted so long. 3 
bedroom, 2 bath, large den with woodbuming firepUet, 
living room, dining room large kitchen with lots of caliinets. 
Some paneling and completely carpeted. Huge workshop. All 
of this on approximately 4 acres.

Far Sale: 499 Crestwood under construction now this 3 
bedroom, 2 baths brick home with living room, dining room 
and kitchen with built-ins. Woodbuming fireplacs and double 
garage. Nice large lot in Ideal locadoa Time to come in and 
pick your colors 347,900.00 with 10 psreent down on Con- 
’ cntional Financing.

For Sale; 2 bedroom, living room, kitchen and 1 liath. 
Located on nice comer lot with carport at back and c l « «  to 
school. Some furniture 313,900.00.

I
2 large bedrooms, 1 bath kitchen, living and dining room. 

Paneled and some carpet. Detached 1 car garage. Good 
location. Immediate possession.

CISCO
3 Bedroom, 1 bath, living room, dining and kitchao. Neu’ly 

redone. Large lot with small houao at badL A k o  Inrga 
detached garage and workshop. Lots of possiblities. Sosos 
Pecan trees. Priced right

H & \W Realty
Tin»

3 bedroom, l  bath, living and dinii^ arest nice kitchen and 
cabineta. Carpat and paneling. 2 car detai'^hed carport and 
fenced back yard. As is: MO.OOO.OO. t

Oldon

2 bedroom, i hath, large kitchen, hu( !•  living room, on 
large hR city water, gas and tv cable at tached carport on 
payment

r .

Lak« Leon j
I ■

8 bedroom, I4<i baths with snuU glaaseid-in «ro *  Ideal fOr 
office or plant room. Panelled end ca riie t 1 "otal elechric 
central, haat and air. Kitchen has buUt-i ns. C. ^  • « !  lake 
water, nice ihede treea, some small ftu it Irt »6 . Double 
garage. 340,000.00.

Gorman

Very good commercial building site cimvenienti:’ kK » I * ! !  
on hi^iway 3 290 f t  frontage by 190 foot drop.

SfVOSTWIITMS

W I HAVI MANT 010«  IIHUNN6 SnB  
COME M  AND EKK JO U i OHM HAN~

J.C Batter 3 »  Xltt 
l'SK m -  1140 

Im n y  AmastreogOM- 1033

mt^Anoe*

1978

ARER INVENTORY SALE ON FALL AND WINHR MERCHANDISE. MAN' 
ITEMS REDUCED TO CLEARI SAVE UP TO 60% ON MANY IHMS.

WOMEN'S 
SPORTSWEAR

M aty ItwNs A tfo rtid  S htt 
Rgg. And ColorB HOW
M 4

WOMEN'S DRESiUS
Floor LonfHi Stybo Mm v  ISolm , 

Astorfod Sixot «m i

To
»3 8

6 0 %  T
*15*1

To
OFF »SI P R ia

GIRLS SP0R1SWEAR
M aiy Stylos And Colors

NOW

BOY'S SPORT SHIRTS
Ung Sbovos In KnHs And lo g e lv  Stylos.

• ; To

PRKE P R ia

MEN  ̂ SWEAHRS
infIrs Stock WIntor Stylo On Snioi
R o f  M O W

:: 3 5 %  T
•M OFF $ 2 2 '®

WOMEDN'S JEANS . KNITTOK
.  NOW

ï  ’/ a  *6 »
PRig M7

BIG SHOE SALEI
Wonion's Stylos M on'i; Slylis

VM M rYIlM  # iy iM

To

W O M IN ^ SPORTSWEAR 
SWEATER AND DRESSES

Ono Mg Rnek On Sniol
NOW

To

»80
To

P R ia

MEN'S LONG SLEEVE 
SHIRTS

Dross M d Cnosonl Stylos 
M uiy Colors, Most A l Dios 

lo g . NOW

-  Ì/ 2  M
To ^  ^  To

»28 PRKE M4

To

»IS

CANVAS SHOES
Roy's And GHs 

Mnny Stylos And Slios
NOW

To

BOY'S JEANS
Most A l Shot

T*ni
To



You nevcir thought it could 

hi6tppon to you? Sentenced to jail 

£or taking some little thing from 

m store? Perhaps you never even 

thought of shoplifting as a crime. 

Wrfi7 now you know...it’s stealihgl

If you steal, it s a crime. 

A  conviction goes on your record. 

For the rest of your life. People 

can find out about your past when 

you look for a job ... and colleges
V . i.'M l ir . » - .  > 1̂ .. - m g t * «  I

don’t want any juvenile offenders!

Just One Conviction Can Wreck Your Whole Life!
Presented in The Public Interest By Your Local

Newspaper

I
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G O O D B Y E ,  COLD  

Ju iu n ! H«IU, to  wIm I
•vetybody kepee wIN be ■
liqaki Febffwry. Then’e no 
Mch thing u  Wtters to the 
groundhog, bnt U then 
wen, they’d nodi enough 
roln to lU  the loke, o ^  
temperatnreo above  
fneting. And one n on  
thing! we’ve been good, m  
pkeee, no wind.
AGRICULTURE 

ECONOMY to better than 
you thinh. la the rxceUeni 
foomn article, by Viola 
Payne oboul County Agent 
De Gordon (who should be 
named Agent of the Year for 
TetM) the computer dropped 
a number of Inportnnt aems. 
It should have aald that 1978 
estlmatco are for over S23 
million in gnao eg aolea, and 
the 1979 pnopecta an  for 
almoot S2S million. Bualness 
to always good In Eastland 
County.

“ THE CON MAN 
COMETH’’

Phineas Taylor |P.T.] 
Barnum once s ^ ,  “ I W n  to 
a sueier born every minute.’’ 
The tntb in that statement 
would be quite apparent If 
anc wen to add up the 
number of con games, 
swindles and frauds which 
succeed every day.
You don’t have to go out 

looking for con-arttota •• 
they'n out looking for you, 
even to the eitent of coming 
to your fnnt door.

Square Donee 
dub Enjoy 

TunioutBig
The Eastland County 

Spinners and Square Dance 
enjoyed their dance Satur­
day. Jan. 27 in the new High 
School and we would like to 
thank Mr. Clark. School 
Superintendent, for the use 
of it. There were seventy-one 
dancers in attendance.
From the Fastland County 

Spinners Club Freddie and 
Fren Johnson, Vera and 
Cecil Wyatt. Les and Betty 
Linsham. Dun and Jeri 
Squyres. Frankie and Donna 
Squyres, Mary Keatherford, 
Ronnie and June Guess, Jack 
and Joy Webber. Willie and 
Hilda Tipton. Jerry and Sue 
Williamson and Cora 
Walton. Abilene Key City 
Gub had Jim and Sara 
Culshall, Howard and Cherry 
Gtoason, Sid and Ruby 
Wfaiherman. J.W . and 
Donna Vernon. Pat and Ethel 
Pratt, Ralph and Jane 
Kycner, David and Gerry 
Hines. James and Thelma 
Cogburn, Noule and Bobbie 
Rogers and Ellison and Rita 
Edwards. Peanut Promo- 
naders of Gorman had Mr. 
and Mrs. N.O. Huff. Ruth 
and Ted Underwood. Sue 
and Dick Troutman. J.S. and 
Sue Ripley. Don and Marciel 
Laminars. Doug and Manila 
Rainy and Stan and Glenda 
Weeks. The Breckenridge 
Gub had Al and Helen White 
and Tester and Barbara 
Atkinson and the Graham 
Gub Jr., and Marilyn Yancy. 
Visitors were Bill and Betty 
Gay bom. Callers were Ralph 
and Roy McMillian from 
Gyde

Boxing Qub Wins 
A t Brownwood
Eastland Boxing Club 

returned home from Brown- 
wood with the 1st place team 
trophy. Ten boys were 
entered with 5 wins and S 
loses. Those entered were: 
Paul Reed. Harry Novak. 
Mel Leal. Ricky Herrera. 
Mike Gonzales. Steven 
Alford, Jracy Alford. Curtis 
Govan, Carl Govan. and Erby 
Reyes.
Eastland was in Competi­

tion with Brownwood. Early, 
Coleman, Sweetwater. 
Colorado City, San Angelo 
and Abilene.
The dub from Eastland was 

organized in March 1. 1978 
startingwith the first tourna­
ment on March 25 and 
ending the season on May 
12.19% tournaments started 
two weeks ago. In less than 3 
montju of entering tourna­
ments, the Eastland Boxing 
Gub have received 81 indivi­
dual trophies and S team 
trophies.
The dubs goes to Sweet­

water Feb. 2 A  3. Eastland. 
Feb. 9 A  10. Brady. Feb. 16 
A 17, Brownwood Feb. 23 A 
24.
The dub to proud to be 

iweefinf new red T-shirts 
with the EBC emblem. There 
are presently 30 boys active 
in the club which is 
sanedoned by the Eastland 

* County Sherrlfs Dept. Boys 
Inturested in jolniag the dub 
may do se by catHag coaches 
J e i^  RoMaton, 629-1154 or 
Rlduud T. Herrera. 629- 
1180.

AN old swindle that to often 
tried, aud freqeeetly succeed 
begins when a “ By by night’’ 
business malls second rale 
and over-priced merchandise 
C.O.D. to an Individual who 
did not order It. Meny times 
such meterial to accepted and 
payed (or by someone who 
believes that another mem­
ber of the family ordered It.
Another form of this tame 

fraud to porpctralcd by the 
cen man who dons a delivery 
uniform ued cunca to the 
door asking Ike occupant to 
accept and pay (or a package 
for a neighbor who to not 
home. In (act, the package 
coalains nothing of value and 
was not ordered by the 
neighbor or anyone else.
A third common scheme to 

the home repair racket. After 
a free home Inspection, the 
repairman advises the 
homeowner that the chimney to about to crumble or that 
the furnace could explode the 
next lime it is turned on. The 
“ repairman’’ Insists that 
repairs must be made at onc\. 
and offers to make them for a 
bargain price. After pre­
tending to do some work, be 
Insisis on being paid In cash. 
In reality, the repairs were 
not really needed and work 
was not actually dune.

To avoid falling victim to 
such schemes, be certain 
that your family, frienda and 
neighbors arc aware of how 
the schemes work, don’t 
hesitate to call the police If 
you think yon are being 
swindled. Check with the 
Chamber of Commerce, or 
other business organixalloos 
or reputable companica 
dealing in the same product 
or aervice and ask alMat the 
people at your door. 
Remember, loo, to be guided 
by some very simple advice: 
Do Dot be hurried Into paying 
for anything unlH you are 
certain of what you urc 
receiving In return.
I I I l l X X E X l

IGiurthouse 
j News
The following proceedings 

were had in the Court of Civil 
Appeals for the Eleventh 
Supreme Judicial District of 
Texas;
Motions Submitted
SI97 General Insurance 

Company o f America v. 
William C. Hallmark, et ux. 
Appellees ' motion for 
rehearing. Dallas 
522S Melvin Niell and Kath- 

lee Niell v. Dt*n Mooney. 
Appellants' motion for 
rehearing. Baylor 
5230 M egargel Drilling 

Company v. North Central 
Texas Municipal Water 
A u th o rity . A p p e lla n t 's  
motion fur rehearing. Baylor 
5300 Jo Ann Reynolds v. J. 

Rex Reynolds & Jack 
Finkelstein. Appellant's 
agreed motion for extension 
of time fiW Tiling statement of 
facts. Harris
5307 Mansell Brothers 

Equipment Company et al v. 
Robert Reyes Appellants'’ 
motion for extension of time 
to file statement of facts. 
Nolan
Motions Granted
5300 Jo Ann Reynolds v. J. 

Rex Reynolds <& Jack Finkel- 
stein. Appellant's agreed 
motkm for extension of time 
for Tiling statement of facts. 
Harris
5307 Mansell Brothers 

Equipment Company et al v. 
Robert Reyes. Appellants' 
motion for extension of time 
to Tile statement of facts. 
Nolan
Motions Overruled
5197 General Insurance 

Company of America v. 
William C. Hallmark, et ux. 
Appellees' motion for 
rehearing. Dallas 
5225 Melvin Niell and 

Kathlee Niell v. Don 
Mooney. Appellants' motion 
for rehearing. Baylor 
5230 M egargel Drilling 

Company v. North Central 
Texas Municipal W ater 
A u th ority . A p p e lla n t 's  
motion for rehearing. Baylor

Appeal Diantoaed 
5261 Patricia Welch 

McCabe Lawther v. Francis 
Williams McCabe. Dallas 
5273 Mobil Oil Corporation 

et al V. Troy McKUlip. East- 
land.
Motiena Submlllcd 
5199 Harry D. Hawn, et al 

V, J.V. Hawn, et al. 
Appellant's motion for 
rehearing. Dallas 
5229 In Re: R.G.S. 

Appellant's motion for 
rehearing. Stonewall 
5248 North River Insurance 

Company v. Rheaco, Inc., M 
al. Motion for leave to amohi 
and Supplement Ap^llant'a 
brief. Dallas
5261 Patricia Welch 

McCabe Lawther v. Francis 
William McCabe. Motion to

Dismiss attempted appeal for 
lack o f jurisdiction and 
motion to dismiss attempted 
appeal as moot. Dallas 
52 "3 Mobil Oil Corporation 

et al V. Troy McKUlip. 
Appellant's motion to 
dismiss appeal. Eastland 
5306 Hubert Lee Bowen. Jr. 

V. Patricia Jeanette Bowen. 
Agreed motion for extension 
of time to file brief of 
Appellee. Taylor 
Motions Granted 

, 5248 North River Insurance 
Company v. Rheaco, Inc., et 
al. Motion fur leave to amend 
and Supplement Appellaw's 
brief. Dallas
5261 Patricia Welch 

.McCabe Lawther v. Francis 
William McCabe. Motion to 
Dismiss attempted appeal for 
lack o f jurisdiction and 
motion to dismiss attempted 
appeal as m(H>t. Dallas 
5273 Mobil Oil Corporation 

et al V. Troy McKUlip. 
Appellant's motion to 
dismiss appeal. Eastland 
5306 Huben Lee Bower, Jr. 

V. Patricia Jeanette Bowen. 
Agreed motion for extension 
of time to Tile brief of 
Appellee. Taylor 
Mittioiis Overruled 
5l9q Harry D. Hawn, et al 

V. J.V. Hawn, et al. 
Appellant's motion fur 
rehearing. Dallas 
5229 In Ke: R.G.S. 

Appellant's motion for 
rehearing. Stonewall

1st Natl Bk. Gorman To 
James R Bruton & wife Rel 
V L & D.'T

Floyd Frady & wife To 
TESCO Esmt & R-W 
J.P. Fuqua To Tex Pacific 

Oil Co. OGL
Percy V. Fuqua To Tex 

Pacific Oil Co. OGL 
Floyd Fuqua to Tex Pacific 

Oil Co. OGL
Flamingo Motel To The 

Public Assumed Name 
Cecil B. Freeman, dec'd To 

The Public Proof o f Heinship 
Jimmie G. Cresset To 

Union Bk of Houston Deed o f 
trust
Jimmie G. Cresset To 

Union Bk of Houston F/S 
Truman Gregory A  wife To 

Odessa Natl Corp. R/W A 
Esmt
Otis Green To TESCO Esmt 

A  R/W
Joe T. Gray, Receiver To 

Texas Pacific Oil Co. OGL 
Homestead Const Co. To 

Don R. Bradshaw Warranty 
Deed
Teddy Higginbottom A  wife 

To Small Business Admin. 
Deed o f trust
Elsie Scott Hines To West 

Artesa Transmission OGL 
John V. .. Hademck To 

TESCO Esmt A R-W 
Doris L. Hawkins. Indv. To 

TESCO Esmt R-W 
Alva Lee Hawkins To 

TESCO Esmt A R-W 
J.F. Harris, dec'd To The 

Public Certified Copy 
Probate

JaoMS H. Hadley To Tex. 
Pacific Oil Co. OGL 

J.B. Houston. Indv. To 
Marion A. ntomat Special 
W-D
Imperial Swine Co. To The 

Public Asaumed Name 
Mary Jackson To The Public 

Certified Copy Probate 
S.M. King, dec'd To The 

Public C 'C  Probate 
S.M. King, dec'd To The 

Public Proof of Heinship 
Rsyrtond Kellsr To Lonnie 

K. Holotik OGL 
Mdc D Kiser A wife Indv.

A others To E P. Thomas 
OGML

La Cantina To The Public 
Assumed Name 
Robert Anthony Lamb A 

wife To Dorothy E. Lester 
Warranty Deed 
Donna McGowen Leon To 

Elmer Tidwell OGML 
MJM Oil To H .W . 

Boersiler MML AfTd 
MJM Oil To H.W. Boerstler 

MML Affd
MJM Oil To Halliburton Co. 

MML AfTd
Billie V. Mealer To K.E. 

M u rd och  O G M L
K.E. Murdoch To Cassell 

Oil Fund 78A Asgn ORR 
K.E. Murdoch To Roy J. 

Plunkett Asgn ORR 
G.P. Mitcham A others To 

Mike H. Roberts A  others 
OGL

Mrs. W.B. (Caroline Lee) 
Matthews, dec'd To The 
Public C/C Probate '  
Maurine Calhoun Milbum 

To Tex. Pacific Oil Co. OGL 
Margaret L. Mallow To 

Tex. Pacific OU Co. OGL 
Hubert O. Murphy To 

Lonnie R. Holotik ciGL 
Gyde Melton To Palo 

Petroleum Inc. Asgn ORR 
MJM Oil Co. To William 

F. Keman Asgn OGL 
Gyde Melton To Palo 

Petroleum Inc. Asgn ORR 
W.A. Marshall A  wife To 

J.E. Gardner OGML 
William M. McDavid To 

Betty Dowdey Asgn OGL 
William M. McDavid To 

Allen C. Rieves Asgn OGL 
OIney Savings Assn. To 

R.L. Crossley Appt. Subs Jr. 
George M. Peery To 

Kenneth Grke M/D 
R.L. Parks A  wife To 

TESCO Esmt A  R-W 
Janell Porter To Lonnie R. 

Holotik OGL
I.N . Poyner To E.P. 

Thomas Agreement 
W.L. Pippen A  wife To 

Travis Starr OGL 
C.J. Qualls A/F To Csl 

Michelson OGML 
Donald Rhodes To Odessa 

Natl Corp. R-W Easement 
Mrs. Kyle Rich To Odessa 

Natl Corp. R-W Easement 
A.L. Rhodes To Christi-Co., 

Inc. Asgn OGML 
City o f Ranger To Robert 

A. Howell A  wife Warranty 
Deed
R a n g e r  In d u s t r ia l 

Foundation To TESCO Esmt 
A  R-W 
Hazel Savage To K .E .

W.A. Hill A  sons. Inc. To 
Fastland Natl Rk. Deed of 
trust
Morris D. White Jr. A  wife 

To Magnum Oil Co. OGL 
Waymsn Ware A  wife To 

Robert J. Ratcliff** A  wife Rel 
D T
Murdoch OGML 

Ernest Sneed To TESCO 
Esmt R-W
G. O. Salmon To TESCO 

Esmt R-W
Clifton B. Schooler A  wife 

To TESCO Esmt A  R-W 
Sharon Simpson To Larry 

K. Simpson Ratification of 
deed
Larry K. Simpson A  wife To 

Dorothy E. Lester W 'D  
Menter B. Sheffey To 

Roben Anthony Lamb A  wife 
Warranty Deed
H. M. Scallorn & others To 

Robert L. Bradford Asgn 
OGL

Wayne Singleton To Judy 
Webb Mersiousky Asgn 
ORRl

William E. Smith A  wife 
To Charles Arnett A  wife 
Warranty Deed 
Tra-C Oil A  Gas To Leroy 

Rogers Asgn OGL 
Tra-C* Oil A  Gas To 

William McDavid Asgn OGL 
Douglas O. Thorpe A  

others To TESCO Esmt A  
R-W
Tra-C Oil & Gas To Wm. J. 

John Asgn OGL 
Charles Underwood A  wife 

To Phillip Arther A  wife 
Warranty Deed 
Minnie Wende To Odessa 

Natl Corp. R.'W A  Esmt. 
Violet Walker to Odessa 

Natl Corp. R/W A Esmt 
Lee D. Wooley A  wife To 

Mary E. Sneed. Indv. A  
others R-W A  Esmt 
Jim R. Wright A  wife To 

1st St Bk, Ranger Deed o f 
trust
Sidney L. Waynick A  wtfe

To E.E. Duneixon A  wife 
Warranty Deed 
Hubert Clyde Wilkins To 

Clydelle Bryan Warranty 
Deed
Roy Woodard A/F To K.E. 

Murdoch OGML 
Mary M. Wiedeman To 

K.E. Murdoch OGML 
Fred E. W illiams to 

TF:SC0 Esmt A  R-W 
Keith Williamson A  wife To 

TESCO Esmt A  R-W

(^ ^ k e c ta /

(^ n itiC c U ù y n

Homer D. White A  wife To 
TESCO Esmt A  R-W 
Cera Williams, dec'd To 

The Public Proof of Heinship 
Jimmy Gail Warren, dec'd 

To The Public Proof o f Hein­
ship a ffd
Erna Faye Wende To 

Megargel Petro. Corp. Rati­
fication.
Ralph G. Wheat A  wife To 

B.D. Armstrong A  wife M/D 
Anton White & wife To

J„E. G a r d n e r , 

Thursday, 

February 1, 1979

Head (he clasaifieda
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SSSPIRIT FILLED 
SERVICES

¿onoNf
STUDIO

«

RhM-AI ShM 
And Off COBTM 

Hm  Photogrophy 
Ib  0 « r  B m h t t t

Gitton't 
Studio

y sn sst 300 W. SHi]

JOHN C. JONES. PASTOR

Hospital Ministry 
Tape Ministry 
Nursing Home Ministry

PASTOR JOHN C. JONES AND 
CONGREGATION CORDIALLY INVITE 

YOU TO THESE GREAT SERVICES

SUNDAY...............  10:00 A,M.
EVANGELISTIC 

SERVICES...........7:00 P.M.
Day Light Savings Months

6:30 P.M.
Other Months

WEDNESDAY NIGHT . . . . . .  7:30 P.M.
In-Depth Bible Studies -h . v

•  Charasmatics, A Special “ Vl'elcoine"

•  Special Gospel Singing Groups
•  We Baptize in “Jesus* Name”  *

•  Children’s Chun.;h
•  Professional Family and Personal CbUnseling,

For Information Relative To Service*
® Or Trasporfation Call 442-2673 ( C I b c o ) 

P.O. BOX 269- CISCO PHONp(^f^643aa627
“ A UNITED PENTECOSTAL CHURCH’

» ' V* Sto

/TPâYSTOADVERTrSE...AD VEK n S£  WHERE ITPAìfS...

H A RG RA V E 
IN SU R A N C E A G EN CY

MOS AVENUE O 
OSCO TEXAS TS43T \

• « ! * i
.1

TRI-nXENERG rC0.,INC
*  Butane
♦  Propane

i t  Tonkt

i t  Corburetlon Systems

Phenp 442-1611 

Night 443-2379

Rsosonobis Rates • Reliobls Service
We Appreciote Your Business. p-tfe

YOU NiEO A TV C A iU  CONNiOION
f i r  c o n p I t t B  t s lB v i i io i i  fR ja y H M iit

★  ★  ★

Soutiiuni T a itv is io ii Systoms C orpil
ItnriRg Chco, to t lw d, te n e r
C ii t i  ffer fe e p iin  iwffen— Hoe

K s c e a e e a c a a M a s e a B p l

MONUMINTS

0 MONUMENT works

B ^  442-9995
See I  •

I"

I

E4STLA.\D
\ TELEGRAM

629-1707

•toy Hfut toixiiaBS» 9B*i Btes* 4 . 4*s»*

M7-I10I

T h e  C is c o  P r e s s
tin 11 %i* 

IVVNI

iNg«

442-2144
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A U S T IN - -W h e n  the 
northers blow in, don't put 
your fishing tackle in moth­
balls.

Fishing is a year-round 
activity fur those Texans who 
adapt to the changing 
weather conditions of winter,

according to the Texas Parks 
and Wildlife Department.
In freshwater lakes, the 

ever-popular largemoulh 
bass head for the deeper 
areas and may not be tricked 
by fishing methods that 
worked earlier in the year.

r ^ N G F R  TIMES EASTLAND TELEGRAM CISCO PRESS 
 ̂ Ranger, Texas Eastland. Texas Cisco, Texas

Thursday. Fobruory 1, 1979 ^

WEIGHT
WATCHERS

Diet and eat like the next guy.

Do you hunger for food 
others enjoy, but are you 
afraid it will show up on 
your bathroom scale?

The Weight Watchers® 
Program lets you eat 
cheeseburgers, corn on 
the cob, franks on rolls — 
and more, within limits.

Join a Weight Watchers 
meeting today and learn 
how to eat at any table — 
without looking like 
you did.

WEIGHT
WATCHERS
Tlie Authority.

YOU’RE THIS aXISC TO LOSING WEIGHT

Eastland
F irtt C kritfion  Church 

215 S. Lemur
Tuut. 7:00 P.M.

d a u A b o b i BrcckmHdgu 
For Moro InfonN utiofi 

C u lT o lF io t

14100-792-1126
MI.MT MTCtnXS" MS SliaTIMB TS.Ha.SSS Sr SSISWT !HTCWtSS
siTiss.TiHi.< sa.aJKHSiT . .  .saiSsT wiTf.isssmsasnsaAi,art

But bass fishing experts have 
found that artificial worms or 
jig-and-ecl combinations 
fished deeply and slowly will 
work at times through the 
winter.
Bass lournament statistics 

compiled by the department 
indicate that a high percen­
tage of trophy-sized bass are 
caught during February and 
March -  months which most 
fishermen would consider 
mure winter than spring, 
weatherwise.
After a cold spell, a couple 

of warm, sunny days also can 
put bass in a feeding mood, 
and they will cruise 
shallower vegetated areas as 
the water warms a few 
degrees
Keeping an eye on cold 

fronts is important to the 
winter angler, according to 
Bob Bounds, inland fisheries 
management coordinator. 
‘ Just after a front passes 

usually is a bad time to go 
fishing because the pressure 
changes causes fish to slow 
down on their feeding activi­
ties." he said. "A n  east wind 
also is another discouraging 
factor in Texas for some 
reason."
Bounds said there are other 

freshwater fish species which 
can be caught in the winter, 
but they also may be in the 
deeper water. "Sunfish are 
easily caught in the winter 
although they arc usually not 
as concentrated as they are 
in the spring and summer 
around spawning areas," he 
noted. "Once located, they 
can be caught on warm days 
even with surface baits as 
well as on the usual methods 
as live bait or sinking flies." 
"Catfish also will bite in 

surprisingly cold weather, 
but you have to have 
patience and fish near the 
bottom in deeper areas.
"Another great wintertime 

fish is the striped bass, 
which is a genuine cold- 
water f is h ,"  Bounds 
continued. “ Stripers behave 
opposite to most native fish 
in Texas in that they stay 
deep in the summer and 
come to the surface in 
schools during the winter, 
especially at night."
The wintertime fisherman 

also should try the warm- 
water discharge areas at 
powerplant lakes. Bait fish 
often will congregate in the 
warmer water, especially if 
there are artificial lights in 
the area, and white bass, 
catfish and stripers often can 
be caught under these condi­
tions even during the 
nastiest winter weather. 
Coastal fishing also can be 

great in wintertime, 
according to Ernest 
Simmons, the department 
inland fisheries director who 
spent many years on the 
coast as coastal fisheries 
regional director. "Even the 
windy days are good if you 
want to catch some large 
black drum off the piers and 
jetties in w in tertim e," 
Simmons said. "Yon also can 
catch trout and reds in the 
surf during the winter, both 
on live bait and lures."

Simmons added that 
croakers also can provide 
good winter sport, although 
most fisherman consider 
croaker "runs" to be mainly 
an autumn phenomenon. 
‘Croaker fishing is often 

gcHid in channels, and bank 
fishing along a channel can 
be mc»re comfortable than 
being out on the bay in a

Have You Purchased A Smoke Detector

/•■V
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Have you purchased a 
SMOKE DETECTOR? Many 
lives and homes have been 
saved because a person had 
enough forethought to put 
one in their house.
The Cisco Civic League is 

sponsoring a fire safety 
program, and hopes that 
each and everyone in EAST- 
LAND COUNTY will pur­
chase a smoke detector, 
either from them, or from 
one of your local merchants. 
The Civic League will make 
nothing from this sale. They 
are doing it as a public

Yeor Of Thu 
Hog Moy Hove 
Finally Arrived

The year of the hog may 
have finally arrive! In the 
September hog report, many 
were wondering why there 
had been no response to the 
favorab le hog prices 
producers were receiving. 
That is, why hadn’t the pork 
p ro d u c e rs  e x p a n d ed  
production in the face of 
continuing profits? Now it 
appears there will be ex­
pansion of pork suppliers, if 
producers intentions are 
carried out The December 
Hog and Pigs report in­
dicated t the breeding hog 
inventory was up IS percent 
from a year ago and the 
market hog inventory up 5 
percent from  last year. 
Possibly more important, 
producers indicated they 
intend to increase the 
numbers of sows farrowing 
during the December-May 
period by 15 percent above 
the previous year.

The question ia, in light of 
the reported increase, will 
hog producers reevalate and 
cut back from their original 
plan? It’s happened before. 
In fact, the situation was 
much the same as year ago. 
The December 1977 report 
indicated show farrow ing 
would be 13 percent higher 
for the December-February 
period last year but were 
actually 1 percent less. Of 
course, the seven winter 
weath«' and disease and 
gestation problems curtailed 
much of the expected ex­
pansion. Just how much of 
the cutback was planned 
would be pure speculation, 
but producers can still adjust 
their production plans (or 
1979.

W ith beef suppliers 
dwindling, some expansion 
of pork production would be 
in order without a severe 
price redustion.

boat," he said.
Fisherman may overlook 

flounders in the winter, 
figuring that they have left 
the bays. "Flounders can be 
fuuiid in the deeper areas of 
bays throughout the winter 
months, and they can be 
caught on worm jigs, squid 
or dead shrimp bounced 
along the bottom," Simmons 
advised.
"The fact is that if you fish 

the right areas you stand a 
chance o f catching larger fish 
in wintertime than in hot 
weather, and you aren’t 
bothered as much by smaller 
fish like pinfisli and hard­
heads stealing your bait."

service, in the hopes that a fe 
few lives and property will be 
saved because o f iheir 
conceni and efforts.
Older people, invalids, and 

children are unable to react 
as quickly as must, and 
certainly we would hope that 
smoke alarms are in all their 
homes. If an aging parent 
needs one, and can't afford 
it. you (older sons and 
daughters) might see to it 
that they get one.

In 1978, Cisco recorded 151 
fires. January 1979 is just 
ending, and already there 
have been 22 fires. Most 
fires occur during the colder 
months, so people need to be 
especially careful now with 
their heaters.
To order your SMOKE 

DETECTOR, you may call 
Youvonne McMillan, at 442- 
1671, and buy one for $16.80

(complete price), or purchase 
one from your local 
merchant.

h â v u  anica waakand.

¡ Office M arines » j
Check With  ̂ 5

¡Your Local Newspaper
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It's A Giant 
Shoe Sale For 
Your Feet.

Price
On Select Group

DRESS & CASUAL 
SHOES

S  All U fa , FASHHNBOOIS

Susy Q Brand
Children's Sizes 7 To 14

JEANS AND 
SHIRTS

Price

Don't Hove Many, 

So Come Early
ISSSGSiiS rd

Town Square Fashions
Uec oor ̂ rawaj Plaiiitf

One Group 
Men's Velovr And 
Knit Long Sloovt

SPORTS 
SHIRTS

Mostly Slp^ver 
Valves Tf «16**

One'Group todies
V IN Y L  C 0A 1Y

$ 1 5 «

Short 'H J
QUILTED COAIS

A
SmaN Group

LADIES FALL 
DRESSES

0 «

Large Group todies

SPORTSWEAR 
SUITS
Up To

Off

todies
FALL HANDBAGS
SmoH Group $ 1 0 0  

Other Vinyls
^ 3 “  ^ 1 1 * ®

toother • Solo Prkod

from «6 ** 1̂ 4 ®̂
Vfdues To ®20**
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I
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