
Beneficial Rain
Falls In County

Rainfall measuring from a 
half to an inch fell over 
E ^ tlan d  County Monday as 
a cool front passed through 
this region. Cisco area rain 
gauges measured from .6 to 
an inch.

Hail was reported in the 
Rising S tar area  as a 
th u n d e rs to rm  moved 
through that region. The hail 
was described as ping-pong 
ball size and crops and or­
chards suffered damage, the

report said.
County Agent DeMarquis 

Gordon described the rain­
fall as “very beneficial’’ to 
pastures and crops.

Very l i t t le  p ean u t 
harvesting has taken place 
this month, Mr. Gordon said. 
He said recent rainfall has 
been a big help to the peanut 
outlook and th a t m ost 
farmers were waiting to get 
maximum benefit from the 
moisture before harvestmg.

The rain began falling ear­
ly Monday morning. Cisco 
police reported that two 
minor auto mishaps were 
due to slick streets.
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Loboes To Travel To 
Goldthwaite

Contract Is Awarded To Build
Friday

Jr. High And 
J.V . Teams
To Ptay H«. New Athletic Track At CHS

The Cisco High School 
Loboes will tra v e l to 
Goldthwaite this Friday to 
play their final non-district 
game of the season. The 
kickoff for the Loboes and 
Eagles battle will be at 8 
p.m.

The Loboes will rest next 
Friday since they have an 
open date scheduled, and 
will open District play the 
following Friday, October 2, 
in Eastland against the 
Mavericks.

The l/>boes are 0-2 for the 
season. The Ixiboes have lost 
to Haskell and Baird.

This year’s Lobo roster in­
cludes: Randall Rattan, of­
fensive quarterback and 
defensive secondary; Danny 
Garcia, offensive wideout, 
defensive secondary; Doug 
H en d rick s, o ffensive 
q u a r te rb a c k , defensive  
secondary; Mike Gallegos, 
offensive end, defensive

lineman; Blair Boyd, offen­
sive, defensive linebacken; 
Jason P o tte r, offensive 
quail, defensive secondary; 
Shane Posey, offensive 
fu llb ack , defensive  
linebakcer; Brian Fleming, 
offensive quail, defensive 
secondary; Gary Speegle, 
offensive fullback, defensive 
linebacker; Larry Adams, 
offensive wideout, defensive 
secondary ; Bud Wood, offen­
sive c e n te r , defensive  
lineman; Brad Hawari, of­
fensive, defensive lineman; 
Mark Humphries, offensive, 
defensive lineman; Mark 
Petree, offensive lineman, 
defensive linebacker; Ken­
neth P reston, offensive, 
defensive lineman; Tommy 
T h ack erso n , o ffensive 
center, defensive secon­
dary; Terry Owings, offen­
sive, defensive lineman; 
Sean M anire, offensive, 
defensive lineman; Bubba

defensive
Marquez,

Eaker, offensive, 
lineman; Manuel 
offensive, defensive lineman 
and Joey Worley, offensive, 
defensive lineman.

Coaches are Jim Puryear, 
Clyde Evatt, Tom Slagle, 
Danny Kent and Ron 
Mouser.

Cisco Junior-Senior High 
School’s seventh, eighth and 
Junior Varsity teams will be 
playing against DeLeon 
teams in Cisco Thursday.

Seventh grade teams will 
start playing at 5:00 p.m., 
the eighth at 6:00 p.m. and 
the Junior Varsity at 7:30 
p.m.

A contract to build a 
regular track for track and 
field events at Cisco High 
School was awarded to Bron- 
tke Brothers at Abilene by 
the board of trustees of the 
Cisco Independent School 
District at their monthly 
meeting Monday night.

Lohoes Lose Second 
Game Of Season, 13-6

The project will cost 
$129,800 and funds from a 
surplus left over from last 
year will be used in financ­
ing, Supt. Jam es Couch 
reported. The track will be 
built in the area west of the 
high school building.

Work is due to begin this 
month and the track will be 
completed and ready for use 
when needed. Specifications 
call for a 400-meter eight- 
lane track with facilities for 
field events in the center. 
The center area will also

The Loboes of Cisco High 
School lost their second 
game of the season last Fri­
day night to the Baird Bears 
by the score of 13 to 6.

Cisco will be on the road 
again this Friday night as 
they travel to Goldthwaite 
where they will take on the 
Eagles. Kick-off will be at 8

Scramble Golf 
Touraey It Held 
At Local Courte

TIM AND JAMIE SKAGGS

East Osco Baptist Oiurch 
To Hold Youth Revival Here

WAYNE SCHEFIELD
East Cisco Baptist Church 

will be holding a youth 
rev iv a l S ep tem b er 25 
through 27. The services Fri­
day and Saturday will begin 
at 7:30 p.m. The Sunday 
morning service will begin 
at 10:50 and conclude the 
revival.

Friday night after the ser­
vice th e re  will be a 
fellowship featuring stuffed 
potatoes with all the trimm­
ings.

Wayne Schefield will be 
preaching and Tim and 
Jamie Skaggs will be leading 
the music.

Mr. Schefield is the

minister of Youth/Education 
at First Baptist Church, 
Comanche. He has worked 
for 2 ^  years in Youth 
Evangelism. He graduated 
from  H ard in-S im m ons 
University and is now atten­
ding S ou thw estern  
Seminary.

Mr. Skaggs is presently 
serving as the minister of 
Music/Youth at First Bap­
tist Church, DeLeon. His 
wife Jamie will assist him 
with the special music. They 
both graduated from Angelo 
State University. He is also 
a tten d in g  Southw estern  
Seminary.

Everyone is invited to 
come and worship during 
these revival services.

The team of Mike Thiber­
ville and Bennie Nichols won 
the Cisco Country Club part­
nership scramble golf tour­
nament last weekend. The 
team posted scores for three 
18-hole rounds that totalled 
26 under par. They had a 
11-under par score for the 
final round.

Winning second place was 
the team of Gerry Webb and 
Tracy Owens with a score of 
14-under par for the three 
days. Bobby Smith and 
Delburt Schaefer, tourna­
m ent cha irm en , placed 
third.

In the first flight, Carrel 
Smith and Tim Jones were 
the w inners w ith Roy 
Gevara and Roy McCoy 
coming in second. George 
Owens and Charlie Graham 
won the second flight with 
Steve Thomas and Jimmy 
Yowell placing second.

All of the first round losers 
played in a special lame 
duck medal score flight and 
this event was won by O.B. 
Edm ondson and Oliver 
Smith of Cross Plains. They 
posted a 70 in the Sunday 
event.

Some 20 teams took part in 
the tournament. A barbecue 
was served Saturday night 
with Oscar in charge of the 
food. Arrangements were 
made for the event by Mrs. 
Major Farnsworth.

Cloboni Wins
Tommy Claborn, Cisco 

FFA member, won first 
place in his class with his 
registered Suffolk ewe at the 
West Texas Fair in Abilene. 
His ewe won over all youth 
and open show. Later in the 
morning his ewe was named 
Reserve Champion of both 
the youth and open division.

p.m.
Cisco will then have an 

open week before starting 
play in Eastland, against the 
Mavericks, on October 2.

Last Friday night’s loss to 
Bairn placed the Cisco 
Loboes season record at 0-2 
while Baird’s record became 
2 - 0 .

Cisco’s defense held the 
Bears throughout the first 
half of the game and neither 
team vfas able to get any 
points on the scoreboard; 
although, late in the first 
quarter, a Lobo pass from 
quarterback Randall Rattan 
to Gary Speegle was carried 
across the goal line but a 
penalty on the play er&'wd 
the touchdown.

B aird  m oved inside 
Cisco’s ten-yard line three 
times during the first half 
but was unable to cross the 
goal line. On the first at­
tempt, Cisco’s Rattan in­
tercepted a pass, while on 
the second attempt an in­
complete pass was thrown 
on the fourth down, and on 
the third try Cisco’s Speegle

Ploydoy Set 
In Breckenndge

Brownies and Girl Scouts 
To Get Meetings Underway

AUTOMOBILE BURNS 
A 1074 Cadillac owned by a 

Midland man was destroyed 
by fire two miles west of 
Cisco on IH-20 early Satur­
day, Sept. 12, Cisco firemen 
reported. Firemen were call­
ed at 2:80 a.m. The driver 
told them that his engine 
caught fire while they were 
driving. FirerMn said the 
oar was a total loas.

The Brownies and Girl 
Scouts will get th e ir  
m eetings underway the 
week of September 14.

The first and second grade 
brownies will not be meeting 
until further notified. There 
is not enough adequate adult 
supervision at this time. 
Leaders must be over 18, 
responsible, and be willing to 
attend training meetings for 
le ad e rs  scheduled
throughout the year.

The third grade brownies. 
Troop 203, will meet on 
Tuesdays from 3:30 to 5:00 
p.m. at the Scout House. 
Leaders are Betty Webb and 
Doris Humphries.

Troop 303, 4th, 5th and 6th 
grade Girl Scouts will meet

on Thursday from 3:30 to 
5:30 p.m. at the Girl Scout 
House. Leaders are Carla 
Whitley and Evelyn Valek.

The Cadets, 7th, 8th and 
9th grades will also meet 
Thursdays from 3:30 to 5:00 
p.m. at the Scout House. 
Deanna and Juanelle Black 
are the leaders.

The Senior Girl Scouts, 
10th, 11th and 12th will meet 
on Monday at 3:30 p.m. at 
the home of Betty McGrew, 
Oil West 6th. Betty McGrew 
is the leader.

Registration fee is $3.00 
and uniforms are optional. 
The Junior and Cadette 
troops of Moran will join 
troops with Cisco this year. 
This is the first year Moran

An open high point trophy 
playday is scheduled for 
Sunday, September 20, at 2 
p.m. at the Junior Rodeo 
arena in Breckenridge. The 
arena is iocated on East 
Walker across from the 
stock yards. Registration 
will begin at 1 p.m.

Events to be ridden are 
poles, baseball, straight bar­
rels, cloverleaf barrels and a 
special event. AASP&RC 
rides wdl be used. Entry fees 
will be $1.00 per event.

Regular age divisions and 
classifications are 0 through 
6 years Super Pee Wees, 7 
through 10 years Pee Wees, 
11 through 14 years Juniors, 
15 through 20 years In­
termediates, 21 titfough 39 
years Seniors, 40 and over 
Super Seniors. Each divi­
sion’s divided by sex except 
Super Pee Wees.

There will be a beginners 
class of first time riders on 
horses which have not run 
speed events before. There 
will be four divisions: 1. 
Super Pee Wees; 2. Pee 
Wees and Juniors; 3. In­
termediates and Seniors; 4. 
Super Seniors. Boys and 
girls will compete together.

High point trophies will be 
given in each class and rib­
bons first through sixth 
place.

will have Girl Scouts.
A basic outdoor training 

camp will be held next 
weekend. A later arUcle will 
give the names of the ladies 
who wlU attend 

If more Information is 
needed, caU Carla WhiUey 

after 5 p.m.

serve the junior band as 
marching practice area.

The track will have a rub­
berized all-weather surface- 
material that has a long life, 
Supt. Couch said. School of­
ficials had been working on 
the track project for several 
months.

In other action, the board 
approved the CISD’s par­
tic ip a tio n  in th e  new 
Eastland County Tax Ap­
praisal District. Health in­

su ra n ce  fo r school 
employees was approved for 
another year.

Employment of Mrs. Bren­
da L^nd to teach a class for 
gifted and talented students 
in Grades 7 through 12 was 
approved. The new program 
will cover a variety of sub­
je c ts  for ex cep tio n a l 
students. Some 25 students 
have qualified for the pro­
gram, Mr Couch said. Mrs 
Land is the wife of Bruce 
Land of the Cisco Junior Col­
lege coaching staff.

Intercepted a Baird pass.
Cisco received the second 

half kickoff and after five 
plays a handoff was fumbled 
by the Loboes and Baird’s 
Ronnie Casey recovered the 
ball on Cisco’s 45-yard line.

The running abilities of 
Baird’s Sid Grant, Billy Deel 
and quarterback Ronnie 
Casey, moved the ball to 
Cisco’s six-yard line in eight 
plays. On the next play, QB 
Casey took the ball into the 
end zone to break the 0-0 tie. 
The extra point kick by 
Grant was good making the 
score 7-0 with seven minutes 
left in the third quarter.

On the ensuing kick-off, 
Cisco’s Larry Adams receiv­
ed the kick from Baird’s Ben 
Mendez at Cisco’s 20 yard 
line. Adams then scampiered 
57 yards before B aird’s 
Casey could tackle him at 
the Bears’ 23-yard line.

Cisco’s possession ended 
four plays later with an in­
terception by Baird’s Grant 
in the end zone to kill Cisco’s 
drive.

Cisco’s Adams fielded a 
Baird punt late in the third 
q u a rte r a t the Loboes 
15-yard line to set up Cisco’s 
scoring drive.

Cisco QB Rattan nude five 
yards on the first play and a 
handoff to Speegle got two 
more yards. QB Rattan got 
the first down on the next 
play and two plays later he 
had another first down with 
the keeper play. A handoff to 
Jason Potter moved from 
Cisco’s 45-yard line to the 
Bears’ 44-yard line for 
another first down. A pitch 
back to Potter got five more 
yards and another keeper 
play by Rattan placed the 
ball on Baird’s 35-yard line. 
Potter took the next handoff 
and scampered the 35 yards 
to the goal line for Cisco’s on­
ly points in the game. A try 
for two extra points was no 
good making the score 7 to 6 
with 9:30 left in the final 
quarter.

B a ird ’s Deel fie lded  
Cisco’s kick from Kenneth 
Preston at the 20 and ran it 
back to the 30 before Preston 
tackled him. From this 
point, Baird started their 
final scoring drive of the 
game.

Runs by QB Casey, Grant 
and Deel moved the ball 55 
yards in 12 plays to Cisco’s 
15-yard line. Baird made five 
first downs during the drive. 
Baird’s Deel took the han­
doff from QB Casey and 
scored on a 15 yard run with 
3:20 renuining in the game. 
The extra point kick by 
Grant was no good making 
the final score 13 to 6.

Defensive standouts for 
Cisco were Shane Posey, 
Gary Speegle, Blair Boyd, 
I^arry Adams, Bubba Elaker, 
Joey Worley, Danny Garcia, 
Kenneth Ih'eston, Manuel 
Marquez, Brian Fleming, 
Tommy Thackerson, Bud 
Wood and Terry Owings.

Standouts on the Baird 
defense included Ronnie 
Casey, Ricky Defosses, Sid 
Grant. Alan Tatum. Billy 
Deel, James Freiman, Scott 
Norman. Jay Moore. Robert 
Bums and Ben Mendez.
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THE SIGNBOARD at the entrance of College Hill announces events of 
interest at Cisco Junior College. The above pictnre tells passerby this 
week Uiat the Wranglers are playing Texas Tech at Lubbock. There 
wasn’t room to note that the CJC team would meet the Tech Junior varsity 
this Thursday night. (Staff Photo)

Wranglers To Battle
Tech's J .V . Thursday

By Bill Roberts 
Thursday night when the 

CJC Wranglers battle the 
Texas Tech Red Raider 
Junior Varsity, Coach Bill 
Anderson and his team wiU 
be facing a team which is 
probably the only well- 
coached, well-trained junior 
varsity in the state.

This comes from the fact 
that the philosophy of Texas 
Tech is to field a junior var­
sity which is as well-coached 
as most small college or 
junior college teams.

Head JV coach is Rodney 
Allison, former Odessa High 
School and Texas Tech 
quarterback and Anderson 
feels this will be the best 
team the Wranglers have 
faced so far this season.

“They put a lot more em­
phasis on their JV,’’ Ander­
son says. “They’re more 
serious about their JV pro­
g ram . They have a 
philosophy m uch like 
Nebraska. They encourage 
5-year participation, play on 
JV, red shirt the second 
year, on specialty teams the 
third year and that leaves 
them two years to play.’’ 

This, along with the fact

Mrs. Bill NowtN

that the Tech JV opened the 
season with a convincing win 
over a future Wrangler oppo­
nent, West Texas State 
University’s JV, and this 
p<»es a problem for the 
fourth year Wrangler coach 
and his team-coming up 
with its third straight win of 
the 1981 season.

The Wrangler defense, 
which is being led by an im­
posing figure on the field 
thus fa r  th is  s e a s o n -  
linebacker Mark Sanderson. 
Sanderson, a 6-0, 216-pound 
sophomore from Calhoun, 
La., leads the Wranglers in 
tackles with 10 and has 
assisted on four more. He’s 
followed by an o th e r 
sophomore linebacker, Doug 
Barton of Gatesville and 
defensive tackle Fred Staf­
ford of Houston Spring 
Branch with six each. Bar­
ton also has three assists and 
Stafford has four. Stafford

Presentation 
To Be Made On 
Rock Music Sot.

Wins Microwove 
Oven In Drawing

Mrs. BUI Howell of Cisco 
has been named the winner 
of a Microwave Oven in the 
4th Quarterly drawing of 
Stanley Home Products, 
Inc., in the $50,000Gold Rush 
Sweepstakes.

Mrs. Howell had received 
her entry blank from Elarline 
Payne of Snyder a local 
S tan ley  d e a le r . The 
manufacturer of household 
cleaning products held this 
contest for the post year in 
conjunction with the Com­
pany’s 50th Anniversary 
Celebration.

Do you really know what 
your listening to? Mike 
Johnson has done much 
research to expose the con­
nections of cults, witchcraft 
and satanism with rock. He 
gives reportedly undeniable 
evidence that today’s music 
is engineered to get directly 
into the subconscious. Efe 
also reveab how groups are 
reportedly highly involved 
with the occult such as the 
“Efegles’’ belonging to the 
First Satanic Church in San 
Francisco.

Come hear Mike as he 
g ives his m ulti-m edia 
presentation on rock music. 
Youth and adults are invited. 
Saturday night, September 
19, at 7:00 p.m. at the First 
Baptist Qnuch in Cisco. For 
more Information call Craig 
Childress at 443-1100.

also has a fumble recovery.
The Wrangler defense has 

held its opponents in the first 
two games to only 152 yards 
on 70 attempts on the ground 
and 196 yards passing on 12 
com pletions. T h a t’s 175 
yards a game total offense.

Offensively, the Wranglers 
are averaging 220 yards on 
the ground and 149.5 yards in 
the air for a 184.8 yards-per- 
game average.

Fullback Billy Richardson 
is the team ’s leading rusher 
with 189 yards on 28 carries 
for a 6.8 yards-per-carry 
a v e ra g e . N ext com es 
sometimes tailback Keith 
Pantalion, who also doubles 
at defensive back, with 107 
yards on six carries and a 
17.8 average. Pantalion pick­
ed up 70 of those yards on a 
touchdown run  ag a in s t 
Southern Methodist in the 
Wranglers’ 27-14 win over 
the Mustang JV last Thurs­
day.

John Farris continues to 
be the starting quarterback 
for CJC, having completed 
19 of 39 passes tat 247 yards 
with only one in te rc ^ o n . 
On the receiving end of those 
passes, R ichardson has 
caught seven and leads that 
department with 117 yards 
and  a 10.7 p e r-ca tch  
average.

Kickoff time for the con­
test is 7:30 p.m. in Lubbock.
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TñADC on nENT mnOUGH THE

PARTTIME CASHIER for 3
to 11 Friday and Saturday 
nights. Taylor Center 805 W 
Mam. Tnf

YARD WORK: Light 
and heavy hauling. All 
tree work. Call 442-3869 
or 442-4098. p-52tlc

RLMMAGE SALE: Thurs­
day only, 9 to 6. 1307 Park 
Drive, Cisco. Side entrance 
please Lots of children and 
ladies fall clothes, coats, 
shoes, baby and toddler toys, 
tricycle, mini., big wheel, 
books, patterns and etc. p-75

FOR SALE: Registered 
TAM106 Wheat seed, sacked, 
cleaned and treated. Call 
915-945-2625 after 7 p.m. p-76

TWO FAMILY GARAGE 
SALE: Saturday, 8 to 5 508 
West 10th, Cisco, p-75

t 'i ,
JUST CALL \

¿ ^ - 2 ^ 4 4 2 - 2 2 4 4  j
Have something to buy or sell? One 
phone coll to us is like dialing

IRONING WANTED: $6 
dozen. Call 442-1753, Cisco. 
p-75

FOR SALE: One recliner 
value $75, sale price $45; 
recliner value $80 sale price 
$48; GE Wildcat record 
player, works good, $25; 
shortwave radio AM-FM, 
value $135, sale price $75. 
Call 442-3821. p-78

our entire circulation, person-to-
• person' Ploce your Wont Ad today! 
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CISCO-EASTLAND-j 
RANGER ! 

S U B S C R I P T I O N !  
RATES; Cit> and in 
county $13.00. Out ufi 
county and out of state! 
$16.00. $1.25 by the!

(M O TKi: UWUts yo« k««« ««tobEthetl crwdH 
, tHiilH Ik *  Osco Tr%n d i «é« mwst
 ̂ be payeiJ in odvonce.

IMPORTANT 
Check your ad the 

First Day it appears. In 
event of errors, please 
rail im mediately to 
have it corrected. No 
claims will be allowed 
for more than one ioeor- 
reel insertion.

The publishers liabili­
ty shall be limited to on­
ly the amount of spare 
consumed by these er­
rors.

D07.KK .SERVICE ^  
Tanking, brush pushing 
and all types of dirt | 
work. $35 per hour. Call 
Bob Hallmark, 442-2127. 
p-tfr

!• i4ESH doughnuts, cin­
nam on ro lls , tw ists. 
Delivered to Ci.sco home or 
office Tuesdays through 
.Saturday IVliverios bet­
ween 11 00 a m  and 12:00 
a m. Call 629-2002 a day 
aliead Tfn

■STEVE COZART 
CON.STRLTTION 

Remodeling 
Add-ons 

New Homes 
Cabinet 

C onrrete 
Filectriral, etc. 
Free estimates 

Phone 442-1709. p-41tfc

NOTICE; Dallas Morning 
News, home delivery, one- 
third off rack price Save 
with food coupons Call 
442-1179, Glenda Peirce 
p-tfc

SAW SHARPENING 
SERVICE 

Sr’issors, hand saws, tin 
snips, rirru lar saws, 
chain saws, lawn mower 
blades. R.B. Boyd. 1602 
Ave. H. Cisco, p-tfc

Carpentry and Con­
s tru c tio n  Work. 
Residential and com­
mercial. Remodeling, 
add-ons, new homes, 
custom rablnets, roo- 
crete, electrical work, 
e tc . HOLLIS
WILLIAMS, 442-1933.

In ONE FAMILY Out 
OF 5. MOTHER Gets a 
JOB To Help PAY Fora 
CHILD S L ND ERSITY 
EDUCATION. LIFE IN­
SURANCE Can Help
AVOID t h is :

Allen's Heating 
Air Conditioning 
Sales & Serv ice 

854-1795, Baird p-tfc

:j|imiMiiimiiiimiiMiiiMiiiiiL 
i  SISTER TORAH |
I  Christie Palm and card i  
= reading. Guaranteed E 
= satisfaction. For ap- = 
i  pointmcnt call 725-6660. i
i  H 7  inmiimiiiiiiiiiiiiimMiiiiiiiiir

I CARPENTRY

* Any thing done around i

I Remodeling Ì
Repairs

442-4090

cu sto m  OIIJ'IELD 
PAINTING

Tank batteries, pumpi 
Jacks, and rigs. Call I 
PIppen Pum p Jack  
Sales, 442-1245, Highway [ 
80 WesL Ciaro. p-4«tfc

NOTICE
For your alununum storm 
windows, doors, screens, 
window awnings and car­
ports Call Otis Coleman, 
6-29-1644

MOBILE HOME PARK I 
One acre spaces, lots of| 
trees—garden space. 
Call Mary Youvonnel 
McMillan, Real Estatel 
Broker, 442-3846. p-4tfc

NOTICE: For home
delivery of the Abilene 
Reporter News! If you live 
north of 8th Street or west of 
Avenue N ca ll L aura 
Hamilton. 442-4007. p-tfc

DIA.MOND DIRECT started 
new company giving better 
chance to d is trib u to rs . 
Break-away $2000 level. 20% 
not 3% retirement and other 
bonuses. Finest household, 
co m m erc ia l, co sm etic , 
vitamin. Sending informa­
tion (817 ) 466-3565. p-79

.ST rU U R  
EUUNITt RE 

REFINLSHERS 
Furniture redone 

and some for sale. 
RMW Ave. D 

Cisco, T eu s  
V4Z-0MS

P-1S

NOTICE
Carpentry and painting. 
Call 442-3933. p-77

MARQUEZ 
Concrete Contractor 

Will do c a rp o rt, 
driveways, sidewalks, i 
cemetery eurbs. Also 
chain link fences. Free 
estimates. Call Manuel 
Marquez. 442-3848. p-SZ

MOBILE HOME 
SPACE FOR LEASE: 
One acre tract. 442-3330. 
p-4t(c

FOR RENT

HOUSE FOR RENT: 3 
bedroom, carpet, fenc­
ed. $300 month, first and 
last. Inquire at 701 East 
14Ui, Cisco, p-83

the house. Painting, S 
carpentry work, con- J 
C re te  work, small plum- # 
bing. etc. Call 442-1446 ! 
p-33tfc I

Freeman Draper Custom 
Drapes for one window or for 
the whole house For more 
information call 725-6684 
44-4TP______________

FOR RENT; Completely 
private bedroom and bath 
No kitchen Call 442-1291 
after 4 p.m. p-75

MINI WAREHOUSE 
STORAGE as low as $201 
month. Call 442-3340. 
Cisco. p-57tfr

: dHELP WANTEI 
Mature cashier. Apply 
in person at Taylor 
Center, 100 Ave. D | 
Cisco. p-45lfc I

TWO FAMILY GARAGE 
SALE: 110‘2-1104 West 9th, 
Cisco. Saturday, Sept. 19, 9 
to 5 Appliances, furniture, 
many misc. items, p-75

FOR SALE: Overhead 
camper, sleeps four, very 
good and very cheap. Call 
442-3663. p-76

WANTED 
Custom Plowing, 
work. Hauling. 
442-1928. p-80

Day
Call

FOR SALE: Mobile home, 
8x55 and old car. See at 20th 
and Avenue H. p-76

FOR SALE: Registered 
Chihuahua puppies. Call 
442-1325 or come see at 711 
West 13th, Cisco. Also a 
divan and hospital bed. p-76

FOR SALE: Used Comet, 
like new. Ideal for beginner. 
Call 442-1291 after 4 p.m. p-75

WELDERS NEEDED: Top 
pay, all company benefits. 
Contact I.,one Star Head Co., 
Albany, Texas, Bobby or 
Randy McCoy, 915-762-3380. 
p-75

WORD of GOD

WANTED: Would like a 
couple, prefer middle aged 
to work together on 11 to 7 
shift. For more information 
call 442-3508. p-73tfc

BABYSITTING
WANTED

Would like to keep small 
infant in my home. Mon­
day thru Friday. Call 
44M753. p-82

FulllllmonI 
[Now Too*omont]

Then Herod, when he 
saw that he was mock­
ed of the wise men, was 
exceeding wroth, and 
sent forth, and slew all 
the children that were in 
Bethlehem, and in all 
the coasts thereof, from 
two years old and un­
der, according to the 
time which he had dili­
gently inquired of the 
wise men.

WANTED: 3-7 men need 
deer and turkey lease, very 
responsible. Can also do 
roofing, painting, siding 
work if needed for lease. 
817-281-2779, ask for John 
p-78

Then was fulfilled that 
which was spoken by 
Jerem y the prophet, 
saying.

(lesf T A K E  A

In Rama was there a 
voice heard, lamenta­
tion, and weeping, and 
great mourning, Rachel 
weeping for her child­
ren, arid would not be 
c o m fo r t e d ,  b e c a u se  
they are not.

Maitacw 2:J6-JS
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THE REST OF 
THE GOSPEL

John 9:1-2 tells us that a man had been blind from 
birth. Then they ask who did sin that he was bom blind, 
him or his parents? If he had sinned and this sin caused 
him to be bom blind, then he would have had to existed 
somewhere else and have been able to sin before he 
was born into this world. John 3:13 tells us that no man 
has gone to heaven except that he came down from 
heaven first. We would have been in heaven before we 
came to earth. In Jeremiah 1:4-5 the Lord says He 
knew him before he was conceived in the womb. 
Jeremiah existed before he came to earth. What is this 
pre-existence; where was it and why don’t we 
remember it? Write to The Rest of the Gospel, P.O. 
Box 763, Cisco, Texas 76437. p-78
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FOR RENT OR LEASE: 
Cisco-Rising Star area, two 
bedroom house with use of 
pasture land. Handy man 
can work for part rent. Call 
214-272-2637 after 5 p.m. and 
weekends. 34-ltc

:  LOYAL & DORIS LUNDSTROM
CURBING 

LAST DATES 
708 E 8tli

WORKS
OWNER

442-9995
CISCO JEX .

HARGRAVE INSURANCE 
AGENCY

1 1 0 6 A v e . D  
C is c o , T e x

Personal Soles i  Service For
— H O M E  Insurance

Cor insurance
— Commerciol Business Insurance 

Mobile Hom e Insuronce A  Travel Trailers
— Boat Insurance 
^  U f t  Insuronce

Bonds O f  Ail Kinds
Shirley A .  H a rg ra v e  

4 4 M 4 7 7  O r  4 4 2 -10 5 9

l-X)R SALE: 8 ft. cabover 
camper, cook top with oven 
and ice box, good condition. 
Also Atlanta wood stove, 
thermostat control, used on­
ly one winter. Call after 5 
p.m. 643-5370, Turing Star. 
jv77

FOR SALE: Hogs. 
Registered Duroc. Gilt 
and boar. Call H.T. Sut­
ton after 5 p.m. at 
647-1026.

FOR SALE: Small Hon­
da Elxpress motorcycle, 
two baskets on rear and 
one on front. Ideal for 
student going to school 
or housewife. Excellent 
rondition, autom atic 
starter. Priced for quirk 

.sa le . Call 442-1300,| 
Cisco, p-79

FOR SALE: 1974 Harlex 
1200, pay off note at 
bank. See at 1007 Ave. B, 
Cisco, after 5:30 p.m. 
p-75

FOR SALE: 1975 BMW 
900 motorcycle, 10,000 
miles, fairing, luggage, 
clean. See Wayne West, 
442-1588 or 44^26S2 after 
5 p.m. p-77

( REAL ESTATF

FOR SALE BY OWNER; 2 
bedroom, 202 .Ave. I, Cisco. 
Call 442-3593. p-75tfc

HOUSE FOR SALE; 3 
bedroom house at 505 West 
3rd. For appointments call 
915-762-2340. p-77

Here it is, just outside the 
City limits of Cisco, exciting­
ly beautiful dwelling, sur­
rounded by five (5) acres of 
good land, paved road, city 
water plus well, you will like 
it, best of all you can buy it. 
Also one of the nicest brick 
dwellings in Cisco, best of 
locations and price is not ex­
orbitant. We have a place to 
fit your need and your 
pocketbook. GARL D. GORR 
REAL ESTATE
BROKERAGE. p-69tfc

FOR SALE; Commer­
cial building across 
street from Bank. About 
40' X 100' sales floor, two 
rest rooms, four office 
room s, vault, a ttic  
storage space. 713 Ave. 
D, Ixtne Star Gas office 
building. Call 442-1588 or 
see Wayne West. p-69tfc

HOUSE FOR SALE OR I 
TRADE: Nice 3
bedroom in Cisco, cor­
ner lot, Ideal for school 
and churches, ready to 
live In. Owner will carry I 
some paper or trade fori 
land, travel trailer, cat-| 
tie, etc. Call 442-3017. 
p-78

Six room frame dwelling, livable eondltloii, extra 
ground, good neighborhood, owner financing.

Attractive, beautiful Inside, lour large rooms, dwell­
ing sits in good part of town and owner f l n w l^ -

SU room frame dwelling ready to move In, finest of
locations and on paved street. ^

Choice three bedroom two bath brick, beautiful yurt, 
paved street and owner financing. You may own the 
finest at no extra charge.

Anyone would be proud to own thU one, t ^  
bedroom, two bath, brick v., comer lot, paved street, 
beautiful yard and in the best part of town.

Another two story frame, very attractive upstairs 
and down, paved street and very good location.

Roomy five room frame, good location and worth the
money.

Five room dwelling, nice fenced bach yard, comer 
lot good part of town.

Roomy tour bedroom, 2 bath brick, very attractive 
interior, nine rooms total, location adequate for com­
bination business and dwelling or either. Owner financ­
ing.

Very desirable country property with dwelling or 
without.

SoUd medium priced houses, some with ready Ilnan- 
clng.

Some real buys in commercial buildings, vacant lots 
you name it we could have It.

Dwelling on Avenue D in commercial district will 
make home or business.

807A ve.D .,G sco
Garl D. Gorr 

Real Estate Brokerage
Tliree salesmen to assist in a l phases 

of the work. 442-3642 or, night 442-1642

REAL ESTATE REAL ESTATE

FOR SALE BY OWNER 3 
bedroom. 1*4 bath, 2,000 .sq. 
ft., corner lot, FHA approv­
ed. Equity and assume 9*t:% 
loan. Call 442-1245 or 442-1585 
after 7:00 p.m. p-42tfc

FOR SALE: 2 large lots. 
Just off Ave. D and 1-20. 
Inquire at 701 East 14th, 
Cisro. p-76

SMC 9«te

Need a cabin...or a permanent home...on Ijike Cisco? 
You’ll like this North I.ake Shore Drive 2 story water 
front home. Priced low 30’s includes furniture. Owner 
carry. Call today Corine Ingram, RE/MAX Realtors, 
Abilene, office (915) 698-4440, home (915) 554-7767. p-78

NEED RO O M ?

)
2 LARGE BRICK BUSINESS BUILDINGS 

Facing On Ave. 0  In Cisco
located on CÌKo't main itrott at tho north oo4 of Hm Wtiptjs Astrkt 

ntor tho origionoi Comotf NItoit Notti m i  dico k . CoBagt

BUILDINGS AB OUT 50 X  100 A N D  25 X  110 
WITH R A V ED  A LLEY  BETWEEN

50' X 100' hiiirfinf hai office spocos ocross tho troni 
rost rooms. Ttio rtmoinOer It citar tpon wHh largo sMng éoors gponhig 
to th« oottiil«- Tilt intorior ol woNs b of woo4 m i  H b ctitd tnrooghoot.

25' X tIO' bui dlng hai ëtivo In 4oon and rompt.

ID E A L FOR R ETA IL, INDUSTRIAL, A N D  REC R EATIO N AL USES, 
IN C LU DIN G  WAREHOUSES A N D  G ARAG ES

BuiUin>$t to ho sold togothor oi ■ pochogt
Wrtlo^Btffinofi Bv>dinBI. Boi 21 HfftvN.

FOR SALE: 3 bedrouir, 
home with life time vinyl 
siding, all paneled, carpet 
and drapes, dishwasher and 
garbage disposal, 2's lots 
with good water well, 2 
storage buildings, 2 air- 
conditioners, and pool table 
included. 508 East 8th, Cross 
Plains, 725-6648 or 725-7311. 
p-82tfc

id i  HiA -
507 West 5th. 3 bedroom with pretty kitchen, central 

heat and air, and fenced yard. $35,500. Assume 12% 
loan with $12,000 down.

806 West 13th. 2 bedrooms, 2 lots, 80% financing 
possible. $22,000

1004 West nth. Neat 2 bedroom home, ready to live 
in. Storage, carport, trees. $27,500.

605 West 11th. 2 bedroom home with fenced yard. 
Priced to leave you with fixing up money. $13,000.

WE NEED IJSTINGS 

AI.MOST SOIJ3 OUT 

IÜT US SELL YOURS TOO

Anita Webb, /«....ociaie,
Ray Moody, Broker, 725-7279

( 9 - ^ 2  a *u é  Í- 5  
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Norris Reunion Held 
At Buffalo Gap Park
Tt» descendants of the 

late George and Mary Norris 
reunion was held at Buffalo 
Gap, Ahilene State Part 
August 21, 22, 23 with ap­
proximately 170 attending.

Games of 42, dominoes, 
cards, exchanging pictures, 
reminicing many memories.

The Sandyland Band were 
there in full force composed 
of L«ta and Carrol Hogan, 
Truet and Paul Norris and 
Roland Smith, Loyd [./evens 
of Sweetwater and Larry 
Northcutt of Bangs joined in. 
There were many, many 
beautifui gospel songs sang.

L^ts of good food was en­
joyed at each campsite and 
everyone together Saturday 
at the new Mess Hall. 
Relatives were Almagorda, 
CspinoU, N.M., Ft. Worth, 
D allas, O lustee, Okla., 
Brownwood, Ralls, Ranger,

C om anche, G orm an, 
Eastland, Antelope, Abilene, 
Sweetwater, Sudan, Lub­
bock and Elk City, Okla.

Those attending and mak­
ing plans for next year were: 
Mr. Si Mrs. George Lasater, 
Mr. Si Mrs. Glenn Lasater, 
Mr. & Mrs. Billy Bentrup, 
Mr. Sc Mrs. Earl Norris, Mr. 
St Mrs. George Norris, Mr. & 
Mrs. Obie Duncan, Mr. Sc 
Mrs. Paul Norris, Mr. St 
Mrs. Walter Maynard, Mr. St 
Mrs Montie Hood, Jody, 
Amy St Kerdin, Mr. St Mrs. 
Rocky Maynard St Mandy, 
Mrs Louise Dorsey, Mrs. 
Rozelle Caraway, Mrs. Willa 
Dean Hennicke, Mr. St Mrs. 
Larry Rollins, Becky St 
Rowdy, Mr & Mrs. Rick 
Hobbs, I^ura, Johnny & Jen­
nie, Mr. St Mrs. Hulon 
Hogan, I^urie Sc [.«shia, Mr. 
Sc Mrs. [.arry Duncan, Judd 
St Undy, Mrs. Bo Stanley,

(loh od

LOAN PRODUaiON & REAL ESTATE

Just on Market; 9.362 Ac with nice mobile home. 42 pro­
ducing pecans. CALL FOR DETAIL.

NEED A GROWING BUSINESS; Nice Modern 
Restaurant in good location. Doing a booming 
business.

2''« AC St NEW HOME: 1300 sq. ft. 3 bedroom 2 bath 
Total electric. Gorman. Nice Home.

Your Business Is Our Pleasuiv.

coMPini LOAN uavici
(117) èlf.lSJ« Offk* 
(117) 4 7 « .I m  R ti.

CAIOl SltWil, Irolicr 
101 Weit AW« StrMt 
UittanO, TIim 74441

Majestic Theatre
E o stfan d

One ShoMfing Only iaeh fuening 
Open 7:30 p .m . Showtim0 7:50 p.m.

STARTS THURSDAY...

S.ARNY
The story of a man who wanted to keep 

the world safe for dem ocracy... 
and meet girls.

COLUMHA PICTLTitS PirSTNTS 
AN f\-AN RtriMAN HIM

BILL MURRAY. 
STRIPES

★  HAROLD RAMIS ★  WARREN OATES ★  
★  P J. SO LES ★  JOHN CANDY ★

MUSIC iT ELMER BERNSTEIN saittupLAY «y LEN BLUM & 
DAN GO LD BERG wir HAROLD RAMIS 

pboducediyIVAN REITM AN  wir DAN GOLDBERG 
DBtcTtD BY IVAN REITMAN

Christi, Jessica and Kelton 
all of Eastland.

Mr. & Mrs. Truett Norris, 
Mr. St Mrs. Arl Lasater, Mrs. 
Lorena Phelps all of Carbon.

Mr. & Mrs. Gene Hogan, 
Mr. Don Hogan, Mr. St Mrs. 
Gerald Pullig St Skipper of 
Ft. Worth. Mr. St Mrs. Dickie 
Norris of Carbon, Mr. St Mrs. 
Larry Stubblefield, Brian St 
Brent of Garland, Mrs. 
Richard Martin Sc Son of 
Garland, Mr. St Mrs. Danny 
Norris, Monica Sc Mike of 
Carbon, Mr. Billy Earl Nor­
ris & Friends of Lubbock, 
Mr. St Mrs. Carl Clemmer St 
Rita of Abilene, Mr. St Mrs. 
Sonny Wyatt St Family of 
Abilene.

Mr. St Mrs. Ix>yd I^evens 
and Eddie, Mr. St Mrs. A.F. 
Pullig, Mr. Sc Mrs. Frankie 
Little, Stacy St G.'egg of 
S w eetw ater, Mrs. Tom 
Lasater, Eastland, Mr. St 
M rs. Alen K eller of 
Eastland, Mr & Mrs. Keller 
Shaunda St Christy of Gran- 
bury, Mr. Sc Mrs. Rickey 
D ecker St Mr. C harlie 
Levens of Abilene, Mr. St 
Mrs. H.P. Ball of Colorado 
City, Mr. St Mrs. Jerry Bun- 
dick of Brownwood, Mr. St 
Mrs. Edd Druery Olustee, 
Okla, Mr. St Mrs. l.eonard 
Norris of Espinola, N.M., 
Mrs. Myrtle Bolin of Lub­
bock, Mrs. Deima Gann of 
Sudan, Mr. St Mrs. Elmer 
Norris St Dolton of Ralls, Mr. 
St Mrs. [..arry Northcutt, 
Brian & Mark of Bangs, Mrs.

Thelda Miller of Almogordo, 
N.M. Mr. St Mrs. Gene Qurra 
and childrenijfc Miss Lynelda 
D avis, m /%, B rend^ 
McDaniel of Monahans.

Mr. St Mrs. Pat Collins St 
P a tr ic k , M rs. Ju a n ita  
Broom St Bud, Mr. St Mrs. 
Randell Rogers Sc daughter 
of Ranger, Mr. St Mrs. Brad 
Collins Si C h ild ren  of 
Eastland, Mr. St Mrs. Bill 
Collins & Son of Euless, Mr. 
St Mrs. Carrol Hogan of Gor­
man, Mr. St Mrs. Davis Had- 
derton of Antelope, Mr. Sc 
Mrs. Thom Winnegar of Ft. 
Worth, Mrs. Larry Morrow, 
Lana, Lane St Lenny, Mrs. 
Ronnie Pack, Cory and Lacy 
of Gorman, Mr. & Mrs. 
James Norris and Girls of 
Eastland, Mr St Mrs. Dink 
Davis of Stephenville, Mr. 
B.J. Levens of Comanche, 
Mr. Si Mrs. Jim Jackson of 
Seminole, Mr. St Mrs. Eddie 
Green Sc Christi of Eastland, 
Mrs. Sandra Stuard and sons 
of Elk City, Okla.

Court of Appeals
Cases Submitted 

5654 Patsy Ervin v. Gary 
Ervin Eastland 

5651 Clifford William Cur­
tis V. Lucy Debra Curtis 
Callahan

5659 J.C. Haines d/b/a 
Haines Mobile Homes Park 
and Merchants Mutual Bon­
ding Co. V . Lone Star Gas 
Company, a Division of 
Enserch Corp. Taylor
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Unit 537«

RANGER DRIVE - IN
t h e a t r e

647-3802Konger
One Showing Only Each fvening 

Opon 8tu0 p.ni. Showtime ItlO  p.ni.

Thursday, Friday,

Saturday, & Sunday
BO  DEREK RICHRRD HARRIS >

T he fTOÄ b e o U fU  u xxT xri o f exjf tim e
n  th e  nno/t erotic oejuen tu re o f oil tim e.
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MGM «  Untied Artiete

Next Thursday, Friday, 
Saturday, & Sunday
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Car Owners,
Protect Yourselves!

Thursday, September 17, IV8I

COLLEGE STATION- 
Who needs “ uninsured  
motorists coverage” -  one of 
the six au tom obile  
coverages offered to the con­
sumer.

You may need it, says Lin­
da McCormack, a family 
re so u rce  m an ag em en t 
specialist.

Charged with helping 
families manage their finan­
cial “and other” resources, 
McCormack is part of the 
home economics staff of the 
Texas Agricultural Exten­
sion Service, The Texas

A&M University System.
One way to m anage 

resources is to protect them, 
McCormack says. That’s the 
reason for her advice to con­
sumers to take a close look 
at “ uninsured m otorists 
coverage.”

COVERAGE FEATURES
This coverage is designed 

to pay for losses due to bodi- 
ly in ju ry , including 
payments for medical ex­
penses, loss of income, loss 
of support, pain and suffer­
ing and losses due to perma­
nent disability or death.

County O erk's Office
C.O. Terrell, Jr. To Ridge 

Oil Co. Inc. OGML 
Charles J. Terrell To 

Ridge Oil Co. Inc. OGML 
Tommy C. Thomspon To 

Sun Oil Co. OGML 
Bector R. Templeton To 

Coy Oil Corp. OG.ML 
Knox A. Thomas Est. by 

Ex’r To Leland W. Carter 
OGML

Ben 0. Timberlake Jr. To 
Archie Joe Thurman War­
ranty Deed

M.C. Tucker Jr. St Wife To 
Adobe Oil St Gas OGL 

Robert Tucker Jr. St Wife 
To Adobe Oil St Gas OGL 

L.W. Tuckr To Adobe Oil 
Gas OGL

George M. Taff St Wife To 
T-Square Pet. Co. Inc. 
OGML

T-Square Pet. Co. Inc. To 
G.M. Tuff Sc Wife Rel. OGL 

Raymond Edwin Thacker- 
son, Dec’d To The Public In- 
her. Tax Return

USA FmHA To H.L. Per­
rin Jr. St Wife Rel. Deed of 
trust

Bernice Richardson Vosek 
To Larry Eudy OGML 

Veteran’s Land Board To 
W.H. Gordon Jr. St Others 
Deed

James T. Wright St Others 
To Bakker Funeral Home 
Waranty Deed 

Weitzel & Sons, Inc. To 
Don H. Hanvey Oil Int. Inc. 
Asgn OGL

Bertie Wood To Don H. 
Hanvey Oil InL Inc. OGL 

Guy J. Ward A Othrea To 
Don H. Hanvey Oil Int. Inc. 
OGL

Laura E. Weaver To Vic­
tor Huerta Jr. Sc Wife Con­
tract

The Happy Go Getters 4-H 
CHub had their first meeting 
Sept. 8 at the Texas Electric 
Reddy Room. President 
Robin White called the 
meeting to order. Russell 
Wite led the motto, pledge 
and p ra y e r . M em bers 
discussed having a float in 
the County Fair Parade Oct. 
3.

A report was given by 
Amy Farmer about the field 
day at [.aMancha Ranch Ju­
ly 7.

Amy Gann gave a report 
on the Food and Nutrition 
workshop and Salad Lun­
cheon Aug. 10. tT h is 
workshop took the place of 6 
meetings after school etc.)

Leanne Brown gave a 
report on her trip to San An­
tonio where she attended the 
State 4-H Congress July 
21-24. She also gave a report 
on S tate 4-H Camp at 
Brownwood.

Officers elected for the 
coming year:

F^es: Leanne Brown
Vice P re s : G erald  

Ragland
Sec.-Treas; Robin White
Reporter; Amy Gann
Council Delegate; Rhona 

Little
Photographer: Russell 

White
Ten members and 3 adult 

leaders were present.
The next meeting will be 

Oct. 13 at 7:30 at Eastland 
National Bank m eeting 
Room.

Amy Gann-Reporter

See .M H Perry for 
GROUP INSURANCE 

629-1566 or 629-1095 
104 N. Lamar-Eastland

Texas O. Wagstaff To 
Ridge Oil Co. Inc. Corr. 
(XIML

Karl W. Williams To In­
grid H. Owen Asgn ORR 

Encell Williams To l>eland 
W. Carter OGML 

Edith Walter To Twin 
Drilling Co. Inc. OGL 

WiUiam M. Wofford To 
C.B. Hazel, Inc. OGML 

Tom B. Wofford Jr. To 
C.B. Hazel Inc. OGML 

Roberta Woodward To 
Freddie I..ane Gilmore St 
Wife Part. Rel. OGL 

S.E. Weathers To Bennett 
Si Guinn Inc. OGL 

James T. Wright & Others 
To Geo. McKelvy & Wife 
Warranty Deed 

Mrs. Lillie Wragg To 
Adobe Oil St Gas OGL 

Buck Wheat Res. Inc. To 
Adobe Oil Sc Gas Asgn OGL 

Sherron L. Williams To 
Sun Oil Co. OGML 

Albert Westmoreland To 
The Public Proof of Heirship 

U.V. WiUiams St Wife To 
Birdsong Corp. Quit Gaim 
Deed

Buck Wheat Resources To 
W.H. Jacobs St Wife OGL 

Velma Brooks Barrow 
Williams St Others To John 
A. Adams St Wife Rel. D-T 

Howard Worley & Wife To 
1st Natl Bk, Gorman Sub. 
Lease Deed of trust 

Howard Worley Sc Wife To 
1st Natl Bk, Gorman Deed of 
trust

Bobby L. Young to \aX St 
Bk-Ranger Deed of trtist St 
See. Agrmm.

Wynnell Hitchcock York 
To Sun Oil Co. OGML 

Henry Ziehr A others To 
Don H. Hanvey Oil Int. 
OGML

Alvin E. Ziehr St Others To 
Don H. Hanvey Oil Int. 
OGML

Also, other persons occu­
pying your car are covered.

However, coverage does 
not include damages to the 
automobile.

Simply said, “uninsured 
motorists coverage” pro­
tecta Texas car owners from 
other drivers who carry no 
automobile insurance and 
from hit and run drivers, 
McCormack explains. 

ACCIDENT RISKS HIGH 
Risks that you might have 

an accident with an unin­
sured driver are high, the 
specialist adds. One of five 
Texas motorists has no 
automobile insurance, she 
says.

COVERAGE ADVAN­
TAGES

The advantage of protec­
tion ag a in s t uninsured 
motorists is immediate pay­
ment from your insurance 
company for hospital and 
medical bills, McCormack 
points out.

If the uninsured motorists 
is at fault, it may take some 
time for an agreement to be 
reached on the amount you 
should receive for your in­
juries.

Finally the uninsured 
motorist may have little or 
no property or money and 
may not ever be able to pay, 
no matter what penalties the 
law faces with.

R ecen tly  the T exas 
legislature passed a law re-

quutiig compulsory liability 
insurance, the specialist 
reminds, but eviilence of 
financial responsibility is 
demanded only in certain 
cases, such as after an acci­
dent occurs, or if a motorist 
is stopped by a policeman or 
patrolman.

Failure to provide proof of 
coverage can result in a 
penalty, such as a fine, or, if 
convicted of failure to main­
tain financial responsibility, 
uninsured motorists may 
face having  d riv in g  
privileges revoked.

If you are involved in an 
accident with an uninsured 
vehicle and the other driver 
is responsible. Uninsured 
M otorists will pay the 
amount that you would be 
entitled to collect as though 
the other vehicle had been 
insured, subject to the state 
limits.

In Texas, this means 10/20 
for bodily injury (coverage 
up to 820,000 for all persoas 
injured in an accident, sub­
ject to limit of $10,000 for one 
individual). 'This includes 
payments for medical ex­
penses, loss of income, pain 
and suffering, and losses due 
to permanent disability or 
death. However, it usually 
does not include damage to 
your car, as mentioned 
above, unless you purchase 
another “ rider” in your in­
su ran ce  policy for 
“collision.”

Autumir 
Sale 
At...

fo\ ‘^ou"
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kCordurory B lazers • 4 9  
Suede B lazers • 5 3

These Prices F o r a
X im ite d  T im e  O n h

T - 7 5 .

P E R R Y 'S  ( A C
S e p te m b e r Bonanza

Thursday/ Friday, & Saturday, ^ptem ber 17, 18, & 19
Jergins Large Size

BATH SOAP 
4 / » 1 0 0

Limit 8 BAR

CHARMIN TISSUE
4  RoR Pkg.

9 9 *"  "  Limit 2 Pk

DAYTIME
PAMPERS

Large

CANNON TOWELS 
6 0 4 7

“  Eodi

COnON BALLS
260 (9. a v # *

7 7"  "  ?k.

Polyester
SEWING THREAD
^  Spools $ ̂  00 1

16 oz.
RUBBING
ALCOHOL

ifo Y  ^100 * 1 Limit 4

BOUNTY
Paper Towels

7 7 *# # IM 2  R s li 1
16 oz. Simve

BABY SHAMPOO
99c
"  "  LimH 2

REJOICE
Liquid Soap 9 oz.

6 1 2 7

While Limited Supply Lasts {

I

I

Î
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Donnie Jotwaon
V if I t iB g  H ourq Rudenc Sawyers

Wakkm W. Harria' Laura Kennedy
Paarl Crtawell Jack Muirhead Sr.
Milabeth Copeland RoaeBlackweU
PauUm Coker Barbara Standi
Roberta Glaacock Charles Burnett
Mildred Naylor Fred Newman
Billy Jack Copeland Verlan E. Overstreet
Fatthie Hollander Alma 0. Page
DdlaSrader Wayne Eaves
EarlE. Trout Mai7 C. Sutton
Mattie K. (Pat) McPherson Troy Weaver
Noah Johnaon Oliver Walker
Martha Graves Willie Cakin
Marjorie Ann Cagle Martha Cashion
Tammy Sparks Lela Ham
Floyd FJkina Grady C. Bond
Fkirance Fariea
Tommy O’Bryant Homer A. Bible
Jamaa Bennett Willie Parten
Baby Boy Sparks Jessie Freeman
Lorene R. Ivey Oma L. Carbary

Ira RiumU 
BUI W. Hobbs 
Paul Rowch 
Vernon Humphreyi

V isiting  H ours:
^:004:0Q & 7:00-9:00
Prank Kenoski 
RsynKwid Hughes 
Charlie Noaek 
Lura Harper 
Mary Collins 
Lanora Bean 
Richard Bowman 
Joanna Olsen 
Winnie Pilgrim
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V isiting H ours. 
2¿0g4:00 <i 6:0M:30

IN APPRECIATION OF THE EFFORTS by representative Dan Kubiak 
in sponsoring and ensuring passage of SB 730, members of the Texas 
Association For the Prevention of Alcohol and Drug Abuse awarded 
representantive Kubiak a special plaque of recognition. Senator Grant 
Jones, representative Gary Thompson, and representative Walter 
Grubbs aided in the passage of this t^ to ric  Legislation.

m t y s u x A c o
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BeuUh Simpson 
Ginny Taylor 
Baby Boy Taylor 
Myrtle Rawson 
Juanita Neeley 
Charlie Moad 
John Earp 
Mamie RoweU 
Roy Smith 
Sherrie Ray 
Grady Clark 
John Deere 
Herman Stephan 
Lela McBeth 
Gordon Murray 
Joy Drennan.

SB 730, which becomes effective September 1, 1981, appropriates |8  
million dollars during the Biennium to develop and maintain a coor­
dinated system of community-based programs designed for the preven­
tion, treatment and rehabilitation of alcohol abuse and alcoholism. Ap­
pearing in the picture are (L to R) Jim Zoth/Abilene; I>avid Cason/Ex- 
ecutive Director, Abilene Council on Alcoholism; Richard Finely/Ex- 
ecutive Director, Texas Association for the Prevention of Alcohol and 
Drug Abuse; Representative Dan Kubiak; Gene Howell/President of the 
Texas Association for the Prevention of Alcohol and Drug Abuse and Ex­
ecutive Director of the Central Texas Council on Alcohol and Drug 
Abuse; Bill Strother/Executive Director of the San Antonio Council on 
Alcoholism; Barney Bedford/Abilene Council on Alcoholism; and Doug 
Justice/Abilene, President-elect of the Texas Association for the Preven­
tion of Alcohol and Drug Abuse.
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SPECIAL
Gupets Cleaned Only ’n** 

fw any living room.
Drying tíme 30 nunnlet.  ̂

ni move fomitiire & pot it back, i 
Any additional room, '15~, :

>ny hall *5̂ . ’ antí-eoU treatment̂  
*27** liv-din. combo.

CARPET CLEANING
CALL TODAY
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If you’re 35 or over, you 
should know about glaucoma 
warns the Texas Society to 
Prevent Blindness.

"Glaucoma is an insidious 
eye disease that is the 
leading cause of blindness 
today," says Richard L. 
K im brough, M .D., a 
member of The Society’s 
Medical Adviaory Commit­
tee. “Over 100,000 Texans 
have it and and half of them 
don’t even know it because 
glaucoma can nibble away 
at vision without pain or 
noticeable symptoms."

"F o r th is  reason the 
disease is often called The 
Sneak Thief of Sight,” he 
went on “ but it is a thief that 
can be arrested if the disease 
is d isco v ered  ea rly . 
Glaucoma cannot be cured 
and any vision lost cannot be 
restored; however, the sight 
• destroying process can be 
halted with treatment and 
sometimes, surgery."

Abnormally high pressure 
within the eyes causes

glaucoma, Ur. Kimbrough 
explained. The eye is bathed 
and nourished by a fluid call­
ed the aqueous humor which 
is constantly being formed 
and drained off. This fluid 
circulates over the lens and 
around the front of the eye 
draining out through sieve­
like outflow structures at the 
side of the eye.

In glaucoma the outflow 
structures fail to drain off 
sufficient fluid. This causes 
increased pressure to build 
up within the eye. In time, 
the pressure caused by the 
fluid build up desiToys the 
sensitive cells within the op­
tic nerve and causes loss of 
sight, so gradually that the 
victim is unaware of the 
change.

“The best defense against 
glaucoma is a simple test 
called tonom etry which 
m easu res  the p re ssu re  
within the eye,” Dr. Kim­
brough said, adding that 
Prevent Blindness uses two 
forms of tonometry at its

many free glaucoma screen­
ings around the state.

‘‘At som e sc reen in g s 
ophthalmologisis test using 
a hand - held Schitoz 
tonometer. At others, train­
ed lay people use a machine 
called a non-contact or Air 
Puff tonom eter th a t is 
transported to the screening 
in one of the Society’s four 
new glaucoma Alert Vision 
Vans.”
Although glaucoma can oc­
cur at any age, the older the 
person, the greater the risk 
of glaucoma, he noted. The 
Society therefore advises 
that all persons 35 a n d  older

PUBLIC NOTICE
BRIEF EXPLANATORY STATEMENTS 

OF PROPOSED

CONSTITUTIONAL AMENDMENTS
S P E C IA L  EL E C T IO N  
N O VEM BER 3, 1981

PROPOSITION NO. 1 
ON THE BALLOT

TAX FREE. BEGINS 
OCTOBER 1.
SIGN UP NOW!

CONVERT YOUR 
6- MONTH MONEY 
MARKET CD. TO 
THE ALL-SAVERS 
CD. NO PENALTY!

Baginning October 1, 1981, OIney Savings will offer a 
1 -year certificate which pays tax-free interest — up to 
$2,000 for nsarried coupies filing jointly, $ 1,000 for an indi­
vidual. $500 minimum required.

This tax-free feature is not the only attraction of the 
All-Savers C.D. It will also return a high yield. For many sav­
ers, the All-Savers C .D .’s tax free yield will be higher than 
the after-tax yield available in other types of accounts. And 
the OIney Savings All-Savers C.D. is insured by the 
F.S.L.I.C., up to $100,000.

Come in and talk with us about the All-Savers C.D. We’re 
prepared to answer any questions you have and we can 
begin now to set up your All-Savers C.D. We’re ready to 
help.

Come see us soon. Or coll and we’ll come see you.
H jrowr lomihf Your Tor Irockot 

prOÉMÉ>̂ >8:
Inlarait teta naaàad 
to nal 12 51 % after 
fsdaral incorna lo> i«i

$20,000 or lets 25% 16.81%

$25.000 30% 18.01%

$35,000 40% 21.02%

$50,000 or 
more 50% 25.25%

tlw iba I tiew** w* opefeiimeN and an boiod on 1911 toa toblot Tho 12.51% 
■doro.1 roto ■ .quot •• 70% at coroa« nvMtnwni ywtd ex on. yaa U S. TroOMry 
M« m at man mean oMcrioa dots.

RANŒ R O  EASTLAND 
SWINGS SWINGS

Otnoy, Soymouf, Jocblboro, iridgaport, Nocono, 
Wootharford, Alla, Graham, Archar City, >rownwood, 
•eona and Wtchila M h . Alto Eioctra Savings in Eloc- 
ha, Rortgor Savings in Rongor, Eosttortd Sovingt in 
Eosltand. AN Otvistons of Obwy Savings.

Senate Joint Kraolution 
8 proposes a constitution­
al amemlment that would 
allow the legislature to 
authorize cities, towns 
and other taxing units to 
grant exemptions from ad 
valorem taxes on an un­
productive, underdevel- 
o|ie(i or blighted area in 
order to encourage its de­
velopment. The amend­
ment would also allow the 
legislature to authorize a 
city or town to issue 
bends or notes to finance 
this development and to 
pledge future increases in 
ad valorem tax revenues 
from the property in such 
areas to repay these 
bonds or notes.

The proposed amend­
ment will appear on the 
ballot as follows: "The 
constitutional amend­
ment to authorize cities, 
towns, and other taxing 
units to encourage the 
improvement, develop­
ment, or redevelopment 
of certain areas through 
property tax relief and 
the issuance of bonds 
and notes.”

resolve a boundary dis­
pute. This amendment 
will not apply to land 
which has been deter­
mined to lie state-owned 
by a court of competent 
jurisdiction or that has a 
productive state mineral 
lease on the effective date 
of the amendment.

The proposed amend­
ment will appear on the 
ballot as follows: "The 
constitutional amend­
ment authorizing the 
commissioner of the 
General Land Office to 
issue patents for cer­
tain public free school 
fund land held in good 
faith under color of title 
for at least 50 years as 
of November 15, 1981.”

PRUPO.SITION NO. 3 
ON THE BALLOT

PROPOSITION NO. 2 
O.N THE BALLOT
House Joint Resolution 

117 proposes a constitu­
tional amendment that 
would authorize a person 
to receive a patent to land 
from the Commissioner of 
the General Land Office 
under certain conditions. 
.Application for the patent 
must be made within five 
years from approval of 
the amendment. The land 
must be surveyed, public 
free school land not pre­
viously patentable. The 
person must have a prop­
erly recorded deed to the 
land, which he acquired 
w ithout know ledge of the 
patent defect and which 
title he and his predeces- 
sora in interest have held 
for at least 60 years. The 
person and his predeces­
sors in interest must 
have continuously claimed 
the land and paid the 
taxes for at least 60 years.

This amendment does 
not apply to beach land, 
submerged land, or is- 
landa. An applicant may 
not use this provision to

House Joint Resolution
38 propose.s a constitu­
tional amendment that 
would enable the legisla­
ture to grant to a state 
finance management com­
mittee the authority to 
manage state fun.iS. 
Funds constitutionally 
dedicated to specific pur­
poses would not be sub­
ject to committee man­
agement. The committee 
would lie composed of the 
Governor, Lieutenant Gov- 
eiTior, Speaker of the 
House of Representatives, 
Chairman of the Sen­
ate f'i nance Committee, 
Chairman of the House 
.Appropriations Commit­
tee, Chairman of the Sen­
ate State .Affairs Com­
mittee, and the Chairman 
of the House of Repre- 
sentati\es Ways and 
.Means Committee.

The proiMised amend­
ment will appear on 
the ballot as follows; 
"The constitutional 
amendment to allow 
the legislature to grant 
to a state finance man­
agement committee the 
power to manage the 
expenditure of certain 
appropriateil funda."

I*R< »POSITION NO. 4 
ON THE BALIAIT
Hoaae Joint Resolution

5 propoaes a constitutional 
amendment that would 
provide that one-half of 
the surnlus tax revenues

were

heaven# ntade; and 
all tha boat of them 
by the breeth of hit 
mouth. Aakn S3;6

NOTICE
TO AU

INTERESnO PERSONS
TIm  cH> ot M M a id  PiSc« I b p a t n w t  b  MS M - 

ctp U R i sppNcaliom for C a tith d  PoNco O ttk o n .

S lK t i« |  Salanr ( U U . O O  lo {1,3 9 $  p «  oo p tk, 
depending upon tiperience.

Incentative par program; Bacliolor Oagroe 
$180.00; Associate $99.00 per mentk.

Equipment & uniforms fumishod. Uniforms d o m ­
ed at no expense to tmploree.

Twenty deys paid vacation, annually.

Liberal sick leave policy.

Retirement plan with Texas Municipal Retire­
ment System.

Complete group insurance package.

A Midland Police Department representatiM wiM 
be at the Ranch House Motel, 1-20 and 1 7 1 , in 
Weatherford on Saturday, September 19, 1981.

Interested persons may apply at room 113  from 
8KX) a.m . to 5KX) p.m. Tho City of Midland is m  
Equal Opportunity Employer.

should have a thorough eye 
examination at least every 
two years. Senior citixens, 
people with a family history 
of glaucoma and those with 
diabetes and cardiovascular 
diseases are more at risk 
and should be checked an­
nually.

To alert people to the 
dangers of glaucoma the 
Society has three films on 
the subject that may be bor­
rowed without charge for 
community shows. They are 
“Seeing,” featuring Helen 
Hayes, “Glaucoma, A Silent 
Threat to Sight” and “The 
Glaucomas,”  a film for pro­
fessional audiences. For in­
formation on the films or a 
froa copy of the publication

“Glauconu, Sneak Thief of 
S ig h t,”  send a long, 
stam ped , se lf-addressed  
envelope to Prevent Blind­
n ess , P .O . Box 2020, 
Houston, Texas 77001.

’The Texas Society is an af­
filiate of ’The National Socie­
ty to Prevent Blindness, the 
oldest voluntary  health  
agency nationally engaged 
in preventing blindness

through community service 
programs, public and profes­
sional education and 
research.

MUTCH O U T-

DRIVE CARERIUYJ
above the spending limit 
provided by Article VIII, 
Section 22, of the Texaa 
Constitution would be 
placed in a Water Assis­
tance Fund to be used as 
provided by law, includ­
ing projects for water de­
velopment and conserva­
tion, water quality en­
hancement, and flood 
control purposes or any 
combination of these pur­
poses.

The amendment also 
provides $600,000,000 of 
the general credit of the 
state to guarantee bonds 
issued in commercial mar­
kets by local political sub­
divisions, including cities, 
counties, and special dis­
tricts. The amendment al­
lows amounts to be es­
tablished to decrease or 
retire state debt, which is 
defined as that debt se­
cured by the full faith 
and credit of the state. 
The amendment would 
raise the interest that 
could be paid on autho­
rized, but unissued, bonds 
guaranteed by the full 
faith and credit of the 
state from 6% to 12%. 

The proposed amend­
ment will appear on the 
ballot as follows: “The 
constitutional amend­
ment authorising the 
use of a portion of the 
excess revenues of the 
state for water devel­
opment, water conaer- 
vation, water quality 
enhancement, and flood 
control purposes; au­
thorizing the use of the 
state’s credit, not to 
exceed five hundred 
million dollars, to guar­
antee the bonds of ci­
ties, counties, towns, 
and other units of local 
government in the fi­
nancing of projects for 
such purposes; increas­
ing the interest rate 
that may be paid on 
previously approved, 
but unissued, state 
tronds; and authorizing 
a program to retire 
state bonds.”

PROPOSITION NO. 6  
ON THE BALLOT
House Joint Resolution 

81 authorizes the govern­
ing body of a county, city, 
school district or other 
political subdivisions to 
exempt from taxation a 
portion of the market 
value of a residence 
homestead. The portion 
exempted may be as 
much as 40% for 1982- 
1984; 30% for 1985-1987; 
and 20% for 1988 and af­
ter. The amount of an 
exemption may not be 
less than $6,000 unlesa 
the legislature by general 
law prescribes other 
monetary restrictions on 
the amount of the exemp­
tion. An eligible adult ia 
allowed to receive other 
applicable exemptions 
provided by law. An ex­
ception is made where ad 
valorem tax has previous­
ly l>een pledged for the 
payment of debt.

The amendment further 
directs the legislature to 
require that notice be giv­
en to property owners of 
a reasonable estimate of 
tax on their property in 
certain situations.

The proposed amend­
ment will appear on the 
ballot as follows: "The 
constitutional amend­
ment authorising a po­
litical subdivision to 
provide property tax 
relief for owners of 
i-esidence homesteads 
and changing certain 
property tax admini­
strative procedures.”

PROPOSITION NO. 7 
ON THE BALLOT

PROPOSITION NO. 5 
ON THE BALUÍT
House Joint Resolution 

49 proposes a constitution­
al amendment that would 
exempt livestock and 
poultry from taxation. 
Currently, farm products 
in the hands of the pro­
ducer and family supplies 
for home and farm use 
are exempt.

The propoeed amend­
ment will appear on the 
ballot aa follows: “’The 
constitutional amend­
ment to provide for the 
inclusion of livestock 
and poultry with farm 
products aa exempt 
from taxation."

House Joint Resolution
4 proposes a constitution­
al amendment that would 
authorize the Veterans’ 
Land Board to issua and 
sell an additional $250,- 
000,000 in bonds increas­
ing the Veterans’ Land 
Fund’s total bond is­
suance authorisation from 
$700,000,000 to $960,000,- 
000. The amendment 
would inerpate the maxi­
mum intereat payable by 
the state on these bonda 
from 6% to 10%, and 
permit an even higher 
rate, if specified by the 
legislature.

The proposed amend­
ment will appear on the 
ballot aa follows: “The 
constitutional amend­
ment authorising the 
issuance of additional 
bonds to finance the 
veterans’ land program 
gnd to increaae the 
tisximum intereat rate 
allowable on veterans’ 
land fund bonds.”



A a  & SAT Test 
Dotes Announced

PSAT Test To Be Given At High School Junior-Senior President Dick Woolley Describes

Juniors and seniors who 
are thinking of going on to 
school afver graduation will 
want to take note of the na­
tional test date schedule for 
the ACT Assessment E*ro- 
gram and the Scholastic Ap­
titude Test of the College 
Board.

Students who want to take 
the /  CT or the SAT on the 
first 1981-82 national test 
d a te  m ust have th e ir  
registration materials com­
pleted and mailed before the 
September 18 deadline. The 
full 1981-82 schedules of test 
dates and deadlines are as 
follows:

Regist.
Test

Regist.
Test

ACT
Test DateOct. 17, 1981; 

Regist. Deadline-Sept. 18 
Test Date-Dec. 12, 1981; 

Deadline-Nov. 13 
Date-Feb. 20, 1982; 
Deadline-Jan. 22 
Date-April 3, 1982; 

Regist. Deadline-March 5 
Test Date-June 12, 1982; 

Regist. Deadline-May 14.
SAT

Test Date-Oct. 10, 1981; 
Regist Deadline-Sept. 18 

Test Date-Nov. 7, 1981; 
Regist. Deadline-Oct. 2 

Test Date-Dec. 5, 1981; 
Regist. Deadline-Oct. 30 

Test Date-Jan. 23, 1982; 
Regist Deadline-Dec. 18 

Test Date-March 27,1982; 
Regist. Deadline-Feb. 19 

Test Date-May 1, 1982; 
Regist Deadline-March 26 

Test Date-June 5, 1982; 
Regist. Deadline-April 30 

The basic student fee for 
using the ACT Assessment is 
$8.50, the SAT $10.50. 
Students can obtain ACT

A ssessm en t and SAT 
registration packets, as well 
as other college and career 
planning materials, from the 
counseling office.

At area test centers on na­
tional test dates it will take 
about three hours to com­
plete the ACT and about four 
hours for the SAT. In order 
th a t s tu d en ts  m ay be 
familiar with the character 
and format of test items and 
responses, a copy of a full- 
leng th  te s t  booklet is 
available in the counseling 
office. Students who wish 
copies of additional tests 
may obtain them upon re­
quest from ACT or the Col­
lege Board at cost.

In fo rm atio n  re p o rts  
resulting from the tests and 
the questionnaire are sent to 
the students and their high 
school counselors, as well as 
to those colleges and other 
in s titu tio n s  spec ifica lly  
designated by the students.

It is recommended that 
students take these tests dur­
ing their junior year or early 
in the senior year so that 
resulting information will be 
available in time to be of 
maximum assistance to 
s tu d e n ts  and th e ir  
counselors in education and 
career planning. Students 
who are uncertain if they 
need to use the ACT or the 
SAT, or are concerned about 
the location of the nearest 
test center, are urged to con­
tact Mrs. Mouser in the 
counseling office.

It is noted that the ACT 
will be given at Cisco Junior 
College on the February 
date.

Juniors who are interested 
in going to college after 
graduation should take note 
th a t the P re lim in a ry  
Scholastic Aptitude Test/Na- 
tional M erit Scholastic 
Q ualify ing  T est
(PSAT/NMSQT) will be 
given on Tuesday, October 
27, 1981, at Cisco High 
School

The PSAT/NMSQT is co­
sponsored by the College 
Board and National Merit 
Scholarship Corporation. It 
is administered annually to 
m ore than  one m illion 
students and measures ver­
bal and m a th e rr 'M c a l 
abilities that are important 
in college work.

The PSAT/NMSQT gives 
students a chance to find out 
what the College Board’s 
Scholastic Aptitude Test 
iSAT) is like and can be used 
to predict scores on the SAT. 
It also helps students in plan­
ning for college. Further, 
students who opt to par­
ticipate in the College Board 
Student Search Service have 
an opportunity to hear from 
colleges that they might not 
otherwise learn about. The 
PSAT/NMSQT is also the 
qualifying test for students 
who wish to participate in 
the nationwide scholarship 
competitions administered 
by the N ational M erit 
Scholarship Corporation. 
Students in competition for 
this scholarship awarded in 
1983 m ust tak e  the 
PSAT/NMSQT in 1981.

Before the test, students 
will receive the PSAT/NMS­
QT Student Bulletin which 
contains a complete sample 
test with an answer key and 
scoring instructions. In 
December, students will 
receive a Report of Student
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Answers which displays the 
correct answers and the 
students’ responses as well 
as scores. Schools will return 
test booklets at the same 
time so that students can 
review the original ques­
tions. Students will also 
rece iv e  About Your 
PSAT/NMSQT Scores. a 
booklet containing informa­
tion on in te rp re tin g  
PSAT/NMSQT results and 
on general college planning.

The fee for taking the 1981 
PSAT/NMSQT is $4.25 per 
student, to be paid at the 
time of registration. Fee 
waivers may be requested 
for students from low- 
income families who cannot 
afford to pay the fee. 
Students may register for 
the test in the counselor’s of­
fice before October 9th. 
S tudents requesting fee 
waivers must register before 
September 28th

High Elects New Building For Bonk To Rotorions 
Class Officers

Anderson And 
Claborn Catch 
Calves At Fair

Scott Anderson and Tom­
my Claborn, Cisco FFA 
members, caught calves in 
the West Texas Fair Rodeo 
on Sunday night. These two 
students will be awarded 
$100.00 each with which to 
buy a registered ewe and 
show at next year’s West 
Texas Fair.

Sunday School 
Class Meets In 
Payne Home

For Â FoIntmoirif, Call 442-2121

W e * r e  O p e n !f

TV Sales & Service
26 yrs experience

Zenith •  Philco 
Sylvania •  Admiral 
Sharp#Air Temp
Also Major Appliances

Sight ‘N’ Sound
(formerly Rockwell Lumber) 

107 E. 5th Cisco 
442-4131

Hours: 9-5 
Closed Saturday & Sunday

The Homemakers Sunday 
School class of East Cisco 
B ap tis t C hurch m et 
September 8 in the home of 
Mrs. Annie (A.V.) Payne. 
M em bers p resen t were 
Thelma Bosworth, teacher, 
Pauline Ingram , Mable 
Thetford, Fay Clack, Artie 
Shirley and Edna Neely. 
Outreach leader Mable Thet­
ford called the meeting to 
order. The class repeated 
their watch word from Pro­
verbs 31:26. Pauline Ingram 
lead the opening prayer. 
Mrs. Payne gave a devo­
tional from Proverbs 31. 
Mrs. Ingram lead a quiz of 
Proverbs. Mable Thetford 
p resided  over a sho rt 
business session concerning 
ways to improve the claas.

All reported an enjoyable 
time of fellowship.

Refreshments were served 
by the hostess.

Massey Reunion 
Held Sept. 6th

The relatives and descen­
dants of John and Ida 
(Marchman) Massey held 
their annual reunion in the 
Corral Room of the laguna 
Hotel in Cisco Sunday, 
September 6,1981.

The day was spent in con­
versation and showing pic­
tures and snapshots (mostly 
by doting grandparents, who 
just happened to have them 
in their billfolds).

At noon a delicious 
covered dish lunch was serv­
ed, followed by a business 
meeting. Officers for next 
year will remain in the same 
office as this year. The reu­
nion time will remain the 
same and in Cisco. The place 
will be decided later.

Numerous members were 
kept away by illness or 
distance. Those attending 
were from Denison, Odessa, 
Midland, Gordon, Austin and 
Cisco. Everyone is hoping 
for a good year for all "until 
we meet again”

Ihursdoy,
beptember 17, IVBl

Cisco Junior-benior High 
School class officers for the 
1981-82 school year were 
elected last week during 
class meetings. The classes 
and elected officers include 
the following:

SENIORS-Gary Speegle, 
president; Delia l.,opez, vice 
president; Carol Endebrock, 
secretary; Greg Cermin, 
reporter; Carol Endebrock, 
female class favorite and 
Joey Worley, male class 
favorite.

JU N IO R S -G reg  S ipe, 
president; Jason Potter, 
vice president; Randall Rat­
tan, secretary; Bud Wood, 
re p o r te r ;  Lezlea Hull, 
female class favorite and 
Jason Potter, male class 
favorite.

SO PH O M O R E S-D oug 
Hendricks, president; Glenn 
S ta r r ,  v ice p re s id e n t; 
Robert Sherman, secretary; 
R obert G orr, rep o rte r; 
Lucinda Hagan, female 
class favorite and Gary 
Echols, male class favorite.

F R E S H M A N --D a v id  
Seabourn, president; Angie 
Bradford, vice president; 
Cynthia Dill, secretary ; 
Sabrina Justice, reporter; 
Angie Bradford, female 
class favorite and John Gon­
zales, male class iavorite.

EIGHTH G R A D E - 
Shannon Kendall, president; 
Renee Latham, vice presi­
d en t; D eborah  Jam es , 
secretary; Tony Kearney, 
reporter; Deborah James, 
female class favorite and 
Tony Kearney, male class 
favorite.

SEVENTH G R A D E - 
Tracie Edgar, president; 
Stacey Edgar, vice presi­
dent; David McDonald, 
secretary; Ixmnie Pevey, 
reporter; Janice Woolley, 
female class favorite and 
Ricky Chambers, male class 
favorite.

Sixth Grade Choir 
Organizes For 
School Yeor

The Cisco Intermediate 
Schools sixth grade choir has 
been organized for the 
lMl-82 school year.

The members selected the 
name "U ttle LoboM." W« 
will wear gold soccer-style 
T-shirts with white stripes on 
the sleeves and an emblem 
on the left side.

We elected officers for the 
school year. They are as 
follows; Raiford Rattan, 
president; Kevin Kirk, vice 
president; Jill Reynolds, 
secretary; Laurie Cagle, 
treasurer; and Leigh Callar- 
man, reporter.

We also chose the follow­
ing sec tion  le a d e rs : 
sopranos-Raif Rattan, Paul 
Reeves, Bobby Webb, Jill 
Reynolds, Teresa Maxwell 
and Connie Streiff; altos- 
Jarrod Jeffcoat, Kevin Kirk, 
R obert W ages, G inger 
Williamson, Gina Kinser and 
I,eigh Callarman.

C hristy  Smith is the 
choir’s accompanist.

Our choir’s special ensem­
ble will be singing for the 
district Federated Women’s 
Club meeting September 25.

S p ecia l ensem ble 
members are Robert Wages, 
Jarrod Jeffcoat, Kevin Kirk, 
Paul Reeves, Raif Rattan, 
Mark McGinness, Kevin 
Bentley, Bobby Webb, Jill 
Reynolds, Leigh Callarman, 
Gina Kinser, Kim Arnold, 
Teresa Maxwell, Ginger 
Williamson, Teresa Petree 
and Connie Streiff.

I,eigh Callarman, 
Reporter

Carson Relatives
Hold Reunion

KRYSTAL MICHELLE 
THOMPSON

Mark and Terri Thompson 
are the proud parents of a 
brand new baby girl, Krystal 
Michelle, bom at Henderson 
M em orial H osp ital in 
Henderson on September 11, 
1981. The baby weighed eight 
pounds and two and one-half 
ounces, and was 21 inches 
long at birth. Maternal 
g ran d p aren ts  a re  Mrs. 
Pearla Agnew and the late 
James Ed Agnew of Cisco. 
Paternal grandparents are 
Mr. and M rs. Lawton 
Thompson of E astland . 
M aterna l g re a t­
grandmother is Mrs. Fannie 
Agnew of Ciscx). Paternal 
great-grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs Jesse Ward of 
Eastland and Mrs. Millie 
King of Eastland

President Dick Woolley of 
the Cisco First National 
Bank described to the Cisco 
Rotary Club Thursday noon, 
the general features of the 
new 12,100 square-foot home 
of the bank to be located over 
most of the area between 
Avenue D and Avc iue E and 
fifth to fourth streets. Razing 
of existing buildings to make 
way for the modernistic 
structure was begun this 
week. Only the Cisco Junior 
College Annex, originally the 
laguna Hotel, will be left 
standing and in harmony 
with the new building, whose 
design was developed by the 
bank officials, in consulta 
tion with Architects Boone 
and Pope, of Abilene, to 
blend into the fu tu re  
development of the area and 
to in co rp o ra te  all the 
features of modern elec­
tronic banking.

Haney and Sivley of 
Abilene are the contractors 
who hope, Woolley said, to 
have the new quarters ready 
for occupancy by September 
of next year.

The one-story structure 
will front on D Avenue in a 
line of deeply recessed win­
dows overlookmg an area of 
landscaped parking. At the 
rear of the building parallel­
ing E Avenue and extending 
from fifth to fourth street, a 
four-lane drive-in facility 
equipped with the most ad­
v an c e  feature^ of electronic 
remote control, will serve 
car-sitting customers.

In c o rp o ra te d  in the 
spacious layout will be a 
large lobby, fronting tellers’ 
booths and quarters for the 
bank’s loan officers; an ac­
counting department, staff­
ed with all the modem magic 
of e lec tro n ic  reco rd s- 
keeping; a generous lock- 
box department provided 
with customer conveniences 
emphasizing both access and 
privacy; a community room 
at ground level, three vaults 
instead of the present one; a 
cooling and heating system 
which can be switched from 
refrigerated air to ventral 
air on mild days; conference 
rooms and etc.

13% murals, painted by the 
late Randy Steffen, which 
have been a feature oi the 
present bank lobby lor many 
years, will be removed to the 
new bank and fitted as a 
back-drop for the new tellers 
cages.

The new structure is the 
result of two years of plann­
ing which began with an idea 
of rebuilding on present site 
at D Avenue and Eighth

Family Of
L.F. Traut
Holds Reunion

The children of Thad and 
Cordia (Lisenbee) Carson 
and grandchildren of the late 
J.L. Lisenbee, who was sec­
tion forman on the old Katy 
Railroad here in Cisco dur­
ing the 1890, enjoyed a reu­
nion Sunday, September 5 
and 6 at the Cisco Country 
Club.

Those attending were 
Reba Carson Hitt of (Tisco, 
Boyd L. Carson of Irving, 
Kevin Carson of Abilene, 
J.T. and Pearl Carson of 
Cisco, Earl Lee Carson of 
Rosebud, loma (Carson) 
Howard of Cisco, Carroll, 
Gayle and April Odell of 
Denton, W H. and Reta 
(Carson) Phillips of Anna, 
Ron and Connie, Metzie and 
Melaina of Houston, Floyd 
and Darlene, Archer, David 
and Dana and Dewayne of 
Scurry, Michael and Lynda 
Charles of Scurry, Tom and 
Ruby (Carson) Wilson of 
Memphis, Tenn., and larry

The family of L.F. Trout 
had their family reunion at 
the city park Sunday, Sept. 6. 
All of his children were 
there:

Olen of Eastland, Earl of 
Lake Leon, J.C. & Barbara 
Butler of Eastland, James & 
Mildred Sherrill of Eastland, 
Virgil it Ruby Trout of 
Gyde, Gene of Eastland, 
John & Billie Herod of 
Abilene, Elbie & Láveme 
Moore of Round Rock, Joy 
O’Brien of Eastland, Nona, 
Derik k Dana Fox of Lake 
Leon, Terry, Jan, Emily & 
Sarah Trout of StephenvUle. 
John k Tamara Slejia of Ft. 
Worth, Gary, Kathy, Diana, 
Barbie k Cody J. Butler of 
Eastland, Unda, Doug k 
Kim Webb of Gorman. Gif- 
ton k Calvin Trout of Clyde, 
Ricky Graham of Abilene, 
John & Christy Stephens of 
Abilene, Shona Herod of 
Abilene, Ken, Diane, Kindra, 
Kelly k Steve Hagen of 
Houston, Bobbie Moore k 
friend Bob of Round Rock, 
Cindy k Bradley O’Brien of 
Eastland, Mike Cindy, k 
Freddy O’Brien of Cisco, Bill 
k Loraine Trout of Cisco, 
Melissa k Tonya O’Brien of 
Eastland 8c Guy Sherrill of 
Eastland. There were 18 
grandchildren and 14 great 
grandchildren there.

Street, Woolley said. Dif­
ficulties in f i t t i^  the design 
into the space available 
there soon dictated a new 
location, and the present 
property, including the old 
Maronic Building, formerly 
occupied by Mott’s, has been 
leased to an out of city firm 
which will take charge of it 
when the new site is ready 
for occupancy, he said. The 
banker said he did not know 
what the lessee intends to do 
with it.

The new facility, one of 
several in the bank’s long 
history, is in keeping with 
the growth of the Cisco finan­
cial institution since its

beginning in March, 1917, 
with assets of |114,000 and 
deposits of 174,000. John 
Gamer, pioneer Cisco mer­
chant, was the principal 
stockholder and the bank’s 
first loan was for a mere 
$630, the banker said. He il­
lustrated his descriptions 
with a table model of the new 
building.

By 1958 when the present 
quarters were remodeled, 
deposits had grown to 
$4,500,000. Its assets today 
to tal approxim ately  $30 
million.

For next week’s luncheon 
A1 Anderson atmounced an 
outstanding musical pro­
gram.

COURTHOUSE NEWS
Joseph D. Kennedy To 

Robert W. Carter 8i Others 
Asgn OGML

Truman P. Kirk 8i Wife To 
WUlard J. LaMothe k Wife 
Warranty Deed 

Joe King To Energy 
Search Co. OGML 

Virginia Eppy Lutz To 
Richard F. Williamson, Tr. 
OGML

Ken L aw rence To 
Lawrence Drilling Co. Part. 
Asgn OGML

Benjamin Roy Lee To 
Harry E. Whitsitt OGML 

Lyles Energy, Inc. To Don 
Barton 8t Wife Asgn ORR 

Roy L. Lane, Rec’r No. 
29,182 To Fred Moseley 
OGML

Melva Love k Wife To 
Fred K. Moseley OGML 

Charles G. Lord k Wife 
Dec’d To The Public Proof of 
Heirship

Nancy K. Lester To West- 
wind E x p lo ra tio n  Inc . 
OGML

W.D. Lester 8i Wife To 
Keystone Oil Co. Inc. 8c 
Others OGML 

Loise Davis Martin, Dec’d 
To The Public Inher. Tax 
Return

J.L. Madewell To Lee 
Starr Asgn OGL 

Montgomery Ward 8c Co. 
To Jack D. Renter It Wife 
Abstract of Judgment 

Gary Minchew It Others 
To F isd  K. Mnaekey OGML 

Fred JC. Moseley To Stan- 
•on OU Inc. Asgn OGL 

Montgomery Ward A Co. 
To E.L. Sikes, Jr. ft Wife 
Abstract of Judgment 

Shirley Marmon To WDH 
Oil Properties, Inc. OGML 

J.L. Madewell To Tommy 
Bacon Asgn OGL 

Allie Mickle To Keystone 
Oil Co. Inc. 8c Others OGL 

Jasper Charles Massegee 
8c Wife To Fed. U nk Bk. of 
Texas Esmt.

C harles M assegee
Evangelistic Service, Inc To 
J.C. Massegee, Jr. 8c Wife 
Warranty Deed 

Jasper Charles Massegee 
Jr. 8c Wife To Fed. Land 
Bank Deed of trust 

John T. Moser 8c Wife To 
Sunbelt Sav Assn. Deed of 
trust

John Moser To Elizabeth 
T. Moser Power of Atty.

L.D. McCurry 8c Others To 
W.B. Norton 8c Others OGL 

Kitty McCracken To Sad- 
dlecreek Exploraton Inc. 
OGML

Ray McCoy To R.O.C. Inc. 
OGL

W.C. M cFadden To 
Rodney Mitchell k Others 
OGML

W.C. McFadden To The 
Public Aff’d

Fannie Velma McFadden 
To Rodney Mitchell 8c Others 
OGML

Fannie Velma McFadden 
To ’The Public Aff’d

and Lynda Wilson, Tribby 
and Je n n ie , Cape of 
Gerardeau, Mo.

Weldon and Celo Sage of 
Lubbock, H arrison  and 
Jeane Sage of Idalou, Eula 
Mae Jerrell of Riverside, 
Calif., Jea rl and Joyce 
L isenbee and Leah of 
Odessa, E arl and Mary 
Lisenbee of Odessa, Jessie 
and Dolly Simmons, Kelly 
Don, A.U. Payne of Cisco, 
A.L and Barba Laird of Big 
Spring.

Henry Wayne McFadden 
8c wife To R o^ey Mitchell 8c 
Others OGML 

Henry Wayne McFadden 
8c Wife To ’The Public Aff’d 

Patsy S. Nelson ft Others 
To Richard F. Williamson, 
Tr. OGML

Betty L. Nixon To Frank 
O’Neill Deed of trust 

Kerry Nelms ft Wife To 1st 
Natl Bk, Cisco Deed of trust 

C.U. Norton ft wife To 
Gene M. Snow OGML 

BUly D. Nemir ft Wife To 
George Bingham ft Wife 
Warranty Deed 

J.C. Nash To Atlas-Reiss 
Pipeline Inc. R/W 

Lee Taylor Owens To 
Richard F. WUliamaon, ’Tr. 
OGML

Frank O’Neill ft Wife To 
Betty L. Nixon Warranty 
Deed

Olney Sav. Assn. To Dale 
Mellette ft Wife Rel. Deed of 
trust

Olney Sav. Assn. To 
William F. Hopson ft Wife 
Rel. Deed of trust 

E lm er Britton Owens, 
Dec’d To The Public Proof of 
Heirship

Rogers Parker To 1st Natl 
Bk-Gonnan Deed of trust •

Jam es Parker, Tr. To 
Elastland Natl Bk Deed of 
trust

Charles M. Page ft Wife To 
L.H. Jones, Trustee Deed of 
trust

Fulton P. Powell, Elst. To 
The Public No. Tax Due In- . 
her. Tax Cert. -

Eugene Patton ft Wife To . 
David Coan ft Wife Quit 
Claim Deed

Philadelphia Natl Bank To '  
Helen Greathouse Warranty 
Deed

W.G. Reed To 1st St. Bk. 
Rising Star Deed of trust ;

Kenneth Dean Reynolds i 
To Robert M. Kincaid OGML 

Donna Powell, Dec’d To 
The Public Proof of Heirship 

Mary Jane Rowch Rec’r 
No. 29,891 To Ridge OU Co. -- 
OGML

Rockwell Bros. Endow­
ment, Inc. To Cisco Junior _ 
College Special Warranty • 
Deed !

Mary Jane Rowch, Rec’r. • 
No. Xa,3l2ToDonH. Hanvey ' 
ORUw.lne.OGL

Mertz Rattin ft Wlte To 
Latmy E. Siedge ft wife War­
ranty Deed

Betty Lou Regian ft Hus­
band To Barbara Rogers 
Quit (Haim Deed 

Jack T. Robertson, Sr. To 
Westwind Exploration OGL 

Colleen Reed to Atlas- 
Reiss Pipeline R/W 

Candace Y. Roadcap To 
Rodney Mitchell ft Others 
OGML

J.F. Sparks ft Wife To 
Richard F. Williamson, ’Tr. 
OGL

Gene M. Snow dba To 
Michael T. Ramsey Asgn 
ORR

Sentinel Petro. Corp. To 
Gene Snow Asgn OGL 

H.M. Scallom To Howard 
Worley ft Wife Warranty 
Deed

Southern Sav. ft Ln. Assoc. 
To L.H. Jones, Trustee Part. 
Rel. Deed of trust 

Lanny E. Sledge ft Wife To 
Olney Sav. Assn. Deed of 
trust

Stanson OU Inc. To Rockey 
Mountain Resources Asgn 
OGL

.Stanson OU, Inc. To BiU 
Ballard Asgn OGL 

State of Texas ft Others to 
A.J. Woodard ft Others 
Abstract of Judgment 

Charles AUen Shook To ■ 
WDH OU Properties Inc. 
OGML

Bemie Davis Shook To 
WDH Oil Properties Inc. 
OGML

Schkade Bros. Drlg. Co. To 
Sandra Elaine Storey ft 
Others Asgn ORR 

Gene Snow To ’The Public * 
Affd

R ichard E. Sparks ft 
O thers To R ich ard  F . 
WUliamaon, Tr. OGML

Clinton L. Taylor ft wife To 
Richard R. WUliamaon ’Tr. 
OGML

R obet L. T u ck er To 
Odessa Natural Co. R/W 

MUdred M. ’Trammell ft 
Others To Gene M. Snow
OGL

’Thrift Mart Properties To 
Martha Graves ft others 
Deed of trust

United States of America 
To Jack D. Fenter ft Others 
Notice Fed ’Tax Lien
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CHS Varsity
Sept. 4 HaskeH Home 8:00 p.m.
Sept. 11 Baird Away 8:00 p.m.
Sept. 18 Goldthwaite Away 8:00 p.m. 

Sept. 25 OPtN
Oct. 2 Eastland Away 7:30 p.m.
Oct. 9 Early Home 7:30 p.m.
Oct. 16 Dubfin Home 7:30 p.m.
Oct. 23 DeLeOh Away 7:30 p.m.
Oct. 30 Bangs Home 7:30 p.m.
Nov. 6 Ranger Away 7:30 p.m.

ir  tENov. 13 San Saba Home 7:30 p.m.
★  ★  Homecoming

ALL DISTRICT GAMES BEGIN AT 7:30 p.m

1981 SCH CD U LC
Cisco Junior College
Sat. Sept. 5 McMurry Cisco 7:30
Thur. Sept. 10 SMU Dallas 7:30 

Thur. Sept. 17 Texas Tech Lubbock 7: 
Sat. Sept. 26 Ranger Breckenridge 7:

Thur. Oct. 1 U.T.Arlington 7:30 
Thur. Oct. 8 WTSU Canyon 5:00 

Eri. Oct. 16 TCU Ft. Worth 2:00
Thur. Oct. 22 Ft. Hood Cisco 7:30 
Sot. Oct. 31 NMMI Cisco 2:00

Sat. Nov. 7 NEOAM Miami, Ok. 7:30

<a I

r/

/

 ̂ o JUNIOR VARSITY
(all games played oo Thursday nights)
Sept. 3 Haskell Away 7:30 p.m. 1Sept. 10 Baird Home 7:30 p.m.
Sept. 17 
Sept. 24

DeLeon Home 7:30 p.m. 
OPEN

Oct. 1 Eastland Home 7:30 p.m. 1Oct.8 Early Away 7:30 p.m.
Oct. 15 Dublin Away 7:30 p.m. H
Oct. 22 DeLeon Away 8:00 p.m.
Oct. 29 Bangs Away 7:30 p.m. ■Nov.5 Ranger Home 7:30 p.m.

I SFA ENTH AND EIGHTH GRADE

\

/

Sept. 10 
Sept. 17 
Oct. 1 
Oct. 8 
Oct. 15 
Oct. 22 
Oct. 29 
Nov. 5

s played on Thursday nights )
Baird Home 7th 5:00 8th 6:00

DeLeon Home 7th 5:00 8th6:00
Eastland Home 7th 5:00 8th 6:00
Early Away 7th 5:00 8th 6:00
Dublin Away 7th 5:00 8th 6:00
DeLeon Away 7th 5:30 8th 6:30
Bangs Away 7th 5:00 8th 6:00

Ranger Home 7th 5:00 8th 6:00

Firs t National Bank />
ISCO, T iX A S

Member F.D.I.C.

Q U IC K  W A Y  G R O C ER Y  
D ELIC ATESSEN  & B A K ER Y

1104 West 8th Open 24 Hours 442-3508

Compliments of
CISCO R A D IA T O R  SERVICE

Jim 8i Richard Butler 
207 East 6th 442-1547

Com« On Out And Join Usi

Rsstowrant
mrnt Om» 1»tm Om» t* 0»mt Imn Om

STATE FA R M  IN S U R A N C E
Ed d ie  M c M c M illa n

801 Avenue D. 442-1671

CISCO F U N E R A L  H O M E
203 West 7th 442-1503

5

K IM B R O U G H  F U N E R A L  H O M E

300 West 9th 442-1211

O IL STATES RUBBER C O .

Humbletown Cisco 442-3666

FOR SALE

§
§

PIERCE M O T O R  C O M P A N Y
119 West 7th 442-1566

T H E CISCO PRESS
700 Ave. D 442-2245

i  Cisco, Eastkmd, Ranger

T E D 'S  A N D  R EX 'S  O N E  STO P
North Ave. D 442-1188 Cisco

Groceries-Gos-Tires-Used Pickups- 
Utility Trailers-Guns-Ammo

M ER LE N O R M A N  
C O S M ETIC  S T U D IO

709 Ave. D Gsco 442-3113 |

FOR SALE
S&M  S U P P L Y  &  R EY N O LD S  

M A N U F A a U R I N G  C O .
Siding - Windows 105 East 8th 
Can Us For Free Estimates 442-2077

SUPER Y A L U

1002 Ave. D Gsco

T H R IFT  M A R T
1010 Ave. E Cisco

C ITY D R U G

800 Ave. D 442-2587 Gsco

^  M A D IS O N 'S  tà
W ESTER N  S T O R E

Ml . ctOCO TtBAi • .
"Look For Tho Horto" X l :. ■ -

ZABLE SYSTEM Inviting You To Watch AH Of The Games 
NCAA-AFL-NFL-WFL

u ^ 4 ^ ^ ^
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Superior Siding
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Dress u|> your present re ¡̂^^enee 
aad save on lieating and eo<din^ 

ith steel or v inyl sidin^i' w illi m>olation 
Keplaeeinent Vi’indow«. Storm W ind>.\vs, 

and ''lui ill I iiiiii'«.
CAliIi FUK FHKI. I STIMATK

Bu tl er
(817) 6 2 9 -2 1 4 9

Choice Building Sites 
Located East Side of 

Eastland near Gibsons 
Starting at $3,000.00 

Can build to suit your 
needs or you build 

A-1 Saies 
215 S. Wainut 

$29-2102 Anytime

FOR SAl-E 
OR LEASE 

50 by 100 ft. brick 
building on Ave. D, 
Cisco. Office front; 
loading doors rear; 
rest rooms; dear- 
span interior. Call 

629-1707 or $29-2413.

MARQUEZ 
Concrete Contractor 

Will do c a rp o r t ,  
driveways, sidewalks, 
cemetery curbs. Also 
chain link fences. Free 
estimates. Call Manuel 
M arques, 442-3848, 
Cisco, p-92

FOR SALE; Lake lot ai 
Lake Granbu-O'- Also 2 
bedroom house in need 
of repairs $07 West 11th 
St., Cisco. Priced to sell. 
Call 442-1005, Cisco, p-78

FOR SALE BY OWNER: 3
bedroom house, $25,000.00. 
Terms. Owner will finance 
at 12% interest. Call 442-1561,

FOR SALE; 3 bedroom, 1 bath, 
Using room and dining room. Will' 
finance FHA. Call after 6 p.m.

Cisco. p-60tfc 647 1386. TF

FOR SALE: Ideally suited 
lease lot at Lake Leon with 
200 feet waterfront; Staff 
Water; enclosed floating 
boat dock with walkway. 
Rugged, secluded, good 
roads, and convenient ""ose 
to Country Club. 629-2413. TF

By Owner; Shady corner 
lot, 3 bdrm, newly remodel­
ed, privacy fence, Spanish 
Style structure. 602 South 
Daugherty. Owner carrying 
some financing. Phone 
629-1461 for
appointment T-tnf

Nice 3 bedroom home for 
sale by owner. Buy equity 
and assume 10 percent loan 
with low monthly payments. 
W/w carpet with big kitchen. 
On 11/2 lots with big trees in 
nice neighborhood. 812 
Young St. Call Wayne or 
Kim at 647-1590 or 647-1161 
for appointment. T-76

House For Sale 
By owner

Clean, freshly pain ted , 
remodeled 3 bedrooms, 2 
baths, sunny breakfast area, 
w a llp ap e r, c a rp e t, 
dishwasher, lots c. storage, 
cen tral air-conditioning, 
cedar fence, cellar, garage, 
2 lots, FHA approved $31,500 
call 647-1891, if no answer 
call 647-3027. TC
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Lone Star Title 
it Abstract Co.

Jof B. loonec, Hgr.
101 W. Main 

Butland, Tcxu 70448
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Oil Is Where You Find It ... D & R ENERGY SAVERS

......so sayeth the oilmen. So is love, happiness, success and all of the
other elements that make up our lives. Where do you go to find title in­
formation? Not on the street corner or the barber shop or any other 
place except in an abstract office. Yes, we have it, compiled, indexed 
and assembled daily, from the very beginning down to the present 
time, plus years of experience and training. Visit us soon and let us 
hiave an opportunity to serve you.

VINTI SKMNO 
VWING UOtffi 
STHl SIUNC

P O BOX 603 
CISCO. TEXAS 76437

Free Estimates
DEE ROBBINS

TC
Phon« (817) 442-1521

iv/E A litt le  s a v e  A LOT«

EASTLAND
^ aeity^  û u iù t

FUA m  V A  
F IN A N C IN G

m .  1 V-i

Eastland County Abstract Compony 
Pot And Annoile Miller

/AOBILE HOME SALES
SINGLE WIDES 

DOUBLE WIDES
WE SERVICE 
OUR HOME

f o r  o n e
YEAR AFTER 

THE SALEI B

TEXA S' l e a d in g  EXTEPM IN ATO P IF M O A M V A ie a i

Abstracts and Titlt insurance Eostlond, Texos :  WE SPRAY 
:  YARL'S & TREES
J 114 W Conner

RO BERT HARBIN « 
Ph 629-2713 • LOT:

K IN C A ID
R E A L  E S T A T E

LAKE PROPERTY
RESIDENTIAL

NOT GF.TTING OLDER-GETTING BETTER! This 
older frame home hai been recently improved with 
paint, panelling and carpet. Has 2 or 3 bedrooms, 1 
bath. Roomy house on big pretty lot. Lots of trees in 
nice quiet neighborhood. $24,500.

LARGE OLDER frame house on over sized lot. 7 
rooms and full attic. Lots of space inside. Needs 
remodeling. Would like to trade for airplane or other. 
$25,000.00.

S U M M E R  H I D E - A W * v ^ - - ”  odem  cab in  on deed­
ed tot. Good ftahinR. B f«ron  th is one! LLH)7

31.29 ACRES-F a n i;  
Has tank and waUl^ 
Priced at $7t»/acn7

' Pasture. Vk minerals, 
of Cisco on Hwy. 183.

$11,700 22 ACRES - North of Eastland. Mostly coastal with a 
Unk. Nice location. |1 .000.00 per acre.

CIA)SE TO DOWNTOWN-3 bdrm., 1 bath older 
frame house. l,arge rooms with some improvements. 
House solidly constructed. Ixicated on extra large lot in 
nice neighborhood. Has several bearing fruit trees and 
garden spot. 1 car garage. Owner will finance with one 
half down. $32,500.00.

10 LOTS in Ranger -1 set up for mobile home. By all 
10 for $12,000 or 5 for $7,500.

LAKE LOTS- We also have many lots available some 
with excellent water frontage. The fishing is good and 
the price is right. LL41

20 ACRES - Scenic and m«»'c «-ea. Scattered trees, ci­
ty water available 5 SOLD of Cisco, ideal mobile 
home site. Owner finance. joou.OO

COMMERCIAL ACREAGE
45 ACRES - All impr-'- 
tank. Oak tree country

native grasses. Stock 
k^TEXAS VET. $525/acre.

NEWER BRICK HOME IN STEPHENVILLE-3 
bdrm., 2 bath, fireplace, builtins, new carpet, custom 
drapes, central H&A, fenced yard, double attached 
garage. 2 blocks from high school.

OWN A FAMILY BUSINESS-locally owned conve­
nience stor with gas pumps. Has good cash flow. Owner 
will consider financing for right person. Also has 
trailer park on 3 acres. Can accommodate 21 trailers. 
Good buy. Call for information.

$0 ACRES- S. of Cisco close to Union Center, 25 acres 
peanuts. 1 good water well, good fences. Will divide. 
$625/acre.

ATTENTION SINGLES-own your own home with this 1 
bdrm.. 1 bath home. $1500 down and owrer wUl finance. 

,$8.500.00

SPORTSMAN RETREAT-78.9 acres of hunting and 
fishing! 3 stocked tanks for fishing with live creek. 
Dove, quail, turkey and deer. 20 acres coastal and 13 
ac. wheat. 1 acre fenced garden. City water. Pretty 
campsite with all hook-ups. Some assumable financ­
ing. $633/acre.

85 ACRES - All improve, «>' -kI native grasses. Scat­
tered oak trees, stori’ eA O jood fences. Old frame 

v V r . $52house. WILL TEXASv' $525/acre.

83

(LOW DOWN PA Y M P»'^ on this neat 2 bedroom. 1 
bath mobile home ^ \ > V  n lot. Only $1.000 down and

COMMERCIAL PROPERTY 2.9 acres on 1-20 fron­
tage road in Cisco. Owner would finance part with 
good down payment. $20,000.

i owner finance. $8,..a».u0

RANGER - 3 bdrm, 1 bath comfortable home has new 
carpet, new paint, C 0 L O '’®' pecan trees,

i.^ow-ner I

PRIME RAILROAD SPUR LOCATION-1 building with 
office, 1400 sq. ft. floor space - dock height, 2 storage 
buidlings on 1*3 acres. Excellent for bulk delivery ship­
ping point. $75,000.

93.34 ACRES in Okra area. Has good stock tank, 57 
acres cultivation, 18 acres of pretty timber. Also a 33 
acre peanut allotment. Owner will finance with 29% 
down or will Texas VET/Also wUl divide. Has minerals 
that will go. Great buy at $540/acre.

ACRES - Some cultivation, beautiful trees. Ex­
cellent building site, fenced, city water. Some 
minerals. Pavement fronUge. 750/acre. Assumable 
financing.
50 ACRES - Secluded 35 acres timber, river bottom, 2 
tanks, well, 15 acres cultivation with small 1 bedroom 
house S. of Cisco. Some owner finance. $«50/acre.

Come look! Possib. finance. $25,000

RANGER- 3
I pletely remodelled, s ^ p e s , too. Nice location. $31,500.

THRIVING BUSINESS - Ixical business that grossed 
$740,000 in 1979 . Excellent cash flow and terrific loca­
tion. Terms negotiable.

77 ACRES - Close to Ranger. Good pasture land, 
tank, easy access. Also good deer and turkey hunting. 
r25/Acre.

IDEAL MOBILE HOME SITE - City utilities available 
on this cleared lot in Olden. 150’ x 75’. Owner finance.

COMMERCIAL LOCATION- -Large bldg, site on N. ac­
cess of 1-20. Excellent location., Good investment. 
Owner finance, 25% down. $25,000.00

49 ACRES - in northern part of Eastland County. 
Tank has been stocked. On good County Road less than 
1 mile off pavement. $700/Acre.

$2,750.00
EXCELLENT LOCATION -1.5 acres on Hwy. 80 near 
1-20. Unlimited potential. Older 3 bdrm. house. Call for 
more information.

42.53 ACRES - Oak trees, pasture land. New tank - 
really pretty land. Come and look at it. Owner will 
finance. $685/acre.

COZY & CUTE - 2 bdrm, new paint and carpet. Small 
; yard, carport on paved street. Nice for single or starter 
»home. $25,000.

* PLENTY OF ROOM - to live in and rent out this large 2

DEVELOPMENT POSSIBILITIES 151 acres with 120 
frontage, paved hwy. Nemerous options. Owner finance. 
$l,000.00/acre.

20 ACRES - available on pa’ ed highway about 4 miles 
from Eastland. All im p r^ ji^o asta l bermuda, 1 tank, 

nSVe-.K

97 ACRES-about ^  native pasture, some im­
provements. Older frame house and dairy barn. Owner 
finance. $567.00/acre.
124 ACRES - Exce*'i|fci U  g on this property. Travel 
Trailer included. 1 »Uw^,„,iure. $50,000 
230 ACRES - All in coastal and love grass. Excellent 
hunting. Well water, stock tank, some minerals. Will 
divide. $495/acre
300 ACREIS - Two miles from Eastland, some timber, 
native and improved grasses, 2 tanks. Excellent ranch 
land. Financing arranged. 425/acre.
420 ACREIS - Peanut farm. Fully cultivated and ir­
rigated, *̂  minerals. Beautiful 4 bdrm., 3 bath home 
with fireplace. Excellent investment. Call for more 
details.

few trees, good fen c tO jT sib le  owner finance. Will 
Tex Vet. $15.000

story apartment good repair, stays
<3M.iT, great investment. $27,500.I rented, good neighb<

B AFFORDABLE LIVING-Start with this small home 2 
P  or 3 bdrms., 1 bath. 12,500. Owner will finance.

ERAL MOTELS - listed in various parts of the 
state. All excellent investments. Call for location and 
details

We have several other tracts of land from 37 acres up 
to 78 acres. F»riced from $685/acre to $900/acre. Each 
tract has trees and at least one tank.

Owner will consider financing. Call for more details.
12'.■ AfRF.S - Pecan orchard at Carbon, about 70 pio- 
ducing trees, citv ** m  lank for a mobile home,
all on paved hiway ^ W . . . . - y .  Owner financed at

RANGER- This remodeled hou» has 3 bdrms, 1400 sq.
ft. on extra large lot. 
financing. $32,100.00.

led hou»
SOLD t and air. Assumable

INVESTMENT WITH RETURN 4 unit apartment 
house Small 2 room units upstairs, larger 2 room 
downstairs. Washer 4  dryer. $700 month income 
$35.000

10% interest. $25,000

FHA-VA-CONVENTIONAL FINANCING
We have many other listings on ranches, motels, and apartments.

Eddie Kbicoid 629-1781 M ila Kincaid 629-8757 Gilbert Meredith 653-2472

We want to SELL your listing. 

Robert M. Kincoid, Broker

^  \



r PAT MAYNARD
REAL ESTATE

INT. 20 E. NORTH SIDE
629-8568 EASTLAND

442-1880 CISCO
IF NO ANSWER CALL 442-1933

HOMES i  LOTS
A very nice 3 bedroom home in Olden. Carpeted, ceil­

ing fans, water well and beautiful yard. 139,600

An older 3 bedroom frame home on corner lot. Needs 
some work done on it. Terms can be arranged $17,000

Owner Financed! A 3 bedroom, 1*« bath frame home. 
Some carpet, panel ray heat $23,000.

A Large 2 bedroom, 1 bath home with permanent 
siding Carpeted, some paneling, fireplace, carport and 
detached garage $29,900.

A nice 3 bedroom frame home close in. Carpeted, 
fireplace, central heat and deUched garage $37,500. 
13A«% loan available.

3 bedroom, 2 bath frame. Carpeted, living room plus 
den>ith fireplace, built-in oven and range top. $32,500.

A nice lake cabin on deeded lot Good boat dock and 
boat storage. $29,500. Terms available.

A large i  bedroom home on comer lot. 2 story Better 
hurry on this one. $23,500

Close In, a 2 bedroom, 1 bath older home that is 
carpeted I>ocated on large lot. $21,500.

Lake Leon! 1 bedroom, 1 bath home on deeded lot. 
Screened in porch, fully carpeted $25,000

One acre tracts In Ranger. Ideal home sites near new 
school. All city utilities. $2,500 each.

We have owner financed lots and others at laUie Leon.

Lake Leon! A 1 bedroom, 1 bath lake home with a 
large den, including a Ben Franklin fireplace. I.ocated 
on a 278' i  300' deeded lot.

COMMERCUL

In CISC«: A nice bnck building with 5,000 sq. ft. in 
prune downtown location. $60,000

la Eastland! A 25 z 100, 2 story building on square. 
Ideal for offices. $75,000

In Eastland! A 50’ x 100' building. Gose to downtown. 
Ideal for retail business $32,500

On hlway 80 E approx a 10 acre tract and 20 acre 
tract of land. Ideal location for a business. Utilities 
available

1.3 acres joining railroad tracks with spur. 3 buildings, 
one has office and bath, and a 2,000 gallon underground 
gas tank $75,000.

In CISC«! Large lot on Hi way 80 E with older building 
and garage $18,500, will divide

la Ranger! 9 acres on Hiway 80 W. 1800 sq ft. office, 
24.000 sq. ft. shop building, 2400 sq. ft. warehouse, other 
buildings and commercial antenna. Owner will sell or 
consider long term lease.

In Cisco! Good commercial building with about 1100 
sq. ft. Good location with mam street frontage. Only 
$19,500

In Rising Star, established service station and garage. 
Located on busy highway near mam downtown intersec­
tion. Good Income Potential. $40,000

Lot on Interstate 20 East, approx. ^  acre located near 
Best Western. Perfect for offices or business $16,000.

We have a place that would be a good location for most 
any business There is an 1840 sq. ft. building with ample 
parking on 4 lots. This is a fast food business. It is now 
pnced at $60,000, which includes all equipment.

Located on Hiway 80 E. near 120, approx. 14 acres 
with old house and large metal garage. Now used as a 
wrecking yard. $54,000

FARMS A RANCHES

181 acres located between Carbon and Gorman. Ap­
prox. 60 acres of cultivation. Included are: an extra nice 
3 bedroom, 2 bath mobil home and a new 3 room and 
bath home that needs some finish work. Bams, pens, ci­
ty water and good tanks. $140,000.

Near Cisco, 40 acres with 2 bedroom home with city 
water 3 good slock tanks, reasonably priced at $45,000.

174 acres near Gorman off Desdemona hiway. Water 
well, natural gas available, 4  minerals. $25,000.

52 acres located north of Eastland on Wayland hiway. 
All in cultivation, four tanks, 2 water wells, barns A 
pens, and good fences. $52,000.

10 acre tracts near Gomian located on old Hiway 6. Ci­
ty water available $10,000.

147 acres near Carbon with approx. 80 acres cleared. 
F'air to good fences, road frontage on three sides and 
some minerals. $500 per acre with terms.

SO acres south of Elastland near I.ake Leon. 15% down, 
owner fmanced, $50,000.

We have tea acre tracts and up on hiway near Lake 
Leon. $11,000 and up, owner will finance.

500 acres aorth of Eastland on highway. Kline and 
native. An older 2 bedroom, 1 bath home with fireplace. 
Bam and other outbuildings. $530 per acre.

320 acres located between Carbon and Gorman. Some 
cultivation but mostly wooded. Good fences and hunting, 
s(xne minerals included. $450 per acre with terms.

10 acres near ElasUand. 120 frontage. $3500 per acre. 
Terms can be arranged.

Approx. 55 acres in Ranger. Ideal location for subdivi­
sion. Utilities available. $1500 per acre.

A 2 bedroom, 1 bath home only one year old. Ixx'ated 
on 5 acres south of Cisco. Carpeted, screened in porch, 
extra nice. $48,000.

1* acres in edge of Ranger, good grass, fair fences. 
$18,000.

34 acres, with stock tank, located approx. 1 mile from 
F^stland. 86500

CISCO HOMES
Extra large 3 bedroom, 14 bath home, central heat, 2 

window units. 2 bedrooms in other section by carport. 
Separate heat and air. Double garage and double car­
port, all on 4 chain link fenced lots.

Near Cisco! 4 acres, a large 3 bedroom home that is 
carpeted, paneled and with a woodbuming heater. Love­
ly tree shaded yard with pecan and oak trees.

A large 2 story home with apartment attached, located 
on a comer lot. A very scenic yard with lots of trees. This 
IS a versatile house.

A large 2 or 3 bedroom home on 3 big lots with about 30 
oak trees, lots of fruit trees, big fenced garden, storage 
building and also has mobil home hook-ups. This home 
has been recently remodeled and has new carpet and 
lots of cabinets.

Big 2 story older home. First floor could be used for a 
business and still have 3 bedroom 14 bath upstairs. 
Also, has a basement and big attic, which could be used 
for more living space. Good location and reasonably 
priced $26,000

A nice 3 bedroom, 14  bath home on corner lot. Central 
air and heat, new carpet, modem kitchen and built-in 
dishwasher. Also, a garage and storage area.

A 3 bedroom borne with large rooms, central heat and 
air, carpet, paneling, lots of closets, built-in oven and 
range, big pecan trees, comer lot. Priced to sell.

A large 3 bedroom, 14 bath, 2 story carpeted home. 
Large game room and also a study which could be a 4th 
bedroom As a bonus, two rent houses go with property, 
which are fully furnished. 2 large corner lots with 
several fruit and other trees.

LEASE PROPERTY

18M sq. f t  rock building with extra lot for lease $600 
per month.

3 bedroom, 2 bath brick home on 40 acres to lease. 
Must be at least a six months lease $500 a month, first 
and last, plus $500 damage deposit.

For Lease! Commercial 6 8 acres in Olden. Septic tank 
and utilities available.

For Commercial use only. One to five acres with 120 
frontage.

We hove other home, huid, and commercial listings.
We appreciate your listings and businessi

Roy Bailey 
i M o d a t a
629-2365

PotMoynord
Brokar
629-8063

Judy Orms
Aeioclate

629-1218
CkNiye Foster InGormon RusseN Cordell 

Aitoctata
6 1 9 - 8 9 1 5 734-2690

In Osco AnnWillioms 
lliioclata 

442-1880

To Ust Her« Coll

I L F I E L
Oil News Report

442-2244
629-1707

I6 P P TC H
T racker M ineral, 

Clyde, filed application 
to drill No. 1 Seaboume 
as a proposed 
4,100-foot wildcat in 
Eastland County.

lx)cation is two miles 
southwest of Eastland 
on a 60-acre lease.

It spots 1,680 feet 
from the south and 400 
feet from the east lines 
of Section 5, Block 3, 
H&TC Survey.

3-A J.H. Nix-Ashely in 
the regular field 10 
m iles no rth  of 
Eastland.

The
4,30D-foot

p lanned 
venture is

located on a 60-acre 
lease.

Drillsite is 660 feet 
from the south and 330 
feet from the east lines 
of Section 460, SP 
Survey, A-1927.

F irs t
P e tro leum  
Dallas, will

Texas 
Inc ., 

drill No.

Triple S Roustabout
Kenneth Sowell S G fV iC G  Stuart Sowell

FULLY INSURED & 
EQ U IPPEDBox 575 

Cross Plains 
76443 ROUSTABOUT CREWS 

Winch Truck*. 
W«ld«r, Bulldoz«r 

Pip« Troil«r,
Took Skids Extra Long Pol«*

-  ,  „ (817) 725-7731Dump Truck Bock Hoe

Texans May Pay 
For Doing Without

scrvicf
4 mCXJF̂

INSURED

PRYOR WELDING INC.
P O BO> *6< 40r W 13I. 

OSCO TI«»S T6437

WArNf PWYO« 
J£BRV C A R U R

817/44? ?555 
817/44? 189U

P 7 f

EASTLAND PETROLEUM U N D  
SERVICES COMPANY

306 Exchong« Building
Eostlond, T«xo*

(BI7) 63V-B076

Titl« S«orch— Curativ«—L«o*« Acquisiliotv 
—Drilling D«al*— harmout*

Oparotor*:
W« Hov« Som« L«a*«* You Might Lik« To Drill

IT*

A U S T IN -T ex an s 
face the “ looming 
spectre of living in the 
midst of rich gas field, 
unable to get adequate 
supplies, and paying 
a rtific ia lly  bloated 
p rices  for the 
priviledge of doing 
w ith o u t,”  sa id  
Railroad Conunission 
ChaiiTTum Jim Nugent 
as press conferences in 
Austin and Dallas this 
week.

Nugent said Texas 
consumers face higher 
natural gas prices and 
probable shortages in 
supply unless changes 
are made in the federal 
Natural Gas Policy 
Act.

As the a c t now 
stands, an estimated 40 
percent of all U.S. 
natiu'al gas will re­
main under federal 
price controls after 
1985.

Most of the low-cost, 
price-controlled gas

Eastland National Bank
salutes the oil industry.

We are eager to help in your growth and welcome 
the opportunity to serve you. You've got a friend —  

in Eastland.

EASTLAND NATIONAL BANK
201 East Mam Stre«t 817/629S551

Equal ( Tpixirlunity Employer M-F-H
y\ember FDIC

continue to flow to 
other states under the 
fed e ra l law . The 
department of Energy 
estimates that this so-J 
called “old interstate" 
gas will cost $1.01 per 
Mcf (thousand cubic 
feet) in 1985, compared 
to 93 cents per Mcf in 
1978.

By contrast, old in­
trastate gas prices will 
cost Texas consumers 
$3.29 per Mcf in 1985 
under the NGPA.

“This is the gas you 
and I bum every day, 
and we’ll be paying 
over three times what 
it costs our northern 
n e ig h b o rs ,”  sa id  
Nugent.

Problems multiply 
for TexEuis when in­
terstate customers use 
the dollars they save to 
bid up the price of new 
gas supplies. Nugent 
seriously questions 
whether the intrastate 
pipelines can compete 
for these new supplies 
without a base of con-

OU related bustnesses 
We have the bext loca- 

Uon
la Eaxtland for your 

business
In the New Pogue In­

dustrial
Park located across 

Highway 80 from Ser­
vice

PIple A Supply 
Sell by the lot or acre 

A-1 Sales 
215 S. Walnut 

828-2102 AnyUme

BIG COUNTRY REAL ESTATE
509 East 8th Cisco, Texas L a

REALTOR

H O M ES
•2 Bd.
•Great commercial location on 8th Street Cisco, with large corner lot and 2 bd. house.

with garage, owner will carry at 12% with $8,000 down.
•4 Bd., 2 bath home on large corner lot buy equity H assume low interest loan.
•2 Bd, 1 bath double carport on 3 acres V.A. ready.
•Assume good interest note, payments under *300®« per month. 14X80 3 bd. mobile 

home on 2 50X150 lot storage building, too. *7,500 equity 
•*6,000 Down & owner c SOLD I 12®/* 2 bd. close to town. Or. FHA/VA.
• 3 Lots and small house, *15,000.

LA K E  H O M ES
•3 bd. all the extras SOLDA^ner will finance at low interest
•REDUCED 1 bd, fireplace, private cove, only *13,500. Low down ft owner carry.
•1 bd. nice dock, 2 beautiful lots, *24,000.
•3  Bd cabin Southpide tix up only *11,500.
•BeautituI 2 Bd, 2 both home, water tront, boatdock and boot house patios, terraced, 

workshop 
PLUS

•2 Bd. cabin complete with root deck, patio, and furniture.
A C R E A G E

•160 oc. ranch, complete set of steel pens, and small home.
•320 ac. 1-20 frontoge, investment opportunity, some minerals, good water 
•179 ac. cottier ranch 12 mi South of Breckenridge 3 bd. Central H/A lovely home.

Good Hunting, some minerals 
•160 oc with 40 oc in pecans, some minerals.
•330 oc. V* minerals, 150 ocres in popershell pecan' Price Reduced 
•7 acres with good fences and metal shop only *12,500.
•8 Acres in coastal with 4 bedroom home, some owner finance.
•116 oc. near Cross Plois. This is o working form with postures, garden spot, truit trees 

cultivated fields, wells, steel fences, workshop, ond tractor shed. Beautiful 2 bd.
2 both, wood stove patio, and lots of shade trees.

•45 qc. ft 3 bd. house moved to site. Lovely country south of Cisco.
LOTS•177' X 110' on paved street in desirable spot *16,000

T h e se  D o M ot R e p re a e n t  A ll O u r  LM Ing* Call Urn Par M o r e  In tom atlan .

Dono Goosen, Broker / a i - y \  a«.» i  Penny feoy
(«17; 442-3958 V O ' ' ;  4 4 -Z - I  O V  O (817)442 1707



trolled low-price gas. 
He cited a recent 
Department of Energy 
study which estimates 

•that ha lf-a -trillion  
cubic feet of gas will be 
transferred from intra­
to interstate markets 
in 1985 under the 
NGPA.

Even if s ta te  
pipelines do compete 
successfully, Nugent 
said they will have to 
pay h igher-than - 
market price for the 
gas. ‘‘If Texans are to 
burn gas, they will 
have to pay more than 
the free market price, 
because they will be 
subsidizing the costs to 
consumers in other 
states, particularly the 
Northeast,” he said.

Other factors add to 
the problem, noted 
Nugent. Not only will 
intestate customers 
have privileged prices, 
they will have privileg­
ed access to new sup-

plies as well.
With few exceptions, 

he said, once gas is 
placed in the interstate 
market it is forever 
com m itted to that 
m ark e t. In m any 
cases, the sale of gas 
from a single well 
binds the gas from an 
entire field until the 
field is depleted and 
abandoned. In other 
words, gas can move 
freely from Texas 
markets to the in­
terstate market, but 
not back again.

Finally, Nugent said, 
federal rules effective­
ly preclude intrastate 
pipelines from bidding 
on any gas produced 
from the Outer Con­
tinental Shelf, one of 
the most promising 
new areas for gas 
discoveries.

Nugent called on 
Congress and the Ad­
ministration to:

1. Change the federal 
law which guarantees

privileged prices to in­
terstate buyers, and

2. Change the federal 
laws which guarantee 
privileged access to in­
terstate buyers.

N ugent recen tly  
returned from a round 
of talks with congres­

sional and administra­
tion o ffic ia ls  in 
Washington where he 
discussed natural gas 
policy problems. He 
has also written to 
Texas senators and 
congressmen urging 
their assistance.

, REALTOR

Naltii Bradford, Broktr 
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LAKE HOUSED Deeded lot with staff water. 267’ fron­
tage & 300’ deep. House has all new plumbing, new 
carpet, new curtains & shades, new TV antenna & 
booster. Kitchen newly painted, Ben Franklin wood 

I stove, targe storage shed with porch, 250 gal. butane 
I tank, 70% full of fuel. Ixits of big shade trees. Price 
I $26,600.00

BUSINESS - In Ranger - Call for details.

BUSINESS • Station, garage doing good business, buy 
equip, and inv. • Rent Building.
IDEAL FOR ANY 'TYPE BUSINESS: Apx. 1350 sq. ft. 
for office space or other business. Lot .614 A. on Hwy. 
SOW

LOTS
I NEED RENT PROPERTY? 2 bdr , 1 bath frame house 
on big lot located in Strawn, Texas. $8,500 00

GREAT BUY
Ideal property for oil field supply, drilling co., or truck­
ing CO. 5000 sq. ft. metal 3 story building - total usable 
sq. ft. all 3 stories 12,000 sq. ft. Completely fenced 
metal fence includes parts dept., garage, 2 offices.

Additional metal building 1600 sq. ft. 2 bath A/C in­
sulation asphalt parking area - all for 160,000. With 
terms.

THIS ONE WILL MAKE MONEYA 2 bdr., 1 bath 
frame on 1 lot located on Howsley St. in Strawn, Texas. 
Some carpet. Now rented for $130.00 mo. Priced at only 
$9,000.00
HOUSES TO BE MOVED! 3 Br., LR. kitchen, 1 bath, 
good solid frame. 2 BR, 1 bath, comb. LR A DR. Priced 
to sell quick.
LAND - 22 A. Close In - Call for details.

LAND - Enjoy hunting’ 35.5 A. Post Oak - No Minerals 
15 M. SE of Cisco. Wild turkey and deer. Fenced on (3) 
sides • Next to Game Preserve.

160 ACRF^ OF BLACK LAND-Cleared. good tank, 
good fences, kline ^  grass
on 13 acres. City w a ^ ^ 'l i la b le ,  good grass, some of 
the best land in Stephens County! U minerals goes with 
place. Excellent bird hunting! Will sell all or would 
divide.

IDEAL Hwy. 80 E. Business property! 2 A. with house 
and shop building. Lots of highway frontage.

PECAN AND FRUIT TREES wiU help make payments 
on this 64  A.-Appx. 1900 sq. ft. in House. Double car 
port A patio. Good Buy!

fîEALTO;

HOMES-RANGER
New listing; Mobil home on Travis street, two 
bedrooms, one bath, all furniture that comes with a 
mobil home goes. Storage house goes with this place. 
Priced to sell $7,750.00

About a year and a half old, two bedroom brick home, on 
two lots, central heat and vented evaporative cooling. 
One bath, range, dishwasher, fenced back yard. This is a 
comer lot, 1006 Foch Street.

New listing on Pine Street, three bedrooms, one bath 
older home that need someone to work on it. Very large 
rooms, could be made into a very nice place. Two lota go 
with this house $22,500.00.
Three bedroom, one bath, large living and dining room 
combination. Central heat and air, washer dryer connec­
tions. Seperate garage and storage room. This house is 
on two lots on Main Street. $30,000.00 
Approx. 5 acres of land in City limits with a three 
bedroom, two bath house. Central heat and air, horse 
barns, garage and storage. Very attractive place. 
$45,000.00
Brick three bedrooms, two full baths, den with wood bur­
ning fireplace, kitchen with double oven, corning 
cooktop, dining room combination, central heat and air, 
utility room with washer and dryer connections. Fenced 
back yard with covered patio. Two storage buildings. 
This is in a nice neighborhood. $75,000.00i

RESIDENTIAL
OIDER 2 story house near school in Carbon. Ijirge lot 
with plenty of room for gardening. Needs repair. Budget 
priced.
SPACIOUS HOME ON 2 lX)TS-4 bedrooms. 14 baths, ful­
ly carpeted, custom kitchen with built-ins, energy saving 
storm windows. Covered patio faces large, fenced back 
yard. Near schools. See this one soon!
A IJTTIJ; BIT OF HISTORY; One of the oldest homes 
in Palo Pinto County, moved from Thurber to present 
site in Strawn in early 1900’s. Restorable condition. On 
200’ X 140’ lot, and price includes 197514 x 80 total electric 
completely furnished mobile home. Price reduced!
P I .F.NTV OF ROOM: This three bedroom or could be fouf 
bedroom, 1 bath home on corner lot. Assumable financ­
ing with $190 monthly payment. Owner said trade for 
anything of value for his equity.
IDEAL WEEK-END EAT, or year-arouha
residence. Attrac*^ , ^ * ftJ3  .lied 2 bedroom, 1 bath 
home on large d e e > y ^  vfTiAKE I£ON. Many extras in­
cluded.

COZY 2 br, 1 oath completely remodelled i>iside, new 
carpet, on shaded lot, located in Ranger. Budget priced. 
GORMAN: Ideal for'retired or small family. This nice 2 
bedroom with separate utility sits on two tots with large 
garden area. Excellent condition, well insulated. City^ 
utilities and well for garden use. Reasonably priced. 
OWNER MUST SELI>-Equity lowered - l^ke Cisco: l.«ve- 
ly South side home ’’cnt only 44  miles from
downtown. Two ^'replace, central
H/A, glassed sun *?!cn opens to wooden deck, beautiful 
view, fenced yard. Numerous extras. Call for details. 
RENTAL PROPERTY • 3 bedroom 1 bath home on targe 
lot. $12.500.00.
PRICE DRASTICALLY REDUCED Invest your money in 
duplexes and have a hedge against inflation while you en­
joy the tax advantages of rental property. We have two 
duplex units, brick, builtins, carpet, carports, 100% oc­
cupancy. Inquire today.
SMALL ACREAGE with 3 or < ' edroom Older home in 
good condiUon, garden re«», water well, huge
carport and storage a r e a ^  Jii't miss this opportunity for 
country living at a reasonable price.
LAKE LEON: Deeded lot Approx. 200 ft. road frontage. 
Approx. 65 ft. waterfront. JWillow Beach subdivision, old

JM A Road. ’NEW HOML ctiMFLETED uii t>4 ac. with own water
well. 1300 sq. ft. Brick home, total electric.
Coloalal Style Brick you will like the arrangement of 

o i^aU e^w ^^gl^hom e in one of Ranger’s

JAMES W. RATLIFF REALTOR

REALTOR-BROKER

6 4 7 -1 2 6 0
Brick three bedrooms one and a half baths. liSrge den, 
central heat and air, range and dishwasher. This house 
is in Meadowbrook addition and would make some fami­
ly a very nice home. FHA Financing available.
Two bedrooms, one bath, close to down town. Needs very 
little work, double garage. This house is on 14 lots, a 
good buy at $10,000.00
1980 Mobil home on eight lots. Three bedrooms, two full 
baths, carport, central heat and air. There is a large 
24x30 steel building with concrete floor that goes with 
this place, also a 14 x 20 storage building. $65,000.00 some 
owner financing.
Rock two bedroom, central heat, one bath, living room, 
large kitchen, washer connection, range, refrigerator, 
would like to sell furnished. This house has 44 lots, six 
pecan trees and several fruit trees. $40,000.00

■“" '6 4 7 -1 6 6 7
COMMERCIAL PROPERTY
7,000 square foot Delta Steel Building in Ranger. This 
building has a large truck scale that goes with the 
building.

'Two lots on Hwy. 80 just next to JRB. A good commer­
cial location.

Three story brick i S O LD  Ranger with twelve lots.

Ten acres of land in the city limits, good place to 
develop. Will sell worth the money, $10,000.

RANCH OUT OF RANGER
981 acres on 1-20 just east of Ranger, excellent hunting 
place. Will run 60 pairs year round, small but nice house 
with central heat and air.

JUST OUT OF RANGER

LAKE PROPERTY

25 acres of land with a four bedroom house, two full 
baths, Franklin Stove, very ^ e  kitchen with plenty of 
cabinet space. D ishw asb'^N ^ge and ovens, large pan­
try. Lots of closet spav^^ id  storage. Several outside 
buildings, metal pens, water well, fenced garden spot. 
$58,000.00

Tile block house on deeded lot, one large bedroom with 
very large living room with sleeping facilities. This 
place has a nice boat dock. All furniture goes with this 
$30,000.00

Very nice small lake house on deeded lot. One large 
bedroom, kitchen, living room, then a large bedroom on 
the lake side. This on a good fishing part of the lake with 
a boat dock. $22,500.00

160 acres of land, one tank, 87 acres in cultivation, good 
fences, some improved pasture, 4  minerals. Owner will 
sell parts of this place also.

We solicit your listings on any type of Reol Estate 

Oneta Robinson Associate 629-1467
t i ï
(QUAI HOUSING 
•fPeRTUqiniS I

aae

C o u t i t t y  R E A L  ES7 A T Í
O fflCE NI6NWAT M  E

FHA-VA CONVENTIONAL FINANCING
established neighborhoods for formal or informal 
entertaining. Features like living room with custom 
drapes, and formal dining area, den with fireplace, 
bresidast area off kitchen, 3 bedrooms, 2 baths. Patio 
yard is privacy fenced. Garden area and dog run 
separately fenced. Outside storage bldg. By appoint­
ment.
OPPORTUNITY KNOCKS! Take advantage of this offer­
ing of income producing property consisting of four units 
All have maintenance-free metal siding, and all conve­
niently located on 150 x 150 ft. lot only 4  bliK?k from high 
school. OR. live in the spaciou.s, coinfnrtable, recently 
remodelled. 3 bedroom. 2 bath. l.R. den w/fircplace. built- 
ins, central heat and air. and let 3 rentals help make your 
payments.
OWNER HAS MOVED! We are looking for a family who 
needs over 1600 sq. ft. 3 bedrooms, 1 bath on corner lot, 
shaded, by huge trees, with excellent garden space. 
Recently remodelled, with almost new range and 
refrigerator. Separate utility room with space for ironing, 
sewing. Don’t wait. Call us today!

629-1725
EQUAL NOUBUIBBARBARA LOVE, BROKER OPrOSTUNITIil

COMPLETELY REMODEIJCD • 2 bedroom with car 
port and storage room in Eastland. Perfect for the 
small family
IDEALLY located on corner lot, close to schools, this com­
fortable, recently remodelled home offers 3 bedroom, 2 
baths, living room, den with fireplace and all new kitchen, 
central heat and air. Reasonably priced.

COMMERCIAL PROPERH
RISING STAR - I.arge commercial/shop building located 
downtown area REASONABUl, and you convert to your 
own needs.
BRICK BUILDING with 20 x 25 ft. office on several lots in 
Gorman. Excellent for garage or small factory.

ACREAGE'
9 ACRES M/L onlyS/lO mile West of Ranger City 
Umits. All cleared, county road two sides. $2,000.00 
down, owner finance balance on contract for deed.

5 ACRES of oak trees is the setting for this large brick

WE WANT YOUR BUSINESS - YOU ARE OUR BUSINESS
iu sä i PteCTC SWAFFOIID M7-I050

home with 3 bedroom, 24 baths, separate dining room 
and living room. Lived in only 2 years. Good water well, 2 
septic tanks, total electric. Located near Gorman.
53 ACRES conven ier*•J-^ '^ ind . All cleared with scat­
tered trees. Water a S O LD  County Road. Will divide 
for Texas Vet. with papers.
60 ACRES So. of Cisco, 1 mile off Hwy. 206. Approx. 30 
acres coastal, 15 acres love grass, some timber. One good 
stock tank, shallow hand-dug well.
66 ACRES with large 2 bedroom home, city water and 
well, located on Hwy. 69. Convenient to Eastland, Cisco, 
Ranger, Breckenridge. Approx. 36 acres pasture, 30 acre 
field, 3 stock tanks, roping pen, bam.
79 ACRES sandy land C A | |k  tal, mostly cleared, good 
fences, at Olden. Will
10 ACRES near Eastland. All cleared. About 4  mile off 
Hwy. 69.
3.9^ acres in City Limits with mobile home hookup, cit^ 
water. Cleared, fenced, some large pecan trees. .,
60 ACRES, M acres peanut allotment, 1 water well, sandy 
loam, south of Cisco. Approx. 1 mile off pavement. 
HORSE IXIVERS - You must see this 120 acres with large, 
completely remodelled rock home. This place is set up for 
convenience of horse breeders and safety fenced to pro­
tect your investment in your animals. 6 large sheds, 
numerous corrals, 3 water meters, 2 mobile homes, 
peanut allotment, 4  minerals, 4 stock tanks, cross- 
fenced. coastal and native grasses. CARBON AREA.
63.S Acres near Eastland with frontage on blacktop.
One tank and old well. Part wooded, good deer and 
turkey hunting. Will divide for Texas 
Vet. witl\ papers in hand.
12.642 ACRES on FM 2461 near Lake Leon Dam Blacktop' 
frontage, staff water. Pennanent easement to lake. Call' 
today. •
150 ACRES with 3 BR home. Some improveid grasses, two 
irrigation wells. Fronts on paved highway South of Ciaco.' 
Owner will help finance.
BUILD your dream house on one of these 2 to 3 acre 
tracts. Located on Hwy 6, 5 miles S. of Eastland. City 

,water available. . y
' SI ACRES with beautiful 3 bedroom, 2 bath 5 yr. old bri3T 

home. Horse pens, 3 stock tanks, 25 acres in coastal, good 
fences. Located 4 miles NE of Gonpan,
18 acres, m/1 approx. * ^ ’es So. oiEastUind on Hwy. 6. 
Highway fro n tag '« £ ^A ;ared . 25% down and owner 
finance balance. C,^^oon.
64  ACRES with new large 2800 sq. ft., 3 bedroom, 2 full 
baths, family room, separate utility. Only 3 months old. 
Plenty of trees. Just outside the city limits of Gomum. 
Prirr reduced for Quick sale.

BARBARA LOVE 647-1397 20 ACRES approximately 3 miles west of Gorman. Co-Op
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KING INSURANCE AGENCY !
CISCO 

106 W. 6th 
442-2552

RANGER

REAL ESTATE
Mrs. Opol C. King-Broker 

Res. 647-1510

RANGER 
207 Main 
647-1171

H EW  L D T U fO
REAL NICE two-bedroom, one bath dwelling, carpet, 
nice kitchen cabinets, car-port with storage room, 
small building, fenced back yard, corner lot. Priced 
right for $13,500 00 Owner will carry, with down

LAKE LEON
lake dwelling, large .iving area with wood burning 

Franklin stove, large bedroom, dressing room and bath, 
kitchen, nice carpet and drapes, storage building with 
porch, T V antena. Butane (250 gal.i. Staff Water. Deed­
ed lot w ith nice shade trees.

TWO BEDROOM HOUSE. 2 nice lots, paneled, 
carpeted, good neighborhood $21,000

GOOD COMMERCIAL location: two bedroom house, 
store building, trailer park with six hook-ups, lots of 
beautiful trees, on 23 lots, on Hwy. 80, inside city limts.

CISCO
N EW  U 8 T IN O

3 BR, 2 bath, mobile home, w ith large addition includes, 
large den with sliding glass doors on to cement patio, 
bedroo, bath and walk-in closet, 2 car garage and barn, 
shop building on 3 acres just outside city limits

Very nice two-bedroom, living room, dining area, 
one bath, kitchen with plenty of cabinets, attached 
garage, CHA, fenced back yard. FHA Financed.

STRAWN
 ̂ VERY NEAT 2 bedroo 

lot, 2 out buildings
use, fenced yard, corner

YOU MUST SEE! REA Nice twi>-bedroom and enclosed 
porch, livmg-dining rf" ^  kitchen, one bath, two-car 
garage, completelv <N«^,ed with very nice furniture, 
drapes, dishes. ei ^ ^ o o d  neighborhood. READY TO 
MOVE INTO All of ihi« for only $27,500,00

We need and appreciate your listings

VA And FHA FINANCING

r t t f / £ ...l O O K U S O V E R !

Colony Homes has already built three model homes to 
give you a general idea of how beautiful your new home 
could be.

We have thirty-eight different floor plans for you to 
choose tiuin. There’ s o::e that’s just right for you and your 
family. And we have plenty of financing available too!

Our homes range from 1,000 to 1800 square feet in site 
and our prices are not out of reach either. In fact they 
start from the middle 30’s and up.

So come on out and have a look for yourself. We'ld like 
the opportunity to show you around.

You’ ll Be Glad You Did!

•80 »OOM*»
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E a s t l a n d ,  T e x a s

( 8 1 7 ) 6 2 9 - 8 5 7 1

RIG SAVINGS on 2 houses located in Eastland and Ranger.
[ Priced 20 percent below market value. Special low interest 
rate for the right person. Will sell separate or package. Only

UidL------------------------------------------------------

PARTIALLY BRICK 3 N»-i ^  2 bath energy efficient
home approximately 2 y -< central heat and air, 12
X 22 covered patio and is .«i comer lot. Financing available.

4 ACRES off old hwy. 80 E. block from city water main. 
Excellent for pipe yard or for oilfield storage. A-10

0LDE:R HOMF'.: 3 bdrm., 1 bath, all new kitchen cabinets 
and bathroom fixtures. Completely restored. Central heat 
and carpet and tile throughout. Being appraised F.H.A. E-10

TWO BED»
cabinets. R-t'

home with fireplace, carpet, nice

ATTRACTIVE 3
location. F.H.A. $31

'ith, central H/A excellent

NEAR NIMROr
minerals, grass, tr SOlO

with peanut allotment, some j
uove hunting. A-9

20 ACRES, owner financing $3,000.00 down at 12% for fivejj 
years, 4 mi. N.W. of Eastland-good fence all cultivation, ( 
Farm  to Market Road 3010. A-3 5

FOWLER REALTORS
820 West Main 629-1769 

Bill Grtfmh, Brokar

Residential
Eastland

CHECK THIS one: OUT. NICE older home on two large 
lots. l.,ocated on trees. 3 BR, 1 bath, 2
fireplaces, nice bull drapes, screened in porch,
hardwood floors and carpeting. A terrific buy.

SMALL 2 bedroom, one bath home in good location for only 
$9,000.00. R-2

SMALL ACREAGE TO BUILD ON between 2 and 3 acrej

3 BDRM. 2 bath home in good location. Needs some 
reapirs. Carport, fenced back yard with storage bldg. Call for 
more information. E-2

ONE bedroom, 1 bath home with den, wood heater, car­
port, FHA appraised. R-9

NICE three 
home. Good lot

<ne bath, completely remodeled

IN EASTLAND: Three apartments that gross monthly 
¡$435 00 Upstairs can be made into another apartment. Car­
port and furnishings stays with apartment. E-1

STORY B(K)K HOME: 1900 sq, ft. Owner will finance, 
bdrms., 2 bath needs some repairs. E-19 SMALL three 

large lot.
bath fully carpeted home on

WE HAVE new homes under construction. Call for details.

RtK'K CHURCH 412 N. Ba.ssett. Very spacious could be 
converted into residence. Already has two baths, two rooms 
that could be bedrooms. Kitchen with dining room. Worship 
hall could be huge living room. Call for details. E-6

REMODELED: Three bedroom, one bath carpeted home. 
One car garage, close to schools, church and shops. FHA. R-5

COMFORT/xBLE I '
! formal dining room ai 8P1^ bedrooms, living room. Cisco

NICE: Three bedroom, one bath, den home. Completely 
carpeted. Back of house has an efficiency apt. Call for 
details. R-3

TWO BEDROOM, 1 bath - has wall furnace and 
refrigerated air condition, carport on side of house, carpeted 
This is only $25,000 (X) E-5

NICE small 2 bedroom, 1 bath, central heat and air. Close 
to school. $18,000.00 Oxvner finance. E-0

NEAT 2 bedroom, 1 bath on nice corner lot, close to school, 
owner financing available. E-4

UNDER CONSTRUCTION: Beautiful new fou^ bedroom. 2 
bath home in excellent le ;< v n  - to consist of 1854 sq ft..

MIVELY 3 bdrm, 2 bath home on large corner lot. Must see 
to appreciate. 2 car garage, large trees, close to schools. C-2 

NICER THAN AVERAGE: Three bedroom brick home, 
has powder room and one complete bathroom. Has central 
heat and air. Cyclone fenced back yard, peach, pear and ap­
ple trees House is furnished with stove and refrigerator. To 
be appraised FHA Call for more details C-3 

A VERY GOOD BUY A nice well kept older home with ap­
prox 1100 sq. ft. on 2*2 lots l.arge storage building with elec­
tricity. 2 separate garages Storm cellar. Nice garden spot. 
Beautiful fruit trees. 3 BR. 1 bath Very comfortable home on 
a quiet street. Call about this one. C-1

Lake Property

fireplace, insulated wi: # C v ^enn-aire drop-in oven, high ef- 
s T a lfeciency heat pump, dis 

be a beauty.
.abinets and other extras. This will

Ranger 647-1302

CHARMING CABIN IN REMOTE LOCATION Recedir g 
water does not detract from this cozy 1 bedroom with 
fireplace. Plenty of trees, fenced yard, and year-round 
neighbors. $17,000.00. Some owner financing. LP-11.

LAKE LEON - Nice l>ake home on deeded lot, city water, 
good boat dock, 3 BK. -1 bath, 2 fireplaces, beautifully land­
scaped. This is a very pretty plate. LP-1.

IJVKE HOME: One bedroom, one bath large living room 
overlooks lake. Builtin kitchen, stove, dishwasher and 
disposal. Antenna with UHF attachment. Back of lot slopes 
gently down to the lake Call for more information. LP-4

tracts about 6 miles south of Eastland on Hwy. 6 - City water 
and electricity available. Call for details. A-17

House with Acreage
1884 ACRES Northwest of Ranger. Three tanks, 1 water 

well 1/8 minerals, good hunting. A-5
1.734 acres - Breckenridge Road, 3 bedrooms, 2 baths. 

Great condition. Call us. HA-7
1.10 ACRES with a four bedroom one bath house on it. Elqui- 

ty buy, loan assumption. Call now for more information. 
HA-9 I

Commercial & Lots
ATTENTION MERCHANTS ■ RELOCATE! ONE half to 

ONE ACRE TRACTS, all utilities and pave street, situated in 
new shopping development. Adequate parking space, 
$8,500.00. C-2

IN CISCO, 2 large lots with many oak trees. Utilities on pro-| 
perty great for mobile home. Ij-15

THREE lots 25 ‘•’’s Original Town Site Addi­
tion (Commerce i

LAKE LEON BUSINESS with 3 bedroom siding home on 
water front, 2 gas pumps, 4 trailer hook-ups, store is 500 sq 
ft., 24’ X 30’ workshop, storeroom, storm cellar, staff water, 
garden spot. GOOD LOCATION AND A GOOD BUSINESS. 
CP-5

CISCO, LARGE COMMERCIAL Bldg., includes nice size 
apartment, 2 bay car wash, mobil home hookup. Make offer.
CP-6 ?

GREAT LOAN r 
payments of $306 001  
bath home. E-20

S O U > ,

IN RANGER, nice 2 bdrm., 1 bath. Has a breakfast room 
and a I car garage This house is close to school. R-2

.000 down and take up 
i.D% interest on 3 bedroom. 1 TWO bedroom. 1 bath home vxith central heat, fireplace, 

fenced in backyard FHA R-13

Country Homes & Acreage
Acreage

1122 DESDEMON I l^ath.

DOWNTOWN CISCO Just 3 doors from proposed site of y 
new bank, attractively remodeled for retail store or offices. ^ 
CP-7 ■ j|

PACKED WITH POTENTIAL Going business good in-fc 
come, excellent location. Call for details. CP-8 i

EXCELLENT INCOME PROPERTY 3 apartments with 
100% occupancy gross monthly income of $435 00 Property 
need some repair, if you are a handy man this is for you. E-1

energy efficient home, 3 
•oom, large den, central heat

FUESH ON MARKET Nice Brick home on large lot, house 
has approx. 2400 sq. ft. living area. 4 BR, 2 baths. Cent. H/A, 
Nice built in kitchen, custom made drapes, covered patio, 
Brick BQ pit and smoker in back yard, nice large oak trees. 
You must see this one. E-7

NEW ON THF 
bedroom, 2 bath. 
and air, only 2 years old FHA 

TWO bedroom. 1 bath home with two car garage on large 
lot FHA appraised R-11

BRICK home with 3 bedroom, 14 bath in the Meadow 
Brook Addition R-1

S5 ACRES good building site. Across from new high school 
in Ranger May be subdivided or sold as a unit. A-6

FRESH ON MARKET 60 acres about 12 miles South of 
Cisco, 30 acres Coastal, 15 acres in Love Grass, rest in 
timber, 1 tank and 1 hand dug well. Call for details. A-1

EXCELLENT BUSINESS LOCA'OON on Old Hwy. 80 West
has room for four office spaces, central heat gnd a ir,j 

carpeted. CP-1. i
ONE lot on Br SOLD I. L-2
EXCELLENT commercial property on large comer lot -j 

central air and heat - perfect for business offices. Eastland. 
CP-12

I^R G E COMMERCIAL lot, 188 x 144 fronts on oldj 
Highway 80 E. Excellent for a fast food restaurant or 24-hour | 
grocery store. CISCO. CP-1<*

LO O K  U S O V ER  B E F O R E  YO U  LO O K  ARO UN D
Wt Apprtciitt Your Businiss

Rosezell Emerson Shirley Griffith Bill Griffith. B ro k e r  H * « “' Underwood, Assoc. Broker • Chris Frost Crum
629-8183 647-1635 647-1635 629-1188 629-8224
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SMITH, VERETT & CO., certified public accountants, now occupies 
one of the city’s oldest buildings that has been completely remodeled and 
redecorated. They are located in the old Lemore Pharmacy building at 
the comer of Avenue D and 5th Street.

The building was purchased from the Joe Lea Moore Estate last year. 
The brick exterior was sand-blasted and the border joints were removed. 
After repainting the brick, the joint border material was replaced. The in­
terior was paneled and partitioned for three offices, a conference room, 
reception room, utility room and rest rooms.

The back pari of the building, which is used for storage, was built 
before 1900 and was the site of the originate Red Front Drug, a pioneer 
Cisco business that later moved a block south. Later, the building was a 
bakery and a shoe repair shop before the front part was built early in the 
century.

The firm is a partnership composed of Bobby Smith, Vic Verett and 
Ken Parker. The company also has offices in Breckenridge with Verett in 
charge. Smith and Parker have offices in Cisco. The partnership was 
formed in July, 1977, by Smith and Verett, with Parker joining them in 
March, 1980.

The firm has two computers for use in servicing client accounts, in­
cluding accounts receivable, payrolls and other records. Some 60 area 
clients are served by the computers.

Employees include Lmda Witt, office manager; Connie Donica, com­
puter operator; Beverly Smith, secretary; Susan Schaefer, accountant 
and Carla Begley, DE student.

A recent open house was held with more than 150 persons visiting the 
new offices. (Staff Photo)

NEW BUILDING-Central Masonry, Inc., is erecting the building 
shown in the above picture at 606 East 8th Street in Cisco. The structure 
will be used as a warehouse by the firm that contracts building construc­
tion work throughout the state. Work is due to be finished in a month.

Central Masonry has its offices at 307 West 11th Street. The firm 
employes some 40 men on brick, block and stone commercial projects 
over the state. Officers of the corporation are Kerry Nelms, president; 
Dan Wilks, vice president and Alva Nelms, secretary and treasurer. 
(Staff Photo)

NEW SERVICE RIG-The machine pictured above is the first oil well 
servicing rig turned out by Bandera Supply & Manufacturing Company at 
their plant in Cisco. The 98-foot telscoping mast was moved from the com­
pany’s faculty on East 21st Street last Friday to Bandera’s yard in 
AbUene where it was mounted permanently on a huge truck.

The new rig, the first of several due to be buUt here, has a hook capacity 
of 220,000 pounds. It was designed by a Canadian firm. LeRoy Kirby is 
supervisor of the Cisco facUity. Several plant employees are shown work­
ing on the rig in the picture. Bandera has some 20 employees here and 
buUds drilling rigs as weU as the new servicing equipment. (Staff Photo)

"'■i t  *

-

FHA OFFICERS for 1981-1982 held their first meeting August 27 at the 
Homemaking Lab of Cisco High School. They are (sitting) Eloise Torres, 
LesUe Robe»son, Velia Lopei, Becky Chamness and Tricia Zellman. 
Standing are Gayla Gwlnn, Diane Zarate and Trecia Reich.

; Putnam Nuwt.
* Mii~ r ' b . •

T)us has been a wonderful 
weeli. We did get nearly an 
inch of rain here. The 
temperature has not been to 
bad either. The farmers are 
plowing the grain fields. The 
dove hunters are out in 
force!

I have had all my fanaily 
home for the Blakley reunion 
Sunday, September 6. My 
family attending included 
Mr. and Mrs. Ross Finley of 
Farmington, N.M., Debbie 
Guerrero, Kim and Jenni of 
D enver, Colo., Denise 
Tefteller of Grand Junction, 
Colo., Bill and Dorothy 
Taylor of Weatherford, Gary 
and Jeannie Taylor and 
fanaily of DeRidder, l.a., 
Homer and Carolyn Taylor 
of Sweetwater, Mrs. Bobbie 
Taylor of Snyder, Mr. and 
Mrs. Tom Lemmons of 
Abilene, Brent Taylor of 
Abilene. Other Blakley 
descendants were from 
Tulsa, Okla., San Antonio, 
Houston, Amarillo, Abilene 
and Baird. 51 registered. A 
wonderful day!

We are happy to report 
that Mrs. Ollie Burnam is do­
ing fine after hip surgery 
and hopes to be home soon.

Stanley Trout of Fort 
Worth spent several days 
with the I.G. Mobleys. He en­
joyed dove hunting while 
here.

Mrs. Naonai Heyser and 
Mrs. Maggie Cook of Baird 
visited the I.G. Mobleys and 
Mrs. R.B. Taylor Sunday 
night.

Mr. and Mrs. Jammie Fry 
near Cisco honored his 
father, Doug Fry on his bir­
thday with a fish fry. Sunday 
night guests were from 
Baird, Putnam, Brownwood 
and Cisco.

Mr. and Mrs. Gerald Price 
of Baird visited Mrs. R.B. 
Taylor and Jack Ramsey 
and Maxie Solomon Wednes­
day.

Mrs. Louise Isenhower of 
Abilene, formerly of Put­
nam, had the misfortune to 
break an arm recently. She 
was confined to a hospital 
several days.

V isiting  the  M ilton 
Donaways over the weekend 
were their sons, Hubert and 
family of Odessa, and Mr. 
and Mrs. Warren Donaway 
and daughter of Brownwood.

Mrs. Marie Maxwell is still 
vacationing in Florida. She 
reports to having a grand 
time and will be home soon.

Mr. and Mrs. Calvin King 
are working at the Mary 
Guyton building. Mary is 
planning to open a china 
shop there real soon.

How quickly the weeks slip 
by. This one has been rather 
nice. And Putnam did get a 
nice shower Saturday, not 
enough to fill the cracks in 
my yard but enough to cool 
the temperatures off some. 
The farmers still busy plow­
ing grain fields. Some have 
fall gardens and are reaping 
blackeyed peas, okra and 
squash.

The musical Friday night 
was well attended, despite 
ball games and the West 
Texas Fair. We want to 
thank the musicians who 
brought the good music and 
all who attended.

Once again our communi­
ty is saddened by the death 
of one of our loved citizens, 
Mrs. Lee White, who died at 
an Eastland nursing home 
Sunday a.m. Mrs. White had 
lived in Putnam many years 
and reared a large family 
here. Our deepest sympathy 
goes to the family.

We are glad to report that 
Mrs. Ollie Burnam is doing 
fine after hip surgery at a 
Fort Worth hospital. At last 
report she was walking 
without pain and expected to 
go to the home of her 
daughter, the Bill Browns 
there to spend a week or so 
before coming home.

Ray Maxwell suffered an 
arm injury on the job last 
week and was off work 
several days.

Mrs. Naomi Heyser spent 
Monday and Tuesday with 
Mr. and Mrs. LG. Mobley 
They did quite a bit of fishing 
and caught a big one 

Debbie Guerrero and Kim 
and Jennie of Denver, Colo., 
and Denise Tefteller of 
G rand Junction , Colo., 
returned to their homes 
Monday after spending the 
weekend with their grand­
parents, Mrs. R.B. Taylor 
and Mr. and Mrs. R.D. 
Williams at Baird.

Mr. and Mrs. Doug Fry of 
Cisco went to Houston this 
week to attend funeral ser­
vices for Mr. Pope, their 
brother-in-law. Mr. Pope 
had visited Cisco and Put­
nam and had friends here.

Mr. and M rs. Babe 
Donaway of Odessa visited 
her m other, Mrs. R.C.

Speegle Sunday.
Mr. and M rs. L.C. 

Donaway of Albany visited 
his m other, the Milton 
Donaways this weekend.

Mr. and Mrs. Ross Finley 
returned to their home at 
Farmington, N.M., Saturday 
after spending a week with 
their parents, Mrs. R.B 
Taylor and Mr. and Mrs. 
R.D. Williams at Baird. Mrs. 
Williams went home with 
them for a visit.

Mr. and Mrs. Randy 
Kunze and children and Mr. 
and Mrs. Larry Wright and 
son of Fort Worth visited 
Mrs. R.B. Taylor last 
weekend and did some dove 
hunting.

Roddy R eynolds of 
Elmdale was working on the 
Guyton building yesterday. 
Mrs. Calvin King will open a 
china shop there in the near 
future.

The Women’s Study Club 
meeting scheduled to meet 
Monday, Sept. 14, was 
postponed until the following 
Monday.

Moran News
By Mrs Luka Huskey

Evelyn Hutzenbieler of 
Powell, Wyoming, is visiting 
her mother, Mrs. Alvin 
Huskey and ^n d y .

Harold Hill of Austin and 
Robert Hill and son of Cor­
pus C h ris ti spen t the 
weekend with their mother, 
Mrs. Mattie Arnold and 
sister, Mrs. Frances Green.

Jean Johnson and Mike 
and Mr. and Mrs. Rickey 
Midlock and son of Fort 
Worth spent the holidays 
with Mrs. Frances Green 
and Mr. and Mrs. Howard 
Green.

Bobby Guy Thomason of 
Hobbs, N.M., spent a few 
days with his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Guy Thomason.

Mr. and Mrs. John Cran­
dall of Houston spent the 
holidays with her brothers, 
Jerry and Buster Cottle and 
families.

Mr. and Mrs. Larry Mohon 
spent a few days in Moran.

C aro llyn  L oudder of 
California visited with her 
mother, Mrs. Carroll Loud­
der last week.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Kim­
brough of Austin visited with 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
B.G. Young last week.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Howard 
and daughter of Midland 
spent the holidays with their 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Howard and Mr. and Mrs. 
Roland Fuller.

Keith Harber of Copperas 
Cove visited with his grand­
paren ts, Mr. and Mrs. 
Charley Hagemann last 
week.

Lynn Harrell of Dallas 
visited with Mr. and Mrs. 
Hub Baughman last week.

MORAN SCHOOL NEWS 
The classes of Moran High 

School have met, elected of­
ficers for the school year and 
also elected the favorite girl 
and boy of the class.

' Officers for the Senior 
class are Melissa Whitt, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
W.C. Whitt, president; Jana 
Miller, daughter of Mr, and 
Mrs. C.L. Miller, vice presi­
dent; Wendi Jones, wife of 
Lonnie Jones, secretary- 
t re a s u re r ;  and M argie 
Stovall, daughter of Mr and 
Mrs. Fred G. Stovall Jr., 
reporter.

Class favorites for the 
year are Jana Miller and 
Melissa Whitt. There are no 
boys in the class. Members 
of the class are Wendi Jones, 
Jana Miller, Melissa Whitt, 
Sindia Martinez and Margie 
Stovall.

Officers for the Junior 
class are Katie Jackson, 
president; Sheree Boyd, vice 
p re s id e n t; D ora Cook, 
se c re ta ry -tre a su re r  and 
Darrell Gilmore, reporter. 
Sponsors for the class are 
Ava Moore, Delnita Jones 
and Tianay Rabb. Favorites 
are Katie Jackson and Dar­
rell Gilmore.

Sophomore class officers 
are Aline Cates, president; 
Tracy Bivins, vice presi­
d en t; J a n e t S im m ons, 
secretary-treasurer; Rickey

A guirre, rep o rte r. R.O. 
Smoot is the class sponsor. 
Favorites are Blanche Jen- 
tho and Rickey Aguirre.

Officers for the Freshman 
class are Holly Stewart, 
president; Rickey Hunter, 
vice president; Tiffany 
Brooks, secretary-treasurer 
and Rowena Gunn, reporter. 
Mrs. Jerry Jackson is the 
sponsor. Favorites are Holly 
Stewart and George Mark.

Alvin Huskey III of Big 
Spring visited with his 
mother, Mrs. Alvin Huskey 
Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Boyd J. 
M cKelvain and son of 
McLean, Va., spent some 
time with his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Hiram McKelvain.

W.H. McKelvain had eye 
su rg e ry  in H endricks 
Hospital last week.

Word has been received in 
Moran of the death of 
Theadore Henry at his home 
in California.

BIRTHDAY PARTY 
The Birthday Club Party 

was held on Thursday night. 
Sept. 10, at the Moran Coffee 
Shop. Those celebrating bir­
thdays were Mae Delle 
Jones, Mrs. R.T. Cockrell, 
Ezra Weir and Bill Walker. 
Those helping with the 
c e le b ra tio n  w ere Mr. 
Cockrell, Mrs. Weir, Mr. and 
Mrs. Bud Brooks, Gertrude 
Jones, Elma May Huskey, 
Mildred Smith, Mr. and Mrs. 
Dudley Keith, Mr. and Mrs. 
A.L. Hunter, Mr. and Mrs 
R.O. Smoot, Barney Midkiff 
and Mr. and Mrs. Lucion 
Brooks. A delicious baked 
ham dinner with all the trim­
mings was enjoyed by all.

Mrs. Charles Gardner of 
San Antonio spent the 
weekend with her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. J.W. Booth.

BALL GAME 
The Moran Bulldogs will 

play Paint Creek Friday 
n igh t a t  P a in t C reek. 
Everyone is urged to attend 
the game and help the 
Bulldogs beat the Paint 
Creek team.

ML'SICAL
Remember the Moran

Newt From 
The Center

By Moa Graan

1

Thanks to our many 
friends who called your 
pledges into the Jerry Lewis 
Telethon. We appreciate 
your caring enough to call. 
You can say to yourself, that, 
you have helped in the 
sea rch  for a cu re  for 
Muscular Dystrophy. Our_ 
pledge.? amounted to $671.00. 
We p laced  donation  
canisters in many of the 
stores. The money from the 
c a n is te rs  am o u n ted  to 
$43.25. A money order for 
this amount was bought and 
mailed to the Muscular 
Dystrophy Association, New 
York, N.M. 10141. The toUl 
am ount for Cisco was 
$714.25. We hoped that you 
w atched  the T ele th o n , 
because many questions 
were answered pertaining to 
the use of the money. Your 
money will be used for a wor­
thwhile cause.

The volunteers that served 
as operators for the Telethon 
were Eva Humphreys, Betty 
Hastings, Shirley Green, Mr. 
and Mrs. Voy WiUis, Mr. and 
Mrs. Ernest Reich.

Thanks so very much to all 
of you who spent many hours 
at the telephone taking 
pledges.

We had a joyous time 
When the telephones weren’t 
ringing, we sat and talked, 
sharing with each other 
about how good the Lord has 
been to us.

May God shower His bless­
ings upon you and give you 
peace

Ihursdoy,
September 17, IVBl

Country Musical to be held" 
on Friday night, Sept. 25, a t : 
the M oran C om m unity 
Center. Everyone is invited 
to attend and enjoy an even­
ing of country music. A con­
cession stand will be open.

This dependable energy 
saving Frig^daire Laundry Pair 

can handle big family-size loads 
up to a full 18 pounds.

B  Frigidaire

Washer offers dependable 
cleaning power — even lets you 
conserve hot water and detergent

• No need to waste hot vvater This 
Frigidaire Washer features a Water Level 
selector that lets you match the amount 
of water to the size of your washload

• Depend on Frigidaire to keep lint from 
settling back on your clothes with
the Lint Filter which snaps in and 
out for easy cleaning

• New horizontal cleaning action 
passes clothes under the recirculating 
filter 8 to f 4 times each cycle
The new system is equally effective 
for small average or large loads

Sec a Dcmontiralion 
TODAYI

Dryer puts big drying 
capacity within easy reach

• For easy loading and unloading the 
big oversize dcxir opening — one of 
the largest in the industry — is 
positioned a comfortable 18 inches 
off the floor

• For efficient dry'ing without hot 
spots that can damage fabrics. 
Frigidaire gently pulls air through 
your clothes

• For big-family wash loads this 
Frigidaire dryer provides gentle 
fabric care for up to 18 pounds of 
laundry

WEST TEXAS UTILITIES COMPANY

A Memfw» nl The C wntral and Smith Ww«l Sysiwitt

Qualified Factory-Trained Servicemen Offer You The Finest In AppliarKe Service

>
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COWBOYS

By Richard
After beating the St. Louis 

Cardinals 30 to 17. the Dallas 
Cowboys will go to New 
England for a Monday night 
game against the Patriots 

New England is described 
by Tex Scrhamm as an up 
and down team that may 
play very well or very poorly 
depending on the game. 
They also have about as 
many first round draft 
choices playing for them as 
any team in the N F L 

The heat was a problem in 
the St. Louis game that con­
tributed to a lot of minor in­
juries, but only two Cowboys 
are not expected to be able to 
play Monday. They are 
center Robert Shaw and 
backup defensive tackle Don 
Smerek, both of whom have 
sprained knees 

O ffensive tack le  Jim  
C(X)per will practice at and 
play center this week in 
Shaw's place, as John Fit­
zgerald the other center, is 
on the injured reserve Fit­
zgerald may be well enough 
to start working out next 
week He could be placed on 
the team in a couple of weeks 
if he IS first able to clear 
waivers without being claim­
ed by another team and if a 
player is removed from the 
team to make room for him 

Kookie Angelo King was 
recalled to take the place of 
linebacker .Mike Hegman 
who was placed on the tem­
porary injured reserve with 
a broken arm King is back­
ing up Guy Brown at 
strongside linebacker 

tYo-Bowl offensive tackle

Pat Donovan has reportedly 
agreed to salary terms for a 
new m ulti-year contract 
with the Cowboys.

With rookie free safety 
Mike Downs out of the last 
game, rookie cornerback 
Everson Walls got a lot of 
playing time but failed to 
make an interception. Walls 
had made an interception in 
each of the previous games 
with the Cowboys

These rookies, who figure 
heavily in the Cowboys 
future plans, are improving 
but still make mistakes 
sometimes that leave an op­
posing receiver in the 
opener

Cornerback Aaron Mit­
chell, who was earlier traded 
to Tampa Bay, was said by 
some to not have the speed 
that the coaches desired, to 
be having trouble learning 
the Cowboy system, and to 
have an eyesight problem 
that prevented his being able 
to properly judge distances. 
Walls may have taken his 
place in the Cowboys plans 
for the future.

The Cowboys plans for 
Walls may be to first play 
right cornerback, then to 
move to strong safety to 
replace Charlie Wates when 
he retires The cornerback 
spot might then be filled by a 
future draft selection with 
greater speed.

The heat at the St Ix)uis 
game could lead to more ear­
ly season gam es being 
played at night

r

AARP
AARP Chapter No. 2428 

will meet September 18th for 
a salad supper at 6 00 p.m.

The program w ill be on the 
"Doors of Sharing" with 
speaker Hub I,ewis Forty- 
two games will follow
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Water Gordening
By

Ted Brice, the Garden 
Editor

Probably no single feature 
add as much charm to a 
g ard en  as an aq u a tic  
display. In addition to grace 
and beauty, they are both 
tran q u iliz in g  and r e ­
juvenating qualities in water 
-  great for today’s besieged 
and battered nenes. And 
yet, now many of us have the 
beauty of water in our 
gardens. From a fountain to 
a trickling waterfall to a pool 
as large or as small as one's 
resources will allow , there is 
some sort of water display 
that will fit every situation.

P e rh ap s  the most 
desirable choice is the 
garden pool. The thoughtful­
ly planned, well placed 
aquatic pool with interesting 
plants, colorful fish and in­
triguing reflections make a 
focal point of serenity that 
adds to the grace of any 
garden, large or small. Also, 
the pool can easily have a 
fountain or waterfall incor­
porated into Its design.

Today a do-it-yourselfer 
can install a garden pool 
relatively easily and inex­
pensively by doing the ex­
cavating himself and using 
one of several methods to 
line or seal the hole.

IJNING: Instead of con­
crete, fiberglass or metal, 
which are good pool lining 
materials but which unfor- 
tunatley share the disadvan­
tages of being difficult for 
the amateur, consider one of 
the follow ing ea s ie r 
methods.

1. Sink, or partially sink, a 
child's plastic wading pool or 
a galvanized water trough 
(available at farm supply 
stores) which has been 
painted both sides with an 
epoxy paint Blue paint gives 
the illusion of deeper water; 
black plant reflects the sky 
and clouds and bright days 
but tends to look gloomy on 
dreary days.

2. Use a flexible plastic 
pool liner designed especial­
ly for this purpose Available 
in a number of shapes, sizes 
and depths, these start at 
about $10 for a 2x3 foot size.

3. Use one of the sheets of 
heavy plastic made especial­
ly for lining pools. These last 
a long time and conform to 
any shape

4. Apply several inches of 
smooth clay worked to mud- 
pie consistancy to sides and 
bottom of hole. This makes a 
natural pool.

5. Pour a special sealing 
material (for use with clay- 
type soils only) into the 
water of the newly dug and

filled pool. W'hen using this 
be sure to follow the instruc­
tions concerning any waiting 
period from date of applica­
tions to time of planting and 
introduction of fish.

Consult the yellow pages of 
the telephone directoiy for 
the nurseries which stock 
aquatic plants and supplies.

EDGING: For aesthetic 
reasons, concealing the edge 
IS often desirable with con­
crete, fiberglass, plastic or 
metallined pools. Rocks, 
stones, bricks and/or plants 
make attractive edges. The 
natural or clay-lined pool 
usually needs no concealing 
edge for appearance's sake. 
However, with any type of 
pool It’s advisable to erract 
about 12xl5-inch barrier of 
some kind, such as concrete, 
brick or wire to prevent a 
boom in the the toad or frog 
population. Toads and frogs 
seek out water in which to 
lay their eggs. These are str- 
mgly and messy looking and 
later hatch into tadpoles. 
Also, frogs have a habit of 
croacking all night long.

PLANTING: A number of 
our local wild water plants 
adapt well to culture in the 
home garden pool. Such 
species as water hyacinth, 
American lotus, the native 
Nymphaea water lilies, a r­
rowhead, pickerel weed and 
swamp ins are beautiful, of 
easy culture and grow 
naturally in our area In ad­
dition to these, numerous 
cultivated species are com­
mercially species available 
for use in almost any size 
pool.

Some water plants are 
floaters, requiring no soil in 
which to grow , such as the 
bt>autiful water hyacinth and 
floating heart.

Usually, water lilies re­
quires about 18 inches of 
water depth (24 is even bet- 
ten , full sun and still or only 
slightly moving fresh water. 
Most gardeners prefer to

plant their lilies in plastic or 
wooden (jontainers of rich 
soil ra th ir than directly in 
the mud of the of the pool. 
Since container size, plan­
ting, ntethod and depth re­
quirements vary with dif- 
feriejit species, follow the

supplier’s planting instruc­
tions. Generally, however 
water lilies like a rich soil 
and fertilizer every year. 
GOOD GARDENING UN­
TIL NEXT WEEK FROM 
THE GARDEN EDITOR, 
TED BRICE.

Constitution Week Is 
September 17th-23rd

.News from the Courthouse

J & A Borgoin Box 
701 W. Moki 
Now À Uto  ̂
Merchandise 

629-1133

BUDDY 
AARON 

INSURANCE 
629-8533 

P.O. Box 392 
108 S. Seaman 

Eastland
It.

CASH' CASH!CASH!
MONEY IN YOUR POCKETS QUICK 

Do you have an extra pickup or car around you don’t really 
need’ If you do you're loosing money every day! Don’t sell 
or trade your pickup or car away for nothing - get our offer 
before you deal! Chevrolets and Fords preferred - but will 
condiser any make or model 1954 through 1974 that’s clean 
and good running - with current license and sticker. Extra 
premium paid on small V-8's and 6 Cyl's and 2 drs. The 
cleaner they are the more we will pay! No clunkers or rusted- 
out junkers at any price please! ABSOLUTELY BY PHONE 
APPOINTMENT ONLY! Don't just drive out and find me 
gone - save gas • phone Rising Star (817) 643-1372, best early 
mornings or late evening. tl05

THOMPSON'S 
USED CARS AND 

EQUIPMENT
Phone 442-1961, Day or Night 

At 1-20 A Hwy 183 Osco
CARS

PICKUPS
1979 Che\ rolet Diesel Pickup

1966 Che\rolet du mp truck.
Good Selection of New Ford pickups and cars We will 
gise you a good price for your used cars as a trade-in. 

434 International diesel. 3 point hookup.
Massey Ferguson Track Loader 
1030 Case Diesel Farm Tractor 
434 International Diesel 
65 Massey Ferguson Diesel
35 Massey Ferguson Diesel with Front End Loader. 

PTO Shaft
^'AA Ford with Front Find Loader 

(3) 16-8 John Deere Grain Drills 
(2) 16-10 John Deere Grain Drills 

Good selection of shredders, blades, chisels, planters 
and other related farm equipment.
3 used equipment trailers in stock.

2-14 John Deer tandem discs 
COME BY AND l.(K)K AT WHAT WE HAVE

New Vehicle Registrations 
Lone Star Gas Co. Chev. 

Dump Dallas
Hailey Oil Co., Inc. Ford 

Pu. Comanche 
L.L. Bevill Chev. 4 Dr. 

Euless
Com m and .M ergener 

Energy Corp. Gen. Fit. Ft. 
Worth

Burt Mongtomgery GMC 
Pu. Eastland

Dr. Dick Hodges Chev Pu. 
Gorman

Dennis R. Stalcup Chev. 2 
Dr Houston

Mrs. Caddye Lee Claborn 
Ford 2 Dr. Cisco 

Cliff Clary Chev. 2 Dr. 
Eastland

Reich Brothers Ford Pu. 
Cisco

Weldon 0. Cunningham 
Cad. 4 Dr. Ranger 

D.E. Dossey Ford 2 Dr. 
Gorman

Jack Hubbard Ford 2 Dr. 
Rising Star

B arb ara  L. Galloway 
Chev. Pu. Wills Point 

L.T. Aberegg Chev. Pu. 
Abilene

Allene Ivey Diller Chev. 
Pu. Eastland

Cliarline Wheat Cad. 4 Dr.

Cisco
Steve Thomas Chev. 2 Dr. 

Cisco
Ruben R. Gaeta. Jr. Pont. 

2 Dr. Eastland 
Walter G. Hall Ford Pu. 

Cisco
B&H Trading Post Ford 

Pu. Eastland

Henry G. Johnson Chev. 2 
Dr Eastland

United Energex GMC Pu. 
San Antonio

Carl Steefel Yamaha MC 
San Angelo

E G. Loftin Yamaha MC 
Santo

Mary Funderburg F’ord 4 
Dr. Cross Plains

Hailey Oil of Calif. Pont. 4 
Dr Midland

Hoffman Oil Co. Ford Pu 
Eastland

E.S. Clark Ford Pu. Cisco 
Tommie Lee Ford Pu. 

Cisco
Roy Cozart Ford Pu. Cisco 
Ball Producing Co. F'ord 

Bronco Eastland

RESt f A Ì ^ ~ A |
b r e a k !

TÌBi»w«nc4 0» Traffic

On July 23,1956, Congress 
adop ted  a R esolu tion  
authorising and requesting 
that the FYesident of the 
United ^tates designate a 
period beginning September 
17 and ending September 23 
of each year as Constitution 
Week, and to isstje annually 
a proclamation in«|Ung the 
people of the United States to 
ob serv e  such week in 
schools, churches and other 
suitable places with ap­
propriate ceremonies and 
activities.

Our C o n stititu tio n , 
adopted in 1787, is the 
greatest inheritance ever 
given to a people. It is a 
sacred compact between the 
past, the present and the 
future. We owe a solemn 
debt to our forefathers to 
preserve this heritage for 
the unborn.

Americans have shown the 
greatest demonstration of

progress that the world has 
ever known because of this 
mantle of protection; this 
declaration of human rights- 
-our Constitution.

I.et’s observe September 
17-23 and review our Con­
stitution.

Charles Crawford 
Chapter, DAR 
Allye Terrell, 

Secretary

CISCO RADIATOR 
SERVICE 

207 E. 6th Street 
I Kreckenridge Hwy ) 

Cisco, Texas 
C lean ln g -ro d d in g - 

re cori ng-au to -truck- 
t ra c to r  ra d ia to rs -  
hcaters. New radiator 
and heaters. Auto gas 
tanks eleaned-rppaired. 
Open Monday thru Fri­
day, 8 a.m. to 5:30 p.m. 
Call 442-1547,
Cisco. p-5tfe

Bookkeeping ond Tax Service
Ken Porrock

205 F!ast Main. Ranger, 647-3022 
116 North Seanan, F^astland, 629-8641

INCOME TAX RETURNS 
MONTHLY AND QUARTERLY

REPORTING roR BUSINESSES
Individual. Partnership, and Corporation Tax Returns

G O O D W Ÿ E A R

Howls The Time To Buy 
AH-Season Radial Tires!

S iz e  P 15 5/8 0 R 12 b leckw a ll
P lu s $1 4 0  F E T  and old tire

S u n  T i r e . . .  R a in  T i r e . . .  
O n e  T ir e  D o e s  I t  A l l !

• 10 ,000  BITING E D G E S  for y ea r 
ro u n d  trac tio n

• G A S-SAVING d o u b le -b e lte d  
rad ia l-p ly  c o n s tru c tio n

• O N E  RADIAL you d o n  t h av e  to 
c h a n g e  w h en  th e  w e a th e r  d o e s

• THE ORIGINAL a ll-s e a s o n  radial 
tire  an d  only  from  G o o d y e a r

R A IN  C H E C K  -  II we sell out o l your si/e we Will issue you a rain check assuring tuture delivery at the advertised price

kiC Size Style P R IC E
Plus FET and old lire

P 1 8 5 /8 0 R 1 3 W hitew all $5 6  95 $ 1 9 5
P 1 9 5 /7 5 R 1 4 W hitew all $ 64 .17 $2 23
P 2 0 5 /7 5 R 1 4 W hitew all $ 66  83 $2 34
P 2 2 5 /7 5 R 1 4 W hitew all $ 7 1 .3 0 $2 6 2

\ P 1 9 5 /7 5 R 1 5 W hitew all $ 6 5 .27 $2 31
 ̂-N» J P 2 1 5 /7 5 R 1 5 W hitew all $ 7 0 .3 3 $2 6 2

P 2 3 5 /7 5 R 1 5 W hitew all $ 77 .83 $2 9 5

The TÎÊue To B u y  Tie m p o !
R lt WESTERN VEST

WITH PU RCH A SE O F  4 W RANGLERl
l i g h t  t r u c k  a n d  RV RADIALS  j

O U RJA05T  
POPULAR BLACKWALL

r

A78 13 Blackwall. plus 
St &0 Ft I ano o'fl tire

Ottier sues low priced too
Power Streak
• Trie performance 

dependapiiity ot hias pi> 
construction

• Plenty o( road contact 
tor all around traction

• "yn annoyino ti'e ttiiirnn 
f»en wrien lust starting 
out

Blackwall
Size

LOW
EVERYDAY

PRICE
FET and 
old tire

B 7 8 -1 3  
E 7 8 -1 4  
Ü 7 8 -1 4  
6  0 0 -1 5  
G 7 8 -1 5  
H 7 8  15

S 3 3  0 0
5 3 8  45  
S41 75
5 3 9  0 0  
S 4 3  05  
$ 4 5  0 0

$1 b1 
$1 75 
S2  2 8  
$1 6 9  
$2 3b 
$2 57

YOUR 
CHOICE 

BRAKE SERVICE

* 6 6
• ’.Ml 'I'.t! ,.a ' j"!'- irrviccr. 
e if  t ii ’’ceicc

R E G  S 88

2 WHEEL FRONT 0ISC m‘ ' m '■> r- "
; .i'i . and rfsui'a'r' trr ' ’ ■ ir • • In .tali 

OCA rit /rasi ,eal- and oac- l•'lnl .’.tiir. 
t). a'.n'j • ''.peci : a1i(iers anri tiyil'a.li''

• Aid fluid and r.i't ; r '̂■’ : ar CJ'jf". 
H’ • ■ r ludo rea- Ani’c-i'- 

OR
4 VWHEFL DRUM Insta': 'i'w ''"’'’9■ jrli'-.'- all Ir 'ir Itiims • instad i" A 
•* ■ • jrr asr '-. a'-, and '■ ija’ i' l'oril Afiijul 

' . • insof'.l fiyd'a'ii'C ‘y'.lein add
: 'sad test car

or '
II.ni .im:

-sti; Taf Otiar Fnds Od 3

For a limited lime only get this good-looking 
western vest absolutely free The suede-like finish 
IS buckskin tan and the vest has a full shepherd 
lininrj with Eixposed trim on both pockets The 
decorative branding patch is dark brown, with 
matching stitching Get yours tree with purchase of 
tour Wrangler Badials Or. buy two Wi angler Radials 
and pay just $10 95 S top at any participating 
Goodyear Store or dealer tor com plete details 

DON T WAIT O F F E R  E N D S  S EP T . 30th, 1981.
L.v>otivr-*r 
$4;. . . . iv r tr i  
A.T t< ify r A c C u i i n l I

. !hi •r Afiyv to buy M.ist#YfCrttd • Visa f4i inr h« • ritnt’fs CUib • Cash
Amf*rican

J u s t  S a y  ^Charge I V ____
„  ,  » M IC H  ANDC H fO IT  Tl MMS A S S H O W N  At G O O D T iA h  S f H V IC f  S l O k f  S IN ALL C O M M U N ITOun iNntrt NDf NT of ali " ron wspapi n si nvier s not AyAiiABif at STAnnt o locations

r
Everisto jim«n«z, Mgr.
Phone bi't-IbhZ 
r ---- ----- -------------

Your Local Goodyear Store
Men Thru Fri 7:30 o i. nz 6 Ith p in. Sot 7 30 o m. to 5 00 p m.

315 East Moki 
Eastland

L



Tohlequoh—
An End And A Beginning

Ihurtdoy, September 17, IV8I

GREER’S
DEPARTMENT

STORE
I N  K A S T L A N D
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25% Off
Ladies Fall C oord inate  Sets 

By K ore t-JackW in ter—Rogue

25% Off
T ransitiona l Dresses

V2 Price
1 Full Rack Ladies Blouses 

1 Full Rack C hildren’s P layw ear 
_ _ 2 j j d l ^ a c j c s  Ladies Sets & Pants

MENS ARROW SHIRT SALE
Buy Any Two Arrow Shirts

WESTERN WEAR
G reer’s Is Now Stocking W estern W ear 

In T he E astland  Store
Levis-  ------------- -------------- W rang lers
Resistol H ats---------------Am erican H ats

W rangler S h irts-----------K arn ian  Shirts
K enny Rogers Shirts-----------Niver Suits
H ag g ar W estern Suits------------------- Belts
Hush Puppy Boots—Acnie Ladies Boots

GREER’S
DEPARTMENT STORE

I N  E A S T I , A N I )
I ' i i i
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m
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By Viola M. Payne
People who travel much 

learn that many places are 
overpublicized, and their at­
tractions are mainly de. .,;n- 
ed to separate tourists from 
their money. How refreshing 
it is to find an area which is 
rich in culture, historic sites, 
and scenery, yet not over­
written, overpriced or over­
crowded. This is the situa­
tion in Tahlequah, northeast 
Oklahoma, Cherokee Coun­
ty, site of the old Cherokee 
Nation. In some ways it is a 
whole universe away from 
Eastland County, but in ac­
tual miles it is only 390.

The land around Tahle­
quah is structured in blues 
and greens in the summer­
time - greens of the large 
trees, gentle hills and valley, 
and blue of the running 
streams, lakes, and intense­
ly blue skies. And fortunate­
ly the Cherokee Indians, 
whose population  o u t­
numbers the Anglo-Saxons 
in the area, still think enough 
of their land to preserve it. 
The actual town of Tahle­
quah - the County* Seat and 
12,000 population • has many 
people of Cherokee blood, or 
those who at least have 
enough of the ancestry to be 
listed on the Cherokee 
Registry of the seven Gans. 
But visitors to the town soon 
forget previous ideas of what 
an Indian is like or even 
looks like. For the Cherokees 
are different from other 
native Americans, and even 
their wide variety of looks is 
different. Although they 
generally have dark hair and 
eyes, r"any are fair-skinned.

Their uniqueness, which ex­
tends to their concept of life 
and immortality, is baffling 
enough to make a person 
wonder if they may have a 
direct ancestral tie to An­
cient Greece or Southern 
Europe, rather than Asia 

There are a number of 
Christian Churches in Tahle­
quah. and a State University 
with tree-shaded grounds. 
And the  Chief of the 
C herokee N ation, Ross 
Swimmer, would be most 
astonishing to Television 
Producers out looking for 
"horse Indians” to put in a 
battle scene. For he is an att- 
tractive young Community 
leader who ser\ es as a Bank 
President as well as Head on 
the Tribal Council. His other
interests include work with 
the Historical Society, which 
is helping to preserve the 
Cherokee heritage from the 
past

Frying
Proud

The numerous attractions 
at Tahlequah, which would 
take days to view properly, 
include the famous “Trail Of 
Tears" historical Pageant, 
presented during the sum­
mer in an outdoor am ­
phitheatre. This is a gripping 
drama which uses colorful 
symbolism and realism to 
bring the story of the 
Cherokee Nation up to the 
tim e of the Oklahom a 
statehood. Nearby is the An­
cient Village - an authentic 
representation of how the 
Cherokees lived 300 years 
ago. Then th e re  is a 
reconstructed village from 
about 1880, an Arboretum 
and, Herb Garden, and a

The
G it c h

COLLEGE STATION- 
Frying the "proud catch” 
over an open campfire is one 
thing, but cooking it at home 
may be quite another, says 
Anette Redell Hegen, a 
seafood consumer education 
specialist.

Excitement and exhaus­
tion of the moment makes up 
for lack of cooking expertise 
at the campsite, but “doing 
the proud catch justice" at 
home naturally carries a bit 
more responsibility with it.

OLNEY SAVINGS INTRODUCES

OLNEY
SAVINGS/INVESTMENT

PLAN

HIGH YIELD. 
FLEXIBILITY. 
FLOATING RATE.

Olin's S.i\ im;> now Kill IS a lu-w w.iy lo inM -! \nii! monc\ 
I'lu'O liu’v N,i\iiig> Invi-^uiicni I’l.m It - ilc"»iv.iu ■! to \ >u 

il liiktl) \ It 111 .\nii iHvaii't viiM fan  uitbdr.iw  .im oiint' ot 
or moil' .It am  time witliiuil in nalty . it ¿ inc- \on  the rit sihiliu 
toll nil li m thcM- fhangm g tim o

I'hc inti I I >t t alc ill icrminetl il.iiK In OItu \ S.i\ mgs anti 
m.i\ I h.inge trom d.n to da\ .\ mmmuim of i> required
to mx'it \om  .iffnimt r i l l ' pl.m i> a reptitfliii'C agicem cnt 
and \iui may renew In a 'im |ilc  phon«' fall h\ mail, or in 
IH-rson

I'hf OlncN S.n in g ' ln \c 'ln if iit  I’lan i-li.icki d ’i\ guaran 
ti ed L > liiniTitm cnt ' i  t iii :tics. p io in  ted hv tiu 'tn-ngth 
,md If'o iiri't>  ot ( )liu \ .''¡n ing- and i> not niMin d In the 
F M . I C

F ot the investor looking lor 'lim t term, lugli yield anti flexi 
bihiv. the Olnev Sav mg> Inve>tment Plan i' idial

T.ilk to one of our 'av ing? coim>elor< Thev n- prepared to 
an>wct anv questions you havi We want to help 

Come see u> soon Or fall .md we ll fonie >ee vou

RANGER
SAVlNC'iS

EASTLAND
SAVINĈ tS

Olf'uy. Stymowr locktbore Ifxigupo'« Noco^o 
WuotHurford. All« CroNom Afch«'C ty Brownwood 
Bowi« ood W<Ki»o FoHt Ai»0 Sov-ngi (t«€tro,

n fo«t1<irid Sovif'Qt Fotflond
All D«vr«ioni e l  Ole«y $ 0 *̂ 09«

the specialist reminds.
For the at-home cook who 

wishes to “ live up" to the 
almost-certain expectations 
for this cooking feat, Hegen 
has a sure-fire technique: 
“Sesame Fried Fish."

“ Pan-frying is the all-time 
favorite way of preparing 
fish, and com meal is the 
traditional coating used in 
Texas," she carefully ex­
plains.

“However, pan-fried fish 
take on a new dimension 
when prepared with the 
method below suggested by 
the Texas A&M Marine Ad­
visory Service,"Hegen con­
tinues.

“Although the receipe re­
quires more ingredients than 
a fisherman normally car­
ries on his trip, it's perfect, 
remember, for the grand 
meal back home

Oh, yes, and just in case 
that touted bait or new lure 
didn't work after all. go 
fishing' in a seafood market 

to get the items you need for 
this recipe, if your culinary- 
curiosity now has the best of 
you," she says.

SESAME FRIED FISH 
2 pounds fish fillets
1*2 teaspoons salt
1 cup pancake mix 
*4 cup yellow corn meal
‘ 2 cup flour
‘ 2 teaspoon salt 
dash pepper 
1*2 cups milk
1 jar '2*4 oz. 1 sesame seeds

Sprinkle fish with salt and 
pepper.

Combine pancake mix, 
com meal, salt and pepper

.Add milk and stir until 
blended

Stir in sesame seeds
Roll fish in flour and dip in 

hatter
Place in single layer in fry 

pan with 1/8” hot oil.
Cook two t" tl r» e inmijtes. 

turn and cook other .sidt- -  nr 
deep fry

Drain “h absorbent paia r 
Keep waiin. Make.s six serv- 
inga. _________

See M H Peirv f'.r 
D IS A B lI.irV  IN­

SURANCE 
«29-IS86 nr 6rMt»9& 

104 N. laiinar-l astland

i

When the Europeans came 
to America the Cherokees 
were an enlightened people 
with a Government resembl­
ing what we live under to­
day. Their native religion 
and culture, in which they 
worshiped a Supreme Being, 
was not incompatible with 
Christianity. So they began 
to accept this new religion as 
soon as Missionaries came 
and lived among them liCla 
l.atch Lloyd's book ' ‘If The 
Chief Vann House Could 
Speak" tells of some of these

See M.H. Perry for 
EDUCATIONAL 

INSURANCE 
629-1566 or 629-1095 

104 N. I,amar-Eastland

in

large Cherokee National 
Museum, constructed on the 
historic site of the old 
Cherokee Female Seminary, 
which burned in 1887. Three 
brick columns remaining 
from the old structure are 
surrounded by a reflecting 
pool which continues mto the 
lobby of the .Museum. Ex­
hibits in this magnificent 
building include ancient ar­
tifacts of the Cherokees. as 
well as material relating to 
the Cherokee history of the 
present. In the Tribal Arts 
and Crafts Center, located 
on a highway leading from 
the south mto Tahlequah. 
there are many interesting 
examples of modern crafts 
by regional citizens.

Other interesting places in 
the area are the Cherokee 
Courthouse, the Murrell 
Home, the site where the 
Chief Vann House was 
re b u ilt, the C houteau 
Memorial, Sequoyah State 
Park, and Ft. Gibson.

The Cherokee paintmgs m 
the Museum and Arts Center 
and even in buildings around 
town are stunning examples 
of native American art at its 
best - ranking right with the 
Navajo. It is a totally dif­
ferent kind of art - no Euro­
pean background here! It is 
a type of impressionist, truly 
holistic art, in which man, 
nature and the supernatural 
are linked together. And a 
dark thread of tragedy, just 
as in the Cherokee thought 
patterns, run through the 
colors of many of the pic­
tures. Many depict the 
"Trail of Tears", in which 
the Cherokees were march­
ed from their old homeland 
in Georgia to the Tahlequah 
area.

S ix teen  thousand  
Cherokees began this trip - 
four thousand died on the 
way. Many had scattered, 
before this disaster of the 
1830's, into the Carolinas, 
Tennessee and Arkansas. It 
is estimated that 100,000 peo­
ple with some Cherokee 
blood live in the United 
States today - with about half 
of them in Oklahoma.

Since time immemorial 
human beings have been 
herding each other around 
for purposes of removal. But 
this part of man’s inhumani­
ty to man seems so alien, so 
foreign to American ideals 
that it comes as a shock to 
realize that it happened here 
too.

e a rly  M issio n a ries  
Georgia.

The Cherokees, who claim­
ed large tracts of land in the 
Southeast part of the United 
S ta te s , helped  the 
Americans win the war of 
1812 against the British. 
They still feel betrayed by 
President Andrew Jackson 
for the loss of their homes 
across Georgia and up into 
Virginia. But they were pro­
mised territory for another 
Nation in Oklahoma, and 
picked the site at Tahlequah 
for its headquarters

Their days in Tahlequah, 
in which they attempted to 
rebuild their Nation, have 
been in te re s tin g  and 
som etim es tra g ic .
Cherokees became involved 
in the Civil War, with divided 
loyalties. There were many 
struggles to hold their small 
country together during a 
time of American expansion 
on the frontier Finally the 
Cherokees tor some of them) 
decided to accept Oklahoma 
statehood in 1906.

In 1918 a Cherokee Elder, 
Redbird Smith, stated: “We 
must now get together as a 
race and render our con­
tribution to mankind.”

The contributions of the 
Cherokee have been amas- 
ing, both in war and peace. 
Will Rogers is only one of the 
well-known Americana with 
Cherokee blood - there are 
numerous others. There are 
many University graduates 
among the people now, and 
others who are excellent 
fa rm ers, ranchers, and 
craftsmen.

The Cherokees have had a 
lot going for them during 
their push upward from 
n ea r-e x tin c tio n  • good 
hum or, p a tie n c e , p e r ­
sistance, courage, and adap­
tability. This adaptability 
has led them to learn from 
others and accept change, 
while winnowing out all that 
is best in their past culture.

The legend of the Phoenix - 
the bird which rises from the 
ashes of death and defeat • is 
depicted with a haunting 
dance which concludes each 
performance of the “Trail of 
Tears" in the amphitheatre. 
This becomes a portrayal of 
the essence of the Cherokee 
spirit, which has refused to 
die. It too becomes a lesson 
which is useful to all of us • 
w hether we a re  ea rly  
Americans or later ones.

Take A\\feekend 
Family Vacation

(w ilh o u i §'**'*■ f» -)-

U va Inn a  indM d AM lan* • Inn Door R«K>n 
al Forruly Fun oil y«ar longr Wilfun tha 0iani 
b ao u iitu lly  lo n d tro p a d  o iriu m  c lim o i*  
cxmiroUad lor lolaJ comlon a  world ai ocivitv  
.jjo ld i batora your ayat Tha daiinciiva Uand ol 
a luBviry noM <vtd raton lading oOan you lha baa
ol avarylfung m W aa TaioB wshoui going k ir

Ha arid Han StairxB 
PUding Graar. 
E u fc a a  Arao 
Hydro-Spa Whirlpool

Childiam  Pkjy Arao 
<iamm Room 
TVo RaMourona 
UriK^ja Cockioil 
txnjnga

Lu iury Guaa Room 
and Sudai with 
Spanai Appomnnana 
livdoor OKI Outdoor 
tooa
TWo All waathar 
Sunora Tanna Coura

/̂IOTÔ  MOTFL

Hwy AO W««f AXiümrw T«B(js 9(5^96  
I Of P««Hfvcfr>or» CaU i fVX) 44fit

OfERSTOClED
BÜILDII« ■ATBR1AL8 

AVAILABLE
AT W10LB8ALB PR1CB8!

liU rU r P i i i t - I  ••l«rt 
SifalliBlt ■•rmtl •!*•- *7** lOW *t'*
”#★ 11111 O T III ITIH8 ìl io  

AfAILABLI AT BIB SA flIB B -
★  Ix ttrU r Ab4 IittrlBr D««ri

# la r iv tra
★  iiBaBftaaal Bamkar—SX4 2X1 IXI 

|# lla a tr lta l Sappliai #üaéarplBnlag
★ Plaakiog loppllai Aai nx tarai 

#Ply««oi— and W*
★  larBkaard Bidlni *  Faiti 

★  Ititi lld ia i and Batllng
★  Hath Hart

Opal 7:00 to i:S0 Haaday-Tkiridaf 
HOIBAI BÜILD1IB COBP. 

g Iwy 00 Barth Baitlaad, Taxai 7m/

Morgin Building Corp. nnads a faw 
raally good paople in kay Jobs. Wa build 
buildings in a manufacturing onvironmnnt.

Wo bava an all-woathar ficiiity and 
full timo work.

Wo naad poopio in tha following nrnas:
★  Assembly linn workers 

w Linars
w Plumbars

-A-Elacfricians
We offer E paid holidays, paid vacations, 
and group Insuranco. Apply In person, 

Morgan Building Corp.
Hwy 69 North 

Enstimd, Taxis 
5.O.E.



Leomed Judges Moke Wise Low
by

W.B. AUen
Dr. AUen Is Associate Pro­
fessor of PoUtical Science at 

Harvey Mudd CoUege 
(c) PubUc Research, Syn­

dicated, 19S1
Were we to ask for the ap­

pointment of a Solomon to 
the bench of the Supreme 
Court, our problems would 
only have just begun. For 
w here would we find 
Solomons to people our 
courts’ There does not seem 
to be any university which 
specializes in Solomonic 
wisdom And even if there 
were, we have become so 
acustomed to thinking of 
judges as merely lawyers by 
another name that it is near­
ly unpossible for the or­
dinary ciUzen to conveive 
that qualification a judge 
needs beyond a license to 
practice law

This identification of law 
schools, lawyers, and judges 
has come to be firmly fixed 
m the popular imagination 
only since the start of the 
twentieth century Before 
then judges were usually 
lawyers, but their training 
often was much broader and, 
interestingly, they were 
chosen as judges rather for 
their knowledge of the law

V <W V

than for being laywers. As it 
happened, however, few 
there were with knowledge 
of the law who were not 
lawyers. In that simpler 
time, it was easy to make the 
mistake that people were be­
ing chosen as judges because 
they were lawyers rather 
than for any more weighty 
reason

The founders defended the 
e s tab lish m en t of the 
Supreme Court and the prac­
tice of judicial review as an 
institution designed to cap­
ture for the benefit of free 
government the wisdom of 
the learned. They often 
spoke and wrote of the 
‘learned professions” as 

standing apart from the nor­
mal social classes and able 
to arbitrate the divisions of 
con tend ing  fac tio n s, 
Solomon-like In Congress, 
therefore, it was to be the 
members from the ‘‘learned 
professions" who could im­
partially  judge between 
m an u fa c tu rin g  and 
agricultural classes In 1789, 
though, members of the 
‘‘learned professions” were 
a lm o st exc lusive ly  
clergym en and lawyers, 
with a smattering of pro­
fessors

' w w

OFFICE SPACE 
FOR RENT OR PURCHASE

116 N. Seomon, Eastlond 
Coll 629-8641 
or 647-3022

Secretarial i  Teiepliofie Answering 
Service Available

■kWiriti

MRS. ROSE I HV

KrwOrr 4 Ad\u«K TrlU PmI, PrneNt. and I'nturr 
Who Will hrip you wh«*rr all oChers have failed Are you sufferuv:. are 

yiMi s** A, do you not'd help’’ this Dtvme Painust show the way to Sue* 
CVX.S ervd Mapptnrvs Are ytm separated from Ihr one you kne' Has 
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We see, then, how easiy 
the first generations of 
Americans may have come 
to depend upon lawyers for 
learned judgement of the 
law What is more difficult to 
see is that they saw in these 
lawyers not mere advocates 
who practiced the art of 
manipulating the law. They 
saw, ra th e r, gentlem en 
schooled in the arts of free 
government, habituated to 
seek the common good 
through the processes based 
on the consent of the govern­
ed. mindful of the claims of 
justice not m the form of 
legal pleas but rather in the 
form of a sound constitution, 
and able to find in the ex­
pression of public opinion the 
high ground of the rule of 
law. The learned judge was 
not expected to ‘̂ decide in 
the last instance,’’- th a t  
privilege belongs to the 
Court, not the judge-but 
ra th e r ,  like Solomon 
himself, to strike upon those 
decisive mans which would 
preserve for self-governing 
freemen the capacity to 
judge rightly themselves.

It would be an understate­
ment to say that modem law 
schools do not prepare 
lawyers to assume this role. 
They cannot do so, for their 
very goal contradicts this 
role. They instruct their 
students in the arts of 
employing the law as a 
means to obtain one's ends 
rather than a source of 
guidance for forming one’s 
ends in accord with justice. 
(For most lawyers, the 
justice which eventuates 
from our legal processes is a 
m ysterious presence or 
spirit which is entirely inex­
plicable. ) The law in modem 
law schools is a useful instru­
ment; it IS not a tutor.

If we will have Solomons 
as judges, they may yet be 
lawyers, but their legal 
training will not have made 
them Solomons This is to say 
nothing more than every 
lawyer will admit. Besides, 
it is no longer the case that 
persons learned in the law- 
are necessarily lawyers. The 
education revolution in 
America has so greatly 
diversifed the ‘ learned pro­
fessions” that we often find 
knowledge of the law in other 
fields of endeavor, as, for ex­
ample, in the social sciences. 
Here, to, however, we are 
hard pressed to find the 
sp ec ific  tra in in g  of 
Solomons.

All is not lost, however. If 
our first justices were in any 
way Solomons, and not on 
account of having been 
lawyers, we can perhaps 
take guidance from such 
training as they did have. In 
this regard, nothing stands 
out in sharper relief than 
their intimate involvement 
in democratic political pro­
cesses, above all having ac­
tually held elective offices 
and participated with their 
fellow citizens in the prac­
tice of law-making.

This IS certainly the cas 
eith the outstanding exam­
ple. Chief Justice John .Mai- 
shall, whose outstanding 
political career included 
participation in the debate 
on the formation of the Con-
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stitu tlon . M arshall was 
above all a statesman nur­
tu red  and m atu red  in 
political and partys wars. 
This, more than legal study, 
made him a great Chief 
Justice. Nor was he a mere 
party infantryman, receiv­
ing, as the reward for loyalty 
and bravery, custody of his 
people’s destiny in form of a 
high judgeship. The latter 
description better fits Roger 
B. Taney, whose Dred Scott 
decision, as much as any one 
factor, condemened his peo­
ple to the fratricide of Civil 
War.

Marshall, rather, was a 
captain in the field. In him 
knowledge of the law meant 
deep learning and deep 
responsibility to public opi­
nion. Justice Story, again, 
while a lesser political 
luminary, advanced to the 
Court from the U S. House of 
Representatives. It may be 
said, in sum, that insasmuch 
as the Supreme Court’s task 
in many and perhaps most 
respects bears a stronger 
resemblance to the supreme 
legislative task than to the 
o rd in a ry  ta sk s  of 
jurisprudence, the school for 
justices IS more fittingly the 
democratic political process 
than even the practice of 
law.

This essay is not mean to 
boost the candidacies of Jim­

my Carter, Jerry Ford, or, 
Heaven Forbid, Richard 
Nixon for the vacancy on the 
Court which P res id en t 
Reagan now has to fill. 
Nevertheless, those were In 
some repsects tlie glory days 
of our republic when former 
presidents could serve pro­
fitably as Congressman and 
Chief Justice, rather than as 
useless appendages. In those 
days, the perspective of the 
office-holder as public ser­
vant kept open the door to 
useful service, and did not 
nurture the idle pretense 
that, having held the highest 
office on earth, there re­
mained nothing for one to do 
but to write fables. Every 
elected official, past and pre­
sent, ought to be regarded as 
a suitable candidate for the 
Supreme Court, provided he 
unite in his person the unique 
qualities we seek in this 
Solomon.

Accordingly, we can ad­
vise our President to seek for 
Solomons to appoint to the 
Court among those learned 
b re th e re n , s teep ed  in 
knowledge of the law and the 
claims of a just conditional 
order, who have already- 
revealed their judiciousness 
amidst the trials and temp­
tations which beset our 
representatives. These are 
they who, in addition to 
knowledge of the law, have 
acquired a knowledge of the 
poeple. They know not only 
the law, but the lawmakers. 
But give us a Solomon, and 
we will make wise law.

C o n g r e s s m a n

C h a rle s  W .
Stenholm

Congressional Comment
vy A SH lX .rO N , D.C . —

Most of US are familiar ssiih 
the term, "roh Peter to pay 
Paul.” We also kno», when 
dealing with our personal 
budgets, that the time in­
variably comes when that ploy 
no longer works. So it is with 
the Federal budget.

It is no secret that for years, 
politicians on both sides of the 
aisle — both Democrats and 
Republicans — have taken 
“ the easy way out” and 
responded to a variety of social 
ills hy approving more and 
more money to create pro­
grams to deal with those prob­
lems Many of those programs 
were very popular with their 
constituencies and, so long as 
no one seriously complained 
(usually serious complaints are 
defined as \ ores during election 
time), business went along as 
usual

Business as usual meant 
“ ro b b in g ’’ the Defense 
budget. for example, to 
finance domestic programs. In 
1970 defen.se's share of federal 
expenditures was 40 percent. .A 
steady decline in that share 
since then has finally dropped 
defense spending to only 20 
percent of the total budget in 
1980 With our new emphasis 
on defense (even with some 
cuts) we will be spending over 
.fO percent by 1984

W e are currently examining 
the Defense budget for areas 
where spending can be tight­
ened and, in some cases, cut 
outright. There is no area of 
federal spending that cannot 
stand close examination. 
Defense is no exception 1 am 
confident, that cuts can be 
made in non-essential areas — 
the fat that is present in every 
federal budget — s«hile we are 
concurrently concentrating on 
strengthening our overall 
defense '-muscle''

Wi have ncAv reached the 
point when even the liberals 
admit that there is no more 
room for such spending shifts 
awav from national defense. 
The question now before Con- 
grevs IS how can we best im­
prove our defense posture at 
the least c o m  to the budget. 
There d no question, however, 
that improvements have to be 
made

The Social Security Pro­
gram grew by leaps and bounds 
during the same time frame. As 
long as the voting public did 
not complain. Congress in­
creased payroll contributions 
to Social Security from 3 per­
cent at the end ol W orld W ar 
11. to the present 13 percent 
and benefits increased accord­
ingly

Such increases are no 
longer “ politically easy” , 
however Workers now ques­
tion the stability of the pro­
gram and I t  lakes no economic 
genius to recogni/e that revi­
sions to the Social Security 
Program arc in order "Easy 
revisions?" No. I can think of 
no easv answers to the current 
SvKial Security dilemma I can

only offer my personal 
assurances to those dependent 
on Social Security that the pro­
gram will continue, but further 
increases in benefits will be of 
less magnitude.

The final ploy that has been 
common in the past is the use 
of deficit spending to continue 
the “ business as usual” spend­
ing attitude in Congress. The 
federal government operated 
as a deficit during 19 of the 
past 20 years and, despite our 
best efforts to date during the 
current Session, deficit spend­
ing has not yet been 
eliminated. Important steps 
have been made toward lessen­
ing the deficit that have had the 
country economically bogged 
down. More will be necessary 
because of high interest rales. 
There is much concern today, 
but all skeptics need to be 
reminded the new plan does 
not begin until October I.

I did not expect to see im­
mediate results following the 
votes on the budget and tax 
plans this summer. We have 
made an important beginning, 
but our task is very difficult 
and our job is far from fin­
ished.

See M.H. Perry For 
CANCER INSURANCE 

629-1566 or 629-1095 
104 N. Lamar-Eastland

Past History Indicates 
We've Only Just Begun
If you th ink  the 

Ijegislature has had difficul­
ty in reapportionment, a look 
at past history may indicate 
that we’ve only just begun.

The Texas Constitution 
has always required periodic 
reapportiorunent based upon 
sut»tantially equal popula­
tion; although over the 
years, it has been sometimes 
less periodic and sometimes 
less substantially equal in 
population.

The present State Con­
stitution adopted in 1876 re­
quired the Texas I.«gislature 
to reapportion after each 
federal decennial census. 
This g en e ra lly  went 
smoothly from 1881 through 
1921. Then in 1931, the 
Legislature found itself 
unable to agree on the 
red raw in g  of ex is tin g  
legislative districts. The 
I^egislature found that to 
base the districts on substan­
tially  equal population, 
many of the districts would 
have to be combined and 
some incumbents would be 
paired. So the legislature 
agreed to do nothing. The 
Legislature did not redistrict 
the House nor Senate in 1931 
or 1941. New lines were not 
drawn until 1951.

Congressional redistric­
ting found sim ila r dif­
ficulties. The Legislature 
failed to pass any congres­
sional redistricting plan bet­
ween 1917 and 1933. The 
measure enacted in 1933 re­
mained in effect until 1957, 
when only one significant 
change was made in the 1957 
plan was struck down by a 
1963 lawsuit. The court try­
ing the case found the ratio 
between the districts of ex­
cessive population and 
lowest population to be 4.4 to 
1.

Subsequently, in the mid 
and la te  1960’s, the 
L e g is la tu re  a c te d  to 
e lim in a te  the g ross 
disparities in population and 
redraw the Congressional, 
State Senate and State House 
plans and did pass plans with 
less population variances.

Still, the growth and shift 
in location of the population 
evidenced by the 1970 census 
re q u ired  the  T exas 
I/egislature to redraw the 
House, Senatorial and Con­
gressional lines in 1971. The 
only plan that got out was the 
State house. The Congres­
sional and State Senate lines

remained unchanged. ’The 
Governor immediately call­
ed a Special Session and 
w ithin th ree  days the 
Legislature had passed a 
Congressional plan.

The Senatorial rediatric- 
ting, following the dictates of 
the State Constitution, was 
referred to the Redistricting 
Board, and that Board pass­
ed a plan on October 15,1971.

'The Board also wound up 
unwillingly drawing the 
State House boundary lines. 
The House plan passed by 
the Legislature was declared 
unconstitutional by the State 
Supreme Court as it failed to 
adhere cloaely enough to the 
requirement for preserving 
county boundaries (the same 
conclusion the State District 
Court reached on the 1981 
House plan).

The plot thickened as the 
Redistricting Board refused 
to accept the responsibility 
of redrawing the House 
lines. A lawsuit was filed by 
a State Senator in the Texas 
Supreme Court to require 
the Board to draw the House 
lines. The Supreme Court so 
ordered, and a House plan 
was drawn by the Board.

Now, I would hope to be 
able to say that the job was 
done and everyone lived hap­
pily ever after. Not so.

The Congressional Plan 
was challenged in Federal 
Court in 1971. The court 
struck down the plan as 
deviating too greatly in 
population and adopted an

baptam bar 17, 1V81
alternative plan. The State 
appealed, and the Supreme 
Court stayed the lower 
court’s plan and the 1972 
elections were held under 
the original Legislative plan. 
Subsequently, the Supreme 
C ourt d e c la re d  the 
Legislative plan unconstitu­
tional and the case was 
remanded to the lower court 
where a plan was adopted. 
Subsequent Congressional 
elections were held under 
this plan.

The Senatorial and House 
plans were also challenged 
In the courts. While the 
Senate plan was upheld, cer­
tain parts of the House plan 
were overturned. Litigation 
continued until 1975 when 
combined efforts of the 
courts and Legislature had 
finally drawn plans that 
were constitutional.

This phenomena of dif­
ficulties in reapportionment 
has not been peculiar to 
Texas. All or part of the 
State Legislative Districts in 
use in 1978 in twenty states 
were the products of court- 
ordered redistricting plans. 
Two states to 1978 were still 
involved in 'litigation over 
plans redrawing the lines 
after the 1970 census.

Hopefully, plans will be 
drawn by the Board that will 
not be challenged, but the 
probabilities are such that 
when a plan is drawn, litiga­
tion w ill follow . The 
possibility remains that the 
reapportionment efforts will 
be mired in the courts and 
the 1982 elections will be con­
ducted using the old boun­
daries.
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WANTED All kinds ot mer­
chandise for consignment 
auction to be held the 2nd 
and 4th Thursday nights of 
each month at Olden Gym. 
Call 653-2259. Starting time is 
7;30p.m. TC

GREENWOOD for sale. 
Split, delivered and stacked. 
Mesquite $60., Oak $65. Call 
629-2731 any tim e and 
629-1360, 8 to 5 weekdays. 
T-77

SERVICE

WE CARE ABOUT 
YOUR HEALT»^

S pecia liz ing  in 
p h y sica l a ilm c .iis  
related to the spine and 
nervous system.

Dr. Geo. G. McPaul 
Chiropractor 

Telephone 647-3821 
454 Pine Street Ranger 

Please Clip & Save
TC

HOLLIS WILLIAMS 
CONSTRUCTION

Residential and commeicial. 
Remodeling, add-ons, new 
homes, custom cabinets, con-

leveling, painting barns and ........................................................  442.1933, Cisco p-58tfc
SPECIAL s a l e : Beautiful 
Stationery in nuiny different 
colors. U rge package on

WA.NT TO BUY: Used fur­
niture. S&K Sales, 515 E. 
M ain, E as tlan d . Call 
629-2241 T-105

WANT TO BUY; Used furniture. 
SAK Sales, 515 E . M a n , 
Eastland. Call 629 8382 or 
6 2 9 2 2 4 1. TC

WORK WANTED House

hours - inside and out.
ETtEE EÜTIMATHS 

Pho. 817-643-3027 day

FOR SALE: Three used gas 
air conditioners and on" 
ed gas furnace. As is, where 
is. $450 00 for all four pieces. 
See a t the E a s tla n d  
Telegram 629-1707. tf

FOR SALE: 1979 Cad. coupe 
Deville, 33,000 miles, one 
owner, extra clean and load­
ed. Call 629A421. T-77

JOY 185 CFM air com­
pressor, has John Deere 
diesel engine, like new 
$9,000.00. Call 817-6824851. 
T-76

FOR SALE: 1980 Ford 
L a r ia t S uper-cab  
pickup, red and white, 
11,000 mUes.

1969 Ford
88,000 c O ^
dable a *  clean.

Depen-

Bay Mare, 
horse.

good stock

Cedar Stays 
Contact: Jr  Chambers 

817-259-3453 
Williams Vicinity' 

36-ltc

or

......... .............. sale for $2 98 and small
package for $1.98. See at the

WANT LAND
Call 629-2401; 
629-2507. T-76

TO LEASE 
629-2446 or

IMnOTMENT
HOUSEWIVFix NEEDE:D: 
For light construction work.
In an all weather facility. 
Hours 9:00 a.m. to 2:30 p.m. 
Mon. thru E'riday. Starting 
rate at $3.50 per hour; with 
raise at end of 30 days. Apply 
at Morgan Buildings, Hwy 69 
North Eastland. An Equal 
Opportunity Employer. TNF

Cisco Nursing Center is now 
taking applications for 7-3 
LVN's and nurses aides for 
all shifts. Starting salary for 
LVN’s is $5 00 an hour with 
evaluation for raises in 90 
days. C ontact F ran ces 
Terry. 442-1471, Cisco. TNE'

HF.IJ* NE:EDED no  ex­
perience necessary  call 
REM D rilling  629-1032 
Eastland. Starting pay $4.00 
per hour. Tnf

WE ARE NOW hiring  
machine operators. Starting 
Salary  $3.50. Excellent 
benefits, paid vacation, 
group in su ran c e , paid 
holidays. Apply in person at 
Russell Newman Mfg. Co. of 
1-20, Cisco, from 8:00 to 4:30 
Mon thru Fri. TNF'
HELP* w a n ted“
wanted to build oil field 
tanks. Top wages. Call (817) 
647-1462.

HELP WANTED: Once 
every two weeks general 
house cleaning wanted.

Eastland Telegram office 
110 W. Commerce. Lovely 
Christmas FTesents!

ON SALE NOW at the 
Eastland Telegram is all 
IJving Bibles. One dollar off 
regular price. Buy now at 
this low price for Christmas 
presents. See at 110 W. Com­
merce. Tnf

‘78 DATSUN KING CAB PU 
New motor, has less than 500 
miles on it, 44,458 total miles. 
Priced $1100 below retail at 
$3500. 2 miles south of Rising 
S ta r. G eorge Webb 
817-643-6144. 34-ltc

FOR SALE: 1980 Chevrolet, 
^28 with t-top and electric 
windows call 629-1726 or

Residential and commer­
cial. Remodeling, ad-ons, 
concrete work, new homes, 
electrical work, etc. Mickey 
Williams 652-2235. TC

SALE everyday at OI-DEN 
GENERAL STORE in 
Olden, Texas. ‘Little bit of 
everything.’ Groceries, Fur­
niture, Jewelry, Knives, 
Watches, Mexican Imports, 
Books, Tools, Toys and lots 
of misc. items. Cheapest 
store in this area. We buy us­
ed furniture, appliances, and 
old coins. Call 653-2259. TC

EASTLAND County 
B uilding E x p erien ced  
remodeling, painting, insula­
tion, storm windows. All tyes 
of remodeling and new con­
struction. Guaranteed work 
at reasonable rates. 442-2406. 
Evenings 629-2804. TNF
WESTERN MATTRESS

Complete Remodeling 
C o n cre te -E lec trica l- 

Roofing
P a t io s -D r lv e w a y s -  

Ruom Additions 
S i d i n g  - W i n d o w  s- 

Plumbing 
Chain Link Fence 
No job to large for 

A-1 Sales 
215 S. Walnut 

629-2102 Anytime

6291495. Tnf  ̂  ̂ Sales and Service Complete
.............................................. bedding. New, Exchange,
FOR SALE; 'Antique Glass and 
Furniture’ and other collectables. 
’We Buy EsUtes.’ The House of 
Antiques moved to 908 So. 
Bassett. Eastland. Texas open

Renovate. Call Lois Measell 
at 6292703 or 442-9995. TC

NOW is the time to clean that
every day. T-105 dirty chimney. Get ready for
******••••••»•*••••••**•• those cool fall evenings. (^11

FOR SALE: Three ton cen­
tral air, good condition, 
$350.00. Call 442-1229 after 
noon or come by 303 W. 3rd. 
in Cisco. t n f

FOR SALE: 1973 Ford 
Mustang, good condition. 
Call: daytime 629-8568 or 
after 5:00 629-8063. Tnf

6392307. T-77

jiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiHiiiiiiiinnt
NOTICE; Oolie Johnson Contrac T 
tor Remodeling, Concrete, Elec j 
trical. Plumbing, Fencing, Boat; 
Dock, House Leveling. Call' 
647-3682 or 647-3679. t c 
niiiiiiituiiiKiiiimMiiiiMHiiir.

References. 6292413. TNF 442.2709

FOR RENT: furnished or 
unfurnished apts. At Royal 
Oaks apartments, 1304 Royal 
U ne, Cisco. Pho. 442-3232 or

EASTLAND /  
COUNTY

SUPER
SOLE"
RED

WINGS
LONG-W EARING 
SU PER-TO U G H  
U RETH A N E S O L E S

12" Pecos 
style Oil- 

Unnwi leather

#2221

8" lull gram 
oiitanneO 

leather

*2223

Red
• G re e n  
Western Store] 

in Ranger
Greer's

D E A L ER
in Eastland

CITY OF CISCO, TEXAS 
REQUEST FOR BIDS 

The City of Cisco is accep­
ting bids for the Icc.^e of the 
following lots along the Lake 
Cisco Shoreline;

North Shore: 1. Lot 31; 2. 
Lot 214

South Shore: 1. Lot 25, 
Block 1: 2. Lot 8, Block 2; 3. 
South 4  of Lot 6 and North 4  
of Lot 7, Block BB 

All lots are currently va­
cant and ready for use. It 
will be the lessee’s respon­
sibility to inspect any lot 
prior to bidding. All leases 
are for a five (5) year period. 
The City has established a 
minimum lot lease bid at 
$1(».00 per year; along with 
a minimum right-to-bid, one­
time payment of $150.00. The 
lease agreement may be in­
spected at City Hall during 
normal working hours.

All bids should be sealed 
and marked as "Bid-Lake 
U t” on the envelope. Bids 
should be addressed to the 
City Secretary, P.O. Box 110, 
Cisco, Texas 76437 and 
presented no later than 5:00 
p.m., October 27, 1981. All 
bids will be opened and 
awarded at the City Council 
meeting on Tuesday, Oc­
tober 27,1981, at 7:00 p.m. at 
City Hall, 116 West 7th 
Street.

The City reserves the right 
to refuse any or ""  bids Anv 
questions regarding the 
Lake Cisco lots should be 
d irec ted  to the City 
Manager, 817-442-2111. p-75

Annuol Petrae 
Reunion H| Held 
At Country Club

1 he annual Petree reunion 
was held at the Cisco Coun­
try Club on September 29 
and 30.

Those attending from out 
of town were Joe C. Barton, 
Carroll Barton, Mr. and Mrs. 
Edw in P e t r e t  from  
Gatesville; Mr. and Mrs. 
Toby Sims of Houston; Mr. 
and Mrs. Royce Kinard, 
Danny Nichols, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bill Carlton, Debbie Poe, 
Kitty and Kandance, all of 
O dessa; Mr. and Mrs. 
Charles Petree, Mr. and 
M rs. Roy P e tre e  and 
Kim berly of P ittsbu rg ; 
Sonya, Flanda, Ron, Robbie 
and Darla May of Carbon; 
Mrs. Larry Robertson and 
David, Mr. and Mrs. Rex 
Morgan, Kay and Gregg 
Warren, Patsy Castleberry, 
Christine and Jeremy, Mr. 
and Mrs. John Hull and

E o n o N 'T
s t u d io ;

Quolity-Snopshots 
, Cameras ft Supplies ̂  
r mms AH Shes 

And Of Course 
Fine Photography 
Is Our Business

Cotton's 
Studio

<442-2565 JOO W. M i!

Monte, Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Beeman and Julie, Oscar 
and Ellen Petree, Bob and 
Jan Beeman, Mr. and Mrs. 
Tony Petree, Mr. and Mrs. 
Ronnie Johnwn and Shane, 
Joey and Julie Petree, Lin­
da, Tammy and Teresa 
Taylor, Joe and Sandy 
Petree and Robyn and Jenny 
Petree, Jewel Petree, Billy 
and Verna Casey.

Those from Cisco atten­
ding were Mrs. Joe Petree, 
May Dell Petree, Mr. and 
Mrs. Burl P e tree  and 
Johnathan, Dale Petree, 
Betty and Staci Jones, Mr. 
and Mrs. Randy Johnson and 
Chris, Mr. and Mrs. Joe Lee 
Petree and Mark, Mr. and 
Mrs. Bob Johnson.

I  Read the classifieds I

I In B rie f' ^
Mr. and Mrs. Coy Dial hao 

as their weekend guests, Mr. 
and Mrs. Jam es Donald 
from Laurel, Miss.

Mr. Donald works for an 
Oil Tool Co. Mrs. Donald and 
Mrs. Dial were nurses in 
New Iberia, Louisiana, for^ 
Dr. Tom Bush.

Mrs. Donald now works for 
the State of M ississi(^ in the 
C ripp led  C h ild ren ’s 
Hospital.

The Donalds also visited 
Mr. and Mrs. R.L. Wyatt.

your 
maitatplacej

N tH V i DEAFNESS"
Con Be Helped

Free tlecfronic Hearing te st 
CISCO  AMERICAN LEGION HALL

Thursday, Septem ber 17, 1981
Texas State Hearing A id  Center 

4201 A  No. 1st 
Abilene, Texas 79603

PLUMBING
SpAcid Rotes For Those On Fixed Incoines

■ Need a New Roof?
■ All Types
■ We Specialize in Hot Toppinjs
2 compositions shingles
2 ALL Work Guaranteed
S Paul Williams Roofing Co.
S (817) 639-2330

YOU NEED A TV CABLE CONNEaiON 
for complete television enjoyment

^  i r  i f

Southern Television Systems Corp
Serving Cisco, Eostlond, Ranger 

Call us for complete informotion

f-.“ *

MPT DRILLING
P.O. Box 733 

Graham, Texas 76046

I t n m ,.
7  V .S
Inftt rnntl io

HEIJ* WANTED: Cisco 
Nursing Center is now ac­
cepting applications for 
LVN’s or GVN’s 7-3 and 911 
shifts Starting salary for 
LVN’s $5 hour. Please con­
tact Betty Hart, Director of 
Nurses. 817-442-1471. p-61tfc 
WANTED: Part time 11-7 
LVN at Northview Develop­
m ent C enter. C ontact 
DeVonna Wheeler. T-77

TAKING applications for 
mauls and nuiintenance. See 
Mr. Walker at Eastland Best 
Western, Pho. 6292655. TNF

HELP WAiJTED: Cashiers 
and experienced island help. 
Apply in person at Guthrie 
Truck Harbor, Interstate 20 
West, Cisco, p-76

DUPLEX FOR RENT: 2 
bdrm, 14 bath with stove. 
Fully carpeted and draped. 
Central air and heat. $300.00 
per month plus $100.00 
damage deposit. No more 
than 2 children. No pets. 
Pho. 6292175. T-tnf

r ----------- iiKW  ^ ilS T !iT
l i  I O F F IC E  F U R N IT U R E  

on display at
Steven Printing 
& Photography

EASTLAND

^ cSñToiiibni. 0P»id Pinup.
(817Ì 549-0768 (817)549-4712

SpodaBies in ShaKow W§K DrilKng

TC

NOTICE

♦‘629-2682 ______

HELP WANTED: Waitress 
and bookkeeper. Apply in 
person at White Elephant 
Restaurant, Interstate 
West, Cisco, p-76

20

GARAGE SALES
BACK YARD SALE: Nice 
Gas range, dishes, books, 
clothes and toys and lots 
more. Thursday, Friday and 
Saturday. 1604 W Plummer. 
T-75

NOTICE: Land Develop­
ment Service
(1) Land clearing
(2) Farm and Ranch Im­
provement
(3) Terracing
(4) Other improvements 

E xperienced  o p era to r
bulldozer Further informa­
tion call after 6 p.m. (817) 
6292058. T-81

NOW LEASNG OFFICES in 
the Petroleum  Building 
(formerly Eastland Bank 
Building) catered to your 
decor. Reasonable rates; 
many extras. View by ap­
pointment only! Big Country 
Real E s ta te . 629-2281; 
442-1693 or 442-1707 evenings. 
TNF

Metal Buildings 
All Welded Construction 
Clear Span to 60’ Wide 

Any l.«ngth 
Built to suit your needs 

A-1 Sales 
215 S. Walnut 

6292102 Anytime

J &  J A IR  C O N D IT IO N IN G  
&  R E F R IG E R A T IO N ;

Full Line GE Dealer
Free Estimates 
on Installation

629- 2251'
Service on All Makes 
O w n e r .  James Schuman

W i l l i a m s  Pumpinq  S e r v i c e  
R L (Rocky) Willioms

P O BOX 4M 
mSlNOSTAB T€XAS ^64M

SPECIAL NOTICE
Anybody

know ing the wherebouts o f 

Lynn  Cochran , age 16 years. 1
he haa short blond hair, blue eves,

IS 5 ft. & 2 inches tall & weighs
about 1 10 pounds. 8he has been
missing since Sunday, Sept. 13,
1981. Any information contact
Buck Cochran or W illie Cochran

at 653-2345, Olden or
write to P.O. Box 79 Olden, Texasocweooooeooc

^  w w  w m m w "w m w w w w w m

??LEGAL PROBLEMS??!
Divorce from *49" 

Bankruptcy from *300" 
Simple Wills from *25"

filing fees not included
Soturdoy & Sunday appointments 

available.
Our temporary Office will 

be in your area soon#
Full Legal Services available, 
including oil & gas leases, title 

opinions, etc. cioil suits 
& criminal actions

Terms Available
Willow Pork Legal Clinic 

Weatherford, Texos 
(817) 441-7551 

Call 8-6 for appointment

mirMOHi 
(•17) A43 46«2
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CISCO IS WELL 

represented at the West 
Texas Fair in Abilene these 
days. Cisco Junior College 
has a nice booth in the 
display building to tell one 
and aU the story of this fine 
educational institution Mrs 
Jammie Fry is in charge of 
the booth, and members of 
the Wrangler Belles help her 
each day.

Mayor E ris  R itch ie 's  
Southwest Enterprises has 
an exhibit of his wares with 
Mrs Bob Keyes in charge . .  
. Bob Bevers, local Salad 
Master distributor, also has 
a booth to advertise his pro­
duct . . . And S&M Supply 
Company has some products 
on display with Harvey Hull 
looking after same.

The CJC Band and Belles 
weren’t  able to appear in last 
Saturday’s Fair parade due 
to previous commitments

YOU’VE PROBABLY 
noticed that the Gulf Service 
SUtion at 310 West 8th Street 
has a new proprietor -  .Mr 
Bruce Speegle -  since Sept 
1st. B ruce bought the 
business from Mr Wilson 
Smith, who has been in the 
service station here for 
many years.

As you know, Bruce is a 
native of Cisco -  the son of

the Johnny Speegles. He’s a 
former Lobo at CHS and had 
been teaching school at 
Houston before deciding to 
return home and go into 
business.

U n d e rs tan d  th a t Mr. 
Smith is considering retire­
ment.

OUR SCOUTS report that 
the CJC Band and Belles 
Special to New York City for 
M acy’s T hanksg iv ing  
parade has reached the 300 
mark -  their goal Direciurs 
Ens Ritchie and Tim Jones 
were checking lists .Monday 
to see if they could take two 
or three more ticket orders 
before starting a waiting list.

If you’re mterested and 
didn’t get on the list yet, con­
tact Eris or Tim very soon.

CITY MANAGER Mike 
.Moore was m Austin .Monday 
checking with EPA officials 
inre Cisco’s application for a 
grant to correct sewer water 
problems . . .  The sewer pro­
ject will be discussed by the 
City Council at a special 
meeting Thursday night at 
City H all. . .  Ed Wende of the 
Post Office staff was back on 
the job .Monday after a vaca­
tion. Highlight of last week, 
he reports, was attending the 
West Texas Fair in Abilene

OFFICE SPACE 
FOR RENT OR PURCHASE

116 N. Seomon, Eostlond 
Call 629-8641 
or 647-3022

Secretarial I  Telephone Answering 
Service Available

♦ ♦ ★  i T w ★ i t ' w i t * A
MRS. ROSE

. .  The post office flag flew at 
half mast several days in 
tribute to Roy Wilkins, civil 
rights leader who died last 
week

COACH JIM Puryear of 
the CHS Loboes learned 
recently that John Huff- 
myer, formerly of Cisco, was 
now coaching a football 
team in Colorado. John, you 
know, was the public ad­
dress system announcer for 
CHS games here a good 
many years

And Mr. Puryear would 
tike nothing better than to 
announce one of the :;r.'nes 
on the PA system for Coach 
H uffm yer’s team  . . . 
Understand John’s assistant 
coach is their son, Mark, a 
former lx)bo star.

DUMP TRUCKS are haul- 
mg the debris from the old 
buildings that are being 
demolished to make way for 
the new bank building to a 
site back of Ted Fields’ 
North Avenue D store. And a 
bulldozer there is packing it 
down . . . Bennie Nichols, 
local golfer, has accepted an 
invitation from an Olney 
man to play in a partnership 
golf tournament there this 
coming weekend . . . CofC 
President Ronnie Ledbetter 
was among the big crowd of 
Texans and others enjoying 
white wing dove hunting 
down in the valley country 
last weekend.

MR. DERWIN Honea of 
SWBell Telephone Com­
pany’s local staff tells us 
that he is making good pro­
gress after two rounds of 
surgery this year and that 
his doctors expect to let him 
return to work Nov. 1st. The 
Honeas enjoyed a travel 
trailer trip to Ijike Proctor 
to attend a family reunion 
recently . . . .Mrs. Gerald 
Parks of the Callarman In­
surance Company tells us 
that her two sons, David and 
Steve, and wives are now

residents of Midland. David 
works for Exxon and Steve is 
with a bank.

CISCO WAS well 
represented at the big picnic 
honoring  C ongressm an  
Charlie Stenholm and family 
near Stamford last Saturday 
afternoon. It was rainy and 
muddy but the affair at- 
tracteid over 1,000 people and 
was a good success, we were 
told.

Those making the trip 
from Cisco included the J.C 
Fletchers, the Sutton Crofts, 
Jack Farleigh, the Archie 
Chamnesses, the Truman 
Kirks and Raymond Smith. 
Gamer Altom, formerly of 
Cisco, also was there.

VISITING OUT in El Paso 
recently, we met up with a 
man who has a diesel 
powered automobile. And he 
buys his fuel in Mexico at 16 
cents per gallon -  about a 
dollar less than you pay in 
the USA.

Our friend goes to a bank 
in El Paso and gets $50 worth 
of .Mexican pesos -  about 23 
for $1 He puts his pesos in an 
envelope in the glove com­
partment of his car and uses 
them when he goes for fuel. 
The $50 runs his car for 
about six months.

AFTER READING an ar­
ticle in The Press recently 
about a resort type place the 
Post Office Department is 
building at Potomac, Md., 
we’ve been meaning to write 
our sen a to rs  and con­
gressm an. This type of 
waste of public funds doesn’t 
set very well with folks.

It’s not too hard to unders­
tand why postage rates have 
increased more percentage­
wise than anything else in 
the country when you hear 
about such things as this 
facility they’re building.

Ihursday,
beptember 17, IVBl

K ra ^ r A AdvifM»r Te lit P m i. P retrM , aod F iila re
Who Will help ytiu wh«‘re all ulhers have failed Are you suffertnk:. Are 

ytm till you need help ' l,et thu Dtvme Palm ist show the wa> to Sue- 
ceas and HappincM» Are you separated from the one you lo ve ' Has 
vajcnethiiu; or Monetme come between you and you loved ones'* I can tell 
you why I have r«'-unitcd mony who were separated and caused many * 

m arriauch If you <»eem to be overcome with bad lucA. s iiii in body  ̂
or iiurul I can help you' Do you neem to be pulled back in a ll that you do' "y 
I t an te ll you what is wrun^ and te ll you what to do about it ^
1202 E . Hroderson M1-0751 Cleburne,

 ̂ Upk>a« a.m U If p m Doily
♦ in-

Morren’s Gift Shop 
24 hr. Service

5 days a week death

C  Sep tem ber  / 6 ,  19 6 1 - 1 9 8 1

G ^^Happy 20th Anniversary  
Thank V oii. Buddy Sipe^ For

20  U ond er fu l  Yeani 
o f  Marrriafge 

Our 2 Children  
e  Our Chrintian
s Home
G Together

1431
Your Wife

on Kodacolor ^ ROBO CARWASH
Wishes To Announce...

-Ä//// /»7 //jre

Ektachr ;
yMe renty 1 ) jh e  Automatic Carwash is now coin-operated, and n o !

/A [ attendant will be on duty.
! 2) The Automatic Carwash will be open daily from 9 a.m .
; to 6 p.m .
* 3) Two additional stalls are being added for hand-operated ;
; carwashing, and will be ready soon. ^

Cisco West 9th and Avenue D i
.......................... ^ 8 3 ]

^ c 4€¿€^
t.Aíe€tt

2  í / 2  cyl

si

;d

6 2 9 -8 ^ 9 2  ^
, t / / /
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MARVAUEES PRESS SHOP
611 E. till Ciiei, Tout

Hundreds of New Full Arrrhrale 
At Dieeount Prieei

Jr. Topi 
Mlity Top! (Small-Mod-Urff) 

Mlny Topi SIzo 86-SO 
S w e a f o n

MataraHy Topi 
MataraHy Dratiaf 

Brai 
Oowai 

lab Coaft 
PaaHai 

Paalybota 
NoapHil

jH at wHb ilaiHe 
KaH Paah 

MataraHy Paata 
WbHa Uaiforai Paati 

MataraHy Paati
Jaaai 
SIdrti 

Jr. Pm iai 
Mliiy Drmai 

Naif Siza Draiiai 
VNiHa Uatfarai Draaiat

Wt 9h s âftêêÊ Shmp§

CJC To Offer Number Of Petroleum Courses
Cisco Junior College will 

offer a number of Petroleum 
Industry courses in Cisco 
and Abilene. These will be 
adult education courses.

Well Log Analysis for Oil 
and Gas Industry will be of­
fe red  in A bilene on 
September 22 and 24 from 
6:30 to 9:30 p.m. at the 
Abilene Civic Center. Well 
Log Analysis is a basic 
course on reading and inter­
preting oil and gas logs The 
instructor will be Richard 
Simonson, sales engineer for 
S ch lu m b erg e r for the 
Abilene area Fee for the six 
hour course is $30.00.

Fundamentals of Acidiz­
ing, Cementing and Fractur-

mg 1 will be offered in Cisco 
on October 6 and 8 from 6:30 
to 9:30 p.m. in the Harrell 
F ine A rts B uilding 
Auditorium. Fundamentals 
of Acidizing, Cementing and 
Fracturing I is a basic 
course on the completion 
processes used in current oil 
field operations. The instruc­
tor for this course will be 
Brett Collins, Senior District 
Engineer for Dowell. Fee for 
the six hour course is $30.00.

Bulldozer Operations I will 
be offered in Cisco the week 
of October 12-16. This a 40 
hour course covering the 
safety, maintenance and 
operation of bulldozers. The 
fee for the course is $125.00.

A four hour Basic Fluid 
Seminar will be held in Cisco 
on November 5. The instruc­
tor for this seminar will be 
Dee Averyt, Manager, Basic 
Training for Mageobar in 
Houston. Fee for the four 
hour seminar will be $20.00 

Petroleum Land I will be 
offered in Cisco beginning

Cory & Carl Gravel

October 13 and will run for 10 
weeks. The class will meet 
from 6:30 to 9:30 p.m. In the 
Science Hall lecture room. 
This is a 30 hour course per­
taining to leasing property 
for oil and gas exploration. 
The cost of the course is, 
$60.00.

Additional inform ation 
can be obtained by calling 
the President’s office at 
817-442-2567, extension 113.

Win Lewis Wafcti To Meet Thuriday
Cory and Carl Graves col­

lected $84 for the Jerry 
[.ewis Muscular Dystrophy. 
They received a Jerry l.ewis 
watch at the Marr’s Short 
Stop in Cisco.

The Good Times Gang 4-H 
Club will meet at 7 p.m. 
Thursday, September 17, at 
the First Christian Church. 
Everyone is welcome. Come 
and bring a friend.

RNUPSINCREDIBLE 21-DAY COUNTDOWN
IN THE LAST FEW DAYS OF THE MODEL YEAR 

ONLY FORD OFFERS THIS GREAT WAY TO SAVE ON BOTH CARS AND TRUCKS 
________ A MILLION DOLLARS A DAY IN CASH REBATES AND INCENTIVES«500

« 5 0 0
O N  M U STA N G

Americas 
most popular 
sports car

OilCii

O N  '82 EXP

O N  FA IRM O N T$500«506/«700 REBATE
ON AMERICA'S 
BEST-SELLING 
LIGHT TRUCKS 

AND VANS.i
*:<!<}: .tsOidiersma«» .I pcf loi m*m lopdsiwig '.i. ogi ,1 - «800 iwi 8< G'anaaas and Thi,ndert)wd»

HURRY! FORD'S INCREDIBLE 21-DAY COUN TDOW N  ENDS
SEPTEMBER 23.

Pierce Motor Co.
442-1566 Cisco, Texas

Œ Ï  FOLGEITS
COFFEE

, . . $ 1 8 9
MR I H i l  I

FREE 24 oz. COCA-
MORTON S SIllSBURf STERN TURRET WESTERN MEtUORF

DINNERS PKG.

6LADI0LA

FLOUR
UPTON FAMILY SIZE

TEA RAGS
Ifraff 32 oz. Jor
Miracle Whip
Kta. '7 "  »l“ OW

89
$-|29

BUYA 
PPED BOO 
WICH FOR 

SI .49 AND RECEIVE A

RITZ

CRACKERS
S FRUIT

K

16 OZ. 
PKG.

« 1

$]20
i

1 GAL.

PRICES EFFECTIVE SEPTEMBER 17-19,1981

SUNSHINE COOKIES

CHIP-A-ROO’S
AKsup's 1 gal

Milk

12 OZ. 
PKG.

$ 1 2 9

ALLSUPS
CONVENIENCE STORES

T H E R E ’ S O N E N EA R  YO U  "

.  O P EN  24 H O U RS 
k .  365 D A Y S  

A Y E A R


