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THE LAKE THEO FOLSOM Bison 
Kill Site Historical Marker inside 
the Caprock Canyons State Park 
near Quitaque was unveiled last 
Sunday afternoon during dedica­
tion ceremonies. Diggings here in

the past few years had uncovered 
remains of a race called Folsom 
Man. Historians say that this 
people inhabited this area many 
hundreds of years before the time 
of Christ.

CAPROCK CANYONS STATE 
Park Superintendent Marquis Ro­
bertson welcomed the visitors to 
the park and dedication ceremony. 
Mr. Robertson stated that he sin­
cerely believes that the Park will

become one of the finest, if not 
the finest. State Parks in Texas, 
in the right of the photo is Mrs. 
Carrie Dell Dickerson of Silverton, 
chairman of the Briscoe County 
Historical Survey Committee.

FORMER TURKEY MAN Speaks 
at Ceremony— Curtis Tunnell, jr., 
whose home town is Turkey, Tex­
as, is now making his home in 
Austin where he is the State Ar­
chaeologist. He spoke at the dedi­
cation ceremony Sunday and told 
some of the history concerning

the Folsom Man and the appear­
ance of the land at the site 10,000 
years ago. On the right is Elgin 
Conner, minister of the Quitaque 
Church of Christ, who led the in­
vocation and group singing of 
"America the Beautiful."

Saturday Is Election Day
Histoiical Marker Dedicated

At Folsom Kill Site
Sunday afternoon, April 30, at 

4:00 o’clock a historical medallion 
was unveiled and dedicated at the 
Folsom Kill Site in Caprock Can­
yons State Park north of Quita­
que.

Mrs. Edwin Dickerson of Silver- 
ton, chairman of the Briscoe Coun­
ty Historical Survey Committee, 
was in charge of the program 
which opened with the presenta­
tion of the colors by Boy Scout 
Troop 262. This was followed by 
the group singing of “America 
the Beautiful,” led by Elgin Con­
ner, minister of the Quitaque 
Church of Christ. He also led the 
opening prayer.

The guest speaker was Curtis 
Tunnell of Austin, a former resi­
dent of Turkeyi the State Ar­
chaeologist. He brought some in­
teresting notes of history on the 
Folsom Site. It is thought that the 
bison kill was probably 10,000 
years ago. The area was much dif­
ferent then from what is now 
seen. The layers of earth which 
have been moved have told many 
interesting things about when the 
indians roamed the area. He stat­
ed that “bits of pollen” lead one 
to believe that the immediate area 
was covered with pine trees. The 
wildlife was probably herds of 
buffalo, antelope, wild tigers and 
lions, much like Africa today.

“Then where did it all go?” one 
may ask. Tunnell says the dry 
weather and dust storms from the 
Plains covered the entire area. La­
ter, in the rains, the lake was un­
covered. The archaeologists be­
lieve that when the Bison Kill 
took place, the men who were here 
probably dressed in skins of ani­
mals. They killed great numbers 
of bison near the site of the his­
torical medallion. They probably 
spent months there, dresisng and 
preparing the meat for food.

At the close of Mr. TunnelTs ad­
dress, he asked Mrs. C. L. McWil­
liams of Silverton, the Briscoe 
County Historian who is also with 
the State Archaeological Depart­
ment, to read the inscription on

Farmers Home 

Office Closed 

May 8-9-10
The Farmers Home Administra­

tion office will be closed May 8- 
9-10 while all personnel are at­
tending a statewide meeting.

The Tulia office will be open 
at 8:00 a.m. Thursday, May 11.

----------0----------

Toby Honea Buried 
M onday A t Quitaque

Funeral services for Lois Earl 
(Toby) Honea, 79, were conducted 
Monday at 2:30 p.m. at the Church 
of Christ in Quitaque. Officiating 
were Elgin Conner, minister, and 
Earl Cantwell, minister* of the 
Rock Creek Church of Christ.

Pallbearers were Deloy Myers, 
Morris Wilson, P. John Monk, Le­
roy Hamilton, James Brunson and 
Buster Chadwick.

Burial was in Rest Haven Ce­
metery by Moore-Rose Quitaque 
Funeral Home.

Mr. Honea died at 2:00 p.m. 
Saturday, April 29, in Lockney 
General Hospital.

Born February 18, 1899 in Cle­
burne, he was a retired laborer, 
and had been a resident of Briscoe 
County since 1912. He was a mem­
ber of the Church of Christ.

He is survived by one brother, 
Odis Honea, of Quitaque.

the medallion.
It reads:

LAKE THEO
FOLSOM BISON KILL SITE

“Stone tool fragments were dis­
covered in 1965 and 1972 on the 
shores of Lake Theo, named for 
former landowner Theodore Geis- 
ler. Archaeological testing in 1974 
revealed a campsite and bison but­
chering and processing area dating 
back to the age of Folsom years 
ago. Projectile points and scrap­
ing tools were found at a depth of 
four feet, along with over 500 bon­
es from an extinct type of bison. 
Ponds in Holmes Canyon, now co­
vered by Lake Theo, probably at­
tracted prehistoric men to tiiis 
area. 1978.”

Mr. Tunnell also introduced 
Bill Harrison, curator of the Pan­
handle-Plains Museum at Canyon, 
and Henry Smith of the West Tex­
as State University archaeological 
department. They told of the un­
covering of more history in the 
last year at the site. The archaeo­
logists have worked there, moving 
dirt from June to October 1977 
and in the caves ;hey have discov­
ered the Plano culture and the 
Plainview culture, which proves 
what Mr. Tunnell had stated be­
fore: that the dirt from the Plains 
had covered the area about 2000 
years later than the culture.

Briscoe County voters will have 
several races of interest to vote 
on Saturday in the first Democra­
tic Primary on county, state and 
national levels.

On the local level, residents of 
Briscoe County Precinct 2 will be 
voting on their choice for County 
Commissioner, and Orval Cobb, 
the incumbent, who is a candidate 
for re-election, has two opponents 
this time around. They are Jack 
Chandler and Leroy Hamilton. All 
three men are long-time residents 
of the area and are well known 
to local residents. '  ,

Dick Taylor, Justice of the 
Peace for Precinct 2, is again a 
candidate for that post and is un­
opposed.

Also on the couuty level, Fred 
Mercer is the candidate for County 
Judge and he has no opponent.

Bess McWilliams is the candi­
date for re-election as County and 
District Clerk, and she is unoppos­
ed.

In the race for State Senator, 
30th District, Ray Farabee is again 
a candidate for re-election and he 
has no opponent.

In the race for State Represen­
tative, 66th Legislative District, 
the incumbent is not a candidate 
for re-election. There tare three 
candidates for the past, two demo­
crats and a republilcan, Glenn 
Conrad, a farmer and rancher at 
Claude, and Foster Whaley of 
Pampa, a former employe for 
many years of the Texas Exten­
sion Service who has farmed and 
ranched since leaving his job as 
county agent, are the democrats 
to be voted on in the Democratic

JOAN LEE TURNER SHERICE PRICE

☆  ☆  ☆

Valley High School Honor 
Stndents Have Been Named

Valley School Principal Jerry 
Maupin has announced the names 
of the high school honor students 
for the year 1977-78. They are as 
follows:

Joan Lee Turner, the 18-year- 
old daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Jan 
Turner of Turkey, is valedictorian 
of her Valley High School class 
with a scholastic average of 95.38. 
She has been active in all phases 
of school life, including Annual 
Staff for four years and editor 
for 1978; Student Council four 
years; FHA four years, serving as 
an officer for the FHA, Valley 
Concession Treasurer, and Senior 
Class Secretary. She served as a 
Cheerleader two years. Her senior 
year, she served as co-captain and 
was an All-District guard on the 
basketball team and was elected 
Miss VHS, Class Favorite and FFA 
Chapter Sweetheart. She has been 
named to Who’s Who Among Am­
erican High School Students. Her 
future plans include continuing 
her studies at Clarendon College, 
majoring in secretarial accounting. 
She plans to be married in late 
summer.

Sherice Price, the 18-year-old

daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Hubert 
Price of Turkey, is the class salu- 
tatorian with a scholastic average 
of 95.11. She has also been active 
in many phases of school activities, 
especially in the field of sports. 
In basketball, she was co-captain 
this year and has been named to 
the All-District team for three 
years as a forward. She played 
for the East Panhandle All-Stars. 
She has been a Regional Qualifier 
in track for three years, and is 
on the State Qualifying Relay 
Teams this year.

She has been a cheerleader, 
served as class officer and was 
elected “Most Athletic” and “Most 
Likely to Succeed” by the student 
body and “Best All Around” by 
the faculty her senior year. She 
has also been named to Who’s 
Who Among American High 
School Students.

Her plans are to attend Texas 
Tech University in Lubbock, but 
she has not decided on her major 
yet.

------------0------------
Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Keeling of 

Canyon spent Saturday night and 
Sunday visiting Miss Gladys Stroup 
in Quitaque.

Primary. Bill Hale, a Floydada bu­
sinessman, is the republilcan can­
didate.

Jack Hightower is the incumbent 
U. S. Representative, 13th District 
of Texas. He is running unopposed 
in the Democratic Primary.

The biggest race apparently in 
the state level is that for. governor. 
Apparently it' will be a two-man 
race with incumbent governor 
Dolph Briscoe having John Hill 
as his biggest challenger.. In this 
area, from what is heard from 
talking with the people, John Hill 
will be the winner in this part of 
the state. There is a full slate of 
races and voters must take their 
pick from a long list of candidates.

HALL COUNTY
Turkey voters must select be­

tween two candidates in the race 
for County Commissioner, Prednot 
4. James Fuston, the incumbent, 
is a candidate for re-election and 
his opponent is Dale Garner. Both 
men are long-time residents of 
Turkey and are well known by 
the voters of that precinct.

Curtis Tunnell, incumbent, is 
running unopposed for Justice of 
the Peace, Precinct 4.

Also on the county level, can­
didates are as follows:

Lester Campbell, incumbent, is 
running unopposed for the office 
of Hall County Judge.

PhyUii? Dunn, incumbent, is run­
ning unopposed for the office of 
County and District Clerk.

Lucille Wright, incumbent, is 
running unopposed for County 
Treasurer.

In all other races. Hall and 
Briscoe voters will vote on the 
same list of candidates.

Public
Notice

An appreciation hour for Con­
gressman Jack Hightower, spon­
sored by Turkey Farmers Union, 
will be held Saturday, May 13, at 
8 p.m. in the Bob Wills Center at 
Turkey.

Everyone is urged to attend and 
bring a salad.

Congressman Jack has stood ten 
feet tall for us. Come out and 
show your appreciation. It will 
help. Buck Blakney

47-2t
----------0----------

V acation Bible 
School Set A t 
F irst Baptist Church

The Vacation Bible School for 
the First Baptist Church in Quita­
que has been scheduled for May 
29 through June 2. Classes will 
begin at 9 a.m. and continue until 
11:30 a.m.

The church bus will run, and 
will start rounds at 8 a.m.

If anyone living in the country 
wants to ride the bus, call Phyllis 
Cheatham, VBS Superintendent.

-- ;-------- 0------------
NEW MISSION TO BE 
DEDICATED IN TURKEY

The new St. Elizabeth Ann Se- 
ton Mission in Turkey will be de­
dicated on May 7 at 8:00 p.m. 
The bishop of the diocese of Am­
arillo will be the chief celebrant, 
with priests and clergymen from 
throughout the Panhandle also 
attending. There will be a recep­
tion after the Mass of Dedication 
in the cafeteria at the Bob Wills 
Center in Turkey.

Along with the Bishop Lawrence 
DeFalco and other priests, there 
will also be parishioners from 
Jayton, Matador and Spur. There 
will be a special supper served for 
the visiting clergymen at the Big 
“T” Restaurant in Turkey at 6:00 
p.m.

Everyone is cordially invited to 
attend the dedication and recep­
tion following.

R A I N !
X The year 1978 has already gone 
down as the coldest winter in 
about half a century—and in these 
parts, one of the driest in many 
moons. Things can change over­
night and the dry part has been 
relieved. For the north and west 
Panhandle, up to 11 inches of snow 
has fallen in the past 24 hours 
along with some freezing weather, 
so for those parts the winter ap­
parently is not over.

Although the Valley has been 
chilly very little snow fell but 
good rains have fallen to alleviate 
the long dry spell.

Turkey reports that up to noon 
Wednesday, a total of 2.4 inches 
of rain had fallen.

The Quitaque area caught a to­
tal of 2.10 before noon Wednes­
day.

The rain started falling early 
Tuesday morning, fell intermit­
tently until late in the afternoon, 
then more fell during the night.

The rain was of the slow-falling 
variety and there was no runoff.

This area was getting very dry 
and planting time is here. The 
springtime thus far has been cool 
for the most pari;, although some 
warm days have been experienced, 
but for the most part the tempera­
tures have been below nonr|al for 
this time of year. Rainfall to the 
west of the immediate area was 
heavier than that in the Valley, 
with some areas near Silverton re­
porting three inches or more of 
rain.

The possibility of more rainfall 
is included in the forecast for the 
next day or two.

----------- 0-----------

A nnual Sports 
Banquet Tickets 
A re On Sale

Tickets for the All Sports Ban­
quet are on sale. They may be 
purchased at the First National 
Bank in Quitaque, the Peoples 
State Bank in Turkey, or the Unit­
ed States Post Office in Quitaque.

Bill Yung, football coach at 
West Texas State University, will 
be the guest speaker.

The banquet will be held Mon­
day, May 8, at 7:30 p.m.

----------- 0-----------

Johnny McKays To 
Celebrate Silver 
Wedding Anniversary

The children of Mr. and Mrs. 
J. A. (Uncle Johnny) McKay re­
quest the honor of your presence 
at the twenty-fifth wedding anni­
versary of their parents on Sun­
day, May 14, 1978, from 2:00 until 
5:00 p.m. in the Community Cen­
ter, Quitaque, Texas.

Gertrude Gonce and Johnny Mc­
Kay were married May 16, 1953 
in Clovis, New Mexico.

The couple has eight living chil­
dren. They are Orvil Gonce and. 
Adrian Gonce, both of Brecken- 
ridge; Mrs. Juanita Jernigan, Ab­
ilene; Mrs. Mavis Green, Lawton, 
Oklahoma; Mrs. Pearl Hulsey and 
Eddie Earl Gonce (twins), both of 
whom live in Hereford; Mrs. Jones 
Raymolds, Sacramento, California; 
and Mrs. Dorothy Scott, Eastland, 
Texas.

PUBLIC NOTICE!
There will be a School Board 

Meeting Tuesday, May 9, at 8 
p.m. in the Valley Cafeteria. Rem­
ember this date.

MRS. NALL IN TULIA HOSPITAL

Mfs. Bess Nall was taken to 
Swisher Memorial Hospital in Tu­
lia Monday afternoon by Quitaque 
Ambulance Service. According to 
her daughter, Mrs. Bill Woods, she 
is still undergoing tests. Another 
daughter, Mrs. Bernice Thurman 
of Denton came Sunday to visit 
her mother. She plans to stay as 
long as needed. Rev. Sid Parsley 
and Mrs. Bill Woods visited Mrs. 
Nall in Tulia fagain Tuesday mor­
ning.
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New Labor 

Regulation To 

Affect A g  Youth
Agricultural producers who rely 

on hand harvesting of short sea­
son crops should know about a 
proposed federal regulation that 
would allow the hiring of 10- and 
11-year old youth for this work, 
announces Dr. Gary S. Nelson, a 
safety engineer with the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Service.

Presently, as a result of a 1974 
amendment to the Fair Labor 
Standards Act, minors under 12 
years of age may only be employ­
ed for non-hazardous work with 
written parental consent and only 
on farms where the employees do 
not come under federal minimum 
wage provisions. This means a 
farm having less than 500 mandays 
of agricultural labor during any 
quarter during the preceding cal­
endar year.

The proposed regulation provid­
es for a waiver to permit the 
employment of 10- and 11-year-old 
youth in agriculture as hand-har­
vesters of short season crops on 
larger farms under certain condi­
tions, points out Nelson. Youth 
hired under the waiver must be 
employed during non-school hours 
and must commute daily from 
their permanent residences.

Each waiver application must in­
clude signed statements by the 
employer, employees, county Ex­
tension agents, officials of the 
state employment service, and oth­
er knowledgeable individuals re­
garding substantiation of the fol­
lowing provisions of the waiver 
application:

1. Such agricultural operation 
“is customarily and generally re­
cognized as being paid on a piece 
rate basis in the region in which 
such individuals would be employ­
ed.”

2. The “industry of such employ­
er has (prior to the 1974 restric­
tions) traditionally and substantial-

P H Y L L I S  D U N N  

Seeking Re-Election As Your 

COUNTY and 

DISTRICT CLERK

URGES ALL HALL COUNTY

VOTERS TO VOTE IN TH E

MAY PRIM ARY ON MAY 6th

Pd. Pol Adv. by Phyllis Dunn, Memphis

ly employed individuals under 12 
years of age without displacing 
substantial job opportunities for 
individuals over 16 years of age.”

3. The crop to be harvested is 
one with a “particularly short har­
vesting season,” normally within 
a four-week period, in the particu­
lar region in which the waiver 
will be applicable.
* 4. The 12-year minimum age 
prescribed since 1974 has and 
would cause “severe economic dis­
ruption in the industry of the em­
ployer applying for the waiver.”

5. Neither the type of “employ­
ment” nor the level and type of 
pesticides and other chemicals 
used” would have a harmful ef­
fect on the health and well-being 
of the employed minors.

6. Individuals age 12 and above 
are not available for such employ­
ment.

Nelson cautions that this regu­
lation is only a proposed regula­
tion at this time. Comments, pro 
or con, regarding the proposal are 
invited from producers and oth­
er interested persons and should 
be mailed by May 4 to Lucille C. 
Pinkett, Wage and Hour Division, 
Room S-3022, New DOL Building, 
200 Constitution Avenue NW, 
Washington, D. C. 20210. For fur­
ther information call 202 523-8412.

-------------^-----------

Mr. and Mrs, Lee Maupin of 
House, New Mexico, Mrs. Jewel 
Tucker of Portales, New Mexico, 
and Mrs. Donna Mann and child­
ren of Clarendon were visitors in 
the home of Mr. and Mrs. Michie 
Maupin.

--------- 0------------

John Lane of Turkey is a pa­
tient at St. Anthony’s Hospital in 
Amarillo. Since last week he has 
been in serious condition, and he 
expected to undergo surgery this 
week for a heart blockage.

----------- 0-----------
Visitors in the home of Mr. and 

Mrs. Carl Baker for the weekend 
were Roy Brock of Amarillo and 
Carl’s sisters, Mr. and Mrs. R. B 
Stephens of Amarillo and Mrs. 
Margaret Snowden of Memphis. 
Mr. Stephens served as one of the 
judges Tor the fiddling contest.

------------0------------
Mr. and Mrs. O. H. Majors, Mr. 

and Mrs. Dale Jones and Mrs. Hoot 
Ellis of Lubbock visited with Mrs 
W. At Majors in Turkey over the 
weekend.

----------- 0-----------
Visiting in the home of Mr. and 

Mrs. Johnny Peery were her 
niece, Kim Doss, and her friend, 
Mandy Hughes, Amarillo; Karen 
Ziegler and Rebecca Reid, Silver- 
ton.
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All this glory from one tiny seed! The sunflower 
towers taller than a man, its huge golden head filled 
with thousands of seeds . . .  and every seed contains 
the mystery of life and growth that science cannot 
explain.

We are surrounded by miracles that man did - 
not create. Who created them? Who created us? 
By the reasoning powers of our own marvelous 
minds we can be guided to see that God the Creator 
has made all things according to His plan, and that 
we can only achieve our highest development by 
living in harmony with it.

How can we know God’s will for us? We need 
only a small seed of faith, for He will lead us in 
His way if we ask Him . . .  and that seed will grow 
and flourish under His loving care.

T H E  C H U R C H  F O R  AL.L, • A LL F O R  TH E C H U R C H
The Church is the greatest factor 

on earth for the building of charac­
ter and good citizenship. It is a store­
house of spiritual values. Without a 
strong Church, neither democracy 
nor civilization can survive. There 
are fotir sound reasons why every 
person should attend services regu­

larly and support the Church. They 
are: (1) For his own sake, (2) For 
his children’s sake. (3) For the sake 
of his community and nation. (4) 
For the sake of the Chtmch itself, 
which needs his moral and material 
support. Plan to go to church regu­
larly and read your Bible daily.

Copyright 1966, Keister Advertising Service, Inc., Strasburg, Va.
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ASSEMBLY OF GOD CHURCH

Turkey, Texas
Weekly Schedule of Meetings

SUNDAY:
M orning__________  10:00 a.m.
Evening _________  8:00 p.m.

WEDNESDAY:
Bible S tudy_________ 8:00 p.m.

☆
CHURCH OF CHRIST

Turkey, Texas 
Minister: Jack Hutton 

Weekly Schedule of Meetings 
SUNDAY:

Morning Service___ 10:30 a.m.
Evening S erv ice___ 6:00 p.m.

WEDN-ESDAY-
E^veninig Services______8:00 p.m.

F3RST BAPTIST CHURCH

Turkey, Texas 
Pastor: Melvin Clinton 

Weekly Schedule of Meetings

SUNDAY:
Sunday School ______ 9:45 a.m.
Morning W orship__ 11:00 a.m.
Training U nion______ 6:00 p.m.
Evening W orship___ 7:00 p.m.

MONDAY:
Women’s Missionary 

Society__________  4:00 pjn.

WEDNESDAY;
Prayer M eeting______ 8:00 p.m.

THE COMMUNITY CHURCH
• OF TURKEY

Sunday School----------- 10:00 a.m.
Worship Service---------11:00 ajn.
Sunday Evening_______6:00 pjn...
Wednesday Evening—  7:30 p.m.

☆
UNITED METHODIST CHURCH

Turkey, Texas 
Pastor: Elroy Wisian 

Weekly Schedule of Meetings
SUNDAY:

Church School___________ 9:55 a.m.
Morning W orship___ 10:55 ajn.
M.Y F _____________ 5:00 p.m.
Evening W orship____ 6:00 pjn.

MONDAY; (First and Third)
United viMth^dist

Women_______________ 4:00 p.m.

The people whose names appear below sponsor Ihls message wilh the hope ol pro­

moting a heller Chrisiian community

Young's Auto Supply 

Peoples State Bank 

City Drug 

Lacy Dry Goods 

Couch Food 

Turkey Automotive 

Turkey ^m|)Iement Co 

North Gin

Glad Rags

Lipscomb Grocery 

Salem Dry Goods 

Higginbotham - Bartlett 

Farm and Ranch Supply 

Three Bros. Station 

Seigler Funeral Home 

Big Restaurant 

The Cotton Patch

Turkey Hotel 

Ottis Mullin Well Drilling 

Memphis Compress 

Turkey Farmers Co-op Gin 

Mullin Motor Co.

Peery & Dugan Oil Co. 

Setliff Mill, Turkey, Tex. 

Ferguson Insurance
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Roger Brunson of Quitaque was 
taken to Central Plains Hospital in 
Plainview by Quitaque Ambulance 
Service about four o’clock Monday 
morning.

------------0----------- -

The Valley Tribune received a 
renewal from Mrs. Monty (Edna) 
McCoy of Phoenix, Arizona and 
she sends regards to all her 
friends in the Quitaque and Tur­

key area. She says she is sadden­
ed by the death of an old friend 
and classmate, Gus Eudy.

------------0------------

Mr. and Mrs. Buster Qualls of 
Albuquerque, New Mexico stopped 
in the Tribune Friday to visit 
Gaston Owens (he was not here at 
the time). Mr. Qualls stated that 
he was *a former resident of Es- 
telline, Turkey and Quitaque. He

had recently been in Dean Pur­
cell’s place of business in Albu­
querque and saw The Tribune. 
He and his wife were enroute to 
Turkey for Bob Wills Day.

Mrs. Olga Gafford and Marlane, 
Mrs. Deanne Dennis and girls, 
Mr. and Mrs. Ladd Gafford, all 
of Spearman, visited in the Doyle 
Proctor arid Dean Lane homes

over the weekend.

: , f J ' CO*".!**' J'-Z

i towote-Saturday

S ta te  Senah^r.

Aerial spraying time is here a- 
gain for the control of mesquite 
and sand sagebrush, according to 
Charles Wade, Range Conserva­
tionist with the Soil Conservation 
Service in Memphis. This year it 
looks like May 5-15 will be the 
only time available to spray due 
to the early cutoff date. Resting 
the pasture for a minimum of 90

consecutive days following spray­
ing is a must if any range improve­
ment is to be made, Wade said. 
Several farmers and ranchers are 
planning to spray their brush and 
rest their pastures this year. They 
will receive cost share assistance 
through the Great Plains Conser­
vation Prpgrarh administered by 
the Soil Conservation Service.

The Land Bank
Agriculture’s long-term len ^ r
For 60 years, through good times and bad 
times, America’s farmers and ranchers have 
depended on the Federal Land Bank for long­
term financing. The kind of financing needed  
to set and reach long-term goals.

F E D E R A L  LAND BA N K  
ASSOCIATION  OF FLO YDADA

105 South Wall 
FLOVDADA, TEXAS 79235 

Ph. 983-2480

* Mrs. Vella Herrington visited 
•her sister-in-law, Mrs. J. S. Mc- 
Murray in Memphis Monday of last 
week. It was the 86th birthday 
anniversary of Mrs. McMurray.

-------- 0--------
Mr. and Mrs. Harvey Williams 

and children of Hereford and Mr. 
and Mrs. Terry Doc Williams and 
children of Abilene spent the 
weekend in Turkey assisting in 
the Bob Wills festivities, and vis­
iting with their parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Doc Williams.

Visiting in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. E. L. Hill were their child­
ren, Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Weath­
erly and children, Haskell; Mr. 
and Mrs. Rod Hill, Wellington; 
Bob Hill and daughter, Kristie 
and a friend, Cathy Miroco, all of

A  Stat0 Incom e Tax.
A  Hangm an’s Noose For Texas.
If you think taxes axe choking you now, 

consider the possibility o f a State income 
tax. It would be a noose around your neck. 
Around the neck o f every Texan. And 
around the future o f Texas.
A  vote for John H ill is a vote for:
•  bigger goveniment.
•  more government spending.
•  more inflation.
A N D  FOR A  STATE INCOME TAX.

A  vote for Dolph Briscoe is a vote for:
•  fiscal responsibility
•  less — not more — government.
•  continued economic growth.
A N D  FOR NO  NEW  TAXES.

•  W e don’t need N ew  York-style govern 
ment in  Texas.
•  We don’t need Washington-style 
bureaucracy in Texas.
•  And we don’t need a big spending 
liberal activist as Governor o f Texas, 
LETS KEEP DOLPH BRISCOE 
AS OUR GOVERNOR.

I

“We are already footing the bill for 
run-away government in Washington. 
As Texans we should not have to foot 
the bill for run-away government in 
Austin.

“I don’t think Texas should spend 
itself into a state income tax. That is 
exactly what will happen if Mr. HiU 
fulfills only some of his political 
promises.”

Governor Dolph Briscoe

Governor Dolph Briscoe 
For Texas

Polilical advertismg paid for by The Briscoe Committee, David A. Dean, Treasurer, P. O. Box 2174, Austin, Texas 78768.

Houston.

Rod Setliff, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Arville Setliff of Turkey, has re­
turned to Turkey for a visit with 
his parents after completing 10 
months of training in Hobbs, New 
Meixco.

Rod will leave Turkey for Spain 
Wednesday of this week. He will 
be working for Halliburton Oil 
Service Company which is the lar­
gest oil service company in the 
world. He will be stationed in Ma­
drid and commute back and forth 
to Libya. He will be an operation 
engineer for two years.

------------o------- -----
Visitors in the Arville Setliff 

home over the weekend were all 
their sons. Those who joined Rod 
in Turkey were Mr. and Mrs. Al­
ton Setliff and son, Aaron, of El

Paso; Scotty Setliff, Levelland; 
Kenny Setliff and a friend, Relda 
Straine, Canyon, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Bud Richardson of Purcell, Okla­
homa. 'The Richardson’s daughter, 
Karla, and son, Shane, of Amar­
illo joined her parents here in 
the Setliff home.

----------- o-----------
Susie Hulsey, 13-year-old daugh­

ter of Mr. and Mrs, Loyd Hulsey 
of Hereford, former residents of

Quitaque, was one of the contes­

tants in the Amarillo Spelling Bee. 

She placed 14th out of 47 contes­

tants.

Susie is also the granddaughter 

of Mrs. Mildred Hulsey of Quita­

que and the late George Hulsey.

I WILL APPRECIATE 
YOUR VOTE AND SUPPORT 
IN THE PRIMARY ELECTION, 

SATURDAY, MAY 6 
JACK CHANDLER .

I have tried to contact each of you 
personally but if I have not, I now solicit 
your vote.

If I am elected to Commissioner 
Precinct 2, I will serve you to the best of 
my ability.

Thank you for your consideration.
Pd. Pol. Adv. by Jack Chandler

•  Judge, Court of Criminal Appeals: since Jan. 1,1978
•  Judge, 85th District Court: 10 years
•  County judge: 9 years
•  Municipal judge: 4 years
•  Practicing attorney: 1948-1967
•  1948 graduate: Baylor University Law School
•  World War II veteran
•  Deacon and teacher of men’s Bible class: First

Baptist Church, Bryan •

Vote to retain Judge W .C. (Bill) Davis— the QUALIFIED 
candidate— on the Court of Criminal Appeals, Place 3.

Democratic primary: May 6.

T here is on ly O N E  issue  
in  a judicial race:

QUALIHCATIONS.
JUDGE
W. C. (BILL)

DAVIS
Political advertisement paid for by 
W. C. Uavis Campaign,
W. C. Davis, Treasurer,
1212 Guadalupe, Austin, Texas 78701

MACK
MALLACE
R a i lr o a d  C o m m i s s i o n  o f  T e x a s

“Mack Wallace . . .  has recognjzed not only 
the importance of maintaining a healthy oil 
and gas industry but the needs of the 
consumer faced with ever-increasing 
energy costs.”

DALLAS MORNING NEWS

“Mack Wallace . . .  brought to the job the 
dedication it commanded. . .  he has the 
experience it requires . . .  he has shown 
himself to be a guardian of fairness for 
both the energy producer and consumer^*

FORT WORTH STAR-TELEGRAM
\

“As Railroad Commissioner, Wallace’s 
record has been marked by a keen 
awareness of the responsibilities of the 
commission . . . h e  has carried the message 
of Texas with vigor.”

HOUSTON CHRONICLE

“ Wallace. . .  brings to the Commission the 
sound judgment and background that will 
continue to serve Texans well.”

WICHITA FALLS TIMES

ON SATURDAY, MAY 6 VOTE FOR 
A PROVEN LEADER FOR TEXAS

Pd. PoL Adv. by The Mack Wallace Campaign, P.O. Box  
8075, Austin*,Texas 78712, Shelton Smith, Treasurer
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Valley Tribune
Successor to The Quitaquo Tribune, established a t Quitaque in 1960 

P U B L IS H E D  E V E R Y  T H U R S D A Y  A T  Q U IT A Q U E , T E X A S  79256 
SEC O N D  CLASS PO STA G E P A ID  A T  Q U IT A Q U E , T E X A S  79255 

BY GASTON A N D  L O T T IE  O W E N S
S U B S C R IP T IO N  R A TE S : Briscoe, H ali, Motley, Floyd Counties, $4.00 per 

year; Elsewhere, $4.50 per year.
Advertising rates upon request. Classified advertising, 6 cents per word 

firs t Insertion, 4 cents per word thereafter. M inim um  charge, $1.00 weekly.
Cards of Thanks, $1.00. Poetry, at classified advertising rates.
Any erroneous reflections upen the character, standing or reputation of 

any person, firh i or corporation which may appear in the columns of The  
Valley Tribune w ill be gladly corrected upon its being brought to the atten* 
tion of the publishers.

JOAN TURNER JILL EUDY

☆  ☆  . 
Misses Turner And Eudy To Present Recital

Miss Joan Turner and Miss Jill 
Eudy, students of Mrs. Ross Her­
rington, will present a Senior Pi­
ano and Organ Recital Sunday, 
May 7, at 3:00 p.m. in the United 
Methodist Church in Turkey. 
There will be a reception follow­
ing.

Miss Turner is the 18-year-old 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Jan 
Turner. She has taken music for 
nine years and is a member of the 
National Fraternity of Student 
Musicians.

Miss Eudy is the 18-year-old 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Jay 
Eudy. She has taken music for 
nine years and is a member of the 
National Fraternity of Student 
Musicians.

The young ladies will present 
selections in classical, popular, 
country-western and gospel.

The girls will present individual 
selections plus piano duets and 
piano-organ duets. The public is 
invited to attend.

Gospel M eeting In 
Progress a t Quitaque 
Church of Christ

The Quitaque Church of Christ 
is hosting a series of gospel meet­
ings this week. May 3-7, with 
Bro. Ellmore Johnson of Lubbock 
doing the preaching.

3 ro . Johnson is a native of Tur­
key, and is son of the late Mr. 
and Mrs. Arthur Johnson. He is a 
graduate of Abilene Christian Uni­
versity. Bro. Johnson has worked 
with congregations in Medford, 
Oregon; Campbell, California; 
Robstown, Stanton and San An­
gelo, Texas before moving to work 
with the Quaker Avenue Church 
of Christ in Lubbock. While in 
Stanton, he also taught school and 
served as principal for several 
years. In San Angelo, Johnson 
taught in the San Angelo Bible 
College. He is a very knowledge­
able and capable teacher of the 
scriptures.

Your time would be well spent 
to come and listen to his messages 
from the Bible. Weeknight ser­
vices will be at 8:00 p.m. with a 
singing and ice cream fellowship 
planned for Friday liight after 
preaching. Sunday worship servic­
es will be at the regular time: 
10:30 a.m. and 6:00 p.m. Lunch is 
planned at the Community Center 
at noon on Sunday. Everyone is 
invited to attend any or all of 
these activities.

Piano Stndents Of Mrs. Herrington 
Drive To Memphis For Auditions

Twenty-seven Valley students 
from the class of Mrs. Ross Her­
rington journeyed to Memphis 
Thursday and Friday, April 27-28, 
to participate 4n the National 
Guild of Piano Teachers auditions. 
There are 80,000 piano pupils, 
from coast to coast, participating 
in this event annually.

Mrs. Clay Bennett was the 
judge Students performed four to 
ten pieces, all by memory. The 
students playing ten memorized 
pieces included Melissa Maupin, 
Cindy Griffin, Dana Ramsey, An­
gela Eudy, Melody Cruse, Karen 
Ramsey, Staohia Chadwick, Iva 
June Johnson, Joe Morrison and 
D’Vona Smith.

Other students playing in the 
auditions were Ronda Leeper, 
Criss Morrison, D’Anna Smith, 
Kaylene Green, Jill Eudy, Linda 
Coker, Bena Patrick, Card Morri­
son, Lacy Price, Jeff Fuston, San- 
di Lipscomb, Colvin Morrison, Ro­
bin Myers, Lori Clay, Michelle 
Robertson, Lisa Herrington and 
Judy Morrison.

One outstanding event of this 
year’s Guild was that Judy Morri­
son, the mother of Cari, Criss and 
Colvin, herself performed with 
high grades, along with her child-

f90 or above. The judge remarked 
that she had judged auditions all 
over Texas and Oklahoma pre­
viously, and that Cindy Griffin, 
making 99%, was the highest 
grade she had ever given.

All students who performed re­
ceived a pin, a diplolma and a 
report card. They were all regis­
tered as members of the National 
Fraternity of Student Musicians.

---------------------0---------------------

QUITAQUE METHODIST 

WOMEN MEET FOR STUDY

The WSCS of the Quitaqiie Me­
thodist Church met Monday, May 
1, in the home of Mrs. Thelma 
Loving. After a business meeting, 
Mrs. Sid Parsley finished a review 
of Women of the Bible.

In the business meeting, it was 
voted to change the meeting time 
to 8:00 p.m.

Everyone is asked to remember 
the Barbecue Saturday, May 6, 
from 6:00 to 8:00 p.m. (If you 
come in late to vote, plan to eat 
with the Methodist ladies.)

Frosted cokes were served to 
six members.

The next meeting will be in the 
home of Mrs. Jimmy Davidson on

New Image 

Shaping Up For 

Downtown Turkey
A new image is shaping up in 

Turkey for a western look for the 
fronts of businesses in the down­
town area. The beginning of the 
change came when Mrs. Byron 
(Sybil) Young when she redecor­
ated her building for her new 
business, “The Cotton Patch.” ' A 
sloping awning with a shingled 
roof was installed on the front 
of her building overhanging the 
window.

The next improvement for Tur­
key was the Turkey Implement 
with the same type of awning, 
adding a western look with the 
addition of a unique corral-type 
fence accented with cactus plants 
and the area rocked with big gyp 
rocks spaced at random at the 
entrance to their shop area.

and Mrs. Jack Barnhill.

Wills Day.

GREAT-GRANDDAUGHTER OF 
THE BUDDY MORRISES 
WINS FIRST PLACE

ren. Grades of all students were'Monday, May 15. [ 1320 relay.

BANK

W I T H  U S

Y O U R  C O K V E N I E N T

BANK
Peop les 

S ta te  B a n k

Saturday
is a very exciting day for the 

Conrad family!
Your support and your vote on Saturday, May 6 is earnestly 

solicited and will be appreciated very much.

CONRAD
DEMOCRAT FOR STATE REPRESENTATIVE

Common Sense in the Statehouse
Pol. Adv., Bob Byrd, Box 365, Claude, Texas ■

SHOP OUR, M ARKET FOR USDA C H O IC E M EATS, WE GUARANTEE 

EVERY CUT TO YOUR SA TISFA CTIO N
BLADE CUT

CHUCK ROAST lb. T
CENTER CUT

CHUCK STEAK lb.
BONELESS

CHUCK ROAST lb.
BONELESS

SHOULDER ROAST lb. M*”
ARM CUT

SW ISS STEAK lb. ’1“
BONELESS

SHOULDER STEAK lb.
LEAN AND TENDER

STEW MEAT lb. M ”
CHOICE '

SIRLOIN S M  lb.
CHOICE

ROUND STEAK lb.
CHOICE

T-BONE STEAK lb. *1“
s u e  SLAB BACON WrigbtBraml lb.
F R Y E R S  Grade‘A’ H e  Pwiid 49r!
F R Y E R  B R E A S T S  Pound 980
SHURFRESH BISCUITS 10 Count Can l O f r

PICK-O-THE-PATCH FRES
SUNKIST 1

ORANGES Z k . T
H FRU ITS AND VEGETABLES

TEXAS

CABBAGE k  100
WASHINGTON

WINESAP APPLES lb. 3 9 0
CALIFORNIA

CARROTS 2pkg.390
CALIFORNIA

AVOCADOS 4 F 1 ”
RUSSET

POTATOES 10 lb. 790

Phone 42M321
GUNN BROS. STAM PS

Turkey - Phone 423-1020
DOUBLE ON W EDNESDAY

Phone 455-1220 - Quilaque
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Young's Auto 
Supply

Phone 423-1111 Turkey, Texas

C O MP L E T E  A U T O M O T I V E  
R E P A I R S  a n d  P A R T S

We Also Feaiure Gulf Products

CU T HEA TIN G  & COOLING COSTS! 

INSULATION

Give Free Estimates 
Insulate Home or Business

MESSER
Memphis, Texas

ELECTRIC
Phone 259-3329

PLANTS, FLOWERS & THINGS
O PEN

10 a.m. to 5 p.m.
Now Have Vegetable Plants,

Tomatoes and Peppers
Cathy and Girls Main St., Quitaque

Phone 455-1475

BOB WILLS BAY HELD
SATURDAY IN TURKEY

Saturday, April 29, 1978, the 
Seventh Annual Bob WiUs Day 
Celebration got underway in Tur­
key at 10;30 a.m. with a big par­
ade. The welcome banner, sponsor­
ed by the parade committee, was 
carried by Todd Mills, Randy Lacy 
and Randy Fusion, followed by the 
flag bearers, Bruce Ferguson and 
Leckie Fuston.

Grand Marshall of the parade 
was Cindy Wills James, daughter 
of Bob Wills. She was riding in a 
1978 Corvette furnished by Grab- 
be-S&mpson Ohevrolet-Oldsmohdle. 
The car is the official Indianapolis 
500 pace car. It will be a collec­
tor’s item in a short time, cost 
projected to be $75,000.

Judges for the parade were Mr. 
and Mrs. Denny Fuston of Pan­
handle, Mr. and Mrs. Riley Harris 
of Silverton, W. E. Helms of Child­
ress, Earl Patrick of Quitaque and 
Melvin Bramlet of Plainview. Mrs. 
Don (Pat) House was chairperson 
in charge of the group.

The winners over some 40 en­
tries in the parade were Valley 
FFA, first; the San Antonio Rose 
float sponsored by the Bob Wills 
dance committee, second; and 
the Peoples State Bank float de­
corated in pink and blue with Re­
becca Reid of Silverton riding the 
float dressed in a white western 
suit and pink bat, third place.

The FFA boys had put some 100 
hours of work into readying these 
antique tractors for the parade.

The traditional San Antonio 
Rose float was riden by Rondalyn 
Crump.

The winners in the riding clubs 
division of the parade were Lub-

bock Saddle Club, first; Lamb 
County Sheriffs Posse, with ap­
proximately 15 riders, second, and 
Charro Riding Club of Plainwew, 
third.

Another float that caught at­
tention was the Bob Wills Queen 
float sponsored by the 24 mem­
bers of Alpha Rho Chi chapter of 
Beta Sigma Phi. The Bob Wills 
Queen, Melissa Greenhaw, daught­
er of Mr. and Mrs. Mabry Green­
haw of Silverton, was on the 
float along with Lezley Wofford 
of Lockney, first runner-up; Doris 
Tucker of Amherst, second run­
ner-up; Leslie Pigg of Quitaque, 
Miss Congeniality, and Melanie 
Huffman of Memphis, a finalist.

The parade was ended by the 
Turkey Fire Truck driven by Fire 
Chief Byron Young. Riding in the 
final entry was Betty Wills Sheets 
of Alvarado.

At the noon hour, barbecue was 
served to a crowd of 5,000 people, 
followed in the afternoon by Hoyle 
Nix, western swing band leader, 
playing an open air concert to a 
hand-clapping crowd. Nix, 60, 
made his first appearance at this 
festival honoring the “King of 
Western Swing” in 1973—the last 
year Wills appeared. Nix played 
a bright blue fiddle and led his 
six-piece western band in a two- 
hour performance. He first per­
formed with Wills at the Stam­
pede, a club in ‘ Nix’s home town. 
Big Spring, in 1952.

Nix often echoed Wills’ famous 
“Ah-<ha!” as his son, Jody, sang 
lead vocals and played drums.

Jody Nix was among the musi­
cians who played on Bob Wills’
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REPORT OF CONDITION
Consolidating domestiic subsidiaries of the First National Bank of Quitaque. In the state of Texas, at the 
close of business on March 31, 1978 published in response to call made by Comptroller of .the Currency, 

under title 12, United States O^e, Section 161. Charter number 11706 National Bank R ^ . No. 11
ASSETS Thousands

/’ash and due from banks ....................................... . ......................................................... 1,426
U, S. Treasury securities............................................................................................................. 885
Obligations of other U. S. Gov’t, agencies and corps...........................................................  800
Obligations of state and political subdivisions.......................................................................  2,406
Other bonds, notes, and debentures............................................................................................ None
Federal Reserve stock and Corporate stock...................... ...................................................  6
Trading account securities.............................................................   None
Federal Funds sold and securities purchased under agreements to resell.......... ............  1^025

Loans, Total (excluding unearned income)....................................................................... 7,207
Less: Reserve for possible loan losses..............................................................................None
Loans, Net.............................................................................................................................  7,207

Direct Lease financing...................................................................   None
Bank premises,.furniture and fixtures, and other assets representing bank premises... 20
Real estate owned other than bank premises......................................................... ................ None
Investments in unconsolidated subsidiaries and associated companies.............................  None
Customers’ liability to this bank on acceptances outstanding................................................ None
Other assets....................................................   None
TOTAL ASSETS    13,775

LIABILITIES
Demand deposits of individuals, prtnshps., and corps....................................................... • •
Time and savings deposits of individuals, prtnshps., and corps..........................................
Deposits of United States Government...................................................... .............................
Deposits of States and political subdivisions.................................. ........................................
Deposits of foreign govts, and official institutions.................................................................
Deposits of commercial banks........................................... .......................................................
Certified and officers’ checks.................................................................... ................................
TOTAL DEPOSITS ' ............ .............. ........ .....................

Total demand deposits..,......................................... ...........................................................4,725
Total time and saving deposits........................................................................................... 7,444
Total deposits in foreign offices............................................................................................

Federal funds purchased and securities sold under agreements to repurchase................
Liabilities for borrowed money...................................................................................................
Mortgage indebtedness............................................ ...................................................................
Acceptances executed by or for account of this bank and outstanding................................
other liabilities.............................................................................................................................
TOTAL DEPOSITS IN DOMESTIC AND FOREIGN OFFICES
TOTAL LIABILITIES (excluding subordinated notes and debentures)................................
Subordinated notes and debentures...........................................................................................

4,433
7,240

5
299

None
175
17

12,169

None
12.169 
None 
None 
None 
None 
None
12.169 
None

EQUITY CAPITAL
Preferred stock a. No. shares outstanding None (par value)....... .
Coipmon stock a. No. shares authorized 500

b. No. shares outstanding 500 (par value).......
Surplus ................................................................................................
Undivided profits.......................................................; ......... ...............
Reserve for contingencies and other capital reserves.................
rOTAL EQUITY CAPITAL........................................................................
rOTAL LIABILITIES AND EQUITY CAPITAL..................................

Nona

50
150
862
544

1,606
13,775

MEMORANDA
Average for 15 or 30 calendar days ending with call date:

Cash and due from banks............................................................. .........................
Fed. funds sold and securities purchased under agreement to resell.........
Total loans..............................................................................................................
Time deposits of $100,000 or more in domestic offices .................................. .
Total Deposits.................................................................................................... ..
Fed. funds purchased and securities sold under agreements to repurchase.
Liabilities for borrowed money............................................................................

Standby letters of credit outstanding as of report d ate .......... .............................
rime deposits of $100,000 or more in domestic offices:

Time certificates of deposit in denominations of $100,000. or more................
Other time deposits in amounts of $100,000 or more.......................................

1,367
1,288
6,992

625
12,224
None
None
13,790
None

421
204

1, Bob J. Ham, Vice-President of the above-named ba nk do hereby declare that this Report of Condition 
is true and correct to the best of my knowledge and belief.

Bob J. Ham
April 27, 1978

We, the uYtHArgignpd directors attest the correotness of this statement of resources and habilities. We de­
clare it has been PYamiTiipd by us, and to the best of our knowledge and belief is true and correct.

0. R. Stark, Jr. Directors
Orlin Stark 
J. T. Persons

last album, “For the Last Time.” 
He said he considers it a “great 
honor” to have performed on that 
album with Wills.

Following the program by Nix’s 
band, a group of South Plains Col­
lege students presented a program 
on the history of country mMsic, 
and included a set of numbers 
made famous by Wills.

As the band played “Faded 
Love,” Dr. Townsend, the West 
Texas State University professor 
who chronicled Bob Wills’ life, 
commented on Wills.

“Bob never played country mu­
sic,” Townsend said. “He recorded 
‘Faded Love’ to make fun of Nash­
ville. When it came out, he said 
he had never been to Nashville, 
but it became a big hit.”

While the afternoon’s perfor­
mances were going on outdoors 
under sunny skies, a fiddlers’ con­
test was going on in the auditor­
ium of the Bob Wills Center.

Dale Marsh of Decatur won first 
in the contest, Bartow Riley of 
Childress was second and David 
Cunningham of Paducah placed 
third.

Other winners were Merle Da­
vid of Odessa, fourth; Wilborn 
Turpin, Lubbock, fifth; Ray Da­
vid, Clarendon, rixth; Wes Nivens, 
Truth or Consequences, New Mex­
ico, seventh; Rickie Turpin of 
Lubbock, eighth; Rodney Smith, 
Waynoka, Oklahoma, ninth, and 
Rick Greiner of Amarillo, tenth.

Twenty fiddlers performed in 
the contest, the largest in the fes­
tival’s history.

-------------- 0---------  I

PR ESEN TED  SEN IO R  
PIANO  REC ITAL

Rondalyn Crump was presented 
in a senior piano recital Sunday, 
April 16, at the First Baptist 
Church in Turkey. The composi­
tions were selected from baroque, 
classical, romantic, impressionistic 
and contemporary periods.

Miss Crump is a student of Sam 
Brown, of Tulia.

Bena Patrick of Quitaque ac­
companied Miss Crump in a duet.

A reception was held following 
the program.

Approximately 90 guests atten­
ded from Fort Worth, Dallas, Mat­
ador, Lubbock, Amarillo, Silver-

Farmers Union 

News
by Buck Blakney 

We were honored Bob Wills 
Day with about an hour’s visit 
with Congressman Jack Hightow­
er. Ihe Congressman and Lee 
McMurtry, his assistant from Am­
arillo, rode in the parade. They 
did not stay for lunch because 
the Congressman had to return td 
Amarillo for a meeting. The Con­
gressman stated we would have a 
compromise farm bill out the last 
of this week, with a loan or floor 
on cotton at 48c per pound.

We were also honored with a 
visit by Senator Ray Farabee who 
won the Farmers Union Senator of 
the Year award in his freshman 
year. He was accompanied by Wil­
liam Bentson, area resource de­

ton, Tulia, Canyon, Friona, Quita­
que and Turkey.

velolpment specialist. Mr. Bentson 
has guided Turkey in our town de­
velopment program.

The Senator and Mr. Bentson 
spent about six hours in Turkey 
and seemed to enjoy every minute 
of their time. Mr. Bentson took 
slides of just about everybody 
and everything in Turkey. He 
wants to come back in about two 
months and sjiow these slides.

------------0---- -̂------

Mrs. Larry Farley and children, 
April and Cory, of Amarillo spent 
last week with the Wendell Far­
leys. Larry came for his family 
Friday and spent the weekend 
here, returning them home with 
him Sunday.

----------- 0-----------
Mrs. Frances Martin of Portal- 

es. New Mexico spent from Friday 
until Monday with her sister, Mrs. 
E. S. Stockton. Others joining 
them Sunday were the Orb Paynes 
and Freddie Stockton of Estelline 
and the Cecil Reagans.

TO TH E VOTERS O F PRECINCT 2

I would like to remind the voters

That Saturday Is Election Day.

I have tried to see every eligible

Voter In Precinct 2.

T h a ^ s  for the support and 
Cooperation you have given m e in the 
past. I feel 1 am  experienced, willing 

and  capable for the job.

Again, I would like to ask for 
your vote and support in the election 

to be held on May 6.

Thanks,

Orval Cobb

Pd. Pol. Adv. by Orval Cobb
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Health Systems 
Plan Adopted 

For 1978-79
The l^anhandle Health Systems 

Agency has adopted the first Pan­
handle Health Systems Plan for 
Health Service Area I and the 
Annual Implementation Plan 
1978-79. The Panhandle Health 
Systems plan and the annual im­
plementation plan 1978-79 are be­
ing placed in all community libra­
ries throughout the Panhandle.

The 'Panhandle Health Systems 
Agency has worked with health 
professionals, community leaders, 
and interested persons over the 
last 18 months to develop com­
prehensive health plans and strat­
egies. The HSP and AIP represent 
local planning efforts to help im­
prove and promote local health 
systems.

The Panhandle Health System’s 
plan is a five-year long-range study 
which describes and evaluates the 
health of area residents and the 
health care delivery system which 
serves them. The plan will be used 
to help develop and implement 
programs, projects, and plans that 
will help improve the health of 
residents in the 25-county area. 
The first health systems plan

looks closely at health education 
and information, prevention, can­
cer and heart disease, infant mor­
tality, mental health, and recruit­
ment of primary care profession­
als.

The annual implementation plan 
1978-79 is an annual action plan 
which draws from the goals and 
objectives of the health systems 
plan those programs and activities 
the community wishes to see achi­
eved during the coming year. The 
annual implementation plan ob­
jectives will be undertaken by 
many health professionals, organ­
izations, and agencies in this area. 
It is hoped that the successful 
implementation of these objectives 
will help reduce the number of 
health concerns in our area and 
help to improve and maintain a 
healthful environment.

The HSP and the AIP are also 
available by contacting the Pan­
handle Health Systems Agency of­
fices in the Amarillo Building, 
Suite 730, Third and Polk, Amar­
illo, Texas 79105. For more in­
formation call 806 372-3381.

—....... — 0__ __ ,

Clyde Patterson, brother of Mrs. 
J. A. McKay of Quitaque, is in a 
hospital in Wichita Falls suffer­
ing with double pneumonia. His 
wife called Mr. and Mrs. McKay 
early Sunday morning' and gave 
them the report.

PLANTS, FLO W ERS AN D  TH IN GS

We Have A Lot Of New Plants 

And Things 

T H E  FLO W ER  SHOP

Will be moving May 6 to next door.

I will then have a telephone in the building.

(Don’t forget. May 14, is Mother’s Day)

County Highway 

To Be Extended
Work in Briscoe County is in­

cluded in the 1978 Texas Farm to 
Market Road Program approved 
by the State Highway and Public 
Transportation Commission recent­
ly.

The work includes construction 
of a farm to market road to pro-' 
vide improved access to the Lake 
Mackenzie area. The Childress 
District is in charge of the portion 
of road to be constructed in Bris­
coe County which extends from 
the Swisher County Line East 2.1 
miles to State Highway 207. The 
road will be approximately four 
miles south of FM 146. The new 
road will have a 20’ wide asphalt 
surface. Estimated cost of the two 
mile section of new road in Bris­
coe County is $131,000. The por­
tion of the new road Swisher 
County will be supervised by the 
Lubbock District.

StateAvide, the program totals 
$20.9 million for construction on 
387.7 miles of Farm and Ranch to 
Market Roads in Texas.

The 1978 Texas Farm to Market 
Program includes 80.1 miles of 
new construction and funds for 
completion and the further devel­
opment of the remaining miles. 
In aU, the program includes 127 
projects in all sections of the 
state.

The Texas Farm to Market road 
network has been called one of 
the most sophisticated secondary 
road networks in the world. The 
all-paved system now extends 
more than 41,000 miles.

It has been cooperatively devel­
oped between the state and the 
counties. Projects are selected in 
consultation with county commis­
sioners courts. The counties are 
responsible for providing all the 
right of way for FM roads, while 
the state provides for construction

WE ARE PROUD TO
ANROVNCE

Fred Brannon will now be operating our 

Silverton office.

Fred says to drop by for a cup of cofffee. Coke, or

just for a chat.

In the field, we have a team of as qualified 

personnel as is available anywhere:
Rick Fangm an, our entomologist, is highly qualified, 

highly experienced in this field.

Rick Kellison is probably as well versed on 
soils and fertilizer needs as anyone in the area,

Jim  M artin is also highly qualified in soils, 
fertilizers and herbicide work.

Ralph Pedigo, our pilot, is a  very capable m an - 
in the aerial spraying business.

Bill Evans will also be available to serve you. H e has 
m any years experience in all phases of ag 

chemicals and fertilizers.

Just let Fred know if we can be of service to you in any 
way and we will have a man in touch with you 

immediately to assist you with any problem you have.

W e have all types of farm  chemicals, aerial and ground 
application, Na-Churs Liquid Fertilizer, Anhydrous 
Ammonia, and  other liquid blends will be available

soon. '

We have the following seed available:
NCT, Funk’s, Pioneer, PAG, Taylor-Evans (G olden 

A cres), Brownie, Coffee Seeds.

Call on Fred at the office, across the street from the 
International house, or call collect to Lockney.

Main Office 
Dcanie Henderson 
Rick Kellison

806-652-2761
806-652-3434
806-652-3504

Jim Martin 
Bill Evans 
Silverton Office

806-652-3594
806-652-3765
806-823-2376

LONE STAR CHEMICAL, INC.
DEANIE HENDERSON

'Fm  around and also available but I  am not. an expert at anything!"

Neta Landry, Kathy Landry and 
Patricia Price of Amarillo visited 
in the home of Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
Hill over the weekend.

-----------0--------------
. Dick Shepherd and son, Frank, 
of Ohanning, another son. Red, of 
Amarillo and Sam Elliott of Am­
arillo were guests in the home of 
Mrs. Frankie Bell and Cody over 
the weekend.

----------- 0-----------
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Fields and 

daughter, Nancy, and Miss Karen 
Ekidy of Fritoh visited their par­
ents over the weekend. Nancy re­
mained this week to visit with her 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. Tom

Eudy.

and maintenance.
In addition to providing routes 

for the movement of agricultural 
production to market and the dis­
tribution of goods and supplies 
needed by farmers and ranchers, 
many FM roads provide access to 
industrial plants and serve as ru­
ral mail routes and school bus 
routes.

In addition, much of the system 
also serves as recreational roads, 
providing access to lakes and oth­
er recreational areas.

Mrs. Floyce Hanna prepared a 
delicious birthday dinner for her 
husband last Sunday, and the 
Make Hannas, their daughter, 
Glenda, her children, J. Dale and 
Carrie, were in Hereford for the 
weekend to assist with the honors. 
Sunday, Mr. and Mrs. Dane Bal- 
lew and Mrs. Donny Miller and 
children, Michelle and Cory, of 
Amarillo, daughters and grandchil­
dren of the Floyce Hannas come 
and enjoyed the day.

Visitors in the home of Mrs. 
Ruth Ware for the weekend were 
Mr. and Mrs. J. V. Mohon of Whit­
ney and their children, Mr. and 
Mrs. Roy Chitty of Stephenville, 
Mr. and Mrs. Vickie Mohon and 
girls of Hurst; Mr. and Mrs. Jess 
Meacham of Amarillo and their 
children, Joe Burton of Los Ala­
mos, New Mexico and Pam Mea­
cham of Albuquerque; and Ruth’s 
daughter and children, Mr. and 
Mrs. Doyle Purcell and their dap- 
ghter, Mr. and Mrs. Lewis Vaughn 
of Stinnett, and another daughter, 
Mrs. Hoyt Key and children of 
Fritch.

A PROVEN LEADER. 
QUALIFIED BY EDUCATION. 

EXPERIENCE. INDEPENDENCE 
AND INTEGRITY TO SERVE AS 

LAWYER FOR THE PEOPLE 
OF TEXAS.

LEADERSHIP
As Speaker of the Texas House of Representatives, Price DaAiel, 
Jr. led the successful effort to achieve reforms in State govern­
ment after the Sharpstown scandals. This resulted in the strongest 
and most effective legislation in the nation on:

* Governmental ethics and personal financial disclosure by 
public officials

* Campaign finance disclosure
* Open meetings of governmental bodies
* Lobby control and regulation
* Freedom of information and open records.

Price Daniel, Jr., a proven leader with a positive record 
achievement for Texas.

PoL Xdv, Fd. for by  Price D aniel, Jr., for Attorney General 
Houston Daniel, T reasurer, P. O. Box 13332, Austin, Texas 78711

Memorial Day Is Appropriate 
Time To Give Gift Of Life

Mrs. Peggy Fleimng, Memorial 
Chairman for the Briscoe County 
Unit of the American Cancer So­
ciety reminds all Silverton resi­
dents that Memorial Day is an es­
pecially appropriate time to give 
a Gift of Life dn memory of a 
loved one.

Mr. and Mrs. Wesly Woods of 
Pladnview spent the weekend with 
the Buster Chadwicks and the Carl 
Woods.

Mrs. Buster Chadwick and Mrs. 
Guy Smith were in Lubbock on 
business Saturday.

Memorial gifts to the American 
Cancer Society support programs 
of research to find a cure for can­
cer, public and professional edu­
cation, and services for cancer pa­
tients and their families.

Contributions made in memory 
of a friend or a member of the 
family are acknowledged by the 
American Cancer Society, and a  
memorial card is sent to the fam­
ily stating that a memorial gift 
has been received and giring the 
name of the donor. The contribu­
tions may be in any amount and 
should be sent to Mrs. Peggy Flem­
ing, Box 98, Silverton, Texas 
79257.

John Hill Opposes 
State Income Tax
When he announced for Governor, Attorney General 
John Hill said that he would oppose - 7  and would 
veto —  a state income tax or any other new tax bill. 
He has repeated that pledge many times sihce. Any­
one who says that Hill would .support a  state income 
tax is just trying to mislead the public.

A s Attorney General, John Hill cleaned up political 
corruption in Duval County, sued the phone company 
to stop an increase in rates and worked for a  national 
energy policy that would be fair to Texas.

A s Governor, John Hill will use the state’s budget 
surplus to reduce property taxes and to help pay 
more of the cost of our public schools. There will be 
no state income tax and no other new taxes if Hill is 
elected Governor.

**************************** 
GOVERNOR

Paid for by the John Hill Campaign Fund, Lowell Lebenmann, Treasurer, 
1035 Brown Bldg., Austin, Tx. 78701, Phone (512) 478-6489.

i l LET'S KEEP

THE GOVERNMENT  

(At All Levels)

OUT OF THE

/ /CATTLE BUSINESS

SAYS

F O S T E R  W H A L E Y
Democmfic Candidate 

For State Representative
MATURITY OF JUDGMENT 

A PROVEN RECORD OF 
ACCOMPLISHMENTS

FOSTER W HALEY as County A gricultural A gent used his boots on a couple of 
bureaucrats; one tried  to close'down a  cotton gin, the other tried  to sell compulsory 
soil and w ater conservation to the local soil conservation district.

FOSTER W HALEY was the first to a le r t Texas’ m ajor farm  organizations of this 
statew ide effort. He wrote the resolution fo r his local farm  organization’s opposing 
compulsory soil and w ater conservation.

IN TH E PEN ABOVE, Foster W haley hedged  the first cattle ever hedged in G ray 
County, and among the first ever hedged south of the C anadian Rivei*. He then 
taught this technique to thousands of feed lot m anagers, cattle feeders, farm ers and  
4-H members. M any 4-H Members a ttended  college on profits earned  from  his 
help.

FOSTER W HALEY, as S tate Representative, will continue to boot any bureau­
cra t in S tate Government who gets over zealous in regulating our industries, or­
ganizations and agriculture.

Vote For A Record Not A Promise 
Foster Whaley, Democratic Caodiiiate 

For State R^reseotative
Subject to the May 6th Democratic Primary 

Paid Political Adv. by booster Whaley, Route 1, Pampa



ASSEMBLY OF GOD CHURCH

Quitaque, Texas 

Pastor: Rev. Frank Postelle 

Weekly Schedule of Meetings

SUNDAY:
Sunday School------  10:00 a.m.
Morning Worsihip —  11:00 a.m. 
Evening W jrsh ip___ 7:00 p.m.

WEDNESDAY:
Prayer Mee t in g --------- 7:45 pjn.

☆

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH

Quitique, Texas 

Pastor: Rev. Frank Roberson 

Weekly Seh<«dule cf Meetings

SUNDAY:
Sunday School----------9:45 ajn.
Morning Worsihip —  11:00 a,m.
Training Un io n --------- 5:30 pjm.
Evening W orship------ 6:30 p.m.

WEDNESDAY
Prayer Mfeeting___ 8:00 pjn.

☆

CHURCH OF CHRIST
Quitaque, Texas 

Minister: Elgin Oonneir 
Weekly Schedule of Meetings

SUNDAY:
Morning W orship__ 10:30 a.m.
Evening Worsihip_____6:00 pjn.

WEDNESDAY:
Bible S tudy_________ 7:00 p.m.

FLOMOT BAPTIST CHURCH .

Flomot, Texas
Pastor: Rev. Raymond Crowder 

Weekly Schedule of Meetings
SUNDAY:

Sunday School_______10:00 ajn.
Worship Service_____ 11:00 a.m.
Church Training______6:00 p.m.
W orship____________ 7:00 p.m.

WEDNESDAY:
Prayer Meeting_______7:30 p.m.

FAIRMONT BAPTIST CHURCH

South of Quitaque 
Weekly Schedule of Meetings

SUNDAY:
Sunday School--------10:30 ajn.
Morning W orship__ 11:00 ajn.
Evening ly^orship ____ 7:00 p.m.

UNITED METHODIST CHURCH
Flomot, Texas 

Sidney Parsley, Pastor 
Weekly Schedule of Meetings'
Sunday Worsihip___ 9:30 a.m.

SUNDAY:
Sunday School____ 10:30 ajn.

UNITED METHODIST CHURCH
Quitaque, Texas 

Pastor: Sidney Parsley 
Weekly Schedule of Meetings

SUNDAY:
Sunday School____ 10:00 ajn.
Morning W orship____11:00 a.m.
Evening W orship____ 6:00 pjn.

☆
First & Jago

j e h o v a Vi 's  w it n e s s e s
Quitaque, Texas

SUNDAY:
Public BiMe Lecture__10:00 ajn.
Watohtower Study____11:00 a.m.

TUESDAY:
Bible Study__________ 8:00 pjn.

THURSDAY:
Ministry Sdhooil_____ 8:00 pjXL
Service Meeting_____9:00 pjn.

The people whose names appear below sponsor this message with the hope 
of promoting a belter Christian communitif.

Stark  Insurance Co. 

F irst N ational Bank 

Quitaque E levator 

Farm ers Co-op Gin 

Royers

V alley Farm  Store 

Farley^s Flowers - V ariety

H am  Theatres 

Rice Dry Goods 

Moore and  Rose, 

Bill and  M able G riffin 

Gulf Oil Products 

Stephens Ins. Agency 

City of Quitaque

Sportsm an R estaurant 

W ilm a's Grocery 

H errington Equipt. Co.

G riffin Gulf Service 

Hawkins Ins. and  Fum . 

Caprock Gin Co.

Jim  and A llie M ae Taylor
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Survey Shows Cattle Being
In Near Peak Numbers

According to Sam Thomas, man­
ager of agriculture development 
for Southwestern Public Service 
Company, 4,373,850 fat cattle were 
produced in the SPS service area 
for 1977. This production, revealed 
in a recent survey conducted by 
SPS, is the third highest in the 
history of the industry.

The survey which has been con­
ducted since 1963 is quoted 
throughout the United States as 
the most authoritative source as 
to production of fat cattle in the 
southern great plains area.

“During the 1977 period, the 
feedlot capacity came to 2,734,740 
head and is barely 10,000 head un­
der the peak year of 1974 when 
2,742,250 capacity was in use. This 
dropped to a low of 2.6 million in 
1976 and present indications are 
that the 1978 year will see a new 
peak in feedlot capacity use,” 
stated Thomas.

The survey . also revealed that j 
the 1978 feedyards doing custom 
feeding was one less than the 
preceeding year but that this rep­
resented the consolidation of re­
porting yards. The total number 
of yards surveyed continued to 
fall with a reduction of six from 
last year. This too, reflects a con­
solidation but is the eleventh year 
it has occurred. There were 274 
yards counted in 1967 as compar­
ed to 153 in 197S!

“The total impact of the feed- 
yard industry on the business com­
munity reached eight billion dol­
lars in 1977,” Thomas stated, “and 
the farm sale value exceeded two 
billion dollars.”

The survey al^o showed that the 
packing plant annual slaughter 
capacity jumped from 4,990,680

to 5.4 million head and the num­
ber of plants increased from 17 
to 20. Thomas also stated that 
589,000 of this capacity is not in 
use but that this industry has 
made another estimated eight bil­
lion dollar contribution to area 
business.

“The future of the feedlot. in­
dustry appears to be the brightest 
of any period in its history, and 
this may not be good. Too many 
people believe this and with great 
majority acting together adverse 
reactions can occur. The price 
being paid for feeder cattle is a 
case in point,” emphasized Tho­
mas.

Eventually the customer must 
be considered as to what he will 
do and we could have poor profits 
along with good prices if the cus­
tomer refuses to go along with all 
this enthusiasm, Thomas said.

This survey has made a major

Mr. and Mrs. Dale Wilks of 
WMte Settlement near Fort Worth 
visited in the home of her father, 
Preston Jouett.

--------- 0---------
Mrs. Jeanett Judd and son, Ja­

son, of Amarillo visited Sunday 
with her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Boyd Lane.

----------- 0-----------
Mr. and Mrs. Richard Irby and 

children of Tulsa, Oklahoma and 
Dennis Irby of Dallas spent the 
weekend visiting with their par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Reddell Irby. 

--------- o---------
Wayne Pinkerton of Cottonwood, 

Arizona and Morris Pinkerton of 
Las Vegas, Arizona attended the 
Bob Wills Celebration and visited 
with Mr. and Mrs. Dale Garner 
and other friends while in Tur­
key for the weekend.

----------- o----------
Danny Mayfield of Clarendon 

College and a friend spent Satur­
day night with the John Kings.

contribution to the development
and growth of the industry and
has been especially valuable in 
the vertical integration that has 
occurred in the SPS service area, 
concluded Thomas.

G O S P E L  M E E T I N G
May 3-7

CHORCH OF CHRIST
Qyifague, Texas

Week Hight!_ _ _ _ _  _ _ 8:00 p.m.
Sunday_ _ _ 10:30 a.m. & 6:00 p.m.

Elimore Johnson of Lubbock Speaker 
Everyone Invited To Attend

F OSTE R W H A L E Y
OEMOCRATIC CANDiOATE FOR 
STATE REPRESENTATIVE FOR 

eetli OISTRICT
Would Like To Present The Whaley Family

Standing (left to right)
/

Karlette Kay, Senior, Pampa High School;

Wayne Jay, Junior, Texas A& M University;

Christie Ann, 1977 Graduate, Texas A&M University, 
Presently High School English Teacher, Bryan, Tex.

(Seated) Lois, Wife, a Graduate of North Texas State 
University and a former Second Grade Teacher;

Poster, a Graduate of Texas A&M, Farmer, Rancher 
and Retired County Extension Agent.

If Lois and Foster missed you in the big 10-county 66th 
District in the Democratic campaign, we hope we can 
see you before the fall election.

Your vote on May 6 and your influence will be greatly
appreciated.

Paid Political Adv. by Foster Whaley, Route 1, Pampa



JINTADS
For Sale: 25 weaner pigs, $35.00 
each in lots of two or three; will 
give better price if sold in lot of 
25. Leroy Hamilton, Ph. 455*1215, 
Quitaque, Texas. 46-2tc

For Sale: Used Side Roll Sprink* 
lers. Call 983-5231 day, or 983- 
5367 night. 46-4tc

Wanted: Graze-out Wheat Pasture. 
Call 469-5322 or 455-1196. 47-tfc 
Planting Seed: PAG, Acco, NCT, 
Funk's, Golden Acres, Red Top 
Cane  ̂ Hegari, Browning. Lone Star 
Chemical, Inc., Phone Main Office, 
806-652-2761; Deanie Henderson, 
806-652-3434; Rick Kellison, 806- 
652-3504; Jim Martin, 806-652-3594; 
Bill Evans, 806-652-3765; Silverton 
Office, 806-823-2376. Call collect.

46-tfc

INSULATION: Fire Resistant, In­
stalled and Guaranteed. Marr In­
sulation Co. Phone 652-3593, Lock* 
ney, Texas, or call J. W. Lancaster, 
423-1336. 39-tfe

Germania Farm Mutual Aid As­
sociation: reasonable, sound pro* 

.party insurance. If you want to 
save, contact Mrs. Orville Lee, 
Flomot. Cali 806-469-5370. 44-26tp

B IL L  E B B S  
PU M P  & M A C H IN E

Plainview, Texas 
Any brand pump pulled and 

Repaired, Casing Pulled, 
Wells Perforated, etc.

We Enjoy Working Around 
Quitaque

806-296-7017 P. 0. Box 344

For your hearing aid needs and 
service, check your teiephone yel­
low pages. No. 7. Have served 
this area for 14 years. 39-4tc

THE YARN SHOP
“Something for Everyone-”

W. E. Schott Res. 406 Briscoe 
Silverton, Texas

43-tfc

For Wedding, Anniversary and 
Special Occasion Cakes, call Ruby 
Kitchens, Ph. 806-847-2511, Silver- 
ton, Texas. 44-4tc

UN O IRO IIO U N D
Aabeatf - Camont for main liM  
sprinkler pipe. A ll sisee plesHe 
^pe fer wafer end ges. Rhode 
Pipe Co., Phone 82S-2458. Res. Now
823-2149, Silverton, Texas. 17-tfe

DEALERS WANTED  
To handle a major line of pre­
engineered steel bins and build­
ings. Lucrative opportunity for the 
right person. Aggressive farm op­
erator considered. Cali 800-835* 
2246. 45-3tc

For Sale: Four items by Wayne 
Hunter at Flomot, Ph. 469-5240. 1. 
Dandy '72 Va ton Chev. pickup 
with propane system and/or cam­
per. Asking $1750. 2. Good used 
Payne central heating unit, $145. 
80,000 BTU. 3. Used Whirlpoor el­
ectric cook-top. $25. 4. Used
O'Keefe & Merritt gas oven (built- 
in type) $35. 45-2tc

WWWVtfWVWVWWWVS^'^W

For Sale: Moore's Nursery, store 
building, greenhouse with irriga­
tion well, 3-bedroom house two 
years old on 306'x140' located on 
256 in Memphis, Texas. 46-4tc

Singer Sewing Machines, Vacuum 
Cleaners, Smith Corona Typewrit­
ers and Adding Machines. Buy 
here, service here. Call in Quita­
que, 455-1101, or 423-1149 in Tur­
key, or 259-2716 in Memphis. Of­
fice located at 620 Noel in Mem­
phis. Here every two weeks on 
Thursdays. 35-tfc

PO L IT IC A L  AN N O U N C EM EN TS

Subject to Action of the 
Republican Primary 

FOR STATE REPRESENTATIVE, 
66th DISTRICT OF TEXAS: 

W IL L IA M  R. (B ILL ) H A LE  
 ̂ Floydada, Texas

Owner please come claim a short 
handle spade that I took from a 
pickup on Main Street in Turkey 
to use. Jack Lacy. 46-2tc

Herbicide Work available at Lone 
Star Chemical. Phone Main Office, 
806-652-2761; Deanie Henderson, 
806-652-3434; Rick Kellison, 806- 
652-3504; Jim Martin, 806-652-3594; 
Bill Evans, 806-652-3765; Silverton 
Office, 806-823-2376. Ground and 
Aerial Application; Fast, Depen­
dable Service. Will accept all col­
lect calls. 46-tfc

TOLE PAINTERS: Beautiful wood 
and tinware items for painting. 
Pattern Books, Supplies. CHRIS- 
TEEN'S HOBBY HUT, Flomot, 
Texas. 47-4tp

TUPPERWARE PARTY To be 
held at the First National Bank 
Community Room in Quitaque Sat­
urday, May 6, at 2 p.m. Anyone 
having Tupperware that is damag­
ed, bring it with you. Everyone 
invited. Henrietta Scoggins. 47-1tc

* SEW IN G  M A C H IN E  

S E R V IC E  C E N T E R

m s .  Main Street 

Lockney, Texas 

Phone 652-2721 Day 

983-2068 Night 

1 Day Service on Repair 

New & Used Machine SaJes 

& Service

New Home Machines

Morning Worship __  11:00 a.m.
Evening Worship .... 6:30 p.m.
Sunday School ........ ^10:00 a.m.
Church Training .......  5:30 p.m.

Mid-Week Prayer Service 
Wednesday 8:00 p.m.

F IR ST  BA PT IST  CHURCH  
Second and Morris St. 

F R A N K  RO BERSO N  Pastor 
PAU L N E W B E R R Y  

Music and Youth

HEARING TESTS 

SET FOR 

SENIOR CITIZENS

Electronic hearing tests will be 
given at the Quitaque Community 
Center on Tuesday, May 9, from 
10:00 a.m. to 12:00 noon.

Factory - trained Hearing Aid 
Specialists will be at the center 
at First & Jones Streets to per­
form the tests.

Anyone who has trouble hear­
ing or understanding is welcome 
to have a test using the latest 
electronic equipment to determine 
if his loss is one which can be 
helped. Some of the causes of hear­
ing loss will be explained, and 
diagrams of how the ear works 
will be shown.

Everyone should have a hearing 
test at least once a year if there 
is any trouble at all hearing clear­
ly. Free service is available for 
all makes of hearing aids. Every­
one wearing a hearing aid should 
have it serviced regularly.

The free hearing test wUl be 
given Tuesday from 10 a.m. to 
12 noon at the Community Center 
in Quitaque. If you can’t get there 
on Tuesday, call 455-1456 and ar­
range for an appointment at anoth­
er time. In-home testing is also 
available.

BELTONE
7th & Ash Plainview, Texas

PO L IT IC AL A N N O U N C EM EN TS

Subject to Action of the 
Democratic Primary 

FOR TEXAS SENATE, 30th DIS­
TRICT:

R A Y  F A R A B E E
Wichita Falls, Texas 

(Re-election)

FOR u n i t e d  s t a t e s  REPRES­
ENTATIVE, 13th DISTRICT OF 
TEXAS:

JA CK  H IGH TO W ER
Vernon, Texas 

(Re-election)

FOR STATE REPRESENTATIVE, 
66th LEGISLATIVE DISTRICT 
OF TEXAS:

FO STER  W H A LEY  
Pampa, Texas 

G LEN  CONRAD  
Claude, Texas

FOR COUNTY' JUDGE, HALL 
COUNTY, TEXAS:

L E S T E R  H. C A M P B E L L
Memphis, Texas

For Your Flower and Variety Needs
SH O P A T

f i R i m  flO W ER S 4  VARIETY
P H O N E  455-1410 Q U IT A Q U E , T E X A S

COURTEOUS SERVICE
PHONE 455-1361

OZEAN’S MOBIL SERVICE 
Qujtaque, Texas

Dr. 0. R. McIntosh 
O P T O M E T R I S T

316 Pouth Main Phone 983-3460
T pioydada, T exas

ELAINE'S BEAUTY SHOPPE 

Phone 455-1305

Open Wednesday Through Saturday 
Operators, Elaine, Barbara and Lolla Belle

FOR JUSTICE OF PEACE, PRE­
CINCT FOUR, HALL COUNTY, 
TEXAS:

CURTIS TUNNELL
(Re-election)

FOR COMMISSIONER, HALL 
COUNTY PRECINCT FOUR: 

J A M E S  FUSTON  
(Re-election)

D A L E  G A R N E R

FOR COUNTY AND DISTRICT 
CLERK, HALL COUNTY, TEXA5: 

P H Y L L IS  DUNN  
(Re-election)

Memphis, Texas

FOR COMMISSIONER, BRISCOE 
COUNTY PRECINCT TWO: 

O RV A L COBB  
(Re-election)

JACK  C H A N D L E R  
L E R O Y  HA M ILTO N

FOR COUNTY AND DISTRICT 
CLERK, BRISCOE COUNTY, 
TEXAS:

B ESS  M C W ILL IA M S
(Re-election)

FOR TREASURER, BRISCOE 
COUNTY, TEXAS:

M IL D R E D  R E ID
(Re-election)

FOR JUDGE, BRISCOE COUNTY, 
TEXAS:

FRED MERCER
Silverton, Texas

FOR JUSTICE OF THE PEACE, 
BRISCOE COUNTY PRECINCT 2. 

D IC K  TAYLO R

FOR COUNTY SCHOOL SUPER­
INTENDENT, HALL COUNTY, 
TEXAS:

TOPS G ILR E A T H
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CARD OF THANKS
We want to thank the wonderful 

people of Quitaque who were so 
thoughtful during the illness and 
death of our brother and uncle, 
Toby Honea.

Thank you for the beautiful 
funeral service, the good food, 
the beautiful flowers and the 
words of comfort. May God bless 
each of you in a special way.

Odis and Polly Honea '
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Self 

and David
Mr. and Mrs. Thomas Self 

and family

MRS. TANT TO BE HONORED 

AS MOTHER OF THE YEAR

“We the Women” of Quitaque 
wish to honor Mrs. Gordon (Della) 
Tant by naming her Mother of 
the Year.

The community is invited to 
help congratulate Mrs. Tant.

Gifts to honor her have been 
selected at Rice Dry Goods, Val­
ley Drug and Gifts, Farley’s Var­
iety, and the Caprock Home Cen­
ter. Individual gifts may be left 
with Delene Tyler at West Texas 
Utilities Company. All gifts will 
be delivered on Sunday, May 14, 
in an attempt to surprise Mrs. 
Tant on Mother’s Day.

-----------0--------------
BELLRINGERS SELECTED FOR 
AREA MENTAL HEALTH DRIVE  
Dear Editor:

Today we know that mental ill­
ness can be prevented in many 
cases. We can do this through edu­
cation, especially of parents, and 
by learning to cope with stress 
There is a group of citizens, like 
ourselves, trying to see that this 
happens-^the Mental Health Asso­
ciation.

During May, Mental Health 
Month, your neighbor will be com­
ing to your door to collect for 
mental health. We urge you to 
give generously.

The Mental Health Association 
needs your support because men­
tal illness can be cured; the cycle 
of child abuse can be stopped; ed­
ucation of parents can prevent 
some emotional problems in child 
ren.

Your support is needed to ac­
complish this.

Bellringers are Wanda Payne, 
Elizabeth ’ McDonald, Henrietta 
Scoggins, Gladys Stroup and Janet 
Turner.

Very truly yours,
Mrs. James F. Bailey,

Quitaque
Mrs. Connie Dvorak, Turkey 
Mental Health Chairpersons

----------- 0-----------
Mr. and Mrs. Randy Stark of 

Plainview and Samantha Stark of 
Canyon were visitors over the 
weekend with Mr. and Mrs. O. R. 
Stark, jr.

— ------- 0----------
Mr. and Mrs. L. W. Hamilton 

spent the weekend visiting Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe Hamilton in Lubbock.

Mr. and Mrs. Don Weems and 
daughter of Crosbyton visited the 
Leroy Hamiltons Saturday after­
noon.

from 
double 

disasterl

A property loss Is bad 
Enough. But having to 
replace that property 

with your own savings becomes a double disaster. 
That's why you should eliminate gaps In your 
insurance program. The best way to do this is with 
our exclusive FARM AND RANCH POLICY.

This policy takes virtually everything you own 
and tailors it into one convenient protective package 
. . .  and offers you savings in the bargain!

Your home, garage, furniture and furnishings, 
clothing and personal possessions can be covered.
So can your barns and other buildings, your farm 
machinery, equipment, livestock, and other farm 
personal property. In most states, even your cars and 
vehicles may come under the protective reach of this 
dynamic approach to the complex insurance needs 
of farmers and ranchers. Don't delay! Start protecting 
your financial future by calling us today. We will be 
pleased to give you the full details without obligation.

Stark Insurance Agency
Phone 455-1100 Quitaque, Texas

EVA CHEATHAM

☆
ELECTED PRESIDENT OF 
STUDENT GOVERNMENT  
AT W AYLAND COLLEGE

Eva Trene Cheatham, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. W. W. Cheatham 
of Quitaque, was recently elected 
president of the Student Govern­
ment Association for 1978-79 at 
Wayland Baptist College in Plain- 
view.

A 1975 graduate of Valley High 
School, Miss Cheatham is a junior 
majoring in physical education 
and miiwring in history. She plans 
to teach after graduation.

Miss Cheatham is active in Stu­
dent Foundation and Fellowship 
of Christian Athletes, and is a 
member of the nationally-ranked 
Wayland’s womens basketball 
team, the Hutcherson Flying 
Queens.

----------- o-----------
Mr. and Mrs. Mike Bloxom and 

daughters from San Antonio are 
here visiting her parents, the Don­
nie Brunsons. They are in the 
process of relocating since he has 
finished his service with Uncle 
Sam.

Mr. and Mrs. Ehno Edmonds 
hosted a barbecue Tuesday night 
O'f last week for the senior class 
of Valley High School. Some of 
the parents helped Mrs. Edmonds 
by sending salads to add to the 
menu. Twenty^x seniors and 
their sponsors, Mr. and Mrs. U. F. 
Coker, jr., were present.

--------- 0------------
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Curry atten­

ded the Home Decorator Seminar 
at Dallas from April 17 through 
April 20. They heard Billy Gra­
ham, W. A. Criswell, Bob Hope 
and Tom Lester from the “Green 
Acres” show speak. Mrs. Curry 
says it was very inspiring.

Mr. and Mrs. Carl Wayne Lewis 
and grandson and friends of Al­
pine were dinner guests of his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Earl Lewis, 
in Quitaque Saturday evening. 
They also spent Sunday visiting 
here.

A  GO O D  LINE OF

G rata  and Nidiols Sweeps
ARE NOW  AVAILABLE AT

. S i M n  Metal Woiis 
SPECIAL DISCOUNT PRICE

TELL M OTHER YOU LOVE HER
on Mother’s Day 

May 14 .
W ITH  A CORSAGE, BOUQUET, OR 

PO T PLANT.

CALL EARLY 
Phone 455-1410

Farley’s Flowers and Variety
Quitaque, Texas 79255
— MM— — j nrnr— j—

MOTHER'S DAY GIFT 
19 Piece Stainless Steel 

WATERLESS COOKWARE
SUPER SAVINGS

JUST A FEW SETS AVAILABLE  

MAKE OFFER 

Call 806-799-1465 before 9 a.m.

Sale on Now

S E D 6 E F I E L D S  
Always 20% Off al 

BOOT HILL WESHRN STORE
on Main Street in 

Lockney

r  Think 1  
' rilfu rh o n th e

io n d  w atch t .V

Sounds strange, doesn’t it? No one ever thinks 
about the role electricity plays in making most of our 

activities possible. But without it, our lives would 
come to a virtual standstill.

At West Texas Utilities Company, we don’t expect 
you to think of electricity directly each time you turn 

on the T.V. or cook dinner or wash clothes. But maybe, 
every once in a while; you’ll think of what it takes to 

make your life so comfortable.
W e’ve aimed our sights in but one direction, year 

after year —  to meet your needs. You may not always think 
of us, but we’re always thinking of you. Because electricity 
is such a versatile energy source, it will play an increas­

ingly important role in all our lives.
So, when you think about the comforts and necessities 

of your life, think about WTU. W e’re dedicated to providing 
you with a reliable supply of electricity. We hope you’ll 

use it wisely.

WEST TEXAS UTILITIES COMPANY

A Member of The Central and South West System

Remember, Reddy supplies the energy, but only you can use it wisely!


