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A Tribu te  to  the B ronte C lass of 1991
The Bronte Senior Class of 

1991 will graduate in com­
mencement exercises Friday, 
May 24, at 8 pm in the school 
auditorium.

The Processional "Pomp 
and Circumstance" played by 
Mrs. Ida Lee Ellis will be fol­
lowed by the Invocation given 
by Misty Golson.

Bronte High School Princi­
pal Albert Johnson will pre­
sent the awards, followed by 
the Valedictory by Lee Son- 
nenberg and the Salutatory 
by Melissa Bivins.

Ms. Rebecca Papazian will 
give the address to the Se­
niors and their guests. She is 
known in the San Angelo area 
as an outstanding motivational 
speaker.

Following the awarding of 
the diplomas, the Seniors will 
present a slide show entitled 
"The Dance" which includes 
scenes from their past.

John Thomas will conclude 
the evening w ith the 
Benediction.

Members of the 1991 Se­
nior Class include Brian Lee 
Arrott, Rosemare Lynn Bald­
win, Melissa Bivins, Julie Ruth 
Blair, Sean P. Conway, Misti 
Ensor Cotton, Susan Gail 
Culp, Angela Reyes Davis, 
Misty Michelle Golson, Sherry 
Lynn Healey, Billy Magness, 
Brandon Marshall, Debra Ann 
Montez, Justin Wade Phillips, 
Jason Frank Pierce, Stephen 
Shults, Tim Sims, Bruce Lee 
Sonnenberg, Eboni Marita

8th Grade Promotions
Twenty-two Bronte 8th 

graders will advance from ju­
nior high into high school at 
Promotional Exercises Satur­
day, May 25, at 4 pm in the 
school auditorium.

The Prelude will be provid­
ed by Mr. David Phillips, fol­
lowed by Jill Johnson giving 
the Invocation. Albert John­
son, tJrbnie Nfyit oCnGGr 
Principal, will welcome the 
students and their guests and 
a poetry reading will then be 
given by Micah Arrott and 
Jessica Salser.

Laura Thomas, First Honor 
Student, and John Johnson, 
Second Honor Student, will 
be given their awards by Mr. 
Johnson and Miss Thomas will 
speak.

Michael Hartman, Superin­
tendent of Bronte Schools, 
will present the class with their 
diplomas.

Chris McPherson will con­
clude the exercises with the 
Benediction.

Class members include 
Micah Ann Arrott, JonI Sue 
Barrett, Jon Clint Brasher, 
Lindsey Rhae Bun/vick, David 
Wayne Cason, Regina Lyn- 
nette Clayton, Amanda Nicole 
Dunn, Ramon G abrie l 
Fus.hiss, Ja.nies Hambrjaht, 
Todd Nathan Harrell, Jill Ann 
Johnson, John Travis John­
son, Freddie Rene Montez, 
Christy Ann M c K in n e y , 
Christopher L. McPherson, 
Devlin Mason Pierce, Ter­
rance Lee Queen, Jessica 
Lee Salser, Jamie Lynn  
Shipman, Brent Taylor, Laura 
LeeAnn Thomas, and Wesley 
Brandon Tinney.

Ushers for the exercises will 
be Wendy Johnson, Shae 
Sanford, Shannan Smith, and 
Nicholas Arrott.

Taylor, John W. Thomas. Cory 
Thorn, Larry R. Wallace, Jr., 
and Bill Richard Windham.

Ushers for the evening will 
be Kristie Cooper, James Wil­
son, Tina Smith, and Darrell 
Lucas.

Elementary sets 
awards assembly

Bronte Elementary will hold 
their end of the year awards 
assembly on Saturday, May 
25, 1991, at 9:30 am In the 
school auditorium.

Awards will be given for the 
honor roll, perfect atten­
dance, the President's Aca­
demic Fitness Av/ards, UIL, 
citizenship, volunteer service, 
physical education, and cer­
tain class awards.

School will dismiss at 2 pm 
on Saturday, May 25,1991.

Lee Sonnenberg, son of Mr. and Mrs. Bruce 
Sonnenberg, is the 1991 Valedictorian for 
Bronte High School. He has a four year grade 
point average of 100.948 and plans to major In 
Civil Engineering at Texas Tech University. 
1991 Bronte High School Salutatorian is  
Melissa Bivins, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Garry 
Bivins. She has a four year grade p o in t 
average of 99.947 and plans to major in 
Education at Texas Tech University.

Upcoming

Chouse Closing
The Coke County Court­

house will be closed Monday, 
May 27, - m of
Memorial Day, a national holi­
day. Most offices and busi­
nesses In Robert Lee and 
Bronte will also close, includ­
ing both city halls, banks, utili­
ty offices, and Observ- 
er/Enterprise offices. A few 
service stations, restaurants, 
and grocery stores may re­
main open for the conve­
nience of their customers.

payment for proper credit.
This is a regular service of­

fered by the Coke County Tax 
Office and the First National 
Bank of Bronte.

Brisker Sinner
The youth of First Baptist 

Church are sponsoring a 
brisket dinner with all the 
trimmings on Sunday, May 26, 
at noon in the Fellowship Hall.

Proceeds will go toward the 
expenses of summer activi­
ties. Everyone is invitfed and 
donations will be appreciated.

Harmon-Sparks Tuesday Special

Laura Thomas, daugh*^
Thomas, is Mf. and Mrs. Danny
Bronte E'-  ̂ rirst Honor Student for the

ynth Grade class.
-•’.Vr Johnson, son of Mr. and Mrs. Albert 

Johnson, was named the Second Honor 
Student.

The Harmon-Sparks Re­
union will be held Sunday, 
June 2, 1991, in the Big Ree 
Hall in Robert Lee. To begin 
early and stay late. A Potiuck 
Lunch will begin at 12:30. 
Friends and relatives are invit­
ed to come and e n jo y ^ ^  
food and fellowshjrt-'

Reg., Titling
Vehicle registration and ti­

tling will be offered in the First 
National Bank of Bronte on 
Tuesday, May 14, from 9 am 
to 1 pm by the Coke County 
Tax Office.

Property tax payments will 
also be accepted. Please 
bring your statements with

The Tuesday Special 
Dance, May 28, will take place 
at the Ree Hall in Robert Lee 
at 7:30 pm. Dancers, 
ages are welco«>’ ^ '   ̂ T'.,? 
dance

'  - Played by the Coke 
v/G'Jhty Cavaliers. The 
monthly dance is held on the 
4th Tuesday and tickets are 
available at the door.

Rodeo Playday
Coke County Rodeo Asso­

ciation will be holding their 
next Playday Friday evening. 
May 31. Registration will open 
at 6:30 pm and the first rider 
will be called at 7 pm.

Everyone is welcome to 
come and ride or just to watch.

Lucas Party
A going-away party will be 

held at First Baptist Church 
Fellowship Hall May 26 at 8 pm 
for Jimmy and Joyce Lucas 
and their son, Darrell. The 
Lucas’ are moving to Midland.

EvoryCPe is invited"  ̂to at­
tend. ___

SW Select Shot
There will be an 18 Hole 

Select Shot Golf Tournament 
Sunday, May 26, at 1 pm a * ' 
the Singing Winds r>olf 
Course in Bronte. Rqtv^rt Lee 
State Bank is spor.^or for the 
tournament.

B^/iroad Depot
Jtme 1 is the date of several 

events scheduled in the area 
of the old Railroad Depot in 
Bronte beginning at 10 am.

Slated activities include the 
dedication of the Bronte Ma­
sonic Lodge Hall.

A Texas Historical Marker will 
be unveiled at the D epot 
which has been designated a 
Texas Historical Landmark.

There will also be a dedica­
tion ceremony for the Capitol 
Gazebo recently given to the 
City of Bronte.

A brunch will be hosted by 
Chapter #1048 Order of the 
Eastern Star for all attendees.
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Mobile breast cancer unit set May 28

Obituaries

Robertson
Clifford D. Robertson, 68, of 

Lindsay, Oklahoma, died 
Thursday, May 16, 1991, at 
his residence.

Service was at 2 pm Mon­
day, May 20, at Robert Lee 
Baptist Church with burial in 
Robert Lee Cemetery, direct­
ed by Shaffer Funeral Home.

He was born October 11, 
1922, in Robert Lee and had 
lived in Lindsay since 1973. 
He worked for the City Service 
Oil Co., for 35 years before 
retiring in 1983. He was a 
veteran of World War II.

Survivors include his wife, 
Mary Belle Robertson of 
Lindsay; a son, Clifford H. 
Robertson of Midland; four 
daughters, Fonda Jean Hall of 
Waukomis, Oklahoma; Rita 
Carol Woods of Midland, 
Janet K. Martinez of Lubbock, 
and Toni Ann Williams of Cape 
Elizabeth, Maine; three 
brothers, J. B. Robertson, 
Jesse Robertson, and Donny 
S. Robertson, all of Robert 
Lee; three sisters, Annie B. 
Mitchell of Robert Lee, Nita 
Hester of Portland, and Elaine 
Bennett of Arlington; three

stepsisters, Gertrude Blood- 
worth of Silver, Billie Talley of 
Cleburne and Lonnell Tomes 
of Amherst; and fifteen 
grandchildren.

AON scholarship 
donations noted
Memorial donations honor­

ing departed friends or loved 
ones have been recently 
made to the AON Service 
Club Scholarship Fund. This 
fund was established in 1987 
to present scholarships to 
graduates of Robert Lee High 
School. Those contributing 
and memories honored are 
noted below. Families of 
those named in memorial will 
receive a card from AON Ser­
vice Club.
JiimjgmQry. of Jake Jacoby 

Joyce Dodson 
Lynn & Shawn Curlee

In memory of Fred McCabe. 
Sl

Gaye and Gary Sam Williams 
and John

In memory of Eula Smith 
Sparks and Beverly Burdett 
and family

The Mobile Breast Cancer 
Detection Unit of Odessa, 
Texas, which services Robert 
Lee, today received the certi­
fication of the American Col­
lege of Radiology Mammog­
raphy Accreditation Program.

Mammography is an x-ray 
examination of the breast, 
which the American Cancer 
Society and other medical ex­
perts see as the best means 
for the early detection of 
breast cancer.

The program is voluntary 
and is designed to insure that 
women receive optimum 
quaiity mammographie exami­
nations. The process is done 
through a peer review evalua­
tion of the facility's staff quali­
fications, equipment, quality 
control, and quality assurance 
programs, image quality, and 
breast dose. The accredita­
tion must be renewed every 
three years.

The accredication program 
was Instituted because of the 
concerns of radiologists, oth­
er national medical organiza­
tions, and the public that 
qualified personnel perform 
and Interpret mammograms 
and that dedicated mammo­
graphie equipment be used. 
The American College of Ra­
diology received an American 
Cancer Society Control Grant 
which was used to pilot test 
the Accreditation Program.

Breast cancer will strike one 
In 10 women. The American 
Cancer Society predicts that 
about 41,000 women will die

Wink recuperates 
fo l lo w in g  s tro k e

Les Wink, longtime rancher 
and farmer near Robert Lee, 
has been hospitalized at 
Shannon Medical Center 
since March 10 with a stroke. 
Although in poor condition for 
a long period, he has recently 
shown some improvement 
and the family welcomes visi­
tors. He is in the skilled care 
unit at Shannon, Rm 604.

They were strangers from different worlds, 
but a friendship f o r ^  out of danger and 
desperation linked tfiern together forever.

★ ★ ★ ★ 1987 
TOP FILM 
AWARD

—Excellence. . 
. In Media

The Power of O ne Person 
Caring About Another.

SUNDAY, MAY 26th 7:00 pm ROBERT LEE BAPTIST CHURCH

of breast cancer this year. As 
there is no way to prevent the 
disease, early detection and 
treatment offer the greatest 
hope for survival.

The American Cancer Soci­
ety recommends that women 
do monthly breast self-exams 
and have regular physical 
breast exams by a doctor. It 
further recommends mam­
mography on the following 
schedule:

• a baseline mammogram (for 
reference) between age 35 
and 39;
• a mammogram every one or 
two years between age 40 
and 49;
• an annual mammogram from 
age 50.

The Breast Cancer Detec­
tion Unit will be in Robert Lee 
on Tuesday, May 28. You 
may call 453-2511 for an ap­
pointment.

Sr's attend Spring Fling
On May 8, a group of West 

Coke County Senior Citizens 
attended the annual Senior 
Spring Fling at the San An­
gelo coliseum. The event is 
sponsored each year by the 
Concho Valley Retired Senior 
Volunteer Program, the Con­
cho Valley Area Agency on 
Aging and the San Angelo 
Senior Services Division. The 
day included health screening 
and informational services, a 
luncheon, and a full afternoon 
of entertainment.

Coke County Senior Coor­
dinator Kelly Milllcan drove the 
enthusiastic local group in the 
van. Attending the Spring 
Fling were Zola Hatley, Faye 
Miller, Verna McDorman, Faye 
and Grady Flowers, Mildred

Smith, Bessie Brice, and Lil­
lian Gaines. Kay Lackey and 
Ella Reeder came later and 
joined the group. Faye Miller 
was delighted to have been 
chosen for a free facial and 
make-over.

The local program is sup­
ported In part by the Area 
Agency on Aging, Concho 
Valley Council of Govern­
ments, through grants from 
the Texas Department on 
Aging.

On May 9, the same group. 
In addition to Christene Hen­
derson and Trudy Farris, ac­
cepted the Bronte Senior 
Citizens' invitation to a 
brunch. A GTE representa­
tive presented a program on 
hearing devices following the 
meal.



Pecan casebearer
treatment dates
The initial treatment fo r 

Pecan Nut Casebearers for 
our area has been predicted 
for May 22-29. This should 
control the casebearers be­
fore they enter the nutlet.

A second application may 
be required where eggs are 
found and nutlet damage 
continues 7-10 days after the 
first application.

For more information, con­
tact the County Extension 
Office.

Pageant has float 
in Angelo parade

The Coke County Pageant 
Association participated in the 
"Welcome Home" parade in 
San Angelo Saturday, May 
18. A float decorated with U. 
S. Flags, yellow ribbons, and 
bearing the "Ole Coke Coun­
ty" banner was well-received 
by those lining the parade 
route.

Riding on bales of hay were 
members of the pageant 
choir, Kenneth, Donna, and 
Lynn Green, Ava Lou Davis, 
Melba Long, and Edna 
Havins. Joe Brazier pulled the 
float for the group.

Pool opening set
The Bronte Swimming Pool 

will open Sunday, May 26, at 1 
pm. Cost for children will be 
.75 a day and for adults $1.50 
per day. Season tickets can 
be purchased for $15.00.

For information regarding 
booking the pool for private 
parties, call 473-2401.

Reunion attended
Attending the Myrick-Hester 

Cousins Reunion at Brown- 
wood on Saturday, May 8, 
were Marie Hester, Sondra 
Hester, and Joan Davis of 
Robert Lee. Sharon Arnold of 
San Angelo accompanied 
them. Bronte cousins who 
attended were Sybil Hester, 
Mozelle Smith, and Mar­
guerite Hester.

Others who attended the 
get-together were Mona and 
Mike Casey, Maurice and Jo- 
Nell Yarbrough, all of Abilene; 
Truitt and Lorea Myrick, Randy 
Bigbee, all of Brenham; Jess 
and Hazel Bigbee, Baird; 
Maurine Myrick Foster, Steve 
and Pam (Bigbee) Polaski and 
three children, Horace and 
Eva Myrick, all of Brownwood; 
Vada Bagley of Early; Ron 
Bagley of Cross Plains; John­
ny and Anna Smith of 
Burleson; George Hester of 
Weatherford; Betty Mundell 
and Edith McGinley, both of 
San Angelo; Carol Morrisson 
and Glenn Whittington of Irv­
ing; Bill and Ruth Myrick of 
Blanket; and Albert and Billie 
Hughes of Ft. Worth.

The reunion has been held 
the last four years at Brown- 
wood at the Early Lions Club 
building. In a business meet­
ing following the wonderful 
pot luck luncheon, the 
cousins voted to return the 
reunion to the country home 
of Mona and Mike Casey near 
Abilene in 1992.

GRADUATES
ARE A CUSS ACT!

The Observer/Enterprise Friday, May 24, 1991

Recipients for the 1991 Bronte Chamber of 
Commerce scholarships were announced this 
week. Winners are Tim Sims, son of Ronnie 
and Beverly Sims, and Misty Golson, daughter 
of Lisa and Richard Sharpes.

Chamber President Michael H a r t m a n  
presented the $150 awards to the two 
outstanding graduates after faculty members 
made the selections.

Tim plans to enroll at Angelo State University 
for the summer session and will major in 
Agriculture Science.

Texas Tech in Lubbock Is the university 
Misty has chosen to attend and further her 
education.

WE CONGRATULATE BRONTE'S

VALEDICTORIAN

LEE SONNENBERG
MARGARETS 

FLOWERS AND GIFTS 
CHESTER WILSON

FOOD 

STAMPS I 

WELCOME

SUPER H LIMIT

IGA RIGHTS

I * ;  RESERVED

501 Commerce -  Robert Lee. TX
Store Hrs: Mon-Sat 8-8 Sun. S-6

SPECIALS GOOD 5-22 THRU 5-28

FRYER LEG 
QUARTERS

2 9 c

WE CONGRATULATE BRONTE'S

SALUTATORIAN

MELISSA BIVINS

FIRST NATIONAL 
BANK

IVEY MOTOR CO.

Fresh Florida

COB CORN

4 $1
Fresh Golden Ripe

BANANAS

Extra Fine Oranulated

IMPERIAL 
4lb SUGAR
BAG M  ^1.49

RAINBOW ASSORTED

SOFT DRINKS CÒLA
2 LTR-
art. 49c

PEPSI, SLICE 
or MT. DEW

6 PACK 12 OZ. CANS

$ 1 .3 9
DR. PEPPER

12 pack 
12 oz. cans

$ 2 . 6 9
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ROBERT LEE SCHOOL NEWS

UMW hosts graduating seniors, faculty
Members of Robert Lee 

High School's 1991 senior 
class and their families and 
faculty members were enter­
tained Sunday evening, May 
19, after baccalaureate ser­
vice. The annual affair was 
held as usual in Fellowship 
Hall of First United Methodist 
Church in Robert Lee, spon­
sored by United Methodist 
Women.

The serving table was 
decorated with carnations and 
ribbons featuring the class' 
colors. Numerous bouquets 
of roses brightened the hall, 
and the ladies of UMW, as­
sisted by Methodist under­
classmen, served a delicious 
punch with an abundant vari­
ety of cookies.

One hundred and five peo­
ple registered, including all of 
the seniors except one.

Pentecost elected 
District FFA VP

Rachel Pentecost

Rachel Pentecost, daugh­
ter of Mr. and Mrs. James 
Pentecost of Robert Lee, was 
recently elected Concho Dis­
trict FFA vice president. 
Rachel is a freshman Agricul­
tural Science student at 
Robert Lee High School and 
has served the Robert Lee 
FFA Greenhand Chapter as 
president this past year. She 
was the president of the 
Robert Lee FFA District win­
ning Junior Chapter Con­
ducting tearp this fall.

Rachel's duties will include 
being in the Courtesy Corp at 
the Area II FFA Convention, 
attending the Area II FFA 
Leadership Conference at 
Howard College in June, and 
serving as a voting delegate at 
the State FFA Convention in 
El Paso in July. She will also 
serve in a primary leadership 
role within the Concho District 
in 1991-92.

S & S
Window Tinting 
of San Angelo

will be in your area 
tinting automobile, 

resjdential & 
commercial.

Call for details

9 4 4 -2 5 4 9

Those attending w e re  
Thomas Baker, Jody Brasher, 
Sheree Burns, Stephen Ep­
person, Brent Gibbs, Lenny 
Jackson, Ron McCown, Brent 
McPeek, Steve Oleksiuk IV, 
Heather Parks, Janet Lee 
Pentecost, S te p h a n ie  
Poehls, Lori Renfroe, Robert 
Rodriquez, Crissy Sherrill, 
Jodie Tavarez, Ronnie Wag- 
gonner, Amy Johnson, Randy 
Watkins, Jeff Wilkes, and Ce­
cilia Ybarra.

Other faculty members and 
school personnel in atten-

Dinner honors Jacoby
Opal Jacoby was honored 

with a Birthday Dinner pre­
ceding the regular meeting of 
Robert Lee Chapter No. 187, 
Order of the Eastern Star. 
Among the 26 present were 
22 Eastern Star members, her 
daughter and son-in-law. Bill 
and Linda Burns, and friends, 
Douglas and Denise Roberts.

During the regular meeting, 
the annual Memorial was pre­
sented by Cristie Bagwell. 
There were eight applicants 
for the $250 scholarship giv­

en by the Chapter. Each of 
the twenty-five members pre­
sent cast their ballot. Brent 
Gibbs received the most 
votes and was named the re­
cipient. The Chapter, also, 
gave $25 to the 1991 RLHS 
Project Graduation Party.

Birthday cake was served 
for refreshments by hostess­
es Dorothea B., Dorthea He­
len, and Lou Wright. Jeffie 
Roberts, Worthy Matron, and 
Bobby Roberts, Worthy Pa­
tron, presided at the meeting.

Gibbs receives TTU funds
Brent Gibbs, son of Mr. and 

Mrs. W. B. Gibbs of Robert 
Lee, has been announced as 
recipient of a $1,000 Texas 
Tech Agricultural Science 
scholarship.

This scholarship is based 
upon scholastic achievement, 
participation in FFA events 
while in high school, and 
leadership abilities.

Brent also received the 
$250 scholarship given by 
Robert Lee Chapter #187, 
Order of the Eastern Star.

Brent, a 1991 Robert Lee 
High School graduate, is 
planning on attending Texas 
Tech University and majoring 
in Agricultural Education. Brent Gibbs

QUISENBERRY'S GREENHOUSE
BEDDING Broccoli, Tomatoes, Peppers, 
P L A N T S : Snapdragons, Petunias, Pinks, etc.

4  " G eranium s 98c each  
Petunia & Geranium  

H anging B askets $ 5 - $ 7 .5 0

1 - 6  pm 408 E. 7th Robert Lee 453-2428

MEMORIAL DAY 1991

Remember those who 
have served our country

BELL AUTO PARTS
Robert Lee 453-2911

Payne elected Area II VP

dance were Linda Burns, 
Judy Gibbs, Lane and Donna 
Jackson, Sid and Kathy Mc­
Cown, Winnie McPeek, Sheri 
Millican, Joan and Edward 
Poehls, Kenneth Rasco, Judy 
Shook, Bea Patterson, and 
Virginia Garlington.

Among the above named 
school-related families, there 
are seven 1991 graduates.

UMW members appreciate 
the excellent attendance of 
the seniors and their friends 
and families, and look forward 
to 1992 and beyond.

Miss Christie  Payne, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Paul 
Payne of Robert Lee, was 
elected as Area II Vice Presi­
dent at the Area II FFA Con­
vention in San Angelo on May 
11. Christie is a junior at 
Robert Lee High School and 
presently serves as Robert 
Lee FFA president. She also 
served this past year as Vice 
President of the Concho FFA 
District.

Christie will receive her 
Lone Star Farmer Degree at 
the State FFA Convention in 
El Paso in July at the State 
FFA Convention.

Her duties as Area II Vice 
President will include attend­
ing and participating in the 
State FFA Leadership Con­
ference in Trinidad, Texas,

Christie Payne
providing part of the leader­
ship program at the Area II 
Leadership Conference at 
Howard College, and provid­
ing leadership for the Area II 
delegation at the State FFA 
Convention.

"Caught" slated May 26th
"Caught," the newest film 

from Billy Graham's World 
Wide Pictures will be shown 
on Sunday, May 26, at 7 pm, 
at the Robert Lee Baptist 
Church.

The true-to-life dramatic 
story portrays the power of 
one person caring for anoth­
er.

An 18-year-old American, 
Tim Devon, goes to Amster­
dam in search of the father he 
has never known. His mother 
reluctantly admits he was born 
illegitimately out of a college 
romance between her and a 
Dutch exchange student.

In this city, far from his 
home, he slips into the self­
destructive drug culture, but 
is encountered by a single, 
caring person -  a person of 
deep faith. The person, Ra- 
jam Prasad, found a way to 
share Christ's message of

love, hope and forgiveness in 
a way that Tim could not ig­
nore.

Vast audiences who have 
witnessed the film's premiere 
in movie theatres around the 
world have been gripped by 
its central focus on their 
friendship which was forged 
out of danger and despera­
tion.

Deeply moved by the 
warmth of the film with its 
many moments of humor, Billy 
Graham, said "'Caught' is cer­
tainly the most outstanding 
film yet produced by World 
Wide Pictures."

"Caught" rings a challenge 
to us all; in reality, one caring 
person can have an immea­
surable impact on the life of 
another lonely, disillusioned, 
desperate person. The public 
is cordially invited to attend 
this showing.

WINK INSURANCE AGENCY
Home*Auto

L ife *H ea lth *C om m erc ia l

715 A u stin 453-4551

WE HELP MAKE 
MOMENTS LIKE THIS

Ask about our 
long-term, low 
interest rate boat 
loans.

Financing made 
easy and 
affordable.

Come See Us for Your Next

IBcpaiT L(E)a).im

Robert Lee State Bank
M e m b e r  F D IC



Spencer receives 
TSU Spirit Award

Reggy Glen Spencer, a 
Tarleton State University stu­
dent from Roby, was one of 
eleven TSU students select­
ed as a recipient of the 1991 
John Tarleton Spirit Award. 
Spencer, a junior majoring in 
Agricultural Services and De­
velopment, received the 
award during the annual 
spring Student Leadership 
banquet hosted by the Uni­
versity's Office of Student 
Services.

The John Tarleton Spirit 
Award was created in 1988 to 
recognize students for out­
standing contributions to the 
student life programs at TSU. 
The award honors student 
leaders who give freely of 
their time and resources to in­
sure the success of campus 
activities while leaving behind 
a wealth of opportunity and 
experience for the fellow stu­
dents. Sometimes called the 
"other education," these ex­
tracurricular activities provide a 
set of experiences compli­
mentary to the formal educa­
tional process.

The son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Richard Spencer of Roby and 
grandson of Mr. and Mrs. Gar­
land Spencer of Bronte, Reg­
gy is a member of the Kappa 
Delta Rho national fraternity, 
the Collegiate FFA, and the 
Alpha Chi national honorary 
scholastic society. Active in 
TSU's Intramural program, 
Spencer played all sports, 
coached girls softball and 
volleyball, and is a member of 
the Texas Amateur Softball 
Association.

He is a peer advisor. Distin­
guished Student, a member 
of the TSU livestock judging 
team, and a recipient of the 
San Antonio Livestock Show 
scholarship and the TSU Aca­
demic Scholarship.

Kuykendall signs
Karmen K u y k e n d a ll,  

daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
David Kuykendall of Abilene 
and granddaughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Clark Glenn of Bronte, 
has signed a letter of intent to 
play tennis for Hardin Sim­
mons University.

Karmen played No. 1 sin­
gles for Abilene High School 
and teamed up with Stacey 
Vaughn to play No. 1 doubles 
as well. Vaughn also signed 
to play tennis for Hardin Sim­
mons.

Karmen and Stacey were 
two of the three seniors on 
Abilene High's District 4-5A 
runner-up squad, which ad­
vanced to the quarterfinals of 
the regional tournament. In 
the spring season, the two 
girls lost in the district semifi­
nals to the eventual Region I- 
5A champions.

In the individual United 
States Tennis Association di­
visions, Karmen stands 26th 
in the state on the top Super- 
Champion bracket In the girls 
18-year-olds.

Karmen stated, "They really 
seemed to want me there, but 
I know most of the girls and I'm 
not an outsider. I've never 
even watched college tennis 
before, but my goal in singles 
is just to be strong and 
consistent."

Karmen plans to major in 
physical education and even­
tually become a physical ther­
apist.
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Mr, and Mrs. Stan Phillips of Austin are 
pleased to announce the upcoming wedding 
of their daughter, Stacie Lynne, to Aaron  
Felton Allison, son of Mr. and Mrs. Dick 
Allison, also of Austin. Stacie is the 
granddaughter of the late Walter Phillips and 
Mrs. Irene Phillips of Bronte. The wedding will 
be held on August, the third, at seven o'clock 
in the evening at Hyde Park Baptist Church in 
Austin. A Reception will follow at the Texas 
Federation of Women's Club. Family and 
friends are invited to attend.

Drawing winners named
The 85th Anniversary of 

Cumbie •& Arrott Mercantile 
was officially celebrated Sat­
urday, May 18, in the local es­
tablishment.

Customers and other 
friends and relatives enjoyed 
viewing old photographs and 
other memorabilia, as well as 
remembering the "old days" in 
Bronte's business history.

Merchandise lines carried 
by the Mercantile gave away 
items including two dresses

Davis resigns 
teaching position

Nadine Davis, Special Edu­
cation teacher in the Robert 
Lee school system for ten 
years, has resigned, effective 
May 17. She had previously 
taught at Mertzon three years.

A graduate of Robert Lee 
High School, Ms. Davis re­
ceived her BA degree and her 
MA, both In Couseling and 
Administration, from Angelo 
State University. She also 
holds undergraduate degrees 
in English, Psychology, Spe­
cial Education, and Elemen­
tary Education.

Ms. Davis has accepted a 
position with the Abilene 
Wylie school district. She will 
be a full-time counselor with 
some administrative duties at 
the Intermediate School of 
4th, 5th, and 6th graders. 
The Wylie school district, one 
of the fastest growing in the 
state, is now 3A.

She will reside in Abilene 
following her summer position 
as waterfront director at Camp 
Sweeney, a camp for diabetic 
children at Gainesville.

She is the daughter of Joan 
Davis and Add Davis, both of 
Robert Lee.

won by Velva Hartman and 
Betty Jackson. Karen Gordon 
and Shaye Coalson also won 
a blouse and briefcase, re­
spectively.

Winners of the $85 gift cer­
tificates included Helen Mur- 
tishaw, Beth Parker, Pearlie 
Mae Andrews, Helen Kirkland, 
Jean McSwain, Martha Arrott, 
Irene Newell, Ester Smith, 
Neta Tiner, Luvene Akins, 
Veneta Linney, Jeann Millsap, 
Bobby Petty, Paula Brock, 
Orela Price, Patsy Sanford, 
Mabel Clark, Dee Gordon, 
Shaye Coalson, Jennifer 
Robinson, Gina Deans, Mary 
Morrow, Ann Ellis, Hazel Per- 
cifull, Karen Gordon, Mary 
Lawhon, Frances Connel, 
Tavia Hale, Dorothy Collins, 
Kay Millican, Jolene Barrett, 
Fredda McCabe, Shery Mes- 
sick, Susan Jackson, Linda 
Adams, Angela Davis, Leona 
Kubena, Lillian Porter, Shirley 
Denton, Joel A. Miles, Donna 
Ash, Nancy Daily, Mrs. Ollie 
Higgins, Jr., Pete Percifull, 
Veronica Parker, Verla Smith, 
Fay Roe, Kay Taylor, Fran 
Pierce, Peggy Hembree, 
Kevin Roe, Sondra Elam, 
Mozelle Smith, Margaret 
Brunson, Jackie Corley, Gary 
Shaffer, Mary Reyes, Judy 
Millican, Joy McDaniel, Mary 
Frances Glenn, Marlene 
Vaughn, Shellie Gibbs, Ericka 
Clendennen, Elaine Scott, Iris 
Champion, Velva Hartman, 
Dana Robinson, Margaret 
Timmons, Pam Randazzo, 
Shalon Gibbs, Vicky Mc- 
Cutchen, Kreta Lee, Christine 
Clark, Carolyn Lee, Brian Ar­
rott, Ann Pate, Virginia Eu­
banks, Tanya Burwick, Pat 
Oglesby, Melinda Busby, 
Glenda Draper, Vera Raney, 
Lesa Sharpes, Christy Bivins, 
Rena Kuck, Imogene Long, 
Joy Wheat, Paula Shipp, 
Aubrey Helwig, and Karla 
Clark.

"FREE DELIVERY" - CALL 453- 2488 

We Have R.O. Water & Ice

PARADE R E S, or RIPPLE POTATO

CHIPS 15oz. Bag
PARADE

APPLE JUICE
PARADE

KETCHUP
BETTER VALU

SHORTENING

g $1.39
32 OZ. .99

32 OZ. .89

42 OZ.

a
$1.19

1 (Limit 4) ,9 9

32 OZ. $1.49

Î OZ. (Limit 4) .99

3/$1

HAMBURGER

PICKLES
A S S T D . FLAVORS

GATORADE
A S S T D  K IND S

COOKIES
KRAFT

BAR- B-Q SAUCE
SANTIAG O

PICANTE SAUCE gallon $4.95

GROUND BEEFu, $1.49
A S S T D . .SI7F.R

TURKEY HAM o,.
PEYTON'S MEAT

FRANKS 12 OZ.

18 OZ.

Asst'd. Roll

PARADE PAPER

TOWELS
PARADE Q U A R T R I7F

CHARCOAL STARTER $1.19
TH IC K  SLIC ED  SI AR

B A C O N ^^P ^ $1.49
CUT TO ORDER

TOP SIRLOIN L. $2.49
"Check Our In-Store 

Specials & Deli"

WE HAVE BAR'B^QUE i 
BEANS - POTATO SALADi

Specials good 
5-23-91 thru 5-29-91

YOUR FULL LINE GROCERY STORE

Davis Grocery & Meat
North Hwy. 208 - Robert Lee - 453-2488
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Br. awards assembly held Stenholm to address Blackwell grads
Outstanding S tu d e n t 

Awards were presented to ju­
nior high and high school stu­
dents in an assembly Thurs­
day, May 16, in the Bronte 
School auditorium.

Scholastic Student Awards 
were given to the girl and boy 
in each class with the highest 
average. These students in- 
ciuded: 9th Grade - Justin 
Lampier, 96.560 and Wendy 
Huckabee, 95.120; 10th 
Grade - Jason Blayiock, 
88.280 and Amy Allen, 
95.200; 11th Grade - Cory 
Montez, 90.893 and Alisa 
Richards, 96.577; and 12th 
Grade - Lee Sonnenberg, 
97.088 and Melissa Bivins, 
96.882.

The Highest.Scholastic Av­
erage Award went to Lee 
Sonnenberg.

Those listed on the "A" 
Honor Roll were Christy McK­
inney, Amy Bailey, Kim Blair, 
Wendy Huckabee, Justin 
Lampier, Casey Thorn, Ree 
Baldwin, Darla Scott, Tina 
Smith, Shay Burwick, Misty 
Golson, Misti Ensor Cotton, 
and Billy Magness.

Presidential Awards went to 
Melissa Bivins, Julie Blair, Misti 
Ensor Cotton, Misty Golson, 
Billy Magness, Lee Sonnen­
berg, Eboni Taylor, Micah Ar- 
rott, John Johnson, Christy 
McKinney, Chris McPherson, 
Laura Thomas, and Brandon 
Tinney.

Lee Sonnenberg, Melissa 
Bivins, and Julie Blair received 
UIL Scholar Awards.

The Who's Who Awards 
were also presented and are 
as follows: "  ̂ .
Agriculture - Ray Wallace; 
Band - Julie Blair; Athletics - 
Justin Phillips; Athletics - 
Teresa Vaughn; Business - 
Eboni Taylor; Drama - Brian 
Arrott; English - Julie Blair; 
Home Economics - DeAnn 
Flores; Journalism - Sherry 
Healey; Math - Lee Sonnen­
berg; Science - Lee Sonnen­
berg; Social Studies - Billy 
Magness; Spanish - Kristie 
Cooper; Art - Sean Conway; 
and Yearbook - Lee Sonnen­
berg.

National Honor Society 
Awards went to Brian Arrott, 
Julie Blair, Melissa Bivins, Misti 
Ensor Cotton, Misty Golson, 
Billy Magness, Lee Sonnen­
berg, Eboni Tayior, Kristie 
Cooper, Amie Parker, Alisa 
Richards, Sonja Salser, and 
Tina Smith.

Named ta  the Academic 
Excellence Honor Roll were 
Nicholas Arrott. Micah Arrott, 
Jonathan DeLaughter, Cory 
Robinson, Shae Sanford, 
Mandy Dunn, John Johnson, 
Brent Taylor, Laura Thomas, 
Amy Allen, Kristie Cooper, 
Alisa Richards, Sonja Salser, 
Melissa Bivins, Julie Blair, Lee 
Sonnenberg; and Eboni 
Tayior.

Those getting certificates 
for Perfect Attendance were 
Nicholas Arrott,,Angela Lewis, 
Mario Montez, Shae Sanford, 
Russel Vaughn, Gary Walker, 
Freddie Montez, Brent Taylor, 
Amy Bailey, Gary Bilbrey, 
Randy Bilbrey, Wendy Huck­
abee, John Lewis, Jennifer 
McCorkle, Amy Allen, Gina 
Chambliss, Misty Mackey, Mae 
Baldwin, Shay Burwick, Kristie 
Cooper, Luke Robbins, Sonja 
Salser, Ree Baldwin, Debra 
Montez, and Stephen Shults.

UIL Participation Awards 
went to Amy Allen - Spelling; 
Brian Arrott - Journalism, Edi­
torial Writing, Headline Writ­
ing, Feature Writing, and One 
Act Play; Amy Bailey - Key­
boarding, Science, and One 
Act Play; Amber Bairrington - 
Accounting; Melissa Bivins - 
One Act Play; Julie Blair - 
Journalism, Literary Criticism, 
Ready Writing, and One Act 
Play; Kim Blair - Poetry Inter­
pretation; Shay Burwick - 
Journalism, News Writing; 
Sean Conway - One Act Play; 
Angela Davis - Journalism, 
News Writing; Misty Golson - 
Ready Writing, One Act Play; 
Vanessa Halstead - Poetry In­
terpretation; Sherry Healey - 
Journalism, Editorial Writing, 
Feature Writing, and News 
Writing; Wendy Huckabee - 
Spelling, Science, One Act 
Play, and Number Sense; 
Jennifer Johnson - One Act 
Play; Walter King - Science, 
One Act Play; Justin Lampier - 
Science, Number Sense; 
Jennifer McCorkle - Poetry In­
terpretation; Stephen Shults - 
Current Issues & Events; Lee 
Sonnenberg - Literary Criti­
cism, Science, One Act Play, 
and Number Sense; Eboni 
Taylor - Ready Writing, Ac­
counting; John Thomas - 
Journalism, Editorial Writing, 
Headiine Writing, and Sci­
ence; Casey Thorn - Science, 
One Act Piay, Number Sense; 
Cory Thorn - One Act Play and 
Accounting; Gina Clayton - 
Spelling; Jonathan DeLaugh­
ter - Speliing, Number Sense, 
Science; Mandy Dunn - Sci­
ence; Cody Holland - Sci­
ence; Ben Huckabee - Ready 
Writing, Science; John John­
son - Ready Writing, Science; 
Angeia Lewis - Oral Reading; 
Melinda Mackey - Ready Writ­
ing; Stephanie Martinez - Oral 
Reading; Shae Sanford - 
Speliing, Number Sense, 
Science; Clint Scott - Ready 
Writing, Spelling; Lynn Son­
nenberg - Oral Reading; Brent 
Taylor - Ready Writing, Sci­
ence; Laura Thomas - Ready 
Writing, Science; and Gary 
Walker - Science.

To conclude the program, 
the following scholarship re­
cipients were announced.

Misty Golson received the 
C. J. Davidson Scholarship 
worth $6,000 and the $300 
Haiey Home Economics 
Scholarship to Texas Tech.

Lee Sonnenberg was 
awarded the $1,500 Robert 
C. Byrd Schoiarship, Josten's 
$1,000 Scholarship, $800 
from the Elk's Lodge, $700 
General Scholarship to Texas 
Tech, TSPE West Texas 
Chapter Scholarship for $750, 
and the big full tuition 
scholarship in engineering to 
Tech.

Billy Magness received a 
Carr ASU Scholarship for 
$ 1,000 .

Eboni Taylor will be going to 
ACU on a track scholarship.

Brian Arrott received the 
Band Boosters $500 
Schoiarship and also a $200 
Texas Tech Mass Communi­
cations Dept. Scholarship.

Julie Blair was awarded a 
$2000 Carr Scholarship to 
ASU, a $500 Band Boosters 
Scholarship and an ASU Band 
Scholarship worth $300.

The Baccaiaureate service 
for the class of 1991 at Black- 
well Consolidated H igh  
School will be held at .8 pm, 
Sunday, May 19, in the school 
auditorium. The Honorable 
Charles Stenholm, United 
States Congressman for the 
17th District of Texas will ad­
dress the fourteen seniors.

A reception honoring Con­
gressman Stenholm will be 
held In the school cafeteria 
prior to the Baccalaureate 
service from 6 pm to 7:30 pm. 
The public is encouraged to 
attend.

The activities S u n d a y  
launch a week of events at 
Blackwell School. A n

academic awards program is 
scheduled for Tuesday night. 
May 21. Elementary awards 
will be presented at 7 pm with 
the presentation of the junior 
high and high school awards 
to follow at approximately 8 
pm.

The junior class is sponsor­
ing a Mexican food "pile-on" 
before the awards program. 
The meal will be served from 
5-7 pm with advance tickets 
selling for $4 and tickets at the 
door for $4.50.

The eighth grade gradua­
tion takes place on Thursday, 
May 23, in the school audito­
rium. Sixteen students will 
advance into high school.

The week concludes with 
the high school commence­
ment, Friday, May 24, at 8 pm 
in the new gym. The Honor­
able Temple Dickson, Texas 
State Senator, will be the 
speaker for this ceremony. A 
reception for the class of '91 
will follow the graduation.

Members of the Blackwell 
1991 Senior Class include 
Tammy Barnes, D'Linn Blair, 
Julie Byers, Will Davis, Dianna 
Edwards, Jennifer Hejl, Billy 
Hindman, Beth Holland, Stacy 
Hyde, Christina Meffert, 
Timothy Neal, Marla Self, Am­
ber Waddington, and Jimmy 
Waddington.

Remember REDDY supplies the energy -  
but only YOU can use it safely!
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FOOD STAMPS WELCOMEE ^  OF

STORE HOURS
Mon.-Sat. —7:30 am to 9 pm 

Sunday — 8 am to 7 pm 
BRONTE

^ ^ ^ F u ll Cut Bone In

$1.89
Full Cut Boneless

Round Steak a  Round
Steak
Extra Lean Sirloin

1 .9 9
Tip Steak Lb. 2.99
Extra Lean Beef

Cube Steak Lb ^

Boneless Rump

Roast Lb ------
Eckrich Beef ^

Bologna»"$1.39^"
Eckrich Lite Smoked

VW right's  Sliced

2.09 :Slab Bacon

1 . 3 9
89 Sausage Lb $ 1 .3 9

Cottonel le
Bath Tissue

89c4 roll 
pkg.

Lemon

50 oz. 
box

Dash
$1.29
M artha W hite

5 lb. 
bag

F lo u r
89c

Gladiola
Yellow & White

Corn Bread Mix
6 oz. pouch 3 / $ 1

Market Made

Pork Sausage

K r a f t
Bar-B-Q Sauce'

18 oz y g g
bott le  '

Thick & Spicy 1.19
Holsum Hamburger

Buns
69c6 ct. 

pkg.

Vac Pac

Boneless
Brisket

Lb.$1.09

1.29
¥  E ckrich  
Reg. or Beef

Smoked
Sausage
$1.79Lb.

Clover Club

Potato Chips 6 Oz. Pkg. 89c
K r a f t Ranch

M ira c le S ty le
W h ip Beans & Jalapeno

Pinto & Jalapeno

1.99
15 Oz. Can

2 / 8 9 C

Pepsi Cola
7 9 c2 liter Bottle

Viva
Paper Towels

7 9 c

Best Maid Hamburger 
Dill Sliced

Pickles
32 oz. jar 1 . 5 9

Folger's
Coffee

13 oz. Can «4 Q  Q  
All Grinds I  ■ W  W

Del Monte 
Vegetables

Whole Kernel Corn, 
Creamstyle Corn, 
Mixed Vegetables,

Cut Green Beans, Spinach 
303 can

2/ $1

Large

EQQS Dozen 7 3 C
Gandy's
Cottage
Cheese 24 Oz. Ctn. ^1 .4 9
Kraft Colby or Cheddar

Cheese Pkg $ 1 .6 9

YELLOW 
CORN

$ 1

FRESH PRODUCE

Bananas Lb 39c
Fancy Valencia " 7 0
Oranges Lb f t i C
Green r \ f \
Cabbage Lb ¿,\iC

o  /  i4C arrots 1 Lb Pkg. 3  /  ^  ■

Gandy's
Ice  1/2 Gal. Ctn.

Cream 5 Qt. Bucket 

Parade Frozen
Whip Topping 8 Oz. Bowl

Parade Frozen r s r \
Pie Shells 2 Pk. 9 inch ■ O  w

P ric e s  G o o d  5 -2 3  thru 5 -2 9
FOCO STAMPS WELCOME

$ 1 .8 9  
$ 4 .9 9  

.6 9
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BRONTE SCHOOL NEWS

Luncheon honors "A" honor roll youth
The "A" Honor Roll Lun­

cheon was recently held for 
the Bronte Elementary stu­
dents in 4th, 5th, and 6th 
grades. It was held in the 
Homemaking Building. Two 
students recognized for this 
honor were Brandy Denton, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Ker- 
win Denton, and Angie 
Shults, daughter of Cathy

Grads travel back 
to elementary

The Bronte High School 
1991 Senior Class took a walk 
back into their past Monday 
night. During a Progressive 
Dinner sponsored by the Se­
nior parents, the graduating 
students journeyed back into 
their elementary years as they 
hiked from one stop to anoth­
er.

The first event was with Jo- 
Beth Shields of Winters, their 
Kindergarten teacher, as the 
students relived the fun of 
painting. It was followed by 
the appetizers at the home of 
Mickey and Fran Pierce.

Then they rode to Ron and 
Beverly Sims' for a session of 
making molded handprints 
with Wanda Barbee, their first 
grade teacher.

The third course, at the 
home of Garry and Marilyn 
Bivins, featured the highlight 
of the fourth grade, Shug 
Lawhon and the flutaphone 
band playing "Your Cheatin' 
Heart."

The party closed with 
Tamara Marshall's big water 
balloon bash at the park.

Senior points 
of interest

The 1991 Bronte Seniors 
will have a lot to remember in 
the years to come. Following 
are a few points of interest 
that will go in their scrap­
books.

"Life is about 10% what you 
make it and about 90% how 
you take it," is the motto the 
Class chose. It joins the red 
rose as the official class flow­
er, and "The Dance" as the 
class song. Class colors are 
burgundy and silver.

Senior sponsors for this 
year were Mary McMulian and 
Lloyd Walker.

Class officers Include Presi­
dent Brian Arrott, Vice Presi­
dent Misty Golson, Secretary 
Ebon! Taylor, T re a su re r 
Stephen Shults, Reporter 
Lee Sonnenberg, and Stu­
dent Council Representative 
Misti Ensor Cotton.

PARKER PLUMBING
Residential-Commercial 

All Types Plumbing Repair

♦N ew  C onstruction  
♦ R em o d elin g  
♦ F ix tu res  
♦Sew er Service

Licensed Master Plumber 
473-2131 Bronte

Shults.
Garry Bivins, local busi­

nessman, was the guest 
speaker. He encouraged the 
students to always do their 
best because the end results 
would be worth all their ef­
forts. He said that they al­
ready had a good reputation 
for doing well and he knew

this would continue through­
out their school years.

A special thanks was 
expressed to Mrs. Melissa 
Howard, and her Homemaking 
I class for preparing very 
delicious meals throughout 
the year for the Honor Roll 
Luncheons.

WELL DONE

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

LEE SONNENBERG

SON OF
BRUCE & FRAN 
SONNENBERG

Band 9, 10, 11, 12; Librarian 10, 11, 12; Drama Club 9, 10, 11, 
12; President 12; TAPE 10, 11, 12; Historian 11; President 12; 
1st District Speech 12; UIL 9, 10, 11, 12; Zone One Act Play 9, 
10, 11, 12; Zone Honorable Mention All-Star Cast 9, 12; Zone 
All-Star Cast 10; District One Act Play 10, 12; District All-Star 
Cast 12; Calculator 9, 10, 11; Numbersense 9, 10, 11, 12; 5th 
District 10; Science 10, 11, 12; 6th District 11; Regional Sci­
ence Fair 9, 10; 2nd Environmental Science 10; FFA 9, 10; 1st 
District Quiz Team 9; Secretary 10; FHA 9, 10, 11, 12; 
President 9; Secretary 10; Vice President Programs 11, 12; 1st 
STAR Events Region Job Interviews 12; Annual Staff 9, 10, 11,
12; Business Manager 10, 11; Editor 12; NHS 11, 12; Historian 
12; Class President 11; Class Reporter 12; Who's Who Among 
American High School Students 11; "A" Honor Roll 9, 10, 11; 
Highest Scholastic Student 11; Academic Excellence Award 9, 
10, 11; Highest Class GFA Boy 9, 10, 11; Who’s Who in Sci­
ence 11; Division I State Vocal Solo 11; Division Regional Vocal 
Solo 11, 12; All-District Choir 12; All-Region Choir 12; Most 
Outstanding Boy 12; Chamber of Commerce Most Outstanding 
High School Boy 12; Most Likely To Succeed 12; West Texas 
Scholar 12; Josten's Leader Scholarship Recipient 12; 
Valedictorian 12.

HALL'S SUPER SAVE

A ll f a c i l i t ie s  o f  th is  b a n k  w ill  be

CLOSED
Monday, May 27, 1991

in ob servan ce o f

D
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Y
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0  
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Please plan your banking requirements to 
avoid any inconvenience.

First National Bank
MEMBER FDIC  

B ronte, T ex a s -- 4 7 3 -2 9 1 1

Pictured is Garry Bivins, speaker, and Angie 
Schults (I) and Brandy Denton, honorées at 
the luncheon for the 4th, 5th, and 6th grade 
students making the "A" honor roll for the 5th 
Six Weeks at Bronte Elementary.

BEST OF LUCK

W e Are Proud 
To Sponsor

EBONI MARITA 
TAYLOR

DAUGHTER OF 
MR. AND MRS. 

STOVER TAYLOR
Volleyball 9 ,1 0 ,1 1 ,1 2 ; Captain 12; All-District 11; Area Runner- 
Up 11; Regional Runner-Up 12; Academic All-State 12; All- 
State Team 12; 2nd Team All-District 12; Basketball 9, 10, 11, 
12; 2nd Team All-District 11; Regional Semi-Finals 9; Area 10, 
11; 1st Team All-District 12; Track 9, 10,11, 12; Regional Quali­
fier 800 m, 400 m Relay 9; 3rd State 3200 m, 4th State 1600 m 
Relay 10; 1st State 3200 m 12; State Qualifier 800 m 11; Aca­
demic All-State; State Runner-Up Team Trophy 11; 1st District 
12; Regional Runners-Up 12; Curly Hayes Sportsmanship Tro­
phy 12; Cheerleader 9, 10, 11, 12; Head 12; Student Council 
10, 11, 12; FCA 9, 10, 11, 12; President 11; Vice President 12; 
FHA 9, 10, 11, 12; Reporter 9, 10; Vice President Recreation 
11; Treasurer 12; TAPE 10, 11, 12; Secretary 11; Treasurer 12; 
NHS 11, 12; Treasurer 12; Drama Club 9, 10, 11, 12; Band 9, 
10, 11, 12; Vice President 11; Class Officer 9, 11, 12; Treasur­
er 9; Secretary 12; Academic Excellence Award 10; Perfect At­
tendance Award 9, 10, 11, 12; DAR 11, 12; Academic All-State 
Volleyball & Track 11, 12; US Army Reserve Scholar/Athlete 
Award 11, 12; MVP Track 11; Most Athletic Girl 12; Who's Who 
in Girls Athletics 11; Class Favorite 9; Chamber of Commerce 
Outstanding Student of the Year 11, 12; Most Outstanding 
Student 12; Most Beautiful 11; Homecoming Queen 11; 
Homecoming Duchess 12.

GARY AND 
BARBARA SHAFFER

GLENN-BIVINS INSURANCE
Home
Life

Auto
Health

T IM E  T O  B U Y  C R O P  IN S U R A N C E !

123 W. Main Bronte, Texas 76933 
(915) 473-6791

SWIMMING LESSONS
BRONTE POOL 

JUNE 3rd - 7th, 1st Week 
JUNE 10th - 17th, 2nd Week
10 am  - 11 am , ln te rm ed ia te (6 -8  yrs) 
11 am  - 12 noon, B eginners(3-5  yrs) 

$5  per day of instruction

Misti and Eboni Taylor 
Red Cross Life Guard Certified 

and CPR Certified
For More Information Call 473-5551
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BEST WISHES

W e Are Proud 
To Sponsor

MELISSA BIVINS

DAUGHTER OF 
GARRY & MARILYN 

BIVINS

Volleyball 9, 10, 11,12; Academic All-State Volleyball Team; UIL 
9, 10, 11, 12; Honorable Mention All-Star Cast 10; All-Star Cast 
11; FHA 9, 10, 11; Band 9, 10, 11, 12; Representative 9 ,1 0 ;  
Drum Major 11, 12; National Honor Society 11, 12; Secretary 
12; Student Council 11, 12; Treasurer 11, Secretary 12; Class 
Treasurer 10, Class Secretary 12; Drama Club Stage Manager 
11; Drama Club Publicist 12; Fellowship of Christian Athletes; 
Salutatorian.

GLENN-BIVINS
INSURANCE

YOU'RE SPECIAL
We Are Proud 

To Sponsor

MISTY GOLSON

DAUGHTER OF 
LISA & RICHARD 

SHARPES AND 
JAKE & MARYBETH 

GOLSON
Volleyball 9, 10; Trainer 10, 11; UIL 9, 10, 11, 12; 3rd District 
Ready Writing 11; Regional Qualifier 11; District One-Act Play 
10, 12; Zone One Act Play Best Actress 11; FFA 11; 
Greenhand; Treasurer 11; FHA 9, 10, 11, 12; FHA Reporter 10; 
President 11, 12; Region II Treasurer 12; State Nominating 
Committee 12; National Honor Society 11, 12; Vice President 
12; Student Council 11, 12; Parliamentarian 11; Reporter 12; 
Class Reporter 9; Class Treasurer 10; Class Secretary 11; Class 
Vice President 12; Drama Club 9, 10, 11, 12; Stage Manager 
10, 12; Treasurer 11; TAPE 10, 11, 12; President 11; Vice 
President 12; FCA 9, 10, 11, 12; Vice President 11; Annual 
Staff 10, 11, 12; Longhorn Mascot 10, 11, 12; Perfect 
Attendance 9, 11, 12; Who's Who Among American High 
School Students 11; "A" Honor Roll 9, 11; Academic 
Excellence Award 11; Class Favorite 10; Wittiest Girl 12; Best 
Personality 11, 12; Universal Cheerleading Assc. Superior 
Mascot 11.

BILLY JOE & 
DIANE LUCKETT

C0NßfU4.TULy|.TX0NS 
CL^SS OF 1991

OUR ADMIRATION

W e Are Proud 
To Sponsor

JULIE BLAIR

DAUGHTER OF 
FRANK & MARTY 

BLAIR

UIL 9, 10, 11, 12; One Act Play; District All-Star Cast 10; District 
Honorable Mention All-Star Cast 12; FFA 9, 10; Star Greenhand 
Farmer; 1st District Quiz Team; Livestock Judging; Band 9, 10, 
11, 12; All-Region Band 12; Drum Major 10, 11, 12; Zone Band 
9, 10, 12; John Phillip Sousa Award 9, 10, 11; National Honor 
Society 11, 12; Reporter 12; Student Council 11, 12; Reporter 
11; Treasurer 12; Drama Club 9, 10, 11, 12; Publicist 10, 12; 
Class Reporter 10; Class Treasurer 11; TAPE 9, 10; Annual 
Staff; West Texas Scholar Award; State Soloist 10, 11, 12; 
Highest Girl GPA 9, 11; Highest Scholastic Student 11; Who's 
Who in Band 9, 10, 11; Who's Who in Spanish 10, 11; Best All- 
Around 12; Most Likely to Succeed 12; Academic Excellence 
Award 9,10 , 11.

HALL'S SUPER SAVE

GOOD LUCK

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

TIM SIMS

SON OF 
RONALD AND 

BEVERLY SIMS

Football 9, 10, 11, 12; District Runners-Up 11; Coke County 
Champs 12; All-District 2nd Team Linebacker 10; Team Co- 
Most Valuable Player 10; All-District Offensive Lineman 12; All- 
District 2nd Team Defensive Lineman 12; All West Texas 
Offensive Lineman 12; Track 9, 10; FFA 9, 10, 11, 12; Star 
Chapter Farmer 10; Sheep Production Award 9, 10; Grain Pro­
duction Award 12; Livestock Judging 9; Sentinel 10; Vice 
President 11; President 12; Band 9; Homecoming Duchess 
Escort 12; Who's Who in Agriculture 11; Best All-Around 12.

BUTLER OIL CO.
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OUR TRIBUTE
We Are Proud 

To Sponsor

ANGELA R. 
DAVIS

DAUGHTER OF 
MR. & MRS. 

ROBERT REYES 
WIFE OF 

TIM DAVIS
Volleyball 9, 10, 11, 12; District Champs 10, 11, 12; Area Run­
ners-Up 10, 11; Honorable Mention 10, 11; Regional Runners- 
Up 12; 1st Team All-District 12; Basketball 9, 10, 11, 12; District 
Champs 9 ,10 ,11 ; District Runners-Up 12; Bi-District Champs 9,
10, 11, 12; Sub-Regional Champs 9; Area Runners-Up 10, 11, 
12; Regional Qualifier 9; 1st Team All-District 10; Track 9, 10,
11, 12; Regional Qualifier 400 m, 800 m Relay, 100 m. Triple 
Jump 9; Regional Qualifier 1600 m Relay 10; State Qualifier 
1600 m Relay 10; Regional Qualifier 100 m, 300 m Hurdles, 
1600 m Relay 11; Regional Qualifer 100 m. Triple Jump, 300 
Hurdles, 1600 m Relay 12; State Qualifier 300 m Hurdles, 1600 
m Relay 12; Football Manager 12; UlL 12; Regional Qualifier 
Journalism News Writing 12; FHA 9; Band 9, 10, 11; 2-Event 
Sweepstakes 11; TAFE 12; Parliamentary 12; FCA Treasurer 
12; Journalism 12; PAL; Most Athletic 11; Football Sweetheart 
11; Mrs. BHS 12; Most Beautiful 12; Homecoming Queen 12; 
Class Favorite 11.

BURWICK OILFIELD 
SERVICES, INC.

OUTSTANDING

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

BRIAN ARROTT

SON OF 
MR. & MRS. 

TIM ARROTT

Basketball 9; Tennis 9 ,1 0 ,1 2 ; Golf 10 ,11 ,12;
UlL 9, 10, 11, 12; Qne Act Play Zone 9, 10, 11, 12; District 10, 
12; All Star Cast 10, 11, 12; Best Actor 12; Regional & State 
Journalism Qualifier 12; FFA 9, 10, 11, 12; 1st FFA Quiz Team 
9; FHA 9, 10,11, 12; FHA Beau 10, 11, 12; FHA Vice President 
Public Relations 11; Band 9, 10, 11, 12; Band Beau 11, 12; 
Zone Band 11, 12; Two Event Sweepstakes 11; Band Council 
President 9, 11, 12; Honor Society 11, 12; President 12; Stu­
dent Council 10, 11, 12; President 12; Vice President 11; 
Representative 10; Class President 9 ,1 0 ,1 2 ; Class Favorite 9, 
11, 12; Drama Club 9, 10, 11, 12; Drama Club Choreographer 
10; Publicist 11; Annual Staff 9 ,1 0 ,1 1 ,1 2 ; Fellowship of Chris­
tian Athletes 12; Qutstanding Student of BHS 11; Most Likely 
to Succeed 11; Most Handsome 12; Who's Who Among 
American High School Students 12; Academic Excellence 10; 
Band Scholarship Recipient 12; Communications Scholarship 
to Texas Tech 12.

JONI-LYN
SPORTSWEAR

WELL DONE

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

JUSTIN PHILLIPS

SON OF LYNN & 
GLENDA PHILLIPS

Football 9, 10, 11, 12; District Runners-Up 11; Coke County 
Champs 12; All-District Quarterback 11; All-District Most Valu­
able Player Offense 12; All West Texas Safety 12; Basketball 9,
10, 11, 12; Regional Runners-Up 11; State Runners-Up 12; All 
District Most Valuable Player 10, 11, 12; All Big Country Team
11, 12; All West Texas 11, 12; All-Regional 1st Team 11, 12; All- 
State 2nd Team 11; All-State 1st Team 12; All-State Tourna­
ment 1st Team 12; Optimist All-Star Game 12; Whataburger All- 
Star Game 12; Track 10, 12; Golf 10, 11; Band 9, 10, 11, 12; 
Student Council 10; FCA.

ANGELO SYSTEMS
Lynn & Glenda Phillips

OUR ADMIRATION

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

SHERRY LYNN 
HEALEY

DAUGHTER OF
RICK HEALEY

Powder Puff Football 9 ,10 , 11; Basketball Manager 12; UlL 11, 
12; Regional Alternate Editorials 11; Journalism 12; Regbnal 
Qualifier Features 12; Literary Meets 11,12; 4th Feature Writing 
11 ; 5th News 11 ; 4th Feature 12; 4th News 12; Madrigal Dinner 
10; School Musical "Brigadoon" 10; School Play 12; FCA 12; 
TAFE 12; Spanish Club 9,10; Freshman Choir 9; Concert Choir 
10; Drama 12; Qutstanding High School Students of America 9; 
Blue Honor; Academic Excellence; Who’s Who Among Ameri­
can High School Students 11.

HURLEY PHARMACY

OUR RESPECT

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

BILL WINDHAM

SON OF 
GARLAND AND 

ANGI RICHARDS
Football 9, 10, 11, 12; District Runners-Up 11; Coke County 
Champs 12; All-District Offense 11, 12; All-District Defense 11, 
12; Defensive Most Valuable Player 12; All West Texas 
Linebacker 12; Basketball 9, 10, 11, 12; District Champs 9, 10, 
11, 12; Regional Runners-Up 11; State Runners-Up 12; All- 
District 10, 11, 12; 2nd Team All Regional 11, 12; Honorable 
Mention All Big Country 11, 12; Co-Captain 11, 12; All-State 
Tournament Team 12; Track 9, 11; UlL 9; FFA 9, 10, 11, 12; 
FHA 9, 10; Band 9; FCA 9, 10, 11; PAL 12.

GARLAND AND 
ANGI RICHARDS
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OUR TRIBUTE

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

BILLY MAGNESS

SON OF 
BILL & HAZEL 

MAGNESS

Football 10, 11, 12; District Runners-Up 11; Coke County 
Champs 12; Basketball 9, 10, 11, 12; Regional Runners-Up 11; 
State Runners-Up 12; Track 11; Golf 10, 11; FFA 12; FHA 9, 
10, 11; Band 9, 10, 11, 12; 2-Event Sweepstakes 11; FCA 12; 
Drama Club 10, 11; Who's Who Among American High School 
Students 12; Presidential Academic Fitness Award; Carr Schol­
arship Recipient 12.

BUTANE SALES

OUR RESPECT

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

BRANDON
MARSHALL
 ̂ ,̂  SON OF 
' TAMARA 
MARSHALL

Football 9, 10, 11, 12; All-District 1st Secondary 11; All-District 
2nd Secondary 12; All-District 2nd Team Running Back 12; All 
West Texas Running Back 12; District Runners-Up 11; Coke 
County Champs 12; Basketball 10 ,11 ,12; All District 2nd Team 
Guard 12; Regional Runners-Up 11; State Runners-Up 12; FFA 
10 ,11 ,12; FCA; Most Athletic 12.

CUMBIE & ARROTT
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GOOD LUCK

We Are Proud 
To Sponsdr

DEBRA ANN 
MONTEZ

DAUGHTER OF 
MR. & MRS. 

RAUL MONTEZ

Basketball 9; FHA 9 ,1 0 ,1 1 ,1 2 ; Band 9,

EL VAQUERO 
RESTAURANTE

BRIGHT FUTURE

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

JOHN THOMAS

SON OF 
DANNY AND 

ROENNA THOMAS

Football Manager 9, 10; Basketball Manager 9, 10; Trainer 11; 
Assistant Coach 12; Golf 12; UIL 9, 10, 11, 12; Science; Jour­
nalism; 4th District Headline Writing; FFA 9, 10; FHA 9, 10, 11,
12; Band 9, 10, 11; Drama Club; Who's Who Among American 
High School Students; Disabled Sporting Events.

COKE CO. ABSTRACT
Mike Varnadore

YOU'RE SPECIAL

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

ROSEMARE 
LYNN BALDWIN

DAUGHTER OF 
JOHNNIE L. 

ANDREWSON

Volleyball 9, 10, 11, 12; Area Champs 11; Regional Finalist 12; 
Basketball 9, 10; Manager 11,12; Track 11; FFA 10, 11; FHA 9, 
10; Band 9, 10, 11, 12; Band Sweetheart 12; Representative 
12; Fellowship of Christian Athletes 12; Drama Club 9, 10; Per- 
feet Attendance 10, 11, 12.

TOWN & COUNTRY

X
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s

OUR BEST

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

JASON PIERCE

SON OF 
MICKEY AND 

FRANCES PIERCE
Football 9, 10, 11, 12; District Runners-Up 11; Coke County 
Champs 12; All-District Lineman 11, 12; All-District Linebacker 
12; Basketball 9, 10, 11, 12; Regional Runners-Up 11; State 
Runners-Up 12; All-District 12; Golf 9, 10; FFA 11, 12; Band 9.

FIRST NATIONAL 
BANK

Member FDIC
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SUPER CLASS

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

SEAN CONWAY

SON OF 
WAYNE & JEAN 

PETERS
Football 9, 10,11, 12; All-District Defensive Lineman 1st Team 
11; Basketball 9, 10, 11, 12; State Runner-Up All-District 1st 
Team 12; All Big Country Honorable Mention 12; All Region 3rd 
Team 12; All State Tournament 1st Team 12; Track 11; Tennis 
9, 10, 11; UIL9; FFA10, 11, 12;FHA9.

JONI-LYN
SPORTSWEAR

OUR BEST

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

MISTI ENSOR 
COTTON

DAUGHTER OF 
JESSE & ELAINE 

ENSOR

Volleyball 12; Manager 12; FHA 11,12; National Honor Society 
12; Student Council 12; Class Favorite 12; TAPE 12; Drill Team 
10, 11.

B & B ENTERPRISES

OUTSTANDING

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

CORY THORN

SON OF 
RON & FAYNE 

THORN

UIL 12; Accounting; FFA 9, 10, 11, 12; Reporter; FHA 9, 10, 
11,12; Band 9,10 , 11,12; Drama Club.

HOMETOWN
HARDWARE
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BRIGHT FUTURE

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

RAY WALLACE

SON OF
DOROTHY WALLACE

Football 11; FFA 9, 10, 11, 12; Mechanics Award 11, 12; Vice 
President; Band 9, 10, 11 ; Drama Club 11.

ADAMS LAND 
& REALTY

OUR RESPECT

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

SUSAN CULP

DAUGHTER OF 
MR. & MRS. 

GLENN CULP

Volleyball 9, 10, 11, 12; Area Champs 11; Regional Finalist 12; 
Basketball 9, 10; UIL 9, 10, 11; FFA 10, 11, 12; FHA 9, 10, 11, 
12; TAFE 9, 10, 11, 12; Fellowship of Christian Athletes 9, 10, 
11,12; Drama Club 9 ,10 , 11, 12; Who’s Who Among American 
High School Students 10, 11.

JAMES & BRENDA 
TIDWELL

OUR TRIBUTE

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

STEPHEN SHULTS

SON OF
CATHY SHULTS

Football 12; FFA 11, 12; Treasurer.

COKE-STERLING 
FARM BUREAU
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Knowledge itself is power.
-Frances Bacon

Pow er is to im a gin e a- better world, 
and, g ive  sfrcrpe to those cCreams. 

BEST OF LUCK
BRONTE SENIOR- CL^SS OF 1991 

UOU ^ R E  R E ST IN E P  
FOR g R E ^ T  TRXNBS.

RED BARN 
BAR-B-QUE

DAVIS GROCERY 
AND GAS

Butch and Tim

HUGHES TV & RADIO
Fred and Ona

BRONTE 
NURSING HOME KEY FEED STORE SINGING WINDS 

GOLF SHOP

COKE COUNTY 
TAX OFFICE

Donna - Kristy - Cathy

UNION TEXAS 
PETROLEUM

KELLY'S TEXACO 
STATION

LOUISE'S
COUNTRY DESIGNS ROYCE & BETTY LEE BOB WRINKLE'S 

ACE HARDWARE

AIM MATERIALS THE BEAUTY DEN
Turner and Eyvonne Lee MARTIN & PAT LEE

BILL HELWIG 
Attorney-at-Law ASKINS PROPANE

COKE COUNTY 
AUDITOR'S OFFICE

Stover - Jerita - Dovie

SUBLETT'S ANTIQUES CRACKER BARREL 
RESTAURANT

BEN BESSENT 
CHEVROLET

COKE COUNTY 
CLERK'S OFFICE
Ettie - Sharon - JoAnn

SUPER "H" IGA

CITY OF BRONTE BELL AUTO PARTS

GLENN-BIVINS
INSURANCE

BRONTE CHAMBER 
OF COMMERCE MARGARET MARTIN

COKE COUNTY 
TREASURER

Phelan Wrinkle

SHERIFF & MRS. 
MARSHALL MILLICAN
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BUY IT. 
SELL IT. 
FIND IT.

C L A S S I F I E D
CLASSIFIED 

ADVERTISING RATES

1st. Insertion...
20c Per Word 

($3.00 Minimum)
2nd. and Subsequent 
Insertions..V

16c Per Word 
($2.50 Minimum)

Additional 50c 
for Blind Ads 

Cards/Thanks... '
20c Per Word

Legal Notices...
20c Per Word

COPY DEADLINE
Class Ads..5 pm Tues. 

Display Ads..5 pm Tues. 
Classified Ads & Cards of 

Thanks are payable in 
ADVANCE unless customer 
carries regular account.

C FOR SALE

HOUSE FOR SALE
Four-room house plus bath 
and screened porch. Carlton 
or Leta Caston, 453-2453. 
Robert Lee.
____________ 37-6tc

25 ACRES on Hwy 158, 1 
mile from Robert Lee & 1/2 
mile from Lake Spence. 
Agent, 453-2995 or 453- 
2226.
_____________02-tnc

2 LOTS FOR SA LE, 310
Zero Street. Contact Bill Allen 
or D'Ann Eubanks, Robert 
Lee State Bank, 453-2545. 
_____________39a-tnc

OWN YOUR OWN HOME
with no money down. Best 
part of town. 2 BR for $225 
per mo. 100% owner financ­
ing. 453-2756, Robert Lee. 
______________ 4Q-3tC

EDITH e s t a t e s , breath­
taking view, double wide, 
ready for occupants. Let's 
deal.
Just listed . . TWO improved 
lots, Bayview Estates. Call to­
day.
FURNISHED M O B IL E
home close to the school. 
Priced for quick sale. 
PERFECT weekend cabin 
fully furnished. Call for further 
details.
Showing FrnHA and HUD 
homes, acreages available. 
Call today.

i i i

2 BR, 1 BA house Bayview 
Estates
TWO STUCCO houses for 
sale - priced cheap
SEVERAL LO TS  Edith 
Estates and in Robert Lee.
GOOD SELECTION of 2
BR, 1 BA, and 3 BR, 2 BA.
3 BR, 2 BA, double 
garage/shop, located on 
corner lots.
2 VACANT LOTS with 2 
storage bldg., mobile home 
hookups.
SM. HOUSE & 4 lots.
Priced to sell, Bronte.
3 BR, 2 BA with apartrirent 
located on Ig. corner lot.

SIX BR, 2 BA, located on Ig. 
corner block, near school. 
EDITH ESTATES - 14 X74 
mobile home with addition 
and enclosed porch.

AUSTRALIAN 
SHEPHERD PUPPIES 

FOR SALE 
Wayne McCutchen 

473-3201 
After Dark

_____________4i_-im .

FOR SALE: 3-Piece Bed­
room Suite. Vanity dresser. 
102 Key Street, Bronte, 473- 
3171, Christine Clark. 
______________ 4.1b-1tC

FOR SALE - 3 BR house in 
Bronte, $12,000. Call after 7 

3 pm, 949-4337. 
_____________40-2tc

GERMANIA 
FARM MUTUAL

Insurance Association 
reasonable, sound insurance 
protection for your home and 
other property. If you want to 
save, contact J. A. Dunklin, 
805 Vicki St., 915-453-2397, 
Robert Lee, Texas. 
_____________26a-1tc

c FOR RENT 1

EQUAL HOUSING 
OfPORTUNITr

ADAMS LAND & 
REALTY CO.

Phone 453-2723 or 
655-9429

Elsie Adams 453-2757 
Becky Clendennen 

453-4748

FOR SALE BY OWNER
122 W. 12th St, Robert Lee, 
Austin Stone, CA/CH, 3 BR, 1 
1/2 BA, den w/vaulted ceiling 
and fireplace, dining room, 
sunroom overlooks backyard 
w/large trees. Phone 915- 
453-2910 for appointment. 
_____________3^-tnc

FOR S A LE  - 24' X 54' 4
bedroom, 2 bath, double wide 
mobile home to be moved. 
Call 473-2131, Bronte. 
____________ 40b-4tc

FOR SALE
75' X 150' lot in Robert Lee. 
Water and plumbing hook­
ups, convenient location, 
$3,150. Call 453-2184. 
_____________34-tnc

FOR SALE - 21 inch, self- 
propelled mower. New blade. 
Call 473-3931. 
____________ 41-1tc

FIREWOOD FOR SALE -
Dick's Firewood, 453-2151, 
Robert Lee.
_____________07-tnc

Elaine Lee 
Nell Kennedy

453-2995
453-4355.

SHAFFER 
FUNERAL HOME
BRONTE ROBERT LEE

473-3131 453-2424
MONUMENTS
Duplications 

Custom Designs

TRAILER FOR RENT by
the weekend, week, or month 
furnished, bills paid. 1516 
Washington, Robert Lee. Call 
Neta at 453-4786. 
_____________41a-tnc

THE H O U S I N G  AU­
THORITY of Robert Lee will 
be taking applications fo r 
housing 9 am - 3 pm, Monday, 
Wednesday, and Friday, 453- 
2912 or 453-2802. Equal 
Housing Opportunity. 
_____________15a-tnc

FOR RENT - Clean 1 BR 
furnished house, $150 per
month plus bills. Contact 
Doodle Tinkler, 453-2752, 
1609 Hamilton, Robert Lee. 
____________ 36-tnc

TO KICK OFF the 1991 
RLHS Project G raduation 
Party, plan to attend our drug- 
free, alcohol-free dance.
Date? Friday, May 24,1991 
Time? 9:30 pm -1 :30 am 
Place? Robert Lee Show Barn 
Who? Presently in 9th grade 
and Up
In order to make this a special 
night for our seniors, all activi­
ties after 1:30 am will be limit­
ed to the graduating class.

Thanks!
1991 Project Graduation 

Committee
________________ 39-3tP

APPLICATIO NS F O R  
CERTIFIED N U R S E S  
AIDES - Full-time, Part-time 
and Call-In positions. Above 
average salary, excellent work 
conditions. Apply in person at 
Bronte Nursing Home, 900 S. 
State Street, Bronte, Texas. 
EOE
_____________36b-tnc

HELP WANTED - Full or 
part-time, apply in person 
only. Paint Creek Marina. 
_____________4,Q,a:gtC

TO GIVE AWAY
Collie-type puppies, 453- 
4714, Robert Lee. 
_____________4.1- I tP

NEEDED - RN for weekend 
coverage, 7-3 shift. Competi­
tive salary. Apply in person, 
Bronte Nursing Home, 900 S. 
State, Bronte, Texas. EOE. 
_____________32b-tnc

C SERVICES

c M is e

APPLICATIONS ARE be­
ing accepted in the office of 
County Treasurer of Coke 
County for a secretary posi­
tion. Applications will be ac­
cepted through June 7, 
1991. Apply in person. Coke 
County is an E q u a l  
Opportunity Employer. 
______________ 41a-2tC

POSTAL JOBS
Start $11.41 pr hr. Carriers, 
Sorters, Clerks. Excellent Pay 
& Benefits. For Examination 
and Application Information, 
Call 1-206-736-7000 Ext. 
9166T9 6 am -10 pm/7 days. 
_________ _____41-1.1P

CERTIFIED N U R S E S  
AIDE needs part-time work 
sitting with the elderly (in 
Bronte only). Call 473-2070. 
______________ 4.Q-2tC

CARRIER/BRONTE - great 
parttime job if you like early 
morning hours. Makes ap­
proximately $850/mo. Bronte 
residents only. Call 1-800- 
588-1884, Ext. 352, 353, or 
360 before 5 pm. 
____________ 40b-3tc

BRONTE ISD is accepting 
applications for Cafeteria 
Manager, lunchroom and/or 
managerial experience pre­
ferred. Salary open, fringe 
benefits. Contact Michael 
Hartman, 915/473-2511. 
_____________40b-2tc

]

SW IM M IN G  
LESSONS 

June 17 - 28
Wes Horn 453-2186 

$20/2 weeks

WANT TO HELP in your 
home, cleaning, shopping, 
etc. Pam, 453-2684. 
_____________41-2tp

SUMMER CHILDCARE
0-12 years, $1.50 hour. Drop- 
ins welcome. 602 W. 18th, 
Robert Lee. Phone: 453- 
4507.
______________ 4Q-.gtP

JUST WINDOWS
Let us wash your windows, 
inside and out. Call Vallery 
Johnson at 453-4714 or 
Kathy Deen at 453-2786. 
_____________40-2tp

TREE SPRAYING
Pecans for Casebearer. Also 
spraying for webworms and 
fleas and ticks. No job too 
large or small. PBS Nursery, 
Ballinger. Call 365-3269, day, 
or 365-2372, night, Donnie 
Bruton.
_____________41-4tc

JOHNNY’S MOWING & 
HAULING SERVICE 

Call 453-2158.
______________ 4Q-2tC

CO M PLETE L A W N  
CARE: Mowing, Edging, 
Weed-eating, ro to -tilling , 
flower beds, and gardens. 
One time or all season. Rea­
sonable rates. Call 473-2406, 
Bronte.
____________ 40b-4tc

Beirs Dirt 
Construction

Back-Hoe Dump Truck 
Roadgrader 

Call For FREE Estimate 

DON BELL
453-2259 Robert Lee

Johnson's  
UJater UJell 

Seruice
Farm

Ranch Home 
Windmills & Pumps 
24 HR. SERVICE

1 -8 0 0 -5 4 8 -4 2 4 1
or

658-6039 655-0379

J

WILL DO QUALITY Interior 
and Exterior House Painting. 
Also mow lawns and caretake, 
etc. Danny Sheppard, 453- 
2684.
_____________4V21P

PROCLAMATION
TO THE CITIZENS O F 
ROBERT LEE, TEXAS: 
WHEREAS, EIGHT STU­
DENTS OF THE Robert Lee 
High School have participated 
in the Class A academic and 
sports events at state compe­
tition and have won First 
Place, and
WHEREAS, THEY HAVE 
BROUGHT to the City of 
Robert Lee by their out­
standing abilities and dedica­
tion and hard work necessary 
to achieve this, and 
WHEREAS, they have by 
their individual high character 
and personalities represented 
their school and city well, 
NOW, THEREFORE, I, Jackie 
Walker, in my capacity as May­
or of the CITY OF ROBERT 
LEE, do hereby proclaim the 
week of May 19 - 25, 1991 as 
APPRECIATION WEEK in the 
City of Robert Lee for 

CARLA BEWICK 
LENNY JACKSON 

RON MCCOWN 
STEPHEN EPPERSON 

JODY TAVAREZ 
BRENT GIBBS 

SCOTT ANTILLEY 
JOHN WILLIAMS 

AND DO HEREBY express to 
each of these boys and girls 
the sincere appreciation and 
congratulations of the City of 
Robert Lee.
IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I 
have hereunto set my hand 
and caused the Seal of the 
City of Robert Lee, Texas, to 
be affixed this the 16th day of 
May, 1991.

Jackie Walker 
Mayor, City of Robert Lee 

ATTEST;
Edna Havins 

Secretary
_____________41a-1tc

C GARAGE SALES

OAK CREEK - Several 
garage sales, May 25th, 26th, 
27th, Live Oak Marina Road 
off Hwy 70 - 1 mile and 1.3 
mile. Follow signs. No sales 
before 7:30 am Saturday.
— ------------------4J--.1tp

TWO FAMILY P A T I O  
SALE Friday and Saturday, 
8am - 8 pm. 627 N. Franklin, 
Bronte.
_____________41b-1tc

J



classifieds

c GARAGE SALES 3
GARAGE SALE

Saturday only, 9-12. Lots of 
misc. - Honda 90, like new, 
1200 miles; oil field tools; car­
pet; drapes; coffee table; 
small buffet; clothing. Hwy 
158 to Bayview sign, turn 
right, last house on right. 
_____________41-1tc

GARAGE SALE - Saturday 
only on 3rd Street, Robert 
Lee.
_____________41-1tc

[  CARD OF THANKS )

APPRECIATE the prayers, 
flowers, visits, food, and calls 
during my recent illness.

Johnnie Pearl Beaver 
_____________41b-1tp

TO THE PARENTS O F 
THE BRONTE SENIOR 
CLASS,

The Senior Class would like 
to thank you for the wonder­
ful, adventurous, and delight­
fully fun experience that we 
will remember forever. The 
time we were able to spend 
together not only revived old 
memories, but also created 
new ones. We appreciate all 
of the hard work, time, and ef­
fort that went into planning 
the progressive dinner.

Sincerely Yours, 
The Bronte Sr Class of '91 

_____________41b-1tc

c NO TICES 3
BIDDERS NOTICE

Bronte ISD is accepting bids 
for construction of 350 feet of 
6 foot small mesh fence for 
Elementary Playground.

Bids are also being taken for 
construction of two hallways 
approximately 500 feet with 
sheet metal exterior wall, inte­
rior sheetrock walls, tile floor, 
suspended ceiling and light­
ing.

For details and specifica­
tions for both bids come by 
the Bronte ISD Superinten­
dent’s Office, 210 South Jef­
ferson, Bronte. 
_____________40b-2tc

ADVERTISEMENT 
FOR BIDS 
CITY OF

ROBERT LEE, TEXAS 
T. C. D. P.

Project No. 700751
The City of Robert Lee will re­
ceive bids for the construction 
of Water Distribution Im­
provements until 4:00 pm on 
June 10, 1991, at City Hall, 6 
East 7th Street, in Robert 
Lee, Texas. The bids will be 
publicly opened and read 
aloud at 4:00 pm on June 10, 
1991, at City Hall, 6 East 7th 
Street, in Robert Lee, Texas. 
Bid/Contract Documents, in­
cluding Drawings and Techni­
cal Specifications may be ex­
amined at City Hall or at the 
following location:

REYNOLDS-HIBBS 
& ASSOCIATES 
#17 Windmill Circle 

Abilene, Texas 79606 
Copies of the Bid/Contract 
Documents may be obtained

from R EYN O LD S-H IBBS 
& ASSOCIATES, P. O. Box
5198, Abilene, Texas 79608, 
(915/698-5562) upon pay­
ment of $25.00 (non-refund- 
able) for each set.
A Bid Bond in the amount of 
five percent (5%) of the bid, 
issued by an accep tab le  
surety, shall be submitted with 
each bid. A certified check or 
bank draft payable to the City 
of Robert Lee, or negotiable 
US Government Bonds (at par 
value), may be submitted in 
lieu of the Bid Bond.
This project is financed with 
$95,000.00 of federal funds 
which represents 90% of the 
project budget. Because 
federal funds are being used, 
attention Is called to the fact 
that not less than the federally 
determined prevailing (Davis- 
Bacon) wage rate, as issued 
by the Texas Department of 
Commerce and contained in 
the Contract Documents, 
must be paid on this project. 
In addition, the successful 
bidder must ensure that em­
ployees and applicants for 
employment are not discrimi­
nated against because of their 
race, color, religion, sex, or 
national origin.

Attention is also called to 
General Condition 141 
"Restrictions on Public Build­
ings and Public Works Pro­
jects." The Bidder certifies by 
the submission of its bid that 
it:

1. Is not a contractor of a for­
eign country included on the 
USTR list.
2. Has not and will not enter 
into any subcontract with a 
subcontractor of a foreign 
country included on the 
USTR list.
3. Will not provide any prod­
uct of a foreign country in­
cluded on the USTR list.
The City of Robert Lee re­
serves the right to reject any 
or ail bids or to waive any in­
formalities in the bidding. 
Bids may be held by the City 
of Robert Lee for a period not 
to exceed thirty (30) days from 
the date of the bid opening 
for the purpose of reviewing 
the bids and investigating the 
bidders qualifications prior to 
the contract award.

City of Robert Lee, Texas 
By: Jackie Walker, Mayor 

Date: May 16,1991 
_____________40a-2tc
¡eeaasaaaaeeoeeaesas
S WAREHOUSE SALE

May 26th & 27th 
Saturday & Sunday

Everything 75% off! 
Come by and have a cup 
of coffee with Ara and 
SAVE - SAVE - SAVE 

HOBO DEPOT
4th & Magdalen -San Angelo

DEMO
1991 Grand Marquis 

4,646 miles 
Completely loaded, 

including formal coach 
roof, leather interior.

List $22,159 
Sale Price $17,990 

A beautiful car and 
the last 1991 model 

we will have.

IVEY MOTOR CO.
453-2715 Robert Lee
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Br. All Sports boosters nonor athletes
The Bronte All Sports 

Booster Club honored the 
outstanding student athletes 
with a banquet recently in the 
Bronte Community Center.

The building was decorated 
with streamers in our 
traditional maroon and white 
colors.

A t t ra c t iv e  w o oden  
Longhorns decorated each 
serving table where a deli­
cious meal was served.

Officers of the All Sports 
Club include Stover Taylor as 
President; Gerald Parker, 
Garland Richards, and Scottie 
McCorkle as Vice Presidents; 
Gina Grant as Treasurer; and 
Angi Richards as Secretary.

Coach Rocky Rawls was 
recognized as All West Texas 
Coach of the Year. John 
Thomas was also recognized 
as his assistant coach.

Those recognized in Boys 
Basketball included Justin 
Phillips as Most Valuable 
Player, Sean Conway as Most 
Improved and Most Valuable 
Post, Bill Windham as Most 
Valuable Guard, Jason Pierce. 
as Defensive Player, and 
Brandon Marshall as the Hus­
tlin' Horn. It was noted that 
Justin Marshall had 1,713 ca­
reer points with Bill Windham 
having 1,072.

Football honoree included 
Brandon Marshall as Most 
Valuable Player, Bill Windham 
and Justin Phillips as Out­
standing Backs, and Tim Sims 
and Jason Pierce as Out­
standing Linemen. Jason 
Pierce recovered the most 
fumbles, while Justin Phillips 
had the most interceptions 
and Bill Windham had the 
most tackles.

Angela Davis was named 
the Most Valuable Player in 
Girls Volleyball, with Teresa 
Vaughn as Offensive Piayer 
and Angela Davis as Defen­
sive Player. The Coach's

Award went to Ree Baldwin 
and the JV Player Award went 
to Misty Mackey.

In Girls Basketball, Darla 
Scott was named the Most 
Valuable Player. Teresa 
Vaughn was named Defen­
sive Player, Angela Davis as 
Hustlin' Horn, Alisa Richards 
as Most Improved and Eboni

Taylor as Most Consistent.
The Most Valuable Awards 

in Track went to Teresa 
Vaughn and Gary Bilbrey.

Jami Morrow and Brian Ar- 
rott took the MVP Awards in 
Golf.

MVP in Tennis went to 
Brandi Thomas with Jay Park­
er being named the Most 
Promising Player.

Best of luck to the grads
Twelve long years of hard 

work will culminate for the 
Bronte Seniors of 1991 as 
they graduate, Friday, May 24, 
at 8 pm in the auditorium.

For eight of the twenty- 
three graduates, the journey 
through childhood, puberty, 
and early adulthood began 
together as kindergartners In 
1979.

Chubby-cheeked a n d  
snaggle-toothed, the eight 
(Brian Arrott, Susan Culp, Bill 
Magness, Justin Phillips, Ja­
son Pierce, Angela Reyes 
Davis, Lee Sonnenberg, and 
Eboni Taylor) have weathered 
13 years of growing up to­
gether. Misti Ensor and Misty 
Golson started with the group 
but moved away, only to re­
turn later.

Julie Blair joined the class in 
first grade, with Cory Thorn 
moving in during second 
grade.

In third grade. Bill Windham 
was a new addition to the tal­
ented class. During fourth 
grade, they gained Melissa 
Bivins and Tim Sims as new 
classmates. Sean Conway 
joined the group in fifth grade.

Their junior high years saw 
the addition of Debbie Mon- 
tez and Ray Wallace in sixth 
grade and John Thomas in 
seventh.

Ree Baldwin became a 
member of the class he r

Freshman year and additions 
continued as Stephen Shults 
moved in during tenth. The 
newest classmate. Sherry 
Healey, moved here last year.

Throughout the years, the 
Seniors of '91 have offered 
their wide range of talents to 
BHS through participation in 
countless activities.

Not only are they students, 
athletes, and scholars, they 
are also state qualifiers, state 
champions, actors, musicians, 
PALS, cheerleaders, live­
stock showmen, singers, 
journalists, FCA members, 
class officers, student body 
leaders, a dwarf, single, mar­
ried, parents, job-holders, 
artists, and entertainers to 
name only a few.

They will discover many 
more talents as they pursue 
their goals in life. In the 
meantime, we proudly wish 
the Class of 1991 the best of 
luck in their future endeavors.
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McPeek nets, scholarship
Texas Tech University Agri- 

cultufai Science Department 
has announced that Brent 
McPeek, Robert Lee FFA 
member, has been selected 
to receive the Agricultural 
Dean's Scholarship of 
$ 10,000 .

Brent is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Douglas McPeek of 
Robert Lee.

The selection was based 
upon scholastic achievement, 
involvement and participation 
in FFA leadership and judging 
teams, and motivation and 
desire to excell. Brent will also 
receive a $350 scholarship 
and a valedictorial scholarship 
his first two semesters at 
Tech.

Brent was also selected to 
receive the $250 Robert Lee 
FFA scholarship and is in the 
final stage of scholarship se­
lection by the Texas FFA. 
Brent will be interviewed for 
the Texas FFA Scholarship 
the first week in June in 
Austin. Texas FFA Scholar-

Brent McPeek

ships range in value from  
$12,000 to $300. Ninety FFA 
members from across Texas 
are competing for 86 different 
scholarships. Brent will attend 
Texas Tech University this fall 
and major in Agricultural Eco­
nomics with an agricultural fi­
nance option.

Dominoes
Come and play Tuesday, 

June 4, from 9 am until 12 
noon.

Blood Pressure Clinic
Ballinger Home Health Ser­

vices will be taking a blood 
pressure check from 8:30 - 
9:30 am Thursday, June 6. 
There is no charge for this 
service. It doesn't take long 
and it doesn't hurt, so come 
by for a check up. The Bronte 
Senior Center is located at 
613 East Oliver Avenue.

Strollin'
We're still strollin' Mondays, 

Wednesdays, and Fridays at 8 
am.

Center Hours
The Senior Center is open 

Mondays, Wednesdays, 
Thursdays, and Fridays from 8 
am to 1 pm. It Is open from 8 
am until 4 pm on Tuesdays.

Bronte Senior Center 
Staff

The staff of the Center in­
cludes: Mary Perclfull, Direc­
tor; Iris Champion, Van Driver; 
Geneva Minnick, Green 
Thumb; and Lois Wallace, 
Green Thumb.

on a first-come, first-serve ba­
sis.

Call Iris at 473 -2406  or 473- 
6471 to make reservations. 
Donations are accepted from 
those over 60 and for those 
under 60, the fee is $1.50 
one-way or $3 round-trip.

Meals For The Week 
Monday, May 27
Closed for Memorial Day 
Wednesday, May 29 
Chicken Fried Steak w/gravy 
Corn on the Cobb 
Mixed Vegetables 
Hot Roll 
Apple
Friday, May 31
Baked Flounder 
Pinto Beans 
Carrot & Cabbage Slaw 
Cornbread Muffin 
Sweet Applesauce

Bronte Hosts Robert 
Lee

Brunch was served to 13 
Robert Lee Senior Citizens 
last week by about that many 
from Bronte. GTE presented 
a very informative program 
about devices for the tele­
phone that helps those who 
have a hearing Impairment.

Rural Public 
Transportation Van

Iris Champion is the driver of 
our "Thunderbird" van and 
our objective is to provide 
transportation to the rural 
public. Our van goes to San 
Angelo every Tuesday on a 
demand basis. It leaves 
Bronte by 8:30 am at the 
latest.

Medical appointments, so­
cial service agencies, welfare 
agencies, social and recre­
ational activities and shopping 
are priorities in that order 
Seats are reserved in advance

These programs are funded 
in part by the Area Agency on 
Aging, Concho Valley Council 
of Governments, through 
grants from the Texas De­
partment on Aging.

Sorosis hosts 
summer party
A summertime party atmo­

sphere was the scene for the 
Sorosis Study Club's last 
meeting of the 1990-91 Club 
year. Diane Luckett was the 
hostess for the affair in her 
home Thursday evening. May 
9.

President Peggy Hembree 
conducted the business ses­
sion following the reading of 
the Club Collect and Pledges 
to the flags. Committees pre­
sented reports and communi­
cations were read. Plans were 
coordinated by the finance 
committee to participate in the 
Bronte Summer Fest June 21 
and 22. Club members will 
sell sandwiches and pickles 
on the portico of the old Santa 
Fe Depot alongside the East­
ern Star members selling 
drinks and brownies.

The history of the American 
flag was presented by Diane 
Luckett as the evening's pro­
gram. Questions were asked 
and answered about the many 
changes to the appearance of 
the flag. Also, proper display 
of the flag and its care were 
discussed.

An assortment of party 
cookies and iced lemonade 
was served to eleven club 
members. Ladies attending 
were Virginia Boecking, Mary 
Frances Glenn, Hembree, 
Frances Kemp, Bobbie Lee, 
Betty Lee, Luckett, Margaret 
Martin, Pat Oglesby, Mildred 
T h o m a s o n , and Ne l d a  
Thomason.

Band concerts presented
By Angela Davis

The Bronte ISD Department 
of Music presented their ele­
mentary, junior high, and high 
school bands in concert 
Thursday, May 16, at 7 pm in 
the school auditorium.

Fourth grade recorders be­
gan the program with "The 01 
Time Twinkle Twinkle" fol­
lowed by five other selec­
tions.

They were followed by the 
fifth grade recorders who 
played "French Carol," "The 
Gift to be Simple," "Purple 
People Eater," and "Turtles."

Six selections, ranging from 
"Space Bird" to the fun tunes 
of "Kokomo" were played by 
the Junior High.

Finally, the Longhorn Band 
performed a variety of ten se­
lections in all including "The 
Marche Militaire Française," 
"Rhythm of the Winds," 
"Modal Song and Dance," and 
the "Cowboys."

Receiving outstanding stu­
dent awards were: Amye Peel 
- 4th; Amie Shults - 5th; and 
Jason Martinez - 6th.

Band Director Awards went 
to Cory Robinson - 7th; Jessi­
ca Salser - 8th; Kim Blair - 9th; 
Amy Allen - 10th; Luke Rob­
bins - 11th.

Julie Blair earned the Sousa 
Award. Seniors Justin Phillips 
and Brian Arrott received mu­
sicianship awards, while Billy 
Magness and Cory Thorn re­
ceived merit awards.

The concert also marked a 
milestone in the career of di­
rector Homer Stewart.

Stewart, a teacher for 18 
years, eight of those in 
Bronte, has decided to shift 
from teaching to cooking.

Homer Stewart

He will be attending John­
son and Wales University in 
Rhode Island where he will 
spend two years learning to 
be a chef. He plans to spe­
cialize in pastries and hopes 
to return to San Angelo.

Stewart will leave behind 
many fond memories. From 
the teacher appreciation gift 
from Brian Arrott, to the 
friends he made, and getting 
to drink coffee first period.

We will all miss him and 
would like to express our ap­
preciation for the many things 
he did for BHS.
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