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A tribute to the Bronte Senior Class of 1995
Formal commencement ex­

ercises for twenty-four Bronte 
Seniors will be held on Friday, 
May 26, at 8 pm in the school 
auditorium.

Laura Thomas will deliver 
the valedictory address and 
Christy McKinney will convey 
the salutatory. Speaking to 
the graduates, their relatives 
and friends, and school per­
sonnel will be Garry Bivins.

Members of the 1995 
graduating class includes:

Joni Sue Barrett, Jon Clin­
ton Brasher, Lindsey Rhea 
Burwick, David Wayne Cason, 
Regina Lynnette C layton, 
Wilma Renea Cooper, Corina 
Flores De La Cerda, Amanda 
Nicole Dunn, Monica Joy Ehl, 
James B. Hambright, Todd 
Nathan Harrell, Micah Ann 
Hoyt, Jill Ann Johnson, Fer­
nando Rene Montez, Christy 
Ann McKinney, Roy Kenneth 
Parks, Devlin Mason Pierce, 
Terrance Lee Queen, Phillip

David Ratliff, Margie Ro­
driquez, Jamie Lynn Ship- 
man, Brent Dayne Michaels 
Taylor, Laura L e e  A n n  
Thomas, and Jon Dale 
Thompson.

A Project Graduation Party 
js planned for the seniors fol­
lowing the commencement 
ceremonies. This will be a 
chaperoned, all-night ge! to­
gether with food, prizes, 
games, and activities for the 
class. The party will be held at 
the Bronte Community Cen­
ter.

Sanco Homecoming
The Sanco Homecoming 

will be held the second week­
end in June, the 10th and 
11th.

Plans are in the making and 
letters will be sent out soon. 
Watch the paper for more in­
formation.
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Honor graduates have been named for Bronte High School. Laura LeeAnn 
Thomas (I) posted a grade point average of 100 for valedictorian honors. She Is 
the daughter of Danny and Roenna Thomas. Salutatorian for the 1995 senior 
class is Christy Ann McKinney, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Phillip McKinney. Her 
grade point average was 99. Brent Dayne Michaels Taylor is the high ranking 
boy of the class with a grade point average of 94. His parents are Stover and 
Jerita Taylor.

County athletes bring home gold medals
Robert Lee and Bronte 

tracksters brought home a 
bevy of medals from the state 
track meet last weekend, with 
four of them being gold.

Bronte's Jill Johnson re­
peated her performance of 
last year, bringing home the 
gold in the 100 meter hurdles.
She bettered her third place 
performance of last year in the 
300 meter hurdles by taking 
the gold medal in this event, 
also.

Seldom can a team take two 
high school athletes to the 
State 1-A Track and Field 
Meet and come away with 2nd 
place in the state team cham­
pionship. The Steers did.
They were second with 40 
points to Roscoe's first place 
60, only by being outgunned 
in depth.

Adam Morgan, Steer junior 
vaulter, took third place with a 
13-9, a personal best and will 
hopefully get a rematch next 
year.

In a Herculean effort senior 
multi-sports athlete Lee Mc- 
Cown was entered in four 
events, back to back on two 
days. On Friday, the 12th, he 
grabbed first place in the dis­
cus with a 165.5. He took 
third in the high jump with a 6- 
7 leap, the same height as #1 
and #2 but the difference was 
misses.

In Saturday's action, Lee 
was 2nd in the 110 meter 
hurdles at 15.38 and won the 
shot put with a 53-9 1/4 toss.

Freshman Bree Bolding 
represented RLHS in fine

Lee McCown

fashion in the girls' division of 
the 1-A high jump at 5-4 for 
the bronze medal.

Playday scheduled
The Coke County Rodeo 

Association will hold its first 
Playday this Friday, May 19th, 
beginning at 7:00 pm at the 
arena in Bronte.

Events will include barrel 
racing, pole bending, flags, 
and goat tying. The age 
groups for participants are: 5 
and under with help, 5 and 
under, 6-8 years, 9-12 years, 
13-15 years, 16-18 years, and 
19 and over.

Anyone interested in par­
ticipating and/or joining the 
Coke County R o d e o  
Association is encouraged to 
come on out and enjoy the 
fun.

Calhoun improving
Freddie Calhoun, Jr. of 

Robert Lee was in improved

Jill Johnson

condition Tuesday in Shan­
non Medical Center in San 
Angelo. Mr. Calhoun, 38, was 
seriously injured in an acci­
dent on Highway 158 West 
near Calhoun's County Store 
the night of May 6.

According to DPS trooper 
Richard Fernandez of San 
Angelo, Calhoun was east- 
bound on foot on the south 
white stripe of the pavement. 
He was struck by the passen­
ger side of a 1987 GMC pick­
up belonging to and driven by 
Ronnie Waggonner of Robert 
Lee, who was also east- 
bound.

Waggonner rendered aid, 
called 911 and the local EMS 
responded. The injured man 
was airlifted by helicopter to 
San Angelo. He suffered 
from loss of blood from a head 
wound and underwent ex­
ploratory surgery at Shannon.
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Joneses to

Death Notices

Sockwell
Rhonda Denise Sockwell, 

39, of Robert Lee a n d  
formerly of Winters, died 
Tuesday, May 16, 1995, in a 
San Angelo hospital.

Graveside service was con­
ducted at 10:30 am Thursday 
in Lakeview Cemetery, di­
rected by Winters Funeral 
Home.

Survivors include her hus­
band, Larry Don Sockwell of 
Robert Lee; her father, Paul 
R. Gerhart of Winters; three 
sons, Michael Dean Sockwell 
and Jason Payne, both of 
Robert Lee, and Steven Lynn 
Sockwell of San Angelo; a

Sorosis Study 
Club

The Sorosis Study Club of 
Bronte met on Thursday 
night, May 11, in the home of 
Mrs. Royce Lee.

President Mrs. Clark Glenn 
presided for the business of 
the meeting.

Secretary Mrs. Billy Joe 
Luckett read the minutes of 
the last meeting. She also re­
ported the meeting that she 
had with the Coke County Ju­
venile Justice Center about 
the projects being discussed 
for the participation of the 
clubs from the Heart of Texas 
District of Federated Women's 
Clubs.

Mrs. Royce Fancher and 
Mrs. Lee reported on the up­
coming repairs to be made on 
the Capital Gazebo in Bronte. 
The club members voted to 
give $300 for the repa ir, 
matching the $300 recently 
donated by the B ro n te  
Evening Lions Club.

The members also voted to 
sell ribbons commemorating 
"old Fort Chadbourne Day" to 
be held in Bronte on June 24.

Margaret Martin presented 
the program on "Toward a 
Healthy America".

Mrs. Lee served coffee, tea, 
cokes, cherry cheesecake 
and hors d'oeuvres to those 
mentioned above and two 
guests, Doris Small and Ear- 
lene Moore of Bronte.

sister, Rebecca Gerhart of 
Winters; and a grandson.

Magness
Maudene Walls Magness, 

62, of Blackwell died Monday, 
May 15, 1995, in a West Coke 
County Nursing Home in 
Robert Lee.

Service was held at 2 pm 
Thursday at the Blackwell First 
Baptist Church with burial in 
the Hylton Cemetery, directed 
by Shaffer Funeral Home.

Survivors include her hus- 
bank, Jessie Magness of 
Blackwell; a son, Lee Mag­
ness of Granbury; a daughter, 
Sandra Bushore of San Anto­
nio; two brothers. Cloven 
Walls of Hamilton and Russell 
Walls of Frederick, Oklahoma; 
two s isters, B e r t h a  
Greathouse of Brady and Dell 
Massey of Aubrey; and two 
grandchildren.

Social Security 
Rep here

Garland Gregg, representa­
tive for the San Angelo Social 
Security Office, has sched­
uled his May visit to Robert 
Lee and Bronte. He will be in 
the Conference Room of the 
County Courthouse on 
Thursday, May 25th, between 
11:00 am and 11:30 am. He 
will be in the Bronte city hall 
Thursday, 1 :3 0 -2  pm the 
same day.

Anyone who wants to file a 
claim for benefits, g e t  
information, or transact other 
business with the Social Se­
curity Administration may 
contact him at this time.

Talpa Reunion
An old town, where only a 

post office, Branding Iron 
Cafe, and an auction barn ex­
ist, will come to life again on 
Saturday, May 27, in the Olda 
Wool House in Talpa.

Events will begin at 10 am 
with registration. Visiting will 
continue most of the day with 
several school classes hold­
ing reunions. Main happen­
ings will be the BBQ dinner at 
6 pm and the 9 pm dance.

For more information, call 
Joyce Smith, 915-636-4567.

NORTH RUNNELS 
HOME HEALTH SERVICE

PERSONAL CARE IN THE COMFORT OF YOUR HOME
BY

RN's Physical Therapists
Home Health Aides

Georga Jones, RN 
Winters

Occupational Therapists 
Speech Therapists
Patsy Cason, RN 
Robert Lee/Bronte

Jean Chew, RN 
Blackwell/Bronte

1-800-687-3305 915-754-4141

celebrate 50th
Bill and Ruby Jones of 

Robert Lee and long-time 
residents of Coke County, will 
mark their 50th wedding. To 
celebrate the event they will 
be honored with a réception 
Saturday, May 20th.

The affair will be in the Fel­
lowship Hall of the First United 
Methodist Church of Robert 
Lee from 2-4 pm.

Hostesses will be children 
and grandchildren of the cou­
ple: children are Keith Jones 
and wife, Kaye, of Round 
Rock, Texas and Scott Jones 
and wife, Mary Anne, Lake 
Jackson, Texas; grandchil­
dren are Amy and Chris of 
Round Rock and Keely and 
Ross of Lake Jackson.

The former Ruby Mae Le- 
hde and Billy Murray Jones 
were married May 26,1945, in 
the Highland H e ig h ts  
Methodist Church in Sweet­
water, Texas. The Reverend 
J. E. Shewbert officiated. Mr. 
Jones was a Master Sargent in 
the United States Air Corps 
and Mrs. Jones was secretary 
for the Ground School at 
Avenger Field after attending 
McMurry College in Abilene.

The couple moved to San 
Antonio while Bill was sta­
tioned at Stinson Field. After 
five and a half years service, 
he was discharged October 
31, 1945. They returned to 
Sweetwater before moving to 
Stephenville while he attend­
ed Tarleton College.

Leaving college. Bill worked 
for Gulf Oil. Ruby worked part- 
time in the Nolan County tax 
office.

The couple's sons were 
born in Sweetwater.

In 1955 the family moved to 
Silver and lived seventeen 
and a half years in the Perkins- 
Prothro Oil camp where Bill 
was a pumper.

The entire family was active 
in the Silver community and 
their Methodist Church. Bill 
was a member of the Official 
Church Board for many years. 
Ruby directed the church 
choir for fifteen years; was 
Methodist Youth Sponsor; 
was a Cub Scout Den Mother 
five years; a Vice-President of 
the PTA's 16th District and a 
member of the Women's So­
ciety of Christian Service. 
School activities kept the 
family busy.

When the Spence Dam was 
being built. Ruby was office 
manager for the C lem ent 
Brothers Company and when 
Silver Peak School consoli­
dated with Robert Lee, the 
family began attending the 
Robert Lee United Methodist 
Church. Their son, Scott, 
graduated from RLHS.

Bill and Ruby left Perkins-

Bill and Ruby Jones

Prothro and Silver to go into 
Child Care for five years, first 
with the Texas Youth Council 
and then Hendricks Home for 
Children in Abilene, only to 
return to the oil patch in Coke 
County. Bill was a pumper for 
Star Production out of Dallas, 
retiring in 1994. Ruby retired 
from the Coke County Tax 
Office in 1990.

In a special Sunday Church 
Service, the First U n ited 
Methodist Church of Robert 
Lee presented Ruby with a 
plaque and flowers for 13 
years of leading the church 
choir and music.

Out of town guest attending 
are their children and grand­
children and Mr. and Mrs. 
Walter Lehde and Mr. and 
Mrs. Ron Lehde,, all of San 
Antonio; Mr. and Mrs. Jesse 
P. Reid of Phoenix, Arizona; 
Elizabeth Whitworth o f

Sweetwater; Mr. and Mrs. 
Robert Headrick of Sweetwa­
ter; Mrs. Estelle Jones of 
Odessa; Mrs. Gladys Shaw of 
San Angelo: and Mrs. Cleo 
Reid of Big Spring.

Runnels Baptist 
Assn, to meet

The regular meeting of the 
Runnels Baptist Association 
will be held May 22, 1995, at 
First Baptist Church, Miles, 
Texas.

The W.M.U. and executive 
board will meet at 5:30 pm. 
The evening meal will be 
served at 6:00 pm.

The program begins at 7:00 
pm. The program is on family 
life emphasis. Tony Gruben, 
family life director, is in charge 
of the program.

KEN GREEN RGENCV
-Headquarters For-

Medicare Supplements 
Health * Life Products 

(915) 453-2215
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National Nursing Home Week 
May 14-20,1995

We, at Hurley Pharmacy, wish to extend our support to the 
residents of our local nursing homes. Those who have 
given us so much in the past deserve our admiration, 

respect and honor. We invite you to join us in celebrating 
National Nursing Home Week by visiting a nursing home

resident today.

HURLEY PHARMACY
503 S. State Bronte 473-2351
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WCCNH Mother’s 
Day Tea

Several guests and twenty- 
seven residents gathered in 
the recreation room at West 
Coke County Nursing Home 
on Saturday, May 13, at 3:00 
pm to honor their mothers.

Mrs. Sadie Chumley was the 
oldest mother present, she 
will be 100 in June.

Mrs. Irene Newell was born 
in the fa rth e s t s ta te , 
Minnesota.

Francis Cole had 8 children, 
so was honored as having the 
most children.

Thelma Preston had the 
most grandchildren with 9 and 
Floy Sawyer and Vera Jame­
son tied with having the most 
great-grandchildren with 10.

A pretty cake, furnished by 
the Ladies Auxiliary, and cof­
fee punch was served to all 
while Pat Stevens played the 
piano and Bonita Copeland 
and Joan Cantrell lead some 
"oldies but goodies" songs.

A drawing was held for 3 
baskets of greenery. Essie 
Childress, Francis Cole and 
Cora Allen were the winners.

Everyone always enjoys 
these parties more when rela­
tives and friends attend and 
this was no exception.

Sunny 
Notes for 

_ the Coke 
County 
Seniors

Senior Recreation Week 
May 22-26 

Bingo
Tuesday, May 23 we will 

play Bingo at the Bronte Se­
nior Center beginning at 1:00 
pm. Come join us for a fun 
afternoon. Refreshments will 
be served.

Potiuck and ”88"
Time again for our monthly 

Potiuck and table games day. 
Door opens at 9:00 am for 
games, short program at 
11:15 and luncheon at 11:30.

Flower Contest!
We would like to issue a 

challenge to make our Senior 
Center more attractive. How 
would you like to have a sec­
tion of the flower bed and you 
be responsible for planting 
and maintaining that small 
section? We will have judges 
and a nice prize for the win­
ner. Call the Center at 473- 
6471 if you would like to par­
ticipate.

Center Closed
The Bronte Senior Center 

will be closed on Memorial 
Day, May 29th.
MENU FOR THE WEEK 

Monday, May 22 
Beef Stew, Macaroni and 

Cheese, Turnip G reens, 
Cornbread, Fruited Gelatin 
Wednesday, May 24 

Fish Sticks, Pork and 
Beans, Slaw, Cornbread, 
Peanut Butter Cake 
Friday, May 26 

Chicken Fried Steak, White 
Sauce, Mashed Potatoes, 
Mixed Vegetables, Hot Roll, 
Orange

These programs are funded 
in part by the Area Agency on 
Aging, Concho Valley Council 
of Governments, through 
grants from the Texas 
Department on Aging.

Gary Davis serves his grandmother, Mrs. Floy 
Sawyer, cake at the West Coke County Nurs­
ing Home's Mother's Day Tea.

UMW Dorcas Circle
Robert Lee's United 

Methodist Women (UMW), 
Dorcas Circle, met May 10, in 
the Fellowship Hall with Emma 
Lee Bickley serving as host­
ess. President C harlo tte  
McKnight led the group in the 
usual invocation before re­
freshments were served, then 
presided in a business meet­
ing.

•64 Study Club
The Sixty-four Study Club 

of Robert Lee met May 9, 
1995, in the Sanco homu of 
Winnie Pitcock. Co-hostess­
es were Maxine Post, Pauline 
Vaughan, and Pat Carwile. 
Being the last meeting of the 
club season before summer 
break, it was the annual salad 
supper to which members 
brought salads of their choic­
es. That is always interesting 
and delightful, a time when 
members try to sample every 
dish and exchange recipes 
and ideas. Seventeen mem­
bers and three guests at­
tended.

The program for the 
evening was a book review by 
Alice Beaty. Her choice of 
book was STICK A GERANI­
UM IN YOUR HAT AND BE 
HAPPY, a delightful and hu­
morous story of the author's 
own family by Barbara John­
son. Alice, a l w a y s  
dependable as a good 
reviewer, added to the reality 
of her story by we,aring a big 
hat with a geranium stuck in its 
band.

During a business meeting 
which followed the review, 
Nettie Autry was voted in as a 
new club member.

Next meeting will be held in 
September, the first of the 
1995-1996 fiscal year.

The day's program was pre­
sented by Alice Beaty. It was 
the second of three programs 
from an annual SPIRITUAL 
GROWTH study using the text 
material, DRAWING THE CIR­
CLE WIDE. The programs 
center on home and family 
life.

An animated discussion of 
Alice's presentation revealed 
that most members agree that 
today's problems among 
youth stem from the break­
down of traditional family life 
and family values. Since most 
of those present are grand­
parents, it was agreed that 
growing up in their youth was 
not as difficult as it is now. 
Being sympathetic with their 
grandchildren did not diminish 
concern, but rather increased 
it. Recalling the motto that 
"Families that pray together 
stay together," it was agreed 
that children who grow up in 
homes in which parents and 
children attend church to­
gether and who participate in 
church activities together, 
usually have the fewer prob­
lems.

Bronte End-of-
Schooi Activities
The annual Academic 

Awards ceremony was held 
Thursday evening. May 18th, 
at 7:00 pm in the school's au­
ditorium.

Bronte ISD will hold final ex­
ams May 23rd through the 
25th.

The Eighth G r a d e  
promotional exercises will be 
held at 6:00 pm on Thursday, 
May 25th in the auditorium.

Commencement exercises 
for the 1995 Bronte graduat­
ing seniors will be held Friday 
evening May 26th at 8:00 pm 
in the auditorium.

MANDY DUNN 
JONI BARRETT 
MICAH HOYT 
SHELLY SIMS 
JILL JOHNSON

KIZZIE HOWELL 
MELISSA SMITH 
MEAGAN HILL 
MARANDA WOJTEK 
BREE BOLDING

LEE MCCOWN 
ADAM MORGAN

FIRST NATIONAL BANK IN BRONTE
MEMBER FDIC

50J pommerce - Robert Lefi,, TX 
Store Hrs; Mon-Sat 6-8 Sun> 6-6 

SPECIALS GOOD 5/17 THRU 5/23

Value Pack
Fryer Thighs  

or
D r u m s t i c k s

L b . Wright’S Sliced

Bacon

Catifornia

Peaches
Lb. 7 9

Asst. Chunk Light 
StarKist

T una
6 OZ.
can 2/$1

Rainbow Asst,

Ice

So Dri

Paper
Towels

Single
Roll

Coke or 
7 Up

12 pk. 
12 oz. 
cans 2.99
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1995 BHS Heart Award Recipients: Brent 
Taylor and Jill Johnson.

Nicole Denae Butts (I) has been named the valedictorian of the Eighth grade 
graduating class of Bronte School with a grade point average of 96.6. She is 
the daughter of Gerald and Sandy Butts. Salutatorian honors went to Bonnie 
Rae DeLaughter whose grade point averaged 92.9. Paul and Patti DeLaughter 
are her parents. High ranking boy in the class Is Cody Joe Harris with an 89.1 
gpa. His parents are Mike and Debbie Harris.

Bronte Eighth 
Grade Promotional

Bronte Eighth Grade pro­
motional exercises will be held 
in the school auditorium on 
Thursday evening, May 25, at 
6 pm. Twenty-nine candi­
dates make up the class in­
cluding the following:

Brittany Jo Barrett, Shane 
Jason Briley, Nicole Denae 
Butts, Mica Dawana Carper,
Natasha Lynn Carper, Daniel 
Ray DeLaCerda, Bonnie Rae 
DeLaughter, Brandy Rene 
Denton, Rod James Harrell,
Cody Joe Harris, Regina Lynn 
Hastings, Dustin Clark Hol­
land, Kevin Allen Johnson,
James Christopher Keller,
Joshua Cope Knight, Julie S.
Martinez, Stacie Darlene Mc­
Kee, Robert Minjarez, Kim­
berly Ann Perry, Dawn Eliza­
beth Rhodes, Jason Eric Ro­
driquez, Jose M a n u e l  
Rodriquez, Rolinda Sanchez,
David Dustin Scott, Jason 
Chad Silva, Jimmy Joe Soto,
Vanessa Kay Sparks, Erin 
Robin Stevens, and Dusty 
Ray White.

Terah Collins and Karen 
Cox have served as the class 
sponsors for 1994-95.

Bronte All-Sports 
Banquet

On May 15, 1995, th e  
Bronte Comunity Center was 
decorated in maroon, silver, 
and white with balloons, tin­
sel, and giant jigsaw puzzle 
pieces r e p r e s e n t i n g  
volleyball, football, basketball, 
track. Boosters, community, 
band, cheerleaders. Flag 
Corps, go lf, te n n is , 
administration, and faculty - all 
key ingredients in this year's 
BHS All-Sports B anque t 
theme of "Teamwork 
Together We Stand, Divided 
We Fall". In one corner the 
many and varied trophies and 
plaques won by the 1994- 
1995 Bronte High School 
athletes were showcased.
Brass and walnut sports 
plaques were displayed along 
the head table; awards later 
distributed to the 16 senior 
athletic participants of BHS.

Superintendent Mike Hart­
man welcomed 159 guests, 
followed with a prayer voiced 
by Brent Taylor, FCA Presi­
dent. El Ranchero Restaurant 
catered an enjoyable meal of 
BBQ with all the trimmings, in­
cluding homemade rolls.

Speaker Tim Cassidy was 
introduced by local rancher 
and Texas A&M alumni Ed 
Cumbie. Mr. Cassidy has 
been associated with Texas 
A&M's sports program for ten 
years, associated with eight 
Bowl teams and 10 players 
who attained first-round draft 
status for Pro Ball. He is cur­
rently the Associate Athletic 
Director for Football Opera­
tions at Texas A&M University. 
Mr. Cassidy voiced praise for 
the "clean-cut group" of 
Bronte athletes on their many 
successes of this past year. 
His motivational speech was 
based on the Mental Maps of 
Life.

Coaches Karen Fox, Keith 
McCutchen, Kerry Lee, Rocky 
Rawls, and Russ Peterson 
presented individual sports 
awards.

Highlights of the evening 
were the presentation of the 
Martin and Patricia Lee Chris­
tian Athlete Scholarship by 
the First Methodist Church to 
Senior Brent Taylor and the 
coach's presentation of the 
BHS Heart Awards to Lady 
Longhorn Jill Johnson and 
Longhorn Brent Taylor.

Most Valuable P la y e r 
Awards were as follows: Vol­
leyball - Kim Hall, Football Of­
fense - Brent Taylor, Football 
Defense - David Cason, Girl's 
Basketball - Jill Johnson, 
Boy's Ba.'iketball - Brent Tay­
lor, Girl's Golf - Laura Thomas, 
Boy's Golf - Nick Arrott, Tennis 
- Gina Clayton, Girl's Track - Jill 
Johnson, Boy's Track - Clint

Brasher.
The following individual 

awards were distributed: 
Sommer Beck - Volleyball 

Freshman MVP and Track - 
Regional Qualifier 

Shelly Sims - Volleyball Ju­
nior Varsity MVP, Golf Team - 
3rd in State

Joni Barrett - Volleyball All- 
District 1st Team, Golf - 3rd in 
State, Volleyball Outstanding 
Server

Jill Johnson - Volleyball All- 
District 1st Team, Volleyball 
Outstanding Defense, Bas­
ketball All-District 1st Team, 
State Winner 300 and 100 
hurdles

Julia Gentry - Volleyball All- 
District 1st Team, Volleyball 
Outstanding Hitter, Basketball 
Outstanding Defensive Player 

Wendy Johnson - Volleyball 
All-District 2nd Team, Volley­
ball Outstanding B locker, 
Basketball All-District 1st 
Team, Basketball All-Around 
Player Award

Gina Clayton - Volleyball All- 
District 2nd Team, Volleyball 
Outstanding Passer 

Laura Thomas - Volleyball 
All-District Honorable Men­
tion, Volleyball Most Dedicat­
ed Award, Lowest Round Av­
erage-Golf, Golf Team - 3rd in 
State

Mandy Dunn - Volleyball Ail- 
District Honorable Mention, 
Volleyball Most Improved 
Player, Golf Team - 3rd in 
State

Kim Hall - Volleyball Out- 

(cont'd. on page 10)
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SCHOOL
MENU

B reakfast 
Monday, May 22

Cereal, Applesauce, Toast, 
Milk
Tuesday, May 23

Pancake and Sausage on a 
Stick, Grape Juice, Milk 
Wednesday, May 24 

Oatmeal, Diced Pears, Cin­
namon Toast, Milk 
Thursday, May 25 

Sausage, Apple Ju ice, 
Pancakes, Milk 
Friday, May 26 

SCHOOL OUT!!!

Lunch 
Monday, May 22

Pizza, Tossed Salad, But­
tered Corn, Milk, Banana 

■ Pudding
Tuesday, May 23

Corndogs, C h i c k e n  
Nuggets, Macaroni and 
Cheese, Ranch Style Beans, 
Applesauce, Milk, Pink Pan­
ther Cake
Wednesday, May 24

Tacos with Cheese, Span­
ish Rice, Lettuce and Tomato, 
Refried Beans, Taco Salad 
Shells, Milk, Jello with Whip 
Topping
Thursday, May 25

Submarine Sandwich, Ham 
and Cheese, Lettuce and 
Tomato, Pickles, Pork and 
Beans, Apple, Bun, M ilk, 
Oatmeal Cookies 
Friday, May 26 

SCHOOL OUT!!!

OUR BEST

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

CHRISTY
ANN

MCKINNEY

DAUGHTER OF 
MR. & MRS.

PHILLIP
MCKINNEY

Salutatorian; National Honor Society 2, President; 
Yearbook 3, Yearbook Editor; TAPE 4, President; Band 
4, Drum Major 2, Vice-President; Band Sweetheart; One 
Act Play 4; Best Actress Award - Zone, All Star Cast 3, 
District Academic UIL 4; Bronte Chamber of Commerce 
Award Outstanding Girl Student of the Year; DAR Award; 
Hardin Simmons Univ. Top Five Juniors Award; Who's 
Who Among American High School Students Award; US 
Achievement Academy Award; HOBY Ambassador; Most 
Likely to Succeed.

CUMBIE'S MERCANTILE
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YOU’RE SPECIAL
We Are Proud 
To Sponsor 

Our Daughter

LAURA 
LEEANN 
THOMAS

DAUGHTER OF 
DANNY & ROENNA 

THOMAS
District Volley Ball Team Honorable Mention 4; Volley­

ball Heart Award 3; All-Star Academic Volleyball Team 4; 
Golf 3rd State 2, 4, 7th State 3, Golf MVP 3, Low Round 
Average Award 3; Cheerleader 1, 2, 3, 4; Class Presi­
dent 1,3; Class Vice-President 2; Student Council Rep­
resentative 4; National Honor Society Reporter 4; FFA 
Secretary 2, 3, FFA Vice President 4; FHA Vice-Presi­
dent 1; FCA Vice-President 4; International Foreign 
Language Award 2; Certificate of Excellence Award 
Spanish II 3; UIL Literary Criticism 6th in District, 2- Who's 
Who in A m : Honor Roll and High Class GPA 1,2, 3, 4; 
Scholarship Award and Principal's Award 2; Miss BHS 4; 
FFA Greenhand, Star Farmer and Lone Star Farmer 
Awards 1, 2, 3; National Merit Science Award 4; Class 
Valedictorian.

LONE STAR 
MAINTENANCE

TX Lie# TACLB012289C

OUR TRIBUTE
We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

JONI SUE 
BARRETT

DAUGHTER OF
TONY 

BARRETT &
JOLENE 

HENDERSON
Band 9; Drum Major 9; FCA 9, 10, 11, 12; FFA 9, 10, 

11,12, Reporter 11,12; FFA Sweetheart 12; FHA 9, 1o! 
11, 12, Secretary 10, Vice-President 11, President 12- 
State Voting Delegate 12; UIL Feature Writing 11, 12; 
Volleyball 9, 10, 11, 12, District Champions 11,12, Bi- 
District Champions 11, 12, Area Champs 11, Regional 
Runners-up 11, First Team Selection All-District 12; 
Basketball 9, 10, 11, 12, Area Runners-Up 11, Semi- 
Regional Runner-Up 12; Tennis 9, 10, 11, District 
Runner-up Doubles 11; Golf 9, 10, 11, 12, State 
Qualifier 10, 11, 12, 3rd place State 10, 12, 5th Medalist 
Regional 12; Class Representative 10; Perfect 
Attendance 9, 10, 11; Football Manager 10, 11, 12; 
Highest Average in Agriculture 11; Homecoming 
Duchess 12; Student Council Secretary 12; Most Out­
standing Student in Journalism 11.

FIRST NATIONAL BANK 
IN BRONTE

MEMBER FDIC

Congratulations 
Class of 1995

OUR RESPECT
We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

BRENT 
DAYNE.

MICHEALS 
TAYLOR

SON OF 
STOVER
& JERITA 
TAYLOR

Student Council President; FCA, President; Football 
All-District Quarterback, Standard Times All-District Quar­
terback, All West Texas Football Team, Basketball All- 
District, Standard Times All West Texas Basketball Team; 
Who's Who in Athletics; Most Athletic; Mr. BHS; UIL One 
Act Play, North Zone Winners; UIL Ready Writing; 13 
Years Perfect Attendance; Track & Golf Teams; 
Longhorn Band 1, 2, 3, 4; National Honor Society; 
Chamber of Commerce Male Student of the Year; KRBC 
Classroom Champion Athlete Profile; FFA, FHA, TAFE.

COKE CO. 
ATTORNEY 

CHRIS WYATT

OUR ADMIRATION

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

JILL ANN 
JOHNSON

DAUGHTER OF 
MIKE&TERI 
JOHNSON

Volleyball 1,2, 3, 4, MVP 1, AI I-District 2, 3, 4, All Re­
gion 3, All State 4, All Star 4, All State Academic 4, All 
Tournament Ector County 3; District Champs 3, 4, Re­
gional Semi-Finalist 3, Bi-District Champs 4; Basketball 1, 
2, 3, 4, All-District 2, 3, 4, All West Texas 4, West Texas 
Academic Team 4, All Tournament Ballinger 4. Bi-District 
Champs 3, Regional Semi-Finalist 4; Track 1, 2,3,4, Re­
gional Champ 100 M. Hurdles 2, 3, 4, Regional Champ 
300 M. Hurdles 3, 4, Regional 3rd place Triple Jump, 
Regional Qualifier Long Jump 4, State 3rd Place 100 M. 
Hurdles 10, State Champ 100 M. Hurdles 3, 4, State 3rd 
Place 300 M. Hurdles, State Champ 300 M. Hurdles 4, 
Track District Champs 4; Cheerleader 1, 2, 3, 4, Head 3, 
4; Homecoming Duchess 3; Homecoming Queen 4; 
Miss Bronte 4; National Honor Society 3, 4; Most Beauti­
ful 3; Most Athletic 4; FFA 1, 2; FHA 2; Band 1,2.

HALL'S SUPER SAVE
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SUPER CLASS

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

JAMES L.

HAMBRIGHT
SON OF 

BEN 

&KAY 

HAMBRIGHT

Football 9, 10, 12; Basketballs, 10, 11, 12; FFA 9,10, 
11,12; FHA 12; FCA 12; Class Treasurer 10; Class Vice- 
President 12; Livestock Judging 12.

PAM SHAFFER

BRIGHT FUTURE

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

TERRANCE
LEE

QUEEN
SON OF

MARGRET BAKER 
& BUDDY OUEEN

Basketball 1,2, 3, 4; Track 1,2, 4; CAP 2, 3, 4; Band 1, 
2, 3, 4, President 4, Chaplain 3; TAPE 1, 2, 3, 4; 
Parlimentarian 4.

BRONTE POST 
OFFICE

RAY, ELANE, DEBBIE & DANA

OUR ADMIRATION

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

JON 
DALE

THOMPSON
SON OF 

DONNIE 

& DEEANN 

THOMPSON

Football 4; FFA; FHA; FCA; Band 1; Spanish Club.

GLENN-B IVINS 
INSURANCE

OUR TRIBUTE

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

MONICA
JOY
EHL

DAUGHTER OF 
EDWARD 

&JO Y 
EHL

FFA 1, 3, 4 Officer 3; FHA 2; Basketball 1, 2, 3, 4; All 
District 1, 2, 3; Regional Qualifier 2, 4; Golf 2- UIL 
Calculator, Number Sense, One Act Play 1, 2; Baseball 
3; Track 1,3.

HIGHWAY GARAGE

WELL DONE

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

CORINA 
FLORES 

DELACERDA

DAUGHTER OF 
JOHN DeLaCERDA 

& LUPE BAILEY

FHA 1, 2,3; Class Favorite 2; Wittiest 4; TAFE 4; 
Volleyball manager 4.

RED BARN 
BARBECUE

OUR BEST

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

AMANDA
NICOLE
DUNN

DAUGHTER OF 
HAROLD & PATSY 

DUNN
UIL Spelling 4; Basketball 1, 2; Volleyball 1, 2, 3, 4; 

District Runner-up 2, Regional 3, Area 4; Golf 1, 2, 3, 4, 
State 3, 4; FFA 1,2, 3, 4; NHS 3, 4; Class Secretary 1,2, 
3, 4; Wittiest Girl 3; Football Sweetheart 4; TAFE 10; FHA 
1, 2, 3, 4, President 3; FCA 1,4, Secretary 4.

SHAFFER FUNERAL 
HOME & MONUMENT 

COMPANY



BRIGHT FUTURE

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

JON
CLINTON

BRASHER
SON OF 
WILLIAM 

& WILLA 

BRASHER
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YOU’RE SPECIAL

Football 2, 3, 4; Track 1,2, 3, 4.

HURLEY PHARMACY

GOOD LUCK

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

MICAH 
ANN 

HOYT
DAUGHTER OF 
MIKE & ANDRA 

ARROTT
Honor Roll 1,2, 3, 4; Student Council 4; National Hon­

or Society 3, 4; Senior Class President; Band 1, 2, 3; 
Best Personality 3, 4; Class Favorite 1,3, 4; Mascot 2, 3; 
Football Sweetheart 3; Basketball 1, 2, 3, All-District De­
fense 3; State Golf 1, 2, 3, 4; Who's Who in Spanish 3; 
Volleyball 1, 2; FHA 1,3; Miss Bronte 3.

MARGARET'S FLOWERS 
& GIFTS

OUTSTANDING
We Are Proud 
To Sponsor 

Our Daughter

LINDSEY
RHAE

BURWICK
DAUGHTER OF 

GLENN
BURWICK &

DAWN
BURWICK

Volleyball 1, 2, 3; Football Managers; Basketball Man­
ager 1, 2; FHA 1 ,2 ,3 ,4 ;F F A 1 ,2 ,3 ; TAFE 1; Volleyball 
Regional Runner-up 3.

BURWICK OILFIELD 
SERVICES

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

JAMIE
LYNN

SHIPMAN
DAUGHTER OF 

SALLY 

WILSON &

JAMES
SHIPMAN

PELE

WACKENHUT
CORRECTIONS

WELL DONE

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor 

Our Son

PHILLIP
DAVID

RATLIFF
SON OF 

MARTHA 
& PHILLIP 
RATLIFF

Fi^ootball, All District, All West Texas, All Big Country;

EL RANCHERO 
RESTAURANT

BEST WISHES

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

TODD
NATHAN

HARRELL
SON OF 

JAMES 

& CATHY 

HARRELL
Football 3, 4; FFA 1,2, 3, 4; FFA President 4.

S&S PRINTING 
& SUPPLY
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BRIGHT FUTUftE
We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

DEVLIN 
MASON 
PIERCE
SON OF 
MICKEY 
PIERCE
&FRAN

CRUMPLER
Football 1,2,3, 4, All-District 3, 4; Basketball 1,2,3, 4; 

Track 1,2; FFA 1, 2; FHA 1,2; Golf 1, 2,3.

FIRST NATIONAL 
BANK IN BRONTE

MEMBER FDIC

OUTSTANDING

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

FERNANDO
RENE

MONTEZ

SON OF

MARY 
MONTEZ &

JUSTINO
montez

BELL AUTO PARTS & 
BODY SHOP

GOOD LUCK
We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

REGINA 
LYNNETTE 
CLAYTON

DAUGHTER OF 
MANSE 

CLAYTON &
SHIRLEY 
BILBREY

FHA 1, 2, 4; Cheerleader 2, 3, 4; Basketball 1,2; Track 
4; Tennis 1, 3, 4, 2nd District 3, Regional Qualifier 3; 
Volleyball 1, 2, 3, 4, District Runner-up 2, District Champs 
3, 4, Bi-District 3, 4, Area Champs 3, Regional Runner-up 
3; Student Council Secretary 3; Homecoming Duchess 
3, 4; Most Beautiful 4; UIL Accounting 4; Class Reporter 
1, 2, 3, 4; FCA 1; UIL Spelling 1; Band 1, 2, 3; 2nd Team 
All-District Volleyball.

GLENN-BIVINS
INSURANCE

OUR RESPECT

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

ROY
KENNETH

PARKS

HOMETOWN
HARDWARE

WELL DONE

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

WILMA
RENEA

COOPER

BRONTE NURSING 
HOME

OUR ADMIRATION

We Are Proud 
To Sponsor

DAVID

WAYNE

CASON
SON OF 

WAYNE 

CASON

Football 1, 2, 3, 4; FFA 1,2, 3, 4; FHA 1,2, 3, 4.

D ’S TOTAL E. CLIPSE 
JAMES & BRENDA 

TIDWELL
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WisHing tHe (Bronte Senior CCass o f 1995

^he (Best OfLueUi

Ctdss CoCors: S~orest Qreen & iMaroon 
CCass 9viotto: "I itad no shoes and I  compCained 
nntiC I  met a man zviio had no feet."
CCass White ^ s e
Ctass Song: "‘The ^ver" - Qarth (Brool<;s

dhe dotCoxving businesses &  Individuals zoouCd 
Cube to e?(tend their congratuCations to the bronte

Senior Ctass o f 1995

CITY OF BRONTE COUNTRY CHEF 
RESTAURANT

COKE COUNTY 
JUDGE'S OFFICE

JACKIE-ROSA

THE BEST 
CONNECTION

COKE CO. CLERK'S 
OFFICE

ETTIE-SHARON-MARY
SUBLETT'S ANTIQUES

THE OBSERVER/ 
ENTERPRISE

COKE COUNTY TAX 
ASSESSOR

KRISTY-BILLY JACK-T.J.

BILLY JOE & DIANE 
LUCKETT

RANCHLAND
RESTAURANT

ROBERT LEE STATE 
BANK

MEMBER FDIC

COKE CO. AUDITOR'S 
OFFICE

STOVER-JERITA-SHERYL

BUTANE SALES CO. COKE CO. FEED & SUPPLY  
ASKINS PROPANE CO.

CRACKER BARREL 
RESTAURANT

SUPER H IGA IVEY MOTOR CO. KEY FEED STORE

BOB WRINKLE'S 
ACE HARDWARE

B&B ENTERPRISES CongratuCations!



Page 10 Friday, May 19, 1995 The Observer/Enterprise

....Banquet
standing Hitter, Basketball All- 
District 1st Team, Basketball 
Outstanding Offense Player, 
Track - Regional Qualifier 

Jodie Hilliard - Basketball 
Longhorn Spirit Award 

Joy Ehl - Basketball Super 
Sub Award

Courtney Arrott - Basketball 
Most Improved Player

McKinney awarded
DAR Good Citizen
Christy McKinney, daughter 

of Phillip and Arlene McKin­
ney of Bronte, has been 
named as one of the seven­
teen area high school seniors 
chosen as DAR Good Citi­
zens. Members of the Poca­
hontas Chapter of the 
Daughters of the American 
Revolution honor seniors 
chosen and nominated each 
year by their teachers. The 
nominations are based on 
service, patriotism, leader­
ship, and dependablility at 
school, at home, and in the 
community. Honorées will 
receive a certificate and pin.

Red Cross 
assisting storm 

victim s
Local American Red Cross 

disaster volunteers are cur­
rently conducting on-site 
visits within the area affected 
by Sunday night's storm. The 
volunteers are p rov id ing  
casework and relief services 
to the families affected by the 
disaster, as well as providing 
food to families and relief 
workers.

On Monday, the Red Cross 
volunteer Damage Assess­
ment teams identified seven 
homes as destroyed, four­
teen with major damage, and 
twenty-four homes with minor 
damage.

The Red Cross volunteers 
will continue providing on-site 
casework services in the af­
fected area through Wednes­
day, May 17. Anyone still 
needing assistance after 
Wednesday are encouraged 
to contact the Red Cross at 
658-4409. The San Angelo 

'Red Cross is located at 602 
South Abe, at the corner of 
Avenue B.

In a disaster, the Red Cross 
provides emergency care in­
cluding shelter, clothing, and 
food. Trained caseworkers 
meet one-on-one with the 
families affected, help them 
determine their disaster 
caused needs, and provide 
for them. Emergency assis­
tance may include vouchers 
for daily necessities such as 
groceries, clothing, prescrip­
tion medications lost in the 
storm, and other necessities.

All Red Cross disaster 
assistance is free, made pos­
sible through generous gifts 
of time and money from the 
American people.

The best way to help fami­
lies affected by this and other 
disasters is to make a financial 
contribution to the American 
Red Cross Disaster Relief 
Fund and send it to the West 
Texas Area Unit, American 
Red Cross, Box 3465, San 
Angelo, Texas 76902. Credit 
card contributions may be 
made by calling 1-800-HELP- 
NOW.

(cont'd. from page 4)

Micah Hoyt - Golf Team - 3rd 
in State

Devlin Pierce - Football All- 
District Offensive Tackle, 
Football Outstanding Offen­
sive Lineman, Basketball Most 
Valuable Post

Brent Taylor - Football All- 
District Quarterback, Football 
All-District Punter 2nd Team,

Personal
Randy Barbee, son of C. B. 

and Wanda Barbee of Bronte, 
recently paid a brief and en­
joyable visit to the Bronte area 
as well as to his brother, Alan, 
and family in Arlington, and his 
sister, Leah, and family in 
Lubbock.

A visit to Angelo State Uni­
versity where he received two 
degrees and a visit with 
friends and colleagues in the 
Fort Worth-Dallas area proved 
equally enjoyable.

Randy resides in New York 
City. He is an assistant direc­
tor for "New York Under Cov­
er" which is aired on Fox on 
Thursday nights. His wife, Ina, 
is completing a movie with 
Spike Lee.

Tuesday Dance
The Coke County Cavaliers 

will provide C/W music for the 
Tuesday Special Dance on 
May 23 at 7:30 pm. Held the 
fourth Tuesday of each month 
at the Rec Hall in Robert Lee, 
it is for dancers of all ages and 
tickets are available at the 
door.

Football Outstanding Offen­
sive Back, Track - Best Work 
Ethic, Basketball Best Defen­
sive Player, Lowest Round 
Average-Golf

David Cason - Football All- 
District Guard 2nd Team, 
Football Outstanding Defen-- 
sive Lineman

Todd Harrell - Football All- 
District Center 2nd Team 

Kale Beck - Football All-Dis­
trict Offensive Back 2nd Team 

Phillip Ratliff - Football All- 
District Defensive Lineman 
2nd Team, Track - Outstand­
ing Field Event 

Clint Brasher - Football All- 
District Defensive End 2nd 
Team

Cory Robinson - Football 
A ll-D is tric t Outstanding 
Linebacker 2nd Team 

Nick Arrott - Football All-Dis­
trict Defensive Back 2nd 
Team, Football Outstanding 
Defensive Back, Basketball 
Most Valuable Guard 

Gary Walker - Football 
Fighting Heart Award 

Jason Wilson - Football

Bronte TAPE
Last Thursday the Bronte 

TAFE Chapter held a meeting 
to elect new officers for the 
1995-96 school year. The 
new officers are: president - 
Joy King, vice-president - 
Angie Shults, secretary - Feli­
cia Beam, treasurer - Angela 
Wilberg, reporter - Katie 
Collins, and historian - April 
Holdway.

They also discussed having 
an end of the year party at the 
park on May 19 at 5:30 for all 
of the TAFE members.

WINK INSURANCE AGENCY
Home*Auto 

Life^Commercial
715 Austin - 4 5 3 -4 5 5 1

READY TO SF.F, THF. 
COIINTRYSiDF?

Travel at your own pace in 
comfortable style in your 

new RV...

Come by and ask our loan 
officers about RV loans. 

We have reasonable rates, 
easy terms, and 

fast service.

eiMLHOUSKLENDER Robert Lee 
State Bank

M em ber FD IC

Most Valuable Players: (Back) Clint Brasher - 
Track; Brent Taylor - Basketball, Offensive 
Football; Nick Arrott - Golf; (Front) Gina Clay­
ton - Tennis; Kim Hall - Volleyball; Jill Johnson 
- Basketball, Track; Laura Thomas - Golf. Not 
pictured: David Cason - Defensive Football.

Outstanding Wide Receiver 
Darrel Sharp - Football Out­

standing Linebacker 
Keith Treadaway - Track - 

Most Dedicated, Basketball 
Super Sub Award 

Courtney Beam - Track - 
Most Improved 

Clint Scott - Basketball - 
Most Improved

James Hambright - Basket­
ball Hustling Horn Award 

The banquet ended with 
the time-honored tradition of 
the 1994-1995 BHS cheer­
leaders, Jill Johnson, Laura 
Thomas, Mandy Dunn, Gina 
Clayton, Wendy Johnson, 
and Kim Hall, leading the 
school song.

WELL DONE
We Are Proud 
To Sponsor 

Our Son

BRANDON
TINNEY
SON OF 

BRIAN & IRIS 
CHAMPION

1995 Graduate 
Ft. Davis High School

Football 1, 2; Basketball 1, 2, 4; UIL One Act Play 4; 
Drama Club 1; Government Award 2; Mr. Fort Davis High 
School Best Acting Award.

CHAMPION 
MARKETING 

& SALES

BRIGHT FUTURE

MARGIE
RODRIQUEZ

DAUGHTER OF 
MARTHA RODRIQUEZ

THE
OBSERVER/ENTERPRISE
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Navy Petty Officer Third Ciass Biiiy Reed, a 
1986 graduate of Bronte High Schooi, is cur- 
rentiy stationed onboard the USS Mississippi, 
which depioyed to the Mediterranean in March 
with the USS Theodore Battie Group.
-Photo credit US Navy PHAA David Schmidt.

Son-in-law excels 
on Navy Destroyer

by Dave Wei is
As a fire controlman in the 

Navy, Petty Officer Third Class 
Billy Reed is quick to point out 
the irony in his job title. "At 
first, most people think I fight 
fires. Actually, I'm the guy 
who pulls the trigger to launch 
missiles from USS Mississip­
pi," said the son-in-law of Jerry 
and Wanda Parker of Bronte, 
Texas.

Nuclear-powered guided 
missile cruisers, such as Mis­
sissippi, are multi-mission 
warships capable of support­
ing carrier battlegroups, am­
phibious forces or operating 
independently.

Guided missile cruisers like 
Mississippi are forward de­
ployed around the world to 
maintain a U. S. presence and 
provide rapid response, in 
times of crisis. Sailors and 
Marines like Reed are often 
the first to arrive in situations 
ranging from humanitarian re­
lief efforts to combat opera­
tions.

These ships have weapons 
and sensors that allow them to 
effectively protect themselves 
and other vessels in the battle 
group from aircraft, surface 
ships, or submarine attacks. "I 
work on the weapons direc­
tion system, the system that 
fires the standard missiles, not 
the Tomahawks or Harpoons," 
Reed said.

Reed depioyed with the 
ship to the Mediterranean as 
part of the USS Theodore 
Roosevelt Battle Group in 
March. In addition to Missis­
sippi, the battle group is 
equipped with tactical jet air­
craft, helicopters, ships and 
submarines. It offers theater 
commanders a formidable 
force that is mobile, flexible 
and able to remain on station 
for long periods.

Reed, 27, had been anx­
iously awaiting the deploy­
ment. "I've only been on 
some short, five-week training 
cruises. I haven't been on a 
full-length deployment. The 
Mediterranean cruise will be 
my first and I'm looking forward 
to the port visits," he said.

In fact, the chance to visit 
foreign countries was one 
reason Reed enlisted in the 
Navy. "My father, who retired 
from the Navy as an engine- 
man chief petty officer, told 
me about intriguing foreign 
countries he had visited dur­
ing his time in the Navy," said 
the 1986 graduate of Bronte 
High School. "I also wanted to 
learn a trade."

During the deployment

Reed will have the opportuni­
ty to visit several countries in 
Europe and the Mediter­
ranean. He is especially 
looking forward to visiting 
Naples, Italy and Greece, al­
though he isn't looking for­
ward to the separation from 
his family.

Reed is married to the for­
mer Melinda Parker of Bronte, 
Texas. They met in high 
school and dated on and off 
for nine years before they 
were married. They now re­
side in Virginia Beach, Vir­
ginia, where his wife is work­
ing on a bachelor's degree in 
biology.

Reed reported to USS Mis­
sissippi in August 1994 after 
nearly a year-and-a-half of 
high tech training in Navy 
learning the complex com­
puter, electronic and hydraulic 
systems used to launch guid- 

'ed missiles.

During the two-and-a-half 
years he has spent in the 
Navy, he said the most impor­
tant thing he has learned is to 
trust your leaders and main­
tain good working relations 
with everyone.

While he says the Navy has 
been a good experience for 
him, he doesn't intend to stay 
in long enough to retire. "I 
would like to return to Texas 
with my wife and start a family."

RL Elem/JH 
compete in Dist. 

Academic UIL
The 1995 District Elemen­

tary and Junior High Academic 
U.I.L. meet was held April 24 
and 25 at Sterling City. The 
Robert Lee team fin ished 
second with 435 total points. 
They were preceded only by 
Roscoe, and followed by 
Sterling City, Bronte, Water 
Valley, and Roby.

The results of the meet are 
as follows:

Creative Writing(2^ - 5th. 
Erik Lowery, 6th. Kayli Dickey.

Number SensefS^ - 2nd. 
Chad Helwig, 5th. Sabrina Ri­
ley, 6th. Mariusz Skibicki.

StorvtellinaO) - 6th. Pre­
ston Francis.

Ready Writinq(5.6^ - 4th. 
Shanna Hendrix, 6th. Jessica 
Cowart.

Number Sense(4) - 3rd. 
Shelby Roe, 6th. Travis Pit- 
cock.

Number Sense(5) - 1 st. 
Bobbie Sparks.

Calculator(6) - 1st. Beau 
Boxell, 2nd. James Gallegos, 
3rd. Tiffany Copeland

Number Sensei6^ - 4th. 
Cayla Jeffrey.

Calculatori?^ - 1st. Dan Mc- 
Cown, 2nd. Macy Hill, 5th. 
Nick Pinson.

Number Sense(7) - 1st. Dan 
McCown, 3rd. B. J. Bessent, 
5th. Daniel Cates.

Calculator(8) - 2nd. Justin 
Kendall, 4th. Holly Copeland, 
6th. Mariusz Skibicki.

Science(8) - 6th. Justin 
Kendall.

Oral Readina(4) - 4 th . 
Stewart Millican.

Oral Reading(5.6) - 3 rd . 
Jodee Helwig, 4th. Matthew 
Tinkler.

Dictionarv(5.61 -1 st. Cayla 
Jeffrey, 3rd. Bobbie Sparks, 
5th. Amber Freeman.

Dictionarvf7.81 - 5th. Justin 
Francis, 6th. Holly Copeland.

Listeningf5.6) - 5th. Chase 
Rainwater.

Listeninq(7.8) - 2nd. Chad 
Helwig, 3rd. Justin Francis.

SDellinq(3.4) - 5th. Ashlee 
Millican.

Maps/Graphs/Charts(7.8) - 
6th. Adam Cates.

iN T R O D U C I N G

PRIMESTAR:
G E T  P R O G R A M M IN G  A N D  

M A IN T E N A N C E  F O R  
A S L IT T L E  A S A D O L L A R  
A DAY. IN C L U D IN G  T H E  

U S E  O F  T H E  D IS H .

P R I M E ^ W
WE BRING SATEUITE TELEVISION DOWN TO EARTH
BTTCI

CALL NOW: 
1-800-318-8829

El Rancherò Restaurant
M e x i c a n - A m e r i c a n  F o o d

Open Tues.-Sat. 11 am - 2 pm & 5-9 pm 
Open Sunday 11 am - 2 pm 

224 W.  Main Bronte 473-2140

The Story Time graduates display their cer­
tificates at the Coke County Library on Tues­
day. In the program for 3 and 4-year-olds not 
in school were Kollln Meek, Steriin Ebenstein, 
Chase Roe, Christian Herring, Michael Smith, 
Brody Dillard, Kasie Skinner, Chelsea Conner, 
Shayla Grim, and Allison Millican.

$pellinq(5.6I - 2nd. Jamie 
Chesshir, 5th. Shanna Hen­
drix.

Maps/Graphs/Charts(7.8I - 
2nd. Dan McCown, 6th. Justin 
Francis.

$torvtellinq(2) - 2nd. Lind­
sey Roe, 4th. Michelle 
Sanchez.

Oral Readina(7.8I - 1st. 
Macy Hill

Impromptu SpeakinqI7.8I - 
4th. Bill Torres, 6th. B. J. 
Bessent.

Music Memory - 5th. Robert 
Lee team.

Spellinq(7.8I - 6th. Daniel 
Cates.

Art Contest - 2nd. Bobbie 
Sparks, Jamie Chesshir, 
Trichelle Gray, Shelby Roe, 
Whitney Fleming, Ashlee Mil­
lican.

Others participating were: 
Jamie Luna, Lori Eubanks, 
Whitney Montgomery, Coke 
Hendry, Nicklas Service, 
Shane Hendrix, Samantha 
Padgett, Kim Gloria, and Joel 
Gallegos in Junior High.

Others participating at the 
Elementary level were: Coop­
er Riley, Mirta Alcantar, Nicole 
Sanchez, Misti Brothers, Jen­
nifer Fluhmann, Melissa Long, 
Mary Arellano, Stephanie 
Balderas, Robert Barrett, 
Kristy Calhoun, Justin Fluh­
mann, Erin Millican, Favian 
Minjarez, Lewis Samaniego, 
Curtis Bell, Jeannie Eaker, 
Lettie Olguin, Dee Van Huss, 
Clifton Bohannon, Beau Blair, 
Zeke Montgomery, Rachelle 
Mills, Brady Bolding, Sammy 
Minjarez, and Monica Navarro.

Personal
Jack and Glo Snead, of Ft. 

Washington, Maryland, visited 
ten days in the home of Gio's 
mother, Mrs. Lillian Middleton, 
and other relatives. They left 
Robert Lee May 10th on their 
way to St. Lewis Park, Min­
nesota to visit their son David 
before returning to their 
home.

Shannon
HEALTH NOTES
Walker Danger

Despite a voluntary safety standard for baby walkers 
started in 1986, the number of injuries involving baby 
walkers has continued to increase.The latest year for 
which figures are available from the Consumer Product 
Safety Commission National Electronic Injury Surveillance 
System is 1993, when more than twenty-five thousand 
injuries to young children were reported.

The numbers had not changed much from a year earlier 
when ninety-two percent of the injuries were to the head 
and face, and eighty-one percent were caused when the 
child fell down stairs while in a walker.

The purpose of our report is to point out that despite 
safety improvements in the design of walkers, babies are 
still being hurt. It would be a stretch to blame walkers for 
stairway falls, thus we can only caution parents and other 
caregivers of babies to arrange protection to make certain 
that the first effort at mobility does not result in trauma to 
the baby - or to the parents.

©1994, Lyle Dean, Inc.
Shannon Health Notes is a public service of

Shannon MedicalCenter
120 East Harris • San Angelo, Texas • (915) 653-6741
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TrocessionaC
Invocation
(Presentation o f Sp^akir 

A ddress

benediction
%ecessionaC

RL Baccalaureate 
> set

Baccalaureate services will 
be conducted Sunday, May 
21, for the Robert Lee 1995 
candidates for graduation at 8 
pm in the school auditorium. 
Tommy Williams, minister of 
the Northside Church of 
Christ, will address the senior 
class.

Twenty-one students make 
up the class roll which in­
cludes:

Eliza Arellano, Laura Ann 
Chesshir, Cameron Wayne 
Cook, Jeremy Michael Fluh- 
mann, Bartley Murl Goodman, 
Kristana Gayle Hall, Charles 
Wayne Hayes, Jr., Wayne 
Allen Hayes, Christy Michelle 
Hendry, Michael Brannon La­
mar, Jamilynn Logan, Lee 
Alan McCown, Lynlee Aron 
Owen, Blake Orland Payne, 
William Tray Taylor, James 
Michael Tennison, Jonathan 
Paul Torres, Ross Torres, Jr., 
Jeremy Wayne Vincent, Jerrid 
Dwayne Vincent, and Antho­
ny Robert Wink.

Serving as ushers for the 
ceremony will be Maranda 
Wojtek, Patricia Minjarez, Eric 
Torres, and Koby Howell. 
Sponsors for the school year 
were Mrs. Patricia Ballew and 
Jimmy Randolph.

Qayie boCding 
yerenty
WUCiam Mood 
Superintendent, ‘KLISd) 
Lommy WiCCiams 
Minister, Odprtfiside 
Cftarcfi o f Cfirist 
Lee McCozvn 
Qaytc botdin£

B reakfast 
Monday, May 22

Breakfast Bagel, Orange 
Juice, Milk 
Tuesday, May 23 

Donuts, Cold Cereal, Or­
ange Juice, Milk 
Wednesday, May 24 

Cinnamon Toast, Cold Ce­
real, Orange Juice, Milk 
Thursday, May 25 

Biscuits with Jelly or Gravy, 
Cold Cereal, Orange Juice, 
Milk

Lunch 
Monday, May 22

Managers Special 
Tuesday, May 23 

Pizza, Tossed Salad, But­
tered Corn, Fruit, Milk 
Wednesday, May 24 

Bologna and C h e e s e  
Sandwiches, Potato Chips, 
Pickles, Carrot Sticks, Fruit 
Roll-up, Milk 
Thursday, May 25 

Corndogs with Mustard, Ta- 
tor Tots, Popsicle, Pork and 
Beans, Milk

RL PTA meeting
Robert Lee PTA meeting 

will be on Tuesday, May 23 at 
6:00 pm. All members are 
encouraged to attend. Pre­
liminary plans will be dis­
cussed for the Fall Festival 
and Honor Roll Recognition 
Program. This will be the last 
meeting for this school year.

PROCLAMATION
Appreciation Week 

for the
Robert Lee High School 

Girls and Boys 
All Sports and Academic 

Teams
TO THE CITIZENS OF THE 
CITY OF ROBERT LEE: 
WHEREAS, Students of 
Robert Lee High School have 
participated in Class 1-A 
Sports and Academic events 
at District, Regional, and State 
competition, and 
WHEREAS, the entire teams 
have brought honor to the city 
of Robert Lee by their out­
standing ability and their 
dedication and hard work 
necessary to achieve this 
goal, and
WHEREAS, these individuals 
have by their individual high 
character and personality rep­
resented their city and school 
so well,
NOW, therefore, I, John Q. 
Conley, in my capacity as 
Mayor for the City of Robert 
Lee, Texas, do hereby pro­
claim the week of:

May 19 - May 26, 1995 
APPRECIATION WEEK 

FOR THE
ALL SPORTS AND 

ACADEMIC TEAMS
AND DO HEREBY EXPRESS 
to each of the boys and girls

the sincere appreciation and 
congratulations of the City of 
Robert Lee.
IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I 
have hereunto set my hand 
and caused the seal of the 
City of Robert Lee, Texas to 
be affixed this the 17th day of 
May, 1995.

John Q. Conley, 
Mayor

ATTEST: Kay Torres, 
City Secretary

Teacher
Appreciation

In appreciation fo their year 
round work, the Robert Lee 
ISD teachers were served a 
noon buffet by the Robert 
Lee PTA. The members 
chose this way to recognize 
our educators continued ser­
vice to our children and com­
munity.

1995 Summer 
TAAS-TEAMS 

Testing
All out-of-school individuals 

who wish to take the 1995 
Summer Exit Level TAAS or 
TEAMS test must register by 
June 9, 1995. The TAAS 
Writing test is scheduled for 
administration on Tuesday, 
July 11, 1995, the TAAS Math 
test on Wednesday, July 12, 
1995, and the TAAS Reading 
on Thursday, July 13, 1995. 
The TEAMS Mathematics test 
is scheduled for administra­
tion on Wednesday, July 12, 
1995, and the TEAMS En­
glish Language Arts is sched­
uled for Thursday, July 13, 
1995.

Robert Lee High School will 
be a testing site for these 
tests. Those individuals who 
have completed all other high 
school graduation require­
ments are encouraged to 
register in advance for any 
section of the TAAS or 
TEAMS for which necessary 
minimum expectations have 
not previously been met.

Registration packets may be 
acquired at Robert Lee ISD. 
For more information, contact 
Melba Mauldin, Robert Lee 
ISD, 453-2612.

IT'S "TRY TRANSIT" WEEK!
If you are a new rider,
YOUR FIRST RIDE 

IS ON US!!
F irs t-t im e  rid e rs  ca il 4 5 3 -2 3 1 4  

fo r one free  ride anyw here  in 
the C ity  of R obert Lee during  

M ay 15-26, 1995

t r y

THUNDERBIRD TRANSIT

Processional
Invocation
SaCutatorian
Valedictorian
Introduction o f Speai^r
A ddress
Presentation o f CCass 
Presentation o f PipComas

benediction
P^cessionaC

CCass pCoivcr 
Carnation

Qayie bolding 
Jam ie CarmicfiaeC 
M ariusz Skibicki 
Ckad M ehvig 
WiPiam Mood 
Pdw ard Poekis 
Jackie Lennison 
iVUCiam Mood 
Pianne Simpson 
Sam antka Padgett 
Qayie boiding

Ciass Coiors
biacki Leai &  Wkite

Ciass Motto
"Pont wait fo r  your skip to come in, szvim out to it."

RL Eighth Grade 
Commencement

The Robert Lee Eighth 
Grade Commencement will be 
held, in the school auditorium 
at 8 pm Thursday, May 25. 
Their motto, "Don't wait for 
your ship to come in; swim out 
to it", symbolizes the spirit of 
the twenty-six candidates for 
graduation into high school. 
Making up the Eighth Grade 
class of 1995 are:

Angela Abalos, Flor Barrera, 
Tony Bell, Kendra Kimberly 
Bohannon, Jamie Carmichael, 
Holly Copeland, Brandie 
Cragg, Amanda Cunningham, 
Jeremy Edging, Lori Eu­
banks, Justin Francis, Kim­
berly Gloria, Chad Walker Hel- 
wig, Justin Kendall, Kyla 
Long, Whitney Blane Mont­
gomery, Michael Munoz, 
Jaime Olguin, Samantha Mae 
Padgett, Sabrina Kay Riley, 
Melissa Sanders, Will Ernest 
Simpson, Mariusz Skibicki, C. 
R. Tijerina, Bill Torres, and 
Sondra Renee VanDeventer.

Valedictorian of the class is 
Chad Helwig, son of Mrs. Au­
drey Devon of Robert Lee and 
Bill Helwig of College Station. 
Mariusz Skibicki, son of 
Slawomir and Anna Skibicki of 
Robert Lee, is the 1995 
salutatorian.

Class members chose Kurt 
White as their sponsor for the 
past school year.

Addressing the class will be 
Robert Lee Athletic Director 
Edward Poehls.

Jamie Luna, Ashley 
Townsend, Dan McCown, and 
B. J. Bessent will serve as 
ushers for the commence­
ment exercises.

RLHS
Weekly Activities 
May 22-26, 1995

Tuesday, May 23
Robert Lee High School 

Awards Day, Robert Lee 
Auditorium 10:15 am 
Thursday, May 25 

Final Semester Test; 8th 
Grade Graduation, Robert Lee 
Auditorium 8:00 pm

Friday, May 26
Final Sem ester Test; 

School dismisses at *2:30 pm; 
Robert Lee High School 
Senior Graduation, Robert 
Lee High School Auditorium 
8:00 pm

Success is simply a 
matter of luck. Ask any 
failure.

THANKS
to everyone who supported 
me in the Mayor's race. I 
will try to serve the people 

of Robert Lee to the best of 
my ability.

JOHN CONLEY

PRIMESfW
WE BRING SATELLITE TELEVISION DOWN TO EARTH.

C R L L  N O lU :
915- 365-5934
1- 800- 310-8398

By TCI Cablevision
Authorized service & installation by:

TEXTRONICS
H e r b  P a lm e r

1705 Hutchings Ave. 
Ballinger, Texas 76821
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473-2065\  4¡!m ^
4 i OPEN

7 Days a Week

S '

STORE HOURS
Mon.-Sat. -7:30 am to 9 pm 

Sunday -  8 am to 8 pm
OF BRONTE FOOD STAMPS WELCOME

J i
Boneless Valu Pack

Arm Steak

Boneless

Beef Ribs

Boneless

Arm Roast

Lb.

L b .

Lb.

Lean ^  ^  /

1 . 3 9 G r o u n d  C h u c k L b 1 ^ 9 ^ N  C u b e  ,

SteakM ^  f \  FafTfiily Pack
1 . b y  Ground Beef “ . 1 . 9 9

Extra Lean

1 . 3 9 c h u c k  Eye
Steak Lb. 1 . 9 9

Wolf Plain B ounty
)
r
L Chili Paper Towels
1
r

19 oz. 1  1  Q  
can 1 ■ 1 7 9Roll ■ I ^

►
» S h u rf in e Shurfine or Parade
»»
► Fruit Cocktail Mixed Vegetables
>>
• 16 oz. /  V f  

can ■ f ^ 3 1 .9 9
»

Shurfine or Parade Shurfine 1 arge Ripe
►
\

Tomato Sauce Olives
1 5 / . 9 9 6 0 2 . 7  Q

can ■ t

Lean

Ground Chuck 10-1 Lb. 
or 5-2 Lb. 9 . 9 0

Market Made Hormel Black Label

Pork Bacon
Sausage

L b . .9 9 1 . 4 9 ' ^
J !

Town Talk

Bread
0' ______ —

lis . A  À

\Coca  C o la

'^ ■ 1 “ 1 - 6 9 ^

Reg., Unscented, 
Bleach Laundry 

D etergent

Ultra 
Tide

Shurfine

Sugar

98-110
oz. 5 . 9 9  4Lb 1 . 2 9

1 1/2 Lb. 
Loaf . 5 9

Dozen
Limit 1 w/$10 

Purchase 
Each additional 

590

A /Ài ^
Shurfresh L a rg e ^

E g g s  ^

. 3 9

3 Ltr. 
Bottle

Coca Cola

1 . 3 9
Parade Hamburger

Dill Slices
. 9 932 oz

Pace

Picante Sauce
2 . 6 924 oz.

32 oz.

Del Monte

Ketchup
1 . 3 9

SHOP AT 
H O M E &

Support Your 
Local

Community!

Treesweet
Orange Juice
Shurfresh Non-Dairy

Whipped Topping can . 9 9

Shurfresh

Cheese Spread
Oscar Mayer

Lunchables

2 Lb. 
Box

4.5 oz.

2 . 9 9 :
I<

. 9 9 :

California Large

Tomatoes FRESH PRODUCE FROZEN FOOD
Good Time

1/2 Gal. 
sq. ctn.

Super Select

Cucumbers 4  /  $  1 »c® Cream
Large m  !  t H  ^  Frozen Concentrate
Bell Peppers 4 / $ 1  Sunny Delight
Washington Fancy Red Delicious Shurfine

Apples Lb .49  Fried Chicken
Jumbo Yellow 1015 Sweet

Onions Lb. . 4 9  Prices Good 5/18 Thru 5/24
FOOD STAMPS WELCOME

12 oz.

25 oz. 
Box

1 . 1 9  

. 8 9

2 . 9 9 1

kiMM

{
(

. (
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B U Y  IT. 

S E L L  IT. 

F I N D  IT.

C L A S S I F I E D .

/

CLASSIFIED 
ADVERTISING RATES

1st. Insertion...
20c Per W ord  

($ 3 .0 0  M in im u m )

2nd. and Subsequent
Insertions...

16c Per W ord  
($ 2 .5 0  M in im u m )

Additional 50c 
for Blind Ads 

Cards/Thanks...
20c Per W ord

Legal Notices...
25c Per W ord

COPY DEADLINE
Class Ads..5 pm Tues. 

Display Ads..5 pm Tues. 
Classified Ads & Cards of 

Thanks are payable in 
ADVANCE unless customer 

carries regular account.

C FOR SALE D
HOUSE FOR SALE

by owner, 4 bedroom, 2 bath, 
total electric. 1121 Euel, 
Robert Lee, call 453-2580. 
_____________ 13-tnc

FOR SALE
3 Bedrooms, 1 bath, carpet­
ed, on 2 large corner lots, 
large pecan trees. 222 East 
6th Street, Robert Lee. Call 
944-0128.
________  39-4tC

HOUSE FOR SALE:
3 br, 1 ba, 2 vehicle carport. 
Storage build ing, large 
fenced back yard, pecan 
trees. 453-2381. 
_____________40-4tc

FOR SALE
2 BR, 1 BA brick home in 
Bronte, carport and large utili­
ty room. 915-473-5561. 
Shown by appointment only. 
____________ 40-1tc

OUR STOREWIDE 
25%-50% OFF SALE

continues thru May!
Shop now for Graduation, 

Father's Day, and the 
coolest summer clothing! 

Cumbie's Mercantile 
Bronte.

_____________41B-1tc

1987 MERCURY 
MARQUIS

For sale. 4-door in excellent 
condition with new tires. See 
T. H. Franklin or call 473-2161 
after 9 pm.
_____________41b-2tC

HELP!
MAIN STREET MARKET

is ready to help you with your 
shopping for the Seniors of 
1995. We have a catalog from 
Basic Gifts and each Senior 
from Blackwell and Bronte has 
been invited to make a selec­
tion of their choice from this 
catalog for family and friends 
to be able to pay any amount 
towards the gift of their 
choice. Come in and let Main 
Street Market help you make 
this a memorable occasion for 
these graduates at this special 
time.
_____________39B-3tc

C FOR RENT

HOUSE FOR RENT
Bronte, 3 bedroom, 1 bath. 
786-2033.
_____________41-1tc

C GARAGE SALES j

FOR SALE

Robert Lee
SUPER NICE CABIN, fu r­
nished. Lots of room. Call to­
day.
ARROWHEAD POINT a
stone's throw from water's 
edge. 3 bdrm., 2 bath home 
on approx. 2 acres. Get de­
tails and let's look. 
O VER SIZED  D IN IN G  
ROOM & DEN plus LR, 2 
bdrm/2 bath with rental in­
come. Interested?? Call me.

Elaine Lee 
4 5 3 - 2 9 9 5

GARAGE SALE
Clothes, furniture, household 
items. Saturday only 8-? 902 
W. Price, Bronte. 
_____________41B-1tc

GARAGE SALE
Saturday, May 20th 8 am - 
noon. Lots of southwest 
crafts, pictures, some baby 
items, coffee table, maternity, 
kids and baby clothes. 413 
Key Street, Bronte. 
____________ 41B-1tc

GARAGE SALE
Friday & Saturday, May 19 & 
20 - 8 am - 5 pm. Electric dry­
er, wood stoves, Shopmate, 
miscellaneous. 706 Brunson, 
Bronte. 473-2063. 
____________ 41B-1tC

MOVING SALE
Friday and Saturday,

May 19 & 20, 9 am until - 
Furniture including antique 
Singer sewing machine, prac­
tically new Singer machine, 
many bargains of odds and 
ends. Large size women's 
clothing. Margaret Martin, 107 
Parkwood, Bronte. 
_____________41-1tc

The iiiiporlaiit thing is 
not to stop questioning.

— Albert F2instein

BlUAl HOUSINGLENDER MLS IB.flEALTOFT

Nell Kennedy 

1-915 -453 -4355

NEW LISTING
3 BR/1.5 Bath Mobile 

Home and Carport 
EXTRA NICE 

Furnished 2BR/2Bath, mobile 
home, carport, lots of extras!

GREAT LOCATION 
Comfortable, furnished or un­
furnished, 2BR/2Bath home 

at Edith Estates 
CALL FOR ADDITIONAL 

LISTINGS & DETAILS 
_____________ 41-2tC

WANTED:
Arts & Crafts Booths 

Food Booths 
June 24, 1995 

Bronte Summerfest 
"Fort Chadbourne Days" 

Call Dorris-915/473-2911 
8:00 am-4:00 pm. 

_____________39B-3tc

BABYSITTING
in my home at 402 South 
State, Bronte or call 473- 
6703.
_____________41B-2tp

C Mise

■Lu d oc:s ejoieq uzz-est' 
l|BO J0MSUB ou 1! ‘SZZ3-est^ 
• 6 u !UB0|O 0U !| J 0 M 0 S  Aj b io j

J 0 M O d  ‘0O1AJ0S pUB SJ|Bd0J
0ujoq 0i!qoi^ - 0O!aj0S J!Bd0y 

|.■VV S.AVdO S3 T

DONNIE'S 
RPPLIRNCE & 

REFRIGERRT IQN
R12 Certified 

453-2188

J

TEKTRONICS
TV, VCR, Microwave 
Oven Repairs & Fence 

Charger Repair

1705 Hutchings - Ballinger 
365-5934 or 1-800-310-8^398

We make service calls to the 
following towns & 

surrounding areas within 50 
miles of Ballinger: Blackwell, 

Bronte, Miles, Paint Rock, 
Robert Lee, Rowena

1

(915)

NEED A BABYSITTER?
Call Amy Wheat -453-2011 
Robert Lee.
_____________41-1tp

D & L DOZER SERVICE
Larry Spivey, Owner-Opera­
tor. PO Box 160, Bronte, TX. 
Phone (Oak Creek Lake) 915- 
743-2577.
___________________2 1 b -t.ac

FOOD MANAGEMENT
Richeson Dairy Queens has 
40 opportun ities  f o r 
managers, assistants and 
trainees. We will train and re­
locate you to a small town in 
north central Texas. City pay, 
country living and great places 
to raise a family. Mid $20's. 
Send resume to Box 1299, 
Graham, Texas 76450 or call 
Barbara Freeze today at 
800/346-7472. 
_____________3g-..4Ig

PART-TIME HELP
needed in Wingate: 14 hours 
per week and as needed to 
help elderly in home. Light 
housekeeping, meal prepara­
tion, shopping, etc. Call Nur- 
secare, Inc. at 1-800-588- 
2273.
_____________ 40-2tC

WAGGONNER’S 
Auto and Truck Repair 

18 West 10th 
Robert Lee, TX 76945 

915 -4 53 -4730  
_____________ 39-4tC

FULL TIME HELP 
WANTED

at Paint Creek and Wildcat 
Marinas. Apply in person 
only.
_____________35a-tnc

"TEXAS BEST" 
CARPET CLEANING

professional service, truck 
mounted cleaning system. 
Serving all Coke County. Call 
toll free 1-800-473-2807 or 
473-2807, Bronte. Free es­
timates.
_____________49-tnc

Johnson’s 
Water Well 

Service
F arm

Ranch Home 
W in d m ills  & Pum ps

24 HR. SER VIC E  

6 5 8 - 6 0 3 9  or 6 5 5 - 0 3 7 9  

1 - 8 0 0 - 7 9 7 - 6 0 3 9

CARD OF THANKS 1
TO THE EMTS

(Larry, Keith, Mary and 
Sharon), to Dennis, Roxie, to 
Pat and Shirley, to each and 
everyone who helped in the 
tragedy which touched all our 
lives on May 6th,

Our heartfelt thanks! 
Thanks for your prayers, the 

cards, calls, for all your sup­
port and concerns. Words 
cannot express our gratitude.

We ask your continued 
prayers for Fred Calhoun and 
family.

Ronnie, Ron, Joyce, 
Jonie and Jodi Waggonner 

_____________41-ltP

SINCERE THANKS
to James Tidwell for mowing 
Mule Creek Cemetery - su­
perbly done. Coke County is 
fortunate to have him as 
County Commissioner.

Melvin and Naomi 
Cornelius James 

San Angelo
_____________41B-1tP

/  zidsfi to tfianl̂  everyone 
who tooĥ  time out o f their 

Busy day to vote fo r me.
n^'ftankjy'ouj

9doCiu ChiCds

C NOTICES 1
THE CITY OF 
ROBERT LEE

has adopted Ordinance No. 
1050 to be effective May 1, 
1995:

Ordinance No. 1050
The following is a summary. 

This ordinance is available at 
City Hall.

Article 1: Animal 
Regulations

All dogs and cats shall be 
kept under restraint. It shall 
be unlawful for any animal to 
be at large within the city. Any 
animal found at large shall be 
impounded and its ownership 
verified. Animals not claimed

by their owner within 3 days 
shall become the property of 
the shelter. The authority may 
exercise the option of serving 
the owner a citation, and/or 
impounding the animal.

Except as otherwise pro­
vided, no person shall own, or 
harbor any dog or cat over 
four months of age within the 
city unless such dog or cat is 
vaccinated and licensed.

A violation of this article shall 
be punishable by a fine of not 
less than $25.00 or more than 
$500.00.

John Q. Conley 
Mayor

City of Robert Lee 
_____________41a-1tc

Bronte OES
Bronte Chapter #10 48  

Order of the Eastern Star met 
on Monday night. May 8, for 
their regular monthly meeting 
at the Masonic Lodge Hall.

Worthy Matron Mildred 
Thomason and Harley Hilliard, 
Worthy Patron, presided at 
the meeting.

The Charter was draped in 
memory of our beloved sister, 
Laura Seale.

Guests Bob Large and Polly 
Large of Robert Lee presided 
for the initiation ceremonies of 
Bobby and Patricia Clark into 
the Bronte Chapter.

Following the meeting the 
members hosted a salad sup­
per in the Fellowship Hall.

LOOK WHO'S NEW!
Cody Nicholas Harmon
Nick and Kim Harmon of 

League City are pleased to 
announce the arrival of their 
son. Cody Nicholas made his 
way into the world March 30 at 
10:30 pm at Clear Lake Re­
gional Medical Center. He 
weighed 7 pounds, 1 3 
ounces and measured 21 
inches in length.

Cody was welcomed by his 
sister Krystal, age 10 and 
brother Michael, age 5.

Proud grandparents are Al­
fred and Ethel Harmon of 
Robert Lee and John and 
Janice Scott of H ouston. 
Great-grandparents are Leroy 
and Jonnie Coe of Liberty.

Personal
Anna Rosson, sixteen-year- 

old high school sophomore, 
granddaughter of C. B. and 
Wanda Barbee of Bronte, has 
received much recognition as 
a member of the Lubbock 
Cooper High School band.

The most recent accom­
plishment is that of making the 
All-State band as a French 
horn player. Her band was 
one of sixteen in the nation to 
participate in a "Bands of 
America Music Festival" in 
Chicago in early May. She 
auditioned and was accepted 
into the honor band.

An honor student, Anna is 
well-rounded. She runs cross 
country and track and plays 
volleyball.

She is the daughter of Kerry 
and Leah Rosson and the 
granddaughter of Ken and 
Patty Rosson of Novice.

Anna has three younger 
brothers - Jesse, Rob, and 
Caleb.

American Heart 
Association.
Fighting Heart Diaease

«

Tired o f throwing 
your weigfit around?

Exercise
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The Puppeteers of First Baptist Church of 
Bronte have been on the road again. This 
time the group went to Howe, Texas, the 
weekend of Aprii 22 and 23. Bronte former 
Youth Minister Bobby Kacai invited the group 
to the church there to conduct a workshop and 
introduce puppet ministery to that church. 
The Bronte group performed during the Sun­
day morning service there.

Patterson honored 
on 80th

Family and friends gathered 
at Zentner's Daughter on Sat­
urday, May 6th, to celebrate 
the 80th birthday of Mrs. 
Beatrice Patterson.

Beatrice Marion Colvin was

born in Decatur, Texas, on 
May 6, 1915. She married C. 
F. Patterson in 1933 and 
raised two sons, Larry and 
Charles, in Freer, Texas.

Mrs. Patterson has lived in 
Robert Lee for 29 years. She 
is an active member of Robert 
Lee Baptist Church where

IT'S "TRY TRANSIT" WEEK! 

If you are a new rider,
YOUR FIRST RIDE 

IS ON US!!
F irs t-t im e  rid e rs  ca ll 473-6471  

fo r one free  ride anyw here in 
the C ity of B ronte during  

M ay 15-26 , 1995

t r y
THUNDERBIRD TRANSIT

BEAD rOR TBE BILLS
This summer depend on Texas 
Cellular to keep you within range, 
even when you're on vacation.

•  Great Rates
•  Safety
•  Convenience
•  Peace of Mind

Great cellular communication and 
service from your local cellular 
provider!

she teaches Sunday School. 
Bea is known to friends for her 
generosity and kind heart. 
Her family loves her endless 
support, her big hugs, and 
her chocolate cookies.

Helping Bea celebrate were 
her two sons and their wives, 
Larry and Beth Patterson and 
Charles and Sarah Patterson.

Granchildren Lee Ann Clark, 
Ed Patterson, Patti Sullivan 
and husband Bill, and Bobby 
McCurdy were also present.

In Bea's own words, her 
"special bonus" has been her 
eight great-grandchildren. In 
attendance were Hailey Clark 
and Harry and Charlie Sullivan.

Among her "ocean o f 
friends" present were Virginia 
Garlington, Mr. and Mrs. 
Ernest Clendennen, Mr. and 
Mrs. Pete Prentice, Mr. and 
Mrs. Perry Post, Dorothy 
Haines, and Norman Thomas 
of Freer.

Omega Coterie 
Club

by Bea Murray
The Omega Coterie Club of 

Blackwell met May 10th for a 
salad luncheon in the fellow­
ship hall of the First Baptist 
Church. New officers for the 
coming year are Carolyn 
Crawford, president; Luverne 
Akins, vice president: Jane 
Wheat, secretary-treasurer; 
Bea Murray, reporter; tele­
phone committee, Dorris Ha- 
gler and Verla Smith. The 
Vice President Joyce Jones, 
presided over the business 
session. A moment of silent 
prayer was observed in mem­
ory of Laura Seale.

Sue Parker and Vera Smith 
served as hostesses. Other 
members present were Marie 
Romine, Lily Walters, Margaret 
Stout, Collene Fletcher, 
Shirley Walston, and Frances 
Green.

Next meeting will be in 
September.

LOOK WHO'S NEW
Tyler Don Hall

Jeremy and Jeanna Hall are 
proud to announce the birth 
of their new son, Tyler Don 
Hall, who was born April 14, 
1995, at Humana Hospital in 
Abilene, Texas. He weighed 
5 pounds, 2 ounces and 
measured 18 inches long.

His grandparents are Calvin 
and Debbie Garvin of Clyde, 
Don and Rae Ann Hall of New 
Mexico, and Leland and Suzy 
Miller of Abilene.

His great-grandparents are 
Roland and Jean Sowell of 
Bronte, Clyde and Joy Garvin 
of Albany, Dorothy Watson of 
Potosi, and Dorothy Hall of 
Arlington.

Great-great-grandmother is 
Daisy Dell Sims of Bronte.

Robert 
off their

Lee April 
awards.

Accelerated Readers show

Euterpean Club
by Bea Murray

The Euterpean Club of 
Blackwell had a covered dish 
dinner May 15th at the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. Gene Cole. A 
short business session was 
held by the president, Bobbie 
Varnadore. Invited guests 
and husbands were included 
for the enjoyable evening.

Others attending were the 
following: Lillie Burwick, Hu- 
lene Conradt, Mary Lee, B. J. 
and Dona Sanderson, R. Q. 
and Gracie Spence, Juanita 
McRorey, Myrie Thompson, 
Sonny and Linda Watts, Es­
ther Smith, Rosemary Ten 
Eyck, Paul and Kay Gothard, 
Ben and Tommie Lucas, Mar­
garet Stout, Bea Murray, and 
one guest, Herman Seale.

Hostess was Betty Cole and 
co-hostess was Kay Gothard. 
The next meeting will be held 
in September.

Personal
On April 29, 1995 the family 

of Mrs. Lillian Middleton gath­
ered at her home for the sixth 
family reunion. Present for 
the occasion were h e r 
daughter, Zelda Woodard, 
and husband John, of Robert 
Lee; Glo Snead and husband 
Jack, of Ft. W ash ing ton , 
Maryland: son Jim Caraway, of 
Houston; granddaughters 
Elizabeth and Anne Marie 
Caraway of Houston; sisters, 
Calla Mae Perkins and 
husband Virgil of Big Spring;. 
Gene Dickson and husband 
Guy of Clifton, Texas; a friend, 
Helen Kirkland of Bronte.

After a lunch of smoked 
turkey brisket and all the trim­
mings, a picture taking ses­
sion and a lot of visiting took 
place. Though small in num­
ber, a great time was had by all 
present. Mrs. Middleton invit­
ed them ail back next year.

D's Total E. Clipse Salon
Is Proud To Announce The Association Of

Mildred Cason Brown
Monday-Wednesday 8:30 am - 5:00 pm 

Penns- Colors - Razor Cuts
121W. Main Bronte 473-6131

GLENN-BIVINS INSURANCE
Home, Auto, Life, and Health

123 W. Main Bronte 4 7 3 - 6 7 9 1

RL Elem. 
Accelerated  

Readers
The Robert Lee Elementary 

Accelerated Readers for the 
month of April were:

First Grade/Mrs. Pavne - 1st. 
Mallory White, 2nd. Brittni 
Herring

First Grade/Mrs. Goodman - 
1st. Cassidy Wink, 2nd. Analy 
Gallegos

Second Grade/Mrs. Horn - 
1st. Kayli Jo Dickey, 2nd. Erik 
Lowery

Third Grade/Mrs. McCown - 
1st. Monica Navarro, 2nd. 
Melissa Long, 2nd. R. J. Ser­
vice

Fourth Grade/Mrs. Davis - 
1st. Kindra Johnson, 2nd. 
Sheibi Roe, 2nd. Amber 
Brosh

Fourth Grade/Mrs. Devon - 
1st. Whitney Fleming, 2nd. 
Jennifer Nesbit

Fifth Grade/Mrs. Wilson - 
1st. Charles Abates, 2nd. Amy 
Riley

Sixth Grade/Mrs. Randolph - 
1st. Erin Millican

Sixth Grade/Mrs. Burns - 
1st. Jessica Cowart, 2nd. 
Jennifer Hamilton

Personal
Faye Scott recently re­

turned from vacation in  
Nashville, Tennesse. She 
and others in her party visited 
the Grand Ole Opry, Barbara 
Mandrell Musuem, and the 
Country Music Hall of Fame. 
While on a tour of the city, 
they saw the homes of many 
stars. They attended a taping 
of the famous Crook & Chase 
television program.

Probably the best attraction 
was a dinner cruise on the 
General Jackson River Boat 
which featured outstanding 
entertainment.

One of the highlights of the 
trip was a visit between Faye, 
her son Kenneth, and Doak 
Snead, formerly of Bronte. 
Doak is a recording artist and 
song writer for Reba McEntire.

PARKER PLUMBING
Residential-Commercial 

All Types Plumbing Repair
. *New Construction 

^Remodeling 'ih
♦Fixtures
♦Sewer Servicev^^^^i

Licensed Master Plumber

473-2131 Bronte
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On May 28 at 6:30 pm the annual "God's 
Special Women's Banquet" was held at the 
First Baptist Church in Bronte. After a nice 
meal, the ladies and other guests were sere­
naded by Bronte's own version of Poncho and 
Lefty. A good time was had by all in atten­
dance.

A group of Senior Citizens traveled to Miles and Eola on Thursday, May 4th. 
They had lunch at the Miles Opera House which is also their Senior Center and 
toured their nice facility. After a relaxing lunch they were off to Eola and the 
Ernest and Dorothy Barrow Museum. Pictured are Virginia Boatright, Marie Ar- 
rott, Helen Kirkland, Maude Collins, Royce Dean Clark, Pearlie Mae and Murl 
Andrews, Charliebelle Bagwell, Mary Percifull, Juanita Bradley and tour guide, 
Deanna Lehr. Not pictured is Donna Noland who drove the van and took the 
picture.

Personal info safe 
with SS

During your lifetime, Social 
Security collects a great deal 
ot information about you. Are 
you concerned that o ther 
people may be able to get this 
information? Don't be - it's all 
confidential and protected by 
law. Unless you specifically 
permit it, Social Security can­
not give information about 
you to anyone without your 
permission.

If you receive a letter from 
Social Security and have 
questions about the informa­
tion in the letter, call us; we 
are here to help you w ith  
those questions. But the call 
we receive must be from you. 
If you ask someone else to 
make the call on your behalf, 
the Social Security represen­
tative is prohibited by law from 
discussing your personal 
business with that person 
unless you authorize it.

When Social Security be­
gan keeping records, we de­
cided to use a numerical 
identifier, your Social Security 
number. The number as­
signed to each person is dif­
ferent. This allows us to keep 
information about you sepa­
rate from any other informa­
tion. The public was told that 
information kept by Social 
Security would be regarded 
as confidential.

Although we can't prevent 
others from asking for your 
number, you should know 
that giving it to them does not 
give them access to your So­
cial Security records. The pri­
vacy of your records is 
guaranteed unless the law re­
quires us to give it to another 
government agency or the in­
formation is needed to con­
duct Social Security or other 
government health or welfare 
programs.

If a business asks you for 
your Social Security number, 
you can refuse to give it to 
them. However, they may not 
let you make the purchase or 
give you the service you are 
requesting without the num­
ber. Be careful with your So­
cial Security number and keep 
it confidential whenever pos­
sible.

A re  You 
Concerned 
About Water 
Quality?
Join the Lower Colorado River 
Authority, Upper Colorado River 
Authority, Colorado River Municipal 
Water District, Texas Alliance of 
Groundwater Districts, Glasscock 
County Soil and Water Conservation 
District, North Concho Soil and Water 
Conservation District, Lower Concho 
Soil and Water Conservation 
Authority, Concho Soil and Water 
Conservation District, City of 
Ballinger, City of San Angelo, City of 
Sterling City, City of Robert Lee, City 
of Winters, City of Bronte, City of 
Colorado City, City of Eden and City of 
Paint Rock

for a

Town M eeting  
7 p.m.
Thursday, May 25
San Angelo 
Convention Center 
5d0 Rio'Concho Drive

L O W E R  C O L O R A D O

W e  want to hear 
from residents about 
their concerns on 
water quality of the 
river, its tributaries 
and lakes.

For more information: 
Call 1-800-776-5272, 
Ext. 3261,
Mary Ann Neely, LCRA

THE POWER TO MAKE A DIFFERENCE.

THETEXASLEAN
R I V E R  A U T H O R I T Y


