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Sin g in g  Winds  to 
host  go l f  t o urney

There will be a 27 hole, 2 
person, low ball, alternate 
shot, select shot, golf 
tournament on July 19, 2008, 
at the Singing Winds Golf 
Course in Bronte. Tee off 
time is 8 am. For more 
information, call 473-2156. 

USDA an no un ces  
d i s a s t e r  program  
s ign -up  dead l ine  
Livestock producers have 

until July 18, 2008, to enroll 
in the 2005-2007 Livestock 
Com pensation Program 
(LCP) and Livestock 
Indemnity Program (LIP). 
Signup began on September 
10, 2007, for the two 
programs that provide aid to 
livestock producers who 
suffered eligible livestock or 
livestock feed losses between 
January 1, 2005, and
December 30, 2007, because 
of a natural disaster.

The LIP provides payments 
to eligible livestock owners 
and contract growers who 
incurred the death of 
livestock because of a 
natural, disaster. The LCP 
provides payments to eligible 
livestock owners and cash 
lessees who suffered feed 
losses or increased feed costs 
because of a natural disaster.

More information about LCP 
and LIP is available online at 
http://disaster.fsa.usda.gov.

For more information on 
FSA programs, visit your 
local USDA Service Center 
or the agency’s website, 
http://www.fsa.usda.gov. 

Rides  for cancer  
pa t i e n t s  now  

av a i lab l e
People are now available 

through the America Cancer 
Society to take cancer related 
patients to and from 
treatments (within 80 miles 
one way). For more 
information, call Benny and 
Jackie Corley at 473-7771, 
Joe and Glenda Draper at 
473-2050 or Carolyn Lee at 
786-4866. If you are 
interested in taking the 2- 
hour class to become a 
driver, call someone on the 
list for more information. 

2008 RL Mini  
Cheer  Camp  

The Robert Lee High 
School Cheerleaders will 
hold a mini cheer camp 
August 11 -  15 at the high 
school tennis courts for all

Vol. 120, No. 51

girls in Pre-K through 6th 
grade. There is a small daily 
fee or one-time fee for the 
whole week. There will also 
be special 80th anniversary 
Steer football t-shirts for 
sale. For more information, 
contact Maranda Hood at 
maranda.hood@rlisd.net.

RL swimming  
pooi  opens

The Robert Lee swimming 
pool has officially opened for 
the summer. It is open from 
2 pm to 6 pm daily.

Pool managers this year are 
Cathy Green and Jeff Barnes. 
Certified lifeguards are 
Chase Roe, Megan Percifull, 
Olga Perez, Sarah Philley, 
Emalie Green, Alexis Garren, 
Molly Hinderliter, and Blake 
Millicaiv

Ladies night is each 
Monday night from 6:15 pm - 
7:30 pm.

Reserve the pool for your 
next gathering or party. You 
may hire your own certified 
lifeguard or one can be 
schedule for you. More than 
30 swimmers requires 2 
lifeguards. Call to schedule 
your next et together at 450- 
5204 or 201-4227.

Season tickets are available 
for individuals or family 
rates at the window.

Call the swimming pool at 
450-5204 or 325-201-4227 to 
get admission fees.

Car ing  for the  
Careg iver

Providing needed care for a 
loved one is perhaps one of 
the toughest jobs you’ll ever 
love. It really does not matter 
what ailment afflicts the 
family. The stress that builds 
is just as dangerous. Love 
and loyalty are very strong, 
but without support the 
bridge may eventually 
collapse. Simply talking 
about your situation with 
o th e rs  in s im ila r  
circumstances helps and may 
put you in touch with 
resources that are available 
to you. If you or someone 
you know is a caregiver, or 
you want to know how to 
support someone who is a 
caregiver, please attend the 
quarterly support group 
meetings provided by Robert 
Lee Care Center. These 
meetings are open to anyone 
and everyone. The next 
meeting will be held July 24 
at 5:30 pm in the RLCC 
conference room. Please 
contact Mary Rodriguez, AD
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BHRC Hot Dogs, Pies, and Fireworks! July 4th was a festive day at the Bronte Health 
and Rehab Center, as the annual hot dog supper, cake auction, and fireworks display did not 
disappoint residents and guests. A good crowd attended (although somewhat smaller than last 
year), and the bidding on between 70 and 80 cakes and pies was lively. Complete results o f 
the baked goods auction which benefits the BHRC Auxiliary were not available at presstime.

at 453-251 1 or Sherri 
Munsey, LBSW-IPR, CCH at 
656-2039 for more 
information.
Communi ty  Med ica l  
to host  s enior  talks

San Angelo Community 
Medical Center will be 
hosting free educational talks 
for seniors. Holly Wescott 
will present “File of Life” on 
July 11, from 9:30 am -  
10:30 am. Both talks will be 
in the conference rooms at 
San Angelo Community 
Medical Center. Coffee, 
water and snacks will be 
served. There is limited 
seating so call 947-6262 to 
reserve a seat.

RL M ethod i s t  
VBS s lat ed  

The Robert Lee First United 
Methodist Church will hold 
Vacation Bible School, July 
14-18, from 1 pm - 3 pm. 
This is open to all children in 
grades Kindergarten through 
6th grade.

FSA accept ing  
app l i c a t ion s

The Farm Service Agency 
(FSA) is now accepting 
application for Emergency 
Farm Loans resulting from 
damages and losses caused by 
fires and high winds on 
January 1, 2008 and
continuing.

Coke County has been 
named a primary county 
where eligible family farmers 
may qualify for FSA EM loan 
assistance. Farm Loan 
Manager, Justin B. Holland, 
asks farmers who want to

apply for emergency loans to 
submit their applications as 
soon as possible. The 
deadline for applications is 
January 15, 2009, but if 
farmers wait too long, a 
backlog will develop and 
cause delays.

Generally, farmers who 
have lost 30 percent of their 
production due to designated 
disaster are eligible for 
emergency loans. The FSA 
office is located at 103 W. 
F lo rid a  Avenue in 
Sweetwater, Texas.

Si lver  Spur Bal l  
set for July  25

Dust off your dancing 
shoes as traditional country 
artist Tony Booth and the 
Texas Tradition are coming 
to the Knights of Columbus 
Hall in San Angelo. The 
occasion is the annual Silver 
Spur Ball July 25 benefiting 
West Texas Rehabilitation 
Center.

The evening also will 
include a light supper by 
Outback Steakhouse as well 
as a silent auction with more 
than 125 hand-crafted and 
retail items up for bid. In 
addition, there will be a 
drawing for a hand-made, 
queen-size quilt.

Tickets are available at the 
Rehab Center. Tables for ten 
are available on a first come, 
first served basis.

In 17 years, the Silver Spur 
Ball has raised more than 
$335,000 for the Center, 
thanks to the generous 
support of sponsors and those 
who attend each year. Event

under-writing is being 
provided by West Central 
Wireless, Concho Valley 
Home Health Care and 
Superior Services. Additional 
funding is by Angelo Fleet & 
Industrial Supply, Bearing 
Service & Supply, Catholic 
Life Insurance, Hartman 
Roofing, J.L. Mercer Boot 
Co., Milford Engineering, 
San Angelo Standard-Times 
and Wal-Mart of Ballinger.

Singer/songwriter/guitarist 
Tony Booth has had three Top 
20 country hits, including 
“The Key’s in the Mailbox.” 
He was a regular performer 
on Buck Owens’ Ranch Party, 
toured with Gene Watson’s 
Farewell Party band and was 
featured throughout the U.S. 
as band leader for Tommy 
Tune’s “ B est L itt le  
Whorehouse in Texas.” He 
signed with Heart of Texas 
Records in Brady, Texas, and 
his latest CD, “Is This All 
There Is to a Honky Tonk,” 
was released this spring.

Through its facilities in San 
Angelo, Abilene and Ozona, 
West Texas Rehab Center 
p ro v id e s  o u tp a t ie n t  
rehabilitation care each year 
to more than 23,000 children 
and adults who have 
experienced  d isab lin g  
illnesses or injuries. Events 
such as the Spur Ball make it 
possible for the Center to 
treat all who seek its 
services, regardless of their 
financial status.

For event or ticket 
information,, call (325) 223- 
6300.

http://disaster.fsa.usda.gov
http://www.fsa.usda.gov
mailto:maranda.hood@rlisd.net
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Arthur
Billy Joe Arthur of Corpus 

C h ris ti, form erly  of 
Tennyson, Texas, went to be 
with the Lord on Monday, 
June 30, 2008, at the age of 
28 years.

Viewing was held all day 
Sunday, July 6, 2008, at 
Shaffer Funeral Home in 
Bronte. Funeral services 
were held at 10 am on 
Monday, July 7, 2008, at the 
Tennyson Baptist Church. 
Burial followed in the Mule 
Creek Cemetery. Services 
were under direction of 
Shaffer Funeral Home.,

Billy lettered in football 
and band while attending 
Bronte High School. He 
served proudly in the United 
States Navy for 9 years. He 
was a loving father, husband, 
brother and son. He married 
Sarah his loving wife on 
January 17, 2003.

He is preceded in death by 
g re a t g ra n d p a re n ts ,  
grandparents and one aunt.

Billy is survived by his 
wife, Sarah Arthur, of Corpus 
Christi; three daughters, 
Dakota Arthur of Tennyson 
with his first wife, Rita, and 
two with Sarah, Abby and 
Jenna Arthur of Corpus 
Christi; his parents, Robert 
and Diana Arthur; two 
brothers and their wives, 
Robert and Angie Arthur and 
Fred and Rea Arthur, all of 
Tennyson; numerous nieces, 
nephews, aunts, uncles and 
cousins.

He will be remembered, 
loved, and missed by all. He 
was our Superman.

We appreciate all the 
friends, relatives, and co­
w orkers, we g rea tly  
appreciate all the care and 
support of Dr. Pollard and 
her sisters of Corpus Christi.

51-ltc

Political Science Association 
as well as Managing Editor 
of The Journal Oklahoma 
Politics. She was working as 
summer staff at the Lifeway 
Conference Center in 
Glorietta, New Mexico when 
the Lord called her home. 
She went to sleep in New 
Mexico and woke up in the 
arms of Jesus.

Erin is survived by her 
parents, Elaine and Russ 
Ketner and brothers, Tyler, 
Jacob and Luke, all of the 
home, whom she was very 
proud: grandmother, Polly 
Millican of Robert Lee, 
Texas; grandparents Billie 
and Frank Ketner of Noble; 
and many aunts, uncles, 
cousins and friends.

She was preceded in death 
by her grandad, Conrad 
Millican of Robert Lee, 
Texas.

51-ltc

Ketner
Erin Elaine Ketner, 27, of 

Washington, Oklahoma, went 
home to be with the Lord 
June 28, 2008 at Glorietta, 
New Mexico. She was born 
June 25, 1981 in Lubbock, 
Texas to Elaine and Russ 
Ketner. She grew up in 
Austin, Texas, Lebanon, 
Connecticut and Washington, 
Oklahoma. She started 
school in Lebanon, 
C onnec ticu t, a ttended  
Washington schools until the 
age of sixteen and graduated 
from Parkview, Oklahoma 
School for the Blind in 
Muskogee, Oklahoma where 
she was class Valedictorian. 
She was currently attending 
East Central University in 
Ada, Oklahoma where she 
had earned a Bachelor’s 
degree in English with a 
Spanish Minor and was 
pursuing a second Bachelor’s 
degree in Legal Studies. She 
planned to get a Master’s 
degree in Political Science 
and teach at the college level.

Erin loved her family and 
friends and enjoyed spending 
time with them. She also 
loved to read. Her life was 
devoted to serving God. She 
spent three summers as a 
counselor at Camp Nunny 
Chaha working with girls. 
She accompanied her church 
on two week long summer 
mission trips to Cimarron, 
New M exico. While 
attending East Central 
University she worked part 
time for two years at the Ada 
Public Library. Erin was 
recently appointed Executive 
Director of the Oklahoma

Death 
Notices

Jacques
Remedy Faith Jacques, 14 

months old, passed away 
peacefully, with her loving 
family at her side, on July 3, 
2008, to be with her Lord 
and Savior. Visitation was 
all day Saturday, July 5, 
2008, at the funeral home. 
Family visitation was from 2 
pm -  4 pm. Graveside 
services were Monday, July 
7, 2008, at 3 pm at the 
F a irv ie w  C em ete ry . 
Arrangements were by 
Shaffer Funeral Home.

Remedy is survived by her 
mother Christy Casares, her 
father Ryan Jacques both of 
Bronte, her grandparents, 
Lucy Casares of Bronte, 
Johnny M artinez of 
Ballinger, Ruben and 
Rosalinda Jacques of 
Sabinal, Richard “Popo” and 
Janie Ornelaz of Ballinger, 
greatgrandparents Lidia 
Casares of Bronte, Anzelmo 
Casares of Andrews, Juan 
and Maria Gomez of Sabinal 
and a very “Special” aunt 
and uncle, Isaiah and Savina 
Ornelaz of Bronte. She is 
also survived by numerous 
aunts, uncles, and cousins. 

Hol loway
Danny Michael “Mike” 

Holloway, 60, of Menard 
died Wednesday, July 9, 
2008, at his residence. 
Visitation will be Friday with 
the family present from 6 pm 
to 8 pm. Funeral service will 
be held at 10 am, Saturday, 
July 12, 2008, at the First 
Baptist Church of Blackwell. 
Burial will be in the

Tommy E. Neal
Financial Advisor Edward Jones

2412 College Hills Boulevard 
Suite 102
San Angelo, Texas 76904-8475
Bus. (325) 223-8244 Toll free (877) 223-8244
www.edwardjones.com

MAKING SENSE OF INVESTING

Arrangements are by Shaffer 
Funeral Home.

Survivors include his wife, 
Sharron Holloway of Menard; 
sons, Matthew Holloway of 
New York City and Kyle 
Scott of Westbrook, Texas; 
daughters, Michelle Gehrts of 
Anson and Cari Smith of 
Clyde; his mother, Essie 
Pearl Holloway of Anson; 
brothers, Mark Holloway of 
Hamlin and David Holloway 
of Gallatin, Tennessee; and a 
sister, Wanda Archer of 
Eastland, Texas.

RL Project  
Graduat ion  2009  

Project Graduation class of 
2009 held their first meeting 
on Tuesday, July 1, 2008 in 
the Robert Lee High School 
library at 6:30 pm to discuss 
plans for the upcoming year. 
Officers elected: Terri Blair -  
President; Becky Ross -  
Treasurer, Mary Tinkler -  
Secretary ; and Mary 
Rodriquez -  Reporter. 

McMur ry 
Unive rs i ty  Spring  

2008 D e a n ’s 
Lis t /Ho no r  Rol l  

Dixie Ann Johnson, a 
Robert Lee High School 
graduate, has been named to 
the Spring 2008 Dean’s List 
and Dean’s Honor Roll at 
McMurry University. To be 
eligible for the Dean’s List, a 
student must have maintained 
at least a 3.5 grade point 
average while taking *12 or

more credit hours. To be 
eligible for the Dean’s Honor 
Roll, a student must complete 
6-11 hours with at least a 3.5 
grade point average. Dixie is a 
sophomore majoring in Pre- 
Nursing and is the daughter of 
Dallas and Vallery Johnson.

Check Out 
Coke County 

Library
A new winner in the Coke 

County Library Road Trip 
Summer Program was announced 
on July 3. Ashlie Tennison’s 
name was drawn from the 
names of readers who return 
books and add their names to 
the drawing. Ashlie can come 
claim her prize any time.

All names entered are being 
reserved for the final drawing 
at the end of the program on 
July 25. Coke County readers 
are invited to take a Road Trip 
that requires no gasoline at the 
Coke County Library this 
summer.

An article that appeared in 
the Big Country Library 
System newsletter might be of 
interest to Internet users. 
“Stopping Online Thieves” was 
written by the technology 
director, Mac Skinner, at the 
System. The article gives 
several examples of email 
scams and ideas for preventing 
identity theft. The article is 
available at the Library.

Area Churches
I n v i t e  Y o u  t o  W o r s h i p

Bronte Church of Christ Southside Church of Christ
PO Box 346» 118S.Jefifeisai»BiaTte PO Box 698 • 8th & Houston
(325)473-3291 RobertLee* (325) 453-2176
Preacher John V. Driggers Frank J. Daniels, Preacher
Sun. 10 am & 6 pm. Wed. 7 pm Sun. 10 am, Sunday School
Central Baptist Church 11 am & 6 pm, Worship
324 S. Franklin • Bronte Wed. 7 pm, Worship
(325) 473-4811 Northside Church of Christ
Dale Patterson, Pastor PO Box 508 *9th & Chadboume
Sun. 10 am Sunday School RobertLee

11 am & 6 pm Worship (325) 655-9784 or 453-2685
Wed. 6 pm Portis Ribble, Minister
Emmanuel Pentecostal Services: Sun. 10 am & 1:30 pm;
PU Box 683 *10I9(jdcrado City Hwy Wed. 6 pm
Robert Lee Our Lady of Guadalupe Catholic
(325) 453-2360 Church
Rev. Ray Aldridge, Pastor 601 W. 10th, Robert Lee
Sun. 10 am & 6 pm, Wed. 7 pm (325) 365-2687
First Baptist Church Rev. Hubert Wade, Jr., Pastor
424S. Washington »Bicnte Sat. 6 pm
(325) 473-2331 Pecan Baptist
Bro. Corey Comutt, Pastor PO Box 542 *12 miles West of
Sunday 9:45 am Sunday School, Robert Lee on Sterling City Hwy
10:55 am Worship, (325) 453-2482
6 pm Youth Jim Dominey, Pastor
and Worship Sun. 10 am, Sunday School
Wednesday 7 pm Prayer Meeting 11 am & 7 pm. Worship
First United Methodist Church Robert Lee Baptist Church
Comer of Washington & Holmes PO Box 493 *22 W. 11th
BiOTle (325) 453-2724
(325) 473-3281 Jason Martin, Pastor
Rev. David Bailey, Pastor Sun. 9:45 am, Sunday School
Sun. 10:00 am Sunday School 11 am & 6 pm. Worship

11:00 am Worship Wed. 7 pm. Prayer Meeting
5:00 Youth Tennyson Baptist Church

First United Methodist Church Hwy 277 • Tennyson
PO Box 144 *9th & Chadboume Joe Hodges, Pastor
Robert Lee (325) 473-2040
(325) 453-2417 Sun. 9:45 am, Sunday School
Rev. George Bradley, Pastor 11:00 am & 6 pm. Worship
Sun. 10 am Sunday School Wed. 6:00 pm Prayer Meeting

10:50 am Worship Victory Assembly of God
Wed. 6 pm Choir PO Box 638 • 6th & Houston
Iglesia Bautista Bethel Robot Lee
101 Houston • Robert Lee (325) 453-2208
(325) 763-9208 * 320-1354 Rev. Irving Smith, Pastor
Sun. 10 am • Worship Sun. 9:45 am, Sunday School

11 am & 6 pm • Service 10:45 am & 6 pm. Worship
Wed. 7 pm Wed. 7 pm. Prayer Meeting

St. James Catholic Church
215 N. Washington, Bronte 
(325) 365-2687
Rev. Hubert Wade, Jr., Pastor 
Sun. 5 pm

mailto:CokeCoObserver@aol.com
http://www.edwardjones.com
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Final  Plea for  
Coke Cou nty  Area  

Host  F am i l i e s
Foreign high school 

students are scheduled to 
arrive soon for academic 
semester homestay programs, 
and the sp o n so rin g  
organization needs a few- 
more local host families. The 
students are anxiously 
awaiting news of their new 
fam ilies. These young 
ambassadors are looking 
forward to fulfilling their 
life-long dreams.

According to Pacific 
In te rcu ltu ra l Exchange 
(P.I.E.) President, John Doty, 
the students are all between 
the ages of 15 and 18 years, 
are English-speaking, have 
their own spending money, 
carry accident and health 
insurance, and are anxious to 
share th e ir  cu ltu ra l 
experiences with their new 
American families. P.I.E. 
currently has programs to 
match almost every family’s 
needs, ranging in length 
from a semester to a full 
academic year, where the 
students attend local high 
schools.

P.I.E. area representatives 
match students with host 
families by finding common 
interests and lifestyles 
through an informal in- home 
meeting. Prospective host 
families are able to review 
student applications and 
select the perfect match. As 
there are no “typical” host 
families, P.I.E. can fit a 
student into just about any 
situation, whether it is a 
single parent, a childless 
couple, a retired couple or a 
large family.

Families who host for 
P.I.E. are also eligible to 
claim a $50.00 per month 
charitab le  contribution 
deduction on their itemized 
tax returns for each month 
they host a sponsored 
student.

For the upcom ing 
programs, P.I.E. has students 
from Germany, the Former 
Soviet Union, Venezuela, 
Argentina, Brazil, Japan, 
Hungary, Korea, Mexico, 
Australia, Yugoslavia, China, 
and many other countries. 
P.I.E. is also participating in 
two special government- 
funded programs to bring 
scholarship students from the 
Newly Independent States of 
the former Soviet Union as 
well as predom inantly 
Islamic countries such as 
Yemen, Syria, Jordan, 
Morocco, Kuwait, Iraq and 
Qatar to the United States. 
P.I.E. is a non-profit 
educational organization that 
has sponsored more than 
25,000 students from 45 
countries since its founding 
in 1975. The organization is 
designated by the United 
States Department of State 
and is listed by the Council 
on S ta n d a rd s  fo r 
International Educational 
Travel (CSIET), certifying 
th a t the organization 
complies with the standards

SUPER H

Watermelon! These two little girls sure seem to be 
enjoying the watermelon at the Bronte Health and Rehab 
Center 4th o f July Celebration held this past Friday.
set forth in CSIET’s 
Standards for International 
Educational Travel Programs.

Doty encourages families to 
con tac t the program  
immediately, as it will allow 
the proper time for the 
students and hosts to get to 
know one another before they 
actually meet for the first 
time.

Coke County area families 
interested in learning more 
about student exchange or 
arranging for a meeting with a 
community representative 
may call P.I.E., toll-free, at 1- 
866-546-1402. The agency 
also has travel/study program 
opportunities available for 
American high school 
students as well as 
possibilities for community 
volunteers to assist and work 
with area host families, 
students and schools.

To advertise, 
call 453-2433!

Editorial & 
Advertising 

Deadline 
is 2 pm on 
Idesday 

preceding 
publication.

Robert Lee 
State Bank

Internet Banking 
Has Arrived

Come b y  or call the bank  
at 325/453-2545 to sign  up! 

robertleestatebank.com

Online Bill Pay 
Available!

Full Service ATM & 
Night Drop On Site!

w m  

m i .

MEMBER
FDIC
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Su pp or t in g  
Hea l t hy  L i f e s ty l e s  

for T e x a s ’ Youth
By U.S. Senator Kay 

Bailey Hutchison 
Summer in Texas is now in 

full bloom. Unfortunately, 
many children will spend 
their free time not on swings 
at playgrounds but in front of 
te lev isio n s  at home, 
consum ing hours of 
program m ing full of 
advertisements for unhealthy 
foods. Others will spend 
time on the Internet instead 
of playing outside with their 
friends. This lack of physical 
activity among our youth is 
contributing to an American 
healthcare crisis: childhood 
obesity. We must work 
together to reduce the 
harmful influence that 
inactivity can have on our 
kids, and promote healthy 
living that is vital to their 
long-term well-being.

Texas ranks s ix th  
nationally in the percentage 
of obese youth (ages 10 -  
17), and many of these 
children are at risk of 
significant health problems, 
including Type 2 Diabetes. 
Since 1990, the number of 
children diagnosed with Type 
2 diabetes in our country has 
jumped 15-fold. This is 
extremely troubling because 
diabetic children face 
lifelong medical problems.

Fortunately, a number of 
b r o a d c a s t e r s  and  
corporations are taking steps 
to foster healthy and active 
life s ty le s . They are 
demonstrating, that they are 
willing to be part of the 
solution.

The Walt D|sney Company 
is phasing out the use of its 
characters in promotions that 
market unhealthy products, 
and it is developing shows 
that demonstrate the benefits 
of exercising and eating 
well. Nickelodeon, one of 
the national networks for 
youth, has an initiative 
called “Let’s Just Play,” 
which inspires young 
viewers to be more active. 
On the network’s annual 
“Worldwide Day of Play,” it 
suspends programming for a 
block of time so kids can go 
outside and run around. I 
hope that Texas parents will 
help me support the 
continuation and expansion 
of these efforts.

Broadcasters in our state 
are also creating initiatives 
that nurture wholesome 
living. Many of these 
endeavors are community- 
based and address physical, 
nutritional, and mental 
health.

This is a good start, but 
there is much more that can 
be done to curb the epidemic 
of childhood obesity. We can 
help shape the content of the 
shows our children listen to 
and watch by encouraging 
m e d ia  c o m p a n ie s ,  
broadcasters, and marketers 
to air responsible programs 
and advertisements.

Finally, a foundation for 
healthy habits must be

reinforced at home. In the 
2008 Farm Bill, I created an 
elementary school pilot 
program that invites parents 
to become involved in 
nutritional education along 
with their children. This 
initiative is modeled after the 
very successful Coordinated 
Approach to Child Health 
(CATCH) Program which 
helped significantly reduce 
the number of overweight 
fifth graders in El Paso.

By using the major 
influences in a child’s life -- 
from parents, to teachers, to 
their favorite television 
characters -- we can help 
reverse childhood obesity. 
We can all be part of a 
national movement to 
cultivate positive lifestyles 
and good health that young 
Americans can carry into 
adulthood.

Driftwood! On July 3, local band, Driftwood, entertained the residents o f the Robert Lee 
Care Center. Those performing include (from left to right) David Sheldon, Dallas Johnson, 
Scott Smith (drums), Kyle Long and Daryl Copeland. The residents enjoyed the music, eating 
watermelon and visiting with people from the community.

Summer  Safety  
Driv ing  Tips

With the arrival of hot 
weather, motorists should be 
reminded to ensure their 
vehicle is well-maintained 
and working properly to 
ensure safe travel during the 
summer months.

Vehicle breakdowns are 
never convenient, but they 
can be especially problematic 
during hot weather. By taking 
the time to have your vehicle 
checked by a mechanic now, 
you may be able to prevent a 
future problem and better 
enjoy your summer travels.

Engine hoses and drive 
belts should be inspected by 
a mechanic for wear, and the 
cooling system should be 
checked to be certain that it 
is functioning properly to 
help avoid over-heating. 
Also, have the battery 
checked because battery 
failure is a common problem 
during hot weather.

In addition, motorists 
should regularly check fluid 
levels and tire tread depth. It 
also is important to have tires 
properly inflated  for 
maximum fuel efficiency. In 
times of very hot weather, air 
pressure inside the tire can 
expand, causing a blowout if
r

the tire is in poor condition.
Hot weather also can 

contribute to problems on 
roadway surfaces. Extreme 
heat causes oils deposited 
from vehicles to be absorbed 
into the road. Rain forces 
these oils to the surface, 
creating  slick  spots. 
Motorists should use extra 
caution while driving during 
a rainstorm, particularly after 
an extended period without 
rain.

Remember the following 
tips for safe summer driving:

*Never leave children or 
pets unattended in a vehicle, 
which can heat up quickly 
during hot weather.

♦When traveling a long^ 
distance, try to plan your trip 
for early in the day or later in 
the evening when the weather 
is cooler.

* Carry a cell phone and 
charger in case of emergency.

* Carry extra water and 
non-perishable food.

* State law requires 
headlights to be turned on 
any time the wipers are in use 
due to rain, fog or other 
conditions.

* Remember to always 
buckle up and never drink 
and drive.
Get your f inanc ia l  

re so lut ions  
back on track

By Jason Alderman
You probably began 2008 

with the best intentions: lose 
a few pounds, reduce debt, 
start saving for college or 
retirement. You may have 
even written New Year’s 
resolutions and started 
working on them. But you get

WINK INSURANCE AGENCY
Home • Auto 

Life • Commercial
715 Austin 453-4551

The Best Connection 
402 Hwy 208* Robert Lee, Texas 

•24-Hour Towing*
Oil Changes,

Routine Maintenance, Light 
Mechanical Work

(325) 453-2342________

busy, unexpected expenses 
come up, and suddenly it’s 
summer.

Don’t despair. There’s 
plenty of time to get back on 
track. Here are a few 
suggestions:

First, make a budget. 
Compare what’s going out 
with what’s coming in. If 
your expenses exceed your 
income, you’ll never get 
ahead.

Track what you spend. For 
the next few months, write 
down every penny you spend 
on rent or mortgage, utilities, 
groceries, meals out, parking 
meters, allowances, gas -  the 
works. Don’t forget to add in 
monthly amounts for periodic 
bills like your car and 
homeowner’s insurance.

Review your list for non- 
essentials you can trim. A 
$5-a-day coffee habit costs 
$1,800 a year; buying a $10 
lunch every day will run 
about $2,500. You could save

a fortune by brewing your own 
coffee and packing lunch a few 
days a week. Put those savings 
toward paying off credit cards 
and you’ll save even more, 
since you’ll reduce the amount 
of interest accrued on those 
loans.

A few other money-saving 
ideas:

* Consolidate errands to save 
gas

* Try generic brand groceries
* Investigate using generic 

drugs and ask if there’s a 
discount for ordering multiple- 
month prescriptions by mail

* Raise insurance deductibles
* Pay down higher-interest 

credit cards first
* Balance your checking 

account regularly to avoid 
overdraft charges

* Avoid using out-of­
network ATMs; take cash back 
on debit card purchases to 
avoid foreign ATM fees

* Quit smoking -  a pack a day 
habit costs over $1,500 a year

Grace Or Wrath?
The Bible teaches that God is perfectly Holy. Because of 
this attribute of His character. He cannot tolerate sin 
{Numbers 14:18). The Bible says that God must deal with 
sin, and He does so in one of two ways - either grace or 
wrath.
Every person on the face of this earth is at this moment 
under either the grace of God or the wrath of God. John the 
Baptist made this point in one of His sermons when he said: 
“He who believes in the Son has eternal life; but he who 
does not obey the Son shall not see life, but the wrath of 
God abides on him.” {John 3:36).
It’s amazing how all Christians seem to know John 3:16. 
But almost none seem to be aware of John 3:36. It shows 
how little preaching has been done on the wrath of God.
Like John the Baptist, the Apostle Paul emphasized God’s 
wrath in his preaching and teaching. In Ephesians 5 he 
warned against immorality, covetousness, and idolatry, and 
then he added this observation; “Let no one deceive you 
with empty words, for because of these things, the wrath of 
God comes upon the sons of disobedience.” {Ephesians 
5:6).
We come under God’s grace by placing our faith in Jesus 
and appropriating His atoning sacrifice for our lives {1 John 
1:7). There is no salvation apart from Jesus {Acts 4:10-12) 
Those who have rejected God’s gift of grace in Jesus are 
under God’s wrath {John 3:36), and they have no one to 
blame but themselves.

Victory Assembly of God 
Corner of 6th & Houston • Robert Lee

Pastor Irving Smith________________
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* Weatherproof your home 

and buy energy-efficient 
appliances

* Check out books and 
DVDs from the library 
instead of buying them

Start saving for retirement. 
Now. Thanks to compound 
earnings (where interest 
earned on your savings in 
turn  g enera tes  more 
earnings) the sooner you 
start saving, the faster your 
account will grow. Here’s an 
example:

Say you’re 22, earn 
$30,000 a year and put aside 
6 percent of pay until age 65 
at an 8 percent average 
annual rate of return. Your 
$77,400 investment will 
grow to $619,000 by 65; but 
wait until 32 to begin saving 
and you’ll only accumulate 
$274,000 -  a huge
difference. If you increase 
the percentage of pay saved 
and factor in annual raises, 
your savings will skyrocket.

Probably the easiest and 
m o s t  t a x - e f  fective 
retirement savings method is 
your employer’s 401(k) or 
similar plan. Money is 
deducted  from  your 
paycheck before being 
taxed, which lowers ‘your 
taxable income and thus, 
your taxes. You aren’t taxed 
un til the money is 
withdrawn at retirement, 
when your taxable income 
and tax rate may be much 
lower.

Most companies match a 
p o r t io n  o f  y o u r 
contributions -  commonly 
50 percent of your first 3 
percent of pay saved, or 
better. That’s a 50 percent 
rate of return, so be sure to 
contribute at least enough to 
take full advantage of the 
match. Practical Money 
Skills for Life features a 
complete guide to 401(k) 
plans and other employer- 
p r o v id e d  b e n e f i t s  
(www.practicalmoneyskills. 
com/benefits).

If a 401(k) plan isn’t 
available, try a Roth IRA. 
A l t h o u g h  i n i t i a l  
contributions are taxed, 
you’ll never pay taxes on 
the earnings. The earlier you 
contribute to a Roth, the 
bigger your tax savings. 
C onsu lt a fin an c ia l 
professional regarding your 
personal situation.

You’ve still got several 
months to end the year on a 
high note, so start saving 
now.

H e a d a c h e s  on the  
Job P r e v a l e n t ,  

P a in f u l  and Cos t ly
Experiencing headaches at 

work is not only painful for 
employees, but can be costly 
to employers, according to 
the National Headache 
Foundation (NHF). In a 
recent survey of headache 
sufferers, the NHF found 
that 99% of respondents 
experience headaches while 
on the job. Respondents say 
headaches lead to missed 
days of work, decreased 
productivity, inability to

concentrate, and changes in 
mood or behavior.

While half of all survey 
respondents reported missing 
anywhere from 1-3 days of 
work per month because of 
their headaches, 66% of 
them do not report their 
h ead ach es  to th e ir  
supervisors. When asked 
why, most respondents said 
they feel their supervisor 
wouldn’t be sympathetic or 
accommodating or they don’t 
want to be labeled as 
“ n eedy” or “ w hiny.” 
Additionally, 8 6% of 
respondents said the issue of 
work-related headaches has 
never been addressed at their 
place of employment. 
Ninety-three percent said 
that information on work- 
related headache treatment 
or prevention is not available 
through their employer.

“Many who suffer from 
headaches at work feel their 
employers or co-workers 
won’t understand  the 
severity of their condition,” 
said Dr. Nabih Ramadan, 
Board member. National 
Headache Foundation. “If 
you experience headaches on 
the job, talk with your 
healthcare provider about 
what triggers your pain to 
determine the best treatment 
options. You can also 
encourage your employer to 
learn more about headaches 
and their profound negative 
im pact on w orkplace 
performance.”

When asked what triggers 
headaches at work, nearly 
70% of the respondents 
attributed their pain to work- 
related stress. A larger 
majority also associated 
bright or florescent lighting, 
computer glare or eye strain 
with their headaches.

Additional NHF survey 
results:

* 92% of respondents said 
they work outside their home

* 90% of respondents said 
headaches have affected 
their performance at work

* 73% of respondents said

they take an over-the- 
counter product when 
experiencing a headache at 
the workplace '

NHF’s Tips to dealing with 
headaches at the workplace:

* Get help. Discuss the 
connection between your 
headaches and work with 
your healthcare provider. He 
or she can help you 
determine your treatment 
options.

* Track your headaches. 
Using a headache diary, 
track your headaches for 
three months. Download a 
free headache diary at 
www.headaches.org and 
bring your results to your 
healthcare professional to 
review and determ ine 
whether your headaches are 
associated with workplace 
triggers.

*  Eliminate florescent 
lighting

Use a non-glare 
computer screen

* Use loose telephone head 
set instead of phone receiver

* Take frequent breaks
*  Utilize ergonomically 

designed work spaces
Sh owe rs  dot  area;  

qu a r t e r l y  
t o ta l s  pos t ed  
by Hal Spain, Publisher

It’s Wednesday morning, 
July 9, 2008, and the reason 
I mention this is last night 
we got another 1/2 inch of 
rainfall at the house (near 
Lake Spence). As it is right 
at our deadline, I have not 
been able to ask around to 
see how much rain anybody 
else recorded for last night. 
Hope you got a good one.

The accompanying graph 
will indicate that the west 
side of the county is trying 
to catch up to the east side 
this quarter. Looks like the 
Edith area may have 
benefited the most, as far as 
rainfall totals for this 
quarter.

Something else you may 
observe from the comparison 
to last year’s totals at this

YOUR M ndependenn  
 ̂ in s y m n c t §  tS ilE IS T

123 W. Main

G LENN-BIVINS INSURANCE
Please support the Bronte 

Volunteer Fire Department! 
Bronte 473-6791

PauVs Body Shop
Don’t let the insurance company dictate 

who repairs your vehicle. It’s your choice!

PAUL KNIGHT 
123 N. State B ronte, Texas

O f f i c e  (325)  473-2425 • H o m e  (325) 473-2026 
_____________ Cell ( 325)  450-2281

Commercial • Residential 
New • Remodeling

Construction Serxnces, Inc

Professional • Experienced 
Licensed • Insured & 

Bonded

Call Todd Smith
325-453-2646 • Cell 325-234-0157  

Robert Lee, Texas

County Rainfall Totals
April May June Total for Year
Edith Area • Dee & Dessie Kendall

2007
2008

3.01
2.30

2.70
3.85

1.40
3.00

16.81
12.65

Valley View Area • Bobby and Jeffie Roberts

2007
2008

2.51
1.92

7.28
2.41

1.72
2.15

19.04
10.43

Divide Area • Dolores McCabe Seal

2007
2008

2.43
1.64

5.27
2.33

3.18
2.00

18.70
9.21

Bmce & Fran Sonnenbeig • 3 miles E. of Bronte

2007
2008

7.90
3.10

7.35
1.10

7.80
3.00

31.55
14.2

Bob Blackwood • 4 miles E. of Robert Lee

2007
2008

1.46
2.40

8.13
1.85

3.42
1.17

20.50
10.19

Bronte Area • Charles & Dorris Sonnenberg
2007
2008

5.48
1.51

7.10
1.09

5.94
2.14

25.79
9.69

Wayne & Melinda McCutchen • 3 miles N. of Bronte

2007
2008

3.90
2.90

7.00
1.45

10.00
1.65

30.00
12.00

same time is the record 
rainfall we received during 
the second quarter of last 
year, with the exception of 
the Edith area. Maybe they 
are just now catching up.

We have been pretty lucky 
so far with some of these 
showers. Our underground 
moisture (carried over from 
the winter) is next to 
nothing; so every one of 
these showers is money in 
the bank, whether or not you 
raise cows or farm.

Even if you live in Bronte 
or Robert Lee, and don’t 
own anything except the lot 
your house is on, you still 
have a large stake in the 
weather. If you like to fish 
or boat on area lakes, you 
are concerned with rainfall 
totals. If you like to see 
wildlife, now is a critical 
time in the life of quail, 
turkey, and deer and their 
reproduction cycle. Or if 
you just like to see a 
b e a u tifu l s tan d  of 
bluebonnets by the roadside. 
We are all affected by the

weather, and its importance 
can never be overstated.

Thanks again to our 
cooperators for turning in their 
rainfall totals. I think it.gives 
us a good look at the rainfall 
situation throughout the 
county. We’ll keep our fingers 
crossed for some more ,of the 
wet stuff as we get into the 
critical third quarter of the 
year.

If paying 
subscription 
renewal by 

check, please put 
name to be 
renewed in 

memo line of 
check.
BSERVER/ 
NTERPRISE« Serving Coke County 

P.O.Box 1329 Robert Lee. TX 76945 
(915)453-2433

FEED, PET SUPPLIES, DEER FEED, FENCING, LAWN AND GARDEN
3744 Summer Crest Dr. & Hwy. 67 Just West of Sam’s Club * (325) 942-6516

http://www.practicalmoneyskills
http://www.headaches.org
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BUY IT! SELLITI FIND IT!
CLASSIFIED 

ADVERTISING RATES 
Rates when paid in advance.

First Insertion 
200 Per Word 
$3 Minimum 

Subsequent Insertions 
160 Per Word 

$2.50 Minimum
Legal Notices:
250 Per Word

A service charge will be added 
to all ads which must be billed.
ADVERTISING DEADLINE 

Thesdays at 2 pm

PUBLISHER’S NOTICE:
All real estate advertising in 

this newspaper is s u b ^  to the 
Fair Housing Act which makes it 
illegal to advertise "any 
p referen ce, lim itation or 
discrimination based on race, 
color, religion, sex, handicap, 
familial status or national origin, 
or an intention, to make any 
such preference, limitation or 
discrimination.” Familial status 
includes children under the age 
of 18 living with parents or legal 
custodians, pregnant women 
and people securing custody of 
children under 18.

This new spaper will not 
know ing ly  a cc e p t any  
advertising for real estate which 
is in violation of the law. Our 
readers are hereby informed that 
all dwellings advertised in this 
newspaper are available on an 
equal opportunity'basis. To 
complain of discrimination, call 
HUD toll-free at 1^800-66^9777. 
The toll-free telephone number 
for the hearing impaired is 1- 
800-927-9275.

EQUAL HOUSING 
OPPORTUNITY

 ̂ FOR SALE )

Political Calendar 
The

Observer/Enterprise
has been authorized 

to make the following 
announcements for the 

political offices in 
Coke County.

Each candidate or the 
campaign treasurer has paid 
for his or her announcement.

All political advertising, 
announcements, and printing 

is cash in advance.
CONSTABLE. 

PRECINCTS 1& 3
Marshall Millican (Dem.) 

COKE COUNTY 
SHERIFF 

Randall Jacks (Dem.) 
George Brickey (Rep.)

ALL NEW
Mattress set, No springs or 
coils, Memory Foam pressure 
relieving sleep, $550. 432- 
664-8980.

51-ltc
NEARLY NEW 

SWAMP COOLER
$250 OBO. 209 N. Fayette, 
Bronte. 473-2070 or 473-3840.

51-ltc

( FOR RENT

COMPUTERS
New and Used. Repairs, 
upgrades, internet service. 
New 6.0 megapixel digital 
cameras $90. New Polaroid 
photo printers $25. Many 
new items 1/2 price! Ed 
Martindale, 473-3004.

22-tnc
HAYGRAZER

Square and round bales. 
Horse quality. 453-2731.

35-tnc
BED

All new pillow top set Queen 
$150 in plastic, factory 
warranty. 432-664-8980.

51-ltc
FOR SALE

4 houses in Bronte. 205 and 
209 S. Franklin, 510 S. 
Franklin, 418 SW Railroad. 
FMI (432) 693-2322.

42-tnc
PILLOW TOP

King mattress with box 
spring and warranty never 
slept on. Will sell for $245. 
432-664-8980.

51-ltc

PARKER PLUMBING
Residential & Commercial. 
All types plumbing repair - 
new  c o n s t r u c t i o n ,  
remodeling, fixtures, and 
sewer service. Licensed 
Master Plumber. 473-2131, 
Bronte.

34-tnc
STUMP GRINDING

You have an unsightly tree 
stump in your yard? We’ll 
grind it out without leaving a 
hole or a mess. Richard 
Baker. 473-2017 (home), 
(325) 669-7415 (cell).

20-tnc
LET US IRON OUT 

YOUR LAUNDRY NEEDS
We are now taking in 
washings and ironings at 
Shalon’s Floral, 113 W. 
Main, Bronte, Texas, (325) 
473-5101. Monday - Friday, 
9 am - 5 pm, Saturday, 9 am - 
noon.

51-ltc

FOR RENT
2 BR/1 BA, furnished, 
covered parking, fenced yard. 
325-763-7843.

40-tnc
FOR LEASE

In Pecos County, 4,320 acres of 
top mule deer and whitetail 
hunting, with great turkey, quail, 
and dove also some great hog 
hunting. Electricity and water. 
This is a family or corporate 
lease, that also offers year round 
camping and recreational 
purposes. $25,000.00 per year. 
432-336-3006. Also for sale in 
Pecos County, 2,500 acres, 
excellent cattle and hunting 
ranch. Good water and 
e lec tric ity  priced at 
$650,000.00. Owner will 
finance with half down. 432- 
336-3006.

50-4tc
LOT FOR RENT

with hookups. Call 453-4488.
______ 51-2tp

MISCELLANEOUS
NEED A SIGN?

Banners, Graphics, Vinyl 
Lettering, Magnetic Signs 
and Vehicle Lettering. Juan 
Rangel, (325) 453-9010.

40-tnc
The “BARBER” SHOP

Debora England, 107 W. 
Main, Bronte. Monday, 
Tuesday, Wednesday. 9 am - 
5 pm. Avon, buy or sell, 
independent rep. 650-1970.

50-tnc

C DHELP WANTED
IMMEDIATE OPENING

Delivering the San Angelo 
Standard Times in Robert 
Lee. Earn approximately 
$750/month working 2 1/2 
hours each morning. 659- 
8294 or 659-8292.

42-tnc
COKE COUNTY WATER 
SUPPLY CORPORATION

Applications are being 
accepted for a part-time 
secretary/bookkeeper until 
Friday, July 18, 2008.
Com puter sk ills  and 
bookkeeping skills desired. 
Applications may be picked 
up at the Coke County Water 
Supply Corp. at 10390 W. 
Highway 158, Robert Lee, 
Monday-Friday 8-12, or at 
the Coke County Judge’s 
Office in the Coke County 
Courthouse at 13 E. 7th St., 
Monday-Thursday, 8-5, and 
Friday, 8-1.

50-2tc

GARAGE SALES

W e  are back 
from the markets.

We have new items 
and more to come. 

Come check out the 
giraffe and zebra purses!

Amazing Hair Calon 
a Gifts

401 W. 10th 
Robert Lee • 453 -21 25

Boll Fiazee'o

IJi

944-0010
473-6603

Deflooding & 
Carpet Cleaning

- 6

Ash-MilucamC arson Real Ectate
453-5144 OFFICE • 21 E 6th Street • Robert Lee, TX 

J o e  A sh  •  473-0164 M arshall M illigan • 473-0437

For information & photos, visit our web site at 
www.amcwesttexasranches.coni

Coke County ~ Ranch & Hunting Properties 
91+/- ac., Highway frontage, 2 water wells, a 36’x45’ all metal bam with 
plumbing, nice 3 bedroom, 2 bath mobile home.
310+/- ac. in Mitchell County. Very Nice 3 BR,»2 bath home. Live water. 
Good fishing. Large Live Oak trees. Excellent turkey and deer hunting.

We have BuyerSy We need Land Listings.
Lake Spence, mobile home on large lot with huge storage/shop.
Lake Front Prnnrr*' -3 BR, 2 Bath home, 1550 sq. ft., vaulted ceiling in 
living al on apprx. 4.5 ac. with magnificent views,
additional guest house.
Nice Mobile Home. 2 BR, 2 Bath, fully furnished.
On 30 Acres, 3 BR, 2 Bath Brick home near Bronte. Bam, Pecan trees, 
cross fenced with good cultivation.

BRONTE 
CARPORT SALE 

401 Cumbie St. Friday, 11th. 
8am -  dark. Sat., 12th, till 
noon only. Come look. Lots 
of stuff.

51-1 twp 
YARD SALE

Saturday, 8am -  3pm. 121 W. 
12th, Robert Lee.

51-ltc

SUMMER 
CLEANING SALE

Saturday, July 12. 7:30 am -  
noon. 501 N. Franklin, 
Bronte. Too much to 
mention.

51-ltc
GARAGE SALE

Friday, Saturday and 
Sunday. 8 am - ??? 305 E. 
3rd, Robert Lee. 
_______________ 51-ltp

( NOTICES ]
REQUEST FOR BIDS

Bronte ISD is accepting bids 
on the following items: 
Teacher supplies, athletic 
supplies, janitorial supplies, 
m aintenance supplies, 
computer supplies, dairy 
products, and food service 
supplies for the school year 
2008-2009. Bids are due 
July 31, 2008 at 2:00 pm in 
the Superintendent’s Office, 
325-473-251 1 or PO Box 
670, Bronte, TX 76933. Street 
address is 210 South Jefferson, 
Bronte, TX 76933. BISD 
reserves the right to accept or 
reject any or all bids.

51-ltc
NOTICE TO OFFERORS

The Robert Lee Independent 
School District (RLISD) 
hereby offers for sale 
approximate houses generally 
situated at 302 W. 13th Street 
and 306 W. 13th Street. The 
houses will be bid separately.

[This is a request for the houses to 
be moved. This is not a request for 
bids for the land on which the 
house sits.]
Bid packets may be obtained 
beginning 9:00am, July 15, 2008 
at the following location:

RLISD
Superintendent’s Office 

1323 Hamilton St.
Robert Lee, TX 76945 

The property is sold subject to any 
conditions, covenants, easements, 
mineral interests and restrictions 
of record in the Deed Records of 
Coke County, Texas. Conveyance 
of the property to the successful 
offeror shall be by a no warranty 
deed. RLISD reserves the right to 
reject all bids. ADDITIONAL 
CONDITIONS OF SALE ARE 
CONTAINED IN THE EARNEST 
MONEY CONTRACT FORM 
AND BID PACKET 
MATERIALS.
Offers must be submitted in a 
sealed envelope and must be 
received at the Superintendent’s 
office of the Robert Lee ISD 
located at 1323 Hamilton Street on 
or before 3:00 pm, July 24, 2008. 
BID PACKETS RECEIVED 
AFTER THIS DATE AND TIME 
CANNOT BE ACCEPTED.
THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER 
WILL BE REQUIRED TO 
REMOVE THE HOUSE FROM 
THE PROPERTY NO LATER 
THAN 30 DAYS FROM THE 
DATE THE SCHOOL DISTRICT 
AWARDS THE BID.

51-2tc

-------- Ì 0 1 0 ' '
24 hr. Emergency 

Water Damage Service

Available Homes!
• Hillcrest Addition! 4 Bedroom 2 Bath Home! Corner Lot! Enclosed back porch! 
$60’s!i!
• Brick Home with Bay Windows! 2 Bedroom 2 Bath! Island in Kitchen! Patio 
doors lead to deck!
• 15 Acres with Pecan & Oak Trees! Brick Home with New Paint, Tile & Hardwood 
Floors! Creek!
• Lake Spence! 3 Bedroom 2 Bath Mobile Home! Large‘Shop! Pipe & Chain Link 
fence around property!
• Near Church! 3 Bedroom Home wth Hardwood Floors! CH/CA! Wood Burning 
Stove! Shop/Garage!
• Steps Away from the River! 4 Bedroom 2.5 Bath Home! 2 Living 2 Dining Areas! 
Fireplace!

Under Contract!
• Near School! 3 Bedroom 2 Bath Brick Home! Beautiful neutral colors! Ceramic 
Tile & Wood Blinds!
• Near School! 3 Bedroom 2 Bath Home with Hardwood Floors! Bring the Horse! 2 
Stalls!
• Near Golf Course & Park! 4 Bedroom 2.5 Bath Brick Home! Vaulted Ceiling! 
Fireplace!
• Covered Back Area! Brick Home with Fireplace! Kitchen has stove & dishwasher! 
Garage w/opener!
• Swimming Pool! 3 Bedroom 2 Bath Brick Home! Large Den with Fireplace! Pool 
House/Shop and Bath!
• House with Acreage! 3 Bedroom 2 Bath! CH/CA! Garage & RV Cover! Pecan 
Trees! Pens!
• 2 Story Home with Extra Land! 4 Bedroom 2 Bath! Beautiful Kitchen with 
French Doors!

Land Available!
• 80 Acres! Lovely Home! Great Barns!
• 20 Acre Home Sites with paved frontage! $2500/acre!!!
• 149 Acres with 4 Bedroom 2 Bath Home! Barn! Live Oaks! Breathtaking view!
• 70-250 Acres! Fabulous brick home! Large Bam!
• 100+/-Acres near Robert Lee! Pastureland! Barn and Windmill!
• 220 Acres with Creek, Pond, Water Well and New Fences!
• 382 Acres! Remote! Rolling pastureland! Excellent Hunting!
• 950+/- Acres! Rough Creek area! Great Hunting or Home Site!

Concho Realty
O ffic e  6 5 3 -4 5 3 5

B e c k y  www.conchorealty.com M e lin d a
C le n d e n n e n  Home 453-4748 Home 473-3201 M c C u tc h e n  
Owner/Broker Cell 650-9729 Cell 473-8863 REALTOR*

i
3 SOS.

http://www.amcwesttexasranches.coni
http://www.conchorealty.com
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( NOTICES )
CLERK OF THE 

COURT, MARY GRIM, 
CLERK,

13 E. 7th STREET, 
ROBERT LEE,
TEXAS 76945 
ATTORNEY:

GREG GOSSETT,
PO DRAWER 911,

SAN ANGELO, TEXAS 
76902-0911

THE STATE OF TEXAS 
NOTICE TO 

RESPONDENT:
“You have been sued. 
You may employ an 
attorney. If you or your 
attorney do not file a 
written answer with the 
clerk who issued this 
citation by 10:00 am on 
the Monday next following 
the expiration of forty two 
days after you were served 
this citation and petition, 
a default judgment may be 
taken against you.”
To: BILL EASLEY, ET AL 
Defendants, Greeting:
You are hereby commanded 
to appear by filing a written 
answer to the Planfiffs 
petition at or before 10:00 
o’clock am of the first 
Monday after the expiration 
of 42 days from the date of 
issuance of this citation, the 
same being Monday the 1st 
day of August, 2008 at or 
before 10 o’clock am, before 
the 51st District Court of 
Coke County, at the 
Courthouse in Robert Lee, 
Texas.
Said PlaintifUs Petition was 
filed on June 16, 2008 in this 
case, numbered 08-4262 on 
the docket of said court, and 
styled: Sue Diane Luckett vs 
Bill Easley, Et Al.
The names of the parties to 
the cause are as follows: Sue 
Diane Luckett is Plaintiff 
and Bill Easley, Et Al are 
Defendants.
A brief statement of the 
nature of the suit is as 
follows, to-wit; All of Lots 
11 and 12, Block 49, 
Original Town of Bronte as 
is more fully shown by 
Plaintiff’s Petition on file in 
this suit.
If this citation is not served 
within ninety days after the 
date of its issuance, it shall 
be returned unserved. The 
office executing this writ 
shall promptly serve the 
same according to 
requirements of law, and the 
mandates thereof, and make 
due return as the law directs. 
Issued and given under my 
hand and the Seal of said 
Court, at office in Robert 
Lee, Texas, on June 16, 
2008.

ATTEST: Mary Grim, 
District Clerk 

Coke County, Texas 
48-4tc

PUBLIC NOTIFICATION 
OF NONDISCRIMINATION 

IN CAREER AND 
TECHNOLOGY 

EDUCATION PROGRAMS 
1. Bronte ISD offers career 
and technology education 
programs in Agriculture and

Business. Admission to these 
programs is open to any and 
all students enrolled in 
Bronte High School.
2. It is the policy of Bronte 
ISD not to discriminate on 
the basis of race, color, 
national origin, sex, or 
handicap in its vocational 
programs, services, or 
activities as required by Title 
VI of the Civil Rights Act of 
1964, as amended; Title IX 
o f the Educ a t i o n  
Amendments of 1972; and 
Sect ion 504 of the 
Rehabilitation Act of 1973, 
as amended.
3. It is the policy of Bronte 
ISD not to discriminate on 
the basis of race, colour, 
nat ional  origin,  sex, 
handicap, or age in its 
employment practices as 
required by Title VI of the 
Civil Rights Act of 1964, as 
amended; Title IX of the 
Education Amendments of 
1972; the Age Discrimination 
Act of 1975, as amended; and 
Sect ion 504 of the 
Rehabilitation Act of 1973, 
as amended.
4. Bronte ISD will take 
steps to assure that lack of 
English language skills will 
not be a barrier to admission 
and participation in all 
educational and vocational 
programs.
5. For inforrnation about 
r ight s  or gr i evance 
procedures, contact the Title 
IX Coordinator, Alan Richey, 
Superintendent, at Box 670, 
Bronte, Texas, 325-473- 
2511, and/or the Section 504 
Coordi nat or ,  Michael  
Bohensky at Box 670, 
Bronte, Texas, 325-473- 
2521.
NOTICERO PUBLICO DE 

NO DISCRIMINACION
1. Bronte ISD ofrece 
programs vocacionales an 
Agriculture and Business. La 
admisión a estos programs se 
basa esta abier para todos 
estudiantes en Bronte High 
School.
2. Es norma de Bronte ISD 
no discriminar-’por motivos 
de raza, color, origen 
n a t i o n a l ,  s exo o 
impedimento,  en sus 
programas, servicios o 
activados vocacionales tal
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Week Ending
Cash Markets I 07/05/2008 06/28/2008 07/07/2007
Feeder Steers ($/cwt) 111.69 110.67 111.22
Finished Cattle ($/cwt) 101.97 99.03 89.97

Slaughter Lambs ($/cwt) * 87.00 88.50
Slaughter Goats ($/ewt) * 107.50 109.25

Cotton ( m 63.75 66.75 56.00
Wheat ($/bu) 8.32 8.54 5.44
Com ($/bu) 7.46 7.57 3.71
Grain Sorghum ($/bu) 12.33 12.62 5.65

Watermelons ($/lb) 0.17 0.17 0.12

Futures Markets
Feeder Steers ($/cwt) 111.58 111.73 114.70
Finished Cattle ($/cwt) 103.80 105.10 92.50

Cotton (fé/ìh) 68.02 73.41 60.00
Wheat ($/bu) 9.05 9.25 6.11
Com ($/bu) 7.46 7.55 3.35

Lumber (SdOOObdi) 248.50 243.00 288.50

como lo requieren el Titulo 
VI de la Ley de Deprechos 
Civiles de 1964, sequn 
enmienda; el Titulo IX de las 
Enmiendas en la Educación, 
de 1972, y la Sección 504 de 
la Ley de Rehabilitación de 
1973, según enmienda.
3. Es norma de Bronte ISD 
no discriminar por motivos 
de raza, color, origen 
nacional, sexo, impedimento 
o edad,  en sus 
procedimientos de empleo, 
tal como lo requieren el 
Titulo VI de la Ley de 
Derechos Civiles de 1964, 
sequin enmienda; el Titulo 
IX de las Enmiendas en la 
Educación, de 1972, la ley de 
Discriminación por Edad, de 
1975, según enmienda, y la 
Section 504 de la Ley de 
Rehabilitación de 1973, 
según enmienda.
4. Bronte ISD tomara las 
medidas necesarias para 
asequrar que la falta de 
habilidad en el uso de la 
lengua ingles no sea un 
obstacula para la admission y 
particapacion en todos los 
programas educativos y 
vocacionales.
5. Para información sobre sus 
derechos o procedimientos

para quejas, comuniqúese con 
el Coordinador del Titulo IX, 
Alan Richey, en PO Box 670, 
Bronte, Texas 76933, 325- 
473-2511, y/o el Coordinador

de la Sección 504, Michael 
Bohensky en PO Box 670, 
Bronte, Texas, 76933, 325-473- 
2521.

51-ltc

OVERSTOCKED
Best SALE of the YEAR!
0% FIMlANCING OR CHOOSE $500 CASH BACK 
or PAYMENTS AS LOW AS

fo r  A8 W ths.

-»narTerm .

M46'“
Qo/ APRTOrw«"",97o -TgfjT» ^

T1510 Compact Tractor

620 N. Bell
San Angelo, TX

(325) 653-2121 • 800-496-0271

£an JLngelh
TRACTOR & EQUIPMENT
‘Easy to <Do (Business 'WitHi

FInaneIng provIdMl by
IBtOMe i UA3«K ■ OIBXTCMOS I WSmUNCE

*0llB r s u t^  to CNH Capital America U.C erad* approval. See your New Holland dealer for dotais and eligibiity 
teriuiremenis. Down payment may be tequaed. O llar good Ihrough July 31,2008. at p a rtic ip é  New Holland dealers ! 
n  the Unied States. Oner subfect to change. Taxes, ffeight setHg). delivery, additional options or attachments not 
nduded n  pnce. 62008 CNH America LLC. A l rights reserved. New H olaid and CNH CaplU m  registered 
bademartrs o( CNH America U.C.

www.sanangelotractor.com

ADMoiH>f

IfEfMO
#7091

#5105

2008 Ford Escape XLT
Red Fire •  Camel Cloth •  V-6 • 17K Miles!
2007 Ford Expedition XLT
Red Fire •  Stone Cloth •  24K Miles!
2007 Ford F-150 SuperCrew XLT 5̂102
Red Fire •  Tan Cloth •  24K Miles •  Really Sharp!
2007 Ford Explorer XLT #5093
Pearl Blue • 3rd Row Seat
2007 Mercury Grand Marquis LS 5̂103
Vibrant White •  Tan Leather •  24K Miles!
2007 Toyota Highlander #6068A

Salsa Red Pearl •  Graphite Interior •  Great Gas Saver!
2007 Ford Taurus SEL #5104
Spruce Green •  Leather • Moon roof
2007 Ford Taurus SE #7087
Silver •  Floor Shift •  Power Seat
2006 Ford Expedition XLT #h248a
Pueblo Gold •  Tan Leather •  DVD •  Power Fold 3rd Row Seat
2006 Ford F-250 SuperCab XLT »« îa $ 17,995
White •  Powerstroke • Auto •  Grill Guard •  Headache Rack
2006 Ford F-150 SuperCab STX «107 $15,995

Black •  Gray Cloth
2005 Ford Explorer XLT 4x4 #4986A $14,495

Silver • 3rd Row Seat •  Rear Air

$18,995

$21,995

$20,995

$19,995

$16,995

$16,995

$14,995

$11,995

$20,995

PAM.MC.
#6005A $15,995 

V7074A $12,995

2004 CMC Yukon XL SLT
Dark Gray •  Charcoal Leather • DVD •  VCP
2004 Ford F-150 SuperCab XLT
Toreador Red * V-8 •  Automatic
2004 Ford F-150 STX »hmoa $11,995
White • Gray Cloth • V-6 Auto * Only 35K Miles! • Sporty Ride!
2003 Ford Excursion Limited #H221A $20,995
Hunter Green •  Tan Leather • Powerstroke •  Wow!
2003 Mercury Grand Marquis LS $ 9,895
Satin Silver •  Graphite leather Interior •  Only 44K Miles!

You ’ll like the way 
we do business!

453-4561
Rand]/ Flanagan • Marsha Wink 

Billy Wayne Roe
Ask For:

http://www.sanangelotractor.com
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A  garage sale is the perfect place 
to get rid o f all your unwanted stnff!

M ake sure yours is a success by placing  
a Garage Sale ad in the Classifieds!

B SE R V E R /
NTERPRISE

Serving Coke County 
P.O. Box 1329 Robert Lee, TX 76945 
(325) 453-2433 • FAX (325) 453-4643

CokeCoObserver@aol.com

per week
Unlimited

Cellphone Rate Plan
* *Plus tax and fees. Certain restrictions apply.

What can you get these days for under 10 bucks? You might be able to buy a couple 

gallons of gas, lunch, or maybe see a movie. At Right Wireless you can talk all you want 

for an entire week for only $9.95*. That's right, you get unlimited minutes, an expanded 

coverage area, more convenient locations and the option of paying weekly for one low price.

Unlimited Minutes • No Contract • No Credit Check • No De
Contact Our Area Agents:
San Angelo Menard Brady
Right Wireless • 3371 Knickerbocker Rd. B&N Artwear • 606 Ellis
Right Wireless‘ Sunset Mall 
Right Wireless'2609 N. Bryant Eden Mason
Food Basket • 2 South Main Street Lubke Chevrolet'302 W. Broadway MasonGas' 1004 San Antonio Hwy.

San Saba
West Central Wireless '20 I9S . Bridge Central Texas Communications • 208 East Brown

Robert Lee
Rock Solid Communications • 803 Austin

Big Lake
N a p o A u to f> a m S to re 'l2 0 0 2 i)d S tre e { LecyX  

Mertzon
Modem theS ha^>3dSS ,8m odw t^

mailto:CokeCoObserver@aol.com

