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YOUNG MISS ALEXIS HOLBERT (LEFT), and Junior Miss
Hannah Smith. Courtesy Photo

MISS FLOYD COUNTY WINNERS—(L-R) 1st Runner-Up Elegant Miss Britnee Brotherton, Miss Elegant Floyd County Randi- 
Jo Covington, Teen Miss Floyd County Jennifer Rainwater, 1st Runner-Up Teen Miss Ashley Ovalle. Courtesy Photo

Miss Floyd County crowned
Randi-Jo Covington named M iss Elegant Floyd County

ROXANNE ESPINOZA 
1st Runner-Up Junior Miss

M a n g o ld ’s 
Health Fair 
is Saturday

W.J. Mangold Memorial Hos­
pital will present their “Holiday 
Health Fair” this Saturday, De­
cember 4th from 9:00 a.m. until 
2:00 p.m. in the Lockney El­
ementary Cafeteria. Your admis­
sion to the Health Fair will be a 
donation of a canned good or a 
new toy to be donated to the Sal­
vation Army Christmas Cheer 
program.

There will be over 30 booths 
providing glaucoma checks, cho­
lesterol screens, blood sugar and 
blood pressure checks, body fat 
evaluations and you can consult 
with a hearing specialist. There 
will be no flu shots available this 
year.

Local and area merchants will 
provide door prizes, and a 
healthy lunch will be available.

United Blood Institute will be 
holding a blood drive and there 
will also be bone marrow testing 
at this year’s fair.

Returning to the Health Fair 
'w ill be “Project KidCare” a 
children’s identification project 
that provides a picture and cur­
rent information about your child 
in a handy vinyl pocket. This is 
part of a national effort to pro­
vide parents with personal safety 
ID’s of their children in the event 
of an emergency. KidCare is be­
ing offered as a free public ser­
vice to families in the area. If 
your child attended last year, 
bring your packet to be updated. 
If you didn’t attend last year, a 
new packet will be issued.

Don and Sybil Harrington 
Cancer Center will be at Cogdell 
Clinic on Friday, December 10th 
to hold the annual mammogra­
phy clinic. If you would like to 
make an appointment for a mam- 

. mogram, call 1-800-377-4673.
This event is designed to be 

informative and fun for the en­
tire family.

Young ladies from Floyd 
County competed in the Miss 
Floyd County Pageant Novem­
ber 13 at the Floydada High 
School.

Randi-Jo Covington, 18, won 
the title of Miss Elegant Floyd 
County and Jennifer Rainwater, 
14, was named Teen Miss Floyd 
County.

Randi-Jo is the daughter of 
Kevin Ross and Vicki 
Covington-Ross, of Floydada. 
Jennifer is the daughter of Randy 
and Sharon Rainwater, of Floy­
dada.

The new Junior M iss is 
Hannah Smith, 8, and Macee 
Brotherton, 6, is Petite Miss. 
Young Miss is Alexis Holbert, 
12.

Hannah is the daughter of

Kyle and Shelly Smith, of Floy­
dada. Macee is the daughter of 
David and Kay Brotherton of 
Floydada. Alexis is the daughter 
of Phillip and Stephanie Holbert.

The smallest queen is two 
year old Tiny Miss Hailee Jalyn 
Widener. Hailee is'the daughter 
of Brandon and Elizabeth Wid­
ener of Lockney.

Runners up are: First Runner- 
Up Elegant M iss Britnee 
Brotherton; First Runner-up Teen 
Miss Ashley Ovalle; First Run­
ner-up Junior Miss Roxanne 
Espinoza; F;rst Runner-up Petite 
Miss Kennedy Hope Coon.

Those winning in the Photo­
genic portion were: Haliee Wid­
ener, Kennedy Coon, Alexis 
Holbert, Ashley Ovalle, and

Randi-Jo Covifigton.
Also participating in the pag­

eant were: Angelica Fierros, 
Johanna Dawdy, and Brenda 
Cuellar.

Fifty percent of the girts over 
all scores was derived from the 
interview by judges. The girls 
also modeled both casual and 
party dress.

Entertainment was provided 
by the 2004 Queens and Tate 
Greer and his band.

“We want to thank all the 
people and businesses who do­
nated items for the girls,” said 
Pageant Director Martha Garza. 
“And I really want to thank alt 
the girls, who participated in the 
pageant, for the hard work and 
determination.”

John Campbell to be honored 
for years of serving public

PETITE MISS FLOYD COUNTY.MACEE BROTHERTON 
(left) and 1st Runner-up Petite Miss Kennedy Hope Coon 
(right). Courtesy Photo

Enjoy Christmas 
shopping locally

By Darwin Robinson
In 1954 John Campbell, 18 

years old at the time, may not 
have understood what was hap­
pening when Ohmar Kirk, owner 
of Kirk and Sons Hardware 
Store, gave him a job at the store. 
But the segregation barrier was 
beginning to be broken in Floyd 
County.

Layne Kirk, son of Ohmar, 
and now owner/manager of Kirk 
and Sons Hardware Store, told 
the Hesperian-Beacon, “The way 
I understand it, John was the first 
black man to be hired to meet the 
public by a white business owner 
in Floyd County. In 1954,1 think 
that was very significant. This 
was about ten years before the 
Civil Rights Act was passed into 
law in the sixties.”

Campbell, now 68, said, “I 
was first hired to clean up and do 
some janitorial work. After about 
two years, I began meeting the 
public and waiting on them as a 
clerk. Back then most people re­
ceived me real good, but some 
didn’t. Kirk and Sons are good 
people and they have been real 
easy to work for.”

Kirk and Sons Hardware 
Store is planning a Reception and 
Visit celebrating Campbell’s 50th 
Anniversary with the store, on 
Saturday, December 11, at the 
store (119 E. Missouri), 9:00 a.m 
to 12:00 noon.

Campbell married Louise 
Davis in 1969 and they cel­
ebrated their 35th anniversary 
this year. They have two children: 
Althea Green of Amarillo and 
Cornelius Campbell of Childress. 
They have five grandchildren: 
LaShauntee, Emerald, Eugene 
III, Chance and Chelsea.

Concerning those early years, 
Campbell said, “Some interest-

JOHN CAMPBELL

ing changes began to take place. 
The biggest change here (at Kirk 
and Sons Hardware) included, a 
big warehouse for furniture 
which was built next door in 
1960 (now the east side of Kirk 
and Sons). Business was really 
good back then. In 19'8, I was 
told, J.T. Kirk (Layne Kirk’s 
great grandfather) bougnt the old 
Stan Goen building on the west 
side. J.T. died in 1950.”

According to Campbell, his 
dad, L.A. Cam pbell, was a 
farmer. He worked for Bill Brock 
and Layne Decker. It was here, 
just south of Floydada, John grew 
up on the farm. He began his 
schooling at the age of seven. “In 
1947 or ‘48, we moved into town 
and my dad bought a truck. He

began hauling produce to Dallas 
and to the valley in South Texas.” 

Concerning segregation, John 
said, “I really had no bad experi­
ences here. I do remember we, 
African-Americans, had to go to 
the back doors of the cafes and 
restaurants to eat our meals.” 

“Our school. Northward High 
School on Washington'Park, was 
a one room school house. We had 
grades 1 through 10. Because it 
wasn’t large enough, later we 
were split up and some went to 
school at the Mount Zion Bap­
tist Church. My teacher was Mrs. 
A.M. Taylor.”

In those early years, Campbell 
said he worked at Arwine Drug 
Store part-time, also. In 1962, he 

Continued On Page 2

L O C K N E Y -T on igh t the 
Lockney Chamber of Commerce 
will sponsor their popular Holi­
day Affair Businesses will stay 
open late for the convenience of 
downtown shoppers and children 
will be able to visit Santa Claus 
at Lockney’s City Bank from 
6:00 p.m. to 7:30 p.m.

The Chamber will continue to 
sell tickets for a lawnmower and 
a T.V. The gifts will be given 
away at the close of Holiday Af­
fair.

The Lockney Library will 
have an Open House in conjunc­
tion with Holiday Affair and will 
have quilts on display. Cook­
books and Christmas ornaments 
will also be on sale at the Library.

FLOYDA DA--Floydada’s 
Chamber of Commerce is host­
ing “Christmas on the Square”, 
December 6th. It will include a 
Christmas Parade, caroling, spe­
cial bargains at local stores, a live 
Nativity, and Santa Claus.

The Christmas Parade will 
begin at 5:30 p.m. at the Floy­
dada Fire Department. The pa­
rade will travel around the square

and stop near the “Christmas 
Tree” on the Courthouse lawn. 
Anyone wishing to be a part of 
the parade should call the Cham­
ber of Commerce at 983-3434.

First, 2nd, and 3rd grade mem­
bers of Floydada’s First Baptist 
Church will perform a live Na­
tivity near the square’s Christmas 
tree. The youngsters will take 
their positions after arriving on 
a Christmas float during the pa­
rade. The Nativity will last ap­
proximately 45 minutes.

The Nativity will be accom­
panied by the background music 
of R.C. Andrews and Duncan El­
ementary children singing Christ­
mas carols.

Santa Claus will also be a par­
ticipant in the parade and will be 
brought to the former Hale’s De­
partment Store to visit with chil­
dren. Children can have their pic­
ture takerrwith Santa for $5.00.

Businesses who have chosen 
to be open until 7r30 p.m. will be 
marked with a large red bow. Re­
freshments will be available at 
some businesses.

Santa^s Deadlines 
A t The Hesperian-Beacon
Letters to Santa Claus, or any 

sc h o o l’s C h ristm as stories  
must be submitted to the news­
paper offices by December 6, 
to be included in the Christmas 
edition.

http://www.hesperianbeacon.com
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By The 
Way

By Alice Gilroy
email:floydada@amaonline.com

Courtroom Activities

I owe an apology to the young 
ladies (and their families) who 
competed in the Miss Floyd 
County Pageant. The pageant 
completely passed me by and I 
didn’t get any pictures.

I appreciate all the mothers.

and one particular dad, who 
worked at getting me pictures to 
put in the paper. I couldn’t put 
the paper out each week without 
lots of prayer, my staff, and all 
our readers!!!! Thank-you very 
much.

Kirk^s honors Campbell
Continued From Page 1

began attending college at 
Wayland Baptist College in 
Plainview. “I never graduated, 
because I dropped out in 1967 so 
I could save up enough money 
to get married in 1968,” said 
Campbell.

The C am pbell’s children

graduated from Floydada High 
School. Their daughter, Althea, 
graduated from West Texas State 
University at Canyon. Their son, 
Cornelius, attended the Police 
Academy in Levelland, West 
Tejías State University in Canyon 
and a police technical training 
school south of Houston. He now 
is a security officer in Childress.

City of Floydada to raise 
reconnect fees this month

Beginning this month the City 
of Floydada will now charge a 
$15 reconnect fee for electricity 
and a $15 reconnect fee for wa­
ter for any accounts that are not 
paid on time.

The original fee was only $15 
for either electricity or water or 
for both together.

After hours reconnect fees 
will also be divided. There will

be a $35 fee to reconnect water, 
and a $35 reconnect for electric­
ity after hours.

Also beginning this month, 
Floydada City Hall will be open 
through the months of December, 
January, February, and March, 
Monday through Thursday, 7:00 
a.m. to 6:00 p.m. and 7:00 a.m. 
to 5:00 p.m. on Fridays.

American Cancer Society hosts 
annual Christmas Brunch

By Martha Farris
The American Cancer Soci­

ety, Floyd County Unit, is once 
again heralding the Christmas 
Season by sponsoring the annual 
Christmas Brunch. This event, 
looked forward to and always 
well attended by community resi­
dents and out of town guests, will 
be held this year in the new home 
of Kyle, and Shelly Smith at 909 
W.Ce6 Street.

“This colorful holiday event 
is given in the spirit of sharing 
time with friends while reaching 
out to help others through a very 
worthy cause,” said Linda 
Matsler, coordinator of the event.

On Saturday, December 11,

from 9:30 until 11:00 a.m., the 
board members of the local unit 
will provide an abundance of 
tempting, homemade holiday 
foods including breakfast casse­
roles, sausage balls, veggie tray 
and dip, a variety of muffins and 
holiday breads, cheese ball and 
crackers, fruits, cookies and can­
dies, along with coffee, almond 
tea, and jttiges*. , ,  "

Tickets for the hrunch are 
available at First National Bank 
of Floydada, Fred Thayer’s CPA 
office, and from any board mem­
ber for a $10.00 donation to the 
ACS. Tickets will also be avail­
able at the door.

Live
Christmas Trees

From Oregon

7ft. - $69.99 
8ft. - $79.99

These Trees are beautiful

A
Hardware 

, Floydada 
“ 983-3000

The
Lockney Library 
will be holding a
Holiday Affair
OPEN HOUSE 

&
QUILT SHOW

Thursday, Dec. 2 
6:00 p.m. - ?

W^e wiUIiave
Cookbooks & Christmas 

Ornaments for sale

In District Court, November 
28, 2004, Victor Mata, 17, of 
Lockney pled guilty to Tamper­
ing With Physical Evidence (try­
ing to swallow marijuana), which 
occurred on August 27,2004. He 
was sentenced to 3 years in TDC 
which was probated for 3 years, 
and a $250 fine.

In County Court, November 
23, 2004:

Eugene Cullar, pled guilty to 
DWI-2nd from March 12, 2004. 
He was fined $750, court costs, 
and sentenced to 9 months in jail 
which was probated for 5 years;

A February 8, 2000 charge of 
Theft by Check of more than $20 
but less than $500 against James 
Gonzales was dismissed on No­
vember 23, 2004.

Ronald L. Thomas, 43, of 
Floydada, was charged with 
Evading Arrest;

Jorge Sanches II, 17, of Floy­
dada, was charged with Deadly 
Conduct;

Marjorie Spencer Williams, 
46, of Floydada, was charged 
with Interference of Public Du­
ties.

In J.P. Court, 41 traffic related 
citations were filed and 8 com­
mercial citations were filed. An 
open container citation was is­
sued against Kenneth Ford, 54 
and one forcible detainer by Bank 
of America against Jessie P. 
Cabello was filed.

Tax suits were filed in District 
Court, November 22, 2004 
against:

Archer, Wilmer Gene Jr. and 
Debra, of Lockney; Ismael and 
Ernestino Arevalo, of Floydada; 
Johnny Arjona, of Lockney ; Eva 
Bernal, of Lockney; Xavier and 
Sanjuana Cardenas, of New 
Braunfels; Robert and Gloria 
Cavazos, of Floydada; Jerry and 
Veronica Chapa, of Floydada; 
David L. Cook, of Floydada; 
Ramiro and Irma Coss Jr., of 
Floydada;

Israel and Idalia Cuellar, of 
Lockney; Marcos Delafuente, of 
Floydada; M ateo and Jessie 
Delgado, of Floydada; Rebecca 
Soliz and Ramos Rosa Diaz, of 
Floydada; Antonia Felan, of 
Lockney;

Plutarco and Mary Garcia, of 
Floydada; Venturo and Rachael 
Gonzales Jr., of Floydada; Juan 
Em elia Gonzalez and Rosa 
Torres, of Floydada; Tony Lee 
Gross, of S. Padre Island; Lisa 
Guerra, of Floydada, Kenny B. 
Hooten et ux., of Lockney; Mark 
and Ruby Hooton, of Dickens;

Ronald Neal and Vicky 
Huffman of Lockney; Joshua 
Paul Lambert, of Lockney; An­
drew V. Lloyd, of Floydada; 
M iguel Lopez and Robert 
Cavazos, of Floydada; Louis and 
Yolanda Luna and Manuel 
Rendon, of Lockney;

Virginia Lyon, of Lockney; 
Brent Martin, dba Lockney Farm 
Chemical, of Lockney; Cruz and 
Maria Martinez, of Lockney; 
M aria Teres and Richard 
Martinez, of Lockney; Ricardo 
C. M artinez, of Floydada; 
Delores Mata, of Floydada; Tim 
Nelson, of Floydada; Lucia 
Nunez, of Floydada; Eloisa 
Perez, of Lockney ;

Ruben and Paula Pesina, of 
Lockney; George Ratliff Estate 
and Linda Ratliff, of Floydada; 
Isidro Sanchez, dba Sanchez 
Concrete, of Floydada;

Samual Segura, of Floydada; 
Carolyn Porter Smith, of Floy­
dada; Ricardo and Carol 
Vasquez, of Lockney; and Cruz 
Zavala, of SunRay.

Tax suits were also filed in 
Justice Court against: Robert and 
Jeanette Angeloff, of Borger; 
Holly and Eric Villarr Ascencio, 
of Lockney; Guadalupe and 
Cindy Basaldua, of Lockney; 
Ricky Basaldua, of Lamesa; 
Darlene Broseh, of Lockney; 
Terry Bryant, of F loydada; 
Jeanette Campbell, of Snyder; 
Ruben M. Chavarria, of Lock­
ney; Elsie B. Clark, of Lockney; 
Michael and Brenda Clay, of 
Lockney;

Anthony Cruz, of Floydada; 
Isabel Christina DeLeon, of Lub­
bock; Jessie and Maria Delgado, 
of Floydada; Francisco and

Viviana Eguia, of Floydada; 
Stella Gonzales, of Lockney; 
John F. Guzman and Ophelia 
Basaldua, of Lockney; Jennifer 
Jackson, of Borger;

Raynol Jimenez Jr., of Lock­
ney; Gilbert and Yolanda Luna, 
of Lockney; Billy F. Marquis, of 
Lubbock; Charles Martin Ind/dba 
Martin Vending, of Lockney; 
Andy Martinez, of Floydada; 
Oscar and Luna Martinez, Phillip 
and Gloria, of Lockney;

Santiago and M anuela 
Medellin, of Floydada; Juan H. 
and Juanita Melchor, of Floy­
dada; Domingo Nuncio, of Lock­
ney; Armando Ortiz Jr., of 
Plainview; Bertha Peralez, of 
Lockney; Daniel Peralez, of 
Lockney; Robert and Barbara 
Perez, of Floydada; Lorrie 
Reagan, of Lockney; Carlos 
Rendon, of Lockney; Saundra K. 
Rendon, of Lockney; Dianne' 
Reyes, of Plainview; Carmelita 
Rodriguez, of Floydada; Mendy 
Shurbet, of Floydada;

Mark Snell, of Floydada; 
Jesus & Maria Soliz, of Lockney; 
Ed Standlee, of Plainview; 
Bobby Sterling, of Lockney; 
Charles Sterling, of Lockney; 
Fabian Torres, of Floydada; 
Guadalupe Trevino, of Floydada; 
Tonya Westbrook, of Wichita 
Falls, Texas; F.L. Williams, of 
Floydada.

Our Children—Our Future
A Community Effort

By Raymond Lusk
■ Meeting the educational needs 
of today’s students has become 
an extremely complex and diffi­
cult process. Schools can no 
longer concentrate merely on 
providing the basic academic 
foundation necessary for life af­
ter high school. Rather, they are 
asked to deal with a myriad of 
societal issues. Many phases of 
a child’s training, which were 
once considered to be the respon­
sibility of parents, are now in­
cluded in the school curriculum.

Schools are now conducting 
classes for 3 year olds, and the 
increased demand for these 
classes' gfows eiieh »year.̂  Many^ 
times' baSic- training, that .shouldv  ̂
be occurring at home between 
child and parent is taking place 
in these early childhood classes. 
Schools are required to offer in- 
depth feeding programs, to in­
clude breakfast and lunch. Sum­
mer months are now a part of this 
requirement. Throughout the 
grade levels, pre-k -12, the scope 
of required subject offerings and 
school responsibilities has in­
creased and broadened to an al­
most unrealistic level.

A few years ago the greatest 
problems teachers faced in the 
classroom were with students 
who did not turn in homework, 
or those who might dare to talk 
out of turn or chew gum in class. 
Normally those students were 
taken to the principal’s office for 
a paddling and promptly returned . 
to class. If their parents learned 
that they were paddled at school, 
many times they received more 
of the same when they got home.

In contrast, teachers today 
face classrooms where students 
refuse to do homework or class 
work, and many parents refuse to 
require that their children attend 
to these tasks, or are unable to 
require them to do their school- 
work. Students across the nation 
are known to bring weapons to 
school, and more and more of 
these weapons are being used on 
others students or on teachers. 
Many students are openly disre­
spectful and defiant to teachers, 
to one another and to their par­
ents, Schools have been forced 
shortcomings, we must have a 
unified effort from the entire

Jessica  Jord an  earns  
H o n o r s  E n d o w e d  
$12 ,500  S ch olarsh ip

Jessica Noel Jordan, 2004 
graduate of Kempner High 
School, Sugarland, Texas gradu­
ated 13th out of a class of 621, 
Magna Cum Laude. She is at­
tending Texas Tech University 
and is a recipient of a $12,500 
Honors Endowed Scholarship.

She is a member of the Texas 
Tech Goin’ Band from Raider 
Land and plays the piccolo. She 
is the daughter of Bonni and 
Jackson Jordan of Sugarland and 
the granddaughter of Delton and 
Clydelle Jack of Lockney.

to hire mil-time security person­
nel to patrol halls and campuses. 
Gang activity and drug usage, as 
well as other societal factors, 
have spawned fighting in schools 
as a regular activity.

Teachers and principals who 
attempt to paddle or otherwise 
discipline kids for misbehavior 
face many forms of resistance, to 
include:

• Refusal of the student to ac­
cept the discipline.

• Refusal of the parent to al­
low the child to be punished.

• A trip to the courthouse be­
cause of a lawsuit resulting from 
the discipline that was adminis-

These;'and itiairy other'jirbb-'' 
lems, exist and arc real to some 
degree in almost all public 
schools today. Fortunately, they 
are less severe in the smaller 
towns and smaller schools such 
as Lockney. Even though 
Lockney Schools is not without 
its share of problems, we can be 
thankful that we do not experi­
ence those that many schools 
face. There are many reasons for 
this, to include:

• We have a caring and com­
petent teaching staff that is dedi­
cated to teaching our kids the aca­
demic skills included in their sub­
ject matter.

• Just as important, these are 
also teachers who work with each 
student as a whole person in an 
attempt to prepare them for all 
phases of life.

• Most parents care and sup­
port their children, the school and 
the teachers.

• We live in a caring commu­
nity, one with a great deal of pride 
in the activities of all Lockney 
citizens, young and old alike.

• Our churches and civic 
groups actively support our 
schools and our kids.

Those are but a few of the 
important ingredients that come 
to mind; however, in recognizing 
our strengths, we must also be 
aware of our weaknesses and 
work toward overcoming them.

In order for our school to be 
successful to the extent that we 
desire, and to overcome our

community. Teachers and other 
school personnel must be sensi­
tive to the needs of the students 
and the community and to con­
tinually search for ways to better 
fulfill these needs.

We must make sure that we 
employ only teachers who are 
competent and who truly care 
about every child and the whole 
education of every child. They 
must all be positive role models 
for their students.

All parents must show a sup­
portive attitude toward the school 
and must work with the school 
and with their children in bring­
ing about required and desired 
results. In order for teachers to 
be successful in leading students 
to meet expectations, the parents 
must also require mat those ex­
pectations be fulfilled.

If ours is a school where par­
ents and teachers work together, 
rather than against one another, 
then we will be successful with 
larger numbers of children.

We must be a school and a 
community who feels free to 
communicate with one another

rather than talk about one an­
other. “Rumors”, “gossip” and 
“jumping to conclusions” are 
perhaps the most damaging fac­
tors in threatening the overall 
success of a school or commu­
nity.

Differences of opinion and a 
certain degree of conflict will al­
ways exist when two or more 
people associate with one an­
other. How we deal with this con­
flict is important to the success 
of our school. Unity in purpose 
is an extremely important factor 
and must be accomplished if our 
students are to ever receive the 
very best.

I congratulate thi$ community 
for the good' 'that 'doe^'exist. I 
appeal to all that we continually 
recognize our weaknesses and do 
all in our power to overcome 
them. Problems that do exist can 
only be corrected when we rec­
ognize them as problems.

Our children are our greatest 
joy, our greatest asset. Let’s join 
together as school personnel, par­
ents and community in providing 
the very best for their future.

HAVE CROP INSURANCE QUESTIONS?

GOEN & GOEN
HAS THE ANSWERS

Let us prove it to you.
Visit with Kyle Smith, Pat Franklin,

& Gail Dubois

102 E. C a lifo rn ia 983-3524

www.goen-goen .com

Vc

Shaklee Products
For your Shaklee needs 

call Sue Reeves
983-2562

^  THE FLOYD COUNTYX 
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Thursday at 111 E. Missouri 
St., Floydada, TX 79235.

Periodical postage paid at 
Floydada, Texas 79235.

POSTM ASTER: Send 
change of address to: The 
Floyd County Hesperian-Bea­
con, 111 E. Missouri, Floy­
dada, TX., 79235. 

Subscriptions:
$25.00—Out of County 
$23.00—In County

. website: hesperianbeacon.com.

Breakfast With 
Santa

Date: Decem ber 4 ,2004  
Time: 9:00am  - 10:30am  
Location: Lockney Youth Center

Come and jo in  Santa Claus for break­
fast and a picture on Dec. 4th. Tickets 
are $5.00 and can be purchased from 
the First Baptist Church (Lockney) 

youth group or at the door. Proceeds 
go toward FBC youth camp 2005.
For more information contact Chad Cook 

at 652-2072

mailto:floydada@amaonline.com
http://www.goen-goen


Thursday, December 2 ,2004-The Floyd County Hesperian-Beacon-Page 3

Wetsel and Nelson exchange wedding vows

MRS. NICHOLAS “NEAL” NELSON
Nee Sammi Suzanne Wetsel

Sammi Suzanne Wetsel and 
Nicholas “Neal” Nelson were 
united in marriage on August 7, 
2004 at the First United Method­
ist Church in Hamlin, TX. Rev. 
Dolan Brinson officiated.

The bride is the daughter of 
Jan Yarborough of Hamlin and 
Barron and Becky Wetsel of Lub­
bock, and the granddaughter of 
Parker and Billie Lois Wetsel of 
Roby.

The bridegroom is the son of 
Kevin and Terry Nelson of Floy- 
dada and the grandson of W.H. 
and Loene Nelson and Hal and

Janet Pierce of Bayfield, Colo­
rado.

Escorted by her father, the 
bride wore a strapless white satin 
gown. The bodice was fashioned 
with beads and lace and had scal­
loped edging. The gown featured 
a tulle skirt with lace applique’s 
and a chapel length train. The 
bride’s bouquet was assembled at 
the altar by Billie Wetsel, grand­
mother, Margaret Calhoun, Mary 
Holloway, Sharon Brinson, and 
Janelle Rutherford fpiends of the 
bride.

Serving as maid of honor was

Bailey Wetsel of Lubbock, sis­
ter of the bride. The bridesmaids 
were Kollin Thornton of Hamlin, 
Shanna Diggs of San Angelo, 
and Kaylann Titus of Abilene all 
friends of the bride. They wore 
pink A-line tea length skirts with 
a white strapless top accented 
with pink ribbon bows tied 
around the waist. Serving as 
flower girl was Shayden Aaron 
of Hamlin, friend of the bride.

The bridegroom was attired in 
a black tuxedo with a white vest 
and white tie.

Serving as best man was 
Lonny Nelson of Lubbock, 
brother of the groom. The 
groomsmen were Casey Wetsel 
of Abilene, brother of the bride, 
John Carter of Waco, friend of 
the groom, and Russell Roof of 
Waco, friend of the groom. The 
groomsmen were attired in black 
tuxedos with black and pink 
vests and black ties. Serving as 
ring bearer was Logan Everett of 
Floydada, friend of the groom.

Ushers were Jeff Huffmyer of 
Bayfield, Colorado, cousin of the 
groom. Dusty Duke of College 
Station, friend of the groom. Sh­
annon Bailey of Lubbock, friend 
of the bride and groom, and Cory 
Kirk of Littlefield, friend of the 
groom.

Serving at the guest registry 
was Lyndie Stuart of Roby, 
Brittney Lewis of Lubbock, and 
Jazmine Roblero of Lubbock, all 
friends of the bride.

Rhonda Ward, Trevor Ward, 
Robin Bradley, Julie Moorhead, 
Olivia Cole and Stacy Freeman 
perform ed “When You Say 
Nothing At A ll” and “One 
Friend”, during the lighting of 
the unity candle.

The church was decorated 
with candles and fresh asparagus 
fern with pink and white accents. 
Following the ceremony the

bride and groom released two 
white doves in the courtyard of 
the church and were then taken 
to the reception in a horse drawn 
carriage.

A reception immediately fol­
lowing the ceremony was held at 
the Central Place. The guests en­
joyed a barbeque meal hosted by 
Barron and Becky Wetsel. Serv­
ing at the brides table were 
Lyndie Stuart of Roby, Brittney 
Lewis of Lubbock, and Jazmine 
Roblero of Lubbock, all friends 
of the bride. The cake was a four­
tiered heart shaped white cake 
with pink accents. Punch, mints, 
and nuts were also served. Serv­
ing at the grooms table were Jes­
sica Huffmyer of Bayfield, Colo­
rado, cousin of the groom and 
Salina Elliott, of Floydada, long 
time friend of the groom. The 
groom’s cake was made in the 
shape of an old leather suitcase 
with a bi-wing airplane pulling a 
just married banner. Coffee and 
chocolate dipped strawberries 
were also served.

Parents of the bridegroom, 
Kevin and Terry Nelson hosted a 
rehearsal dinner the night before 
the wedding at the Central Place 
in Hamlin. Belynda Rains of 
Roby catered the meal.

Bridal courtesies included a 
bridal shower hosted by Kay 
Rainwater of Floydada, a bridal 
tea in Hamlin, an outdoor garden 
and yard shower hosted by Jeff 
and Lori Hill of Lubbock, and a 
bridal luncheon given by Diane 
Wise.

After a wedding trip to Playa 
Del Carmen, Mexico the couple 
are making their home in Ama­
rillo where the groom is em­
ployed as a pilot for Brentco 
Aerial Patrol and the bride is a 
student at West Texas A&M Uni­
versity pursuing a degree in el­
ementary education.

By Margarette Word
Our Center was closed 

Thursday and Friday last week 
due to it being the “Thanksgiv­
ing Holidays.”

I learned many of our mem­
bers had their families home, 
many went to be with their loved 
ones, some attended weddings, 
some attended funerals and some 
just stayed home. I just wanted 
you to know our members were 
very busy over the holidays and 
this is great.

We have recently had some 
new people to eat lunch with us 
at the Center and hope they con­
tinue to come. They were Gor­
don and Darlynn Hambright, Ray 
and Kay Tinney and their son.

Danny.
Recently Nell McClung, Lori 

and Carson Batty drove to 
Burleson to visit Kelly Hays and 
children and also to see Sue and 
Alton H igginbotham s’ new 
home.

Last Saturday, Nell received 
word that granddaughter Marcie 
and Randy Giesbrecht’s baby boy 
was born November 27, weigh­
ing nine pounds six ounces. They 
have two older boys.

J.W. and Dolores Cannon’s 
grandson Jeff and his wife 
Rebecca Cannon gave birth to a 
two pound one ounce, thirteen 
inch long baby girl named Kayley 
Alyssa, bom November 20. Jeff’s 
parents are Douglas and Rebecca

Cannon of San Antonio. The 
baby is doing well.

Bill Ferguson, a couple weeks 
ago, flew to Houston to visit a 
sister-in-law, Leatha Atkisson.I ' ' i
She spent about a week with her.

Congratulations to Bill and 
Roberta Hardin and Norman and 
Edith Muncy who celebrated 
their 50th Wedding Anniversary 
Sunday, November 28. It was a 
double Wedding in 1944.

Thank you for remembering 
the Center when you need to 
make a memorial donation.

In memory of Lindsay Lovell 
-Joy Guest, Q.D. and Joyce Wil­
liams, Ray and Kay Tinney,

L ockney Senior C itizen N ew s
By Vera Jo By bee
Johnnie Mac and Denny 

Quisenberry spent Thanksgiving 
with their daughter Donna and 
Danny Francis and their family 
near Silverton.

Guest with Molly and Charles 
Huffman for Thanksgiving 
weekend was their daughter 
Christine and husband Mark 
from Abilene.

Dorothy Stapp had all three of 
her sons, Roger, Randall, and 
Lyndall and their families for 
Thanksgiving.

Wanda and Lynn Ray (blue 
eyes) Smith had their children, 
Sandy, Becky and Gary and their 
families for the holiday. Also her 
brother Bill Johnson.

Gene Newton spent the most 
of her time at the nursing home 
with husband Arvie. However 
her grand daughter Tory brought 
Gene over a plate of turkey and 
dressing and the trimmings that 
her Mom M issy M ennick 
cooked.

Geneva and Sol Barclay had 
her daughters Wilma, Jessie and 
Bobbie and their families with 
them. There were 26 guest in all.

Annabelle said she had a nice 
day just a sitting and rocking. I 
bet she was reading too.

Gleynn Earle and Sterling 
Cummings had brunch Thursday 
with their daughter Dee Earle 
Sanders and husband in Floy­
dada. Also attending were her 
other children Paula and Zach 
and their families. Their other 
sons Kim and John did not get to 
attend.

Elna and Gene Bloys of San­
dhill had their two sons David 
and Kenneth and their families 
out for dinner Saturday.

Inez and Boyce (Pete) Mosley 
and daughter Elaine spent

Thanksgiving with their son Rick 
and Lisa Mosley and family in 
Lockney. Other guest was Lisa's 
Mother Jackie Gregory of Floy­
dada.

Guest of Linda and Jerry 
Edwards Thanksgiving was his 
Mother Wilma Edwards and Den­
nis and Mary Carter.

Donnie and I had Thanksgiv­
ing dinner with our daughter 
Becky McPherson and her fam­

ily. Other guest were Steve's par­
ents Gay and Gale McPherson. 
His sister Darlee and family. 
Louie and Cynthia Bybee and 
sons enjoyed Thanksgiving with 
Cynthia's brother and wife Mar­
tin and Robin Stoerner and boys.

Masonic graveside services 
were held Wed 24th for Gerald 
Rascoe husband of Peggy Livisay 
former Lockney residents at the 
Lockney cemetery.

floyd Coui)ty 
Lifestyles

CASEY BROWN AND LA’SHAE ISOM

Brown and Isom
Mr. and Mrs. Jeff Isom of Abernathy announce the engagement of 

their daughter, La’Shae of Bastrop to Casey Brown, also of Bastrop, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Sam Brown of Dale. The couple plan to marry 
January 15, 2005. at Aldersgate United Methodist Church in Lub­
bock.

The bride-elect is currently a pre-nursing student at Austin Com­
munity College. She is the granddaughter of Kenneth and Bonnie 
Edwards and M.T. and Willetta Isom, all of Lockney.

The future bridegroom is presently co-operator of Browns’ Water 
Well Service out of Dale. He is the grandson of Reba Jean Brown and 
the late Donald Brown of Dilley and James and Francis Parker and 
the late Dorothy Parker of Marble Falls.

Join us at Schacht Flowers/or
Holiday Affair

Thursday, 8:30 a.m. - 9:00 p.m.

Schacht FLOWERS, JEWELRY & GIFTS
H2W. Poplar, Locknev 8:30-5:30, Mon.-Sat., 652-2385 

J-800-566-5754

Doyle and Dorothy Turner. 
Menu

December 6 - December 10

Monday-BBQ Brisket, blackeye 
peas, brussel sprouts, cornbread, 
cherry cobbler
Tuesday-Meatloaf with creole 
sauce, corn, turnip greens, 
cornbread or hush puppies, pine­
apple gelatin
W ednesday-Cube steak with 
gravy, cabbage, corn, pickles, 
cornbread, pumpkin crunch 
Thursday-Turkey pot pie, tossed 
salad/Ranch, cornbread or roll, 
purple plums, cookies 
F rid ay -B eef Stroganoff, 
noodles, broccoli, wheat roll, 
strawberry shortcake

20% OFF
all gift items all day Thursday, Dec. 2, 

For Holiday Affair
CLARK PHARMACY

Danny Clark
309 North Main, Lockney- Pharmacy - 652-3353 

Residence - 652-3712 (24 hour call)
Free in town prescription delivery

Tommy Assiter of Floydada 
brought the impressive Masonic 
message.

Gerald a resident of Clarendon 
passed away in an Amarillo hos­
pital Monday 22.

Our thoughts and prayers are 
with you Peggy and your family.

Menu for Dec 6-10
Monday: Pork Chops 
Tuesday: Salmon Patties 
Wed: Chicken Fried Steak 
Thurs: Hamburger Steak 
Fri: Fried Chicken Strips

o o o o  
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Catfiv's FCoraC
Q i f t s

Come join us for 
Christmas on the Square

Monday, Dec. 6th
Open late for your shopping convenience.

20%  OFF
ON ALL MERCHANDISE

including:
Christm as Arrangem ents, 

Decorating Needs &
Gift Items

128 W. California - Floydada 
983-5013

Sue's Gifts 
Open Saturdays

9 a.m. - 2:00 p.m. 
til Christm as 

M onday - Friday 9 a.m. - 5:30 p.m.
Be sure and come by to check out all the

20% - 50% SALE Items
store  W id e ................20% OFF
Christm as Cards 50% OFF
Precious M oments....20%  OFF  
M any other item s.....50% OFF

Sue's Gifts & Accessories
100 East California, Floydada 983-5312

0 ^ 0  q O 0 , 0  O q
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It's a  Holiday Affair at Heart's Desire this Thursday Dec. 2. We
will be open until 9:00 p.m. Remember to register for Door Prizes.

%

In  conjim eU on w ilk  H o liJ a y  A f fa ir  Y o a '«  In v ite  J  to  a  

T n in L  S to w in g  3:30 p .m . to  6:00 p .m . o f K o e l fe w e lry , 

Jesign eJ &  crea teJ  t y  K o r i K e llis o n  CTOen a n  J l i z H  a rris .

On Sunday December 5th from 1:00 p.m. - 5:00 p.m. we will be 
having a SPecial Qpen House. We have whatever your Heart 

Desires, whether it is Splatterware, Brighton or Emily Ray Jew­
elry, Western Decor, including Tin Stars or our new Clothing!

Door Prizes

Heart's Desire
120 S. Main, Lockney 652-2548 

M-F 10 a.m. - 6 p.m. Sat. 10 a.m. - 4 p.m.
www.heartsdesireonline.com

O O OU^OO
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http://www.heartsdesireonline.com
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Lockney Longhorns named to 2004 All District
Ford a n d  Schum acher nam ed "Most Valuable Players"

MARK FOl

Lockney - Senior 
2004 - 6AA

ALL-DISTRICT OFFENSE 
*MOST VALUABLE 

PLAYER
ALL-DISTRICT DEFENSE 

FIRST TEAM 
Back

RANCE SCHUMACHER

Lockney - Senior 
2004 - 6AA

ALL-DISTRICT DEFENSE 
*MOST VALUABLE 

PLAYER
ALL-DISTRICT OFFENSE 

FIRST TEAM 
End

GRADEN LONG

Lockney - Junior 
2004 - 6AA 

ALL-DISTRICT 
FIRST TEAM OFFENSE 

Tackle
SECOND TEAM DEFENSE 

Line

LANCE TERRELL

Lockney - Junior 
2004 - 6AA 

ALL-DISTRICT 
FIRST TEAM DEFENSE 

Linebacker
HONORABLE MENTION 

OFFENSE 
Full Back

VICTOR MARTINEZ

Lockney - Senior 
2004 - 6AA

ALL-DISTRICT DEFENSE 
FIRST TEAM 

Line

DAHLEN MCCARTER

Lockney - Junior 
2004 - 6AA

ALL-DISTRICT OFFENSE 
FIRST TEAM 

Kicker

Photos courtesy of Hall Photography

JEREMY PYLE

Lockney - Senior 
2004 - 6AA

ALL-DISTRICT OFFENSE 
FIRST TEAM 

Center

MONTE LASS

Lockney - Senior 
2004 - 6AA

ALL-DISTRICT OFFENSE 
SECOND TEAM 

Running Back 
ALL-DISTRICT DEFENSE 

SECOND TEAM 
Back

HAGAN JOHNSON

Lockney - Senior 
2004 - 6AA

ALL-DISTRICT OFFENSE 
SECOND TEAM 

Full Back
ALL-DISTRICT DEFENSE 

SECOND TEAM 
Linebacker

TREY GRAVES

Lockney - Senior 
2004 - 6AA

ALL-DISTRICT OFFENSE 
HONORABLE MENTION 

End
ALL-DISTRICT DEFENCE 
HONORABLE MENTION 

End

TREVOR MORRIS

Lockney - Junior 
2004 - 6AA

ALL-DISTRICT DEFENSE 
HONORABLE MENTION 

Tackle
ALL-DISTRICT DEFENSE 
HONORABLE MENTION 

Line

MATT REAY

Lockney - Senior 
2004 - 6AA

ALL-DISTRICT DEFENSE 
HONORABLE MENTION 

Back

LOCKNEY LITTLE LONGHORNS—(back row, 1 to r) Ruben Ascencio, Nazario Briggs, Chris­
topher Franko, Lacie Nuncio, Dolores Luna (middle, 1 to r) Maria Palomen, Jose Hernandez, Alex 
Reay, John Salas, Alyssa Tejeda (front, 1 to r) Susie Salas, Hanah Kidd, Tanisha Peralez, Andres 
Garcia, Tavian Walwrath. Staff Photo

A subscription brings the paper to 
your doorstep every week!

$23.00—In County $25.00-0ut of County (Cheaper Than Buyiiig Off the Newsstand)

JASON MONDRAGON

Lockney - Junior 
2004 - 6AA

ALL-DISTRICT OFFENSE 
SECOND TEAM 

Guard
ALL-DISTRICT DEFENCE 
HONORABLE MENTION 

Linebacker

CAGAN CUMMINGS

Lockney - Senior 
2004 - 6AA

ALL-DISTRICT DEFENSE 
SECOND TEAM 

Back
ALL-DISTRICT OFFENSE 
HONORABLE MENTION 

Quarterback

J.W. MACPHERSON

Lockney - Junior 
2004 - 6AA

ALL-biSTRICT OFFENSE 
SECOND TEAM 

End

C o n g r a t u la t io n s i

SPORTS
t

Lockney High School Honor Roll

The “A” honor roll for Lock­
ney High School, second six- 
weeks follows.

Twelfth grade: Addie Foster, 
Alissa Poindexter, Clara Reecer 
and Ranee Schumacher

Eleventh grade: Amber 
Dorman, Trinity Ford, James 
McPherson, Emily Mercado, 
Tana Saul, Tori Terrell and 
Rebekah

Tenth grade: Erin Mangold, 
Matthew Prather, Krista Rasco 
and Kayla Thomas

Ninth grade: Leah Ford and 
Ashley McCulloch

The “AB” honor roll for

Lockney High School, second 
six-weeks follows.

Twelfth grade: Ashley 
Brock, Lindsay Collins, Cagan 
Cummings, Mark Ford, Trey 
Graves, Davis Hooten, Karah 
Hrbacek, Monte Lass, Jaime 
Ledesma, Sarah Martinez, Jana 
M iller, Zane M ontandon, 
Martina Nolan, Shelly Pachiano, 
Cristina Pesina, Jeremy Pyle and 
Joshua Raissez

Eleventh grade: Philip 
Gotham, Rina Gonzales, Alexis 
Hall, Blaine Hall, Brandon Hall, 
Nathan Hancock, Frankie Hays, 
Criselda Jimenez, Kami Keaton,

Graden Long, April Lopez, 
Dahlen M cCarter, Wendy 
Moralez, Trevor Morris, Kory 
Smith, Lance Terrell, Brance 
Wilson and Ty Young

Tenth grade: Rion Aufill, 
Tyson Carthel, Weston Davis, 
Bethany Dietrich, Tyler Kidd, 
Joanie Reecer, David Rosales; 
Coby Tannahill and Codi Wiley 

Ninth grade: Jamie Butler, 
Dru Carthel, Bryan Cooper, 
Desiree DeLeon, Elizabeth Fos­
ter, Laura Fulton, Courtlyn Long, 
Paul Lopez, Zachary Montandon, 
Tanner M orris and Trasa 
Poindexter

December 6 - December 10 
Monday

Breakfast-French toast or cereal, 
toast, juice, milk 
Lunch-Pig in a blanket or PBJ 
sandwich, corn, tossed salad, 
pineapple, milk

Tuesday
Breakfast-Mini corndogs or ce­
real, toast, juice, milk 
Lunch-Steak fingers or ham, 
mashed potatoes, green beans, 
peaches, hot rolls, milk 

Wednesday
Breakfast-Oatmeal or cereal, 
toast, juice, milk 
Lunch-Fish sticks or ham and 
cheese, pinto beans, cole slaw, 
pears, cornbread, milk 

Thursday
Breakfast-Scrambled eggs or 
cereal, toast, juice, milk 
Lunch-C orndog or grilled 
cheese, vegetable soup, 
applesauce, milk

Friday
Breakfast-Cinnamon roll or ce­
real, toast, juice, milk 
Lunch-Hamburger or PBJ, let­
tuce and tomato, baked fries, 
mixed fruit, milk

Don’t do drugs, or drugs will do you I
© 2004 City Bank Texas. All rights reserved. sdsttaii2204

WE INVITE YOU TO JOIN US

Friday, December 3rd
FOR OUR ANNUAL

Christmas Open House.

W e h o pe  to s e e  you  for r e f r e sh m e n t s

AND GOOD CONVERSATION.

Member FDIC TEXAS
201 N. Main Lockney TX



Longhorns beat Petersburg 
60-34 in first basketball game

By Bubba Edwards
After only a days practice, the 

Lockney Longhorns hit the 
hardcourt as if they had already 
played a dozen of games. The 
Longhorns pummeled the Peters­
burg Buffaloes 60-34.

A strong second quarter per­
formance which the Longhorns 
outscored the Buffaloes 20-6 
helped put the game out of reach. 
Lockney came out strong in the 
third quarter as well winning it 
15-8.

"I was very pleased with our 
basketball skills and defense for 
the first time out," Head coach 
Bubba Edwards said, "i was es­

pecially pleased with our effort."
Taylor Becker lead the Long­

horns with 19 points followed by 
Ranee Schum,acher with 15 
points and 10 rebounds. Cagan 
Cummings and Jeremy Pyle with 
six points and Mark Ford with 
five points. Trevor Morris added 
three points while Brance Wil­
son, Dahlen McCarter and Reid 
Carthel chipped in two points.

Lockney will participate in the 
Nazareth Tournament over the 
weekend. Their first home game 
will be the following Tuesday 
versus the Lubbock Cooper Pi­
rates.

Longhorns JV Boys 
Basketball Report

By Bubba Edwards
The Lockney Longhorn jun­

ior varsity basketball squad 
earned their victory of the early 
season by defeating the Peters­
burg Buffaloes 48-27.

The Longhorn defense al­
lowed only seven first half 
points, and in return the offense 
built up a 20 plus lead to take 
complete control of the game. 
Just about the entire roster put the 
ball in the hoop including lead­
ing scorer J.W. McPherson with

10 points. Alston Becker, Rion 
Xufill, Landon Cotham, Tyler 
Kidd and Cole Patton added six 
points. Zacary Gonzales chipped 
in three points followed by Nolan 
Armstrong with two points. Tan­
ner Morris added one point to the 
Longhorn victory.

The junior varsity squad will 
continue action next Tuesday 
against Lubbock Cooper. The 
will be in the Longhorn Gym 
starting at 6:15 p.m.

Sbortborns 8tb Grade 
Boys Basketball Report

By Bubba Edwards
The Lockney eight grade bas­

ketball squad split their last two 
district games by beating Olton 
and falling to Floydada.

Lockney outscored the Mus­
tangs of Olton 17-6 after the first 
half of play, and finished strong 
at the end by outscoring them 8- 
0 in the final quarter winning by 
the score of 31-13. Adrian Cortez 
lead the team with 12 points fol­
lowed by Brett Johnson with 11 
points. Kyler Ellison, Lucas Hall 
and Ruben Pesina added two

points while Joe franco and Caleb 
Schumacher chipped in a point.

Lockney started off slow in 
the first half of the Floydada 
game falling behind 12-4. Floy­
dada also won the second half 
with a 13-12 score making the 
final score 25-16. Cortez lead the 
'Horns with eight points followed 
by Daryn McCarter with four 
points. James Mercado and Brett 
Johnson added two points.

Lockney will host the 
Dimmitt Bobcats on Monday 
starting at 6:30 p.m.

Sbortborns 7tb Grade 
Boys Basketball Report

By Bubba Edwards
The seventh grade hoopsters 

have failed to add a notch to the 
win column in their last two out­
ings. The 'Horns lost to Olton 
Monday night 41 -13 and to Floy­
dada last week 27-25.

Olton jumped out to a 15-4 
lead in the first quarter and never 
looked back. Matt Rendon lead 
the team scoring seven points. 
Konner Ellison added four points 
while Angel Cortez chipped in 
two points.

Lockney lost a heart breaker 
to the Breezers last week. After 
leading 17-5 at the half, Floydada

put up 14 points in the third quar­
ter alone and holding Lockney to 
only five points. Floydada made 
the go ahead basket with seven 
seconds remaining and held off 
Lockney for the victory. Angel 
Cortez lead the team scoring 
eight points while Loius Perales, 
Konner Ellison and Hugo 
M artinez added four points. 
Billy Lee chipped in three points 
followed by Matt Rendon with 
two points.

Lockney will continue district 
play at home against Dimmitt 
next Monday starting at 5:00 p.m.

IHMIICH THE MUS
Dietrich inducted into Honor Society

Jalee Dietrich, daughter of 
Michael and Jo Beth Dietrich of 
Lockney, was inducted into Al­
pha Theta Mu Chapter of Phi 
Theta Kappa at Western Okla­
homa State College. She is serv­
ing as Treasurer, and is on the 
Dean’s List with a G.P.A. of 3.91.

Established by Missouri two- 
year college presidents in 1918, 
Phi Theta Kappa International 
Honor Society serves to recog­
nize and encourage the academic 
achievement of two-year college 
students and provide opportuni­

ties for individual growth and 
development through honors, 
leadership and service program­
ming. Today, Phi Theta Kappa is 
the largest honor society in 
American higher education with 
more than 1.3 million members 
and 1,100 chapters located in 50 
Lfnited States, U.S. territories, 
Canada, Germany and Japan. In 
1929, the American Association 
of Community Colleges recog­
nized Phi Theta Kappa as the of­
ficial honor society for two year 
colleges.

Lockney Youth Activity Center 
®  Basketball Registration 0  
For Pre-K - 2nd Grade runs until 

December 15th
Forms may be picked up at the schools or the Youth Center

S tartin g  im m ed ia te ly  th e  Y outh C en ter  
w ill c lo sed  on  S u n d ay  an d  M on d ay

We will be closed Thanksgiving
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W h ir lw in d s and L ady  
W inds hosting tournament

W hirlwinds JV Boys 
Basketball Report

By Coach Chris Brattain
Floydada basketball has offi­

cially started. Both the girls and 
boys teams have gotten off to 
good starts. The girls record is 5- 
1 and the boys record is 3-0.

The girls have beaten Hale 
Center, Abernathy, Ralls, Lub­
bock Roosevelt and Memphis. 
This past Tuesday they posted

their loss to a solid Slaton team.
The boy's team is on a 3 game 

winning streak, which includes 
Memphis, Ralls and Slaton.

Floydada will host their an­
nual tournament this week start­
ing Thursday and finishing Sat­
urday. Everyone is encouraged to 
come out and support the Lady 
Winds and Whirlwinds.

• OLTON TOURNAMENT
WHIRLWIND JV - 48
OLTON 9TH - 30
The Whirlwind Junior Varsity 

basketball team traveled to Olton 
and participated in the Olton 
Tournament on November 18-20, 
2004 and came home with the 
first place trophy.

In their first game of the tour­
nament they played Olton's 9th 
grade and won by a score of 48- 
30.

Raymond Everett led the scor­
ing with double digits with 18 
points.

Brandon Monreal ended the 
game with 7 points. Kody Smith 
and Ryan Monreal each added 6 
points to the scoreboard.

Blake Greer ended the game 
with 3 points.

Scoring 2 points each were 
Adam Rainwater, Kevin Smith, 
Eladio Saldana and Taylor 
Beedy.

WHIRLWIND JV - 28
SHALLOWATER 9TH - 38
The W hirlwind JV team 

played Shallowater 9th grade in 
their second game of the Olton 
tournament. They came up on the 
short end by a score of 38-28.

Leading the scoring for the 
game was Raymond Everett with 
10 points.

Scoring 4 points each were 
Brandon Monreal and Blake 
Greer.

Kevin Smith and Ryan 
Monreal each added 3 points to 
the scoreboard.

Kody Smith and Eladio 
Saldana scored 2 points each.

WHIRLWIND JV - 48 
QLTONJV-29

“tn their third and final
ofili

WHIRLWIND JV - 39
RALLS JV - 33
The Whirlwind JV team trav­

eled to Ralls on November 22, 
2004 to take on the Jackrabbits. 
The 'Winds came away with a big 
win by a score of 39-33.

Leading the scoring with 
double-digits was Kody Smith 
and Brandon Monreal with 12 
points each.

Kevin Smith was close behind 
with 9 points.

Scoring 2 points each were 
Raymond Everett, Blake Greer 
and Ryan Monreal.

TEAM RECORD: 3-1
Coach Prather’s Com­

ments:
The team is gaining valuable 

playing experience against differ­
ent types of teams and circum­
stances which will only make 
them better in the future. They 
continue to play hard and will 
continue to improve as the sea­
son continues. They are learning 
new defenses and offenses and 
are making progress. I am very 
proud of the way we continue to 
hustle.

Lady W inds beat  
Roosevelt Eagles 35-26

LADY WINDS - 35
LADY ROOSEVELT - 26 .
The Lady Winds traveled to 

Lubbock Roosevelt on Tuesday, 
November 9,2004 to take on the 
Lady Eagles and came home with 
a victory by a score of 35-26.

Leading the scoring for the 
Lady Winds was Lindsey 
Leatherman with 21 points. She 
hit 6 of 13 two-point field goals, 
2 of 3 three-pointers and 3 of 4 
free throws along with 3 assists, 
2 steals and 6 rebounds.

Reagan Heflin added 4 points 
to the scoreboard as she hit 1 two- 
point field goal and 2 of 2 free 
throws along with 1 rebound.

Katya Vega hit 1 of 5 two 
point field goals and 1 of 3 free 
throws for a total of 3 points. She

also had 3 assists and 2 steals.
Cynthia Martinez ended the 

game with 2 points. She made 1 
two-point field goal, 4 assists and
1 steal.

Britnee Brotherton also added
2 points to the scoreboard. She 
hit 1 two-point field goal and had
3 rebounds.

Tania Pesina hit 1 two-point 
field goal for 2 points.

Rounding out the scoring was 
Jackee Wickware with 1 point. 
She also had 2 rebounds.

Kristan Lackey ended the 
game with 3 rebounds and i steal.

Magan Flores had 1 rebound 
and 1 assist.

SCORES BY QUARTERS 
Lady Winds - 14 8 9 4 
Lady Eagles - 6 9 5 8

Lady Winds beat Hale 
Center Owlettes 59-38

St€ty in School
game

Olton Tournament, the 
Whirlwind JV team won over 
Olton's JV 48-29.

Kody Smith led the'scoring 
for the 'Winds with 10 points.

Raymond Everett was close 
behind with 9 points.

Kevin Smith added 7 points 
to the scoreboard.

Blake Greer ended the game 
with 6 points. Adding 5 points 
was Elidió Saldana.

Taylor Beedy added 4 points

to the scoreboard while Ross 
Tucker added 3 points.

Scoring 2 points was Ryan 
Monreal. Adam Rainwater and 
Brandon Monreal each scored 1 
point.

TEAM RECORD: 2-1
Coach Prather's Com­

ments: Even though we suffered 
one loss during the tournament, 
we still won 1st place due to the 
Shallowater team not being able 
to return on Saturday. The loss 
on Friday was due to a poor 
shooting 4th quarter. I was very 
proud of the way the team came 
back and played on Saturday. 
They ran the press very well and 
shot the ball well. They are work­
ing hard right now and plan on 
playing hard the entire season.

December 6 - December 10 
Monday

Breakfast-Eggs/biscuit or ce­
real and graham crackers, juice, 
milk
Lunch-Frito Pie, corn, beans, 
brownie, milk

Tuesday
Breakfast-Breakfast pizza or 
cereal and graham crackers, 
juice, milk
Lunch-Spaghetti with meat 
sauce, peas, carrots, bread 
sticks, Jello, milk

Wednesday
Breakfast-Pancake & Sausage 
on a Stick, milk 
Lunch-Stuffed Baked Potatoes

LADY WINDS - 59
HALE CENTER - 38
The Lady Winds played host 

to the Hale Center Owlettes on 
November 12, 2004 and won by 
a score of 59-38.

Lindsey Leatherman led the 
scoring with 28 points. She hit 12 
of 17 two-point field goals and 4 
of 5 free throws. She had 10 re­
bounds, 2 assists, 6 steals and 1 
blocked shot.

Katya Vega scored in double 
digits with 16 points. She hit 4 
two-point field goals and 2 three- 
pointers. She also had 2 re­
bounds, 7 assists and 5 steals.

Jackee Wickware ended the 
game with 6 points. She hit 3 
two-pmnrfield goals^feng. with

9 rebounds.
Tania Pesina sank 1 two-point 

field goal and 3 free throws along 
with 4 rebounds, 1 assist and 2 
steal.

Magan Flores scored 4 points 
as she sank 2 two-point field 
goals and had 4 rebounds and 3 
assists.

Cynthia Martinez hit 1 two- 
point field goal for 2 points along 
with 5 rebounds, 2 assists, 1 steal 
and 1 blocked shot.

Kristan Lackey had 1 assist 
for the game.

Britnee Brotherton had 1 re­
bound and 1 deflection in the 
game.

Reagan Heflin ended the night 
with 2 rebounds, 1 assist, 2 steals 
and ! deflection.

FLOYDADA BREEZERS 2004 8TH GRADE FOOTBALL TEAM-(top row, 1-r) Keegan Will­
iams, (flag), Richard Hatcher; (8th row, 1-r) Coach Tobias, Coach Ayala; (7th row, 1-r) Randy 
Lerma, A.J. Garcia, Wade Hill, Yared Pinon, Robert Finley, Miguel Chairez, Zachary Hatcher; 
(6th row, 1-r) Michael Sanchez, Luis Foster, Luis Deachoa, Dillon Chesshir, Luis Ramos, Oscar 
Chavez; (5th row, 1-r) Christopher Carasco, Christopher Trevino, Chad Davis, Tyler Derryberry, 
Justin White; (4th row, 1-r) Isom Bolton, Titus Miller, Aarrhon Flores, Manuel DeLaFuente; (3rd 
row, 1-r) Juan Ascencio, Dusty Hicks, Gerald Mercado; (2nd row, 1-r) Colton Covington, Joe Suarez; 
(1st row) James Espinoza; (not pictured, Christian Fuentes) Photo by Cory Sinklier

w/Ham & cheese, broccoli w/ 
cheese, fruit, milk

Thursday
B reakfast-Scram bled eggs, 
toast and jelly or cereal and gra­
ham crackers, juice, milk 
Lunch-Enchiladas with meat, 
beans, salad, cornbread, fruit, 
milk

Friday
Breakfast-Cinnamon roll, fruit 
or cereal and graham crackers, 
juice, milk
L unch- “W hirlwind Sand­
wich”, (Chicken Fried Steak 
Sandwich) fries, salad, assorted 
fruit, milk

Please call 911, 
not the EMS Station

The employees of Floydada 
Emergency Medical Services 
want to let you know that if you 
need medical attention please call 
911. Do not call the EMS station 
for emergency attention. If you 
feel that it is a true emergency, 
please do not hesitate to call 911. 
If you feel it is something that 
you can wait and see your doctor

about, then do not call 911.
There are laws that regulate 

the reason you call 911; it is for 
emergencies. If you violate these 
laws you may be charged with a 
violation of the law. The impor­
tant thing to remember is that if 
you feel it is a true emergency 
then please call for medical at­
tention through 911.

REFLECTIONS OF LOVE
Help us honor our senior citizens by filling 
Baskets O f Love. If you would like to donate 
any items please take them to Fred Thayer's 
office or call Mary Ann Reyes at 983-3717 
or 983-2990. All items need to be turned in 
to Fred Thayer's office by November 30th.

J&K Insurance Agency, Inc.
Wants to help you find the best coverage 

possible for your HOM E & AUTO  
We have 5 great companies to choose from 

ALLSTATE - BEACON - GERMANIA  
PROGRESSIVE - TRAVELERS - UNITRIN  

Come by and see us or give us a call 
806-652-3386 806-983-3284

119 West College or 121 West California 
Lockney or Floydada 

Serving Floyd, Briscoe, Hale and 
surrounding Counties
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Floydada Whirlwinds named to 2004All District

JACOB REDDY

Floydada - Junior 
2004 - 6AA 

ALL-DISTRICT 
FIRST TEAM DEFENSE 

♦Defensive Back 
♦Punter

FIRST TEAM OFFENSE 
♦Tight End

♦Unanimous Selection

JASON NUTT

Floydada - Junior 
2004 - 6AA 

ALL-DISTRICT 
FIRST TEAM OFFENSE 

♦Defensive Line 
FIRST TEAM DEFENSE 

♦Offensive Guard

♦Unanimous Selection

TY HEFLIN

Floydada - Senior 
2004 - 6AA 

ALL-DISTRICT 
FIRST TEAM DEFENSE 

♦Linebacker
SECOND TEAM OFFENSE 

Runniing Back

♦Unanimous Selection

PAUL MARMALEJO

Floydada - Sophomore 
2004 - 6AA

ALL-DISTRICT OFFENSE 
FIRST TEAM 
♦Running Back

♦Unanimous Selection

JUSTIN MARTINEZ

Floydada - Senior 
2004 - 6AA

ALL-DISTRICT DEFENSE 
FIRST TEAM 
Defensive End

PAUL IRLAS

Floydada - Senior 
2004 - 6AA

ALL-DISTRICT OFFENSE 
SECOND TEAM 

Tackle

Photos courtesy of Cory Sinklier Photography

TATE JONES

Floydada - Sophomore 
2004 - 6AA

ALL-DISTRICT DEFENSE 
SECOND TEAM 

Linebacker

CODY WARE

Floydada - Senior 
2004 - 6AA

ALL-DISTRICT OFFENSE 
SECOND TEAM 

Tight End

ARTURO DIAZ

Floydada - Senior 
2004 - 6AA

ALL-DISTRICT OFFENSE 
HONORABLE MENTION 

Tackle

TAYLOR SUE

Floydada - Senior 
2004 - 6AA

ALL-DISTRICT OFFENSE 
HONORABLE MENTION 

Center

LIONEL WILLIAMS

Floydada - Senior 
2004 - 6AA

ALL-DISTRICT DEFENSE 
HONORABLE MENTION 

Back

RUBEN ORTIZ

Floydada - Junior 
2004 - 6AA

ALL-DISTRICT OFFENSE 
HONORABLE MENTION 

Tackle

C o n g r a t u la t io n s  Jf

FJHS 2004-2005 BREEDERS TWIRLERS-(back row, 1-r) Angela Wiley, Ashley Ovalle, Elena 
DeOchoa, Ashley Aleman; (seated, 1-r) Sonya Salinas, Adriana DelaCerda.

Photo by Cory Sinklier

F L O Y D A D A  C L A SS IC  
Decem ber 2 ,3 ,4 ,2004  

Girls Bracket 
Smyer

DRUGSARE BAD! 
NO DRUGS ARE GOOD!

7th P lace  
Sat. 9:00 am

Thur. 10:30 a.m .

Rooevelt
Fri. 9:00 a.m . New Deal fri. 3:00 p.m.

Thurs. 12:00 p.m .

Springlake-Earth 

Puducah

Thurs. 3:00 p.m .

Petersburg

Fri. 12:00 pm Vally Fri. 6:00 pm

Thurs. 4:30 p.m .

Floydada

3rd Place  
Sat. 3:00 p

FJHS 2004-2005 BREEZERS CHEERLEADERS-(back row, 11-r) Hallie Bertrand, Crystal Alvarez, 
Blanca Suarez;(middle row, 1-r) Johanna Dawdy, Ariel Peralez, Nikki Lavy, Lindsey Beedy; (seated, 
Kaylie Nutt. Photo by Cory Sinklier

Flovdada Classic 2004
Bovs Bracket

Pool A PooIB
Floydada Roosevelt
Smyer New Deal
Petersburg Springlake-Earth

Game Times;
Thurs. @ 1:30 p.m. -  Springlake-Earth vs. New Deal
Thurs. @ 6:00 p.m. -  Floydada vs. Petersburg

Fri. @ 10:30 a.m.- Roosevelt vs.. Springlake-Earth
Fri. @ 1:30 p.m. -  Smyer vs. Petersburg
Fri. @ 4:30 p.m. -  New Deal vs. Roosevelt
Fri. @ 7:30 p.m. -  Floydada vs. Smyer

Sat. @ 10:30 a.m. -  3*̂“ Pool A vs. 3’’** Pool B -  Consolation
Sat. @ 1:30 p.m. -  2"“ Pool A vs. 2"“ Pool B -  Third Place
Sat. @ 6:00 p.m. -  1" Pool A vs. 1“ Pool B -C ham pionship

***ON THURSDAY AND FRIDAY, THE l*’  ̂TEAM  LISTED ABOVE
W ILL BE HOM E AND WEAR THEIR LIGHT COLORED

UNIFORM . ON SATURDAY, POOL A TEAM S W ILL BE HOM E
AND W E.AR THEIR LIGHT COLORED UNIFORM .***

Mary Kay Cosmetics 
Susan Simpson 

Independent consu ltan t

983-5325

Subscribers Get 
It D elivered!

Just in the time fo r  the Holidays
Fresh Shelled Pecans

$6.50 a lb.
Halves or Pieces

(806) 675-2669 or (806) 620-0379 
Leave a Message

D O  THE 
MATH. 

W ILL YOU 
• HAVE 

ENO UG H  
SAVED EOR 
COLLEGE?

Lert talk college savings plans today.

N ick  Long, Agent
201 W California 

Floydada, TX 
806-083-3441

LIKE A GOOD NEIGHBOR 
STATE FARM IS THERE.’  

Priiviifing Insurance and Financi<d Services
Consull your lax or legal advisor lor sgecilii: advice 

Slala Farm • Home CBices: Sloomintfon, I  
P0362B3 Q7i03 slal6larm.cora*



THIS WEEK'S

ANNUAL CHRISTMAS 
BRUNCH

Annual Christmas Brunch 
will be held Saturday, December 
11th from 9:30 a.m. - 11:00 a.m. 
in the home of Shelly Smith, 909 
West Lee, Floydada. Tickets 
available now for $10 donation. 
Sponsored by American Cancer 
Society, Floyd County Unit.

FLOYDADA AREA 
TENNIS ASSOCIATION 

MEETING
A Floydada Area Tennis As­

sociation meeting will be held on 
Monday, December 13th from 
5:30 - 6:30 p.m. at Triple T Res­
taurant.

The Floydada Area Tennis 
Association has been formed to 
promote, encourage and foster 
the development and growth of 
tennis in the Floydada area for all 
ages.

Anyone wanting to learn more 
about this organization or would 
like to serve a a board member is 
welcome to attend.

For more information contact 
Robin Nixon at 983-5483.

COMMUNITY
STOREHOUSE

The Community Storehouse 
in Lockney is in need of blankets 
and jackets. These are needed 
badly for the winter months.

GERMANY ' THE ALPS”
Register now for the June 

2005 tour of Germany, Switzer­
land, Austria and Liechtenstein. 
Call Kay Rainwater at 983-5543 
or log on to www.eftours.com, 
tour #255738 for more informa­
tion.

BLOOD PRESSURE CLINIC
A free blood pressure clinic is 

held in the community room of 
the F irst National Bank in 
Floydada every Tuesday from 9 
a.m. to 11 a.m. Everyone is wel­
come.

FLOYDADA EMS 
appreciates your memorial 
donations. Mail memorial 

donations to:
P.O. Box 373 

Floydada, Texas 79235 
Please include the address 
to which acknowledgement 

cards are to be sent. 
Thank you for 
your support!

Thanks for reading 
the Hesperian-Beacon

The F U M C  in 
L ockney w ill 
celebrate Revival 
with Rev. Barrett

The First United Methodist 
Church in Lockney will celebrate 
Revival, Sunday December 5th 
through Wednesday, December 
8th.

Evangelist John Barrett will 
be the featured speaker for the 
revival.

Rev. Barrett has pastored 
churches for 21 years in a vari­
ety of settings. He has served in 
farming communities, bedroom 
areas, resorts, large cities and 
county seat towns. His preaching 
style could be best described as 
“down home”

His story-telling ability helps 
illuminate the Scripture themes 
he uses so effectively and chal­
lenges people for commitment to 
Jesus Christ and His Church with 
simplicity and clarity.

He has pastored three 
churches in New Mexico and 
West Texas that were selected as 
Evangelism Church of the Year..

The revival begins on Sunday 
morning with a 9:00 a.m. fellow­
ship time of coffee and donuts 
and all adult Sunday School with 
Rev. Barrett beginning at 9:30 
a.m. Barrett will lead the 10:30 
a.m. service which will be fol­
lowed by a covered dish lunch.

Every night, Sunday through 
Wednesday, at 6:00 p.m. there 
will be a fun Bible time hnd 
memory verses for kindergarten 
through 5th grade, followed by 
evening worship at 6:30 p.m.

Certain nights have been dedi­
cated to different groups. Sunday 
night is youth night; Monday 
night is women’s night; Tuesday 
night is m en’s night; and 
Wednesday night is family night.

The church will also sponsor 
a breakfast at 7:00 a.m., Monday 
through Wednesday, which will 
include a short devotion by Rev. 
Barrett.
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We want to send a very special Thank You to the 
staff at M angold M emorial Hospital for providing 
and administering the flu vaccine to our residents 
during this time of shortage.

THANK YOU SO MUCH!
Floydada Rehab and Care Center

Love Fund For C raig G illy
A Love Fund has been set up for Craig Gilly at American 
State Bank in Floydada to help pay for medical expenses. Gilly 
has been diagnosed with Myloma (a blood disease). He will 
begin chemotherapy this week.

Pray fo r  Our Troops\
FLOYD COUNTY 4-H'ERS, PARENTS AND 

LEADERS WANT TO EXTEND THEIR APPRE 
CIATION TO EVERYONE WHO HELPED IN 
ANY WAY WITH THE FLOYD COUNTY 4-H 

FAMILY AUCTION
• Businesses, Individuals and Families who 

made donations
Everyone who Attended 

Everyone who Purchased Items 
Everyone who Made Donations 

SPECIAL THANKS TO 
Overall Chairman - Judy Dunlap 

Lockney Club Chairman - Dale & D'Lee Powell 
Floydada Club Chairman - Angela Ragland 

AUCTIONEER - Sam Fortenberry 
Auction Helpers - Larry Ogden, Marty Lucke & 

Brent Sanders
Meal Chairman - Kami Keaton, Katie Beth Crossland 

& .Brady Ragland 
Publicity - Judy Dunlap 

Cashiers - Mike & Ginger Mathis 
SPECIAL THANKS TO:

Darrell Rasco
All proceeds will benefit: Projects, Activities, Awards, 

Achievement Banquet, Achievement Jacket Program, Gold 
Star Scholarships, Camps, State Competitions, National 

Award Trips, and Parent/Leader Appreciation Party.

Revival
The First United Methodist 

Church in Loekfiey
Sunday, Dec. 5th
9:00 a.m. Donuts and fellowship.
9:30 a.m. All Adult Sunday School with John. 
10:30 a.m. Worship Service with John Barrett 

followed by a covered dish lunch. 
Sunday - W ednesday 5th - 8th 
6:00 p.m. H.I.M. (Hidden In Me) Fun Bible 
time and memory verses with K-5th (all nights) 
6:30 p.m. Evening Worship (all nights)

SUNDAY IS YOUTH NIGHT  
MONDAY IS W OM EN’S NIGHT 
TUESDAY IS M EN’S NIGHT 
WEDNESDAY IS FAMILY NIGHT

Help us fill all the pews and come 
join us fo r a sandwich fellowship 
after our Wednesday night's service.

MON. - WED
COME JOIN US FOR BREAKFAST AND  
A SHORT DEVOTION W ITH JOHN AT

§  p"v*'y*ŷ *'*v*y*% ^ ¡00

c Obituaries )

JO V BIGHAM
Funeral services for Jo V 

Bigham, 82, of Floydada were 
held Saturday, November 27, 
2004, at First Baptist Church in 
Floydada. Burial was in Floyd 
County Memorial Park under the 
direction of Moore-Rose-White 
Funeral Home of Floydada.

Mrs. Bigham died November 
25, 2004 at the Floydada Rehab 

-and Care Center.
She was born January 22, 

1922 in Floydada to the late 
Clarence and Cleo Andrews 
Goins. She graduated from 
Muleshoe High School in 1939 
and attended Mary Hardin 
Baylor University. She married 
H. Allen Bigham November 17, 
1945 at Camp Lejune, NC. He 
preceded her September 18, 
1993. They moved to Floydada 
from Milford, Utah in January 
1947. She worked as an office 
manager at the Federal Land 
Bank for 33 years until she re­
tired. She was a veteran of the 
United States Marine Corp. She 
like doing crafts, painting and 
reading. She was a member of the 
Order of Eastern Star, BWC and 
the Friendship Sunday School 
Class at the First Baptist Church 
and was active in the 1934 
Women’s Study Club.

She is survived by one daugh­
ter, Sharon Stanton of Elephant 
Butte, NM; two granddaughters, 
Sherre Green and husband Roby 
of Floydada and Terri Frazier of 
Lubbock and three great-grand­
children, Jeremy, Caleb and 
Ashlyn.

The family suggests memori­
als to Cal Farley’s Boys Ranch, 
P.O. Box 1890, Amarillo, TX 
79174.

ALLEN M. COCHRAN
Services for Allen M. 

Cochran, 64, of Greenwood, pre­
viously from Floydada were held 
Saturday, November 27, 2004 at 
Baldwin Lee Funeral Home in 
Pearl. Burial was in Floral Hills 
Memory Gardens.

Mr. Cochran was retired from 
Southwestern Public Service in 
Tucumcari, New Mexico. He was 
preceded in death by his parents, 
Charlie and Lillian Cochran, five 
brothers and five sister !̂.

Survivors include son David 
Cochran of Plainview; daughters 
Carol Seago of Little Rock, Ark., 
Misty Cochran of Floydada and 
Crystal Cochran of Sidon; brother 
Burton Fowler of Dayton; sisters, 
Retha May of College Station, 
Louise Roberts of Nashville, 
Tenn., Bernice Walls of Pearl, 
Grace Fleming of Indianola, 
Doris Adkins of Tutwiler, Sylvia 
Walker of Greenwood; three 
grandsons; and three grand­
daughters.

The Mountain Top

There's nothing quite like a 
mountain top.

To make you feel complete. 
But you have to go down 

to the valley
To give your soul a drink.

We'd like to live out our lives 
Perched high in an eagle's nest.

But it's down in the valley. 
Where we have to pass the test.

God visits us on the 
mountain top.

And our hungry souls he feeds. 
But it's down in the valley. 
Where He meets our every 

need.
Edward Marks 

2003

SUBSCRIPTION REMINDERS
If your name appears below, your subscription will soon be running out. P lease  

com e by the office or mail your renewal payment to:

Floydada Hesperian -111 E. Missouri, Floydada, Texas 79235
or

Lockney Beacon, Box 187, Lockney, Texas 79241 

RATES:
Floyd County - $23.00 

Out-of-County and Out-of-State - $25.00 
(Senior Citizens deduct $1.00)

November 30, 2004 Expirations 

FLOYDADA. OUT-OF-TOWN AND OUT-OF-STATE SUBSCRIPTIONS
Anderson, Edwin 
Bichsel, Flois 
Christain, Charles 
Daniel, Danny 
Davis, Lon 
Elliott, Jo
First United Methodist 
Ford, Naomi

Fortenberry, Imogene 
Giesecke, Mike 
Harrison, Rex 
Hendrix, Joel 
Jarrell, Christopher 
Langley, Ralph 
Lawson, Rex 
Martinez, Arturo

McCain, Melissa 
McIntosh, Kathie D. 
McIntosh, Amy 
Myrick, John 
Rodriquez, Amelia 
Settle, Mr. & Mrs. 
Smith, Bryan 
Watson, M.H.
White, Glen

MAXINE HOLLEY
Funeral services for Maxine 

Holley, 74, of Lubbock were held 
Saturday, November 27, 2004 at 
Tabernacle Baptist Church. Rev­
erend E.L. Bynum officiated. In­
terment followed in the City of 
Lubbock Cemetery under the di­
rection of Sanders Funeral Home.

Mrs. Holley died November 
23, 2004.

She was born December 6, 
1929 in Silverton to Lois and Joe 
Millard Graham. She was raised 
in Floydada and lived most of her 
life in Lubbock. She married 
Larry holley April 24,1948. Mrs. 
Holley was a faithful member of 
Tabernacle Baptist Church.

She is survived by her hus­
band, Larry of Lubbock her chil­
dren, Sherry Holley and Randy 
Holley, both of Lubbock; a sis­
ter, Nadine Weems of Lubbock; 
three granddaughters; and two 
grandsons.

GLENDA OKERSTROM
Glenda Fay Meek Gay 

Okerstrom passed away from this 
life Saturday, November 13,2004 
at home. She was born March 1, 
1936 in the little farming commu­
nity of Floydada, Texas to Ollie 
and Opal Meek.

Glenda was brought up in 
Floydada, where she graduated 
from high school as salutatorian. 
Then she moved with Ollie, Opal 
and sister Joan to San Diego, 
Calif., a long time dream of hers. 
There she met and married 
Charles Gay. A few months later, 
she and Charles moved to 
G ainesville, Florida where 
Charles attended and graduated 
from the University of Florida.

A year was then spent in Ak­
ron, Ohio where Charles worked 
for Goodyeàç^.Tire a i^  Glenda 
worked for Goodyear State Bank. 
Ohio wasn't their idea of a place
to live so they returned to Fla. 
where they lived in Eau Gallie 
(presently Satellite Beach) and 
Charles worked for General Dy- 
namics at Cape Canaveral. 
Charles Gregory Gay and Rich­
ard Allen Gay were born during 
this period. This marriage didn't 
work out, and Glenda married 
Charles Merald Okerstrom and 
they moved to Lompoc, Calif.
where Charles "Chuck" worked 
for General Dynamics and

Glenda for Crocker National 
Bank. Then Chuck obtained a 
position with Aerospace Corp. 
and they moved to Riverside, 
California where Glenda was 
transferred with Crocker Bank.

Aerospace moved to El 
Segundo, *Calif., and so Chuck 
and Glenda also moved to nearby 
San Pedro, Calif., a sleepy little 
fishing village that is in the har­
bor of Los Angeles. At this point, 
Glenda was assistant manager in 
San Pedro. The traffic was hor­
rific, so Chuck asked for and re- 
ceived a transfer to Cape 
Canaveral, Fla.

Glenda retired from banking 
at this point, and pursued "Du­
plicate Bridge" with a passion. 
She came within a few points of 
making life master before decid­
ing that the stress and work of 
commuting to games wasn't 
worth it.

Next, Chuck and Glenda 
moved from their beachside 
condo in Cape Canaveral to a 
little home in Titusville where 
Chuck retired in 1988 and they 
spent six months of each year 
traveling, bird watching and tak­
ing in the fabulous scenery of the 
West. Then in 2003 the work 
started outstripping the pleasure, 
and they traded in their pickup 
and RV for a car and the comfort 
of staying home all year.

Glenda leaves her beloved 
husband. Chuck, two sons, 
Charlie and Rick Gay with wives 
Laura and Pattie, four grandchil­
dren, Sunny and Skylar; Nicole 
and Patrick. Also, two stepsons, 
William Charles "Chuck" and 
Randy Paul Okerstrom, with 
wives Maureen and Mary , and 
grandchildren, Karen, Robbie 
and Jeff; and Keith, all of whom 
Glenda loves very dearly. That 
present tense is intentional; we

do not believe that life and love 
ends just because we no longer 
have a body.

Glenda had an abiding faith in 
GOD, Jesus and His message in 
"A Course In Miracles" taught by 
Chuck since 1984. This philoso­
phy teaches that there is no death, 
only a passage from one experi­
ence to another.

Memorial service was. held 
at 7 p.m. Thursday November' 
18th at Unity Church, 2000 South 
Street in Titusville.

North Brevard Funeral Home 
w.as in charge of arrangements.

FLOYDADA EMS 
appreciates your memorial 
donations. Mail memorial 

donations to:
P.O. Box 373 

Floydada, Texas 79235 
Please include the address 
to which acknowledgement 

cards are to be sent.

Carthel, Dart 
Hancock, Julie

LOCKNEY RENEWALS
Jackson, Judy 
Reves, Walter

Roberts, Tim 
Texas Blind Mftg. 
Wilson, Aaron

http://www.eftours.com
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CHILD CARE

CHILD CARE - Immediate open­
ings in registered family home. Ages 
oirth - 5 years. Call 983-2643.

12-2c

FARM MISCELLANEOUS

RYE SEED FOR SALE-Rye is an 
excellent cover crop and great for 
grazing. Rye matures earlier than 
wehat, so it can be terminated ear­
lier to plant cotton. 806-292-9723.

tfn

NO-TILL DRILL-Custom drilling 
of wheat in milo. Inter-seeding of 
grass, cotton stalks, etc. 806-292- 
9723.

tfn

WHEAT PASTURE WANTED-
Call 806-292-9723.

tfn

HAY FOR SALE” Norman Muncy, 
983-2259.

tfn

-FLOYDADA-

Large 3 bed and 2 bath 
home with 2 car garage 
near track field and high 
school.
Cozy 3 bed and 2 bath 
home with 1 car carport 
located near football 
field.
Roomy 3 bed and 2 bath 
home with 1 car carport 
near the high school. 
Spacious 3 bed and 2 
bath home with 2 car 
garage in good and easily 
accessible location.
Large 3 bed and 2 bath 
home with 2 car brick 
carport located near 
football field in south 
pari of town.
Country Home—3 bed 
and 2 bath home with 2 
car garage, storm cellar, 
and shop north of town. 
Cozy 2 bed and 1 bath 
home with 2 car carport 
near upper elementary 
school.
Spacious 2 bed and 1 
bath home with 1 carp 
garage and small apart­
ment in west part of 
town.
NEW LISTING!!! 
Large 3 bed and 1.5 bath 
home on 2 lots in mid­
part of town.

-LOCKNEY-

Large 3 bed and 2 bath 
home with 2 car garage 
located near hoth 
schools.
Country home—3 bed 
and 2.5 bath located 
south o f town and in­
cludes a shop.
Spacious 3 bed, 1.75 
bath home with 2 car 
garage on comer lot.

Warren Mitchell 
Dedra Thomas

H g - f t t  g S T A i e . ,

C ountry  P roperty
5 plus acres.

Three bedrooms, 2 baths

812 W. Lee
3-1 - Cute! Perfect starter 
home. Ready to move into.

Commercial Warehouses

Contact Bob Simpson 
778-2120

THE CLASSIHEDS
Call 806-983-3737 or 806-652-3318

web site: www.hesperianbeacon.com —  e-mail: floydada@amaonljne.com

i

HELP WANTED

DUINICK BROS. INC. is seeking 
experienced Loader Operators 
and Dozer Operators for our pit op- 
erations between Matador and 
Floydada. Health, Life, 40IK and 
Dental Insurance offered upon quali­
fication. Hourly competitive wage 
commensurate with experience. 
Drug test required. Contact Allan 
Dvorak (Superintendent) at mobile 
817-994-7064. We are an Equal Op­
portunity Employer and comply with 
the Americans With Disabilities Act.

11-25, 12-2p

HOUSES FOR SALE

Floydada
710 W. MISSOURI-3 bedroom, 3 
bath, 2 car garage, fireplace, central 
heat and air, deck and pool. Call 
Assiter and Associates for details. 
806-983-3322.

tfn

FOR SALE BY OWNER - 4 bed­
rooms, 3-1/2 baths, multiple walk- 
in closets and built-ins, outside stor­
age, sprinkler system. 827 W. Jack- 
son. Call 983-2824 or 786-8452.

tfn

HOUSE FOR SALE-3 bedroom. 
123 J.B. Avenue. Call 983-3334.

tfn

Lockney
MOBILE HOM E-14x80, 3 bed­
room, 2 bath, with heat pump unit. 
SW 3rd and Popular, Lockney. To be 
moved. $6,500 or best offer. 806- 
652-3722.

tfn

5 miles north of Lockney on FM
378. Nice large home with 3 bed­
rooms, 1-3/4 baths and 2 living ar­
eas. Has new carpet in kitchen and 
utility areas. 2 car garage and 2 car 
carports. Kim Street, Billington Real 
Estate, 806-292-9944.

tfn

SCRIPT PRINTING  
& OFFICE SUPPLY

* Commençai Printing 
* Office Supplies & Furniture 

♦Business Machines

108 S. Main Floydada 
983-5131

BARKER MINI-STORAGE
MONTHLY RENTALS
5'xlO' - $18.00 per month 

lO'xiO' - $28.00 per month 
10'xl5' - $35.00 per month

ASK ABOUT OUR 
LONG TERM DISCOUNTS
PHONE: 652-2642
Corner Main & Locust, 

Lockney

Subscriptions make a 
great Christmas gift

Don't get left out o f our 
Christmas Edition call 

983-3737

CLASSIFIEDS
PUBLISHER'S NOTICE

AH real estate advertised herein is subject to the Federal Fair Housing 
Act of 1968 which makes it illegal to advertise "any preference, limitations, 
or dLscriminations based on race, color, religion, sex or national origin, or 
intention to make any such preferences, limitation or discrimination." We 
will know knowingly accept any advertising for real estate which is in vio­
lation of the law, AH persons are hereby informed that all dwellings adver­
tised are available on an equal opportunity basis.

A Subscription Makes a 
Great

Graduation Gift!

LOST AND FOUND

REWARD!! For information con­
cerning missing irrigation pipe. Bor­
rowed or stolen, 7 miles north of 
Dougherty. Flow line pipe, 6" and 7" 
in 30 and 40 foot joints. If you have 
information call 806-983-4901 or 
806-983-3073.

12-2c

SERVICES

FARM EQUIPMENT AUC­
TIONS AND APPRAISALS, Farm 
& Ranch Land Sales, Five Star Auc­
tioneers Associate, Billington Real 
Estate Agent, Plainview, Texas. 
Johnny Street, 806-847-7400.

12-9c

MISCELLANEOUS

6 FOOT EXECUTIVE desk. 
$65.00. Call 983-3121 between 9-5.

12-9p

LARRY OGDEN AUCTIONEERING
Estates, Farm, Ranch, Business, Liq­
uidations, State Licensed and 
Bonded. (806) 983-5808. TX. #9240.

tfn

FREE TRAILER to give away. You 
move it - you have it. Call Barbara 
or Pete, 983-3036.

12-2p

LOVE TO SHOP & HATE TO 
WRAP? Bring it to me and take a 
nap! Shirt box or smaller - $3; larger 
- $5. Call Shondra Kidd, 652-1100.

12-9p

FOR SALE-Couch, love seat and 
recliner. Navy blue floral. Good con­
dition. PRICE REDUCED! Call 
983-2186 or 983-7379.

tfn

FOR SALE--7-1/2 foot Monterey 
Pine Christmas tree. Excellent con­
dition. Only used one Christmas. 
PRICE REDUCED! Call 983-2186 
or 983-7379.

tfn

LIKE TO SHOP?? Need mystery 
shoppers for Floydada area. 
www.shoppersjobs.com or write PO. 
Box 2912, Broken Arrow, OK. 
74012.

12-9p

POOLE UJELL COM 
& SUBMERSIBLE 

SERUICE
Dual Lens 

for Color Videos of 
Irrigation and domestic 

wells.
Reveals sand inflltration, 
crusting or deterioration, 

blockage 4"-30” I.D.
704 Matador Hwy. 
Floydada, Texas 

806-983-2285

PETS

ALPHATEX KENNEL, AIKEN, 
TEXAS offers superior quality AKC 
Registered, DNA Certified Collies, 
Golden Retrievers and German 
Shepherds. Puppies and stud service 
available.

www.alphatexkennels.com
tfn

: ADAMS WELL 
: SERVICE

Complete Irrigation Service *
5 Year Warranty •
Domestic Pump *

720 N. 2nd, Floydada J 
983-5003

^  ' ' ' r e r t s

8 0 6 .2 9 3 ^ 4 4 1 3
REALT ORS *

Your Friends, Your Neighbors, Your

NEAT HOME on 5 lots, 2 bedrooms, 1 bath in great condition, central
heat and air. Great shop!............................. ........................ $ 47,000
LOTS OF SPACE in this clean 3 bedroom home with 2 baths. Almost
1600 sq. ft. Large lot, 3 storages........................................... $ 31,000
COUNTRY COTTAGE COZY! But spacious with 3 bedrooms, cen­
tral heat and air, appliances, fireplace.................................... $ 67,000
COUNTRY HOME on pavement NE of Lockney. Brick 3-2-2, fire

place, will pay $1500 buyers closing cost............... ;.............$ 72,500
NEW LISTING-Super nice 3-1-3/4-1 home on corner lot. Excellent
condition............................................................................••• $ 71,500
GOOD FLOOR PLAN in this 3 bedroom home with attached carport,
central heat & air & storm windows. Large lot...................... $ 38,500
INCOME PRODUCING- Duplex, each side has 2 bedrooms, central 
heat. Recently updated with paint, carpet and more................ $ 46,500

Rhonda K. Thomas 652-2152
Rob or Ceil Wilson 293-5722 3009 Olton Road

Dan or Debbi Wilkins 292-0263 Plamview, Texas 
Vince Rojas 292-6138 www.rwrealtors.com
Joey Davis - 292-8034

NOW LEASING
Whirlwind Country Self-Storage

Sizes — lO'xlO’ and lO'xlS'
115 W. Virginia, Floydada (across from City Hall)

Call 806-983-3774

How to make your 
Cash Resister Sins..

Advertise in the

Floyd County Hesperian-Beacon
for results that wall be music to your ears! 

call 983-J737 or 652~33JS to place your ad.

Public Notice

NOTICE TO CONTRACTORS OF PROPOSED 
TEXAS DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

(TXDOT) CONTRACTS

Sealed proposals for contracts listed below will be received 
by TxDOT until the date(s) shown below and then publicly read.

CONSTRUCTION/MAINTENANCE/BUILDING 
FACILITIES CONTRACT (S)

Dist/Div: Lubbock
Contract 6123-61-001 for SEAL COAT in HALE County, etc. 

will be opened on January 12, 2005 at 1:00 p.m. at the State 
Office for an estimate of $729,043.87.

Plans and specifications are available for inspection, along 
with bidding proposals and applications for the TxDOT 
Prequalified Contractor's list at the applicable State and/or Dist/ 
Div Offices listed below. If applicable, bidders must submit 
prequalification information to TxDOT at least 10 days prior to 
the bid date to be eligible to bid on a project. Prequalification 
materials may be requested from the State Office listed below. 
Plans for the above contract(s) are available from TxDOT's 
websiste at www.dot.state.tx.us and from reproduction compa­
nies at the expense of the contractor.

NPO: 14961

State Office

Constr./Maint. Division 
200 E. Riverside Dr. 
Austin, Texas 78704 
Phone: 512-416-2540

Dist/Div Office(s)

Lubbock District 
District Engineer 

135 Slaton
Lubbock, Texas 79408-0771 

Phone: 806-745-4411

Minimum wage rates are set out in bidding*documentes and 
the rates will be part of the contract. TxDOT ensures that bid­
ders will not be discriminated against on the grounds of race, 
color, sex or national origin.

12-2, 12-9c

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO ORGANIZE

Notice is hereby given that ASSITER INSURANCE 
AGENCY, whose principal business office is at 120 West Cali­
fornia Street, Floydada, Floyd County, Texas, intends, on Janu­
ary 1, 2005, to become a limited liability company without a 
name change.

DATED: November 2, 2004

ASSITER INSURANCE AGENCY, L.L.C.
Tim Assiter, President

11-11, 11-18, 11-25, 12-2c

LOCKNEY HOUSING AUTHORITY 
NOTICE OF PUBLIC MEETING 

ON AGENCY PLANS 
FEBRUARY 15,2005 AT 5:30 P.M.

LOCKNEY HOUSING AUTHORITY 
COMMUNITY ROOM

II4 WEST LOCUST STREET, LOCKNEY, TEXAS

The Quality Housing and Work Responsibility Act of 1998 
require the Housing Authority of the City of Lockney to prepare 
a Five Year Plan and an Annual Plan covering operations of the 
Lockney Public Housing Authority. On February 15,2005 at5:30 
p.m. the Board of Commissioners for the Housing Authority of 
the City of Lockney will hold a Public Meeting to receive any 
comments on the Lockney Housing Authority Five Year and 
Annual Plan. The meeting will take place in the Community room 
at Lockney Housing Authority;

12-2, 12-9c

NOTICE TO BIDDERS

The Commissioners' Court of Floyd County will accept sealed 
bits until 10:00 a.m., Monday, December 13, 2004, for the pur­
chase of the following:

Precinct #2 - Two New Motor Grader

Trade-In or Straight Cash Buy: Three used Motor Graders
1) 1997 140H Caterpillar SN2ZK02580
2) 1999 140H Caterpillar SN2ZK04291

3) 1996 770BH John Deere SN DW770BH554966

INSTRUCTIONS:
Bidding Specifiations and Bid Forms are available in the 

County Judge's office, Floyd County Cpurthouse, Room 105, 
Floydada, from 8:30 a.m. - 5:00 p.m., Monday thru Friday.
Bid forms provided by Floyd County must be used.

All bids should be delivered to: County Judge, Floyd County 
Courthouse, Room 105, Floydada, Texas 79235. Bids shall be 
sealed when presented and will be opened at the above time and 
date. Bids should be plainly marked as such.

Floyd County Reserves the right to accept or reject all bids 
and the right to waive all formalities.

COMMISSIONERS' COURT, FLOYD COUNTY, TEXAS 
BY: WILLIAM D. HARDIN, County Judge

II-25 ,1 2 - 2 , 12 -9 C

http://www.hesperianbeacon.com
mailto:floydada@amaonljne.com
http://www.shoppersjobs.com
http://www.alphatexkennels.com
http://www.rwrealtors.com
http://www.dot.state.tx.us
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It’s Time For Our Great

HOLIDAY
HEALTH FAIR

Saturday
December 4, 2004 

9:00 a.m. to 2:00p.m . 
Lockney Elementary School 

310 S.W. 8th Street

Early Childhood 
Intervention

Cogdell Clinic 
Height, Weight, 
Blood Pressure

United Blood 
Services 

( Blood Drive )

Covenant Home 
Health

r
For Admission

please bring a New Toy 
or Canned Goods 

Which will be donated 
to the Lockney 
Salvation Army 

Christmas Cheer 
Program.

Aero Care

V >

National Marrow 
Donor Program

West Texas

N

Chip

J
Blood Sugar 

Checks

r
Dr's

Webb & Webb -
Optometrist

. J
American
Red Cross

4 /

Audio Acoustics 
Hearing Centers

r Lunch
will be provided 
by the Lockney 
J^and Boosters

>
\

r \

Mangold Mangold
Nutrition Services Care Center

J L J

r
Texas Star 
Program & 

Texas Health Steps

r
Central Plains 

Center
Mangold Fitness 

& Rehab

/ ------------------------------^
Floydada WIC

r \
B lood  D rive
9:00  to 2 :00

J

r
Lockney Health 

&
Rehab Center

Mangold 
Memorial 

Home Health

J

J

Cholesterol
Check

/

w \<
\

Panhandle
Council

fo r the Deaf
-J

J

' \

Hale County
Crisis Center

L J

r
Childrens Crafts

Body
Composition

\ J

Hospice Hands
o f

West Texas

Mangold Home 
Medical Equipment

c

Lockney

\

PTO

- J

r

K

Lockney P.D. & 
Junior Chamber 

of Commerce 
(Fingerprint Booth) ‘

Ç
VistaCare

\

Hospice

L_ J

r

N

Kid Care
Photo ID

p \
4-H Consumer

Education

L J

Covenant 
Heart Institute 

(ABI Screening)

The Don & Sybil 
Harrington 

Cancer Center 
(Mammagrams) 

Will be at Cogdell 
Clinic Dec. 10

Door Prizes furnished bv:
Clark Pharmacy - Davis Lumber 

City Bank, Lockney -D & J Gin - Kaleidoscope 
Heart's Desire -  Raceway Fuel - J & K Insurance 

Lockney Meat Company - Lowe's Pay & Save 
Schacht Flowers, Jewelry & Gifts, Main Street Pizza 

Dr. & Mrs. Kevin Stewart 
Dr. & Mrs. Kevin Stennett 
Dr. & Mrs. Gary Mangold 

Dr. Sharie Moore & Family
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2004 FLOYDADA WHIRLWINDS JV FOOTBALL TEAM-(top row, 1-r) Coby Emery, Keith 
Prather, Gilbert Trevino, Larry Beam; (4th row, 1-r) Kevin Smith, Adam Rainwater, Landon Lackey, 
Eddie Lopez, Kody Smith, Brandon Monreal, Abel Cortinas; (3rd row, 1-r) Mgr. Paul Beuning, 
Christ Hayter, Tucker Ross, Christ Cervantes, Dustin Coursey, Adam Pyle, Jenaro Segura, Abran 
Enriquez; (2nd row, 1-r) Anthony Herrera, Daniel Soldana, Joseph Martinez, Eric Rainwater, 
Michael Rodriquez, Michael Shaping, Robert Beuning; (front row, 1-r) Mgr. Kaden Lackey, Mauro 
Ortiz, Michael Flores, Coby Turner, Charles Beedy, Tanner Sue, Eladio Saldana, Harvey Garza.

Photo by Cory Sinklier

WHIRLWIND VARSITY 2004-2005 CHEERLEADERS- (bot­
tom to top) Jessica Garza, Meghan Graham, Valerie Riojas, 
Jesalyn Bradley, Stacy Griggs, (top) LaToya Green, Mascot.

Photo by Cory Sinklier

Bradley makes 
President’s List

Joshua Bradley was nomi­
nated for the President’s Honor 
Roll for the third quarter at Spar­
tan College of Aeronautics and 
Technology.

He was recognized at a recep­
tion on November 2, 2004 for 
achieving this honor.

Students are eligible at the end 
of each quarter if they receive a 
4.0 in their classes.

Spartan is located in Tulsa, 
Oklahoma at Tulsa International 
Airport. The students learn the 
technological aspects òf the Air­
line industry.

Bradley is the son of Sammy 
and Sandra Bradley of Floydada. 
He is the grandson of Lorilla Bra­
dley also of Floydada and Art and 
Diana Tetreault of Worcester, 
Massachusetts.

Through
the

Halls

Lucky
By Marla Reeves

Sitting and thinking.
Thinking of the past,
I sometimes wonder 
How long my luck will last.
I’ve always had a home 
Where no harsh word is spoken. 
I am always loved.
Never lonely or broken.
My parents love me.
My brother does, too.
My friends care for me 
And have always been true.
We, aren’t the richest family.
Not by any means.
But we have always had enough 
Unlike some other teens.
I love'my Savior,
Standing by me thick and thin. 
He loves me regardless 
Of all my horrid sin.
So yes, you could call me lucky. 
There are those w ho have m uch less. 
But sornehow I don’t like it.
I prefer the term “blessed.”

2004-2005 WWlkLWIÑb jk .  VARSITY CHEERLEADERS- (bottomto top) Emily Griffin, 
Samantha Floréis; Morgáh Norrell, Kimberly Garza. ' Photo by Cory Sinklier

r

TALK. SURF. W ATCH. GO. 
BUT MOST OF ALL...SAVE,

GET SERVICES FROM THE SBC FAMILY 
AND SAVE TIME AND MONEY.

The more services you add, the more m oney you 
can save. Get connected and save like never before with 
SBC local and long distance, SBC | DISH Network, Cingular® 
Wireless and SBC Yahoo! DSL (which is now available in your 
area for just $26.95 a month), in addition to saving money, 
you'll also experience the convenience of paying Just one 
bill. Take your household communications to the next level 
with these SBC services. SBC. GOING BEYOND THE CALL?

Now Available 
In Your Area 

SBC YAHOO!DSL

$2 6 ? 5
Other monthly charges apply. See below.*

1-866-297-7928 I SBC.COM | ( s ^

LONG D ISIANO ÌMTERNE1 SATELLITE T WIRELESS HABLAMOS su IDIOMA. LLAME 1-877-SOLO-SBC.

You will also be charged a monthly FUSF (Federal Universal Service Fund) cost-recovery fee to help cover charges from our data transport supplier pursuant to state and federal telecom regulations. This fee is not a tax or government-required 
charge. Offer ends 12/31/Oir for new online orders or if part of a qualifying bundle. SBC local service and one-year term required. $200 early termination fee. At end of term, then-current rate applies. $150-$200 additional charge if a technician 
install IS required or desired. The equipment charge will appear on the first bill along with any instant credits. Laptop and some desktop users may need to buy an Ethernet card. Billing begins on service activation date. Acceptance of terms o f  service 
required. Other restrictions apply. SBC Yahoo! DSL combines DSL transport, Internet access and applications from SBC Internet Services with customized content, services and applications from Yahoo! Inc. SBC | DISH Network is a cobranded service pro- 
vided by SBC Home Entertainment and EchoStar Satellite L.L.C. Programming provided by EchoStar Satellite L.L.C.; equipment and other services provided by SBC Home Entertainment. DISH Network, the DISH Network logo and other product and service 
names are trademarks and/or service marks of EchoStar Satellite L.L.C. Long dislance services provided by SBC Long Distance. Cingular is a registered trademark of Cingular Wireless, LLC. All Cingular Wireless trademarks belong to Cingular Wireless, LLC. 
SBC, the SBC logo and other product names are trademarks and/or service marks of SBC Knowledge Ventures, L.P. and/or its affiliates. All other trademarks and service marks are the property of their respective owners. ®200A SBC Knowledge Ventures, 
L.P. All rights reserved. . r r j r  e .
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DEMOLISHING OLD HOUSES TO REBUILD NEW ONES-The City of Floydada is demol­
ishing 7 houses in town inorder to rebuild new homes for eligible citizens through the HOME 
grant program. This pile of rubble was seen at 119 W. Mississippi Monday morning. Staff Photo

Gene chips will show the way in the cotton industry
Working with agricultural re­

search funding from Cotton Inc., 
Texas A&M plant geneticist, Dr. 
Jeffrey Chen, has created what 
can conservatiyely be described 
as a research coup for the U.S. 
cotton industry.

C hen-and his staff have 
adapted a unique tool for cotton 
that can be used to create im­
proved varieties and fiber qual­
ity characteristics. DNA 
midroarrays, or “gene chips”, can 
be used to study the way genes 
express or trigger cotton trait de­
velopment.

how any orgapisrp' deye^ps and 
reacts to the surrounding envi­
ronm ent,” explains Dr. Roy 
Cantrell, vice president. Agricul­
tural Research for Cotton, Inc.

Since his arrival in 2002, 
Cantrell, a seasoned plant breeder 
and geneticist, has established a 
path of breeding and genetic re­
search projects and related pro­
grams, that will lead to an over­
all improvement in varieties that 
are offered to the cotton produc­
ing community.

“Cotton breeding is a long and 
arduous process, but when we 
have advances like this one from 
Dr. Chen, it’s clear evidence that 
we’re heading in the right direc­
tion,” says Cantrell.

: p  G e  ch ip s  Ca:n be  u sed  in 
various contexts including genet­
ics (geno types and germ plasm ), 
p h y s io lo g y  (s tre s s  re sp o n se s), 
d e v e lo p m e n t (f ib e r, n o n -f ib e r  
i.e ....gossy-pol) and environm ent

LOCKI^EY YOUTH ACTIVITY CENTER

CHRISTMAS JAMBOREE  
& CAKE AUCTION

December 4, 2004 - 6:00 p.m. until ? - Youth Center

There will be live music all night long and a Cake Auc­
tion during intermission. Santa will be here also, so 
bring the kids and have their picture taken with Santa. 
The JR. Board will be selling Fajita Wraps and other 
Goodies. Come on out and have some fun with us and 
help support the youth of our community.

(temperature and water).
Chen manufactured the gene 

chips by “spotting” or making 
bio-molecules on 1x3 inch labo­
ratory glass slides. “One side can 
contain more than 30,000 differ­
ent DNA elements - each corre­
sponding to a specific gene 
within the cotton plant,” explains 
Chen

This is a new and reliable 
‘high-throughput tool’ that can 
now be used to directly improve 
a cotton plant’s ability to with­
stand all types of environmental 
influqn^es, to improve fiber qual- 
it^uclwracteristies, and even help 
explain interactions among genes 
in a cotton plant’s internal con­
trol m echanism ,” concludes 
Cantrell.

Have You Made 
Your Will?

Laney & Stokes, 
Lawyers 
293-2618

A Subscription Saves You Money 
Off The Newsstand Price

t h e S R I R I T .of America
Over half a century ago. Farm Bureau 
Insurance was founded in the idea of people 
helping people ... the spirit of Farm 
Bureau. From that beginning, rich traditions 
were established reflecting the best of 
America. We continue to build 
on that foundation proudly each 
and every day. The spirit of 
America is in Farm Bureau.

FARM
BUREAU

s «

T*?vas farm B-jreAj Mutual Co
Tevas Farm Bmea-j Underv.'rders 
Southern Farm Burertu Casually insutan 
Southern Farm Bureau I.T& Innuranre C.f 
Farm Bureau County Mutual Ifisufafsce C

Auto • Home • Life

H e l p i n g  Y ) u
is what we do best. 

101 S. Wall 
Floydada, Tx. 

(806) 983-3777
sfbli.com • txfbins.com

Cotton futures settled higher 
Thursday on the New York Board 
of Trade as participants contin­
ued rolling out of the December 
contract ahead of first notice day 
and traders reacted favorably to 
USDA’s weekly export sales re­
port. According to analysts, a 
weaker U.S. dollar and lower 
prices led to higher cotton export 
sales in the department’s report 
on Thursday.

Net export sales of 242,700 
bales were up 52 percent from the 
previous week and 95 percent fro 
the four-week average. Primary 
buyers were Turkey, China, and 
Hong Kong.

Export shipments increased 
three percent from the previous 
week as shipm ents totaled 
126,900 bales. The new figure 
was 20 percent higher than the 
four-week average. Major desti­
nations included Mexico, South 
Korea and Indonesia.

Spot cotton sales also rose in 
the week ended Nov. 18 as Texas, 
Oklahoma and Kansas producers 
sold 36,830 bales online com­
pared to the previous week when

25,775 bales were traded. Prices 
received by producers selling 
their cotton online ranged from 
38.54 to 39.75 cents per pound 
versus the previous week’s range 
of 39.15 to 40.90 cents per pound.

Harvest progress advanced to 
67 percent of the prospective U.S. 
crop in the week ended'Nov. 14, 
according to the National Agri­
cultural S tatistics Service 
(NASS). The figure compares 
with 69 percent complete at the 
same time one year ago and the 
five-year average of 74 percent.

Analysts believe only 41 per­
cent o f  the Texas crop is out of 
the field and untimely rain and 
snow brought outside activities to 
a standstill across the Texas High 
and Rolling Plains this week. In­
clement condition there over the 
past few weeks have delayed the 
harvest season by roughly one 
month, and farmers are anxious 
to get the crop off the stalk be­
fore any further quality and yield 
reductions occur. As of Nov. 17, 
a total of 12.78 inches of rain had 
been recorded in Lubbock, Texas, 
for the month of November, well

above the normal 0.71 inches.
Partly cloudy skies were re­

ported across most of the Texas 
High and Rolling Plains on 
Thursday with no precipitation in 
the daily forecast, giving the crop 
a brief respite from the recent wet 
weather. If dry conditions con­
tinue, field work likely will re­
sume in approximately 10 to 14 
days. However, a slight chance 
of rain is predicted over the 
weekend and wintry precipita­
tion is possible early next week.

Elsewhere, mostly dry 
weather prevailed throughout the 
Memphis Territory until the lat­
ter portion of the week when 
^scattered rainfall was reported in 
some areas.

Harvesting in the northern 
most parts of the region remains 
behind schedule, and USDA re­
ports that significant plant re­
growth and the absence of pro­
longed sunny conditions have 
caused problems for picking and 
ginning machinery, and cotton 
quality has continued to decline.

DONATION TO HELP WITH SHATTERED DREAMS PROGRAM-A DPS Grant, Anti-Drug 
Donation has been presented to Lockney ISD to have a Shattered Dreams Program at the school 
in 2005. Shown here are: (1-r) Jeff Rendon with Texas Alcohol and Tobacco Commission; Michael 
Thomas, DPS Trooper in Floydada; Michelle Araujo, J.P. ; Chuck Martin, Lockney P.D.,-High 
School Principal Dean Thompson; and Floyd County Deputy Paul Raissez. Courtesy Photo

P l e a s e  r e m e m b e r  to
PRAY FOR OUR TROOPS

PRODUCERS
COOPERATIVE

ELEVATOR

983-2821 - Floydada 
983-3770 - Dougherty

FIRST NATIONAL 
BANK OF FLOYDADA

a

Floydada 983-3717 
Member F.D.LC.

FLOYDADA 
COOPERATIVE 

GINS, INC.

Floydada 983-2884
Stop by.or give us a call 

Panhandje-Plains FLBA 
629 Baltimore Plainview, 

Texas (806)296-5579

LA N D  B A N K

Part of the fabric of rural life

H onor your loved ones 
past, present and future 
and the loved ones of oth­
ers by purchasing a m ag­
netic M emorial Ribbon.

$5.00 each

Not only are you supporting our troops and 
our country, but also you are supporting our 
local youth's present and future. All proceeds 
will go to the building of a skate park here in 
our community. This will give our youth a 
place to go. They will have a safe place to skate 
and get a great workout as well.
For your ribbon, contact any Floydada Po­
lice Officer or City Hall at 983-2835

Oxygen & Acetylene

R e fills
Available at

FERGUSON SPRAYING, INC.
608 E. Houston, Floydada - 983-2474

Satisfy your 
need
for speed!
AMA*TechTel brings you high­
speed fixed wireless Internet 
access. With speeds up to 50 
times faster than dial-up and 
access that's always on, you'll 
connect to the world faster 
than ever.

AMA*TechTel is committed to 
providmg the latest technology 
and the best customer service, 
so no matter who you're 
connecting with, you can count 
on us to get you there.

Now you can have the fastest, 
most reliable Internet service 
available. So act fast; contact 
your local distributor today!

A ssiter I nsurance  
120 W. California • 983-2511

A ce H a r d w a r e
1101 S. Ralls H ighway • 983-3000

/

CO n ne
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Marriage 
guidelines

By Ron Trusler
There have been a number of 

studies over the years that pro­
vide information about certain 
factors that contribute to a good 
marriage. Last week’s article 
was titled “Traits That Make a 
Better Marriage Partner.” This 
is a supplement to the same sub­
ject.

If a person has experienced 
warm and satisfying relation­
ships with both his father and 
mother, his marriage will be in­
fluenced positively. If the par­
ents were affectionate, firm, con­
sistent, and fairly will adjusted in 
their own marriage, this contrib­
utes to the new marriage relation­
ship in a positive way.

Another interesting fact is if 
each person had friends prior to 
the marriage and they remain 
mutual friends, the marriage re­
lationship is enhanced.

Also, environmental condi­
tions in the person’s background, 
both social and physical, can in­
fluence the marriage somewhat.
A happy childhood, lack of pov­
erty, and completion of an exten­
sive formal education can con­
tribute to success in marriage.

I read a person’s comment that 
was something like, ‘ We can 
eliminate poverty in our nation, 
if everyone at least graduates 
from high school, gets a job, 
waits to start dating until they are 
21, and don’t have children until 
they are married for 5 years.’
Marriage at an early age is not 
favorable to a healthy adjustment 
or to marital longevity.

LOCKNEY YOUTH ACTIVITY CENTER

CHRISTMAS JAMBOREE 
& CAKE AUCTION

Date: December 4 ,2004  
Time: 6:00 p.m. until ? 
Where: Youth Center

There will be live music all night long and a 
Cake Auction during intermission. Santa will 
be here also, so bring the kids and have their 
picture taken with Santa. The JR. Board will 
be selling Fajita Wraps and other Goodies. 
Come on out and have some fun with us and 
help support the youth of our community.

FEAR NOT
E ncountering the C hrist 

O f C hristm as

The Lockney Volunteer 
Fire Departm ent has 
disconnected its tele­
phone.
(Num ber 652-2451)
In the future 
please call 911 
if you have 
an emergency.

L ive M usic and D ram a

”F ear not: for behold , w e bring you  
good tid ings o f great jo y .”

P resented at
F irst B aptist C hurch, F loydada

Saturday, D ecem ber 11th - 6:30 p.m . 
Sunday, D ecem ber 12th - 5:30 p.m .

"Christmas Open House Tour"
Sponsored By

Hospice Hands of West Texas
December 5th 

1:30 PM to 4:30 PM

Tickets $5.00 per person

Tour Five fieauliful H Iornes
Rosie & Jr. Rendon 114 SW 7th Lockney 
Isabel & John Pichardo 211 SW 3rd Lockney 
Shandra & Tracy Kidd 718 SE 8th Lockney 
Sheryl & Rodney Rigby 717 SW 3rd Lockney 
Carol & Don Kelly FM 2883

Tour M aps w ill he available a t Hospice 
Office prior to tour.

Refreshments will be served at Hospice
Office

305 N . M ain  L ock n ey  
806-652-3000

Tickets available at:
Hospice Hands 305 N. M ain - Lockney 

Schacht Flowers 112 W. Poplar - Lockney 
Payne's Pharmacy 200 S. M ain - Floydada  

'Broadway Craft & Antique M all 709 Broadway - Plain view  
Bonnes Am ies 2111 W. 5th - Plainview

Floyd County Church Directory
AIKEN BAPTIST 

CHURCH
R andy Curtis,. Pastor 

Sunday School....'. t0:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship .. 11:00 a.m.^ 
Evening Worship.... 6:00 p.m. 
W ednesday............7:30 p.m.

BIBLE BAPTIST 
CHURCH

810 S. 3rd , F loydada 
Darwin Robinson, Pastor 

983-5278
Sunday School.... 10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship .. 10:50 a.m. 
Evening Worship .... 6:00 p.m 
W ednesday.............7:30 p.m

CALVARY'S
CORNERSTONE

FELLOWSHIP
Floydada

A rm ando M orales, Pastor
Sunday School...... 9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship .. 11:00 a.m.
Bible Study.............6:00 p.m.
Wednesday Evening7:00 p.m.

^
CARR’S CHAPEL
Service Every Sunday: 

Morning Worship .... 9:00 a.m. 
Sunday School.... 10:30 a.m.

CHURCH OF CHRIST
W est College & T hird , 

Lockney
Steve McLean -M inister 

Morning Worship .. 10:30 a.m. 
Evening Worship .... 5:30 p.m. 
Wednesday Service 7:30 p.m.

CITY PARK 
CHURCH OF CHRIST

Ken Free- M inister 
F loydada

Sunday Bible Study ,9:30 a m. 
Morning Worship .. 10:30 a.m. 
Evening Worship .... 6:00 p.m. 
Wed. Bible Study.... 7:30 p.m.

 ̂̂  ̂
FIRST BAPTIST 

CHURCH
A nthony D. Sisemore, 

Pastor
Bill Swinney, 

M inister of Ed./M usic 
Scott Reed - Min. S tudents
Sunday School...... 9:15 a.m.
Morning Worship ... 10:30 a.m 
Evening Worship .... 6:00 p.m. 
Wed. Bible Study... 7:00 p.m.

FIRST BAPTIST 
CHURCH, Lockney

Carl M om an, Pastor 
Chad Cook, Youth Min. 

Phil Gotham , Music Min..
Sunday School....... 9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship .... 10:45 a.m.
Evening Worship...... 6:00 p.m
Wednesday.............. 6:30 p.m.
yVednesday................7:15 pm

' f ir s t  UNITED 
METHODIST 

CHURCH
Floydada

Dr. David Jones, Pastor 
W infield D avenport 

Associate Pastor
Sunday School........ 9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship.... 10.50 a.m.

American 
State Bank

Member FDIC
217 W. California 

983-3725

Barwise
Gin

Barwise Community 
983-2737

City Auto
Buick, Pontiac, CMC

201 El Missouri 
Floydada 
983-3767

Clark
Pharmacy

320 N. Main - Lockney
652-3353

Davis Lumber
102 E. S hübet 

Lockney 
6523385

Garcia's 
OK Tire  Store
306 S. Main - Floydada - 983-3370 

511 1st 01ton,TX 2657796

Lighthouse 
Electric Coop

102 E. California 
983-3524

FIRST UNITED 
METHODIST 

CHURCH
Lockney

Rev. Neely Landrum , 
Pastor

Sunday School...... 9:15 a.m.
Worship Service ... 10:30 a.m. 
Evening Service .... 6.00 p.m. 
Praise/Worship..... 7:00 p.m.

GRANT CHAPEL 
CHURCH

OF GOD IN CHRIST
Joe B ennett, Pastor

Sunday School.... 10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship .. 11:00 a.m.-
Evening Service.... 7:30 p.m.
Tuesday...............   8:00 p.m.
Wed. Service..........7:30 p.m.

MAIN STREET 
CHURCH OF CHRIST

Lockney
Jay  Don Poindexter, 

M inister
Bible Study...............9:30 a.m.
Morning Worship .. 10:30 a.m. 
Evening Worship ... 6:00 p.m. 
W ednesday............7:30 p.m.

MT. ZION 
BAPTIST CHURCH

Floydada
Rev. Ralph Jackson

Sunday School.... 10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship .. 11:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship .... 7:00 p.m.
W ednesday............ 7:00 p.m.
Thursday................. 7:00 p.m.

NEW SALEM 
PRIMITIVE BAPTIST 

CHURCH
Floydada

Pastor Elder Ronnie 
Hedges

(806) 637-0430 
Sunday Singing .... 10:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship .. 11:00 a.m.

POWER OF PRAISE 
FULL GOSPEL 

CHURCH
Rev. M anuel Rendon, 

Pastor
704 N. Main, Lockney 

Sunday Services .. 10:00 a.m. 
Sunday Evening .... 5:00 p.m. 
W ednesday...... ....... 7:30 p.m

PRIMERA IGLESIA 
BAUTISTA

Lockney
Jesse Caballero, Pastor

Sunday School...... 9:45 a.m.
Worship Service ... 11:00 a.m. 
.Evening Service .... 6:00 p.m.
Wed. Service......... 7:30 p.m.

 ̂ ^
PRIMERA IGLESIA 

BAUTISTA
Floydada 

Rev. Lupe Rando
Sunday School....  9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship . 10:55 a.m. 

Evening Worship ... 6:00 p.m. 
Wed. Evening.........7:00 p.m.

SAN JOSE
CATHOLIC CHURCH

Lockney
Jim  M cCartney, Pastor 

Wed. Communion .. 8:00 p.m. 
Sunday M ass......  11:30 a.m.

Goen & Goen 
Insurance
102 E. California 

983-3524

Lockney 
Co-op Gin

652-2377

Lockney 
Ins. Agency

105 N. Main 
652-3347

Moore-Rose-White 

Funeral Home
329 W. Calif. Floydada 983-2525 
402 S. Main Lockney 652-2211

Oden
Chevrolet-Olds
221 S. Main, Floydada 

983-3787

Payne Family 
Pharmacy

200 S. Main, Floydada 
983-5111

Pay-n-Save
210 N. Main 

Lockney 
652-2293

SOUTH PLAINS 
BAPTIST CHURCH

Joe W eldon, Pastor
Sunday School.... 10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship ... 11:00 a.m 
Prayer Meeting....... 7:00 p.m

TEMPLO 
GETSEMANI 

ASSEMBLY OF GOD
701 W. M issouri 

Rev. Ray Gonzales 
983-5286 (church) 

983-3047 (parsonage)
Sunday School..... 9: 45 a.m.
Morning Worship ;. 11:00 a.m.
EveningService..... 5:00 p.m.
Wednesday............7:00 p.m.

ST. MARY 
MAGDALEN 

CATHOLIC CHURCH
Floydada

F ather Arsenio Redulla 
D eacon Ricky V asquez 

Phone: 983-5878
Sunday M ass...... 11:30 a.m.
Mon.Wed. Mass......... 6:30 p.m.
Confession Sat. 10:00-11:00 a.m.

TEMPLO BAUTISTA 
SALEM
Lockney

Pedro Reyes, Pastor 
Sun. Prayer Service 9:30 a.m.
Sunday School...... 9:45 p.m.
Worship Service ... 11:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship ... 6:00 p.m. 
Wed. Meeting.........7:00 p.m.

TEMPLO BETHEL 
SPANISH ASSEMBLY 

OF GOD
W ashington an d  1st St. 

Rev. Eliseo Ovalle 983-6202 
Sunday School....... 9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship .. 11:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship ... 5:00 p.m. 
Wed. Service..........7:00 p.m.

TEMPLO NUEVA VIDA
Rev. H erm an M artinez 

308 W. Tennessee, 
F loydada

Sunday School..... 10:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship .... 5:00 p.m.
Tuesday................. 7:30 p.m.
Thursday Service ... 7:30 p.m.

TRINITY ASSEMBLY
500 W. H ouston 

F loydada
H enry Russell, Co-Pastor 

Vance M itchell, Co-Pastor 
983-5499

Sunday School...... 9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship .. 10:40 a.m.
Sunday Evening.... 6:00 p.m.
W ednesday............7:00 p.m.

TRINITY
LUTHERAN CHURCH

Providence C om m unity  
on  FM 2301 293-30()9

'Rev. Burnell Lund, 
M inister

Sunday School...... 9:45 a.m.
Worship Service ... 11:00 a.m.

WEST SIDE 
CHURCH OF CHRIST

Floydada 983-3548 
Sunday Worship... 10:30 a.m. 
Sunday Evening.... 5:00 p.m.

FLOYD COUNTY 
COWBOY CHURCH

U nity C enter - M uncy 
1st Sunday  o f th e  M onth 

Meal - 6:00 p .m
Services - 7:00 p.m .. 

*****

Thispaae 
is brought 
to you by 

the
foíboídm
sponsors:

Schacht
Flowers, Jewelry & Gifts 
112 W. Poplar, Lockney 

652-2385

Sunshine Pump
Oliver Clark

Box 266, Lockney
983-5087 - 774-4412 (Mobile)


