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Churchof Christ

SpringMeeting

BeginApril 27
Tho Church of Christ which

mceta at 010 North Ave. E, Is
their spring meet-

ing, April 27 and
ending Sunday evening, May
3rd. Services will be conducted
twice daily through the week,
7:00 o'clock in tho morning and
7:30 each evening.

Last August the church held
their morning service at 7:00
and found that attendance was
doubted for that service each
day, church leaders said. By
mcoting at this early hour,
many of the men and most of
tho school children, were able
to attend who otherwise
couldn't have come. It is hop-
ed that the public will take ad
vantage of this early hour of
meeting to come and study
with them in the quiet of early
morning, membersstated.

Hulen Jacksonof. Dallas will
be the guest He
preaches regularly for the
Trinity Heights of
that city. He will arrive In
Haskell next Monday after-
noon, April 27th, to begin his
part Sn the meetingthat evening
at 7 :30. Members o the church
solicit your interest and at-

tendance to the meeting. Paul
Rogers, local preacher, will
preach the first sermon of tho
meeting Monday morning at
7:00 o'clock.

On Sundaymorning, May 3rd,
the church is striving for a
record Bible study attendance.
The study of God's word be-

gins promptly at 9:45 on Sun-
day morning. Morning worship
will begin that day at 10:45.
Following the morning service,
.members of the church and
their guests will go to the city
park where lunch will be en-

joyed together. In the evening,
at 7:30, the service
will be

The public is cordially invit-
ed to be the guests of the
church all' week. "Come thou
with us and we will do thee
good."

Be Held May 2

""""Miy ni8T"y

To

announcing
beginning

evangelist.

congregation

concluding
conducted.

date for next year's meeting.
Presentofficers are Steve

Sloan president, whose parents,
the late Mr. and Mrs. J. S.
Sloan, came to Haskell County
In 1901;' and Mrs. Angle Mui-lln- o,

secretary.She Is a mem-
ber of an earlyday family In
this area,her parents, the late
Mr. and Mrs.' Sam Vernon hav-
ing moved here in 1880.

. 4

The big onesare biting at the
lake!

Fishing out from Shaw's
Camp at Lake Stamford last
week Mrs. W. R. Howard of
this city and Mrs. Lola Klnser
of Lubbock caught tho three
o's: yellow, ijcatflsh. pictured
above. Th.UrzK is weigh
ed 27'.found, the smaller ones
lfLanif .is pounds.,ech
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HULEN JACKSON
Evangelist

MethodistsWill

ConductSpecial
pi, pv
nnanteunve

Final plans for launching an
education andfinance program
were made at a meeting of
the organization
of the First Methodist Church
board of stewards Tuesday
night.

Goal of the program Is to
raise $4,500 in the next three
weeks, to be used for building
repairs and maintenance of
the church. This supplements
the regular budget, and brings
the over-a-ll budget for the con-

ference year 1959 to approxi-
mately $21,000.

Themo of the program is
"Not how much of my money
shall I give God, but how much
of God"s money-- inall I keep
for myself?"

General chairman of the
special program is Roy John-
son, and serving with him will
be y: H. Pitman, Allen Rleves,
Joe 'Harper, Henry Withers,
Oscar Bruce, T. A. Barfield,
George Tyler.

Qrfchnirmen of the mechan-
ics division are Allen Rievee
and Floyd Cook; and of the
education division are T. A.
Barfield and Joe Harper.

Mrs. W. R. Johnson
NamedMemberOf
Nafl C-- C Group

Recognition for her outstand-
ing work as C. of C. manager
was accordedMrs. W. R. John-
son this week, when she was
selectedfor membershipIn the
American Association of Cham-

ber of CommerceExecutives.
Members of the AACC, a na-

tional organization,are select-
ed by Invitation only, in recog-

nition for achievementIn com-

munity service as rendered by
a Chamoer oi wniiiierec.

Mrs. Virgil Shaw, who with her
rV.... ...ts the txjpular

wWMf&HHiL

nusoanu U4"- - - -

Www afishing camp. Mrs.

beauty operator in Lubbock
Mrs. Shaw and

had telephoned
asked her to bait out a

Mrs. Klnser and Mrs.
HowvJ for their
fffiSiVtrlp. Mr. Shaw used

Jvorite balt-goldf-Uh-in

jfOlnJevJ the line for the two

'women.
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No Election On
HospitalPlans,
Court Decides

At a special meeting Tues-
day, tho CommissionersCourt
unanimously adopted a reso-
lution against calling a bond
election for proposed enlarge-
ment of the Haskell County
Hospital.

Commissioners also approv-
ed plans to provide a dormi-
tory In the courthoui for wo
men jurors, a project which has
neon under consideration for
some time.

Tho commissioners decided
to convert the present jury
quarters on the northeast cor-
ner, third floor, into a wo-
man's dormitory.

The presentgrand jury room
on the southwest corner, third
floor, will be converted into
jury quarters for men. Tho
northwest corner room on the
third floor will be used as
meeting place for the Grand
Jury, it was decided.

ine vote against caning a
bond election came after archi
tect's plans prepared for the
hospital's board of directors
were shown to the Commis-
sioners Court at the special
meeting for the first time.

Previously, the plans had
been submitted to Uie hospital
directors at a meeting last
Thursday, April 16. Date for
that meeting was set by the
hospital directors and not by
the Commissioners Court as
staled in The Free Prcss last
week.

2
Haskell's annual" community-wid- e

Spring Clean Up campaign
has been scheduled for April
27 to May 2, and Mayor Ira
Hester has officially proclaim
ed the coming week as "Clean
Up Week" for the entire town.

The Chamber of Commerce
and other civic groups have
pledged wholehearted cooper-

ation In a concerted effort to
make the clean-u-p campaign
ono. of the most effective in
ycais.

City street departmenttrucks
will operateduring the week in
hauling off without chaige all
rubbisvt, cans, etc., that can
not be bumed or otherwise

Final Rites For

Mrs, Frierson

Held Saturday
Funeral service for Mrs.

Eugene Frierson of Bryan,
jTexas, former Haskell resident
who died in Bryan eany rr-da- y

morning April 17, was held
at the First Presbyterian
Church here at 3 p. m. Satur-
day.

Officiating for the rites were
the Rev. Bill Barnett, pastor
and the Rev. M. D. Rexrode
pastor of tho First Baptist
Church.

Burial was In Willow Ceme-
tery under direction of Holden
Funeral Home.

Death of Mrs. Frierson oc-- ,..

nt 9. n. m. Fridav in
Bryan Clinic Hospital, where
she had been a patient about
15 days.

She was tho former Gernldlne
Lane, born Nov. 11, 1916 at
Munday, Texas, the daughter
of Mr. and Mrs. Noah Lane.
She graduatedfrom Goree High
School in 1935, and attended
Draughon'sBusiness College in
Wichita Falls, and then attend-

ed Texas State Teachers Col-leg- e

from 1937 through 1938,

and Baylor School of Nursing

from 1941 to 1944. She came
with her parents to Haskell in

19On May 8, 1943, sire married
Eugene Frierson at Munday,

Texas. The couple moved to
.Bryan In 1955, vmer. r. F..--

son emereu iwu "-- ge.

Slnco graduation ho has
been employed by the Texas
Transportation Institute of A.

k M. College.
Beforo moving to Bryan, Mrs.

Frierson was superintendentof
nurses at the Haskell County
Hospital while her husbandwas
administrator of the local hos--

P
Mrs. Frierson was a member

of the Presbyterian Church.
She Is survived by her hus-

band and two "f6"?;
Vlckl and Carol Jean,
Bryan; her parents, Mr. ana
ir.'C Mnnh IjinO of HaSKOll;

a sister, Mrs. Mack Due; of
.Dallas; and four Drouiera,

Lane of Fort Worth, Bill Lane
and Buddy Lane of Abilene,
and Kenneth Lane of Wichita

Pallbearers were Ed Hester,
Ira Healer, Belton Duncan,
Theron Cahlll, Dave. Person.
Virgil Bailey, Clinton Herren,
darvln Foote.

SeniorClassTo
PresentTalent
ShowApril 27

Next Monday night in the
Haskell High School auditor-lu-

the Senior Class Is havlncr
its annual talent show. Entries
are invited from Haskell and
all surrounding schools and
towns. The entry fee is 25 cents
per person.

Prizeswill be awarded to the
acts judged first, second and
third place by the judges. First
prlzo Is $7.50, second prize is
$5.00, and third prize $3.00.

The public Is invited to at-
tend this show which will fea-
ture entertainment of varied
types. Tickets will be on sale
at the door for 50 cents for
adults and 25 cents for school--
ago students.

Anyone wishing to enter is
asked to call the high school
office (UN and leave
their name and kind of act to
be presented.

$
S. E Crume of Los Angeles,

Calif., spent the weekendhere
visiting his parents, Mr. and
Mrs. Sam Crume of the High-
way Drive In.

disposed of safely on home
premises.

However, all rubbish to be
hauled away must be placed at
the side of tho streetor alleys
Where it will be accessible to
the ,trucks, city officials ex-

plained.
Postmaster Harold Spain has

HHS StudentHas
Entry In Abilene
ScienceFair

Rodney Davis,
junior in Haskell High School,
received honorable mention on
his project in the Science Fair
held last week In Abilene.

Rodney displayed a radio
controlled model ahplane, and
his exhibit attracted consider-
able interest and was highly
commendedby judges.

Rodney is emoll'ed in physics
durlntr his iunior year. He Is
the son of Mr. and Mrs. Ray-
mond Davis of Haskell.

$

Cub ScoutPack
Meeting Slated
Monday Night

The regular Pack Meeting of
Haskell Cub Scoutswill be held
Monday, April 27, at 7 p. m. In
tho Elementaly School.

This month's 'heme fo.' Cub
Scouts Is "On he Farm," and
fcr Monday night's mesting,
Cubs and patents are asked to
dress as farm workers. A suit-

able prize will be auanicd for
the best costume.

FRC

Building of a new ticket
booth and a concessionbuilding
on Rice Springs Roundup
grounds was authorized at a
meetingof directors of tho Has-kel-l

County Sheriff's Posse
Wednesdaynight of last week.

Directors also discussedplans
for this year's Roundup and
Horse Show, and voted to take
part in the Baird Rodeo pa-

rade on April 30.
,The ticket booth project was

placed in the hands of Brooks
Middieton ana uarom opm,
and they will determine the
type and sixe building to be
erected.

The permanent concessions
building will be a project of
Haskell Jaycees, directors of
the Sheriff's Possegrantingthis;
privilege at the request of Tom
Watson, who represented the
junior chamber'of commerce
at the meeting. Jayceeswill
also assist Posae members in
the sale of tickets for a saddle
to be given away during the
Roundup.

Time for the parado opening
the 1959 Roundup was set for
i n m. on May 14.

Directors also voted that the
Sheriff's Posse would host a
suDDer or meal at 6 p. m. on
opening day of the Roundup
for au vuuung. naing ciuos.
tickets lor. the,supper wilf be
available to the-publi-c at $1.00
each.
ArDlreeteaav
i W0e' eung were

Advertising material for tho
1959 Rice Springs Rounduphas
been distributed over a wide
area, and rules and premium
lists for the rodeo events and
Horse Show have been mailed
to prospective contestants and
exhibitors, as plans for this
year's show moved ahea.l this
week.

Also, supplemental activities
for Western Week are being

Haskell will be approved as
site for storage of a Civil De-
fense emergency hospital, if
necessary can
be made for the storage fa-
cilities required, C. of C. Di-

rector Chos. Swlnson has been
advised.

The Division of Defense and
Disaster Relief at Austin ad-
vised Swlnson that Haskell
could be approvedas a storage
site due to Its location. It is
outside the perimeterof a tar-
get area and would probably
serve as a reception center
for Abilene in event of man-mad- e

disaster.
Facilities required In addition

to storagespace,would Include
a suitable building such as a

been named as general chair-
man of the Clean Up
Serving with him as

will be Roy Ollphant, Mrs.
W .A. Lyles, Mrs. Byron Fra-zle-r,

Jim Alvis, J. M. Craw-
ford, Wix Currie.

Committees appointed to di-

rect the Jn the busi-
ness section include the fol-

lowing :

South side of square, Oscar
Tooley, Morrell Dick.

West side, Sam Parks, Wal-

lace Cox, Jr.
North side, Buster Gholson,

Bill Gattis, Mrs. Hardin Co-fiel-

East side, Jim Byrd,. Mrs.
W. A. Lyles, Mrs. Richard

Bob Wheatley.
Southwest, Clinton Herren,

Virgil Bailey, Jesse Jones.
Northwest, Bill Pogue, Myron

Biard.
Northeast, M. L. Blohm,

George Neely.
Southeast,Grace Blsbee, El-

sie Eastland.

Host For
Of

Haskell Oddfellows will be
host tonight for a
meeting of IOOF lodges of Dis-

trict 30, for the official visit
of Grand Master Roy Kreltz-mel- er

of Pampa, Texas.
A special session of Grand

Lodge will be held, to confer
honors on candidates for Past
Grand and Grand Lodge de-

grees.

Dr. T. W. Williams, Adell
Thomas, Gene Hunter, Shelly
Royall, Fred Gilliam, Myron
Biard, Jetty V. Clare. Mem-
bers of the Rodeo committee
present Included Biard, Brooks
MiddTeton. Royce Adklns, Ru-

dolph Middieton, Paul Allen.

Two womenwere selectedas
members of the new Grand
Jury for the April term of 39th
District Court, sworn in Mon-
day morning by District Judge
Ben Charlie Chapman.

The Grand Jury recessed.
Monday afternoon, after ret-turnl-

three burglary indict-
ments in . connection with re-
cent break-in-s in Haskell and
Welnert.

Named in the three separate
bills was Billy Wayne Howard,
21, of Olney. The Indictments
were based on burglaries of
Wolfe and the Ren-fr-o

Grocery here, and the W.
A. Dutton store in Welnert.

Membersof the currentGrand
Jury, which has Buford Cox
as foreman, are Mrs. R. C.

Holden of Haskell, J. D. Ku- -

i pan, w, a, vggws, Trailer w

Prcss
Many Activities Being Planned
For '59 Roundup,WesternWeek

City-Wid- e Spring

PlansStudiedFor Storing Civil

DefenseEmergencyHospital Here

ScheduledApril 27-M-ay

arrangements

CleanUp

Campaign.

campaign

Bischofhausen,

Oddfellows Lodge
Visit

GrandMaster
(Thursday)

Two Women

Ticket Booth, ConcessionBuilding

Will Be Built On RoundupGrounds

Equipment

rapidly lined up, to present ad-
ditional color and atmosphere
for the annual event.

As the major attraction of
the three-nigh-t Roundup to be
stagedMay 14, 15 and 16, a full
schedule of rodeo events will
be presentedwith the coopera-
tion of Morris Stephens, one of
the best known rodeo produc-
ers In the Southwest.

Stephens will furnish the

school auditorium where the
hospital could be set up if the
need developed.
- No financial obligation is In-

volved on the part of the city
or county In connection with
the emergency operation.

Equipmentfor the emergency
hospital to be stored would In-

clude a 15 kilowatt generator
to be used in event of a power
failure, a 1,500 gallon water
reservoir, and equipment for
a triage room, 200 bed wards,
three operating rooms, clinical
laboratory, X-ra- y room, cen-
tral supply room, sterilizing
room, pharmacy.

After working on the propos-
ed project Wednesday, Swlnson
said the large brick building
formerly occupied by the M
System Supermarket had been
made available as storage
space.

Also, Swinson was given as-
surance that both gyms at the
high school, and lunchroom
would be made available in
case emergency required set-
ting up the hospital.

$

Rev.J. A. Yancy

Funeral Rites

HeldFriday
Rev. J. A. Yancy Sr., 78, re- -'

tired Baptist minister and far' -

mer. died at 3:25 p. m. Wednes
day April 15 at his home in
East Haskell. He had been in
ill health for about 13 months

Funeral for Rev. Yancy was
held at 3 p. m. Friday at the
East Side Baptist Church. Of-

ficiating were the Rev. L. D.
Regeon, pastor, the Rev. H. G.
Hammer, retired Baptist min-
ister of this city, and the Rev.
W. T. Priddy, pastor of the
Mattson Baptist Church.

Burial was in Willow Ceme-
tery under direction of Holden
Funeral Home.

Deceasedwas born Jan. 22,
1881 in Atlanta, Ga. He moved
to Brovv: County when he was
25 year3 old, and served sever-
al churches In that area as
pastor.

He married the former Eliza
May Madison Aug. 7, 1909. at
Burkett. The couple mcved to
Haskell County in 1929 from
Brown County. He served as
pastor for one Haskell County
church prior to his retirement
from the ministry.

Survivors include his wife;
three daughters, Mrs. C. B.
Cagle and Mrs. Sam V. Jordan,
both of Fort Worth, and Mrs.
Taylor Childress of Guymon,
Okla.; two sons, Newton Yancy
of RockCamp, Ohio and James
A. Yanoy Jr., of Washington,
Pa.; one brother, M. H. Yancy
of Atliuta, Ga.; three sisters,
Mrs. Euibf.ra Barker and Mrs.
V'oln Allen of Atlanta, Gu. and
Mrs. Eossic Bell, also of Geor-
gia; 12 grandchildren and one
grent-tmnddnught-

Pallbearers were Thurman
Rhoads, Norman McCain, Lee
Brown, Erby Wolfe, Fred How-
ard, ChesterHodglns. All mem-
bers of the Men's Bible Class
of the East Side Baptls Church
were named as honorary pall-
bearers.

SelectedAs

eller, Ira Short, Bob Guess,
Tolbert Beason, Earnest Wi-
lliams, M. C. Josselet, Morris
Haynes.

Appointed Grand Jury door
bailiff was J. J. Drinnon, with
Truett Cobb and Ewell Lusk
named as riding bailiffs.

PARENTS OF SON
Mr, and Mrs. Cteatus W;

Drinnon of this city are the pa-
rents ot a son, Stephen Wood-ro-

born April 13 in the Has-
kell Hospital. He weighedexact-
ly six pounds. Mrs, Drinnon
la the former Robbie Lou Rob-erso- n.

Grandparentsof the new
arrival are Mr .and Mrs. Thee.
B. Robersonand Mr. and Mm:
Robert Drinnon, all, ctf)Hasfll.
.ureacffaaaparenuu sivvr.
Curtis of Fort City. Art
George",Turnbow of , MtU.

Membersof Grand Jury

' -- 1

70c Per Copy

NUMBER 17

bucking stock for tho major
rodeo events, which will in-

clude bareback bronc riding,
saddle bronc riding, Brahma
bull riding, calf roping and rib-
bon roping.

An additional colorful, feature
will be Cowgirl Barrel Races,
always a popular contest.

Cutting horse contests, both
open and novice, will also be
staged nightly.

The gala RoundupParade,in
which more than a dozenvisit-
ing riding clubs will take part,
will be a feature on the after-
noon of May 14, opening the
three-da-y event.

Horso Show
Separate divisions of the

Roundup will be the Quarter
Horse Show on May 15, Palomi-
no Show and Shetland Pony
Show on May 16.

Advance entries already being
received indicate all divisions
in this year's show will be
at a record high.

The Roundup and all Horse
Show events are being spon-
sored by the Haskell County
Sheriff's Posse.

InterestGainsIn
Western Week

Widespread local interest ia
being shown In plans for West-
ern Week, May 11-1- 6. Dr. T.
W. Williams, general chairman
of the planning committees,
said.

All Haskell citizens will be
expected to wear some type of
Western attire during the
week, with WesternWeek rules
to be enforced by vigilantes
empoweredto hail offendersbe-

fore a prototype of Judge Roy
Bean.

A vacant building on the
square will be headquarters
for Old Timers of this section
who will be invited to meet
here for a reunion during West-
ern Week.

The headquarters building
will also be converted into a
museum for display of Western
relics of all kinds.

Old Fiddlers Contest
An innovation for Western

Week will be on Old Fiddlers
Contest tentatively scheduled
for Fridav afternoon. Mav 15.
Attractlve prizes will be paid
the three best old time musi
cians, and --this event is ex-
pected to attract widespread
interest. Mrs. Luther Burkett is
chairman of this event, and
is being assisted by Lon Pate
and Alfred Force. Old-tim- e fid-
dlers desiring to enter the con-
test should notify Lon Pate at
The Free Press.

A meeting of the Western
Week committee is scheduled
this afternoon, at which time
a detailed,program of all ac-
tivities is to be worked out.

$

Mrs. Montgomery

FuneralRites

ScheduledToday
Mrs. W. A. Montgomery,

member of a prominent farm
family of the Paint Creek com-
munity, died at 4 :00 a. m. Wed-
nesday In the Stamford Sani-
tarium after a critical illness
of several months. Mrs; Mont-
gomery had been In falling
health for some time.

Funeral service for Mrs.
Montgomery will be held at the
First Methodist Church in this,
city at 2:30 p. m. today (Thurs
day), wltn tne Kev. uscar
Bruce, pastor, officiating.

Burial will be in Willow Cem-
etery under direction of Hold-
en Funeral Home.

Mrs. Montgomery was the
former Olive Elizabeth Welch,
born Feb. 18, 1894, in Proctor,
North Carolina, and had lived
in Haskell County since 1908.
She was married to W. A.
Mongomery of Haskell on Dec.
20, 1914, and since then they
had made their home in the
Paint Creek community where
he Is a well-know-n farmer.

Mrs. Montgomery was e

member of the Paint Creel
Methodist Church, and was ac-

tive in the work of her churcj
and in civic and school affain
of the community as long ai
her health permitted.

She was a former schoo
teacher, having taught In tin
Weaver community school i,

number of years airo.
Mrs. Montgomery is survive

by her husband, of Haskell; i

daugnter, Mrs. jpoya vmey o
Grand fraine; a granoaaugn
ter. Elizabeth Cathev of Gran
Prairie; andthree sisters,Mrs
Eiren Reed of Grand Prairie
Mra. Nora Dunn of Strathmorc
Calif., and Mrs. Clyde Gordo;
of Fiamview.

Pallbeai jrs will be
Overton Jr,, Allen Overton, I
vin Overton, J. R. Kuenstle
Buss Hisey, Ray Perry, Al
xsoeii, Aruiur rvauoti.

Mr. and Mrs, John Mc
ana Mrs. Jack Morris

VI VHIIP T(&tojptast week tf. .

.i tajF 9rmm'tr.:mf Mrs.' N.
UTtWs city, "JraCvWHP
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THE HASKELL FREE PRESS
EstablishedJanuaryl, 1886

PUBLISHED EVERY THURSDAY

1&Aecc&Z
JETTY V. CLAKE, Owner and Publisher

ALONZO PATE, Editor

Entered as second-clas-s matter at the postoffice
at Haskell, Texas, under the act of March 3, 1870.

SUBSCRIPTION RATES
Haskell, Throckmorton, Stonewall, Jones

and Knox Counties, 1 Year $2.50
6 Months $1.50

Elsewhere, 1 Year $3.76
6 Months $2.23

NOTICE TO THE PUBLIC Any erroneous re-
flection upon the character, reputation or standing of any
ffrm, Individual or corporation will be gladly corrected
upon being called to the attention of the publishers.

Welcome News To Taxpayers
The CommissionersCourt is to be commended for

up and adopting a reducedbudget covering 1959 operations,

total outlay of some $100,000 under last year's expenditures.
Thi hllHint nroTVu oA uMlh tlin noelclnnna rt fVitint Anll.

tor Coburn after a careful study of anticipated needs and past
expenauures, lists anticipated expendituresof $135,175.16 for
the current year.

If county expensescan be kept within this total, the net
Tesult will be a reduction of $107,115.43 from last year's ex-
penditures of $512,290.50.

This figures a saving of approximately $300 per day in
operating expensesof the county, a saving that will come as
welcome news to county taxpayers.

Springtime Is Clean-U-p Time
The coming of spring brings new beauty to our town

with its myriads of attractive lawns and flower gardens, trees
and shrubbery in a profusion which has earned our community
the reputation of beingone of the "prettiest towns in West Texas."

The spring seasonalso brings the necessityfor a general
town-wid- e clean-u-p to eliminate the harsh vestiges of winter
Tepresentedin the accumulation of rubbish of all kinds, along
with encroaching weeds and other unwanted growth which can
mar the beauty of othenvise attractive surroundings.

The City Council has designatedthe coming week April
27 to May 2 as Spring Clean Up Week, in which the entire
community is asked to cooperate.

a nttie enort on the part of every homeowner is all
that will be required to make their premises more attractive,
enhance the beauty of their neighborhoodand make our entire
town a prettier and more healthful community in which to live.

Clcan-U-p Week should also be observed in the business
section, particularly in the alleys where accumulated trash and
rubbish createnot only an eyesore but a definite fire hazard
as well.

So, while we're about it, let's not put all the burden on
ine nonieuwner in ino resiaentiai areas, let's do some house-cleanin-g

in the downtown area as well.

Legislators Under Pressure
With just about three weeks left in the regular session,

legislators will be under pressure to do many things and do
them fast.

Each day that passes without agreement on financial
mattems heightens the possibility of a special session as soon
as this one ends. j

Many measureswill oc trampled under or pushedaside
until '61. But as Sneakier Wiure-nne- f!nrr nA thn htvioa ,

problem of raising some new money "won't go away, it has
to be faced."

Like every other tax proposal made this session, the
huge "somethingfor everybody" omnibus tax bill recommendedby the House Tax Committee brought howls of protest.

It would raise an estimated $151-millio- n a yearby raisingsome old taxes and placing new taxes on hundreds of items.-Tabbe-

for increasesare natural gas, motor vehicles, cigarettes,
liquor, wine, ,beer licenses.

New targets include hotel rooms, restaurantmeals, ci-gars, chewing tobacco, snuff, aircraft and auto parts, dozens ofluxury items (jewelry, furs, cameras, watches,silver etc.) radioand TV parts, business machines, commercial rentals, club
dues, construction materials, dance studios, reducing salons.Officially, the bill is known ns ihn Tov rvmi ,,,,
stitute for H.B. 727. Unofficially, it's called a lot of other things.

House members showed no more eagerness to rallvbehind this broad-base-d approach than they had for Gov. PriceDaniel's less "spread out" plan.
Reerardlessof th finni fnrm nt tua , khi v. u

individual taxpayer may as well prepare himself for reaching
ww,v.i 11 14 jjuukuiuook 10 1001 ine raise.

W. L. FORE MOVING &
STORAGE

Moving with CareEverywhere
FURNITURE - GRAIN - LIVESTOCK - PIPE

NO JOB TOO LARGE or SMALL

1026 North 6th UNion 4-28-
52
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Buy Your Crop-Ha-il

InsuranceToday
. . . includes fire insurance on

growing crops.
. . . prompt claim payments.
. . . deferred premium at 6

Interest, .

MUTUAL INSORAff CI C(X

m

See CLINTON H. HERREN, Today
General Agent

Box 741 PhoneUNion 50

SEE US ABOUT AUTO, FIRE, LIABILITY, LIFE,m UE CROSSAND BLUE SHIELD INSURANCE"
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Haskell County History
20 Years Ago April 28, 1939
The sum of $263,519 has been

distributed to Haskell County
farmeis during recent weeks
for compliance In the 1939 soil
conservation program, accord-
ing to County Agent G. R.
Schumann.

Mrs. Tommye B. Hawkins,
delegate from the Harmony
Club, attendedthe annual meet-
ing of the State Federation of
Music Clubs in Austin this
week.

Deputy U. S. Marshal Charlie
Brown of, Abilene was here on
businessWednesday,and visit-
ed in the home of his father-in-la-

Mr. and Mrs. R. C.
Whltmire.

O. E. Patterson,F. L. Daugh-crt- y

and R. J. Paxton arc at-
tending the meeting of the
Grand Commandcry in San An-
tonio this week.

Mrs. J. U. Fields and Mrs.
A. H. Wair were in Abilene
Wednesday, attendintr lh nn.
nuat Garden Pilgrimage held
in that city.

Mr. and Mrs. Clvdn Rrissnm
and chikhen of Eastland visft-e- d

relatives and friends here
several days this week.

I. N. Simmons accompanied
his daughter, Mrs. Frank Ju-ncl- l

and baby to OdessaTues-
day. Mis. Junell was returning
to her home in El Paso after a
visit here In the home of her
parents.

M. R. Hemphill of Brown-field- ,
former resident hnrv

was transacting business in
this section this week.

Mrs. John A. Willoughby
went to Wichita Fall's Friday
to spend a few days with Mrs.
Gordon Phillips who is in a
nospuai in mat city.

Mrs. Myrtle Meyer and Miss
Eleanor Footo went to Anthony,
Kans., this weekend to attend
exercises in which Miss Fran-
ces Meyer was presented the
D. A. R. scholarship for out-
standing woik in the high
school in that city.

A ElOUP of 22 business ninl
professional men of Rule met
last week and organized a Ro
tary Club. Elected officers
were Frank, E. Hill, president;
F. E. Gauntt. vice president
and A. J. Mills, secretaryand
treasurer.

30 Years Ago April 25, 1929
A record attendance of 752

was reported at the Methodist
Sunday School last Sunday.

Alfred Pierson and J. B. Post
were Installed as Aldermen at
the meeting of the City Coun-
cil Tuesday afternoon. The
resignation of Marvin H. Post
as city secretary was accept-
ed, and David Perrin was ap
pointed to the post.

Grady Adcock son of J. W.
Adcock of Post, won in the Ju-
nior declamation contest nt
Abilene and:-wil- l go to Austin
where he will compete in the
State League events.

uiarK James, a hrothor nf
Mrs. John Ellis of Haskell,
has been appointed Governoi
General of the Philippine Is
lands. James,a former attor-
ney in Durant, Okla., was rear
ed in Haskell, his father beinp
an earlyday teacher and minis
ter here.

Martin J. Insull of Chicago,
president of the Middle Wesl
Utilities Company, accompan
ed by Jnmes C. Kennedy of
Dallas, president of the South
west Utilities Co., and G. W
Fry of Abilene, president of
West Texas Utilities Co., weievisitors in Haskell Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. J. H. Herring
nam spent severaldays this week on the Clear
Fork fishing. They reported
goou 1UCK.

L. M. Keel of the Powell
community was in town Tues-
day. He stated the rain last
week was light, but' that therewas now sufficient moistureto bring up cotton and feed.

Lankford's Bakery advertised
the following special prices for
the weekend: Rrpnri r. inn.
cup cakes, plain rolls, 5c doz-
en; large fruit pies 15c; regu-
lar Pullman loaf, 5c.

County Agent W .P. Tricereports considerable interestamong farmers in planting im-prov-

varieties of maize inthis county.
A busy week is in prospect

in District Court beginning
Monday, with a number of
criminal casesset for trial dur-ing the week. There is one
murder case, nnnlhm- - i..- -

the operation of a gambling
house, one case involves brib-ery, and violation o the liquor
laws is charged in sevenothercases on the docket.

Jf you would like to do a
little remodelrng or repair-In- g

. . . anything to fix up
your home for summer
living, we can be useful.
Do It yourself or have It
done, we can help with the
financing, especially if you
hesitateto dip Into savings.
Reasonablerates and of
course,prompt service.

THE HASKELL FREE PRESS

50 Years Ago April 24, 1909
Misses SalUoand Coot Hughes,

Annie Ellis and Ella Day spent
Sunday in Stamford.

Dr. Aleck Spencer of Stam-
ford has placed a card in The
Free Pi ess.

The plans for the new Mcth
odlst Cnurch are complete,and
ine on exhibition in the show
window of Giis Evans jewclcry
store.

The cows have to go in the
pens and off the commons to-

day under the ordinance pnss
ed by the City Council. The
Editor has a good old pet cow
and it nearly breaks our heart
to put her in the lot in view
of the fine green glass on the
outside.

Henry Tandy is now with the
Haskell Light plant. We are in-

formed that plans will soon be
made to improve the machin-
ery and the company will be
piepaied to give us better ser-
vice than before.

Rev. L. O. Cunningham and
R. E. Sherrill have returned
from Midland where they at-
tended a meeting of the Pres-
bytery.

O. B. Norman represented
the local lodge as delegate to
the Grand Lodge of the Knights
of Pvthins nt Snn Antnnln.

C. E. Bowci s returned the
early part of the week from
easternmarnets wncre lie pur-
chaseda large stock of season-
able goods.

T. L. Montgomeiy left Inst
week for Galveston where he
will' take a steamer to New
York. He plans to spend the
summer in the north.

Judge Jas. P. Kinnard spent
seveial days this week at

where he was engag-
ed as counsel in some impoi-tan- t

matters in 'the district
com t.

Theic are public enterprises
such as the new Methodist
Church, the sewer system,the
new jail, besides much private
constmction that will place nn
estimated $150,000 in clrcula
tion here as work gets going on
the construction and improve-
ments this spring and summer

60 Years Ago April 29, 1899

We learn that the Haskell,
Tiuockmorton and Seymoui
telephone line has secur-
ed peimanent connection with
the Southwestern Teleohone and
Telegraph Company which has
recently extended its lines to
imuuKmorion. mis connection
will make possible lon dis-
tance telephone service from
mis section to all principal
points in the state.

Messis. John Agnew and
Riley Stephens, with the'r fam-lies- ,

went fishing Monday but
had poor luck.

Dan Couch of the Simmons
College ici..t:'. Abilene, cameup yesterday to see Haskell
friends and to return wilh hit
wife, who came a week earlier.

Fiank Vernon has bought theEly place in the south part of
town.

Bob Dickenson ..,--,

the Indian Tnrritnru thbc.i.
tlrVt AA d. 1 1 ..'r,..wc iic uas oeen ciunng thewinter feeding and lookng af-te-r

his cattle there.
Col. E. H. Carter of the H.

& T. C. Railway land deport-men- t
is here looking after the

company's land interest in this
county.

While Major Smith was driv-
ing out several miles fromtown Tuesday he saw a largo
rattlesnake. Getting out to kill
it without fastening his team,
the horses took fright and ran
Off With the bUCG-V-. smnshlnw o
wheel and othenvise batterimrit up.

D. Jamison of Newcastle,
Penn., who is a laige landown-er in Haskell County, was here
the first of the week looking
after his interests.

J. E. FltzceralH wont i....r.
on Paint Creek a few day
ago and taking a stnnd on the
shoals where he could see fishgoing upstream, killed about
300 pounds of fish, most ofthem being buffalo of large
size. He brought a ot of themm and gave a number of hisneighbors a much appreciatedtreat.

Five families from Wise andMontague Counties arrived herethis week and are looking overthe county with a view of se
in ,?,av.nd bu,ylnK fnrxn lands

to locate.

I Pr. Arthur A. Edwardt
i Optometrist

Telephone UN
106 N. Ave. D HaskeD

HASKELL NATIONAL BANK
--MembeHPHEfc-IrGr -- - . .

PEOPLE,PLACES

AND THINGS
By A. PATE

That yellow catfish
caught by Ross Hemphill re-

cently and which we duly
as quite a feat, can now

be relegated to second place nt
OCSt. And KOSS, Jia ijuuu a noii- -

crman ns he is, can take a
back sent to a couple of fem-

inine anglers.
The two women, Mrs. W. R.

Howoid of Haskell and Mrs.
Lola Kinser of Lubbock, a
beauty operator,snarednot one
- but three big fish that in total
poundnge nmost tripled Hemp-
hill's catch.

The women, fishing out from
Shaw's Camp where Mrs. Shaw
had baited out a trotlinc for
them, caught a and
two other yellow catfish weigh-
ing 16 and 15 pounds respect!
vely.

As a hint to some of these
know-it-al- l fishermen who
Miinnv Viv nni-r- no thn nlllv hnlt
tm t.nl1mt nntflnti thv mlp-h- t

keep in mind that Mrs. Shaw
added the feminine touch in
her selection of bnit. She used
goldfish on the trotlinc!

a

There is no telling how many
20, 30 and even 10 pound fish
linvo lipun rmllpht nut nf the
lake. Whcie they came from is
anybody's guess but the most
likely theory is that they were
already big fellows in Paint
Creek when the lake was built,
then developed rapidly into
monsters.

0 11

Theie's a widely-hel-d belief
among local old-tim- e fisher-
men that a monster fish inhab
its a certain deep pool on Paint
Cieek. "Old Blue" "as he has
been talked about for ycais,
has been snagged a few times
but he's always broken the
stoutestgear used. Tom Clark
and several other dyed-l-n the-wo-

fishcimcn claim to have
had personal encounters with
"Old Blue" but were no match
for the big fellow.

incidentally, we'll add that
Paint Creek is off limits to
fishermen. No hunting or fish-
ing is permitted, and "Old
Blue" is destined for a peace
ful life during the remainder
of his existence in case he Is
more than a legend.

i

There is an eerin etn-- tniri
by oldtimers of a 90.nnnni rich
which drowned a Negro ranch-wago- n

cook back in the early
days.

The ranchwagon had stopped
for an overnight camp at a
bend in the Clear Fork a short
distanceabove where the pres-
ent Wolf Creek ranchhouse now
stands.

When the Negro man had
finished his chores after supper, he took a trotlinc and baitto the river, telling the cow-boy- s

he was going to set the
line in a deep hole in the bendof the river and wouldn't be
back for several hours.

When the Negro was'still absent at daybieak, a searchwas
started. Two cowboys rode tc
the bank of the river and

,

vcmf

Bent.

Here's a brisk

trip the

sitting on thclias they weie
horses looking for signs of the
missing man they were art-le-d

to the Negro fl head
and shouldersbob out of the
water In midstream, then in a

few seconds plunge out of sight
under water acaln.

After this harrowing sight
had been repeated several
times, the cowboys figutod thnt
the Negro hnd become cntang--

led in ins irouinc tmu ui.t..w.
But why was it bobbing up and
down?

One of the men went to the
opposite side of the river nnd
cut the end of the trotlinc. g

to his companion they
tugged and heaved in pulling
out the line and retrieved no'
only the Negro's body but a d

catfish a few hooks
away.

Alley mvui imi .... - -- -
gro, swimming out to check his
line, had caught his jumper on
a hook at about the time the
big fish plunged toward the
bottom, pulling under nnd
drowning the man. Then, as the
big fish continued his efforts
to to the bottom of the pool,
the Ncero's body would bob
under and then up again.

No matter where you go in
these United States,more than
likely you'll l tin acrossa friend
or acquaintanceironj nusKcu.

Had a letter recently from
Iola and Chick Henshaw, who
now live in Glcndalc, Ariz.,
where they own and operate a
uny anu iniic coin operaiea
laundry nnd are doing fine.

They told of attending n re-

vival conducted in Avondale
Ariz., 20 miles from Glendalc,
by Roy Don Rhodes ofHaskell,
a local boy who is makfng a
flnn nrnnrlior. Nppi1l.s.q in rjiv.
it was a veiy pleasant reunion
for the former Haskellltes.

Roy Don, back, for a visit
since then, said he was never
as glad in his life to some-
one from "home" as was
Chick and Iola in Arizona.

A similar Incident happened
in Tacna, Peru, recently. Eddie
Lusk and family went to the
South Anci lean country a few
weeks ngo, where is to work
for a mining company. In a let-
ter lapt week. Eddie told that
among the fiist persons to
greet him and his family were
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Spinks, for
merly of Haskell. Bill is work-
ing for the samecompany and
has been in Peiu for several
years. He Is the son of City
Nightwatchmanand Mrs. Rich-
ard Spinks.

Then, there's the fiiend of
ours we hadn't heard from n
years who now lives in Nan
tucket, Mass., according to a
brief note which read: "Am
sending you a copy of my
hometown weekly."

Separately, we received o
copy of the "Inqulrer and Mirror" published
in the island city of Nantuck
et. Now we get the paper reg
ularly and consider it one oi
the most Interesting and out-
standing publications we re
ceive.

Most striking feature is thrpage size, 22x30 inches. Eacipage has nine columns, and the
overall size is twice that of tinaverage daily newspaper. As

K8' S. .3w t.s. &.
ixv'fAm7v&&y?.
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HASKELL, TEXAS, THURSDAY
an Illustration, one page of Tj)P
rrce ca wouici Do a jmif
lingo In the Inquirer anJ m.p
ror.

Of especial Interest in the Inqulrer nnd Mirror currently an.the news storicfl and pictures
in connection with pians tocelebrating Nantucket's
Annivcmiry. Just in Tovns, men folks of the IMand nrogrowing benrds for the cole-brntio-
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There are 3,425 families llv-in- g

In Haskell County.
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Additional tactical mls3ilo flro
support for the NATO shield
forces. Formerly stationed at
Fort Sill, Okla., the 46th is tho
second unit of its type to be
stationedoutside the continent-
al U. S.

Sp4 Flanary, 24, is the son
of Mr. and Mra. Creed S. Flan-cry- ,

and attended Haskell High
School. His wife, Mary, lives
In Haskell. (U. S. Army Photo.)
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BoatingRules
Of The Road

Tho outboarder should no
more consider boating without a
clear knowledge of tne of
the waterways than a motorist
should drive on a highway when
he does not know the meaning
of signal lights and road courte-
sy.

The Mercury outboard peo-
ple list these easy-to-lear-n

inles:
1. Keep to right when meet-

ing approaching cratt.
2. The boat toeing overtaken

has the light of way.
3. You must give way to any

boat approaching In your dang-ge-r

zone" your right hand
side from dead ahead to slight-
ly more than a right angle.

4. Sailboats have the right
of way over power boats.

5. Fishing boats have the
right of way, but are not allow-
ed to fish in channels or ob-

struct navigation.
6. Boats leaving piers or

.wharveshave no right of way
until clear.

T. Use signals properly: 1
short blast I am directing my
course to the right; 2 short
blasts I am directing my
courseto the left: 3 short blasts

I am proceeding astern (in
reverse); 4 short blasts Dan-
ger! (Can imply emergency,
or indicate inability to under-
stand or comply with signal
received.)

8. Learn your buoys. Mem-
orize "red right returning" so
that the red buoy is on your
right entering channel from
seaward. At night, a fixed red
light has same meaning. A
quick flashing light indicates
caution.

$
O'BREN COUPLE MAKES
TOUR OF 14 STATES

Mr. and Mrs. D. T. Emiore
of O'Brien returned home re-

cently from an extended visit
and tour of 14 states.They vis-
ited relatives in Arkansas and
Missouri and friends in North
Carolina. On the 17-da- y trip
Un.. t...l Till

no-Is- Indiana. Kentucky, Vir- -

glnla, South Carolina, Georgia,
Florida, Alabama, MisslsslDpl
and Louisiana.

$
VISIT IN HOME OF
PARENTS

Mr. and Mrs. Bradley Bu-for- d

and children of Sweet-
water were visitors in the home
of Mrs. Buford's parents,Mr.
and Mrs. Chas. M. Conner dur-
ing the weekend.Mr. Buford is
resident engineer in Sweet-
water for the Stato Highway
Department.
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Cotton Breeding
FarmEstablished

The Texas Planting Spo.i a
soclatlon this week extended an
InvitAtlun to the citizenship of
Haskell County and the adjoin-
ing urea to visit Its new cot-
ton Breeding and Cotton Re-
search Farm located on High-
way 283 one half mile north of
Rulo.

Tlio Texas Planting Seed As-
sociation was organized In 10-1-

and Is owned by cotton fann-
ers of tho Stato of Texas. The
first facilities were constructedat Bryan, Texas where it has
10,000 acres of cotton in Uie
Brazos Rlvoi bottom under
contract. Here a complete cot-
ton breeding program has been
carried on since 1CM3.

In 1951 the association ex-
tended Its cotton breedingpro-
gram to tho Rio Grnnde Vol-
ley and now owns a cotton

Five SchoolsIn

County Compete
In 14JB Events

Five Haskcli County schools
competed in the District U--

University Intorscholastlc Lea-
gue Literary contestheld April
14 at Rochester High School.

rune first places were scored
by students from Mattson
rural high school, while Weln-cr- t

entrants had six. Other
schools competing were Rule,
Rochester and O'Brien. Team
points were not computed by
the contest official's.

Bill Baker, superintendentof
schools at Mattson, served as
Director of the annual contest.

The winners:
High School Junior Girls

Declamation Kathryn Kret- -

schmcr of Mattson, first; Mary
Alice Davis of Welnert, second;
and Nancy Turnbow of Rule,
third.

High School Senior Girls
Declamation Ava Lou Harper
of Rochester, Jan Ousley of
Rule, and Lou Underwood of
O'Brien.

High School Senior Boys
Declamation David Phemistcr
of. Welnert, Danny Walsworth
of O'Brien, and Buddy Williams
of O'Briea.

High School Junior Bovs
Declamation Royce Cox of
O'Brien, and Hugh Peiser of
Mattson.

High School Debate Matt-son'- s

team won by default with
W. L. Holt and Kathryn Ruef-fo- r

prepared for the contest.
Shorthand Dorinda Kret-schm- er

of Mattson, Judy Nor-

man o Rule, and Kathryn
Rueffer of Rule.

High School Number Sense
W. L. Holt of Mattson, W. C.

Davis of Welnert, and Gene
Leonard of Mattson.

High School Extemporaneous!
Boys speecn uanny niane oi
Weinert, and Burlie Peiser of
Mattson.

High School Extemporaneous
Girls Speech Linda Dunnamof
Weinert, Pat LaDuke of O'-

Brien, and Brcnda Campbell of

Mattson. .
Boys Poetry Reading Gene

Leonard of. Mattson, Larry
Campbell of Mattson, and Bob-

by Kreger of Weinert.
Slide Rule Dorinda Kret-schm- er

of Mattson won by de-

fault.
High School Typewriting-San- dra

Grinstcad of Rochester,
Joe Nell Camp of Rochester,
and Mary Beth Cameron of

Rochester.
High School Spelling O'Brien

(Sarah Taylor and Kay Ford).
Rochester(Doris Strickland and
Mary Beth Cameron), and
Welnert (Mary Raynes and
Mary Davis).

Hirii School Ready Writer-s-
Diane Reid of Rochester,Sha-

ron Caddell of Weinert, and
a tic for third Deiween uuu
Underwood of O'Brien and Er-llnd- a

Alexander of Welnert.
Girls Poetry Reading Shir-

ley Stewart of, Mattson, Nell
Rainey of Weinert, and Pat La-Du- ke

of O'Brien.
Number Sense of Grade

School-Li- nda Adams of Weln-

ert, and a tie for secondwith
Yvonno Moeller of Mattson.
Joe Hackney of Welnert and
Wanda Miller of Welnert.

Story Telling-M-ary Yates
of Welnert, Nan Jonesof Rule,

and Yvonne Ross of Sagerton.
Picture Memory Mattson

team (Keith Chapman. Roger
Leonard and Kay Newton),

Rule, (Ronda Stryker, Lynn
Marjorie Langston,

SSBoliey. peryl Oounts and
Glen Davis), O Brlen
(Shirley Johnson, Roxy, Day,

Sandra Walling and Delta Es--

PlJuSor Girls Declamation --
Beth Simmons of Rochester,
CharlenoWood of Rule, and Ja-nic- e

Hertel of Sagerton.
Junior Boys Declamation --

Kenny Young of Rule, Jerry
Wilcox of O'Brien, and George

Rochester.
sXlunlor Girls Declamation

MMdlebrook of O'Brien,--Betty
Connie Carncsof Ride, and An-t- o

Edwards of Weinert.
SubJunlor Boys-K-eith Chap-ma- n

of Mattson, Ray Clark of

Sagerton,and Terry Lee Hester

"WW?IS Sixth Grade Spell.

inRochester team (Rita
wSod and Troverta Posey).
RuUT (Ronda Stryker and Lin-

da Simpson) and Welnert (Do-lore- s

and Dorothy Rftyncs).
Seventh ond Eighth Grade

team (Lnd
Spllng-Wein- ert

Adams aim ""?',,---" andnnin fDelores oujv
Pauletta Cox), and Mattson

(Yvonno Moellor and Shirley

"nlidy Writers Grade School
MoeHer of Mattson,

-Y-vonne
fiUrlev Klose of Mattson, and

WandaMiller of Weinert.
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and Research
Near Rule

m.?.H1,S? ,nnd arch farm
Wcslaco, Tcxns.

y having the two cotton
un(1 cotlon research

establishments at Bryan andwcilaco, the association is ableo carry on a complete cottonbreeding program for souUi
Texas and the Rio GrandeVal-
ley.

In mi the associationhad a
matl amount of seed of itsbreeding material of one of itsnew strains of cotton Uiat In-

dicated that it might be adapt-e-d

to Haskell County and West
Texas. A. R. Eaton of Rulewas contactedand was askedto plant a small acreageo thisnew strain of cotton for obscr-yatlo-n

purposes. Eaton agreed
to plant the seed nnrf na thn
result of this one observationor demonstrationthis new strain
of cotton proved to be adapted
not only to the Rule area but
all of West Texas. This new
strain of cotton was named
Storm King TPSA No. 1.

In 1956 cotton farmers of
West Texas requestedthe Tex-
as Planting Seed Association to
expand its cotton breedingpro-
gram to West Texas. After a
full discussion of this proposed
expansion with cotton produc-
ers of the Lubbock and the
Rule area plans were made to
establish a cotton breeding
mm rcscarcnprogram at Rule.

In 1958 a tract of land was
purchasedon Highway 283, ap-
proximately one mile north of
Rule and constructionof facil-
ities were started and complet-
ed. New facilities will be added
in the future.

In 1958 approximately 5,500
acresof Storm King TPSA No.
1 foundation seed was planted
by membersof. the Rule Co-o- p

Gin Association and the cotton
produced from this block was
ginned on one of the gins own-
ed by the Rule Coop Gin As-
sociation and no other cotton
was ginned in order to keep
the seed pure. During the gin-
ning season the seed produced
from the block of Storm King
TPSA No. 1 was stored in five
large tanks constructedon the
Texas Planting Seed Associa-
tion farm near Rule.

A complete cotton breeding
and researchprogram will be
carried on by the association
on the Rule farm.

A. R. Eaton of Rule Is one
of the directors of the Texas
Planting Seed Association.

Lynn Shaw Is the superin-
tendent of the Rule plant and
farm. We want you to meet
Mr. and Mrs. Shaw and their
three fine sons. The Shaws
live on the farm and a welcome
sign always hangs on their
door.

The Texas Planting Seed As-
sociation is proud of having the
opportunity of being listed as
one of your new business firms,
assistingin the developmentof
agriculture or west Texas.

$

President Henry W. Smith
of the Haskell County Farm
Bureau, C. G. Hammer, C. H.
Herren and County Agent F.
W. Martin attended a district
meeting of Farm Bureau In
Wichita Falls Monday. Heard
during the day's meeting were
reports on Research in Agri-
culture, Blue Cross Reports,
staff reports by Director L. D.
Barbour, and a discussion on
the wheat program. The state
Farm Bureau convention will
be held Nov. 1 at San An-

tonio in the Hilton Hotel.

RaHv Crocker

Pet or

Carton

c l.llav

or

We Them .

All Brands

PricesGood

FREE

GrassProtects

From
Erosion

With the weather warmingup. It is time to be doing some-
thing to help manago spring
rains when they come, accord-
ing to Claude Jr. of
the Soil Service
work unit at Haskell'.

are tne solution
to tho problem of how to man-ag- o

oxcesslvo rainfall on a lot
of farms, according to Thomp-
son.

"Several hundred
aro needed around th0 Haskell
area," said "butmany people consider them
Just a waste of land." Some of
these places that receive extra
water would mak0 good graz-
ing areas but often have crops
damaged or lost by flooding
before they are harvested.The
biggest problem in putting in
a waterway ia selecting theproper vegetation to be grown
in it. The first step in correct-
ing the damage begins when
uie waterway is first built.

The best type, he said, is a
wide flat channel that'll spread
the water and cut out erosion
before it begins. Some water-
ways will have to be shaped
becauseof the erosion that has
already taken place; some will
need to be shaped to hold the
water in the protected area on
flat land; but many only need
permanentvegetationestablish-
ed in them.

The seasonto do shaping on
waterways is in the spring just
before time to do planting. An.
annual forage crop such as Su-
dan, sorghums, or millet should
men be drilled In to help re-
duce erosion until a permanent
cover can be

Shred it or mow it to keep it
from seeding and leave as
much stubble as possible, said

After frost the stub-
ble Is left to provide a dead
litter cover in which to plant
the permanent grass the next
spring. The time of year to
plant permanentgrass,suggests

is January through
the middle of June, with the
early part of this seasonusual-
ly best. Grassessuggested In-

clude K. R. bluestem, sldeoats
grama, buffalo grass, switch-gras- s

and other native grass-
es.

Some farmers in Uie
Soil Dis-

trict are putting In
this spring.

Bill Holt of Mattson Is level-
ing and shaping a waterway
this spring and will drill a
cover crop to protect it until
next February or March.

Another is Calvin Frierson,
a farmer north of Haskell, who
plans to shapea waterway this
spring to serve as an outlet
for terraces and carry water
through a field to a tank. When
it is protected with perennial

he will use it for
grazing along with some other

grass In fields
which join it.

M. H. Sorenson near Matt-
son shapedand seededa water-
way with sudan cover, last
year, with plans to go to per-
manent native grass this
spring.

Other farmers around here
drill annual crops in wide nat-
ural waterways where the slow
flow of water will cause little
erosion.

The most common uses of
waterways, Thompson said, are
to provide outlets for terrace

Half Gallon

Plus

18c
WHsht

1 pound 15c
Club

pound 69c

3 dozen$1

2 17c

for April 24-2-5

TRICE'S
For Your Everyday Needs N. 14th & Ave. I

f AKR MIX box 29c
White, Devil's Food

Foremost

MELL0RINE

K00L AID 6pkgs 25
Carnation

MILK

R. C. COLA
Mariorold.

OLEO
Folger's Maryland

COFFEE
Produce

EGGS
Taste the Purina Makes

BISCUITS

PRESS

Waterways

Damage

Thompson
Conservation

Waterways

waterways

Thompson,

established.

Thompson.

Thompson,

Wichita-Brazo- s

Conservation
waterways

vegetation

permanent

2tallcans29cl
Deposit

cans

Yellow, Marble,

Difference

on steep land and on tight
soils, for dlBjKMial' of storm
runoff In Irrigation systems,
and for the protection of nat-
ural waterways through crop-
land.

To maintain waterways,
Thompson suggeststhis: Graze
it lightly or mow it, clean out
excessiveslltatlon and prevent
accumulation of weeds. A 30
foot strip of grain along the
sides protect the grass from
damage by blowing.

.

ReceivesNews Of
Relative Death
In Tennessee

Mrs. Jim McKennon of Mun-da- y

received a telegram Fri-
day, Apill 17 from her uncle,
Joe Watklns of Chapel Hill,
Tcnn., advising her of the death
of her aunt, Mrs. Jack Brown
on April 15.

Mr. Watkins and Mrs. Mack
Brown arc brother and sister,
respectively,of Mrs. McKennon
and Mrs. Lamiza Brock's late
mother, Mrs. V. L. Brown.

The funeral for Mrs. Mack
Brown was held at 3 p. m.
Thursday, April 16, at the First
Methodist Church in ChapelHill,
xenn., near Nasnvllle.

$,

CARD OF THANKS

We wish to expressour deep-
est appreciation and thanks to
our many neighborsand friends
for their many comforting ex-
pressionsof sympathy through
words, deeds, cards, food, flo-
ral offerings and prayers dur-
ing the lengthy illness and
death of our loved one, Mr. J.
A. Yancy Sr. May the Lord bless
each of you is our sincere
prayer. Mrs. J. A. Yancy and
cnudren. i7p

The

Gospel In Songs
To Be Presented
By ColoredChoir

Tho Independent Baptist
Church Senior Choir will pre-fon- t

The Gospel In Songs in
the form of a musical Saturday
night at the church.

Other guest churchesarc In-
vited and are welcome td
come hear the gospel In song,
and especially the Senior Choir
of Haskcli sing The Elder
Brothers.

AT HIGHWAY PATROL
TRAINING SCHOOL

Billy Ray Luak enteredHigh-wa- y

Patrol training school last
week at Camp Mabry, Austin,
where he will be for approxi
mately three months. Mra.
Lusk and their two children
will stay with her parents in
Floydada while Mr. Lusk is
completing the training course

PAGE THItEtf

O. R Perkins of Burnett,
Texas, was n visitor here tht
week In the homo of Mr. and
Mrs M R, Hemphlir.

Mother's Day

Beauty
Special

A wonderful gift for
mother and one she'll
long appreciate. Make
an appointment today!

$10 Permanents.... $7.SO
Other PermanentsOa

Special

Fifth Street
BeautyCenter

Pho. UN 901 N. Mi

Mr, and Mrs. John Stockton
Have Purchasedand Are Now Operating

Cook'sGrocery& ServiceStation
On Stamford Highway and S. 7th Street

Formerly Operatedby M. Ray

They solicit the continued patronage of
the present customers and invite the general
public to visit them.

Winners
Below you will find the names of the eleven

lucky peopleandwhateachwon during our inspection
days from our list of nationally advertisedmerchan-
dise of quality andstyle:

JOE C. SCHE3TS, First Prize Botany 500 Suit,
59.50 value.

MRS. ALFRED TURNBOW, Second Prize Style-Ma- rt

Suit, 49.50 value.
BEATRICE MOBLEY, Third Prize Pairof Florsheim

Shoes,19.95 value. X

MYL.TA KREGER, Fourth Prize StetsonHat, 15.00
value.

FLOYD COOK, Fifth Prize One Box of 3 Jayson
Shirts,his choice.

BEN BASSING, Sixth Prize Pair Men's Masterbilt
Slacks,14.95 value.

ERNEST PEISER, Seventh Prize McGregor Sport
Shirt, 10.00 value.

CLAY HATTOX, Eighth Prize Moore Hat, 10.00 val.
MRS. MILLER MONTGOMERY, Ninth Prize Pool

Khaki Pantand Shirt, 3.50 and 4.95 values.
C. H. F. MOELLER, Tenth Prize Five Pair Cooper

Sox, 5.00 value.
A. D. FRIERSON,EleventhPrize One All-Sil- k Cava-

lier Tie, 2.50 value.

ThanksA Million - -
We want to expressour sincere thanksfor the

hundredsof peoplewho visited our store during in-

spectiondays. Your compliments,words of praiseand
encouragementhas given us greater determination
andenthusiasmthaneverbeforeto makethis thebest
Man's Store in WestTexas.

We now have many outstandinglines of mer-

chandise that are nationally known and represent
quality andstyleandwill remainalert for other lines
thatwe think will beof interestto you anda credit to
our store.

To thoseof you who helpedto addto the attrac-
tivenessof ourstoreby sendingflowers, we aregrate-
ful. They added much to our openingand will long
beremembered.

HunterMen s Wear
HOME OF THE BEST IN MEN'S WEAR

108 North Avenue D PhoneUNion 88 Haskell, Texas
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Magazine Club
WelcomesTwo
New Members

With Miss Nettie McCollum
as director, the Magazine Club
met April 17 at the club house.

The president, Mrs. R. C.
Couch Sr presided during the
business meeting.

Received into the club as
new members were Mrs. At C.
Williams and Mrs. W. T Evans.

Miss McCollum gave some re-

marks concerning "The need
for more nurses."

Mrs. Clinton Kimbrough. a
registered nurse, and teachei
of the LVN nurses in the Has
kell Hospital, was Introducedas
guest speaker.With great pride
and enthusiasm for her profes-
sion, Mrs. Kimbrough gave a
brief history of nursing. She
stated that the Sistersof Char-
ity started the first musing
school, althoughFlorenceNight-
engale was the first to select
and train nurses. Mrs. Kim-
brough defineda nurse as more
than a person In a white uni-
form. A nurse Is a persontrain
cd to care for and wait upon
the sick. She stated thatin her
opinion the LVN nurses would
be the answer to the nursing
shortage we now experience.

Honored with Life Member-
ships In the club were Miss
Nettie .McCollum. Mrs. Elmer
Turner, Mrs. J. M. Collins,
and the late Mrs. R. L. Harri-
son posthumously.

Members were served sand-
wiches and punch by the host-
esses,Mrs. Bailey Toliver and
Mrs. B. C. Chapman.

Presentfor the meeting other
than those previously mention-
ed, were Mesdames Virgil
Bailey, J. M. Collins, Wallace
Cox Sr.. C. O. Holt, W. E
Huss, C. J. Robinson, Earl
Atchison. J. U. Fields. C. L.
Lewis.-Hl- ll Oates, C. V. Payne,
R. L. Burton, J. P. Payne and
Miss Beryle Boone.

W.T.lLWomen's
Club Elects
New Officers

The West Texas Utilities
Women's Club met April 9 in
the HHS Home EconomicsCo-
ttage for a business meeting
with Ruby Holt ashostess.Bette
Wainscott opened the meeting
and read the minutes In the
absence of Dwanna Klose.

During the businesssession.
election of officers was held
Named to office were the g:

President, Eva Dunnam; vice
president, Grace Atchison: sec-
retary treasurer,Evelyn Cobb;
reporter, Gl'eijna Rhoades.

The president appointed Ger-
tie Waggoner chairman of the
benevolence committee, with
Bette Wainscott and Ruby Holt
assisting. Appointed on the tel-
ephonecommittee was Evelyn
Cobb, chairman, with Pauline
Derr and Jo Tucker assistants.

Refreshmentswere served to
10 members.

Onemothetwill
Free May 9th

be
Us
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CenterPoint HD
Club Given Report
On THDA Meeting

Mis. Marvin L. Walters and
Mrs. Sallle Patterson, deleg-

ate.-? to the District 3 THDA
convention held in Graham
April' 7, gave a very good re-
port to the Center Point H. D.
Club meeting April 16 in the
home of Mis. Albert Hannsz.

Mrs. T. M. Patterson, club
president, called the meeting
to jrcler- - Minutest were read
from the previous meeting.
Mrs. Emma Bland led the sing-
ing, with Mrs. JeanetteFrier-so- n

as pianist.
Mrs. Oris Gibson gave the

Council delegate report. Mrs.
Marvin Walters gave a pro-
gram on Civil Defense Recom-
mendations.

The club members and visit-
ors honored Mrs. Edgbert
Smith with a pink and blue
shower.

Those attending were Mes-
dames Sallle Patterson, Lorene
Fouts. Zada Smith, Julia Gib
son, Virginia Flournoy, A. C.
Denson, Autie Bland, Frances
Bird. Essie Bland, Neveldean
Smith. Emma Bland, Marie
Kohout, Tilda Marugg, and vis-
itors Mrs. Paul Cothron, Mrs.
Marvin Walters, Mrs. W. E.
Johnson, Mrs. Grace Hannsz.
Keith an Charlotte. Mrs. Jean-
ette Frierson and the hostess,
Mrs. Albert Hannsz.

The next meeting will be in
the home of Mrs. A. C. Den-
son May 7.

$

Weinert Future
HomemakersElect
New Officers

On Wednesday, April 15, the
Weinert chapter of Future
Homemakers met in the home-makin- g

department for the
monthly meeting. The program
on Consumer Education war
given by Nell Rainev. Erlindn
Alexander, Mary Nell Rayncs
and Mary Alice Davlj "The
girls gave pointers on how to
buy clothing, food and make-
up

The officers for the comlm.'
year were also elected, as fol-

lows: President, Erllnda Alex-
ander: vice president. Mary
Nell Raynes; secretary-treasurer-,

Beverly York; song lead
er, Patsy Raynes; historian
Sue Sanders: parliamentarian.

er, Yvonne Hawkins.
' ' The chapter parents were
also elected.They are Mr. and

"Mrs. Leonard Al'exandes.

YP&

in Charm...
cotton chiffon,

lized double--

for crease
resistance little

or no ironing.

rown7 navy, lilac,

black. 8 to 20

and customsizes

for the shorter

figure,

I0cto20c.
14.95
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Wonderful Way to Remember
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MRS. DUDLEY DABEKRY

Vanelle Whatley
Is Bride Of'
ShamrockMan

Mr. and Mrs. JamesC. Brad
ley, Pampa, Texas, have an
nounced the marriage of their
daughtei, Vanelle Whatley to
Dudley Daberry, son of Mr.
and Mrs. D. C. Dnberry of
Shamrock, on March 17 In
Stinnett, Toxas.

The bride attended Pampa
High School, and the bride-
groom is a senior in Shamrock
High School. They are making
their home in the Linda Kay
Apartments in Shamrock.

Mr. .and Mrs. Bradley are
former residents of Haskell.

T
PresentedAt
B&PW Club

"What to Take Alone" was
the theme of the style review
ot a Business womun s win .

robe suitable for a trip and
all the social activities arising,
presentea oy tne personality
shoppe ana Cotiela s ueput .
ment Store foi the Business A

Professional Women's Club
Tuesday evening, Aj.j-j- l 21 iu
8 o'clock in the Community
Room of the Haskell Nationa
Bank.

Opal Dotson, commentatorof
the show, stressed qualities ot
the materials, coordination of
costume and accessories,and
the versatility of each cos-
tume.

Madalin Hunt, Lois Jones,
Pauline Baird, Artie Mae Burk-et- t,

Clara Biard, Ethel Kirk-Patric-

Emma Franklin, Marie
Culberth, Donna Thomas and
Grace McKelvain modeled the
proper attire to wear for travel
club meeting, luncheon and
dinner engagements,after five
occasionsand relaxation. Mod
els strolled among the tables
where members and guests
were seated each table being
covered with yellow cloth and
a golden floral arrangement
ai the centerpiece carrying
out the club colors of green and
gold. The Projects Committee,
composed of Leone Pearsey,
Corsie Johnston and Juanita
King, was In charge of the
music, program and social
hour. They were assisted by
Eizabeth Cofleld and Veta
Furrh in presenting the mod-
els.

Nettie McCollum, president,
presided for the businessmeet-
ing when the invitation to at-
tend the May meeting of the
MagazineClub was extendedto
the members of the Business
andProfessionalWomen'sClub.

Dates of Western Week, weie'announcedas May 11-1- 6. The
'endorsement of Avis Deavers
for tWrd vice president of the
Texas Federation of B&PW
Clubs was requested and the
request by wire to our con
gressman. for. 0190011 of the
Equal Legal Rights Amend-men- t

was authorized. .Special
recognition was. given. Mrs.
Roy Johnson,local Chamberof
Commerce .manager upon her
election io membership'in the
American Organization of
Chambers of Commerce Exe-'cutive- 's.

Coffee and cookies were ser-
ved by the hostess committee
io twenty-flv- e . members and
special gests, Mrs. Leon Rob-
ertson, Janice Garrett, Donna
Thomas. Ethel Kirkpatrick,
Marie Culberth and Emma
Franklin.

The next meeting of the club
will be the annual presentation
of the "Woman of the Year"
award under the direction of
the Public Affairs Committee
May 8,

THE HASKELL
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Jetton Family-Reunio-

Held At
Fort Richardson

The children of the late Mr.
and Mrs. W. R. Jetton met at
old Fort Richardson at Jacks-bor-o

Sunday, April 19 for a
family reunion.

The old fort was a large
rock building with everything
convenient for a reunion. It
was a very interesting place,
becauseof the old relics and
collections of the days gone
by. x

Pictures of early Indian tribal
of Texas were on display,
Among them were the picturti
of Satana,Satankand Big Tree
Kiowa and Comanche chiefs";
also Quanah Parker.

Also guns, tommyhawks,arid
battle weapons' of the Flat Top
Mountain Massacre or
Henry Warren's wagon team
stersMay 18, 1871 between Ft.
Richard and Ft. Belknap
Everyone really enjoyed the
day there, and will have their

. reunion mere next year,
There were four new 1959

babiespresent.Church servicer
were observed,and at noon a
bountiful lunch was spread ir
seven brothers and sisters and
their families. One sister, Ruth
Gilbreath of Taft, Calif., was
unable to attend.

Those attending were:
Mr. and Mrs. Marvin Jetton

of Fort Worth, Mr. and Mrs.
T. F. Phegley, Sandra, and
Mary Gall; Mr. and Mrs. Ralph
Jetton, Reese., Charles, Judy.
Robert and Nancy Jane of Ft.
Worth.

Mr. and Mrs. Veldon C. Jet-
ton, Gloria Ann, Weldon Jr..
Kenneth and Jerry Don of
Olney; Mr. and Mrs. Julian
Savage and Kenneth Ray of
Roby; Mr. and Mrs. J. L. Sav-
age Jr., and Don of Genoa.
Texas; Mr. and Mrs. Joe Luna
and Phyllis Ann. Hugo, Okia.;
Mr. and Mrs. Billy Lynn Mor-
row, Forrest and Scott of Cal-li&bu-

Mr. and Mis. Roy Jetton
David and Roger; Mr. and Mrs.
Freddie Jetton and Tommy of
Seagraves,Mr. and Mrs. Joe
Hix of Weinert, Mr. and Mrs.
Wayne Hix of Wichita Falls
Mr. and Mrs. T. W. Jetton of
Weinert, Mr. and Mrs. J. E.
Jetton.and3111 of Weinert, Mr.
and Mrs. Tommy Claik and
WaJe of Electra.

SaladLuncheon
Copipliment To
Bible Classes

The Ruth Bible Class and
the Esther Class of the First
Baptist Church enjoyed a joint
salad luncheon in the home of
Mrs. Nancy Toliver Monday,
April 20. 4

- ; - Z.
Mrs. Toliver welcomed mem--

el A Wtf ey1" Mrs. C,
V. Oates, department superin
tendent; led! ih .prayer.

The EstWer'Classnas recent-l-y
organJzedwJyith,Mrs. Toliveras teacher.''Mrs Wanda Kim-

brough, preside,!!!, Mrs. Ruby
Turner, secretary, and Mrs
Coullla Teague and Mrs. Flo
Henderson!'grollfrrleaders.

Mrs. Toliver and
Mrs. Jfld) Henderson ai'Mrs. Bobble William served

luncheon to Mms ye Bled-- 'soe, guest; Ed Fouts, teacheiC .V. Oates, Gayla Nnnnv
Carolyn Everett, Delight Jones,
Carolyn Reynolds, Ruby Tur-ner-,

Nancy Elliott, Pat Sim
mons. HazoU. Overton. Mavis
MIddleton, Dickey Flipperi
Coullla Teague, Willie Lamnn
Anna Kimbrough and Bcttir
Wainscott.

The May social will' bn In
the home of Mrs, Carolyn Ev-
erett. 1 j

FltM PfWW

Mo&pitai lloteA

The following persons have
as pntlents in the

Sell County Hospital during

the past week:

Mrs. Joe Barnes, Haskell,

mAdlCLn,,Ham, Jayton, surgical.
Mrs. Eugene Ablla, O'Brien,

of

"r? Haskell, med- -

0

1CTommy Whlteficld, Rotan,
of

mSils.nn. C. Montgomery, Has-

kell, medical.
Mrs. T. J. Brown, Rochester,

medical.
Mrs. Douglas Brown, Haskell,

medical.
Wm. H. Brannon, Haskell,

of
medical.

H. D. Griffls, Weinert, mod- -
8

'CA.' L. Shelley, Haskell, mcdl--

Cfll

Mis. Bertha Lawson, Rule
medical

Freddie Wright, Rule, surgi--

Pfll
Francisco Perez, Haskell

medical
Ronnie Wcha. Haskell surgi-

cal.
Delorcs Puslejousky, Stam-

ford, medical.

Dismissed:
Mrs Henry Darden, Haskell;

Cairoll, Harris, Post; Mrs.
Carroll Harris. Post; Henry
Powell, Haskell; Robby Collins
Haskell; Mrs. Jan Espinosa.
Rochester; Mrs. A. R. Story,
Arlington; Elbcit Mapes, Has
kell; Mrs. KUtn Kuynuma, "no-kel- l;

Mrs. R. V. King, Haskell;
Mrs. W. P. Russell. Rochester; a
T. M. Bird. Haskell; Mrs.
Frank Richter. Rule; Annie
Whitnker, Haskell; Mis. Ro
berta Owen, Haskell; Mis. J.
E. Robinson, Haskell; Mrs. Ro-si- e

M. Payne, Gorce; Mrs,
Vernon Mohler, Rule; D. A.
Bandeen, Abilene; John Holm-

es, Haskell; Vlckl Caudlllo,
Haskell; David May, Rule; Tom
Florence, Rule; Jesse Toche,
Abilene; Mrs. W. H. Patsons,
Haskell; Mrs. C. D. Powell,
Oklahoma City; Mrs. T. C.
Epey. Rochester J. R. Mitch-
ell, Haskell; Mrs. Willie Love,
Haskell; Darrcll Davis, Has-

kell; Mrs. Mildred Gauntt,
Stamford; E. D. Allen, Roches-
ter: Karen Adkins, Haskell:
Martha Middleton, Haskell,;
Mis. Willard Free, Gorce: Mrs.
Gene Wood, Munday; Janice
Jones, Rochester; Mrs. John
Coffman, Goree; J. W. Wal-

lace, Jr., Haskell; Mrs. R. I.
Walsworth, O'Brien; R. I
Walsworth, O'Brien; Mrs. Ed
Honea, Haskell; J. M. Diggs,
Haskell; Mrs. C. C. Campbell,
Haskell; Buzzy Smith, Haskell;
Mrs. J. M. Littlefield, Haskell;
Mrs. O. T. Sturdy, Weinert;
John Duncan, Old Glory.

' s

THE VERY NEWEST
The following births were re- -

Tops

CARNATION sheath,a

new cfcverlng print ofj

flowers on satin, elas-tlclz- ed

to throw Its

bouquetof.compllments

to everycurveyou own.

10-1- 6,

Priced

wi In the Haskell County

CXf 'Nathan MU1I-- "

oi La., twin
Pamela Ann, weigh 5

4 ounces, nnd FntiiciaC weighed 0 pomuls and one
April 9, .ounce, bom Woj

Mr. nnd Mrs. A.

den, Haskell, a boy, Kendall

Ray, born April 11, weight 9

pounds, 9 ounces.
Mr. and Mrs. Roy Reynolds
Haskell, a boy, Bobby Gene,

bora April 11, weight 7 pounds,
ounces.

Mr. and Mis. Charles Bates
Haskell, a gir , Cynthia La-vern- e,

born April 14, weight 7

pounds, 5 ounces.
Mr. and Mis. Clcatus Wood-ro-w

Dilnnon of Haskell, a boy,
Stephen Woodrow, born April
13, weight 0 poundt.

Mr. nnd Mrs. Felix Ginnado
Rule, a boy, Fidel Pucntcs,

born April 19, weight 6 pounds,
ounces.

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Rodri-que- z

of O'Brien, a girl, Mar-
garet, born April 18, weight 7

pounds.
Mr. and Mrs. Henry Town-sen- d

Jr., of Rule, a gir . Col.

lcen, born April 20, weight 8

pounds, 7 ounces.
Mr. and Mrs. Leonard Weise

of Haskell, a boy. Tlmmy
Wayne, born April 21, weight 6

pounds, 4 ounces.

In
Mesdames Erma Watson,

Thomas Watson and R. H.
Darnell were in
Saturday, April 18, to attend

morning coffee and bridal
shower honoring Miss Johnnye
Lou Wilson, bride-elec-t of Guy
Ewing, III, also of Brecken-rldee-.

The coffee and shower was
held in the home of Mrs. P.
W. Pitzer Jr. The wedding will
be solemnized on the evening
of Saturday,June 6 in the First
Baptist Church In

$

Let a Free Press Want Ad
clear your store room of ar-

ticles no longer needed.
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GardenClub Stanza m
mvo Qf.ao.Tim. Of (. Vuwersi

;Lrior(iiss
held its first practice flower ' , ,c,rillcl$tn
,.U.., nt in YInc'-nl- l ?,!. I V."- - (ION Ai.li. "
5,' , ....,,.,1" ;;V "Ul'nai division. Jrlure
Jillim uuuuuik mummy, APnl.n ...1.1. HCn Cn.l Cln i.io wiui uoi mm tfi(iuur, na-
tional flower show judge, Stam-
ford, as guest speaker.

The president, Mrs Jnmcs
Crawford, presided ovo

Picrson gave the trca8ureii'fl c'ty nnd Crepott nnd load iiiviUwiU , form, sphtni1
from tnc Vernon nnu Knox City
clubs to attend their flower
shown on April 15 and 29.

Mrs. Ira Hcstei waa chair-ma- n

of the decorating commit-too- ,
Mrs. Howard Perry had

charge of the entries and Is
nlso chairman of a committee
to decorate a downtown build-
ing for Haskell Western Week.

Mrs. Crawford Introduced
Mrs. Stcgner who Is widely
known as on nccerdltcd na
tionnl flower show judge. Mrs.
Stagncr presented an Tnforma- -

Hobby
Club MeetsWith
Mrs. Wallace

The NelghboisHobby Club
met April 15 In the home of
Mis. Julie Wallace "for an all-da-

quilting bee.
The meeting was openedwith

prayer by Pansy Harris.
It was agreed that those re-

ceiving gifts from the club
were to send only one "Thank
You" note to the secretary to
be rend at the next meeting.

A lunch of sandwiches,salad.
nlv ton and noffee wnn sorvorl
to the following: Mesdamesil
luuy iuisk uiunii, "iimill OIUIUI,
Jolene Grand, Donna Thomas,
Pansy Harris, Winnie Hodgln,
Lora Mae Mulllns, Mae Broc':.
Julia Calloway, OpalAlsabrook,
Julie "Wallace, a new member,
Mrs. Velma Hamilton and a
visitor, Mrs. Joyce Hagcr of
Mattson.

Everyone reported an enjoy-
able day. The next meeting
will be May 20 In the home of
Mrs. Donna Thomas.

ronj :u m il m j ifitl
wmmmmmmmimeMmimmmmummaiE&m&M

COMPOUAOBO WITH PRECISION BY EXPl?.

JACK PIPPIN
Graduate Registered Pharmacist

Phono with Complete Confidence

Twenty-Fou- r Hour PrescriptionSei

Prescriptions Delivered to Your

i Complete Lino Sick Room Supplitt

Haskell Pharmac
PrescriptionDelivery Service

for SummerFun by

efastlcUedbtnrn.

$13.95
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MISS MADA LIN HUNT

Miss Madalin Hunt Is Elected
To Advisory Board Of TCTA

Miss Madalin Hunt, teacher
in the Haskell EVementary
School was elected to the nd-vlso-

board of Texas Cla."5-roo-

TeachersAssociation in
the StateConventionheld in Uie
Adolphus Hotel In Dallas April
17-1- She will represent dis-

trict Seven of TCTA.

Miss Hunt received her Bach-
elor of Music degree from Tex-
as Christian University, her B.
S. and Master's degrees from
Hardin - Simmons University.
She is now working on her doc-

tor's degree.
In 1955 she was a member of

the University of Texas Seminar-Co-

nference on Secondary
Education in Europe. She made
her second trip to Europe in
the summer of 1958 for study,
and attend the World's Exhibi-
tion in Brussels.

Miss Hunt Is a charter mem-
ber of, the..Haskell Classroom
TeachersAssociation. She ser
ved,as, the first .president .of
th AMfocftttOn, TtrW was tfect?
cd to serve a --second term. In
1957 she was a member of the
State nominating committee.
She has served as --vice presi-
dent of the Oil Belt District
ClassroomTeachersUnit. The
past year she has served as
membership chairman In Dls-tii- ct

Seven.
She 1b a charter memberof

Beta Chi Chapter of Delta Kap-
pa Gamma, and past president
oi tnc chapter. She has held
several offices In tho Haskell
County Chapter of American
Association o University Wo
men, sne is now serving as
membership chairman of the
B&PW Club. She is a member
of Texas State Teachers Asso-
ciation, and a life memberof
NEA. She also holds member

mssmatmightbe a fire hazard.

w.?4.A

. .

R

mo '... v-- r '' j.- -. ff'r- - Fr

S

h ii

ship In the Haskell Chamber
of Commerce.

Durward Grubbs, Science
teacher in Lincoln Junior High
School, Abilene, was elected
president of Texas Classroom
Teachers. Miss Antoinette Mill-
er of Houston will serve as
vice president.

Texas Classroom Teacheis
Association now has 21.000
members and 191 affiliates in
Texas.

Sen. Ralph Yarborough was
guest speaker for the banquet
held Saturday night, Apiil IS

$

Mrs. ParsonsIs
Party HonoreeOn
80th Birthday

Mrs. W. H. Parsons, long-

time resident of this city, was
honored with a birthday party
Sunday, April 19,at her home
In this. $ltyAonUi$ Occasion of
her 80th birthday,

More than 100 relatives,
friends and acquaintancescall
ed during the day, and Mrs.
Parsond was the recipient of
many tfts, along with cards
and messagesextending good
wishes.

Among immediate relatives
present from out of town were
her son, E. O. Parsons and
children, Linda, David, Ricky
nnd Jlmmv Parsons.

Others attending from
were Miss Marie PI-in- H

nf Post. Chick Smith of

Abilene, Sandra Adkins of

Graham.
.

The town of Sagerton at one

time boasted a weekly news
paper, The bun,

TART NOW!
What You CanDo for "Clean-U- p Week"

CITY-WID- E CAMPAIGN
N out basements, attics, garages, etc., of

earyour yards or lots of all rubbish.

n shrubbery,hedges,$ta 'Repair

'Mi "iU

and paint

off going
for dM!jBi$Moevs next

i.reafefltrinceAr1e
eeb windows and;ffld?walks

fronunaigfitTy rubbish
iff ." '.

iHfpw.crarWl w UfnnK If-A-
v Kifrdih back

KavVantjlota
hf" Vf.--J

'" 811 avhnyk, l,wl w4-o-l nVmfniners.w ev-- an uiuocu uicvai vv.
SE HELP CLEAN UP YOUR CITY!

avcrtiaement is sponsoredby the City of Haskell)
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PianoAuditions ScheduledHere
For StudentsFrom ThreeTowns

Announcement was made to-
day by Mrs. Hubert Bell, chair-ma- n

of the local Audition Cen-ter that piano auditions will
e held In the sanctuary of the

1'irst Methodist Church, Friday
nnd Saturday,April 2-- and 25.

Approximately 35 studentsfrom Haskell, Rule and Knox
City will paitlclpatc. Piano
learnersholding National Guild
membershipand cnteilng stu-
dents for participation arc:
Mrs Mary Gibson of Rule.
Mi 8 E Q. Warren of Knox
City, Mis J. F. Cadenhcad and
Mrs Bell of Haskell.

Mrs. Bell stated that theGuild judge who is to nirlve
Thursday aftcinoon is one of
tnc most outstanding In the
fie d She is Mrs. Margaret
Qulnn-Fo- x of Chicago, 111.

Mrs. Toliver
Hosts Meeting
Of H. D. Club

Mrs J. L. Toliver was host-
ess to the JosseletHome Dem-
onstration Club Apiil 14.

Mrs Martin Rucffer opened
the program with the T.H.D.A.
prayer Mis Paul Cothron gave
the "Thought for the Day."

Mrs. Laton Robeitson, club
secretary, called the roll with
membersanswering with "My
Favorite Color."

The recieation chairman,
Mis. M L. Walters, had sever
al games and songs. Grouns
were given a sack of odds and
ends from which a spring bon-
net was constructedand mod
eled.

Mrs. J. L .Toliver showed the
members through her new
home, nn Interest of all club
women.

Those present for the meet-
ing were Mrs. Raymond Pick-
ering of Lubbock, Mesdames
Martin Rueffer. Carl Bailey,
C. A. Thomas, M. L. Walters,
Laton Robertson, J. P. Perrin,
Paul Cothron, Stella Josselet,
and the hostess, Mrs. Toliver.

4.

Central Baptist
Girls Auxiliary
MeetsMonday

The G. A.- - Girls of tho Cen-
tral Baptist Church met In the
church auditorium Monday,
April 13, with Mrs. Haynes as
their new leader.

Principal' business was the
election of new officers for the
current year.

Members voted to take re--,
freshmentsto the men working
on the-- new church building
Friday after school. The mo-
tion was approved.

$

Trinity Ladies
Society To Have
Mission Study,

The Trinity Ladles Society
will have a Mission Study on
"North American Neighbors,"
April 30th at the Trinity Luth-era- n

Church. The time is from
10 a. m. to 4 p. m. Everyone is
urged to come and bring a
sack lunch for the noon meal.
Mrs. Martin Rueffer, chairman
of the Missionary Education
Department will be iu charge
of the program dining the
day.

j
CARD OF THANKS

We wish to expressour sin-

cere thanks and appreciation
forthe many kind words and
deeds expressed during the
loss of our mother and grand-
mother, Mrs. Annie Hallmaik
May God bless each of you.
The Hallmark family. 17c

I

Mrs. Qulnn-Fo-x Is a graduate
of Chicago Musical College In
College and Normal' Depart-
ments, and winner of free pi-
ano scholarship In piano com-
petitive examination.

She conducted her own stu-
dio for many years nnd hasmany studentsnow in profess-
ional positions. She was em-
ployed by the Chicago Board of
Education (music division) as
Clns3 Pluno Teacher In the
Chicago Public Schools. At
picscnt she is tho Chicago Dis-tii- ct

Counsellor of the Illinois
Federation of Music Clubs.

ResultsListed
In IL District
Literary Events

Five schools competed In the
distllct Intcrscholfistln Luninin
literary events held April 11 in
Haskell, under the supervision
of Principal J. W. Simpson of
Stamford, director general of
the meet.

First place winners in senior
declamation, poetry reading,
extemporaneous speech, and
fiist through third place win-nor- s

In shorthand, typewriting,
slide rule and number sense
will go on to further competi-
tion, going to regional meet at
Lubbock April 24-2- 5, Simpson
said. The other literary con
tests do not go beyond the
district level.

The results:
Poetry reading, girls: Anne

Hudson, Stamford, first; Mar-
tha Gage, Hamlin, second, and
Nancy Dixon, Anson, thiid.

Poetry reading, boys: Pat
Bonds, Stamford; Paul Cooper,
Haskell; and Dudley Griggs
Hamlin.

Extemporaneousspeech, boys:
Jimmy Vaughter, Haskell;

Jody Kennedy, Haskell; and
Jet Bartlett, Anson.

Extemporaneous speech,
girls: Betty Cole, Anson; Pat-
sy Jones, Anson; Betty Buer-
ger, Haskell.

Typewriting: Syh'ia Willett
Seymour; Dorothea Rueffer,
Haskell: Martha Holland, Stam-
ford.

Shorthand: Nancy Dicken-
son, Stamford; Nancy Johnson,
Stamford; Judy Bibb, Sey
mour.
,, Slide rule : : Douglas Beggs
Stamford; Gene ;Murff, Ham
liri-- ; Wesley Ackjln, Hamlin.

"Number sense: Jerry Crow-
ley, Hamlin; Wayne Boatrlght,
Hamlin;- - Patricia Cole, Stam--

Declamation, . ,boys : Danny
McCurdy, Hamlin; Gene Doug-las-i

Seymour;'.and Jackie
Blankenship, Anson.

Declamation, girls:. Patsy
Greenway, Stamford; Nancy
McCurdy, Seymour; Cynthia
Patterson, Hamlin.

Declamation, junior girls :

Jan Larson, Seymour; Scotty
Pryor, Stamford; Betty Wilk-ins- ,

Stamford.
Spelling: Stamford (Celeste

Craig and Jane Smith); Sey
mour (Sue WJlIet and Sylvia
Willet); and Anson (Wayne
Propst and Brownie Addison).

$

CARD OF THANKS
We wish to expressour thanks

and appreciation for the many
kindnesses shown during the
Illness of Mr. T. M. Bird and
Joan Holmes. Especially do
we want to thank the doctors
and nurses.May God blesseach
of you. The family of T. M.
Bird. ' 17p

$

Kiowa Peak .near the north-
west corner of Haskell County,
has an elevation of 2,000 feet.

WHILEYOU ARE . . .

CLEANING -- UP
PAINTING -- UP

FIXING -- UP

Don't forget your clothes.
Qur cleaning facilitiesare
gearedto clean,work clothes--'

and professional uniforms,'
aswell asfragiledressesand

"table linens. ' I
i

Our dry cleaning, plant,js
known for, its;' gentlytfrpr--.
ough cleaning. Indiyidual
attention is givep;;tdfcfch
order, yet cost. no-mor- f

so.cleanout yourclosets-an-d

senti them to us. ..
.

'I V

BIARD'S CLEANERS
ServiceThat Satisfies

MYRON BIARD, Owner -- .

115 North Ave. E Haskell, Texas

New Life For You
Theme Of Baptist
Revival In Rule

New life for you can be had
in the Revival Meeting at the
Sweet Home Baptist Church In
Rule, Pastor R. N. Tucker
stated in announcing April 20
to May 3 as dates for the re
vival.

Services will be held each
evening, with prayer meeting
at 7 p. m. and preaching at
7:30.

The Rev. JamesA. Crlswell
will do the preaching. He Is an
outstanding preacher, and has
held pastoratesin Chalk, Texas,
Eldorado und Headrick, Okla.,
and presently is pastor of the
Lake Cieek Baptist Church in
Granite, Okla.

ft

CHRISTIAN CHURCH NOTES

The Lord's Day, April 28,
1959:

Bible School at 9:45 a. m
Classes for all ages. Dennis
Ratliff Is superintendent and
Eula Faye Crawford is Pri
mary superintendent.The lesson
will be: "The Rise of David."

10:15 a m. Worship and
Communion service. The morn-
ing message will be: "We
Walk by Faith and Not by
Sight."

5:15 p. m. Youth meeting at
the church Pinkie Ratliff Is to
furnish the refreshments.

6:30 p. m Evening service.
Wednesday at 7:30 p. m. the

church will meet at the home
of Miss May Fields at 401 N
Ave. F for cottage prayer
meeting.

You are cordially invited to
attend a church which Is fol
lowing the New Testament pat-
tern.

Guy I. Harris, Minister.
S

WEEKEND GUESTS IN
GASTON HATTOX HOME

Mr. and Mrs. Kendall Hen-
derson and daughters, Sherrie
and Denise, of Austin, were
weekendguests In the homeof
their patents and grandparents,
Mr. and Mrs. Gaston Hattox.

Side of

HHS Will Have
Iwo StudentsAt
Girls State

Haskell High School will
have two representatives at
Girls State in Austin June 11-2- 0,

as the result of additional
sponsorship by the Progres-
sive Study Club and Mr. and
Mrs. Chas. M. Conner, through
the local Auxiliary of the Am-
erican Legion

Recently named as HHS rep-
resentative was Suzanne Weav
er, with Gail Ratliff as alter-
nate.

Under the additional spon-shi- p

announced this week, Bar-
bara Jean Elliott has been se-
lected as Girls State lepresen-tatlve-,

with Kay Culbertson as
alternate.

Girls selected to attend the
Legion Auxlliaiy - sponsored
course in governmentand citi-
zenship are chosen bv tho on--

tire faculty of Haskell Hitrh
School.

Miss Elliott, a junior, is the
daughter of Mr. and Mrs Jean
Elliott. She is a majorette In
the HHS Band this year and
has played the oboe and clari-
net In the band for three years.
She was chosen Basketball
Sweetheartthis year. She is a
member and vice president of
Future Nurses,also vice presi

IS
Insurance

County

4-26-46

ONLY
SALE STARTSTODAY TIME SPRING

CLEANUP WEEK APRIL

iS
GARDEN HOE. Reg. 1.98,

on sale $1.55
14-TOO- BOW RAKE.

Reg. 2.29, $1.77

LONG
SHOVEL. Reg. 2.49,

$1.97

STEEL WHEELBARROW.
Reg. 10.95 $7.77

TANK
SPRAYER
Reg. 9.98
val. on
sale

LAWN SUPPLIES

IT

Haskell

HOSE NOZZLE.
Reg. val.

50-F- T. GARDEN
2.49 value. 5 year
guarantee $1.57

FERTILIZER SPREADER.
Reg. 7.75, $5.88

BIG 22"
& Stratton en-

gine, only

REVOLVING

LER.-'Re-g lrl9
val. Reachesdi
ameterofS4
feet, now' ....;

GRASS-- SHEARS, renter
tl.19 value,

19-P- C.
$2-2-8

a.pn TRMPEREDALUM- -

Viltft

TVTfur. SET. rff '!)
to SPIN

ALUMINUM PLtATF.OBM
-- STEPLADDERS:;'

aiie

West

PAGE FIVE

dent of the Spanish and
a member of Future Homemak-er-s

of America. She is active
in Uie Methodist Church,
sings in the church and

as an officer In tho
and district

Youth Fellowship.
Culbertson, alternate,a

popular and talentedjunior, is
the daughter of Mr. nnd Mrs.
E. H. She has been
a member of the HHS

years, a Flag Twirler In
1958-59- . membpr of the Future
Homemakers years and

pianist In her sophomore
nnd junior year, is n member
of the Future Teachers and
Library Club nnd a
member and secretaryof the
Spanish Club two years. A
gifted musician sings and
plays the piano

4

GUESTS IN HOME
OF MRS. IIELLUMS

Mrs. W D Heliums had as
guests In her during the
weekend, her daughter
Wynelle Heliums,
by Mrs. B. M. Whiteker and
daughter Marjorie, all of Dal-
las.

Is neighbor .'ecelvinET
social security cherks? If so,
you may be temnted to on
him for advice However,
case Is different so the best
thing to do Is ask your own
questionsby writing the Abileno
social serurity office.

TIME!
secure Hail on your

grain crops. rates
are lower this year. See

CAHILL & DUNCAN AGENCY
306 North First Street Pho.

9 DAYS
mqvjfsiLt

IN FOR THE
27th - MAY 2nd

now for .

now ... .

HANDLE UTILITY

now

val., now ...

now
for .. $6.88

BRASS
69c now 44c

HOSE.
-

now

LAWN MOWER.
Briggs

now for . $59.95

LAWN SPRINK--

n6w"...(

88c

88c

SOCKET SEJTvm.

, .V.. -- .&.... .

Square

nPF

choir,

Methodist

Culbertson.

accompanied

lllliSIiSPECIAL BUYS
5-L- GRASS SEED $1.88
STEEL LAWN RAKE .

SPONGE MOP. Regular
1.98 value, $1.27

OTHER VALUES
OVAL PLASTIC CLOTHES

BASKET. Reg. 2.69
val., only . . $1.46

IRONING BOARD PAD &
COVER with free iron
rest ,

- QT. PLASTIC PAIL.
Reg. 1.19, .. . .

FIELDER'S
GLOVE. Reg. 6.95
val. Mde' gen-
uine cdwhidp.
now

Club

First

serves
local

Miss

Band
three

three
FHA

been

Kay

home
Mlsa

your

rely
each

to

UN

m

77c

now

now for

99

12
now 76c

of

X $5.88
IN

25' SEWER AND WASTE
CLEANING ROD 99c

BIGT2,4" BARBECUE GRILL i

Withhflf6d and electric r

spit. Reug22;5Vnow $14.9

WHITE UTILITY PAINT.V xj ,
etf J&frv! ho'w ... $2.27

7';nPAJN? ROLLER ,SET. v ' I
Re'ff. 2.29. now $1.88

RAR.1LO r YKii
Limit-on-

e Vcwftp- - 5V-F- T,

WEEKEND

$1.47 SjteASfcQD&WMO

fc CASTING 'REELM
14.95 Val. .. $7.88

t. . .

3H

ShermansBargain Dept
Haskell Texas
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DY MILDRED GUESS

Attend Funeral of
Former Resident

Mr. and Mrs. VJ B. Guess
attended the funeral seivices
of J. M. Martin Monday April
20 at Highland Heights Baptist
Church in Wichita Falls.

Mr. Martin. 86, died Friday,
April 17 at Ids home In Wichita
Falls. He had been making his
homo with a son, Foshay Mar-
tin and family, since retiring
from the grocery business he
had operated In Weinert from
1933 to 1951.

He was a deaconand charter
member of Highland Heights
Baptist Church. Mr Martin
first went to Wichita Falls in
1911 and worked for C D.
Shambunrer and Moor nirh.
olt Lumber Co. until moving
to Weinert in 1911.

The Rev. Dean Newberry,
pastor of Highland Heights
Baptist church, officiated for
the funeral rites. Burial was
in Rosemont Cemetery

Surviving are four sons, Fosh-
ay, Basil and Ray Martin of
Wichita Falls, Roy Martin of
Dallas: and two daughters,
Ruby Lee and Katherine Mar-
tin of Wichita Falls and Dal-
las.

Re-i-- Schedules
Special Night

Old Fashioned Revival Night
will be held Friday evening at
Weinert Baptist Church at 8
p. m.

Members are asked to dress
in keeping with the theme
and bring lamps and lanternsto use in place of electricity.'
Old hymns will be sung withorgan music.

This special emphasistoward
uie - gooa om days" is in con-
nection with the week long

no wi nprogresswith the
Rev. Jimmy Burleson of Abi-
lene preaching. Singing is un-
der leadership of Billy Alexan-
der of Abilene. Oiganist is Mrs.
R. C. Liles. Everyone is invit-
ed.

Locals
Mrs. Marcus Gentry of Okla-

homa City brought her mother,
Mrs. Wm. Gilbreath home after
a few weeks visit. Ray Gil-breat- h

was also a guest in the
Mathison home Saturday and
Sunday.

Nadine Weinert of Snvder.
visited her parents, Mr and
Mrs. P. F. Weinert and Harlan
over the weekend.

Sgt. Billy Oman of Fort
Hood visited his parents, Mr.
and Mrs. Frank Oman and
grandmother, Mrs. C. F. Oman '

during the weekend. i

Mr. and Mrs. Tillman Hub-
bard entertained their son, Till-ma- n

Jr. and family from Fort.
worm, aunaay.

Pvt. Raymond Boykin of Ft.
Bennlng, Ga.. visited his pa-
rents, Mr. and Mrs. M. R. Boy-ki- n

during the weekend.
Mr. and Mrs R. H. Jones

entertained their son Arnold
Jones of Wichita Falls during
the weekend.

Mrs. G. C. Newsom returned
home after a weeks visit with
her daughter and family. Mr.
and Mrs. Raymond Jones in
onyaer.

-- -

IIASKELL VISITORS

Mr. and Mrs. Don Chitwood
and daughter Janie of Los duc-
es. N M., were visitors in the
home of his aunt, Mrs. J. L.
Dilbeck Monday.

Western
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sm-iHi-N

CONSOLE

:' TRUETONE
TV

17" (diag. meas.) screen.
Weighsbut 38 lbs. Anten-
na folds into handle.20C3900

Phone 4-22-36
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Klngsville, Texas (FHTNC)
Arvln H. Jr., air-

man, USN, son of Mr. and Mrs.
Arvln H. Lindsey of Stamford,
takes the oath of. allegiance

Paint Creek . . .

Community News
BY MRS. GENE OVERTON

Paint Creek is a poorer com-
munity, and a weaker com-
munity this week. When we lose
people like Mrs. W. A. Mont-
gomery, everyone from the
oldest to the newest baby has
lost a beloved friend.

No one had as mnjjy
as 'Gomery. "Very few

babies born in Paint Creek in
the last 20 years have not worn
a pair of booties, a swentpr. or
a cap crocheted by her. Even
our youngest baby, little David
LeFevre wears a little pair of
shoesshe made. She sent them
to him from her hospital room.

we aon i nave many people
in our busy world today who
take time to each
new baby, who always remem-
ber everyone's birthday or Ill-

ness with a card or note, who
always tells you she enjoyed
vour song, and who can grow
flowers when no one else can.
Once, I remember when 'Gom-
ery planted some bulbs, and
to mark the place where she
had planted eachone, shebroke
off some switches from a near-
by bush and made stakes. Do
you know, not only the bulbs-cam-

up and grew, but some
of the stakes took root and
grew, too.

To Arthur and Beryl, Boyd
and Elizabeth we all want to
expies.s our dfepest sympathy
for your great loss. But really
'Gomerv's death is such a loss
to us all, that we extend our
sympathy to everyone In Paint
Creek. Whethershewas "Ollie,"
your sisier or sister-i-n law or
close friend, or "Miss Ollie,"
your former school teacher, or
"Mrs. Montgomery", your
friend at the Methodist Church,
or just 'Gomery, your dear
neighbor and close friend of
your may we extend
to you our sympathy, because
there'll never be anyone who
can take her place.

Superintendent Pat Morrison
has announced the honor stu-
dents in the graduating class.
In the SeniorClassSue Watson
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Ar-
thur Watson is the valedictor-
ian with a four year average
ff 91.83. Barbara Grand, the
daughter of Mr. and Mis. John
Grand is the salutatorian with
an averageof 91.04. and Jimmy
Griffith son of Mr. and Mrs.

Prices fuel. Fed. Tax, warranty
a all parts, tubes (incl. Pie. Tube).

BIG SCREEN

Portabl
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SAVE
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South Sid: of

upon for six years
while serving at the Naval
Auxiliary Air Station at Kings-vlil- e.

Hi3 Commanding Officer
Capt. Wm. A. Sullivan, admin
istcrcd the oath March 19.

W. B. Griffith is third high
with an avetage of, 91.36.

In the 8th Grade, the honor
students are valedictorian,
Paulette Fischer ,wlth an aver-
age of 95.85. Paulette is the
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Paul
Fischer. Jeff Smith, son of Mr.
and Mrs. Woodrow Smith, is
salutatorian with an average
of 93.71, and Carolyn Liven-goo- d,

daughterof Mr. and Mrs.
Durward is third
with an averageof 93.14. These
8th Gradeaveragesare for only
a year and not for all the ele
mentary grades.

The BaDtist Revival olnsorl
Sunday evening. Rev. J. B.
Rutledge from Hugo, Okla.,
was the evangelist and Rev.
Vern Ellis lead the song ser-
vices and sang the specials.
Joan Griffith played the piano.

Jimmy Griffith, Mike Over
ton and Gene Overton were In
College Station last week end
for High School Day.

Mr. and Mrs. Glen Berry,
Glenna and Mike from Stam-
ford spent Sunday with her
parents, Mr. and Mrs. W. B.
Griffith.

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Overton
Sr. returned Wednesday'from
Petersburgwhere they went to
see Mrs. Overton's sister, Mrs.
Catherine Terry. Mrs. Terry
returned home with them for
a visit.

Mr. and Mrs. R. J. Miles,
Joel and Sue have moved from
the Owen Cox farm to one of
the Fielding in
Haskell. Joel and Sue are com-
muting to school

Curtis Cox is working on the
Cox houseandwill move to our
community when it is ready.

Mina Griffith was at home
with her parents, Mr. and Mrs.
Bill Griffith over the weekend
from her studies at Hendricks
Hospital Nursing School.

Mr. and Mrs. Jess Mlckler
had their children home for the
weekend. Mr. and Mrs. Phil
Williams from Lubbock, Mr.
and Mrs. JamesRoss Mlckler
and children from Abilene, Mr.
and Mrs. Bob Mlckler and
children from Stamford and
Mr. and Mrs. Twain Mlckler
and children from Veda's Camp
all spent Sunday with the
MIcklers.

Jimmy and Freddie Shaw of

TRUETONE 21

$14277

lAStNAl
MIASHREMIMT

16888

EASY TERMS
Modern "Super Thinline Styling" In
beautiful mahogany finish! 21" (diag.
meas.) aluminhed picture cube. Tinted
glass! "Surge Check" tube saver adds
years of life to set! 2OCI00O
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LYNN & ALLEN RIEVES

UNion

Lindsey

"chil-
dren"

remember

children,

Square

Livengood

apartments

Haskell

Midland are spendingthe week
at home with their parents,
Mr. and Mrs. Fred Shaw Sr.,
and Mike.

Mr. and Mrs. E. A. Howard
from San Angelo and Mr. and
Mrs. Seth and children from
Abilene spent the weekend with
their parents, Mr. and Mrs
Harvey Terrell, and attended
church at tho Baptist Church.

Tanls Smith and La Junn
Goodman from Stamford visit-
ed Paint Creek school Thurs-
day and Friday while Stamford
was dismissed for spring

Clara Ann Fischer, student
at Cisco Junior College spent
Inst weekend at home with Mr
and Mrs. Paul Fischer, Paul-
ette and Margaret.

Eddie Lee Thane is taking
his basic Army training at Fort
Chaffee, Ark. Eddie Lee Is the
son of Mr. and Mrs. Manuel
Thane.

Ray Hughes, Yeoman third
class in the Navy is serving
aboardthe submarineUSS Crc-vall- c,

operating with the U. S.
AUantic Fleet out of New Lon-
don, Conn. On March 8th, the
Crevalle completed her 6,000th
dive since her recommisslon
ing In April 1957.

Mis. left Inst
for

i...,,tn ttrimrn she will loin
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RoyalTwirl
DEL MONTE

TomatoJuice
INSTANT

Whipped
FROZEN

Kimbell, -- Lb.

TEA
Kimbell Vienna

SAUSAGE
Kimbell Sliced

BEETS
Kimbell

SHORTENING
Mrs. Baird's Frozen

ROLLS

I

Hany Logan
week Manitoba,

ERSff

vCTEEl

' Lt. Logan. He had left earlier
to visit nis in uuh,
Colo, and they both went on

to visit their parents in Whine-nog- ,

Canada. Lt. and Mrs. Lo
ran will bo stationed in

where he is jet pilot.
Don Hngcr recently

for Selective Service wltr
the board at Anson.

Beverly Jonesof Spring
spent the weekend with Mrs.
Harry Lojjan at the home o:

her parents,Mr. and Mrs. Ray-

mond Bounds, before Mrs. Lo-

gan left for Canada.
Mr. and Mrs. Tony Ham of

Odessa were recent visitors in
Mio immp nf her narents, Mr.
and Mrs. Fred Shaw. Mrs. Ham
is the former Sue Shaw.

I surely the nice
letter to th" from Mr
and Mrs. T. G. Atchison. It
made we ashamedthat I didn't
have some Paint Creek news
last week, but some weeks
there isn't much good news,
and I hate to write. Last week
with 'Gomery so very sick, and
Mr. so sick, and

worried, couldn't
think of newsy.
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KIMBELL'S

POUND

Bcauscjour,

Bca-iisejot- ir

tegistcr-c-d

appreciated

Raughton ev-

erybody
anything

25c

for 39--

H

bag10.
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59

S&H Green Given

Only When
Paid Full.
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A petite Hardln-Slmmo- ns

University co-e- Mona Mobley,

is doing her share in telling
the world about the school's
13th annual Intercollegiate ro-

deo to be held in Carl' Meyers
Memorial Aiena April 23, 35,
25. Miss Mobley, a junior from
Goree, will be amongthe many
cowboys and cowgirls taking
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Big

F.dltor
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Potatoes
Strawberries

Wednesday Double Stamp

the Purchaseof

$2.50

Frozen Chicken or Turkey

POT PIE

Armour's Star

PurePork
a

All

- tzffi?xmm&aM --HI

.otrI

part in the
show.

arc each
night at 8 p. m. with a
April 25.

$
Floral of the white

lotus were used in the tombs
of Egypt as far back
as 2,500 B. C.

if-- -

?MM
'&.wtr vy

I ERTRTRf M ifM &
lsfsfsfsfsTRV x':vi?;

25c

or More

FINEST QUALITY

MEAT!
Bacon

ETm T CfiJ J ML AM mm0 m
..$1.00 WORTH PDrrti c!T

lOmbeiri

Day with

-m-mmmw
- "cn aiAwrs rKfcfc WITH

Wright's Meat

Bologna
Whole Only

Fryers

Southwcst's out-
standing college

schecduled
matinee

wreaths
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3.POUND CAN

CRISCO

FOR

KIMBELL'S B. PKG.

imatoJuice3
KIMBELL'S BEST
25-L-B. BAG

DIAMOND CREAM STYLE

(BERRIES

MAY SOAP

fFLE SYRUP

KIMBELL'S

POUND CAN

BIRDSEYE FROZEN

NACH CUT GREEN
EANS PEAS CORN

BETTY CROCKER

CAKE MIXES

DEL
MONTE

46-O- Z.

CANS

1--
79

CANS

DIAMOND, CAN

QUART

-

- -

REG.
BARS

FULL

STALEY'S

HAMS

THE HASKELL FREE PRESS

SWIFT'S FINEST PURE

ICE CREAM
Vi GALLON

VAN CAMP

TUNA

NABISCO COCONUT,

GOLDEN SUGAR, MACAROON

cookies

Your Dollar Buys More In An

M SYSTEM STORE

FRANKS
BACON
OLEO
CHEESE
CHILI

HALF OR WHOLE, LB.

ARMOUR'S STAR, LB. PKG.

2-L- B. THICK SLICED

WILSON'S
GOLDEN BRAND LBS.

LONGHORN, LB.

KIMBELL'S NO. 2 CAN

'"

BORDEN'S BAIRD'S FROZEN

COTTAGE ROLLS
CHEESE PACKAGE

PreservesKRAFT'S
20-o-z. JARS
PEACH

DETERGENT

Shortening

I BABY FOOD

ARMOUR'S

KIMBELL'S
LARGE BOX

KIMBELL'S 3-L- B. CAN

GERBER'S FOR

BUTTER BEANS 2

FLOUR

TEA
GUM

CAN
SEASIDE

PURASNOW 1.89
KIMBELL 14-L- B.

PAGE SEVEN

25-LB- S.

PKGS.

KIMBELL'S INSTANT

BIRDSEYE FROZEN

PotPies
CHICKEN, TURKEY, BEEF

FOR
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. . . ThoughApril
showers

will bring May
Flowers . . .

They Won't Be A

Bit Welcome If
Our HomeHasA

LEAKY ROOF!
Now, during Spring Clean-U-p Week, is
the time to make those needed repairs.
You'll profit by our yearsof experienceand
quality products.Stopby today for the tools
and materials necessaryfor the job to be
done.

NothingDownand36Monthsto Pay

KENNEDY LBR. CO.
Pho. UNion 61 Throckmorton Highway

1

1

SpringShowerof Bargains

at FRAZIER'S
- 36" RCA Whirlpool Gas

Range,regular $379.95

- 5-P-c. Berkshire Dinette
Suite,regular 69.95

Total
Both on Special

for Only

$449.90

$299.95
Trade

1 AutomaticWasher,2-sp-
eed

2-cy-
cle, regular329.95. Sale,

with trade .... $248.00

1 20' Upright Freezer, reg.
449.95. Sale,with trade $330.00

1 8' De Luxe Refrigerator.
Regular 219.95. Sale, with
trade $165.00

FRAZIER'S
RADIO andRECORD SHOP

PhoneUNion 4-27- 56

Texas
Friday - Saturday DOUBLE FEATURE

BBkV t" ' MtwmStLEwwrt

rWE$k JAYNE MAHSREt SH3fei

jv BADAil
ONKMAScOPE CCKOtbyDCtUXt

Sun. - Mon. Adults 75c; StudentCards50c
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INGRID BERGMAN

CURTJURGENS
ROBERT D0NAT

Hjjr4isrfBB

I would like to urge you to seethis movie It
is one of the greatestyou will have the oppor-
tunity of seeing in 1959. It is GREAT!!! You
will enjoy every minute of it. Chas. Swinson,
Mftingpr, Te::a Theatre.

BergmanStarsIn

"Inn of Sixth

Happiness"
The humnn urama or one

courageous woman plnycil
ngnlnst n lush, seml-bnrbjut-c

Oriental backdrop Is combined
with romance, violence and
mysticism in Buddy Alcr's
CincmaScope color production
of "The Inn of the Sixth Happi-
ness" coming Sunday,April 20,
to the Texas Theatre.

With an international starring
cost, capped by Ingrld Bcrg
man, Curt Jurgens and thelnte
Robert Donat, it is the largest
film ever producedin England.

Directed by Mark Robson of
"Peyton Plnce" fame, the
picture tells thestory of Gladys
Aylwnrd, an English woman
who traveled to China, alone
and without friends or outside
help, at its most turbulent
modern period to work as a
missionary.

Told in the spiritual, dedicat-
ed and most exciting terms as
Miss Aylward lived it, the film
casts Miss Bergman in thi?
real-lif- e role.

At one point in the picture,
which is based on the novel,
"The Small Woman," by Alan
Burgess and was scripted by
Isobel Lennart, Miss Bergman
asks an aged woman mission-
ary "What is the sixth happi-
ness?" She answers, "Each
must find it himself." This pic-
ture goes a long way toward
satisfying that Individual
search.

$
O. M. HUNT IS
HASKELL VISITOR

C. M .Hunt of Los Angeles.
Calif., is a guest in the home of
his brother, CourtneyHunt and
family. Mr. Hunt drove from
California to San Antonio, where
he visited in the home of his
sister, Mrs. John Beyette.From
San Antonio he went to Dallas
and visited with Mr. and Mrs.
H. E. Fields, before coming
to Haskell.

Deanic Phillips, student in
West Texas State College, Can
yon, spent the weekend here
visiting in the home of his
mother, Mrs. Callle Phillips and
other lelatives. Mrs. Phillips
recently moved to Haskell from
Amarillo.

BY MRS.

The Sagerton students who
placed in the Interscholastic
Leagueeventsat Rochesterlast
week were Story Telling,
Yvonne Ross, 3rd place; Sub-Juni-

Declamation, Ray Claik
2nd place; and Jr. Declama-
tion, Janice Hertel, 3rd.

Alvin Bredthauer, Tom
Thane and Herbert Vahlen
kamp attended a meeting in
Hermleigh Tuesday of last
week for the Gemania Mutual
Fire Insurance Co.

Kent LeFevre was honored
on his 6th birthday Friday,
April 7 with a birthday party
in the home of his grandmoth-er-,

Mrs. Will Stegemoellei,
with his other grandmother,
Mrs. Cliff LeFevre, assisting.
Those attending weie Steve,
Dale, Regina and Russell Letz
of Old Glory, Ricky and Randy
Lehrmann, Calvin and Clayton
Stegemoeller, Kennet.i and
Lorry Peggy Clark,
Ruth Hertel, Larry LeFevie,
Steve Clark and the honoree.

Mothers present were: Mes-dame-s

Allen Letz, Carl Her-
tel, Leon Stegemoellei, Nor-ve- il

and the host-
esses.

The boys who are interested
in playing: Little League base-
ball and their dads met at the
school house Tuesday night of
last week to elect a manager
for this year. ReeceClark will
be their manager, and he will
be assisted by Delbert Le
Fevre and Herbert Vahlen-kam- p.

The Sagerton M.Y.F. met in
the home of Linda LeFevre
Wednesdayof last week.

Guests of Mr. and Mrs.
Adolph Helm Tuesday even-
ing, April 14 were Mr. and
Mrs. Herbert Stremmel and
family, Mr. and Mrs. Edwin
oiremmei ana sons, Mr. and I

Mrs. August Angerman, Emil '

and Hilda Stremmel, Mr. and
Mrs. Leo Monse Sr., Mr. and
Mrs. Alvin Bredthauer and'
family, Mr. and Mrs. Jack
Monse and Diane, Mr. and
Mrs. Otto Schaake, Henry
Hagemiester,Mr. and Mrs. Le.
land Thane and son, and Jean-ett-e

Helm and George MulUns
of Stamford. The occasion was
a party in honor of
Mrs. Helm.

The auditorium of the Sager-
ton School is being repainted
and other improvements are
being made. A new water cool-
er has also been added for the
students. i

Mr. and Mrs. J. E. Threet
visited with Mr. and Mm. M
Y. Benton, Mrs. John Clark
and Mr. and Mrs. Chas. Clark
Sunday.

Mrs. John Clark went to
Holliday Sunday to visit with
Mr. and Mrr. Charlie Clark.

"IakeH-easy-!

Find It Fast
In The

Yellow Pages
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MR. SIIEITAItn AD MISS BALDWIN
. . . retiring teachers

Former HaskellWoman Is Retiring

After 35 YearsWith DallasSchool
Miss Mable shown

at right in the above picture,
recently retired from the facul-
ty of Noith Dallas School,'
where she had taught continu
ouslv for 35 vears. At left is t

Mr. Sheppard,another retiring
faculty member.

On the occasion of her retire-
ment, Miss Baldwin was honor-
ed nt a coffee given by the
school faculty and officials,
and was piesented the silver
pitcher shown in the pictuie,
in recognition of her long ser-
vice to the school.

Miss Baldwin is a former ies-ide-

of Haskell, the daughter
of a pioneer couple here, the
late Mr. and Mrs. J. L. Bald-
win. She taught In the Haskell
schools early In her teaching
career.

The veteran retiied teacher
I is a sister of Mrs. Myrtle Col

lins oi tiasKen, is an aunt oi
Mrs. Gconge William Fouts,
and a first cousin of Mrs. J. U
Fields, all of this city.

SagertonNews
DELBERT LEFEVRB

Stremmel.

Lehrmann

birthday

Baldwin,

Mr. and Mrs. Cliff LeFcvre
visited in the home of Bro.
and Mrs. Vernon Bayfield near
Hamlin Wednesday night of
last week.

Guests in the home of Mr.
and Mrs. C. E. Stegemoeller
Sunday were Mr. and Mrs.
Marvin Stegemoeller and
daughters of Childless, Mr.
and Mrs. E. W. Schaake of
Sego, Mr. and Mrs. Hetman
Raphelt of Stamford, Mrs. J.
F. Schaake, Erna and Waltei
of Stamford, Mi. and frs. Er-vi- n

Schaake of Paint Creek,
Mr. and Mrs. Otto Schaake,
and Mr. and Mrs. A. C. Knlp-lin-

Mrs. Leon Stegemoeller
and sons, all of Sagerton.

The Lutheran Laymen's Lea-
gue held a rally at Albany
Sunday, at which representa-
tives from the West Texas
zone were present. E. H.
Diers and F. A. Stegemoeller
lepresented the Sagerton's
Men's Club of the Zion Luth
eian Church.

Delbert LeFevre attended a
Quarter Horse Show at Hale
Center Saturday. His horse,
Leo Lea, placed fourth in the
Junior Registered Cutting.

Mr. and Mrs. J. C. Spitzer
and family attended the West
Central Texas and the West
Texas Cutting Horse Associa-
tion Show in Sweetwater Sat-
urday.

F. A. Ulmer went to Dallas
Monday to visit with his aunt
who is in Baylor Hospital theic
after undergoing surgery.

108 FarmersIn
County Vote For
'B' Allotment

Approximately 3,013 acies of
upland cotton has been added
to the Haskell County total
thiough farmers' election to
follow the Choice "B" allot-
ment schedule for the 1950

crop, according to figures re-

leasedby the United StatesDe-p-

tment of Agriculture.
In the county, 108 faimers

with a total of 10,538.4 acres
voted for the "B" choice, add-

ing 3,013.9 to the total. The
108 farms represented5.7 per
cent of the county's acreage.

The county's allotment of
cotton acreagefor 1959 is 112,-305.- 8

acres, a cut of 10 per
cent from lact year.

Jones County had a total of
140 "B" farms accounting for
12,235.4 acres, Knox 31 "B"
farms for a total of 4,135.4
acies.

!- -

MattsonFaculty
Are Re-Elect-ed

At the last meeting of the
board of trustees of Mattson
Rural High School, all teachers
were for the 1959-6- 0

term of school. Previously, the
board had extended the con-
tract of Supt. Wm. R. Baker
for two years, through the i960-u- i

term.
Teachers are:

Jimmy Trimble, Mrs. Norris
Gibson, Mrs. Lucille Marlow,
Mrs. John Wooten, Mrs. Frank-i-e

Baker, Don Cook and Ger-aldea- n

Lane. However, Mrs.
Marlow, who has taught at
Mattson for three ears, has
resigned.Supt. Bnker said this
week. She is teacher of the
Third and Fourth grades.

Matthews Welding
Shop Moves

Matthews Welding Shop, for-
merly located at the ccmer of
South 1st and Avenue F has
been moved to a new locatior
on Highway 277, at the lnte:
sectionof South nth Streetand
the highway.

Otis Matthews, owner and op-
erator of the welding concern,
says the new location Is more
convenient for their patrons
and they have the advantage
of much additional toom i'
needed.

The concern specializes in
heavy equipmentwork and en
joys patronage fiom a wid
area in this part of West

SPRING
CLEARANCE

Marts Friday, Apr. 24,8 A. M.

Ladies Hats Our entire selection. Reg-
ular 5.95, 4.00, etc 1.3 Off

Ladies Nylon, Quilted Dusters, Solid col-
ors, florals and Lurex trimmed.
Values to 12.95 1.3 off

Batiste Shorty Pajamasby Shrank. Some
tailored and some lace trimmed.
Regular3.98 $2.98

Piece Goods Smash Hit. Cottons, .etc.
Values to 1.19 yard 3 yards $1.00

City Club Shoes.Sizes 6 to 12. B and D
widths. Values to 14.95.Pricesdfrom $5.00

Men's Short Sleeved Shirts. Jayson and
other brands. A Nice Selection:
Regular1.98, Spring Clearance . . .. $1.39
Regular 2.98, Spring Clearance $2.09
Regular3.49, Spring Clearance .... $2.49
Regular3.98, Spring Clearance $2.79
Regular4.95, Spring .Clearance . ., $3.49
Just in Time for Warm Weather!

Omm sileu's
OF RUtE

NnmkM Soldier
RatesExpert In
M-- l Rifle Firing

Munich, Germany (A"TNCi
Four noraco

W. Oncal'jr., 10, n of Mr.

and Mis. Horace W. pneal or

Haskell, recently qunllficclnj
expctl in firing
while assigned to the 31th Ar-tlllc-

In Munich.
A direction center chart

in the artillery's Bnt-fei- 7

B, Specialist Onen entered
lie Army in December 1957

and received basic training a
Fort Dix, N. J. He was last
stationednt Foil Carson. Co o.,

and arrived in Europe in July

10Oncal is a 1057 graduate of

Haskell High School and war
employed by M System Super
Market before entering the

Army.
--&.

Local Rotarians
Attend Assembly
In Mineral Wells

Several membersof the Ro-

tary Club of Haskell attended
District 576 Assembly in Min-

eral Wells Friday, when club
officers met to make plans for
the ensuing year. In the group
attendingwere District Governor-nom-

inee R .R. (Bob) King,
President Tom Barfleld, Presiden-

t-elect Hooper Wilkinson,
and W. R. (Roy) Johnson,sec-letar- y

of the local Rotary
Club.

LEO STIEWEIITS AKE

fAKENTS OF DAUGHTER

Mr. and Mrs. Leo Stiewert
of Anson are announcing the
nrrlvnl of a dauchter, born
April 12 In the Anson Hospital.
The little girl weighed six
pounds, 10 ounces and has been
named Dianna Jean. Mr. and
Mrs. Stiewert have anohter
Mrs. Stiewert have another

wuvit, nm, rim fuuhtuk

OVEAftS 111 ATAMPASB I

Now Lnrk $2,195 Up

HASKELL COUNTY
ABSTRACT CO.
Prompt and Efficient

Sorvlco

South Side Square Haskell

W III
'

designer.
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SIGN IN
YOUR HOME

costs little

SPRING CLEAN-U-
P

"..ywii . MAY

CDDIMri A

oriAinu u KANIK

prepare your winter
mer storage . . .

garineil,
,,

Is to bring them to us! Not o?
garments thoroughly .

ydo

will protect against 'Jlst'
will also prolontr ")S; ""1 me.

DON'T DELAY
WINTFR haISLAND

Miy

SERVICE CLEANE
una GastonHnft

Pho. UNion 40

516:

SPRINGOFFENSIVE

UPLKATION CLEANI

Weekof April to j J
If Dress-U-p Time

Haskell residentsshould fall !n
Citv-Wid- e

and objectionable. Well-kep- t

D . lllc gotuoreach

Paint Up andFix-U- p

Propertyis valuable.Owners
meir investments renters y
suit landlords for help in repair
painting ouuaings.

CheckFire Hazards
Fire can destroy material

things not replaceable.Look we

moval things which can cause
kindle fires.

BARFIELD-TURH- E

LOANS INSURANCE REAL!

CMm.

SAVINGS

A MEDALLION HOMI

'WJi

DIVIDEND

.

means

Better--

SfecfrtcaMcf

t'T'pj.,,

you,..

v x u .v.yH

Your Medallion Home
offers you theseexclusive featun

MODERN ALL-ELECTR-
IC KITCHEN. Automata

electric rangeand oven are already installed.

" '-?.

"M" A TWO r T "PTD TOAT A TYTkT T A XTT2C f Ut foil

of them, including the range are part of the onginjl

house plan . . . located for convenienceby tne nw

LIGHT FOR LIVING is for in work, ?k4
traflfif ric tn i11nn-;MM-- v .L UamiMr nt Well U "l
your family's safety and comfort.

jitikSsW'mMtMmW t

mx

&yd

NMitrt. i,j

100K FOR THIS
SELECTING NEW

jsIVS SSSB
k---'

A

SUcfaitity so
you can use lots of it

36
2nd

all

nl J
--TTr-THOSE

iur. wrs.

27

8

the M-r- u:'

J

should

and

your

of

Live

J. &tl

provided

REDDY WIRING A prime re

quirement:in homesqualifying

the Medallion seal is af?
accommodatetoday's appWM

i.. 1 :. ...:ll fintinuW
jpus tnosc you w -
years.

.llJi
Th Medallion Home tmM-aw- ard.d

only to "
wnicn mttt all me siun----Mdal- llon

Home program for

housing.
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ty. Want To Say

THANKS
friends and customersfor
....nnpnintf sucha success.

Vm l , i.i. i.
TMViH do Olir oesbLO ant
i 1... nmnrinfr irnii in n
..nnnffe W OWYI..6 7" " "
Lent mannerand give you

J MA1l1n4-- n t

st service anu puuid xui

noney.

LTEX SER. STA.
R. C. Trussel

WALL WALL
A f 1

peiaynuieum
Popular Prices

Expert Workmanship

ee Us For Any SizeJob
tow andUsedFurniture

Mattress Factory

gs & Johnson
We

23, 15

wan

TO

Sq.

fOOCAN

UN 4-23-
46

ring, remodeling or rebuilding any--
i your home is a lot than you
Just a little common sense, a right
of tools and quality material is all

3.

a real "handy man" in vour own

inn
Buy materials

.
you need from R. B.

M LUMBER CO. and see how
you can put your homein good shape.

A Complete Line Of
Building Needs For
tkelh Clean-U-p Week

pe.D

B. SPENCER
(BER COMPANY

Paint Up
Clean Up
Fix Up

Ph.

easier

Pho. UNion 4-28-33

BUSINESS
AUTO
HOME
FARM

BUT . . .

DON'T FORGET

TO PROTECT

YOUR

INVESTMENTS!

Insurance I- - tl. - ......c dcii roucy
' (SCOTCH) COCGINS

Oi50l Off. Jtnrn TTXT A nOAO
South Side Square

WAMTAD
IIOUHKIIOIA rrRMH
FOR HALE: Urge buffet, m

condition, bargain PhoneUN J aioi.
AIR CONDITinNir.im

17 I8c
lupat'k

CU. Any size Padsfor stiln nitmore Implement Co. n,.
FOR SALE: Solid walnut din"
ing room suite. 8 chaija and 2
YffcU,J.n Perfe condition.

UN 4 2711. R. j hv.nolds. 17 1

McCain98 Laundry
8. 1st juhI Avo. C 1 Block

Ent of Post Office

At'TOMWnc SERVICE
OPEN TIL 9 P. M.(5 DAYS
SUNDAY I) A. M.- -fl P. M.

Soft Water & Autonuitlc Speed
Queen Washersfor

Clean Washes.

Also Helpy Sclfy Service
Mnytags Equipped with
Steam Wet & Dry Wash

G n. m.-- 6 p. m. 5 Days Week

CANCER POLICY: Pays up to
$3,G00.00. Annual premium in-

dividual $9.00, family $16.00.
United Bankers Life Insurance
Co. Jack Johnson, acrent. Ph
UN Haskell, Texas 12tfc
FOR SALE: One new grade A
bath set, 5 foot cast iron tub,
lavatory and commode, white,
complete with faucets, P traps
and supply pipes. $125.00 Mar-
vin Lctz, phone UN 202
3 Ave. G. l

ANTIQUES
Sherman's 14tfc

OLD BIBLES are priceless rel-Ic- s.

Preserve them by letting
us rebind them. Haskell' Free
Press. i3tfo
FOR SALE : Plumbing supplies,
Dam nxiurcs, colored and white
at wholesale prices plus small
handling charge. Marvin Let?:.
202 S. Ave. G. Phone UN

tf

WANTED
WANTED: Used porch swing
Must be in good condition. Mrs.
Charley Redwinc, Free Press.

17ti
WANTED: Ironinc to do in mv
spare time. Mrs. Audie Stocks.
Sr. D

Listings Wanted on farms,
ranches, houses and other
property. J. C. WhcaUey Real
Estate, 1510 N. Ave. E. Pho.
UN or UN 17c
CLEAN out your garages!
Clean out your attics! We buy
or trade for anything of value.
Call UN Sherman Bar-ga-ut

Dept. 43tfc
WANTED: Guns of all types.
Will buy, sell or trade. See T.
J. Ballard at 1005 North Ave.
K. 7tfc
WANTED TO BUY: Cooking
ware, dishes, air condiUoncrs,
radios, refrigerators, stoves,
toots, etc. Commercial Whole-
sale OuUet, N. E. corner of
square, Haskell, Texas, Phone
UNion 2tfc
WANTED: Male and female
help. Part or full time. Earn-
ings according to effort. For
appointment call UN

lltfc
SEED. GARDEN TLANTS
CAIJUWRC KtrkoUmpn TlflirV.
men! Low prices on field seed
at one ot North Texas oldest,
most reliable seed stores.Com-
mon Sudan $5, Texas Hegari
$5, Sorghum Almum $22.50,
Perennial Sweet Sorgrass $25.
All seed recleaned, bogged,
tested. Call or write today.
HARPOOL'S, P. O. Box 599,
Denton, Texas. Phone DU

17-18-p

COTTON SEED : Western
Storm-proof-, first year seed
ginned in 10 bale lots. R. Y.
Mobley, 3 miles southwest of
Hiukcll. 16-I- Od

PLANTS READY NOW: To-

mato, pepper, carnations, pan-
sy, stock, sweet Williams,
Shasta daisy and geraniums.
Trice Hatcherv. 36 17 pd

--
. AOT-kC- Ciinnllna nnil InSOCti

cides of all kinds can be found
r Tftnn Wntrhorv The Pl'ace
for your everday needs. 16-17-p

NOTICE
WE HAVE moved to a new lo-- ,

cation and are ready to servo
you. On Stamford highway
across from Highway Drive In.
Corner of 13th and S. Ave. E.
fnfthtw5i Welding Shop. 1S-1- 8C

hirvrirw. fP KUXJl'lOXM

Notice Is hereby given that
an election will be held by

tti.ii - Wntfr SunDlv

District No. 1 at the City of

Welnert, Texas in uio wnimu-nll- y

Center building, Tuesday,
May 5, 1959. for the purpose
of electing three directors to

serve two year terms each.
Polls will be open from 8:00
a. m. unUl 7:00 p. m.

Signed: R. J. Ralney, Presl--

At n TtnnrA. 18-ll- P

FOR WENT
piMl KENT: Concrete mixer by

the hour for any
time. 700 N. Ave. H. Leroy
o IHT-- .1 WW.

FOR RENT:" Apartment707 N.

Ave. G. Mrs. Walter Roger.
m IIM AMWl. 16-17- C

CJllMIO "" "
LIVESTOCK

SALE: 36 ewes. w mnib
Jni 2 bucks. Also 50 weaning
rl' j r fltornv at D. H.

f-- m nar Jud. 15-17- p

Personsbl. FSTATK" JPm

FOITSALE: Three room
and bath, two large lots Will

UN 4- -Phonosell reasonable. "3241 aftor 6,

IJSETri)7ttSANDTRlJCK8:--
FORSALErc.ood IMS.2 door

Ford 6 cylinder, nearly now

motor. Will consider trading
o dor model car. Inqulg .at

Free Press. Wayn; Phemlsjon

,. THE HASKELL FREE PRESS

SECnOMis
MSrKU,ANKOU8
"' ALB;.niP,y 2 howetralUJ ?:, ""Whliw. Phone 4081,i5noxrity, Texas. 17-10-c

S.,.SA' I
Saddle, 'excellcrit

hlaiiket. 1001 N. Ave. L afterLJLJ!!; 1718p
TILLKR SERVICE: Will plowgardensand lawns. Phone UN
' 2397. 17.1 on
rntt . .. . - o,

food. O. K. for your dog and
,r.,tutu

NEED extra $25 to $5U weekly?Route work on your day off
nnd evenings brings extra cash.Wife may help too. Write Mc-Ne- ss

Co, Dept. 2. Box 2766,
Deboto Sta. Memphis 2, Tenn.

up
HOW (In Vnll Ifnnn ifr.... .,.....
so clean? Blue Lustre of course

U's tops. Sherman Floor
Covering. nc
FOR SALE: Palomino saddle
horse. 5 years old and gentle.' mi'o south of Mattson school.
J. W. Aycock. 16-19- p

MARIGOLD

OLEO
MRS.

PETER PAN, TALL CANS

Mrs.

Zee Brand

Foremost

Powdered or Brown

I WILL not be responsible forany debts except those madeby mc personally. Donald
jToinmy) Fuqiia. l6-22- p

FOR SALE: 7'4 hp Scott-At-wat-

boat motor; perfect
Ray. 16-I7- c

ORELAND KENNELS, Rt. 3
Haskell. Registered Bull-Mn- s

tiffs. VlBltois welcome. 15-I8- p

PERSONAL If you have a
drinking problem, write P. O.
Box 213. Haskell, for a confi-
dential' talk. intfc
FOR SALE: Red sable and
camel hair paint brushes in
all sizes. Excellent for ceramic
work. Haskell' Free Press.12tfp
FOR SALE: Paint brusiies: red
sableartist rounds and brights;
camel hair white
bristle brights; red sablewater
color, camel hair water color
and ox hair one stroke. Haskell
Free Press. i2fp
FOR SALE: Stencils from
in. to 2 in. in Frontier, Old
English and Roman style type.
Haskell Free Press. lltfp

wide

3-L- b. Can

SHORTENING 69c

Rolls

TOILET TISSUE 33c

i2 Gallon

MELLORINE 39c

EGGS

SUGAR

3 dozen89c

box 10c

Gold Medal

FLOUR 10 89c

No. 303 CanDel Monte or

SPINACH 2 29c

WHEN in need of
call Dr. W. H. 8tewart.

0861, Munday, Texas. 4tfc
WP. fin ffwtln.r... ml.tlHrlln...
Mx gas tanks, car heaters and

for all kinds of radi-
ators. All work guaranteed.
Wootcn's Radiator Shop. 2tfc
WE Vulcanize and recap any
size tire. Wootcn Oil Co. UN

Haskell. 23tfc
SEE US about rebindlng your
old manuscripts, Bibles and
books. Haskell FreePress.13tfp
Bulldozer, root plowing and
dirt work. Call T. C. Redwlne.
Phone UN 14tfc
WE NOW have 3 style types of
stencils; Frontier, Old English
and Roman, ranging in size
from Vi in. to 2 in. Haskell
Free Press. . lltfp
HOSPITALIZATION: Pays up
to $3,650.00. Pays $10.00 per
day for one year for sickness
or accident. United Bankers
Life Insurance Co. Jack John-
son, agent. Phone UN
Haskell. Texas. 12tfc

f

vv 1 . Miiv-7rv- y t'i1' --zaw. fMVwrits ? rair wt

BAIRD'S

Tucker's

lacquering;

4

Stokely,

cans

Veterina-
rian,

LEAN, BONELESS

VEAL
CUTLETS

88c lb.

ROUND
STEAK

88c lb.

WRIGHTS
COUNTRY STYLE

BACON

2 lb. Pkg.99c

P

fasP1

PAGE NINK

'NEED a plumber?
I

Prompt Plumbing Service from the Smallest
Repair Job to Complete Installations.

,
PHONE UN 4-30-

30

Brazelton LumberCompany

MARVIN LETZ
Built-i- n Appliances and Installation. Central
Heating and RefrigeratedType Air Condition-
ing Systems in Janitrol and Day and Night
brands.

Ceramic Tile Materials and Installation.

Pho. UN 2-21- 04 202 S. Ave. G

..sawnqs

lb.

$$$!?,L -- .

in ev6ry deparfmenfi
(UMIT - 2 LBS.)

124'
PACKAGE OF 1 DOZEN

FROZENROLLS 10'

SALMON

OGEE'S

CAN

39'
Our Darling, No. 303 Cans

CORN 3 cans49c

Sunshine "Sugar Honey" ILb. Box

GRAHAM CRACKERS 29c

Dole, Crushed or Sliced, No. 1 Flat Cans

PINEAPPLE 2 cans29c

California Sunkist

ORANGES lb lQc

Fresh from the Valley

YELLOW SQUASH lb. 9c

Big, Firm Heads

LETTUCE headlQc

Kimbell's

PORK & BEANS 4 cans39c

113 NORTH AVENUE E

r J
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News from Rule
BY IKS. FAYE DUNNAM

Eighth Grade Ilanquot

The eighth grnde banquet on
.Friday night, April 18, in the
school cateterin was in a set-
ting of "Old Mexico" as it car-
ried out tlic Spanish theme,
beginning ut 7 p. m. when the
eighth graders promenadedfor
their parents in the Spanish
fashion.

The banquet room was color-
ful and resplendent with its
flower covered fence, the Sen-or-s

with their donkey carts,
and the Spanish Senoritos.

Rev. Tommy Nelson of the
First Methodist Church gave
the invocation. Following the
dinner, Bob Clark at the piano
with Tommi Jo Simpson, Susie
and Sallie Dowdy and Judy
Jones, sang "Heart of My
Heart." Andres Lopez sangand
played a number on his steel
guitar. Sonla Singleton read
tiie class prophecy and Tommi
Jo Simpson read the classwill.

The class president. H. J.
Thompson. Introduced the ev-

ening's speaker,T. E. Simpson
of Rule.

The banquet closed with the
singing of the Rule Junior High
School song.

Mothers of eighth graders
prepared the banquet and the
seventh grade girls served it.
Guests other than the eighth
graders were the elementary
faculty, and Mr. and Mrs. Con-
nor Horton.

Junior-Seni- or Banquet

In a Mardi Gras setting the
Hule Junior Class entertained
the Senior Class with their an-
nual banqueton Saturdaynight
April 17. Streamers, floating
balloons, clown faces, masks,
confetti and serpentine made
gay and festive decorationsfor
the cafeteria. Each guest was
presenteda glittered mask and
a blower for plate favors.

Jackie Colbert, Junior Class
president, acted as master of
ceremonies. David Garlington,
high school nrincipal, gave the
Invocation. Jackie Colbert wel-
comed the Senior Class and
Audrey Joe Smith, in the ab-
senceof the Senior Class presi-
dent, Ronald Hill, led in the
Senior response.

Sherry Kile and Linda Higgs
sang a duet, accompanied by
Janet Hannsz at the piano.
Steve Denton read the Junior
prophesy for the Seniors and
Audrey Jo Smith read the
Senior will.

The banauet closed with the
singing of the school song and
the benediction by Superin-
tendent Connor Horton

Twenty Seniors, 13 Juniors,
and J3 faculty members were
present. Mothers of the Juniors
prepared the meal and the
Sophomore and Freshmen girls
served.

Men's

Handkerchiefs

Large size in white
only.

15 $1

ONE GROUP
SPRING KNIGHT

SHEETS

Double size only.
Pitted and 81x108.
Slightly irregular.
Regular 1.88, now

$1.44
SPECIAL
16 Only, Boy's

Blue Jeans

$1.00
SPECIAL

PUFF

F00TLETS

Regular 1.00, now

88c

Larry Horton Hecognlicd

Larry Horton, s6n of School
Supt. and Mrs. Connor Horton
of Rule, was recognizedat the
Honor Day Convocation at
Southern Methodist University.
Ceremonies were held at Mc-Farll- n

Auditorium in Dallas
last Tuesday. Larry, a fresh-
man, had maintained the stan-
dard of scholarship necessary
for this recognition. Mr. and
Mrs. Horton attended the

Rule School News

The yearbook, The Bobcat.
arrived last week and 190 cop-
ies of the 80-pa- book were
distributed to the student body.
The annual was dedicated to
the boys and girls basketball
teams.

Jan Ousley was the editor
and Mrs. Faye Dunnam, facul-
ty advisor.

Miss Margaret Williams, the
Homemaklng teacher, and Jan-
et Hannsz, Pam Bailey, Linda
Higgs and Mrs. Albert Hannsz
are making a trip to Dallas to
attend the State FHA. They
will go on Thursday and return
Saturday. Janet and Pam are
going as chapter representa-
tives and Lindawill sing In the
State FHA choir.

The commercial department
has 16 new typing tables added
to its department. The blonde,
plastic topped tables are 22x34
inches In size and have shelf
space for books and supplies.
The tables were purchased
from accumulated funds earn-
ed by the 3chool paper, The
Bobcat Tales.

4-

011, gas, sand and gravel
produced in Haskell County in
1954 had a commercial value
Of $9,367,438.

$

Jericho, 825 feet below sea
level in Jordan, was once own-
ed by Cleopatra. She prosper-
ed from its rich harvests.

Your social security office is
the right place for information
on what social security may
mean to you and your family.

3
Haskell County has a labor

force of 4,678, according to the
latest edition of the Texas
Almanac.

-- S-

Paper originated in Asia be-
fore Christianity and was in-

troduced into Europe, probably
by the Saracens,in the eighth
century.

.j
If you're paying social secur-

ity taxes, you should find out
what you're buying. Ask thr
Abilene office for free booklet
No. 35.

ONE GROUP "

NOTIONS

Regular88c

2 $1

SPECIAL
BROWN

DOMESTIC

High threadcount.
First quality. Regu-
lar 27c

6 yards $1

SPECIAL
15 Only, Men's

Sport Shirts

$1.00
SPECIAL
CHILDREN'S

PANTIES

A cotton and rayon
combination forsoft, durablewear.

3 for $1

GrassSeedingIs

HelpedBy Litter
Cover Crop

Poor seed bed preparation
has been the cause of grass
seedingfailures much more of-
ten than has the lack of rain,
according to Travis V .Her-
ring, local Soil Conservation
Service technician. When a
young grass plant Is becoming
established, it Is tender and
succulentand about the size of
a straight pin. Sand blowing
across the ground surface will
destroy it the same as a lawn
mower. The sun will blister
small grass seedlingsand even
a hard rain will wash out the
young root system.

In seeding cultivated land,
waterways, spillways or other
eroded areas, a dead litter
cover crop should be establish-
ed the year before. Sorghums,
annual sudangrass, or millet
may be used to obtain this
cover, according to Herring.

The seeding may either be
done in early summer with

I the expectation of taking one
or more crops or nay, or in
late summerat a time when the
crop will not produce mature
seedbefore frost. In anv event.
Herring emphasized, mature
seed should not be allowed to
form and shatter, because of
competition from volunteer
plants the next spring. The ob-
jective of planting a crop for
dead litter cover is to leave
the field at thc end of the
growing season with a good
ground cover of litter and a
standing cover from six to
eight inches high.

The following spring, grass
Is drilled in this undisturbed
stubble mulch cover without

of any sort. This
seed bed reduces rapid sur-
face evaporation, prevents soil
blowing, surface crusting,
guards young plants against
wind damage.

W. L. Holt, Wichita Brazos
Soil Conservation District

is carrying out this
practice on his farm two miles
south of Mattson. Holt intends
to sow his newly constructed
waterway with annual sudan
grass and follow next spring
with sideoats grama.

Raymond Denson of Rule, a
cooperator with the California
Creek Soil Conservation Dis-
trict, plans to sow annual Su-
dan grass this summer for
dead litter cover in which to
seed a pure stand of Blackwell
switch grass next spring on a
field he is taking out of culti-
vation for improvement pur-
poses.

Any further information con-
cerning seed bed preparation
and planting of crops for the
establishingof dead litter cover
can be secured from your lo-- j
cal SCS technician.
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THE FREE PltES

Views Of

ShownAt Lions

Payne Hattox, Church of
Christ minister who recently
returned to thc U. S. after
spending two years in Sweden
doing mission work for the
church, was guest speaker at
the weekly meeting and lunch-co-n

of the Lions Club Tuesday
at noon.

Hattox, former businessman
here, showed a scries of color-
ed slides accumulated during
his two years In Sweden along
with his talk.

He related that he and his
.family went by plane from
Dallas to New York City, then
by boat to Gothcnbcrg,Sweden.
Pictures of the harbor in Goth-cnber-g

were shown, and of a
Lutheran Church which is the
state church of Sweden and is

Other scenes included an
open air market, where flow-
ers arc sold the year around,
even in 20 below temperaturein
winter. One interesting scene
was of the King's Palace, a
structure containing 600 rooms
and 40 kitchens.

Hattox gave many interesting
facts about Sweden, its cli-

mate and customs. A favorite
sport is skiing, ahd he showed
a ski jump 40
feet high where the skier trav-
els a distance of 170 feet or
more In making a jump.

Harold Spain was program
chairman for the day and In-

troduced the guest speaker.
3

Dies In

Mrs. G. C. Reding Sr., 89,
mother of J. H. Reding of
Weinert, died at her home in
Killeen, Texas, Saturday morn-
ing April 18, of a heartattack.

Funeral services for Mrs.
Reding were conductedat 3 p.
m. Sundayat the First Metho-
dist Church in Killeen, and
burial was in the Killeen Cem-
etery. Her survivors, include
two daughters and sevensons.

Mr. and Mrs. Reding attend-
ed the funeral, and remained
in Killeen a few days.

$

Coastal Bermuda grass, re-
ports E. M. Trew, extension
pasture specialist, has. proved
its worth as a forage producer
where adaptedand when prop-
erly managed. Research and
farm demonstration tests'have
established the superiority of
this hybrid grass over common
Bermuda. Trew says local
county agentSjCan supply.'print-
ed material on many product-
ion phasesas well as give In-
formation basedon observation
and farm

FIRST QUALITY

BIRDSEYE

DIAPERS

Large size.
absorbent. Regular
2.39, only

$1.99
LADIES SUMMER

JEWELRY

Includes earrings,
necklaces,pins and
bracelets.

88c

SPECIAL
GROUP

CUP TOWEL

SACKS

Jjor$l
SALE

Children's
Seersucker

PLAY SHORTS

for $1
i

HASKELL

Sweden

Club Meeting

approximately

Weinert Man's
Mother
Killeen

demonstrations..

Highly

Film Exposing
Communism Will
Be Shown Here

The public Is requested to
keep Friday, May 8 in mind
as thc date when a surprising
film. "Communism In Action
will be shown at the High
School audltprium, sponsored
by thc Haskell County Farm
Bureau.

"Everyone will want to see
this shocking film," said Henry
W. Smith, president of thc lo-

cal Farm Bureau.
No admission will be charg-

ed.
j

HaskellPreacher
ConductsRevival
In Floyd County

Rev. Hubert Scgo, Baptist
minister of this city, has re-

turned from a successful revi-

val held at the Lone Star Bap-

tist Church in Floyd County.
Good Interest and attendance

marked thc one-we- ek revival.
As a result of the meeting
there were 17 re dedications,
nnn alirrpnrW for KDOCial SOf- -

vice, and 16 conversions by
baptism.

$
On March 4, 1776, the newly-forme- d

Marine Corps saw its
first combat when 300 Marines
landed and capturedthe British
port of New Providence,

Want Ads
FOR SALE: House, three
rooms and bath, carport, two
blocks from square, hardwood
floors, Venetian blinds, good
condition. J. W. Massle, 104

Ave. G. 17-19-p

FOR SALE: Used bed-
room suite, old but excellent
condition. 1004 North Ave. L
after 5:00 p. m. 17-18-p

PURINA CHOWS: A complete
line of feed for game birds,
dogs, poultry, cattle and hogs.
Trice Hatchery. 17-18-p

BABY CHICKS : Place your or-
der with us for thc baby chicks
you need and we will have
them on short notice. Trice
Hatchery. 17-18-p

WANTED middle age unin-
cumbered lady to keep house
and care for elderly lady.
Write Albert Kuhler, Rt. 2,
Munday, Texas. 17p
BIG "Best o' West Texas"
Stocker & Feeder Cattle Sale
at Abilene Livestock Auction
Commission Company, Abilene,
on Friday, May 1, at 10 a. m.,
featuring 4,000 or more head
calves, yearlings, cow and calf
pairs, bulls all breeds, all
classes. Buyers welcome ad-
ditional consignments invited.
For Information call Abilene
Livestock Auction Commission,
ORchard Oris Reynolds,
OR or Billy Haynes, OR

i7c

SALE
OF KHAKIS
Comfortable Fit
Sanforized and

Reinforced
Easy to Wash, Easy

to Iron
Grey and Tan Colors
Broken Sizes Only

Regular2.98, CloseOut

$1.99
SPECIAL

MEN'S COTTON

WORK SOX
Long and short tops.
White and random
Regular25c a pair

UnionizingFarm
Labor Opposed
By FarmBureau

Strong opposition to unioniz-

ing of farm labor wnn voiced
at a meeting of some 500

farmers and small business
men in San Angclo last week,
sponsoredby the Farm Bureau.

Local Farm Bureau members
attending were Mr. nnd Mrs.
W. G .Ellis, Fred Brown, J.

TEXAS CAFE PINING R(J

naf1
comfortable conveniew

household

Square

SPECIAL
GROUP

BETTER
:

MATERIAL

Includes checks,
ginghams&

66ca yard

special
LADIES

PANTIES

All
through 8.

3 $1.

GROUP

LINENS

3

GROUP

INFANT'S

RUBBER PADS

Regular

HASKELL, TEXAS, THURsDav
M. Crawford nnd C. II. Horrcn.
mcy rcponcu an informativemeeting nnd wore imprest,!
with the to a,,!
smnll fanner of the move infarm Inbor.

Matt Trigg, Farm Bureau nntional legislative director,
yested that farmers write tnPresident Elsenhower, viPresident Nixon and Secretnrv
of Labor Mitchell, as welltheir State SennlnA n,i ns
sentntlvc and tell thom why

nvp j

in n o A ."

j.

X- r- 'urn
nn tr,

Jrn.vnind

WILL BE OPENSUNDAY, APRlL
Wo nnur

ATtui..:

." m

0,a s So,
Were m.L '!aMl

-

26n

establishmentto enable us to offer
serviceandmore and
in the future. In doing this, we will be
our dining room after April 26th. We hav

makeandserveyou softpiesatall timeswith

Wo rmVAVn,, M, -- , wxnaucpiesanainvito!

' "" "c ,mve whole
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TEXAS CAFE
"Where Most PeopleEat"

FURNITURE SALE

Our Sale on a few moredays.Come

buy you aregoing to needin fui

while you canmakea big savingon some,We

largestock for you to selectfrom.

BOGGS & JOHNSON
Last of PhoneUNm

ndValue
ONE OF

prints.

acetate. Size

for

ONE

for $1
ONE
OF

2.49, now

seriousness

unionize

vrnnnrlaUv

cnopinliVo

lnufacM

.ro

goes
what

Side

SPECIAL
CHILDREN'S

ACETATE

PANTIES

4for$l
ONE GROUP

Ladies

Middie Blouses

Sizes S-M-
-L.

$1.00
CLOSE OUT

SCAT TABLE

Items

50cto$2.50
LADIES SHORTY

JAMAS

Made from cotton
seersucker.

ONE GR

Play C!c

Includessho

suits,blous

pushers.

'l

Vest

Childre

ft!

SPEGl

CHILDR

BE'nl

CAN-- C

..

9'

HANE

UNDER

M0

Briefs

Shorts

T-Shir- tM

TV Shirts.

0
Briefs

6 pairsfor $1.00 $1.49 $1.98
Vest
T-Shi- rts

-

re!!


