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Giris Win District Titie ; Elks In 2nd Place Cattlemen Hear
Stratford Elkettes won the 

championship of district 1-A 
Tuesday night by defeating Gru- 
ver 55 to 50 in a close game. 
White Deer girls had been in a 
dead heat with the Elkettes for 
several games, but fell before 
the Gruver girls in a game Fri­
day night. In nosing out Gru­
ver, the Elkettes held their re­
cord of winning nine of the ten 
conference games while White 
Deer girls had lost two of the 
ten games.

The district champions expect 
to play the champions of district 
2-A on a neutral court on either 
February 26 or 27 in the first 
game of the regional tourna­
ment. At present it appears 
that either Clarendon or 
Canadian may claim the dis­
trict 2-A championship. Little 
is known of the strength of the 
Canadian team. Clarendon 
has the reputation of having 
the tallest team in the Texas 
Panhandle but little is known of 
their speed.

The Elkettes have won 27 of 
the 30 games they have played 
during the season.

Stratford Elks came in second 
in district 1-A by running wild 
over Gruver 68 to 38. During 
the conference play they won 
six and lost four games. They 
have played 27 games this year 
and have won 19. White Deer 
finished their conference games 
to win the district champion­
ship by winning all ten games.

Stratford Elkettes trailed be­
hind Gruver at the end of the 
first quarter. They had gain­
ed a three point lead at the 
half, and increased it to five 
points at the end of the third 
quarter.

Donna Boner was high point 
forward for the Elkettes in the 
final game. She was supported 
in the scoring plays by Joyce 
Scott and Charlotte Eller. Shel­
ia Donelson, Billie Robbins and 
Elaine Cummings, turned in out­
standing performances as 
guards. Charlene Wisdom and 
Carolyn Wright, substituting 
guards, held the Gruver for­
wards under control during the 
last minutes of play when they 
were working under pressure.

Gary Garoutte was high point 
man for the Elks in their game 
with Gruver. He scored 19 
points, playing his last game 
with the Elks as a senior.

Jack Standefer and Pat Don­
elson, guards, and Dan Newman, 
center, earned honorable men­
tion for playing an outstanding 
game.

T. V. Weaver 
Dies In Fort 
Worth Hospital

Troy V. Weaver, 62, an agrono­
mist with the Soil Conservation 
Service in Stratford in 1936 and 
1937, died in a Fort Worth hos­
pital January 24, it was learned 
by friends here this week. 
Weaver was ill for only a few 
days before his passing.

Weaver had operated the T. 
V. Weaver Real Elstate and In­
surance business in Fort Worth 
for the last 20 years.

He was a native of Eastland 
County. Weaver had affiliated 
memberships with the Masonic 
Lodge of Oomache, Mosiah Tem­
pie Shrine, United Commercial 
Travelers of America, and Mat­
thews Memorial Methodist 
Church.

Survivors include his wife; 
two daughters, Mrs. C. W. Le- 
Doux and Mrs. C. W. Dowdy of 
Fort Worth his mother, Mrs. E. 
L. Weaver of Fort Worth; three 
brothers, C. L. Weaver of Fort 
Worth, Club Weaver and Wood- 
row Weaver of Levelland; a 
sister, Mrs. J. D. Worley of 
Farmington, New Mexico; and 
seven grandchildren.

Funeral services were held in

Harry Schultz 
Candidate For 
District Judge

Harry Schultz announces his 
candidacy for re-election to the 
office of District Judge of the 
69th Judicial District subject to 
the action of the Democratic 
primary election Saturday, May 
5 In announcing his candidacy 
and asking the voters of the dis­
trict for their consideration in 
the coming election, Schultz 
made the following statement. 
“To The People Of The 
69th Judicial District:

I am grateful to you for the 
privilege of serving you as Dis­
trict Judge. I hope that my 
services have been sufficiently 
satisfactory to merit your vô ■̂ 
for my re-election. In trying to 
merit your confidence I have 
given unceasing attention to 
the following matters:

Case Load: Although the case 
load in this District is heavier 
than that of any other Court
outside of the cities in this
State, I have kept the dockets 
current. That is, all cases have 
been disposed of as rapidly as 
the legal procedures permit.

Pre-Trial Procedures: Con­
tributing greatly to rapid dis­
position of cases has been my 
purposefullness in using pre­
trial procedures in civil jury
cases. By these procedures ev­
ery effort is made (far in ad­
vance of the dates set for trial) 
to stream-line the cases. This 
results also in saving much of 
the time of jurors sitting in the 
trial of those cases. Much 
jury expense, time and incon­
venience of jurors is also elim­
inated by keeping in touch with 
cases set for trial and if some­
thing unforseen occurs to delay 
trial of the cases, then the jury 
panel is notified not to report. 
Good Appellate Record: The 
pre-trial procedures have also 
aided greatly in getting cases 
tried correctly and in accord­
ance with the requirements of 
law; thus avoiding reversals by 
Appellate Courts. Among the 
dozens of cases tried by juries 
and appealed, only one civil and 
two criminal cases had to Jdc 
tried again because of revèrsal 
by the Appellate Courts.

Adult Rehabilitation Work: 
After a recent session of the 
Legislature passed legislation 
authorizing it, I succeeded in 
getting the counties to employ a 
full time district adult proba­
tion officer. Now most of the 
first offenders are being re­
habilitated in their own homes 
without being committed to the 
penitentiary. While they are 
being rehabilitated under the 
supervision of the probation of­
ficer they are working and sup­
porting themselves and families. 
At this time there are about 115 
such cases.

Increasingly effective work is 
being done toward rehabilitat­
ing alcoholics who violated the 
law.

Child Welfare: With the indis- 
pensible help of the members of 
the County Child Welfare 
Boards outstanding work has 
been done in a great many cases 
in protecting the rights and wel­
fare of children of broken 
homes and dependent and ne­
glected children.

All of which is to say I’ve done 
my best. I hope that my ef­
forts merit your vote and sup­
port for my re-election to this 
office.”

Progress Plans

Stratford Elkettes clinched the district 1-A girls basketball championship here Tuesday night, 
defeating Gruver 55 to 50. They expect to meet either Clarendon or Canadian in the first game 
of the regional tournament.

Pictured above is the Elkette first te'am composed of Charlotte Eller, Joyce Scott, Billie Bob­
bins, Elaine Cummings, Donna Boner and Shelia Donelson.

Charlene Wisdom and Carolyn Wright, substitute guards, not pictured, held the Gruver for­
wards at bay during the last part of the game with Gruver.

H. S. Hawkins 
Succumbs To 
Heart Attack

Funeral services for H. S. 
Hawkins, 79-year old senior 
resident of the Texas and Okla­
homa panhandles, were con­
ducted Friday at 2:30 p. m. in 
the First Methodist Church in 
Texhoma by Rev. J. H. New, 
pastor of the First Baptist 
Church, assisted by Rev. Mit­
chell Lowery, pastor of the 
church.

H. S. Hawkins died Tuesday 
of last week in Memorial Hos­
pital in Guymon following a 
heart attack. He was ill for 
two and a half days. Hawkins 
death, February 6, 1962, was
preceded by the death of his 
wife February 6, 1961.

Mr. and Mrs. Hawkins had 
made their homes in the Pan­
handles of Texas and Oklahoma 
since 1917.

Mr. Hawkins was engaged in 
farming most of his life. He 
operated the Chevrolet and 
Allis-Chalmers agency in Tex­
homa for a few years. For a 
number of years he served on 
the Sherman County A.S.C. 
Committee, retiring from pub­
lic life in 1948.

H. S. Hawkins is survived by 
one son, Clifton R. Hawkins of 
Texhoma, three grandchildren 
and six great grandchildren.

The girl friend asked him if 
he liked moving pictures; then 
invited him to help clean out 
“the attic.

Owens & Brumley Funeral Cha­
pel and burial was made in 
Laurel Land in Fort Worth.

Consumers Co.
/

Re-Elects Board 
Of Directors

J. W. Flores, Dale Knight, 
Oma Ellison, W. L. Pendleton 
and Rex Hudson were re-elect­
ed to the Board of Directors at 
the annual meeting of Consum­
ers Co., Inc. Friday.

R. M. Trainham, H. T. Jack- 
son, F. M. Keener, Mrs. Meritt 
Sweny and Arthur Oartrite won 
the attendance prizes.

Trainham won an electric ice 
cream freezer. H. T. Jackson 
won an electric toaster. Keen­
er won a flashlight. Mrs. 
Sweny won a box of candy for 
traveling the farthest distance 
to attend the meeting. Arthur 
Cartrite, 80 years of age, won a 
pocket knife for being the oldest 
stockholder attending the meet­
ing.

W. P. Caraway 
Funeral Rites 
At Hereford

Funeral services for W. P.
Caraway, 84-year old father of 
Hartland and Obed Caraway of 
Stratford, were conducted at
3:00 p. m. Sunday in Rose Cha­
pel of Gililland Funeral Home 
in Hereford.

Officiating were Bob Wear, 
minister of Central Church of 
Christ of Canyon, Ernest Higers, 
minister of Hereford Central 
Church of Christ, and Rev. Her- 
schel Thurston, pastor of the 
Hereford Methodist Church.

Burial was made in Rest Lawn 
Cemetery.

■ Mr. Caraway died Friday night 
at his home after four hours of 
illness.

He was born September 22, 
1877 in Williamson, Texas. Cara­
way married Miss Mamie Bargs- 
ley January 27, 1907 in Ranger. 
They moved to Deaf Smith 
County in 1924.

Survivors include his wife, 
Mamie of the home; three sons, 
J. B. Caraway of Hereford, Hart- 
land and Obed Caraway of 
Stratford; a daughter, Mrs. 
Aleene Leake of Canyon; four 
brothers, John Caraway of Ran­
ger, Jim Caraway of Comanche, 
Frank Caraway of Energy, and 
Elmer Caraway of Dublin; three 
sisters, Mrs. John Robinson of 
Odessa, Mrs. Minnie White of 
Plainview, and Mrs. Lola Bolton 
of California; and 12 grand­
children.

The Caraway families, Mr. and 
Mrs. H. L. Vincent, Mr. and Mrs. 
R. B. Terrell, Mr. and Mrs. Hor­
ace Sneed, Mr. and Mrs. Dick 
Farris, Mr. and Mrs. Arthur L. 
Golden, Mr. and Mrs. Webb 
Whorton, and Mrs. Mertie Mas- 
sie attended the funeral.

Flames Destroy 
Butch Keener 
Trailer Home

A fire of unknown origin de­
stroyed the trailer house home 
of Mr. and Mrs. Butch Keener 
Tuesday. The fire was discov­
ered about 4:00 p. m. Strat­
ford Volunteer Firemen brought 
the flames under control but the 
trailer had been damaged be­
yond repair before the fire 
alarm sounded.

The newlyweds lost practically 
all of their posessions in the 
fire.

To The People 
Of The 18th 
District

(By W’alter Rogers)
The Sugar Trust

Signs are appearing daily in­
dicating that the sugar trust has 
not been asleep. It was thwart-^ 
ed three years in a row in its 
attempt to gain a long-term ex­
tension of the Sugar Act. It 
was forced on each of these oc­
casions to resort to scare tac­
tics and “emergency” talk and 
unfair procedure tactics in or­
der to obtain short-term exten­
sions to further hide the com­
plete truth from the American 
people. They do not want the 
Sugar Act or the sugar problem 
debated openly on the Floor of 
Congress. They know that the 
American people and the Ameri­
can farmer have been hood­
winked and that if all the facts 
are made available and are un­
derstood by the people of this 
country, their heydey is at an 
end.

A good representative group 
of Sherman County cattlemen 
attended the brucellosis meeting 
Tuesday and heard a progress 
report on the bruecllosis pro­
gram in Texas by Dr. Zirkle.

Dr. Zirkle has charge of all 
brucellosis field work in West 
Texas. He reported rapid ex­
pansion of brucellosis free areas 
in West Texas. Five crews are 
busy keeping up with the de­
mand for testing cattle under 
this program in his area.

Local livestock men expressed 
interest and asked many ques­
tions about the advantages and 
disadvantages of Sherman 
County becoming a modified, 
brucellosis free area. Dr. 
Zirkle said he thought it was a 
good livestock program and that 
livestock men would find less 
restriction in movement of cat­
tle if the county was certified 
as a modified brucellosis free 
area. Also he did not think 
inspectors would find many cat­
tle infected with brucellosis in 
this county.

He pointed to restrictions of 
free movement of cattle in an 
unclean county compared to a 
clean county and said more re­
strictions would be placed on 
movement of cattle in unclean 
areas June 1. He explained

Jesus was about 33 years of 
age at the time of His death.

Janice Boren 
On Semester 
Honor Roll

CANYON — Mary Janice Bor­
en, senior business education 
major at West Texas State Col­
lege, has been named to the fall 
semester honor roll, the upper 
five per cent of the undergrad­
uate student body.

Miss Boren, the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Allen Boren of 
Kerrick, is also a member of 
Chi Omega, social sorority; and 
Phi Gamma Nu, professional 
womens sorority.

Pronger Bull 
Sells for $1,000 
At Boise City

At the Five States Hereford 
sale in Boise City, the grand 
champion bull bred by P. J. 
Pronger of Stratford, was pur­
chased by Carl Myers of Felt, 
Oklahoma for $1,000. The re­
serve champion bull, bred by 
Newton James of Kerrick, was 
purchased by Jerry Lee Rice, 
Felt 4-H member, for $700.

Clifford Hitchings bought the 
grand champion female, bred by 
P. J. Pronger, at $430 for his 
daughter, Norma Jean, as a 4-H 
project.

David Cope of Walsh, Colo­
rado bought the reserve champ­
ion heifer, bred by W. S. Whor­
ton & Son of Stratford for $305.

Bulls sold for an average of 
$400 per head, and females sold 
for an average of $273.25 pær 
head.

Days’ Drizzle 
Recorded .09 
Of An Inch

A mist and light showers of 
rain falling during the day 
Wednesday, recorded .09 of an 
inch in the official weather 
gauge of Horace Sneed, local 
weather observer.

Wheat has been growing 
rapidly during the warm days. 
Producers say there is an abun­
dant supply of subsoil moisture 
but more surface moisture would 
be welcomed.

They are a powerful group, 
with control of several hundreds 
of millions of dollars annually, 
out of which they reap huge 
profits. By virtue of the pow­
er associated with these tre-, 
mendous sums, they have been 
able to retain a law that re­
quires the importation from for­
eign sources of approximately 45 
percent of the sugar demand in 
this country. This means that 
approximately 5,000,000 tons of 
sugar are imported into this 
country each year. At a value 
of five cents a pound. This would 
mean an overall transaction of 
approximately $500 million. 
This half-billion dollar business 
is handled through approxi­
mately 12 refineries and it is 
generally assumed that the 
ownership of these refineries is 
by a lesser number than 12. This 
will give you some idea of the 
small, compact group that has 
a throttle-hold on the sugar 
needs of this country. All of 
the sugar, with a very minute 
excepion, must be channelled 
through these refineries because 
it is raw sugar and could not be 
imported into this country if it 
had already been refined. Hence, 
these refineries are guaranteed 
a refining process business of 
half a billion dollars worth of 
sugar each year. The next 
question is, where does the sug­
ar come from? Not from 
American farmers, either in the 
continental United States or any 
of our possessions or other 
States. It comes from foreign 
countries under the provisions 
of the law. It is this law that 
the sugar trust does not want 
amended.

Up until about two years ago, 
Cuba furnished this country 
three million tons of sugar of a 
value of approximately $300 mil­
lion. When Cuba went Com­
munist, we stopped purchasing 
sugar from Cuba, or thought we 
did. At that time it was the 
hc^e of the American farmer, 
who had long clamored for the 
right to grow more sugar 
ibieets, that he would he al­
lowed to produce some of this 
sugar allotment that we had 
taken away from the Communist 
country. However, he failed 
to reckon with the half-billion 
dollar sugar trust. These fel­
lows had not been asleep. They 
immediately went to work and 
procured the extension of the 
Sugar Act through the Congress 
without debate in the House of 

(Continued on Page 6)

that sales rings in Texas mark, 
cattle with colored paint to 
designate origin of cattle. If 
cattle came from unclean areas 
green colored paint was used. 
This practice affects the sale 
price of cattle and tended to re­
strict freedom of movement. 
Federal laws affect interstate 
moyement of cattle in unclean 
areas and cattlemen can expect 
stricter enforcement he said.

The brucellosis program and 
other problems affecting the 
cattle industry locally and what 
cattlemen want done about 
them are being considered in 
some adjoining Panhandle 
Counties currently, E. Goule 
stated. He also gave a progress 
report to the group on South­
west Animal Health Research 
Foundation in Texas.

City Office 
Filing Deadline 
1$ March 3

Saturday, March 3, is the last 
day candidates may file for the 
offices of mayor and councilmen 
of the city of Stratford. City 
Secretary Dan Foreman says 
prospective candidates are not 
rushing to the city hall to file 
for their names to appear on 
the ballot.

A mayor and two councilmen 
are to be elected in the city 
election to be held Tuesday, 
April 3.

Terms of office of W. O. 
Bryant, mayor, and E. R. Bell 
and H. M. Caraway, councilmen, 
are expiring.

Terms of office of Council- 
men K. L. Eller, John Knight 
and Howard Etheridge will not 
expire until next year.

Jamboree 
Committees 
Meet Feb. 22

The Stratford Jamboree Board 
of Directors and the Advisory 
Committee will meet Thursday, 
February 22, at 7:30 p. m. in the 
County Exhibit Building. Plans 
for the September fair and jam­
boree will be discussed.
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Town Talk

Mrs. J. W. Smith accompanied 
her hrothers-in-law and sisters, 
Mr. and Mrs. Raymon Reynolds 
and Mr. and Mrs. Marion 
Thompson of Dalhart, to Colo­
rado Springs, Colorado last week 
end for a visit with S/Sgt. 
Richard Ringo, who is ill in the 
FOrt Carson Hospital. Ringo is 
a brother of Mesdames Smith, 
Reynolds and Thompson,

Mr. and Mrs. J. T. Lollis and 
Larry were visitors in Dalhart 
Sunday,

- —
Mr. and Mrs. W. N, Jackson 

and daughters, and H. T. Jack- 
son were visitors in Amarillo 
Sunday.

Mrs. Bessie Mitchell and Mrs. 
F. A. Judd were visitors in Dal­
hart Monday. , i

Mr. and Mrs. Leo Meek and 
Mary Jo and Mrs. Lacy Meek

attended the funeral of Oliver 
Norris Sunday in Wellington. 
Mr. Norris was an uncle of Mrs. 
Lacy Meek and Leo Meek.

Mr. and Mrs. Walter Pendle­
ton of Amarillo visited rela­
tives and friends in Stratford 
Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs, Don Ray Knight 
and Valerie have moved from 
Lubbock, where Mr. Knight ,hŝ s 
been in school, and are to be 
here until fall. >

DO VOU REA.LIZE WHILE VDU 
J U S T  LIE  T H E R E  VOUR MOTHER 

J S  DOING A L L  TH E  HOUSEWORK 
A L O N E ?  /

B U T FATHER.,^ 
MOTHER A N D  

X  HAVE A  
P E R F E C T  
S Y S T E M ^ .

Miss Sharon Mullican and 
Mrs. Lenna Vickers of Amarillo 
were guests in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Grady Mullican over 
the week end, : ,

Mrs. J. T. Lollis and Mrs. Ha­
zel Diehl were Dalhart visitors 
Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. C. H. McNeil, 
Dalhart, visited in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Ed Hill Sunday

Mr. and Mrs. G. R. Garrison 
and Mr. and Mrs. Earl Phelps 
returned home Monday from a 
visit with relatives in Califor-

Mr. and Mrs. Homer Blake vis­
ited Mr. and Mrs. Monte Shearer

Breakfasts
AFTER 6:00 A. M.

TASTY HOME SEASONED

Meals and Short Orders 
Fern’s 287 Truck Stop Cafe

WE CLOSE ON SUNDAYS

Better Hearing Aid Center 
317-A Polk DR 3-2781

Amarillo, Texas 
Keneth Goebel, Mgr.

HEARING AID CLINIC ANNOUNCEMENT 
AT WOOLSEY’S APPLIANCE STORE 

STRATFORD
WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 21, 10:00 A. M. TO 12 NOON 
Batteries for most hearing aids are stocked regularly «at 

Woolsey’s Appliance Store

Baptist WMU 
Week Of Prayer 
Starts March 5

The Amie W. Armstrong week 
of prayer will be observed be­
ginning March 5 through the 
ninth at 10:00 a. m. at the Bap­
tist Church. The morning 
program on March 7 will be 
omitted, but will be presented 
at the regular prayer meeting 
service at 7:00 p. m.

An invitation is extended to 
all. Every woman of the church 
is urged to attend these prayer 
meetings and to co-operate fully 
in the effort to further the 
Home Mission Program.

S A V E
From ^ c  to §c a Gallon 

On Gasoline At

287 Truck Stop
W E  H O N O R  A LL C R E D IT  C A R D S

J. L. ADAMS

What Does She Do??
Campaigning through Sherman County 

many questions asked, for instance, “Just what are the du­
ties of the County and District Clerk?”

T he C ounty  A n d  D istric t C le rk
Types and records all legal instruments involving land 

transactions.
Serves as Commissioners’ Court Clerk.
Is present at all District and County Court sessions. 
Keeps minutes of all sessions of four courts: County, 

District, Commissioners’ and Probate Courts.
Keens Judges’ dockets, may approve court or appeal 

bonds, is accountable for bills of costs and swears jury
members into service. . . .  j  • m 4.Files for record all probate, criminal and civil mat­
ters ih County and District Offices.Makes transcripts of records concerning all actions 
taken by this court to any given case that is appealed to
another court. ^Collects and disburses all child support and adult pro­
bation moneys.

Issues marriage licenses. .i. aIs accountable for trust funds, one for District Court and 
one for County Court. These funds are comparable to 
moneys placed in escrow.

I HEREBY PLEDGE TO YOU, that I hm qualified to 
fulfill the above duties. I offer my training and exper­
ience in evidence.

TRAINING: Business Administration Degree, Univer­
sity of Texas, including Business Law, Real Estate Law and 
Insurance, Accounting, Typing, Shorthand, Office Manage­
ment and others.

EXPERIENCE: Legal secretary, Underwood Law Firm, 
Am'arillo, Texas. Secretary to Cashier, Bank of America, 
Los Angeles, California. Alternate secretary to President 
Painter, University of Texas, Austin, Texas.

MRS. JEANNIE DAVIS
C a n d id a te  fo r C ounty  &  D istric t C lerk  

S h erm an  C ounty
(Paid Political Adv.)

Mrs. Pleyer 
Is Hostess To 
Friendship Club

The Friendship Club met with 
Mrs. W. E. Pleyer Thursday af­
ternoon, February 8. Those 
present spent an enjoyable af­
ternoon embroidering and visit­
ing.

Three members were unable 
to be there on account of acci­
dents and illness. The group 
voted to send flowers to Mrs. 
Kenneth Borth, Mrs. Roscoe 
Dyess and Mrs. Bertha Borth. 
They also voted to send flowers 
to Miss Edna Bolster, who is 
suffering from a broken collar 
bone and a broken hip as a re­
sult of the accident she and 
Mrs. Borth were in recently.

Members attending were Mrs. 
Ernie Dyess, Mrs. Nell Wall, 
Mrs. P. J. Pronger Jr., Mrs. Bill 
Taylor and Mrs. Pleyer. One 
visitor, Mrs. Ed Smith, was pres­
ent.

The club will gather for an all 
day meeting with Mrs. P. J.

Mrs. Collins 
Entertains 
CWF Group

Group Two of the C. W. F. 
meeting was called to order by 
the leader, Mrs. Curtis Collins.

The minutes were read and 
approved.

After the business for the day 
had been transacted, the roll 
call was taken, with 11 menrbers 
reporting six books read, eight 
daily devotionals, one World 
Call read and twenty-eight calls 
made.

The devotional was given by 
Mrs. Gail McDaniel, and the 
lesson by Mrs. Joe Billington, 
after which the group was dis­
missed with the C. W, F. bene­
diction.

The next meeting will be with 
Mrs. Claude Allen, The leader

is to be selected by Mrs. McDan- j iel. Mrs. Dean Gifford will give the devotional.

Pronger Jr. on Thursday, Feb­
ruary 22. All members are to 
bring thimbles to quilt with, 
and a covered dish for lunch.

Oil Sale Prices
Available Until March 1,1962

Co-op Motor Oil 55 gal. 30 gal. 5 gal. 24/1 case
R eg u la r $36.85 $22.50 $4 .05 $4 .5 5
P rem iu m  H D $50.60 $28 .50 $5 .05 $ 5 .7 5
H eavy  D uty  S-1 $52.25 $30.00 $5.30 $6.05
D iesel Sr2 $56.10 $33.00 $6 .05
S uper G $52.80 $31.50 $5.55 $6 .75
S uper V is 10-30 $58.30 $34.50 $6 .05 $7 .15

D -X M O T O R OI L
D-X 200 H D $ 5 3 .3 5 $30.00 $5 .3 5 $6.20
D-X 140 D H D $5 5 .0 0 $31.50 $5.50 $6.45
D-X 120 Spec. 10-30 $6 8 .7 5 $42.95 $7.15 $8.30

(5  G a ls .)

Transmission Oil 120 lbs. 100 lbs. 40 lbs.
U N IV E R SA L $19.40 $16 .25 $6.85
B R IT E  M IN E R A L $11.75 $5.65

Grease 100 lbs. 40 lbs. 35 lbs. 25 lbs.
S ham rock  S u p erfax 0  $14 .65 $5 .85 $3 .70
S ham rock
S u p erfax  lSc2 $14.25 $5.65 $3.55
Co-op M ultipu rpose $19.05 $6 .80 $4 .90
Co-op C ofax $14.00 $5 .40 $3 .90
D-X 607 $14.75 $5.70
D-X 630 F IB R E X 120 lbs. - $18.90 35 Lbs. -  $6.15

A ll tax es  an d  d ru m  dep o sit in c lu d ed  in th e  above prices. 
D R U M  C R E D IT  —  55 g a l. —  $4.25  30 g a l. —  $2.50

THE ABOVE PRODUCTS ARE TO BE PLACED ON ORDER BEFORE THE ABOVE 
MENTIONED DATE, AND MUST BE PICKED UP BY MARCH 31, 1962.

Consumers Co.
WS9

and daughters in Spearman 
Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Fritz Steinber- 
ger spent the week end in Can­
yon visiting with Mr. and Mrs. 
Gary Steinberger and Bill Stein- 
berger.

J / *.- •
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rjpay dwidèûds in better living

M

Dick Diehl bought cattle at 
the livestock auction in Ama­
rillo Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. Ted Reynolds 
and Lynn went to Fort Carson, 
Colorado, over the week end to 
visit their son, Teddy, who is 
stationed there. He accom­
panied them to Denver, Colo­
rado, where they visited their 
son-in-law and daughter, Mr. 
and Mrs. Jim Shaver and child­
ren.

Mr. and Mrs. Van B. Boston 
attended the hardware conven­
tion in Amarillo the first of the 
week.

Mrs. Roy Combs and Bonnie 
went to Wellington, Colorado 
Sunday to be with Mr. Combs’ 
sister, who underwent surgery 
Wednesday.

Mr. and Mrs. O. W. Wharton 
of Tucumcari, New Mexico visit­
ed in the Dick Diehl home from 
Wednesday of last week to Mon­
day. He bought and sold cat­
tle while here.

, 'k'

A G A S
A I R - C O N D I T I O N E R
Automatic year-round gas air condi­
tioning offers a new standard in com­
fort for your entire home. Blissfully 
cool in Sum m er. . .  cosy and warm in 
Winter with no stuffiness and no 
dam pness no m atter what the 
weather. And gas air conditioning is 
so quiet, so clean and so economical. 
There’s nothing like it.

A G A S
R E F R IG E R A T O R

Revolutionary new gas refrigerators 
with “ built-in” styling provide greater 
cooling and freezer storage in more 
compact space. Automatic ice cube 
maker does away with trays and 
messy filling. And gas refrigerators 
are quiet (a tiny flame does the work) 
. . .  dependable (a 10-year warranty).. .  
and economical, too.

G R A C I O U S  
G A S  L I G H T S

A new fashion in modern living is gas 
lighting for entrances, lawns, patios 
and pools. The soft glow of contem­
porary or traditional gas lights lends 
graciousness to every home. So many 
families have found gas lighting de­
lightful that there are more outdoor 
gas lights in America today than 
when gas was the major source of 
illumination.

AN A U T O M A T I C  
G A S  R A N G E

For today’s “gourmet” cooking and 
convenient housekeeping, there’s 
nothing like a new automatic gas 
range. You get such pleasant advan­
tages...radiant steak brpiling on both 
sides at once, automatic temperature- 
controlled top burners, and ovens 
that “ hold” the roast ’til you’re ready. 
All in a world of colors with both 
built-in and “free-standing” styles.

A G A S
W A T E R  H E A T E R

Millions of families have proved there 
is nothing to match the performance 
of an automatic gas water heater. 
Plenty of hot water is one of the 
“ musts” of modern liv in g...and gas 
provides it whether your home has 
one bath or four. With gas, you not 
only get more hot water faster; you 
get it more economically too.

G A S
H O M E  H E A T IN G

Automatic home heating with gas Is 
more popular than any other kind In 
the country today. Gas heat is so 
clean, so safe, so economical. . .  and 
just plain comfortable that wherever 
it is available, people prefer it. And 
you get the fresh, circulated air the 
modern home should have.

A G A S
C L O T H E S  D R Y ER

The gentle warmth of automatically 
controlled gas has replaced the sun 
for drying the clothes of modern 
families. It makes your clothes so 
bright and fluffy, so clean smelling 
...a n d  it costs so much less to use. 
There is no greater convenience than 
an automatic gas dryer. It banishes 
drudgery at the touch of a dial.

f l

u

WESTERN

LIVE MODERN, 
FOR LESS,
WITH GAS!

SERVICE
C O M P A N Y
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Entertains 
Inter Se Club

Mrs. Zelda Dunlap entertained 
the Inter Se Club recently. The 
usual game of “42” was enjoy­

ed throughout the afternoon. 
Mrs. J. C. O’Brien won high 
score. Lovely refreshments were 
served to Mesdames Joe Brown, 
Nellie Blanck, R. C. Buckles, A. 
L. King, C. W. Moon, F. B. Mul­
lins, A. E. Pronger, Sam Wohl- 
ford, Byron Pedric, J. C. 
O’Brien, E. W. Butler, Bessie 
Mitchell and Ira Divine.

•  Get Wise and Advertise!

Americans Largest Independent Telephone System

C^onsider the General Telephone service man. 

He is a trained technician, whose knowledge 
includes the telephone instrument you use, 
and the vast amount of other complex equip­
ment which makes it useful to you.

He is one of many people at General Tele­
phone, both seen and unseen, who are dedi­
cated to the mission of providing you with 
continuing good telephone service.

GENERAL TELEPHO NE
C O M PA N Y  OF THE SOUTHWEST fciÑERAD

WILLIE
SHOEMAKER-
A1MIN« A T  HIS I21U 
CONSBCÜTIVK HlDINd 

CHAMWONSMIP AT 
aA» fTA  A N IT A .. .

HE HOLDS THE (RECORD 
f o r  m o s t  w i n n i n g  

Rioes veAR.— ■486 IN I9S4...

Mrs. Gladish’s 
Sister Dies 
In Denver

Mrs. Frances Truog, 73-year 
old sister of Mrs. V. M. Gladish 
of Dalhart, died Tuesday morn­
ing in Presbyterian Hospital in 
Denver, Colorado where she had 
undergone surgery.

Burial will be made in the 
family’s home town of Stewarts- 
ville, Missouri.

Rains Follow 
Winter High 
Temperatures

Winter temperatures soared 
to an all-winter high of 85 de­
grees as the long range forecast 
of a snow storm failed to appear. 
Working men appeared in shirt 
sleeves and some of the younger

'M y mashing is

dried inside, out

of the co ld ...

electrically,

$ay$ Mrs. limmy 
Sterling,

Mrs Sterling appreciates drying 
her clothes inside, out of the 

weather, and with Carla, age ‘IVz, 
and the baby, Bliss, barely 8 months 

old, Mrs Sterling really enjoys the 
time her electric clothes dryer 

saves her. She comments, too, on 
the feeling of her electrically- 

dried clothes, “Towels are 
so fluffy and diapers are so 

soft.” Youll agree with 
Mrs Sterling when you get 

your electric- clothes dryer.

BUY YOUR

ELECTR IC  
Clothes Dryer 

NOW

SEE YO UR  
REDDY KILOW ATT 

APPLIANCE DEALER

WE STERN

PIIBIIC^SERVICE

Lunts Named 
P-TA Family 
Of The Year

Mr. and Mrs. Wesley Lunt and 
their twin sons were named 
“family of the year” by the 
Sunray P-TA this week. Like 
their parents, 10-year old fifth 
graders, Harry and Gary, are 
natives of the North Plains.

Besides the family’s partici­
pation in P-TA work, all are ac- 
ti\e in the First Baptist Church 
and the Boy Scouts. Lunt is a 
member of the Sunray Lions 
Club and the school board. He 
is president of the Band Boost­
ers organization, and a mem­
ber-at-large of the Moore Dis­
trict Boy Scout Council. He is 
also a 32nd degree Mason, a 
Shriner and a member of the 
Eastern Star.

Mrs. Lunt is president of the 
20th Century Study Club and a 
member of the Eastern Star.

The Lunts have a farm in the 
southeastern edge of Sherman 
County.

L E T T E R S  
To The Editor

Dear Editor:
Why should the proprietor of 

a theater show movies that 
play to an empty hoLise?

Last week end “St. Francis of 
Assissi”, rated top flight family 
entertainment by Parent’s Mag­
azine, was featured at our lo-

girls ventured out in shorts as 
the winter sunshine bathed the 
high plains with summer weath­
er.

Wednesday morning a slow 
mist began picking up momen­
tum at 8:30 a. m.

Wheat is growing rapidly in 
the first extended period of 
warm weather that has visited 
the plains since freezing weath­
er began earlier in the winter.

Throughout the nation, tem­
peratures generally were mild 
Monday with the exception of 
the northeastern portion of the 
nation, with New England, New 
York and the Great Lakes re­
gion reporting minimum tem­
peratures around zero.

In the far west, California 
was getting a respite from the 
deluge of rain inundation the 
Los Angeles area had exper­
ienced for several days. Rains 
were expected to be over for at 
least two days and maybe more.

In the Tri-State area, mini­
mum temperatures included 
Amarillo 47, Lubbock 47, Pampa 
55, and Perryton 46.

cal theater. Qn Sunday the at­
tendance was below average. On 
Monday night there were twelve 
people present.

This is not an isolated case. 
In our community good movies 
often receive poor attendance, 
while shows featuring crime and 
violence are well attended.

If we hope to have better 
movies and cleaner literature in 
our comunity we must support it 
with our dollars and cents, not 
with talk alone. The only way 
the merchants have to evaluate 
our interest is the cash register. 
Our slightest action is of more 
value than the largest inten­
tion.

The next time a good, clean 
movie is shown, take your whole 
family. I t’s up to you.

Sincerely,
Mrs. Alvin Engelbrecht

Dear Editor:
Newton Norman Minow is 

chairman of the Federal Com­
munications Commission. He 
is 36 years old, and a most effi­
cient man. He is interested in 
the influence our TV shows are 
having on our young people. He 
doesn’t want censorship or con­
trol, but feels that our broad­
casters have an obligation to 
use the medium to elevate, in­
form and uplift as well as en­
tertain the public.

Are you ^s a parent concern­
ed: Or maybe you haven’t giv­
en it much thought. Have you 
ever considered the influence it 
does have on all our lives? Try 
sitting in front of a television 
set all day (for just one day). 
What do you suppose you’d end 
up with, information, entertain­
ment or just plain boredom. In 
most cases the latter is true. 
Our television shows have not 
improved with, age, and if we as 
parents don’t take an interest, 
who will. Do you ever tell the 
children they can’t watch a cer­
tain program? Some employ 
brutality in excess of that ne­
cessary to the story line, or 
purely for shock purposes. Then 
there are those with a low mor­
al ton which are occasionally or 
consistently in conflict with 
Christian standards of morality 
and decency. Watch some of 
the shows your children watch, 
and you’re sure to recognize 
them.

What can we do about getting 
better television? Try writing 
a letter to Walt Disney or other 
producers that do put on an 
outstanding program. It takes 
only a few minutes, and they 
would appreciate a word of 
praise, just as we do in our daily 
efforts. They are serving their 

(Continued on page 4)

Mrs. Butler 
Is Embroidery 
Club Hostess

The Embroidery Club met 
Thursday, February 8, with Mrs. 
E. W. Butler for an enjoyable 
afternoon.

Refreshments were served by

the hostess, Mrs. Butler, to Mes*Idames Frank Judd, Bessie Mit­
chell, Ann Williams, H. L. Vin­
cent, J. P. Cameron, Zelda Dun­
lap, Bertha Oquin, A. E. Prang­
er, Grover Keown, D. D. Wood- 
all, G. L. Taylor, Royal Pendle­
ton and J. C. O’Brien.

The next meeting will be held 
in the home of Mrs. Zelda Dun­
lap on March 8, at 2:30 p. m.

YOU CAN LAUGH AT SNOW, MUD AND SLUSH

DUNLOP
T i a c t i o H ' t i r e s

You can count on the extra grip of the 
deep, deep tread on this remarkable winter 
tire by Dunlop, to power you through heavy 
snow, mud or slush. Get a pair now for 

peace of mind. Deep, deep tread for 
extra miles, extra safety, extra 

go in the snow.
AS LOW AS

plus tax and recappable tire 
6:70 X 15 nylon tubed block

Gulf Super Service

T h e  S tra tfo rd  S ta r
Published Weekly By 

Brown Ross
Entered as second class matter 

at the Post Office in Stratford, 
Texas, under the act of March 
8, 1879.

Subscription Rates
$3.00 per year in Sherman and 

adjoining counties. $3.50 per
year outside first zone.

Classified and Legáis
3 cenes per word first Inser­

tion, 50c minimum, 2 cents per 
word subsequent insertions.
Display rates on application.

Get in on the

ro iL iiis
with o u r

tm  mDEB’s Bonus
T h e  ea rlie r 
yo u  trade 
the m o re

BONUS 
DOLLARS

yo u  get

Hurry . . .  be an Early Trader, and 

collect bonus dollars now! Come in and 

let us show you how big your 

cash bonus can be.
You’ll collect your Early Trader’s 

Bonus on any purchase of new IH 

equipment of $500 or more . . .  from 

tractors to twine, from tillage tools to 

harvesting equipment.
When you buy, you’ll earn a shower 

of dollars . . .  you’ll collect interest at 
the rate of 6% on your trade-in and/or 

down payment. And you get your 

bonus check at once!

King Equipment Co.
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4-H Club Calves
Win Places In
Guymon Show

Andy Berry’s 4-H Hereford 
calf was declared the reserve 
champion of the Great Plains 
Hereford Association Pat Stock 
Show held in Guymon last week. 
The calf was the grand champ­
ion of the’Sherman County Fat 
Stock Show.

Scott Whorton won two fourth 
place honors with two 4-H club 
calves.

Lynn Gaylord’s pig placed 
fourth in its class.

Letters To
(Continued from page 3)

country well and giving their 
best for our entertainment.

A post card to our Amarillo 
stations may have a surprising 
effect on the programming of 
shows.

Let’s get behind Minow and 
demand a higher form of tele­
vision for our families.

Mrs. Doug Dettle

It’s profitable to read the ads.

Rev. Bums
Returns To
Visit Stratford

Rev. and Mrs. Pearce Burns 
of Stinnett were visitors in 
Stratford Monday. He was the 
minister of the First Christian 
Church in Stratford 33 years 
ago. It was their first visit to 
Stratford since that time.

Rev. Burns accepted the min­
istry at the First Christian 
Church in Stinnett about a 
month ago.

Among the Sick
Mrs. M. S. Horton was brought 

home Tuesday from St. Anthony 
Hospital in Amarillo where she 
has been a surgical patient.

Mrs. Eugene Hudson was ad­
mitted to St. Anthony’s Hos­
pital in Amarillo Tuesday for a 
medical examination.

Mrs. Roscoe Dyess was brought 
to the home of her mother, Mrs. 
A E. Pronger, Sunday, and 
taken to her home seven miles 
southwest of Stratford Wednes­
day. She recently underwent

Want A d s
W a n ted

WANTED: Players for the 
game night at the American 
Legion Hall Saturday, Feb­
ruary 17. Free refreshments 
will be served. — Prospectus 
Study Club. 7-2tc

WANTED: Sewing to do in my 
home. Will also cover buckles, 
make button holes and belts. 
— Mrs. W. J. Lowe, Phone 396- 
4381. 36-tfc

WANT To Rent: A three bed­
room home in Stratford. Will 
pay rent a year in advance, 
with option to buy comparative­
ly new home. — Benton Noble, 
201 Northeast Sixth, 'Tulia, 
Texas, telephone WY 5-3217.

4-tfc

S pecial Service*
FOR Your Stanley Products.— 

See Della Adkins, 6th and Wall, 
Phone 396-4391. 7-4tc

F o r R en t
FOR RENT: Small modern 

house on pavement. — G. R. 
Garrison, Phone 396-2451. 52-tfc

F o r S ale
FOR SALE: 23-Foot Alum­

inum Trailer House. — Leslie 
Dodson, phone 396-3751. 7-tfc

FOR SALE: Bird Dog Pups. — 
A. B. Morris, Box 885, Stratford.

6-4tp
SEVERAL Good used Living 

Room Suites. — McMahen Fur­
niture Co. 43-tfc

FOR SALE: Ironrite Ironer in 
good condition, priced reason­
able. — Mrs. Buddy Miller. 5-tfc

surgery in Memorial Hospital in 
Dumas.

M. S. Horton has been ill with 
the flu this week.

Frank Judd has been a medi­
cal patient in Baylor Hospital 
in Dallas the past week for 
tests and treatment. Mr. and 
Mrs. Paul Aduddell accompan-

Methodist Church
(Rev. Raymond T. Dyess, Pastor)

PLEASE Call J. D. Atnip in 
Dumas at phones 935-2511, 935- 
4131 or 935-4703 for construc­
tion of new homes, remodeling 
or commercial work. Would 
appreciate the chance to figure 
with you. Can give references 
if needed. 7-3tc

COMPACT Vacuum sales and 
service, also used vacuums. Call 
W. D. Brannan, Phone 396-3741.

43-tfc
FOR ALL kinds of ccmuner- 

cial or home refrigeration ser­
vice, call Russell Beall, phone 
396-5121. 5-tfc

FOR THE BEST in house mov­
ing, call 249-2084. — E. O.
Matthews, Dalhart. 50-tfc
* FREE Removal of dead stock. 
Call 396-3736 Stratford, or DI 
9-2211 Amarillo Collect. — Am­
arillo Rendering Co. 49-tfc

H ouses F o r S ale
FOR SALE: Two bedroom 

modern home with half-b^e- 
ment, wall to wall carpeting, 
built-in refrigerator and stove; 
m 21/2 lots on paved street. — 
Wayne Cummings, Phone 396- 
J066 or 396-5551. 48-tfc

FOR SALE: Two story house 
to be moved off of lot. Con­
tact Dr. Paul E. Smith at Phone 
396-2351. 4-tfc

FOR SALE: Our home at Sev­
enth and Maple, for immediate 
possession. — Joy D. Smith, 
Phone 396-3926. 41-tfc

FOR SALE: House on 21/2 lots, 
paved, across street from park. 
See Edward Brannan. 29-tfc

OUR HOME located at 8th and 
Poplar for sale. Priced con­
siderably under appraised loan 
value. — E. A. McBryde, Phone 
396-3651. 34-tfc

FOR SALE: Three bedroom 
house, located on seven lots, 
paving paid for, — Roy Mitchell. 
>■ 24”tfc

fo r  SALE: Two Story 7-roonl 
house On four lots. House is in­
itiated and has new roof. — 
C. C. Plunk. 15-tfc

FOR SALE: Income Property, 
one bedroom furnished house 
and two bedroom unfurnished 
house. Both modern. See F. 
L. Yates. 11-tfc

FOR SALE: Two bedroom 
house with service porch and 
concrete storm cellar, located on 
three lots on paved street. — J. 
L. Adams. 8-2tc

The model T Ford was super- 
oiT'̂ ed by the Model A in 1927.

FOR SALE: Baled Alfalfa
Hay, first, second, third and 
fourth cuttings. $27.00 a ton 
delivered. — Larry Miller,
Phone Dudley 4-9862, La Junta, 
Colorado. 7-4tp

FOR SALE: Good Bundle feed 
$22 per ton. — J. M. Gorman, 14 
miles east of Stratford and U/2 
miles south. 3-tfc

FOR SALE: Side Oats Gram­
ma Grass Seed. See J. J. Willey.

5-tfc
FOR SALE: Cane bundles, lo­

cated 18 miles southeast of 
Stratford. — Chuck Smith,
Phone 396-5531. 5-tfc

HAY, Alfalfa and Prairie Hay. 
See J. I. Mooney. 36-tfc

FOR SALE: Good Two-wheel 
Trailer. — Garrison Motor Co., 
Phone 396-2451. 2-tfc

(X)NDI’nO N  Your lawns with 
Pax Crabgrass killer and Turf 
Magic fertilizer. — Van B. Bos­
ton’s Big Trading Post. 45-tfc

We have something very fine 
for vinyl and other floors called 
Seal Gloss acrylic finish. — Mc­
Mahen Furniture Co. 8-ltc

Massey-Ferguson early bird 
trades save you money. You 
save $350 on a Super 92 Gas 
Combine. You save $500 on a 
Super 92 S.P. Diesel Combine 
and $275 on an 82 Combine. — 
Moore Implement Co. 6-tfc

Stone-Field custom tailored 
Suits, sport coats and slacks. 
Measured to fit. See Edward 
Brannan, Phone 396-3521. 46-tfc

You can’t get better Carpet 
Deals any where than you can 
at McMahen Furniture Co. 5-tfc

Demonstrator Spinet Organ, 
National Known brand, will sell 
at 20% discoimt. Spinet Piano, 
Nationally known brand, re­
possessed. Take over pay­
ments. Write or call collect, 
Clark Music Co., 409 N. 8th, 
Garden City, Kansas. Phone 
Br 6-7362. 7-2tc

For the best buys in Furni­
ture and carpet, see Woody 
Furniture Co., Dumas, Texas, 
call WE 5-4811 collect for free 
estimate. 38-tfc

A im outicem ents

STRATFORD LODGE 874 
Grady R. Mullican, WM. 
W. S. Frizzell Jr., Sec’y. 

STATED COMMUNICATION
Third Thursday Every Month 

7:00 P. M.

Sunday School 9:45 a. m .
M orning worship 11:00 a. m.
M .y j . 6:00 p. m.
Interm ediate Fellow ship 6:00 

p. m.
Junior additional session 6:00 

p. m.
Evening worship 7:00 p. m.
Wesleyan Guild meets second 

Wednesday of each month at 
7:80 p. m.

Choir practice: First and 
third Wednesday of each month, 
7:30 p. m.

Official board meetings and 
all commissions second Wednes­
day of each month, 7:30 p. m. 
at the church.

W.S.C.S. Meetings: Third
Wednesday of each month at 
the church at 2:30 p. m.

Circles meet the first Wednes­
day of each month; Mary Ethel 
Circle at 9:30 a. m.. Flora Fore­
man Circle at 2:30 p. m., Flor­
ence Mullins Ĉ ircle at 9:30 a. m.

Methodist Men meet the 
fourth Wednesday night of each 
month at 7:00 p. m.

MYF council meetings: First 
Sunday of every third month at 
5:00 p. m.

ied him to Dallas. They left 
Stratford Saturday, February 
3, and went to College Station 
for a short visit with Mr. and 
Mrs. Paul Leroy Aduddell, going 
to Dallas on Monday, where Mr. 
Judd entered the hospital on 
Tuesday.

Mrs. Owen E. Hudson was a 
medical patient from Wednes­
day to Sunday in the Dumas 
Memorial Hospital.

Mrs. Blanche Strother, who 
fractured her left hip in a fall 
last month in Arlington, was 
brought home Sunday. Mrs. 
Nova Joyner went to Arlington 
by train and drove Mrs. Stroth­
er’s car back home for her. Mrs. 
Houston Cates and Lisa took 
Mrs. Joyner to Dalhart to take 
the train Friday afternoon. Mrs. 
Strother is able to get around 
on crutches.

Cards of Thanks
APPRECIATION

Christian Church
(Rev. H. Cecil Bever, Minister)

Sunday School 9:45 a. m.
Morning worship 10:45 a. m.
Junior youth fellowship 5:00 

p. m.
Chi Rho youth fellowship 5:00 

p. m.
C. Y. F. (high school) 5:00 p. 

m.
Evening worship 6:00 p. m. 

Wednesday
Adult choir practice 8:00 p. m.
Mid-week prayer study and 

prayer meeting 7:30 p. m.
A friendly welcome awaits 

you at any service of the First 
Christian Church.

I would like to say “Thanks” 
to everyone for the cards, flow­
ers and visits while I was in the 
hospital and since I have been 
home. They were sincerely 
appreciated.

Mrs. Owen E. Hudson

CARD OF THANKS
I would like to use this means 

of saying “Thank You” to the 
kind and thoughtful friends and 
neighbors who did so many nice 
things for my folks, Mr. and 
Mrs. A. L. Sutton, during moth­
er’s illness and convalescence. 
In this world of selfishness it is 
nice to know there are still peo­
ple who follow the Christian 
teaching of “Love thy neighbor.” 

Many sincere and grateful 
thanks to you all.

Helen Forester,
Hajrward, California

CARD OF THANKS
I want to thank all of my 

friends for the cards, flowers

and visits I enjoyed while in 
the hospital and since my re­
turn home.

Mrs. Roscoe Dyess

State Capital 
Highlights

(By Vern Sanford)
Candidates flooded this capi­

tal city as the filing deadline 
arrived. Politicians came to 
town to pay filing fees for state 
offices at both the state demo­
cratic headquarters and the re­
publican camp.

Thousand dollar fees were 
paid in many ways: One thou­
sand one-dollar bills, one hun­
dred ten-dollar bills, and var- 
ried contributions from friends 
of the candidates.

A former athlete brought a 
handful of ex-football stars a- 
long, to show that he had a 
sporting chance.

There were very few sur­
prises at the State Democratic 
Committee. Gubernatorial
candidates John Connally, Mar­
shall Formby, Will Wilson and 
Maj. Gen. Edwin A. Walker had 
paid before the deadline; Don 
Yarborough was expected, and 
everyone knew Gov. Price Daniel 
would show up after his TV an­
nouncement.

Austin Attorney Bob Looney 
arrived at the last minute to 
join Tom James, Tom Reavley, 
Waggoner Carr, W. T. McDon­
ald and Les Procter in the at­
torney general’s race.

Keith Wheatley, 27-year old 
Stamford oil operator, decided 
to oppose Railroad Commis­
sioner Ben Ramsey in the May 
primary.

Both Looney and Wheatley 
filed without paying, but plank­
ed down their $1,000 fees by the 
February 8 deadline.

Joe R. Pool, Dallas attorney, 
Charles H. Stevenson Jr. of 
Nueces County and rancher 
Phil Willis of Kaufman County, 
made the same sort of financial 
transaction as candidates for 
congressman-at-large.

Houston businessman Robert

W. Hervey and Mitchell County 
District Judge Eldon Mahon 
forfeited their right to run for 
congressman-at-large when 
they failed to follow filing with 
payment of filing fees.

Indicative of the expectal 
turnover in both House and Sen­
ate is the democratic line-up 
for lieutenant governor. Speak­
er of the House James A. Tur­
man, Senators Preston Smith, 
Jarrard Secrest and Robert Bak­
er, all are abandoning present 
posts to seek the state’s second 
highest position. Gene Smith 
of Fort Worth is the only non- 
legislative candidate for lieu­
tenant governor.
Republicans RaHy

“Rebirth of the republican 
party in Texas” has been wide­
ly discussed. It was quite evi­
dent when filing time was over 
that considerable progress had 
been made. If the party wasn’t

reborn it certainiy was revilDized.
Breckenridge oilman J 

Cox, former democratic caifl 
date for governor who annou 
ed for the GOP months ago,
two opponents at the cou' 
down. One was Amarillo ran 
er-publisher Roy WhittenbiO
who polled 185,926 votes when
opposed Ralph Yarborough Btj
the U. S. Senate in 1968. ?b

■ E
other was Harry Diehl, Hous.e 
factory representative, who Gi 
one of the 71 who ran for L; 
don Johnson’s senate seat Ig 
year. n

The republican line-up ed 
house and senate seats is imf 
ing. Fourteen republicans ;h 
campaigning for 10 of the m 
senate seats. And 74 reputi< 
cans have filed for 70 of the e 
representative offices. ŝ

dk.r<

Have Your Car
ec
n(
le
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Checked
And The Necessary 

Adjustments Made

er
idi

T<

w hile  th e re  is p len ty  of tim e to  com ply  j 
w ith  sa fe ty  in spection  law s

Motor Vehicles
a re  req u ired  by  S ta te  L aw  to  b e a r  

N ew  Inspec tion  S tickers by  A p ril 15

T. 0 . C. Motor Co.
S a fe ty  Inspec tion  S ta tio n

See “MR. ED” sponsored by Studebaker On Channel 10 aerr 
5:30 P. M. Saturdays.

Baptist Church
(M. E. Upchurch. Pastor)

Sunday School 10:00 a. m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a. m. 
Training Union 6:30 p. m. 
Evening Worship 7:30 p. m. 
Mid-week prayer service 7:00 

p. m. Wednesday.

Church of Christ
(Arthur L. Golden, Minister) 

Sunday Services 
Bible Study 10:00 a. m. 
Worship 10:55 a. m.
Evening Worship 6:00 p. m. 

Tuesday
Ladies class 9:30 a. m. 

Wednesday 
Bible study 7:00 p. m.
A friendly welcome awaits you 

at all services.

Assembly Of God 
Church

(Rev. Leland Lewis, Pastor) 
Sunday School 10:00 a. m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a. m. 
Yoimg People 6:00 p. m. 
Children’s Church 6:00 p. m. 
Evangelistic Service 7:00 p.

m.
Wednesday night service at 

7:30 p. m.
The public is invited to all 

services.

Catholic Church
(Rev. James W. Sonderman, 

Mission Pastor, Phone 
Dalhart, CH9-4128

Sundays
Confessions: 7:30 to 8:00 a. m. 
Mass: 8:00 a. m.
Catechism classes from 3:00 to 

4:00 p. m. Saturday.

ALCOHOLICS ANONYMOUS

AA Group Meets in Dalhart 
Every Tuesday — 8:00 P. M.

Stratford Phone: 396-3533 
Dalhart Phones: 249-4214 or 

249-2040

I >
!d.

This is the Ford Fairlane’s new Challenger “2 6 0 ” V-8.
There's no other V-8 like it. It’s the latest in a series of Ford V-8 triumphs 
that started back in 1932 when Ford introduced the world’s first popular- 
priced V-8. Today—30 years and 30 million V-8’s later—the Challenger 
“260” adds new fuel to the hottest performance record in V-8 history. It 
gives you all the time-tested toughness of ii'on—̂ with a lightness and com­
pactness iron never had before. A  muscular 164 hp, this new Challenger 
“260” V-8 is all snap, sparkle and smoothness. I t runs on regular, y e t gives 
you better gas mileage than any standard-size 6-cylinder car. Price it and 
you’re in for a surprise—a Fairlane V-8 carries a smaller price tag than some 
compact Sixes. And, of course, a Fairlane gives you big-car room and fine- 
car quality you’ll find in no other car anywhere near Fairlane’s amazing 
low  price. There’s never been a buy like Fairlane because there’s never 
been a car like Fairlane; that’s why this all-new car from Ford is now out­
selling evei'y other “new-size” car! PRODUCTS OF

MOTOR COMPANY

FAIRLANE 500 . . . Right size . . . Right price . 
Right between compacts and big cars

W Ñ Í A /V F

Whatever you’re looking for in a car, look to the long Ford line

FALCON GALAXIE/500
America’s best selling compact Its silence whispers quality

THUNDERBIRD 
Unique in all the world

Stratford Motor Co., Inc.{
S tra tfo rd , T ex as
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Diehl, House Bradley and Mrs. 
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P o l i t i c a l
Announcements

(Subject to the action of. lihe 
Democratic Primary Election 

Saturday, May 5)
For State Representative Of Tare 

92nd Legislative District:
A. C. Hallmark 
Chester Logue

For County and District desk: 
Mrs. Jeannie Davis.
Mrs. Marguerite Terrell 
Mrs. C. W. (Lela) Moon .

For County Treasurer: I
Mrs. Dorothy R. Slay 
Mrs. Madge F. Lowe

i

For County Judge and Ex-<^i- 
cio Superintendent Of 
Schools:
Chester Guthrie 
Arthur Ross
Bill Frizzell ;

For Justice Of The Peace; |
Precinct Four:
J. R. (Bob) Marshall I

For County Commissioner; .
Precinct Two: |
E. W. Carter '

For County Commissioner; ^
Precinct Four:
Tom Wakefield

For District Judge; ,
69th Judicial District: !

Harry Schultz !

RepubUc^an
For State Representative Of 

92nd Legislative District: 
Darrel Cathey

Luck’s biggest letter is H'l

There’s ̂ my other boyfriend I  was telling you about—the jealous one

CITATION BY TUBLICATION
THE STATE OF TEXAS

To any Sheriff or any Con­
stable within the State of Tex- 
tas— GREETING:

You are hereby com­
manded to cause to be
■published conce ^each week 
for four consecutive weeks, the 
first publication to be a t least 
twenty-eight days before the re­
turn day thereof, in a newspa- 
pfer printed iin Bherman County, 
Texas, the accompanying cita­
tion, df ■v îch the ’herein below 
following is a true copy.
CITATION BY PUBLlCATIOiN 

THE STATE OF TEXAS 
T O :  MR S .  MAG-

G I E S. HA Y N E S, 
and husband, if any, whose 
name is unknown, M. S. 
HAYNES, T. D. LIPSCOMB and 
wife DELLA LIPSCOMB, also 
known as MRS. M. I. LIP­
SCOMB, M. I. LIPSCOMB, and 
J. P. SMITH, the husbands 
a,nd/or Wives of any of the above 
named married persons, whose 
names are unknown, except as 
above stated, the unknown heirs 
■and legal representatives of any

IS

r-

It
>

es
id
le
a

«
s r

t-
DF

ANY

HUHURS
SCOUT SEÂSOU’S mm

of said defendants above named 
and described who may be de­
ceased, their unknown heirs and 
legal representatives, if deceas­
ed, all herein called defendants, 
Gieeting:

YOU ARE HEREBY COM­
MANDED to appear before the 
Honorable District Court of 
Sherman County at the Court­
house thereof, in Stratford, Tex­
as, by filing a written answer at 
or before 10 o’clock A. M. of the 
first Monday next after the ex­
piration pf forty-two days from 
the date of the issuance of this 
citation, same being the 12th 
day of March A. D. 1962, to 
Plaintiff’s Petition filed in said 
court, on the 25th day of Jan­
uary A. D. 1962, in this cause, 
numbered 1503 on the docket of 
said court and styled HATTIE 
MAE BUSH, Trustee, et al. 
Plaintiffs, vs. MRS. MAGGIE S. 
HAYNES, et al. Defendants.

A brief statement of the na­
ture of this suit is as follows, to- 
wit: A suit in Trespass to Try 
’Title, pertaining to that part of 
Section 216, Block 1-T, T&NO 
Ry. Co. Survey, Sherman Coun­
ty, Texas, lying south of the 
railroad right of way, Sherman 
County, -Plaintiffs pleading con­
secutive transfer of chain of ti­
tle from the State of Texas and 
the three, five and ten year 
statutes of limitation, praying 
for removal of all clouds of ti­
tle, for possession, title and gen­
eral relief, as is more fully 
shown by Plaintiff’s Petition on 
file in this suit.

If this citation is not served 
within ninety days after the 
date of its issuance, it shall be 
returned unserved.

The officer executing this 
writ shall promptly serve the 
same according to requirements 
ci law, and the mandates hereof, 
and make due return as the law 
directs.

Issued and given imder my 
hand and the seal of said court 
a,t Stratford, Texas, this the 
25 day of January A. D. 1962. 
(Seal) Attest: LELAH BONE Y 

(Jlerk, District Court, Sher­
man County, Texas.

(Pub. Feb. 1-8-15-22)

School C a fe te r ia  
L unch Schedule 
F eb ru a ry  19-23
Monday

Meatloaf, catsup 
Buttered potatoes 
English peas
Peanut butter muffins, butter 
Apple sauce 
1/2 pint milk 

Tuesday
Macaroni and cheese 
Blackeyed peas 
Tossed salad 
Hot rolls, butter 
Syrup, cherry cobbler 
1/2 pint milk 

Wednesday 
Hamburgers, gravy 
Mashed potatoes 
Mixed vegetables 
Hot rolls, butter 
Apple cobbler 
1/2 pint milk 

Thursday 
Roast, dressing 
Gravy, sweet potatoes 
Green beans 
Hot rolls, butter 
Raisins 
1/2 pint milk 

I: iday
Salmon balls, catsup 
Buttered potatoes 
Asparagus 
Hot rolls, butter 
Blackberry cobbler 
1/2 pint milk

TEXAS OPERATES 8,000 
SCHOOL BUSES

Approximately 8,000 school 
buses transported 423,000 stu­
dents more than 493,000 miles 
per day. Bumper to bumper the 
buses would create a traffic jam 
more than 51 miles long. Ap­
proximate annual cost of the 
transpcn'tation program to the 
State is $16,224,000.

Bill P en d le to n
Tour Home Town 

A U C T I O N E E R  
Box 406 -------  Stratford, Texas

TEXAS RANKS FIRST 
IN CIVIL DEFENSE

Texas ranked first in the na­

tion with 37,477 persons enroll­
ed in Civil Defense adult edu­
cation classes.

F O R D
E C O N O - P O W E R

Batteries
$11.95

6 V o lt 
12 M onth  

G u a ran te e

$14.95
12 V o lt 

24  M onth  
G u a ran te e

F A S T , F R E E  IN S T A L L A T IO N

Stratford Motor Co,
(INCORPORTED)

A rra n g e  F o r S u n d ay  A^ppointments

For Free Estimates On

HOMES
Built On Your Lots To Your 

Specifications
No M oney D ow n T o  Q u alified  

A p p lican ts , 4%  In te re s t 
$3500 a n d  U p C red its  G iven

T & 0  MODERN HOMES
BOX 350 PHONE 2381

T exhom a, O k lah o m a

“Our Family Checking Account
Is The Best Tax Record We Ever Had!

It’s the best hunting butMy a  bunter can 
have.

The Scout by iNTERNATiOiRLM. will get 
you there and back in solid comforjt. 
Weather-tight tops (there arefour of them;) 
—steel or soft vinyl, cab or full-length 
Travel-Tops—keep you snug and dry. A 
]high capacity heater/defroster warms ycsi 
on the way to the blind.

Great as it is in the field, the Scout will 
also shine for you at a wide variety of work-

aday tasks—from delivering to servicing, 
family shopping to church socials.

Its four cylinder, 93 horsepower Coman­
che engine gives it the oomph for plowing 
snow, pulling a 3-gang mower or hauling a 
trailer. Optional all-wheel-drive gives it the 
added traction for heavy work or for going 
'cross country, beyond the roads. A full as­
sortm ent of accessories enables you to 
equip your Scour for your needs. See us 
today about your Scout.

SC0Ur<̂  mERMATIONAV HI.

c.iing Equipment Co
STRATFORD, TEXAS

CONTRACTORS’ NOTICE 
OF ’TEXAS HIGHWAY 
CONSTRUCTION

Sealed proposals for con­
structing 13.544 miles of grad­
ing, structure widening, flexible 
base, two course surface treat­
ment, and asphaltic concrete 
pavement From Dallam County 
Line To Stratford, Bridge Wid­
ening 1 Mile, 29 Miles, and 30 
Miles S.W. of Dalhart, and 
Prom US 54 in Stratford To 6.6 
Miles East on Highway No. US 
54 & FM 289, covered by S 469- 
(5), C 238-1&2-14&15 & C 238- 
5-10 in Hartley and Sherman 
County, will be received at the 
Highway Department, Austin, 
until 9:00 A.M., February 20, 
1962, and then publicly opened 
and read.

Plans and specifications in­
cluding minimum wage rates as 
provided by Law are available 
at the office of H. L. Gallegly, 
Resident Engineer, Dalhart, 
Texas, and Texas Highway De­
partment, Austin. Usual rights 
reserved.
(Pub. P 8 & 15)

Don’t be as imcertain as the 
weather — use Star ads.

‘T w o y e a rs  ag o  w e w ere  ju s t sick ab o u t ou r incom e 
ta x . W e knew  w e h a d  m ore  deductions, b u t w e couldn^t 
p ro v e  them . W e h a d  e ith e r lo s t som e rece ip ts , o r ju s t n e ­
g lec ted  to  g e t them . So w e p a id  m ore  ta x  th a n  w e should  
have .

“ So la s t y e a r  w e d ec id ed  to  open  a  check ing  accoun t 
w ith  th e  fr ie n d ly  peop le  of T h e  F irs t S ta te  B ank  of S tra t­
fo rd . A n d  a re  w e g lad ! O u r  can ce lled  checks a re  ju s t 
like  rece ip ts , a n d  our ta x  th is  y e a r  w as a  lo t less because 
w e cou ld  prove every  d ed u c tio n .

“ W e h av e  on ly  one re g re t, w e should  have opened  a  
check ing  acco u n t a t  T he F irs t  S ta te  B ank  so o n e r.''

The First State Bank
OF S T R A T F O R D

Y our D eposits In su red  U p T o  $10 ,000  By F e d e ra l D eposit
In su ran ce  C orp o ra tio n
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Buckles And 
Browder Elected 
As Co-Op Chiefs

R. C. Buckles was re-elected 
president of the Rita Blanca 
Electric Cooperative and XIT 
Rural Telephone Cooperative at 
jointmeetings of the two co-ops 
Wednesday of last week. More 
than 300 attended the gather­
ing at Lake Rita Blanca Park 
Coliseum in Dalhart.

Luther Browder was re-elect­
ed secretary-treasurer, and a 
member of the board of direc­
tors.

I t is hoped, said R. L. Elliott 
Jr., manager of the co-ops, that 
the Kerrick Exchange, to serve 
most of Sherman County and 
Northeast Dallam County, can 
be put into service in about 90 
days.

THE STRATFORD STAR, STRATFORD, TEXAS THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 15, 19j62

Cub Scouts 
To Receive 
Awards Feb- 24

Eligible Cub Scouts who are 
accompanied by their parents 
■will receive their awards at 
the annual blue and gold ban­
quet given in their honor at the 
County Exhibit Building on Sat­
urday, February 24. The Feb­
ruary pack meeting will be held 
at this time.

Joe Nesbitt of Dalhart will be 
the guest speaker. R. C. Buckles 
will serve as toastmaster.

hev,6 u e !  th is  h ill  is  to o  ta m e/
LETS FIND ONE MORE EXCITING/^

MAWOC/

stop the outflow of American 
dollars; it would invigorate the 
agricultural communities in a 
number of areas throughout the 
United States; it would make it 
possible to build at least ten ad­
ditional sugar processing plants 
in this country at a cost of a- 
round $12 to $18 million each. 
This latter would help measur­
ably in solving the unemploy­
ment problem not only in the 
factory areas but in the rural 
areas where these plants would 
be located.

It must also be remembered 
that this would all be possible, 
yet we would still be able to 
import 35 percent of our sugar 
needs from these other coim- 
tries; countries which hereto­
fore have furnished us less than 
15 percent of our sugar needs.

The big question in the minds 
of those who have studied this 
matter is why the sugar trust is 
so determined to deny the 
American farmer the right to 
grow sugar that is sold on the

American market, even in a lim­
ited amount; yet they are •will­
ing that the sugar allotment 
formerly held by Chba can be 
handed over to countries like 
Mexico and Brazil, who vigor­
ously fought the United States 
in the move to oust Castro from 
the Organization of American 
States, and to such countries as 
British Guiana, headed by one 
Cheddi Jagan. It will be re­
membered that this Cheddi Ja- 
gan and his wife have been link­
ed on numerous occasions in 
the press with Communism, 
both in this hemisphere and 
elsewhere. A large part of this 
could be transshipped Cuban 
sugar. The whole matter ap­
pears to me to ibe a case of ma­
terial greed that could do as 
much damage to this country 
any other one factor.

I can assure you that the 
small band which has fought so 
long and so hard is not going to 
give up, and that the battle will 
continue ■without cessation.

Gamma Xi 
Initiates 
New Members

Three new members were in­
itiated into Gamma Xi Chapter 
of Delta Kappa Gamma Society

♦♦♦ 4*

I 
I

%

ABSTRACTS
W E H A V E  A  C O M P L E T E  

A B S T R A C T  P L A N T

C overing  A ll R ea l E s ta te  In  
S h erm an  C ounty

W e F urn ish  Q uick  E ffic ien t Service 
O n S hort N otice

Sherman County Abstract Co.
I* Royal Pendleton, Manager Stratford, Terme
^♦J4> Î^*Î44J4♦J4♦♦♦4♦4♦J44J44J4424♦J44J^4J44J44J^4J4♦J4^J4♦J44^^Î44J44J4♦J^4J44J4^44J4^J4>Î^♦J44J44J4>Î^4J^4J4^44J44Î^^J4^J4^J4^^^^♦J^♦J^

The Sewing Center 
And Saw Shop

Dress Making or Alterations
S E W IN G  O F  A LL K IN D S

Saws Sharpened, Retoothed 
and Repaired

L et Us S h arp en  Y our Saw s 
th e  F o ley  W ay

Gladys and Earl Kirkwood
In  th e  S lay  B u ild ing  

P h o n e  396-5361

International when members 
met in Sunray High School Sat­
urday afternoon for their Feb­
ruary meeting.

Initiates were Mrs. Mildred 
Chiles, Mrs. Billie Denman, and 
Mrs. Bonnie Airhart. Their es­
corts were Miss Sylvania Den­
nis, Mrs. Vera Tuck and Mrs. 
Julia VanBebber. The initia­
tory service was conducted be­
fore a table bearing the chap­
ter insignia, red candles in gold 
candlesticks, and an arrange­
ment of red roses.

Those conducting the service 
were Mrs. Eula Vick, president, 
Mrs. Marie Reynolds, Mrs. Lois 
Bassett, and Mrs. Frances Hold­
en, Mrs. Mildred Hosier played 
piano selections for the service.

To finance the annual 
scholarship award by the chap­
ter, a white elephant sale was 
held.

Miss Lucile Hughes conducted 
a study on the Delta Kappa 
Gamma constitution, and Miss 
Jewell Foster gave information 
on pending changes to be made 
in the regulations of the so­
ciety.

Mrs. Vick presided during the 
business session with Mrs. Anna 
Elliott substituting as secretary. 
The next meeting date is 2:30 p. 
m. March 3, in Stratford high 
school. At that time the pro­
gram highlight will be a chap­
ter birthday celebration.

Gamma Xi members attend­
ing were from Dalhart, Hartley, 
Dumas and Stratford.

Members from Stratford at­
tending were Mrs. Lorraine 
Mehner and Mrs. Charles Cam­
eron.

W ill C lose S undays a t  6 :0 0  p. m .

Chevron Tips

"Tell her! it's the springs not a 
mouse squeak!"

When you want your car to 
stand the Shock w ell get it 
ready.

Atlas

T I R E S

F a c to ry
F resh

Atlas
BATTERIES

P hone 396-3351

Cotney Chevron Station
D A R R E L L  C O T N E Y , M an ag e r

We wish Emily Post would 
provide the answer to the proper 
way to make a waitress aware 
of our existence.

•  To The People
(Continued from Page 1)

Representatives, and without 
hearings before Committees, as 
is the proper procedure. This 
extension included a term which 
denied to the American farmer 
the right to produce as much as 
one pound of the sugar that had 
formerly been purchased from 
Cuba. It did not even give the 
President of the Unied States 
the light to authorize the Amer­
ican farmer to produce any of 
that sugar, because in each in­
stance where this sugar was
referred to in the Act, the
authorization to purchase con­
tained the term “from other 
foreign countries” or “from any 
foreign country.” The use of 
the word “foreign” successfully 
blocked the American farmer 
from participating in the mar­
ket of the American consumer to 
any further extent than he had 
participated prior to the dis­
continuance of purchases from 
Cuba.

A small but vigorous minority 
group of Congressmen who know 
and understand this situation 
have fought bitterly to obtain 
fair treatment for the American 
farmer and for the American 
consumer. If the American 
farmer were allowed to produce 
in this country one-third of the 
amount of sugar formerly pur­
chased from Cuba, it would en­
able 400,000 acres of land now 
being used for growing surplus 
crops to be used for growing 
sugar beets; it would help to

SHAKING THE TREE 
Food Sale Prices

F o r S evera l W eeks W e H ave  B een Giv 
Y ou P lum s of F ood  V alues, B ut T his 

W eek  W e’re  S hak ing  T h e  T re e

Beef Roast
U.S.D.A, Good Chuck
POUND

Fryers
Grade A
FRESH DRESSED — POUND

P O R K  C H O P S
pound 59
W I E N E R S
PINKNEY SMALL
3 P o u n d  P ack a g e

OLEO
WILSON GOLDEN BRAND 
COLORED QUARTERS 
POUND

CHILI
KIMBELL’S ----- NO BEANS

No. 2 tin

98

Lady
WANTED

For Motel Work
S T E A D Y  J O B

Mornings Only
O r C ould U se T w o Ladies^ w itkcd iild ren . 

w ho w ou ld  a lte rn a te  B aby  S ittin g  
W hile T he O th er W orks'

R A N G E R  MO T E L

DOUBLE STAMPS TUESDAY
W ith  $2 .50  C ash  P u rch ase  

o r m ore.

Plus Tuesday Specials

Cherries
Kimbell’s R.S.P. —

4  cans for
Kimbell’s R.S.P. — No. 303 Tin — 23f!

WHOLE SPICED

P E A C H E S
T h ree  S ta r  — No. T in  —

4  cans for

ORANGE JUICE
TEXSUN
46 O unce T in

Pineapple & Orange Juice
DEL MONTE
46 O unce T in

Coffee
KIMBELL’S

1 pound tin

Grapefruit Juice
TEXSUN
No. 2 T in

2  cans for

VIENNA SAUSAGE ^  7
KIMBELL’S ^  B
2 C ans fo r  4m m

W E L S H A D E  I
GRAPE DRINK <  <  I
QUART CAN 40 40 |

Potted Meat
KIMBELL’S m

3  cans for am  Ja

PRODUCE ^  m i 1 
T O M A T O E S  / V I  
No. 1 —Pound i j  1

GREEN BEANS
PECAN VALLEY CUT B MB B
No. 303 T in  —  15^

7 cans for M  M 2 5  s F  6 9
P E A S  r f t
WHITE SWAN FANCY TINY TOTS
2  No. 303 T ins F o r M

O R A N G E S
F lo rid a  1 M 0
POUND ■ Bk ^

T U R N IP  O R  M U S T A R D  ^  _

G R E E N S
WHITE SWAN — NO. 303 TIN m

2  cans for

Green Onions 4 Q

2  Bunches for  ̂ u M

ALBERT’S GROCERY
&  M A R K E T  - - Phone 396-4821


