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Out Of Court Settlement 
Reached In Ambulance Suit

The class action lawsuit 
filed on behalf of Loyd 
Ambulance Service sub 
scnbers against the serviLC 
has tx>en settled out of court 
tTver the weekend 

Thi- sui* had h(-t n 
scheduled for jury trial in the 
102md District Court during 
the week of April 27th, hut a 
spokesman for Jim D 
Lovett, attorney for the 
subscribers, stated that 
settlement for an unspecified

amount liad fx>en reached 
lAer the p;ist weekend.

The suit was fired in 
•August of 1979 by a com­
mittee consisting of Duane 
Benson, Olen Douglas. 
Bobb> ilrem and James 
Wood, who had retained 
Clarksville Attorney Jim D. 
Lovett as counse

The action, which hiid 
included virtually all the 
members of the Lovd Am­

bulance Service as plaintiff’s 
charged the sendee with 
deceptive practices, and 
asked that Mr. and Mrs 
Elvin Loyd, operators of the 
sendee either refund the fee 
charged to suljscribers or 
fulfill the servic-e for the 
year

It was estimated that 2800 
citizens of Red River County 
had been members of the 
commerical ambulance

sendee, and those mem­
berships had ranged from 
$20 for an individual to $30 
per family.

The service had Icx'ated in 
Red River ( ’(Hinty in the 
summer of 1978, and after a 
year of operation conducted 
a massive membership drive 
in the summer of 1979, and 
then abruptly discontinued 
the service int he county in 
.September of 1979, leaving

the county without an am­
bulance service, and the 
subscribers without services 
for their money.

The settlement porvides 
for a monetary payback of 
the funds that had been paid 
to the service.

Since the discontinuation 
of services by Loyds the Red 
River Ambulance Servic, a 
non-profit corporation has 
been organized, and is now 
serving the county.

Water Well Will Provide For Needs
The City Ccxincil of Rogata 

looked to the future recently, 
and let ,i contract for the 
drilling of a second water 
well to provide water for the 
city of Bogata.

The .S' !’> w ili pros ide extra 
watei tor the pru.ent. and

will also be sufficient to keep 
the city from suffering a 
future shortage as t̂ ’e town 
grows

Dunng the sc botching hot 
month of .lulv last summer

the motor on the present well 
burned out For four or five

days only small wells were 
available, and the shortage 
of water nearly became a 
problem If during th.it 
period tliere had been a large

Riveivresl Math 
Students Compete

Twenty Rivercrest Math 
students recently took the 
annual High School 
'lathematics Examination. 
This was the second year for 
Rivercrest students to be 
involved in this testing 
program

R iv e rc re s t com peted 
ogainst all calsses of schools 
from AAAAA to A The top 
three students scores were 
combini*d to give a team 
score Rivercrest had the 
highi'st earn score for any 
AA ■ "ool n Texa Al.so. 
oniy OIK- AAA sctiooi was 
higher than Rivercrest. 
Rivercrest outscored several

AAAAA schools in the testing 
program also.

There were a total of 21.320 
students in Texas that took 
the exam

The three top scoring 
students for Rivercrest were 
Timmy Daniels. Lisa 
Thompson, and Pam 
Mauldin. Several other 
Rivercrest students were 
cliKC liehind these three

fire, controlling it would 
hiive been impossible 

The city at that time began 
consideration of a new, large 
well, which would provide a 
tiackup system and also 
help to handle increasing 
water needs in the future

Via Initiated 
Into Pi Kappa Alpha

The well is now in the 
process of being drilled, and 
so far reports look good that

it will be able to provide 
plenty of good water for the 
city of Bogata, both now and 
m times to come

Jimniv Via

Praii^ftTs iVlny Bt* l*ic‘k<‘cl I p
R.x|in->‘s for transfers for 

1 joi -c_ oeiiool year need to be 
filed by May 1. 1981 Forms 
may be picked up at the

Talco-Bogata CISD Business 
Office at Rivercrest or at 
either of the elementary- 
schools

Pi Kappa .Alpha, a mens’ 
social fraternity at East 
Texas State University 
would like to announce the 
initiation of Jimmy Via into 
the Thet Xi Chapter The 
initiation took place 
Saturday April 25 at the 
campus of East Texas State 
Seven new members were 
added to the cahpter 

One of the highlights of this 
s e m e s te rs  a s s o c ia te  
membt'r educaion was a trip 
to the .National Headquar­
ters of Pi Kappa Alpha in 
Memphis. Tennessee in

mum
.MOTHER—The Bogata 
Kindergarten members

dressed up as parents and 
spelled out the poem

“ Mother”  as part of the 
variety show night held at

Rivercrest High .School 
Friday night. (Staff Photo

bv Linda Tabb)

Charlie Lewis Honored By Continental Telephone
Bogata resident Charley 

l ^  is was recently honored 
by Continental Telephone for 
his participation in and 
support of community ac­
tivities in the local area 
Lewis, an installer- 
repairman for the firm, was 
a recipient of the company’s 
Public Affairs Citizenship 
Award for his ouLstanding 
community involvement 
during 1980.

The award was presented 
to Lewis at a luncheon held

at K-Bob’s in Sulphur 
Springs. Making the 
presentation was district 
customer services manager 
Jerry Teague and local 
customer services manager 
Ann Logan. Bogata area 
supervisor Kenneth Jeffrey 
was also present for the 
ceremony.

The firm ’s recognition of 
Lewis is based on his 
leadership and involvement 
in a number of community

organizations. He is 
currently troop leader of Boy 
Scout Troop 135 in Bogata 
and serves as a board

member and umpire for the 
Bogata Little League Lewis 
is also the Second Fire Chief 
of the Bogata Fire Depart-

Stiicleiils Honored 
Diirinw Awards

A Bogata Resident and a 
former resident were among 
students honored during the 
annual Awards Night on 
Tuesday, April 21, at Paris 
Junior College. The program 
is held annually to recognize 
PJC students for their 
achievements during the 
school year

Gayle Reeder of Bogata, 
an art major, receivetl the

Edna R Fagg Art 
Scholarship given to PJC art 
student, and Sherrie Taylor 
of Paris, graduate of 
Rivercrest, was named one 
of the outstanding members 
of Phi Beta Lambda, 
business fraternity at PJC.

Buy, Sell or Rent 
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ment and a member of the 
Red R iver County Am­
bulance Board. Well 
respected in the community, 
Lewis is also an elect^  
member of the Bogata City 
Council. In presenting the 
award, district manager 
Jerry Teague said, “ Charley 
is an example of the 
ded ication  Continental 
employees show to the 
communities they serve. Our 
company believes in em­
ployees working to improve 
the quality of life in their 
towns, and I ’m proud to be 
able to recognize Charley for 
his efforts." Area supervisor

March. During this 
educational trip, the Zeta 
Class toured the museum of 
Pi Kappa Alpha which 
houses historical items since 
1868. The two day learning 
•session was to give the new 
members a first hand ex­
perience of history of Pi 
Kappa Alpha Among other 
accomplishments of the Zeta 
Class was a car wash to raise 
money for the chapter and a 
fund raiser for the Hunt 
County Chapter of Big 
Broghters - Big Sisters of 
America.

NEW W'EH.L—Bogata will 
have additional water to 
meet it’s needs when this 
water well, located just

east of Bogata, is com­
pleted. Tom Wright and 
Kenneth Waller are 
working on the drilling.

which is let by Don Dale, 
Inc. of Clarksville. (.Staff 
Photo bv Linda Tabb)

Taleo-Bo«fata Board ()r«[anizes
The Board of Trustees of 

the Talco-Bogata Schools 
met in regular session on 
Tuesday, April 14. 1981 at 
7:00 p.m. The first item on 
the agenda was the 
reorganization of the new 
Board and the swearing in 
newly elected members. 
Board officers for the year 
were elected as follows 
John Ward, president; Gene 
Smith, vice-president; and 
Kenneth Jeffery, secretary. 
Newly elected members 
Donald Ray Jones, Dr. E E 
Brooks, and Jerry Ru.ssell 
took the oath and were sworn 
ito office.

The meeting was held at 
the Talco Elementary School 
for the purpose of touring the 
building and looking at the 
classrooms arrangements 
and use being made of the 
building as it might relate to

the proposed heating and air concerning the hig i 
conditioning project which is Program for nex 
under study The Board was 
impressed with the use being 
made of the building in that 
many of the teachers are 
given double rooms which 
make--' ii ..ossible to set up 
various study i.x,' 
creates a better learning 
situation The feeling was 
expressed that an effort 
should be made to maintain 
the present use being made 
of th building if at all feasible 
to do so. The Board con­
tinued to discuss various 
factors related to the heating 
and air conditioning of the 
building with the hopes that 
some firm action can be 
made in the near future 

Tillman Hale. Rivercrest 
principal, met with the 
Board to present information 
and discuss some matters

school 
school

year. In other matters, the 
Board adopted a resolution 
endorsing the Community 
Concept of education, ap­
proved a revised employe<* 
contract form, and approved 
*' ’  L \ i lous fip-i* clal repoi 

An executive session was 
held for the purpose of 
discussing personnel mat­
ters. Various auxiliary 
personnel were employed for 
the 1981-82 school year as 
recommended. In final 
action, it was agreed that the 
Board would begin meeting 
at 7:30 p.m. with the May 
meeting during Daylight 
Saving Time.

The next regular meeting 
of the Board will be on 
Tuesday, May 12. 1981 at 
’ s:30p.m at Rivercrest with 
the public cordially invited 
to attend

Nichols Worth
By Nanalee .Nichols 

For the third time a United 
States Flag has been stolen 
from the Veteraas Park, 
located just across from the 
bank in Bogata.

Vandals have stolen the 
flag, littered the small park, 
or ruined plantings as if it 
were provided totally for 
their own amusement.

The park is not for 
anyone’s amusement, it is 
kept by the I^adies Auxiliary

of the Bogata V.FLW. and 
they have worked hard to 
make it a place worth 
haveing. Veterans of World 
War 11, the Korean conflict 
and the Viet Nam conflict 
are honored there, and it 
would be very nice if a flag 
could be flown over the 
monument to their valor 

The vandals cannot have a 
Ijetter use for an American 
flag than the use it is put to at 
the park, and it is to be hoped

that they would stop to think 
more carefully about the 
disrespect. they are 
showing

Those who have worked 
hard on the park deserve 
consideration, not to mention 
that respect due to veterans.

It can only be hoped that 
those who have stolen the 
flags will consider in the 
future that what they are 
doing means little to them, 
but much to many others.

Kenneth Jeffrey noted that 
Lewis’ involvement was on 
his own time and an example 
for all company employees 
to follow. “ I think Charley 
Lewis demonstrates that one 
man can have a positive 
impact on his community, 
and I'm  proud to be 
associated with h im ," 
Jeffrey said.

Lewis was presented with 
a framed award certificate 
signed by Continental 
Telephone of Texas 
President James Miles. The 
awards have been presented 
annually since 1977 to 
deserving employees.

Charley Lewis
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H E A D I N G  F O R  
STATE—students win­
ning in the Regional I ’ll, 
competition and ad­
vancing to the state meet 
In Austin on May 7 and 8

are: left to right. Dusty 
Damron, third in 
News writing; Yvette 
R u ss e ll, a lte rn a te  
ed itorials; Marv Lvnn

Horn, second Headlines 
and alternate in feature 
stories; and Sherri 
Cheatwood, third in 
editorials. (Staff Photo)
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Red River Co. Horse Show 
Scheduled May 9

The Annual Red River 
County 4-H Horse Show is 
scheduled for Saturday, May 
9th.

The show will be con­
ducted at the Bogata Rodeo 
Arena in Bogata, Texas. 
Registration will begin at 
8:00 a.m. and the show will 
begin at 9:00 a.m. Thophies 
and Rosettes will be given 
through sixth palce.

There will be Mars and 
gelding Halter classes. 
Showmanship and 12 per­
formance events. There will 
be four age groups and a 
high point trophy will be 
given for each age group. 
Everyone is invited to at­
tend.

At the show there will be

three age groups plus four, 
eight and under classes. One 
high point trophy will be 
given in each age group. 
F irst place will receive 
trophies, with second 
through sixth palce 
receiving rosettes.Plaques 
and 18”  rosettes will be given 
for Grand, and plaques and 
12”  rosettes will be given for 
Reserve. Contestants must 
enter showmanship to be 
eligible for high point.

Halter classes will begin at 
9:00 a.m. and there will be a 
$3.00 per entry-per class 
charge. Classes are: Reg. 
Mares 4yrs. and under; Reg. 
Mares 5 and over; Grade 
Mares-all ages; Grand and 
Reserve Mares; Reg.

TSO is in 
Paris, Texas

15 A  EAST  P L A Z A
( D O W N  r o v v N )

T e x a s  S t a t e  Oi >t i c a i . 

(214) 784-3371

Geldings 4 and under; Reg. 
Geldings 5 and over; Grade 
Geldings-all ages; Grand 
and Reserve G eld ings; 
S h o w m a n s h ip  9 -12 ; 
Showmanship 13-16; and 
Showmanship 17 and over.

Performance Classes will 
be one hour a fter 
Showmanship and $2.00 per 
class are: Western Pleasure 
9-12; Western Pleasure IS­
IS; Western Pleasure 17 and 
over; Reining'9-12; Reining 
13-16; Reining 17 and over; 
Ride-A-Euck (open); Boot 
race 9-12; Boot race 13-16; 
Boot race 17 and over; Rings 
9-12; Rings 13-16; Rings 17 
and over; Poles 8 and under; 
Poles 9-12; Poles 13-16; Poles 
17 and over; Straight-a-Way 
8 and under; Straight-A-Way 
9-12; Straight-A-Way 13-16; 
Straight-A-Way 17 and over; 
C loverlea f 8 and under; 
Clovarleaf 9-12; Cloverleaf 
13-16; C loverleaf 17 and 
over; Potatoe race 9-12; 
Po*atoe race 13-16; Potatoe 
race 17 and over; Flag Race 
8 and under; Flag race 9-12; 
Flag race 13-16; Flag race 17 
and over; Ribbon race 
(open); and Rescue race 
(open).

For additional information 
concerning the Horse Show 
call 214-966-2363, 214-427-2493 
or 214-652-6963.
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0iP^(T|otheR§0fly
Mother's Day is  May 10th 
but If you shop at Pat's Place on 

May 1st & 2nd you can save20% on every article 
 ̂ in the store!
I f  you Remember Mom,

I Remember Pat's Place
The Best For Less

1I
I
y

1

, _ Pat's Place m  i
1 Downtown Bogota \

NOTICE
ABBOTT’S FURNITURE 

ANNOUNCES

5 YEARS 
FREE SERVICE

ON ALL MAYTAG APPLIANCES 
SOLD IN OUR STORE!

We ore the only dealer in this area with this 
warranty and we are doing this because of our 
confidence in Maytag!

A/so Abbott’s Furniture Has Just Been Appointed
The

MAGNAVOX DEALER
IN PARIS!

You Con Also Buylhese  
Famous Brands Here!

FURNITURE TELEVISION AND STBIEO
American Drew
Antique Creations
Broyhill
Builtrite
Barcalounger
Brown-Jordan
Cusetta
Emerson Leather
Eastwood
Gordons
Homecrest
Krebs-Stengle

Tell City 

Unique 

Williams

Lana Mognovox
Mayo
Mastorcrerft

Sony

Pulaski APPLIANCES
Part action Amana
Rivarsida Hoover
Ridgeway Kitchenaid
Schweigar
Southland

Maytag

Sumpter
Sidex

CARPET

Singer Brinkman
Temple-Stuart Stephens

kCC
oo'

ABBOTT’S
lu h iu tu iu :.

26 North Side Plaza 785-8701

THE CATCH...

Cunningham
News

By Berniece Wyatt
Everyone is invited to 

attend a Youth Rally at the 
United Pentecost Church 
Friday at 7:30 p.m.

Mr. and Mrs. Vernon 
Shuford of Port Neches 
visited recently with Mr. and 
Mrs. William Cooper.

Mr. and Mrs. Narman Sain 
and Mr. and Mrs. Carl 
Guthrie of Talco and Mrs 
Goldie Bloomington and 
Mrs. Lena Black of los 
Banos, Calif., visited Mrs. 
Ida Deshong, Tuesday.

Allie Rees was honored 
with a birthday dinner 
Sunday. In attendance were 
Mr. and Mrs. Perry D. Ash­
ford of Dallas, Mr. and Mrs. 
Ronald Kelsoe of Naples, 
Mr. and Mrs. Fern Rees of 
Milton and Mr. and Mrs. 
Buddy Taylor.

Mr. and Mrs. Bo Bulin of 
Dallas visited Mr. and Mrs. 
George Taylor Saturday 
morning.

Joe Betterton of Deport 
visited with Mr. and Mrs. 
William Cooper Wednesday.

Mr. and Mrs. Clarence 
Ashford and Mr. and Mrs. 
Rufus Hdder of Temple 
visited Rob Ashford during 
the week-end.

Rev. and Mrs. Charles 
Soules and family of Kilgore 
spent the weekend here aiid 
he preached at the United 
Pentecost Church Sunday.

Mrs. Jow Bailey Williams 
spent Monday night with 
Hazel Deshazo of Paris.

Mrs. Britt Phillips, Lindy 
Jo and Bonnie Sue of Lone 
Star spent Friday night with 
Mr. and Mrs. W illiam 
Cooper.

Mr. and Mrs. Amos Smith 
of Clarksville visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Herman Clement and 
Lisa Saturday.

Faye Black moved to 
Deport last weekend.

Darrell W. Smith, Steve 
Cherry and son Stevie (rf 
Irving, Mr. and Mrs. Robert 
Goley and Cindy of Paris, 
Mr. and Mrs. Donald Smith 
and fam ily, and Larry, 
Clista and C.D. Haskell of 
Deport and Mr. and Mrs. 
Dale Smith, Staley and 
Randy of Blossom visited 
Mr. and Mrs. Alfonzo Smith 
during the weekend.

Mr. and Mrs. C lifford 
Pynes spent Thursday night 
with Mrs. Dorothy Dean 
Baker of Longview.

Mr. and Mrs. Clavin 
Devlin of Grand Prairie and 
Mr. and Mrs. Richard 
Trussell rA Arlington, Mr. 
and Mrs. Roy Powers and 
Velma Cox were Sunday 
dinner guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Walker Devlin of 
Minter.

Allie Rees with Mr. and 
Mrs. Ronald Kelsoe of 
Naples and Mr. and Mrs. 
Perry D. Ashford of Dallas 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Fern 
Rees Saturday night.

Mr. and Mrs. George 
Taylor spent Sunday with 
Mr. nad Mrs. Earl Wilson rA 
Reno.

Mr. and Mrs. J.D. Polk of 
Dallas were here to attend 
the Junior Livestock show in 
Paris Thursday.

Davy Jo W illiams of 
Greenville and Mrs. Mike 
W illiams and Jennifer 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Joe B. 
Williams Sunday.

Ida Deshong who un­
derwent surgery in the St. 
Joseph Hospital Thursday is 
h(Hne and recovering nicely.

Mr. and Mrs. W.J. Fowler 
spent Sunday with Mr. and 
Mrs. Howard Fowler of 
Maud.

Cara Gordon of Paris 
spent Wednesday night with 
Berniece Wyatt.

Charles B. Pynes of Paris 
and Mis. Kenny Giffoed, 
Fair Shae and Kenneth III of 
Deport visited Mr. and Mrs. 
(Hifford Pynes Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Hubert Allen 
of Dallas spent from Fridky

O b itu a rie s
Tommie Massengil Mrs.J.M.

Browning

until Tuesday with Rev. and 
Mrs. Weldon Allen.

Etta Bartlett and Pauline 
Chambers of Paris vistied 
Ida Deshong Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. Mike Fowler 
of Dallas visited Mr. and 
Mrs. W.J. Fowler Tuesday.

Mr. and Mrs. John L. Allen 
of Dallas spent Sunday night 
with Mr. and Mrs. Fred 
Allen.

Mr. and Mrs. Perry Ash­
ford of Dallas spent Tuesday 
night with Allie Rees.

Lena Black of Los Banas, 
Claif. left for Washington 
D.C. thursday after spending 
several days with Berniece 
Wyatt.

Rev. and Mrs. J.D. Wat­
son, Hazel Keshazo and 
Josephine Parrott of Paris, 
Ida Mae Cochran, Mrs. 
James Plottand Mrs. Wigley 
of Taylortown visited Ida 
Deshong Sunday.

Freddie Davis of Paris 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Willie J. 
Fowler Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Perry Ash­
ford of Dallas spent Tuesday 
night with Allie Rees. She 
accompanied them to Naples 
for a few days visit with Mr. 
and Mrs. Ronald Kelsoe.

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Allen 
with Mr. and Mrs. John L. 
Allen of Dallas and Mr. and 
Mrs. Bob Alim  rA Blossom 
are spending a few days in 
Oklahoma.

Mr. and Mrs. Larry Bell 
and Stacie Bell of Paris 
visited Ida Deshong 
Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. Bart Mc­
Dowell, Mr. and Mrs. 
Weldon George, Mr. and 
Mrs. Weldon Hume and Paul 
and Herbert Hume and 
grnadson Kmt Whitaker all 
of Paris spent Sunday with 
Milo Hume and Stasha. Milo 
and Stasha Hume spent 
Monday with Mrs. Wanda 
Whitaker of Paris.

Senior Citizen 
Day Planned

Smior Citizen Honor Day 
is planned for May 8, at the 
F irst Baptist Church in 
C larksville. AH com ­
munities, churches, and 
organizations are invited to 
submit a nominee to be 
honored. To do this, send the 
nmiinees name and a short

resume to Beth Dannheim, 
County Extension Agent. 
Resume’s are due May 1, in 
the Extension office.

The senior Citizen Honor 
Day is coordinated by the 
Committee on Aging and is 
open to all persons regar­
dless of socio-economic 
level, race, color, sex, 
religion or national origin.

Buy, Sell or Kent 
With Clasilfied Ads

Tommie MassingiU
Miss Tommie MassingiU 

died at her home in Deport 
Wednesday.

Services were held at 11:00 
a.m. on Friday at the Grant 
Funeral Home Chapel. 
Burial was in Highland 
Cemetery. The Rev. Glenn 
Renfro ofUciated.

Miss MassingiU was born 
in Fulbright, May 4, 1911, a 
daughter of Tom and Jorena 
Gullion MassingiU.

Surviving are a sister, 
Mrs. Essie Fisher of Detroit 
and several nieces and 
nephews.

Mrs. Mildred 
Houston

Mrs. M ildred Couch 
Houston, age 32, was killed in 
a one car accident early 
Saturday morning near 
Jacksonville, Texas

Her husband, George 
Michael Houston was the 
driver of the car, which left 
the roadway and overturned 
several times. He was 
slightly injured.

The form er Mildred 
Couch, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Marvin Couch of 
Deport, was a former Deport 
resident, and attended 
DepOTt School.

I^rvices were held at 4:00 
p.m. Sunday at the First 
United Methodist Church in 
Alto. O.T. Allen Funeral 
Hcxne made burial in the Old 
Palestine Cemetery at Alto.

Mrs. Houston was born 
May 19, 1948 in Deport. She 
married Mike Houston in 
1966.

She was a registered 
nurse, a supervisor at 
Medical Arts Hospital, in 
Houston, a form er Alto 
resident and a Methodist. 
She was employed by Rusk 
State Hospital for twelve 
years.

Surviving are her 
husband, three children, 
Michael, Amy and Amanda 
all of the home, her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Marvin Couch 
of Deport; one brother, 
Marvin Wayne Couch of 
Pattonville; and one sister, 
Eva Nell Flenniken of Paris, 
Texas.

FOR SALE—24,000 BTU 
Hotpoint Air Conditioner, 

18,000 ETU Philco A ir 
Conditioner, 350 gal. butane 
tank, 18’- 2 door no frost 
Catalina refrigeratw, 632- 
5140, Bogata. 5-14

GARAGE SALE—May 1, 2, 
3, at 105 Grayswi, Bogata. 

Clothes, Furniture and 
Miscellaneous. 4-30

Mrs J.M. (M ary 
E lizabeth ) Browning of 
Deport died at 9;55 p.m. 
Wednesday at McCuistion 
Medical Center.

Services were held at 2 
p.m. Friday in the chapel of 
Gene Roden’s Sons Directors 
of Funerals. Burial was in 
Meadowbrook Cemetery.

Mrs. Browning was born 
April 23,1892, in Hill County, 
Texas, a daughter of R.L. 
Watson and Amex Harriet 
Cox Watson.She married 
J.M. Browning in 1910. He 
died in 1952.

Surviving are two sons, 
Robert J. Browning of San 
San Antonio and John S 
Browning of Paris ; two 
brothers, T.F. Watson of 
Blum and R.L. Watsm Jr. of 
Covington; three sisters 
Mrs. Ester Burkleo of 
Euless, Mrs. Ida Smith of 
Cleburne and Mrs. Ruby 
Jensen of Cooper, six 
grandchildren and 13 great­
grandchildren

Mary Whistler
Mary King Whistler, 57, of 

Dallas died April 21 at her 
hmne in Dallas after a long 
illness. Memorial services 
w ere held April 22 at 
Restland Memorial Chapel 
in Dallas with Chaplain 
Montgomery of the United 
States Air Fwce officiating, 
with burial there.

Mary King Whistler was 
bom March 29, 1924 the

daughter of Walter Grant 
and Nora Sloan King of 
Bogata.

Survivors include her 
husband Charles F. Whistler 
of Dallas , her Parents Mr. 
and Mrs. Walter King of 
Bogata, two sons Dale of 
Dallas and Wayne o f 
Raleigh, N.C., two 
daughters, Karen Whistler of 
Dallas and Diane Raper of 
Yukon, Okla., one brother, 
Robert Ed King of Katy and 
one sister Martha Seitz of 
Dallas and four grand­
children.

CARD OF THANKS 
I wish to express my ap-; 

preciation for the kindness 
shown me in the loss of my 
husband Melvin Hudson. The 
cards, phone calls and food 
and everything were sin-, 
cerely appreciated.

Oma Hudson

CARD OF THANKS 
I wish to thank my friends, 

neighbors, and loved ones for 
the prayers, cards, flowers 
and all the nurses at the 
hospital. I loved each one 
who waited on me. God bless 
each one.

Alma Bell

CARD OF THANKS 
We wish to thank everyone 

for the prayers, Bowers, 
cards and visits over the past 
three months. The kindness 
you have shown us will never 
be forgotten.

Duane & Jetty White

Fulbright News
By Betty Rodgers

Ruby Chandler and 
Mildred Early of Paris were 
Sunday visitors of Mrs. Eula 
Tucker in Rosalie.

Mr. and Mrs. Lee Nw- 
worthy of Sacremento, Calif, 
were Friday and Saturday 
visitors of Wayne Roberts. 
They also visited Betty 
Rodgers and children. They 
were on their way to Alaska.

Mr. and Mrs. Edgar 
Rodgers of Bogata visited 
Betty Rodgers and Melissa 
and Monte Wednesday af­
ternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. Freddie Furr 
and children of Mt. Vernon, 
Stanley Smith, and Mr .a nd 
Mrs. Aubrey Herring and 
Gary of Bogata were Sunday 
visitors of Mr. and Mrs. 
Arthur Fisher and Anita.

Ann Fisher entered Paris 
Regional Medical Center 
Monday for tests and 
su!)gery on Wednesday.

Mr. and Mrs. Clarence 
Pate Jr. of Dallas were 
Sunday and Monday visitors 
of Mr. and Mrs. Hurley 
Stevens. Mr. and Mrs. Clovis 
VanDeaver and Mrs. John

Denison and Dru of Deport 
also were Sunday visitors.

KOEHN
BACKHOE
SERVICE

Water, Sewer, & 
Electric Lines. 
Septic Systems. 

f R l i  I s t im a t e s  
ALTON KOEHN

674-5471
Rt. 1 Detroit, Tx.

C0MlhC3 500h  
Bogata

Methodist
Womens'
Cookbook
Watch Tor 

Announcement 
next WeeK. 
Available By 

Mother's Day.

JOHNSON 
MONUMENT CO.

A«Owrltr4
Siriltf

• BRONZE MEMORIAL MARKERS
• DEATH OATES ADDED
• MAUSOLEUMS
•  WE CLEAN A STRAIGHTEN OLD MONUMENTS 

INSIDE AIR-CONOmONED SHOWROOM

784-4335
1100 CHURCH

(OH*OSlTl CORNER EVERGREEN CEMETERY)

Fresh Spring 
Arrangements

Rose Arrangements

Bud Vases

Get Yaur Order In Early Far Mather's Day.

C0R5AQE5
Orchids, Roses,

Carnations,
Mixed Spring

5ilk Sl Dried Flower 
Arrangments

all kinds Cemetary Arrangments 
Pot Plants

green plants hydrangea violets 
hanging baskets mum plants

Bogota 632-5623
M0U5E or rLOWERS

Daport 652-3560
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Anderson To Begin Basic
Thomas David Anderson, 

son of Sue Anderson of Ir­
ving, Texas and Roy An­
derson of Sulphur Springs is 
scheduled to begin basic 
m ilitary training at 
Lackland A.F.B on April 29, 
1981. He signed with the U.S. 
Air Force under the delayed

enlistment program in 
February. He has selected 
training in the bomb- 
navigation specialist area 
after basic training. David is 
a grandson of Mrs. Laura 
Parker and his mother is the 
former Sue Parker.

Mrs. Swarts Honored
Mrs. Johnny Swarts was 

honored recently with a pink 
and blue shower in the 
Fellowship Hall fo the First 
Baptist Church. Hostesses 
were Mmmes, W illa Jo 
Mills, Patty Kuhl, Ophelia 
Hood, Pauline Jones,
Zonetta Hawkins, Sandra 
Ingram, Peggy Barnett and 
Joyce Alexander.

On entering the honoree 
and her mother were 
presented lovely corsages.
The tea table was covered 
with a lime green cloth with 
an overlay of white lace 
centered with an 
arrangement of yellow roses

YHT Meets 
With Mary Hudson

and gladiolus.
Hostesses served yellow 

punch and white cake 
squares decorated in green 
and yellow.

The register was passed 
aroung the room for each 
guest to sign. After several 
games gifts were opened by 
the honoree and passed for 
each guest to view.

The hostesses’ gift to Mrs. 
Swarts was a stroller.

Out of town guests were 
Mrs. Swarts mother, Mrs. 
Lenton Roach, her sister, 
Mrs. June Banks and Mrs. 
Bobbie Calhoun.

Stephenson To Speak At Bogata
Mark Stephenson, a senior 

at Austin College in Sherman 
will speak at the 11;00 a.m. 
services at the First United 
Methodist Church in Bogata 
Sunday. He is the son of Mr. 
and Mrs. A.D. Stephenson.

At the Sunday evening 
service Mrs. Johnny e
Clayton and Mrs. Cliristine

Skaggs of Deport will show their three weeks studv on 
slides of their recent trip to Prayer at this service. The 
the Holy Land. The United public is invited to attend 
Methodist Women will start both services.

y BIRTHS
The daughter born Mon­

day April 20, to Nancy and 
Ronnie Matheidas has been 
named Mondalin Karecia 
and weighed 11 pounds and 
four and one half ounces. 
Grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. Lewis Wilkerson of 
Bogata and John R. and 
Kathryn Matheidas of 
Dallas.

HOW OPEN!
To Serve You

MONTGOMERY
WARD

AAon-Fri. 8:30-5:00 
Sat. 8:30-12:30 
214 427-3817

106 E. Main C la rk s v ille , Tx

WINNERS—Science Fair 
winners were:first John 
Hines and Cassandra 
Dugger “ Aiiatomey of a

Frog” : second Michelle 
Strain and Kim Reeder, 
“ Insect Collection”  and

Mrs. Mary Hudson, 
representative of Hudson 
E n te rp rises , B lossom , 
Texas, presented the 
program during tiie April 
meeting of the Rivercrest 
Chapter of Young 
Homemeakers of Texas. She 
directed each member in the 
steps of facial care and 
make-up using Espree 
personal skin care products 
and gave tips on caring for 
various skin types.

In the absence of the 
president, the meeting was 
call'd  to order by vice- 
(vesident Ginger Foster who 
led the group in the Opening 
Ceremony. Tracie Guest 
introduced the speaker and 
(M'esented her with a gift of 
appreciation at the close of 
the program.

Frances Smith gave the 
report of the nominating 
committee and officers for 
1961-82 were elected. They 
will be installed at the next 
meeting, which will include a 
salad supper and program 
on ceramics.

Plans were made for a 
concession stand featuring 
homemade ice cream and 
fresh lemonade on Frontier 
Day.

Refreshments of raw 
vegetable snacks, cheese 
and cracker, and V-8 juice 
were served by Mary Jobplin

and Pat Cowan. The door 
prize was won by Pat Cowan.

a Little Miss”
Pageant
Scheduled

The ‘ ‘ L ittle Miss East 
Texas Pageant”  is scheduled 
for May 9 at 7:30 p.m. at the 
City Hall Auditorium in 
Atlanta, Texas. Rehearsals 
will be May 8 at 7:30 p.m. 
Five age ^visions will be 
crowned. Ages one month 
through 18 years will be 
accepted. A talent contest 
will be held in the same 
afternoon at 2:30. Crowns, 
Trophies and banners will be 
awarded to the winners in 
each divisions.

For more information and 
entry forms contact: East 
Texas Pageant Association, 
Rt. 2, Box 3272, Texarkana, 
Texas 75501 or phone 214-796- 
4050 or 214-792-4190.

Deadline for entering is 
May 1.

Tresa Anita Couch 
and

David Chris Potter

Owings-Sniith A n n oiin ce 
Engagement

third Scott Brown and 
Stan Wood ‘ ‘Functions of 
Feathers” . (Staff Photo)

(A m ch -P o tte r  
T(f M a r r y

Mr. and Mrs. Jackie Couch 
of Bogata announce the 
engagement and ap­
proaching marriage of their 
daughter, Tresa Anita to 
David Chris Potter, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. David E. 
Potter of Johntown. The 
vows will be exchanged on 
June 5, at 8:00 p.m. at the 
First United Methodist 
Church of Bogata. Rev. 
Johnny R. Couch of Welch, 
La., Uncle of the bride will 
officiate.

The bride elect is a 1979 
graduate of Rivercrest High 
School and is attending Paris 
Junior College. She is em­
ployed at Huddleston’s 
Grocery in Bogata. The 
Groom to be is a 1978 
graduate of Rivercrest High 
School and attended Paris 
Junior College. He is em­
ployed by Babcock and 
Wilcox in Paris.

No formal invitations will 
be sent but relatives and 
friends are invited.

CORNBREAD M IX G lad io la 2 0
PINTO  BEANS 4 Lb 99

BARBECUE SAUCE French's Cattlem an's 8 9
VANILLA WAFERS 11 oz. 49
BANANAS

2 9 ^
SHORTENING

G eneric 42 oz.

CORN Cream  Style

Libby 3/»l

have a 
nice weekend..

Mr. and Mrs. Marvin 
Owings announce the 
marriage of their daughter, 
Cathy Lynn Owings to 
Donald Wayne Smith, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. F O. Tosh of 
Mt. Pleasant. Smith is 
employed by Justiss-Mears

Oil Co. out of Jena, La. Mrs. 
Smith is presently employed 
by Carlton Manufacturing 
Inc. of Mt. Vernon.

The couple were married 
April 16 in Athens, "fhey plan 
to make their home in Mt. 
Pleasant.

^Fdr EveryGiverTHere^A Beaurful Receiver.

Give something special 
for that someone special 
your mother This Mother’s 
Day show your bve by giving 
her the perfect receiver; a deo âtor 
telephone. These beautifully crafted decorators, 
the cradle phone shown here, mod^ trinilines 
and oontempras, or the candlestidts of the 20’s are 
availaWe now at your Continental biLsiness cffe

ling your soneone spec 
enjoy everyday—then give her a caD.
(S Continental liGlephone Corporation

of Texas
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Almost Half
The Pacific Ocean con­

tains 46 percent o f Earth’s 
water, the National Geo­
graphic Society says.

\DULOSE
ALcnr
WHEN 

YOU LOSE 
AFQREST

Bank Employees
Honored With Banquet

The Talco State Bank 
honored Christelle Cato and 
Jerry Jonees with a banquet 
at the Mt. Pleasant Country 
Club Tuesday April 21. Miss 
Cato and Mr. Jones received 
a watch from the Directors 
of the bank for their year of 
service with the bank.

VFW Aids In 
Restoration

Dinner was enjoyed by the 
officers and employees of the 
Talco State Bank. Attending 
w&'e; Jerry and Dorthy 
Jones, Rusty and Donna 
Jones, Bill and Wanda 
Vickers, Tony and Jo An­
schutz, Zenith I'a rgrove , 
Carla Mills, Bill and Amy 
Jones, and Barry Jones.

The Bogata Veterans of 
Foreign Wars helped out the 
Bogata Lions Club in their 
restoration of the Bogata 
Cwnmunity Center and Park 
by presenting them with a

CHRISTELLE CATO and 
Jerry Jones were honored 
at a banquet recently by 
the Directors of the Talco

State Bank com­
memorating their years 
of service with the Talco 
State Rank.

Forest fires 
even catch fish.

Buy, Sell or Rent 
With Classified Ads

$100 donation for the project.
The Lions had previously 

obtained funds for the 
project, but vandals 
damaged the center so badly 
that additional money was 
required to complete the 
restoration.

SANDY BROOKS with 
her horse Mr. Nero 6 
proudly displays trophies 
and blue ribbons won at 
the Deport Riding Ciub 4- 
H Horse Show in Deport 
April 18th. She won first 
place in Reg. Geldings 
five and over. High poi.it 
individual 9-12, first place 
potatoe race 9-12, second 
in C loverlea f barrels, 
straightaway barrels, 
flag race and reining, 
third place Western 
pleasure, fourth place 
showmanship at halter.

Hill Descendants Have Reunion

A Public Service of This Newspaper 
6l The Ad •rertKing Council

1 overheard one Arab oil­
man say to another: “ Let’ s 
do it the American way. We 
won’ t raise the prices—just 
make the barrels smaller.’ ’

The descendants of the late 
Mr. and Mrs. J.W. Hill met 
Saturday April 25, at the 
Ramada in Paris for a 
reunion. The five children 
living attended, they are: 
Mrs. Ethel Fredenburg

’r ry g T Y V t i'B T n r r tfT v r g T r i n n r r r r g w i n n n r r y ^  a 8 b cTn n ra » b 6 o in n n n r

SPECIAL SALE DAYS
May 6-9

Wednesday Thru Saturday
^  J. W. Nichols Features Many Excellent 
Hems For Mother's Day And Graduation.

s

Lingerie And Sleepwear By VANITY FAIR & MISS ELAINE 
DANIEL GREEN Houseshoes Trifari Jewelry

Handbags By CONTESSA & MUTTERPERL 
Outstanding Selection Of Dresses And Sportswear—  

JUNIOR SIZES 3-13  MISSES SIZES 6-20 
All S p r in g  JACK WINTER Sportswear—  1 /3  Qff- c a s h  o n l y

All Panties By KAYSER LINGERIS—  l/j Q f f ____
ISOTONER GLOVES - Spring Colors —  Reg Pric ̂ $ 1 0 0 0

Sole Price— ’

MASTERCHARGE

$ 1 3 9 0

J. W. NICHOLS So. Side Square
VISA •  *  ■ •  Clarksville, Tx.

e e a o e Q a Q Q e O O Q O O O Q Q Q O O B O O O Q O Q Q Q n Q & Q Q Q Q Q Q Q O Q Q Q Q Q O Q Q Q Q Q Q Q Q f

Portales, New Mex., Mrs. 
Jewel McBride and Mrs. 
Hontas Petty of Bogata; 
Gene Hill of Dallas and 
Howard Hill of Anthony , 
New Mex. Others present 
were Mrs. Gene Hill, Mr. and 
Mrs. J.C. Marks, Robbie and 
Elizabeth, Mr. and Mrs. J.L. 
Neal, and Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
Welch of Dallas; Mrs. 
Howard Hill, Mr. and Mrs. 
Stanley H ill, Misty and 
V iolet of Anthony, New 
Mex., Archie and Lonnie 
McBride, Linda Burns, 
Houston Pettit, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Glenn Babb, and 
Michelle of Bogata, Rhonda 
Myrick of Naples, Donna 
Suggs and Christopher of 
Paris, Dorothy Tolivar of 
Grand Prairie.

Also Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Welch of Lancaster, Mr .and 
Mrs. Kenneth Welch of 
Houston, Mr. and Mrs, Olan 
Calloway of Ennis, Mr. and 
Mrs. Horace Welch of 
Blossom, Mr. and Mrs. 
Johnny Graham and Mrs. 
Robbie Buchsenshuts of San 
Antonio; Mr. and Mrs. 
Duane Hill of Midlothian, 
Mrs. J.L. Hill, Steven and 
Mildred of Calero, Okla., 
Mrs. Alva Hill of Kingston, 
Okla., Mr. and Mrs. Tom 
Strickland of Oklahoma City, 
Mr. and Mrs. Carl Taylor 
and sons of Carrollton, 
Mr.and Mrs. Bill Thompson, 
Debbie, Lisa and Tracy 
Vernon Reynolds and Dana 
Hensley and Mrs. Tratimy

LaPlant of Duncanvulle, 
Mrs. Betty Lou Gray of 
Jefferson, Mr. and Mrs. 
James Weddle, Neil, Larry 
and Renee Weddle and Mrs. 
Annette Chennault of 
Blossom. Mrs. Maxine 
DeMers of Sterling, Colo, 
came the farthest. A number 
of friends and old 
acquaintances called in the 
afternoon.

[ L
SCHOOL

Jjunck Menu
TA LC O B O G A TA  

RIVERCREST 
LUNCH MENU 
MAY 4-MAY 8

Bingo Held
At Haven

At The TALCO STATE BANK

NOW-Checking Accounts

Can Earn YOU Money!
You Decide Whether Interest Paying NOW-Checking or

your regular Talco Stote Bonk checking account is best for you.

M rs. Wanda Vickers Gm

Give You Full Details On NOW-Checking Accounts.

m  TALCO STATE BANK
Talco, Texas

Member F.D.I.C.
THE NEIGHBOR 

YOU CAN BANK ON

SCOTTI Wood-Rlvercrest 
Senior, place third in the 
Regional Golf Com­
petition out of a field of 55 
girls. On Monday she shot 
a score of 102 and on 
Tuesday a 88. for a two 
day total of 190. This is 
Scottl’s first year to play 
golf. (Staff Photo)

■— ■if!

Bell Descendants Have Reunion
The following descendants Mary Bell, Billy and Marie 

of the late Mr. and Mrs. Kit Bell, Bill W. and Nancy Bell 
Bell met at the Rosalie of Longview , Texas;R ick

and Donna Tucker, Crayson 
and Susie Bell of Mesquite,
Texas; Linda, Leri, and 
Jason Proffer, Merion and

Monday
Burrito - chili&cheese 
Tossed green salad 
Whole new potatoes 
Ice cream bar 
Milk

Tuesday
Chicken Fried Steak&gravy
Buttered rice
English peas
Hot rolls
Milk

Wednesday 
Bar B-Q on bun 
Potato salad 
Baked beans 
Banana pudding 
Milk

Thursday 
Beans&chili 
Cole slaw 
Fruit cup 
Milk

Friday 
Hamburgers 
Potato chips 
Ranch style beans 
Lettuce&Tomato salad 
Onions&Pickles 
Ice cream 
Milk

Cemmunity Center Sunday 
for a reunion: Jimmie, Mary 
R ita, Lisa and Darrin 
Stewart of Allen, Texas; 
Ronald, Dorothy, Stanley 
and Kahlayah Benson erf 
Atlanta, Texas; Debbie and 
John Simms of Bedford, 
Texas; Woody, Ann, Denise, 
and James Duffer of Bells, 
Texas; Mac, Kaye, Jason, 
and John Bell, Robert and 
Faye Bell, Reagan, 
RueAnna, LaTonya, and 
Crystal Bell, Eddy, Nancy, 
T()dd, and Scott Denny, 
Norma Jean, B ill, and 
Ronnie White, Alta Bell, 
Alma Bell and John Lee Bell 
of Bogata, Texas; Floyd and 
Bonnie Beetle Elson of 
Carrollton, Texas; Terry 
Bell, Duane, Sandra, Jayson, 
and Kim berly Benson, 
Cullen and Opal Benson of 
Clarksville, Texas; Paul and 
Teida Swadeks of Farmers 
Branch, Texas; Samdra and 
Jerry Beaty of Houston, 
Texas; Linda, Clarence, 
Leslie, Kecthen and 
Christopher Diggs of 
Lewisville, Texas; D(xi and 
Kathy Duffee, Danny and

Do you ever get the feel­
ing that somewhere deep in­
side your garden, there are 
2,000 seeds saying: “ Heck 
no, we won’ t grow’ ’?

Flora McCrary, Merlene 
Reaves of Paris, Texas; 
Myrn Zarate of Rowlett, 
Texas; Ronald and Sharon 
Bell of Sulphur Springs, 
Texas: Tom and Eva Riddle, 
J.O. and Etoile Sockwell of 
Wills Point, Texas; and T(»n 
aixl Caroline Riddle, Pam, 
Randy, Bobby Tom, and 
Jimmy Russell of Roswell, 
New Mexico.

Mrs. Alma Bell of Rosalie 
was the oldest present and 
the only living child or in law 
of the couple. It was voted to 
meet again the last Sunday 
in April 1982 at the Bogata 
Community Center.

Kathy Brooks 
Accepted At Texas Tech

Kathy Brooks has been 
notified of her acceptance to 
Texas Tech University 
Medical School in Lubbock, 
Texas, which she will enter 
in August. Kathy was a 1977 
graduate of Rivercrest High 
School. She also graduated 
from Paris Junior Ccdlege, 
with highest honors, and was 
the recipient of the Albert 
Broadfoot Science Award.

She is presently attending 
Texas A&M University. 
Kathy is the dau^ter of Dr. 
and Mrs. E.E. Brooks of 
Bogata.

Tableware Film
Using 100 much dish­

washer detergent may cause 
a film on stainless steel 
tableware. This film can be 
removed with silver polish.

In bingo at Red River 
Haven recently sf>onsored by 
the Ladies Auxiliary of the 
VFW, 23 were present with 
16 winning. The one game 
winners were Robert 
Hunter, Lily Mauldin, Oscar 
E lliott, Cora Whitaker, 
Minnie Harris; two games 
winners were, Mr. Hood, 
Hontas McDonald, Agnes 
King, and Alfred Kelley; 
three gam e winner was 
Pearl Moody.

Assisting the players were 
Mr. and Mrs. Buster 
Mauldin, Blanche Mauldin 
and Rita, Misty and Lori 
Malone.

Noisy Cockroach
The 3-inch-long, horned 

Madagascar cockroach can 
emit wheezes, rasps, and 
hisses heard up to 12 feet 
dway by pumping its abdo­
men and expelling air 
through modified breathing 
vents on its flanks.

Foralonger day.
If the sun always seems to set before you’re 
ready, a few extra hours of outdoor light could 
help you. The Nite-Liter, outdoor lighting from 
Community Public Service Company, comes 
on automatically at dusk, and turns itself off 
at dawn. The Nite-Liter is installed on a tall 
pole in your yard, giving up to a 100-yard 
diameter of light, so you can finish those out­
door activities, even after the sun goes down. 
And the Nite-Liter uses less energy for the 
same amount of illumination compared to 
incandescent lighting. To get the Nite-Liter for 
your home, just give us a call.

COMMUNITY PUBLIC SERVICE
Your Bhclric Uqhf Sr Rnn/pr Company

E13 81
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Bogota
Personals

STUDENTS of the month 
for April at Rivercrest 
High Schooi are Rill 
Dixon and Dusty 
Damron. Dixon is vice- 
president of Allied Youth, 
secretary of the Drama 
Club, Program Director 
for Futures Teachers and

a member of the National 
Honor Society. Damron Is 
the daughter of Mr, and 
Mrs. Buddy Damron of 
Bogata. She is an FHA 
member and officer and 
involved in journalism 
and the National Honor 
Society. (Staff Photo)

Roberts Honored On Birthday
Gilbert Roberts of Reno 

was honored Sunday with a 
birthday dinner at the home 
of his sister Mr and Mrs. 
Gilbert Sulsar. Thirty two 
were present and the 
honoree received many gifts.

Jerry Sulsar of Mt. Ver­
non, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Sulsar is in Athens this week 
for weeks school in con­
nection with his job at Texas 
Utilities Co.

»

MYLAIMTA.
Effective

Antacid/Anti-Gas
grea t taste 

fast action/ low  sodium

12 oz. 
LIQUID

$]67 LIMIT OF 4

WAL-MART
PHARMACY

B ill B ryson - P h a rm a c is t C larksv ille

Mr. and Mrs. Albert 
Legate and Mr. and Mrs. 
Earl Legate spent several 
days last week visiting their 
sister Mr. and Mrs. B.F. 
Rainey of Lubbock. The 
Albert Legates also visited 
their daughter Mr. and Mrs. 
J.O. Wimberly and sons of 
Littlefield.

Dr. and Mrs. E.E. Brooks 
attended the Paris Junior 
College Chorale Concert at 
the Central Presbyterian 
Church in Paris Sunday 
afternoon. Their daughter 
Staci is a member of the 
Chorale.

Mr. and Mrs. Geral Fritz 
of Stevensville, Mich, spent 
Wednesday night and 
Thursday with Mrs. Nell 
Mathis.

Mr. and Mrs. Harold 
Vickers of El Paso spent the 
weekend with his mother 
Mrs. Jim Vickers and otl.er 
relatives.

Weekend visitors of Mrs. 
Josie Fennell were Mr.and 
Mrs. Donald Dolan of 
Temple, Danny Dolan of 
Austin, Mr. and Mrs. John 
Simms of Bedford, Mr. and 
Mrs Billy Gene Bell, Mr. 
and Mrs. Danny Bell and 
Mr .arid Mrs. Billy Wayne 
Bell, Mike and Katy of 
Longview.

Sunday visitors of Mrs. 
Alma Lowrj’ to honor her 
birthday were her son Mr. 
and Mrs. W'lford Lowry of 
Blossom, her daughter Mr. 
and Mrs. Leon Shoffner of 
Jefferson, Mrs. Burt West 
and children of Ashdown, 
Ark. and Mrs. Vivian 
Westbrook of Talco.

Recent visitors of Mr.and 
Mrs. Raymond Mauldin 
were her children Mr. and 
Mrs. Bobby Thornton of 
Lakewood, Calif., Mr. and 
Mrs. Bob Hancock, J.J. 
Hancock and Robert Smith 
of Garland, Mr. and Mrs. 
Duane Benson, Jason and 
Kim of Clarksville, Mr. and 
Mrs. Donnie Smith and Dorie 
of Bogata and Mr. and Mrs. 
Willie Gray of Purly.

Sunday guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Horace Adams were

S S P B D a s s *

EMTIRE5TOCK
20% TO 50%

Off Regular Price

Friday & Saturday, May 1-2 Only

, e /  /  _• t f t W L  Downtown Bogota

oMtqiMAL Qtrrs a nttqnjtJtvz AccESSonws

BISC UITS Parade 6/M
PEPSI & D IET PEPSI ■ - 99*
PAPER TOW ELS c 69̂
BEEF P A H IES  *3“

CHIPS POT PIES DIAPERS
Frito  Lay Banquet 36 Ct. G eneric

A ll Kinds

8 9 ’

Beef & Chicken

4/»l
Elastic Legs-Disposable$̂83

Open 9 a .m . - 7 p.m . 
Open Sunday FRED'S 120 W. Main 

C la rk sv ille , Tx.
11 a .m . - 5 p.mWAREI

,

10USEFOODS

Mr. and Mrs. Kyle King, 
Micki and Michelle Lee of 
Paris.

Mr. and Mrs. James 
Montgomery had as 
weekend guests her grand­
daughter Mr. and Mrs. 
Kennon Schackleford and 
April Ann of Atlanta.

Mr. and Mrs. Pleas Turner 
visited Sunday with her 
sister Mr. and Mrs. Henry 
Pierce of Arlington. They 
were met there by M»^. Don 
Buffo and children of Plano.

Sunday visitors of Mr. and 
Mrs. Rufus Ward were his 
daughter Mr. and Mrs. 
Malcolm Palm er of Mt. 
Pleasant.

Weekend visitors of Mrs. 
Ruby McClure were Mr. and 
Mrs. Charlie Hale and Mrs. 
Lola Seals of Wichita Falls. 
They all visited Sunday with 
Mr. and Mrs. Vernon Mc­
Clure of Sulphur Springs.

Mary Lassiter, Truman 
Lassiter, Mrs. Hontas Mc­
Donald and Mrs. Bill 
Wilkinson were in Tyler 
Saturday with the latter’s 
son Mr. and Mrs. Fred 
Wilkinson to honor Mrs. Bill 
Wilkinson on her 87th bir­
thday.

Patrick Scoggins of 
Hollywood, Fla. has 
returned home after a two 
weeks visit with his grand­
parents Mr. and Mrs. Homer 
Scoggins. Visiting the 
Scoggins this week are 
their daughter Mrs. Pat 
Lindsay of Charlotte, N.C. 
and Mrs. Ida Lewis of 
Bakersfield, Calif.

Weekend guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Darcy Cage were her 
brother Mr. and Mrs. Andy 
Douglas and Mike of Hunt- 
svill, Ala. and Mr. and Mrs. 
Thomas L. Cox of Asher, 
Okla.

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Burch of 
Sulphur Springs spent 
Sunday with her father and 
sister Bill Harbison and Mr. 
and Mrs. H.W. Smith and 
Eddie and their guests Mr. 
and Mrs. Roy Cox of Palm­
dale, Calif.

Mrs. Marjory Myers, Mrs. 
Virginia O ’Donnell and 
James Albert Hancock 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Dick 
DeBerry of Idabel Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Ed Un­
derwood of San Juan, Porto 
Rica are visiting his sister 
and brother Miss Tom 
Underwood and Jimmy 
Underwood.

Attorney
Speaks
ToDAR

Mr. Billy Frank Hicks, 
Franklin County Attorney 
spoke to 24 members of the 
Martha Laird Chapter, 
Daughters of the American 
Revolution, at their regular 
monthly meeting, Saturday, 
April 11 at 2:30 p.m. in the 
community room of the 
Guaranty Bond State Bank.

The topic of Hicks’ 
program was geneological 
research. He discussed the 
various methods and 
procedures availab le to 
trace ancestors through the 
use of Civil W'ar records. 
A number of visual aids were 
employed to demonstrate 
how this type of study could 
be accomplished.

The business meeting was 
conducted in the usual 
manner with various officer 
«nd committee reports.

Mrs. Jack Firm in, 
Chariman of the American 
H e r i t ig e  C o m m itte e , 
suggested that Chapter 
members begin a tradition of 
bringing early American 
crafts for display at 
meetings. She noted that 
such a practice would help 
preserve this vital part (rf 
American heritige.

Reports of State Con­
ference were given by Mrs. 
John Austin, Mrs. Gerald 
Hampton and Mrs. Karl 
Raynar. Mrs. Hampton 
announced that Martha 
Laird Chapter had received 
awards for excellence in 
yearbook, public relations, 
service for veterans, and 
Constitution Week.

The meeting was ad­
journed by singing Faith of 
Our Fathers and praying the 
Mizpah.

Hostesses for the oc- 
cassion included Mmes. 
Winkle, Keeling, Vickers, 
Rolston, C. Davis, Drews, 
Kennemer, Glick, and 
Lawrence.

The next meeting will be 
Saturday, May 16, at 2:30 
p.m. in the First Christian 
Church, Mt. Pleasant.

STUDENTS of the month 
for May are Kathy Earley 
and John Hines. Earley is 
the daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Ray Earley and 
Secretary of the F'uture 
Teachers while Hines is 
the son of the late Mr. and

Mrs. C.H. Hines. He is 
active inthe athletic 
program, onthe Student 
council, a class favorite, 
and president of the 
Sophomore class.(Staff 
Phot)

DECEMBER 
STUDENTS of the month, 
which are just now being 
published since one of the 
students was ill, were 
Stan Wood and Sandra 
Dunn. Wood is the son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Wake Wood, 
active in athletics ciass 
favorite, on the student 
council. National Honor 
Society, a member of the 
Drama Club and One Act 
Play, and the Coin Club. 
Dunn is the daughter of

Mr. and Mrs. James 
Dunn of Mt. Pleasant. She 
is a Rivercrest senior. 
She is the senior class 
reporter, vice-president 
of the Future Teachers of 
R i v e r c r e s t .  v i c e -  
president of the coin club, 
secretary of Allied Youth. 
Program director of the 
Drama Club, and a 
member of the paper 
staff, taff Photo)

BOGATA BUSINESS 
D IR Ea O R Y

Rod River 
County 

PvbfcUbrary
Mon., Wod., Thurs., Frl.

12:00-5:30 p.m. 
Tu»«.. 9:00-12:00 a.m.

1:00-5:30 p.m. 
Saturday. 9:00 a.m.- 

12:00 noon

MT. VERNON 
TRADE DAY 
AUCTION

Every Sot, at 7 o.m. 
-ocoted 2 Miles North 

Of Mt, Vernon 
On Hwy. 37

Col. Buddy Stringfcilow , 
Auctioneer.

A lso  A va ilab le  •
Doors and Trim  

Jam es Diggs. Ph. 632-4505

D &  S TOOL 
HARDWARE and 
FURNITURE CO

See Us For Your 
LAWN & GARDEN SUPPLIES 

Mowers-Tillers- 
Hoes-Rakes-Etc.

1 17 M ain Street Bogota. Tex

POINTER'S BOOT & 

SHOE SHOP
W e Do Saddle Repairing . 

W e A lso  Repair Both Men
& Wom en's Shoes.
IF POINTER DOES IT 
IT S DONE RIGHT 

146 S. M ain Bogota , Tx,

MAIN
CONOCO STA.

201 E. M ain  St. C la rk s v ille  
Ph. 427-2829.

W e Hove A  Fu ll Supply O f 
Conoco Productts & O ther 
Popu lar B rands. A  Fu ll 
S e rv ice  Station . G iv e  Us 

A  Try .
B 'lly  M itche ll.

Open 6 a .m . C lo se  8 p .rn .

TH IS  SPACE 1
CAN MAKE j

YOU MONEY 1 
CALL 1 

632-5322 1
COUNTRY FURNITURE

W e Sell New & Used 
Furniture. W e Buy Used 

Furniture. 1 P iece or Full

Household. Coll 427-3227 
or 427-3573. A re a  214 .

Doy or Night.
1807 W. Main 

C la rksv ille , Tex.

ARMSTRONG I  
PEST CONTROL |

Complete Pest Control R 
A ll Work Guronteed B 

licensed TPCL 3418 
Coll Day Or Night R 
Charles Armstrong B

Bogota Tx. 214-632 5925 R

MASON
SHOES

For Men 
And Women.

Call 632-4230 Or 
See John W. Hood.

THIS SPACE CAN 

MAKE YOU

MONEY
CALL

632-5322 1

M in i-A d s  
3 W e e k s  Fo r$ 3

FOR A SMALL MONTHLY CHARGE,
SHE COULD’VE

ANSWERED IT BY THE DRYER.
Every time Barbara Phillips' 

phane rings, it's long distance— 
the distance from her to her phone, 
that is.

If you spend a lot of time running 
to the phone, maybe you're in the 
running for on extension phone. 
For much less than you'd expect, 
you con start reaching for your

phone. Whether you're stuck in the 
laundry room, glued to the TV or 
deep in sleep.

What's more, you know you've 
got a phone that's as reliable as 
fne phone company. So the next 
time you run to the pnone, call your 
General Telephone business of­
fice And make it the last time.

frTra EXTENSION PHONES
"Touch CaOtng avMloblo in mott arMt**
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Area IV Conservation Awards Given
Thirty-five soil and water 

conservation districts in the 
East Texas region of the 
state which covers a 51 
county area will hold their 
third annual Region IV 
Texas Conservation Awards 
Program in Nacogdoches, 
Texas on May 4.

The propose of the awards 
P'^ogram which begins at 
6:30 p.m. in the Student 
Centei Building, Stephen F. 
Austin State University, is to 
acknowledge, recognize and 
honor individuals who have 
dedicated themselves to the

conservation and wise use of 
renev.'able natural resources 
on their private lands or who 
have contributed time and 
talent ot promoting sound 
soil and water conservation 
in their communities.

Receiving the award of 
“ Outstanding Conservation 
D istrict”  for the most 
progressive conservation 
program during the past 
year is the Red River County 
SWCD headquartered in 
Clarksville. Members of the 
board of directors of the 
honored district are: James

^  W O W ll
win a* ]

1 .
T ¥ ) gift certificate $

C I R C L E  0
WESTERN WEAR

V I

Hwy 82 W. 427-5180
CLARKSVILLE, TEXAS*
(Sale Ends Saturday, May 2)

•  Open Til 6 On Saturdays n
For Our Out Of Town Customers

STA-niESS JEANS..................................................$f.W
lEVI SADOUMAN5.............................................. $11.9S
AUtOOTS..............................................MMrcaatoH
WESTEtN STIAWS....................................... IrMn SMS
WALKER WORK SHOES, REG. 39.9S......................$29.$S
WALKER WORK ROOTS, ROOTS, REG. $7$............SSR.fS

GOOSE DOWN VESTS A COATS..................30 parcant aH
ALL WESTERN LS. SNIRH....................... .. ^rcaat aH
AU RELT RUaLES....................................2S parcant aH
LEVI 14 ai. COnON JEANS .................................... SMS
CHIC UDIES FASHION JUNS................................SI4.9S
WRANGLER 14 ai. JEANS...................................... S13.9S

1hENS western s u it s ..............................2S parcant oH

•FREE COKES & DR PEPPER

E. Pearce, chairman, 
C larksville; DaviH ^  
Jackson, Clarksville, E.H.

Hausler, Clarksville; W.H. 
Hammer, Clarksville and 
Jack Franklin, Bogata.

The Red River County 
SWCD which is a political 
subdivision of state govern­
ment was established to 
assist farm ers, ranchers, 
and local communities 
within the boundaries of the 
district solve soil, water and 
related resource con­
servation problems through 
local initiative and voluntary 
assistance programs.

T w o  e d u c a t i o n a l  
categories, an essay contest 
and poster contest, have 
enabled students to 
demonstrate creative  a r­
tistic and writing skills 
relative to the conservation 
of soil, water and related 
resources.

In the essay contest 
students 18 years and under 
demonstrate research and 
writing skills on the subject 
“ Conservation-Our Best 
Insurance.”  First, second 
and third place winners in 
respective order are: Terri 
Robinson, Center High 
School, Center, Texas; 
Kemue' Wiley Black, Big 
Sandy High School, Big 
Sandy, Texas; and Arthur 
Sheppard, Pittsburg High 
School, Pittsburg, Texas.

The Poster Contest which 
was open to students 12 years 
and under enabled students 
to present impressions on the 
subject,“ Resource Con­
servation .”  First, second 
and third place winners in 
respective order are: Stacy 
Taylor, Bogata Elementary, 
Bogata, Texas; Leigh 
Schuster, Fa irfie ld  In­
termediate School, Fairfield, 
Texas; and Amy Crowder, 
Coston Elementary, Lufkin, 
Texas.

Ambassador’s Quartet 
To Perform In Talco

The Ambassador’s Quartet 
from Atlanta, Ga. will be in 
concert at the Assembly of 
God Church Tuesday night 
May 5, at 7:30 p.m.

The Ambassador's are no

strangers to this area having 
preformed at the civic center 
in Mt. Pleasant and at 
several churches.

Everone is invited to at­
tend.

Fair view Will Have 
Homecoming

KICKING UP their heels 
were the R ivercrest 
Varsity Cheerleaders,

who performed a 
precision routine at the 
Rivercrest Variety Show

last Friday night. (Staff 
Photo by Linda Tahhi

Sheriff's Report
The Franklin County 

Sh eriff’s Department is 
sponsoring a benefit music 
show on May 4, 1981, at 8:00 
p.m. at the Mt. Vernon High 
School in Mt. Vernon, Texas. 
All advance tickets for the 
benefit w ill be sold by 
members of the Franklin 
County Sheriff’s Depart­
ment.

The department is spon­
soring the benefit in order to 
help them to raise the 
necessary funds which will 
enable them to purchase 
some additional law en­
forcement equipment. If the 
Franklin County Sheriff’s 
Department is successful in 
raising the funds, they will 
be able to provide even more 
service than they are 
providing for the area at the 
present time.

Red River County Sheriff’s 
Department daily activities 
from April 20-April 27 were: 
two reports of assault, one 
report of criminal mischief, 
two reports of disorderly 
conduct, three reports of 
theft, two reports of burgalry 
of coin operated machines, 
one report of burglary of 
residence, one report of 
driving while intoxicated, 
and one report of burglary of 
a business.

Ther were two arrested for 
public intoxication, one 
arrested for assault and 
turned over to juvenille 
(rfficer, one arrested for 
driving on wrong side of 
roadway and driving while 
intoxicated, two arrested on 
warrants for issuance of bad 
checks from Red River 
J .P .’s office, and one

Early Regestration Underway At PJC
Early registration is un­

derway for the first and 
second semesters at Paris 
Junior College, announced 
Max Mabry, director of 
counseling at PJC.

Students may register for 
either or both summer terms 
by seeing a counselor in the 
Mike Rheudasil Learning 
Center from 9 a m. to 4 p.m. 
weekdays. Those enrolling

Baptist WMU Meeting
Mrs. Vola Ward led the 

Bible Study when the Baptist 
Women of the First Baptist 
Church of Bogata met 
Monday morning at the 
church. Mrs. Jim Bankston 
opened the meeting. Mrs. 
Ann Culpepper led the

opening prayer. “ Gift of the 
Holy Spirit”  was the theme 
for the lesson. Mrs. Edie 
Stogner read the Prayer 
Calendar and Matt. 28; 11-20. 
Mrs. Emmie Mitchell led the 
benediction.

Johntown News

•FREE SHOE SHINE
n r

By Mrs. Francis Foster 
Mrs. Edd Childers was a 

over night visitor Friday 
night in the home of her 
daughter Mr. and Mrs. Mac 
McCuller of Mt. Pleasant.

Recent visitors of Mr. and 
Mrs. Wesley Askins were 
Mr. and Mrs. Bud Askins and 
Brandi and Ty of New

Please.
Am erica is not your ashtray.

A  Public Service of Th is Newspaper 6i The Advertising Council

Orleans, La. Mark and Tim 
Askins of Irving, Mr. and 
Mrs. Bob Estell and Bruce of 
Ft. Worth, Vicki Askins of 
Oklaa. City, Mr. Jim 
Brockhalter of Dallas.

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Hervey 
of Midlothian were recently 
visitors of his parents Mr. 
and Mrs. Sammy Hervey.

Mr. and Mrs. Carlos Potter 
of Kaufman were recent 
visitors in the home of his 
parents Mr and Mrs. 
Howard Potter.

Emma Upchurch and 
daughters of Richerson 
visited Saturday in the home 
of her sister-in-law, Mrs. 
Odie Hervey and Mrs. Arrita 
Hervey.

Mr. and Mrs. Gene 
Hawkins returned home 
Wednesday after spending 
the Easter holidays in 
Corpus Christi. While there 
they visited their son, Mr. 
and Mrs. Roger Hawkins and 
sons, Jeremy and Aaron. On 
Sunday afternoon they 
visited Mrs. Cleo Hawkins 
and Mike and were met there 
by these relatives: Mr.and 
Mrs. Gene Crane, Cidy 
Roberts, Reesie and Clinton, 
Omar and Cheryl Garcia, 
Betty McGregor, Mr. and 
Mrs. Buddy Hawkins, Randy 
and Rexann, Mr. and Mrs. 
Rodney Hawkins and two 
daughters, Mr. and Mrs. 
Johnie Hawkins, Jason and 
Jennifer, and Mr. and 
Mrs Pat Hawkins, 
Brandon, Gretchen and 
Heidi. Mr. and Mrs. Coy 
Vicars of Sulphur Springs 
visited the Gene Hawkins on 
Thursday morning.

Mr. and Mrs. K.O. 
Shoulders visited Friday in 
the Glendale Community 
with Mr. and Mrs. Bob 
Martin.

Glenda and Cinday Cox of 
Commerce spent the 
weekend with their parents 
Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Cox.

Dorothy Foster was a 
dinner guest Monday of Mr. 
and Mrs. Marion Foster of 
the Bridges Chapel Com­
munity.

Mrs. Jim Pirtle visited 
Saturday in Talco in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. David 
Hudson and family.

early must pay all tuition 
fees at that time, Mabry 
explained.

Summer sessions w ill 
begin on June 2 and July 8, 
and courses will be offered in 
a variety of academic and 
technical-vocational areas. 
Complete course schedules 
are availabel at PJC.

Among courses scheduled 
during the first term are 
photography, Germ an, 
music appreciation and 
individual musical in­
struction , en g in eerin g  
drawing, college reading, 
camping, backpacking and 
b o w l i n g ,  a g r i c u l t u r e ,  
b i o l o g y ,  c h e m i s t r y ,  
mathemat i cs ,  Engl i sh 
course, government, history, 
learning skills, machine 
shop, physical science and 
sociology.

Gross Sales 
Are High

state Comptroller Bob 
Bullock Thursday reported 
that gross sales in Texas 
during the final quarter of 
last year surged to $89.8 
billion.

Sales in the final three 
months of 1980, as reported 
by 341,539 outlets, out­
stripped third quarter sales 
by $24.1 billion, Bullock said.

Total gross sales figures 
for 1980 in Texas reached 
$281.1 billion, according to 
Bullock, compared to gross 
sales for 1979 of $213.8 billion.

“ The numbers speak for 
themselves,”  Bullock said, 
’ ’showing most Texas 
companies closed out the 
year on an economic high 
note.”

Bullock said the expanding 
Texas business picture was 
also partly responsible for 
the rapid increase in 
reporting outlets-up by 
nearly 100,000 from the third 
quarter to 341,539 at year’s 
end.

Bullock also released a 
computer analysis showing 
reported sales for each of the 
state’s 254 counties and a 
sales tax analysis broken 
down by the state’s Standard 
Metropolitan Statistical 
Areas.

Fourth Quarter gross sales 
in Lamar County were 
121,157,603 and for Red River 
county were 35,930,145.

arrested
conduct.

for disorderly

The annual homecoming of 
the Fairview Cemetery will 
be held Sunday, May 3, 1981 
at the Fairview Church.

A business meeting will be 
held at 10:30 a.m. and all 
interested persons are urged 
to attend. There will be an 
election of officers. The 
treasurer will give an annual 
report with a complete 
analysis of cost of recently 
c o m p l e t e d  r e s t r oo m  
facilities. Perpetual care or 
an alternative w ill be 
discussed

At noon, there will be a

basket lunch so bring yours 
and join others in eating and 
visiting with old friends. 
After lunch, there will be a 
singing.

Anyone, wishing to make a 
contribution to Fairview  
Cemetery may do so a» the 
homecoming. You may also 
mail donation to the First 
National Bank, Mt. Vernon, 
Texas 75457, or to Helen 
Biggerstaff, Rt. 1, Box 133A, 
Talco, Texas 7548"7.

Buy, Sell or Rent 
With Classified Ads
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N E X T  Y E A R  — The 
varsity cheerleaders for 
the next school year were 
selected recently at

R ivercrest. They are: 
Sandra Spencer, head 
cheer l eader ,  Mar la  
Martin, Kim Reeder,

Tessa Morgan, Stacey 
Spencer and Leilani 
Barnette. (Staff Photo)

Weekly Agriculture Briefs
By Paul d. Payne 

MILO DEMONSTRATION 
PLANTED

A 16 variety milo 
demonstration has been 
plated on the Webb Farm 
which is located between 
Blossom and Pattonville. 
Cooperators are Melvin and 
Mark Webb with expert 
veteran farm er in the 
Byrdtown Community.

The demonstration is 
located west of Webb’s home 
on the oil top road, and it will 
be marked later so farmers 
can follow the progress of the 
various varieties.

Varieties included are 
Golden Acres TE Y-101; 
HHarpool 9703 GR; Oro G 
Extra; Conlee Top Hand II; 
Ring Around 807; DeKalb 57; 
Pioneer 8680; Golden Acres 
TE 66 B; Harpool 6203-GR; 
Conlee Top Hand TA ; 
Pioneer 8311; Ring Around 
733 GB; DeKalb DK42; 
Paymaster DR 1125; TE 
Bird-a-Boo II; and 
Paymaster Gr 1089.

Seed were furnished by 
Tide Products of Deport; 
Harpool Seed Company of 
Denton; R.C. Young Seed 
and Grain Company of 
Lubbock; Garth Yeager of 
Pecan Gap; Cooper Farm & 
Seed Center; Ring Around 
Products of Tyler and James 
Gordon of Taylortown.

LIMOUSIN SALE SUC- 
CESSFUW

The First Annual Lamar 
County Limousin Breeders 
Association Sale was termed 
very successful by Fulton

Stephens, president. The 
sale, held Tuesday, saw 87 
lots sell for $112,025 for an 
average of $1288. A standing 
room only crowd was at the 
Cat t l eman ’s L i vestock 
Commission Company for 
the sale.

The top animal in the sale 
was a purebred Limousin 
cow and heifer calf pair 
consigned by Littlis Hilltop 
Ranch of Mt. Pleasant. The 
successful buyer was Brian 
Payne of Paris, who gave 
$2600 for the pair. Brian, a 
Reno 4-H member, plans to 
show the heifer.

A fullblood 20 month old 
bull consigned by Jack 
Greek Cattle Company of- 
Chattanooga, Oklahoma 
brought $2500. He was 
purchased by Crowe 
Brothers of Sherman.

Buyers from as far away 
as Miami, Oklahoma and 
Winters, Texas made pur­
chases. However, a large 
percentage of the cattle 
founcl new homes in the 
Northeast Texas and 
Southeast Oklahoma area. 
Association members were 
particularly pleased that so 
many of the cattle found 
homes with new breeders in 
the area.

Sale averages by category 
were as follows: Eight 
purebred cow pairs-$1541; 
four bred purebred cows- 
$1119; four open purebred 
heifers-$919; four purebred 
bulls-$1919; seven per­
centage bulls-$1330; 29 three- 
quarter cow pairs-$1312; 12 
halfblood cow pairs-$944; 15

bred percentage cows-$886 
and three open percentage 
heifers-$1092.

Educational programs 
conducted by the Texas 
Agr i cul t rua l  Extension 
Service serve people of all 
ages regardless of socio­
economic level, race, color, 
sex, religion or national 
origin.

David Bull 
Injured

Mr. and Mrs. Sam Coffin of 
Ft. Worth were here Sunday 
to visit her son, David Bull 
who received a crushed hell, 
caused when a casting fell on 
him at work. David is em­
ployed by Texas Steel Co. He 
is in St. Joseph Hospital and 
is doing well.

CONSUMER ̂ CHECKLIST

A dirty kitchen fan 
doesn’ t operate at peak 
performance and may 
even be a safety hazard. 
Remove the screen or 
filter and wash in deter­
gent. Clean the fan and 
duct work with a suds- 
dampened sponge and 
rinse with a clean, damp 
sponge.

BACON
Slab Lb.

$ 1 19
COFFEE

Folger's Lb.

$ 2 2 9

EGGS
G rad e  A  Large

79
COKES, DR. PEPPERS, DIET DR. PEPPER ho.^ poci. $]69

TOMATOES Vine Ripened Lb. 39’

M ILK
G a l.

Good marriages are like a 
man’s beard. They keep 
right on growing despite the 
number o f close shaves they 
have.

imiiiiiMiimmi

GOLD
BOND
STAMPS

iiiimmiiimmi

CORN
Shurfine 303 Can

093/M TISSU E
Charm in 
4 Roll

09
JOE FORD GROCERY
S p « :ia ls  Good Fridoy S  Saturda, /y\oy t-2 Ouontities Reserved
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HEREFORD BULLS-Good 
selection yearlings thru 3 

years old. CHAPM AN
I  HEREFORD FARM . M. 

Lynn Chapman (T ira
Community), Route 3, 
Sulphur Springs, Texas. 
Phone 214-945-2446. (tfc)

FOR SALE or lease, 3 bay 
garage, could easily be 

converted to home. Will 
finance if sold, call Doug 
Richards,817 477-5162 or 817 
582-5725. 4-30

JEEPS. CARS, TR U CK S- 
: a v a i l a b l e  t h r o u g h  
government agencies. Many 
sell for under 1200. Call (602) 
941-8014, ext. 615 for your 
directory on how to pur* 
chase. 1-15

Need appliance repair? Call 
Lowry’s in Mr. Vernon for 

> factory trained servicemen 
for all brands of home ap- 
plieances. Phone 537-2214 of 
537-2213. Nights, holidays 
and weekends call 588-2664. 
TFC

SISTER BELL 
SPIRITUAL 

READER 
& ADVISOR

HELPS ON ALL AFFAIRS 
OF LIFE

SPECI/M. '/j PRICE READINGS 
214-784-0056 

822 N. Main, Paris Texas

HELP WANTED,Secretary- 
)  bookkeeper, for interview 

call 632-4271 or 5474, BogaU. 
tfc

W A N T E D  R N ’ S 
OR L V N ’ S

Franklin County 
Hosptial 
Contact

Judy Yarbrough 
Director Of 

. Nursing Services 
537-4552

COUNTRY HOME FOR LEASE
t

Beautiful Brick 
Ranch Style Home,

Over 2700 sq. ft. 4 Bdrms,
3 Bath, Game Room, Modern 
Built-lm, TV Antenrx],
Rotor, Booster. MUCH A40RE!

In The Country 
On FM Rood In Deport Area.

VERY REASONABII. 
Purchase (Option Available.

ALSO 33.25 Acres 
Two Miles Southwest 
Of Deport On FM 1501. 
Excellent Buildi.ng Site 
Dr Form Land • One Quarter 
\4ile Of Rood Frontoge.

FOR SALE
3 Bdrm., 2 Bath, House 

In Bogota On Circle Drive. 
Approx. 1540 sq. ft. 

of Living Areo.
FIRST MARK REAL ESTATE 

AGENT JIM GIFFORD 
785-0364 785 6077

Want Ads
FOR SALE—By owner, pink 

brick home on comer lot, 3 
bedroom, 2 baths, living 
room St dining area, den with 
firep lace, kitchen with 
dinette area, large patio with 
g r e en h o u se .  632-5324, 
Bogata. tfc

SPEIR St Speir Upholstery 
now open. A ll work 

guaranteed. Prompt service. 
149 N. Main, Bogata. 632-4535 
or 4484. tfc

FO R  S A L E —Johntown 
Baptist Church P a r­

sonage. Four bedrooms, 
brick, 2 baths, fully car­
peted, utility room, central 
heat & air, lots of storage, 2- 
car garage, deep well. 
Bogata 632-5493, 632-5051. tfc

FOR SALE—Nice lot on west 
side of First Baptist 

Church, Deport. Contact 
Murl Roach, Johnnie 
Dawson or Reymond 
(Crawford, tfc.

FOR SALE
Household Furnishings, 

Including B & W Portable TV 
Set & Tappan Refrigerator. 

TO SETTLE ESTATE.
For Furthmr Information,
Call 652-3376

Or Write
Box 277

Deport. Tx. 75435

RESPONSIBLE PERSON 
wanted to own and operate 

candy or Confection vending 
route. Bogata and surroun­
ding area. Pleasant 
business. High profit items. 
Can start part time. Age or 
experience not important. 
Requires car and $1644 to 
$5376 cash investment. For 
details call Toll Free, Eagle 
Industries, 1-800-328-0723 4- 
23

FOR S A L E -O ld er  2 
bedroom frame house. On 

50X180 lot. Storage house. In 
Cotten addition near 
Johntown. Call 632-5050 after 
6 p.m. and on weekends, tfc

STRAYED from Clarksville 
St. pasture, Hereford 

Whiteface 400 lb. heifer. 
Reward for information or 
retum. 632-4219 or 5140. 4-30 
MA

CERAMICS BY DORRIS—1 
mile West of Taylortown. 

Supplies, free lessons. Open 
Tuesday and Tlnirsday 2-6 
p.m. Sat. 12:30-3:30 p.m. Call 
785-2070. 4-9

GARAGE SALE—Saturday 
only. May 2, 311 Hudson. 

Bogata. Jackie Couch.

FOR SALE—5 weeks old 
registered P itt Bull 

puppies, 632-4142 after 4 p.m. 
MA 5-7

FOR SALE—Console Singer 
Sewing Machine, 6 in. 

joiner, 10 in. table saw, cut­
off saw. 632-5677. Bogata. 
MA 5-7

PIANOS exceptional quality.
New and repossess^. Can 

be inspected and financed 
locally. Write Joplin Piano, 
Joplin, Mo. 64801. 4-30

LOST-Valuable, large, white 
dog. Roadside Park, 271 S. 

of Bogata. Call collect 713- 
664-6408. 5-14.

r

$
$
$
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We’re banking on you, America, with

AGRICULTURAL LOANS
Qualified applicants to American Midlands, 
Inc. can receive assistance for;

Farm Purchases 
Livestock and Machinery 
Farm Refinance 
Conversion from short term 
to long term 

$ Leasing
MINIMUM: $150,000

Call Toll Free 
1 -800-228-2702

(In Nebraska call 402/334-5100)

American Midlands. Inc,
2945 S. 132nd St. • Omaha. NE 68144

Member NAFCO

Offices in Columbus. Dallas 
Denver. Knoxville, Omaha

An ordinance creating a user charge 
lyttem for the treatment of domeatic 
wastewater; establishing user 
classification charging for excessive 
strength wastewater; providing for 
the annual notification fo wastewater 
treatment service charge of billing; 
provi^ng for the annual review of 
ooeration and maintenance charges; 
requiring adequate record keeping; 
providing for charges on extraneous 
flows and toxic pollutant ; taking 
precedence over inconsistant 
agreem ent!; and declaring an

*"^?t*Sr3[ained by the d ty council of 
the a t y  of Deport. Texas as Follows: 
Section 1; A  m j  classification is 
herMy eHsblisned for all users of 
muiiicipal wastewater facilities, as 
follows: User Classification Class A- 
Residential Users, Class B- 
Commercial Users.

Class A users shall include all 
reaidnetlal type users including, but 
not limited to. residences, apartment 
units with individual meters, trailer 
court units with each trailer having an 
individual meter, duplexes, or any 
other service primarily intended for 
domestic or residential type use. The 
City may include small office 
buildings, churches and other low 
volume (similar to domestic volume) 
users in Class A.

Oaas B users shall include com­
mercial users, such as, but not limited 
to, restaurants, cafes, car washes, 
schools, hospitals, nurring homes, 
offices, hotels, motels, laundries, 
grocery stores, department store, 
apartments with a master meter, 
trailei court units with a master 
meter, etc., not included in Class A 

In future. City may establish other 
user classifications, as necessary, to 
meet local, state, or federal 
regulations.or the general needs of the

‘ lection 2:A1I users of municipal 
wastewater facilities shall be charged 
a mimmum of $4.50 per month of the 
first 1.500 gallons, plus a charge of 
$1.00 per 1.000 gallons of metered 
water consumption for usage over 
2 000 gallons. The water consumption 
per month to be billed for Oass A 
users shall be to amaximum of lO.OOO 
gallons in order not to account any 
water usol during months for pur­
poses such as lawn and garden 
watering from which water is not 
returned into the wastewater 
facilities. The water consumption per 
month to be billed for Class B users 
shall be the actual water <-on- 
sumption recorded each month for the 
purpose of water bill. In case of u„ers 
not on a metered basis, the City shall 
establish an estimated water mn- 
sumption based on a comparison of tne 
non-metered user with a metered user 
of similar class.

Section 3- Review and Revisi'Ti: The 
User enlarge Ordinance shall be 
reviewed annually regarding the 
wastewater conlributiop of users and

Public Notice
user classes, the total costs ol ttw 
operation and maintenance of the 
treatment works, and its approved 
user charge system the charges for 
users or user classes shall be revised 
to accomplish the following; (1) 
maintain the proportionate 
distribution of operation and main­
tenance costs among users and user 
classes. (2) generate sufficient 
revenue to pay the total operation and 
maintenance costs necessary to the 
pioper operjtion and maintence 
(including replacement) of the 
treatment works. (3) apply excess 
revenues collected from a class of 
users to the costs of operation and 
maintenance attributable to that class 
for the next year, and the rates shall 
be adjusted sccordingly.

Section 4: Toxic raiutants and 
Excessive Strength Charges Each 
user that diacharges any toxic 
pollutants which cause an inc'eaie in 
the cost of managing ttie effluent or 
the sludge of the treatment warks 
shall pay (or such increased costs For 
any user, when the BOD exceeds 300 
mg-1, or the suspended solids exceeds 
300 mg-1. or when other pollutant 
concentrations exceed the range ol 
concentrations of these pollutants In 
normal domestic sewage, a surcharge 
shall be added to the basic charge 
n iis surcharge shall be calculated by 
the fallowing formula-Cs- 
Bc(BI-)-Sc(SH-Pc(P) Vu (Based on 
Model No. 2. 40 CFR 35, Appendix B) 
Symbols and Definitions: Cs-
surcharse for wastewaters of ex­
cessive strength. Bc-O&M cost for 
treatment of a unit oi biochemical 
oxygen demand (BCD !, B- 
concentration of BOD from a u ^  
above a tose les’el. Sc-tl&M cost lor 
treatment of a unit of suspended solids 
(SS). and S-concentralionof^from a 
user atwve a base level. Pc-OotM cost 
for treatmi-nt of a unit of any 
pollutant. P-concentration of any 
pollutant from a user above a base 
level, and Vu-volume contribution 
from a user per unit of lime

Section 5: Notification: Each user 
shall be notified at least annually, in 
conjunction with the regclar bill, of t|» 
seww" use rate and the portion of the 
user charges which are attributable to 
wastewater treatment services Costs 
shall be broken dov n to show the 
operation and maintenance costs 
attributable to that user.

Section 6: Charges for Extraneous 
Flows: Ttie costs of operati<>n and 
maintenance (or all flows not directly 
attributable to us«?rs (such as in­
filtration-inflow) shall be d striated 
among users on the same basis as 
operilion and maintenance charges

Section 7: Records: A record 
keeping system shall be established 
and maintained by the City to 
document ctimpliancc with federal 
regulations pertaining to the user 
charge ordinance

.Set ium 8 Validity: all ordinances or

DRigidaire BRIgi^ireBFhgidairBRIgidairE D
I FRIGIDAIRE 100% - I  

IV i FR O ST-PR O O F
’ ' 'REFRIGERATOR-FREEZERg

I R i K  I •Reversible Doors 2
C i' | *1 7 C u .  Ft.

" * 2  Full Width Adjustable g) 
ShelvasiFixed Egg Storage £  

• Energy Saver Switch D
Sale

F cu rT H  $ C Q Q 9 5
Reg. 649.95 U J I J I
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i

Room Air 
Conditioners

ASK ABOUT OUR S YEAR 
WARRANTY

DISHWASHER
tr

MODEL 8561

REG. *240°<> plus in s t a l l a t io n

Now Only 22500
PLUS INSTALLATION

Paris Appliance Center
37 C larksv ille  785-7586

I RODGBK - WADE «
I  Manufacturing

Custom Cabinets ^
Counter Tops Stock Cabinets ^

Available Rnished Or Unfinished ^  
G>mplete Line Of Roper Appliances ^  

0̂  FREE ESTIMATES ^
Can Collect (214)785-1619 Or Come ★  

j  By Our Display Room At 1401 3rd S. W. ^

parts of ordinances in conflict 
herewith are hereby repealed. The 
invalidity of any section, clause, 
sentence or provision of this ordinance 
shall not affect the validity of any 
other part of this ordinance which can 
be given effect without such invalid 
part of parts. The user charge system 
shall take precedence over any terms 
or conditions of agreements or con­
tracts between the Qty of Depart and 
nay of the users which are inconsistent 
with applicable federal regualtions 
regarding user charge system.

Section 9: Billing: users will be 
billed on a monthly basis with 
payment due ten (10) days after the 
date of billing. Users on metered 
water service will be billed on the 
same notice as water charges aixl will 
be designated as separate entry Users 
of the wastewater system not on 
metered water service will be billed 
monthly or an individual notice for 
wastewater service at the rate 
esta'jlished by the City. Users with 
deliquent accounts at fifteen (15) days 
will be notified in writing by the City 
that water and or wastewater services 
will be temi mated unless the account 
is paid in full. The City will utilize its 
law enforcement divisionas required 
in the control and managemait of the 
user charge system.

Section 10: Ordinance in Force: an 
im m olate necessity existing for the 
preservation of the public peace, 
health and safety, AN EMERGENCY 
is herby declared to exist by reason of 
which this ordinance shall be in full 
force and effect from and after its 
passage, approval, and publication.

Pa^ed and adapted by the City 
Council of the City of Deport. Texas on 
the 13 day of April. 1961.

Charles Faster 
Mayor

FRAN (Polly) Yates An­
tiques, 318 So, Kaufman, 

Mt. Vernon, Texas. Fine 
A m e r i c a n  fu rn i tu r e ,  
jMnmitive to orate Victorian, 
china, pressed glass, 
orientals, many lovely 
things. Browsers welcome, 
coffee drinkers, also. Thurs., 
Fri., and Sat. and by ap­
pointment, any time. 214 537- 
4348. 4-30

FOR SALE—commercial 
buildings and lots in 

Bogata. Garrison Real 
Eastate. 632-4346 or 632-5307 
tfc

IF YOU LEFT a gold Pyrex 
bowl at Leona Holders 

when Mr. Holder died please 
call her, 632-5593, Bogata.

GARAGE SALE-Friday & 
Saturday May 1&2, 605 N. 

Main, Bogata, Mrs. Maxie 
Lewis and Mrs Bill Buck- 
man.

FOR SALE—1975 Plymouth 
2 door, very clean. 50,000 

miles, call 652-4833. MA tfc

FOR SALE—5 room house 
with bath, 75X150 lot, new 

carpet throughout, FHA 
approved. 379-3684, Talco. 
MA 5-7

CUSTOM SHREDDING and 
Bushhogging. Contact 

Thomas McDowra, 652-5713, 
Pattonville. MA 5-7

\  I
79 Impaig 4 Dr. Chev. Air & 
power, small V-8 305, EX-' 
TRA NICE car $3995.
I I
I I
78 Monark 4 Dr. Mer. Air St 
power, small 302 V-8, Middle 
size. EXTRA clean $3195
I II I
78 Malibu Classic Station 
Wagon, Air & power, small 
305 V-8, small size wagon. 
$2995.
! i
77 LTD II 4 Dr. Air & power, 
small 302 V-8, Mid size. 
$2195.
I I
I '
77 Malibu Classic 4Dr. Air & 
power, small 305 V-8. EX­
TRA clean. $2695.
20 More to choose from!!

! I
I NORRIS I 
j McDo w e l l  | 

j USED CARS j,'
I I
I 900 N. Main |
I Paris, Texas j
I I
I 784-7331 After Hours I
I------------------------- J

T.C .
G RAVES
CUSTOM 

FARM WORK
C o a s ta l G r a s s  

Setting
Plow ing

G ra in  Drilling

365-2229

Mini-Ads
FOR SALE—100 gal. Butane- 

propane tank on metal 
frame. Call 65?-4396 or G52- 
3036. MA 5-7

GALVANIZED HAY BARN 
for rent—200X80 feet, 

beginning June 1. Owner, 
Lena Marie Skeen, 3808 47th 
St., Lubbock, Texas 79413. 
Call (806) 795-1607. MA 5-7

FOR SALE—Lot on Lake of 
the Pines, 50X100, 214-632- 

5936, Bogata. MA 5-7

L I F E  I N S U R A N C E  — 
Woodmen of The World. 

Whole life-Term-Annuity. 
Frank Herring 652-6972.

G E R M A N I A  F A R M  
MUTUAL—Low cost in­

surance. Homes, rent 
houses, farm buildings and 
machinery. Frank Herring, 
652-6972. MA tfc

BEST WISHES to all of my 
friends for a happy, 

healthy, prosperous 1981. 
Frank Herring Insurance. 
MA tfc

A R C H E R ’ S H O U S E  
l e v e l i n g  and Foun­

dation Repair. Fix dragging 
doors. Work Guaranteed. 
Free estimates. Call 785-5829 
or 982-5422. MA tfc

C H A N N E L  C A T F I S H  
fingerlings, 3 to5 inches, 15 

cents. W.J. Stretcher, Mt. 
Vernon, Texas, 537-2371. tfc

L IF E  IN S U R A N C E :' Or­
dinary Life; Mortgage 

Protection; Term. Garrison 
Insurance Agency, Bogata; 
632-4346 or 632-5307. MA tfc

FOR SALE—1959 Ford 
Pickup, short, narrow bed. 

Good Condition. Runs good. 
652-4650 after 4 p.m. Dan 
Barnard. MA tfc

I DO CARPENTER work, 
plumbing, yard work, 

garden work, fence building, 
rem ove dead trees, 
ANYTHING. 632-5903. MA 
tfc

ROSALIE LODGE No. 527 
stated meetings on fourth 

'Riursday of each month at 
7:30 p.m. MA tfc

ROACH O IL CO.—now 
h a n d l in g  p lu m b in g ,  

e lectrica l and hardware 
supplies.Call652-4400. MAS- 
14

STANLEY HOME producU- 
complete line of household 

cleaners. Distributor, Rt. 1, 
Box 334, Clarksville, Tx. 632- 
4549 after 6 p.m. TFC

FOR SALE—20 acres of land 
two miles east and one 

mile south of Rosalie. Phone 
Deport 652-6211 or 652- 
5635.MA 5-8

FOUR Mobil home hook-ups 
271 Snack Shop, Talco. 379- 

5411. 4-30 MA

FOR SALE—8 ft. regulation 
size pool table and ac­

cessories, not slate top- in 
good shape. $300. Talco 379- 
4731. 4-30 MA

WANTED—Backhoe work, 
sand houling. Gary Moore, 

632-5344, Bogata. MA 6-18.

ED WILLIAMS, 632-5404 and 
Jim Bond, 632-4408, are 

buying house furniture and 
appliances or anything of 
value. MA tfc

ALL 'TYPES OF Mortgage 
Loans, Commercial and 

Residential, F irst and 
Second Mortgages. 214-379- 
5661. MA 3-19

W ILL DO painting or car­
penter & repair work, 652- 

9495, Sepfvt, Jessie Williams 
Church of God Pastor- 
Bogata. 4-30 MA

FOR SALE—hothouse and 
cold frame tomato, pepper 

and eggplant. Mrs. Walter 
Harper, S. Grayson Bogata. 
832-5930 4-30 MA

RED R IVER Insurance 
Agency, Homeowners, 

Fire and E.C., Livestock, 
Household Goods, Com­
p r e h e n s i v e  P e r s o n a l  
L iab ility . Frank Herring. 
652-6972. MA TFC

FOR SALE-two bedroom, 
one bath Fram house 2^ 

Acres, Garrison Real Estate. 
632^346 or 5307. MA 4-26

FOR SALE-New in dasli tape 
player. Plays both 8-track 

and cassette tapes. 652-3668. 
MA 4-23

FOR RENT—house on Circle 
Drive in Bogata. 652-3795. 

MA 5-14

W'OULD LIKE  TO work on 
dairy, ranch, or drive a 

small truck. 632-5831. MA 5- 
14

f o r  S L A E — Eskimo Spitzs 
puppies, $25. 632-5140, 

Bogata. MA 5-7

B E A U T IF Y  and protect 
your home. For Free 

Elstimates call Floyd Lee 
962-5437. Also tree trimming 
and lawn mowing. MA 5-14

D E T R O I T  M e a t  
Processing—Custom 

killing, processing, and 
wrapping. Also feed lot beef 
available. 674-6911 or 674- 
5712. MA tfc

FLO\'/ERS for all occasions.
Call Mrs. (iordon Allen, 

Representative. Clarksville 
Florist. MA tfc

SEE INEZ’S Beauty Shop for 
your Watkins Products, 

632-5139, Bogata. (MA 1-9)

IN TALCO, BOGATA and 
surrounding area—For' all 

your plumbing needs call 
Rose Enterprises, 379-4531, 
Talco. MA tfc

FOR SALE—house, 5 rooms, 
bath, fo be moved. 632- 

5160. ^ a t a  MA 5-14

SHOP SLA’TON Furniture 
for furniture, appliances, 

carpet, vinyl floor coverings. 
Quality at Money-Savings 
Prices! MA tfc

BOBBIE’S BAKE SHOP— 
Can furnish the best in 

wedding, birthday or an­
niversary cakes, pies, baked 
fresh. Call 652-3803. 4-2

GARDEN WORK-Custom 
discing, flat breaking, 

bedding and shredding. 632- 
5369 or 632-5032. MA tfc

FOR SALE—1973, Olds-88, 
air, power, good condition, 

$800.00. 632-5466, Bogata. 
MA 5-7

M A R Y  K A Y — Beau ty  
Consultant to full your 

beauty and skin needs. Free 
Facials. Contact Laura 
Wright 652-2412. MA 4-30

PA IN T IN G ----- 20 years
experience, by hour or 

contract. Roland Burson, 
632-4546, Bogata. MA 2-26

FE E D E R  & STOCKER 
Heifers & Steers. Brah­

man-Cross replacement 
heifers. Norris Ballard, 
Paris, Tx. 214-785-0192, 
after 9 p.m. MA tfc

CALL MRS. BEN W ARREN 
for all your flower needs. 

Robinius Greenhouse, 652- 
2211. MA tfc

FOR SALE—15 acres Pine 
Branch Community...$800 

per acre. 785-8855. B. Moore. 
MA 5-14

FOR SALE—house on corner 
of (Church and Kelsey Sts. 

Deport. Mrs. Lucille McGill. 
652-4905. MA 5-14

LIKE  A G(X)D Neighbor, 
State Farm is there. For 

car, home, life and health 
insurance ca ll: Harold
Sheppard, 401 E. Main, 
C larksville. 427-5614 after 
5:00, 427-3923. MA 9t

W O R K  W A N T E D —boy
scouts to do odd jobs to 

help build up tnx^. Call 632- 
4434. 4-30 MA

FOR RENT—hay bam and 
lot in Deport. Call 652-3795 

4-30 MA

FOR SALE—six week old 
pigs and rabbits of all 

sizes. One mile south of 
Deport. 652-2782. 4-30 MA

FOR SALE—1 Coldspot 
Refrigarator $175,1 Tapan 

gas range $125, 1 portable 
sewing mach. case $15. 632- 
4344. 4-30 MA

ELECTRICAL SERVIC E- 
24 hour call, residential 

repair & remodeling. Tom 
Sisson, 632-4434. 5-21

RABBITS-f<w sale. High­
way 37 S. Last house 

bef(H^ crossing Sulphur. 632- 
4422. 4-30 MA

FOR SALE—Kodak EK6, 
I n s t a n t  C a m e r a ,  

Automatic Flash, like new, 
130. James Wood-632-5061. 4- 
30 MA
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Signs Of Love 
To Perform

The Signs of Love Choir, 
which sings and gives sign 
language at the same time, 
w ill be featured at the 
regular meeting of the Red 
R iver Valley Deaf and 
Hearing Association Friday, 
May 1, at Paris Junior 
College. The public is invited 
to the program scheduled for 
6:00 p.m. in the Recital Hall 
of PJC’s Center for the 
Musical Arts.

“ Those interested in 
programs for the deaf or 
hard of hearing, in sign 
language or music, will find 
the program educatior»al and 
entertaining,”  said Harold 
B. Norris of Blossom, 
president of the association.

Tlie choir, which has a 
memberhsip of ten, is from 
Christ for Nations Cdlege in 
Dallas, anon- 
denominational institution. 
No charge will be made for 
the program.

FHA Members To Attend State Meet

T R A C K  T E A M — the
Talco-Bogata team are 
first row, left to right; S. 
Burson, L. Armstrong, .M. 
Savage, L. McGee, T. 
Hale, K. Anshutz, A.

Hood. S. Early, second 
row, W. Clark. A, 
Stockton. S. Taylor. N. 
Smith. K. Jones, C. 
Belcher, K. Walker, K. 
Lederer; third row, M.

Brooks, T. Gibson, J. 
McColn, T. Howerton, S. 
Baker, D. Damron, J. 
Smith, B. Brooks; fourth 
row, T. Duffer, D. Moore, 
D. Sessums, R. Burns, K.

Anderson, C. Woods, J. 
Gray. J. Ward, fifth row, 
M. Foxworthy, P. Hanes, 
J. Hnaks, K. White, V. 
Cannon and T. Mitchell. 
(Staff Photo)

Talco Locals
Mrs. Gladys Garretson 

returned home Saturday 
after spending the week in 
Winfield with Mr. and Mrs. 
Raymond Houston and in Mt. 
Vernon with Mr. and Mrs. 
Chester Garretson.
Mr. and Mrs. Gerry Gieger, 

Andy, Brad and Sharon of 
Everman visited during the 
weekend with his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. James Geiger. 
Mrs. Mary Kelley and Mrs. 

Georgia Eastel 
Mrs. Mary Kelley and Mrs. 

Georgia Easterling have 
returned home after visiting 
their children, Mr. and Mrs. 
Ray Kelley and family in 
Plano.
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Turner, 

Lori and Lance of Garland 
were Easter weekend guests 
in the home of his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Fred Turner. 
Also Gary Neill and Mr. and 
Mrs. Rickey Cross of Dallas 
were here for the day on 
Sunday and visited with Mr. 
and Mrs. Carlie Peters and 
family.
Mrs. Wayman Alexander 

and Mrs. Terry Barnett and 
Gavin attended the 
Fellowship District WMA 
meeting at the Bethel 
Baptist Church in Pittsburg 
Thursday.
Mrs. Brenda Barnard and 

baby of Granbury ac­
companied by her grand­
mother, Mrs. Bert Lewis of 
Mt. Pleasant visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Jack Mill Sunday af­
ternoon
Mr. and Mrs. Bobby 

Thornton of Lakewood, Calif. 
Mrs. Betty Jones and 
granddaughter, April of 
Norwalk, Calif. Mrs. Mary

Ruth Sikm^ky of Dallas and 
Mr. and Mrs. Jesse Smith 
and Alexandria of Longview 
have returned to their homes 
after visiting teir parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. J.J. Smith. 
Mr. and Mrs. Bobby Brown 

of Clarksville visited Mrs. 
Brown’s grandmother, Mrs. 
Sidney Frugia Friday.
The Rev. and Mrs. Terry 

Barnett accompnaied Rev. 
Lloyd Cashion, Rev. Mike 
Gauntt and Mrs. Bob White 
of Mt. Pleasant to Biloxi, 
Miss, where they attended 
the National Baptist 
Missionary ASssociaim of 
America which convened 
there Monday through 
Wednesday.
Mr. and Mrs. Jim Jones, 

Cathy and Timmy in 
Houston over the weekend to 
help their daughter and 
family move here.

Mr. and Ms. Wayman 
Alexander, accompanied by 
her mother, Mrs. Gladys 
Garretson and Mr. and Mrs. 
Chester Garretson of Mt. 
Vernon were in Mineola 
Saturday to visit Mr. and 
Mrs. Don Mewb<xm and Lea 
and Shelly and to help Lea 
celebrate her 4th birthday.
Mr. and Mrs. George 

Burleson and Mr. and Ms. Al 
Cargile of Grand Prairie 
were here during the 
weekend to be with their 
mother, Mrs. R.L. Clark who 
suffered a heart attack 
Friday night and was taken 
by ambulance to the Titus 
County Memorial Hospital in 
Mt. Pleasant. Mrs. Cargil 
remained for the week.

Mrs. John Northam has 
returned home after a two 
week visit with her daughter, 
Mrs. Lou Rce Stuart of 
Grannis, Ark.
Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Welch 

and children, Russ and Rob 
of Ft. Wo'^th visited their 
uncle and wife, Mr. and Mrs. 
W.E. Welch f Friday.
Mrs. Vivian Westbrook 

joined Mrs. Diann West and 
children of Ashdown, Ark. 
Mr. and Mrs. Leon Shoffner 
of Jefferson and Mr. and 
Mrs, W ilford Lowry of 
Blossom at the home of her 
sister, Mrs. Alma Lowry in

Bogata Sunday for a family 
get-together.
Tuesday dinner guests in 

the home of Mrs. Gladys 
Garretson were her sisters- 
in-law, Mrs. Lona Mae 
Garretson and Mrs. Ethel 
Crooks, her nieces, Mrs. 
Billie Jo Grant and grand­
daughter, Jill, and Mrs. 
Murle Brazir and Mrs. 
Brazie’s sister-in-law Mrs. 
Reese Brazir all of Avery. 
Jamie Swarts is visiting her 

grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Lenton Roach of Mt. Plasant 
tis week.
Mr. and Ms. Gerald Foshee

of Bethan, Ok. spent from 
Sunday until Tuesday iwth 
Mrs. Foshee’s grandparents, 
Mr. and Mrs. W.E. Welch.

John Collins, a representive 
of TANE was guest sneaker 
at the Calvary Baptist 
Church in Talco Sunday 
morning.
Weekend guestsinthe home 

of Mrs. Lucy McCiung and 
Mrs. Nadine Caldwell were 
Mrs. Irene Johnson and 
graddaughter Shura of 
Dallas and Mrs. Cladwell’s 
grandson, Chad Dodd of 
Garland.

Footprints From 
The Past

By John W. Hood
Over the weekend I ate a 

hamburger and drank a coke, 
and got to back when I was 
small and my brother and 
myself would be given a 
quarter by my Dad and we 
would go to town on Satur­
day. That quarter each of us 
had would buy us a coke and 
hamburger, and then we 
would go to the picture show 
to see if our hero had sur­
vived the week.

The hero was always left in 
some spot where it did not 
oeem he would possibly

return alive, but somehow he 
always did.

The hamburgers we got 
were cooked on a grill with 
lots of grease on it so that the 
burger would be good and 
juicy. They had mustard, 
onions and pickles and the 
meat and bun. They only cost 
a nickle, the coke a nickle, 
and that left us with 15 cents 
to spend on the show. That 
was also five cents, so we 
still could go to the grocery 
store and look o\-er the candy 
or we could buy us a ice 
cream cone.

S p rin g  TMiic 
fo r W in ter-W eary  

C ars!
BELDEN 50-FT. 
OUTDOOR 
EXTENSION CORD
#GL1 or #777032 
Includes FR E E  
\M-ap-a-Cord.
9 9 7
FREEI
WRAP-A-CORD
When you buy a 
Belden 50 Fl. 
heavy duty exten­
sion cord. Holds 
100 Ft. of cord.
A *3 25 value!

GO-JO CLOUT 
HEAVY-DUTY 
HAND CLEANER
Fortified with lanolin 
to help soften hands. 
Dispenser pump, 
l 6 o z . (# l l 7 1 )

SALE 1.99
LESS 1.00 R»b«t*

from Cio-Jo

Now I* the time to get your car’s 
cooling system ready for hot sum­
mer weather. Summer is hard on 
belts, hoses, thermostats and 
radiator caps. Be sure your car 
is ready for summer driving by 
replacing worn-out parts writh 
quality Gates products.

Green Light
Exclusivel
RADIAL TIRE GAUGE
Compact, registers to 80 
PSI, handy clip fastener.

Helps check tire pressure 
— for better mileage,

longer tire life and safety!
only

4 9 *
When you buy any other 

Gates product.

T-PAC PICKUP CARRY-ALL TOTE
Light but sturdy. Hauls guns, tools, 
and more! Pigskin-grained vinyl, 
reinforced grom­
mets; black. 4  J k  9 9  
(#JHJ-1900-0)

OCT»l 
SACK F lion  
o o  JO w m n  

TOUWJT
cLOon

Available at most locations.

STOP 
GAS THEFTS 

WITH SUPERIOR 
GAS LOCKT«

Hides inside filler pipe of most cars 
and light trucks. Use with regular gas 

cap; 5-tumbler lock. # 's 55-4561-71-81
for unleaded 0 8 8  
systems only

Prices good through May 16.

AUTO SAVER BATTERY SPECIAL
Sizes to fit most American cars and 
light trucks. Low antimony plate 
construction. 40-Month limited 
warranty (prorated adjustment after 
90 days, full details at your store).
Model #322, #324, #325, #372,
#374 only. 40-AAonth, low maintenance

3 8 95
with exchange

The Auto Saver

GLASS AUTO PARTS
Hwy. 271N, Bogata

Representatives of the 
Rivercrest Junior and Senior 
Chapters of Future 
Homemakers of America 
will be attending the 1981 
state meeting of the Texas 
Association of Future 
Homemakers of America 
along with over 7,000 
members and advisors from 
across the state. “ Putting It 
All Together”  is the tlieme of 
the meeting which will be 
held at the Convention 
Center, San Antonio, April 
30-May 1.

Attending from Rivercrest 
will be Staci Parrish,Stacy 
Spencer, Kelli Holmes, Pam 
Ward, l^ilani Barnett, and 
Sabre’ Burson. They will be 
accompanied by the advisors 
Anita Stubblefield, Bonnye 
Gage and Mr. Gage.

Speakers will include Dr. 
Robert Lindberg, University 
of Texas at San Antmio, who 
will focus on the family, and 
Brian Hall from Texas Tech 
who will send FHA’ers home 
with a new outlook on the 
future.

The business of the Texas 
Association will be con­
ducted at the House of 
Delegates session Thursday 
evening, followed by a talent 
show. A state choir com­

posed of 130 Future Installation of the 1961-82 
Homemakers will perform state officers will climax the 
during the meeting. Friday evening session.

Sponsored By 
Bogota Funeral Home 

Grandchild Of The Week

*

Tina & Robert Bailey
I Children of Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie Bailey of 

Irving. Grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. C. M. Wright of Deport and
Mrs. Ella Hensley of Irving.

I Great Grandmother is Mrs. Clara Murris 
of Bogota.

About two dollars is what a 
burger costs now, not 
counting anything to drink! 
And to my mind they aren’t 
as good anyway.

My brother back in the old 
days couldn’t eat as fast as I 
could, when I had finished 
my burger and coke I would 
beg Jack for some of his. He 
would share with me! He’s 
still a great brother, but I 
don’t get his hamburger 
anymore, as I don’t eat near 
as fast as I did back then.

As kids we shared a lot of 
things. I always tried to lay 
the things off on him that 
wo-e going to get me in 
trouble. That didn’t always 
work.

Of course, when I give 
things consideration, I don’t 
suppose that hamburger, 
brothers, or shows were any 
better than they are now, but 
they sure seemed to be. 
Perhaps those were the best 
days of our lives because 
they were the easiest.

Clinic Set 
In Bogata

The Texas Department of 
Health, Public Health 
Region 7 office announced 
plans today for the con­
tinuation of a series of 
monthly immunizat ion 
clinics for all children 
needing immunizations.

The clinic will be con­
ducted at the Bogata City 
Hall, on May 14, from 2:00- 
4:00 p.m. Future clinic dates 
will be announced.

The Health Department 
emphasizes that this clinic is 
available to all children, 
preschool and school age, 
beginning at two months of 
age. Immunizations to be 
offered include Mumps, 
Measles, Rubella, Oral 
Polio, Diptheria-Tetanus- 
Pertussis (D P T )  and 
Tetanus-diptheria (Td). All 
children must be ac­
companied by a parent or 
legal guardian. Parents are 
.reminded to bring the child’s 
immunization record if it is 
available.

The Tetanus-diptheria 
(Td )  vaccine is also 
available to adults.

Thin Skin
Although Earth’s crust is 

about 23 miles thick in plac­
es, it makes up only about 
one percent o f the planet’s 
volume, the National Geo­
graphic Society says. I f  the 
Earth were an apple, the 
fruit’s skin would equal the 
thickness o f  the crust.

THE CANTERBURY 
5M0PPE

F o u n d e r ’s  D a y  S a le
Thursday - Friday - Saturday

Suits & Sport C o a ts ..................25%  ott
Pant - Belts
Dress S h ir ts ................................20%  off

Clotl|ter» 

2 2 0  ^ o r i i f  ^ e f f e r e m t  

p U a B j m t ,  t H e x x e  

2 1 4 - 5 7 2 - 5 7 0 0 J * m g

H U D O U S T O N  G R O C E R Y
N. Main Specials Good - Thors., Fri., Sat. Bogoto
OPEN 7 a.m. - 7 p.nn. 632-5624

We Welcome Food Storrip Shoppers

HAPPY BUCK $100.00

TOWELS
Brawny 

Lg. Roll 69
COFFEE

Folger's 
I Lb. Can 
All Grinds

$919

CANNED DRIN KS A ll Flavors Hot 6 Pock 79
PEPSI, PEPSI LIGHT,
DIET PEPSI, & MOUNTAIN DEW

2 Liter 89
MILK

Borden's 
G a l. Jug

$209

BREAD
Wonder Country Style47

BREAD
Mrs. Baird's Sto-Fresh57
POTATOES

20 Lb. Bog

$329

BISC U ITS
Parade & Am erican Mode2/39*

CORN
Del Monte Whole Kernel 

8*/« oa. Can4/M
EVAPORATED M ILK Carnation 13 oz. Can 4 9 <

PRESSED HAM Hormel Lb. 3 9

PEACH SLICES Del Monte 29 oz. Can 75
FLOUR

Glodiola

All Purpose H Self Rising

5 Lb. Bog

999

CATSUP
Del Monte 32 oz.89* RO US

Wonder 

Brown N Serve

SAUSAGE
Carl's 

2 Lb. Roll 
Hot or Mild

$ 2 5 * W999


