
Thirty-Ninth Year Talco, Titus County, Texas Thursday, February 22, 1979____________ 15‘ Per Copy Number 4

Rebelettes To Meet Springhill In Bi-District Tilt
After a practice game at 

6:30 p.m. tonight, Thursday, 
Feb. 22 at Pittsburg, the 
Rivercrest Rebelettes will go 
to Quitman on Tuesday, Feb. 
27 to play Springhill for the 
Bi-District Championship. 
Game time is 7:00 p.m. and 
admission is $1.50 for adults 
and $1 for students.

The Rebelettes are win­
ners of District 20 A and 
Springhill is the winner of 
District 19A. The winner of 
the Bi-District contest will 
advance to the Regional 
Tournament to be held in 
Huntsville on March 2-3.

The Rebelettes duplicated 
their 55-42 Thursday night 
win over Avinger with a 60-54 
win over North Hopkins 
Monday night in the 
Rivercrest Gym.

The North Hopkins team, 
coached by R ivercrest 
graduate Bruce Knowles, 
gave the Rebelettes a run for 
their money, with the 
Rebelettes setting foul 

* records rather than scoring 
records. A total of 29 fouls 
were made in the game by 
the Rebelettes, with team 
leader Scotti Wood fouling 
three times in the first 
quarter.

Although no one fouled out, 
Annette Harris, Marilyn

Mills, Judy Via, Wood and 
Donna Hines had four fouls

€fA

ANNETTE HARRIS was 
high scorer for the 
Rebelettes Monday night 
against North Hopkins 
with 16 points to her 
credit. Miss Harris is just 
one of an entire squad of

each. Tina Vickers and 
Margaret Hines had three 
fouls each.

talented girls who will 
compete for Bi-District 
basketball honors in 
Quitman Tuesday night 
against Springhill. (Staff 
Photo)

Stew Slipper Scheduled
.The Bogata Area Chamber 

. of Commerce will have a 
’  stew supper Thursday, 

March 15 beginning at 6:30 
p.m. Original starting time 
was changed in order to 
avoid conflict with First 
Baptist Church Reviva l 
Services.

The menu will consist of 
homemade stew by Wendell 
Hervey and his staff. It will 
be held at the elementary

Outstanding Citizen Ballot

My Choice For 1978 Bogota 
Citizen Of The Year Is________

My Choice Should Be Outstanding 
Citizen Because________________

f

Total Eclipse W ill 

O ccur Feb. 26

school cafeteria in Bogata. 
Homemade corn bread, pie 
and tea and coffee will also 
be served.

The price will be “ A Buck 
A Bowl” . Tickets are on sale 
at d ifferent locations in 
Bogata.

People are urged to get 
their tickets as early as 
possible so the cooks will 
know how much to prepare.

Texans should not look 
directly at the sun February 
26, according to the Texas 
Society to Prevent Blind­
ness. Although Texans will 
notice no visible difference 
in the day’s brightness, a 
total solar eclipse will occur 
in a path from the Pacific 
Ocean crossing the nor­
thwestern United States. The 
eclipse will occur partially in 
virtually all the rest of the 
continental United States.

The solar eclipse will begin 
in Houston a t9 :ll a m. as the 
moon first touches the sun’s 
upper right corner. The 
moon will hide 57.8 percent 
of the solar disk at 10:23 a.m. 
when the eclipse reaches its 
mid-point. The eastward 
moving moon will slowly pull 
away from the sun after mid­
eclipse At 11:41 a m., the 
dark new moon will leave the 
sun’s upper left comer.

P r e v e n t  B lin d n ess  
re c o m m e n d s  in d ir e c t  
watching as the only safe 
way to view the solar eclipse 
The simplest indirect way is 
the “ pinhole”  method. Take 
two pieces of white card­
board, make a small hole in 
one, and with the sun at the 
back, focus the eclipse 
through the pinhole onto the 
secon(l board. The size of the 
image can be changed by 
altering the distance bet­
ween the cardboards. One 
may use the binoculars or a 
telescope as the projector, 
replacing the pinhole card­
board. With the sunlight at 
his back, a person should 
position the instrument over 
his shoulder with the 
eyepiece down so that the 
light passing through it 
focuses on the white card­
board.

Using either method, the 
circle of light on the card­
board will show the sun 
being slowly obscured by the 
moon as it passes between 
the earth and the sun. Never 
look at the eclipse through 
the pinhole or through the 
binoculars or gelescope. 
Photographers should also 
remember not to look at the 
sun through their camera 
viewfinder.

IVIph. Smith Ho8te 

Mary Martha ClanK
Mrs. Rosemary Swinford 

brought a devotional from 
Psalms 23 when the Mary 
Martha Class of the First 
Baptist Sunday School met 
Tuesday night with Mrs. 
H.W. Smith. Mrs. Willie 
Clark conducted the business 
session. Mrs. Altus Denny 
led the opening prayer.

A motion was made to 
conduct cottage prayer 
meeting in March for the 
revival which will be from 
March 11 to the 17.

Refreshments were served 
by the hostess 'The next 
meeting will be in March 
with Mrs. Johnny Topping.

Following the last total 
eclipse seen in the U.S., 145 
cases of eye injury were 
reported in a Prevent 
Blindness survey, 121 of 
them eclipse bums. Sixty 
percent of the casualties had 
looked at the sun directly 
with the naked eye. The 
rem ainder had tried to 
protect their eyes with 
various devices-sunglasses, 
totally exposed photographic 
negatives, smoked glass and 
welder’s goggles.

Prevent Blindness is the 
only voluntary health agency 
solely concerned with 
p r e v e n t in g  b lin d n ess  
through community service 
programs, public and 
professional education and 
research.

Stained Glass 

Course Sehedtiled 
At PJC

An organizational meeting 
to discuss a stained glass 
course is scheduled for 
March 8 at Paris Junior 
College, announced June 
Jones, director of continuing 
education at PJC. Mary Ann 
Schooler of Sawyer, 
Oklahoma, will teach the 
course, to begin March 29, 
but persons interested 
should attend the 
organizational meeting and 
order supplies. Reservations 
for the meeting should be 
made by calling the PJC 
Continuing Education Office, 
785-7661, extension 145.

In the course Ms. Schooler 
will teach participants the 
craftsmanship of stained 
glass and leading and copper 
fo iling techniques of 
assembling. Students will 
complete specific projects 
such as windows, 
terrariums, jewelry boxes or 
candle holders.

Fee for the 30-hour course 
will be fifty dollars and the 
supplies for course projects 
will cost about fifty dollars. 
Gasses will be from 6:30 to 
9:30 p.m., Thursdays for ten 
weeks, but the organi­
zational meetings on 
Thursday, March 8 will be at 
7:00 p.m. in the Natural 
Sciences Center 109.

Mms. Schooler, an ab­
stract artist who paints and 
does sculpture, has lived in 
Japan and stuclied Japanese 
art forms. In the course, 
participants will learn about 
'Tiffany lampshades, church 
windows and other stained 
glass works. Students will 
gather scrap glass, learn 
basic techniques and 
complete a color project in 
the course.

Samples of Mrs. Schoolers 
stain glass work will be on 
display in the exhibit cases 
of the McLemore Student 
Center March 1 through 8.

For furhter information 
call the Continuing 
Education Office, 785-7661, 
extension 145.

Annette Harris made six 
steals and 16 points, with 
Marilyn Mills good for nine 
points. Judy Via made eight 
points, 10 defensive rebounds 
and two steals for an out­
standing performance for 
the Rebelettes.

Thursday’s 55-42 game 
was a confidence builder for 
the Rebelettes, with Avinger 
rated the number three 
school in the state in Class B.

“ The Rebelettes played 
the best ball they have 
played all year”  Coach 
Frank Stubblefield said. “ I 
expected to play Avinger a 
good game and hold the 
score close to not be 
drummed out of the 
ballgame, but we did a lot 
better than that.”

Rebelette Scotti Wood was 
hitting a high percentage of 
her shots early in the game.

CLOSING IN on the ball, 
in the possession of North 
Hopkins piayers are 
Janet Webb and Mariiyn 
Miiis. At right is Tina 
Vickers. The Rebeiettes, 
who got into foui troubie 
eariy in the game, wili 
hopefuiiy have soived 
some of their foui 
probiems before the Bi- 
District game Tuesday, 
Feb. 27 at Quitman 
against Springhiii. (Staff 
Photo)

FHA Entertains
Rivercrest FHA members 

gave a party for residents of 
Red River Haven Nursing 
Home on Valentine’s Day. A 
program of popular and 
religious songs was 
presented by Staci Brooks, 
'Tresa Couch, Traci Jones, 
Helen Ridge, Mary Lynn 
Vaughan, Laura Vaughan, 
Tammy Strain, and Sandra 
Spencer. Sharon Em brey 
served as Mistress of 
Ceremonies and closed the 
program with a reading 
Mrs. Gordon Allen was ac­
companist for some of the 
songs.

Refreshments of red 
punch, frosted heart shaped 
cookies and candy mints 
were served in the dining 
room and also carried to the 
room of residents who did 
not attend the program. 
Other members helping with 
the party were: Dusty 
Damron, Marla Martin, 
Lessa Martin, Vicki Horn, 
Kathy Cabell, Lori Gordon, 
Rose Davis, Charla 
McKinney, Debbie Ward, 
Belva Ward, Susan Stanley, 
Trade Jeffery, and Frei(la 
Hall.

and the Rebelettes took a 
quick 20-5 lead by the end of 
the first quarter. The 
Rebelette one on one defense 
seemed to confuse 
Avinger,but it also put 
Rivercrest in foul trouble 
early. Wood finally fouled 
out early in the fourth 
quarter, but she had already 
put 20 points on the board.

Also in third quarter foul 
trouble were Annette Harris 
and Robyn Reeder. Sarah 
Scales substitued for Harris 
and Reeder to score eight 
points and to take the foul 
pressure off.

“ Judy Via played the best 
defensive game of her life,”  
Stubblefield said, ’ ’and made 
10 points offensively. Via 
made seven defensive

rebounds, f iv e  o ffensive 
rebounds, five steal and four 
tie balls.

“ E very kid contributed 
something positive to the 
ball gam e,”  Stubblefield 
said. A v in ger’s Jo Ann 
Mathes and Montgomery, 
the strong shooters for tte 
team, made 16 and 13 points 
respectively.

Junior High Tourney Starts Today
The district junior high 

tournament will begin today, 
Thursday, Feb. 22 at 
Prairiland High School with 
four area girls teams and 
four boys teams competing.

The top four teams in each 
division are competing in the 
tournament, which will 
begin at 4:30 p.m. today. 
Brackets showing the

competition are printed on 
another page in this 
newspaper.

In the girls division. 
Blossom will meet Avery at 
4:30 p.m. today, and Deport 
will meet Detroit at 7:00 p.m. 
Thursday. Final games to 
determine the winners will 
be held at 4:30 p.m. Monday 
and 7:00 p.m Monday.

In the boys division, 
Blossom will meet Talco at 
5:45 p.m. ’Thursday, and 
Avery will meet Detroit at 
8:15 p.m. First place game 
will te  at 8:15 Monday and 
third place game will be at 
5:45 Monday.

Admission to the tour­
nament will be $.50 for 
students and $1.00 for adults.

B ee f P roduction  Short 

Course Set A t R ivercrest
A Beef Production short 

course for adult farmers will 
be held March 12-15 under 
the sponsorship of the 
R ivercrest High School 
V oca tion a l A g r icu ltu re  
Department according to 
Mr. Talm adge Morgan, 
Superintendent.

Dr. Richard C. Thomas, 
Beef Production Specialist 
with the Vocational 
Agriculture Division of the 
Texas Education Agency 
and the Department of 
Animal Science at Texas 
A&M University, will be the

Talco VFD
To EHect 
Officers

'The Talco Volunteer Fire 
Department met Monday 
night at the G ty Hall to elect 
the remainder of the officers 
for the department. Those 
elected wCTe: Jim Carrol, 
secretary; E lvin  Hines, 
Assistant secretary; Johnny 
and David Birchfield, 
maintenance men; Johnny 
Deaton, reporter.

The fire department has 
purchased a second self- 
contained breathing ap­
paratus from donated funds.

Officials announced that 
the fire whistle will blow at 
fifteen to seven next Monday 
night to signal their meeting 
at 7:(K) sharp.

Dr. Richard C. Thomas

instructor for the course. He 
is headquartered at Texas 
A&M Univeristy.

Dr. Thomas has a strong 
background in animal 
production and genetics. He 
received his B.S. and M.S. 
Degrees from Texas A&M 
University and his Ph.D. 
degree from Iowa State 
University

For seven years Dr. 
'ITiomas was in charge of 
Beef Cattle Research at the 
Experim ent Station in 
M cGregor. His respon­
sibilities there included the 
direction of record keeping 
and management of an 850- 
cow herd that was bred 
totally by A.I. and of a 500- 
head feedlot. This entailed

direct supervision of the

nutrition, health, and 
reproduction programs 
employed there.

The short course at 
Rivercrest is scheduled to 
begin Monday, March 12 at 
7:30 p.m. in the Vocational 
Agriculture Building. Other 
meetings in the series of four 
w ill be held Tuesday, 
through Thursday. During 
the dates the short course is 
in progress. Dr. Thomas will 
be available to assist cat­
tlemen with individual 
problems and to provide on- 
the-farm instruction.

Cattlemen and other in­
terested individuals in­
terested in attending the 
short course should call or 
write the superintendent of 
schools or a teacher of 
vocational agriculture at 632- 
5989. An entry fee of five 
dollars will be charged.

Horton Graduates
Phyllis Ann Horton 

received her bachelor of arts 
degree in English and 
Spanish from the University 
of Texas at Arlington, 
January 13, 1979.

She is the daughter of 
Raymond Melton of Bogata 
and Mrs. Frances Peppier of 
Monument, N.M.

Mrs. Horton is presently 
employed at John A. Havlir 
and Associates and plans to 
pursue a teaching career.

Freak Accident Re8ult8 In Minor Injuries
Mrs. Madene Potts 

received minor injuries in a 
freak accident in downtown 
Talco Saturday afternoon at 
approximately 1:15 p.m.

H igh w ay P a tro lm an  
Frank Munsinger reported 
that Chester potts had 
parked his car on the south 
side of Broad Street in front 
of B&B Furniture and left 
Mrs. Potts seated in the car 
while he went into the store. 
'Die car started rolling and in 
her effort to stop the vehicle, 
Mrs. Potts hit the gas instead 
of the brakes, causing the 
( » r  to go up on the curb, 
nicking the right back of a 
parked 1972 Chevrolet

pickup owned by Mrs. 
M ildred B irchfield and 
sideswiping a 1977 El 
Camino owned by Wallace 
Handley and hit the electric 
light pole in front of the Town 
Shop. The pickup received 
minor damage, while the

1977 El Camino and 1%2 
Ford belonging to Potts )vere 
heavily damaged.

A pedestrian, Douglas 
Parker, was knocked to the 
sidewalk by the impact. He 
received a skinned knee and 
a bruise to his arm.

(E h r S ia lm  (L h iirs
t S P S  H2Z9

PuM libed  Every ThurM lay 
P.O. Box 157, Tako . Texas 754a7

Entered A s Second t iass Matter At the P«Ht O ffke  at Ikport. Texas 7543S 
R ehertH . H rig h t  .
Pat H H Kht
Mrs. W aym aa Alexander

M R S T R IP T IO N
IS.to A  Year l o r  Titns, FraniiUn, Red R iver, and l.,amar < ountlei 
17.M Out Of Govnty. Overseas. IK  5d.

O E A D U N E
lo r  News And AdverUstng ToeMlay At Noon

Pabllsh rr 
Editor 

T a k a  News Editor

FREAK ACCIDENT-----
A pedestrian was slightly 
injured when this Ford 
went out of control in 
Talco last week. Three 
vehicles were damaged In 
the accident. (S ta ff 
Photo)

City Officials 

To Be Elected 
In Talco

The dection of City of­
ficials for the City of Talco 
will be held on Saturday, 
April 7, 1979. 'The terms of 
Mayor Joe B. Morse, 
Councilman Leo Roberts and 
Ckxincilman Ellis Brown are 
expiring.

Candidates who wish to 
have their names placed on 
the ballot for the election of 
Mayor or G>uncilman may 
do so by signing and filing an 
application at the City Hall 
by 5:00 p.m. March 7, 1979.
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SHUGART COUPONg Crumpler-Stanley Vows Exchanged
Mon. Feb. 26

Dean Ward Gro.
Bogota, Texas
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V8 X 10 for
GROUPS

Anita Beth Grumpier 
became the bride of Kenneth 
Dale Stanley Saturday, Feb. 
17 at 5;00 p.m. in the 
Westlake Church of God in 
Westlake, La. Parents of the 
couple are Mr. and Mrs. 
Dulin Grumpier of Westlake 
and Mr. and Mrs. Carlton 
Stanley of Bogota. Vows 
were heard by F.C. Thomp­
son.

When escorted to the altar, 
which was flanked by two 
baskets of gladiola, by her 
father, the bride wore a 
wedding dress of quiana with 
long sleeves of embroidered 
lace with pearls and a chapel 
train. A finger tip veil 
trimmed with the same lace 
completed her dress. The 
attendants, matron of honor, 
Donna Calverts, sister of the

Classified Ads Bring Results

0 {//?  l/K E -A /E IV  C A R S / 
77 Ford LTD 78 Ford

2 Door, Air G)nd. Bronco
Power Steering, Radio Air Cond., Auto Trans

ONE OWNER
7,000 Miles 

ONE OWNER
Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth Dale Stanley

bride wore a blouson blouse 
with long pleated skirt of 
rust, and the bridesmaids, 
Susan Stanley sister of the 
groom and Janise Grumpier, 
sister in law of the bride, and 
Cindy Parsons wore blouson 
blouses and long pleated 
skirts in champaign beige. 
Bart Hilliard of Mt. Vernon 
was best man, Larry Denny, 
uncie of the groom, Randy 
Grumpier, brother of the 
bride and Dsle Hieronyous 
were groomsmen. Andy 
Hawkins, cousin of the bride 
was ring bearer. Mervin 
Grumpier brother of the 
bride presented organ 
selections before the 
ceremony and the traditional 
Wedding March, “ There Is 
L ove”  was sung by 
the vocalist.

A reception was held at the 
bride’s home following the 
ceremony. A three tiered 
wedding cake was served 
with punch from the bride’s 
table, and chocolate cake 
and coffee from the groom’s 
table to approximately fifty 
guests.

The groom ’s parents 
hosted a dinner at Paw 
Paw’s Seafood and Steak 
House Friday night after the 
rehearsal.

Attending the ceremony 
were the groom’s parents 
and grandparents Mr. and 
Mrs. Denny and Larry, 
Susan Stanley and Mrs. Glen 
White. From Houston were 
I.E. Lee and Mr. and Mrs. 
I.E. Lee Jr.

REBELETTE
Cheerleaders are Lisa

Barger, Stacl Brooks, 
Trade Jones, Carla Mills

and Connie Brown. (Staff 
Photo)

SBA Continues Drought Disaster Assistance
The US. Small Business 

Administration today issued 
suggestions to aid Texas 
farmers and ranchers who 
play to apply for SBA’s 
Physical D isaster Loan 
Program.

“ Agricultural producers 
who had losses on 1978 crops 
because of the extrem e 
drought conditions which 
have plagued much of the 
state may be eligible for a 
low-interest loan,”  said

77 Ford LTD 77 Mercury
2 Door, Air Cond., Marquis

Auto Inn s. 4 Dr. Air Cond
Power Steerinu p„, 5,,

ONE OWNIR ONE OWNER

Candlelight Ceremony Unites Newman^ Waters

Lincoln- Mercury-Ford
Where No One Walks Away 

NO REASONABLE OFFER REFUSED 
Ferguson Rood 572-3486

Mt. Pleasant

Miss Janie Kay Newman 
and Kelly Ross Waters were 
united in a formal can­
dlelight ceremony at 7:30 
p.m. February 9, 1979 at the 
Decatur Ave. Baptist 
Church, Ft. Worth, Tx.

The bride is the daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Donald 
Newman of Ft. Wraith and 
the granddaughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Omie Hanks of 
Talco.

The groom is the son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Howard Waters of 
Ft. Worth.

The Rev. George 
Thomasson heard the couple 
pledge their double ring 
vows before the altar

Wise home energy management
M P S  you J||[

decorated with white can­
delabra, arrangements of 
palm leaves and a white 
archway intertwined with 
greenery and red miniature 
chrysanthemums.

For the wedding music 
Jackie Newman sang “ The 
Twelfth of Never” and (3erry 
Edwards played “ Nadia’s 
'Theme’.

'The bride was escorted to 
the altar by her father and 
was given in marriage by 
her parents.

For her wedding she wore 
a traditional white organza 
organza gown with a Queen 
Anne neckline, fitted tx^ice, 
empire waistline and skirt 
that fell into a chapel length 
train of solid Chantilly lace. 
She carried a bouquet of 
white roses with r ^  car­
nations and baby’s breath.

Miss Becky Loinox was

maid of honor. Bridesmaids 
were Miss Debbie Hall and 
Miss Jackie Newman, sister 
of the bride, all of Ft. Worth. 
The attendants wwe iden­
tical gowns of red velvet and 
carried bouquets of red 
carnations, white pom poms 
and baby’s breath.

Tam m y Wright of Ft. 
Worth, the flower girl, also 
wore a gown of red velvet 
and scattered red tissue 
hearts from a white basket 
trimmed with red and white 
carnations.

Donnie Wilmont served as 
best man. Groomsmen were 
Scotty and Phil Waters, 
brothers of the groom, all of 
Ft. Worth

The ring bearer, Marty 
Newman, brother of the 
bride, carried a heart shaped 
pillow of red satin overlaid 
with white lace.

Ushers were Wayne 
Henderson and Dan Telesko, 
both of Ft. Worth.

Presiding at the guest 
register table were Miss 
Debbie Frazier and Miss 
Thelma Lipper of Ft. Worth.

The bride’s parents were 
hosts to a reception honoring 
the newlywed couple im­
m ediately follow ing the 
ceremony. Guests were 
greeted in the fellowship hall 
of the church by the wedding 
party.

The bride is a 1978 
graduate of Diamond Hill- 
Jarvis High School and is 
now employed at World 
Service L ife  Insurance 
Company.

The groom is attending 
Tarrant County Junior 
(College and is employed at 
Lennox Industries, Inc.

After a short trip to Padre 
Island the couple is making 
their home in Richland Hills.

Mr. and Mrs. Howard 
Waters were hosts for a 
dinner in the banquet roomof 
the Bonanza Steak House on 
"niursday night following the 
wedding rehearsal.

Alicia Chacon, SBA Regional 
Director. “ Loan applications 
must be completed and 
returned to SBA before the 
March 6 deadline.”

Copies of tax records and 
legal documents such as 
deeds, leases and mortgages 
must be included in the 
application. A cash flow 
projection for the 1979 crop 
year is also necessary.

If the applicant is a part­
nership, each partner must 
submit a personal financial 
statement and tax return in 
addition to the partnership 
financial statement and 
return. In the case of a 
corporation, a personal 
financial statement must be 
submitted for each officer or 
director and for anyone 
owning twenty percent or 
more of the voting stock.

SBA disaster loans cover 
only the amount of the actual 
loss in yield as certified by 
ASCS. A producer may not 
borrow more than the 
amount of his losses, and 
SBA loans cannot duplicate 
other disaster or deficiency 
payments.

'The Small Business Ad­
ministration accepts ASCS 
figures on established 
normal yield for program 
crops. On other crops, SBA 
w ill accept the county 
average from the Statistical 
Reporting Service or another 
agricultural unit. Harvested 
yield is subtracted from the 
established normal yield to 
determine the actual loss, 
which then is certified by 
ASCS.

SBA disaster loan ap­
plications may be filed at 
SBA’s district office, IKK)

Comm erce, Room 3C36 
Dallas, telephone 214-749- 
2706, or at SBA’s branch 
office, 100 South Washington 
Street, Marshall, telephone 
214-935-5257. Applications 
must be received by March 
6, 1979.

Historical Film

Series Planned

Mrs. Kelly Ross Waters

Thousands of home owners each winter do not keep what 
they pay for. They let valuable home heat escape through 
uninsulated walls and ceilings, unsealed cracks, and 
unprotected windows. If you are one of these homeowners you 
are actually paying for this lost home heat. So doesn’t it make 
sense to safeguard your valuable energy dollars? Insulate 
ceilings, walls, and floors. Install storm windows. Seal cracks 
with weatherstripping and caulking. Close off unused rooms. 
And make sure fireplace dampers are tightly shut when not in 
use. Any of these steps can help stop wasteful heat loss, and 
allow you to get more for your energy dollar. Call us today for 
more energy management tips.

CnMMBNITY PUBIIC SERVICE
Your Elecfric Lighf &■ Pcwpr Company

Historical Society 
To Meet Feb. 27

T h e  C y p r e s s  
B asin  H is to r ic a l  and 
Genealogical Society w ill 
meet Tuesday, February 27 
at 7:00 p.m. at the Guaranty 
Bond Bank in Mount 
Pleasant, as a temporary 
location.

Lacy Davis of Pittsburg, 
Texas will speak on “ Using 
Photography in Genealogy” . 
This program will be of 
interest to anyone resear­
ching their family’s history.

Members of the Society 
wish to extend a cordial 
invitation to anyone in­
terested in genealogy to 
attend this meeting. Anyone 
needing additional in­
formation should contact 
Mrs. Linda Stansell at 214- 
572-9346 or Mrs. Jane Davis 
at 214-856-2693 or write The 
Cypress Basin Historical and 
G^ealogical Society, P  O. 
Box 403, Mount Pleasant, Tx.
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At PJC
A series of historic films 

will be presented during 
March and April at Paris 
Junior College, announced 
John Stuart, social sciences 
instructor at PJC. 'The films 
will be open to the public, 
and no admission will be 
charged.

Sponsored by the PJC 
Divisions of Social Sciences 
and Continuing Education, 
the films will be presented at 
3 and 7 p.m. in the Mike 
Rheudasil Learing Center at 
the college.

To begin the series, 
“ Goodbye Billy: America 
Goes to War, 1917-18”  will be 
presented on Thursday, and 
Friday, March 1 and 2. The 
Friday presentation will be 
at 3 p.m. only, Stuart ex­
plained. The film concerns 
the United States’ par­
ticipation in World War I at 
home aftd'on (he battle fronts 
using authentic war films set 
to vintage sounds: music, 
poetry and sound effects.

Also scheduled in March is 
“ L ife in the Thirties,”  a 
popular history of the 1930’s 
covering the Depression, the 
election of President 
Franklin Roosevelt

WE HAVE
BULK GARDEN SEED 

SEED POTATOES 
GARDEN FERTILIZER

JOE FORD GROCERY
Sp«ials Good Fridoy & Saturday, February 23 & 24

G.A.'$ Auto and Mobile Home Soles

ANNOUNCES
n a s l i u a . I. HOMES

Now With 
TEN YEARS

At V/2%
10% Down Payment Required

Up To 
Financing

Cenerol Electric Oedit
See G.A. or Jackie For A Good Buy On A New Mobile Home

G-A-'s Auto and ^bN e  Home Sales
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First 
Federal 
Savings 
& Loan

"Get 'Em 
Rebeleffes"

Clarksville 427-3855

Lone Star 

Gas Co.
We Supporf 

The

Rebeleffes
427-2986

Clarksville

Red River Joe Ford
Haven

GroceryNursing
Home Puf If In

"Go Rebeleffes,
The Bag Girls

G o" 632-5323

632-5756
Bogota

Bryson Inez's
Insurance Beauty Shop
Agency Curl 'Em

All The Up, Girls

Way

Rebeleffes
Bogota

632-5139
632-5711

129'/i N. Main Bogota

Bogota 271

Funeral Conoco

Home "Win, Girls,

We Are Win"

Rebeleffe Fans 632-5224

632-5614 Bogota

414 N. Main Bogato

Bogota Gas 
and

Appliance
"Blow 'Em Up, 

Rebeleffes"

632-5934 Bogota

Skaggs 
Wrecker 

Service & 
Gir Parts
Tow 'Em In, 

Rebeleffes
632-5878

Embrey's
Meat

Processing
Cut 'Em Up, 

Rebeleffes

632-5079

Bogota

•  4

Bell's
Beauty
Shop

Bmll i  Nancy

Trim 'Em 

Info Shape, 
Girls

Glass

Auto Parts

Fix 'Em, 
Girls,

Fix 'Em

632-5763

Jean's
Johntown
Grocery

Fighf For If, 

Girls

Johntown 632-5302

Bogota 
Paint & 

Body Shop
"Painf 'Em 

Ouf, Girls"

632-4182

Western
Auto
We

Supporf The 

Rebeleffes 

100%

632-4427 Bogato

REBELETTES who will 
participate in the Ri- 
District game Feb. 27 in 
Q u itm a n  a g a in s t  
Springhill are Manager

JoAnn S tu b b le fie ld , 
Margaret Hines, Bessie 
Knight, Manager Stacey 
Em brey, Janet Webb,

Scotti Wood, Annette 
Harris, Sarah Scales, 
Donna Hines, Coach Billie 
P irtle , Coach Frank

Stubblefield, Judy Via, 
Una Vickers, Margaret 
Mills, and Robyn Reeder. 
(Staff Photo)

BEAT
SPRINGHILL

TUESDAY, 7 P.M. 
At Quitman 

Gmgratulations For

Winning District 20A

Talco Kisner's
State Grocery

Bank Win,

Lock 'Em Up, Rebeleffes,

Girls All The Way

AA^rnKAr F R  1 ^ Leonard Kisner

188 S. AAain

Talco 632 5732

Buckmon's Pat's
Drug Store Place

Inc.
"Give 'Em Their 
Medicine, Girls"

Show 'Em 
Some Fashion,

Rebeleffes
AAr. & Mrs.

Bill Buckman R.Ph. 

AAorris Foster R.Ph.
Kenneth Jeffery

125 N. Main 632-5811 Main St. Bogota

Talco Kwik
Super Komer

Market "Go After

Slice 'Em 'Em, Girls"

Up Girls

379-4722

Talco
632-5032

Hwy 271 Bogota

S.E. Dodd Bogota
Grocery Cleaners
"Show 'Em, Give 'Em

Girls" A  Cleaning

Joe Griffith

Johntown

Ray's
Pipe Supply 

Co.

Jones
&

Bonham
Red Wing Shoe

You Can Do If, Headquarters

Win, Girls, 
WinRebeleffes

Talco

Richord
Garrison Talco
Farmer's Well

Insurance Group
Go Gef Service

'Em, Girls Drill 'Em,

Rebeleffes

Bogota Tolco

1

House Wood's
Of Laundry

Flowers
1

(Formerly 

Webster Laurxjry)

Plan! 'Em, 

Rebeleffes
Give 'Em

New Arrivals A  Scrubbing,

Silk Flowers Rebeleffes

632-5623

Bogota Bogota

Bryson's Razor's
Budding & Edge

Farm Supply Beauty Shop
"Shake Their 
%

Oione Williams

Raffers,
Rebeleffes"

'Go, Girls, G o"

Mr. and Mrs. H.E Bryson
Bogota

N. Main St.

Bogota
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WANT ADS
TURNEi CMIAUn CUSTOM MULT HOMES

HomM Compl«t«ly Finith«<I.Bullt And Movnd 
To Your Lot. BulH By Your Plont Or Our*. Wo 
Usudly Hovo Homo* That Aro Alroody BulH 
And Roody To Go At All Timos. In Butinoss 
For 20 Yoors.

IM 30 At FM Caddo Mlllt, nMM:2l4-<27-3528

We Make 
Our Own

Rhea's 
Hot Links

Wholesale & Retail 
Hot Links & Chili

200 E. First 
Mt. Pleasant, Tex. 

572 3444

nice weekend.

OFFICE SUPPLIES-----All
types of supplies, printing 

and furniture. We are in 
Bogota every Tuesday to 
help with your needs. Jack 
Firmin, Office Equipment, 
405 N. Jefferson, Mt. 
Pleasant, Tex., 472-9871. tfc

INCOME TAX  SERVICE 
Frank Mowery, East 

Fairview St. FM Rd. 194, 
Blossom. Office open 8:30 
a.m .-5:30 p.m. Monday- 
Saturday. Phone 982-5573. 
tfc

GAUZE

COTTON AAATERIAL 
Double & Single 
KNITS

LUCY'S FABRIC
Cunningham 652-5003'^'^^^O*

FRANKLIN COUNTY
Livestock Commission 

McxJern Facilities 
LIVESTOCK SALE Every Thursday 

Horse Auction Sole Friday Nights
Covered Pen Space Competent Handlers

Jim Roter, Ring Mon J.R. Sims, Owner

Sale Born 588-2262 Residence 860-2429

S. Side Interstate 30 Mt. Vernon

OIS SWAIM  

REAL ESTATE
Talco 379-5771 

Bogota 632-5626

IN BOGATA
Clarksville St.

2 Bedroom-Den-1 Bath 
Carport Nice Location 

Close To Town 
Chain Link Fence 
Around Bock Yard 

‘ 12,000

IN BOGATA
Second St. S.W.

2 Bedroom 1 Both Frame 
Closed In Bock Porch 

Lot 73x226
Garden Place In Bock 

‘ 8,000

IN ROSALIE
2 Bedroom 1 Both Frame 

On About 9Vi Acres 
Pecan Trees 

Woter-Electricify-Phone 

‘16,000

BUILDING FOR LEASE— 
—New 6,000 sq. ft. steel 

building, clear span 20 ft. 
walls, three 12 ft. by 16 ft. 
overhead doors, heavy three- 
phase electricity. Paneled 
office on 1 acre, 3 miles north 
of Mount Pleasant on FM 
1402. 572-8742 or 572-1395, tfc

ASSEMBLERS
WANTED

8 X 35
Twilight Bungalow

Fifth W hatM tts than one year old. 
Furnished with Air 
OeluKe thru out.

Call 214^572 S4SI Days

Establishod Factory Has 

Opunings

In Suvural Areos. 

Fringe Benefits. 

Apply Personnel Office

Congoleum Corp. 
Kinder Division

NURSES
WANTED

RNs And LVNs
Woofod By

Franklin County 
Hospital

For ICU^CCU Sp « to l And 
General Core Area

300 N. Houston M t. Varnon
A n  Equd OpporlunHy Emp iq y r

AM Shifts Avaiiobie 
CONTACT

Richard D. Arnold
FronkHn County HotpHol

P O  Box 477 
Mt. Vernon. Texot 75457 

Phone (214) 537-4552

Obituaries
Elmer J. Gamer

Elmer J. (Buddy) Gamer 
of Carlsbad, N.M. died 
February 1 in a Carlsbad 
hospital. Funeral services 
were at West Funeral Home 
Chapel in Carlsbad at 4 p.m. 
February 3. Graveside 
services were held on 
February 5 at Date 
Cemetery with Shawnee 
Masonic Lodge No. 107 of­
ficiating.

Mr. Garner was born 
March 15, 1916 at Cuthand, 
the son of W.A. and Belle 
Gamer. He married Lucille 
Armstrong in Bogata on 
March 20, 1937.

Survivors are his wife 
Lucille; one daughter, 
Patricia of Carlsbad; one 
son, Michael of Midland; two 
brothers and two sista*s of 
Dale, Ok.; several nieces 
and nephews and a host of 
friends.

He had lived in Carlsbad 
for 30 years where he owned 
and operated the New 
Mexico Salt Co. until his 
retirement in 1971.

Attending the services 
from this area were Mr. and 
Mrs Alias Denny, Mrs. June 
Stanley and Mrs. Karen 
Hailey of Bogata, Mrs. Sarah 
Williams and Mrs. Martha 
Goyd of Mount Pleasant, 
Mrs. Glenda Brasher of 
Pittsburg and Mrs, Hattie 
Seals of Paris.

Monard Preston of Tulia; 
Ted Preston of Fairfield; 
Wayne Preston of Aber­
nathy; Dale Preston of 
Houston; and Dan Preston of 
Raton, N.M. One son. 
Garland Preston, preceded 
her in death in 1976.

Hall Riddle

Herman Hunt
Herman Hunt, a former 

Bogata resident died 
Tuesday night in Oklahoma 
City. Services were held 
Thursday, Feb. 15 in 
Oklahoma City with burial 
there.

Albert Lincoln (H a ll) 
Riddle, 72, of the Wilkinson 
community east of Talco, 
died at 9a m. Friday in Titus 
County Memorial Hospital, 
Mt. Pleasant. He was a 
member of a pioneer Titus 
County family.

Services were at 2:30 p.m. 
Sunday at Bates-Cooper- 
Weems Funeral Home 
Chapel in Mount Pleasant 
with burial in B ridge ’s 
Chapel CemetCTy. Dr. Galen 
Riddle of Marshall and the 
Rev. Garnet Walker of 
Mount Pleasant officiated.

Herman Hunt was born in 
Bogata the son of Bill and 
Zelma Thornton Hunt. 
Survivors are his widow, one 
daughter, a brother and a 
sister and his mother, Mrs. 
Zdma Herman of California. 
He was a nephew of Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe Thornton of Rugby 
and Mrs. Hattie Mae Seals of 
Paris.

Mrs. Onelia PresUm
Mrs. Garland (Louise) 

Preston of Blossom was in 
'Tulia, Tx., Saturday, Feb. 
17, to attend the funeral of 
her mother-in-law, Mrs. 
E W (Onelia) Preston, who 
died February 15.

She is survived by her 
husband, and five sons.

Carl Mathis
Carl Mathis, 79, died at 

Berrien Center, Michigan, 
Feb. 12 after a long illness. 
Funeral services were held 
Thursday Feb. 15 at Boyd 
Funeral Home in 
Bridgeman, Mich, with 
burial in Grant Cemetery in 
Bainbridge, Mich.

Carl Mathis was born Sept. 
23, 1899 in Texas and 
married the former Nellie 
Buster Aug. 6, 1941. He is 
survived by his widow.

Attending the funeral w&re 
a sister-in-law, Mrs. J.N. Lee 
and Mr I>ee and a brother- 
in-law A lfred Buster of 
Dallas. Another sister-in 
law, Mr. and Mrs. Edgar 
Rodgers were unable to 
attend

Riddle was born April 24, 
1906, in Titus County, a son of 
CTiarlie and Cora (Black) 
Riddle.

He is survived by his 
widow, the former Olive 
Buchanan; a sister, Mrs. 
Winnie Bragg of Wilkinson; 
two brothers, Harry Patrick 
Riddle of Mount Pleasant 
and John Riddle of 
Wilkinson, and a number of 
nieces and nephews.

CARD OF THANKS 
Words can’t express our 
thanks and appreciation for 
your every act of kindness 
and thoughtfulness in the 
loss of our loved one. Bless 
you. 'The Family of Morris 
(Si) Adams

PEST CONTROL

H You Have Ho u m  
Spraying No«d« For 

Tormlla* And RocKho*, 
W * Ar# In Tha Sproying 

RutinoM
CHARLES ARMSTRONG 

Lloonaod, Bondod CarUflod 
Bojglii^^Taim 633-S925
FOR SALE-----Maple a-

piece dining room suite. 
Call 632 5394, Bogata. 2-22

Tim e
For

Spring

Planting

• Pansies
• Bedding Plants
• African Violets
• Roses

• Fruit Trees
• Nut Trees
• Crepe Myrtles
• Sprays • Peat Moss

• Fertilizers
Potting Soils For 

House Plants And Seed Starting
Open B-4 Mon. Thru Sot. 572-4007: Sundoyt, 5724477

4'/* MMot From Mt. PtooMwH Off Monticollo Rood

Buddy Parker 

O ffers For Sole
TWELVE MILES OUT, 10 acres of good sandy land, 

few trees, nice tliree bedroom, one bath frame, carport, 
Clarksville telephone line, owners anxious to sell.

EDGE OF TOWN. 53.54 acres on .South I.ake 
Highway, highway frontage, two pools, good for pasture, 
farm or development. Priced to sell. Good terms.

62 ACRE BLOCKS, could all be farmed, black land. 
Priced to sell.

ALMOST FOUR ACRES OF GOOD SANOV land, 
located about 10 miles North of Clarksville on Highway 37. 
Igood building site, priced to sell.

90 ACRES Northeast of Clarksville in the limestone 
country, all open with a few pecan trees and good pools. 
Fenced and cross fenced. Priced to sell with low. low down 
payment and good terms.

E04iE OF TOWN, 4‘'i acres of land with extra nice 
three bedroom, two bath brick, separate den and living 
room, on FM Road 'n  mile out of town, two barns, good 
little pasture, immediate possession.

THREE BEDROOM BRICK HOME. Casa Linda 
Addition, central heat and air. woodburning fireplace, good 
garden spot, community water. Priced to sell with extra 
good financing.

HOi:SE ON ONE ACRE, three bedroom, one bath, 
rural water, extra nice, Cuthand Community, South of 
Clarksville, priced to sell.

NEW LISTING-250 Acres Black Land Farm, 5 miles 
from town, all in cultivation, priced to sell. Good terms.

Almost 10 Acres black land with two bedroom frame 
home with barn and corral approximately one mile 
southeast of town. Immediate position, easy term large 
assumable loan.

Buddy Parker 
Real Estate

Day Phones
427-3673

Wood Burning 
Fireplace

Balcony
14 X 80

1- ' h -
1 : '■

L ____J " - '' : □ ,  n L  I

L J'' •' ’ aid

2  " 0
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★  Frost-Free Refrigerator

★  Garden Tub
★  Wet Bar

★  Large Kitchen Pantry

★  Storage Area Under Kitchen

★  9 ’/a Ft. Living Room Ceiling

★  ★ Wood Burning Fireplace
(Free Cord Of Firewood)

2 Mt. Pleasant
S’ 1803 W. Ferguson 
E  572-7901

9 o m 8 p.m Mondov Soturdoy
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MINI ADS - MORE FOR YOUR MONEY I

MINI ADS
M ARY KAY Beauty Con­

sultant, to fill all your 
beauty and skin needs. Free 
facials. CaU 652-6171. M A tfc

C H A R L IN E ’S CUSTOM 
D RAPES, bedspreads. 

F ree estimates, 427-5412, 
Garksville, or Regan Bell, 
632-5885, Bogata, after 5 p.m. 
MA tfc

MRS. GLEN WHITTEN is a 
representative for A House 

of Flowers, Clarksville. Call 
632-5613 for your F lora l 
Needs. MA tfc

FOR SALE-----registered
Beefmaster bull, 4 cows, 2 

big calves. Contact Dan 
Barnard 652-4650. MA 2-15 

CaU after 4 p.m.

INCOME TAX RETURNS 
p r e p a re d . R ic h a rd  

Garrison, 632-4346 or 632- 
5307, Bogata. MA 1-25

LOW COST term insurance, 
credit life. Cash for burial 

tax deductible retirement 
programs. Frank Herring. 
652-6972. MA tfc

FOR SALE-----2 bedroom
house in Bogata on Second 

S.W. 652-5873, 652-4400. MA 
tfc

FOR SALE-----1977 Chev. %
ton Van, loaded. Insulated, 

paneled, carpet. CaU 632-4455 
or 652-6110. MA 3-1

FOR RENT-----1 bedroom
house, furnished. CaU 632- 

5719 after 5 p.m., Bogata. 
MA 3-8

LAVADA HOME REPAIR— 
— plumbing and home 

repair, handyman, odd jobs, 
7 days a week. William 
Stockton. MA 5-10

PASTURE for lease, 130 
acres, most good creek 

bottom pasture, most can be 
cut for hay. 652-4590. MA 3-8

B&B is your garden 
headquarters for Pw ry- 

Morse Seeds. We also have 
Bees Wax. Talco and 
Bogata. MA 2-22

FOR SALE-----Beauty shop
hair dryer attached to 

chair and bedroom suit with 
mattress. 379-3063. MA 2-22

FLOWERS-----Mrs, Pearl
W hitsell is now a 

representative for A House 
of Flowers in Garksville. 
CaU 652-4938. MA tfc

FOR SALE-----in Blossom,
80x150 comer lot, Moore 

Street. $2,350. Call 652-5308 or 
817-277-7033. MA tfc

FOR SALE-----Lot 50x150 Ft.
in Deport, $500. CaU 652- 

5308 or 817-277-7033. MA tfc

TALCO SELF-SERV has it 
all~Drinks, oil, small toys, 

special home service 
products, milk, bread. MA 3- 
1 _____________________
F O R  S A L E ----- 2-1949

C h e v r o l e t  4 - d o o r  
“ Classics” . One runs. ’These 
are priced to sell now. 632- 
4455 or 652-6110. MA 3-1

FOR SALE-----Dry wood,
$25 rick, delivered. 652- 

3131. MA 3-1
WANTED——Sewing and

alterations in my home. 
632-5975, Bogata, after 6 p.m. 
MA 3-15

W ILL BABY SIT during the 
day in my home in 

Blossom. Judy Holland, 982- 
5448. MA 3-8

YUCHI CLOVER for sale, 
cleaned, tested, $.45 lb. 

CaU 652-5823 or 652-4205. MA 
11-2
C L E M E N T ’ S C A R P E T  

Cleaning Service, hot 
water extraction, work 
unconditionally guaranteed. 
Tommy Clement, 632-5552 or
m2-5931. MA tfc_________
FOR SALE-----1964 Chevy

pickup. 632-4126, Bogata. 
MA 3-8

HOUSE L E V E L IN G —  
Foundation repair, fix  

dragging doors, work 
guaranteed. Free estimates. 
785-5829 or 982-5422. MA tfc

FLOWERS for all occasions.
CaU Mrs. Gordon Allen, 

Representative, Clarksville 
Florist. MA tfc

FOR INSU RANCE on 
homes, auto, life  and 

com m ercial, see Richard 
Garrison, 632-4346, Bogata 
Hwy. 271. MA 1-25

271 SNACK SHOP, Talco.
Open seven days a week. 

Lunches, hot links, Mexican 
food, orders to go. 379-5411. 
MA tfc ___________________

FOR INCOME TAX returns, 
call 632-5238, Bogata. 

Evenings and weekends. 
MA tfc

FOR SALE-----Used butane
range, 632-5408 after 5:00 

or 632-5934, Bogata. MA 3-1

FOR SALE -----1974 Ford
Torino station wagon. 

Good condition. CaU 652-6051. 
MA 2-22

REW ARD 
dog.

Small brown 
black markings.

missing since February 15 
from yard. 632-4109, Bogata. 
MA 3-8

FOR SALE-----6 foot drag-
type bush hot, $200. A two- 

disc breaking plow, $150. 
632-5584 or 5139, Bogata. MA 
3-8

F O R  S A L E ------1973
Chevrolet Impala 4-door, 

good condition, low mileage. 
632-5847. MA 3-8

FO R SALE-----1969 Road
Runner, 383 motor, racing 

parts, $300 firm. 379-7422, 
Talco or 632-4421, Bogata. 
MA 3-15

FOR SALE -----1971 LTD
Ford, good condition. Like 

new route mailbox. Jack 
Guest, 652-2383. MA tfc

LOW COST home insurance.
(^rm ania Farm Mutual 

Aid Assoc. Frank Herring, 
652-6972. MA tfc

CAFE FO R S A LE -----
Deport, Texas, profitable 

small business. CaU Frank 
Herring, 652-2511 or 652-6972. 
MA tfc

(X)LDSPOT Refrigerator, 
excellent condition. Priced 

to sell. B&B Talco Store. 379- 
3441, Jack Winn. MA 3-1

CUNNING H AM  Auction, 
Saturday, Trade Day, 

Auction Saturday night. 
Deport Warehouse, contents 
for sale. Joe Ladd. MA 3-1

L IN D S E Y  C O M P L E T E  
M obile Home Service, 

underpinning, leveling, cool 
ceiling. Free estimates. 18 
years experience. 214-379- 
5411. MA tfc

HOMEWORKERS needed. wAM Tirn____c
SEE BRYSON’S Building Earn easy spare-time W A N T E I^ ^ m e o n e  to

Supply for gardening income stuffing envelopes. 
supplies, all types bedding Write: Mailhouse, P.O. Box c Saturday and
__________ I __ 1__ 1__ n no ___ _ ^ .. . _ Sundav. Fphniarv 5A nnHplants and rose bushes. 2-22 68403-T6, Portland Orefion ^^^''uary 24 and 25

97268. 3-8 ’ -̂22
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You Will Be Delightfully Surprised At Our 
Styles, PRICES and Personalized SERVICE.
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D e p u t y  Grand Matron Visits Talco O.E.S
Deputy Grand Matron, to preside. Mrs. Merritt onDeputy Grand Matron, 

Hjrs. Sybil M erritt of 
Texarkana made her official 

1 visit to Talco O.E.S. Chapter 
they met Tuesday, 

peb. 13. She was ac­
companied by Mrs. Adcock, 
also of Texarkana. Mrs.

I Adcock protemed the station 
0 ':ster.

[W o rth y  Matron, Jone 
laemmons and associated 
jpatron, James G ieger, 
[presided.

During the business 
Isession, it was reported that 

Worthy Patron, Sidney 
[prugia entered McCuistion 
lospital in Paris Tuesday to 

jergo eye surgery. Three 
embers in the nursing 
Ines were reported ill, 

Irs. Emma Lee and Mrs. 
[ in n ie  S te p h e n s o n ,  

I'esidents of the Golden 
('ears Lodge and Mrs. Zela 
Peugeot, resident in Red 
tiver Haven Nursing Home 
I Bogata. Mrs. Neugent was 

Drted to be doing fine. 
The honored guest was 

Bcorted to the West and 
Iroduced and then 
sented in the East where 

te was welcomed by the 
forthy Matron and invited

to preside. Mrs. Merritt gave 
the Wwthy Grand Matron’s 
greetings and answered 
questions on the work of the 
Order. She complimented 
the Chapter’ s work and 
graciously thanked the 
C op ter for presenting her 
with a money corsage.

The Altar was draped in 
m em ory of two Grand 
Chapter officers who had 
passed away since last 
meeting.

Three birthdays were 
observed, that of Bobbie 
Giddens, Ivy  Smith and

James Gieger. They wa-e 
each presented a gift from 
their secret pals.

After Chapter closed in 
regular form, refreshments 
were served from a red and 
white Valentine covered 
table and centered with an 
arrangement of multi­
colored spring flowers. 
Hostesses were Mrs. Mary 
Sloan and Florence 
Richardson.

Next meeting night, March 
13 will be Friendship Night, 
so everyone bring a friend.

FHA Delivers Val-O-Grams
Cupid shot his arrow in 

many directions at River- 
crest High School on 
Valentine’s Day as FHA 
members carried out a 
project of selling carnations 
and Val-A-Grams. Orders 
for carnations were taken 
the week before and the 
flowers were delivered 
during the day at the period 
requested.

Val-A-Gram messages 
were taken at Cupid’s 
Comer-set up in the hall-

before school, at noon and 
between classes. Students 
could w rite their own 
messages or choose 
prepared valentine rhymes. 
These were typed on 
telegram  blanks and 
delivered at the end of each 
class period. A total of 240 
Val-A-Grams and 200 car­
nations were sold. Students 
had lots of fun during the day 
and the Rivercrest FHA 
chapters made a profit of 
$ 100.

iLCO GIRLS on the 
linior high school 
ksketball team this year 
re Nelda Anderson,

Kristi Foxworthy and Jill 
Hanks on the first row, 
K elly  Baker, Kelli 
Hollmes, Staci Parish and

Carolyn Forsyth on the 
second row. Coach John 
Gable. Tessa Morgan, 
Patti Stansell, Lisa 
Thompson and Jackie Via 
on the third row. (Staff 
Photo)

Haven
Personals
Mr. and Mrs. J.V. Baird of 

Annona were here Sunday to 
see her mother, Rena 
Tucker.

Mr. and Mrs. Buck 
Ramsey of Ft. Worth visited 
Mrs. Kate Dugger and other 
relatives last weekend.

Mrs. Bobby Martin of 
Talco visited Mrs. Ida 
Thomas and Mr. Coy 
Goddfrey Saturday.

Mrs. William Copeland of 
Mt. Pleasant, Mr. and Mrs. 
R.W. WIsinger of Talco, and 
Mrs. Jane Davis were 
Sunday guests of Mrs. Zela 
Neugent. Monday visitors of 
Mrs. Neugent were Mrs. 
Clara Stewart and Mrs. Jella 
Aldridge.

Mr. and Mrs. Lewis 
Clement of Pattonville and 
Mrs. L.D. Lewis of Lone Star 
were recent guests of Mrs. 
Betty Williams. Mrs. Lesa 
Clarkson of Detroit visited 
her grandmother 'Tuesday 
morning.

Dalton Sprinkle (rf Paris 
visited his cousin, Mrs. Zela 
Neugent Monday at the Red 
River Haven nursing home.

V isiting Mrs. M argaret 
Garmon all the way from 
Tampa, Flordia was Mrs. 
Mary L. Whitley and her 
sister from Bogata, Mrs. 
Alice Byrd.

“ B illy  Swain and the 
(Xitlaw Blues Band’ ’ en­
tertained residents of Red 
River Haven on Satuday 
night, February 10. Several 
members of the country and 
western band belong to the 
New Hope Baptist Church, a 
Paris church whose 
congregation visited Red 
R iver Haven before 
Christmas. A large crowd 
turned out to enjoy the music 
and songs.

Residents received a 
special treat on Valentine’s 
Day when members of the 
R ivercrest Chapter of 
Future Homemakers of 
America sponsored a party 
at the nursing home. 
Refreshments of punch and 
heart-shaped cookies made 
by the girls were served and 
a program of songs was 
presented. A special thanks 
goes to all who were in­
volved.

SCHOOL

SANDRA DUNN, Laura 
Vaughan, Ray Whitney, 
Robert White and Joey 
W illiam s were recent 
Rivercrest High School 
contestants in the Red 
River County Soil and 
W ater Conservation  
D istrict’ s 1979 Texas 
Conservation Awards

Essay Contest. Each 
student wrote an essay up 
to 300 words on the sul^ 
Ject “ Conservation  
D istricts ’ Role in 
Tom orrow ’s W ater.”  
H onorab le Mention 
C e r t i f i c a t e s  w e r e  
presented to Laura

Melinda Brooks Feted
A bridal shower was held 

in honor of Melinda Brooks, 
bride-elect of Rickey Rector 
on Thursday, February 15 
from 7 to 9 p.m. in the 
CcHnmunity Room at the 
Talco State Bank.

Miss Brooks is the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Ha*shall Brooks and the 
prospective groom is the son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Marvin 
Rector.

Hostesses for the courtesy 
were Mmes. J.C. 
M c G o n a g i l l ,  J a m e s  
Hearron, Lynn Carroll, Pat 
Stephens, Gerald Martin, 
A.L. Sikes, Ernest Carroll 
and D.F. Dixon.

They presented the 
honoree with a blue and 
white corsage of carnations 
Both mothers were also 
presented a blue and white 
c a r n a t i o n  c o r s a g e .  
Hostesses gift was a bed­
spread and matching 
<)rapes

Shower guests were 
registered by Mrs. James 
Hearron at a table which 
held a burning candle in a 
blue ceram ic vase, the 
bride ’s book and white

ACCO FEEDS

S U P E R IO R *Q U A L IT V  
P A Y M A S T E R ^ O F  THE IN D U S T R Y

ACCO Paymaster 
Range Feeds

At

Id is c o u n t  p r ic e s
20% Grow-More Cubes 
21% Breeder Cubes
14% Thriftmaster 

Creep Pellets
15% Range Meal

(Pasture Supplement)

20% Gro-More Cubes 
Natural Protein

38% Protein Blocks

SREEN ACRiS, Inc.
Doug Downing 
572-8641

704 N. Woihington 
Mt. Ploosont, Toxos

TALCO BOYS on the 
junior high school 
basketball team this year 
are Shan Wilkins, Guy 
Franks, Dwayne Wilson 
and Scotty Goates on the 
first row, Bobby 
Wisinger, Mark Brown, 
Anthony McGee, Randy 
Galloway and Scott 
Brown on the second row. 
Coach John Gable, Stan 
Wood, Kenny LeM asters, 
Kyle Hatley and John 
Hines. (Staff Photo)

IlMlIKUfpljjW

mm s BISCUITS 15'
CATSUP WESSON OIL TISSUES

>1 Monte 6 9 ^
H|.Dn;

14 Oz.
4 Rolls m

iMELLORlitf '/, Gal. 7 9

IVORY LIQUID

Bogata Book Club
Mrs. David Griffin gave an 

interesting program on 
“ Women Who Have Made 
Great Contributions to 
American Music’ ’ when the 
Bogata Book Club met 
TTiursday, Feb. 15 with Mrs. 
Griffin. Mmes. George Pope 
Jr., and J.E. Holmes were 
co-hostesses. Mrs. Weldon D. 
Smith, president, presided, 
the club collect was repeated 
in unison and roll call was 
answered. Mrs. Griffin was 
presented by Mrs. Avert 
Vaughan. Facts were given 
about L ily  Pons and 
Beverly Sills and recor­
dings by Beverly Sills 
played. Mrs. Griffin also 
sang “ Be Still and Know

Meets
That I Am God” . Mrs. 
Gordon Allen read an in­
teresting article on Fanny 
Oosby prepared by Mrs. 
A.D. Stephenson and the 
group sang “ Blessed 
Assurance”  to the tune of 
“ Beaut i fu l D r e a m e r ’ ’ . 
Minutes were read and 
approved. Articles for M.D. 
Anderson Hospital were 
brought by members.

Mrs. Joe (Thoate and Mrs. 
H.C. McQuer received gifts 
from their secret pals.

Refreshments were served 
to fourteen members and one 
guest, Mrs. 'Thomas Ridge. 
The next meeting will be 
Feb. 28 with Mrs. Harold 
(3eese.

feathered pen.
A blue cloth, with an 

overlay of white lace, 
covered the refreshment 
table. A blue and white 
compote held an 
arrangement of blue and 
white flowers with greenery 
blanked by blue burning 
tapers.

Mrs. Lynn Carroll and 
Mrs. Gerald Martin served 
white cake squares 
decorated in blue and white 
with mints, nuts and fruit 
punch from crystal ap­
pointments.

Gifts were displayed on a 
long table in the middle of 
the room for the guests to 
view.

Miss Brooks and Rector 
plan to be married Friday at 
2 p.m.

Alfred Rodgers 

Honored
On Sixth Birthday

A lfred  Rodgers was 
honored on his sixth birthday 
Saturday at the home of his 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
J.P. Rodgers. His grand­
mother bake the boat shaped 
birthday cake. Cake, ice 
cream  and punch were 
served to these guests 
helping celebrate the oc­
casion : Ike McClendon, Jim 
Southern, Keven Guess, 
Donnie Stockton, Jimmy 
Taylor, John Jenkins and 
Lillian English.

Ivy Smith Honored 
With Dinner

Mrs. Tommie Lou Austin 
of Bonham honored her 
sister, Mrs. Ivy Smith on 
Sunday with a birthday 
dinner when she and Joe 
Masters of Allen came to 
Mrs. Smith’s home, bringing 
a decorated birthday cake, 
baked ham and venison to go 
with the lunch Mrs. Smith 
had already prepared.

Others attending the oc­
casion were her brothers, 
Preston and Leston Mankins 
of Mount Pleasant, Mrs. 
Buryi C!hastine of Arlington 
and Jack Rudd of Mount 
Pleasant. Another friend, 
Mrs. Viola Childress of 
Mount Pleasant planned to 
attend but was unable to get 
a baby sitter for her invalid 
mother, but sent a gift.

The honoree received a 
number of nice gifts.

White And Black
Swans are usually white 

and there is no plumage dis­
tinction between male and 
female. However, two black 
species do exist — the 
Australian Black Swan and 
the Black-necked Swan of 
South America.

Security Savings Money
Market Certificate 

of Deposit.
THIS WEEK’S RATE.

9.62% $10,000 MINIMUM DEPOSIT 
6 MONTH MATURITY (182 DAYS) 
RATE QUOTED ON ANNUAL BASIS

TS^JCALL (214) 572-9896
OR STOP BY SECURITY SAVINGS TODAY ___
Note Substantial interest penalty lor early withdrawal

Security Savings Association
Of Texarkana 
MT. PLEASANT BRANCH 

636 JEFFERSON PARK SHOPPING CENTER

Vaughan, Robert White, 
and Joey Williams. Ray 
Whitney tied for third 
place prize and won $5.00, 
and Sandra Dunn won the 
first place prize of $25.00 
and the honor of entering 
her essay for regional 
competition.

Lufkck Menu. I
Bogata, Talco 
and Rivercrest 

School Lunch Meu 
Feb. 20-March 2,1979 

Monday
Beef taco w cheese 
Seasoned red beans 
Lettuce & tomato salad 
Peach cobbler 
Milk

Tuesday
Barbeque beef on bun 
Pork and beans 
Potato salad 
Fruit cookies 
Milk

Wednesday 
Hot dogs w chili 
Purple hull peas 
Cabbage & apple salad 
Jello w whipp^ topping 
Milk

Thursday 
Beef stew
Assorted sandwiches
Fruit cup
Milk

Friday 
Hamburgers 
Pinto beans
Lettuce & tomato salad 
Pickles, onions 
Ice cream 
Milk

Sunshine Club Meets In Bogata
Forrest Webster and Ruby 
Corbell presented three skits 
and Mrs. Bell and Mrs. 
Webster read poems. 

Refreshments of sand-

Mrs. Ruble Bell demon­
strated three quilts when the 
Bogata Sunshine Club met 
with her Thursday, 
February 15. “ Get Together 
and If You’re Happy”  were 
sung and the club prayer 
repeated in unison.

Mrs. F .P . Brumley 
presided. Roll call was 
“ Something I Remember 
About Valentine” , Mrs. R.J. 
Holt, secretary read the 
minutes of the last meeting 
which 
Mmes.

wiches, potato chips, pickles, 
cookies and soft drinks were 
served.

The next meeting will be 
March 1 with Mrs. Webster 
and Mrs. Corbell will be 
program leader.

Nostalgia Defined 
Nustal/fia has been 

were approved, defined as the state when 
Lewis Herring, you find the present tense 

and the past perfect.
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BOYS
Blossom

Third

Place

5:45
Thursday

Talco

5:45
Monday

8:15
Monday

.^verv

8:15
T h u r s d a y

Detroit

First
Place

GIRI„S
Blossom

Third
P lace

4:»0
Thiirsdav

Averv

4:30 p.m. 
Monday

Deport

7:00 p.m, 
Thursday

Detroit

Come In And Browse
GROCERIES AT DISCOUNT p r ic e s

DICKSON'S
SALVAGE & UNCLAIMED FREIGHT

USDA FOOD COUPONS WELCOME 
IH 30 MT. VERNON 537 4931

Mon. Feb. 26

KING SIZE 
WALLET 

CREATIVE 
COLOR 

PORTRAITS 
FOR ONLY

Kodak papar. For a Good Look at tha Timai 
of Your Ufa.

7:00 p.m. 
Monday

First
Place

CHAD DODD, son of Mrs. 
Gayla Dodd of Garland, 
won first place in the 
kindergarten classes 
from W eaver Elem en­
tary, Best of Show from 
the city and Honorable 
Mention from the district 
with his original painting 
of a snowman. The 
subject. “ Look Out Your 
Window”  had 156 entries 
from 19 elementary 
schools and four middle 
schools. The purpose of 
the project is to provide 
the students with an 
opportunity to use their 
creative talents by ex­
press ing themse lves  
through original art and 
to give recognition to 
creative students in the 
field of creative arts.

V B IR T H S

Talco
Locals

Mr. and Mrs. J.J. Smith 
spent the weekend in Dallas 
with their daughter, Mrs. 
Mary Ruth Sikorsky.

Mrs. Vada Lawrence of 
Mount Pleasant visited Mrs. 
Ivy  Smith Monday a f­
ternoon.

Ricky and Marla Logan 
and family of Marshall were 
luncheon guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Jerry Russell and 
family on Sunday.

Mrs. Alma Lowry of 
Bogata spent Tuesday night 
with Mrs. Vivian Westbrook.

Word has been received of 
the death of a form er 
resident, Don King, of 
Houston. He is the son of the 
late Florence King. Funeral 
services were in Houston 
Thursday.

Clifford Coil is a patient in 
Titus County M em orial 
Hospital.

Rev. and Mrs. Terry 
Barnett, Grant and Gavin 
spent Friday and Saturday 
with her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Harvey Bryan of 
Center.

Chad Dodd of Garland 
spent from Wednesday until 
Sunday with his grand­
mother, Mrs. Nadine Mc- 
Clung, and great­
grandmother, Mrs. Lucy 
McClung.

Mr. and Mrs. R.L. Tef- 
teller of Texarkana visited 
his sister and husband, Mr. 
and Mrs. Jess Waldrum last 
Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. James A. 
Foster, Chris and Jim of 
Garland spent the weekend 
with their parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. A.E. Foster and Mrs, 
W.S. Richardson.

Mrs. Wayman Alexander 
and Mrs. Gladys Garritson 
visited Wednesday in Mount 
Vernon with Mr. and Mrs. 
Chester Garritson and in 
Winfield with Mr. and Mrs. 
Raymond Houston

Sidney Frugia is home 
after eye surgery in St. 
Joseph Hospital in Paris.

Linda Hearron of Denton 
spent last week with her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. James 
Hearron.

Mr. and Mrs. Mike 
Summers of Fort Worth 
spent the weekend with her 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
James Gieger.

J.T. Lorrance was taken 
by ambulance to Titus 
County Memorial Hospital.

Greg Gieger of Fort Worth 
and friend, Michele Nations 
of Arlington, spent last 
weekend with G reg ’s 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
James Gieger.

Mr. and Mrs. George 
Burleson and Carry Joe of 
Grand Prairie spent the 
weekend with her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. R.L. Clark and 
his sister, Mr. and Mrs. 
Lloyd Gauntt and family.

Mr. and Mrs. Ralph 
Oglesby of Pittsburg spent 
the weekend with his 
mother, Mrs. Lynn Carroll, 
Brenda and Randy.

Mrs. Irene Tunier with 
Mr. and Mrs. Charlie Peters 
and Brittany Presley spent 
last Sunday with her sister 
and husba^, Mr. and Mrs. 
H.J. Venable of Denton and 
Mr. and Mrs. Alton Turner 
and Mr. and Mrs. Billy Sam 
Ottinger, all of Crossroads 
City.

Mrs. Lennie M idley, 
mother of Mrs. Erving Horn, 
received word of the death of 
his sister, Mrs. Ethel Jones 
of DeQueen, Arkansas.

Mrs. Janice Fite is a 
patient in Titus County 
Memorial Hospital.

Mr’S. Weatlierall Hosts Book Lovers
Mrs. Elsie Weatherall was 

hostess to the Book Lovers 
Club in her home Friday, 
Feb. 16. The meeting was 
opened with the club prayer 
by Mrs. Ivy Smith and Mrs. 
Ollie Jones, secretary, read 
minutes of the last meeting 
and called the roll to be 
answered with ‘ ‘My Favorite 
President and Why” .

During the short business 
session, the club voted to 
make a contribution to the 
Heart Fund.

Program chairwoman, 
Mrs. J.L. Cato, presented a 
program on presidents, since 
before George Washington.

Following the program, 
Mrs. Cato entertained with 
bingo, which Miss Alice Ruth 
T idw ell and Mrs. Ruby 
Cogbum were the winners.

Refreshments were served 
by the hostess to Mrs. Cleone 
Sullivan, Mrs. T.L. Barton, 
Mrs. Jones, Mrs. Cogbum, 
Mrs. Cato, Miss Tidwell, 
Mrs. Smitn and the hostess.

The next meeting will be in

the home of Mrs. Sullivan 
when Miss Tidwell will bring 
a jH-ogram on Women of the 
Bible.

IIMW Holds 
General Meeting

Mrs. F.P. Brumley and 
Mrs. Cleone Sullivan ha»'^ 
charge of the program when 
the United Methodist Women 
of the Methodist Church of 
Bogata met Monday Feb. 19 
for the general meeting. 
‘ ‘Faith of Our Fathers”  was 
was sung and a prayer by 
Mrs. W.C. Jrffery given. 
Mrs. Brumley gave the 
devotional on Faith and Mrs 
Sullivan gave the article-x 
‘ ‘Responsive Yours” . '

Mrs. Joe Choate, president 
conducted the business 
session and announced 
World Day of Prayer at 
Deshong Chapel March 2 and 
that Mrs. Katy McKnight 
district president will meet 
with them March 5. 
Dismissal was in unison.

ROBYN REEDER made 
four points against the 
North Hopkins girls in a 
practice game at 
Rivercrest  Thursday

n i g h t .  R i v e r c r e s t  
defeated North Hopkins 
60-54 and Avinger 55-42 in 
a game last week. (Staff 
Photo)

SALES AND SERVICE

MF 1105

Hyster Fork Lift 

2200 Fork Lift 

2500 Fork Lift 

40 Fork Lift

Massey Ferguson 

135 Diesels

HARVEY BROTHERS
Massey-Ferguson and New Holland'Hay Machinery 

Dealers
__________ CLARKSVILLE____________________ ___

)

Bogata Personals
Mrs. Bess Pope was in 

Clarksville Friday to attend 
the funeral of her aunt, Mrs, 
Dee Cheyne.

Dr. and Mrs. Bob Holder 
and fami ly  of Baytown 

>8^nt last week in Hawaii 
where he was on a program 
on Dermatology Dr. Holder 
is the son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Sam Holder of Bogata.

Mr. and Mrs. Lawrence 
Vaughan of Overton spent 
Friday with her uncle, Casey 
Watts and Mrs. Watts.

Mrs. Roy Lee Hutson and 
Mrs. Don Roach were in 
Poteau, Oklahoma Monday 
to visit their sister, Mrs. 
Geraldine Jeffery and to 
accompany their mother, 
Mrs. Lena Stephenson, 
home. Mrs, Stephenson had 
been with Mrs. Jef fery 
following surgery several 
weeks ago.

Rev. and Mrs, Clyde T. 
Green of Birmingham, 
Alabama have returned to 
their home after a visit here 
with their daughter, Mrs. 
James Wood and family.

Miss Justine Ford of 
Dallas spent the weekend 
her with her mother, Mrs. 
John K. Ford.

Miss Blanch Mauldin spent 
the weekend with Mr. and 
Mrs. Lawrence Malone at 
Tayone at Taylortown.

Weekend visitors of Mr. 
Everlyn Stillwell were Mr. 
and Mrs. Frank Pope of Mt. 
Pleasant.

Mrs. J.D. Bond has 
returned after spending 
several week in Anchorage, 
Alska with her husband who 
is employed there.

Mr. and Mrs. Philip 
Harold Hobbs, Jr. spent the 
weekend with his mother, 
Mrs. Helen Williams.

Attending the funeral of 
their uncle, Robert Bridges 
of Garland, Wednesday were 
Mmes. Wendell Hervey, Sue 
Huffman, and Mary 
Christopher and Virginia 
Cox of Bogata, Mrs. Mattie 
Briggs of New Boston and 
Dick Cox of Wills Point, 
George Allums of Bogata.

Recent guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. J.P Rodgers were their 
granddaughter Sherylin 
Patterson of Denver, Colo., 
Patsy and Johnie Patterson 
and daughter and son-in-law 
of Paris, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Joe Bob Coats of Talco.

ffuelcf RoHing Homes
Mt. Pleasant

MOBILE HOMES FOR SALE
Having Trouble Financing A Home? 
Come By And Look At Our Selection 

Of Manufactured Homes - 
We Have Financing.

SEE US AND SAVE
Located On Ferguson Rd.

Block West Of The Jefferson Park Shopping Center 
And Across Street From Donnie Keck Ford 

404 Ferguson Rd. Pho. 214—572-5658

T U R N  O N S
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TSO is in 
Paris, Texas
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T e x a s  S t a t e  O i > n  ICAJ
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John (.liapman is the name 
given the son bom Feb. 14 in 
M c C u is t i o n  R e g i o n a l  
Medical Center to Mr. and 
Mrs. Donny (Dianna) Taylor 
of Paris. Grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. H.R. Taylor of 
Paris and Mr. and Mrs. 
Ward Thomas Jr. of 
G r e e n v i l l e .  G r e a t -  
grandparents are Mrs. H.E. 
Troutt of Bogata and Mr. and 
Mrs. Ward Thomas Sr. of 
Greenville

Methodist Movement
The name Methodist was 

originally given to Charles 
and John Wesley and .several 
other Oxford students in 
1729 The term apparently 
characterized the exact and 
‘ ‘methodical”  manner in 
which they undertook their 
Chri.stian duties. Emigrants 
from Ireland carried the 
Methodist movement to 
America in 1760,

BOGATA BUSINESS 
DIREaORY

Red River 
County 

PuUcUbrary
Mon., Wod„ Tliwrt., Frl.

12:00-5:30 p.m. 
Tu m „ 9:00-12:00 o.m.

1:00-5:30 p.m. 
Saturday, 9:00 o.m.- 

12:00 noon

B&B
Ace Hardware

Paint
Headquarters

Bogota

632-5634

B&B
Ace Hardware 

Cement & 
Building Supply 
Heodqunrters

Talco
379-344L

271 TEXACO

SELF-SERVE 
FlUING STATION

Inforxoctfon 

Of 271 a 37

Bofofo 433-4423

Go Team, Co
The whole team must work together to win! It's true in basket 
ball...it's true in our community. Your support of local mer 
chants and businesses keeps your money in the community, 
where it works best for you and your neighbors. We back up 
these same establishments with our many services, commercial 
checking accounts, low-cost business loans. Insurance and tax 
sheltered pension plans. Let’s get in there and work together!

TALCO 
STATE BANK

Cm* i f  QBitM twewre* !• fM.OOO
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