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All Around 

The Town 1
BY MARY ANN SARCHET

The George Long home with shrubs blanketed by about 10 inches of snow. Monday 
night’s forecast called for the end of the snow, but Tuesday morning as the newspaper 
was being prepared for printing the snow was continuing to fall.

—Briscoe County News Photo

Owl Varsity Earns 
Bi-District Playoff Berth

SUBSCRIPTION RATES 
TO INCREASE SOON

Subscriptions to the Briscoe 
County News will be going up 
$1.00 each, as of March 1,1986.

The subscription rate in Bris­
coe and adjoining counties will be 
$9.50 plus 49c tax, for a total of 
$9.99 per year.

Subscriptions mailed to other 
Texas counties will be $10.50 
plus 54c tax, a total of $11.04 per 
year.

The charge for mailing to other 
states will be $10.50 per year.

This increase is necessitated 
by a sharp increase in second 
class postage this month. We 
regret it, because we need your 
subscriptions, but this is the only 
way your hometown paper can 
continue to exist; many increases 
have already been absorbed, and 
it has become impossible to 
continue to do this.

WHAT OTHER EDITORS 
ARE WRITING

Harold Hudson recently wrote 
in The Perryton Herald:

“The latest report shows that 
our ex-presidents cost us $26 
million last year, including a 
$72,000 phone bill. The General 
Accounting Office says that 
Gerald Ford rang up the top 
phone bill, $30,281; Jimmy Car­
ter $21,589; Richard Nixon 
$20,704. Each former chief execu­
tive spent more than $9,000 on 
postage. Secret Service protec­
tion fell to $10.5 million from 
$11.7 million three years ago 
because fewer people got it. Bess 
Truman died, Amy Carter turn­
ed 16. It will fall more since 
Nixon asked to drop protection.

“Ford spent $21,075 for travel; 
Nixon $11,470; Carter $1,187. 
Total for pension, travel staff, 
supplies came to $363,504 for 
Carter; $360,807 for Ford; and 
$327,066 for Nixon. The presi­
dential libraries for the former 
presidents, living and dead, came 
to $14 million. Each former 
president gets $892,438 in pen­
sion; $100,000 plus for staff. Lady 
Bird Johnson gets a $20,000 per 
year pension. It all adds up and 
by now surely this can be 
trimmed just a wee bit and still 
keep our former presidents off 
the poverty roll.”

Carver Monroe entered St. 
Anthony’s Hospital in Amarillo 
Tuesday, expecting to undergo 
surgery on Wednesday.

Friday, January 31, saw the 
Silverton Owl varsity team trav­
el to Hedley to compete in a 
district game. “This game meant 
many things to all of us, but to 
the players it meant that they 
would represent District 1-6A in 
the playoffs as the District 
runner-up champions,” said 
Coach Bob Loy. “Not only did 
they come away victorious but 
by the game’s end, each player 
was physically and emotionally 
drained from the effort he 
displayed all through the game.”

Leading scorers were Russell 
Simpson 14, Scotty Harris 17 and 
Cal Brannon 12.

Monday, February 2, the Owls 
hosted Lakeview for the last 
regularly-scheduled district 
game before the playoffs. “These 
young men remained poised all 
through the game and claimed a 
45-43 victory,” the coach said.

“I can never put into words the 
feeling that I’ve had for each and 
every one of these young men,” 
Coach Loy said. “I will remember 
them for years to come. I would 
especially like to thank the 
seniors who played their last 
game at home: Cal Brannon,

Scotty Harris, Jeff Wheeler and 
Russell Simpson. Just as impor­
tant was the contribution from 
our underclassmen: Jamie Friz­
zell, Brad West, Bryan Wheeler, 
Neal Edwards and Ricky Clardy. 
Corey Robertson joined the team 
after Russell Simpson injured his 
hand.

“I would like to take this 
opportunity to thank the cheer­
leaders, faculty, fans, student 
body and the many townspeople 
who showed their enthusiastic 
support during the season. With­
out your backing and the desire 
of these young men, all that we 
achieved could never have been 
accomplished. Thank you all!” 
Coach Loy said.

In the Lakeview game, the 
leading scorers were Brannon 17, 
Harris 10 and Jeff Wheeler 10.

The Owls finished with a 
district record of four wins and 
two losses, and an overall season 
record of seven wins and nine 
losses.

The Briscoe County News 
would like to thank Coach Loy 
for the reports and stats on the 
games which he has furnished for 
your hometown newspaper.

Com m odities To  
Be Given Away

Weather permitting, commo­
dities will be given away Friday, 
February 14, or Tuesday, Febru­
ary 18, at the community center 
beginning at 9:00 a.m.

Butter, cheese, flour, honey 
and dry milk will be given. 
Please bring a container to carry 
your commodities home.

The commodity schedule has 
been changed. Commodities will 
be given away every other 
month from now on. Be sure to 
pick up your commodities this 
month because you will not 
receive any more commodities 
until April.

Owls Bi-District 
Game is Next Week

The Owls will be playing 
Nazareth in their bi-district 
basketball game Thursday, Feb­
ruary 20, at Tulia. Game time 
will be 7:30 p.m.

Runners-up in their district, 
the Owls will be matched with 
the highly-ranked Swifts,

In North America, deer 
were second only to beavers 
in supplying the pioneers with 
food and clothing.

Eleven Inches of 
Snow Blankets Area

According to Fred Strange, 
who records weather observa­
tions in Silverton, this area was 
blanketed by 11 inches of snow 
during the past week. This 
melted out to 1.40 inches of 
badly-needed moisture.

The low temperature Tuesday 
morning was four degrees below 
zero.

The snow had stopped and the 
sun was shining by mid-morning 
Tuesday.

Four Are Candidates 
For City Council

Four have filed for places on 
the City of Silverton ballot as 
candidates for Councilmen. The 
deadline for filing is February 19, 
and the election is April 5.

The terms of John Bowman, 
Wayne Nance and David Tipton 
are expiring this year, and all 
three will be listed on the ballot 
as candidates for re-election. In 
addition, Dwain Henderson has 
filed for a place on the ballot.

Conservation Awards 
Banquet Rescheduled

The Conservation Awards 
Banquet, originally scheduled for 
Tuesday, February 11, was re­
scheduled for Tuesday, February 
18 at 7:00 p.m. in the Silverton 
School Cafeteria. This postpone­
ment was due to the snowy 
weather this week.

Awards will be presented to 
the winners of the Conservation 
Poster and Essay Contest at that 
time. The meal will be a covered 
dish affair. Everyone is invited to 
attend.

ADA Weeks to 
Begin Next Week

Starting Monday of next week, 
February 17 through March 21 
will be the special Average Daily 
Attendance record-keeping 
weeks on which the school’s state 
monies will be calculated.

Parents are urged to have 
their children in school every day 
of this special record-keeping 
period.

Next Blood Drive 
Here is March 11

There will be a blood drive 
March 11, from 10:00 a.m. until 
1:00 p.m. at the City Hall. The 
bloodmovile from Coffee Memor­
ial Blood Center will be here to 
take the blood donations.
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DOROTHY MARIE MARTIN
Funeral services for Dorothy 

Marie Martin, 66, were conduc­
ted at 3:00 p.m. Friday at the 
First Baptist Church in Silver- 
ton. Officiating were the former 
pastor, Rev. Jerry Miller, pastor 
of the Faith Baptist Church in 
Iowa Park, and Rev. Clinton 
Elliott, pastor of the Assembly of 
God in Silverton.

Interment was in the Silverton 
Cemetery with arrangements 
made by Schooler-Gordon Funer­

Be Sure
Trust the  kn o w le dg e  
and sk ill o f o u r co m ­
p e te n t pharm acists  
w hen in d o u b t abou t 
y o u r  p re s c r ip t io n .

We Can Mail Your 
Prescriptions To You

995-3525
CITY DRUG STORE
Hwy. 86 & Maxwell 

Tulia, Texas

al Directors.
Mrs. Martin died at 10:42 p.m. 

Wednesday, February 5, at 
Swisher Memorial Hospital in 
Tulia following a lengthly illness.

Born Dorothy Marie Cross on 
July 10, 1919 at the home of her 
parents, Ashel and Mary (Heck­
man) Cross, 12 miles northwest 
of Silverton, she was a life-time 
resident of the Rock Creek 
community.

She was graduated from Sil­
verton High School and received 
her bachelor’s degree at West 
Texas State College. She taught 
school at Rock Creek four years 
and taught business subjects in 
Silverton High School four years.

She was married to Milton 
George Martin July 29, 1945 at 
the Methodist parsonage in Ab­
ernathy. They were engaged in 
farming, ranching and the sale of 
crushed quartz rock from a 
quarry on their land.

She was a member of the 
Christian Nondenominational 
Church.

Survivors include her hus­
band; two sons, Gary Martin and 
Van Martin, both of Silverton; 
and three grandchildren, Dustin, 
Vanessa and Matthew Martin of 
Silverton.

Pallbearers were Jerry Mill- 
hollon, Doug Forbes, Jimmy 
Burson, John McCammon, John 
White and Zane Mayfield.

CAROLYN CARLILE
Funeral services for Carolyn 

Carlile, 47, of Lubbock were 
conducted at 1:30 p.m. Monday 
at Highland Baptist Church in

Financial Management 
Workshops Planned

The Briscoe County Extension 
Office and the County Program 
Building Committee will be spon­
soring in-depth Financial Man­
agement Workshops and Intro­
ductions to Computers.

Two separate workshops are 
being planned. The first will be 
held Thursday, February 13, at 
the First National Bank Com­
munity Room in Quitaque. The 
second workshop will be held in 
the Pioneer Room at First State 
Bank in Silverton on Thursday, 
February 20. Both workshops 
will begin at 4:00 p.m. of each 
day. Cost of the workshop will be 
$10.00 per person.

The workshops will be conduc­
ted by County Extension Agents 
Dirk Aaron and Lynda Fogerson 
and Extension Economists Dr. 
Jackie Smith and Dr. Steve 
Amosson.

A sample of the program 
includes, from 4:00 until 6:00 
p.m.: Registration and introduc­
tion, Introduction to record-keep­
ing, Introduction to microcom­
puters, Enterprise budgeting, 
Introduction to cash flow plan­
ning, Computer application.

There will be a break for 
supper between 6:00 and 7:00 
p.m.

Between 7:00 and 10:00 p.m., 
program topics will include An 
exercise in cash flow planning, 
Loan applications, Net worth 
statement and Income state­
ments.

The $10.00 fee for the work­
shop will cover educational mat­
erials and a record keeping 
system. ^

All who wish to participate are 
asked to contact the County 
Extension Office the day before 
the workshop they wish to 
attend. Call 823-2343 for your 
reservation.
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Lubbock with Dr. Richard Wat­
ers, former pastor, of Tulsa, 
Oklahoma, and Dr. Stan Blevins, 
pastor, officiating.

Burial was in Resthaven Me­
morial Park at Lubbock under 
the direction of Sanders Funeral 
Home.

Mrs. Carlile was born January 
20, 1939 in Quanah, and was the 
daughter of William H. and 
Willie Kate Martin. She attended 
the Silverton Schools 12 years 
and was graduated from Silver- 
ton High School with the Class of 
1957. She graduated from Drau- 
ghon’s Business College in Lub­
bock in 1958. She was married to 
Jack Carlile in Lubbock August 
19,1960. She was a Baptist.

Survivors include her hus­
band; a daughter, Kimberly 
Gribben of Lubbock; a son, Mark 
Carlile, of the home; four sisters, 
Mary Ann Scarbrough of Plain- 
view, Sharon McWilliams of 
Midland, Ramona Martin of 
Silverton and Jennifer Mar ley of 
Kress; a brother, Mike Martin, of 
Tulia; her step-mother, Mary 
Martin of Silverton; and her 
grandmother, Mary Martin of 
Turner Rest Home in Childress.

She was preceded in death by 
her parents and three brothers, 
Willie, Jerry and Jimmy, who 
died in infancy.

Pallbearers were Raymond 
Hitt, Billy Waker, Dr. Jack 
Gipson, Travis Burnside, Dale 
Ray and George Whitworth. 
Honorary pallbearers were the 
members of the Highland Baptist 
Church Men’s Bible Class.

Do You Need a 
Slave For a Day?

If you need a slave for a day, 
on Saturday, February 15, from 
8:00 a.m. until 4:00 p.m., the 
Senior Boosters will be doing 
housework, yardwork, and odd 
jobs—FREE.

Call 823-2423 between 8:00 and 
4:00, and a slave will be sent as 
soon as possible. No job should 
last over two hours because 
everyone needs a slave. Dona­
tions will be accepted for the 
Senior Class Trip. 6-2tnc

New Teams in 
Football District

There will be nine teams in 
Silverton’s football district next 
fall, including the Owls.

Three of the teams will be 
new: Amherst, who is moving 
into six-man football for the first 
time, Smyer and New Home. The 
other teams will be Three Way, 
Cotton Center, Southland, Tex- 
line, Whitharrel and Silverton.

The schedule of games will be 
worked out about February 19, 
with two non-conference oppon­
ents to be included.

"Half the promises people
say were never kept—
were never made."

E.W. Howe

Mrs. Bryant (Ruby Lee) Eddle- 
man underwent surgery Monday 
at Methodist Hospital in Lub­
bock. It was reported that 
everything went well and that 
she came through the surgery 
fine.

Crockett Grabbe has been 
moved to the Rehabilitation 
Center at Cedar Rapids, Iowa, 
according to a report from his 
father, Warner Grabbe. Crockett 
is paralyzed on his right side, but 
does have some use of his right 
arm. He is able to walk with 
assistance.

SILVERTON SCHOOL 
LUNCHROOM MENU 

February 17 -21
Monday—Pot Pie, Salad, Corn- 

bread, Fruit, Milk
Tuesday—Tostados with Chili, 

Beans and Cheese, Buttered 
Corn, Spanish Rice, Sopapillas, 
Honey, Milk

Wednesday—Grilled Cheese 
Sandwiches, Vegetable Soup, 
Crackers, Fruit, Milk

Thursday — Fried Chicken, 
Gravy, Mashed Potatoes, Green 
Peas, Hot Rolls, Honey and 
Butter, Milk

Friday—Chili Dogs, French 
Fries, Fruit and Jello, Milk

TERRY GRIMLAND 
WELDING

Now Representing and 
Handling Products For

MILSTEAD
<a*td T flM itty  

S u fe fe lc f
( St<vte )

P. O. DRAW ER C 
PHO NE 293-3689

210 DATE
PLAINVIEW , TEXAS 79073-0439

FRANCIS AERIAL SPRAYING

PESTICIDES APPLIED
Oil - Water 

Dried Pellets
Call Alvie Francis 806-847-2523

The Congregation of the 
CHURCH OF CHRIST 
Meeting at Rock Creek

EXTENDS A GRACIOUS WELCOME TO ALL 
TO ATTEND ANY AND ALL OF OUR SERVICES. 

Sunday
Morning Worship ................................................ ...10:30 a.m.
Evening Worship ................................................... 6:00 p.m.

Wednesday
Evening ..................................................................... 7:00 p.m. I

d r . o. R. McIn t o s h
Optometrist

316 South Main Street Phone 983-3460
FLOYDADA, TEXAS

SPAeab Q beiig/U  

^B eau ty SPtUon
Hair Care For Every 

Member of the Family
823-2468 Silverton, Texas

NEIL A. BRYSON, DDS, Inc.

General Dentistry

Briscoe County Medical Clinic 
Silverton, Texas

Hours by Appointment 
806-995-4191

A *



BRISCOE COUNTY NEWS PAGE THREE

Looking
Back

through the files of the
Briscoe County News

January 29, 1976—Registra­
tion underway here for first 
EMT course . . . Mrs. Eva Lee 
McWilliams, 53, buried here 
Sunday . . . Zeph P. Fogerson 
dies in Colorado . . . Mrs. Beryl 
Long has been a patient at St. 
Anthony’s Hospital in Amarillo ..
. Miss Laquita Bomar, bride-elect 
of Jack Fields, is honored with 
miscellaneous shower . . .  Making 
the sale at the Amarillo Junior 
Livestock Show were lambs 
belonging to Earl Jarrett, Traci 
Mayfield, Walter Perkins and 
Jimmy Lacy; barrows shown by 
Rodney Carpenter, Shane Rea­
gan, Tad Cornett, Mike Cornett, 
Wes Fleming, Zane Reagan, Eric 
Patton and Bryan Burson . . .

February 3, 1966 — Kay 
Strange installed as Rainbow 
Worthy Advisor . . . Richard 
McCutchen, Monty Smith and 
Lynn Edwards had built a 
ten-foot tall snowman on the 
front lawn at the Vinson Smith 
home . . . The SHS chapter of 
Future Homemakers of America 
have been doing their part to 
boost the morale of servicemen 
in Vietnam by mailing boxes of 
goodies to them . . . Sheila 
Jarnagin weds James Warren 
Reid I I I . . .  Meat market specials 
advertised at B&B Food Center: 
Round Steak, 95c lb.; Sirloin 
Steak, 93c lb.; Club Steak, 79c 
lb.; Wilson’s Bacon, 85c lb.; 
Chuck Roast, 55c lb.; T-Bone 
Steak, 93c lb.; Fresh Ground 
Hamburger, 3 lbs. $1.00; Arm 
Roast, 65c lb.; Pork Liver, 19c 
lb.; Beef Liver, 35c lb----

February 2, 1956—Billy D. 
Stevenson, telman second class, 
USN, son of Mr. and Mrs. James 
0. Stevenson, is scheduled to 
return to San Diego, California 
today aboard the destroyer USS 
Gurke which is completing a six 
month cruise in the Far East . . . 
Carl W. Mallow funeral service in 
Plainview Saturday . . . Don 
Alexander selected by school 
board as assessor-collector to fill 
the vacancy made by the resigna­
tion of R. A. Edwards . . . Betty 
McCaslin weds Pvt. Ray H y a tt. .
. Mrs. Flora Dickerson taken to 
hospital. . . Miss Frances Tunnell 
on dean’s honor roll at Southwes­
tern Oklahoma State College . . . 
Carol Elkins has been a patient 
at Methodist Hospital in Lubbock 
for a couple of weeks . . . Annie 
Norris and David Williams mar­
ry . .  . Helping Hand Club meets 
with Mrs. Wade Steele . . . Mrs. 
0. C. Maples has been a patient 
at the Memorial Hospital in 
Houston for some time . . .  Wiley
V. Bomar III, young son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Wiley V. Bomar, jr., 
underwent surgery at the Tulia 
hospital Monday morning. . .

February 7, 1946—Miss Josie 
Lee Barnett becomes bride of J.
W. Smith, jr., at Lubbock 
Sunday . . . Virgil Ballard buys 
Bain Drug, home here . . . 
Grandmother Vaughan observes 
her 94th birthday at dinner party 
. . . More paving added to city 
program . . . Harley Redin 
entered school the first of the 
w eek' at North Texas State 
College . . .  Pfc. Roy McKenney is 
home on furlough . . .  Edd Davis, 
who was recently discharged 
after a year and a half in the U. S. 
Navy, has resumed his-former 
occupation as well driller . . .
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School announces temporary in­
crease in price of school lunches 
from 15c to 20c. . .

January 30, 1936—Silverton 
wins from Matador in Tuesday 
game. Starting lineup for Silver- 
ton was G. Martin, Redin, 
McDaniel, Burson, Odis Gregg 
and G. Martin. McDaniel was 
high point man for Silverton . . . 
Quitaque defeated the Owls in a 
fast moving game at the high 
school gym Friday night. The 
score was 24-21 in favor of the 
visitors. Burson was the high 
man for Silverton . . . J. E. 
Wheelock elected president of 
High Plains Turkey Raisers 
Association . . . Word was 
received here the latter part of

last week announcing the recent 
marriage of Miss Irene McCallon 
of Lubbock to Mr. Carl P. 
Hawkins. The ceremony took 
place at Brownfield, the cere­
mony being performed by Rev. 
Rogers of that city. They will 
make their home in Lubbock, 
where he is associated with the 
Borden’s Milk Co. The bride is 
one of the twin sisters of Mrs. 
Raymond Bomar and has many 
friends in this city and territory . 
. . Mrs. Charles Cowart, nee 
Vernell Gresham, honored in 
home of Mrs. Patton . . . Mrs. 
Mac McKenney is working in 
Tulia this week. . .

“A light heart lives long.”
Shakespeare

HAPPY BIRTHDAY TO. . .
February 13—Melissa Davis, 

Mistie Dyan Mattheus
February 14—Scotti Straley, 

Max Garrison, Brenda Boling, 
Jerry Patton, Lee Burnett

February 15—Gary Weaks, 
Charles Francis

February 16—Zeb Holt, Genie 
Lacy, Diji Couch, Greg Garcia, 
James Alan Patton, Brent Bran­
non, Charlotte Burnett, Clifford 
Clardy

February 17—Patti Whitting­
ton

February 18—Judy Hughes, 
Bill Boling, Amy Minyard, Billie 
Ann Sprague, Molly Riddle, 
Craig Patton

February 19—Carlye Hill, Ca­

they Weaks, David Kellum, Amy 
Jasper

HAPPY ANNIVERSARY TO. . .
February 14—Mr. and Mrs. 

Bill Boling, Mr. and Mrs. Dewey 
Estes

February 17—Mr. and Mrs. 
John Wyatt

February 18—Mr. and Mrs. 
Frank Ramirez

Pigeon babies are some­
times called "squeakers”.

“Spend 
Time and 
Money 
Wisely

B E N  F R A N K L IN

T he b e s t investm en t you can m ake is one 
th a t  p u ts  your tim e  and  your m oney to  th e  

b e s t advantage. O ur various te rm  
C ertifica tes o f D eposit do ju s t  tha t, offering 
you h igher yields on your money. Take th e  

tim e to check ou t our m any CDs soon.
This Bank Will Be Closed 

Monday, February 17 
in observance of 

PRESIDENTS' DAY
Please arrange your banking business so you 
will not be inconvenienced by this closing.

Cjj~ ir s t  S t a t e

FDIC
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NEW ARRIVAL

Mr. and Mrs. Dean Ziegler of 
Amarillo are parents of a son, 
Joshua Dean, born at 5:56 a.m. 
Wednesday, February 5, at High 
Plains Baptist Hospital. He 
weighed eight pounds and four­
teen ounces, and measured 20V2 

inches long.
They are also parents of a 

daughter, Krista, who is five 
yearsold.

Grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. Weldon McCord of Gaines-

ville and Mr. and Mrs. Riley 
Ziegler of Sil verton.

Great-grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. James McCord of 
Hutchins and Lydia Eatherton of 
Gilmer.

The first European mon­
arch to own a motor car was 
King Leopold of Belgium, 
who had a car especially 
built for him in 1898.

Some of the prettiest draw­
ings and photos appear on 
Christmas cards. They can 
become a mini-art gallery by 
using inexpensive frames and 
making interesting wall ar­
rangements.
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The annual harvest of an 
entire coffee tree is required for 
a single pound of ground coffee.

The first suspension bridge 
was reputedly a foot-bridge 
crossing the Indus River, 
described by Chinese monk 
Fa Hsien in 399 A.D.

The famous painting of Wash­
ington crossing the Delaware 
was actually done in Düssel­
dorf, Germany with the Rhine 
as a model of the river.
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Specials Good
Thursday-Saturday, Feb. 13-15

□

Jumbo Bounty 
TOWELS

8 5  . 79c
-GROCERY SPECIALS-

32 oz.
IVORY $1.49
1 lb. Zesta 
CRACKERS 99c
Giant Size 
T I D E $1.99
36 ozs. Aunt Jemima 
SYRUP $2.99
3oz.
NESTEA $2.49
Quart Kraft 
MAYONNAISE $1.69
32 oz.
IVORY LIQUID $1.49
100 ct. Puff 
FACIAL TISSUE 79c
Contadina 
TOMATO SAUCE 5 for $1.00

Charmin »
BATHROOM
TISSUE $1.09

ALL PURPOSE

Russet ̂bag 
Potatoes

LB.
BAG

z s Q n f
BANANAS lb. 3 for $1.00 Red or Golden

15c APPLES lb.CABBAGE lb. 59c

CAULIFLOWER ea. 69c

-M E A T  MARKET SPECIALS-

CHUCK ROAST_________|b._________ $1.99
Wright Sliced
SLAB BACON lb. $1.49

NANCE'S
FOOD STORE

Lynda Fogerson
Briscoe County Extension Agent

STRESS ON THE 
FARM AND RANCH

Those of you involved in agri­
cultural production are recogniz­
ed as some of the biggest 
gamblers in the world! You put 
all of your energy, brain-power, 
money and other resources into 
decisions that may mean major 
gains or major losses for you and 
your families.

You take the gamble, not just 
for the chance to make a profit, 
but most of you enjoy the inde­
pendence of owning your own 
business and want to continue 
producing because you enjoy it 
and because your families have 
been involved in farming or 
ranching for generations.

Yet we know that farm famil­
ies are facing greater stress 
related to their decision to 
remain in farming. We know that 
how each agricultural family 
responds to the stressors from 
agriculture production can be the 
difference between success and 
failure.

The first steps in managing 
stress are to understand what 
stress is and to recognize the 
sources of stress that affect you. 
Stress occurs when agricultural 
production factors interact with 
the producer and his family in a 
way that causes their health and 
their way to thinking to deviate 
from normal functioning.

Stress can be good or bad. 
There are times when stress 
must occur to cause us to make 
needed changes. Bad stress 
occurs when the changes we 
make bring about destructive 
results, like illness, depression, 
violent behavior or accidents.

To make stress work for you, 
sort out the sources of your 
personal stress into three 
groups: those you have NO 
CONTROL over; those you CAN 
CONTROL; and those you can 
feel better about if you UNDER­
STAND them better. Remem­
ber, events which are highly 
stressful to one person may be 
only mildly stressful or not at all 
stressful to another. Each indivi­
dual has his/her own internal and 
external resources and strengths 
for coping with stressors.

In my newsletter which will be 
in the mail this week, I have 
included a check sheet on “Stress 
. . . Individual Perceptions” for 
families to use in becoming more 
aware of your individual stress 
responses. I encourage families 
to use this sheet to identify some 
of the ways they react physically 
and mentally to stressors.

Stress which is not controlled 
can affect your health and your 
family relationships. We hope to 
have a program in the near 
future on coping with the stres­
ses related to agriculture. If you 
need further information on this 
topic, call my office, 823-2343.

The word blackball comes 
from a practice in ancient 
Greece of casting ballots with 
metal balls—white meaning 
innocent, black meaning guil­
ty.
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Owlettes Finish 
Basketball Season

Silverton’s varsity Owlettes 
finished their basketball season 
with two key injuries. DeLyn 
Patton was injured at the 
beginning of the second quarter 
of the Hedley game January 31. 
She suffered torn ligaments in 
her ankle, and is in a boot and on 
crutches.

Kathy Brown was injured 
about two minutes after DeLyn, 
reinjuring her knee. She went to 
San Antonio Friday to see the 
doctor. She has strained cartil- 
ege, so no surgery was neces­
sary. She has to take it easy, lift 
weights and ride bicycle, but is 
expected to be fine for which all 
the Owlette fans and her friends 
are thankful.

In their game at home with 
Lakeview last week, the Owl­
ettes lost by a 56-48 margin. The 
Owlettes outscored the visitors 
in the second and third quarters 
but were unable to take the win.

Kori Baird led the scoring with 
12 points, followed by Shavonne 
Lowrey with nine and Lee Ann 
Durham with eight points. Kris­
ty Fogerson rang up seven 
points, Tonia Perkins and Suzann 
Settle got four points each, and 
Tonnette Miller and Kim Burson 
added two points each.

Kori scored 71% of her shots 
from the field and 67% of her 
shots from the free-throw line. 
Shavonne scored 50% from the 
field and 100% from the line, 
while Lee Ann got 30% from the 
field and 100% from the line. 
Tonia Perkins also scored 50% 
from the field and 100% from the 
line. Kristy scored 60% From the 
field and 50% from the line.

In addition, Suzann led the 
rebounding with four, and also 
was credited with three assists, 
two steals and causing the 
opponents to make two errors.

Lee Ann got one rebound, four

assists, four steals and caused six 
errors. Kori got four steals and 
caused four errors. Shavonne 
had one assist, two steals and 
caused three errors. Tonia had a 
steal and caused three errors.

For 20 games this season, the 
Owlettes have outscored their 
opponents 1028 to 1025 points. 
They have pulled down 655 
reounds as compared with 552 
for their opponents. They have 
committed 16 turnovers per 
game as compared with 19 for 
their opponents.

Kathy scored 45% of her shots 
from the field and 75% of her 
shots from the free-throw line, 
for a per-game average of 15 
points. Tonnette scored 40% 
from the field and 50% from the 
line, for a per-game average of 
seven points. Lee Ann scored 
33% from the field and 55% from 
the line, and averaged seven 
points per game.

Kathy was credited with 58 
rebounds, 76 assists, 61 steals 
and caused 34 mistakes. Suzann 
pulled down 89 rebounds, and got 
41 assists, 37 steals and caused 
33 mistakes. Lee Ann got 102 
rebounds, 38 assists, 59 steals 
and caused 47 mistakes. Kristy 
got 97 rebounds, two assists, 
nine steals and caused 16 errors. 
Tonnette got 93 rebounds, one 
assist, 17 steals and caused 16 
mistakes. Kori got 89 rebounds, 
one assist, 20 steals and caused 
27 mistakes. Shavonne pulled 
down 63 rebounds, got two 
assists, 10 steals and caused 10 
mistakes.

“I’d like to thank those fans 
and parents who supported us 
this year. I appreciate the 
dedication and loyalty of our five 
seniors (Kathy, Lee Ann, Kristy, 
Shavonne and Kori) and two 
managers (Donna and Melannie). 
They will be greatly missed. 
Thanks to the Owlettes for your 
efforts—you’re a great bunch of 
girls! Kathy and DeLyn’s injuries 
hurt us the last two ballgames—

m y i t h

Ge* n c e P 'u s

" S Ç a t .c a v e  o n  s e  .
S v J o rK ,» o ’-

Reduce the risk of downtime this 
year by getting a complete combine 
inspection now. Our experienced 
service technicians will come right to 

your farm and make a Performance Plus Checkup of your IH or 
Case International combine. When our expert is through, you'll 
know exactly the operating status of your combine. Then, if you 
want repairs, we’ll do them at a special —
off-season discount. Call us now!

Don Brown 
823-2292

Phone 823-2441

David Reagan 
823-2537

BROWN-McMURTRY
Implement Company

mm
Silverton, Texas

we all wish them a speedy 
recovery,” said Coach Kelly 
Braisher.

“The Owlettes would like to 
wish the Owls good luck in the 
play-offs. We’re with you all the 
way,” Coach Braisher added.

The Briscoe County News 
would like to thank Coach 
Braisher for furnishing the game 
and season statistics to the 
hometown newspaper. Her coop­
eration is appreciated very 
much.

Letter
To The Editor

Dear Friends,
Would like for you to run this 

ad for me on the back page of the 
paper. Run it three weeks and 
we’ll see how it does. Bill me if 
my credit is still good around 
Silverton.

My family and I have just 
recently moved here to Santa 
Rosa. I’ve taken the job as 
minister for the Church of Christ 
and we have also opened a saddle 
shop. We are making saddles and 
doing repair as well as carrying 
on our cincha business. I know

there are lots .of good cincha 
rings hanging in the saddle 
houses around there just waiting 
for someone to tie a cincha on. 
Part of them I’d know who they 
belonged to without being told.

If any Silverton people get 
through Santa Rosa it would be 
nice if they would stop by for a 
visit. Our shop is at 137 Parker— 
that’s what was old Route 66. My 
phone is 505-472-5060—haven’t 
got my phone in the shop yet, so 
it’s a night phone. We still think 
of everyone in Silverton as home 
folks.

My dad gets the Briscoe 
County News and we catch up on

Diamond Industrial Supply Co.
Phone Days 296-7418— Nights 293-1200 or 296-7828 

1014 Broadway 
Plainview, Texas

SKF BCA TIMKEN BOWER 
“We Appreciate Your Business More”

Chain U-Joints
Sprockets Oil Seats
V-Belts O-Rings
Sheaves Wisconsin

the news when we go to Roswell. 
Best wishes,
Max Stevenson

"Culture is the best that 
has been said and thought 
in the world."

Metthew Arnold

To win a bet for $40, 
Thomas Garson of Chicago 
ate 22 hamburgers and 
two quarts of ice cream in 
25 minutes back in 1938.

PARTS VALUE 
OF THE MONTH.

THE SALE  
OF SALES

I

What do you want in a fitter?
Quality? There’s none better than a genuine 

replacement filter designed specifically for your 
model tractor or implement.

Application? We have a full line of filters for 
Case tractors, International tractors and imple­
ments, and all Case International equipment. And 
we have Fleetguard filters for your cars and trucks, 
and any other farm equipment.

Price? You can’t beat us during our Filter 
Festival. Come in and save up to 10% off regular 
J I Case suggested list prices.

F U E R  FESTIVAL!
B É

BRO W N-M cM URTRY
Implement Company

Phone 823-2441 Silverton, Texas

A #



PAGE SIX BRISCOE COUNTY NEWS THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 13,1986

ONLY

ALLSUP'S
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WITH LARGE COFFEE 
OR REGULAR 

HOT CHOCOLATE

BORDEN'S
Borden
HHÜOTBN 

LmM 
Milk

d i u - ß ’lO '

M ilk ' aGNAL$/09
ALLSUP'S

n  ’/2 GAL. _

■ a L T  $1 6 9
LAY'S® REGULAR,
BARBECUE, SOUR CREAM & ONION

Potato*
ChipA*

REGULAR 

NOW ONLY

S/09

a*5
yoitll f y w  i\m  m \ m _

Xlíü?S
ß  licei, C¡¿ectiae* 

Q e U u v u f*  1 3 - 1 4 - 1 5 ,  1 9 8 6  

W hile* Supplied* Jßadt

Buy a
Barbecue Sandwich

at Regular Price, 
Get a Small 

Fountain Drink 
FREE!

CONVENIENCE STORES

(je t Ijam / 
H ait Minute/ 

Valentine/
a t If  (M A' Pieo/ity

A l U u f i / 'i /

ALLSUP'S

M oney
Ó n x te A Á -

6 pak cans 
Diet and Cherry 
COCA-COLA 

$1.79

MOVIE & VCR 
RENTALS

The Very Best in 
Home Video 

Entertainment!

ALL YOU NEED 
IS YOUR TV!

Executive Committee 
To Meet February 18

The Executive Committee of 
the Extension Program Building 
Committee will meet at 1:00 p.m. 
Tuesday, February 18, at the 
Silverton City Hall. This is an 
important meeting for committee 
members to be involved in 
developing plans for the Long- 
Range Extension Program and 
selecting a group of leaders in 
the county to determine impor­
tant issues facing Briscoe Coun­
ty.

The committee will also make 
final plans for the Financial 
Management Workshop in Sil­
verton on February 20, and 
report on the workshop in 
Quitaque held on February 13.

A slide program, “Feelings in 
Rural Texas—Farm and Ranch 
Stress,” will be presented.

Nutmeg hung around the 
neck was believed to ward off 
diseases.

NOTICE TO BIDDERS
The Commissioners’ Court of 

Briscoe County will be accepting 
Sealed Bids until 10:00 a.m. 
March 10, 1986 for the purchase 
of one new Motor Grader for 
Precinct #1.

Bid Specifications 
One (1) New Tandem Power­

ed Motor Grader meeting the 
following minimum specifica­
tions:

Diesel Engine with 638 cubic 
inch displacement and 135 net 
flywheel horsepower.

Articulating Main Frame with 
Indicator.

ROPS Enclosed Cab with 
heater, pressurizer, and air con­
ditioner.

Direct Drive Power Shift 
Transmission with six (6) speeds 
forward and six (6) speeds 
reverse; single lever controlled.

Oil Disc Brakes, air actuated, 
mounted on all four drive wheels.

Variable Displacement Hy­
draulic Pump.

Full Hydraulic Controls on all 
implements with lock valves on 
all hydraulic circuits.

14” Chrome Moldboard with 
hydraulic sideshift and tip con­
trol. Minimum of 6 circles shoes 
with replaceable wear inserts. 

Headlights
24 Volt Electrical System 
Adjustable deluxe Suspension 

Seat
Low Temperature Starting 

System and Ether Starting Aid 
14.00 x 24, 10 PR Tires 

mounted on 10” Wheel Rims 
Heavy Duty Radiator 
All items which are normally 

standard
Minimum Operating Weight of 

31,520 pounds 
V-type Scarifier w/11 Teeth 
Only Total Cost Bids will be 

accepted.
Forms will be available in the 

County Judge’s office.
Trade-In: One (1) used Cater­

pillar #120G Motor Grader, Ser­
ial No. 87V659.

The bids will be publicly 
opened and read before the 
Commissioners’ Court of said 
County March 10, 1986 at 10:00 
a.m.

The Commissioners’ Court res­
erves the right to reject any and 
all bids. Address bids to the 
office of County Judge.

Fred W. Mercer 
Box 356

Silverton, Texas 79257
7-2tc

*  *



THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 13,1986 BRISCOE COUNTY NEWS PAGE SEVEN

SHS ag students are working on a basic carpentry project, construction of a storage 
building which will be for sale when finished. Proceeds from the sale will be used to 
purchase materials for other projects. Pictured at work on the bam are [left to right] 
Cal Brannon, Joe Ted Edwards, Todd Reagan and Russell Simpson.

—Briscoe County News Photo

LETTER TO THE EDITOR
Dear Editor,

. . .  I know sometimes it is 
difficult to keep courage in a 
community as people have to 
move for economic reasons, but I 
want you to know that Briscoe 
County and your wonderful 
newspaper have a definite pur­
pose in this country, so keep up 
the good work and keep faith.

Thanks for a job well done.
Sincerely,

Ronald Vaughan and family
Arlington, Texas

mother, Mrs. Ollie McMinn, 
home with him to Lubbock where 
she visited until Wednesday 
morning of last week. Travis and 
his son-in-law made some neces­
sary repairs on her car while she 
was there. She also visited with 
Travis and Linda’s new grand­
son, son of Mr. and Mrs. Ricky 
Willis, who was one week old.

Mrs. McMinn recently under­
went skin grafting in Amarillo on 
a place on her leg that had not 
healed properly, and is recover­
ing from this as well as the sore 
place where the donor skin was 
taken.

Travis McMinn came on Mon­
day of last week and took his

Some say it’s good luck to 
burn onion skins in the fire.

Haircuts for Men, Women, Children

Perms Hair Coloring
Ear Piercing Hot Wax
Manicures Facials

Deep Conditioners 
Eyelash, Eyebrow or Mustache Dye 

Open Tuesday through Saturday 
5:00 - 8:00 p.m. Tuesdays and Thursdays 

for men’s haircuts

1006 Commerce St.
AMY’S

Silverton, Texas 823-2555

Local 4-H Members To 
Compete in 1986 
Houston Stock Show

Twenty 4-H members from 
Briscoe County will be joining 
4-H and FFA members from 
throughout the state for show­
ring competition at the Houston 
Livestock Show, to be held 
February 15 through March 2.

These young exhibitors com­
pete in the junior show, where 
1986 entries are expected to be 
more than 16,000. These junior 
show entries combine with open 
show and horse show entries to 
make the Houston Show the 
world’s largest.

Junior exhibitors will be rep­
resenting 804 Texas 4-H clubs 
and FFA chapters while open 
show exhibitors come from all 
over the world.

Market barrows will be shown 
by Russ Baird, Lance Bradford, 
Josh Brooks, Bradley Brunson, 
Brandi Brunson, Penni Fogerson, 
Julie Graham, Christi McWaters, 
Clay Merrell, Warren Wayne 
Merrell, Langdon Reagan, Todd 
Reagan and Robby Weaks.

Market lambs will be shown by 
Bradley Brunson, Brandi Brun­
son, Keeley Burson, Kim Burson, 
Robbie McWaters, Clay Merrell, 
Warren Wayne Merrell, Bradley 
Price, Clay Schott and Christa 
Tucker.

A market steer will be shown 
by Clay Schott, and a beef heifer 
will be shown by Kristi Bean.

“Although we have a truly 
international livestock show, we 
probably take the most pride in 
the thousands of youngsters who 
come to our livestock show each 
year,” said Don Jobes, jr., 
assistant general manager.

“They’ve shown that they’re 
the hope for the future of 
agriculture by committing them­
selves to a long year of hard 
work raising their animals,” said 
Jobes.

The first rubber balloons 
were made by Prof. Michael 
Faraday in 1824 for his 
experiments with hydrogen. 
Toy balloons were introdu­
ced the following year.

The Direct Source
ROARING SPRINGS Downtown 

348-7971 
Mon. - Sat. 

10:00 - 5:30 pm

THACKER
d E W E L R y

A. 14k Double Leaf Jackets Reg. $16. SALE $5.99
B. Amethyst Pendant, .61 ct. Reg. $140. SALE $52.50
C. 7mm Black Onyx Studs Reg. $18. SALE $6.75
D. 1/5 ct. Diamond Studs Reg. $380. SALE $139.50
E. Ladies Freeform Ring, 4 Dia. .55 ct. Reg. $1480. SALE $549.
F. Ladies Ring, Amethyst .99 ct., 2 Dia. .05 ct. Reg. $340. SALE $127.50
G. Diamond Earrings, 14 Dia. .79 ct. Reg. $1860. SALE $697.50
H. Heart Jacket, 15 Dia. .36 ct. Reg. $900. SALE $337.50
I .  1/5 ct. Diamond Drop Reg. $500. SALE $187.50

(not shown)
7mm Lapis Studs Reg. $24. SALE $8.95 
2 Peso Coin Ring Reg. $280. plus coin SALE $129.
14k Nugget Bracelets (NB-25) Reg. $300. SALE $109.50 

(NB-27) Reg. $360. SALE $135.

February's Birthstone is the Amethyst

February (pedals
Save up to 65% below normal retail!

1* *
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NATHAN, JARED and ANDREW FRANCIS
Sons of Barry and Michelle Francis 

Grandsons of Alvie and Glenda Francis 
and John and Barbara McDonough 

Great-Grandsons of Floye McCracken

MOLLY KAYE LONG
Daughter of Nick and Melissa Long 

Granddaughter of George and LaVerne Long 
and Mr. and Mrs. Bev. Roberson 

Great-Granddaughter of Ruth Stewart

TYLER SPERRY
Son of Mel and Nancy Sperry 

Grandson of George and LaVerne Long 
and Mr. and Mrs. E. R. Sperry, sr.

SARAH and I
Daughters of Alvii 

Granddaughters of E 
late Loyd May and L.

MOLLY ANN SARCHET
Daughter of Ken and Jonann Sarchet 

Granddaughter of J. T. and Johnnie Rogers 
and Charles and Mary Ann Sarchet 

Great-Granddaughter of Viola Boyles, 
Thetis Rogers and Gladys Hill

JORDAN BLAKE SARCHET
Son of Ken and Jonann Sarchet 

Grandson of J. T. and Johnnie Rogers 
and Charles and Mary Ann Sarchet 

Great-Grandson of Viola Boyles, 
Thetis Rogers and Gladys Hill

BRANDON MICHAEL SARCHET
Son of Ken and Jonann Sarchet 

Grandson of J. T. and Johnnie Rogers 
and Charles and Mary Ann Sarchet 

Great-Grandson of Viola Boyles, 
Thetis Rogers and Gladys Hill

AMBER $
Daughter of Jimmy 

Granddaughter of JiT m 
and A1 and Ji

AMY JO MACIEL
Daughter of Joe and Faye Lynn Maciel 

Granddaughter of Mr. and Mrs. Donald Perkins 
and Mrs. Mary Maciel 

Great-Granddaughter of Mr. and Mrs. R. E. 
Sweek, Mr. and Mrs. Bud Perkins,

Mrs. Elena Servin 
Great-Great-Granddaughter of 

Mrs. Ester McLeland

BRANDON SCOTT KRAUSE
Son of Mrs. Julie Krause 
Grandson of Ted Vardell 

Great-Grandson of Annie Williams

RANDI PARKER
Daughter of Brit and Virginia Parker 

Granddaughter of Charlie and Fern Parker 
and Sam and Mary Day

MATT and KASS 
Children of Bill and 

Grandchildren of Har< 
and Norman and ' 

Great-Grandchildre 
and Charlie an

*  *
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ÌATIE m ay
i and Kathy May 
thelyn May and the 
L. and Helen Allen

MICHAEL and CHRISTOPHER LAHOUD
Sons of Fares and Nanda Lahoud 

Grandsons of Rex and Faith Redies, 
Robert Barrett, Mr. and Mrs. Michael Lahoud 
Great-Grandsons of Mr. and Mrs. E. 0. Barrett 

and J. D. and Lois Nance

NATHAN RAY PERRY
Son of Billie and Vicki Perry 

Grandson of Harvey and Patricia McJimsey 
Great-Grandson of Mattie Lawrence 

and Stella McJimsey

MISTI, ASHLEY and BARRY
Children of Jackie and Susan Bainum 

Grandchildren of Larry and Mary Lou Jarrett 
Great-Grandchildren of Lula Bellinger 

and Chick and Ruby Northcutt

ITONE
and Terri Stone 

y "id Madeline Stone 
in Ramsey

ANDREW STONE
Son of Jimmy and Terri Stone 

Grandson of Jimmy and Madeline Stone 
and A1 and Jan Ramsey

TRENT SMITH
Son of Jerry and Sandra Smith 
Grandson of Mary Lee Watters 
and Charles and Virginia Smith

ROBBY WEARS
Son of Gary and Cathey Weaks 

Grandson of Elvira Weaks and Nell Clem 
Great-Grandson of Buck Wesley, 
Olga Weaks and Imogene Taylor

¡IE STRANGE
Sharon Strange 

>ld and Dora Storie 
Peggy Strange 
in of Dora Eiland 
d Fern Holt

CRYSTAL STORIE
Daughter of Paula Montague and Gary Storie 

Granddaughter of Harold and Dora Storie 
and Roy and LaNelle Montague 

Great-Granddaughter of Dora Eiland

LESLEE WEAKS
Daughter of Gary and Cathey Weaks 

Granddaughter of Elvira Weaks and Nell Clem 
Great-Granddaughter of Buck Wesley, 

Olga Weaks and Imogene Taylor

LINDSEY WEAKS
Daughter of Gary and Cathey Weaks 

Granddaughter of Elvira Weaks and Nell Clem 
Great-Granddaughter of Buck Wesley, 

Olga Weaks and Imogene Taylor
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DEREK NEAL FINCK
Son of Trent and Cynthia Finck 

Grandson of Harold and Ellen Edwards 
Great-Grandson of Lorena Edwards 

and Pearl Burnett 
Nephew of Joe Ted Edwards

KAYLA and ZACKARY COLEMAN
Children of Douglas and Danna Coleman 

Grandchildren of Beefie and LaRue Garvin 
and Douglas and Valetra Coleman 

Great-Grandchildren of Ruby Gilkeyson, 
Mary Coleman and Lem and Valeria Weaver 

Great-Great-Grandchildren of Charlsie Arnold

f 4

STACI, RICHIE and WILL HILL
Children of Fred and Lois Hill 

MICHAEL HILL
Son of Walter and Dianna Hill 

Grandchildren of T. V. and Opal McClure, 
the late Richard Hill,

Loyd and Laverne Stephens 
and Mr. and Mrs. Eiland Johnson

CHRIS, BRADLEY and KELLI HARRISON
Children of Roger and LaNell Harrison 

STACI, RICHIE and WILL HILL
Children of Fred and Lois Hill 

Grandchildren of Loyd and Laverne Stephens, 
T. V. and Opal McClure, the late Richard Hill, 

Corky Harrison and Geneva Harrison

RUSSELL LEE KENNEDY
Son of Rodger and Nanette Kennedy 

Grandson of Guinn and Pat Fitzgerald 
and Dub and Ruby Kennedy 

Great-Grandson of Jessie Bomar 
and Way land and Flo Fitzgerald

JEFF, MISTI and DUSTI WEARS
Children of Victor and Debbie Weaks 
Grandchildren of Bill and Della Boling 

and Elvira Weaks
Great-Grandchildren of Marie Boling, 

Buck Wesley and Olga Weaks

KELCY SIMPSON
Daughter of Mitchell and Connie Simpson 

Granddaughter of Doc and Sharon Simpson 
and W. D. and Peggy Rowell 

Great-Granddaughter of Ruby Gilkeyson, 
Buel Simpson, Mr. and Mrs. Aubrey Rowell, 

and Jord Hollingsworth 
Great-Great-Granddaughter of Charlsie Arnold

ERIC RAUCH
Son of Marshall and Julie Rauch 

Grandson of Bob and Mary Ann Rauch 
and the late Rosie Dickerson 

Great-Grandson of Mr. and Mrs. Ben Rauch

BROOKE and KURBY GARVIN
Daughters of Lane and Paula Garvin 

Granddaughters of Beefie and LaRue Garvin 
and Mr. and Mrs. Warren Hardin 

Great-Granddaughters of Ruby Gilkeyson, 
and Mr. and Mrs. Dick Dingier 

Great-Great-Granddaughters of Charlsie Arnold
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ANTHONY and PRESTON MAY
Sons of Thurman and Glenda May 

Grandsons of Mr. and Mrs. Johnnie Lee Carthel 
and Mr. and Mrs. Edwin May 

Great-Grandsons of Mr. and Mrs. J. Lee Carthel 
and Mr. and Mrs. 0. E. May

ALISHA BREEDLOVE
Daughter of Guy and Sheryl Breedlove 

Granddaughter of Mrs. Annie Breedlove 
and Mr. and Mrs. Edwin May 

Great-Granddaughter of Mr. and Mrs. 0. E. May

JOSH BREEDLOVE
Son of Guy and Sheryl Breedlove 

Grandson of Mrs. Annie Breedlove 
and Mr. and Mrs. Edwin May 

Great-Grandson of Mr. and Mrs. 0. E. May

LORI DORN GRIFFIN
Daughter of Mikel and Liz Griffin 

Granddaughter of L. D. and Roberta Griffin 
and Don and Mary Brown

HEATH and JUSTIN MAY
Sons of Larry and Kay May 

Grandsons of Mrs. Mary Stephens 
and Mr. and Mrs. Edwin May - 

Great-Grandsons of Mr. and Mrs. 0. E. May

TAYLOR ANN GRIFFIN
Daughter of Mikel and Liz Griffin 

Granddaughter of L. D. and Roberta Griffin 
and Don and Mary Brown
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RYAN and ERIC MIN YARD
Sons of Rick and Beverly Minyard 
Grandsons of Bill and Della Boling 
Great-Grandsons of Marie Boling

AMANDA ESTES
Daughter of Jim and Donna Estes 

Granddaughter of Bill and Della Boling 
and Dewey and Jimmie Estes 

Great-Granddaughter of Marie Boling, 
Mr. and Mrs. Van Barbour, 

and Mr. and Mrs. Jack Estes

SAMANTHA FRANCIS
Daughter of Jace and Becky Francis 
Granddaughter of Ima Nell Francis 

and Carl and Lou Bevili 
Great-Granddaughter of Junita Thompson, 

Mr. and Mrs. W. B. Thompson, 
Bertie Gunn and Mrs. J. Lee Francis

*  *
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Mrs. Jim (Donna) Estes has 
been a patient at Central Plains 
Hospital in Plainview for several 
days. She was being treated for 
viral pneumonia, and was still 
a patient there early this week.

Cultivating bacteria instead of 
trees and cotton plants to 
produce cellulose may one day 
lead to cheaper paper, clothing 
and medical supplies. National 
Wildlife magazine reports that a

researcher at The University of 
Texas at Austin has discovered a 
strain of bacteria which produces 
cellulose requiring much less 
processing than wood pulp to 
produce paper.

DARYL-ANN REYNOLDS
Daughter of Darrell and Dianne Reynolds 

Granddaughter of Mr. and Mrs. Duane Reynolds 
and Mr. and Mrs. Allen Seago 

Great-Granddaughter of Mrs. Roy Jackson, 
Mrs. Allie Mullins, Mr. and Mrs. M. G. Reynolds 

Great-Great-Granddaughter of 
Mrs. Susan Peachy

CORTNEY ANN HILL
Daughter of Greg and Karen Hill 

Granddaughter of Carlye Hill, 
Donnie and Carol Martin and Robert H. Hill 

Great-granddaughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Carver Monroe, Mr. and Mrs. Bob Hill 

and Mr. and Mrs. Bly Shannon

ERICA MONTAGUE
Daughter of Quinn and Debbie Montague 

Granddaughter of Polly Montague 
and Melvin and Ruby Mahagan 

Great-Granddaughter of Alma Overman

GRANT MONTAGUE
Son of Quinn and Debbie Montague 

Grandson of Polly Montague 
and Melvin and Ruby Mahagan 

Great-Grandson of Alma Overman

TARRAN FORBES
Daughter of Cam and Missy Forbes 

Granddaughter of Doug and Elaine Forbes 
and Don and Mary Brown

DONNYBURSON
Son of Tom and Deb Burson 

Grandson of Don and Mary Tom Burson 
and Marlis and Elizabeth Barker 

Great-Grandson of Nannie Bomar, 
Iris Burson and Birdie Stewardson

1986 1836

taken from the Silverton Light 
June 2,1894

ITEMS FROM LAKE VIEW
Mr. Editor:

I will try and write you the 
haps and mishaps of this lovely 
neighborhood.

Getting rather dry but stock 
that gets plenty of water and salt 
are doing fine.

Mr. Joe Reeves got badly hurt 
by a horse running over him but 
he is improving.

We learn that Mr. Pooles wind 
mill is out of fix.

Our school is progressing 
nicely and we are sorry that it 
will soon be out.

We have a well attended 
Sunday school which meets ev­
ery Sunday.

Several of the young men of 
this corner have gone east to 
work during harvest.

A few things we would like to 
know: How some people know so 
much about their neighbors and 
never visit them.

Why some young men can’t go 
to see their best girl and get 
home before night.

Why some go to Sunday school

and leave before it is over.
Mr. T. F. Palmer is clear light 

a head of everyone in this 
community for a garden and 
young chicks. All the Methodists 
can begin to sharpen up their 
appetites for I tell you he has got 
the yellow leg chicks.

Wheat has vamoosed the way 
Ward’s ducks went, oats will 
soon follow suit and corn that is 
up looks sick.

Free Coinage where are you?
Well, Mr. Editor if this does 

not find the miserable waste 
basket I will try again.

Success to the Light and the 
Pops is the desire of

FRED TRADE.

The Briscoe County Sesquicen- 
tennial Celebration is August 16, 
1986.

—Submitted by 
Carrie Dell Dickerson, 

Briscoe County Historical 
Survey Committee Chairman

A newborn blue whale 
weighs two tons and then 
gains about 200 pounds 
a day.

A *
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scholarships in the nation.
The Show is a total charity 

benefitting youth and education 
and currently has 899 students 
on scholarships in Texas colleges 
and universities.

The Show also funds extensive 
research and endowment pro­
grams at colleges and universit­
ies throughout the state.

This year’s livestock show 
opens February 15, a special 
Sesquicentennial celebration will 
star Willie Nelson on February 
18, and the first rodeo perfor­
mance is February 19.

Livestock show and rodeo 
events conclude March 2.

A pencil equipped with an 
eraser, the first of its kind, 
was patented by Hyman L. 
Lipman of Philadelphia 
in 1858.

Sir Gregory Gander, born 
1745, re-named the 12 
months: “Snowy, Flowy, 
Blowy; Showery, Flowery, 
Bowery; Hoppy, Croppy, 
Droppy; Breezy, Sneezy, 
Freezy.”

RICK’S MUFFLER
For All Your Car

Flats Fixed 
Oil Changes 
Grease Jobs 
Cars Washed & Waxed

Needs!
Inspection Stickers 

Exhaust Work 
Front Disk Pads 
Safemark Tires

Rick & Rena Hester [806] 823-2015

Local Dealer Attends 
Steiger Tractor Show

With a theme of “Four Wheel 
Drive Pride,” Steiger Tractor, 
Inc. hosted over 3000 dealers and 
farmers from all over the world 
in Fargo, North Dakota during 
January, including David Reagan 
of Brown-McMurtry Implement.

On consecutive days from 
January 20 through the end of 
the month, attendees at the show 
had an opportunity to see the 
new 1000 Series tractors, visit 
with Irvin Aal, president and 
CEO of Steiger, and tour the 
Fargo manufacturing plant for 
the four-wheel-drive tractors.

The 1000 Series Steigers, five 
models ranging from the 190- 
horsepower Puma 1000 to the 
375-horsepower Lion 1000, rep­
resent a new three frame concept 
of tractor manufacturing, with 
each model sharing many com­
mon components. Each tractor is 
a full-time four-wheel-drive trac­
tor with easy-access cab, 51 
square feet of tinted glass, 
adjustable 12-position seating, 
tilt/telescope steering wheel, on­
board microprocessor that pro­
vides electronic readouts on 
major functions and diagnoses 
itself, and a full power-shift 12 
speed transmission that is elec­
tronically controlled.

A center for much interest at 
the Fargo show was the Puma 
1000, which features a steerable 
front axle option and bar axles 
for making minor adjustments 
during row crop work. The 
Bearcat 1000 at 235 engine 
horsepower, Cougar 1000 at 280 
horsepower, Panther 1000 at 335 
horsepower and Lion 1000 at 375 
horsepower make up the remain­
der of the 1000 Series.

Load-sensing hydraulics are 
standard on all models, with 
options ranging from extra re­
mote couplers to three point 
hitches and 10000 RPM PTO’s.

Since 1958 when the first 
Steiger tractor was built in a 
dairy barn near Thief River 
Falls, Minnesota, over 20,000 
tractors have been manufactured 
by the company. Steiger Tractor 
is headquartered in Fargo, 
where a 420,000-square-foot man­
ufacturing facility shares space

with all other divisions of the 
company.

Local FFA Members to 
Compete in 1986 
Houston Show

Nine FFA members from 
Silverton will be joining 4-H and 
FFA members from throughout 
the state for show-ring competi­
tion at the Houston Livestock 
Show, to be held February 15 
through March 2.

Market barrows have been 
entered in the show by FFA 
members Kristy Fogerson, Rob­
bie McWaters, Clay Schott and 
Jeannita Stephens.

They will be among junior 
exhibitors who will be represent­
ing 804 Texas 4-H clubs and FF A 
chapters.

Junior show and open show 
exhibitors will compete for mil­
lions of dollars in prize monies 
and premium auction prices.

Long before the Show starts, 
committee volunteers contact 
auction buyers to guarantee that 
each animal sold at one of the 
four junior auctions will bring a 
price above the current market 
value.

Junior exhibitors show a vari­
ety of animals, including beef and 
dairy heifers, breeding sheep, 
goats, commercial steers, breed­
ing rabbits and market lambs, 
steers, poultry and barrows.

The junior show will have a 
new sound this year with two 
new auctioneers—Charles Rol­
lins of Fort Worth and Ike 
Hamilton of Monroe, Louisiana. 
Walter Britten retired after 46 
years as Show auctioneer.

Because of past success, the 
three-judge system will be used 
again for market lambs, barrows 
and steers. This system helps 
ensure fair selection of champion 
animals based on production, 
feeding and carcass merit.

In addition to providing a 
learning experience and exciting 
show-ring competition for 4-H 
and FFA members, the Houston 
Livestock Show and Rodeo is the 
largest donor of agricultural

KH3IH PARTS VALUE 
OF THE MONTH.

HARROW 
REBUILD SALE!

22-inch full concavity 
disk blades 

now only

$2373
Buy 7 G et 1 Free

Sharpen field performance!
W e’re run n ing  a spec ia l sale on ha rrow  rebu ild  

pa rts  tha t can get you in shape fo r fall fo r less than 
you m ay th ink. Save up to 35%  o ff regu lar J I Case 
suggested  lis t p rice s  on spoo ls , bea rings , spa ce r 
tubes, d isk  axles, and a rb o r b o lt to o ls  all the  
p a rts  you need to do it you rse lf. D u ring  o u r Price 
P low dow n Sale y o u ’ ll save on the se  and  a w ide  
se lection of tillage  parts  inc lud ing  to p -q u a lity  Earth 
M eta lR d isk blades. Reblade H
and rebuild  now, wh ile  the 
savings are high! iz m m

BROWN-McMURTRY IMPLEMENT
823-2441 Silverton
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Extension Council 
Met Here Last Week

The Briscoe County Extension 
Homemakers Council met at 9:30 
a.m. on February 5,1986.

After being elected vice-chair­
man of the group, Bena Hester 
chaired the meeting. Lanita

AUTOMOTIVE
REPAIR

Mike Pigg 
847-2539
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STORM WINDOWS
And Replacement Win- § 
dows. Call Plain view Home |  
Improvement collect, 293- = 
7622. Free estimates. 3-tfc 5
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Cantwell was elected to serve as 
secretary and Kathy Kingery 
was appointed parliamentarian.

The District Meeting will be 
held at Floydada on April 10, 
1986. It has been suggested that 
Briscoe County co-host a District 
Meeting in the future.

Frances Kellum reported on 
the TEHA training meeting she 
had attended this week.

For the past 60 years, thé 
Extension Clubs of Texas have 
given scholarships to deserving 
4-H youth. Now seven TEHA 
scholarships are given state-wide 
to youth. In addition scholarships 
are presented to two adults 
wanting to further their educa­
tion. One scholarship is given the 
youth by the district also.

Sherma Flowers of Tulia was 
recipient of one of the adult 
scholarships in 1985.

Each club in the state helps 
support these scholarships. The 
council voted to send a check to 
the state to make these scholar­
ships possible. If any adult is 
interested in applying for this 
scholarship, they need to see 
their County Extension Agent. 
Forms need to be returned by 
April 10.

A nominating committee was 
appointed, consisting of Bena 
Hester, Kathy Kingery and 
Eunice McFall.

After the council adjourned, 
the TEHA members met to 
approve delegates to the District 
Meeting. They are Frances Kel­
lum and Bena Hester, with 
Eunice McFall as an alternate.

Members present at the meet­
ing were Christine King, Kathy 
Kingery, Lanita Cantwell, Bena 
Hester, Frances Kellum, Eunice

McFall and Extension Agent 
Lynda Fogerson.

Jamie Frizzell To 
Scramble In 
Houston Rodeo Event

Jamie Lynn Frizzell, a 14-year- 
old FFA member from Silverton, 
will participate in the 1986 
Houston Livestock Show and 
Rodeo calf scramble on March 1 
in the Astrodome.

The calf scramble is an excit­
ing part of the rodeo action 
starring Barbara Mandrell as 
part of that evening’s perfor­
mance.

Jamie, the son of Lynn and 
Kathy Frizzell, will compete for 
one of the 264 calf purchase 
certificates to be awarded at the 
1986 Rode. Additionally, as many

FEBRUARY SNOW SALE
A D A M S ^ â ÉSpecials Good Feb. 13 - Feb.

8 FOOT
ROUND BALE 

FEEDERS
Reg. $87.50 Now $75.00
Reg. $115.00 Now $95.00

Limited To Stock on Hand

Tillage Tools
Plow Shares—All Sweeps 

And Points
10% on

Everyday Low Prices on Stocked Items. 
Similar Savings on Special Orders.

Example:
18"

Reg.
Less 10%

CHISEL SWEEP
$19.25

1.93
$17.32

Metal Feed Bunk
CLOSEOUT: BELOW DEALER COST!

NOW  ONLY $90.00

“S u p e r  H o t "

Starting
Fluid

10 FI. Oz. Can

BROWN-McMURTRY IMPLEMENT
823-2441 Silverton

19" tool box gives you more 
box per dollar. Durable and 
portable. Full-length piano 
hinge, water-shed cover, 
and oversize positive catch 
drawbolt with padlock eye. 
Baked red enamel finish.

as two youngsters from each 
rodeo performance are awarded 
a “hard luck” certificate for their 
strong efforts in attempting to 
catch a calf, resulting in 32 more 
certificates given.

The Houston Livestock Show 
and Rodeo is Houston’s largest 
entertainment extravaganza and 
its largest charity event, with all 
net proceeds directly benefitting 
youth and education.

The calf scramble, a year-long 
activity, is one of the Show’s 
programs benefitting Texas 
youth. It begins with athletic 
competition in the Astrodome 
and ends with qualitative compe­
tition in the show-ring.

The event involves the turning 
loose of 28 energetic youngsters 
and half as many wild calves in 
one arena. Those who manage to 
grab a calf, halter it and drag it 
across the finish line are provid­
ed with a $600 calf purchase 
certificate.

The certificate, donated by a 
sponsoring firm or individual, is 
used to purchase a purebred 
registered beef or dairy heifer.

The calf is raised by the 
winner for special show-ring 
competition to be held at the 
following year’s Show. Each 
project is closely supervised by a 
vocational agriculture teacher or 
county extension agent.

Additionally, the winners are 
required to submit to the calf 
scramble office accurate financial 
records, essays, photographs and 
a scrapbook for the animal 
project.

Proper livestock evaluation 
techniques, efficient cattle feed­
ing and production methods, 
principles of economics and mon­
ey management are feasible 
learning experiences for the 
youngster who’s managed to get 
a firm hold on a calf.

It’s often believed good luck
to dream of onions.

POLITICAL
ANNOUNCEMENTS

Subject to Action of the 
Democratic Primary

FOR DISTRICT JUDGE, 110th 
Judicial District of Texas:

DAVID CAVE 
Spur, Texas

GEORGE W. MILLER 
Floydada, Texas 

[Re-election]
FOR COUNTY JUDGE, Briscoe 
County, Texas:

JIMMY BURSON
FREDW. MERCER 

[Re-election]
FOR COUNTY AND DISTRICT 
CLERK, Briscoe County, Texas:

MARSHA BRUNSON
b e s s  McWil l ia m s

[Re-election]
FOR TREASURER, * Briscoe 
County, Texas:

JANICE HILL 
SANDI TOMLIN

FOR COMMISSIONER, Briscoe 
County Precinct 4:

BRYANT EDDLEMAN 
[Re-election]

DOYLE STEPHENS
FOR JUSTICE OF THE 
PEACE, Briscoe County Pre­
cinct 1:

JAMES EDWARDS 
[Re-election]
J. L. SELF



Junior High Owls 
Finish With Win

Silverton’s Junior High Owls 
finished their season with a 
victory on February 3. The boys 
defeated Lakeview 27-22.

After having trailed 4-2 at the 
end of the first quarter, the Owls 
rallied to outscore their oppon­
ents 14-4 in the second period. 
Even though they were outscor- 
ed 9-2 in the third period, they 
earned a five-point advantage in 
the fourth period which stood up 
for the win.

Clay Mercer led the scoring 
with eight points. Jon Pigg, 
Lance Stidham, Teddy Hubbard 
and Wayne Henderson tossed in 
four points each, while Kendal 
Minyard rang up three points. 
The others on the team were 
Mark Auston, Timmy Wheeler,
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Cowboy Tied Cinches

Model R 912-17 Strand  
M ohair 32"  

Stainless Steel Rings 
$14.50

W e will tie a c inch on your 
buckles, 17 strand, 34 ”  or 
less for $8.
Add $1 .50 for shipping

Send Check or Money 
Order to:

MAX STEVENSON
PECOS CINCH CO.

P. 0 .  Box 52 
Santa Rosa, NM 88435  
Allow two weeks for delivery.

LINN TRAVEL AGENCY

Toni Rhode Jenkins
Travel Consultant

2950 50th Street 
Lubbock, Texas 79413
Business 806 795-8900 

Home 806 795-7019
Let me help you with 
all your travel needs.

Bryan Ramsey, Kirk Couch, 
Bradley Brunson, Fidencio Reyes 
and Emmy Garcia.

“Those who saw this team in 
action witnessed many exciting 
moments during the season,” 
said Coach Bob Loy. “From the 
very first game they played in 
Lakeview when Wayne Hender­
son made the last basket of ,the 
game, to the final game when 
playing the same school, when 
we went into overtime and came 
out victorious, it was an exciting 
season. It was gratifying to see 
these young men come along 
during the season and I was 
especially proud to see the 
character and desire to achieve 
that they showed keep coming 
back when at certain times many 
would have given up. All this 
shows what this team is made of 
and everyone can be proud of 
these young men for the out­
standing season they had,” the 
coach said.

Their overall record was six 
wins and two losses.

The Owlettes dropped their 
last game, 27-24, trailing at the 
end of each period.

Tonya Clardy and Penni Fo- 
gerson rang up four points each; 
Julie Towe, Tonya Baird and 
Julie Graham scored two points 
each. Others on the team were 
Tracy Tomlin and Carrie Ann 
Grabbe.

4-H, FFA Projects 
Exhibited At 
El Paso Show

Five Silverton 4-H and FFA 
members exhibited livestock pro­
jects at the Southwestern Inter­
national Livestock Show in El 
Paso last week.

Clay Schott claimed a first 
place with his medium-weight 
crossbred barrow. Langdon Rea­
gan placed seventh with a duroc 
and Jeannita Stephens’ light­
weight hamp placed ninth in its 
class.

Also exhibiting barrows in the 
swine show were Brad and Brian 
West.

Clay Schott showed a heavy­
weight chianina in the steer 
show.

Don’t discard extra batter 
from waffles, French toast or 
pancakes. Cook and then 
freeze. When wanted, just 
pop into toaster to reheat.

BRISCOE COUNTY NEWS
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The first airmail flight took place in 1911, between Al­
lahabad and Naini in India—a distance of five miles.

PIONEER
SORGHUM

k

For dryland, 
limited water 
or full irrigation... 
Pioneer has you 
covered!

8493
We just can’t say enough good things about the perform­
ance this hybrid has shown under dryland or limited water 
conditions. On farm after farm, it produced outstanding 
yields of high test weight, hard textured grain . . even 
under extreme heat! 8493 has excellent root and stalk 
strength and outstanding resistance to Biotype C and E 
greenbugs. If you grow sorghum on the Plains, try this one'

8333
When you're pouring on the water and pushing for top sor­
ghum yields, this hybrid will come along with you to make 
the most of everything you put into the crop And it has the 
heat and drouth tolerance to withstand the tough sum­
mers you've come to expect. Outstanding resistance to 
Biotype C greenbugs, very good root and stalk strength 
Performance characteristics you need to grow good sor­
ghum on the Plains. It’s all yours with 8333 from Pioneer

See your Pioneer dealer right away.

Dwain Henderson
823-2034 PIONEER

BR A N D  SEEDS
TREATED WITH

'Registered trademark of Pioneer Hi-Bred International. Inc 
Pioneer* brand products are sold subject to the terms and conditions of sale which are part of the labeling and 

sale documents Pioneer is a brand name, numbers identify varieties
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For Sale
BOWMAN VACUUM CLEAN- 

ers: Prices down, down, down. 
New and Used Panasonics, 
New and Used Kirby Va­
cuums. Only a few left. Call 
823-2313, Silverton. 7-ltc

MAYTAG WASHERS AND 
Dryers For Sale. Service and 
Parts. Fogerson Lumber & 
Supply. 13-tfc

FOR SALE: BUNK FEEDERS 
for cake or cottonseed. Reg. 
$124.50, now only $100.00 
each. Brown-McMurtry Imple­
ment Co. 7-tfc

FOR SALE: SQUARE CANE 
Bales; clean and bright. Stan 
Fogerson, 823-2021. 44-tfc

GREEN VINYL COUCH FOR 
Sale. Approx. 80”. Phone 847- 
2668. 6-ltp

ASSEMBLY OF GOD IS SELL- 
ing Pecans, Walnuts, Cashews, 
Peanuts, etc. 823-2045. 6-4tc

PAINTING
Interior and Exterior. Mud 
and Tape, Spray-on Acous­
tical ceilings. Plainview 
Home Improvement. Call 
collect 293-7622. Free esti­
mates. 3-tfc

Services
SCANNERS: KEEP INFORM- 

ed on weather conditions. 
Grabbe - Simpson Chevrolet- 
Olds, Silverton. 21-tfc

TRASH BARRELS FOR SALE: 
Silverton Fire Department. 
Ask at City Hall. 31-tfnc

FOR YOUR ELECTRIC FEN- 
cing needs, see Brown-Mc­
Murtry. We have battery, hi 
line or solar powered fencers. 
We also carry insulators, gate 
handles and wire. 46-tfc

WATKINS PRODUCTS FOR 
Sale in Silverton. Briscoe 
County News, 508 South Main 
Street, or call 823-2333. 41-tfnc

SHELLED, CRACKED OR 
Whole Pecans. 823-2021, Fo­
gerson Lumber & Supply. 50-tf

1982 MERCURY MARQUIS 10- 
Passenger Station Wagon, 
beige; still under warranty. 
Excellent condition; below 
Book Value. Call Nell Mays at 
995-4115 or 995-2294. 50-tfc

NEED A BIRTHDAY CAKE, 
Cake Donuts, Cookies for 
special occasions. Call Lee at 
847-2624. 4-4tp

FOR SALE: MAGNAVOX CON- 
sole TV and Green Tweed 
Chair. Mary John Harris, 823- 
2269 or 823-2519. 5-tfc

B & B SATELLITE CO. New and 
Used Satellite TV Systems 
priced to clear. 823-2313. 7-ltc

I I M I I i M l i H
/  \  

Life •  Auto
Farm • Home

Crop
J I M M Y  M Y E R S

847-2675 
Silverton, Texas

rwnonm mnmcnsi umori tnsuanncE compnniEs
v____  J

BLOWN INSULATION
Attics and Walls. Call 
Plainview Home Improve­
ment collect, 293-7622. 
Free estimates. 3-tfc

GOOD ALFALFA HAY FOR 
Sale: Small bales; stored in 
barn. 823-2038. 52-tfc

LOCKNEYMEATCO.
Kill Days Monday 

through Friday 
CUSTOM PROCESSING 

Half and Quarter Cut, 
Wrapped, Frozen and Fully 

Guaranteed 
SAM & KELLY 

FORTENBERRY 
652-3305

Corner of U. S. 70 and 
Farm Road 378 South

11-tfc

LET US HELP YOU 
WITH YOUR FERTILIZER 
AND CHEMICAL NEEDS

BRISCOE
COOPERATIVES

(c o o p )
Is Your Business

BABY SITTING WANTED: 
Yes, I do keep babies and older 
children in your homes. Virgin­
ia (Tillie) May, 823-2089. 600 
Broadway. 7-ltp

NOTICE: NO, WE HAVE NOT 
closed our 40-year-old business 
of boot and shoe repair. We 
still do general boot and shoe 
repair, fox jobs, zipper replace­
ment from coveralls to purses, 
saddle and tack repair. Full 
service, top quality materials 
and superior workmanship. 
City Shoe Shop, Perry Thom­
as, Silverton. 5-4tc

SINGER SEWING MACHINES, 
Vacuum Cleaners, Smith Cor­
ona Typewriters, Adding 
Machines, Kirby Sales and 
Service. Buy here, service 
here. Call in Silverton, 823- 
2333. Office located at 620 Noel 
in Memphis, 259-2716. Here 
every two weeks on Thurs­
days. 21-tfc

IS SOMEONE’S DRINKING 
causing you a problem? Call 
Al-Anon, 823-2160. 30-tfnc
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BACKHOE SERVICE
UNDERGROUND 

PIPELINE REPAIR
G. W. CHAPPELL 

I 823-2504 I
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OPPORTUNITY
Would you spend $50 to make 
$10,000 first year and $40,000 
second year? Mick Mason, 293- 
4786, Plainview. 5-4tc

r  RENTALS 
Video Home Movies 

and Players 
VCR and Beta 

Overnight or W eekends i 
J3 RO WNJH AR DWA R1E

TO GIVE AWAY: TWO CUTE 
female Cocker Spaniel pup­
pies. Be ready on Valentine’s 
Day. 823-2498. 6-ltc

|  Siding and Carports
A Alside Super Steel. Call
f Plainview Home Improve-

T ment collect for free esti- ?
I  mates, 293-7622. 3-tfc I

I

°Deadbolts °Safes
°Keys °Locks

Locksmith
Security is our Business 

983-3834 Don Probaaco
15 mi. south of Silverton on 207

Real Estate
FOR SALE: THREE BED- 

room house with storm cellar 
and storage building. 804 Lor­
etta. Call 794-6229 or 455-1240.

7-2tc

MUST SELL IMMEDIATELY: 
Cute two-bedroom house. 
Cheap. Shelly Harris, 823-2507 
or 823-2423. 5-tfc

OUR HOME FOR SALE: Riley 
or Sandy Harris. 6-tfc

TWO-BEDROOM HOUSE FOR 
Sale: Steel Siding, Large Liv­
ing-Dining-Kitchen area, Util­
ity, Storage inside and out, 
Carport. Corner Stalbird & 
Lone Star. Price negotiable. 
847-2652. 6-tfc

TWO BEDROOM, ONE BATH 
Home with large attached gar­
age; carpet and drapes. See 
Verlin Towe or call 214-262- 
7267. Reasonable. 4-tfc

ROOF LEAKING?

Call Plainview Home Im­
provement collect for free 
estimates. 293-7622. 3-tfc

Cards of Thanks
Many thanks and appreciation 

are due so many who helped in 
different ways to store memories 
in our storehouse of “Memory 
and Recall.” These memories will 
be recalled on other occasions as 
we continue through the golden 
years.

We are at a loss in arranging 
the words in our vocabulary to 
express our real feelings of 
humility and gratitude. So may 
we ask you to accept a “Big 
Thank-you with Love.”

Gilbert and Letha Elms

The family of Dorothy Martin 
wishes to extend our grateful 
appreciation for all the prayers, 
visits, phone calls, flowers, cards 
and food. Thank you for staying 
at the hospital when we could 
not. Every act of love and 
kindness will always be remem­
bered. We pray for the Lord’s 
blessings for each and every one. 
We love you all.

George and Van 
Gary, Ramona, Dusty, 

Vanessa and Matt 
and all the family

Once again we would like to 
express our deep gratitude to 
each of you for coming to our aid 
when Elbert hurt himself. A 
special thanks must go to the 
ambulance attendants, paramed­
ics and EMTs, Jeff Tiffin, Ted 
Kingery, James Edwards, Danny 
Francis, Mary Ann Sarchet, 
Lynn Frizzell and Riley Harris. 
Thanks to Roy Reed for driving 
Juanita to Tulia and staying with 
her during X-rays. Thanks to 
Kathy Kingery, Fay Perkins and 
Lois Hill for helping with Chris­
tina and to Calvin Shelton for 
finding Wayne.

Thanks to everyone who call­
ed, sent cards and especially for 
the prayers. Every act of kind­
ness is appreciated. It is once 
again brought to home how great 
it is to live in Silverton. May God 
bless all of you.

Elbert and Juanita Stephens

We would like to express our 
appreciation to each of you for 
the many expressions of love and 
kindness shown to us during the 
loss of our loved one.

God bless you.
Wilton and Shirley Whitehead 

and family
George and Faye Whithead 

and family

I want to thank everyone for 
their kindness and concern, the 
individuals and Sunday School 
classes for their cards, calls and 
visits while I was in the hospital 
and since I’ve been home. Thanks 
for the food that’s been brought 
to my home, to those who 
emptied trash and ran errands 
for me. I appreciate every onfe of 
you. My love and blessings to 
you.

Ollie McMinn

RICK’S MUFFLER

For all your exhaust needs, 
including customizing. 

(806) 823-2015 
Silverton, Texas
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TREE TRIMMING
= Emert’s Nursery and 
= Tree Service §
§ Call Red Emert at =
|  823-2567 after 6:00 p.m. |
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BRISCOE IMPLEMENT
Silverton, Texas

NEW EQUIPMENT
50 Series Tractors 
MFWD, 2 WD & 4 WD 
Titan II Combines 
Planters 
1408 Shredders 
235 Disk 
Front Loaders 
Hay Equipment 
155 Blades 
Grain Drills

USED EQUIPMENT
’80 8640 PTO-3 pt.
2 4840s w/duals
3 4440s
2 4240 Quads
’72 6030 w/duals
’72 4320
’79 MF 2675
25’ Krause Tandem
25’ DT Flex King Chisel

Nights: George 823-2258 or Gerald 847-2217 In i .....................  i i ■ i : ...........
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