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FmHA To Guarantee 
Emergency Loans

Financial assistance to live­
stock and poultry producers 
under the Emergency Live­
stock Credit Art will become 
available neat week through a 
new loan guarantee authority 
of the Farmers home Admini­
stration (Fm HA). a rural 
credit service o f the U S. 
Department of Agriculture.

Joe T. Boone. FmHA Coun­
ty Supervisor, said the agency 
will be prepared to implement 
the recently-enacted law by 
guaranteeing up to 80 percent 
of possible loss on loans made 
by legally organised lenders

to livestock and poultry pro­
ducers

Under terms of the art. the 
loan guarantee program will 
be in effect through July 25. 
1975. It may be eatended for 
b months beyond that date if 
the Secretary of Agriculture 
determined that it is needed 
to help the livestock industry 
obtain sufficient credit.

The law calls for loans to be 
made by banks or other 
legally organized lenders. 
Mr Boone said interested 
producers are urged to make 
applications to. and complete

KC Senior Candidate 
For Fair Sweetheart

» * d  lor

back.
Moving up to the varsity 

this year will be Jerry Stamps, 
defensive half back-tight end; 
Mike Burkham, center; Rusty 
Grimsley, guard; Ray Her­
nandez. tackle; Rudy Hernan-

Greyhounds To 
Scrimmage Jayton

The varsity and junior 
varsity football teams will 
scrimmage Jayton Friday 
night beginning at 7:00 p.m. 
on the Greyhound field, ac­
cording to Coach Don Mul­
lins.

Spectators are asked to 
bring the usual bar of soap to 
the scrimmage. Coach Mul­
lins stated towels were not 
needed as the boys now 
furnish their own.

The Hounds' first schedul­
ed game will be Friday, 
September 6. against Roches­
ter beginning at 8:90 p.m. at 
Rochester.

dez, tackle; Randv Lewia. 
center • defensive tackle; 
Bruce Railsback. defensive 
half back • split receiver; 
Mark Howell, defensive back

split end; Jimmy Moore, 
quarterback defensive back; 
Al Bateman, running back - 
defesive corner back.

S ee  HOUiVDS P r . 7

Area Students 
Make Dean’s 
List At Tech

LUBBOCK - A total of four 
Tesas Tech University stu 
dents from Knox City and 
three from Benjamin were 
recognized for academic 
achievement during the 
spring semester and were 
listed on the deans honor 
rolls.

To Qualify for the recog­
nition. student* must achieve 
a grade average of 3 0 on a 4 
point scale

Included or <’ * 0 *
from Knot City cbarlea 
R Escobar. Agriculture; 
Doris M Howell. Art* and 
Science. Ikm E. Pack. Busi­
ness Administration; and 
Kathy Verhalen. Education

Beniamin honor student* 
included Don E Roberts, 
John M Woolley and Kermd 
O Woolley, all In Agrtcul- 
lure,

Appfuiimately 21.500 stu­
dent* are enrolled in the sli 
colleges and two school* at 
the university Agricultural 
Sciences. Arts and Sciences, 
Business Administration, Ed­
ucation. Engineering, and 
Home Economics and the 
Graduate School and the 
School of Law Teia* Tech it 
o«se of the major universities 
in the Mate and third largest 
In enrollment

Debbie Reese, represent­
ing the Knos City FFA 
chapter, will be competing 
with 23 other girls for the title 
of West Tesas Fair Sweet­
heart nest week in Abilene.

The sweetheart contestants 
were honored with a get- 
acquainted luncheon at the 
Westwood Club last Saturday 
at 12:00 noon Interviews and 
pictures were taken. followed 
by the first judging.

The girls will ride in the 
parade which begins Satur­
day. September 7, at 10:00 
a m. and be present at the 
noon ceremonies marking the 
official opening of the West 
Tesas Fair.

The contestants will model 
in the Fashion Show in the 
Modem Living Mall on the 
Fairgrounds Monday, Sep­
tember 9 at 7:30 for the 
second judging.

Jamie Hemphill o f Cole­
man. winner in last year’ s 
event, will be acting hostess 
when the Sweetheart contes­
tants are presented on the 
open stage at the fairgrounds 
al 7:30 p m Wednesday. 
September II .  This will be 
the final appcamace on stage 
for the contestants at which 
time the new sweetheart will 
be named.

Debbie, whose parents sre 
Mr and M-s. Charles Reese 
of Knoa City, is a aemor 
student at Knoa City High 
School. She is head cheer-

1 Hound# Plckad To 
|Win District 7A

According to the Abilene 
ntaportW News, the Knoa 
k( us Greyhounds hase been 
fjKKged as the no I team 
Hbl the 1974 season in 
[District 7 A The story 
(appeared in Friday morn 
[ing's edition

l ompetition could be 
[anvthng but easy, with 
Jieams like Crowell. Padu 
[ f lk , Mundav. and new 
(members Aspermonl and! 
[Haskell, the release said 

Three players who recei- 
L , ,! honors Iasi season 
(return for the Greyhound* 
[including All Area and All 
FDistrict Robert Taylor and 
LAll Dislrut plavers ( larlie 
rHye and Donald Swear 
(inger
[ Other returning letter 
(men include Joev Swam, 
[l  lift Rav Bo Johnson Dale! 
[Blotham JM Huff. Jimmy^ 
[ivnn and Jerry Eaton

Miliar Wins
The first annual Knoa City 

Invitational Slowpitch Soft 
Ball Tournament ended Sat 
urday night with the team 
from Mundav the winner, and 
the Merchant* from Seymour 
finishing second

All proceed* went to the 
Little League of Knoa City 
with S21S donated to the fund 
from the tournament,

A special thanks was exten- 
cied to the wives of the Knos 
City team for preparing and 
selling refreshment* and to 
Jem  May. Jimmy White, and 
the Skiles Brothers for thetr 
help in preparing the field 
ard running the tournament

DEBBIE REESE
leader of the Knot City Pep 
Club, member of the Hound- 
ette basketball and track 
teams. Beta Club, and Annual 
Stall

She is active in Future 
Homemakers of America and 
Future Teacher* of America.

An active member of the 
First Baptist Church. Debbie 
is pianist for a Sunday School 
department and participates 
in all youth activities in the 
church.

loan arrangements with len­
ding institutions. The lender 
in turn will ask FmHA for a 
loan guarantee if one ia 
required The lender will 
process the application, close 
the loan and service it.

The maximum loan to any 
single borrower that can be 
assisted by an FmHA guaran­
tee is $250,000. Loans can be 
repayable in I to 3 years, 
although renewal for 2 years 
mas be authorized. Interest 
rstes are determined between 
borrower and lender.

Mr Boone said the agency 
is authorized to guarantee up 
to 80 percent loss a lender 
may incur on loans to bona- 
fide farmers and ranchers 
who breed, raise, fatten, or 
market beef and dairy cattle, 
hogs, sheep, goats, chickens 
and turkeys. A majority of 
the borrower's income must 
come from the operation, and 
a majority portion of the bor­
rower's time must be devoted 
to the livestock or poultry 
production.

In the case of a corporation 
or partnership, assistance can 
be extended only with the 
majority partners or stock­
holders are primarily engaged 
in the livestock or poultry 
production.

FmHA guarantees will be 
made only when the bonafide 
farmer or rancher cannot 
obtain financing without a 
guarantee Loans may not be 
used to expand operations.

Mr. Boone said the county 
FmHA office serving the area 
where the borrower's live ­
stock or poultry operations 
are conducted will handle 
requests from lenders for 
guarantees, or supply infor­
mation on the loan guarantee 
program

The FmHA Office serving 
Knot County is located at 
1101 East Mam Street. Knox 
City, Texas

Funeral services for long 
time resident Mrs. Alma 
Taylor Edwards were held 
Saturday. August 24. at 10 00 
a m. in the First United 
Methodist Church The Rev. 
Dick Richards, pastor, offici­
ated.

Burial was in thr Knox City 
Cemetery under the direction 
of Smith Funeral Home

Mrs Edwards. 81. wife of 
the late Dr T.S.Edwards, 
died Thursday at ll:S0 a m 
in the Brazos Valley Care 
Home where she had resided 
since 1970.

Born in Lampasas August 
27, 1892. she moved to Knox 
City with her parents, the late 
Mr and Mrs. Z.T Rogers, in 
190b

First Sunday 
Singing At 2

The monthly community 
singing will be held Sunday. 
September I, from 2 00 until 
4 00 p.m in the Foursquare 
Church in Knox City.

Everyone ia invited to come 
and enjoy the tinging and 
fellowship.

Mongrrln To Taach 
Children'# Art Class

Interested parents are invi­
ted to meet with Dee Dee 
Mongrain of the Bateman 
Ranch Tuesday. September 1, 
at 2 00 p m at the Korner 
Kitchen to enroll their chtl 
dren in art classes in freehand 
drawing and water color

“ There will alto be a das* 
for young adults.'' Dee Dee 
said

She bolds an Associate of 
Sctencr Degree in Art from 
South Plaint College in Level 
land, where she was recipient 
of an art award

She attended the old Stam­
ford College and later married 
Dr. Edwards on November 
14. 1912, in Knox City.

Mrs. Edwards and her 
husband established the first 
hospital in Knox City, which 
later became the Knoa Coun­
ty Hospital.

She was a charter member 
of the Knot City Study Club, 
a member of the Knox City 
Garden Club, Knox City 
Chapter No 119 Order of the 
Eastern Star, and the First 
United Methodist Church

Survivors include one sun. 
Lt. Col. Tom Edwards of Fort 
Sam Houston; three daugh 
ters. Mrs. Tom (Sydna) 
Hampton of Dallas. Mrs. 
Charles (Wynelle) Turner of 
Lexington, Va.. and Mrs. 
Fred (M arilyn) Dallai of 
Houston; a sister. Mr*. Abby 
Bailey of Wichita Falls; and 
ten grandchildren She was 
preceded in death by her 
husband and one son, Ken­
neth

Decoupag# Cli 
To Bogin Sept 3

Decoupage classes will be 
offered by American Handi­
craft Associate Dealer. The 
Art Stall in the Mini Mall 
Tuesday. September 3, at 
7:30 p m

Annette Hester will teach 
the lessons based on research 
testing thal has been done by 
American Hindu raft* Design 
and Development Depart­
ment. This procedure is the 
most consistent and safest 
method to decoupage

DM You Know
that Mrs Donny Michalik, 
’'201 Wood Hollow. Onk Hot 
low Apt 217, Austin. Tesas 
7#7J1. subscribe* to The 
Knot Countv News*

ALL THAT REMAINED OF THE ROOF of this mobllo horn# Tuesday afternoon 
was a small remnant on the end near the pickup truck According to Chief of 
Police Eddie Carr, a tornado hit the mobile home ripping off Its roof and 
d es troy in g  the barns about 1 45 p m. H eavy  ra ins a lso occurrad for 
approximately forty-five minutes, dumping four to five inches m the area west of 
Knox City Owners of the mobile home. Mr and Mrs George Roach and young 
son were at home eight miles west of Knox City when the small twitter dipped 
out of the heavy cloud, but reported no injuries Their other three children were 
at school at the time Only a trace of rain was reported In Knox City Tuesday 
afternoon

All Area Hunters 
Invited To Meet

An organizational meeting 
for interested hunters is sche­
duled tonight. Thursday, at 8 
o'clock at the Komer Kitchen.

The American Sportsman 
Gub with members all over 
the state has recently leased 
the hunting rights on 52.000 
acres of the Swenson Ranch 
near Paducah The club has 
over 500.000 acres in Texas 
leased for hunting and fishing 
privileges for its members 
and their families

Bill Roe of Abilene will be 
here to explain the advanta­
ges in belonging to the club 
and everyone is cordially 
invited to be present

Steering Committee 
Picks Five Nominees

The steering committee for 
Texas Concerted Services in 
Training and Education Com­
mittee (CSTE) met Thursday. 
August 22 at 12 00 noon at the 
Korner Kitchen to draw up a 
tentative list of nominees for a 
coordinator for Haskell Jones 
Knox Stonewall counties 

economic development pro­
ject.

All five nominees have 
been interviewed and the list 
was band delivered in Austin 
Friday. "The nominees and 
the recommended candidate 
must be approved bv the state

Mrs. T. S. Edwards 
Buried Here Saturday

Rogers Lankford On 
Coaching Staff

Rogers Lankford, former 
Knox City football star, is 
serving as a football student 
assistant on the McMurry 
College coaching staff this 
season.

I ankford played wide recei­
ver last fall and was a pole 
vaulter for the Indians in 
1972. He is working with 
offensive receiver* under as­
sistant coach J W Aldridge

Lankford is a senior physi­
cal education major and Eng­
lish min >r. He graduated 
from Knos City High School 
in I97| He is the son of Mr 
and Mrs Kenneth Lankford

CSTE office." steering com­
mittee chairman. Charles 
Stenholm said The coordi­
nator chosen will be announ­
ced by September I.

The coordinator chosen will 
direct the four counties to 
coordinate various agencies 
for improvement of educa­
tion. employment, health, 
housing, and economic re ­
sources

The four counties have 
accepted a $20,000 grant for 
the project.

Those attending the meet­
ing included Judge Sam E. 
Gonts and J.B Tabor, both of 
Knox City, Joe Ford of 
Hamlin. Alton Bvrd of Roch 
ester. Doug Myers of Mun 
day, Joe Allbue of Sagerton. 
Dalton Gill of Aspermonl. 
Tom Alvts of Old Glory. Gem 
Richard* and Stenholm. both 
of -Stamford

Art Classes 
Will Resume

Art classes will resume 
Monday. September 9. at b.30 
p.m at the Community Cen­
ter.

John Crump. University 
trained artist and teacher and 
co-owner of Station Studio 
and Gallery at Anson again 
will leach the classes, accor 
ding to Kay Stewart

Crump was an assistant lo 
Fredrick Taubes for five year* 
and is now co-leacbrr with 
Jan Herring in her Goudcmft 
studio each summer

This year he will give lec­
tures and demonstration* and 
hold one day workshops 
through out the southwest

Chess Club To 
Moot Tuesday

According to a spokesman, 
the Knox County Chess Gub 
will meet Tuesday night. 
September 3, at 7:30 p m at 
the First Christian Church.

The club voted to meet the 
Aral Tuesday night of each 
month, beginning with this 
meeting

All area Chess plavers are 
invited to come and enyov an 
evening of Chess

ROGERS LANKFORD

Stores To Close 
On Labor Day

Most o f the Knox City 
businesses will be closed on 
Monday. September 2. in 
observance of Labor Day.

Labor Day is one of the 
holidays agreed to each year 
by the local Chamber of 
Commerce member*, accor­
ding to Mrs Doris Crown- 
over. manager

Hobby Club To 
Meet Sept. 5

The first meeting of the 
year for ihr Knox City Hobby 
Gub will be a salad supper 
Thursday, September S. at 
7 00 p m at the Community 
Center

A special program will be 
presented by Mrs Romaine 
Stubbs on "Arts and Crafts."

Everyone is invited to at­
tend _ _

Weather
rUIUtlSHED BY FLA NT 

MATERIAL# CENTER
4 MUua NW a1 K i m CteT
dale tew high rain
8 21 M 9b
8 22 M 95
8-2J b7 91
8 24 M 88 13
§25 hS #7
8-2b b9 84
8-27 65 82 .52
8 28 b4

Tte ia ftr Pleads
iiiity  I t  diaries

A Knot County teenager 
pleaded guil’ y on Monday, 
August 2b. to misdemeanor 
charges of unlawful posses 
sion of less than two ounces of 
marijuana

The charges were a result 
of an investigation and arrest 
eonducted by the County 
Sheriff H C'.Stone snd Mun 
day Chief of Police Bovd 
Baker

Under the law. the defen­
dant could have been sen­
tenced to a fine of not more 
than SI .000 or confinement in 
jail for not more than 180 
days.

County Judge Sam E 
Gout* assessed punishment 
of a $500 00 fine plus costs 
and sixty day* tn jail The jail 
sentence was probated for a 
period of one year due to the 
fart that this was thr defen­
dant's first offense

County Attorney Bobby D. 
Burnett commented that the 
use of drugs is becoming an 
ever increasing problem even 
in rural areas such as Knox 
Counts and thal future drug 
offender* in this county can 
espert a similar punishment if 
arrested and convicted

KC N«w» Office To 
B# Open Labor Day

The New* office reminds its 
rrader* that the office will 
remain open Monday, labor 
Day. although other busmea 
se* will be closed Readers 
are encouraged to call in or 
bring in their new* and adver­
tising.

All New* correspondenls 
are requested to bring their 
news in on Monday or Tues­
day as there will be no mail 
delivery on Sunday or Mon 
dav. If vou mail your new* In, 
please mail it on Saturday and 
we should receive H by Tues­
day.
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fo r FAST ACTION us e  t i e

MM SALE ( ----------GaM
net 3* Veto Cal) Rochemrf
81* "43 3318 8-22 2tp

o i d f e n c e  M i t r i t i  (or
u k .  Coil 858 J102 •her 
I p m 8222k

MM M U  Good Working 
Black and »h m  Catalan TV 
180 Co m m  W L Du k m  
U n tm o ew  Aptt Apt #1* 
Phone *5 8  32t" 8-22 3 *

V i T n  T 801 CHS »ieel 
putib ail LiMlt of * n  Can 
Builder* Supplt *58 341* 
8 >  2k

108 SALK • 1883 Wildcat 
Butch tudur hard top 

ciena CaH San 
Phune*58JB52 822 tfc

R LM M a GE SAL* Too
families Tkondit Fndat, 
Sararday Cloths, picture 
frames ciotbr* row name ■ 
108 A rt H behind Texaco 
Station Mandat H igh*at 
828 Ik

T I M I D  aad apprvted bt
million* o f homemakers 
Blur Luatrr carper cleaner ta
ivp t Pern "» Knot City.
Treat________________828 lu

T ^ p T r T '  TOL8 BAND St
bat tag a Community Band 
C airttdar If act contacted bt 
a Band Parent, pieaae call 
*583*C" 828 3tr

8  \NTFD - Someone to take 
up patmetnt an a 18 mo aid 
Cunsoir Model Singer Sewing 
machine Duet ztg rag and
ail fanct xtitches OngmalH 
SJ88 -v balance S128 83 or 
take up pavmrnt* of $15 8*
Ca8*S8 J5C2 815 Jtp

K M  SAL*. Registered Angm
Buiit to 2 reart aid 8*Ut 
James Lung 8 murt north aA 
Cron ell P8ont night*.
81" 838 2835 T »8 I1 k

K M  SALi Itoto (mWlm 
Perfect cundittoe - V u  nerl
belted tire* Contact Otit 
Harbert, Phone 858-3848 
828 Itp

W I K I  An tune needing a
ride to the Ftrat Bapttat 
Chart h Sen net. call Bat 
Mat at b58 3810 or Terry 
Bntaur at 858 3328 88 4tc

S R A lS I PLOW AMD S3 B 
VIS S H B I0 0 IB  REPAIR 
PARTS Non te Mott Alt* 
BraAmg pion tharet tar John 
Ueere. IHC and (Miter Cat 
lace Buttrrt lur planting 12. 
14 and 22 1  Jobe Egen 
bacher Implement Co.. CaB 
8S8 3242 87 tfc

*111 B O  maire held* be 
tore or after combining AJno 
bole on a percent or by the 
bole Call 858 386* Mane or 
Umet Oarr 815 3tp

( D M  ACT PAPER ar ail able 
non m W pattern* Knot 
Builder* Supplt. 858 3418 
828 2u

ABT (  LASSES to
dat September 8 at 8 30 p m
at the Community Center 
3oha Crump of Annan teach 
er For information pbonr 
858 35*1 Bat Sm art

828 2tc

SEE 30 1 8  M O M  M tN TS
before you but More than 50 
draign* to chaoae from Alw 
enrb work 3 C McGee 
1821 tfc

YOU are welcome at 
First United 

Methodist Church
10:00 A M

.................  1 1 :0 0  A . M .

0 :0 0  P  M

CLOSE O i l  SPECIALS -
Some Pa an t nhdr thet laM 
M price Boot Builder* 
Snow* 858 341b 828 2k

(OB SAUL Ib ft M<ng A 5 ft
wtdr Gootr Neck Slock Trail 
er 18*2 Chevrolet 3 4 am*. 
4 speed Pvtup radm A Am

Contact Fred Carter or call 
454 2211 After S. call 
«--* Mil 8 1 .H111U1 "4  Ik

IP  AAD O l’T I
828 2>c______________________

fFRTUXUR AVaJLABU
Ire* 48% Nitrogen Bulb 
(Mm Ammc Phot 18280. Bag 
nr Bulk . 12 24 12. Bag or 
Bulk 13 38-0. Bulk All 
fertiluer pellet type, not a 
biend W r do cuatom spread 
mg »tth two tract* atadabie 
Charlie Myer* Gram and 
Fertilizer. Bed Spring* 
Phoae* Be* 81'-888 3064 
Home 888 3084 828 lie

( OB V A IL  Begtairred Angus 
heifer* Parr* bred down In 
yearling* Jame* Long. 8 
aide* north Craned left udr 
highoay Phone sight*.
*1 "438 2835 7-18 V

POODLE ( u r r u c
Elliott. JIO *  Belknap. 
Srvmour Trass "8380 (Alone 
81 *882820 Make appoint 
merits Monday through Sal nr 
day Open 8 to 5 Dipping 
C lipp ing Bath* aad Nad* 
828 tfc_______________________

(OB SALT Plroft of sand
and gratel. and drisenay 
material* Will deliver. or 
ml) load you at my place 
Bu*ter Tolvoa. Phoae 
45*-2034. Benjamin. Trias

(B EE  License Plate* aad 
loner imerrst rate* » her ton 
finance tour car nith Leo 
Fetich 422-42S8. Monday 
88 He_______________________

CALVES 7 m 14 day* old
Healths aad waned an battle 
Free dehrery an 10 or more
(2141 223-5171 after 7 p m
8  V  52k

Lunchroom Menu
BBI Ah I AST M E M Si 
SFPT3MBEB 2-A. 1874 
Mandat Holiday 
Tamdat: Orange 3 mot But
tered Toast » uh Jelly Milk 
*  tlinn  da« Banana Beads
to Eat Cereal. Buttrred Toast 
Milk
Thursday! Orange 3u*ce 
Scrambled Egg Buttered 
Toast mth JeBy Milk 
frtday: Orange 3mce. Break 
fast Roll Milk

LINCH M IN I  Si 
S fPTfM BEB 28 l<T4 
Mannas Labor Day Hoiidat 
la radasi Fish Stick*. Black 
eye Pea*. Sea»oaed Beet* 
Orange Ring*. Thick Sherd 
bread n itv Butter. Tartar 
Sauce. Chocolate Pudding. 
Milk
W edaesdati Enchilada*. 
Green Bean* Buttered 
Squath Sherd Bread Apricot 
Cobbler. Milk
Thuradat: Hamburger* mth
all the Trimming*. French 
Erie*. Chilled Peachc*. Kick 
apoo Krunch (  oufcie* Milk 
Fridas: Chicken Fried Steak 
ettrt mth Graty. Mashed 
Potatoes. Green Salad with 
Fresh Toma pea. Hot Boll* 
mth Butler. Banana Nut Cake 
Square* Milk

Political
Calendar

Notice
Aft*Thai ir ac-tedancr vft*

dr IJTfc of the Pen* 
RIMINAl TRESPASS (Sam 

air Bil U pnaaed bt the *2ad
AB public*, tdsrn itng 
he pmd fur u adtaacc

For Scale 
KJt* Dwmci

MART KIBCHHOFT
i Republic an Party!

The abuse political an 
nounsemrat a a* paid far bt 
the candidate Bated

COUNSELOR FOB 
MANPOH LB TRAINING 
PBOGBa MS W ANTED

The Went Central T«aa* 
Council o f Gosernment. a 
regional manpower spontte 
under the Governor of Texas 
m i resetse application* lor 
Program Counselor* until 
Wednesday September 4 
|8i4 5 DO pm  Applicants 
must hate a college or 
aa itertity  degree in either 
( uwatelmg Sociology. P»s 
etiology or ta allied Social 
Science curriculum or have 
had an equal amount of 
rspenence m social » ark or 
counseling with the dtaad 
tan tagrt Counselor* mas 
need to re locate mthm the 
18-coaaty region For add 
tsonal information and appii 
cation form coatac 'am e* 
Swam or Brad Fletben W nt 
Central T eta* Conactl of 
Government. P O  Boi 3185 
0348 *fa. 12th St ) Abilene 
Teta* "8*04 Phone 8|5 
*72 8544 828 l»c

b i  m m  a g e  s a l e

• 1200 North 5th Old House 
across from Ag Building 
North o f School Rug* 
Kitchen Cabinet* Bathroom 
Fixture* Chair* Men's A 
Bor*’ Sun* A Shirt* Babt 
Ckithe* A Furniture M tv  
Hem* Mr* Btl! Magee

8  ?8 |*e

(ARM AND lASCH WILD
INCj. portable ■ rider Bull 
dmg pipe for sale different 
sue* Will build pens aad 
barat CaB Homer Rotator
|RI?I 454 3341. Benjamin
"25 tfc

RETURN HO Ml
Mr and Mr* D u g Mr-a

zer and Trhe have reornth 
returned home from vacation 
mg ia Sait Antonio They 
tinned her sister* aad then 
lamthe* and came back by 
Hamlin and visited their 
daughter and family. Mr and 
Mr* Jimmy Skiie*. Scotty 
aad Krtcue

Last weekend the Meaner* 
itatted in Lubbock mth Mr 
nad Mrs Floyd Baker

ai land* of the 
W T Waggoner (stair are
POSTED -nave and t i t t f i

T R U T HJOHN BIGGS
13 2 tfc

BETIRN HOMF
Mr and Mrs Arche Lieb 

and Charlie hare returned 
home after spending two 
week* in C reedc Colorado 
ft shine

IN MrkINNE'Y
Mr and Mr* Wtilts Hines 

i (sited their daughter and her 
famtlv Mr and Mrs Larry 
Shieldi Ricky and Victor at 
McKuinei last week 

The Hines and Shield* 
famtlK* met Mr and Mr*. 
Rot Huvet. Leslie and Clay at 
Grapes me Lake for the week­
end.

h8h8888M W BBBM W BtW BBBW NM BBBINW M M k
Wn ftavn rucofvwd • nan shlpmant of maturfal
GIVE US A TRY . ALL WORK GUARANTEED

CHARLIE’S
UPHOLSTERY

i Streams In 1
i

So we hate tee a and 
proved that what the prophet*

WATEB »  E li  DOfcXfNC
irrygntton m t Kwnc k i . CaB 

, w p Hat 181 ' 8u4 3 "T  m
Ha shell ' I t  tfc

FOB VALE Set wtr* * - p  
non pipe au me* ef a ta  
•"cl- gated p«pe See Budd> 
Angie 815 tfc

LADTW.-GS FOB SALE For
infarmatM or to order, enfi
Claud Sean Jajrtoa. 80* 
2J"-*222 7-18 V

FOB SALE: Clean. 18*0 
Chevrolet 2 tot track wwh 18 
ft factor< flat bed motor and 
transm.ssion overhauled

i-drtc

rrs  T» RRIfK the was we re
vllm g Blue Lustre to clean 
nigs and upboitxcry. Bent 
efactru vhampooer SI City 
Hardware 828 Ik

FOB SALI 18"2 Honda Trail 
80. like aew *00 miles CaH
Charlie Clarke. *58 3845 
828 Itp

PICTLB I f BAM INC Cm  
tom and Beady made Soch 
ery Matting and Glaaa Work
Art Supplies Diacowai Prices 

Art Lessons - Day aad 
rteam g* 108 Swenson 
Gamford phone 815 "LS451 
MaesGaDert 8284tc

C ABD OF THANKS
The family of Mrs T.S. 

Edwards wishes to express its 
most sincere appreciation far 
all the kindnesses to our 
mother the beautiful flowers 
the lotely music, and the 
drtKuws food

Tour visits made to our 
mother in the Care Home 
were omforting to her aad 
great It appreciated by each of 
ns.

Out love for thtt community 
will remain with us always 

The Family of 
828 lu  Mrs T 5 Edward*

weF to pat Hoar attention to 
r. i rvThmg tfcet hare wraten 
far hhr lights shining mta> 
dark camera, the* word* help 
a* m understand many thing, 
tha: atherwmr would hr dark 
and lifTu nh "  0 Peter I 18 

W f know that the Nen 
Testament n a bistort of the 
tutfvJlmewt oA Old Testament 
Script area foretold by the 
Hob mm of God who spake 
as tfcry were moved by the 
Halt Ghost Therefore, to 
encourage us to be well 

m the eternal 
of the Scripture the 

> ut vital we would 
wed to pay artentioa to 

if we apply our hearts 
to understand the Scriptures, 
the* we mB be able to regu 
lasr our thoughts, out words, 
our anon aad our whole irres 
according to His Word The 
light of the WOBD will 
Stream ato our being scatter 
mg the darkness, bring peace 
and understanding.

Office Phone 
8882987

VERA.TEXAS

THE GREAT 
AMERICAN 
■ C T O
BTARMNQ

LARRY MAHAN

SERVICES Of THE 
( K I  RCH Of GOD 
I *  ( HRiST

Missionary Bohmsoa of 
O Bc—n said they 
ed with a very goo

The Gome Chorch afao had 
•erricws for about three ntghti

•m ra  very sorry about v -r 
the death of Mr Samoel »««ww 
Bennett to Abdcwc Last Mon * 1
dey

Sept and Mrs A C Ben 
nett were his parewti 

The fnneral was held at |
Bethel Chnrch of God m * •*7 ^  
Christ. Abilene this past 
Friday.

Sunshine Band wax held 
Set

Sunday School and morning 
service were held. Pastor 
Brunei! preached hoc., Isa
33:2.

The Monday Church held 
ns Church Anniversary Sun
day. Elder R.L Williams 
preached from Psalms 122 1
and Ea 25 1.2.

SU

IN REESE HOME 
Mr and Mrs R.L Mitchell 

and Cathy of Dallas visited hi* 
sister and her faauts Mr and 
Mr* Charles terse and Deb 
bte Saturday

Hospital
News

p a t ie n t s  in  h o s p it a l  
AS or ALGLST 24. 1874
K oet City; Nettie Wilcox, 
Nellie Smith
Rochester Fannie Miles. 
Marsha Shackelford aad Babt
Boy
Monday: J F Hrndni
Goree: Ann Birkenfcld and 
Pabt Boy

PATIENTS DISMISSED 
SINCE AUGUST 17. 1874 
Knot Clr»: FJaioe Fatoo and 
Baby Boy. William Duncan. 
Howard Ward
L arue: Kathleen Birkenfcld 
Dennis Watson. Kate Glas- 
« » •
t nthrfc : Jack Rodger* 
Mnndatt Annie Allen. Jo 
Matte Scott. Ray Howell, 
Rosa Belltnghausen. Martha 
Hunter. Tom Brandon. Lactlle 
Stodghtll
O’Briew: Rob Johnston. Bur 
ton Elmore 
HaaheB: Alma Reid 
Rurhet ltf  W ysanda Pi va sale. 
Wesley Adam*

June Navrattl

CARD OF THANKS
Wr would like to sincerely 

express our gratitude to those 
who rendered their service 
and friendship by bringing 
food, flower*, card*, and 
comfort

A special (hanks also to the 
Goodwill Club

May God blest each oae of
you

Leo. Sug. Tern aad 
Brenda Ham*

8 28 He
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BUIE, TEXAS
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da** tht* year and neat year 
Clan* favorite* will probably 
he elected later in the year

SOPHOMORE C U SS NEWS 
by Sheer* Jarkaen

We finally atarted achool 
and *o far everything ia 
turning out O K We had a 
da** meeting laat week and 
officer* were chosen and they 
are Preaident. Adrian Jones 
Vice Preaident. Tamie Gruub 
staff. Secretary. Cindy Ellti. 
ton; Treaaurer. Shery II Guinn; 
Reporter. Sherry Jackson

FRESHMAN CU SS  NEWS 
by Junior Gear alas

The Freshman Class of 
1974-75 met in Mr*. Bauach t 
room to elect officers Tues- 
day. August 20 The 1974-75 
Freshman officer* are: Mike 
Howell. Preaident; Mark 
Clonts. Vice President. Tern 
Harris. Secretary; Angie 
Rios. Treasurer; Junior Gon- 
aales. Reporter; and our 
sponaor is Mr* Linda Bausch 
We haven't elected favontes 
yet

The Varsity Greyhounds 
and Jr. Varsity Bullies travel­
ed to Holliday Friday, the 
2)rd. I will give the results in 
nett week's paper

High School is liked by 
every Freshman. At last, we 
can say we are High School 
Students, but we won't when 
it comes to the initiation Hal 
Ha'
PEP CLUB NEWS 
by Vickie Berryman

Last Thursday the Grey­
hound Pep Club had its first 
meeting for the school year 
*74-‘75. In the meeting we 
discussed our uniforms. They 
will consist of blue jeans with 
a white turtle neck top and a 
red shirt jacket.

Also at the meeting we 
elected new officers. They 
are: President. Temi Baker; 
Vice President. Sarah Me- 
Gaughey; Secretary-Treasur­
er. Carolyn Orr; and Repor­
ter. Vickie Berryman. Two of 
the girls have held their office 
for two straight years. They

August 29, 1974 KNOX COUNTY

CHOSEN TO HEAD THE KENNEL for the coming 
achool year are editor Stacy Angle, Handing, senior 
daughter of Mr and Mr*. Buddy Angle, and assistant 
editor Lite Boone, Jjnlor daughter of Mr and Mrs. 
Joe Boone M r* Renella Watson is Kennel sponsor

Kennel Editors Named

|M AND JA N IE ’S 
Barber Shop 
in Rochester
OPEN 8 TO 5 

ESDAY through SATURDAY 
|Rsgular Haircuts $1.75 

air StylM $2.50 and up

Mrs Renella Watson, 
sponsor of the school news. 
The Kennel, has appointed 
Stacy Angle. Knoi City High 
School senior, as editor and 
Lisa Boone. KCHS junior, as 
assistant editor of the school 
publication.

Stacy, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Buddy Angle, placed 
third in Regional Editorial 
Writing in Lubbock last 
spring and in district compe­
tition. placed first in feature 
writing, second in editorial 
writing, second in newswri­
ting. and third in headline 
writing. She also won first in 
the headline division at the 
Stamford Literary Meet last 
February.

A member o f the High 
School Choir. Stacy serves as 
an officer in Future Home­
makers of America, and is a 
member of Future Teachers

are Temi Baker and Vickie 
Berryman. Sarah McGaughey 
holds her office for three 
years straight, and this is 
Carolyn Orr's first year to 
hold the office of Secretary- 
Treasurer.

We all hope you fans will 
come support our Greyhounds 
to a year-long V-l-C-T-O-R-Y!

BAND NEWS 
by Adrian Jones

The Knot City High School 
Band is off to a good start this 
year with seventy eighth 
graders. Freshmen. Sopho-

of America and the Annual 
staff She was chosen first 
runner-up in the Miss Teen 
age Abilene Pageant last 
year.

Lisa, the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Joe Boone, is a 
member of the Choir. FTA. 
FHA. Band, and serves as 
secretary-treasurer of the 
newly-formed Rode- Club. 
She also participates in bas­
ketball.

Her main interest is rodeo­
ing and Lisa recently was a 
state finalist in barrels and 
poles and placed .evrnth in 
the state in barrels.

Both girls are active mem­
bers o f the First United 
Methodist Church where they 
participate in the adult choir.

Mrs Watson explained 
that each week the girls will 
be responsible for typirg the 
school news and turning it in 
to the local newspaper.

mores. Juniors, and Seniors. 
Despite everyone's busy 
schedule, we manage to have 
practices every Monday. 
Tuesday, and Thursday.

O fficer* for the '74-'75 
school year were chosen a 
week before school started 
and they are as follows 
President. Rickv Bishop. Vice 
President, Timi Graham: Sec­
retary-Treasurer. DeLacy 
Bateman. Librarian, Brenda 
Harris; and Reporter. Adrian 
Jones.

As o f now the band is

ion Regional Junior College
ISEYMOUR EXTENSION CEN TER

Seymour High School
Fall 1974

Thursday, September 5 

Monday, September 9

Monday, December 16 
Thursday, December 19

Registration, 6:00 p.m.
Seymour High School Cafeteria
Lata Registration, 6:00 p.m. 
Classes Begin, 6:30 p.m.
Final Exams 
Final Exams

CLASS SC H ED U LE
MONOAY

<03 PrlnelplM of Accounting S:30-S:30 
306 Horticulture S;00-10;00 
30S Beginning Shorthand 6 30-9:30 
101 Competition and Orammar 6 30-e 30 
321 General Psycholegy B:30 • 9:30

THURSDAY 
403 Lab 6 30-6:30 
307 Beginning Typing 6:30-9:30 
309 Lab 6:30-9:30 
301 U S. History to 1M6 6 30-9 30 
401 Beginning Spenlth 9:30-9:30 

Lab to be arranged

Coat 930 00 per atudent excluding books and lab *«ea where applicable 
All couraea carry collage credit and are approved for Veterana Assistance 

Anyone with a high achool diploma or GED or who if 21 years o» eg* 
or older may enroll In the classes 

High achool senior* may enroll with permission o« the high 
school principal, and collage credit will be awarded 

upon the *tudant * graduation from high achool

f o r  a d d i t i o n a l  i n f o r m a t i o n  c o n t a c t

^non Regional Junior College 
MOO College Drive 
v*non, Texas 76384 
®1T) 552-6291

or
Seymour High School 

(817)888-2947

working on its first halt tune 
show which will be performed 
September 6 at the G rey­
hounds' first football game. 
The Greyhound Marching 
Band is under the field super­
vision of Timi Graham, drum 
major, and Kary Kent. Melin­
da Hewitt. Pam Skiles. and 
Tamie Grindstaff. majorettes.

FHA NEWS 
by Patti Counts

A "come-as-you-are" bre­
akfast was hosted by the offi­
cers of the Knoi City FHA 
Thursday morning A meal of 
sausage, biscuits, and orange 
juice was served after arous­
ing the participants at five 
am

A style show was given by 
the sleeping beauties and 
prize* were awarded to Dune 
Clonts. a former FHA Presi­
dent. Marcella Durham. Lon 
Richards. Ltsa Elston. Cindy 
Elliston, and a K noi City 
High School English teacher. 
Mrs. Renella Watson. A 
special thanks is given to 
Mrs. Peggy Guinn and Mrs 
Peggy McGaughey for help­
ing Mrs Newton prepare our 
meal.

The first official meeting 
will be held in the high school 
library Tuesday night to dis­
cuss whal projects the girls 
will take on for the year, and 
to pay dues. This year 
promises to be a good one so 
remember our chapter can 
only be as strong as its weak­
est member1

CHOIR NEWS 
by Patti CounU

A new school year hat 
started along with which 
starts a new choir year. All 
those interested are cordially 
invited to join Wednesday. 
September 4. at 8 30 a m. in 
Mrs Low rey 't classroom 
There are no special require­
ments except to be there, for 
singing is enjoyed by every­
one. During the year several 
concerts will be given by the 
choir including a Christmas 
special. I would like to 
personally encourage every­
one to consider joining be­
cause it it great fun. and each 
member can really get invol­
ved. Sec you in choir!

RODEO CLUB 
by Mandy Lankford

The Rodeo Club it a new 
organization at Knox City 
High School. The main 
purpose of the Club is to form 
a rodeo team which will

participate in team rodeos 
throughout the year.

Our first meeting was 
Thursday. We elected o ffi­
cers and diacuttcd events of 
the upcoming year The pre­
siding officers are: President, 
Payton Barnard. Vice Presi­
dent. Joey Swam, Secretary- 
Treasurer. Lisa Boone; R e­
porter. Mandy Lankford, and 
Sponsor. Leon Burkham.

Mr. Burkham also sppom 
ted a committee of Lisa. Joey, 
and Mike Burkham to be 
responsible for forming the 
rules of the Cub We had ten 
member* present at the meet­
ing We would like to thank 
the shcool and our sponsor, 
Mr Burkham

GRt UNHAND NEWS 
by David Anderson

Monday in Ag I we elecied 
officer* They are as follows 
President. Brett Boone. Vice 
President. Tommy Mangis; 
Secretary. Mark Clonts; 
Treasurer. Junior Gonzales; 
Sentinel. Raul Espinosa; Re­
porter. David Anderson

We also obtained our FFA 
creeds which we must learn in 
a couple of weeks

FTA NEWS 
by Vickie Berryman

Last spring at our last FT A 
meeting for the school year 
'7J-'74, we elected new FTA 
officers for the school year
• 74-11

They are President. C liff 
Ray; First Vice President. 
Dale Bloxham; Second Vice 
President. Carolyn Orr. Sec­
retary. Patti Counts. Parlia­
mentarian. Joey Swain;

Treasurer Brenda Harris; 
Typist. Laura Lynn. Htatort 
■ n*. Gsylc Tankersley and 
(  indy Albus Social Chairman 
Temi Baker, and Reporter, 
Vickie Berryman

Our neat meeting date isn't 
set yet. but we will be bring 
ing in the new members and 
discussing our work for the 
school year '74-'7S.

EE A NEWS 
by Mike Hsrkham

Monday night the Knoi 
City Future Farmers of A me 
rtca held their first organiza­
tional meeting. In this we 
elected the o fficer* for 
1974 75 C liff Ray t i t  
elected President. Joey Swam 
is Vice President Mark How 
ell. Secretary, Dale Bloxham, 
Treasurer Mike Burkham, 
Reporter, and Randy Lewis. 
Sentinel

Also in this meeting it was 
decided that the FFA would 
have the concession stand for 
the Jayton scrimmage The 
executive work committee 
was chosen with Cliff Rav a* 
chairman. Mark Howell as 
secretary, and Dale Btoiham 
as treasurer

The attention was brought 
before the chapter of having a 
light bulb sale, this was dis­
cussed by the President and 
Mr Burkham before the 
chapter The morion passed 
to have the light bulb sale 
within the neat two months

The chapter will also conti­
nue to have the semi annual 
fruit sales starting in October 
or November

The Knox City FFA has in

NEWS PAGE T H R E E

the past been appreciative of 
this town's support of their 
activities, and this year hop­
ing to repay you with even 
greater service, because you 
believe in the future of farm- 
mg

7lb GRADF NEWS 
by Jnalwf Figueroa

(  las* officers were elected 
Monday for the 7th grade 
das* The election ended at 
follows President. Shelton 
Rhode*. Vice President, 
Dwayne Johnson Secretary 
Treasurer Cyle Clayton. Re 
porter. Junior Figueroa

There are two new stu­
dent*. me, Junior Figueroa, 
and Kenny Cornwell I have 
been living here in Knot City 
for over a year now but going 
to school in O'Brien Kenny 
Cornwell moved from East 
Tesss

TAKE THE FAMILY 

OUTTODIME

TODAY
AT

KORNER KITCHEN CAFETERIA
NOON & EVENING BUFFET

HOURS 6 A M. TO 9 P M

IN q l'IH K  TODAY 
ABo; T OUR NEE 
HIGHER INTI REST 
RATES ON SAVINGS

ON THE GROW
TO BETTER SERVE YOU

Limited Offer on Green Stamps for Savings
___  , Stamps Awarded Depewits

I stamp per dollar $1 -9149
MSI 11." l.'-tV
1200 $250 « * *
2100 $1,000 $4 WS
42« i  $5 i xx» or more

Wa.ra  Continuing to C ro w  With

$32,700,000.00 plus
in  a s s e t s

Where Your Savings Interest Is

PASSBOOK |
Annual Hate

5.25%
Annual Y ield*

5.39%
90-Day Certificate 1

$500.00 Minimum 15.7!
6.2!

i%  l5.92%
12-Mo. CERTIFICATE

$1,000.00 Minimum 1 5% ...i6.45%
12-Mo. CERTIFICATE

SS.000.00 Minimum 6.5(j%  i6.72 %
24-Mo. CERTIFICATE

$1,000.00 Minimum 6.51)% 6.72%
7.50% 7.79%

30-Mo. CERTIFICATE
$5,000.00 MINIMUM

48-M«3. CERTIFICATE
*1,000.00 Minimum

A subatantlnl Interest penalty is required for early withdrawal
•Where Interest Is Accumulated and Compounded.

Savings Accounts Insured to $20,000 Interest Guaranteed

FIRST FEDERAL SAVINGS AND 
LOAN ASSN. OF STAMFORD

122 W. McHarg Stamford, Texas 79553
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Truscott -  Gilliland 
News
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Mr and Mr* I  B Dunru
two of Corpus OirtMi spent 
Saturday night with Mr and 
Mr* J G Adcock They all 
sent to a Johnaoa family 
reunion in Crowell Sunday 

Gtlma Useng and Kell* Bell 
Snow of Dallaa * tailed Mr* 
Kay Baty and the Louia Baty 
family Sunday afternoon 

Mr and Mr* A R Bay era 
and her aiatera. Ruby Coy and 
CNa Barker of Seymour, were 
in Na/areth Saturday night 
for the wedding for their 
nephew. Charlie Jame* Bar­
ker Mr and Mr* Adolph 
Barios of Burkburnett vtatted 
Mr and Mr* A R Bayer* la»t 
Monday and Tue»day 

Kritti Shirley o f Crowell 
»pent the weekend with Gail 
Bullion

Mr and Mr* David A nee 
ondoof San Diego. California. 
vi*ited Mr and Mr* Ralph 
Caram teveral day* thi* 
week Mr* Ralph Caram ha* 
ju»t returned from nailing her 
parent*. Mr and Mr* Trim 
dad Arreeondo. in Wichita 
Fall*.

Mr and Mrs. S.L.King of 
Kail* spent the weekend with 
Mr and Mrs L.M Davis 

Mr and Mrs. Jerry Caw 
throe and Scotty of Vernon 
and Barbie Scon of Crowell 
nxited the Ray Glasscock* 
Sunday.

Mr* Guynn Hickman visit 
ed Rachel Taylor of Farmer'* 
Valley Thursday Mr and 
Mr* Steve Grey of Vernon 
nvited Mr and Mr* M L. 
Looney Sunday. Mr and 
Mr* Looney visited Nancy 
Looney and Mr and Mrs 
Steve Looney m Lubbock this 
week

Mr and Mr* W J Swan
tier. Ten and Lori of Arting 
ton visited Mr and Mr* L.G 
McGuire thn weekend 

Jack Miller of Lubbock 
visited hit parent*. Mr and 
Mr* O R  Miller this week 
end

Mr and Mr* Clay Mark 
ham of Georgetown spent

Thursday through Saturday 
afternoon with Mr and Mr* 
W H Hume

Mr and Mr* Otti* ta»h  of 
Knoi City and F*a Faye 
Hutton of Parnpa visited Mr* 
J.C Black Sunday

Mr and Mr* Rob Daval of 
Tulia spent Friday night and 
Saturday with Mr and Mr* 
Roy Daniel Mr and Mr*. 
J.T Ve»el and Tracy of Ama­
rillo tpent Saturday and Sat­
urday night with Mt and 
Mr* Darnel Mr* Fdith 
Daniel and son Earl V of 
Knot City tpent Saturday 
night and Sunday with the 
Daniel* Thev all visited Mr* 
Pearl Steimer. Mr* Pearl 
Coa. and Mrs C.C Daniel in 
the Crowell Hnapttal Satur­
day Mr* Duval i* the sister 
of Roy Daniel, and Mr* 
Steimer Mr* C.C Daniel t» 
their aunt Mr* Co* i* the 
titter of Mr* Rov Daniel The 
Dick Van Dyke family of 
Detroit. Michigan and Mr 
and Mr* D J Van Dyke of 
Muakegon Michigan viaited 
Mr and Mr* W R Owen* 
this week Mr and Mr* 
Jame* Arnold and Jimmy of 
Spur and Mr and Mr* S t  
M>. Robert* and Mr and Mr*. 
Leon Kincaid of Cisco utited 
Mr and Mr* Owen* this 
weekend

The John (Jumicro family 
spent the weekend in Wichita 
Fall* with relative*

The Gilliland Baptist 
Church had a revival Wed 
netday through Saturda* 
night Brother Joe Ainsworth 
of Crowell preached and Doug 
Phari* of Crowell led the 
singing

The Trutcott and Gilliland 
reunion* have been vheduled 
for neit weekend The Truk- 
cott reunion will be on 
Saturda* August 31 The 
Gilliland homecoming will be 
on Sunday. September I 
Resident* and former retid 
dent* of both communities are 
invited to come and have fun

Bill Myers, ton of Mr and 
Mr* C l  M *er* will be a

KNOX CITY MIOH SCHOOL SENIORS have choaen the** students as officers for
the coming .ear From left. C liff Hay. president, Hand* Lewi*, vice president. 
Carolyn Orr secretary. M ern Clarke, treasurer, Harvey Bey no kit. reporter, and 
Kelly Glaze, sponsor Administrative co-sponsor is W P Baker, who was not 
present when photo was made

DPS Commander Urges Safety
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sod
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kM-1322 JfN .C t
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• It i* indeed tragic that to 
man* men. women, and chil­
dren will become victim* of 
motor vehicle accident* thi* 
last holiday weekend of the 
summer when thousand* of 
mutontt* traditional!* take to 
the highway* for an outing," 
Mayor C W Bell. Regional 
Commander of the Tetas 
Department of Public Safer* 
said

Bell said the DPS will use 
all facilities and personnel at 
it* disposal tn an effort to 
reduce the predicted death 
toil A special Operation 
Motorcide" will be activated 
at b 00 p m Fnday, August 
30. and continue through 
midnight Mondav September 
2 During this period, all 
uniformed DPS officer* and 
equipment will be used on the 
highway* to enforce traffic 
law*.

During the holiday period 
the DPS will tabulate each 
traffic death the total* will be 
announced three time* datlv 
in order to call public atten­
tion to the highway danger*

"More people are killed in

senior chemistry mayor at 
Te*a» Tech.

Hardd Myer* von of Mr. 
and Mrv C F Mver*. will be 
a freshman at Texas Tech 
after attending a summer 
session at VRJC.

Ruth Brown, daughter of 
Mr and Mr* Jack W Brow n, 
will enter Teta* Tech a* a 
sophomore theatre art* ma­
jor

Nine* Looney, daughter of 
Mr and Mrv N L Looney, 
wrtll be a junior at Teiav Tech.

Nett week thi* reporter w ill 
turn in her final column a* 
Truscott'* correspondent. 
Mr* Martha Ca»h will take 
o v e r a * Truscott'* reporter 
after that

ANNOUNCING THE OPENING
LEWIS’ CAR LOT

NORTH OF WEST TEXAS UTILITIFS)

71 M ercu ry M arqu is 
Brougham , 0 * „ # f .

A M  FM  Storoo Radio. 
Tift Whool air. SO 40 
Seats, 4-door sedan. 
429-2 V origin*, otoctrtc 
w indows, back glass 
lot rosters, factory trail­
er hitch, new fire*. 
Silver bottom, black 
vinyl top
St M areury M on tage
M X , 302-2 V angina. 
air, radio, vary claan

73 Feed Cauriar Auto­
matic. 14 000 miiaa. Hka 
naw
72 Chavy H Ton, 4 
spaad. long wida bad. 
Naw 390-4 V angina, 
Air, PS, PB. Radio, 1 
owner
72 Oadga A dven tu rer,
PS PB Radio. Waal 
Coast Mirrors. Naw 
Tires, Trailer Hitch. 
Tool Bo*. 318-2 V an­
gina vary claan

Used Cars
SS O lds 98 4-door 
Sedan. E lec tr ic  W in­
dows Electric Seats

SS C havy Im pels  SS,
2-door Hardtop Naw 
T ires . Tape P layer, 
39S-4 V angina . W ire  
Hub Capa

SS M u stan g. 289 2 V
angina. Automatic. Air, 
Naw Tires Green bo*, 
tom . whitr- op, Vary 
Claan

Used Pickuos
8# Ferd Hi ton, short 
w td * bad. 6 cy linder 
Radio, Good Tiros Vary 
Claan

SS Ford  vy ton, long 
wide bad 6 cylinder 3 
spaad

87 Chavy El Cam I rvo g
Cylinder 3 Spaad. 
Radio. Air, 10.000 m ti«t 
on newly overhauled 
angina

SS Olds Toronsdo, 2-
door Hardtop

• 5 Olds Dynamic SS. 
Air Good TIras 69 | 
modal angina, 2-b*rrol 
carburetor

S3 Mercury Monterey.
Automatic, Radio
S3 Pontiac 4-door Sedan
Radio Air
SO V W . 33 m iles  par 
gallon good condition

64Q M C VS. 4 spaad. M
ton. heavy wheals

St Ford Wrockor, 1 ton '
392 angina. 4 speed | 
heavy winch

97 Oadga Power W a go n ,
W recker 4 wn##i drive 
V 8 -f'y good *ngir>*. | 
Duals PTO Winch. Naw (
Paint, S mud grip*

SS QM C S-cyl 3 speed 
Short wide bed

Texas cacti year in traffic than 
arc killed in all the United 
State* by murder and howii 
ctde." Bell continued, "and 
the death* are just a* tense 
le t*, a* needless, and at 
tragic, but not nearly as well

Mrs. Harris Is 
Buried Saturday

Funeral services were held 
for Mr* Kaiser Hams Satur­
day. August 24. at 1:00 p m 
m the St Paul Baptist Church. 
Rev R l  Reese of Thalia and 
the Rev. Ardel Clay of 
Abilene officiated 

Burial was in the Knox City 
Cemeter* under the direction 
of Smith Funeral Home 

Mr* H arm . 72. died 
Thursday after a lengthy 
illness

Born June 2, 1902. in 
Deberry, Texas. »he had resi­
ded in Knox City the past 10 
year*

She was a member of the 
Baptist Church 

Survivor* include one son, 
Leo Ham* of Knox City, two 
»i*ter*. Mr* Mary Jane 
Moore of Marshall and Mr* 
Louis Roberson of Keiths*ille. 
La., five granddaughter*, and 
four great grandchildren

Mrs. Bobby Baker 
Accepts Position

Mr* Bobby baker daugh­
ter of Mr and Mr* Sammy B 
White, hat accepted a teach­
ing position at Lawndale 
School in the Amarillo Inde­
pendent School District 

A spring graduate from 
Texa* Tech University with a 
bachelor of science degree in 
elementarv education and a 
kindergarten endorsement. 
Tercta will teach third grade

LETTER TO THE EDITOR 
August 2J 1974 

The Knox County New*
Knox City. Texas 

Dear Editor:
Thi* i* in reference to 

Charlene Brothers' "O'Brien 
Happening*'' column appear 
mg in the August 22 (last 
week *) issue of The Knox 
Count* New*.

The writer suggested that 
the calves at the Rodeo Arena 
were not being properly cared 
for and that the calve* were 
**> thin that they could not 
even run.

The Knox City Roping 
Club, who ownx and care* for 
the calves would like to take 
exception to this statement 
We think if Mrs Brothers 
would check into the facts, 
vhe would find that these 
calve* are fed from a creep 
feeder which l» kept supplied 
ai all time*. The calve* are 
never without feed and re 
watered daily.

When the calve* are bought 
they are all vaccinated, and 
are given vhots of antibiotics, 
periodically, a* needed The 
Roping Club provide* the 
same care for these calves 
than any Individual would 
give ihew own calve*

If the writer would come 
out to the arena and watch, 
she would find that these 
calve* can indeed run very 
well The fact of the matter is 
that tome out of town roper* 
have complained that our 
calve* run too fast that their 
hoes** can t catch them 

We just wanted your read 
er* to know that our dub t» 
not neglecting these calve* 
and that they are cared for 
daily by member* of the dub 

Mav we take this oppor 
tunny to thank The Knot 
County New* far the support 
vou have given the Roping 
(Tub and The Braros Valley 
Recreation Assooation

GOP Candidate 
Tours Towns In Area

publicized
" In  the final analysis, 

traffic safety must rest on the 
shoulders o f every person 
who get* behind the Meeting 
wheel of a car With the 
proper attitude of alertness 
and with the acceptance of 
responsibility, we can see 
positive results in our at­
tempt* to halt the increases in 
the number o f traffic mis­
haps." Major Bell concluded

HOMECOMING CANCELED
The New * oflked ha* been 

notified that the homecoming 
at Sunset ha* been canceled 
for this year

" I  became involved in thi* 
campaign because I am alar- 
m*«j about the creeping so
ctaiism in our America, in our 
own Texas, declared Mary 
Ktrdthoff. candidate for the 
State Senate 30th Senatorial 
District. " T o  offset thi* 
growing problem on the Mate 
level, we must have stronger 
representation in Austin Cer• 
taial) agricultural repreienta- 
lion a voice both ripen- 
enccd and knowledgable in 
agricultural matter* -  is 
badli needed.'

Speaking at the Old Settlers 
Reunion tn loanng Springs 
Aug 22. Mrs Kirchhoff 
thanked the group "For mak­
ing this country a place where 
all of us can live today. This 
is where it all Matted. Our 
debt to you la a tremendous 
on* '*

The attractive blonde can­
didate also set forth her 
belief* in the free enterprise 
system, states rights, and 
individual rights. "Surely a 
person ha* the nght. under 
God. to control his own desti­
ny." she emphasized

Speaking out of the back­
ground of her work with the 
Small Towns Task Force. 
Mr* Kirchhoff mentioned 
again the need for industrial 
development tn West Te*a» 
"W e  itand on the thresh hold 
of what can be a day of unpre­
cedented opportunity in our

own area." she pointed out 
"Let u* join together in out 
lining plan* which can tap the 
great potential resource* of 
itu* section "

In line with her work on the 
West Texas water problem 
Mr* Kirchhoff atlrnded 'he 
dedication of the Municipal 
Water Work* on the Master 
son Ranch near Paducah 
Fnday. talking with leader* 
there about way* and mean* 
of improving the water pic 
lure in West Texa*

" I  feel that this problem t* 
certainly one of our mutt cm 
ctai. In the past month I have 
contacted a number of diflrt 
rnt authorities working 
toward solution* Some of the 
plan* have strong merit - If we 
begin now."

FROM PAMPA
Fxa Faye Hutton of Pampa 

»pent the past week with her 
siMer and her husband. Mr. 
and Mr*. Otti* Cash

FROM ABILENE
Don Hawkins o f Abilene 

spent the weekend with Mr 
and Mr*. J. G Hawkins and 
Mr and Mrs Charlie Clarke
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IN FORT WORTH
Mr and Mrs White Hud 

son spent several days last 
week with his brother and hit 
wife. Mr and Mrs Cecil Paul 
Hudson in Fort Worth.

Nil

ROCHESTER STEAK HOU!
RETURN FROM VACATION

Mr and Mr*. Je»* Den- 
mngion recently returned 
home from a two-week vaca­
tion in Albuquerque. New 
Mexico, where they visited 
•  tth Linda and Pam Wilcox 
and also went to Los Alamo* 
and Santa Fe mountain*

The Denmngton* were a- 
mong approximately 60 
friend* and relative* atten­
ding a family reunion in Chil­
dress. Other* present includ­
ed Blue Eye* Denmngton and 
Carl and Carmoleta Graham, 
all of Dallas. Juanita Edward* 
and Rudene Leach o f Fort 
Worth and Linda and Pam 
Wilcox of Albuquerque. Carl 
and Carmoleta Graham left 
following the reunion for Salt 
Lake City, Utah, to visit their 
son and hi* wife. Mike and 
Kim Graham On their return 
trip, they also had a *hort visit 
with Linda and Pam Wilcox in 
Albuquerque

Phone [1171 "43-7509

EX T R A  SP EC IA L

FRIDAY 5-10 p.m.

FRESH CATFISH
or

BARBECUE PLATE
SATURDAY 5-10:00 P.M.

MEXICAN
FOOD

S I M
BUFFI
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YOUR ELECTR IC  COOPERATIVE IS

a network of
fllERGV

Your member owned electric 
cooperative it one of many rural 

electric com pam et located throughout 
our nation Each one vastly different 

from the other but identical tn purpose
,0 0"*"*»deper>dabfe • ‘•c tr*  power to your

wherever it may be The map shows 
e nineteen member owned electric cooperative*o*f 
razo* System All are connected by high voltage 

rantmtaaton line* encompassing a coverage area 
throughout fifty-five Texas counties 

a powerful network of electric energy

The lU dn c
«  r i »

K nox l  t*v Roping Club

B —K  E L E C T R I C
C O O P E R A T I V E , I N C O R P O R A T E D

SEYMOUR, TEXAS
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| of getting 
I night, 
ovs scrim­

maged Guthrie last Friday 
night and they looked very 
good I believe Craig said 
that O 'Brien ran about IS 
touchdowns After the rain 
started the football got a little 
slipper* at lime, but they just 
kept on playing and trying to 
keep the ball dry.
HEBE AND THEBE

Mr. and Mrs Leslie Draper 
visited in Lubbock during the 
weekend wiih their children, 
Mr and Mrs Kenneth Drap 
er and family and Mrs 
Juanita Hierman

Mr and Mrs. Ivan Rowan 
were in Stephenville dunng 
the weekend helping Wayne 
get settled for the new school 
year Wayne will be a junior 
this year.

Teresa Hodges left Monday 
for Stephenville where she 
will register for the fall 
semester at Tarleton State 
University Teresa will be a 
freshman She had visited 
with her parents a week 
between the summer and fall 
semesters.

Mr. and Mrs. Delbert Hayes 
vacationed in various places 
in Oklahoma and Arkansas 
the past week.

Mr. and Mr*. James Man­
ning and Marvin Manning 
were in Spnngtown last week 
visiting the Jerry Brothers 
family. They also attended 
the Anniversary Show of 
WBAP Radio Station in Ar­
lington.

Rhonda Hewitt has moved 
to Haskell where she has 
accepted a position in the 
Countv Clerk's office

Mrs. J.O. Brothers and Don 
were in Wichita Falls Monday 
for Don to have surgery on his 
feet

M I D
LIES 
QUIPM

TER IRRIGATION
TER 658-391*
ktol Wayna's 66 on Eaat Main

Mlkfe Burkham 
Honorad On Birthday

Mike Burkham. son of Mr. 
and Mrs Leon Burkham, was 
honored on his sisteenth 
birthday with a steak cookout 
in the home of his grand­
parents. Mr and Mrs. Bill 
Magee, Monday night. Aug­
ust 26

Other guests were Mr and 
Mr* Burkham. Gaylynn and
Bob

Joining the group for birth­
day cake and ice cream were 
Mr and Mr* Jim Dilion.

Mr and Mr* Grady Ellis 
were in Stephenville during 
the weekend where they 
attended the SOth wedding 
anniversary for their son-in 
law. Grady Murray's parents.

Thursday night. August 29. 
will be lime for the City of 
O'Brien's Equalization Board 
to meet for the purpose of 
studying the City taa roll and 
answering any questions any 
taipayer might have to ask 
about hts taies The time will 
be 8:00 p m at the Tas 
Office. Everyone is invited to 
atiend this meeting

Well. I did it again, opened 
my big mouth when I should 
have kept it closed The 
statement I made last week 
about the roping calves hurt a 
few people’s feelings, so I am 
taking this opportunity to ask 
them to forgive me. I did not 
intend to make anyone mad or 
hurt any feelings, but since I 
did. I'm very sorry. To the 
ones that called me. I have 
personally asked them to 
accept my apologies which 
they did. and I am hoping that 
anyone else that was hurt will 
accept my "I'm  sorry" this 
way. Maybe with God's help 
and your prayers. I will learn 
to think before I speak or act. 
This seems to be one of my 
biggest weaknesses

There are a few school 
yearbooks left, and if anyone 
would like one, they can see 
June Tankersley or Diane 
Phillips.
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MRS. LOWERY CHARLES DEERINO
...the former Patricia Beth Lewie

Lewis-Deering Vows 
Repeated August 19

FROM AUSTIN
Mr. and Mrs Dennis Mur­

phy of Austin visited his sister 
and her husband. Mr. and 
Mrs. O.A.Green, last Wed­
nesday.

Mr and Mrs Lowery 
Charles Deenng are now at 
home in Knos City following 
their August 19 marriage. 
The bride is the former 
Patricia Beth Lewis.

The double nng ceremony 
was held in the horn of the 
bride's brother and his wife. 
Mr and Mrs. Bobby Lewis, at 
6 00 o'clock in the afternoon.

Serving as best man was 
Brian Williams and Mrs. 
Williams was mat.on of hon­
or.

Parents of the couple are 
Mr and Mrs Sterling Lewis 
and Mr. and Mr*. L.G.Deer- 
ing of Abernathy.

The bride wore a formal 
gown of lace over peau de 
soie. designed and made by 
her mother Designed with a 
fitted bodice and full skirt, the 
gown was accented by a 
large, belmist sash tied in a 
bow at the waist in back. The 
full belmist sleeves were

Will Tour USA
Former Knos City resident, 

Mike Tan ersley of San Die­
go, California, w ill leave 
September I on a three and 
one-half month tour of the 
United States.

Accompanied by two oihei 
men. he will represent a 
church music and puppet 
show company.

Mike is the son of Mr and 
Mrs Loyd Tankersley and the 
grandson o f Mr* Mildred 
Tankersley

Knox Cits

FROM MARYLAND
Mr and Mrs Ernest Balm 

tula of Suit land, Maryland, 
visited last week with Mr and 
Mrs Sammy Valdei.

gathered to a fitted lace- 
covered cuff. Tiny seed 
pearls trimmed the neckline, 
cuffs, and bodice. Her floor- 
length lace veil was held by a 
headpiece of pearls and lace.

Following the wedding, 
close friends and relatives 
attended the reception.

The bride is a 1973 gradu­
ate of Knos City High School.

Deenng attended San An­
gelo State and Texas Tech 
University. A 1973 grsduate 
of the Department of Public 
Safety Academy in Austin, he 
is presently stationed in the 
Kno* County area as a state 
trooper.

August 29,

Tributt Is Paid To 
Longtimt Fritnd

Mrs. Libbie A. Huge, a 
life-long friend and church 
co-worker of the late Mrs. 
Alma Edwares, had the fol­
lowing tribute to her memory

" In  the First Psalm, we 
find these words. Blessed is 
the man who walks not in the 
council of the wicked, nor sits 
in the scat of scoffers, but his 
DELIGHT is in the Law of the 
Lord, and on this law does he 
meditate Day and Night.'

"Such a person wss our 
departed friend. Alma Rogers 
Edwards.

"She and her late husband 
Dr T.S. Edwards worked ai f  
team for the betterment of 
humanity and our town and 
community.

"S h e  was delighted with 
the progress of our schools, 
serving as president of the 
local Parent-Teacher Associa­
tion for several years.

"A nother thing that she 
delighted in was the giving of 
the building site to the two 
Federated Clubs of Knox City 
and living to see the building 
completed and used for so 
many activities.

"She was delighted when 
the Knox City Garden Club 
was organized and was an 
active member for several 
years.

"H er Church was truly a 
delight, where she served in 
many capacities. She not only 
served at home but over the 
District and Conference

"She was so generous with 
her time, her talents, and her 
means She was a wonderful 
leader and friend to all.

"Another delight to her 
was every improvement that 
came to our city in the way of 
electricity, gas. water, pav­
ing. and all the other things 
we take for granted

"Perhaps the greatest de­
light to her was when the 
Hospital was made a County 
Hospital and many needed 
improvements were made to 
serve the growing communi­
ty

1974 KNOX COUNTV NEWS PAGE FIVE
Her husband established 

the first hospital in a two story 
residence. His fame as a 
surgeon spread all over this 
pari of the country.

"V o ter* ol Knox County 
decided to build a hospital in 
Knox City and Dr Edwards 
was the chief surgeon for 
years.

"Mrs. Edwards was a great 
Christian and truly a 
DELIGHT to know and call a 
friend."

Dana and one son. Marshall 
Leroy, both of Huntington 
Beach, California, his mother, 
Mrs Pearl Gideon of Knox 
City; four brothers, C W. of 
Poolville. James of Martinez, 
California. Oscar o f Benja­
min. and Hollis of Kno* City; 
one sister. Mrs Ed (Mildred) 
Wynn of Port Arthur, three 
grandchildren and several 
nieces and nephews.

His father. O M .Gideon, 
preceded him in death.

Firmer Resident 
Buried Friday

Funeral services were held 
for former Knox City resident 
G.M (Marshall) Gideon Fn 
day afternoon in the Glade 
water Memorial Park with 
Alfred J Mischnick. minister, 
officiating

Mr. Gideon, S8, died Wed­
nesday in a Gladewater hospi­
tal following a freak accident 
at hit home in Big Sandy, 
where he had resided the past 
two years.

Born August 11. I VIS, in 
Chattanoog*. Oklahoma, he 
moved to Knox City with hit 
parents as a child. He was a 
World War II veteran

Survivors include his wife, 
Helen, o f Big Sandy; one 
daughter. Mrs. Cal (A va l

ATTEND FUNERAL 
IN ODESSA

Mrs. Jessie Teague. Mr*. 
Ruby Robinson, and Bud 
I hompson attended funeral 
service* for their cousin. Mrs. 
W illie  Mae McBride, in 
Odessa last Thursday

They were accompanied by 
Mrs. Bessie Russell of Benja­
min______________________

Frank’s TV
I12S. CENTRAL 

KNOX cm  
656- 3*67

MAGNAVOX-
ZENITH

Also Used TV's 
Color A Black A White

□ E P t n O R U l E

i n s m i R T i o n s

*  OIL FIELD  
*  WIRING «

*  INDUSTRIAL 
IRRIGATION *

*  REPAIR 
COMMERCIAL

C & C Electric
Wlllla Collins Knox City 666-3921

Gift Tea Honors 
Mrs. Deering

A bridal shower honoring 
Mrs. Lowery Deering. nee 
Patricia Lewis, was held in 
the Fellowship Hall o f the 
First Baptiit Church Satur­
day, August 17, from 3:00 
until 4:00 p.m.

In the receiving line were 
the bride, her mother, Mr*. 
Sterling Lewis, her grand­
mother. Mrs C.E.Vaden. and 
her great-grandmother. Mrs. 
V.V.Vaden. both of Seymour, 
and his mother, Mrs L.G 
Deenng of Abernathy.

Mrs Bobby Lewis register­
ed guests and Gayle Tankers­
ley and Shervll Guinn served

The serving table was 
covered with a white satin 
cloth and white net was held 
at various points with clusters 
of blue flowers. The center- 
piece consisted o f a silver 
bowl filled with big white 
mums and pon pons.

Gifts were displayed by 
hostesses Mmes. Jimmy 
Lynn, C liff Swain, Allen 
McGaughcy. Amador Gonza­
les Jr., Buddy Angle, Sammy 
B. White, John Grindsiaff Jr., 
Monty Penman. Jack Tan 
kersley. Jerry Guinn. Henry 
J. Jones. Brian Williams. Bob 
Hamson. Russell Boyd. Carl 
Shelton. J.C McGee, Wayne 
Hutchinson. Wayne McKin 
ney. Frank Woodall, Ed • ie 
Carr. Don Railsback. Glen 
Taylor, Bob Rogers, R P 
Barnard Jr., Alton Fitzgerald. 
Opal Hutchinson. W.C.Orr, 
Sam Clonts. Tom Kent. Chock 
Reeves. Mildred Stubbs. Bits 
Whittem. and Miss Ethel 
Lemond

Stick
with

And get your Green Stamps!
rimes arc tough. Rut if look* like rhinos nnuht lx- getting 

better. So, hang in there friend. Stick w ith Olnev S.t\ mgs. and get 
your Cireen Stamps.

For nearly 50 years, we’ve paid every div idend earned. And you 
can depend on us fo> that same good service in the future.

Your money’s ’mured sate by an agency of the federal 
government. And youll get Cireen Stamps

Save now and earn the highest rates allowed. Ciet your Cireen 
Stamps. And stick with it!

O LN EY
SAVINGS

Jackshorxt .Olnev, Seymour and Bridgeport
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imin News
«J O . VAN G S U N

Oil 4 Highland* 8 00 1 
]t  Benjamin Oct 12 O Brwn* §00 Ht 
II Think all Oct IS Wetncri* § 00 T 
^  lo gu Oct . 25 Hermilrigh § 00 H 
I jet started Nov. I Hobbs* 7:JO H 

daises Nov 8 Paint Crrck* 7 JO T 
j| begun Nov 15 Leudert Avoca7 J0H 
making • . Dtitrtrt games 
and all | . Homecoming 

i that goes We again scnmmagr Fn 
And after dav night, Auguat JO Thu 
■ent from game will be with Paint (  reek 
V kiddoes at Benjamin 
t«o!l! HERE ‘N ’ THERE 
•rv are a i Attending the wedding of 
President. Mian Patti Tidwell and Tom 
teaident. my Joe Bufkin in Quitaque 
try. A.m last weekend were Mrs J x. 
Apol<>nto Hufkin Mr and Mrs Sonny 
)rtver ta Hufkm and children. Mr and 

Mra Jerry Parker and child 
laaa officera rrn. Lora Hall. Gary Hamilton 

Green; and Mra. W .D Hamilton 
ae Hud The group alao toured Palo 

(Treasurer. Dura Canyon before their 
Sponaor, return home

Noel and Ruaaell Hamilton 
i sponsor ia of Idalou vtaited friends here 
r officers are over the weekend.

Weekend gueata of Mr. and 
mc John- Mra Van Green and Dune 
resident. were itia parenta. Mr and 
ih Pierce; Mra. Floyd Green of Gorden 
Brannan. vide and hia brother and 
McCan- family. Mr and Mra. Dale 
it their Green. Brad and Scott of 

Denton
ich in the Mra. W D. Hamilton and 
gs senm- Gary were weekend guests of 
ra Friday relatives in Abilene.
Iidn't go. Mr and Mrs. Joe Barton 
t did that and granddaughter. Lort Kal 
■tty good ston visited relatives in Ama 
f a year. Hilo over the weekend 
ime time. Mr. and Mrs. Weldon 
ly to go Gideon and family were tn Big 
[ball this Sandy Friday for the funeral 
>n. Keith of his brother. Marshall Gid- 
Grovct. eon who was killed in an 
Johnny accident on Wednesday. 

Irannan. Mr and Mrs Dutch Young 
rianlies, »nd Mrs. Thelma Nunley and 
Collins. Jack Nunl y o f Seymour 

attended the funeral of J.T. 
ng ache- Nunley in Lawton. Oklahoma 

Monday.
8:00 H Mr. and Mrs.Clarence Hall 
i 8 00 T of Plainview visited his moth 
8:00 T er. Lora Hall. Friday night

tlCAL J A M B O R E E
In Benjamin

(South of Court Ho u m )

SAT., SEPT. 7, 7:30 P.M. 
No Admission 

Concession Stand
(Proceeds to go toward 

Community Building Rest Room)

y t h in g  a u t o m o t iv e
i Fan Belts. Heee. Pulleys, end 

t Duty Belts tor Air Conditioners
F'lfli and Heatings Oil Filters.

Air Betti Filters.
TON RINQS, GASKETS end 

N8ERTS FOR ALL MOTORS 
Monroe Shock Absorbers end 

Loed Levelers
|c«rry a complete line ol TRACTOR 
lurch at Pistons, Rings. Inserts,

Searings and Gaskets

IS AUTO SUPPLY
Phone B6B-3323

JUNIOR CLASS OFFICERS FOR 1B74-7S are. from left. 
Mark Howell, vice president; Jane Arledge, secretary; 
and Al Bateman, reporter. Mr*. Judy Burnett Is cle

Jerry Stamps, president; 
Patti Counta, treasurer; 

iss sponaor.

Week of Sept. I Is Banking Week
PROCLAMATION...AIB

WHEREAS: The American Institute of Banking, 
which is an educational division of The American 
Bankers Association. Is the largest adult organization 
of Its kind In the world, comprised of 220.077 
members, and

WHEREAS; The Abilene Chapter has over 400 
members, and;

WHEREAS: During the week of September 1. 
the Abilene Chapter will be Initiating its membership 
and enrollment campaign;

NOW THEREFORE. I. C C (Buddy) Angle, ea 
Mayor of the City of Knox City, do hereby prtr'slm 
the week of September 1, 1974, as AMERICAN 
INSTITUTE OF BANKING W EEK In Knox City. 
Texas

The week of September I 
has been proclaimed as Ame­
rican Institute o f Banking 
Week by Abilene Mayor 
J.C.Hunter, and on the local 
level by Knox City Mayor 
C.C. (Buddy) Angle

Local employees o f the 
Citizens State Bank who are 
members o f the Abilene 
Chapter of the AIB are Ruby 
Wilson. Evelyn Shelton. Pan­
sy Russell. Pauline Myers. 
Bertha Speck, Kitty Spencer, 
and Leona Burkham. These 
women have panicipated in 
all planned activities of the 
AIB Trips this year were

and Saturday.
Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth 

Roberts were in Dallas over 
the weekend to be with her 
mother. Mrs. T.J.Stoy. who 
celebrated her 90th birthday 
on Sunday Mrs. Stoy return­
ed home with the Roberts 
Sunday afternoon for an ex­
tended visit.
P.T.O. PICNIC

The annual PTO picnic will 
be Thursday evening, August 
29, at 7:30 p.m. on tF - school 
lawn. Everyone is urged to 
come Each family will bring 
llieit evening meai and it will 
all be spread together. So 
men. if you don't like whal 
you might have for supper, 
come on up and enjoy some 
one else 's cooking for a 
change!

A business meeting will 
follow, according to Linda 
Griffith, president.

cancelled due to ,.ie energy 
crisis.

Resident’s Sister 
Dies In California

Helen Robins. 7§, slater of 
Louis Hughes and the late 
L E.Hughes, died W ednes­
day. August 21. st 10:30 p.m. 
in Carngan Hospital si Free 
mont, California.

Services were held Friday 
at Freemont.

She had resided st the 
Carrigan Hospital the past 
twenty years.

Survivors indude one bro 
ther. Louis of Knox City: one 
nephew. E.L.Hughes; and 
two grand-nephews. Ronnie 
and Sian Hughes, both of 
Lubbock.

RECENT VISITORS
Recent visitors in the home 

of Mr. and Mrs. J.O.Buchan­
an included Mr and Mrs Jim 
Minton of Colorado Springs. 
Colorado. Mr and Mrs. W 
Mack Jackson o f Fountain. 
Colorado. Archie B. Buchan 
an or Fort Worth, Mrs. 
Mildred Dee Klingtman, San 
dra Dee. Lorer.e, Kathy, and 
Elizabeth. Mrs. Robert Stam- 
pee. Bobby and Brucie. all of 
Maplewood, New Jersey, and 
Joe Owen of Pampa.

FROM HASKELL 
Visiting Mr. and Mrs. J.E. 

Gray last Friday were Mrs. 
Everett Berryhilt and Mrs. 
F.mma Banner of Haskell.
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HOUNDS  
(From Pago One)

A thumb-nail sketch of 
team members includes Joel 
Swale quarterback - 170 lb. 
senior - three year letterman 

Much improved after knee 
surgery. Will be able to run 
with the ball much more, 
making our option type de­
fense much better. Throwing 
seems better this early. 
Should be greatly improved in 
the next two to three weeks. 
Charlie Elya running back - 
1401b. junior two year letter- 
man

Speed and quickness has 
improved greatly over last 
year. Runs with much more 
authority and picks holes 
much quicker. Should have a 
great year. All distnct last 
year.
Dale Biatbam running back
• IhO lb junior • two year 
letterman

Didn't gain as much weight 
as expected. Harder runner 
Hr will be playing one of our 
tine backers. Should be one 
o f the top pushers on the 
team.
Jae Huff - split receiver 145 
lb senior three year letter- 
man

Good job adjusting to a new 
position Has good hands and 
should be one of the top pass 
receivers. Plays defensive 
corner back good tackier 
Cliff Ray - guard - 170 lb. 
senior three year letterman 

Good pulling guard and one 
of the most experienced play­
ers on the team. Plays 
defensive line backer and 
calls defensive signals. 
Should grade high each week 
on defense.
Ruberl Taylor offensive and 
defensive guard - 195 lb. 
senior - three year letterman 

Will probably be the best 
defensive lineman in the 
district, gives 100%, made all 
district and all area last year. 
Hat good quickness and 
speed. Most teams will 
probably have lo double team 
him this year. Will grade 
high each week on defense 
Donald Swuareugor - tight 
end - 1§5 lb. senior two year 
letterman

Good hands, size and fair 
speed. Should be leading 
receiver on team. Best 
blocker we've had at light end 
in Iasi Iwo or three years. 
Plays a defensive tackle and 
should grade in top three or 
tour each week.
I ddle Johnson split end - 
185 lb. senior - two year 
letterman

A good fast target for 
Swain's passes. Eddie has 
improved greatly. A good 
blocker on end runs Plays a 
defensive guard and should 
improve each week 
Ray Hemaadri tackle - 170 
Ih senior - one year letterman 

Has grown a lot So far has 
improved to be a more 
aggressive player. Could 
push some one lo make a 
position on defense Attitude 
is g<iod. should improve each 
week
Ruulv GHawley guard - 165 
junior one year letterman 

Steady performer and 
should play more al offensive 
guard Played well last Iwo 
years on junior varsity. 
Should improve each week 
Im 4y law k center 160 lb 
senior • one year letterman 

Did not play last year and 
this shows, but has improved 
greatly since first work outs 
Will probably be a starter on 
specialty teams Should play 
a lot both ways 

Brmr* Ralkhurk half hack
• 110 lb senior one year 
letterman

Didn't play last year but 
has great determination 
Should tie able lo help out on 
tpettaltv trams 
Mari Huwui defensive half 
hack 1 AO lb junior - one yuat 
letterman

Will probably start at left 
defensive half hack Has fair 
speed and desire to be a nnnd
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detensivc player Hr will also 
be back up at split end and 
should see some action on 
offense.
Jimmy Moure quarterback 
and safety - 145 lb junior 
one year letterman

Back up quarterback that 
will probably play a great 
deal. Likes to run with ball 
and should be able to run the 
oplion. Should improve 
weekly Hr also plays safety 
on defense and this should 
help knowing where the pass 
routes should go.

Al Balnman . half back 
140 lb. junior - one year 
letterman

Moved and moved back. 
Speed is a great factor. Prob­
able the fastest man on the 
team for 40 yards Should be 
one of the leading pushers 
and will probably wind up on 
defense some where.
Rady Hemaadri - tackle and 
line backer - 165 lb. junior - 
one year letterman

Dependable player. Strong, 
and should be pushing some 
one for a defensive posit Kin 
before the year is over. 
Played well on junior varsity 
the last two years.
Jimmy Lyaa offensive tackle 
• 170 lb. junior • two year 
letterman

Plays a strong side tackle 
Good speed to lead quick 
pitches. Plays defensive 
comer and should be much 
improved in next two or three 
weeks. Should be as good a 
blocker as we have on the

line
Jerry F.ataa lacklr 165 lb. 
junior - two year letterman

F.stremely fast and quick 
tor a lacklr Good blocker for 
quick pilch Plays defensive 
tackle. Should grade high 
each week on defense 
Mike Burkham center • 150 
lb junior - one vear letterman

Has improved greatly in 
last week or so on centering 
First year on varsity. Should 
improve weekly with experi­
ence. Good thinking blocker 
and give* 100%
Jerry Stamp* defensive half 
- 155 lb junior • one year 
letterman

Transfer that played junior 
varsity ball last year. Should 
Till in al running back on light 
end. Has a lot of ability and 
desire. One of the leading 
ball carriers on junior varsity 
(cam last year.
Dams Sklles split end - 145 
lb. junior - one year letterman

Has grow n a lot Should be

specialty teams Should see 
some playing time in defen­
sive secondary.
Gary Carvar half back ■ 170 
lb senior • two year letterman 

M oved to Brownwood. 
Was a two way starter two 
years ago Could help both 
ways Has a lot of ability and 
should improve during the 
early pari of the season

School Calendar
Friday, August JOi Junior
Varsity and Varsity Scrim 
mage Jayton here at 7:00 
p.m.
Muwdav. September 2i School 
Holiday
Thurwday. September Si Jum
or V.-rsity piays Rule ai Rule 
ai 8 00 p m ; 8th grade plays 
Rule at Rule a> 6:30 p m 
Friday, September 6i Varsity 
plays Rochester al Rochester 
at 8:00 p m End of first three 
weeks.able to fit in and help on

ART CLASSES
For Children and Young Adults

(if enough students are interested)

Classes In
Freehand Drawing and Water Color

Parents are invited to meet 
Dee Dee Mongrain
Associates of Science Degree in Art 

from South Plains College In Levelland 
(Received Art Award at S. P C .)

Tuesday, Sept. 3, 2:00 p.m.
At Korner Kitchen
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A proud salute to Labor

helping make America 
a better place to live!
Theirs it an achievement of which all can be proud. From 
their skillful hands, working with modern techniques and 
equipment, cemes America * industrial productivity . . .  high­
est in the world. From their devotion te the American way ef 
life cemes that most valued ef American products, FREEDOM 
FOR ALL

CITIZENS 
STATE BANK

MEMBEK F.D.I.C. — INSURED TO I2O.B0B 

K.NOX CITY, TEXAS
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