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ADDS OPTIMISM TO 
KNOX COUNTY FOLKS 
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so seldom I get to see any of 
you, but I think of you all 
very often, with fond 
memories of my "home-

more personal note, 
to my n  oo myie.  On.  mother, Frankie Yost, 
I'd like to say "Thanks, 
Mother." Your birthday gift 
to me each year of my 
Munday Courier subscrip-
tion is truly enjoyed, 
appreciated and looked for-
ward to every week. Mun-
day will always be "home" 
and through the psaipnecrerIecaly,  can 
keep in touch with all my 
friends. 

Phyllis (Yost) Dunn 
1617 S. Howard 

Moore, Oklahoma 

Letters To 
The Editor Munday, Texas 76371 

Phone 422-4314 

three hits and two walks. 
Every member of the 
Munday All Star team 
turned in an outstanding 
performance and played a 
hard hitting and aggressive 
game. All the team members 
saw action in the game as 
manager and coach, Larry 
Thompson and Daniel 
Ramirez, substituted in the 
later part of the contest. 

Munday, winner of Area 
II will play the winner of 
Area I which hadn't been 
decided as of tonight. Area I 
teams include Sheppard 
AFB, Iowa Park, Electra 
and Burkburnett. This game 
will be played at 5:00 p.m. 
Monday, July 24. In the 7:30 
game, Graham or Olney, 
Area III, will face the 
winner of Area IV, which 
includes Rule-Rochester, 
Stamford and Haskell. The 
winners on Monday night 
will play the final district 
playoff game Tuesday at 
7:30 p.m. 

Support the All Stars add 
attend the District playoffs 
at Crowell. 

Marion Waggoner Publisher 
Buford Berryhill 	Editor 
Published at Munday, Texas 
76371 every Thursday, ex-
cept the first week in July 
and the week following 
December 25th. 

Entered as second class 
mail matter at the post office 
at Munday, Texas, Nov. 11, 
1971. Second class postage 
paid at Munday, Texas 
76371. Publication number 
917740. 

TAILWATER RECOVERY PIT With pumping unit. 
System will return runoff water to delivery system 
during irrigation. 

YARD OF THE WEEK. The Munday Garden Club 
judges have given this weeks honor to the home of the 
Welton Leflars. The spacious green lawn shaded by 
beautiful trees caught the eyes of the judges. 

Conservation Of Water 
Supported By SCS 

SUBSCRIPTION RATES 
One year in Knox and 

adjoining counties 	$5.25 
$8.00 
$9.00 

tion was recommended by 
the Council. 

Two representatives of 
Danrick Construction Co. 
met with the Council in 
regard to a possible new 
sub-division. Cost estimates 
were discussed for sewer, 
streets, and water service 
for this new area. Mayor 
Selzer reported that City 
funds are not budgeted for 
this project nor a part of it. 
No action was taken. 

Hobert moved the City 
try 12 new ACU meters 5/8 
x 3/4  at $24.50 each 
exchange provided the Wat-
er Department heads ap-
prove. Marr seconded. All 
for. 

The City Administrator 
was authorized to proceed 
with the changeover on the 
bed and lift on the 1955 
Chevrolet truck to the 1973 
Chevrolet truck. Hardin 
moved that the 1955 Chev. 
truck be advertised for bids 
in two issues of the Munday 
Courier with timing for sale 
as required by law as soon as 
available after removal of 
the bed and lift. Andrade 
seconded. Carried with all in 
favor. 

The Council discussed 
requirements by the Texas 
Department of Health Re-
sources in regard to a new 
sewer permit. Improve-
ments in operational pro-
cedure at the plant are now 
being incorporated. Con-
tracts with irrigation water 
users must be renewed in 
writing for long term usag 
within the next 60 days 
(approx.) Other require- 
ments will also be made. The 
Council authorized the ad-
ministrator to take neces-
sary steps as needed to 
secure the new required 
permit. 

Next discussed was a new 
permit requirement at the 
sanitary landfill. Steps are 
being taken at this time in 
regard to space measure-
ments, Soil Conservation 
Service report and many 
other details in regard to• 
securing landfill operational 
approval. A public hearing 
will be called at a later date 
in regard to the landfill. The 
administrator was instruct-
ed to take needed action to 
secure approval. 

Hobert moved bills be 
paid as follows: From Air-
port funds $19.34; from 
Ambulance funds $144.28; 
from Swimming pool funds 
$358.83; from Operating 
funds $8738.13. Andrade 
seconded. All for. Mari. 
moved the meeting be 
adjourned. Andrade second-
ed. All for. 

KNOX COUNTY 
HISTORY 

One year in Texas 
One year elsewhere 
NOTICE-Any erroneous re-
flection upon the character, 
standing or reputation of 
any person, firm or corpora-
tion, which may appear in 
the columns of the paper will 
be gladly corrected upon the 
notice of same being brought 
to the attention of the 
publisher. 

New Director 
Named 

Dr. Lloyd D. Vincent, 

CITY NO ACTION 
(continued from page 1) 

to be published as required 
by law with a full copy to be 
recGrded or filed in the City 
Ordinance file, same to be 
made a part of the original 
ordinance. Marr seconded. 
All members voted for. 

Police Dept. business is 
set out below and the 
following action is recorded. 
Chief Saffel said Gene Nix 
hours on duty last month 
was 10.8 hrs. a day. Night 
work was also given as part 
of the reason for a raise 
request by Chief Saffel. 
After discussion, Marr mov-
ed that Nix salary be 
increased by $50.00 per 
month beginning August 1, 
1978. Hobert seconded. Car-
ried. 

Next request by Chief 
Saffel was fingerprint kit. 
The Council authorized this 
expenditure at a minimal 
cost. 

Expenditure of a motor-
cycle was discussed. Marr 
moved this item be tabled at 
this time. Hardin seconded. 
All for. 

Chief Saffel next reported 
on car use, cases filed, hours 
worked etc. for the past 39 
days. 

Judge Omar Cure met 
with the Council. Corporate 
Court business was discuss-
ed and no changes in opera- 

MUNDAY ALL STARS 
(continued from page 1) 

The "Knox County History" published in 
1966 is being re-issued with a complete index 
of names and subjects. 

The publishers, Nortex of Quanah, says 
that the book will be available in early 
September. 

Orders are now being accepted at pre-pub-
lication price of $13.00. 

Send your check ($13.00 plus $1.52 for 
mailing and tax) to: 

from the storage area to the 
irrigation system for re-use. 
Usually a pump at the 
storage area and a pipeline 
back to the irrigation 
system. 

Lieb stated technical as-
sistance from the Soil 
Conservation Service as-
sisting the Wichita Brazos 
Soil and Water Conservation 
District is available to assist 
farmers install tail water 
recovery systems. If a tail 
water recovery system is 
not practical or usable then 
assistance can be provided 
on cut-back of irrigation 
water to get the best 
possible use of water 
available, Lieb concluded. 
Don't waste water, it is the 
lifeblood of our agricultural 
community. 

"Knox County History" 
Truscott, Texas 79260 

Water is the lifeblood of 
any area. Therefore, it 
becomes the responsibility 
of each person to use the 
water the best possible way. 
At this time ground water is 
short, many wells are low or 
dry. Irrigation water run-
ning off our cropland is not 
only wasteful, it also carries 
sediment, chemicals and 
plant foods with it. These 
can become a pollution 
problem farther down 
stream. 

Irrigation water can be 
collected, stored, and trans-
ported for re-use with a tail-
water (irrigation water run-
off) recovery system, ac-
cording to Arche Lieb of the 
US Soil Conservation Ser-
vice. A tail-water recovery 
system not only reduces 
pollution by collecting the 
water that runs off while 
irrigating, but also conserv-
es irrigation water supplies 
and carries plant foods back 
onto the cropland. 

The following items are 
needed to have a successful 
tail water recovery system: 
1. Collection facility - which 
carries water to a storage 
area without erosion taking 
place. Usually a waterway 
or field ditch at the lower 
end of the irrigation run. 2. 
Storage - a storage area 
large enough to provide 
needed storage, usually a 

storage pit, or pond com-
pletely enclosed by an em-
bankment, with a pipe 
through the embankment as 
an inlet to the pit. Sediment 
traps are located outside the 
pit where needed. 3. Return 
facility - to return the water 

OPEN 24 
HOURS 

had a two-hitter in the 
victory over the Crowell All 
Stars in Monday night 
activity at Crowell. He 
walked eight batters and 
struck-out 11 in their 26 to 4 
roust over Crowell. 

Munday team members 
laid the wood to the ball for 
twenty-one hits, struck out 
four times and received 4 
walks. 

Kip Cotton carried the big 
bat for his team with five 
hits on five trips to the plate. 
His hits included four singles 
and one double. Another 
consistent batter and base 
runner was Quinn Smith. In 
his five times at the plate he 
grounded out once and had 
four hits. Paul Mints scored 
five runs for his team on 

OPEN 24 
HOURS 

president of Angelo State 
University, has been named 
to the Board of Directors of 
West Texas Utilities Com-
pany. 

His election was announc-
ed Friday morning in 
Abilene at a regular WTU 
board meeting, which was 
attended by Dr. Vincent. 

He was presented by 
Durwood Chalker, president 
and chief executive officer of 
WTU, who said he was 
"immensely pleased" at 
having Dr. Vincent become a 
director. 

Dr. Vincent holds three 
degrees, including the Ph.D 
in nuclear physics, from the 
University of Texas at 
Austin. He taught physics at 
the University of South-
western Louisiana, at Texas 
A&M University, and at 
Sam Houston State Univer-
sity before becoming presi-
dent of Angelo State. 
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BORDEN'S 
THREE COUPLES 

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Gaines 
of Munday will be honored 
this month at the Haskell 
Dairy Queen with a free 
meal to mark their anniver-
sary. They were married on 
July 31, 1925, and will be 
celebrating their 53rd anni-
versary this month. 

Of all the couples with 
July anniversaries that sign-
ed up the Gaines and Mr. 
and Mrs. Hallie Chapman of 
Haskell, 55 years, and Mr. 
and Mrs. Charles E. Smith of 
Haskell, 48 years, 
married the longest. 

Every couple registering 
at the Haskell DQ will 
receive a free wedding 
anniversary dinner at the 
restaurant as a gift of Dairy 
Queen, whether they are 
celebrating their first, 50th 
or even longer anniversary 
during the next 12 months. 

it 

4 9  1°20Z. 
CTN. 

OW, 	HOT COOKED 

Apple Delight 

29' were 

TUNA 

Get mole out than you put in 
item Walter Hertel 

City Secretary 
City of Munday, Texas 

HOT COOKED BORDEN'S 
How much more you get out of our savings 

and loan depends on you. 
It all depends on how much you want to save 

and how long you give us to work with it. 
As the amount that you 

deposit goes up —sand as 
the duration of deposit goes 
up — dividends increase. 

In return from one of our 
high yield savings plans, 
you can expect something 
more . . . much more. 

POCHITOS NOVELTIES 

24125C  
HOUSTON'S 
FABULOUS 

/ 
4 49MEXICAN HOTDOG 

rk MOTOR INN 
• 6500 Main (South) 

Telephone 

713-526-4161 

OR MONTE CRUSHED OR SLICED cMoftenoullittoney 

PINEAPPLE 
3 087 Or 

IN JUICE 

SHURFRESH 
BISCUITS 

10/1. 
485 Beautiful Rooms 

Fantastic Pool 

Cabana Rooms & Sipes  

Outside Gloss Elevato r 

Excellent Food 

Individual Sauna Beir.s 

Money Market Certificate $10,000 Minimum 

Issued for 6 Months with a Yield 1/4% Higher 

than the Weekly Average Auction Yield on 6 

Month Treasury Bills 

II 

8% Certificate Yields 8.33% $1,000 Minimum 

and Matures in 8 Years 

Other Savings Plans Are Available 
A substantial interest penalty is required for 

early withdrawal .  MOTOR INN 
6700 Main (South) 

Telephone 

713-522-2811 
GARDEN FRESH TEXAS 

• Nightly Entertainmen t  

• Meeting Facilities 

• Color TV 

• Vibrating Beds 

• Split Level Suites 

• Room Service 

• Free Porking 

• Swinging Club 

a 
R L. "Dick" Maeale, Executive Mgr. 

DEL MONTE 

SPINACH 

At 3 FOR 

I 
WATERMELONS 

$11 59  

Across From Texas Medical Center 

5 Mini() Domed Stadium &  Domed World—Convenient to Everything 

Rico Stadium — zoo  — Coq Course — Fat Stork Show 

	S FSLIC 
HOT, WIC! 

173 W MC/14 ,0 
P 0 Box 311 
Slarnlord, Tent MSS 

drench 011.<e 
Ho I Avenue 0 

P 0 Sot 444 

Haskell 	 71511 

Priem 1144•117, 

Otv.t.on 011.1e 
.Juanan Federal Saving% 
And Loan 

, I) South Main Sr 
Quench Tens /1251 

S Stlisiand. Manager 

NOM/. 

43-AENcy 

FIRST FEDERAL SAVINGS AND 
LOAN ASSOCIATION 

Chocolate 

FRUIT DRINK 

69! 

CHICKEN OF THE SEA 	59c  51,2 OZ. 
CAN 

BORDEN'S DUTCH 

CONVE N I ENCE STORES 	y2o 3° 78 

C 

 T . 

SIZE 

Dear Editor, 
Seeing Mrs. Ina Cowan's 

picture on the front page of 
this week's paper prompted 
this letter. It's always good 
to see familiar faces in The 
Munday Courier, but it 
especially thrills me to see 
the face of one I love as 
dearly as Mrs. Cowan. I was 
truly blessed with the privil-
edge of having her as my 
first grade and third grade 
teacher, therefore becoming 
very attached to her, not 
only as a teacher, but as a 
person. I credit her example 
as a reason why I chose the 
teaching profession. She was 

MI lk tage Cheese 
ao ....  

Bogoo 
112CREgSt 

ICE CREAM 
$1 29... 

CTN. 

MADE WITH A 
CORN TORTILLA & DELICIOUS 

APPLE FILLING 

BORDEN'S PREMIUM 

AlPt'sv 	HOUSTON, TEXAS sent•••••••••••••••••n".• 

biv•-als 	o• MO 000 

atlQ 	 
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HOW MUCH 
IS YOURS 
WORTH? 
The dollar bill still has some 
value these days. especially 
when you open an insured 
savings account that pays 
maximum interest. You'll 
find the value of your dol-
lars Increasing on a quar-
terly basis with interest 
compounded daily. Visit us 
soon and let us help you 
make your dollar worth 

something 

It  rl inT NATIONAL BANK 

-....mook. N in11 

FDIII Service 9s Our Security 
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Farm And Ranch News 
Bollworm Peak Egg lay 
Predicted For July 26 
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JEWEL BOX 
MINI WAREHOUSES 

SELF STORAGE 

Your Lock - Your Key 

310 South 2nd 	• 	Ph: 422-4722 

Charles Baker Insurance 

Olney Sayings 
comes with a 

lifetime 
guarantee. 

Saving money is hard to do. But when you do business with Olney 
Savings you get a lifetime guarantee that we pay the highest interest 
rates allowed by law—plus a whole lot more. 

You Deposit 
This Lump Sum 
(Minimum) 

Your 
Actual 
Yield Is 

For 
This 
Long 

Osamatic 
Prestige 
Account 5.39% 

5.92% 
6.72% 
6.98% 
7.79% 
8.06% 
8.33% 

$ 
$ 1,000 
$ 1,000 
$ 1,000 
$ 1,000 
$ 1,000 
$ 1,000 
$10,000 

C ompounded 
Daily At 
This Rate 

51/4% 
53/4% 
61/2% 
63/4% 
71/2% 
73/4% 
8% 

6 mos. 
1 yr. 
30 mos. 
4 yrs. 
6 yrs. 
8 yrs. 
6 mos. Weekly Average Auction 

T. Bill Rate +749 

Early withdrawal on savings certificates is subject to reduction to passbook rate 
plus 90 days interest penalty. 

01.1NEY 
NerSAVINGS 

Olney, Seymour, Jacksboro, Bridgeport, Nocona and now Weatherford and Azle. 

lb us, people are worth a lot more than money. 
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Goree News Items 
BY MRS. DOUGLAS SMITH 

Kenneth Struck and Kar-
la, Grand Prairie, recently 
visited his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Archie Struck. Kenny 
Struck, who had been 
visiting his grandparents, 
returned home with Ken-
neth. Karla remained for a 
two weeks visit. Mr. and 
Mrs. Struck took her to 
Jacksboro Sunday, where 
she was met by her parents. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bobby Bell 
and Michelle, Tulsa, Okla. 
visited his parents Mr. and 
Mrs. Riley Bell last week. 
Little Scott Bell, Graham 
visited his grandparents a 
few days last week. He 
returned home Sunday with 
his father Roger Bell. 

**•** 
Call 422-4314 to report 

your news tips. 

Talk to the 
Farm Bureau Insurance 
"24-Hour Agent" 

about your fire insurance policy! 
With a Farm Bureau Fire Insurance policy, you know 
your Farm Bureau Insurance "24-Hour Agent" is working 
for you round-the-clock, ready with advice or assist-
ance when you need him, any hour of the day or night. 

The Farm Bureau Insurance "24-Hour Agent"... 
round-the-clock service, for that 
good feeling of security. 

Don Welch 
Ph: 422.4555 

Steven Motl, Seymour, visit-
ed Mr. and Mrs. Bill Orsak 
last Wednesday. 

Visiting Mr. and Mrs. 
Merle Lambeth during the 
weekend were: Mr. and Mrs. 
Douglas Donoho, Jay and 
Zane, San Angelo; Mrs. 
Blanche Atkinson, New 
Deal; Mrs. Corrie Walton, 
Mrs. Betty Walton and Mrs. 
Margie Williams, Wichita 
Falls. Mrs. Atkinson, who 
had been visiting in Wichita 
Falls, remained here for a 
week to visit Mr. and Mrs. 
Lambeth and other rela-
tives. 

Mrs. Amy Edwards, Sey-
mour, visited her brother 
and wife, Mr. and Mrs. Tony 
Hammons, Saturday after-
noon. 

Visiting Mr. and Mrs. 
Cannon Roberts during the 
weekend was their son, 
Jimmy Roberts, Arlington. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clyde 
Morton visited his sister, 
Mrs. Thelma Adkins, in 
Plainview on Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Dewitt 
Green visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Dickie Green and Wade in 
Crowley last Thursday. 
Wade returned home with 
his grandparents for a visit. 

Mr. and Mrs. Arthur 
Hargrove visited in the 
Bobbie Kegley home in 
Munday on Sunday. 

Donkey Baseball 
MONDAY, JULY 24, 8 p.m. 

Munday vs. Knox City 
Munday vs. Haskell 

Advance tickets 	 at Gate 
$1.75/$.75 	 $2.00/$1.00 

ADVANCE TICKETS AVAILABLE AT: 
EVERETT'S MACHINE SHOP 

M-SYSTEM, OR FROM ANY JAYCEE 

Come Join The Fun & Laughs!!! 

her parents, Mr. and Mrs. J. 
c, Watson, during the last 
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rekkre.erndand Mrs. James 
s  and sons, Jimmy, 

Doug and Jeramie, Olney, 
visited her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Riley Bell, recently. 
Mrs. L. T. Vincent of 
Seymour visited in the Bell 
home last Tuesday after-
noom 

Mr. and Mrs. Homan 
McMahon visited his sister 
and husband, Mr. and Mrs. 
Guy Holly in Grandfield, 
Okla., during the last 
weekend. The Holly's son 
and family, Mr. and Mrs. 
Richard Holly and children 
of Little Rock, Ark. were 
also visiting there. 

Visiting Mr. and Mrs. Les 
Jameson during the week-
end was his daughter, Mrs. 
Cheryl Yarbrough and a 
friend, Keith Dixon, Little-
field. Gary  

King and Lloyd 
Glynn, Breckenridge, visited 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Lloyd King and Eddie at 
Possum Kingdom last week. 

Visiting Mrs. Etta Kirk 
last week were her cousins, 
Mrs. Esther Gill, Bowie, and 
Mrs. Edna Mae Lawson, 
Vashti. They all went to 
Sweetwater to visit Mrs. 
Kirk's sister, Mrs. Bessie 
Hollis. 

rh 	 o- 
and Mrs. David 

M ens and family, Petro-
hia, Mr. and Mrs. Jerry 
Hutchens and family, and 
Mary Hutchens and a friend, 
Erick Odell, Woodson, visit-
ed their parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Louis Hutchens, and 
other relatives during the 
weekend.skipe  

Skipper Hamilton, and 
Miss Beckie Hawkins and a 
friend, Mindy, Dallas, visit-
ed Mr. and Mrs. Eldon 
McSwain on Saturday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Delton 
Smith and family, Pan-
handle, visited his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Chester Smith, 
during the weekend. 

Mrs. Bessie Orsak and 

AYTES-POPE 
WEDDING SOLEMNIZED: 

Miss Anna Lea Aytes and 
Mr. Jerry Vonn Pope were 
married Sunday July 2nd in 
the Goree Church of Christ 
with Larry Phillips, minis-
ter, officiating. Soloist was 
Mrs. Jerry Underwood. 

The bride is the daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Floyd 
Nickerson of Goree and Mr. 
Ronald Aytes of Casper, 
Wyoming. The groom is the 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Ben 
Pope of Seymour. 

The bride, given in 
marriage by her stepfather, 
chose a white chiffon gown 
with a three tiered skirt 
outlined with lace. She chose 
a wide brim straw hat to 
complete her attire and 
carried white daisies, peach 
carnations, and babies 
breath in her bouquet. 

Miss Rhonda Aytes, sister 
of the bride, was maid of 
honor. She wore a gown of 
peach floral with a ruffled. 
neckline and carried a single 
peach carnation. 

Best man was Mike Pope, 
brother of the groom. 

The brides grandparents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Earl Howry, 
hosted the reception in their 
home in Goree immediately 
following the ceremony. 
Registering the guests was 
Linda Nickerson, sister of 
the bride. Presiding at the 
table was Mrs. Mike Pope 
and Debra Decker. 

Following a wedding trip 
to Gainesville, the couple 
will make their home in 
Seymour where the groom is 
employed by Bayco Services 
and the bride is employed by 
Russell Newman. 
HOSPITAL NOTES: 

Vernis Lambeth is still 
receiving medical treatment 
in the Knox County Hospi-
tal. 

Mrs. Ruby Beaty, who 
received medical treatment 
in the Knox County Hospital 
for several days, is now at 

home. 
CELEBRATES 
BIRTHDAY: 

Eldon McSwain celebrat-
ed his birthday last Tuesday 
night with a party at his 
home. Helping him celebrate 
this occasion were Mr. and 
Mrs. Jimmy Howry, Red 
Springs, Mr. and Mrs. 
Richard Atwood, Seymour 
and Mr. and Mrs. Earl 
Howry and Mr. and Mrs. 
Floyd Nickerson, Goree. 

Dolan Moore, Houston, 
visited his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Billy Moore, during the 
weekend. 

Mrs. Grace Smith accom-
panied her and son and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Gordon 
Smith, Steven and Jonathan 
of Munday, on a vacation 
trip last week. They visited 
Grace's sister, Mrs. Audie 
Menges in Dallas, and her 
brother-in-laws, Mr. and 
Mrs. Theodric Smith and 
Mark and Leon Smith in 
Winfield. They also visited 
Mrs. Gordon Smith's broth-
er, Mr. and Mrs. Dwayne 
Booe and sons. at Jefferson. 
While in Dallas they visited 
"Six Flags". 

Mr. and Mrs. Vernon 
Routon visited Copper 
Breaks State Park last 
week. They also visited Rev. 
Blackabee's daughters, Mrs. 
Beth Walker and Mr. and 
Mrs. Billy Jacks in Claren-
don. 

Mr. and Mrs. Chester 
Smith have returned from a 
two weeks vacation trip. 
They toured seven states in 
the southern and eastern 
United States. 

Mr. and Mrs. Don Lam-
beth, Mesquite, visited his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Vernis Lambeth, during the 
weekend. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wallace 
Roberts visited relatives in 
Hobbs, N.M. during the 
weekend. 

Visiting Mr. and Mrs. 
Grady Williams during the,  

weekend was his son, 
Charles Williams and Mrs. 
Dorothy Howard, Fort 
Worth. 

Miss Mozelle Vandever is 
spending her vacation this 
week with her mother, Mrs. 
Bertie Vandever and sister, 
Nina. 

Lee Ann Cooke, Azle, is 
visiting her grandparents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Roy Mayo, this 
week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Vance 
Martin, Crane, visited his 
aunt, Mrs. Mayme Fitz-
gerald and his sister, Mrs. 
Mary Moore at the Leisure 
Lodge in Munday, several 
days last week. Mr. and Mrs. 
Porter Fitzgerald, Seminole, 
visited his mother during 
the last weekend. 

Charles Wendell Atkin-
son, who has been visiting 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. L. 
L. Atkinson, for several 
days met his wife, Margaret 
at Wichita Falls Friday 
night. They went on to 
Kress to visit his brother, 
Mr. and Mrs. Williams. 
Atkinson, who accom-
panied them to Casper, 
Wyoming to visit their son, 
Mr. and Mrs. Gaylon 
Atkinson and family. They 
are all making a tour of 
Nevada, Washington and 
Yellow Stone National Park 
this week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Neil 
Greenwood, Wichita Falls, 
visited his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Tommy Greenwood, 
Joey and Amy, during the 
weekend. 

Douglas Beaty, Brecken-
ridge, and Bobby Beaty and 
Brian, Cleburne, visited 
their mother, Mrs. Ruby 
Beaty, in the Knox County 
Hospital last week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ralph 
Forsberg, Alvarado, came 
on Saturday after their son, 
Terry, who visited his 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Jim Cooke, last week. 

Visiting Mr. and Mrs. 
Johnnie Moore during the 
weekend were Mr. and Mrs. 
Wendell Moore and Wendy, 
Borger, David Moore and 
Michelle and Sue Ellen 
Syler, Athens. Mr. and Mrs. 
Larry Phillips and Laurie, 
Abilene, visited in their 
home on Sunday. 

Ron and Paula Howell, Ft. 
Worth, visited their grand-
parents, Mr. and Mrs. J. R. 
Hammons and Mr. and Mrs. 
Les Jameson, during the 

FRIGIDAIRE A Heritage of 
Quality Since 1918 

Frigidaire Jet Cone Washers. 
Every laundry day, you'll be proud of the 
way they get your 
clothes clean. 

I 

Rugged Dependability: It's an 
integral part of every Frigidaire 
Heavy Duty Washer. 

Wash a Full 18-lb. Load or just a 
few pieces, with just the right 
amount of water. 

All Frigidaire Jet Cone Washers 
have an exclusive Up-and Down 
Agitator Action. It gets clothes 
down to the bottom of the tub, 
where Cleaning Power is Greatest, 
an average of 9 times per regular 
Wash Cycle.  

Frigidaire Automatic Dryers. 
They offer care for today's 
fabrics, backed by the 
59-year Frigidaire tradition 
of craftsmanship. 

Every Frigidaire Dryer offers you 
the Capacity to Help Save Energy: 
A Full 181b. Capacity that lets 
you Dry One Big Load, instead of 
Several Energy-Wasting Smaller Loads. 

Frigidaire Dryers know when to 
take the Heat off — to Save you 
more than just Energy. 

The 3-Step Starting Procedure Helps 
Prevent Accidental Dryer Operation. 

weekend. Paula remained 
for a longer visit. 

Clinton, Lisa, Sherri and 
Jayme Hicks returned to  
their home at Lake Charles, 
La. last Tuesday after an 
extended visit with their  
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
J. D. Hicks and Mr. and Mrs. 
Arnold Land. 

Mr. and Mrs. Billy Deck. 
er, Ft. Worth, visited his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. W. L.  
Decker, and other relatives, 
during the weekend. 

Mr. and Mrs. Felton 
Jackson, Andy and Janet, 
met their children, Mr. and 
Mrs. Robert Jackson and 
family, Jacksonville, Flori-
da, and Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie 
Hardin and sons, Kerrville, 
at Hico last Monday, where 
they attended the funeral of 
A.E. Howard. Mr. Howard 
was the father of Mrs. 
Robert Jackson. 

Visiting Mrs. Mayme 
Fitzgerald Saturday night 
was her niece, Mrs. James 
Brunson and Julie of Crane. 

Mr. and Mrs. J. R. 
Hammons visited her sister-
in-law, Mrs. Lura Wetsel, 
and children at Stinnett the 
first of last week. 

Reuben Bates, Wichita 
Falls, visited in the Les 
Jameson home last Thurs-
day. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clint Aytes, 
Dallas, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Jerry Pope, Seymour, visit-
ed their mother, Mr. and 
Mrs. Floyd Nickerson, Linda 
and Anna, during the 
weekend. 

George Adams, Lone 
Star, visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Danny Lain and family last 
Tuesday evening and Wed-
nesday night. He was en 
route to and from attending 
his mother's funeral at 
Lubbock. 

Visiting Mr. and Mrs. 
Grady Williams during the 
last weekend was his 
daughter, Miss Paula Wil-
liams, Bedford. 

Brian Beaty, Seymour, 
visited his grandparents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Beaty and 
Jackie, during the weekend. 

Mr. and Mrs. J. D. Hicks 
visited their son and wife, 
Mr. and Mrs. Don Hicks, in 
Wichita Falls on Saturday. 

Visiting Fred Jones last 
Friday night were his grand-
children, Gregg and Amy_ 
Jones of Floydada. They all 
attended the Jones reunion 
at the Boys Club, Lake 
Kickapoo during the week-
end. 

Mr. and Mrs. Grady 
Williams returned home last 
Sunday from a two weeks 
vacation trip. They visited 
his brother and wife, Mr. 
and Mrs. C. K. Williams in 
San Antonio and her sisters; 
Mr. and Mrs. Charles York 
and Mrs. Juanita Wardlaw 
in Harlingen. Mrs. Wardlaw 
returned home with them 
for a visit. 

Mr. and Mrs. Sammy 
Dobbs and April, Honey 
Grove, visited her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Elkin Warren, 
last Tuesday night. Larry 
Phillips, Abilene, was a 
guest in their home on 
Sunday. 

Mrs. Marie Cooke visited 
her brother and wife, Mr. 
and Mrs. George Conwell, in 
Azle recently. She also 
visited relatives in Ft. 
Worth and attended the 
wedding of her grandson, 
Danny Choke and Miss Vicki 
Glover at the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Mitch Cameron in 
Azle Friday night. 

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Brown 
visited during the last 
weekend with their son and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Jerry 
Brown, Brad and Kem in 
Aubrey. 

Mrs. Nanette Kelly and 
daughter, Paige, Temple, 
visited her mother, Mrs. 
Evelyn Roberts during the 
last weekend. 

Mr. and Mrs. Billy Joe 
Roberts, Ft. Worth, and Mr. 
and Mrs. Kenneth Roberts, 
Plainview, visited their 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Cannon Roberts, and other 
relatives. 

Mrs. Blanche Atkinson, 
Lubbock, Mrs. Corrie Wal- 
ton and Mrs. Margie Wil- 
liams, Wichita Falls, Mr. and 
Mrs. Douglas Donoho and 
family, San Angelo, and Mr, 
and Mrs. Merle Lambeth, 
Mrs. Lois Howard and Mr. 
and Mrs. Billy Walton 
visited Fred Jones last Tues-
day. 

Mr. and Mrs. B. C, 
Glasgow, Lawton, Okla., 
visited Mrs. Tomie Poison, 
George Rawls, Mrs. Kate 
Glasgow and other relatives 
last Friday and Saturday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Gary Hale 
and daughters, Marcie and 
Donna, Big Spring, visited 

WEST TEXAS UTILITIES COMPANY 

VC) 
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Qualified Factory-Trained Servicemen Offer You The Finest In A )ntiance Service. 



tmurvinr Ylkurnie, Jut, SR. 1111, Ng. S 

Cottage Cheese 
FOnn 

Oleo 	Lb 
H tA V1 GRAiN FED/ 

16ei 	 LB 

Chuck Roast 
89` 

THRIFT KING 

aper 
ialCrisco  3 L B 

CAN 	 !VE-i  Towels  
KRA1T 

SHURFRESH ASSORTED Ice Cream 	 FLAVORS 

BODEN RICH 'N READY 

Trash Bags 	
s 29 

 
FABRIC SOFTENER PETER PAN SMOOTH -CRUNCHY MAXWELL HOUSE 

10' Off LABEL 
LAUNDRY DETERGENT 

10 Giant 
Tide 

VA.Sti 1%1 We've got a store-full of 
specials guaranteed to fill 
your basket with outdoor 
eating enjoyment! 

WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT 
PRICES EFFECTIVE Ji I r 1.21 rt. fins 

VENTURE FOODS 
GOREE TEXAS PNONE 434-2S61 

IMMIIIILI I 114t all iTa-111111 VsaAr1111Tri $ 1 NI MIR CRAM is war 

LARGE GREEN SLICERS 

Cucumbers 



Model CL8383CR 
SYLVANIA SUPERSET 

Sale Applies To 

Merchandise In Stock 
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THE FIRST TRUE SELF-ADJUSTING COLOR SET 
• 25" diagonal Dark-Lite" 50 Black Matrix picture tube 

• Deluxe GT-300T.  chassis...100% solid-state 
• Sylvania GT-MaticT"...Self-Adjusting Color System 
• Exclusive ASC circuitry (Automatic Sharpness Control) 
• Electronic VHF/UHF channel selector 
• Room Light Monitor...adjusts contrast and color level when 

room lighting changes 
• Twin speakers 
• Early American styling in a cabinet of Pine veneers, hardwood 

solids and simulated wood. Concealed casters. 
• 25" diagonal Dark-Lite'" 50 Black Matrix picture tube 
• Deluxe GT-300T" chassis...100% solid-state 
• Sylvania GT-MaticT....Self-Adjusting Color System 
• Exclusive ASC circuitry (Automatic Sharpness Control) 
• Electronic VHF/UHF channel selector 
• Five button remote tuning control included 
• Power tune 
• Room Light Monitor...adjusts contrast and color level when 

room lighting changes 
• Early American styling in a cabinet of Cherry veneers, 

hardwood solids and simulated wood. Concealed casters. 

SYLVANIA 
GYMATIC 
SELF-ADJUSTING 

COLOR 

Model 8213K 
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REGISTER NOW!! 

Classes to begin August 5 

Wyneth Blackmon 
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Ages 3 yrs. - Women's 

Classes, Beginner thru 

Very Advanced. 
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Registration: Saturday, 

July 22, 10:00 a.m. to 3:00 

p.m. at the Community 

Center in Monday. 
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THANK YOU 
I wish to express my appreciation for 

Your response to my advertisement in 

this newspaper regarding helping me 

move my additional propane allotment. 

I am still taking new customers and 

would be extremely pleased for those of 

You %4 ho have not come in yet to do so. 

Whether y o u have ever traded with me 

or not...I sure would like for you to give 

me an opportunity to serve you. 

't hank you again. 

J. H. Kane Butane 
Nfunday exa8 
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SUPER.FOOD  BUYS  ! 
FOR JULY 	...... 

\O'FRIENDIY 
SUPER MARKETS 

Munday, Texas SHURFINE FROZEN 

DOUBLE 
S & H GREEN STAMPS 

WEDNESDAYS 
With The Purchase 
Of $2.50 Or More 

SPECIALS GOOD 
THUR.,FRI.,SAT., 

JULY 2021-22 

Orange Juice S 

6-01 29tii 
CAN 

$ 	,..r), Hunt's. COCKTAIL —*— 
FRUIT 	 18' 

t 4 
ri 

15 -0Z. 
CANS 

MORTON'S FROZEN 

CHICKEN 
2-LB. 49 
BOX 

11111111 
OPTS  

ViennaS
Swift's ausage  

WWI 

5-os. 1 
Cans 00 

yl 

r*,  

Palmolive Liquid 
164 

Bottle 
32-oz.

ottle 9 
Comet Cleanser 

1 

,tea"_
ti;--- .  \ 	TIDE ,-- 	 1 

do, DETERGENT 99t 
."------ 	Giant Box 

r"1" '9' 	With 	purchase of 	10.00 or more. 

FROZEN 
• ,51. 	JEN014 

,. 	.--- 

	

s • 	ASST. KINDS ..0.4., 	,.-411,-  • 

	

ge-14:fAI  PIZZAS 	9° 

KETCHUP 
32-os.Bottle 

,-..-----. 

Hunt's 

9° 
, 	. 	, 	---- 

-- 	COTTAGE CHEESE 
Shurfresio  

COTTAGE 	Pound Ctn. 
CHEESE 

,----- 
n  - 

Hunts. SAUCE TOMATO *I  5 8-oz. 100 
Cans 

Eleinf 

'  (,) 
: 	.... 

--...-- 
A&w 
MDT BEER 

64-01.-NO 
RETURN BOTTLE 

SHURFINE 

CORN 
303 CANS 

5  FOR 

HUNT'S WHOLE PEELED 

TOMATOES 
1415-01. CANS 

1/794 
FINAL NET  _ 

HAIR SPRAY 
8-OUNCE 

2.15 value 

1079 

BOUNCE 

DELTA PAPER 

TOWELS 
JUMBO ROLL 

394 
NEW BETTY CROCKER 
ASST. KINDS FROZEN 

13-oz.Can 
COOKIES 

SUPER D BABY 

SHAMPOO 
LARGE 16-01. SIZE 

7 94 

lr  
4vi 4,W 

Wa 
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